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Chapter 1121: Strong is Good, But Only Three?

“This woman…” Li Kuangdeng turned slightly, and spoke softly to Han Wannong.

Han Wannong was also a man and naturally understood Li Kuangdeng’s intentions. Before Li 
Kuangdeng finished asking his question, he hastily said: “She should be a descendent of the Mu 
Family. A long time ago, she made her name with the Crown Phoenix King. However, I never 
expected her to have now entered the dominator rank…”

Han Wannong had left the Wanxiang Realm a few years ago. He didn’t know much about these 
newly emergent experts and could only roughly guess their strengths.

“Haha, I want her.” said Li Kuangdeng.

“She’s not weak. It won’t be easy for Border General Li to make her yield.” Han Wannong laughed 
with profound intentions.

“Doesn’t this make it even more interesting? Otherwise, I would be very bored here.” said Li 
Kuangdeng.

When the two of them were speaking, Li Yi’s blood beast dominator began to fight the Crown 
Phoenix King!

The golden flame from the Crown Phoenix King was like morale that violently burned. The 
imposing aura forced Li Yi’s blood beast to retreat!



The Crown Phoenix King’s strength had clearly risen a level, nearing the low class dominator rank. 
Li Yi’s blood beast dominator was a level weaker and even if Li Yi’s control of his blood besat was 
adept, Mu Qingyi’s Crown Phoenix King had a domineering and imposing offensive aura had the 
absolute advantage.

The pleased expression on Li Yi’s face was no longer there. Evidently, he had underestimated the 
strength of New Moon Land’s experts.

As the battle continued, the skin of Li Yi’s blood beast was lacerated. Currently, Li Yi was looking 
at Li Kuangdeng, with a sense of pleading in his eyes.

But Li Kuangdeng just stood there with a smile. It was rare that an opponent was a very fine 
woman. Li Kuangdeng’s mood was very good and Li Yi’s inability to defend was insignificant to 
him.

“Just this little bit of ability?” Mu Qingyi’s tone was calm, as she looked at Li Yi.

Li Yi’s expression was even more unsightly. He was being looked down on by a girl, moreover one 
from New Moon Land. This was humiliating!

“Li Yi, let me do it.” Li Kuangdeng didn’t chant an incantation. He was hovering in midair and the 
Dark Lion he was riding on had stepped into the air.

Li Yi looked like he was relieved from a burden. He quickly recalled the blood beast dominator 
riddled with burn wounds, and then looked with eyes full of venomous hatred at Mu Qingyi!



“Young Lady Mu, you can summon as you please. All you have to do is beat my Dark Lion, and I 
will immediately return home.” Li Kuangdeng examined Mu Qingyi for a long time before 
speaking.

Having been examined by this man for an excessive amount of time, she obviously understood the 
intentions in his eyes. She coldly said: “Perhaps you guys won’t even be able to return.”

“Oh, Young Lady Mu is kindly urging me to stay. I am extremely happy. With such a magnificent 
person to accompany me, it doesn’t matter to me if I don’t return. Hahaha.” Li Kuangdeng 
immediately began to loudly laugh.

Li Kuangdeng’s words instantly incited everyone’s anger. This fellow even dared flirt with their 
War Goddess. This was too arrogant. One small mistake, and he could be burned to dregs by Crown 
Phoenix King.

He indeed was a frivolous person. Mu Qingyi had always hated these sorts of men, regardless of 
how strong they were.

Mu Qingyi didn’t continue talking rubbish with Li Kuangdeng. She controlled her Crown Phoenix 
King to create a golden river of fire in the air. The river of fire poured down from the sky. The 
surging magma spilled into a shocking nine heaven waterfall. It was incomparably gorgeous!!

The Dark Lion dominator stepped forward. Its fluttering white mane and whiskers rose upwards, 
and its dark body mysteriously disappeared.

Its white whiskers outlandishly passed through the golden fire waterfall. Yet, it was unharmed. 
Immediately after, its body appeared behind the waterfall and it charged with heavy steps at the 
Crown Phoenix King.



Mu Qingyi didn’t have knowledge of the Dark Lion’s techniques. She hadn’t prepared for the 
Crown Phoenix King to dodge and by the time she reacted, the Dark Lion had already crashed into 
the Crown Phoenix King, knocking it flying high up in the air.

Darkness Explosion!

The Dark Lion raised its head and spat out a dark colored air wave that chased after the Crown 
Phoenix King!

“Beng!!!”

The moment it touched the Crown Phoenix King, a dark energy exploded, appearing like a 
blackhole in the air!

The Crown Phoenix King’s flames were dulled as a result of this attack. Fortunately, Mu Qingyi had 
added a sun shield on the Crown Phoenix King in time, so that it wouldn’t be corroded by the dark 
energy.

When Mu Qingyi caught her balance, her expression looked seriously at the powerful and 
outlandish Dark Lion.

The Dark Lion was clearly a low class dominator. Although the fire type countered dark types, if 
she couldn’t hit the Dark Lion, the countering basically had no use.

“White Tiger!” Mu Qingyi didn’t hesitate. She immediately chanted an incantation and summoned 
the White Tiger!



Mu Qingyi’s White Tiger had also become a genuine dominator rank from near the dominator rank. 
After being summoned, the temperature a hundred kilometers around the city tower suddenly 
dropped. The wind became biting like knives that painfully slashed across one’s face!

The appearance of another dominator rank creature covered the faces of Li Yi and Han Wannong 
with shock. They already believed that this woman possessing a Crown Phoenix King was 
extremely amazing. They never expected her to have another dominator rank soul pet.

If they were to truly fight, Li Yi indeed wouldn’t necessarily be her opponent. This made his face 
even darker.

Li Kuangdeng’s expression also changed, but it looked like his interest in her grew even deeper. 
After all, Mu Qingyi’s strength when placed in Cloud Realm would also be outstanding. Most 
importantly, her temperament and body were that of an outstanding beauty.

“Haha, really good. Really good. Two dominator rank soul pets. However, my promise hasn’t 
changed. You can summon as you please. You just have to beat my Dark Lion and I will 
immediately return home.” Li Kuangdeng was full of confidence as he spoke.

Mu Qingyi couldn’t be bothered to speak with a person like this. She ordered her White Tiger and 
Crown Phoenix King to simultaneously attack the Dark Lion.

Ice and fire. Mu Qingyi’s two dominator rank soul pets happened to have perfectly opposed 
attributes. However, the auras of these two soul pets didn’t clash. Instead, the ice and fire energies 
formed a visibly boundary that interweaved with one another as they descended from the sky!



The Dark Lion’s agility was extremely high. It was unexpectedly even able to pass through the 
concentration of ice and fire. Mu Qingyi was only able to see its white whiskers agilely and nimbly 
move about. Each time it approached the ice and fire, it would mysteriously float and disperse. It 
was difficult to grasp its movements!

Darkness type creatures were divided into a few types. The mainstream type were adept at 
imprisonment, sealing and binding. After this type were those with darkness attacks that included 
corrosion, dark poisoning, weakening. The final type were outlandish dark phantoms that could 
teleport using shadows and darkness. These darkness creatures were powerful in that they were 
even harder to catch than demons.

Mu Qingyi’s Evernight Emperor was also more towards this type. However, Li Kuangdeng’s Dark 
Lion had practically developed its dark movement abilities to the limit. The Crown Phoenix King 
and White Tiger’s combined attacks were unable to even touch it.

Mu Qingyi was extremely certain that the Dark Lion’s main attribute was the beast type. If its 
darkness attribute was already so powerful, then once it erupted with its beast type strength, her two 
soul pets would probably be instantly suppressed!

Indeed, as she expected, the Dark Lion continuously dodged the White Tiger and Crown Phoenix 
King’s attacks before immediately attacking the White Tiger!

It was a Shattering Claw. The Darkness Shattering Claw’s aura completely suppressed the White 
Tiger’s Frost Shattering Claw and the armor on the White Tiger was shattered!

Mu Qingyi’s expression was extremely calm. When the Dark Lion clashed with the White Tiger, 
she immediately gave the Crown Phoenix King an order to attack.



Using a wing type confinement ability and golden flames, she successfully managed to trap the 
Dark Lion. Moreover, she managed to intensely burn its body!

It was now that the attribute advantage was visibly manifested. When the low class dominator rank 
Dark Lion was burned, its dark colored body began to fester and it painfully and angrily howled at 
the Crown Phoenix King!

“Get rid of it!” Li Kuangdeng ordered the Dark Lion.

Relying on its berserk beast attribute, the Dark Lion forcibly broke apart the Crown Phoenix King’s 
wing type binding. Its dark body transformed once more into outlandish white whiskers. With 
erratic movements, it passed through the golden flames and appeared diagonal to the Crown 
Phoenix King!

“Hou!!!!!!!!!’

The wild lion roared. Its vocal wave contained a dense darkness energy that transformed into a 
terrifying dark wind where the Crown Phoenix King was. It swept the Crown Phoenix King flying!

The dark wind quickly flitted through the air above the city. The Crown Phoenix King’s body 
rapidly span and fell on a few streets in the city. Mu Qingyi was also affected by the dark wind and 
was blown away somewhere else.

A smile appeared on Li Kuangdeng, and he timely jumped onto the Dark Lion and rushed to where 
Mu Qingyi had been blown to.



Obviously, Li Kuangdeng wouldn’t kill Mu Qingyi. Killing a woman of such an amazing quality 
was too unfortunate. He was going to intercept her and show off his gentlemanly elegance.

However, the moment he passed by the city tower, he abruptly discovered a dark purple colored 
lightning fly out from the depths of the city. The lightning was originally heading straight for the 
city tower when it suddenly and finely made a sudden turn in the air, flying towards Mu Qingyi.

The dark purple lightning flew past Mu Qingyi and the beautiful woman who had lost her gravity 
disappeared from his eyes. Immediately afterwards, the lightning turned again and moved towards 
where the Crown Phoenix King was falling!

Once the Crown Phoenix King obtained a strength buffer, it immediately steadied its flight. Beating 
its wings full of flames, it calmly floated above the streets, causing the people on the streets to sigh 
in exclamation.

Mu Qingyi glanced at the safe streets and she felt much more at ease.

If the Crown Phoenix King fell, it wouldn’t do anything to its body, but it would injure or kill many 
people on the streets. The kind Mu Qingyi didn’t wish to see this happen.

However, Mu Qingyi quickly realized she was being carried by Chu Mu, and when she smelled the 
intoxicating smell of a man from his body, her heartbeat began to violently beat. Her face instantly 
turned red.

“Are you ok?” Chu Mu asked. His expression was completely natural.



Mu Qingyi nodded her head, indicating that Chu Mu could release her. After all, they were in the air 
above the city and many eyes were watching.

At the city tower, everyone saw that Chu Mu had timely come to prevent Goddess Mu from 
suffering injury and let out sighs of relief. As for their clandestine and dubious moment just now, 
nobody felt it to be strange. Who didn’t know by now that the relationship between the two of them 
wasn’t ordinary?

On the other side, Li Kuangdeng was glaring at Chu Mu. His expression wasn’t too good.

Firstly, he really didn’t like watching the woman he fancied in the embrace of another. Secondly, the 
strength of that dark purple colored unique phoenix made him shocked. Faintly, he felt somewhat 
threatened!

“Chu Mu, this fellow is very strong. You need to be careful.” Mu Qingyi had personally felt the 
abilities of the Dark Lion and warned Chu Mu.

“It’s good that they’re strong. But why are there only three?” Chu Mu raised his brows as he asked 
his question.

Truthfully speaking, after peace had arrived, Chu Mu, who loved fighting, was so bored he was 
growing restless!

As for the small mo Xie who spent the entire day sleeping out of boredom, she was even moreso 
looking for an opponent that wouldn’t be smashed to death with a single claw!

Chapter 1122: Dominator fight, Devil Tree Battle Soldier?

Lighthouse Position



“Dark purple….dark purple phoenix species, and it looks like its low class dominator rank!!” Wang 
Dan stared at the evil, beautiful, noble, and wild phoenix species in the skies.

Though Zhen Kuo already guessed King Chu had low class dominator rank organism, when he saw 
a special phoenix species, he was still shocked.

As for Ning Chanqing, he was slack jawed, unable to believe that this man his age was already an 
expert with low class dominator rank.

Aside, Lan Rao’s gaze became slightly flirtatious as her lips curled upwards, clearly gaining more 
interest in King Chu.

“This King Chu has some power. This soul pet is extremely rare even where we come from.” Wang 
Dan said.

Zhen Kuo nodded, his gaze towards Chu Mu slightly shifting.

However, no matter how surprised he was, Zhen Kuo didn’t feel like Chu Mu would be Li 
Kuangdeng’s match. After all, anyone could tell that Li Kuangdeng didn’t only have one low class 
dominator rank.

……

Chu Mu’s current emotions weren’t great. If the cloud gate people could be dealt with in a few easy 
strokes, how could he release his anger?



Dead Dream flapped its wings and slowly floated behind the Dark Lion, its electrical arcs blinking 
rapidly, causing the air to crackle.

The Dark Lion’s Li Kuangdeng looked hostile at Chu Mu, using an elitist attitude to look at Chu 
Mu, “And who are you?”

As Li Kuangdeng finished asking, Han Wannong rode his Earth Fiend Dream Demon up and asked 
in a low voice, “This seems to be the King Chu they were talking about, the strongest person here.”

“Strongest person here?” Li Kuangdeng paused, and reevaluated Chu Mu.

Li Kuangdeng could tell that Chu Mu truly wasn’t that old. Originally, seeing Chao Lengchuan and 
Mu Qingyi as young dominator rank strength experts already caused Li Kuangdeng to be confused. 
He never expected the most powerful person to also be only in his thirties.

“Han Wannong, you bastard!” Suddenly, an old man’s voice came from afar.

This voice was loud and old, causing almost the entire city to hear.

Everyone turned their gazes around, but found an white haired man ride a wing type soul pet slowly 
into the skies, staring angrily at Han Wannong, who was flattering fLi Kuangdeng.

Han Wannong shivered without knowing why, and turned to look at the angry old man.



Han Wannong’s fear was completely an instinctive reaction. However, thinking about it more 
clearly, Han Wannong again let out a pleased and disdainful smile as he said to the old man, “Old 
man, you still are as bad tempered as usual. How many times do I have to tell you not to act the 
elder anymore. Also, I told you long ago that Cloud Gate was a larger country with people of higher 
rank. However, you never believed me. Here, you see now, I brought experts back from outside 
cloud gate. This is Li Kuangdeng, the Border General Li Kuangdeng, he comes to take control of 
here.”

“And who is this old fellow?” Li Kuangdeng stared at Old Han as if he didn’t care at all.

“It’s the oldest soul pet trainer of new Moon Ground and also the strongest a few generations ago. 
Of course, compared to Border General Li, he’s just an old man.” Han Wannong’s face changed and 
quickly went back to flattering Li Kuangdeng.

“So that’s the situation, if you’re old then just remain in retirement. Why wander around like this?” 
Li Kuangdeng said.

“Old man, you saw the situation. Border General Li is far stronger than you. If you don’t want any 
blood lost, just give up, surrender, and you can remain safe. Or else….” Han Wannong said.

Old Han heard Han Wannong’s mocking and lost his ability to breath regularly.

Chu Mu saw Old Han’s emotions and guessed that Han Wannong must be the adopted grandson that 
Old Wen had mentioned.

However, looking at this guy’s flattering face, he indeed wasn’t someone good.



“Wei, and you, don’t call yourself some king. In front of Border General Li, you’re just a slag!” At 
this moment, Han Wannong pointed towards Chu Mu.

Mu Qingyi heard it and was very uncomfortable, saying, “This fellow truly knows how to threaten 
others with his master.”

Old Han was shivering with anger. When he had taken in this bastard at first, how could he not tell 
this was such a dog. Now look, he was bringing outer realm people in to bully us. He should have 
slapped him to death when he had the chance!

Chu Mu saw Old Han was angered, and realized it was time for him to intervene to help the old 
man punish his past mistakes.

Of course, since this dog wanted to rely on other people, Chu Mu naturally had to first get rid of this 
outer realm person first to punish this bastard!

Gazing coldly, Chu Mu gave Dead Dream a command with his mind.

Dead Dream’s lightning darted around making countless layers across the sixteen wings!

“Yi!!!!!!”

Dead dream let out a terrifying call that pushed the entire sky down. The heavy thunder clouds 
created terrifying purple thunder striking down from the skies!!



The dark purple thunder shocked all, turning the city into a thunder area!!

The Dark Lion’s dark energy didn’t have the power of thunder type. Li Kuangdeng let out a cold 
humph, and rode the Dark Lion into an unpredictable white streak through the thousands of 
thunders.

“Chu Mu, his dark movement is very powerful, and we can never hit him” Mu QIngyi reminded 
Chu Mu.

Chu Mu nodded, yet his eyes changed color here, slowly turning silver and started spinning!

Under Other Pupil, this Dark Lion’s speed was very normal. Chu Mu could easily see through its 
movement.

Chu Mu could already see the Dark Lion’s movement, so Dead Dream knew where it had to attack.

“Honghonghong!!!!!!!!”

Suddenly, three incredibly thick thunders flashed through, landing where Dark Lion was about to 
dodge!

On Dark Lion’s back, Li Kuangdeng had a face of ease. Yet, when the powerful light shrouded him, 
his smirk disappeared, replaced with panic as he quickly told Dark Lion to create a dark shield!



“Pipa!!!!!!!!”

Dark shield wasn’t powerful, easily shattered. Quickly after, the entire Dark Lion suffered a 
powerful strike of thunder, causing it to howl in pain as it convulsed.

Li Kuangdeng himself also got electrocuted, causing him to become incredibly haggard, and his 
hair to be burnt.

After struggling, the Dark Lion finally got rid of the thunder, yet Li Kuangdeng’s face blackened.

A moment of underestimation caused the kid to hit him. Li Kuangdeng’s resentment rose as he 
stared angrily at Chu Mu.

“Hahah, I thought Cloud Gate’s people were supposed to be powerful, yet he almost got blasted into 
smithereens!” At this moment, a string of mocking came from the city building, originating from 
Shen Mo.

However, after Shen Mo followed a large wave of insults, it caused Li Kuangdeng’s expression to 
sour even further, clearly angry at the shame!

“You will be the one to die in the most painful way!” Li Kuangdeng said and started another 
incantation!

Li Kuangdeng directly double summoned, creating a grey and brown summoning diagram on each 
side of them.



The grey diagram had a grey fur covered demon. From its aura, one could tell that it was a soul pet 
very close to low class dominator rank!!

On the other side of Li Kuangdeng in the brown symbol was an organism with scythe-like wings. 
This organism’s arms, shoulders, and key parts were all covered in sharp blade armor. It was a bug 
type Hibernating Ghost Scythe!

Hibernating Ghost Scythe was even stronger than the grey demon dominator. Without guessing, one 
can tell that it was a true low class dominator rank, not any weaker than Dark Lion!

Li Kuangdeng’s summon instantly brought his power to two low class dominators and one near low 
class dominator rank. This power was definitely unmatched in Wanxiang Realm. No wonder this 
person was arrogant!

“Do you want to get cut by my demon or dismembered by my Hibernating Ghost Scythe? You can 
choose!” Li Kuangdeng stared proudly Chu Mu.

However, when Li Kuang gazed at Chu Mu, but found Chu Mu simply laughing.

“What are you laughing about?” Li Kuangdeng was very uncomfortable. He was clearly making fun 
of him. Was three low class dominator ranks not enough to deal with anyone there?

Chu Mu didn’t say much. He laughed because Li Kuangdeng seemed to be even weaker than Ling 
Chan, and dared to be this powerful. He was also laughing because Li Kuangdeng didn’t know just 
how powerful the opponent he was against was!



Very quickly, Li Kuangdeng noticed Chu Mu who was also chanting. He resisted the urge to attack, 
and wanted to see the soul pet Chu Mu was going to summon!

The cyan roots wrapped around Chu Mu and quickly created a devil tree battle soldier’s body!

Devil Tree Battle Soldier was only four meters. It was so normal that the entire city recognized it. 
However, what caused everyone to stare in awe was why Chu Mu would summon such a low 
species rank soul pet in a dominator rank battle.

“Hahahaha, I’m dying….. Devil…… Devil Tree Battle Soldier…… a warrior rank devil tree battle 
soldier……” Sharp laughter came from Han Wannong.

Li Kuangdeng saw the soul pet clearly and immediately relaxed, his face turning from grave to 
laughable.

Devil Tree Battle Soldier, no matter how powerful it is, it was just a top tier emperor rank. Almost 
everyone knew. Li Kuangdeng thought it funny. Even if King Chu had no other dominator rank soul 
pets, there was still no reason to bring out a Devil Tree Battle Soldier and shame himself.

Chapter 1123: Chu Mu is a Monster

“Devil Tree Battle Soldier….. This is utterly beyond belief.” The four in the lighthouse stared at 
each other.

One could say that Zhen Kuo and the other three were also tricked by Chu Mu’s smile. They really 
believed that King Chu had a soul pet able to fight two low class dominator ranks.

Yet, this fellow simply summoned a devil tree battle soldier. Is this a farce?



“Looks like we have to help?” Lan Rao quickly lost some interest in Chu Mu and said to Zhen Kuo.

“No hurry.” Zhen Kuo shook his head.

Zhen Kuo wasn’t a very generous person. Since he said he would attack late, he would have to wait 
for Li Kuangdeng to devastate King Chu first before he would appear.

“You should know that humans are strange creatures. Before danger comes, one could live life 
normally and reject outsiders. Only when true danger comes do they know to respect and appreciate 
the people that are willing to help them.”

“Boss Zhen is right. They have to first get stepped on to the point of destruction before we 
intervene, and let them regret their foolish actions that day in the palace!” Ning Changqing said 
with joy.

Wang Dang and Lan Rao both nodded. However, at this moment Zhen Kuo seemed to notice 
something. He no longer spoke as he looked more closely at Chu Mu’s Devil Tree Battle Soldier.

……

Li Kuangdeng, Han Wannong, and Li yi were still laughing at Devil Tree Battle Soldier. Even Mu 
Qingyi aside Chu Mu was stunned, not understanding why Chu Mu didn’t summon little hidden 
dragon or Zhan Ye, instead summoning devil tree battle soldier.

“Chu Mu, did you cast the wrong summoning incantation?” Mu Qingyi reminded Chu Mu in a low 
voice.



Chu Mu shook his head, “Devil Tree Battle Soldier is enough.”

Mu Qingyi heard this and didn’t know whether to laugh or cry.

Was he doing this on purpose? Devil Tree Battle Soldier was enough? Did he want Devil Tree 
Battle Soldier to battle one against two? That was a low class dominator and near low class 
dominator enemy he was against!

Seeing Mu Qingyi’s reaction, Chu Mu simply lifted an eyebrow and said, “You should watch 
carefully.”

“Ao!!!!!!!!!”

Mu Qingyi remained confused as Devil Tree Battle Soldier suddenly let out a bold roar, stepping 
towards the two soul pets by Li Kuangdeng in the sky!

Countless roots started spreading in the sky, interlacing and growing!

Devil Tree Battle Soldier was only four meters tall. However, the roots it had already took over the 
entire upper skies of the city like thick clouds floating, or like a massive forest over the city!!

Li Kuangdeng’s contempt didn’t reduce in the slightest. Any top tier emperor rank could create such 
a plant territory as well. It looked like it was time for some blood, or else they wouldn’t surrender.



Hibernating Ghost Scythe flapped its wings.This bug type low class dominator rank was like a meat 
grinder, making its way into devil tree battle soldier’s root forest and powdering the cloud like 
roots.

“Get rid of it.” Li Kuangdeng didn’t want to waste any time, giving Hibernating Ghost Scythe a 
command to kill.

Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s arms became massive black scythes. After a moment of pause in the air, 
it blitzed towards Devil Tree Battle Soldier, sending out two massive cutting blades that flashed 
through Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s root territory and at its body!

“Shuashua!!!!!:

Two blades criss-crossed, accurately landing on the devil tree battle soldier.

Li Kuangdeng smiled slightly. Looking through the narrow corridor cut open and at the Devil Tree 
Battle Soldier, he expected to see the soul pet cut up into four pieces in no time.

Yet, reality wasn’t as Li Kuangdeng imagined. Li Kuangdeng quickly found that the full out attack 
of the hibernating ghost scythe only left two light marks on devil tree battle soldier’s chest!

It didn’t even seem to cut through the wood armor fully, meaning that this attack merely was a 
scratch to the devil tree battle soldier!!

How is that possible?!



Li Kuangdeng stared blankly, as his face was overtaken with shock!!

A low class dominator rank soul pet could instantly kill a top tier emperor rank even without any 
techniques. Why did his Hibernating Ghost Scythe only leave a scratch on the Devil Tree Battle 
Soldier?

This incomprehensible scene not only shocked Li Kuangdeng. Li Yi, Han Wannong, and even the 
four people in the light house, including Zhen Kuo, were slack-jawed!!

“Aoaoao!!!!!!!!!”

While everyone was shocked, Devil Tree Battle Soldier let out a dominator rank worthy roar!

With a mere thought, the black cloud that floated above the city suddenly started growing at dozen 
times the speed before!!

Growth, exponential growth. Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s root territory became a pressuring mass of 
roots, covering all of north city’s skies.

The sky full of roots seemed to be sentient as they all pointed to the Hibernating Ghost Scythe and 
stabbed towards it with their poisonous spikes!!!

Seeing the roots come down like a downpour, it showed panic and started swiping away at the roots 
with its hands and feet to cut down the roots flying at it.



The Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s attack frequency was incredibly high, still able to keep itself safe 
amongst the densely attacking roots.

However, no matter how fast it swiped its scythes, it couldn’t keep up with Devil Tree Battle 
Soldier’s ability to cast many techniques together!

After the storm of roots, branches as soft as snakes slowly crept up upon it. The Hibernating Ghost 
Scythe didn’t even notice these roots snaking all over its body!

“Su!!!”

The Hibernating Ghost Scythe was still cutting with all its might when suddenly, a powerful yank 
caused it to fly straight from the skies to out of the city. One could see a long branch fall from the 
sky like a whip from the gods, heavily slamming into the outer city mountains. At the end of this 
branch was Hibernating Ghost Scythe, who hadn’t even reacted yet!

“Beng!!!!!!!”

After this whip fell, a long mountain valley was created between the mountains. Hibernating Ghost 
Scythe was thrown into this pile of rocks, unable to get up for a while.

The sky covering roots, the cracked valley between mountains hundreds of kilometers away- the 
low class dominator rank Hibernating Ghost Scythe rendered immovable…….

All these scenes caused the city to fall silent. Only the shockwave from far away in the mountains 
were causing vibrations that one could hear made a noise.



Everyone watching or participating in the fight ahd the same confusion and shock. Was this 
powerful organism truly the devil tree battle soldier with warrior rank species rank???

At the city building, even those familiar with Chu Mu like Shen Mo, Teng Lang, Pang Yue, Old 
Hermit, and Elder Pang were wide eyed!!

Warrior rank reaching dominator rank? How many emperor rank soul pets would be ashamed? And 
how many high species rank organisms reached invincible emperor rank only to stop in its path.

Chu Mu was a monster, able to strength warrior rank devil tree battle soldier to dominator rank 
despite class dominator rank restrictions.

Zhan Ye Mo Ye had six broken limb rebirths, Brave stinging heart and Ancient Power Awakening. It 
was undisputed why it was low class dominator rank.

Little Hidden Dragon had Empyrean Cyan Hidden Dragon’s types and ghost type, so it made sense 
why it was low class dominator rank.

Dead Dream had a species rank of perfect emperor rank. After ten stages, it was indubitably strong 
too.

Chu Mu himself could go half-devil. He also had Hades Fox little Mo Xie and the retracted Evil 
Good Queen. Other than a monster, there were no other words to describe Chu Mu aptly.



“But……But…...a secondary soul pet with species rank of warrior rank was trained to low class 
dominator rank. Even looking at the entire Tianxia and Wanxiang realm, which spirit emperor still 
working towards spirit dominator could endure this?

Not only did people not accept it right now, probably no one in all of the realm could believe it. One 
had to know that there had been no previous cases of a warrior rank organism reaching dominator 
rank ever!!

“Chu…… Chu Mu. You…… you really succeeded?” Standing behind Chu Mu was Mu Qingyi, her 
sexy lips at a loss of words, hanging open.

Even now, Mu QIngyi couldn’t forget how scary the lost desolation ground Ten Thousand Eyed 
treant was. Yet, even that was only near low class dominator rank, while Chu Mu’s Devil Tree 
Battle Soldier was truly a low class dominator rank!

Plant world low class dominator rank. Facing a same rank bug type dominator and demon type 
dominator, it truly had no problem. At first, Mu Qingyi thought Chu Mu was just messing around, 
yet she now knew he was serious; this devil tree battle soldier really could fight one against two!

Mu Qingyi didn’t know what to say. This man truly wasn’t normal. It was a good thing she didn't 
try to compare herself to him, or else her pride will suffer!

Chu Mu found it rare that Goddess Mu was surprised like a little girl and casually made fun of her, 
“Next, I’ll make my Ice Air Fairy dominator rank too.”

“Ice Air Fairy…….” Mu Qingyi was between laughter and tears again.



Ice Air Fairy also had a warrior rank species rank.

Back in the Ice Muslin Valley, she had even scolded Chu Mu, telling him there was no point in 
training Ning, since it couldn’t step into dominator rank.

Yet, now Mu Qingyi could no longer say that after a low class dominator rank Devil Tree Battle 
Soldier had appeared!!

Mu Qingyi knew Chu Mu was intentionally bringing up past matters. She wished she could just 
choke this cocky monster to death with her bare hands!

Chapter 1124: Malicious Spirit Retaliation, Hibernating Ghost Scythe

While chatting with Mu Qingyi, Chu Mu wouldn’t forget that there was someone here who he really 
had to get rid of.

Devil Tree Battle Soldier lifted its right hand, and powerfully smashed the plant curtain in the sky!

The densely compact curtain of plants surged forward like a roaring ocean. Suddenly, ten wild and 
stunning wooden flood dragons appeared in the plant sea!

Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron!!

The ten flood dragons appeared in ten different locations around the grey demon. Their heads 
rapidly wrapped together, extending to the plant cloud and forming a ten pillar prison!

The enormous prison looked like an enormous upside down cauldron. Even if the grey demon, 
which relied on its speed, was faster, it would still be trapped in the Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron!



Countless branches appeared from the flood dragon bodies, rapidly growing and filling in the cracks 
between the Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron. Li Kuangdeng’s grey demon unceasingly used a claw 
bladestorm. However, the claw bladestorm’s destruction speed wasn’t as fast as the growth speed of 
the Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron.

Gradually, not a single crack could be seen in the Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron. A ray of light 
wasn’t even able to pass through.

Li Kuangdeng himself had also been trapped in the Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron. Seeing the pitch-
black darkness around him, his expression grew increasingly unsightly!

Plant world soul pets countered demon beast world creatures to a certain extent. The low class 
dominator rank Hibernating Ghost Scythe wasn’t necessarily even the Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s 
opponent, let alone the grey demon.

Demons were countered the most by wood type creatures, since their speed could be limited by 
multiple technique, their fatal attacks were unable to pierce the thick and rough skin of wood type 
creatures and their mental techniques were useless on wood type creatures; indeed, wood type 
creatures didn’t need to chant to use techniques!

Under identical ranks, demon type dominators would be completely oppressed by wood type 
creatures. In the present circumstances, Li Kuangdeng’s grey demon hadn’t even reached the low 
class dominator rank.

Right now, the grey demon was but a grasshopper in the autumn that could at most hop around 
under the Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron.



“Why is it not dead?!” Li Kuangdeng angrily cursed in his heart.

The moment he finished cursing, the Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron’s outside was ripped apart by 
over a hundred ghost scythes. These scythes were extremely sharp, and each one was able to rip 
apart the growing branches.

The ten main flood dragon pillars of the Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron were not destroyed. 
However, the grey demon’s body was small and after finding a crack, it hastily escaped out of the 
pitch-black prison.

Once he escaped the Wood Flood Dragon Cauldron, Li Kuangdeng let out a slight sigh of relief 
before glaring with anger at Han Wannong!

“Didn’t you say that there were no experts here?!!” roared Li Kuangdeng.

“This…” Han Wannong returned from his shock and didn’t know how to answer.

Before Han Wannong had left, Ling Chan was the ruler here. The people stronger were also the 
Four Heroes. How would he know where the man called King Chu had come from with such 
terrifying strength?

Chu Mu wouldn’t give his enemy a chance to breathe. As Li Kuangdeng was angrily berating Han 
Wannong, Chu Mu ordered his Devil Tree Battle Soldier to launch its next attack!

The plant cloud wriggled once more and the ten thousand woods transformed into weapons that 
filled the sky. There were enormous wood swords, wood axes, heavenly wood spears,and 
bloodwood sabers...



Above the city, the ten thousand wood weapons terrifyingly hung in the sky. The torrential killing 
intent they emitted made even blazing sun lose some color!

“O!!!!!”

The Devil Tree Battle Soldier gave its order, and the ten thousand blades sped through the air, 
interweaving with one another. They shook the heavens and earth, causing even ghosts and gods to 
cry!

The weapons on the Hibernating Ghost Scythe were unable to match the ten thousand wood blades. 
With the intimidating and terrifying killing intent covering the sky, the Hibernating Ghost Scythe 
and grey demon scrambled to defend.

Wood type attack abilities should have been lacking. Yet, each one of these weapons contained 
poisonous wood spikes that easily pierced defenses.

There were a lot of these poison wood spikes. They looked like insignificant feelers, but it was 
precisely these feeler needles with poison that left the Hibernating Ghost Scythe with its thick bug 
type defense injury riddled under the violent storm of weapons.

Li Kuangdeng’s grey demon was left even worse, turning into chicken ribs. The demon’s defenses 
were average, and the attack left it powerless. It could only hide behind the Hibernating Ghost 
Scythe and occasionally brandish its claws, which weren’t of much use.



As the wounds on the Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s body grew in number, its thick insect armor was 
corroded increasingly severely. The power of the Devil Tree Battle Soldier filled Li Kuangdeng 
with shock and rage once more!!

“Shua!!!!”

Finally, the last enormous wood blade swept across and another long poison wound appeared on the 
Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s abdomen.

The Hibernating Ghost Scythe was dripping with blood as it slowly spread open its arms which 
were crossed in front of it. Its deep red eyes carried extreme anger as it gave a deathly glare at Chu 
Mu’s Devil Tree Battle Soldier.

“If you think my Hibernating Ghost Scythe only has this bit of ability, then you’re very, very 
wrong!” Li Kuangdeng’s anger turned to calm and he spoke to Chu Mu in a cold voice.

As he spoke, a ghastly ghost aura suddenly emerged from the ripped open wounds on the 
Hibernating Ghost Scythe. The ghost aura congealed on the sharp and frightening blade arms!

Each one of the wounds emitted ghost aura, which resembled energy that surged forth before 
lifelessly enveloping and intertwining…

“Chu Mu, this is the ghost type Malicious Spirit Retaliation. Ghost types will transform a portion of 
the energy used to wound them into resentment ghost strength. Right now it’s absorbing the 
resentment ghost strength and its next attack will be extremely terrifying!” Old Han hastily warned 
Chu Mu.



Chu Mu nodded his head. Chu Mu hadn’t encountered many ghost type creatures despite the fact 
that he possessed the Ghost King with a secondary ghost attribute...

“Die for me!” angrily roared Li Kuangdeng!

The ghost aura energy on the Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s arms reached their limit. The two blade 
wings on its back abruptly spread open. It leaped into the air and slashed its two arms!!

The mournful cry of a hundred ghosts rang out. The ghost aura enveloping the Hibernating Ghost 
Scythe’s two arms transformed into two enormous black execution scythes. They slashed down 
from above and left two shocking blade scars on the boundless sea of plants!

The ghost colored execution scythe slashed at the Devil Tree Battle Soldier. It was incomparably 
imposing!

The Devil Tree Battle Soldier extended its two hands to block, but it clearly underestimated the 
might of the two sharp blades. Its wood shield covering its arms only managed to stop the two 
execution scythes for a brief moment before being sliced through like hot butter!

“Shua!! Shua!!!!!!”

The two execution scythes simultaneously slashed down and the Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s arms 
were instantly severed from its body. They span through the air before dropping to the city.

Everyone who witnessed this scene sucked in a breath of air.



The defensive and life force properties of wood type creatures were extremely terrifying. Even after 
suffering consecutive injuries, the Hibernating Ghost Scythe was still able to erupt with strength 
that instantly severed the Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s arms. Such strength was astonishing!

Li Kuangdeng was rather satisfied with this and he coldly sneered: “So what if you have a wood 
type? It absolutely is not my Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s opponent. Without its arms, I want to see 
how your Devil Tree Battle Soldier will fight.”

Plant world creatures could grow plants, but their innate bodies needed to be recovered using 
normal methods. Without its arms, the Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s control and attacking abilities had 
definitely suffered a huge blow. The grey demon now just had to combine its sneak attacks with the 
Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s attacks and they would be able to defeat this low class dominator.

“Aren’t you excited too early?” Chu Mu was very bewildered. Why did all these idiots enjoy 
arrogantly chattering the moment they obtained a slight advantage? If they obtained an advantage, 
they should be shutting up and focusing on killing him.

The armless Devil Tree Battle Soldier stood in its original location. It didn’t let out a painful roar, 
nor did it show any signs of struggle. Moreover, it didn’t even look at the two arms it had lost.

Its eyes began to spin with a bloodthirsty glint!!

Suddenly, the split open plant cloud in the sky began to crow again. As the Devil Tree Battle Soldier 
let out a wild roar, the plant cloud abruptly pressed down, transforming into a heavenly plant snare!

The enormous plant snare instantly covered Li Kuangdeng’s Hibernating Ghost Scythe and grey 
demon. The roots on all sides rapidly pierced the two dominator rank creatures!



“You’re courting death!” when Li Kuangdeng saw that Chu Mu was surprisingly attacking again, he 
let out a loud laugh!

The Hibernating Ghost Scythe wouldn’t be so easily killed. As long as it still had fighting strength, 
each injury the Devil Tree Battle Soldier delivered would give more ghost energy for its next attack!

Thus, by the time the Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s attacks ended, the Hibernating Ghost Scythe could 
instantly chop the Devil Tree Battle Soldier in half!

The dense mattering of attacks rapidly pierced through the Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s body, 
leaving and increasing number of holes from which blood spilled out of. Li Kuangdeng knew that 
the Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s attacks were very strong and that this wave of attacks would 
probably leave the Hibernating Ghost Scythe heavily injured.

However, in order to condense enough energy to ensure the next attack was a sure-kill, Li 
Kuangdeng continued to have the Hibernating Ghost Scythe bear it!

“Pu pu pu!!!!!!!”

Once all of the attacks were finished, the Hibernating Ghost Scythe was left with an innumerable 
number of holes. There wasn’t a single piece of its body left intact.

The more injuries there were and the deeper they were, the more powerful the condensed ghost 
energy was. Although the Hibernating Ghost Scythe was covered in intense pain, its eyes were still 
cold as it raised its terrifying arms.



“This time, you really can go die!” Li Kuangdeng’s words were filled with heavy killing intent.

When Chu Mu heard Li Kuangdeng’s words, he silently laughed. Did this fellow really not use his 
dog eyes to observe what was going on around him before speaking?

Pai!!!!!!!”

A sound suddenly rang out an a thick arm whip, resembling a wild dragon sweeping its tail, fiercely 
smashed into the Hibernating Ghost Scythe that had just finished gathering its ghost energy!

The Hibernating Ghost Scythe was planning on launching its attack. How would it expect an 
enormous arm to suddenly appear beside it?

This smash crushed the Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s head, and blood splurted out from the holes on 
its body. Its body once more was launched into an arc through the air that smashing very close to 
the mountain range outside the northern city!

Li Kuangdeng’s heart violently beat, and his face contorted as he watched the Hibernating Ghost 
Scythe that was knocked flying.

An arm! That was the Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s arm. He remembered that he had just now sliced 
off the Devil Tree Battle Soldiers arm. How did it suddenly appear again?!!

Chapter 1125: Li Kuangdeng’s City Massacring Anger

Once he obtained the advantage, he should have immediately pushed for death.



Chu Mu wouldn’t do the same as Li Kuangdeng and idiotically trash talk. Promptly, he ordered 
Devil Tree Battle Soldier to attack the mountain range.

The disheveled and smashed mountain range suddenly began to violently shake. Regardless if it 
was loose dirt or stones, they erupted as fatal roots, rapidly winding around the injured Hibernating 
Ghost Scythe.

Hibernating Ghost Scythe’s entire body was injured. Ghost energy on its arms had been scattered by 
Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s arm strike. Now, facing these roots, it had no way to hold off.

Even more terrifying was that these roots not only pierced its body, but were also rapidly absorbing 
its life force.

As its life force rapidly faded, Hibernating Ghost Scythe didn’t even have the strength to cry out. It 
struggled in the roots, but its body slowly dried up.

Li Kuangdeng’s face was full of fear. He hastily rode on the grey demon, flying towards 
Hibernating Ghost Scythe.

Under normal circumstances, the recall incantation for soul pet trainers could be used 50 kilometers 
away. Li Kuangdeng was going to fly to this distance in order to recall his soul pet.

“O!!!!!”

Devil Tree Battle Soldier simultaneously launched several techniques. The root cloud in the sky 
quickly formed an interweaving plant wall in front of Li Kuangdeng, stopping him from recalling 
his soul pet.



Li Kuangdeng watched on as his soul pet’s life force quickly faded, and he went mad!

Finally, his grey demon managed to rip apart the plant wall, and he flew outside the city.

Chanting an incantation, Li Kuangdeng flusteredly recalled Hibernating Ghost Scythe back to its 
soul pet space.

The incantation array appeared on Hibernating Ghost Scythe. Its withered body instantly 
disappeared from the chaotic root attack.

Only, Li Kuangdeng had forgotten that Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s attacks carried poison.

The poison would continue to eat away at the soul pet’s life. Hibernating Ghost Scythe was already 
heavily injured and on the verge of death. Recalling it to its soul pet space would only prevent it 
from suffering further attacks. The poison would still remain.

A moment later, Li Kuangdeng suddenly clutched his chest. His face went deathly pale, and he let 
out huge gasps for air.

A soul injury. Clearly, Li Kuangdeng’s Hibernating Ghost Scythe had died in his soul pet space. The 
soul rupture caused an intense soul injury to him!

Li Kuangdeng lowered his head, and his body trembled. His half-grown hair fell along both sides of 
his face, covering his extremely dark eyes!



This was coldness after extreme anger. Li Kuangdeng’s eyes looked at the city, focusing on Chu Mu 
who was hovering above it!

“All you had to do was acknowledge our regime. Yet, you ended up senselessly resisting. You don’t 
even have the awareness of a low class creature. How are you going to survive in this world…” Li 
Kuangdeng stood there, alone, terrifyingly muttering to himself.

However, everyone could feel the frighteningness of his aura.

“Now that my soul pet has died, all of you will accompany it to death! This is the price you will pay 
for your stubbornness and refusal to acknowledge us!” Li Kuangdeng was like a madman as he 
roared. It seemed that in his eyes, everyone in the city had become livestock!

Hearing Li Kuangdeng’s madenned speech, Chu Mu still didn’t move.

The truth had been proven. Li Kuangdeng had never seen these people here as anything much. If 
this person was allowed to administer this place, it would undoubtedly cause a terrifying rain of 
blood.

Chu Mu had never felt himself to be a lower class person, nor would he accept the species 
classification of being a low class person for no reason. Listening to this man’s big talk, Chu Mu 
truly felt that these people who felt superior upon birth were laughable and pitiful.

Li Kuangdeng was already chanting. A torrential killing intent was surging from outside the city. 
The feeling, when it reached the city, was like countless bloody and savage wild beasts were 
gathering outside the city. At any moment, they could annihilate the city.



The array was enormous, and Ghost aura was ghastly. Piercing howls covered the sky and earth!

It was another ghost type creature. It was no wonder Li Kuangdeng was emitting a terrifying and 
fiendish aura!

Upon the incantation’s completion, a Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist astonishingly appeared 
from the blood colored pattern. A dense bloody mist lingered around it, forming a long bloody cloak 
that was so long, it practically dragged behind it on the ground. It hovered, extremely frighteningly, 
in front of the towering city tower!

“It’s… it’s a Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist!!” Senior Elder Pang’s expression changed.

Alliance Master Ling Chan’s Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist still left a deep lingering fear in the 
elders and senior elders.

“Everyone bleed!!!” Li Kuangdeng madly laughed.

Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist gave a devilish cry. The bloody mist on its body abruptly 
scattered, instantly covering all of the plant clouds.

The plants also began to bleed and mysteriously dried up, gradually falling from the sky.



Devil Tree Battle Soldier realized the might of the bloody mist. It hastily recalled the plant domain 
it had set up. Unfortunately, its recalling speed was much slower. Most of the plant clouds it had set 
up were withered.

Chu Mu was very astonished. It was no wonder Li Kuangdeng could big talk about slaughtering the 
city. He still had an exceptionally fiendish creature in Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist!

Li Kuangdeng’s Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist’s rank was visibly higher than Ling Chan’s. It 
was a creature a level higher than a low class dominator.

Moreover, with the blood mist, if everyone in the city were to bleed, its power could absolutely 
raise another one or two levels. If this happened, this thing’s fighting strength could reach the realm 
of the Holy King Thousand Wave Beast!

……

“This Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist is very terrifying. Moreover, this fellow wants to slaughter 
the city. Could it be he is not afraid of punishment from Cloud Realm’s Realm Lord? Although the 
people here are an inferior species, killing them will result in divine punishment!” said Wang Tong.

Zheng Tuo creased his brows. Li Kuangdeng’s strength was within his expectations. His strongest 
soul pet was indeed probably a level higher than the low class dominator rank.

However, Zheng Tuo never expected it to be a Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist!



Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist’s blood mist allowed its strength to increasingly grow as blood 
continued to flow. If this was the case, Zheng Tuo didn’t have complete confidence in being able to 
easily defeat him.

“We need to protect the people here. We should still take action. If too many people die, the higher 
ups will blame us…” Lan Rao realized that the situation had developed to an uncontrollable level 
and urgently spoke.

“Who cares. It’s best if more people die!” Yet, Ning Changqing was taking joy in the disaster.

Zheng Tuo nodded his head. He indeed didn’t think highly of the experts here. However, the 
situation had become problematic, and he himself would have trouble. Most importantly, Li 
Kuangdeng had gone mad!

“That’s strange. That fellow doesn’t seem nervous at all. His expression is too calm.” suddenly, 
Zheng Tuo looked at the incomparably calm Chu Mu.

……

Chu Mu initially wanted to have more fun with Li Kuangdeng. But after he summoned a soul pet 
that could endanger the safety of an entire city, he could only immediately get rid of him.

Chu Mu glanced at Mo Xie who was lying on his shoulder.

Mo Xie let out a yawn and languidly jumped off his shoulder. Her eyes were full of boredom as she 
stared at Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist, which had an imposing aura and was extremely 
arrogant.



Chapter 1126: Dying without Knowing

“Everyone get a good taste of this blood. See the appearance of Death while you’re still alive!” Li 
Kuangdeng was mad with violence.

Giving a command, the thick blood fog covered downwards over the north city.

North city still had many normal residents within it, many of which weren’t even soul pet trainers. 
After the blood fog shrouded them, they fainted right on the streets.

Their pores started opening up, letting out blood onto the streets.

At first, there were only a few drops of blood coming out, but the street had hundreds of thousands 
of people. With this large of an amount, the blood quickly became a river!

On the city wall, the senior elders and elders turned pale as they once again were shrouded in this 
blood mist.

They immediately gave commands to tell generals to evacuate the city people.

“Is it fast enough?” Li Kuangdeng laughed.

Evacuation was useless; the blood fog spread way faster than the speed of evacuation. This city’s 
millions of people would fall into the blood fog eventually no matter how they were evacuated. 
Once the entire city became a thick sea of blood, the scene would create an absolutely magnificent 
diagram. Only that much blood could make up for his dead Hibernating Ghost Scythe!



"King Chu, right? I want to see how you plan to save this city. There is no good ending to angering 
me!” Li Kuangdeng pointed at Chu Mu and laughed.

“Ling Chan was more powerful than you, but interestingly, he said the same thing before he died.” 
Chu Mu said in a calm voice.

As he spoke, the silver noble Mo Xie had already stepped forward, walking through the air like it 
were the ground. She passed through the thick blood fog as her fur remained splendid.

“Ling Chan, you mean you killed Ling Chan?” Li Kuangdeng’s laughter stopped suddenly as he 
stared at Chu Mu.

Li Kuangdeng had seen Ling Chan around three to four years ago. Because Ling Chan never 
stepped into spirit dominator rank, he had always been rejected from cloud gate realm. Li 
Kuangdeng had to admit that Ling Chan was indeed slightly stronger than he was. However, Ling 
Chan could only reach that peak, while Li Kuangdeng could surpass Ling Chan when given a few 
more decades.

However, no matter what, Ling Chan was an expert. If Ling Chan died to this person…..

“Sou~~~~~”

Just as LI Kuangdeng was thinking, he suddenly felt something pass by!

“Shua!!!!!!!”



A purple claw flitted past the Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist casting blood fog territory, almost 
as if it were a careless stroke of a brush.

Yet, the next moment, the next moment a shocking blood line appeared on the skull of the Ghost 
Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist, starting from its head, going across his chest, down to his abdomen 
until it cuts through its entire body!

“Gegegege~~~~~~”

Falling apart from the skull, the Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist slowly split in two!!

Blood seeped out of the crack. All the blood fog shrouding people only drew out a few drops of 
blood here and there, yet the Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist was bleeding like crazy!!

“Puchi~~~~~”

Blood became a fountain. The violence all but disappeared from the Ghost Eyed Blood Devil 
Buddhist. Its life force disappeared along with the blood leaving its split body.

Li Kuangdeng’s entire body seemed to be struck by a clap of thunder!

He didn’t even see what had attacked Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist, nor did he understand 
where that slash came from.



The blow from the soul pact breaking cut through, and Li Kuangdeng again clutched his chest, face 
pale.

Dead, Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist died!

The bloody mist remained shrouding the city’s skies. The four people preparing to help were also 
dumbfounded.

At this time, they only saw the Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist’s two parts, these low class 
dominator rank organism was killed in one hit like a weak servant rank soul pet!

Most importantly, the four of them didn’t even see the Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist die, or 
what killed it!

The blood fog started dissipating along with the Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist’s death. 
Countless people full of shock stared at the two pieces of the corpse!

The most terrifying enemy was one that could kill you without you even knowing. A coldness 
passed through Li Kuangdeng’s body!

An expert aura. The claws flashing was definitely a powerful organism. Li Kuangdeng felt it at the 
same moment of the Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist’s death. However, the only thing he saw 
was a little fox returning to Chu Mu.



The organism able to instantly kill Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist had to have reached middle 
class dominator rank, meaning a middle class dominator rank had just passed by him and casually 
took away his Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist’s life.

Able to take away the life of the Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist so easily, it meant that his life 
was for the taking too!

There were no overpowering experts nearby, only a little fox. Could the technique that had killed 
his Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist be the silver nine tail little fox?

Impossible, definitely impossible!

Middle class dominator ranks were extremely powerful organisms even in cloud realm. Yet, in this 
New Moon Ground with Normal Human Subspecies, the species rank restriction meant a power 
definitely couldn’t reach low class dominator rank.

A silver nine tail little fox, one that couldn’t even count as a soul pet, how could it have strength of 
above middle class dominator rank?

Li Kuangdeng couldn't accept or believe it. His gaze stared tightly at the casually walking nine tail 
little fox, giving an angry command to dark lion, who was still fighting Dead Dream.

Li Kuangdeng indeed was crazy. His Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist was already instantly killed, 
yet he told his dark lion to attack Mo Xie.



Enemies able to instantly die to one claw didn’t pique Mo Xie’s interest at all. She seemed to stroll 
casually, but Mo Xie’s speed was very quick. She had immediately gone from outside the city and 
to Chu Mu’s side, jumping onto Chu Mu’s shoulder.

Dark lion chased all the way yet didn’t even touch Mo Xie’s fur, instead getting caught by Dead 
Dream.

The dark purple thunder darted around Dead Dream. It didn’t like it when its prey was stolen. Its 
dark, deep eyes glinted as it completely surrounded the dark lion with thunder!

After Dead Dream found the chance to attack, its attacks became ferocious, its dark powers eating 
into the dark lion’s body.

The dark lion was dark type itself so it had a certain resistance to it. However, its dark type was a 
subtype, so the loss of life caused its body to become very weak and its mind slightly faded.

Quickly following, the wild dragons of thunder pierced the dark lion’s body, slamming it into the 
ground, shattering the wide streets of the city.

A large burning hole appeared aside Dark Lion. It painfully struggled but couldn’t get up no matter 
what.

Li Kuangdeng went crazy trying to figure out how he was defeated, yet sadly, his dark lion couldn’t 
even beat Chu Mu’s Dead Dream.



The blood fog had completely scattered by then, its aura disappearing. The elders and senior elders 
also didn’t see what had happened but were sure that Chu Mu’s nine tail fox supreme must have 
attacked.

Thinking back, even the Evil Slaughter Beast, many times stronger than this Ghost Eyed Blood 
Devil Buddhist, was destroyed in one slap. How could this Ghost Eyed Blood Devil Buddhist live? 
Again, everyone got to see the power of this fox supreme!!

“Impossible, impossible. There Can't be organisms above low class dominator rank here, nor can 
there be a middle class dominator rank…… impossible….” Li Kuangdeng started muttering to 
himself. Different from before, his mind was now near total collapse now!

Warrior rank human was never to surpass spirit dominator rank, meaning their soul pets could only 
each low class dominator rank too.

This was why Li Kuangdeng dared to come to New Moon Ground without knowing the experts’ 
strengths. There was no way anyone had anything beyond low class dominator rank.

However, nothing was as he imagined. The young man before him made Li Kuangdeng feel as if he 
were against a real expert from cloud realm.

“Beng!!!!!”

A loud stamp came from far away in the mountains outside the city. The golden Thousand Wave 
Beast stepped over the mountains, wearing a body full of proud wounds as it held the seven faced 
beast’s body in its mouth.



Standing on top of Thousand Wave Beast, Prince Chao glanced at the finished fight as well as the 
mentally insane Li Kuangdeng.

Li Kuangdeng’s defeat was something the prince had expected. With Chu Mu’s strength, he didn’t 
need to waste this much time at all. This Li Kuangdeng didn’t even know he was used as simple 
entertainment, and couldn’t accept his own loss. Indeed, he was nothing more than an arrogant 
prick.

Li Yi was like Li Kuangdeng, as pale as could be.

As for Han Wannong, his expression was even worse.

Li Kuangdeng from cloud realm had lost so mysteriously. More shockingly, Han Wannong 
despaired to find such a powerful expert appear in human realm!!

“I’ve always done things by getting rid of every threat.” Chu Mu glanced at the other three and said 
calmly.

The calmer Chu Mu was, the more of a shiver the three got. It was scarier than any amount of 
killing intent!

“Devil Tree Battle Soldier, it’s all yours.” Chu Mu said lightly.

Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s roots were already slowly encroaching upon them, entrapping the three 
defenseless people like a reaper’s tendrils.



The nearing of death caused the three to come back to reality with cold sweat. Han Wannong and Li 
Yi even wanted to beg for mercy, yet Devil Tree Battle Soldier quickly sealed their throats with a 
piercing root, absorbing even their internal organs!

Chapter 1127: Tell Him to Get His Head Ready For the Taking!

North of the City, in the Mountains

Ye Wansheng wiped the blood on his face while revealing a terrifying smile.

By Ye Wansheng was was his Multi Colored Devil Tiger. It was full of wounds and nearly couldn’t 
stand upright.

In front of Ye Wansheng was a dominator rank dove with a wing ripped, trickling with blood that 
slowly created a pool below it.

Standing on this dominator rank dove was the female soul pet trainer Xue Luan. At this moment, 
her face was pale and full of fear, as she stared in disbelief at the man walking over.

Lost, she had lost. A pseudo dominator rank soul pet losing to a near dominator rank Multi Colored 
Devil Tiger.

“To women that anger me or I hate, I usually rape them first before killing them, but for your face 
and body, I’ll graciously skip the first step.” Ye Wansheng smiled.

This smile was worse than a devil’s. His words hit harder for Xue Luan than if she were just 
violated, causing her to get so angry she nearly spewed blood.



“Come, kill it, don’t bite, this woman’s heart is dirty.” Ye Wansheng said to Multi Colored Devil 
Tiger.

Multi Colored Devil Tiger was in an excited state too. After all, it defeated an organism with higher 
rank. The largest accomplishment in battle was to beat someone of higher rank, and Multi Colored 
Devl Tiger successfully did that this time!

Multi colored Devil Tiger walked before Xue Luan and slowly extended a claw, covering Xue 
Luan’s face with its shadow. Xue Luan wanted to die now. She had never seen someone with this 
dirty of a mouth, yet she had lost to him.

“Pa!!!!!!!!!”

Multi Colored Devil Color didn’t give Xue Luan much time to think. With the fall of the claw, Xue 
Luan’s face was bloodied, her head nearly twisting off its neck.

Ye Wansheng glanced at the corpse one more time, and stole the spatial ring before leaving with 
Multi Colored Devil tiger.

……

“En? Why is there only one left?” Ye Wansheng returned to North city and quickly noticed that 
there was only one Li Kuangdeng left still floating in the air.

However, the situation was evident to all. Li Kuangdeng could no longer fight with any soul pets.



The fellow was just floating in midair and mumbling, “If you kill me…… you will pay a price…..” 
and other gibberish.

Ye Wansheng never understood these people who remain arrogant even after losing, or those that 
yelled without a solid background. Sometimes the opponent didn’t even want to kill, but after 
hearing the threats, they were forced to.

Li Kuangdeng was yelling at the same time devil tree battle soldier’s roots were entangling his 
body, strangling him like a hungry python, twisting a few bones in the process.

Li Kuangdeng’s mumbling quickly became piercing cries. In the same way as before, Devil Tree 
Battle Soldier’s roots were forced into Li Kuangdeng and absorbed his lifeforce.

Li Kuangdeng painfully struggled, and his eyes turned white.

From the moment he stepped foot in New Moon Ground, Li Kuangdeng felt like the absolute 
dominator of the land. However, he never would have thought that he would end up like this. 
Arrogance and hubris were always the largest reason experts died. There were always more 
powerful people in this world, and power was never determined solely by species rank.

Slowly, Li Kuangdeng’s body lost all its water and became a shrivelled corpse, slowly falling from 
the sky, becoming powder after hitting the ground. The only person who hadn’t died, Han Wannong, 
felt like he was in a nightmare, as he fell into a state of seeming soullessness.

Devil Tree Battle Soldier’s roots were already in his throat. With a command from Chu Mu, his 
downfall would be the same as Li Kuangdeng, feeling pain before slowly dying.



Chu Mu glanced at Old Han to ask how he wanted to deal with Han Wannong.

“Kill him.” Old Han’s eyes glinted with coldness as he said without any hesitation.

Han Wannong originally thought Old Han would care about his past feelings, yet he never would 
have thought that this was the first thing out of Old han’s mouth. He felt as if thunder had struck 
him.

“Wuwuwu!!” Han Wannong was about to speak, but couldn’t beg with his throat filled.

Old Han looked at him and sucked in a deep breath, “However you hurt me, however angry I am, I 
would forgive you. However, this time, you wanted the entire Wanxiang Relam and Tianxia Realm 
to fall. You endangered our entire human species, so death is the lightest punishment you can get!”

Old Han finished speaking and nodded towards Chu Mu.

Han Wannong started struggling, because Devil Tree Battle Soldier started sucking his innards.

His body started losing water and shriveling down.

Finally, like Li Kuangdeng, his shrivelled corpse fell from the skies and shattered!



With every hero that allowed a species to survive and go on, there was a traitor or destroyer that 
could end the species. Old Han already knew that he couldn’t call Tianxia Realm and Wanxiang 
Realm as the entire human race. However, the billions of people on New Moon Ground were still a 
complete group that couldn’t forgive actions that threatened their survival!

Old Han’s decisiveness caused Chu Mu to realize that stepping into a top realm did not’ only mean 
that one was the most powerful or was invincible. A lot of times, it also meant unintentionally 
picking up the burden of species survival. The once most powerful Old Han had this idea deeply 
rooted, causing him to be so angry and decisive towards his grandson.

“There’s a corpse in the mountains too, just deal with it too.” In the city, Ye Wansheng saw the 
sacred guards that were helping to clean up the aftermath and said slightly pleased in himself.

After he finished, he glanced at Chu Mu who was still in the sky and said, “People outside Clout 
Gate aren’t that amazing, huh? I wonder how powerful the other four from Dark Sky Ocean World 
are.”

As Ye Wansheng finished speaking, he glanced over at the lighthouse.

“So there was one that you dealt with.” Chu Mu was wondering why they only had three people.

However, Ye Wansheng’s strength caused Chu Mu to be slightly surprised. This fellow stepped into 
dominator rank too. It looked like the improvement in strength wasn’t limited to just him.

Of course, Chu Mu didn’t forget about Zhen Kuo and the other three still waiting in the lighthouse.

Chu Mu rode Dead Dream towards the lighthouse and floated before the four of them.



He didn't speak, instead simply looking down upon the four shocked faces.

Zhen Kuo, Wang Dan, Lan Rao, and Ning Changqing saw King Chu before them, and felt an 
immense pressure fall upon them, causing them to have difficulty breathing.

King Chu easily defeated even Li Kuangdeng. One had to know that even Zhen Kuo didn’t have 
absolute confidence in beating Li Kuangdeng.

Clearly, King Chu was stronger than them, and not by just a bit!!

The four of them weren’t much different in mentality than Clout Gate people. New Moon Ground 
was a half isolated world. Though they had a lot of people, because of their low species rank, the 
amount of experts in the realm were definitely limited.

So they were like Li Kuangdeng. The moment they stepped in, they acted like the elite.

What was different was, they came to protect the realm!

Imagine, if they had come to take over the realm like Li Kuangdeng, would they be corpses like the 
Clout Gate people too?

“How does Zhen Wu relate to you?” After a while, Chu Mu finally spoke.



Zhen Kuo stared momentarily, not sure why there was this kind of question. After hesitating, he 
replied, “He’s my big brother.”

“Go back and tell him to get his head ready for the taking. I’ll go take it when I have time.” Chu Mu 
said coldly.

Chu Mu’s words caused the four of them to be stunned.

This man wanted to take Border Commander Zhen Wu’s head, this…… this was all to crazy!

Li Kuangdeng was called Border Commander Li. Border Commander was a title, representing an 
expert within a border territory. The lowest was Border Soldier. Usually, anyone with dominator 
rank organisms and was loyal to a border territory could have that title.

Border Generals were higher than Border Soldiers. They must have some contribution to society, 
power, and have a powerful background. These people were hegemons of a territory.

As for Border Commander, that was an even more powerful presence. At least, even all of Li 
Kuangdeng’s soul pets together couldn’t beat any of Border Commander’s main soul pet.

Border Commander Zhen Wu’s power was something that even as a little brother, he didn’t know 
for sure. Yet, the young king of New Moon Ground in front of him said he wanted to take Border 
Commander Zhen Wu’s head. Even on their land, no one dared to say that.

“You…… don’t you know what Border Commander means?” Lan Rao asked.



Chu Mu shook his head.

“Then why do you want to take his head…… any Border Commander is many times more powerful 
than Li Kuangdeng!” Lan Rao continued.

“So what?” Chu Mu replied lightly.

Lan rao was speechless. Did this person not realize just how powerful and terrifying a Border 
Commander is?

“My brother loves challenges from people. However, he doesn't accept all challenges. You indeed 
are powerful. If you step out of New Moon Ground, experience Dark Sky Ocean World and Clout 
Gate’s cruel reality, and still want to challenge him, then I will help you convey your wishes.” Zhen 
Kuo said very sincerely and genuinely.

After watching this battle, Zhen Kuo was already in admiration of Chu Mu’s power. Someone who 
could become this powerful in such an environment had to be a true expert.

However, even so, he didn’t think this King Chu could match Border Commander Zhen Wu.

Chapter 1128: Private Territory

Zheng Tuo could see that Chu Mu was unfriendly with his people.

However, Zheng Tuo clearly wasn’t as stupid as Li Kuangdeng. At least he admitted that before 
coming here, he didn’t put the people here in his eyes. His arrogant attitude indeed wouldn’t be 
accepted by the natives here.



“Let’s go.” Zheng Tuo swept his gaze over the corpses, and spoke to the three people behind him.

The three people were fearful of Chu Mu now. Indeed, they could also be considered foreigners and 
if they were to truly anger him, perhaps their ending would be like Li Kuangdeng and the three 
others.

Chu Mu didn’t stop them, allowing them to leave.

……

“Chu Mu, will these people have other plans?” Mu Qingyi watched the four people from beyond the 
Dark Sky Ocean World and softly spoke.

“Probably not.” Chu Mu waved his hand.

They had come here to protect this place and this was a good thing. Only, it was their attitude that 
was completely unacceptable. Chu Mu didn’t kill them because he didn’t want to ruin Ning Maner’s 
kindness.

Wanxiang City returned once more to calm. However, the existence of external powers now made 
Three Great Palaces anxious and uneasy.



Three Great Palaces were presently hesitating whether to publicize the news about external worlds. 
The past generations of rulers had all ordered a seal on information, and the Sealed Mouth Event 
had also pertained to external forces. Keeping the information a secret had its pros, as well as cons.

The pros were that New Moon Land’s people would have a higher target to strive for and an 
awareness of their species crisis. The cons were that it would sweep up a terrifying unrest, since 
nobody would accept that they were low class people.

……

Chu Mu was unable to decide on this matter. He was innately an unqualified ruler, and let Liu 
Binglan decide everything.

Liu Binglan originally had a few conjectures towards those from beyond Cloud Gate. Now that the 
force beyond Cloud Gate had sent people here, she was able to confirm the reality of different 
species of humans.

Since this had all appeared, there was a decision to make. Liu Binglan’s choice was to make this 
public.

However, she also chose a soft-core policy, which was to gradually release the information.

First, she would let Tianxia Realm and Wanxiang Realm’s people know that there were other human 
territories outside the forbidden regions. Then, she would slowly disseminate information people 
were unwilling to accept in the form of conjectures. This would allow New Moon Land’s people to 
first suspect the truth, then understand more about it, then make their own guess, then finally accept 
it.



Any empire that wanted to develop and prosper had no shortage of miseries and hardships. Tianxia 
Realm and Wanxiang Realm were the same. With any awareness of miseries, the first thing to do 
was to severely reduce the infighting. Experts had to place their goals much further and longer. 
Additionally, with pressure, there would be new breakthroughs, otherwise this species would face 
decline over a long period of time.

Li Binglan’s decision was a long-term consideration. Since there were different human subspecies, 
they would continue to enter New Moon Land like Li Kuangdeng in the future. Moreover, it wasn’t 
every generation that a person like Chu Mu would exist who could defeat these foreigners. When 
the future arrived, this piece of land would need to rely on themselves to defend it.

……

A month after Cloud Gate’s invaders had come.

Wanxiang City continued to develop. In consideration of the fact that foreign enemies had appeared, 
Wanxiang City’s walls were in extreme need of more experts to defend itself.

Towards the experts from beyond Heavenly Mountain, Liu Binglan had already begun to slowly 
disseminate the news. She used the fight between Chu Mu and Li Kuangdeng as a justification, 
forcing people to believe in the existence of other human territories beyond the forbidden regions. 
Moreover, that it was likely they were extremely strong.

This matter caused no small amount of unrest. As the matter was disseminated, it swept through 
every kingdom and region.

There were things that had to be faced head-on. Avoiding it was of no use. Chu Mu felt that Liu 
Binglan’s decision to publicize it was correct.



In the past month, Chu Mu hadn’t gone anywhere. He began to frantically obtain all sorts of 
information from Old Li about the areas beyond the forbidden regions. This way, when he entered 
those territories, he wouldn’t be as lost.

……

“King Chu, Lan Rao from beyond the Dark Sky Ocean World requests to see you.” a holy guard 
politely bowed and spoke to Chu Mu who was quietly cultivating next to a lake.

“She didn’t leave? Have her come.” calmly said Chu Mu.

The holy guard bowed once more before leaving.

Not long after, the holy guard brought Lan Rao in and then left.

Lan Rao gave a slight bow and softly knelt on one knee. She charmingly gave a smile and said: 
“Thank you King Chu for being willing to see me.”

Chu Mu glanced at Lan Rao. This woman’s politeness stemmed from both her fear of his strength, 
and probably her innate enjoyment of using her friendly and flirtatious appearance.

“Didn’t I tell you guys to go back?” Chu Mu didn’t understand why Lan Rao had stayed.



“Zheng Tuo and Ning Changqing have indeed gone back. Although King Chu’s strength does not 
require us to do more than is needed, for the sake of returning a good report after our mission, we 
need to make a good show of appearance. What do you think?” Lan Rao was looking down, but her 
lips had faintly raised, revealing a slightly flirtatious and attractive expression.

“Up to you. What’s up?” Chu Mu remained unmoved.

There were certain women who looked like they were easy to get close to, and it was easy to obtain 
their intention. They were full of attraction that could make one’s heart itch. Yet, each time a man 
was hooked and attempted to pursue this woman in hopes of obtaining something from her, she 
would always maintain a slight distance from him. Then, she would prevent him from getting closer 
or further, always keeping him in the palm of her hand.

Lan Rao was clearly of this type. She enjoyed throwing flirtatious glances at every outstanding 
man, especially those who were young, strong, handsome, and brave like Chu Mu. She was also 
certain that in every man’s heart was an itch to cheat on their partner. A slight nudge and this itch 
would become very itchy and hard to bear.

Lan Rao knew that her looks, body, and charm were top-tier. Her strength had also reached the 
dominator rank. Although she could be certain King Chu didn’t lack beautiful women, this didn’t 
mean she couldn’t make his heart itch.

Of course, Lan Rao’s main reason for being here wasn’t to charm King Chu. Instead, it was to tell 
him something.

“You’ve killed Li Kuangdeng, so in the eyes of Cloud Realm’s ruler, this place still doesn’t have an 
administrator. Therefore, in probably another one or two years, without any news, Cloud realm will 
send more people here. Moreover, they will be even stronger….” Lan Rao’s tone was soft. With 
each sentence, she would take small steps closer to Chu Mu, allowing him to smell her bodily 
fragrance.



“Continue speaking.” said Chu Mu.

“Therefore, your land will always be invaded by others. Perhaps you can banish all invaders, but I 
believe that you will not always be able to oversee this place. There are two ways to deal with this 
problem. The first is to rely on some faction, for example the faction we are in. This way will 
essentially give you a protective name that people like Li Kuangdeng will not dare violate.”

“What about the second way?” asked Chu Mu.

“The second way is a bit troublesome because your New Moon Land is part of Cloud Realm’s 
territory. If you don’t wish to be under their administrator, you need to leave. The only way of doing 
so is going to Divine Sect and telling them that New Moon Land is your private territory. Divine 
Sect will acquire information from various places to ensure you are the publicly accepted king of 
this territory and that over two thirds of the spirit emperors of this territory recognize you. Then, 
New Moon Land will be annexed from Cloud Realm.”

As Lan Rao spoke, she intentionally glanced at Chu Mu. Seeing that he was still calmly and 
composedly watching her, she was slightly disappointed. She could only continue: “You should 
understand that if one of your territories were to be mysteriously annexed from you, you would 
definitely use force to obtain it back. Thus, the moment you indicate you want this territory, you 
will face the wrath of Cloud Realm’s ruler.”

“Divine Sect’s rules ordain that after a territory is annexed, the original owner has the qualification 
to choose to reclaim it. Both sides can enter a war on the scale of a million people that will not 
attack cities. If the new owner wins, the piece of territory will not be encroached on by any faction 
in the next ten years. If the original owner wins, it will reclaim the territory and have the power to 
punish the losers anyway it wishes with the exception of slaughtering. But this could also mean 
enslaving you all…”

Chapter 1129: A Xuan Item to Step Into the Spirit Dominator Rank

Chu Mu nodded his head. He approximately understood the meaning of Lan Rao’s words.



“If you don’t have anything else to say, you can go back.” said Chu Mu.

Lan Rao gave a bow and said: “King Chu, if you make a decision, you can come find me.”

Chu Mu called over a holy guard, and had him bring Lan Rao to the guest courtyards, letting her 
choose a place to live.

Polite actions should be returned by polite actions. Chu Mu couldn’t be bothered to haggle with 
these people from beyond the Dark Sky Ocean World. Since they had come to protect this place, 
there was no harm in leaving them here. It could be considered adding a bit of fighting strength to 
Wanxiang Realm.

After Lan Rao left, Chu Mu chanted an incantation, summoning Yu Sha in front of him.

When Lan Rao had been speaking just now, Chu Mu had undone the first soul restriction. After 
summoning her, he asked: “Is what she said true?”

“Yes.” Yu Sha nodded her head.

After two years of training, this arrogant and haughty queen had already somewhat realized that she 
would not be able to free herself from Chu Mu’s hands in the short-term. Therefore, she was much 
more obedient that originally. Normally, she would answer anything Chu Mu asked her.



Chu Mu obviously knew that with this woman’s character, she would never be completely obedient. 
At least whatever she was scheming, Chu Mu had an approximate understanding.

“In a war between millions, Wanxiang Realm will definitely lose. Is there no other way?” said Chu 
Mu.

“Yes. Cloud Region has the power to revoke this and choose another method of fighting. A war 
between millions is only one method. Another method is to have the owners of the territory fight it 
out. You would then have to defeat the last first rank leader directly subordinate to the territory.” 
responded Yu Sha.

“Who was the last first rank leader of Cloud Realm?” asked Chu Mu.

“I don’t know.” said Yu Sha.

“You don’t know?”

When Yu Sha had assumed the Empress Concubine position, she had practically already come to 
know everything about Cloud Region. She should know who the leader was.

Yu Sha glanced at Chu Mu. Seeing that this fellow was looking suspiciously at her, she sneered: 
“How could I remember such a person’s name?”

“Then what is his strength like?” asked Chu Mu.



“I don’t know.” Yu Sha continued to respond expressionlessly.

“Then you can return.” Chu Mu chanted an incantation, wanting to throw her back to her soul pet 
space.

The moment she heard she was going to be thrown back, Yu Sha immediately grew anxious. Her 
obstinate eyes carried a trace of pleading, as if she wanted to say something but was hesitating.

“Fine. If you have something to say, then say it.” Chu Mu showed a rare instance of kindness.

“Give me three days to cultivate.” hastily said Yu Sha. Just like how Chu Mu’s strength came from 
the unity of his soul remembrance and the White Nightmare’s strength, Yu Sha’s strength came from 
the unity of her soul remembrance and the Evil Good Flower Queen.

What was unexpected was that after two years of devil flame burning, her mental force had already 
entered the dominator rank. If she broke through this time, her strength would greatly increase 
again.

“Do you think I will give you the time?” Chu Mu felt this was laughable.

If her strength increased, there was a chance she could free herself from his binds.

“Your… your strength increases so slow!” Yu Sha said, somewhat vexed.



Chu Mu didn’t pay any heed to Yu Sha’s transformation from a gentle and soft low voice to a 
humiliated rage. He slowly said: “It’s almost as if my soul pet trainer talent was stolen away by you, 
eh?”

“It wasn’t!” Yu Sha’s response was very fast.

Old Li had already told him that Liu Binglan was a higher ranked human. Thus, as her son, Chu Mu 
should have inherited her talent that would allow him to easily reach the spirit emperor rank without 
even cultivating. However, Chu Mu hadn’t and Liu Binglan had told him that his talent could have 
been stolen by the defector woman.

As for how to steal it back, Chu Mu was currently thinking about it.

Yu Sha realized that she was in trouble. Chu Mu’s talent was still extremely important to her 
strength increase. If it was taken back, it would take a long time for her Evil Good Flower Queen to 
grow to the tenth phase.

With that detestable old racoon man in existence, Yu Sha really couldn’t be certain if that rotten old 
man would be able to find a way to steal back the talent.

She was a bit flustered and hastily said: “Talent no longer has any meaning at your rank. I can help 
you enter the spirit dominator rank…”

“How?” Chu Mu indeed was thinking of how to enter the spirit dominator rank. Otherwise, aside 
from Mo Xie who had undergone a species mutation, it would be hard for his other soul pets to rise 
in rank.



“I need the help of a few xuan items. These xuan items definitely won’t be found in Wanxiang 
Realm or Tianxia Realm. Aren’t you planning on going to Cloud Realm? I know a few places with 
xuan items. I can help you enter the spirit dominator rank.” said Yu Sha.

Yu Sha’s current tone was much more pleasant to the ears. It was soft and silky, making the listener 
feel very comfortable. It was like she was singing, and the nearby holy guards couldn’t help but 
poking their heads in. They were silently wondering why another woman had suddenly appeared 
next to King Chu.

Chu Mu was able to approximately differentiate whether this woman was speaking the truth or lies.

In truth, Chu Mu had already asked Old Li already whether he could take back his talent. Old Li 
had told him he didn’t know of any effective methods.

Interestingly, Chu Mu’s simple mentioning of it, and this woman had confessed it herself.

Talent indeed was useless at Chu Mu’s current rank. The most important thing for him was to enter 
the spirit dominator rank. Once he did so and frantically increased his soul pets’ strengths, his soul 
remembrance would naturally increase as well. If Yu Sha was right about there being a method for 
him to enter the spirit dominator rank, this was obviously a good thing.

As they were speaking, Prince Chao and Mu Qingyi walked in.

The two of them saw Yu Sha who was adjacent to Chu Mu and showed slightly fearful expressions. 
However, thinking about it again, this woman was a prisoner, and there ostensibly was nothing to be 
afraid of.



“Chu Mu, I heard you were planning on travelling beyond Cloud Gate?” Prince Chao spoke first.

“Yes, once Qingzi finishes concocting, we will leave.” said Chu Mu.

“You husband and wife couple are planning on continuing to travel the world, eh?” Prince Chao 
laughed, but suddenly realized Mu Qingyi was next to him. He secretly threw a glance at her, and 
hastily gave a hollow laugh to cover it.

Prince Chao’s words indeed put Mu Qingyi in an awkward spot.

Mu Qingyi innately was dedicated to her pursuit of the soul pet path. When she came to know of 
outside worlds, she really wanted to travel them and train in higher ranked regions. Yet, when 
Prince Chao said Chu Mu and Qingzi were going to travel the world, how could she just butt in? It 
would be best if she didn’t intrude.

Even if the rumors were circulating that her relationship with Chu Mu wasn’t just normal, she could 
sense that Ye Qingzi was the only one in Chu Mu’s heart. If she were to join them, perhaps she 
would even break them apart. Her prideful heart wasn’t willing to do this.

After hesitating, Mu Qingyi felt that it was best to just travel alone.

The news of King Mu being alive in Cloud Realm had given Mu Qingyi a direction. She was 
planning on first finding her great-grandfather. Perhaps her grandfather and other family members 
would be there as well.

“Hmm, you don’t plan on going together?” Chu Mu was a bit puzzled by Prince Chao’s words.



Prince Chao’s eyes lit up and he hastily said: “You’re planning on bringing us too?”

Prince Chao and Mu Qingyi had both already entered the dominator rank. If they wanted to rise 
another level, they would have to wanter to the outside world. Chu Mu was very certain that the two 
of them had a sense of impatience and longing for higher levels. If they didn’t travel to the outside 
world, Chu Mu would feel it was strange.

“Haha, I was afraid you felt your strength was too different from ours, and didn’t want to bring us.” 
Prince Chao spoke back with a glib tongue.

Chu Mu bitterly laughed. Strength was something that could always be increased. The world 
beyond Cloud Gate was unfamiliar and bringing more people along would allow for more people 
who could look after each other.

“Qingyi, what about you?” asked Chu Mu.

Since it wasn’t just Chu Mu and Ye Qingzi travelling the world, she couldn’t consider it interfering 
with their relationship. Thus, she nodded her head. She felt that everyone going together was better.

As the three of them spoke, a holy guard brought Lan Rao in.

“Why did she come back?” Chu Mu was confused as he looked at Lan Rao.

Lan Rao had suddenly returned, because she felt she should tell King Chu about the option to 
choose a private fight of territory owners. Intentionally hiding it from him could end up backfiring.



Only, Lan Rao hadn’t expected that Chu Mu would have someone next to him that had a rather clear 
understanding of the outside world.

“King Chu, just now I forgot to tell you that there’s a different method of fighting…” Lan Rao 
bowed again and looked up.

She looked first at Chu Mu then glanced at Prince Chao and Mu Qingyi.

Lan Rao had seen Prince Chao and Mu Qingyi before and as a woman, she subconsciously 
compared herself with Mu Qingyi.

After, her gaze fell on Empress Concubine Yu Sha who was standing diagonally behind Chu Mu. 
Suddenly, the smile on her face froze.

Did there really exist such a beautiful woman in this world?

Lan Rao’s eyes momentarily went absent-minded before quickly diverting her gaze. In the past 
when she encountered women with top tier looks and temperament, she would naturally compare 
herself. This was perhaps something that innately happened for most women.

However, in front of this woman who was wearing blue colored flower petal clothing, she suddenly 
felt self-ashamed. The perfect and flawless complexion made it impossible for women to even 
resist. The incorporeal pride and noble aura was like a flower lotus that blossomed atop an ice 
mountain; it was both far and unattainable!



Lan Rao found it hard to believe that such an outstanding celestial woman would exist.

Even more shocking was that this woman was docilely standing next to King Chu, the man she 
wanted to charm. Yet, King Chu remained unmoved.

“I already know.” Chu Mu stopped Lan Rao from continuing and said: “In a little bit I’m going to 
leave this place. If something unexpected happens, I hope that Young Lady Lan will promptly lend 
a hand.”

“Of course… of course. We came here to protect this territory.” a new smile rose on Lan Rao’s face. 
“Then… then Lan Rao will excuse herself first.”

Seeing the slowly leaving Lan Rao, Prince Chao threw a glance at Empress Concubine Yu Sha who 
was standing next to Chu Mu, looking very obedient. He quietly laughed and said: “That woman’s 
ego seems to have been injured.”

Chapter 1130: Capture a Few to Upgrade our Offspring

Chu Mu turned around to glance at Emperor Concubine Yu Sha and saw the woman’s eyes shift 
slightly.

“You used your technique to charm her?” Chu Mu asked.

“No.” Yu Sha said.

Did she even need to use a technique? She herself had the ancestor flower’s aura, so those who try 
to act pretty were like grass in front of a flower. The more they tried to compare themselves, the 
more self-abased they felt.



“Speaking of which, if we throw you into cloud realm, can you create absolute chaos there too?” 
Chu Mu said.

Yu Sha’s eyes flashed. Cloud Realm was supposed to be her next target, yet she never would have 
thought she would fall to Chu Mu’s hands in this tiny Wanxiang City. if Chu Mu let her free, taking 
down cloud realm was only a matter of time.

“Just wanted to say something random.” Chu Mu had guessed this woman’s ambition but wanted to 
make fun of her.

Prince Chao and Mu Qingyi both let out a breath. To speak the truth, they really were afraid of Chu 
Mu just letting Evil Good Queen free. If she got freedom, she definitely would destroy countless 
more people’s lives.

“Then let’s prepare for travel.” Mu Qingyi said.

Since they were leaving Wanxiang Realm, there was some things Mu Qingyi had to take care of.

Prince Chao needed to talk with three palace elders as well. After all, the future leader was him. It 
wasn’t great if he just left like that.

“I’ll give you five days of freedom.” Chu Mu glanced at Yu Sha and said calmly.

After speaking, Chu Mu walked towards the palaces, leaving behind Yu Sha.



“Thank….. Thank you master.” Yu Sha quickly said softly. Though she was very unwilling, to 
confirm her five days of time she had to play the obedient slave girl well or else she may be 
retracted in a moment’s notice.

Of course, Yu Sha was also confused. This man knew that with these five days she could escape, yet 
he still dared to give it to her.

Chu Mu was giving Yu Sha time to cultivate for a simple reason. Her strengthening would 
strengthen his soul remembrance too. As for whether she could escape the restriction, Chu Mu felt 
that, instead of restricting her strength, he might as well put all the effort into strengthening himself. 
After all, the enemies he was going to soon face were powerful. Without motivation, how was he 
going to compete against these people of higher species rank?

As for whether this woman was going to run away, Chu Mu wasn’t as worried about. If she ran 
away, Chu Mu could catch her again. Let alone, the Evil Good Queen was sealed tightly in his 
second soul pact. If Yu Sha ran away, she could only bring her human soul and shell.

Without Evil Good Queen, Yu Sha wasn’t even a soul pet trainer, and could do nothing much.

……

The morning ten days later

A soft morning light bathed the solemn Wanxiang City. Streets slowly were being populated by 
people starting their busy days.



The appearance of outer enemies didn’t seem to affect things here much. It kept the peace it had 
ever since the war ended.

Outside east city gate, the simply dressed Chu Mu stood by two parts of greenery.

Everyone agreed to meet there. The reason they didn’t leave straight form three palace was to 
prevent ill intended people from knowing they left and cause unwanted trouble.

To the public, Chu Mu and Prince Chao all said they were going to go “train”, giving them some 
lingering power over the realm during their leave.

“Chu Mu, you want to go towards Divine Sect and list Wanxiang and Tianxia Realm as your 
personal territory first?” Ye Wansheng asked for Chu Mu’s plans and received such a response.

Ye Wansheng didn’t know what Divine Sect was. It seemed to be a very respected faction from the 
other world with absolute authority. Ye Wansheng only felt that it may be too ostentatious to be at 
the forefront of everything fight from the start.

Chu Mu indeed wanted to do this. There were three things he wanted to do this trip to Cloud Gate. 
First thing was to raise his strength to spirit dominator rank. Only with power did he have the chips 
to negotiate.

Second was to list New Moon ground as his own territory. This way, Chu Mu could at least ensure 
no outer experts came to the two realms to run amok.



Of course, in this process, Chu Mu was going to look for Chu Tianmang. Since Chu Tianmang had 
always been outside of Cloud Gate, then maybe he might not even know of the news of him being 
alive.

In ten or so years, Chu Mu still wished to be reunited with his father.

“Chu Mu, put safety above everything else.” Liu Binglan looked disapprovingly at Chu Mu, feeling 
reluctant to part. She had been anxious for the past few days because Chu Mu was going to an 
unknown region with unknown amount of experts. Just how dangerous it was was something Liu 
Binglan couldn't even imagine.

“Don’t worry, I’ll be fine. I’ll bring dad back too, we’ll have a family reunion then.” Chu Mu knew 
Liu Binglan would get worried and afraid for him and smiled calmingly.

“Let that man do whatever he wants to do.” Speaking of Chu Tianmang, Liu Binglan’s mood fell.

Chu Mu laughed helplessly at the now stern Liu Binglan. Just how much of a grudge was there 
between his parents, acting so distant from each other. Was there really a need for this?

Standing aside, Ye Qingzi laughed quietly and whispered to Chu Mu, “They’re pretty interesting, I 
wonder what happened in their past?”

Chu Mu shook his head helplessly and said to Ye Qingzi, “They’re definitely not as compatible as 
we are……”

“Who said we were compatible. I still remember thinking you were the most devious person I knew, 
hiding everything inside your heart and not sharing.” Ye QIngzi gave Chu Mu’s arm a pinch.



No matter what, Chu Mu was bringing Chu Tianmang back. No matter what grudge they had, he 
was going to help alleviate it.

Liu Binglan knew that warning Chu Mu, with his personality, would only end up being futile, as he 
forgot trivial things like that. So, she simply told Ye Qingzi to keep an eye on him for her.

Liu Binglan had already taken to see Ye Qingzi as truly her daughter. They often had topics to talk 
about together too. At any rate, Ye Qingzi probably met Liu Binglan more often than Chu Mu did, 
and they were probably more familiar with each other.

“They still not here/” Ye Wansheng sat aside, chewing a straw in his mouth, occasionally glancing 
at the women wandering the streets.

“Aha, Chu Mu look there on your right side, how’s that one!” Ye Wansheng seemed to find a 
treasure as his eyes lit up.

Chu Mu really didn’t have the mind to look at beauties, but with Ye Wansheng’s yell, he 
subconsciously turned to check her out.

Indeed, Ye Wansheng’s eye was good. The yellow clothed woman dressed nicely really was a 
refreshing sight to see. She was slowly walking out of the crowd, seemingly looking for something.

Chu Mu subconsciously glanced a few more times and was just looking at her face, when he 
realized something about her seemed familiar.



“Eh…..it’s Goddess Mu…..” Ye Wansheng’s expression stiffened.

Chu Mu smiled as well. Mu Qingyi’s beauty didn’t need any introduction. It was impressive that Ye 
Wansheng pulled Mu Qingyi right out of the crowd just by glancing around.

Mu Qingyi noticed everyone, and walked over with a smile.

She glanced at Liu Binglan and said, “Female supreme, are you coming with?”

Liu Binglan shook her head and said, “I’m staying here for now. The Six Dawn Space Masters is 
quite vast, and is enough for me to train for a while.”

Mu Qingyi nodded. Seeing Prince Chao still not here, she teased, “Is Prince Chao busy listening to 
his mother’s lecture again?”

Everyone waited for a few moments longer until Prince Chao came forth from the crowd as well.

Prince Chao was dressed like a weak scholar. After coming late, he said sheepishly, “My mother 
was lecturing me again and again, sorry for being late.”

Hearing his explanation, everyone burst into laughter, causing Prince Chao to look confused at 
them.



Prince Chao was a dominator rank expert and had a high position. However, it was inevitable 
sometimes that, no matter how powerful you became, your mother would still lecture you all the 
same, including Liu Binglan.

The five of them were Chu Mu, Ye Wansheng, Prince Chao, Ye Qingzi, and Mu QIngyi, along with 
Old Li and Emperor Concubine Yu Sha that was receiving her punishment in Chu Mu’s soul pet 
space.

Old Li knew a lot about the soul pet world and was their question-answer machine. However, he 
didn’t know as much about human information. In this realm, Evil Good Queen knew much more. 
Of course, more importantly, Evil Good Queen was Chu Mu’s soul pet now. Though Chu Mu still 
needed time to train this woman to help him fight, it would be a waste to not use her strength at all.

Without a route or map, all they knew was to go out of Cloud Gate. This might be the most 
directionless journey Chu Mu had ever embarked on, yet for some reason Chu Mu was filled with 
anticipation and excitement.

Everyone had an innate yearning for discovering an unknown world. Even excluding Chu Mu, the 
others also wanted to see the outside world very much, even if they were no longer the strongest 
outside. The feeling of having new experts and new realms to climb towards was enough to get their 
hearts pumping.

More importantly, the five of them were still young. The heights they were at clearly couldn’t 
satisfy their goals of being a soul pet trainer!

……



“Chu Mu, Prince Chao, you think those higher species rank women outside cloud realm might be 
prettier than ours? Like bigger chests, perkier bottoms, etc.” On their way to Cloud Gate, soaring 
through the air, Ye Wansheng’s curious yet desiring voice floated over.

“Really?” The most gullible Prince Chao’s eyes brightened.

“Maybe we can capture a few to upgrade our offsprings.” Chu Mu said jokingly.

Chu Mu was only joking to try to alleviate the atmosphere, yet the moment Chu Mu finished, Ye 
Qingzi and Mu QIngyi turned to stare at him.

Chu Mu felt a cold stare from Ye Qingzi and a strange one from Mu Qingyi and quickly explained 
helplessly, “I was just saying it for fun.”
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