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Chapter 1631: Born Anew, Evil Good Queen!!

“This maiden, are you in the wrong place?” A Wheel protector slowly walked over.

The guard was a young man. He took a sneak peek at the veiled Yu Suo but didn’t notice that Yu 
Suo’s face had a popping vein and her body was shaking.

“Oh, you came to see her? She’s the Divine Totem Maiden’s little sister Yu Suo. I heard that 
terrifying war against the Heaven Devils was caused by her. She truly is unforgivable.” The young 
guard said.

The guard’s words seemed to have shocked Yu Suo like electricity. She turned around abruptly and 
glared with bloodshot eyes at the guard…..

“You…. what did you say, what is she called??”

“I called her Yu Suo, what’s wrong??” The guard was frightened by Yu Suo’s appearance.

Chu Mu and Princess Jin Rou was still stuck in the shock and anger of Yu Qie dying. The guard’s 
words were like a flash of thunder that struck them both!!

At this moment, both of them understood.

They understood why Human Mother didn’t ever let Yu Suo and Yu Qie see again, even in their last 
breaths.



They also finally realized why, including the Human Mother, no one ever called her by the name Yu 
Suo anymore. They also understood now that telling Yu Suo to take the position was simply a 
replacement of identities.

They had identical appearances. When dressed the same, other than Human Mother, no one could 
distinguish between the two.

……

Seeing this, Chu Mu and Bai Jinrou no longer could describe their emotions.

The Heaven Palace was cruel and almost emotionless. However, when they saw Yu Suo run towards 
the needle seemingly having lost her soul and hug Yu Qie’s shriveled body, Bai Jinrou couldn’t help 
but choke up too…..

After a very long time, Yu Suo’s voice was hoarse from crying and her tears had run dry….

They were merely a few minutes apart in birth, but she was always like the kid that could never 
grow up while her sister Yu Qie was forever the patient mother…...

……

Human Mother found Yu Qie finally. She took slow steps towards her.



“Why, why did they treat her like this.” Yu Suo was already frail from crying. She opened her 
bloodshot eyes and questioned Human Mother.

“Someone has to take the burden of wrongdoings. Without laws, Heaven Palace can’t possibly stand 
for this long. You should know. None of the laws within Heaven Palace are in place because of 
some outdated or stubborn reason. They’re all laws forged in the blood of countless people’s 
mistakes. The young generation will never understand because they haven’t experienced anything. 
They haven’t felt the true fear of death, of seeing the cruelty and danger of devils. They only focus 
on their own carnal desires. Once something becomes boring, they start acting rebellious.” Human 
Mother remained her calm self.

“Opposing, Betraying, Rebelling, who doesn’t know how to do that as long as they’re tired of the 
current state of things? However, just how much of the heart wrenching pain behind these boring 
and lonely roles do they see?”

“Every rebellious thing you did? Your sister took the price for you. This time, the price was her 
entire self, to trade for your current state. She isn’t fitted to be the Totem Divine Maiden, do you 
know why?”

Yu Suo shook her head.

Divine Totem maiden was decided by Human Mother. Since she said she was a bad fit, then it was 
true. However, who else other than Yu Qie could be a better fit?

“She was perfect in every way. She has the determination and calm of a divine maiden. She was 
elegant, composed, wise, and logical. She was benevolent but could ony hold back her small desires 
for mercy in exchange for the greater picture….. Very sadly, and truly, unfortunately, she had one 
thing she couldn’t let down in her heart. That thing was you. For you, she could throw everything I 
just mentioned away. That is the greatest taboo of a qualified Totem Divine Maiden.”



“And under her protection, you will become the perfect choice. You have no restraints. This 
experience will mature you and give you wisdom. This painful experience will cause you to be 
unwavering.”

Human Mother said a lot of things after, but Yu Suo merely hugged her knees like a child without 
any sense of safety…...

She heard everything that Human Mother had said.

However, both Chu Mu and Princess Jin Rou saw something in Yu Suo’s eyes that was far scarier 
than any of Human Mother’s teachings.

It was a seed of fire, filled with anger, resentment, and hatred. It burned brightly, but was buried 
deep into her heart before the Human Mother could notice.

“Stay with her for a while longer. Once you leave here, remember; you are no longer Yu Suo. You 
are Yu Qie.” Human Mother turned to leave.

Yu Suo still sat there. This moment of helplessness and sadness was only something Chu Mu and 
Bai Jinrou, who had seen the entire process, could understand.

They wanted very much to go comfort her, but they were but shadows in this memory. Yu Suo 
couldn’t see them.

After an immeasurable amount of time, Yu Suo finally stood up tiredly.



At this moment, Chu Mu saw Yu Suo walk over to the dried corpse and, with shaking hands, she 
took off the purple pendant around the corpse’s neck.

The necklaces came in a pair. When Yu Suo was attacked, the Heaven Devil had already shattered 
hers.

After she took the pendant off, she wore it on her own neck.

The energy within the pendant was incredibly weak already and it also had cracks. It must have 
used most of its powers in the fight between Yu Qie and the Heaven Devil Ancestor.

The moment Yu Suo put the necklace on, Chu Mu suddenly felt disgusted with himself.

This necklace was the last thing that commemorated her sister Yu Qie. Yet, in the battle of 
Wanxiang City, this pendant was shattered by him. It was also that moment that she had become the 
Evil Good Queen filled with evil energy!

……

To the public, Human Mother announced that the Totem Divine Maiden had recovered completely 
after a long time of nurturing and will take over the Totem Palace again.

However, no one knew that the Divine Maiden was switched from Yu Qie to Yu Suo.



They had identical appearances but two completely different hearts.

Human Mother misjudged Yu Suo. She thought that, after Yu Suo went through this experience, she 
would become the perfect Totem Divine Maiden.

This heart-wrenching memory didn’t allow her to truly accept everything. Instead, it caused her to 
view the Heaven Palace is the most despicable entity. In her heart, every person within Heaven 
Palace was responsible for her sister’s death.

As she calmly accepted every responsibility of a Totem Divine Maiden on the surface, she showed 
no difference from her elegant sister. However, she was planning like frenzy to take her revenge on 
the Heaven palace.

Yet, before she could completely execute her plan, one person saw through her identity.

This person was also the main reason why Yu Qie had died; Yu Tian!

“It’s him again. I really want to tie him to the axle needle and torture him too!” Princess Jin Rou 
said angrily.

Chu Mu saw one level deeper.

He was wondering how a member of Guardian Palace could set down such a trap to even kill the 
Divine Totem Maiden.



This identity swap was also seen through by Yu Tian.

Just where does this person’s loyalties lay? And who was behind him? He was like a spy that wore 
the guise of a Heaven Palace member but wanted to destroy the delicate balance within the palace!

The Guardian Palace and Wheel Palace couldn’t allow such a fake Totem Divine Maiden to control 
the palace even if Human Mother allowed this switch.

That day, they threw Yu Qie’s corpse to the demons. Unable to hold back anymore, Yu Suo used a 
killing formation to kill a thousand guards of Wheel Palace.

That was just a small part of her revenge because her mission was to destroy everything.

Yet, she couldn’t hold back. People found that she used the Totem Palace to set up the killing 
formations and her powers were all taken away.

She was exiled by ten thousand guards from Totem Palace, Guardian Palace, and Wheel Palace. She 
was pushed onto the land field with Heaven Devil blood, pushing her towards the dark cliff.

Under the dark cliff was filled with heaven Devil blood. It was filled with countless ancestral 
demons. Heaven Palace didn’t know when this endless cliff became the nest of so many monsters.

However, in their eyes, the Yu Suo plotting to overthrow the Heaven Palace was just as despicable 
as these monsters. Only throwing her down there could calm their anger.



……

“Huhuhu~~~~~”

Dark and strange winds blew towards her, messing her purple hair.

Yu Suo stood at the cliffside. At this moment, she was still only fifteen years old. In the human 
world, she was a young girl that hadn’t even matured.

Behind her were ten thousand angry faces clad in dignified white armor…..

In her eyes, these white-clad Heaven Palace Imperial Guard were even scarier than the demons that 
had welled forth last time. At least then, her sister Yu Qie was aside her.

“Chu Mu…..” Bai Jinrou grabbed onto Chu Mu’s arm tightly.

This was the first time she had seen this scene. Having gone through all of Yu Suo’s memories, 
Princess Jin Rou felt terrible when seeing her left with only the option to jump off the cliff.

This dark cliff was the end of Heaven Palace and felt like the end of the world. Now, she was 
lonely, helpless, and truly devoid of anywhere else to go.

Underneath her were countless monsters that could swallow her whole without leaving a trace.



This scene was something Chu Mu had seen countless times.

She jumps down, embracing her death.

As she fell, massive python like vines covered the entire region.

More monsters pounced towards her, but the frightening Devil Flower Ancestor was the first to 
devour her.

The Heaven Palace’s people all saw this chilling scene. From what they saw, it felt like the worst 
punishment.

However, no one knew that the Devil Flower Ancestor didn’t eat her but instead protected her.

The Devil Flower Ancestor was fed by Yu Suo using many years of God Dew.

The Devil Flower Ancestor devoured Yu Suo’s past and created a new life from her past painful 
struggles.

She wasn’t embracing a flower devil; she was embracing her other side.



She was no longer Yu Suo, wasn’t Totem Divine Maiden, wasn’t dispensable, and would not live for 
anyone else. She was herself. From the moment she leaped off the cliff, she was the mixture of love 
and hate, Evil Good Queen!

Chapter 1632: Heaven Palace Dragon Pack

The surrounding space slowly became illusory. These memory fragments would intermittently 
appear and intermittently blur out.

After her rebirth, her destiny intersected with Chu Mu.

Her soul became linked with Chu Mu. Perhaps the soul pact was supposed to give her a companion 
so she wouldn’t be lonely. However, she had turned her back on him and made an enemy.

For a long time after, Chu Mu fell into a state where it was difficult for his soul remembrance to 
rise. On the other hand, the Evil Good Queen embarked upon a long and arduous path of revenge.

Anyone from Chu Mu’s perspective would view Yu Suo as a madwoman when they saw what she 
did. They would also think she had a serious delusional disorder.

However, when he finally saw everything from a different perspective, Chu Mu couldn’t help but 
forgive her defection.

In the subsequent memories, Chu Mu saw the place where she laid the formation. It was just as he 
guessed. Yu Suo had been implementing this plan for a long, long time...

The memories were all fragments. Some were unforgettable and some were like wisps of smoke 
that floated past.



Suddenly, Chu Mu clenched onto the Monument Tear, and withdrew his consciousness from the 
tear’s memories.

Chu Mu left at the right time. It was the period of Yu Suo’s memories when she took them to 
Heaven Palace.

The Monument Tear had been formed at that moment. It had probably been an unforgettable 
moment, but Chu Mu didn’t want to watch it. And he was even more unwilling to let Princess 
Jinrou watch it.

There were many things that Chu Mu would be candid about. But there were other things where he 
need not be so candid. He didn’t want to and she didn’t want to either.

“Chu Mu?” Princess Jinrou really wanted to know what had happened between Chu Mu and Yu Suo 
in Heaven Palace. Why had their soul pact split?

After the soul pact rupture, Princess Jinrou could feel that Chu Mu and Yu Suo had both suffered 
heavy wounds on their souls.

“Chu Mu, those Guardian Palace Divine Generals have already landed in our world. Are you still 
unwilling to help her?” said Princess Jinrou.

“Why don’t you return to Northern Territory first,” Chu Mu said to Princess Jinrou.

“What is it?” Princess Jinrou asked, confused.



“That place isn’t safe,” said Chu Mu.

Princess Jinrou said: “You know where Yu Suo’s stealing formation is?”

“Ya.” Chu Mu nodded his head and looked eastward.

The sky was completely dark. Nothing could be seen.

The solar eclipse was accompanied by fear. Nobody knew what would haunt this pitch-black world, 
nor did they know what creature was roaming around.

“Then… then you be careful.” Princess Jinrou didn’t inquire further.

She stood on her tiptoes and kissed the corner of Chu Mu’s lips. Her body transformed into a 
spectral blue light that flew to the Northern Territory.

After Princess Jinrou left, Chu Mu glanced at where the Second Heaven Boundary Monument was.

There were still no signs of movement from the Ancient Flood Dragon person. Chu Mu jumped 
onto the Dead Dream and flew towards Zhengming Main City.

……



It would require some time to reach Zhengming Main City. Chu Mu also didn’t know if he would 
arrive there before the Guardian Divine Generals.

However, Yu Suo probably had ample preparations.

En route to Zhengming Main City, Chu Mu saw countless nocturnal creatures appearing on the 
land.

These were creatures that shouldn’t have appeared. They normally walked in the darkness. They 
were plague soul pets, dark type soul pets, phantoms, corpses and specters…

The advent of the solar eclipse had filled the world with an evil energy and thrown the world into 
fear.

Every city tried to light as many lights as they could to no avail. The places where light could shine 
were extremely limited. In fact, some people were even able to see strange creatures roaming the 
darkness on certain ancient streets.

Zhengming Continent had become abnormal. And behind this abnormalness was inevitably hidden 
some terrifying thing.

Just as Old Li had guessed, a few hidden dangers created in the last ten or so years had immediately 
erupted during that instance of the solar eclipse. Life forms mysteriously died, plagues began to 
rapidly pervade areas and everywhere one went, it was possible to see corpses littering the 
ground…



It was obvious that no war had broken out; there was no smoke from war. However, it looked more 
chaotic and miserable than the aftermath of a war.

Chu Mu glanced at the distant horizon. He saw divine lights rapidly falling from the stars like 
meteor shower.

From their flying trajectory, they were probably the Divine Generals coming from Heaven Palace’s 
Guardian Palace.

……

Zhengming City had become empty during the solar eclipse.

The city of people had dispersed to surrounding cities and this order had been given about a month 
ago.

In this one month, people left Zhengming Main City one after the other. And when the solar eclipse 
arrived, the rest of the city migrated, just like the one that happened in Wanxiang City. The city 
became empty.

There were no lights in the city. It was impossible to see one’s fingers if one were to stretch his or 
her hand out.

At the very center of the city, enormous Evil Good Flower Demons swayed in place while large 
flower petals, that resembled the treetops of big heavenly trees, bloomed.



Torrential amounts of evil energy and thick holy energy simultaneously drifted around Zhengming 
Main City’s enormous beast statues, springs, flowerbeds, inscribed steles and sculptures.

There were countless shattered crystals lying on the ground like grains of sand. Even in the 
darkness, they still illuminated a resplendent light!

There was a huge number of these crystals and they were all high ranking crystals. Even if the eight 
great factions emptied out their treasuries, they may not even be able to produce tens of thousands 
of energy crystals at once.

Each energy crystal was enough to make a diligently training soul pe trainer pay a huge price to 
obtain one. There were monarch, emperor, dominator and immortal rank crystals of different 
attributes and a variety of colors…

If there were any soul pet trainers remaining in the city, they would immediately go crazy once they 
saw the sea of crystals lying on the ground.

Unfortunately, there was no one in the city.

Zhengming Main City was in one person’s control. When she told everyone that Zhengming Main 
City was about to face a solar eclipse crisis, nobody questioned her. Whether it was the residents or 
the factions that had deep roots in Zhengming Main City, they brought their belongings and 
temporarily fled to surrounding cities.

Even if there was someone who didn’t believe, she had the means of forcibly expelling these 
disbelievers.



But the fact of the matter was that the crisis had truly arrived.

The people that had temporarily left Zhengming Main City clearly saw scorching flames falling 
from the sky…

Within these flames were enormous figures. They covered the sky and were dropping to Zhengming 
Main City.

“Hong hong hong!!!!!!”

Loud echoes rang out when the meteors smashed into the city. A piercing light prevented the people 
in the surrounding cities from opening their eyes.

The world was pitch-black and they couldn’t see anything. And even when the destructive light and 
scorching flames shone, they were still unable to see anything. All they knew was that Zhengming 
Main City had been struck by a large group of meteorites.

……

A number of wild dragons with large wings haughtily stood in the craters smashed in the city. On 
the backs of these dragons were mighty Guardian Palace members wearing white armor and with a 
cold and arrogant look in their eyes.

“How courageous. There’s someone who set up a stealing formation in Zhengming Main City!” on 
an azure empyrean dragon’s back, a man wearing a commander’s armor coldly sneered.



Heaven Palace Empyrean Dragon, Heaven Palace Star Dragon, Heaven Palace Dark Dragon. These 
three large dragons were symbols of Heaven Palace’s three guardian commanders.

The Empyrean Dragon was the symbol of Guardian Palace’s Guardian Commander Tao Gu. The 
Star Dragon represented Totem Palace’s Guardian Commander Qin Ji. The Dark Dragon belonged 
to Wheel Palace’s Guardian Commander Rong Fen.

All three of these famous Guardian Commanders had appeared. The Empyrean Dragon, the Star 
Dragon and the Dark Dragon that they were riding on respectively appeared in a triangle formation 
around the city center. They left enormous craters in their wake when they stepped through the city.

Behind each of the three Guardian Commanders were a thousand guardian army members from 
Totem Palace!

In the mortal world, the dragon species were relatively rare creatures. It was not often that one 
could see a pack of them appear.

The lowest ranked subspecies of the Dragon species was the monarch rank. Many soul pet trainers 
saw dragons as their most yearned for soul pet.

And right now, behind the three Guardian Commanders were over at thousand dragons!

Dragons had enormous bodies. Each one of them was comparable to the largest buildings in a city. 
When three thousand large dragons landed on or floated right above the city center, it formed a 
stunning scene.



Some dragons were several hundred meters large. This was essentially a living mountain smashing 
into the city. When these streaks of flames through the night sky and it was possible to see their 
fierce and enormous figures, it was frightening.

“What happened? Why is there not a single person?” Qin Ji stood on the Star Dragon and swept his 
gaze over the city.

The pack of dragons rapidly surrounded Zhengming Main City’s center. However, in the plaza that 
was filled with energy crystals, they didn't’ see anyone.

Suddenly, a strange laughter rang out from the darkness.

At the very center of the crystal formation appeared a woman wearing a thin black veil and thin 
black muslin dress.

Yet, despite facing countless dragons from Heaven Palace, the woman laughed without restraint. 
She seemed to have expected them to come and was standing there to greet them.

“Evil woman. This stealing solar eclipse formation is a crime that can throw you into hell for tens of 
millions of years.” Qin Ji angrily pointed at the wantonly laughing woman.

The pack of dragons pressed forwards. Heaven Palace’s Solar Eclipse Formation’s energy was 
rapidly slipping away right now. However, strangely, even the Totem Maidens in the group were 
unable to break through the stealing formation set up by this evil woman.



It was hard to imagine who would have such a formation ability that surpassed the strongest Totem 
Maidens. If they didn’t stop this woman and seize her in time, the effects would be even more 
terrifying.

……

The moment the dragon pack appeared in Zhengming Main City, Chu Mu also happened to arrive.

He saw you Suo standing on the dragon back, covered in black muslin, and laughing. The Chu Mu 
of the past would have been unable to understand her insanity, but upon remembering Yu Qie’s 
mummy of a corpse, Chu Mu suddenly felt that the laughter was infinitely dismal.

She had waited a long time for this day.

Chapter 1633: Chief of Ten Thousand Dragons, Long Ji

Chu Mu didn’t brashly fly into the dragon pack. He could tell that the woman in the black clothing 
was Yu Suo.

However, this woman was also a bit different from Yu Suo. Chu Mu couldn’t sense life force from 
her body. Her temperament was very similar to Yu Suo’s, but this was merely one of Yu Suo’s 
puppets.

When they were in Tianxia City, Yu Suo had created a puppet and had been able to control it from 
afar.

The one standing in the dragon pack was also one of Yu Suo’s puppets. Chu Mu was able to tell at a 
glance.



Her mad laughter came from Yu Suo’s laughter and her anger came from Yu Suo’s anger. However, 
this wasn’t Yu Suo. The true Yu Suo was hidden somewhere.

Princess Jinrou was worried, but Yu Suo had prepared well and had placed one of her puppets in 
Zhengming Main City.

It was as if she had intentionally lured Heaven Palace’s three great guardians here.

And if this was the case, then the formation currently in Zhengming Main City was not the true 
stealing formation!

……

The puppet Yu Suo stopped laughing. Her voice turned cold and aloof: “This place will be your 
graveyard.”

Chanting an incantation, all of the energy crystals around her instantly transformed into sharp and 
cold lights that pierced into the dark sky above the city. They rapidly intersected above the city, 
forming a formation full of killing intent!

The formation had extreme coldness and it created a terrifying aura that transformed into a desolate 
storm. It covered the heads of the three thousand Heaven Palace large dragon army members.

Extirpate Slaughter Formation!!



On the ground, flower vines that resembled bolts of lightning danced about.

The cold lights formed chains in the night sky that resembled slaughtering swords.

The vines began to grow upwards and intersect with each other. They rapidly twisted around these 
enormous dragons’ bodies.

These vines and flower had petrification poison. If they were so much as to brush against the skin of 
these large dragons, their skin would quickly turn grey.

Immediately the vines were like a snake army that terrifyingly crawled up every large dragon!

Once a dragon became grey, the cold light of stars created by the slaughtering formation 
transformed into a hateful sword that slashed straight down!

As the petrification vines wrapped around more dragons and Heaven Palace members, the hatred 
sword became a cold star sword rain that was filled with killing intent as it slashed down!

Sword lights chaotically interweaved. Blood flew everywhere and the blood-curdling screams 
didn’t stop.

Three thousand large dragons had practically taken over the city’s center region. There were several 
thousand buildings and several hundred streets here.



The terrifying petrifying flower formation and Extirpate Slaughter Formation covered the entirety 
of the central region. Almost every street surged with terrifying flower vines. Behind the flower 
vines were slaughtering swords that chopped Heaven Palace’s dragons into pieces!

Zhengming Main City was extremely large. Although the city was empty, not everyone had actually 
left.

In a few alleyways, streets and on the leaves of tall buildings, it was possible to see a few soul pet 
trainers.

They were still stuck in a state of shock from when the large dragon army had descended from the 
sky. However, the slaughtering attack left them completely stunned.

The dragon army that descended from the sky was so powerful that it surpassed the army of every 
faction. Even Divine Sect was not this strong. Indeed, who had seen an army with several hundred 
immortal rank creatures before?

However, what shocked them even more was that in the city they lived everyday in and thought was 
the safest place for them, a terrifying slaughtering formation was hidden. This place had been the 
home for hundreds of thousands of soul pet trainers only a month ago. If this formation had been 
mobilized a month ago, how many factions would have suffered a miserable destruction?!

……

Chu Mu stood from afar and watched aghast at the slaughter of Heaven Palace’s dragon army.

How long ago had Yu Suo laid this formation?



How long had she been planning this scheme for?

Chu Mu finally understood why she had constantly told him that he had wasted her time, and why 
she had ultimately agreed to give her Flower’s Stamen to him.

It was because she had to finish everything before the solar eclipse arrived.

The slaughter lasted for a long, long time. If it were any mortal army, it probably would have 
already been completely annihilated.

But the three great Guardian Commanders had made it to the very center and dismembered Yu 
Suo’s body into thousands of pieces and used the pieces to offer as a sacrifice for the fallen divine 
guards.

Heaven Palace required hundreds of years to cultivate an army like this. Although their entire army 
hadn’t fallen in this slaughter, Heaven Palace would need a long, long time to recover their strength.

Unfortunately, the three great Guardian Commanders were left with nothing. This woman was 
merely one of Yu Suo’s puppets. Its goal was just to start the slaughtering revenge formation.

Although he couldn’t see the faces of the three great Guardian Commanders, Chu Mu could 
imagine that when these three generals, who had lived a long time in Heaven Palace, realized they 
had fallen into a trap, their faces would be extremely unsightly!



The blood that spilled from a single large dragon’s corpse could create a stream. The death of a 
thousand dragons caused bloody red water to fill the streets, houses, and courtyards of the city. It 
was a ghastly sight.

“How abominable. What kind of demon creature is this!” Guardian Commander Qin Ji angrily said.

Rong Fen’s face twisted as he rode on the Dark Dragon,

There was someone in this world who still dared provoke Heaven Palace? Could these stupid 
people not know that previous generations of experts had ultimately paid a painful price after doing 
this?

Why would some ignorant fellow appear every once in a while? Wasn’t staying in the orderly 
mortal world a very good thing?

“Have the royal families’ people come. We must determine who is defying Heave Palace!” said 
Rong Gu.

……

The bloody stench wafted over from the city center. Heaven Palace’s cold-bloodedness was indeed 
terrifying as well.

A thousand members had died, but these guardians were expressionless. At most, the only thing 
someone was able to see in their eyes was a sliver of joy that the one who died wasn’t them.



Chu Mu was planning on leaving because he guessed wrong. Yu Suo’s sealing formation wasn’t in 
Zhengming Main City.

However, just as Chu Mu was about to leave, a bright red colored noble Imperial Concubine 
Dragon appeared above Zhengming Main City!

The Imperial Concubine Dragon was the rarest dragon species in this world. In fact, it was doubted 
to a certain extent whether this dragon existed.

Chu Mu had heard about the Imperial Concubine Dragon from Old Li. It had a slender body and 
bright red and noble scales. On its dragon horn grew long hair feelers…

“Young master!! An Imperial Concubine Dragon!! Heaven Palace is truly a place with hidden 
talents. Even an Imperial Concubine Dragon has appeared.” said Old Li with shock.

Chu Mu turned around and saw a cold and aloof woman standing on the Imperial Concubine 
Dragon’s back wearing a bright red colored armor.

The woman was mature and cold. Her body radiated both a unique wild charm and an aura that was 
completely different from humans. This was especially the case for her eyes. It was almost 
impossible to see any human emotions in her eyes. Instead, her eyes seemed to resemble eternal red 
gems!

The mature woman wore a crown on her head and dragon form rainbow-colored clothes on her 
body. Her figure was slender and tall. As she sat on the bright red colored Imperial Concubine 
Dragon, she seemed to melt together with the unique dragon.



“Long Ji!” Chu Mu looked with slight shock at the woman.

He remembered seeing this woman when Yu Qie had been surrounded by the Heaven Demon 
Devils!

She wasn’t a Totem Maiden, nor was she a Guardian Palace or Wheel Palace guard. She, like 
Human Mother, was unique in Heaven Palace!

Human Mother was detached from everything worldly. All she was in charge of was appointing 
maidens and training maidens. Long Ji was also a unique existence. In fact, many people believed 
that she was an undying rank expert!

The fact that even Long Ji had personally appeared was enough to demonstrate that Heaven Palace 
had been determined to capture Yu Suo.

……

Long Ji swept her eyes over the scene below her. She apathetically looked at the dragon corpses 
ripped to pieces in the city.

The three great Guardian Commanders stood to the side. None of them dared say a word. It was 
difficult to imagine that Qin Ji, Tao Gu, and Rong Fen, these three nearly unrivaled experts if placed 
in the mortal world, would have moments where they needed to lower their head.

“What happened?” asked Long Ji.



“We fell into a trap. That demon lured us here and mobilized meticulously prepared slaughtering 
formation,” said Qin Ji.

“What about the people in the city?” asked Long Ji.

“I’ve already sent people to ask royal family members…”

Just at this moment, a deep blue meteor flew through the pitch-black starry sky!

Long Ji and the three great Guardian Commanders simultaneously looked up and followed the 
meteor with their eyes.

“Follow that meteor.” Long Ji didn’t hesitate. She urged her bright red Imperial Concubine Dragon 
to follow the meteor.

The three great Guardian Commanders hastily followed behind. Behind them, the remaining 1600 
guardian dragon members were much slower.

Fortunately, Long Ji left a flaming red track wherever she flew across. Even if they couldn’t keep up 
with her speed, they just needed to follow the path to find her.

……



“Young master, that meteor should have come from Heaven Palace. It’s a guiding star. Presumably, 
someone used a powerful perception ability to find Yu Suo’s true location.” said Old Li.

Chu Mu looked at the falling star in the distance and his brows creased…

Wasn’t that direction New Moon Land?

Could Yu Suo have been in New Moon Land the whole time??

“Didn’t she say herself that Heaven Palace and Holy Stem Flower Holy Region have a special 
spatial pathway. Young master, I think that it’s very likely she utilized this secret realm to steal the 
solar eclipse formation’s energy. And she smartly laid a fake formation here beforehand to lure 
Heaven Palace’s guardian army to Zhengming Main City; this was done to buy her enough time,” 
said Old Li.

Chu Mu nodded his head.

Chu Mu had seen fragments of Yu Suo’s memories, but there were a few particulars that Chu Mu 
could not know.

However, if Long Ji appeared, things would be extremely troublesome.

At Chu Mu’s current strength, he could at most fight with the three great Guardian Commanders. It 
was ostensibly impossible for him to stop someone at the level of Long Ji.



“I hope that Long Ji hasn’t reached the undying rank.” Chu Mu muttered to himself.

Chapter 1634: Well-Prepared Net

Chu Mu’s speed was not as fast as Dragon Maiden, the direction that meteor was falling towards 
was none other than New Moon Land.

Fortunately, the guidance meteor from Heaven Palace only told Dragon Maiden the general 
direction. Dragon Maiden’s Imperial Concubine Dragon stopped at He Border region and did not 
accurately locate Yu Suo immediately.

Chu Mu passed through He Border and flew straight towards New Moon Land’s Tianxia City.

Holy Stem Flower Holy Region remained in Tianxia City. Chu Mu could only roughly guess Yu 
Suo set up her Stealing Formation in Tianxia City.

New Moon Land’s citizens had already migrated away. The entire Tianxia City was empty and there 
were even some wild soul pets roaming around the abandoned streets.

Chu Mu flew into the original Soul Palace’s Holy Palace. Holy Stem Flower Holy Region’s gate 
and Palm Dawn Holy Region’s gate were still in Tianxia City. These two Holy Regions were also 
not opened to the public, only New Moon Palace’s internal members could enter.

After Xia Zhixian took over the control of the flower race, this Holy Stem Flower Holy Region was 
also more or less managed by her. If she helped Yu Suo to set up the formation here, nobody in New 
Moon Palace would notice.



Chu Mu entered the Holy Stem Flower Holy Region’s palace which already collected some dust. 
The entire palace was quiet and seemed to have not a single person. However, Chu Mu had already 
sensed many life forms and pairs of eyes staring at him in the dark.

Chu Mu did not mind those people as they were surely Yu Suo’s subordinates. They all seemed 
rather strong.

Since they were guarding there, it meant Yu Suo was really in Holy Stem Flower Holy Region.

After arriving in front of the Holy Region’s palace, two men riding on Slaughter Beasts stood there 
solemnly and glared at Chu Mu in hostility.

“Who are you?” asked one of the men.

Chu Mu found it rather funny. This place was Tianxia City, his own territory, yet someone 
questioned him like that.

Chu Mu ignored the two men and entered the palace.

The two guards frowned and immediately ordered the two Slaughter Beasts to pounce towards Chu 
Mu!

“Hu~!”



Chu Mu’s body was rapidly burned by black and silver flames. Chu Mu creepily vanished within 
the flames and caused the two Slaughter Beasts to miss their target.

When the two men reacted to the sudden change, Chu Mu already entered the palace.

Originally, there should be many Holy Guards guarding the palace, but there was nothing right now. 
The stairs were empty and there was an ancient timespace gate ahead.

On the holy altar, Yu Suo stood below the Holy Region’s gate while wearing a black attire and had a 
black veil covering her face.

Her high heels emphasized her well-proportioned body. Her purple long hair reached all the way to 
her hip area. Countless petals and flower threads lingered around her.

She was in deep thought, yet seemed to be preparing an incantation. She did not even notice Chu 
Mu’s entrance.

Chu Mu looked at her and spoke, “Making that kind of people to guard outside does not seem like 
your style.”

Chu Mu walked in from outside. Although there were still over ten guards outside, those people 
were seriously too weak. Even Chu Mu did not have to be wary of them, let alone the even more 
powerful Dragon Maiden. How would Yu Suo handle it?

Yu Suo did not speak and remained standing there. She did not even turn around.



Chu Mu walked up along the stairs, his steps were heavy.

“Don’t come up!” said Yu Suo angrily.

“I’m here to help you,” said Chu Mu.

“I don’t need. I told you I don’t want to see you again!” Yu Suo remained back facing Chu Mu.

“You also told me I will die a cruel death, but I’m still alive,” said Chu Mu.

“You!” Yu Suo suppressed her rage and spoke, “Get lost!”

Chu Mu continued walking up the stairs. At that moment, a tall figure walked in from the torch 
stand at the side.

This person carried a smile and seemed casual. However, those eyes clearly portrayed a threatening 
gaze.

“Our Saintess Yu told you to get lost, it’s your honor. Brat, get lost!” said the man.

Chu Mu took a glance at this person and asked plainly, “Who are you?”



“Me?” The man smiled and spoke, “Ning Family Dynasty, Ning Yinfeng. Of course, nobody dares 
to call me by this name, they all call me King Ning.”

Chu Mu looked at this person bizarrely and never expected him to be the strongest person from 
Ning Family Dynasty.

Yu Suo even recruited such an arrogant person, she sure had her wiles.

Since King Ning showed up here, it meant other human leaders should be nearby. Chu Mu swept 
his gaze across this palace and noticed a few experts hiding in the palace. Their aura far surpassed 
those outside and they were all leader rank!

It seemed that after reaching tenth phase, Yu Suo’s expanding efficiency became really terrifying. 
She could truly be considered the queen of human world.

She could make everyone in Zhengming Main City migrate, she could make experts like King Ning 
become her subordinates. Those few people that had not made their appearance were all leaders of 
the eight major factions who held major army authorities.

The armies they could control numbered in tens of thousands. If they joined hands to initiate a 
resistance war, even Heaven Palace’s Forbidden Army might not be able to handle it.

“Chu Mu, how do you do?” Tang Ang slowly walked out from the side and showed a friendly smile.

Chu Mu’s gaze went past Tang Ang and saw Magistrate Xiao leaning on the wall. His shadow was 
stretched out by the torchlight.



These few people had completely hidden their aura until just now. Chu Mu did not discover them 
immediately after entering the palace. However, these powerful individuals in Zhengming 
Continent had all shown up here......

As expected, Yu Suo had made sufficient preparation. She was making use of these human experts 
to fight against Heaven Palace!

“Apart from these three, there are seven leaders outside the city. There are also 30,000 elite soldiers. 
Do you think we need you here?” King Ning maintained his casual smile.

This place was Tianxia City, New Moon Land’s territory. Chu Mu had been spending most of his 
time cultivating or in Wanxiang City while the citizens migrated. He never expected Yu Suo to 
begin laying her net in Tianxia City while the citizens were migrating, all to wait for Heaven Palace 
to arrive. He also never noticed these experts and the armies entering New Moon Land.

“Do you know who I saw?” Chu Mu spoke to Yu Suo as he ignored King Ning’s disdain.

YU Suo did not want to see Chu Mu and kept her gaze on Holy Stem Flower Holy Region’s 
timespace gate.

“Dragon Maiden. Your people can only hold back Heaven Palace’s three forbidden army generals,” 
Chu Mu reminded her.

Yu Suo’s body shook lightly and wanted to turn around. However, she seemed to be concerned 
about something.



“I will handle her,” said Yu Suo.

“You are no match for her,” said Chu Mu with certainty.

Chu Mu knew Yu Suo’s strength very well. She would not be able to take on someone on the level 
of Dragon Maiden. Unless Dragon Maiden was really so stupid that she would only show up after 
Yu Suo absorbed the Solar Eclipse’s energy.

However, according to Chu Mu’s estimation, it would not be long before Dragon Maiden showed 
up in Tianxia City. Following right behind her would be the three Forbidden Army generals and 
their dragon race army!

So many leaders showing up here surprised Chu Mu, but he suspected that Dragon Maiden alone 
could completely destroy these fighting forces Yu Suo had prepared.

Yu Suo became silent. In her estimation, Dragon Maiden should not have shown up so soon. Could 
it be that someone ruined the plan she made to stall Dragon Maiden in Heaven Palace?

Yu Suo clearly knew Dragon Maiden’s strength. She was no match for Dragon Maiden before 
obtaining Solar Eclipse’s energy.

Meanwhile, she still had to absorb Solar Eclipse’s energy for an entire day before her stealing 
formation could be fully charged. Dragon Maiden did not need much time to destroy her kingdom 
which she built with much difficulty.



“I have a method to stall her, just a little dangerous,” Chu Mu saw Yu Suo’s memory and naturally 
knew she was unable to take on Dragon Maiden.

Yu Suo gritted her teeth and silently vowed in her heart that this would be the last time she 
conversed with him.

“All of you leave here first,” Yu Suo swept a glance at King Ning, Tang Ang and Xiao Xueang.

The three of them did not say anything and walked out of the palace.

Only Chu Mu and Yu Suo were left in the palace, the mood became a little strange.

Chu Mu walked up the stairs towards the holy altar, approaching Yu Suo.

“Don’t come here,” said Yu Suo coldly.

“Without those aphrodisiac flower pollen, do you really think I’m interested in you?” said Chu Mu.

Chu Mu’s words caused Yu Suo to become furious. This bastard took away her most precious thing 
and yet looked so uncaring!

Seeing Yu Suo’s fuse about to blow off, Chu Mu did not provoke her any further and calmly walked 
to her front......



“I told you not to come close!” Yu Suo’s rage also intensified all at once!

In an instant, poisonous vines rampaged in the air and filled the vast and empty palace. They were 
densely-packed and desired the life of this man!

Chu Mu’s surroundings were filled with sword-like poisonous thorns. If he took one step further, he 
would be pierced for sure.

Chu Mu took a deep breath. He chose not to argue with this mad woman due to Yu Qie.

“Ancient Flood Dragon Person is about to be awakened. Lure Dragon Maiden to its territory. 
Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s seal is related to Totem Palace. I believe Ancient Flood Dragon 
Person will think that Heaven Palace is finding trouble again after seeing Totem Palace’s Dragon 
Maiden showing up...... What you need to do is to make Dragon Maiden believe that it’s Ancient 
Flood Dragon Person stealing the Solar Eclipse Formation’s energy. They may not fight to the 
death, but as long as they are stalled for sufficient time and you obtain enough Crimson Sol’s 
energy, there is no need to fear them,” said Chu Mu.

“Fine, you lure Dragon Maiden to Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s territory,” said Yu Suo.

“Why me? You have so many subordinates here,” Chu Mu was unhappy.

“It’s not a loss for me if you get killed by Dragon Maiden,” snorted Yu Suo.

As expected, women were the most vile creatures. He intended to help her with her revenge out of 
goodwill, yet she told him to sacrifice himself.



“Hmm? What happened to your face?” asked Chu Mu.

Yu Suo did not react immediately. Only when Chu Mu asked this question, her expression suddenly 
turned grim and looked like a banshee which wanted to eat humans!

Chapter 1635: The Final Hope

Yu Suo’s face turned green, or rather, her face was already covered by something green, a polar 
opposite to her originally jade white skin......

Her eyelashes were very long, the blue-colored eyelashes did not seem human-like.

Her lips so red as if blood smeared over them......

This was clearly Evil Good Beauty’s appearance, Chu Mu was shocked by her appearance.

Chu Mu originally thought that Yu Suo did not want him to get close because of the unspeakable 
matter. To think that the reason she was unwilling to turn around and let him near was because her 
appearance had become extremely bewitching and creepy, completely different from her originally 
beautiful appearance.

“What happened?” Chu Mu looked at her and noticed that her body which was covered in black 
dress also seemed strange. Parts of her skin turned blue as if poison was injected.

Yu Suo stared at him furiously. He must be asking the obvious!



“Don’t stare at me like that, what did you do to make yourself look like this?” asked Chu Mu.

“Isn’t this thanks to you?” sneered Yu Suo.

“How is this related to me?” Chu Mu was confused.

How could her witch-like appearance be related to him? Surely it could not be the result of that 
ridiculous mating, right? He only heard that women looked even more beautiful after doing such 
deeds, he never heard of them showing their original appearance after the deed.

“You undid the soul pact!” Yu Suo’s chest heaved up and down heavily.

She must have a really great tolerance to be able to suppress her urge to blast this person before her 
into smithereens!

Chu Mu opened his mouth and realized the cause.

Half Human no longer belonged to human race. The original appearance should be the 
amalgamation of the two.

Just like Chu Mu’s true form was Half Devil, he could only appear in human form after signing a 
soul pact with Ning Maner.



Meanwhile, Yu Suo’s original form was Evil Good Queen. However, her cultivation seemed to have 
encountered some problem and some stuff that should not appear had appeared on her face and 
skin.

“I thought you could already maintain your form,” said Chu Mu.

That explained why Yu Suo never forcefully undid the soul pact with him for a long time. It was 
because she needed his soul pact to maintain her original appearance before becoming Evil Good 
Queen.

Thinking up to this point, Chu Mu suddenly felt that he should treat Ning Maner better from now 
on.

“Young master, after undoing the soul pact, it will take about one month to slowly return to Half 
Human appearance. I think that you should resign your soul pact. Such a beautiful woman 
becoming like this is just weird,” Old Li interrupted them.

He could tell that Yu Suo still cared about her appearance very much. Her appearance did not 
belong only to herself as well......

Chu Mu also considered whether to resign the soul pact with her. If they did sign the soul pact 
again, the relationship between them would be even more entangled.

“Hmph, don’t worry. I will find a more suitable host,” sneered Yu Suo as she did not need Chu Mu’s 
sympathy at all.



“That’s good......” Chu Mu nodded, he also did not want Yu Suo to always hoard a soul slot, 
“Dragon Maiden is too strong. I cannot lure her to Ancient Flood Dragon Person. Since you could 
set up a fake formation in Zhengming Main City, isn’t it possible to lure them to Ancient Flood 
Dragon Person’s territory?”

“I can. Spread these seeds which absorbed Crimson Sol’s energy into Ancient Flood Dragon 
Person’s Dark Wind Palace,” Yu Suo gave some seeds to Chu Mu.

“Ancient Flood Dragon Person knows I’m fourth era’s Monument Tear Individual,” said Chu Mu.

“Isn’t it perfect? You will be killed by Ancient Flood Dragon Person, Dragon Maiden and Ancient 
Flood Dragon Person will fight each other until half dead......” said Yu Suo calmly. If everything 
went according to this direction, she would find this world to be very beautiful.

“You can’t, you can’t,” Old Li jumped out and spoke, “Your child will be fatherless after getting 
born.”

The moment Old Li finished speaking, black flame and crimson flower gale slapped towards Old Li 
simultaneously. Old Li scrambled away immediately......

This matter had completely become their greatest taboo. If Old Li blabbered about this matter, it 
would surely die over a thousand times.

Meanwhile, Heaven Palace’s army would arrive at New Moon Land soon. Ancient Flood Dragon 
Person would also awaken around this time. If Chu Mu did not succeed in luring Dragon Maiden to 
fight against Ancient Flood Dragon Person, be it Yu Suo who violated Heaven Palace’s laws or Chu 
Mu who was the fourth era’s Monument Tear Individual, they would both be killed by those two 
Undying rank experts.



It was already such a crucial time, yet Old Li was not thinking of a method to help and saying such 
a thing, it was totally asking to be killed.

“Uh...... After that day, did you get any treatment?” Chu Mu could not hold back this question in the 
end.

Yu Suo wobbled for an instant and almost lost her footing.

She turned around and her eyes seemed to be almost spilling fire!

“I’m just asking,” Chu Mu found himself asking something stupid and changed back to the main 
topic, “How long do you need to completely absorb the energy?”

“One day,” Yu Suo tried her best to speak calmly.

“You can reach Undying rank after one day?” asked Chu Mu.

“Impossible,” Yu Suo gave a self-deprecating laughter, “Do you think reaching Undying rank is so 
easy? The energy is very impetuous. If you absorb them within one day, you will be burned alive 
even if you are Undying rank.”

“Then...... Aren’t you suiciding? Do you think Heaven Palace will give you so much time to slowly 
absorb the energy?” asked Chu Mu.



“Do you think Heaven Palace dare to stay in human world for a long time? Heaven Palace itself 
already has a huge hidden threat. Mobilizing the army, especially someone as strong as Dragon 
Maiden, is telling those demons at Heaven Palace that it’s time to attack,” said Yu Suo.

“Which means, as long as you finish off Dragon Maiden and the three Forbidden Army generals, 
you will be safe?” asked Chu Mu.

“Yes. It’s impossible to kill Dragon Maiden, but her time in the human world is limited. As long as 
she can be delayed......” Yu Suo looked at Chu Mu and suddenly remembered something, “I cannot 
handle Ancient Flood Dragon Person. If Dragon Maiden cannot injure it, you should find a suitable 
grave and wait for it to take your life, fourth era’s Monument Tear Individual...... The first thing it 
will do after awakening should be eliminating the biggest threat to it.”

“Likewise, if Ancient Flood Dragon Person cannot injure Dragon Maiden, you also should find 
your grave. We can be neighbours,” Chu Mu made a dark joke.

After saying so, Chu Mu laughed bitterly.

He never imagined he would suddenly be facing such a powerful enemy, and Yu Suo also had to 
deal with an opponent she could not win against.

Whether they could safely survive this crisis depended on whether this plan succeeded or not.

Chu Mu originally intended to help Yu Suo overcome this crisis, but he ended up tying his own 
survival with hers.



However, it was better than facing Ancient Flood Dragon Person himself. There was at least a trace 
of hope.

Chapter 1636

Northern Territory.

The city was shrouded in darkness. When one raised his head, he could only see the lonely corona 
within the dark sky.

What was bizarre was that Crimson Sol no longer shifted when the Solar Eclipse occurred. It was as 
if Crimson Sol was bound by something and caused the time to be in disarray.

New Moon Land’s migrants were attacked by strange creatures along the way. Many of those 
creatures were never seen before. They crawled out from underground, flew out from mountains 
and shone murderous green within the darkness.

New Moon Land’s migrants were protected by various factions all over the world. Even so, some 
were attacked and went missing.

Within the Northern Main City, looking through the statistics organized by subordinates, Liu 
Binglan showed a worried expression. Hopefully, all the migration groups could safely arrive at the 
various cities in Northern Territory......

Of course, Liu Binglan was even more worried about Chu Mu.

Ye Qingzi had already told Liu Binglan about Chu Mu’s decision. Liu Binglan felt even more 
worried. The Monument Tear Individual identity itself was a potential danger. The higher the level 
he reached, the closer he was to this potential danger.



Liu Binglan heaved a sigh and was about to return to her room.

Suddenly, a blurry figure disappeared from the corner of her eyes, as if that figure was afraid of 
getting noticed by her.

Liu Binglan was startled. This feeling was already not the first time. There would always be times 
when she felt someone watching over her from the distance.

Whenever she was in danger, that person would always appear to help her.

For a long time, Liu Binglan could not understand who the mysterious person was. However, Liu 
Binglan could not confirm that the identity of that person was the man who had hidden away from 
her for so many years!

Liu Binglan was very angry. Why did he have to hide himself? Did he not know that someone had 
never given up just because of what he said?

Liu Binglan would not let him run away this time. She chanted an incantation and rode on her Star 
River Bird to chase after the figure.

Star River Bird scattered countless beautiful starlights. It crossed through the quiet street and flew 
towards the corner.

Liu Binglan was chasing according to her intuition. After crossing through many quiet streets and 
alleys, she eventually stopped at a blindspot of a street building.



The place was empty and nobody passed through here. Liu Binglan looked at the pitch-black wall 
before her and dazed out for a long time.

She took a deep breath. She really had no more patience to continue the hide and seek with him. Liu 
Binglan spoke angrily, “Chu Tianmang, I know it’s you!”

“Do you think that hiding in the dark and helping us behind our back makes you a great person? Do 
you know Chu Mu had never given up no matter how long the journey would be in order to find 
you? Do you know what you mean to him in his heart?” Liu Binglan did not want to reprimand 
others. However, someone’s behavior made others unable to communicate other than roaring at 
him. He was arrogant, yet held severe machismo. He would always do things according to his own 
judgement!

Only Liu Binglan’s furious voice echoed in the quiet street, there was no response at all.

Liu Binglan also regained her composure. She knew that with Chu Tianmang’s ability, she would 
not find him if he intended to hide. However, he must be nearby and heard her voice.

“I will give you a last chance. If you don’t come out now, then never appear before me and him 
ever!” Liu Binglan stood there and spoke with a chilling tone.

Her voice contained fury and anxiety.

After a period of time, the street became quiet again.



There was still no response in the surroundings, as if Liu Binglan was venting her anger by talking 
to herself.

Seeing the pitch-black street and buildings around, Liu Binglan felt disappointed.

She could not understand why she was fated to encounter such a person in her life. He was difficult 
to communicate, always causing her to become angry whenever they met. His behavior was always 
incomprehensible......

Yet she was married to such a person and even had a child.

Should marriage not be the ceremony to find a person she could love and accompany until the end 
of her life? Just what was her marriage about then?

The ridiculous copulation at Universe Ice Gate, the dating period when she tried to accept him. The 
irreconcilable conflict, them vowing to follow their own paths......

Recalling those, Liu Binglan felt wronged.

She stood there in silence, but her mind was becoming more and more chaotic. Her heart was 
already in chaos as Chu Mu who stayed behind in New Moon Land alone might have to face 
Ancient Flood Dragon Person all by himself and never return.

In Liu Binglan’s heart, Chu Mu was already her most important person, she did not dare to imagine 
how horrifying her life would be after losing her child.



As she continued thinking about that, tears welled up in her eyes. She always felt that shedding 
tears was a laughable matter as she only had an icy heart and no tears. However, for some reason, it 
became easier and easier to shed tears in the recent years......

......

Liu Binglan stood there and sobbed. Within the shadow of the street, a light ripple happened in the 
space.

As if hesitating for a really long time, that ripple slowly opened up and a man’s figure appeared 
from within.

He kept a beard and had black pupils. His facial features were stern-looking.

Perhaps due to a long period of fighting and killing, his black eyes would always be filled with a 
natural killing intent. However, as he looked at the sobbing woman in the dark street, his gaze 
slowly melted away, turning soft and helpless, as well as bitter.

He slowly walked over without making any sound.

In his eyes, this elegant and beautiful woman was like ice, pure and cold. She wrapped her entirety 
tightly and exuded an icy aura, rejecting everything, including him. He could not even feel any 
warmth from this woman most of the time. She did not like to smile or talk. She looked like a 
frozen lake when quiet or when angry.

Honestly speaking, he felt a sense of defeat from this woman.



Everything he did would appear so childish in her cold and mature personality. Everything he did 
for her would not be praised. It was meaningless no matter how much he loved her, he would not 
enter her heart no matter what he did.

Seeing her sob, Chu Tianmang naturally thought that she was not crying because of him at first.

However, after hearing Liu Binglan’s complaints, Chu Tianmang realized that perhaps those were 
all his one-sided conclusions. It was actually different in her heart.

“I heeded your call and showed up,” After a long time, Chu Tianmang finally spoke and interrupted 
Liu Binglan’s weeping.

Liu Binglan was startled for a moment and hurriedly turned around. She saw Chu Tianmang 
standing right in front of her and seemed to have been there for quite a while.

Liu Binglan could not remember how many years it had been since she last saw him. His aged face 
no longer carried any trace of casualness during his youth. Many things Liu Binglan could not 
understand had settled on his face instead......

Liu Binglan looked at him and vaguely found some familiar silhouettes.

Chu Tianmang smiled bitterly and spoke, “You are still so young and beautiful. I look like an old 
man, right?”



Liu Binglan had reached Spirit Emperor rank very early. Her appearance would only become more 
mature and beautiful as her age increased. Time would not leave much of a trace on her as a period 
of a few centuries was as short as a few years to normal people in her long lifespan.

Meanwhile, Chu Tianmang was different. His level had fallen after his soul suffered a heavy injury. 
When he cultivated from below and reached an even higher level, he was already entering his 
middle-age years, causing his appearance to look a bit old.

Liu Binglan wiped away her tears and stared at Chu Tianmang.

“Stop checking, it’s really me,” Chu Tianmang felt that Liu Binglan’s gaze seemed skeptical and 
lamented.

“I know,” Liu Binglan finally spoke.

“You were scolding towards a wall. Aren’t you worried that someone may pass by and 
misunderstand that New Moon Land’s noble and elegant Female Supreme Liu is actually a shrew?” 
said Chu Tianmang.

Liu Binglan bit her lips lightly. Did she really want to do that? Some people would only live in his 
own delusion if she did not scold him, and would only continue doing so.

Chu Tianmang looked at Liu Binglan’s expression. As expected, even if he praised her beauty, she 
never showed any reaction. When he said that she was a shrew, she also never showed any reaction. 
How could there be such a troublesome woman in the world?



In that case, Chu Tianmang had to respect his son Chu Mu. Chu Mu was able to make such an 
emotionless woman cry?

“Why do you never show up?” interrogated Liu Binglan.

“You get angry whenever you see me, why would I look for trouble? Furthermore, it’s been so 
many years since we last met. If we are normal people, we would be greeting each other while 
holding a walking stick today,” said Chu Tianmang.

“Cultivators spend most of the time cultivating, who will remember the time spent on cultivation?” 
said Liu Binglan.

“Fine, it’s already been so long......” said Chu Tianmang.

“It certainly has, you don’t want to see me or don’t want to let me see you, that’s our own matter. 
What about Chu Mu? You can forget about me, but no matter how long time has passed, he has 
never forgotten about you as his father. What about him?” questioned Liu Binglan again.

“Binglan...... I never said I will forget about you,” corrected Chu Tianmang.

“Leave that question for later. Answer me first, why won’t you meet Chu Mu?” said Liu Binglan 
with in a serious tone.

Chu Tianmang did not want to answer, but seeing Liu Binglan’s stubborn eyes......



After a long while, Chu Tianmang sighed, “Because I’m the fourth era’s Monument Tear Inheritor.”

“So what?” asked Liu Binglan.

“The inheritor must eliminate all other fourth era’s Monument Tear Individuals and obtain all 
Monument Tears from them to eventually become the era’s strongest.”

“I have already killed all the other Monument Tear Individuals, and there is only one person left 
now...... This person is our son, Chu Mu.”

“Binglan, tell me, can I see him?”

Chapter 1637: An Enemy Impossible To Defeat

Liu Binglan could not understand why Monument Tear Individuals had to kill one another.

Monument Tear Individuals would only rob one another’s life and Monument Tears to obtain 
greater power.

Would Chu Tianmang rob Chu Mu of his life to obtain power? That was impossible. If Chu 
Tianmang was really so heartless, he would not have to save Chu Mu from the blackhole abyss back 
at Heavenly Mountain stronghold.

She looked at Chu Mu and was still a little doubtful.

“Do you know what era’s strongest means?” asked Chu Tianmang.



“What does it mean?”

“It means the human race will have an Undying rank, the only one apart from Heaven Palace. Be it 
the Divine Sect which holds great authority in the entire Zhengming Continent and Wupan 
Continent, or Demon Beast Palace which has spread all over the world, Elemental Clan or the two 
Royalties, they must all bow before this Undying rank individual. Human leaders have spent 
hundreds of years to look for the way to reach Undying rank. Not only leaders from this era, 
humans from thousands of years ago had also been looking for the method......” Chu Tianmang 
raised his head to look at the dark sky and spoke bitterly.

“When the powerful individuals accumulated over thousands of years found a way to reach 
Undying rank, they will forsake everything and use whatever method to obtain it......”

“Within the Undying rank legends, Monument Tear was able to make one reach Undying rank. This 
was not just a legend but the truth. I don’t know what those desperate people will do to me, 
including you two.”

Liu Binglan watched Chu Tianmang as he told her many things.

Certainly, Liu Binglan did not know all these. She knew that Chu Tianmang had his own concerns 
for not showing up, but she never imagined Chu Tianmang was actually facing all the desperate 
people wanting to reach Undying rank in the entire human territory.

Some people could become heartless devils for a piece of territory, a soul crystal or an Immortal 
Item, let alone a chance to reach Undying rank!

“Now, the human territory will definitely gain an Undying rank, it’s either me or Chu Mu,” said 
Chu Tianmang.



Liu Binglan looked at Chu Tianmang and suddenly felt fear.

This fated Monument Tear meant either of them would die.

To Liu Binglan, that was the cruelest thing. While to Chu Mu or Chu Tianmang, that was something 
they could not accept.

“Can’t you stay like this?” asked Liu Binglan.

Chu Tianmang shook his head and spoke, “In the past, I also thought that we can just give up on 
this Undying rank ticket. Chu Mu’s strength is already unparalleled in the entire human territory, 
while I have already killed all the powerful competitors. There is no longer anyone who can 
threaten us in future. However, I’m wrong.”

“The final Solar Eclipse of the current ten thousand year wheel has arrived. Every era’s strongest 
should be appearing. I can’t say for sure about other era’s strongest, but the fifth era’s strongest 
Ancient Flood Dragon Person has a hostile relationship with the fourth era’s strongest Ancient 
Beast. Once it awakens, the first thing it will do is to kill all fourth era’s Monument Tear Individuals 
who may pose a threat to it!”

Liu Binglan was shocked. At first, she thought that Ancient Flood Dragon Person should only be a 
threat to New Moon Land, but never thought that Ancient Flood Dragon Person was actually related 
to Monument Tear Individuals.

“Which means, either one of you two becomes Undying rank to fight against Ancient Flood Dragon 
Person, or both of you get killed by Ancient Flood Dragon Person?” asked Liu Binglan.



Chu Tianmang nodded.

Chu Tianmang also never expected such a result at the end......

When he found this unchangeable fact, he could only do one thing. He would sweep clean of all 
enemies for Chu Mu, and Chu Mu would no longer need to fight the final enemy of Chu Mu as a 
Monument Tear Individual.

“Chu Mu will not attack me, neither will I attack him. I have been running away, but I cannot run 
away now,” said Chu Tianmang.

Liu Binglan became silent. Why did this matter have to become so cruel?

Could this be the cross of fate necessary after reaching the peak of cultivation?

If that was the case, Liu Binglan would rather wish that they were just common soul pet trainers. 
They would not have to make decisions for the Monument Tear Individual destiny or worry about 
Ancient Flood Dragon Person.

“Is there no other method?” asked Liu Binglan with a heavy tone.

“No.”



For a moment, both of them went silent.

The wind blew from one end of the street and brushed past them.

Liu Binglan’s hair fluttered along the wind, receiving the coldness from the gust.

“Rest assured, I made the same choice as you,” Eventually, Chu Tianmang smiled, “Maybe us two 
are really unsuitable for each other, but our connection is not a complete mistake, at least......”

“You have already made up your mind?” Liu Binglan knew what Chu Tianmang wanted to say.

“Yes, this has always been my decision. Some paths are too crooked and laid with thorns. Someone 
has to pave the path and clean the obstacles for him......” said Chu Tianmang.

Liu Binglan did not say anything. If that was the case, she could comprehend the reason Chu 
Tianmang never appeared before Chu Mu for such a long time. She could also understand why he 
acted in the dark.

However......

“Will you miss me?” Chu Tianmang looked at Liu Binglan and asked this question with a serious 
expression.



Liu Binglan was still immersed in sorrow, this sudden question caused her thoughts to entangle.

“I don’t know,” answered Liu Binglan in an unclear way.

“......” Chu Tianmang was a little speechless. It seemed that this woman was really insensitive 
towards his life.

That was also understandable. He had never shown up for so many years, it was no different from 
being dead to her. She was already used to living without the existence of him in her world.

Chu Tianmang stretched out his hand and combed Liu Binglan’s disheveled hair, then 
unconsciously put his hand on her soft shoulder.

Chu Tianmang had always wanted to hug her, but was afraid of getting hurt by the chill. So he had 
been hesitating.

Perhaps this would be their last meeting, Chu Tianmang suddenly felt that he was too much of a 
coward. Could he not muster the courage to hug her again?

Eventually, he took a step closer and gently hugged Liu Binglan.

Liu Binglan only stood there and appeared flustered. She wanted to reject this unfamiliar hug, but 
slowly remembered a familiar sensation.



This familiarity was not the feeling when they were together at the start, but the familiarity of a 
figure appearing before her to save her whenever she faced a crisis.

She had always thought that he was far away, but in reality, this man had always been by her side, 
using the method he believed to be correct to protect her and Chu Mu.

“I am an impatient man. I should have been more patient back then to slowly reside in your heart, 
and not leave out of impulsiveness,” whispered Chu Tianmang.

Liu Binglan did not speak, she maintained her silence.

Chu Tianmang knew that her keeping silent did not mean she was not listening. It also did not mean 
she never treated his words seriously, she was just poor at expressing.

“No matter what, I will still get angry when I see another man attempting to approach you,” said 
Chu Tianmang.

“The person injuring Xiao Xueang in a secret duel is you?” asked Liu Binglan.

“Hehe, who else can he be apart from me?” Since it already ended up like this, Chu Tianmang felt 
that he could just admit to it.

Sometimes, he really felt that Chu Mu was loved by heaven. He went crazy and even became split 
personality in order to make his woman smile, yet what he received was usually an expression 
which suspected whether he had gone senile. However, Chu Mu could make Liu Binglan smile so 
happily with just a simple praise.



The woman he could not conquer in his entire life was so mindful of another man. Fortunately, that 
man was his son, or Chu Tianmang would really want to kill that man!

“Never mind, forget about that. I will stop on this boring topic. Where is Chu Mu? It’s time to settle 
this,” said Chu Tianmang.

“He’s at New Moon Land,” said Liu Binglan.

“New Moon Land?? Why did he not come to Northern Territory with you!?” Chu Tianmang 
stopped his self-depreciation and turned grim.

“Do you think that by not telling him or showing up, he won’t know anything?” said Liu Binglan 
coldly.

“He knows??” Chu Tianmang was astonished.

That should be impossible. Chu Mu should have assumed him to be dead. How could Chu Mu find 
out about the final secret of Monument Tear Individuals?

“His choice is completely different from yours,” Liu Binglan also understood Chu Mu’s intention 
for staying in New Moon Land.

......



In Chu Mu’s heart, Chu Tianmang was an enemy he could never defeat, and also a person he could 
never surpass.

If he had to face Chu Tianmang as the enemy, then Chu Mu would rather face the Undying rank 
Ancient Flood Dragon Person......

Chu Tianmang’s choice was to run away, and offer his Monument Tear when he could no longer 
escape to grant Chu Mu the position of fourth era’s strongest.

Chu Mu chose to fight!

Even if that was a five thousand year Undying rank creature!

......

Right now, Chu Tianmang’s thoughts began churning rapidly.

How did Chu Mu gain the courage to face an Undying rank creature?

Since Chu Mu knew that he was cleaning the path to help Chu Mu inherit the era’s strongest, why 
did Chu Mu not choose to accept it?

Did Chu Mu not know that even with both of them combined, they could not defeat Ancient Flood 
Dragon Person?



“I will go to New Moon Land now,” Chu Tianmang let go of Liu Binglan and felt anxious.

How could he let Chu Mu face Ancient Flood Dragon Person all by himself? If they really had to 
fight, it should be him facing that five thousand year Undying rank creature. He was the true fourth 
era’s Monument Tear Inheritor.

Chapter 1638: It Awoke Before

A cloud of black dust was swept up around the Heaven Boundary Monument.

No matter how much time passed, nothing could weather away a single ancient sigil or text on this 
monument.

It stood erected on this land as if guarding something, yet reminding people of something.

Chu Mu stood below this Heaven Boundary Monument and looked up to see the top.

He wanted to know the reason for the existence of Heaven Boundary Monument. It represented a 
certain era, but had a history even longer than a wheel. The texts carved on it only recorded a 
certain era’s story, but before then, would there be another story of a creature even earlier than that 
recorded on it? Or perhaps, would he be recorded on this Heaven Boundary Monument in the next 
wheel?

Beneath this Heaven Boundary Monument was the Dark Wind Palace, within the palace was the 
fifth era’s strongest, Ancient Flood Dragon Person.



Its eyes were closed, as if a devil was taking a nap. It would occasionally look at the living beings 
on this land and grin eerily. Its dominance shrouded over this land all the time. Once it woke up, no 
matter if there was any new race or new master on this land, it would reclaim the land.

Chu Mu remembered that when he stood below the Heaven Boundary Monument for the first time, 
only a portion of memory was left in his head. This portion of memory gradually appeared as he 
became stronger, eventually letting him take the path of a Monument Tear Individual.

Meanwhile, there were many people like him in the human territory, guided by Heaven Boundary 
Monument unconsciously. As they became stronger, they would gradually clash against other 
Monument Tear Individuals similarly treading this narrow path......

At the end of the path was this napping devil.

It could be said that Heaven Boundary Monument was deciding the fate of some people.

In the past, Chu Mu had no idea because he was only standing within the folds of mountains and 
could not see the entire picture.

Now, he saw many more things.

The truth behind Solar Eclipse, the truth behind Monument Tear Individuals, the entire world was 
not as vast as he used to imagine. Instead, it gradually looked like a cage, and the rules of the cage 
were determined and managed by Heaven Palace.

“Huhuhuhuhuhu~!”



Gusts of eerie wind blew past, the pitch-black Heaven Boundary Monument no longer looked so 
intimidatingly solemn. Instead, it appeared to be like an arrogant spirit manipulating something.

Chu Mu jumped up and flew to the top of Heaven Boundary Monument.

He used his hands to tear open a spatial sigil above Heaven Boundary Monument and a spatial 
passage connecting to another dimension appeared.

Chu Mu did not think any further and flew inside.

......

The raging wind of darkness remained blowing, there was also occasional coldness coming from 
the chilling palace ahead.

When Chu Mu walked into this palace floating above darkness and raging wind, he felt like walking 
into a mausoleum.

Suddenly, a pair of emotionless eyes appeared on the roof of the palace. Its gaze coldly focused on 
Chu Mu, like pieces of ice stakes piercing into Chu Mu’s eyes, sending waves of chill directly into 
Chu Mu’s soul!

Chu Mu inspected with soul remembrance and noticed a slim creature lying on the roof. It was 
completely dark and had a well-groomed fur. Its long tail hung down from the roof and just touched 
the stairs of the levitating palace.



Its tail lightly swept left and right and appeared to be rather casual, yet it carried a deadly killing 
intent!

Chu Mu’s heart sank, he could not be any more familiar with this creature. It looked exactly like the 
little black fox Yu Suo usually carried in her arms!

Seven Sins Fox Dark Death King!

Chu Mu remembered clearly that there was a petrified Dark Death King in Wind Palace. The 
creature lying on the roof was none other than it.

Chu Mu had personally witnessed the strength of the ten thousand year Immortal Dark Death King, 
and this Dark Death King before him was not any weaker than the ten thousand year Immortal Dark 
Death King.

“Young master, this fellow is guarding outside, it looks like Ancient Flood Dragon Person has not 
completely awaken,” said Old Li.

Ancient Flood Dragon Person had been sleeping for five thousand years. This Solar Eclipse 
certainly could let it awaken, but this awakening process still took time.

Since Dark Death King was guarding outside, Ancient Flood Dragon Person must still be bound by 
something. This was definitely a good news to Chu Mu!



“Wuwuwuwu!”

Dark Death King’s gaze was filled with hostility. As long as this human dared to take one step 
closer, its claws would surely tear this human to shreds.

It slowly stood up, the dense darkness aura lingering around its body slowly turned into a violent 
darkness storm, triggering an unstable shaking within the entire space.

Suddenly, a huge fox shadow appeared on the back of Dark Death King. That majestic body was 
even more astonishing than the solemn Wind Palace. That pair of eyes stared at Chu Mu coldly, as if 
just its gaze could vaporize this weak human.

Chu Mu knew that it was already showing killing intent and immediately chanted.

Since it was darkness, he would find out who was the true dominator of darkness. Chu Two black 
summoning diagrams appeared next to Chu Mu. Within one diagram, Dead Dream flapped its 
sixteen feathered wings and hovered next to Chu Mu.

From the other diagram, Zhan Ye in black armor walked out slowly. Facing a legendary opponent 
like Dark Death King, Zhan Ye’s eyes gleamed in anticipation instead!

Only an enemy like that could allow it to unleash its full power!

Dark Death King slowly walked over along the roof and pillar of the palace. It looked like a ruler 
walking down from its throne. That pair of eyes remained arrogant and cruel!



It exposed its sharp fangs and the fox shadow on its back did so as well!

Suddenly, Dark Death King turned into black lightning and pounced towards Dead Dream!

Its fox shadow actually separated from its body and attacked Zhan Ye!

Black lightning zoomed past with unimaginable speed. Dead Dream already took evasion action, 
but a long claw wound still appeared on its body. Blood slowly flowed out from Dead Dream’s 
body.

Chu Mu turned around and noticed Dark Death King already appearing behind Dead Dream. It 
lifted up its claw and elegantly licked the blood on its claw like a hunting playing with its prey.

What an astonishing speed!

Chu Mu was shocked. Dead Dream had a very high agility, there were hardly any creatures which 
could hit it in a frontal attack.

However, this Dark Death King charged past Dead Dream and yet Dead Dream was unable to evade 
the attack. Dead Dream’s strength after experiencing God Dew’s baptism had become much 
stronger than during the war!

On the other side, Dark Death King’s fox shadow showed a completely different attacking style 
compared to the main body. Dark Death King attacked with speed and drew blood in a single strike.



Meanwhile, the fox shadow split out from Dark Death King used overpowering strikes, each strike 
would tremble the space. Zhan Ye had already reached high class Immortal rank, yet it had trouble 
taking the terrifying strikes of the fox shadow!

Zhan Ye was injured, Dead Dream was also injured. Right after the fight started, this Dark Death 
King which had slept for five thousand years already disppd its terrifying strength. As expected of 
the past strongest creature in that wheel. It was much stronger compared to the other subordinates of 
Ancient Flood Dragon Person!

Chu Mu’s heart sank again. There must be other subordinates guarding within the palace. If Dead 
Dream and Zhan Ye could not handle this Dark Death King despite cooperating, he probably could 
not even enter the Wind Palace, let alone scattering the seeds inside!

“Grrr!”

Zhan Ye roared. It did not take long before it was forced to use Broken Limb Rebirth. This was 
sufficient to prove just how terrifying Dark Death King’s strength was. What caused Zhan Ye to feel 
frustrated was that this was only Dark Death King’s soul shadow!

Dead Dream was facing the real Dark Death King. Under the creepy and swift attacks of Dark 
Death King, even Dead Dream could not maintain its usual calmness and composure.

More and more wounds appeared on its body, yet the dark purple lightning surroundings its body 
could not touch Dark Death King at all.

“Young master, this fellow is overwhelmingly strong. It seems to be even stronger than Yu Suo’s 
Dark King. You have to summon another soul pet to take it on, or you have to join in yourself,” Old 
Li took a glance at the disadvantageous situation and urged.



Zhan Ye was already getting injured at the start of the battle. This was enough to prove that this 
Dark Death King was much stronger than Dead Dream and Zhan Ye. Perhaps, before Zhan Ye could 
boost its strength, it would have used up its Broken Limb Rebirth chances.

After chanting another incantation, Chu Mu summoned Night which also had darkness property.

Night’s strength should be on par with Dead Dream after going through Ning Maner’s nurturing. 
Chu Mu originally thought he could handle Dark Death King with two soul pets, but never expected 
to have to summon all three of his darkness property soul pets.

After Night appeared, Dead Dream and Zhan Ye were able to gain some room for breathing. Chu 
Mu knew he could not waste too much time outside the palace. So he transformed into a streak of 
black and silver flame and flew into the palace.

......

It was still quiet inside the Wind Palace, Chu Mu could see the entirety of the palace within the 
dimness.

There were originally many statues gathered inside the palace, but those statues had already 
disappeared now. There was only one semi-giant like creature half kneeling before Ancient Flood 
Dragon Person’s throne, Chu Mu could not tell what kind of creature it was.

On the throne, Ancient Flood Dragon Person with the upper half human body and lower half dark 
blue dragon body remained leaning on the armrest.



Chu Mu took a glance at it and instantly felt an ominous chill.

He clearly remembered that Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s petrified posture was lying on the side 
with one hand propping up its head back then.

However, Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s sleeping posture changed. Both of its hands were crossed 
in front of its chest. Its closed eyes also gave off a feeling that they might open any moment. 
Meanwhile, its dragon tail with sharp scales changed from the originally coiling state to stretching 
out along the stairs......

It awoke before!

Chapter 1639: Peak Immortal Rank, Bone Demon Giant

Chu Mu could feel his heart beating violently.

He did not know Ancient Flood Dragon’s strength in the past, and the entire palace was filled with 
statues, so he was able to maintain a calm state.

However, after knowing that Ancient Flood Dragon Person was the fifth era’s strongest and was 
about to be awakened, he could feel the fear of facing the grim reaper making his breathing 
difficult.

Chu Mu slowly took a step forward, this step caused his cold sweat to pour out on his back.

He would keep focusing on Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s lightly closed eyes uncontrollably. He 
would feel that if he looked away, that guy would open its eyes and stare at him with a fake smile, 
watching his foolish behavior.



Chu Mu buried Yu Suo’s seeds into the crevice of the stone bricks. These seeds would squeeze into 
the crevices like a living creature after touching hard objects, then slowly germinate.

They already carried energy, so they would slowly grow without absorbing any nutrients.

Chu Mu arranged the seeds into a formation according to Yu Suo’s requirement. After scattering 
halfway, he could feel a pair of eyes staring at him.

Looking past the dimness, Chu Mu took a glance at Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s face.

Ancient Flood Dragon Person had a human-like face, its wide mouth showed a mocking laughter of 
a ruler. There was a weird bone horn at the tip of its sharp chin, its nose and two eyebrows 
connected into a narrow triangle......

This face gave off an incongruity to Chu Mu. It looked like laughing, yet the laughter seemed so 
fake. It was sleeping, yet looked like waiting for a foolish person to walk near it while purposely 
closing its eyes.

“Young master, look at its tail,” whispered Old Li.

Chu Mu turned his gaze towards Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s tail and noticed that the tip of its 
tail was actually slightly vibrating!

Although he had to face it eventually, but when he actually stood in front of it and noticed it slowly 
reverting from the petrified state, that chillness was truly terrifying......



It was hard to imagine even after reaching his current level, he would still feel cold before a certain 
powerful individual’s aura like a weakling.

Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s body was grey in color, appearing to be a lifelike statue.

Currently, the tip of its tail was slowly changing into normal blue color scales. If he paid closer 
attention, he could see the petrification slowly residing from its tail.

The process was not fast, but it would not be long before it completely awakened!

“The energy for Totem Palace’s seal should be from Crimson Sol. Once Crimson Sol’s light is 
absorbed and blocked, the seals in this world should be weakened. In addition, darkness and evil 
creatures are thriving during Solar Eclipse...... Solar Eclipse is just like an amnesty of crime. The 
entire human world will become monster’s carnival night!” whispered Old Li.

“I don’t understand why Heaven Palace needs to absorb Crimson Sol’s energy,” said Chu Mu.

“They have their reasons.”

Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s petrification seal was slowly coming off. As they conversed, the tip 
of its tail was about to be completely unsealed.

This tail was like a newborn life. It was swinging wider and wider, as if eagerly struggling out of 
the confinement.



Chu mu did not know if he should be glad that Ancient Flood Dragon Person had not completely 
awakened or grimaced at the shortness of time.

“There is still half to go, young master, hurry up. We should be able to escape,” Old Li also took 
some seeds to help Chu Mu scatter.

Chu Mu nodded and did not dare to get distracted again.

......

“Wuwuwu~!”

Mo Xie suddenly cried out while lying on Chu Mu’s shoulder, reminding Chu Mu of something.

Chu Mu immediately took a glance at Ancient Flood Dragon Person. He saw its long tail already 
had over one meter unsealed and became even more worried.

“Wuwuwu!”

Suddenly, Mo Xie stood up on Chu Mu’s shoulder. Its eyes stared at the half kneeling giant creature 
at the center of the hall with hostility.



Originally, Ancient Flood Dragon Person had a large number of subordinates. Those subordinates 
had already been unsealed in the past few years and began rampaging in the human territories. Chu 
Mu had hunted down around ten of those creatures. Meanwhile, many were spread out in other 
places, so Chu Mu was unable to find them.

The only ones left seemed to be Dark Death King guarding outside and this half kneeling giant.

The giant’s physique was robust, its shoulder, elbows, wrists and ankles had weapon-like bone 
thorns growing out.

It maintained a half kneeling stance and yet its head was almost touching the ceiling of the palace.

Chu Mu took a glance at it and suddenly noticed this giant’s eyes were looking down at him while 
gleaming!

It was awake! Chu Mu drew a sharp breath!

Pssh!

The giant’s bone thorn stabbed towards Chu Mu while he was in a defenseless state!

Chu Mu immediately transformed into flame and that bone thorn shot past his face. It almost 
pierced through his body from his head!

Bam!



The bone thorn stabbed into the solid palace floor, the entire palace began shaking violently.

Dust settled down, black and silver flame flared up at a corner of the palace. Chu Mu’s figure 
appeared from within the flames.

A few droplets of blood flowed out from the scratch mark on Chu Mu’s cheek. Chu Mu wiped it 
away with lingering fears.

That guy had always been awake. It actually pretended to be petrified and he was almost killed by 
it!

“Young master, give me the seeds. You handle it,” Old Li knew that time was short and hurriedly 
told Chu Mu.

Chu Mu threw the rest of the seeds to Old Li and flared up his wild black flame and creepy silver 
flame!

A huge fist suddenly approached and sealed up all evasion paths.

Chu Mu gave up on dodging and faced the approaching giant fist with his fist covered in black 
flame!

Booom~!



Flame and wind caused by the clashing between fists rampaged in the palace. Bone Demon Giant 
too a few heavy steps back, its head poked through the palace’s ceiling.

Chu Mu also suffered in that clash of strength. He was blasted to the stone wall of the palace from 
the impact and cracked the solid stone wall. The stone wall wobbled and looked like it would 
collapse any moment.

“This thing is also so strong!” Chu Mu shook his numbed arm.

Chu Mu’s current strength was near invincible within human territory. The eight major faction’s 
leaders also had to be polite when seeing him.

However, this giant was able to blast him away with one punch. This was enough to prove that it 
was a peak Immortal rank creature!

He might not be a match for Ancient Flood Dragon Person, but was he even unable to take down 
one of its subordinates?

Chu Mu naturally could not accept it. He focused his gaze and manifested a number of black flame 
spears.

These flame spears stabbed towards Bone Demon Giant according to Chu Mu’s will.

Each Devil Fire spear would generate a flame and spatial explosion when they touched any part of 
Bone Demon Giant’s body. The explosion could wipe out an entire city!



Bone Demon Giant used its thick arms to block its face. It simply allowed those flame spears to stab 
into its body and slid back from the impact of explosions.

Nong!

Suddenly, this Bone Demon Giant roared and slammed its fists onto the palace’s ground!

In an instant, densely packed bones appeared around Bone Demon Giant and became a bone shield!

After the bone shield blocked all of Chu Mu’s attack, it transformed into a lethal weapon and 
swarmed out from the pillars and walls of the palace!

Other than the area around Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s throne, the entire palace was filled with 
bone thorns. Chu Mu could not dodge at all. Old Li also hid into a corner and did not dare to scatter 
the seeds in its hand......

Chu Mu was surrounded by bone thorns. It was as if he fell into a big mouth filled with sharp fangs 
and was getting chewed in the mouth.

“Young master, lure it away. Those seeds are destroyed,” shouted Old Li after hiding at a safe spot.

Chu Mu took a glance at Old Li and was surprised at how that old fellow was able to dodge an 
attack from peak Immortal rank creature.



Perhaps, demon race’s agents were born with such sharp senses to protect their lives.

Chu Mu chanted an incantation and forcefully threw himself into an alternate space. He directly 
transferred to outside the palace.

That Bone Demon Giant saw Chu Mu attempting to escape and its green eyes glowed. In an instant, 
more bone thorns appeared and sealed up this palace.

Chu Mu escaped in the nick of time. When he turned around, he saw the entire palace filled up with 
those terrifying bone thorns!

Outside the palace, Night, Zhan Ye and Dead Dream were fighting against Dark Death King. The 
battle was gradually shifting higher and higher above.

Chu Mu should not need to worry about that battle. He quickly chanted an incantation before Bone 
Demon Giant came out.

The incantation triggered the dark space in the surroundings, ripples formed within the calm space.

The ripples were contained within a diamond area, the space within the diamond area sank in 
unnaturally.

Within the sunken diamond area, darkness energy, spatial energy and fire element crazily 
interweaved and clashed, becoming extremely violent.



“Nong nong!”

Bone Demon Giant really chased after him. The palace’s gate was unable to contain its body and 
was shattered by it!

Chu Mu saw Bone Demon Giant coming out and flipped his hand. That diamond-shaped area also 
began turning and landed at the spot Bone Demon Giant appeared at after coming out, appearing 
like a jail imprisoning its body!

At the same time, the darkness energy, Devil Fire and spatial energy collided and generated a 
rampaging destructive force, blasting onto Bone Demon Giant’s body!

Chapter 1640: Awakened Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s Tail!

The fluctuation of energy swept up waves of chaotic air currents. The air currents contained the 
shards of Bone Demon Giant’s body parts shattered by the collision of the three types of energy!

“Nong!” Bone Demon Giant roared furiously. A black fist suddenly slammed down from high 
above and shattered the diamond prison.

Chu Mu moved back a little and did not clash frontally against Bone Demon Giant too much.

The main mission this time was to scatter those seeds in the palace. Once they lured Dragon Maiden 
to here, he would not have to take care of this Bone Demon Giant himself.

Chu Mu maintained a certain distance and kited around Bone Demon Giant.



Not long after, Old Li ran out from the palace.

Chu Mu knew that the old geezer had succeeded. Without any hesitation, he immediately recalled 
Zhan Ye, Night and Dead Dream into his soul pet space and left this place without turning back.

If Chu Mu only wanted to run, even Dark Death King and Bone Demon Giant could not keep him.

Soon, Chu Mu reached the passage which connected to the second Heaven Boundary Monument. If 
he returned to the ground, this mission would be completed!

“Y...... Young master!”

Suddenly, Old Li shouted in a strange tone.

Chu Mu turned around on reflex and was shocked to notice a sharp scale-covered tail appearing 
from the half-destroyed Wind Palace!

This tail pierced through the palace roof and wildly swept around.

Seemingly dissatisfied that Dark Death King and Bone Demon Giant allowed the enemy to escape, 
the sharp tail rapidly whipped Dark Death King and Bone Demon Giant!

Dark Death King and Bone Demon Giant were swept away by the tail, Chu Mu could even see 
them spitting out blood within the darkness!



Seeing such a scene, Chu Mu drew a sharp breath.

He had already experienced the strength of Dark Death King and Bone Demon Giant. However, 
they were like two toddlers before that terrifying tail, they did not stand any chance of resisting!

Ancient Flood Dragon Person had awakened!

Seeing that huge tail slithering around above the palace, it felt like facing a grim reaper.

That dragon tail was stretching itself. It expanded and occupied the entire dark space. It was solid, 
thick and menacing!

The space itself was filled up by its volume and it was rapidly extending towards Chu Mu!

Chu Mu was shocked and did not dare to hesitate at all. He immediately ran into the spatial passage 
and escaped from here with the fastest speed!

However, it was as if that tail was alive and had eyes. It locked onto Chu Mu and suddenly shot out, 
chasing after Chu Mu!

There was actually some distance between Chu Mu and the tail. However, this distance was 
shortened by half in the blink of an eye!



“Young master, hurry up!” Old Li saw the tail approaching closer and shouted in panic.

Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s tail extended at a terrifying speed. Chu Mu had already raised his 
speed to the maximum, yet the tail was still shortening the distance.

In the past, when Chu Mu was being pursued, he could at least maintain some distance and prevent 
the enemy from catching up in a short time.

However, this Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s tail was many times faster than Chu Mu. Chu Mu felt 
that the tail was flying while he was just standing there.

Rumble rumble~!

The narrow spatial passage could not contain Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s thick tail, the entire 
spatial passage was burst open......

The huge tail was getting closer, the scales covering the tail churned like blades, shredding the 
spatial passage into pieces.

Chu Mu could already sense the chill from his back. He turned around to take a glance and felt his 
scalp going numb.

The tail was right before him. It would catch up in the next second, but there was still a distance to 
the exit!



Chu Mu almost felt despair. He never thought that Ancient Flood Dragon Person was this strong. 
Just its tail was more dangerous and terrifying than any creature he had met!

“Chu Mu!”

Suddenly, an anxious mental voice called out from outside the spatial passage.

This was the voice of a middle-aged man, Chu Mu was unfamiliar with this voice.

He felt doubtful. Who could be calling him outside the spatial passage??

“Hurry, enter the dimension!” That mental voice called out again.

For some reason, Chu Mu trusted that voice unconditionally. He did not hesitate and gave up on the 
spatial passage, squeezing into the turbulent chaos.

Bam!

Almost right after Chu Mu entered the chaos, the entire spatial passage was shredded apart by 
Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s tail!

The shattered spatial energy pelted onto Chu Mu’s body, leaving cuts on Chu Mu’s body......



If he still stayed in the spatial passage just now, he would have been shattered along with the spatial 
passage by Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s tail.

“Young master, don’t stop, run!” shouted Old Li.

Even in the chaos dimension, Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s tail was moving unhindered!

The spatial storm and timespace turbulence in the dimension were like light breeze blowing onto 
Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s tail. None could leave a scratch on this huge tail!

“Chu Mu, exit from here!” That mental voice called out to Chu Mu once again.

Chu Mu was surprised for a moment. He was in an alternate dimension, mental voice should not be 
able to be transmitted here. How did that person manage to transmit mental voice into his ear?

Chu Mu did not dwell on this question. He raised his head, a feeble glow and swirl appeared in the 
chaos.

That was probably the spatial crack that person opened up for him. Chu Mu immediately 
transformed into black and silver flame, flying towards that glow and swirl.

At the same time, Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s tail was still pursuing. From Chu Mu’s 
perspective, he could see that tail acting like a wildly flailing monster. More importantly, this was 
only a portion of Ancient Flood Dragon Person’s tail!



......

Chu Mu was getting closer to the glow, he could sense the smell of air.

He accelerated and squeezed out from this spatial crack.

This crack connected directly to the ground, and not far away from the second Heaven Boundary 
Monument.

After returning to the ground, Chu Mu noticed that there was actually a little light in the originally 
dark sky. When he raised his head to check, he saw the originally covered Crimson Sol slightly 
slanted. This tiny slant caused the world to be not as dark as before.

“Young master, Yu Suo’s stealing formation should be taking effect. The lack of energy caused 
Heaven Palace unable to prevent Crimson Sol’s shifting trail. Once Crimson Sol shifted, light will 
shine onto the ground again,” said Old Li.

Chu Mu nodded.

Actually, what he was concerned with was not this. He was more concerned about who helped him 
escape from Ancient Flood Dragon Person.

Chu Mu walked towards the Heaven Boundary Monument’s direction.



Within the dim light, Chu Mu saw the solemnly erected Heaven Boundary Monument and the dust 
cloud of age around the monument.

Under the Heaven Boundary Monument, Chu Mu saw a figure.

Within the dust cloud, that figure was a little blurry, Chu Mu could not see the figure properly......

He was a stranger, Chu Mu did not recognize him from his impression.

However, his appearance made Chu Mu feel familiar, he should be a person Chu Mu knew very 
well.

Black and silver flame fluttered wildly in the raging wind, the tips of the flames would separate 
from the body and become sparks in the wind.

Chu Mu slowly levitated and flew towards that person, landing right in front of that person.

A stranger’s face......

He kept a beard, at around middle age and seemed like an experienced person.

His eyes were black. It was unknown what kind of experiences he had gone through to exude such a 
chilling gaze.



However, Chu Mu saw a trace of gentleness within the chilling gaze......

Chu Mu focused on him without batting an eye.

He was an unfamiliar, really unfamiliar person. Chu Mu searched through all of his memories and 
could not overlap him with the most cherished person in his heart.

However, Chu Mu’s heart was in a violent turmoil.

Because he knew that this person was definitely Chu Tianmang, his father!

Back at Nightmare Island, Chu Mu had imagined countless times that he would be bringing his soul 
pets to his father, and let his father see that he had become a soul pet trainer again.

However, when Chu Mu returned to Gang Luo City, he did not see his father at all.

Chu Mu thought it was just a short farewell, that he would eventually see his father one day......

He never thought that such a long time had passed. It was so long that Chu Mu could no longer 
match his father’s appearance with the one in his memory. It was so longer that even though he 
knew the person before him was his father, he was unable to call him father......



It was not due to fading memory, absolutely not. Nobody could take over Chu Tianmang’s position 
in Chu Mu’s heart. Since young, he had been telling Chu Mu all kinds of knowledges about soul 
pets. It was him who told Chu Mu the thrilling adventures. It was him who drew a blueprint of soul 
pets for Chu Mu, then letting Chu Mu work towards this goal without a trace of doubt.

From New Moon Land’s most western end to Tianxia City, from Tianxia City to Wanxiang City, 
from New Moon Land to Cloud Realm, He Border......

On the dim continent, two warm glows constantly flickered.

Chu Tianmang took a glance at the glowing spatial ring worn by Chu Mu, then at his own ring.

Within the two rings were Monument Tears. There were Monument Tears from others as well as 
their own most precious Monument Tears. The tears contained all the unforgettable memories over 
the years......

However, two Monument Tears were harmonious. In Chu Mu’s ring, there was a teardrop fallen for 
Chu Tianmang’s sake. Similarly, in Chu Tianmang’s ring, there was an almost solidified teardrop 
for Chu Mu’s sake.

Chu Tianmang also remained quiet like Chu Mu, he slowly took off the ring which was constantly 
hinting at what to do. He put the ring on his palm and then presented it before Chu Mu.

“I always said Binglan is an incompetent mother in the past. Actually, I should be the incompetent 
father,” Chu Tianmang finally broke the silence.



After finishing that sentence, Chu Tianmang already let go of his hand and allowed that ring to 
levitate in front of Chu Mu......

He turned around and focused on the tall Heaven Boundary Monument.

Bam!

A great tremor suddenly exploded out above the Heaven Boundary Monument!

The space blasted open, the Heaven Boundary Monument shook violently and a tail covered in 
blade scales appeared above Heaven Boundary Monument!

This tail stood tall like a grim reaper and looked down at Chu Mu and Chu Tianmang below the 
Heaven Boundary Monument.
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