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Chapter 9: Why? 

Chapter 9 Why? 

Lin Kai glanced condescendingly at He Chenguang, and shook his head playfully: “This 
is the best warrior of Spike, He Chenguang? Hehe, but that’s it!” 

This is He Chenguang. In the second drama I am a Special Forces, He Chenguang is 
the protagonist! 

He has superb judgment and strength value, but such a powerful existence is simply 
vulnerable to Lin Kai! 

This is Lin Kai who has a plug-in, so powerful! 

The female soldiers of the Fire Phoenix were all stunned at this time, looking at Lin Kai 
stupidly. 

In terms of single ability, none of them is He Chenguang’s opponent, but such a 
powerful He Chenguang was actually defeated by Lin Kai! 

If He Chenguang was defeated by experts like Fan Tianlei and Lei Zhan, the three 
women would not be surprised, but He Chenguang was abused by Lin Kai! 

Who is Lin Kai? The first waste of the Southeast Military Region! 

Relying on the army that came through the back door, it only spent three months in the 
recruit company and was fired. Such a waste can actually kill He Chenguang easily? 

He Chenguang, who was half-kneeling on the ground, was holding his knees with a 
heart-piercing pain on his face. A melon seed of Lin Kai almost penetrated into his 
kneecap. If he goes deeper, he inserts the meniscus. The military career is probably 
over here. 

He Chenguang felt unconvinced in his heart, but Lin Kai was helpless. 



Frozen for a long time, the hot-tempered Ye Cunxin was the first to stand up and speak: 
“Hey! It’s okay to bully our sister An Ran, and now he still beats He Chenguang, don’t 
you put our Fire Phoenix in your eyes?” 

“Fire Phoenix?” Hearing this, Lin Kai also laughed playfully, with a disdain on his face: 
“Hehe, even Lei Zhan is not my opponent, you Fire Phoenix, dare you compare Lin Kai 
with me?” 

furious! 

But Lin Kai’s madness, when it reached the ears of the women of the Phoenix, it was 
naked bragging! 

Ye Cunxin laughed out loud when he held his arms: “Huh? You can really brag, that Lei 
Zhan instructor is not your opponent? I will meet you for our Lei Zhan instructor today!” 

After all, Ye Cunxin and Tian Guo surrounded Lin Kai from left to right. 

They may not be as good as He Chenguang in terms of single-handed ability, but when 
the female soldiers join hands, it is not one plus one equals two. 

Their combat effectiveness will be greatly improved because they cooperate very well. 

I saw two women surrounded Lin Kai, one on the left and the other on the right. 

Ye Cunxin kicked Lin Kai’s waist, Tian Guo was even more despicable, and actually 
kicked Lin Kai’s crotch! 

If it is an ordinary soldier, facing the siege of the two women, he will definitely be beaten 
in a hurry, but Lin Kai is different, Lin Kai’s body has been upgraded through the 
system, and it is no longer a waste of Lin Kai! 

Now Lin Kai’s reaction and speed are much faster than before! 

What’s more, Lin Kai now possesses three skills. 

Hawkeye skills are activated! 

In Lin Kai’s eyes, the two women’s movements were slowed down several times, and 
Lin Kai lightly patted Ye Cunxin’s calf at this time, and by the way, clamped both legs, 
directly clamping the calf kicked by Tian Guo. 

“Oh!” He only heard Ye Cunxin exclaim, Lin Kai directly shot Ye Cunxin away with great 
strength! 



One of Tian Guo’s leg was clamped between Lin Kai’s legs. Tian Guo wanted to 
withdraw her leg, but found that Lin Kai’s legs were like a huge vise, her legs were not 
moving. 

brush! 

Lin Kai pulled back, and directly caused Tian Guo to split to the ground. Immediately, 
Tian Guo’s painful tears were about to fall, clutching his crotch and rolling on the 
ground. 

“Who is a special soldier in a woman’s family? Isn’t it okay to cook at home and take the 
kids?” Lin Kai patted the dust on his body, pretending to be forceful. 

Ye Cunxin! Tian Guo! The two elite special forces of the Fire Phoenix were also 
defeated by Lin Kai! 

Similar to He Chenguang, they had never made any moves in Lin Kai’s hands, and they 
were defeated as soon as they shot! 

At this moment, An Ran, who was squatting on the side, stopped crying. The look in Lin 
Kai’s eyes was a little confused and unfamiliar. 

This… Is this the Lin Kai you know? 

An Ran grew up with Lin Kai since she was a child. She knew exactly who Lin Kai was. 

Crazed, arrogant, dull, and arrogant, this is Lin Kai’s character, and Lin Kai himself is 
very incompetent. 

Only relying on the Lin family can Lin Kai live to this day. 

But the Lin Kai in front of him, although he is also very arrogant, but he has arrogant 
strength! 

The strength is strong, and it also gives people a sense of inscrutableness. This feeling 
was never given to An Ran by Lin Kai before. 

Just three months of training for recruits can turn a waste into a genius? 

Impossible, they are the elite of the special forces, they can’t beat a rookie who just 
came out of the recruit company? 

Besides, it is impossible for Lin Kai to be expelled from the recruit company with such a 
strong strength! 



An Ran and Ye Cunxin helped each other back to the side of the jeep, and He 
Chenguang limped back to the side of the jeep. The three of them looked at Lin Kai with 
great fear. 

At this time, Tian Guo was rubbing his inner thighs while quietly saying: “Sister An Ran, 
you are not honest, you actually lied to us, saying that your boyfriend is the most trash 
soldier in the Southeast Military Region.” 

“What’s more, he is a prodigal, he doesn’t have any specialties. In the recruit company, 
he is the bottom of everything. You still want to change a boyfriend. 

“Now, look, what kind of waste is this? He is strong enough to join the Raiden 
Commando!” 

Ye Cunxin also said quietly, with a look of dissatisfaction: “Yeah, my boyfriend is so 
handsome, his family is good, and he has strength. You are not satisfied yet, sister An 
Ran, your vision is really good.” 

An Ran was also stupid and didn’t know how to explain it. 

Lin Kai before was not like this! 

“I…” An Ran couldn’t argue. 

Lin Kai picked up his backpack at this time, turned around and wanted to leave. 

But at this moment, I only heard the roar of a car, and in a vague way, Lin Kai seemed 
to hear someone calling his name. 

“Lin Kai! Lin Kai!” 

Looking back, he saw another military jeep driving out of the Southeast Military Region. 
He Zhijun stuck his head out and waved his hand and shouted Lin Kai. 

When everyone saw that the leader had appeared, they all stood at attention, neatly. 

The jeep stopped, and He Zhijun hurriedly got out of the car and ran towards Lin Kai. 

“Good head!” An Ran saluted several people. 

He Zhijun glanced at several people with a smile and said, “Hello, comrades.” 

After all, He Zhijun skipped a few people and came to Lin Kai. 



He Zhijun looked at Lin Kai with an amiable smile. He patted Lin Kai on the shoulder 
and said, “Lin Kai, how can I let you go home alone? Come, get in the car, and I’ll send 
it. you!” 

“This is not so good.” Lin Kai scratched his head. 

“What’s wrong? Go, get in the car!” He Zhijun said with a smile. 

He Zhijun had a good intention to let Lin Kai get on the car, just because Lin Kai didn’t 
need to go to the station to take the car, and followed He Zhijun to the jeep. 

Now it was Ye Cunxin’s turn that several people were stunned, what? The chief 
personally sent Lin Kai home? 

Why? Is it because the chief wants to please the Lin family behind Lin Kai? 

Seeing this scene, He Chenguang was very unconvinced. He saluted and shouted: 
“Reporting chief! He Chenguang has something to say!” 

He Zhijun, who was about to board the car, was stunned, glanced at He Chenguang, 
and said, “Say.” 

“In the army, everyone is equal! Why should he be expelled to go home? Your chief 
picks him up in person. This is not fair!” He Chenguang shouted. 

Tian Guo and Ye Cunxin nodded again and again to show agreement. 

Hearing that, He Zhijun also smiled: “Hehe, who told you that Lin Kai was fired?” 

“If he is not fired, why should he go home?” He Chenguang asked again. 

“Lin Kai has just passed the inspection of the recruit company and asked for three days 
off to go home. Is there a problem?” This time, He Zhijun’s tone became serious. 

He Chenguang was even more dissatisfied when he heard that, and he blushed: “Why 
can Lin Kai go home? New recruits are not allowed to go home for one year. Isn’t this 
the rule of the army?” 

Facing He Chenguangs repeated confrontations, He Zhijun was also angry. He roared: 
“Lin Kai defeated Lei Zhan! Defeated the King of Yama! Shoot ten shots and ten rings! If 
you have this ability, I will You have ten days off!” 

Snapped! 

After all, He Zhijun slammed the door severely, and the jeep swaggered past He 
Chenguang and the others. 



But He Chenguang and the others were all stupid. 

what? Defeated Hades? Defeated Lei Zhan? Is it a perfect score of ten shots and ten 
rings? 

This… is this true? Is this Lin Kai’s ability to waste? 

Although He Chenguang himself is also the Gun King, and even the best sniper in 
Spike, he dare not say that he can shoot ten shots and ten rings! 

But that kid Lin Kai just got out of the recruit company and he scored ten shots and ten 
rings? 

Who is Hades? The assaultman of the Raiden Commando, his skill is so terrifying, He 
Chenguang is not an opponent. 

That kid actually defeated Hades? 

Lei Zhan, the legendary role of the Southeast Military Region, his deeds are unknown to 
the Southeast Military Region. Even Lei Zhan was defeated by Lin Kai? 

No wonder Lin Kai said just now that he had defeated Lei Zhan, just now He 
Chenguang thought he was bragging, but now it seems that he is ignorant! 

At this time, He Chenguang’s extremely unconvinced spirit went down a lot, at least, he 
was not defeated by a waste who was driven out of the army, he was defeated by a 
strong man! 

The most complicated mood at the scene was nothing but An Ran, who was even more 
confused at this time. 

It was she who proposed the breakup, and it was her who lost such an excellent 
boyfriend for nothing! 

Although she didn’t know why Lin Kai suddenly became so good and so strong, she 
really said the breakup. 

Now An Ran’s heart is full of regret, but there is no regret medicine in the world to take. 

Growing up with Lin Kai, she said it was impossible without feelings. She just hoped that 
Lin Kai would become better, and subconsciously felt that Lin Kai could not do without 
herself. 

But when he really left him, An Ran realized that he could not do without him! 

 


