
Special Soldier 1951

Chapter 1951: It can be regarded as the enemy

Qin Yuan thought to himself that even though he didn't want to admit to Chen Jixiang, this kid still 
had tricks.

However, he also felt that he should be more careful and not be too careless.

For Chen Jixiang, it is still unknown whether this kid has any talents to create? So everyone should 
think about it carefully, what is the reason for this?

So, Qin Yuan looked at Jason and said:

"Jason, I know you are in a state of hesitation right now, but I think you should also believe that our 
kid is quite reliable.

Although, sometimes I always criticize him, but I believe that he still knows very well in his heart 
and will never let us down. "

Jason smiled and said to Qin Yuan:

"Don't worry, ever since I met you, I have not once distrusted you, and I know that this kid is very 
clear in his own mind, and he will definitely not be the kind who acts recklessly.

I can also see that you trust him very much.

The most important thing is that I trust you, didn't I just say that? The person I trust the most is you. 
Since you are willing to help us, I will never tire of it. "

Qin Yuan was very moved. Jason was able to trust himself to such a degree that it was at the level of 
Aiwujiwu. He believed in himself and trusted his friends.

So, Qin Yuan walked up to Jason and patted Jason on the shoulder vigorously and said:

"Jason, do you know? This matter is still very cautious and easy for me.



I am also very surprised that you believe in me so much. I am really grateful that you believe in me 
so much. "

"Okay, there is no need to talk so much between us. I know what everyone is thinking, and I am 
willing to help you do this, so don't worry!"

At this time, Chen Jixiang said:

"I said, you two, can you stop talking here?

The two big men are always here, believe it or not, they look so nasty! "

Qin Yuan couldn't help laughing after hearing Chen Jixiang's words.

"There is some truth in what you said, there are indeed times when the two of us are quite nasty.

It seems that there is nothing wrong with what you reminded.

However, now we really should put everything on the most critical point.

That's who goes down to the cabin and gets your bags.

Aren't your drawings still in the bag? If you don't take it over quickly, I don't think it will have any 
effect, but who will take it now is a problem, and everyone doesn't want to face He Chenguang. "

Jason suddenly said:

"Didn't I already tell you two just now? Leave this issue to me!

I think it is most suitable for me to go down and get it. I will face He Chenguang, and he will not 
say anything to me.



It's also quite reasonable. As for other people, if any of you go down, I find that Chen Guang and I 
will have some criticisms for you. "

Qin Yuan also kept thinking in his heart that if Jason was asked to go down to get things, what 
would He Chenguang say when he went to the underground cabin and saw He Chenguang?

However, Qin Yuan thought for a long time, but he still felt that he could not let Jason go down.

"Jason, I know you really want to replace the two of us now, but I have to remind you that this is 
definitely not as simple as you imagined, and you also know very well what kind of temper He 
Chenguang is. .

You two, although he is irritable and you are relatively calm, we must remind you that many things 
are not as simple as we imagined. He Chenguang, he may be on him now, with a mission 
deliberately.

Provoking us, as in what just happened.

How much trouble has he caused us all by inexplicably creating a storm in the underground cabin?

If I continue to give him opportunities now, I think it will be bad.

Don't give him such a chance, don't go down!

I went down with Chen Jixiang. No matter what he told us, we acted as if we didn't hear it, and he 
wouldn't do anything to us. "

After hearing Qin Yuan's words, Jason said with concern:

"Qin Yuan, don't worry, don't you understand my temper? I have a very good temper. No matter 
what He Chenguang is like, if he provokes me, I won't be as knowledgeable as him.

And you have already told me so much, I know that he is very dissatisfied with this matter in his 
heart now, so we just ignore him and just do whatever we want without thinking so much about 
love.



He Chenguang is very scheming, he has completely grasped our inner thoughts, if we continue to 
indulge like this, it will definitely make him worse.

So, it's better to forget it like this, ignore him, and see what kind of things he can do. "

While looking at the communicator Jason gave him, Chen Jixiang had nothing at all, and wanted to 
stay where he was quietly without saying a word.

After a while, Chen Jixiang said:

"Brother Qin Yuan, and Brother Jason, you two shouldn't discuss it here. I know this matter is still 
quite difficult, so just leave it to me to do it alone!"

"Leave it to you alone, can you deal with him?"

"Then there's nothing I can't deal with. Now I know very well what they think. I don't care so much 
at all. They can say whatever they like.

Moreover, I am thick-skinned, as you all know, no matter what He Chengguang says to me, I can 
ignore him.

Don't worry, I will never be as knowledgeable as him, what's the matter? "

"No, you kid sometimes can't hide things in your heart, you're too impulsive!

You should calm down and leave this matter to others. I always feel that it is not so appropriate to 
leave it to you. "

Chen Jixiang sighed and said to Qin Yuan:

"We've been together for so long, don't you still don't believe me? Just leave this matter to me alone. 
Don't worry, I will never let you down.



Moreover, I think many things are not as complicated as we imagined.

Just now He Chenguang, he has experienced so much, and has caused many disturbances.

Now, he himself is very scared and guilty. I believe he will not take this opportunity to pick trouble 
with us.

He, too, is about to reach his destination by now.

He should also want to be more stable, not as knowledgeable as us.

Let's ignore him, forget it, why don't we stay here cautiously?

Don't worry about his many things, we will do our own things step by step, if he is willing to pick 
things up, he will pick things up, and all of us can just ignore him at worst, what else is there to be 
afraid of? "

Jason knew very well in his heart that in fact, Qin Yuan himself was very unwilling to face it.

Even in such a serious situation, he was still unwilling to let himself join.

So, Jason said to Qin Yuan:

"Qin Yuan, I know what you think in your heart? You want to face all this alone, don't you?

But He Chenguang, he is the most jealous in his heart now, and the person he hates in the end is 
you. If you continue like this, I am afraid it will not be a good result. "

"I know Jason, you are doing it for my own good, and I know more about what you think in your 
heart, but don't worry, leave this matter to me, and I won't say anything.

I don't even have any thoughts, as long as I go down for a while, I can explain to them what is going 
on, and I don't care about the rest.



If you are worried, I will go with Chen Jixiang. This time, Chen Jixiang, you boy will not continue 
to fight with me like this, right? "

Chen Jixiang said with a smile:

"I don't have anything to say this time, it's pretty much what I imagined anyway.

I just want to go down with Brother Qin Yuan, I don't care about other things, and I don't want to 
think so much, as long as the two of us go down together, whatever is left of love is fine. "

Jason looked at the two brothers, and he was very moved. He said with a smile:

"War, brothers go into battle, father and son soldiers, it seems that the two of you really are, you 
want to face these together, but it's understandable!

Just do it according to what you said, there is nothing wrong with it, I know you have always 
wanted to get rid of He Chenguang. Just take this opportunity to take out all the things, and there is 
no need for him to embarrass you when you arrive at the destination. "

Qin Yuan sighed and said to Jason:

"Don't think too easily about this matter. Let me tell you that He Chenguang must not be 
underestimated. Moreover, we came out from Country H together to complete the mission. After 
arriving at the destination, we still have to face Norman. Karim.

The three of us came out together after all, no matter what happens, the three of us have to do it 
together, which is understandable.

But I think we should think about it carefully, what is the reason for all this.

Why does He Chenguang always treat us like this repeatedly? I really don't understand. "

Chen Jixiang stared at his little eyes and said:



"There's nothing you don't understand. You're just deceiving yourself now. What did he do? We all 
know it well, so don't think too much about him.

The two of us will follow our own methods, and the rest of the others can do as they like, and we 
can't control it.

Let's go, Qin Yuan, let's go to the underground cabin to get my bag back, and then quickly modify 
this communicator, hurry up.

Can't continue wasting time anymore, time is life for us now! "

Qin Yuan nodded and said with a smile:

"When did you become so active, kid, but what you said has some truth, so just do what you say!"

After finishing speaking, Qin Yuan took Chen Jixiang and prepared to go back to the underground 
cabin to face the urban management. Even if they were unwilling to face it, they had to face it and 
escape, it was not a solution.

Jason said to Qin Yuan:

"Qin Yuan, just feel free to leave this matter to me. I'll go to the cabin to see what kind of special 
situation there is, and when we can reach the destination. We're fine. rest assured."

"Yeah, I got it, Jason, you go and do your own business first, we'll come back after we go up and 
down the warehouse to get things, and you don't need to worry too much."

Afterwards, Qin Yuan took Chen Jixiang with him, and the two of them walked on the passage. At 
this moment, Chen Jixiang suddenly said:

"Brother Qin Yuan, after seeing He Chenguang, what do you think he will think?

Will he make things difficult for the two of us again? "



"I don't know. He has always been very willful, and he is getting more and more willful. We can't 
control him. He doesn't care what he thinks or how he likes to have sex. We just ignore him. .”

"I know that the best way for us now is to treat him like **** and ignore him, but in the end, we 
always have to complete the mission together after arriving at the destination.

If this method is used to continue, I don't think it is very good. "

Didn't Qin Yuan think so in his heart?

Qin Yuan knew very well in his heart that the reason why He Chenguang did so many things was 
because he deliberately picked things up, but now do you have any substantive evidence?

Also, what about He Chenguang?

After arriving at the destination, do you still have to guard against him? On the one hand, he still 
has to take him to complete the task.

Chen Jixiang patted Qin Yuan on the shoulder, and said half-jokingly:

"Brother Qin Yuan, this matter is going to embarrass you, on the one hand, you have to think about 
how to deal with the landlord, so that he doesn't let him cause trouble again.

On the other hand, I have to take her to complete the task, which is really too difficult. If it were 
me, I'm afraid I can't bear it already.

However, I think Fan Tianlei should be blamed for this matter! "

Qin Yuan sneered and said:

"You kid, why are you blaming the Three-day Thunder God again? If Fan Tianlei finds out, to see if 
he won't tear your mouth apart."



"I'm telling the truth. Is it Fan Tianlei's fault? He already had such suspicions, but he still asked the 
two of us to bring He Chenguang over and give me such an inhuman task.

Didn't he make it clear that he wanted to embarrass me? I had no choice but to follow what he said.

The current situation seems to be that it is not easy for everyone to do anything. If our mission is 
going to fail, this matter will have to track Fan Tianlei! "

"You kid's mission hasn't started yet, are you about to fail? This is not my character, I will succeed 
if I fail!"

Chen Jixiang widened his eyes when he heard this, and said:

"Brother Qin Yuan, although it's very important for us to complete the mission, you won't risk your 
life, right? I'm startled by what you say. If I had known, I wouldn't have come out with you."

Chapter 1952: Successfully modified the communicator

Qin Yuan looked at Chen Jixiang in front of him, this kid was always weird.

Qin Yuan liked him very much. In fact, from the first time he met him, Qin Yuan felt that this kid 
could not be said to have a bright future, but he would certainly have something to do.

His cleverness is the same as when he first joined the army.

Thinking about going to the underground cabin soon, Qin Yuan didn't know how to face He 
Chenguang, and now his heart was breaking out in cold sweat.

He didn't want to have any confrontation with He Chenguang, nor did he want to ignore He 
Chenguang.

Now Qin Yuan is caught in a dilemma and doesn't know what to do.

Chen Jixiang naturally saw Qin Yuan's helplessness in his heart.

So, he hurriedly said with concern:



"Look, didn't I tell you everything? Don't take this matter to heart. I went back to the underground 
cabin by myself to pick up my bag and we left. There is nothing suspicious.

He can say whatever he says, just ignore him. I'm notorious for my temper.

No matter what He Chenguang said to me, I can ignore it and pretend that I didn't hear it, but you 
are different, he always has some jealousy and resentment towards you.

If he sees such a situation, he will definitely sneer at you.

I think He Chenguang, he has some problems in his heart now, so you better not go there at all, and 
let me deal with him alone. "

Qin Yuan knew very well in his heart that this kid Chen Jinxiang was concerned about himself.

"Boy, I know you care about me, don't worry, I have nothing I can't accept, no matter what He 
Chenguang says to me.

I have a mentality, and I am prepared not to have the same knowledge as him, and after we arrive at 
the destination, we still have to complete the task together. "

In fact, Qin Yuan, he also knew that his temper was not very good, and facing He Chenguang's 
cynicism, he really might not be able to control his own mood.

"Okay, Chen Jixiang, I know what your kid is talking about, so don't worry, I don't have too many 
thoughts on this matter, I will definitely not let you down, the two of us will go back to the 
underground cabin together, first Get out your bag and talk about it.

By the way, I thought of another question. "

Chen Jixiang asked suspiciously:

"What question did you think of?"



"Apart from this bag, do you have anything more important? Let's just clean it all at once. Don't tell 
me that after taking this, you go back and find that there are other important things left behind." The 
underground cabin.

At that time, we have to come back again, so let's pack up quickly and take away all the things we 
should take. "

"Brother Qin Yuan, are you planning to stay in the underground cabin before landing?"

"That's my plan, and I don't want to go back to that environment, and I'm a little embarrassed to see 
He Chenguang."

"But you have to understand that no matter how embarrassing we see him, we all go out together to 
complete the task. After reaching the destination, we still have to work together to do things. It's 
better not to make it too embarrassing.

I think He Chenguang, although he is suspicious and a bit hateful, but after all, we all come from 
the same army. If someone is really in danger, we all have no way to deal with it, can we?

Moreover, we don't know and have no way to predict the results and what will happen after the ship 
docks, let alone what will happen.

Maybe we won't be able to meet Effiete after we get off the boat?

All this is possible, let's be prepared. "

Qin Yuan thought to himself that he always felt that these things were different from what he had 
imagined, and some of them always felt like there was a behind-the-scenes case silently leading all 
this, which made him feel very scared.

At this time, Chen Jixiang said again:

"I also thought of a very important question, that is, after we arrive in Pakistan, none of us can 
speak the language of Pakistan, and then we will become fools and blind?"



Qin Yuan thought to himself, what do you know, kid? I have already secretly obtained the ability of 
Ba language from the system, so there is no need for him to worry about it.

"What's your name, kid? You just remembered to learn a language when you're about to reach your 
destination. Do you think it's still too late?"

"But we have to learn before it's too late, we can't become blind when we reach our destination 
now?

We don’t know anything, and we don’t even know when people sell us. "

"Don't worry, you boy! Your brother and I have already mastered the language of Pakistan. Anyway, 
after arriving at the destination, you will not be in any danger, and no one will sell you. You can rest 
assured to put your heart in your stomach!"

After Chen Jixiang heard this, he was very surprised!

"Brother Qin Yuan, what did you say that you already proficient in the language of Ba Kingdom, it 
seems impossible, right?

When we held a meeting in the conference city before uploading, everyone still said that no one 
understands the language of their country. Now you can learn it. When did you learn it? Could it be 
with Jason in the underground cabin? Did you learn it? "

Qin Yuan doesn't know how to answer now, he can't tell Chen Jixiang that he has cheats, can he?

Therefore, Qin Yuan could only smile awkwardly and say:

"Of course, of course I can learn from Jason. Besides her, who else can I learn from? But what you 
don't understand is that I am very talented in language and very smart.

It takes a few hours to master a language. Of course, I am not talking about proficiency but being 
able to carry out daily communication. Hey, forget it, don’t think so much, I will go to the 
underground cabin soon, you Let's think about how to face He Chenguang for a while. "



Qin Yuan couldn't make it up anymore, he had to quickly divert his grades to get this kid's attention.

Although Qin Yuan's words didn't sound so credible, Fu Jixiang didn't care so much now, he was 
just thinking about how to face He Chenguang.

Not long after, a few of them came to the underground cabin and saw that the people who made 
trouble just now had enough food and drink, and fell asleep one after another.

At this time, the messy and noisy environment of the underground cabin seemed to become quieter.

Perhaps the miraculous thing is that after the entire underground tradition has quieted down here, it 
seems that there is no such thing as the unbearable humidity and heat that they just came here.

Chen Jixiang whispered to Qin Yuan:

"Seeing that they are not here, the government and the public have quarreled and quarreled just 
now, and they have got what they deserve, and now they have started to sleep.

How much better it is earlier!

It is very difficult for everyone to do so many things without extra trouble, and it is very 
embarrassing. "

"Stop talking nonsense, let's keep our voice down, don't wake up others, and give them more 
opportunities to find trouble."

"Well, I think what you said is very reasonable, let's keep our voices down."

Therefore, Qin Yuan took Chen Jixiang and the two of them to the underground cabin and walked to 
He Chenguang's neighborhood in a trivial way.

Unexpectedly, He Chenguang did not sleep, which is what everyone expected.



But to everyone's surprise, He Chenguang didn't say anything, he just asked a casual question.

"You two are back?"

Qin Yuan didn't speak, he just nodded.

Chen Jixiang said with a smile:

"Brother Chenguang, why didn't you sleep? I see that everyone is asleep. You kept arguing that you 
were tired and sleepy and didn't take a good rest. Soon we will reach our destination.

We still have a lot of things to do after arriving at the destination, won't you work harder then? You 
better rest for a while. "

He Chenguang said lightly:

"I'm fine, I'm not tired! Although I have experienced a lot, I can't sleep now, and I know that I will 
reach my destination soon.

I don't know why, but my heart is always in a mess, as if I think of a lot of things when I first joined 
the army. "

When Qin Yuan heard what He Chenguang said, he felt very puzzled and surprised, why did he 
suddenly become sad?

Moreover, He Chenguang's current state is completely different from the He Chenguang they just 
saw who was making trouble and taking the lead in causing trouble.

Seeing He Chenguang's depressed state now, Qin Yuan couldn't tell what was wrong, but he also felt 
a little uneasy, so he hurried to He Chenguang's bedside and put his hand on He Chenguang's 
forehead.

He Chenguang smiled and asked:



"What's wrong? Qin Yuan?"

"I see that you are not in a good condition now. Are you sick? Let me see if you have a fever. If you 
are sick, I will go to the street to get some medicine for you, but I just felt that your forehead is 
indeed It's a little hot.

We didn’t bring anything with us this time, thinking that we would reach our destination soon, and 
we didn’t expect so many things to happen in the middle.

How about this, He Chenguang, you lie here first, I will pick you up somewhere and get you some 
antipyretics, you should take it first.

You seem to be a little bit hot. I feel that the underground cabin is indeed a bit too deserted. It is 
understandable that you are sick.

You don't have to worry, though. We'll get you some fever-reducing medicine and take it, and then 
you'll be fine. Don't worry. "

At this time, Chen Jixiang thought to himself, even if he went to the street to get antipyretics, Qin 
Yuan couldn't get them himself. Only he could do such errands.

"Brother Qin Yuan, don't worry about it so much for now, I'll go to Jason's to get some fever-
reducing medicine and bring it to him."

Chen Jixiang went to his bedside pillow while talking, and took out his bag from below.

He Chenguang looked at the situation in front of him, and he also knew that the two of them came 
to pick up things.

"The two of you are here to get something, and you're going to leave later, right?"

Although Qin Yuan knew that He Chenguang didn't do enough in many things, he felt distressed 
and worried when he saw that he was not in good health. After all, they went through life and death 
together to complete many tasks. We are also good friends and good friends. comrades.



"Yeah, Jason asked us to come over and get some things, let's get ready to get to our destination 
soon.

Just rest here and leave us alone. "

He Chenguang took a look and said:

"It's too polite for you to say this. What do you mean you don't have to worry about you? Who can I 
control? I can't control anyone, I can't even control myself.

Think about it, sometimes it is quite sad to live for so many years without even having a dearest 
brother, think about it carefully, in fact, I have nothing..."

Qin Yuan was very surprised and puzzled by He Chenguang's sudden remark.

"He Chenguang, what's the matter with you? Are you running a fever and confused? Why do you 
feel that you seem to be unusual today?"

He Chenguang smiled, and then said:

"Nothing special about me, just being in this claustrophobic environment for a long time.

People can't help but feel a little sad.

But it doesn't matter, don't take it to heart, grab your things and go out first, I have to sleep well.

I always feel very sleepy and tired.

I don't know what's going on with all of this, maybe after reaching the destination, it will be fine if I 
get in touch with the sunshine and fresh air outside. "

Chen Jixiang, and Qin Yuan, the two of them stood in place with masked faces, what happened to 
the deceased, everyone couldn't tell clearly, anyway, they just thought He Chenguang looked weird.



Qin Yuan said to Chen Jixiang:

"How is it? Have you found your things? If we find them, let's go out first!"

"I found it, I found it, let's go out first, don't disturb Brother Chenguang's rest, I feel that besides a 
slight fever, he is still quite tired, we will go get the anti-fever medicine in a while, I will bring it to 
you, You rest first."

After finishing speaking, Qin Yuan took Chen Jixiang and quickly left the underground cabin.

Just after leaving the underground cabin the two of them seemed to be relieved, as if they didn't 
dare to breathe out in the underground cabin just now.

At this time, Chen Jixiang she said to Qin Yuan cautiously:

"Brother Qin Yuan, did you feel anything when you saw He Chenguang just now? Does something 
seem wrong with him?"

Qin Yuan nodded, and then he said with some doubts:

"It seems that this is not my illusion alone, even your kid feels it, right?

I also feel that there is something wrong with him, but I can't tell. I always feel that he has a lot of 
things to hide from us, but seeing him in that state just now may be because he is sick and 
uncomfortable. "

"I don't know, anyway, I think he's weird. Those people who led the underground cabin before made 
this show in the underground cabin, and now it looks like he's about to run out of energy."

Chapter 1953: release signal

Although, there is no basis for what Chen Jixiang said.

It's just that you judge by your own feelings.

It felt like He Chenguang, there was something wrong, but he couldn't tell what was wrong?



Perhaps this is the reason why everyone didn't know what was going on for a while.

Anyway, now everyone vaguely felt that there seemed to be something abnormal about He 
Chenguang, but they couldn't tell what was wrong.

Therefore, Qin Yuan simply didn't think so much about He Chenguang. Maybe it's because he's 
been exhausted from working too much during this period of time, so there won't be any other 
problems.

Moreover, he has always been a little abnormal recently, and it's not a day or two.

But there is no need to take it to heart. It is not easy for He Chenguang to have a lot of thoughts, and 
it is even more difficult to see through them. It is easy to know what he is thinking. Rather than 
being so tired, it is better not to think about his affairs.

How about thinking about the communicator first?

On the contrary, Chen Jixiang, a kid, sometimes has a ghostly mind. Even Qin Yuan himself is not 
sure of what is going on in Chen Jixiang's heart.

Moreover, now Qin Yuan felt in his heart how many tasks did Fan Tianlei give him?

I still don't know that it is possible that he himself is the one being tricked. Judging from all the 
signs, Chen Jixiang, this kid is definitely not a simple character.

Maybe when he talked to himself, he revealed half of it and didn't express too many thoughts and 
results, so let's not think about it so much.

Now that the blueprint for the communicator equipment has been taken out, it is better to study the 
problem of this communication equipment first.

Seeing that he is about to reach his destination, if he doesn't understand this thing, I'm afraid it will 
cause many incidents.



Chen Jixiang looked at Qin Yuan, as if thoughtful, patted his shoulder and said:

"Brother Qin Yuan, what are you thinking? I always feel that you seem to be thinking, are you still 
thinking about the matter with Chen Guang? Did I just say it?

He has a very deep mind, and many times we can't see through it, so let's not think too much about 
it.

He can think whatever he likes in his heart. I think he may be too tired recently. Think about how 
many things he has done behind our backs. Can he not be tired?

He should also be exhausted physically and mentally, and wants to take a good rest. If this is the 
case, then we should not bother him at all.

Let him think about it for himself, he is sorry for so many things, maybe he also feels that he has 
done something wrong.

I'm sorry to face the two of us, but don't think too much about it tomorrow. You are the backbone of 
our team. If there is any change in you.

Then we would become a mess of loose sand, useless for anything. "

After listening to Chen Jixiang's words, Qin Yuan felt that this kid was quite good at talking, as if he 
was so important, he always said flattering words in front of him.

"You kid is always sweet-talking, let me believe what you said, but people have such a personality 
and like to listen to good words.

Who doesn't like to hear words that praise oneself, then you say that, although I think it's a bit 
hypocritical, but I still like to hear it. "

Chen Jixiang smiled and said to Qin Yuan:

"Brother Qin Yuan, do you know? From the moment I met you, I knew you were definitely not a 
simple person.



Therefore, I made up my mind that no matter what kind of difficulties I encounter, I just stay by 
your side, and I will never suffer from being by your side.

But, you didn't let me down, you have always taken care of me by my side for so many years, and I 
think I am also very happy.

do you know? I am the only child in my family, and my family is in a big mountain. The situation is 
not very good. I have told you before that it is my luck to meet you.

If it weren't for the existence of someone like you who is both a teacher and a friend, I really 
wouldn't be able to grow so fast. "

Qin Yuan felt flattery after hearing Chen Jixiang's words.

But it's still quite honest.

Thinking of this, Qin Yuan said to Chen Jixiang:

"I know that it's not easy for you kid to come out of the mountains, so no matter what kind of 
mission you have, as long as it's dangerous, I won't let you go.

But as long as there is no risk factor and you can learn something, I will definitely take you with 
you.

Ever since I saw you, I have felt that you are a very good boy, and I am also very close to you. I am 
willing to take you with me for everything.

I hope you don't simply regard me as a master, we two are good brothers, I regard you as my own 
younger brother. "

Thinking of this, Qin Yuan couldn't help but feel a little sad. He didn't have any relatives here. Apart 
from systematic blessings, he couldn't do anything now, just like a character with cheats in a game.



He is neither very powerful, nor like those ordinary people, maybe the feeling of being too high or 
too low is even more uncomfortable.

Thinking of this, Qin Yuan felt that it was better not to be sad.

"By the way, Chen Jixiang, quickly take out the blueprint in your bag and see if it is the blueprint of 
the communicator device we are looking for.

We have been away from the underground cabin for so long, what if someone steals the boat? "

As soon as Qin Yuan finished speaking, Chen Jixiang widened his eyes and said in surprise:

"Ah? What are you talking about, it shouldn't be possible for someone to steal something, right? My 
thing is not valuable, so who would use it for anything?

Moreover, we are not a conspicuous person in the underground cabin, and everyone should not be 
familiar with it. If we don’t know each other, we won’t be able to lay hands on our things, right?

I just looked at it, I have been putting this bag under my pillow, and I am marking it, there is no 
trace of being frozen. "

Qin Yuan smiled and nodded.

"I didn't expect that you, a kid, are quite thoughtful, and you know how to mark your bag. It seems 
that you learn things very quickly in many cases, and I feel very relieved.

However, there is one thing that I have to remind you, it is called human beings, some people have 
their own.

Sometimes you think that you are the smartest person, put your masterpiece on the bag first, so that 
it will not be touched by others, but if you are not sure, someone will know all about it.

It is the place where your bag is marked on purpose, he has not touched it, so nothing is absolute.



It's better to be cautious, and don't be caught by others. "

After Chen Jixiang heard Qin Yuan's words, he suddenly realized.

"Brother Qin Yuan, I only now know why I followed you as a younger brother?

You are really amazing, many things can be heard in front of me, if you hadn't reminded me, I really 
thought I could do it perfectly.

Now it seems that there is indeed a little bit of pride and complacency, and I still have to correct this 
in the future. "

"Yeah, okay, it's good that you know, let's take your bag and the communicator first, and go back to 
Jason's place to see what kind of arrangements he has."

Then Qin Yuan took Chen Jixiang, and the two returned to Jason's room.

The two of them thought that Jason had gone to the control of the underground cabin, but they 
didn't expect to see Jason lying on his bed as soon as he opened the door.

Qin Yuan smiled and said to Jason:

"What's the matter? Jason feels that you are very tired now. Did something happen? Did we 
interrupt your rest?"

As soon as Jason heard that Qin Yuan was back, he immediately got up and said:

"How could you bother me? You are helping me, but to be honest, I feel a little tired.

Since I got on the boat, I haven't rested all the time, and I don't know what happened recently. I 
always feel very tired. "

"It's normal to be tired. All of us have never rested on this boat. Who can be unmatched? But bear 
with it, and we will arrive at the destination soon. Jason, do you have any plans after you get it?"



Jason shook his head after thinking about it.

"I don't have any special arrangements. You also know that when I come to Pakistan this time, the 
main task is to help Effiete and the others deliver this batch of arms.

I should be able to complete the mission if I hand over all the ammunition to them after arriving at 
the destination, but I think..."

Qin Yuan looked at Jason's hesitant to speak, and felt that he seemed to have something to say.

"It doesn't matter. If you have anything to say, just talk about the relationship between us. Is there 
anything worth hiding? I also feel that there is something wrong with you."

Jason was a little embarrassed to say it, but he still said it after seeing Qin Yuan's question to him.

"However, I think I can do more things after I get there. I think you should have a lot of secret tasks 
to complete. Is there anything I can do?"

Qin Yuan, he didn't expect Jason to want to help her with the task without hesitation, but although 
he himself was short of manpower, he didn't want to hurt Jason.

"Jason, let me tell you the truth, we do have a lot of tasks to do, and it's still quite dangerous, 
besides, we don't know the place well after we arrive in Pakistan.

It is true that we need a guide, we need someone by our side to help us.

However, this task is too dangerous, I don't think you should be dragged into the water, because you 
still have a daughter who needs your care.

We cannot be so irresponsible. Just kidding with your life, there is no way I can do it. "

Qin Yuan is very clear in his heart that Jason's only weakness is his daughter with congenital heart 
disease. Perhaps he has another purpose in going to Ba this time, which is to find some medical 
methods that can treat his daughter's condition. .



"Qin Yuan, do you know? Actually, I went there this time with some attitude.

I heard that there is a person who looked at this aspect and saw it very accurately. You also know 
that there are many quack doctors in Ba.

I can't wait to learn something about my daughter's treatment from them. "

Beside him, he kept studying his blueprints, and he didn't have any grades in speaking. After 
hearing Qin Yuan and Jason's words, he immediately said in surprise:

"Jason, what are you talking about? You want to go to the quack doctor in Pakistan?

Did you make a mistake? Do you know that the quack doctors there are unreliable people, most of 
them are liars, you must not be fooled by them!

At that time, it will be easy for them to cheat you of some money. If they cheat your organs, then 
you will lose more than you gain. "

"is it so serious?"

After hearing Chen Jixiang's words, Qin Yuan couldn't believe it, thinking that this kid was trying to 
scare people here.

"I said you kid, don't scare Jason.

Jason, he's already devastated about his own daughter. As long as there is a glimmer of hope, he 
won't give up. Don't talk nonsense. "

"How can I be talking nonsense? Although I often see it from TV and movies, does art come from 
life?

If there were no such vivid things in life, how could they be made into movies so realistically. "



After listening to Chen Jixiang's explanation, Qin Yuan felt quite speechless. The kid was still a 
little naive, but what he said made sense.

"Jason, although what this kid said is some nonsense, Pakistan is definitely not a good place as he 
said.

Then your quack doctors are not worthy of being trusted, and you must never trust them.

And about your daughter's illness, I've already told An Ran, and he promised me to go back and 
help you find medical resources, so don't act recklessly.

An Ran also told me that if he really has nothing to do, he is willing to seek help from Fan Tianlei. 
At that time, I believe that with our network resources, we will be able to help you find a reasonable 
medical resource to treat your daughter's condition. "

After Jason heard what Qin Yuan said, he was very moved.

"Qin Yuan, thank you so much I didn't expect you to be so considerate.

You even told An Ran and Fan Tianlei about my matter, they are willing to help us, did they really 
agree? "

"Of course, don't worry if they promise to help your daughter's condition!"

Chen Jixiang said with a smile:

"Jason, I know you're called rushing to the doctor, but now your daughter's body is still very fragile, 
don't make fun of his fragility.

Many times, many things are beyond our control and leadership. You must take care of your 
daughter's own body and don't be fooled by them. "

Jason thought for a long time, he patted Qin Yuan's shoulder and said:



"I know about Qin Yuan. I am indeed a bit ill and have to go to the doctor in a hurry, but this is also 
the helplessness of being a father!"

Chapter 1954: wait for the result

 After listening to Qin Yuan's words, Jason also knew that something was wrong with him, but this 
is also the helplessness and anxiety of being a father, and he has nothing to do.

At this moment, Qin Yuan thought of Chen Jixiang, this kid has been studying blueprints there all 
the time, how is his research going?

So, Qin Yuan walked up to Chen Jixiang and patted his head and asked:

"You kid keeps saying how the blueprint research here is going, we are still waiting to see?"

"You don't want to slap my head. I did a good job in research. If you slapped my head stupidly, I 
will definitely get twice the result with half the effort."

Qin Yuan shook his head helplessly and said with a smile:

"You kid is lazy here, and the day after tomorrow we are chatting and making excuses here. I think 
if you don't understand this thing, how can you explain it to Jason?"

Jason looked at the two brothers and felt that the atmosphere was unusually comfortable and 
beautiful.

"It's okay, didn't I just keep talking about it? If this communicator can be modified, it can't be 
modified, then it can only be released according to the original plan. There is no problem.

Anyway, haven't we all finished researching with Norman Karim?

Now that he has agreed to help us, I believe there is nothing wrong with it. If you can't do anything 
else, just follow the steps. It doesn't matter, Chen Jixiang.

You don't have to be nervous, you can make whatever you can, and none of us will blame you. "



Chen Jixiang saw Jason comforting himself all the time, probably because he was afraid that he 
might not do something well, but he thought that he didn't need to worry about himself, and he was 
very confident about his thoughts.

So, Jason took out the blueprint and walked up to Qin Yuan.

"The two of us can help him take a look, although we are not professional, we can still study this 
blueprint.

By the way, Chen Jixiang, are you sure this blueprint is what you said? "

"Of course, if you don't believe me, I'll show you."

While talking, Chen Jixiang separated the drawings from the first page, each page was different. 
This communicator can design patterns. At this time, Qin Yuan looked at the blueprint and said.

"You kid really didn't lie to us. Where did you get this blueprint? It looks very professional?"

Chen Jixiang, in fact, he never told the truth. Fan Tianlei gave it to him secretly, because Fan Tianlei 
knew that many people in Pakistan were using this communicator.

In fact, even if Chen Jixiang was jealous to tell the truth, Qin Yuan could guess it pretty well.

"Tell me, boy, did Fan Tianlei give you this thing?"

Chen Jixiang scratched his head, smiled awkwardly and said:

"Brother Qin Yuan, you really can't hide anything, you are right, Fan Tianlei gave it to me, but I 
have studied this stuff myself.

In the past, before I came to you, I was an expert in this field and Fan Tianlei knew it, so he 
photographed me instead of Li Zheng. "

Hearing this, Qin Yuan suddenly realized.



"So that's the case, I said why Fan Tianlei chose you kid to come and complete the mission with us 
instead of Li Zheng.

Compared with the two of you, Li Zheng is more cautious and careful.

Moreover, it is very suitable for going out to perform missions. I knew that Fan Tianlei must have 
ulterior motives for photographing your boy, but I didn't expect it to be this reason. "

After Chen Jixiang heard this, he pretended to be unhappy and said angrily:

"Oh, then I understand when you say that, you mean that I am not as good as Li Zhengbei in your 
heart?

You can do it! "

Jason smiled and said:

"You must not misunderstand Qin Yuan. That's not what he meant. You should concentrate on 
studying your blueprints. Don't mess with the two of us here."

At this time, Chen Jixiang picked up the communicator and was about to take it apart.

Qin Yuan looked at Chen Jixiang with such an agitated look, and was also afraid that he would do 
something excessive.

"What are you going to do?"

"I've done some research just now, and I've figured out the blueprints, so I'm definitely going to 
modify it now.

I know neither of you believe me.



However, you should have heard this saying that the employer does not doubt, and the suspect does 
not need to. You should have heard this. Give me a little chance, okay? I will definitely not let you 
down. "

Hearing what Chen Jixiang said, Jason also felt that he sincerely wanted to help them, so he pulled 
Qin Yuan's hand away and said cautiously:

"Qin Yuan, I think what Chen Jixiang said makes sense, we should give him more opportunities in 
many cases, and don't make him feel that he is useless.

You see, this kid has been very concerned about helping us do this every day since he came here, so 
I am very satisfied with him when I get home.

And he should be more confident in completing this task.

I believe that this kid like him will definitely not be the kind of person who just fools around. If he 
didn't have some plans in mind, he probably wouldn't just rashly get close to something as 
important as us.

Just give him a chance, I believe he will give us a miracle. "

In fact, Qin Yuan also believed in Chen Jixiang very much, he knew that this kid knew it well.

But these words from Jason's mouth gave Chen Jixiang more confidence.

Qin Yuan, after thinking for a while, said to Chen Jixiang:

"Okay, since Jason helped you talk, then we all trust you once, you can start doing it now, and we 
won't talk about unnecessary things.

By the way, I just observed this drawing.

Every page of him represents a different meaning of this signal, but how can you be sure that the 
communicator is released now? fireworks? Which pattern is the signal? "



Chen Jixiang said with a smile:

"This is where you are unprofessional, come and see!"

While talking, he turned the communicator upside down and there was a small hole under the 
handle. Through this small hole, he could see the pattern of a small firework inside after it was 
released.

"Did you see it? The small pattern inside is what the firework looks like after it explodes."

After finishing speaking, Chen Jixiang turned the handle on the fireworks again.

"You're watching me turn this pattern and he turns into another one, but as you can see, there are 
only these kinds of messages he can convey.

Unless you change its internal structure, no matter how you turn it, the meaning is probably the 
same. "

While observing, Qin Yuan listened to this kid from Chen Jixiang's explanation, and felt a little bit 
of admiration for this kid in his heart.

"You can do it, kid. You can observe him so carefully. I will definitely tell Fan Tianlei to give you a 
promotion and a salary increase!"

After Chen Jixiang heard this, he said with a smile:

"Although I deserve this size, I'm not in a hurry, because I know that you are more cautious about 
this matter than I am.

I am willing to help you, but I am also willing to help myself. This task is also a challenge for me, 
so please don't be so polite to me. I have a lot of things on my mind. "

Jason also smiled and said:



"It seems that Chen Jixiang, this kid has a lot of calculations in his heart.

The two of us don't bother him for now, let him concentrate on changing it here. After the 
modification, I estimate that our ship will basically reach its destination soon.

After the modification, I released the fireworks first, I don't know what kind of signal I can wait for 
there. "

When Qin Yuan heard what Jason said, he was also very nervous now, because he knew that since 
he was about to reach the destination, it meant that they would face to face and fight against Effiete 
and the others.

So, Qin Yuan sighed and said:

"The time flies really fast. Before we know it, we are about to reach our destination. When we first 
came here, the environment in the underground cabin was very bad. Every moment we thought 
about escaping here as soon as possible.

Didn't expect to arrive at the destination so soon, and there is still some empty chatter in my heart, I 
don't know what's going on? "

Chen Jixiang said casually while doing his hands beside him:

"That's because you met such a good friend as Jason, and we spent a few happy days together on 
this boat.

So the happy time is always short, and you feel that the time passes quickly, but He Chenguang 
thinks otherwise. They are in the underground ship cabin, and there is nothing in it.

There is no way to get in touch and no way to get out, that's why he is perverted. "

Jason nodded after hearing what he said, and said:

"I think what this kid said makes sense. Many times it is because time is happier, so everyone feels 
that time passes quickly.



However, after arriving at the destination, we may all go our separate ways, although I also want to 
be with you all the time to help you complete various tasks.

I also have a little bit of my own things that need to be done.

Moreover, I think that since we are going to face Effie and the others, and Norman Karim, you 
should also know Norman Karim.

He is definitely not an ordinary person, so we should take precautions against him. Originally, I 
wanted to go with you.

I still think, don't put all your eggs in one basket.

It’s better to have someone outside to meet you. I believe Norman Karim will look for you as soon 
as he reaches his destination.

Whatever the reason, it is better for us all to be careful.

In case he really detains you, I will try to find a way to rescue you outside. If all of us are caught by 
him together, it will be difficult to escape. "

After listening to Jason's words, Qin Yuan nodded and agreed with this point of view.

"I think the same way, let's not talk about how dangerous it is for us to complete the task. As you 
said, we should still have some friends outside who can help. If our promise is true Mankarim, he is 
not worthy of being trusted. By then, our Axi will not all be trapped here.

However, I still have a big question here, and I haven't thought it through. "

"You mean He Chenguang?

Is it so long? Have you still not figured out how to face him and how to arrange his affairs? I think 
if you're going to believe him take it with you and if you don't believe him just..."



Qin Yuan, although he understands the meaning of marriage, it is absolutely impossible for him to 
hurt He Chenguang.

"Jason, I know that you are doing it for our own good, but you should also know that I am a person 
who values love and righteousness. Not to mention that there is no evidence now, even if there is 
evidence, I will never do anything to He Chenguang?

It's even more impossible for me to hurt him. I always don't believe that we have been through life 
and death together for so many years, will he help Aifeite to deal with us? It seems impossible to 
me.

Although it is often said that hearing is believing and seeing is believing, I still think that we should 
not pay too much attention to the results of some things that are not what we imagined.

In many cases, you may just be blinded by reality, and you may be surprised when the truth comes 
out. "

Chen Jixiang, after listening to these words, he said with a smile:

"I never thought, Brother Qin Yuan, that you can say so many philosophical words, but it's 
understandable.

You and He Chenguang are together, you have gone through so many trials of life and death, it is 
understandable for you to trust him.

But you should also think about us, now I don't trust him.

If you are really unsure, you can call Fan Tianlei again and ask him what he thinks?

Because Fan Tianlei was actually the one who first suspected He Chenguang and asked me to come 
here to pretend to be a spy and watch you two. "

"I know what you mean, I don't doubt him now, and I can't completely let go of my guard against 
him.



Let's talk about it when we reach our destination.

Now, I can't make up my mind, and looking at him just now, it seems that I should know that I have 
done something wrong, and maybe there is still room for redemption. Let's not think too badly 
about things. "

"Then you can't think too well about things,  It's too late when everyone else betrays you!"

After finishing speaking, Ji Ji wanted to put the communicator firmly on the table.

"You're done!"

Jason and Qin Yuan were very surprised when they saw Chen Jixiang saying that it was all done.

"It's over so soon, you kid, aren't you fooling the two of us?"

"How can this be called fooling the two of you? You two come over to see if it's the small hole just 
now to see if the pattern has changed."

Qin Yuan, he believes that seeing is believing, so he immediately went to the communicator, picked 
it up and looked at the small hole.

Unexpectedly, the pattern has really changed. It seems that Chen Jixiang is so quick to change the 
communicator.

Chapter 1955: see landmarks

After modifying the communicator, Chen Jixiang was extremely excited. He felt as if he had 
accomplished a very remarkable feat.

However, it is also conceivable that he was still a child.

Even if, he dealt with the problem comprehensively.



In essence, he still lacks experience and social ability, so he should follow Qin Yuan and learn more 
from his side.

Jason looked at Chen Jixiang, this kid couldn't help but smile and said:

"You don't know, look at Chen Jixiang, how can this kid be so excited?

Boy, don't you feel very accomplished now? For this matter? "

Chen Jixiang already knew that Jason had seen through all his thoughts, so he had nothing to say.

"Of course, I'm so good, don't you all praise me?

You don't praise me, I can only give myself a big full mark in my heart.

I think I'm so smart that I got this thing done in a few seconds. "

Qin Yuan looked at Chen Jixiang, who thought he was cute and funny.

"I said you kid, don't be too happy. Can this signal be released in a while? Success? Don't know 
yet? What if the release fails? Let me see what you will use to compensate Jason. Skin."

"My God? I said Brother Qin Yuan, can you stop being so fierce!

We are called Brothers Fighting Tigers. If you don't stand on my side, if you help Jason come over 
to clean up, I'm going too far. See if I don't tell Fan Tianlei when I go back. "

After hearing this, Qin Yuan half-jokingly pinched Chen Jixiang's ear with his two fingertips and 
made Chen Jixiang scream in pain.

"You have learned to use Fan Tianlei to threaten me now, don't you know that I am not afraid of 
him?"



"Yes, yes, I know you are not afraid of him. Who are you afraid of? You are not afraid of anyone. 
You are naturally courageous. You don't care about Fan Tianlei at all. How can you be afraid of 
him?"

Chen Jixiang begged for mercy while talking.

Jason saw the two of them fighting like this, and felt that the atmosphere was quite relaxed and 
harmonious.

It's like, there is a feeling of joking with my own brother.

"I really admire the relationship between the two of you, both as a teacher and as a friend."

Chen Jixiang rubbed his ears and said to Jason:

"Jason, don't be sad. Now that you know the two of us, we are all good friends and brothers, and 
Brother Qin Yuan, we have treated you as a good friend since we met you." It's a family."

After Jason heard this, no matter whether he was kidding himself or telling the truth, he felt warm in 
his heart.

"Yeah, I've been wandering outside for so long, and there are only a few good brothers around me.

Plus my daughter.

Now, being able to meet good friends and brothers like you is indeed a blessing I cultivated in my 
previous life. "

"Don't say that. It's our good fortune to know you. If you hadn't helped us wholeheartedly, how 
could we have reached our destination so easily? At the beginning, Fan Tianlei had nowhere to ask 
for help and couldn't find any Channels can allow us to come to Pakistan as soon as possible.

An Ran just found you, and we feel that we have caused too much trouble and distress to you along 
the way, so we are embarrassed to see you. "



"It's all right, it's over, so don't say these polite words to me anymore. I know it's not easy for 
everyone, and we are all good brothers."

In fact, the atmosphere at this time came to a very relaxed and harmonious feeling. At this time, 
everyone seemed to relax a little bit. It always felt that they were about to reach their destination, 
and everyone seemed to be relaxed.

However, you still can't relax too much, and you still need to be vigilant about many things.

In particular, in the face of these things, everyone must be prepared in their hearts.

For a while, I don't know what happened after arriving on the shore. Those are unknowns. Be 
careful, there will always be no problem, and be careful to make the Wannian ship.

At this moment, Jason's men knocked on the door inside Jason's room.

"Who is it?"

"Boss, it's me! The brother over there in the cab, let's go over there!"

"Did the people over the cab encounter any problems looking for me?"

"I don't know about that. He was very anxious. He asked me to come to you and said that he had to 
watch the progress of the ship and couldn't come to you directly, so he dragged me over to do this 
matter."

After hearing this, Qin Yuan felt that Jason's brother seemed very nervous, so Qin Yuan also 
hurriedly said:

"Jason, I heard that your brother seems to be very nervous. Maybe there is some problem. You 
should hurry up and take a look with them!"

Jason also knows that his subordinates are definitely not the kind of people who are like soldiers.



"Okay, I'll go now!"

Immediately afterwards, Jason turned to Qin Yuan and said:

"I think you two should go with me, the current situation is very complicated, I don't know what's 
going on, it's fine to go with me, there is always someone to take care of you.

In case of any special circumstances, I won't have to come back to this room and look for you again. 
"

Qin Yuan also nodded immediately, he had thought this way a long time ago, let's follow Jason to 
take a look, although doing so would be a little suspected of violating their privacy.

However, I have been wearing this for such a long time, and I know everything I need to know, and 
there is nothing worth hiding.

Chen Jixiang looked at the two of them as if they were very anxious.

"Why don't you two go and I'll stay here?"

Qin Yuan thought about it, and then said:

"It's also good to get married, the two of us just go there, let Chen Jixiang watch these things in 
your room, and these communicators are very important.

If, if there is any mistake, I am afraid it will cause a lot of trouble for our next task.

How about letting Chen Jixiang, this kid watch over here, so we can go there with peace of mind."

"Yeah, that's fine, as long as the two of us go there, then this matter will be troublesome to Chen 
Jixiang, you brat!"

"Hey~ Is there any way to trouble everyone to perform their duties? I'm just a little guy here and 
just listen to you."



Qin Yuan looked at Chen Jixiang alone, and felt a little uneasy.

"You should have some self-defense on you!"

"Of course, it was given to me by Fan Tianlei back then, you two don't have to worry, I'm on this 
boat, and this is Jason's territory.

He didn't say anything, how could someone do anything to me? Don't worry, you'll be fine. "

After speaking, Jason took Qin Yuan and prepared to walk in the direction of their cab.

As soon as I went out, I found out that the weather on the sea seemed to be getting better slowly, 
and it could be seen that the sky seemed to have been polished.

"The time flies by really fast. Just now we saw that the weather was not so good. Now it is almost 
dawn, and it seems that we can vaguely see the shore of Baguo.

That means we're getting there..."

After Qin Yuan finished speaking, Jason obviously felt very nervous.

"Yeah, we'll reach our destination soon, and we'll know if it's a blessing or a curse."

"Jason, be more optimistic, don't worry, as long as we are here, there will be no good or bad, 
nothing serious, the big deal is that what's the big deal with this breath and one life?"

"It's still clear to you, but I can't give up on myself so quickly. My daughter is still waiting for me to 
go back and help her treat her illness?"

Talking like this, the two of them came to the pilothouse of Jason's cabin.

They were immediately excited when they saw Jason coming, and said anxiously to Jason:



"Boss, according to the display on the radar, we will be able to reach our destination soon, and now 
I'm here to tell you, should the flare be released?"

After Qin Yuan heard this, he felt very surprised.

He pulled Jason aside, and whispered to him:

"Jason, how come Aifite gave you the signal flare, besides you and a few of your subordinates, they 
also know?"

Jason, nod.

"Yeah, I have no way to keep them from knowing about this matter, he is the first to know when we 
will reach our destination, so I have to be mentally prepared.

That's why I told them, but it shouldn't be a big deal, everyone is good brothers, how could 
something go wrong? "

Qin Yuan thought about it for a long time, but he didn't think there was anything wrong with it, but 
he still felt that there was something weird about it.

"Jason, you are really a real person, do you tell your subordinates everything?"

"Yeah, didn't I tell you just now? They have to know about this kind of thing. It's harmless.

And we're all in bed, they won't betray me, will they?

These brothers of mine have been with me through life and death for so many years, I trust them 
very much! "

When Qin Yuan heard this, he didn't feel that there was anything wrong with this matter. Maybe 
Jason shouldn't trust his brothers.



However, since this is the case, even if people like him are not trustworthy, they already know the 
secrets, so it's better to be cautious.

In the end, Qin Yuan had nothing to say, and Jason returned to the cab. Looking at the screen in the 
cab, it should be very soon, indeed, he will reach his destination soon.

At this time, Jason looked at Qin Yuan.

Qin Yuan also nodded.

"Looking at the display on the radar, we will soon reach our destination. Is it your signal, but it 
should be released?"

Jason thought for a while and said to Qin Yuan:

"I also thought the same signal, but it should have been released. When we came out just now, I also 
took a look at the weather outside. Maybe it was better at sea just now or there was some fog.

Therefore, we cannot see the landmark buildings of Pakistan.

Let's go out and have a look in a while. If there is no problem, we should be able to see the 
landmark buildings of Pakistan.

Just put our signal on it, and then sit and wait for the reply from there. "

"Yeah, it seems like this is indeed the time. It should be the time for the Fangxin. It's not a way for 
us to escape here. I don't know what the people over there think, can they help us?"

Jason had nothing, said he, to his men:

"You are anxious to find me because of this matter, right, there is nothing else?"

"Without the boss, we just looked at the destination soon, but after sailing on the sea for so long, we 
were also afraid of mistaking the landmark.



So let you come and have a look, if you think there is no problem, we can prepare to dock now. "

Qin Yuan thought in his heart that if he was planning to dock now, it would not be impossible, but if 
he wanted to be safe before docking, he should take a good plan.

"Well, since Jason is about to finish the exam, let's not waste time here, let's go back to your room 
to discuss the long-term plan."

"Yeah, that's fine, let's go to my room first, and call me later if there is any special situation here!"

"Okay, we understand, boss, don't worry!"

After finishing speaking, Qin Yuan and Jason left this posture, and soon the two of them came to the 
deck in the cabin and saw that the weather had gradually improved, and it seemed that they could 
see the sign of Ba on the shore **** building.

At this time, Qin Yuan pointed to this mysterious building and said:

"Jason, you will see that dark building in the distance, is it the landmark building of Pakistan?

I have never, never been to Pakistan.

I don't know anything about this place, but you have been running for so many years, you should be 
very familiar with the surrounding environment, right? "

Jason didn't speak, he just nodded thoughtfully.

"Uh-huh…"

"Then since we saw their iconic building,  means that we should release the signal first. Let's go 
back and ask Chen Jixiang to take out this signal device. Let's release it. , See if you can get a 
response from the other side."



Jason nodded.

"That's good, now is indeed the time to release this signal gas first, if it is not released in time, then 
in case there is really a problem.

Effiete, they will definitely blame me, I don't want to give them any chance to add guilt to me. "

"Yeah, that's fine, let's go back and get the signal gas now, I don't know if Chen Jixiang's 
modification is worth it, we believe that you must not hold us back.

By the way, you dote on him quite a bit, and sometimes I'm terrified of him even trusting him so 
much. "

Chapter 1956: No, I told him myself

Qin Yuan and Jason saw the landmark buildings of Pakistan on the deck.

Now everyone is prepared in their hearts, and it seems that the moment they don't want to face must 
also be faced.

Soon they will arrive at the destination they have been looking forward to, nervous and afraid, and 
have some longing for.

At this time, Jason said:

"Let me tell you two, we are about to reach our destination now, what kind of preparation do you 
have in mind?

Is it very nervous to go to Pakistan for the first time? "

Chen Jixiang smiled and said:

"This is the first time for me to go abroad. I have never left our country since I was a child. If I go 
out now, I must be very nervous, and I heard that Pakistan is a very mysterious place.



There are many things we yearn for, but this time we didn't come out to play, we came out to 
complete the task, and this is the fact we have to face. "

When Qin Yuan heard Jixiang, the boy seemed to be smiling maliciously when he said this.

"What's on your mind all day long boy what's there's a lot we look forward to what are you talking 
about?

It seems that you kid is all day long.

I always think about some messy things in my heart, see if I don't tell Fan Tianlei after I go back, 
you have a wicked mind. "

Chen Jixiang immediately grabbed Qin Yuan's arm and made a begging gesture.

"Brother Qin Yuan, don't tell Fan Tianlei what I said, he will definitely criticize me for being an old-
timer, Fan Tianlei, and he can't keep up with the trendy thinking and culture of our young people.

It's better not to tell him so much, we just know it ourselves. "

"I really admire your kid's optimistic attitude. Now we are about to reach our destination, and we 
have to go through a lot. We haven't experienced things and things that we haven't seen before.

You feel a little more relaxed now, and you don't have any worries. "

After Chen Jixiang heard Qin Yuan's words, he sighed.

"Hey~ We're just having fun while suffering, what else can I say?

It's just that it's just to find some reasons for yourself to be happy.

You know, I've never had too many bad thoughts.



I don't have any thoughts of seeking pleasure, and I am not such a person.

I know that after we arrive at the destination, there are many tasks waiting for us to complete, and I 
can't say what kind of danger we will encounter.

Therefore, I can only use this attitude to comfort myself, and let myself try not to worry so much.

Although, there is nothing important to me now, and I am just an orphan.

There is nothing to worry about, but I am still more concerned about your safety.

This is also very important to me. I don't want everyone to be in any danger. No matter how we got 
here, we have to go back without one person. "

I don't know why Qin Yuan was moved by Chen Jixiang's words from the bottom of his heart. It 
seems that although this kid said that he has no lover, he is really serious and treats them all as 
relatives.

So, Qin Yuan walked up to Chen Jixiang, patted his shoulder and said with a smile:

"Don't worry, kid, there is nothing to worry about, as long as we can do it, we will do it without 
embarrassing you all, and you regard us as good brothers and relatives.

I am the same, just like you said, we all came together, and there must be one less person to go back 
together, no one can do it, this is what I said! "

Unexpectedly, at this time, I received a call from Fan Tianlei.

Qin Yuan smiled and said:

"Did you see it? I guess it was Fan Tianlei who knew that we were almost reaching our destination, 
so he called again to remind him if he knew that we were about to reach the destination.



I won't let him contact me anymore, I'll just pretend I don't know and let him bother you all the 
time. "

Jason was also shocked to see the relationship between them.

"At first, I thought that the feelings in your army were different from ours, but now after seeing it, I 
can really understand that there is a big difference between Xue and us.

The emotions of your comrades-in-arms are very detached from ordinary emotions, and I really 
envy you.

If I were given another chance, I would definitely not be in the smuggling business.

I want to be like you, the most joyful thing is to have so many good comrades by my side in this 
kind of team. "

Qin Yuan nodded with a smile.

"Jason, although you're not in the same team as us, I've already regarded you as a good friend. It's 
He Chengxiang and He Chenguang.

In the future, we all have experienced so much like brothers, is there any reason why we can't get 
along well together? "

After answering Fan Tianlei's call, Qin Yuan said helplessly:

"Thunder God, don't I deserve your peace of mind? Why did you call again in such a short time? Do 
you want to urge us to complete the progress of the mission?"

"I don't have time to rush you. I'm calling you to tell you that I've successfully met An Ran. Don't 
worry. The woman poses any threat to you.

I believe this should be a very good news for you, and it will give you a lot of relief in the vast sea. 
"



After hearing what Fan Tianlei said, Qin Yuan immediately patted Jason on the shoulder excitedly.

"Jason, you can rest assured this time, this batch of goods has been picked up by Fan Tianlei.

Don't worry, he won't take this batch of goods for himself. He will definitely make the best 
arrangements. After we return from Pakistan, he should take the initiative to talk to you. As for how 
he arranges, I will help you fight for it. of. "

Jason nodded and said very touched:

"Then I have to trouble you to help me, thank you Thor. I know how difficult it is to help us do this. 
I am so excited and moved. If it weren't for you, Qin Yuan, I would believe in Thor. won't help me 
either.

But I don't have any particular thoughts about it.

I don't want to rely on this matter to make merit or what.

As long as I don't count this as my big mistake, I'm already thankful.

I know, I myself call this a misstep that will cause eternal hatred.

Accidentally agreeing to Effiete's words has caused a lot of trouble for you and everyone.

It is very lucky to be able to make up for it now.

I don't dare to ask for any other rewards or something that I shouldn't get. "

After Qin Yuan finished listening, he could tell that Jason had such a sincere attitude towards them 
at this moment.

Qin Yuan said to Fan Tianlei:



"Raytheon, I have conveyed to Jason what you told me, but to put it bluntly, I still have to work 
**** you.

I... can't thank you enough! "

"I said when did you guys learn to say these polite words to me? If you talk to me again, you have 
never been so polite and grateful. Put away your attitude!

what are you like I don't know yet? Even if you are moved back, you should be naughty with me, 
it's still the same.

Another reason why I called you is to tell you, don't worry about An Ran, he has nothing to do.

He is safe and has returned to the army. I will arrange for him to rest in a while.

When he rests, he will contact you again naturally. I know you have given him an important task, 
which is to ask him to help find medical resources.

He has always taken it to heart, and was discussing it with me when he came back just now. Don't 
worry, the matter of medical resources is on the two of us.

I also know Jason, he is very sorry for having numbered ammunition, so we don't care what kind of 
reward we want to give him on the surface.

Or he would not accept rewards, and for a person like him, family affection is the most important 
thing.

As long as you can help her find the right medical resources is more important than anything else, 
but please help me tell Jason that there are many quack doctors in Pakistan, and they are all 
defrauding people with money.

Don't make him believe these things, I've been lied to myself.

No matter what rhetoric he tells you, don't believe it.



They will use the idea that they are worried about their loved ones to blackmail you.

At that time, not to mention that you will end up with no personal wealth, even greater danger to 
your life is also possible.

Tell Jason, but don't be so confused. "

Qin Yuan didn't expect Fan Tianlei to take such little things to heart, and he was also very moved.

"Thank you Thor, thank you for taking this matter to heart, this is something that An Ran and I 
promised, so let you do it yourself.

We, I feel a little sorry for trying to find a way, but thank you anyway, I won't say so much, I will 
buy you a drink when I go back! "

"It's the first time I've seen your sister-in-law treat me so politely, but don't worry if I've said 
everything I need to say, I won't let you down if I take care of this matter!"

"Okay, I guess you are about to reach your destination, how are your preparations going?

Have you figured out how to deal with it? Don't let Effiete and the others take the lead!

I tell you Effiete, these people are very cunning. "

"I know that we have already been mentally prepared. At the beginning, Effiete gave Jason a signal 
similar to electronic fireworks, a communicator.

He told Jason that this signal communicator can be released after seeing the landmark buildings in 
Pakistan, and they should give some responses at that time. I don’t know what this type of 
communicator does, but it’s okay to think about it. The boy has already modified it for us, and the 
meaning of the original information has been changed.

After believing that we put this signal communicator, they should also be caught off guard. "



"I didn't expect you to be able to complete so many tasks independently. It seems that I gave the 
diagram of the signal communicator to Chen Jixiang, is it really the right way?"

"What I mean is that you are too eccentric, right? Why didn't you tell me about this signal diagram 
to Chen Jixiang?"

Fan Tianlei knew that Qin Yuan would definitely ask such a question at this time.

"Because Chen Jixiang is much smarter than you!

He has learned this aspect of knowledge before, and it is naturally handy to use it much faster than 
you who start learning again.

Moreover, if you want to modify this signal communicator, the most important thing is timeliness. 
If you don't modify it in time, it will be useless. "

After Chen Jixiang heard Qin Yuan's words, he whispered next to him:

"Brother Qin Yuan, he is such a competitive person, even for such a trivial matter, he would fight 
with me, but this was arranged by Thunder God, and I have no intention of competing with you.

Thor said, I am fast and smart, and I am suitable for this job! "

After finishing speaking, Qin Yuan immediately said to Thunder God:

"The matter of Thor is still very important, we must plan it carefully, and we have seen it now, 
Pakistan, the iconic building, if we want to release the signal now, we should not wait any longer. "

After Fan Tianlei heard this, he immediately said in surprise:

"What? Have you been able to see the landmarks of Pakistan now?

Your ships are still traveling very fast. If this is the case, then don't waste time. Hurry up and release 
this signal flare. It will be good for you to have more time to prepare.



But I will get there soon, you must keep in touch with me anytime and anywhere, and don't let me 
miss you who are unfamiliar with you, and I even made a good friend back then.

I am really worried that you will be there in a few hours.

Alright, I won't tell you for now, just go and prepare yourself. If you have any difficulties, please 
remember to contact me in time.

At that time, He Fei, if he is unable or unwilling to help you, I can only go and talk to him in 
person. "

After hanging up the phone, Qin Yuan thought about what Fan Tianlei had said to him.

Fan Tianlei said very clearly that if He Fei was unwilling to help them, he would go and argue with 
him in person. It seemed that Fan Tianlei still firmly believed that he could help him.

At this time, Qin Yuan chose to believe in Fan Tianlei, he would not deceive himself, and would not 
put himself in a dangerous situation.

Jason said to Qin Yuan:

"What did Thor just tell you?"

"He just told me about medical resources, and he will definitely try his best to help you.

Moreover, he has taken the issue of numbered munitions to heart, and will not let you pay in vain. 
At that time, he will give you some rewards or compensation in an open and honest manner, but he 
himself said that, I believe that as a Father, you don't care about this. "

Chapter 1957:

After Qin Yuan and Jason talked so much, everyone was very anxious about what was going on.

In fact, all of them are well aware of this matter, knowing that they will soon reach their destination, 
and everyone should keep their hearts in their stomachs.



But now, I am still very worried.

Chen Jixiang said:

"Brother Qin Yuan, when you contacted Fan Tianlei just now, did he tell you what to do?

Fan Tianlei, did he say that He Fei must be asked to help us with this matter, and we can be real 
radicals with him? It would be quite a risky thing to ask him to help us.

He Fei, he is so powerful in Pakistan, we really have to be more cautious, otherwise we don't know 
what to do? "

Qin Yuan nodded.

"When I contacted Fan Tianlei just now, he did tell me this. He said that he believed in He Fei and 
would definitely help us, no matter what grievances there were between the two of them.

Since Fan Tianlei said it so clearly this time, we should choose to trust Fan Tianlei..."

"I believe there is nothing wrong with him, but I still feel that this matter is not as simple as we 
imagined. Why don't we contact He Fei and see what he thinks?"

Seeing the two of them discussing this matter here, Jason actually felt quite uncomfortable in his 
heart. He always felt that it was because he had secretly transported the ammunition that the two of 
them were affected by this incident.

But now that things are up to this point, I can't say anything anymore, what I can do is to help and 
compensate them both by their side.

"Qin Yuan, I'm really sorry, I never thought that this matter would cause trouble, if you had known 
this earlier.

I'd rather not tell you about the munitions on board! "



"Why are you telling us these things now? Everyone knows that you don't have to explain so much 
about things you know well. Is it necessary for us to have a relationship like this at home?"

"Then what should we do now? Should we go to the deck and release the annunciator first, and see 
what's going on?

What does this annunciator represent? "

Chen Jixiang said:

"I've researched it, the signal Effiete gave you, it means that he hopes to come over to respond as 
soon as possible.

And he is a superpower, the reason why he did this one after another is because it might be safer to 
use this on the sea.

He was also worried that the weather at sea would be bad, and he would not be able to see the signal 
clearly because of the bad weather, so he gave you a super signal device. "

Qin Yuan sneered and said:

"It seems that Effiete really worked hard to give us such a good communicator. It seems that they 
should be determined to find us as soon as we arrive at our destination.

Let us take this opportunity to think about it.

I don't know, what should I do when I get there?

By the way, Jason, should we contact Norman Karim now and ask him to come with us and help us 
at the destination?

I also know that it is very difficult to bother him about this matter.



Didn't he say before that we don't need us to act, or some other messy things? This turned out to be 
the case.

Then is he planning to find us directly after we arrive at the destination? "

Qin Yuan was also muttering in his heart, he felt that this matter was not as simple as he thought.

In his heart, he was unwilling to be so active, and quickly contacted Norman Karim, but he was still 
very worried that he was unreliable. If he really stood by Effiete at that time, wouldn't he be If you 
are caught off guard, isn't this the same as putting the opportunity in the hands of others?

Qin Yuan could also see Jason's hesitation now.

So he hastened to say to him:

"I know what you're thinking right now, you don't want to take the initiative to contact Norman 
Karim, but I have to remind you that we need to take the initiative in this matter.

Anyway, I will definitely get in touch with them when I get there.

Why don't we hurry to find them now, otherwise we will be Effiete after arriving at the destination, 
and it is too bad for us if they take the lead. "

Qin Yuan thought to himself after listening to Jason's advice.

Forget it, don't think so much, just let it be when it comes.

Since you chose to let He Fei, help yourself not to doubt too much, at least you should trust Fan 
Tianlei once.

"Hmm, that's fine, I understand, don't worry, you won't hesitate any longer, you'll just take our 
precious time. Should I call Norman Karim now, or should you send the signal first? "

Chen Jixiang said with a smile:



"Brother Qin Yuan, let's go to dinner first, let's get a new account, after we receive the reply letter 
from Effiete, it's confirmed, what should they do next, and then contact Norman Karim, will it be 
okay? better?

At that time, our plan should be foolproof! "

Jason thought about what Chen Jixiang said, and felt that what this kid said was quite reasonable.

I didn't expect this kid to improve so fast.

"Well then, since that's the case, then you should hurry up and release the new account. The three of 
us will go together and see if we can get a reply from them."

Jason looked at Qin Yuan and Chen Jixiang.

"Well, okay, let's go to the deck to release the signal now, we have seen the landmark buildings of 
Pakistan, the only thing we can do now is to hurry up.

First release the signal in our hands to see if they can get a response, and then we will contact 
Norman Karim, wondering if he is willing to help us! "

"Well, this is the best way so far, and there is nothing more suitable for us."

Afterwards, Qin Yuan and Jason took Chen Jixiang, and they walked to the deck carefully holding 
the communicator.

At this time, the fog on the sea has slowly dissipated, and they can clearly see the sea, and now the 
weather is clear, as if the bad weather has passed.

Chen Jixiang said:

"You can see that the weather on the sea is so good now, what does this mean? It means that the 
clouds are clear.



This is another village where the willows are dark and the flowers are bright. It seems that our next 
things will be very complete and smooth. I believe that everything will be fine, as long as we can 
protect these things well.

After we arrive in Pakistan, we will be able to successfully complete the mission and go back as 
soon as possible.

Only at this time did I realize how painful it is to be far away from home. At the beginning, I was in 
country H, and I didn’t think there was anything special about it. Now that I’ve left home and come 
here where I’m not familiar with, I started to miss my hometown.

This is called homesickness, I never thought I could feel it! "

Qin Yuan looked at Chen Jixiang, this kid had a lot of emotions here.

"I didn't expect you to have so many emotions just after leaving your hometown for a few days. It 
seems that it is really not easy."

"Everyone has the feeling of missing their hometown, so please don't laugh at me!"

At this time, Jason said to Chen Jixiang:

"It seems that the clear sky and clear air on the sea are more suitable for us to release this signal.

Then let's start now. In fact, I am still a little nervous now. I don't know what kind of reply I will 
receive in a while? "

At this moment, Chen Jixiang suddenly thought of something again.

"Qin Yuan, I know!"

Seeing his surprised look, everyone felt very curious.



Qin Yuan asked more seriously:

"What did you think of, boy? Just tell me quickly not to play tricks here."

"It doesn't matter for a while, after the signal is released, you will know."

Qin Yuan saw that this kid was determined to play tricks, but he didn't intend to expose him.

"Okay then, let's release now. Who will do the signal release?"

Chen Jixiang looked at Jason.

"Jason is the owner of this ship, of course he did it, and this signal flag was also given to him by 
Effiete himself.

Jason, why don't you come and do it yourself, you should know how to do it, right? "

Jason took the signal device from Chen Jixiang's hand.

"Although I haven't seen a book for a few days and can't read a few big characters, but this thing 
can be regarded as a fool's operation, how can I not know? It doesn't matter, leave it to me.

Are you two ready? Ready, I'm about to get started! "

"Yeah, we two are ready, let's get started!"

Afterwards, Jason mustered up his courage. For some reason, he also felt a little nervous.

Close your eyes and try your best to signal, facing the sky like setting off fireworks.

I turned the button lightly in my hand, and soon the fireworks rose into the sky.



It's like setting off fireworks when the sky is blue during the day.

A gleam of color appeared in the clear blue sky.

There is indeed an unusually beautiful feeling.

After seeing the release of this signal, the big stone in everyone's heart can be put down.

No matter what happens next, anyway, this step can be regarded as a step forward, and the signal 
has been released, which means that it is the establishment of contact with Effiete and the others.

It seems that if you don't want to have anything to do with them in the future, it will be impossible.

This time, they must bravely confront Effiete head-on.

Chen Jixiang, looking at the beautiful fireworks, said:

"I never imagined that you would watch a beautiful firework show in this way. It would be great if 
there were a few more. We can still watch a firework show."

"I said you still have some romantic cells in you.

What time is it? Even thinking about watching the fireworks show! "

Chen Jixiang scratched his head in embarrassment and said with a smile:

"Don't blame me, I think this is a better idea, I didn't think so much.

And we have all been in such an environment, the most important thing is to make ourselves happy. 
"

Jason nodded too.



"Yeah, I think Chen Jixiang is right, this is called having fun while suffering, since we have all 
come here, we have to face it bravely.

Besides, it's all like this now, what we can do is wait for their reply? "

After listening to Qin Yuan's words, Jason is also very curious now.

"Jason, are you sure Effiete and the others will write back to us?

When they told you about this matter again, did they tell you that they needed to write back to him? 
"

"Then he didn't tell us, but I think theoretically speaking, he should give us some reply. Let's wait 
here patiently.

Don't go back to the room yet, see if you can get some reply messages after waiting for a while. "

Jason also nodded. In fact, he doesn't want to go back to the room now. He always thinks that the 
environment on the deck will be better. After all, he can still have close contact with the air here.

Being able to feel the fresh air is better than being stuffy in the house.

Moreover, especially on the sea, even if there is a sea breeze blowing, it always feels extremely 
stuffy and uncomfortable in the house.

It is different from the feeling on land.

This is his experience as a person on land who spent such a long time at sea for the first time.

He can feel it most now, the obvious place is the hot weather.

"Then we'll stay here, wait for a while, just take this opportunity to get some fresh air, didn't you kid 
always want to get some fresh air on the deck? There is no such opportunity, and now you can seize 
this opportunity."



Chen Jixiang listened, shook his head and said helplessly:

"What's the matter? When I wanted to come out to breathe before, you didn't let me get to the 
destination soon, and you remembered what asked me to come out to breathe.

What I should need now is to go back to the underground cabin and have a good sleep. I don’t know 
what the local customs are like when I arrive at the destination. Thinking about it, I’m still a little 
excited. "

One, mentioning the underground cabin, Qin Yuan couldn't help thinking of He Chenguang.

It's about to go down now, He Chenguang, he's still sulking in the underground cabin.

After the three of them arrived at the destination in a while, they had to work together to complete 
the task.  Now he is always unhappy here when he is sullen, and Qin Yuan is actually not happy in 
his heart.

Jason looked at the expressions of the two of them, and knew that they must be thinking of He 
Chenguang.

"It's okay, you two don't worry, I believe this matter is not a bad thing for He Chenguang.

He should just be a little irritated by the environment of the underground cabin.

After he wakes up, I believe that if he comes out to breathe, he will feel better, a lot. "

"I hope so..."

While the two of them were chatting, Chen Jixiang excitedly pointed to the shore of Baguo, the sky 
over there and said:

"Brother Qin Yuan, Jason, look quickly! Look over there, there are also traces of the signal being 
released. Wait a minute and I'll record it. What kind of pattern did they broadcast the signal..."



Chapter 1958: The power of Pakistan is ready to go

Both Qin Yuan and Jason saw the destination from a distance. There were indeed some fireworks-
like patterns in the sky over there. It seemed that this should be Effiete's reply.

Qin Yuan saw all this, he hurriedly said to Chen Jixiang next to him:

"Boy, don't think so much, don't hesitate, quickly use your various methods to record the patterns on 
their side, so that we can see what they mean when they send it?

Go back and compare your drawings in a while to see what their signal means?

We must not be fooled by Effiete.

These people are very cunning, I think they still don't know that Jason has deciphered the meaning 
of this signal.

They thought they could communicate casually with this new account, but we will know later that 
the significance of their signal release should be able to prevent problems before they happen. "

Chen Jixiang smiled and said to Qin Yuan:

"Brother Qin Yuan, don't worry. Do you still have to worry so much about what I do? You don't 
need to say that I have already written it down. I have a good memory?

Moreover, the different colors and patterns of each firework represent different meanings.

No, we deliberately record it.

As long as you can remember his color and approximate pattern, go back and compare it with the 
drawings, it's not that troublesome. "

After hearing what Chen Jixiang said, Jason nodded in satisfaction.



"Hmm, it can be seen that this kid is becoming more and more clever, and he can know what to do 
without you saying a lot of things?

It seems that he is really a very capable assistant. If my subordinates are half as smart as this kid.

I feel like I can wake up from sleep. "

Hearing Jason's compliment, Chen Jixiang was still embarrassed, lowered his head, and blushed.

Seeing all this, Qin Yuan immediately joked:

"You kid is usually either skinless or cheeky. How can you still blush?"

"Of course, I'm also very shy. If you praise me like this in front of me, I feel a little flattered."

"Don't be patronizing and complacent, and don't forget what this signal records.

If you forget by then, watch how I deal with you kid! "

Jason immediately said to Qin Yuan:

"Now, this kid, I know what's in my mind, so don't hit him all the time.

Now what is this called cracking down on education is very detrimental to their growth, and I 
understand it.

My name is Yu, and my daughter is no longer like this, so please don't be so old-fashioned! "

Qin Yuan thought to himself that what he said was quite right.

"However, if you don't hit this kid, his tail will jump into the sky.



This is what Fan Tianlei has always said to me in the past, and now I will give it to this kid intact. "

The few of them watched the fireworks set off from the destination on the shore of Baguo, chatting 
here while admiring the beautiful scenery.

Not long after, the fireworks had already been set off, and they waited for a long time without any 
further signals.

At this time Jason said:

"Qin Yuan, it seems that the news we have been waiting for has been completed. What we need to 
do now is to go back and see what the signal of their disappointment really means?"

Qin Yuan pondered for a while, and felt that what Jason said made sense.

"Yeah, Jason, I think what you said makes sense, let's go back to your room and have a look."

"That's right, let's go back and look at the blueprints now, and compare them, they are the fireworks 
that are released, and what information they represent, we must not be kept in the dark by them.

Effiete, they are very cunning, although I don't have many chances to get along with them, but from 
Brother Qin Yuan's mentally exhausted state after confronting them, I can see that they are indeed a 
terrifying opponents, it is better to be careful.

What's more, we don't know if there are other people on this ship besides us who are Effiete's spies. 
"

Qin Yuan, in fact, is well aware of this matter. He knows that Effiete and the others will definitely 
put some people around him to spy and monitor, but they don't know who this person is now.

Qin Yuan carefully recalled what he did, but he didn't feel that there was anything showing his feet.

Afterwards, they felt that they should not hesitate anymore, and immediately returned to Jason's 
room.



After seeing that there was nothing unusual about Jason's room, they were also relieved.

In fact, Qin Yuan had been worried just now, they had been out to observe the signal for a while.

Will anyone take the opportunity to sneak into Jason's room to spy on the secrets.

Because, they all know that there must be some spies on board. Although they don't know who this 
person is, they always feel that he will take some action, and now he will reach his destination soon.

He hasn't caught who this person is yet, and Qin Yuan just feels a little regretful.

"Chen Jixiang, hurry up and take out your blueprint book, and see what the signal they sent out just 
now means?"

Before Chen Jixiang could wait for Qin Yuan, he immediately took out the drawing and recalled the 
situation of the fireworks on the shore of Baguo just now, carefully searching through his drawing.

Everyone is very anxious now, hoping to find clues about this fireworks as soon as possible.

Not long after, Chen Jixiang excitedly took the blueprint and walked to Qin Yuan's side, and said to 
him:

"Brother Qin Yuan, look quickly!"

Qin Yuan took Chen Jixiang over, and was surprised to find that the blueprint in his hand had an 
unusual meaning when they were on the deck and saw the fireworks released from the bank of 
Baguo.

"Jason, come and take a look!"

Jason had also been waiting anxiously, but when he heard Qin Yuan calling for him, he immediately 
walked to Qin Yuan's side.

None of the three were observing the meaning of the fireworks just now on this blueprint.



To everyone's surprise, the fireworks just now meant "action".

Qin Yuan was surprised when he looked at the meaning of fireworks on the blueprint.

"Why does it mean action? What's going on? Isn't this firework for us to see?"

Chen Jixiang only said it at this time, what he was hesitant to say on the deck just now.

"Just now I thought about this problem before I released the signal. I wanted to say it, but I don't 
have enough evidence, so I can only tell you that you will know after a while. It seems that my 
guess is not wrong. .”

Qin Yuan became even more curious when he heard Chen Jixiang say so.

"What do you mean? Did you feel it when you were on the deck just now, did they set off some 
fireworks signals?"

"Yes, that's right!

In fact, I already felt it just now, but what I thought was not that they would set off fireworks 
signals, it was just something I expected.

What I thought was that they actually set off this firework signal, not for us to see, but for their 
accomplices to see. "

When Jason heard this, he also had some incredible feelings.

"What do you mean? To show their accomplices, do they have other accomplices besides us?"

Qin Yuan stared straight into his eyes while thinking and said:



"It must be like this, because some of them should be guarding the shore, waiting for your news, 
and after your signal is released, they will be anxious for their accomplices to come over to deal 
with the problem.

I believe that Effiete and the others are ready to join you. This batch of arms personnel should 
already be on the way. It seems that we will definitely confront them head-on when we arrive at our 
destination in a while.

If you want to hide from the sky, it is impossible to sneak away, and their people should already be 
guarding there. "

After Chen Jixiang heard this, he fell into deep self-blame.

"sorry…"

"Why an apology? What does that have to do with you?"

"I thought I had figured out the meaning of the fireworks, but I didn't expect to fall into their trap. If 
I didn't, I would change the pattern of the signal gas on my own initiative.

Could it be that they won't be able to receive this useful information and won't come over to 
embarrass us?

Will they think that we have not reached our destination all this time, so we can successfully hide 
from the sky and pretend that nothing happened?

Now that they see the signal and know that we are about to rely on the button, they will definitely 
make things difficult for us. All this is my fault, and I am so sorry.

Brother Qin Yuan, you are right, I am a little too self-righteous.

I'd better go back and wait for Thor's punishment for me, put me in confinement! "

After Qin Yuan heard this, he immediately comforted:



"Chen Jixiang, it's not your fault at all. Do you think it's so simple? Do you think you can get us 
into this predicament by modifying a signal?

Even if we don't release this signal, there is no way to escape the monitoring of Effiete and the 
others.

Didn't you just say it yourself? They photographed many people standing guard on the shore of the 
destination in Pakistan.

Regardless of whether we have good intentions or not, they will be there to watch our whereabouts. 
"

Chen Jixiang also said:

"However, if we hadn't sent this signal, they wouldn't know that we had arrived at our destination 
here. If we wait too long, they will leave naturally. Maybe we can escape."

Jason also comforted Chen Jixiang:

"Don't you know that there is a saying called life, you have to see people, you have to see them 
when you die? In our business.

No matter what method there is to see the evidence, even if they wait for a few months, they will 
have to wait, unless they see our entity, they will give up not guarding here.

Otherwise, do you think they won't find us if we don't release the signal and reach the destination?

You kid is really naive, they won't let us go so easily, and Pakistan doesn't have much area at all.

When we get there, it's very likely that they will know about it too.

When the time comes, they catch us and our fate will be even worse.



Why not take the initiative now, follow what they say, listen to what they say, will we not be 
mentally prepared by then? Even if you confront them head-on, you won't be afraid. At worst, you 
will die or die.

You don't have to blame yourself, all this has nothing to do with you, you have done a very good 
job, without you, we would not know what amazing other purposes they have now.

All this is your credit! "

Chen Jixiang's eyes were filled with tears, and she shook her head sadly.

"Jason, brother Qin Yuan, you two should stop comforting me here. Now I feel that I am a little too 
self-righteous. It's all my own fault."

Qin Yuan looked at Chen Jixiang. There was something wrong with this kid's condition. If he 
continued to blame himself like this, it would probably put a lot of pressure on him psychologically.

"You don't need to be so stressed, don't forget that we still have a trump card in our hand!"

After hearing this, Chen Jixiang was able to calm down his emotions a little.

He widened his eyes and said:

"Brother Qin Yuan, are you talking about He Fei?"

"Of course, what we can rely on now is that he can help us. As long as he helps us, even if it is a 
direct confrontation, we will not be afraid.

Just take advantage of this opportunity to let Effiete and the others suffer a little. We can even feel 
relieved. "

"However, He Fei, it is still unknown whether he will help us or not. We have already received a 
reply from Effiete and the others. Should we contact He Fei and the others now?"



Thinking of this, Qin Yuan nodded a little. It is indeed the case. It seems that since they have 
received their reply.

I know what they are going to do next, and I can use this time to contact Norman Karim and the 
others as soon as possible.

Get them ready to help themselves.

Although Qin Yuan didn't want to trouble others, but now he has no other way out,  can't do it, just 
watch himself being bullied by others.

Jason also said worriedly:

"Qin Yuan, although I can't be so pessimistic, I still want to make it clear to you that this matter has 
nothing to do with you. If they arrive at their destination, they will really make things difficult on 
purpose.

Or the use of arms, so much less, this matter will make it difficult for me, so don't help me too much 
to fight for it.

What you should do most now is to protect yourself as soon as possible.

Don't forget that you have more important things to do here.

All of this is traceable. Don't embarrass you because of my affairs!

If you really have to give up, then leave me alone, and you all just take care of yourselves..."

Seeing Jason say this, Qin Yuan really regarded him as a good friend

Chapter 1959: There's nothing wrong with the past

After thinking about it for a long time, Qin Yuan and Jason thought that they should finally contact 
Norman Karim to see if he is willing to help.



Now that I know Effiete, what kind of thoughts they have, then proceed quickly, and the next step is 
to contact their forces as soon as possible.

In fact, Chen Jixiang was also very worried at this time, he was very worried that Qin Yuan would 
not be able to get in touch with them.

Being teased by that side, it will be difficult for them to proceed to the next step.

"Brother Qin Yuan, I think my words may not sound good, and I don't seem to believe you.

But I still have to say such a relationship between the two of us.

I can't sit by and watch what I know and not tell you. "

After hearing the grades and thinking about what to say, Qin Yuan was a little confused.

"What's the matter? Kid, you know some important information that you didn't tell me, tell me 
quickly.

I have never been to Pakistan, do you know much about Pakistan and do you know any important 
information? "

"It's not that I just think we should be more cautious, after all Norman Karim, he and Fan Tianlei 
haven't seen each other for so many years.

I'm afraid, even if two people walk face to face on the street, they may not be able to recognize who 
is who.

How could he agree to us so easily?

You guys, don't you ever feel that there is something unreasonable about this matter? "

"Of course I know it's unreasonable.



But didn't we say that? I choose to believe in Fan Tianlei, but I promise to guarantee it.

He Fei, no matter what, he will definitely help him and give him this face. Doesn't Fan Tianlei have 
any face with his old face here? "

"But you are using your life to maintain his face!"

"It won't be so serious at that time, you can rest assured, no matter what kind of problems you 
encounter, I will protect you and won't let you suffer.

Even if I die myself, I will not let you lose your life! "

Chen Jixiang shook his head.

"Brother Qin Yuan, that's not what I mean, and I'm not greedy for life and afraid of death, since I've 
come here with you, how could I be the kind of person who is greedy for life and afraid of death?

What I am more worried about is that you and we must not fall into the trap of those people. For a 
place where we are not familiar with, shouldn't the first thing we can do is to find a way to protect 
ourselves? "

Jason listened to the discussion between the two of them here in a few words.

I think what they both said makes sense.

"Qin Yuan, don't think that Shen Ji thinks this kid is just greedy for life and afraid of death.

He has been with you through life and death several times, don't you still trust him? People are also 
doing it for your own good. "

"Yeah, I know Jason, don't worry, I will never let you down in this matter, I know what to do, what 
to do and what not to do, I am like a mirror in my heart. "

"Then have you thought about it? What should we do next? In a few hours, we will be docking.



By the way, do you want to go to the underground boathouse and tell your good brother He 
Chenguang?

I know that you have some conflicts and don't want to see him.

But now that he was about to dock, it seemed inappropriate not to tell him.

Go tell him, this is also good news, I believe he will be happier too.

Although, as you said, I always feel that there is something wrong with him, but it is better to tell 
him, so that he can also prepare in advance? "

In fact, Qin Yuan, he himself has already made preparations, and he is very clear in his heart that he 
will arrive at the destination in a while.

What should be done? At least he has obtained the ability of Pakistani language through the one-key 
recovery system, so there is not much to worry about.

Although you are in a strange place, as long as you can communicate with them normally, it is 
feasible, so don't worry about it.

At this time, Qin Yuan said:

"Jiesheng, I think what you said is very reasonable, you should tell He Chenguang in advance to let 
him be mentally prepared.

It's also time for us to prepare for the disembarkation.

Well, as you said, I will contact Norman Karim again.

Look, what is he going to do?

You can't sit still, and, as you said, you shouldn't pin all your hopes on one person.



When we are in a desperate situation, we should have the ability to save ourselves.

In case, his thinking is really deadlocked and he suddenly decides not to help us, we can't just sit 
and wait in a foreign country. "

After listening to Qin Yuan's words, Jason nodded in satisfaction.

"Yeah, it's great that you can figure it out, I thought you were a..."

Before Jason finished speaking, he hesitated. Qin Yuan seemed to know what Jason wanted to say.

"Jason, do you want to say that you thought I was a proud and arrogant person, but you didn't 
expect that I could listen to everyone's opinions?"

After Jason listened to Qin Yuan's words, he smiled awkwardly afterwards.

Chen Jixiang, this kid also joked next to him:

"Does it need to be said? Jason must mean that. I can already see that he hesitated to speak. That's 
what he thinks in his heart.

But in the psychology of ordinary people, you have such an image, and it is difficult to change, so 
just accept your fate. "

"Okay, since that's the case, I'll hurry up and talk to He Fei first, and then contact me.

However, I thought of another problem. "

"What's the problem?"

"After calling him later, should I call him He Fei or Norman Karim? You all help me think about it, 
which one is more appropriate?"



Chen Jixiang thought for a long time, and he said:

"I think it would be more appropriate to call him He Fei. They should have experienced a lot of 
things when they were young. Calling him by this name should be able to change many other 
memories.

He will also be willing to help us a little.

Of course, this is just my own thoughts. "

"I thought so too, but now that I think about it, it doesn't seem appropriate. There is a saying called 
a hero, afraid of seeing old neighbors, have you heard it?"

"What do you mean by that?"

"That is to say, he may have had a lot of bad pasts in the past. One day writing his name will remind 
him of those things that are not pastable.

His mood will definitely not be better. Now he is the well-known Norman Karim, and he is not the 
same as the original poor boy.

So, he must prefer the current name..."

"There is some truth to what I said. I called him He Fei when I called him for the first time, but he 
didn't feel unhappy.

Anyway, I was quite surprised, and said that no one has taught him this name for many years. I 
think it should feel very kind to be called this name. "

Jason suddenly thought of a very important point.

"Qin Yuan, can you listen to me? I don't think the name is important, the important thing is whether 
we can let him help us and whether his personal interests are involved. Will he give up?



People like them who have reached the top will not care about this simple name, let alone what they 
have experienced in the past.

I think generally successful people like them, on the contrary, sometimes recall those things when 
they were young and feel that their journey has not been easy, and they wish to set a monument for 
themselves.

So I think no matter what your name is, he won't take it to heart, and nothing will happen, so don't 
worry! "

Qin Yuan thought about what Chen Jixiang and Jason had said to him, and they all made sense 
anyway.

"Yeah, I thought about it carefully. I think what Jason said makes sense. He cares more about his 
own. He doesn't care about his current experience and success. He didn't care about it before."

"Then what are you going to do next?

Contact Norman Karim now? "

Qin Yuan thought about it for a while, and she also wanted to contact him now?

Now that I have received a reply from Effiete and the others, it is well-founded to contact Norman 
Karim now.

I believe he should find a way to help himself.

"I thought about it and I'm going to call him now.

Tell him that Effiete is ready to start action, let's see what he plans to do, he wants to come forward 
to resolve the peace.

I still want to take a tough approach and confront Effiete head-on. "



Jason smiled, shook his head and said:

"Qin Yuan, I think you should say whether Norman Karim intends to be soft or hard.

As far as Effiete is concerned, such a small role is not worthy of even lifting shoes in front of him.

How could he care about his views and ideas?

The only thing they care about now is how to face Effiete, such a small character.

It is possible to solve the matter without losing one's identity. "

"Well, I think what you said, Jason, is very reasonable, so let's go like this.

I believe we should be able to have some good results. "

Afterwards, Qin Yuan arranged everything, and he was ready to go out and call Norman Karim.

Unexpectedly, just as he walked onto the deck, he received a call from an unfamiliar Pakistani 
phone number.

Qin Yuan picked it up carefully.

"Hello?"

"it's me!"

"Who are you…"

"He Fei!"



"Ooo, it's Norman Kalim!"

"Why do you suddenly call me this name instead of my original name?"

"I thought about it, and now it's not the original time, and it seems inappropriate to teach you the 
original name, I think it's too rude, so I'll call you the current name.

It's the same name everyone calls you. "

"Oh, if you want to say that, then I understand, have you heard a saying that a hero is afraid of 
meeting his old neighbors and thinks that I have something shameful before, and now I dare not let 
everyone know?

So you dare not call me by my original name?

Afraid that if I think about those unhappy things, it won't help you, right?

It seems that what you think in your heart is too complicated.

I think Fan Tianlei should have told you a lot, what I said before.

Well, there should be some bad ones, anyway, since I chose this step, I don't care what others say 
about me.

What hero is afraid of seeing old neighbors? It is useless for me to look back on any past events. 
Only successful people can write everything here.

No matter what others say, I don't care. If I want to care so much about other people's eyes, I can't 
get to where I am today.

I hope you will do the same in the future, be open-minded, be a little more.



No matter how good or bad things were in the past, or how great they were, they are already things 
in the past regardless of whether they are good or bad. There is no need to use past things to judge 
people in the present.

Some people just care too much about their past selves, so they can't get out of this predicament for 
a long time, and it doesn't matter if they think about it now.

Whether the past events were suffering or good fortune, it was also good experience.

It's all my own treasure, now it's for me when I recall it.

It's a past event worth looking back on.

I rather like my original self. I, I hope you can be as open-minded as I am, and don't be too rigid 
about the things in front of you.

For those unhappy past, you can also face it calmly. "

He Fei, after saying these words, Qin Yuan seemed to be able to clearly feel his open-mindedness 
and cheerfulness.

He neither denied that the things he had done were unbearable, nor did he admit what bad things he 
had done?

It can be heard from his words that he misses his past self quite a bit.

It can be seen that he should cherish the brotherhood with Fan Tianlei in the past.

Qin Yuan was fascinated after thinking about it, and now he didn't know what to say.

At this moment, He Fei immediately asked again:

"What's the matter? Boy, is it that what I just told you is really too advanced, which makes you a 
little bit unable to turn your mind now?



In fact, it’s good if you think about it clearly, it’s not as bad as it can be solved.

You want to find me, do you want to tell me about Effiete?

I want to make sure,  Will I help you? "

It was only at this time that Qin Yuan regained his composure, and instead he said:

"Today, you took the initiative to call me. How can you say that I am looking for you? It should be 
that you are looking for me for something."

"You kid, don't play hard to get with me. It is true that I called you first, but I believe that you just 
want to call me when you come out of the deck!"

After hearing He Fei's description, Qin Yuan was very nervous now, and he immediately turned his 
head to look around the environment on the deck.

He didn't find anyone watching him, and now he couldn't help but break out in a cold sweat.

He Fei, how did he know what he did just now? Could it be that he has clairvoyant eyes and good 
ears?

"You don't need to look at it, you don't need to doubt..."

Chapter 1960: Don't worry, I won't go back on what I promised

What He Fei said made Qin Yuan even more worried, and he even doubted it. This He Fei, how 
could he know so much, did he install surveillance on himself?

So, Qin Yuan half-jokingly said:

"Mr. He, how can you know such details?

I even wonder if you installed a monitoring device on me?



As long as you know what I can do, you still know my every move?

I was really a little too unbelievable, even a little creepy. "

"Haha, you don't need to worry so much, kid. I'm not an outsider, and I won't frame you. What if I 
know a little more? It just proves that I've lived a little longer than you.

That is to say, I have lived longer in this world than you, ten or twenty years, and I naturally 
understand what you young people are thinking. "

"You can understand this?"

"Of course, if I didn't have the ability to read people's hearts, how could I manage the business so 
well?

Let me tell you, what can really control a person is not his rights and money.

It is the ability to control people's hearts.

The reason why these people under me listen to me is not because they are afraid of me.

Rather, because I know deeply what each of them wants.

Only when you control what a person really needs in his heart.

To be able to control his behavior, this is the most basic principle of controlling Xin. "

In fact, Qin Yuan was already terrified at first, but after hearing what He Fei said, he became even 
more frightened, unknowingly breaking out in a cold sweat.

Qin Yuan thought in his heart, this He Fei is too scary. The words he said are like words that control 
people's hearts. It can be clearly heard from his words that he is very good at controlling people's 



hearts, and he is very good at controlling people's hearts. Being good at knowing what everyone 
wants is the scariest thing.

That is to say, he can truly control everyone only when he controls the most wanted desire in 
everyone's heart. No wonder he is able to get to where he is today.

He is really good at playing with people's hearts, this kind of person is terrible.

But thinking about it, combined with what Fan Tianlei told him about He Fei, it can be felt that this 
person came from a relatively humble background when he was young.

I can often be with those big guys, and get along with everyone in a very equal manner without 
being their little brother.

All these things show that he is very good at guessing people's hearts.

Therefore, Qin Yuan also said in order to ease the embarrassing atmosphere:

"Mr. He, what you said really made me feel a little overwhelmed. It seems that you have also seen 
through it. What is the thing I want most in my heart can guess my behavior so accurately."

"Qin Yuan, you're wrong, but I'm not particularly able to guess what you're thinking, kid, so I 
appreciate you very much.

I know that you came to Pakistan this time to complete the task, and I will not make it difficult for 
you, and since you have already asked me for help, I will definitely help you.

Just now you said that I seem to have installed it on your body, and the monitoring equipment can 
immediately know what you are doing, but this is not the case.

Instead, like I just said, I'm just very aware of what's on your mind right now.

You are almost at your destination in Pakistan.



You should be very flustered right now, you are worried, I have promised you something before, but 
now I go back on it.

You can't find my people, and you don't know what to do next.

So come out now and give me a call to make sure.

If, I really can't help you, I'm afraid you have to think of other ways, right? "

After Qin Yuan heard this, he smiled wryly and said:

"It seems that Mr. He, you are really a master at guessing people's hearts.

You are right, I have arrived in such an unfamiliar place, I must have a lot of worries, I hope you 
can understand.

Besides, I contacted you through Fan Tianlei's relationship. If you turn your back on me anytime 
and anywhere and don't want to help me, it's your duty.

But don't blame me for not believing you, this is also my duty as a human being.

If I put all my hopes on one person, then I must make him believe that I must also make this person 
worthy of my trust. "

He Fei said in a gentle and easy-going manner on the phone:

"Qin Yuan, there is nothing wrong with you, I appreciate that you don't like to beat around the bush, 
this is exactly the characteristic of me.

Just say what you have, I appreciate such a person, I can understand if you don't believe me, so I 
will call you in advance and contact you first.

Like you said, I need to make you understand that I deserve your trust in me. "



Qin Yuan said:

"Mr. He, there is one thing you said that is not accurate, and I have to correct it."

"Oh? What did I say wrong?"

"You said that I don't believe you. You are wrong about this. It should be said that I don't fully 
believe it."

"Aoao, well, it seems that you, Qin Yuan, are really careful with your words, and you don't fully 
believe that the word you use is very accurate!

So in order for you to fully believe in me, I will now take the initiative to contact you to see what 
you think.

I believe that you should take action here, and Effiete and the others should also take action, so you 
are more flustered now, right? "

"It seems that Mr. He, you are not only a master at guessing people's hearts, but also a master at 
controlling everything.

Your subordinates should have told you about the current situation in Pakistan, right?

You should already know by now that Effiete and the others took action, and I was flustered, right?

Both of us are smart people. Smart people don't talk, and we don't pretend to be confused, so let's 
talk about our true inner thoughts.

Now that you already know that they have taken action, and you have guessed what I think, what 
are you going to do?

I believe that Mr. He, you called me this time to make me feel at ease, and you will definitely help 
me. I have no doubts about it now.



However, what I'm wondering now is how are you going to help? What method can I use? "

Qin Yuan, he felt that he didn't need to beat around the bush when talking to such a smart person as 
He Fei, and he could just say what he really thought.

"It seems that you are also very powerful, knowing that I have already controlled so many things, 
then I am also a wise person, so I will tell you if I don't talk about secret calls.

I did find someone to watch Effiete and the others. I know that they set off fireworks signals on the 
shore and have already found many accomplices to go to the shore.

Preparation should be action, I believe that if you don't contact me, you will most likely be caught 
by them..."

Qin Yuan thought in his heart that he believed He Fei very much now, what he said should be that 
there is no problem.

Effie, they should have been fully prepared to fight themselves to the end.

This, **** Effiete, is like a dog skin plaster, it always sticks to people's bodies or there must be a 
surefire way.

So, Qin Yuan said:

"Since Mr. He, you already know so much, I want to know what you plan to do?"

"Then let me tell you my thoughts, I should have described it to you before.

I don't think it would be appropriate if I went directly to Effiete.

A person of my level has no reason to face an unknown person like Effiete. I believe this time, it 
should be an order from his superior that he asked the friend you uploaded to deliver arms.



However, he mixed some numbered ammunition, which is purely a personal conflict between him 
and you.

I don't know how you offended him and made him behave like this.

You should also know that numbered arms are something that arms dealers dare not touch.

Although I don't know where she got so many goods, in fact, even if I want to get some numbered 
arms, it is not easy.

You should reply in a reasonable way, is there someone in your internal correspondence with him.

However, now is not the time to start picketing the interior. I have told you so much because I want 
to tell you.

I don't think the acting method you mentioned is feasible or feasible, so don't treat them as fools.

I know Qin Yuan, your boy is very smart, but Effiete and the others are definitely not fools. I know 
he is the subordinate of a very powerful boss in Miguo.

So, this time, you should dock normally.

First use your methods to solve it yourself, if there is any positive conflict with him.

I'll get my guys out anytime, anywhere.

You don't have to worry about what I promised you at that time, I will definitely do it.

It is hard for a gentleman to chase after a word. If I were a villain who broke my promise, I would 
not be able to get to where I am today.

Qin Yuan, are you willing to believe me? "



Qin Yuan, in fact, he heard what He Fei told him, and of course he believed these words very much 
in his heart.

If He Fei was a person who talked nonsense casually, he would not be in the position he is today. 
During the conversation with him, Qin Yuan could clearly feel that this person was a very elegant 
and easy-going gentleman.

"I believe in you. Since that's the case, I promised to help me back then."

"Of course, you can think so. I will never go back on what I have promised."

"Since you promised to help me, then I can rest assured that you can take this big rock of yours for 
a holiday, and I can also tell my friends openly.

Let him not worry, in fact, he is also very worried about this matter in his heart. "

"You mean your friend who specializes in smuggling, right?"

Although He Fei said so, Qin Yuan was never surprised by what he said. A person of his level must 
have good hands and eyes.

"That's right, it's him!"

"This man, I have some knowledge before that he specializes in these smuggling business between 
country H and Pakistan.

Bringing all those criminals from H country to our Ba country is really a little too unethical. I 
wanted to have a good talk with him before?

Tell him not to do these shady business anymore, what's wrong with doing something young?

He sent all these criminal garbage to our side to do bad things, don't cause me a lot of trouble. "

Qin Yuan could tell that He Fei should have known about Jason's existence a long time ago.



It seemed that he was already dissatisfied with Jason's smuggling business, and wanted to take this 
opportunity to beat him up.

However, although it was immoral and inappropriate for Jason to do so, it was also his way of 
making a living.

Qin Yuan knew that all kinds of things were not easy for Jason, and he was unwilling to let Jason 
fall into an embarrassing situation.

"Mr. He, I just don't understand what you said.

Although you have settled in Pakistan for a long time, you are also from country H after all. Why 
do you always think about Pakistan?

Wouldn't it be a good choice to dump these criminals out of country H? "

Unexpectedly, He Fei sneered and said:

"Let me tell you this, garbage is garbage everywhere, and if this kind of garbage comes to our 
Pakistan, it will not end well.

I'm just sorry that your friend is a relatively nice young man, wouldn't it be good to do some serious 
business at a young age? Do not devote yourself to this kind of thing.

It is really unnecessary to make no money and make a show.

Besides, he has a daughter with a congenital heart disease waiting for his treatment. If it weren't for 
his daughter, I might have already talked to him. "

After Qin Yuan heard what He Fei said, he was already a little scared and worried. He could use 
such an easy-going tone.

It's really hard to say such a vicious thing.



Qin Yuan, he is very worried about saving money now, what if He Fei still wants to trouble Jason 
after this matter is over?

It seems that He Fei should have paid attention to him a long time ago. There may not only be 
reasons for this aspect of the routine, but also other reasons.

Qin Yuan also thought so, but it's not easy for him to get to the bottom of it now.

He thought for a long time, felt that Jason should still speak up.

It was absolutely impossible for Jason to fall into a dangerous situation like this.

"Mr. He, I know that you are very powerful, and I know even more that you have done so much, 
what's wrong with you.

Jason, he really shouldn't do this, there's nothing wrong with that, and I understand what you're 
thinking too.

Don't worry, I will never blame anyone from the perspective of my friend.

However, I hope you can give my friend a chance, he is not easy, as you said, he has a daughter 
with a congenital heart disease, so there is not much means of earning a living, if he really has 
What.

How can he do this industry when he earns a living in an aboveboard manner?

If I have a chance, I will still persuade him and let him find some legitimate business. "
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