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Chapter 221: It's a big trouble!

What's wrong?

But when the two people were puzzled, a figure jumped off the bridge on one side and 
clapped his hands.

That's right, this person is Qin Yuan. Just now he finally felt that he was late, but he realized 
that Yan Duopa was dead, and seeing Weng Sha was about to escape, he directly used his 
meteor to drop this Interrupted in the second half of the car!

Although Qin Yuan has already gone through experiments, this is the first time that he has 
used this meteor pendant for actual combat, so he is also worried about whether he will 
accidentally kill Weng Sha!

"No, you...what weapon did you use to beat the car like this?"

Gao Gang looked at Qin Yuan like a monster. Such a powerful firearm had to be 12mm in 
diameter, but Qin Yuan had nothing on him. Isn't this surprising?

"Haha, this guy just jumped off the overpass, did you see it?"

At this time, Fang Xinwu was also sluggish. Although the bridge was not very high, it had to 
be five meters long. When Qin Yuan jumped off, he looked like a okay person!

As for Guo Bing, who was sitting behind, his eyes were about to show up. Is this person too 
strong?

Are the special forces now so strong?

Qin Yuan was not good at explaining to these three people, and said to them: "This is our 
basic training. It's not good to tell you, what are you doing in a daze, go and see if that guy is 
dead!"



Hearing this, the two people could be regarded as reacting, and the three rushed to the car.

After walking in, Qin Yuan breathed a sigh of relief because he found that Weng Sha's life 
was very hard. Although his face was **** at this time, he was still struggling and was 
crawling out.

However, Weng Sha's leg was stuck, and he simply couldn't climb out. Gao Gang saw this 
situation and quickly wanted to help push the car off and rescue Weng Sha.

After all, Yandopa was dead now, and if Weng Sha died again, they really had no clue in 
their hands.

However, when Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang were both on it, they found that the car card was 
tightly closed. With the strength of the two of them, they couldn't move at all.

"You two let me out!"

Qin Yuan said, and then kicked the car, and instantly kicked the car straight.

The two of them looked at Qin Yuan with shocked faces again. Your sister, although this car 
has broken down, it is a car of several tons at any rate. You kicked it with one kick. This guy 
is still not a human being. ?

But Qin Yuan didn't care about the surprise of the two people, and pulled Weng Sha out of 
the car, causing Weng Sha to let out a scream.

And this scream directly pulled the two people out of surprise, Gao Gang looked at Weng 
Sha's miserable look, and quickly said to Qin Yuan:

"You have to be careful, don't kill him, if he dies, this time we will really have nothing to do 
with the bamboo basket!"

But Qin Yuan smiled, and said to Gao Gang:

"Don't worry, this guy can't die."



Having said this, Qin Yuan directly took out a silver needle from his body, and then pierced 
it towards Weng Sha!

Although Weng Sha is a poisonous fan, I don't know how many people have been killed and 
how many families have been destroyed, but he still needs him now, so Qin Yuan is also very 
serious about helping Weng Sha with treatment!

Eight needles against the sky, start directly!

An afterimage flashed from Qin Yuan's hands, and a few silver needles quickly pierced 
Weng Sha's body!

Moreover, Qin Yuan used the method of setting bones to relax the tendons, and directly 
sutured the cuts that Weng Sha had cut.

Of course, as for Weng Sha's screams, spurting blood all over the floor, or something, then 
you don't need to care, as long as it can save your life.

Seeing Qin Yuan's treatment like killing a pig, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang were extremely 
worried that after Qin Yuan's treatment, would Weng Sha really still survive?

However, the worry of the two of them was obviously unnecessary. Soon, the blood from 
Weng Sha's wound solidified, and his screaming voice became full of breath.

At this time, the red blood cell team and the special police operation team also rushed here 
directly.

Seeing that the person who caught him turned into Weng Sha, all of them were a little 
dumbfounded. What is going on? Didn't it mean that I was going to catch Yandopa?

Li Erniu and the others looked at each other, and sure enough, their captain was an 
unexpected master!



After that, several people hurriedly carried Weng Sha into the car and brought back to their 
secret base.

Although I didn't bring Yandopa back this time, he caught Weng Sha, which was a fruitful 
harvest.

After the incident was over, Qin Yuan Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang started to summarize the 
tasks.

When Fang Xinwu saw Gao Gang, he shouted directly:

"How I told you before, repeated orders and five applications, this is the Silver Triangle, not 
the country. You only have 15 minutes. Do you know how lucky you are to escape? Later, 
you may be smashed. People hacked to death.

At this time, Gao Gang's mood was much better, and he whispered to Fang Xinwu:

"You're never finished. In such a situation at the time, could I let this great opportunity out, 
not to mention that Qin Yuan still had to protect us?"

"He protects you, can he beat hundreds of people under his hand? Besides, you are a police 
captain. Do you think your hostage is important, but my informant is not important?"

Seeing the two people facing each other at this time, Qin Yuan also shook his head and said 
to the two people:

"Okay, stop arguing for the two of you, aren't they all for the same thing, do you want to do 
things well? But Gao Gang is right in one thing, I can indeed protect him."

When Fang Xinwu heard Qin Yuan's words, his anger became even more so:

"Even if you are amazing, you really kill all of them hundreds of people?"

"Oh, it is indeed a bit unrealistic to kill all of them hundreds of people, but I killed the 
puddle. You can add this one when you make the information sheet in the future."



Yep?

At this moment, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang were dumbfounded when they heard what Qin 
Yuan said.

What did Qin Yuan say? He killed him?

At this moment, both of them opened their eyes wide, and they felt that their actions were 
already messy enough, and they didn't expect Qin Yuan to be messier than him!

Although Pozha is just a poisonous meal, it is also the second force of the Silver Triangle.

"It's not you, you are too bold,"

Gao Gang looked speechless. Why did they use low-speed rubber bullets in order not to 
make matters worse? Now that Qin Yuan has killed the pounding, how can this not make 
trouble?

Chapter 222: interest

,

"No way, although you knocked him out, but he woke up again, I don't kill him, I can't come 
back alive, I know what you want to say, it doesn't matter, as long as we don't admit it. No 
matter what they say, they have no evidence!"

What Qin Yuan did for such a thing was familiar to him. After all, he discovered this when 
he was in Feizhou.

As long as there is no evidence, even if everyone knows it, it is not counted as Qin Yuan 
killed, and it can't be done to Qin Yuan.

Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang looked at each other, and they were speechless. Why did Qin 
Yuan seem to be so proficient in doing such things?



"Okay, let this matter go ahead, the most important thing for us now is to get news from 
Weng Sha."

Hearing what Qin Yuan said, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang both let out a sigh of helplessness. 
In this situation, the matter can only be temporarily suppressed. After all, everyone is dead, 
so come to condemn Qin Yuan. It's useless, it's better to think about how to improve this 
thing.

"Leave Weng Sha to me, I'm quite good at interrogating things like this, and keeping it will 
make him tell how old he is to wet the bed!"

Fang Xinwu said with a sullen face, and Qin Yuan shook his head when he saw Fang 
Xinwu's appearance. This Weng Sha is rather miserable. Fang Xinwu obviously wants to 
vent his depressedness on Weng Sha.

But at this moment, Fang Xinwu's cell phone rang suddenly, and Fang Xinwu looked at the 
display above, but sighed slightly, and then connected the phone.

Then he used fluent face to communicate with the people inside.

"It's okay, I will go to you!"

"Is the train station, OK, I will bring the money, and you will wait for me there!"

Fang Xinwu looked back at the two and said:

"My informant wants to leave now, I have to deal with this matter, you two go back first."

When he said this, Fang Xinwu still looked at Gao Gang helplessly. After all, if there were 
no overtime tasks, his informants would not have to fall into such a dangerous situation.

And Gao Gang also twitched the corners of his mouth. Although there was a cause, it was 
indeed his fault.

"I'll go with you. I'm sorry to say to him."



Gao Gang said in a low voice, but at this moment, Qin Yuan laughed.

"I have no problem with you two going together, but you two must be careful."

Hearing what Qin Yuan said, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang were a little strange, looking at Qin 
Yuan with puzzlement.

"What do you mean? Fang Xinwu asked suspiciously, but Qin Yuan said with a smile:

"Although I know you trust your informant very much, but I heard more than one breathing 
sound during the call just now!"

Both of them were stunned. There was more than one breathing sound. What does this 
mean?

"You mean there are other people around him?"

For such a hidden thing, it is definitely impossible for the informant to say it in front of 
others, so there is only one possibility, it must be that the informant was caught by the 
thumping subordinate!

But in this way, the purpose of his call is probably not to run away with money, but to attract 
Qin Yuan and others to join the trap!

Fang Xinwuman gave Qin Yuan a strange look:

"Your ears are so sharp, I didn't hear it just now."

"Let's be more cautious, after all, this kind of thing is not impossible, but in this case, should 
we go to the train station?"

Gao Gang also frowned. If this informant has betrayed them, is it necessary for them to save 
this informant?



But Fang Xinwu said firmly:

"I have to go. I know this person very well. If I wanted to betray me, I would have died eight 
times long ago, and he was only doing things for me before he was caught by those people. I 
don’t want anyone to blame me again. And died!"

Speaking of this, Fang Xinwu's face was a bit ugly, he was obviously thinking of something 
bad.

When Qin Yuan heard Fang Xinwu's decision, he also smiled:

"Then I wish you good luck, oh yes, you better bring this thing."

Having said this, Qin Yuan handed Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang an axe directly from the car.

Looking at the axe Qin Yuan handed over, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang were full of doubts. 
Even if they were to be more careful, they should have a gun. What does it mean to hold an 
axe?

"There are many people in the train station. I guess they don't dare to shoot directly. You can 
use this thing to deal with it. There may be some unexpected gains, but I don't guarantee it.

Qin Yuan said directly to the two of them, and when they heard what Qin Yuan said, 
although the two of them were a little confused, they still saw the mystery of Qin Yuan, so 
they pinned the axe directly to their waist and got into a car. , Go directly in the direction of 
the train station.

Of course Qin Yuan knew that this time they would definitely have some accidents, but now 
the people who threw it up were almost beaten by Qin Yuan. Their top priority should be to 
elect their new boss, not to catch traitors.

Therefore, they would definitely not send many people. With Fang Xinwu's high-level skills, 
they should be able to cope.



These two people must go through a run-in to completely relieve the grievances in their 
hearts, otherwise it will be very detrimental to their future cooperation.

And Qin Yuan went shopping nearby, and today was a tough fight, so Qin Yuan also wanted 
to take a good supplement. After all, Fang Xinwu's secret base is hidden in a place where 
birds don't shit, and there is nothing, so he wants to buy some food.

Qin Yuan bought a lot of food When he walked back like this, he saw an old man on the side 
of the road who was giving others a divination.

This kind of things are very common here. The old man is chanting words, and then he is 
giving divination to a woman.

Qin Yuan also met many such people in Yan Country, but most of them are deceptive. These 
people just rely on these words to make a little money.

And this old man, first performed some weird rituals, then let the woman smell something, 
and finally gave her a copper plate, shaking it left and right in front of her.

Qin Yuan looked aside for a while, and found that this woman actually actually paid the 
money honestly.

This is enough to prove that this old man still has a little ability.

Qin Yuan took a closer look and found that this old man was not only relying on words, but 
that strange ritual was actually a hypnotic technique.

Hypnotism?

This time Qin Yuan showed a hint of interest.

Chapter 223: Deserve it

In fact, hypnotism is not as magical as imagined. To successfully hypnotize people, many 
conditions are needed.



However, Qin Yuan was thinking about what it would be like if this hypnotism was obtained 
in the system.

Then Qin Yuan walked over directly and squatted down in front of the old man. The old man 
saw Qin Yuan, put away the money that the woman gave him just now, and said to Qin Yuan 
with an unpredictable face:

"Mr., what do you need? Don't you feel that your life is lost? I can give you some guidance 
on behalf of the gods."

"I want this copper coin in your hand."

Qin Yuan didn't give the old man a chance to bargain. He took out some money and patted it 
directly on the old man's stall, then took the copper coins, turned and left.

"Hey! Hey! Sir! That's the guy I ate, how could you just take it away like that! No way, too 
little money."

But Qin Yuan ignored the old man at all, took two quick steps, and directly dumped the 
opponent.

Seeing that he really couldn’t catch up, this old man stopped his pace. Seeing Qin Yuan had 
gone away from his back, he smiled at the corner of his mouth. He took the money Qin Yuan 
gave him into his pocket, and then In the other pocket, another copper coin was taken out.

Of course Qin Yuan knew that the copper coin was not worth much at all. He just wanted to 
try whether he could get hypnotism.

But Qin Yuan directly recovered this copper coin into the grid.

"Ding Dong~ Please start to choose the host!"

With the prompt sound of this system, three options suddenly appeared in front of Qin Yuan!

"1, get world-class copper plate manufacturing!"



"2, get world-class hypnotism!"

"3, get world-class appreciation of ancient coins!"

Qin Yuan saw these three options, but his eyes lit up. As expected, he had used this 
hypnotism. After that, Qin Yuan stopped hesitating and said directly to the system:

"System, I choose item 2."

"Ding Dong, congratulations to the host for choosing successfully and obtaining world-class 
hypnotism!"

Following the system's prompts, Qin Yuan felt that there was some new knowledge in his 
mind.

Then Qin Yuan checked it carefully and found that the mysterious hypnotism in this legend 
is not as difficult as imagined.

Qin Yuan gently turned the copper coin in his hand. He didn't expect it to be an ancient coin. 
Although he didn't know which dynasty it was from, it wouldn't be a loss to buy it.

After tossing for a whole day, when Qin Yuan returned to the base, it was almost night. 
Counting that it was almost time, Qin Yuan also received a call from two people safely, so he 
began to prepare dinner.

This time Qin Yuan bought a lot of things to send, and they were going to eat a hot pot.

A group of people naturally came to help prepare the ingredients.

At this time, Guo Bing saw Qin Yuan, but he showed a smile, squeezed directly beside Qin 
Yuan, and asked Qin Yuan:

"Captain Qin, I think you are very young. Have you graduated from military academy?"



"Not yet. Although I have already been promoted, I haven't gone to the military academy 
yet, so I can't get enough of the tasks at hand."

Qin Yuan showed his exquisite knife skills at this time, cutting the beef very beautifully.

When Guo Bing heard this, he was secretly delighted and said to Qin Yuan:

"Oh, I didn't expect you to be young."

"Yes, it will be twenty after the new year."

Qin Yuan agreed, but at this time, Song Kaifei surrounded him, hehe smiled and said to Guo 
Bing:

"Why, I want to find a boyfriend from the military academy. I know him. I've finished the 
military academy, a serious pilot..."

But when Guo Bing heard Song Kaifei's babbling, he immediately threw the vegetable 
leaves aside in his hand and prepared other things.

"Huh? Huh? Don't go! I know a lot of people!"

Song Kaifei still wanted to catch up, but he was stopped by Guo Bing's older brother:

"What do you kid do?"

"Didn't I exchange feelings with Bingbing?"

"Go go, my house Bingbing is still young, so big!"

The master directly slammed Song Kaifei aside, and Li Erniu saw this situation, hehe 
smiled:



"Pilot, are you a bit too impatient? I think you scared people away!"

"Cut, what do you know!"

Song Kaifei said dismissively, but when he turned his head, he said with a tragic heart that 
he would never tease his sister with Qin Yuan anymore, and the captain would steal all the 
limelight!

Soon, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang returned. Looking at them, they also experienced a 
struggle, but the expressions of the two people were good, and they obviously did not suffer.

"how about it?"

Qin Yuan asked, but Fang Xinwu said with excitement:

"You're right, they did have an ambush. After I took the informant away, those people came 
to chase us, but when we took out the axe and wanted to fight them, they were scared away. 
It's really strange."

"Yeah, I'm wondering too!"

Gao Gang also followed suit, but Qin Yuan had a normal face. If anyone saw a fierce man 
with an ax and chopped from one end to the other, he would feel liver tremors when he saw 
the axe again.

"Okay, come and eat!"

Qin Yuan greeted, and then everyone began to eat.

However, Fang Xinwu finally took off his beard at this time, and it seemed that it was finally 
pleasing to the eye.

It now appears that Fang Xinwu is at most thirty outcrops, but he has plunged his entire life 
into the turmoil of this informant. It is estimated that it is also a torment in his heart.



At this time, Guo Xu looked at Fang Xinwu, who had already taken off his beard, but said:

"Oh, after you lose your beard, you are a bit like, who is like that!"

"Who is it like?"

Everyone is also interested.

"Peng Yuyan! That's right, it's Peng Yuyan!"

At this time, everyone took a look at Fang Xinwu's appearance.  did look a bit like Peng 
Yuyan, but Gao Gang was a bit blind to it, and directly said:

"Hey, you sucked it up, why didn't I see you doing it like that? I told you so, I look like 
Zhang Hanyu!

"Don't say, if you are a little white, captain, how come you can really look like Zhang 
Hanyu!"

Guo Xu grinned with his teeth at this moment, and then began to say to everyone:

"By the way, which star do you think I look like?"

Everyone stared at it at this time, but their faces were full of doubts. This face was plain, and 
it didn't look like a star.

Seeing that it was cold for an instant, Guo Xu sweated a little on his head and said quickly:

"I'll give you a hint! If this is not love, I am so sad, thank you for your generosity, I deserve 
it!"

Chapter 224: Strange smell

After saying this, Guo Xu suddenly sang, and when he heard Guo Xu's voice, everyone 
suddenly realized it!



"Oh, come to think of it, it's Guo Fucheng!"

Fang Xinwu was full of excitement and said very firmly, but after hearing Fang Xinwu's 
answer, Guo Xu's face collapsed:

"Please! You are also an intelligence officer anyway, with such intelligence capabilities! I 
have given you such a hint, but I still can't guess it."

Song Kaifei on one side also said with a smile:

"That's right, you see, you guessed it, it doesn't touch Guo Fucheng. How dark Guo Fucheng 
is, this is obviously Gutian music!"

Yes, I found a darker one.

"I feel a bit like Dehua!"

And Li Erniu also guessed casually, but at this time, Qin Yuan took another sentence:

"Uh, Ma Dehua?"
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Everyone was silent at first, and finally burst into laughter!

Because teacher Ma Dehua is the actor of the 86 version of Journey to the West!

"Oh, I can't do it anymore, I laughed so hard, Qin Yuan, why are you so talented?"

"Haha, Dehua, master, I will call you the canopy in the future!"

Everyone laughed for a while, but in the past it was an expression of immense exhaustion, 
please beg me to look like Zhang Xueyou, the one that Zhang Xueyou sang!



what?

Zhang Xueyou?

Although this song was sung by Zhang Xueyou, is your image a little far off?

When Qin Yuan saw this situation, he also showed a smile:

"I said you were Zhang Xueyou earlier. You shouldn't sing if you Zhang Xueyou. In our 
current generation, you rarely listen to Zhang Xueyou's songs. You should say: come to 
you!"

"Hahahaha!"

Suddenly hearing Qin Yuan's words, everyone thought of that emoticon again, and 
immediately burst into laughter overturning the ceiling.

The happiness between men is that simple.

At this time, seeing everyone laughing, Xiao Tian also screamed in a low voice.

It looked at the meat on the table and kept the Harazi, but as a professional army dog, in 
order to prevent his stomach upset, he had no way to eat meat and could only eat dog food.

Seeing Xiaotian's aggrieved expression, this kind of person laughed even more.

But the happy time passed quickly. After the meal, the few remaining people cleaned up the 
tableware, while Qin Yuan, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang walked into the room where Weng 
Sha was detained, and began to do nothing in the light. Things that appeared below.

At this time, Weng Sha was tied to a chair and roared with all his strength:



"You bastards, let me go quickly, aren't you people of Yan country afraid of death? Don't 
think about the information that I derive from my mouth, even if I die, I won't tell you."

Hearing such words, Fang Xinwu showed a sneer, grabbed Weng Sha by the hair, and said 
coldly:

"What kind of martyr are you pretending to be here? You are just a poisonous meal. The 
most despicable and bottom scumbag is also 1,000 times better than you. Are you worthy to 
talk about persistence? I don't want you to speak earlier, because this Come, I can't torture 
you properly!"

After saying this, Fang Xinwu began to punch and kick Weng Sha, and Gao Gang, who was 
standing on the side, just wanted to say something, but Qin Yuan directly stopped Gao Gang.

Although Fang Xinwu's behavior is not in line with their discipline, this is a silver triangle 
after all. There are some things that cannot be observed, and they must hurry up.

After a while, Weng Sha, although he was beaten badly, still did not provide any useful 
information. Fang Xinwu's expression became cold, and Qin Yuan grabbed Fang Xinwu and 
refused to let him. Go on.

Such an operation is really inefficient, Qin Yuan said to the two of them:

"I'll try!"

At this time, Weng Sha was beaten with blood all over his face. Seeing Qin Yuan walking 
over, he spat out and said disdainfully:

"What? You want to change when you are tired?"

But Qin Yuan glanced at this guy, moved a chair and sat in front of him, and said to him:

"Hurry up and explain what should be explained. We will not kill you directly, but will bring 
you back to the country for trial. You will have some time to live."



Weng Sha suddenly showed a sneer, looking at Qin Yuan like an idiot. Does this guy think 
he can speak a word? Think he Weng Sha is a gangster on the street?

If he wanted to speak too, he would have spoken already, so why would he suffer this 
beating?

It's just wishful thinking!

Qin Yuan saw Weng Sha's sneer, and shook his head, and said to Weng Sha:

"Do you have nothing to say?"

"I have nothing to say with you Yan Guo pigs!"

Hearing this, Qin Yuan shook his head and said to Weng Sha:

"Oh, forget it, you can't catch the last chance given you, who is it for you to force me to do 
it?"

Qin Yuan stood up directly from the chair and walked towards Weng Sha, and Weng Sha 
also gritted his teeth, planning to withstand Qin Yuan's punches and kicks.

But Qin Yuan didn't do anything, just stared at Weng Sha tightly, Weng Sha also stared at his 
own eyes and Qin Yuan stared!

Weng Sha had injuries on his body and he hadn't eaten anything. Naturally, he was very 
sleepy. After a while, he couldn't hold on to something.

But at this moment, Qin Yuan threw a strange copper plate directly in front of him, swaying 
like this, and then said to Weng Sha:

"You are sitting in a small boat, surrounded by the endless sea, and the oncoming warm wind 
is very comfortable."



Hearing Qin Yuan's voice, Weng Sha actually narrowed his eyes, with a gentle smile on his 
face, as if he was actually at sea.

At this moment, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang, who were looking at each other, looked at each 
other The eyes were full of shock. They thought what way Qin Yuan would use, but they 
didn't expect to use this Way!

They have naturally heard of hypnotism, but most of these things are fake and deceptive, and 
no one has such an effect as Qin Yuan!

But Weng Sha is poisonous rice, is this useful to him?

Sure enough, there was a trace of struggle on Weng Sha's face, and the pain was also 
reminding himself that there was something wrong with his current situation, and he couldn't 
just be so addicted.

But Qin Yuan quickly changed his tone, and shouted directly at Weng Sha: "Suddenly a big 
fish swallowed you suddenly!"

At this moment, Weng Sha was clever, and he woke up immediately. He looked at Qin Yuan, 
his whole body trembling unceasingly, as if he had seen an unstoppable monster!

"by!"

Fang Xinwu's eyes widened, because he smelled a strange smell!

Chapter 225: How to deal with

　　 At this time, Weng Sha was so scared to pee his pants! Moreover, the nose and tears are 
constantly flowing out, which looks extremely funny!

　　 But Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang didn't have any thoughts to laugh at all. They both 
looked at Qin Yuan with shock.

　　 Fang Xinwu didn't keep his hands just now, and Weng Sha didn't give in after so many 
punches. As a result, Qin Yuan made a few random attacks and became like this?



　　 "My dear, what kind of assistant was sent to me?"

　　 Gao Gang murmured at this time, he now feels that Qin Yuan is really extremely 
mysterious, is there anything this person does not know?

　　 Now Weng Sha's mind has been completely destroyed by Qin Yuan. As long as he 
glances at Qin Yuan, it seems that he has seen some terrible demon, and he keeps moving 
back, except that he is tied under a chair and cannot move at all.

　　At this time, Qin Yuan smiled and waved to Gao Gang on one side:

　　 "Okay, now you can ask what you want."

　　 Hearing this, Gao Gang walked over in surprise.

　　 He first asked a few small questions to prove that Weng Sha was really hypnotized, and 
then directly asked Weng Sha:

　　 "You tell me, did you kill the 13 people on that fishing boat?"

"We killed it. This is what Nuoka meant. The boss didn’t agree. But Nuoka said that you 
people from Yan country hindered their transaction and must teach you a lesson, so I want to 
kill those people from Yan country. you guys!"

　　 But after hearing this sentence, Fang Xinwu suddenly grasped a point:

　　 "Boss? Who is the boss?"

"I don't know who the boss is. This is just a code name. I only know that it is a very 
mysterious figure. Even Song Ge from Mianguo is his subordinate. I only know that Song 
Ge is a member of Mianguo. People with high authority, presumably the boss is also an 
upper class in the country!"



　　 Hearing this, Gao Gang's brow furrowed. They knew that the people from these three 
countries would be bought by Nuojia, but they didn't expect that the big boss behind this was 
actually the upper level of the country!

　　 No wonder they killed a poisonous meal, and soon another person came up to replace it. 
Obviously, it was the root cause!

　　 Qin Yuan narrowed his eyes, wondering what was thinking in his heart.

　　 But Gao Gang also understands such a thing, and they have no way to stop it. The top 
priority now is to clean up the grievances of the 13 people. So Gao Gang said directly to 
Weng Sha:

　　 "Tell me, do you know where Nuoka's base is!"

"I do not know about this!"

"You do not know?"

　　 Gao Gang's eyes widened and he planned to attack Weng Sha.

"I really don't know! I'm just a thug under Nuoka. Usually when he takes me to his base, he 
will blindfold me. He has been hiding in that place for almost 10 years, unless there is 
Generally, he would not come out at all for important things, and he was afraid that others 
would reveal his whereabouts, so he hid it very well. Except for his nearest personal guard, 
no one else knew where he was! "

　　 Weng Sha quickly explained, because he saw that Qin Yuan was also walking here!

　　 Gao Gang saw this situation, and understood that Weng Sha probably didn't lie. He 
really didn't know where Nuoka's base was.

　　 But in this way, wouldn't their clues be broken again?



　　 "Aren't you one of the Big Three? Even you don't know where Nuoka's hiding is?"

　　 Fang Xinwu also frowned.

"I really don't dare to lie to you. Although I am one of the Big Three, I only help him deal 
with dirty matters. It can only be regarded as a gun. Ida completes all the ice transactions 
and really follows him. The only person around him is Sanji, but now his son has grown up, 
so he is gradually handing over these things to his son!"

　　 Hearing this, the three looked at each other, and then Qin Yuan asked Weng Sha again:

　　 "Well, tell me about the armed situation in the base."

　　 This Weng Sha knew, and quickly said to Qin Yuan:

　　 "Nokka has a 200-man guard. These people are desperadoes, and the weapons he 
bought are also very sophisticated, all of which are military weapons of the country."

"In addition, he has a baby soldier army. This baby soldier has about 50 people. They are all 
homeless orphans nearby. Nuoka is directly controlled by ice surface. These children have 
been sucking ice surface since childhood, so They can't live long at all, and they don't care 
about their own fate at all. They are truly desperate."

　　 "And they treat Nuoka as a god, no matter what Nuoka asks them to do, they will do it."

　　 At this time, Weng Sha Yiwuyishi said everything he knew. Qin Yuan's brows couldn't 
help but frowned when he heard the three words baby soldier.

　　 The so-called baby soldiers refer to underage children who are victims who are forced 
to participate in the battle, and they are also attackers.

　　 This baby soldier was not invented by Nuoka first, Before com, there were many anti-B 
elements who specially trained minors to be killers, and because of their long-term 
absorption, their minds were fundamentally unsound, so being intimidated by death is a very 



troublesome existence for troops from all countries. After all, for children Shooting is really 
a loss of morale.

And Fang Xinwu also shook his head and said: "What he said is true. In the Silver Triangle, 
as long as it is for food, there is no need for coercion. Someone will take the initiative to 
join, just to enable the family members to survive. ."

　　 Gao Gang also shook his head, this is all money, this place is too poor.

　　 It’s ridiculous to say that every inch of land is in the Silver Triangle, but the poor here 
are the poorest part of the world.

After 　　, Qin Yuan and the others asked a lot of news. Weng Sha also knew everything he 
could say, and said everything he knew.

　　 After receiving these information, Gao Gang quickly reported up and quickly contacted 
the headquarters. They were also analyzing the information to see if there was any 
opportunity.

　　 And Qin Yuan went outside with Fang Xinwu, looking at the stars outside, it was a 
breath.

　　 Fang Xinwu looked at Weng Sha in the room and said to Qin Yuan:

　　 "What are you going to do with this guy?".

　　 "What else can I do? Since they have been caught, he will definitely not be killed, and 
he will be taken back to the country for trial, so that he will be shot after he admits his 
crime."

Qin Yuan shook his head and said, and when he heard what Qin Yuan said, Fang Xinwu spit 
out fiercely: "Mother! A wicked man like this, a bullet would kill him, I think it's too cheap 
for him! "

Chapter 226: 1 family

,



Qin Yuan also shook his head and smiled when he heard Fang Xinwu's words, and said to 
Fang Xinwu:

"In fact, you want to torture him in many ways, and you don't have to do it yourself. I think 
you are a bit too extreme. Your hatred of these people is too deep and it has affected you. 
Have you found that your psychological condition has Something is wrong."

Qin Yuan remembered that in the original work, Fang Xinwu had always been for revenge, 
and after Fang Xinwu completed his revenge, the whole person seemed to have no target at 
all, and in the end he even died with those people in order to kill the poisonous rice.

This kind of operation is very wrong. Qin Yuan once heard that some veterans will fall into 
this state after they are discharged, and then you will be able to see some very fantastic 
heroic deeds.

These people desperately fight the fire, save the people in the water, just like a machine 
without fear.

But in fact, these people should be like ordinary people, fearful, die, and pain.

But because these people have psychological problems, they are extremely confused and can 
only use this form of self-destruction to feel their own existence.

Hearing what Qin Yuan said, Fang Xinwu was also a little silent. He understood that what 
Qin Yuan said was true, but for the time being he had no good way to relieve him, so he just 
said to Qin Yuan:

"I know, I will pay attention later."

Hearing this, Qin Yuan also nodded. After all, everyone is smart. Some words only need to 
be said and the other party can understand.

At this time, Gao Gang walked directly out of the house and said to the two of them: "There 
has been news from above, come and listen."



Gao Gang then took a look at the information posted above, and said:

"I have summarized our existing intelligence. With the support of the headquarters, I found 
that there is a way to go. The ice surface of the Silver Triangle is not entirely made of local 
materials. Nuoka’s subordinates often pass a The intermediary buys some raw materials for 
making ice in our country."

Fang Xinwu also nodded: "I know this is Ephedra."

Ephedra?

Qin Yuan was stunned for a moment, "Isn't Ephedra a blindly Chinese herbal medicine?"

"Yes, but ephedrine can have a certain stimulant effect, so when preparing new ice noodles, 
some will be added."

Fang Xinwu explained to Qin Yuan, and Gao Gang just said:

"These are not important. We directly found a seller of ephedra in the territory. His name is 
Zhang Da'an. On the surface, he is a supplier of medicinal materials, but in fact he has a 
close relationship with these poisonous rice in the Silver Triangle, but he has been We 
caught it, and learned from him that he is a downstream supplier of Nuoka!"

Hearing what Gao Gang said, Fang Xinwu said:

"What does the above mean?"

"The meaning of the above is to see if we can pretend to be this merchant and join Nuoka’s 
people. Although Weng Sha doesn’t know where Nuoka’s base camp is, he also mentioned a 
few positions. If we can continue from Other people can get other positions in their mouths, 
and it is even possible to know where the Nuoka base camp is through reasoning!"

Gao Gang explained, and Fang Xinwu and Qin Yuan also nodded. Gao Gang was right. The 
entire jungle is so big. No matter how powerful Nuoka is, it also needs to eat and drink. 
They always show some clues.



As long as all these clues are collected, then the location of Nuoka can be found!

Gao Gang continued:

"Zhang Daan has already explained that as far as he knows, Nuoka has two agents in the 
entire Silver Triangle, one is Mr. Sha, the other is unknown, and their errand person is a 
person named Peel!"

"Peel?"

Fang Xinwu was stunned when he heard the name.

Gao Gang was a little surprised: "What? Do you know this Peel?"

"I can't talk about acquaintance, just meet a few times."

Fang Xinwu said casually, and then summed it up:

"I understand. This time I just thought that we would catch Peel first, and then show our 
strength through Peer, and finally buy ice noodles from Nuoka's hands, so that I can hook up 
with Ida! Even Nuoka himself! "

"Yes!"

Gao Gang nodded, but Fang Xinwu sighed and said:

"But there is a problem. These people have always sold the familiar but not the raw. Even if 
we catch Peel, how can we make this person believe us?"

"Don't worry about this. Zhang Daan's attitude is very good, and the news of his arrest has 
not leaked out. We can report Zhang Daan's name to gain Peel's trust. As for the future, we 
can only look at ours. Played on the spot!"



Gao Gang said, and Qin Yuan also smiled:

"It seems that we have to look at our acting ability!"

"Hey, that's right, this time we are going to be a rich man who has nowhere to spend, and 
take the place of Zhang Da'an to receive the goods. As long as we are rich enough, they will 
take the initiative to come here!"

Isn’t buying ice noodles really just for making money?

And a character who can make money like a big money, is as attractive as a piece of fat!

But Qin Yuan thought for a moment, but frowned.

Gao Gang saw Qin Yuan's appearance and asked directly:

"Do you think there is a problem?"

Qin Yuan nodded, and then began to explain to the two people:

"Of course the problem is not small, there is nothing wrong with the above plan, but now 
that it is implemented, I am afraid that something will be missing."

"This? What is missing?"

"opportunity!"

Qin Yuan said in a deep voice, if they had implemented this plan from the beginning, there 
might be no problem, but now they are making such a big noise, although they have not 
completely revealed their identity , it is enough. Let the people of Nuoka be vigilant.

After all, there is no pure fool to be the boss, and their strength here is only so much, every 
point of loss should not be.



Although the four countries are now encircling and suppressing, it is estimated that the 
goods in Nuoka's hand are all suppressed, and a buyer is urgently needed.

But at this point in time, the buyer of Yan Country suddenly appeared. How could this not 
make the other party suspicious?

Hearing Qin Yuan's description at this time, Gao Gang also began to think:

"You are right, but do you have any comments on this?"

"I think that if you want to do a full set of the show, you should just muddy the water. I don't 
know if you have heard of a marketing trick."

Speaking of this, a smile appeared on Qin Yuan's face:

"There are two fruit sellers, opposed to each other. One side has a higher price and the other 
has a lower price. People will naturally buy the lower price, but in fact, these two fruit sellers 
are all one family!"

Chapter 227: Rely on yourself

"Oh? You mean, find someone to compete with me and lower the price, so that he can only 
cooperate with us!"

Gao Gang's eyes lit up, and Qin Yuan's thoughts were indeed good, but ordinary people 
would never think that the two rich men would be the same power!

"This method is really good. In this way, not only is it possible to keep listening, but also to 
reduce the risk of reducing the amount of insurance. It is a two-pronged approach."

Fang Xinwu nodded and said, while Qin Yuan said with a smile on his face:

"Maybe if Nuoka has a bigger appetite, she will serve both of us at the same time."

Gao Gang also nodded, and then agreed to Qin Yuan's plan. Gao Gang said to Qin Yuan:



"That's OK, then I will report this plan to my superiors, but I guess the superiors will agree."

Qin Yuan also nodded, but he was a little curious and asked Gao Gang:

"By the way, what role does the above arrange for you?"

"I don't know this yet, and after I report this plan to you, it is estimated that the above 
arrangements will change. I don't care, even if I play a ladyboy from Taiguo!"

Having said this, Gao Gang suddenly made an extremely charming posture, and seeing Gao 
Gang's disgusting look, No.1 and Qin Yuan suddenly couldn't stand it, and directly covered 
their mouths.

The look of this **** face scratching his head is really unstoppable.

"You can pull it down. If you are asked to pretend to be a ladyboy, we don't have to **** it 
when we are out of the police in the future, just hang your photo on the head, and it will 
scare people to death"

Qin Yuan said helplessly, but Gao Gang smiled:

"That's great, if it really works, it will save us a loss."

At this time, Qin Yuan's cell phone also rang. Seeing the number above, Qin Yuan had an 
ominous premonition in his heart, and said to the two of them:

"Okay, you guys talk first, I'll answer the phone first."

But Qin Yuan directly connected to the phone, and it was Gao Shiwei who appeared on the 
opposite side.

Gao Shiwei saw Qin Yuan'er, with a wry smile on his face, and said to Qin Yuan:



"Qin Yuan, Qin Yuan'er, you are really going to find problems for me, why? When I saw that 
I was supporting you, you let go of your hands and feet?"

Now that the time has passed for a day, the people of the Silver Triangle official can 
naturally understand the matter of Puza, and also know that more than a hundred of his 
subordinates have been killed.

It’s just that other people don’t know who did it. Can anyone in the military know?

After all, it was not the first time Qin Yuan took the shot, Gao Shiwei and Fan Tianlei 
naturally calculated it.

"Haha, Commander, what are you talking about... I don't know!"

Qin Yuan also slapped haha, while Gao Shiwei smiled:

"Very well, just keep this mentality. No matter who says or asks, just say that this matter has 
nothing to do with you. Although the official staff of the Silver Triangle shocked so many 
people to death, they didn't think about you. Instead, he put this matter on Nuoka, which is a 
bit strange."

As soon as Qin Yuan heard this, he almost burst into laughter. This glutinous card was really 
unlucky, and he gave Qin Yuan a scapegoat.

But this is normal. After all, Yan Guo's performance outside is very peaceful. Even Gao 
Gang is using low-speed rubber bullets when he is arresting people. So naturally, he would 
not expect that there is a fierce man. With two axes, he killed Puza and more than 100 boys.

Moreover, the official estimates are also aware of the grievances between Puzha and Nuoka. 
Since Puza caught Nuoka, it is normal for Nuoka to retaliate back. This time it is not 
unimaginable to kill the person directly.

Alas, this is also blamed on Nuoka for doing too many bad things. Even when the official 
people heard something bad happened, they would throw the matter on Nuoka in their 
hearts.



"Well, this has nothing to do with me. These are all the **** from Nuoka. For such 
poisonous rice, they should be caught and shot!"

Hearing that Qin Yuan had always been talking about him, Gao Shiwei knew that Qin Yuan 
must have done this.

But in the end Gao Shiwei still said:

"I hope you can maintain your current style, just like what you do now, I hope you can 
accomplish your goals, and good luck!"

After speaking, Gao Shiwei paid a military salute to Qin Yuan, and then hung up.

When Qin Yuan saw this situation, his heart moved.

Qin Yuan also knew that if he killed people directly, there would definitely be some trouble, 
but Gao Shiwei didn't say anything to Qin Yuan, so he uncovered it easily, so as not to put 
too much pressure on Qin Yuan. .

As a frontline fighter, especially a fighter like Qin Yuan who is purely fighting, hesitated in 
his heart, but that was a terrible performance.

Although Qin Yuan killed so many people, they were not easy to deal with, but Gao Shiwei 
would rather wait until Qin Yuan completed the task and take it home to deal with it. He 
didn't want to hear the news of Qin Yuan's sacrifice!

Seeing Gao Shiwei had hung up the phone, Qin Yuan also showed a slight smile and said 
warmly:

"This old man's heart is still very good, I hope he can bear it after a while."

After that, Qin Yuan returned to the yard, only to find that Fang Xinwu Gaogang was 
serious. Seeing this situation, Qin Yuan asked strangely:

"what happened?"



Gao Gang said in a deep voice, "We have agreed to the plan we mentioned above, but there 
is a problem, we may not be able to solve it for a while?"

"What's the problem?"

Qin Yuan asked suspiciously, but Gao Gang said with a wry smile:

"That is, only 2 million soft sister coins were approved for us this time. 2 million may not be 
enough!"

Hearing this, Qin Yuan also reacted Yes, when dealing with poison rice, real money is 
needed.

What's more, they are now divided into two groups, pretending to be two super-rich men, so 
the preparation of money is doubled, and even if it is a tentative transaction, the other party 
will definitely not only need 1 million goods. Prepare tens of millions.

But the government will certainly not help them prepare so much money. After all, this is 
just a plan, not something that must be done.

Fang Xinwu thought for a while, but threw the cigarette away, and said to the two of them:

"Then we can only find another way now. If the money is not enough, this plan will 
definitely not be implemented."

"That won't work, now I have finally found a solution to the plan. Now that the international 
situation is so severe, if it drags on for a day, the public opinion pressure on Yan Country's 
side will increase. It is better to solve the case soon!"

Gao Gang just didn't agree, and Fang Xinwu looked at this situation, but he was anxious. 
Seeing that the two were about to quarrel, Qin Yuan let out a long sigh:

"Then we can only rely on ourselves?"

Chapter 228: I will go with you!



"On their own?"

Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang glanced at each other, and they couldn’t understand. After all, 
the money they lack is not one or two dollars. They can take out whatever they want. If the 
plan needs to be implemented, it will cost 1,000 less. Wan, where did they come to get so 
much money?

"I have almost 200,000 deposits in my hand now, adding it is just a drop in the bucket."

Gao Gang directly shook his head and said, while Fang Xinwu was even more direct, seeing 
the eyes of two people looking at him:

"Don't look at me. You see that I still have a lot of disabled people. I have to raise them. 
There is no money left. You still have 200,000. I don't even have 200,000. At most There 
will be tens of thousands of dollars, and I will give you all of it."

Gao Gang didn't say much about this. After all, he saw Fang Xinwu's situation in his eyes, 
and he didn't even want the money.

After all, the tragedy of those disabled people is right in front of us. What if these disabled 
people need money? Isn't Fang Xinwu running out of any money?

And if Fang Xinwu hadn’t treated these people sincerely, he wouldn’t have had such a large 
intelligence network.

Seeing this reality, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang were even more helpless, but Qin Yuan said:

"Actually, this matter is fairly easy to handle. I still have two money in my hand to 
temporarily help you make up?"

Ok?

Hearing Qin Yuan's description, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang immediately looked back at Qin 
Yuan. They had not heard of Qin Yuan's family background. Is this kid rich?



At this time, Qin Yuan also smiled and said, "Although I am rich, I think it is too strange to 
use this method. Although we have no money, this is a silver triangle. I have no money. 
Others are Rich!"

Although Qin Yuan has money, he is unwilling to spend money on this meaningless thing, 
and as he said, where they are, but the most prosperous place of Xanthoxia, how could it be 
so easy to be stumped by money ?

"Then do you have any good ways to make money? I know that being a poisoned rice in the 
Silver Triangle is the most profitable, but we can't just be a poisonous rice for this little 
money!"

Gao Gang spread his hands. If an anti-narcotics policeman became a poisonous meal, he 
would probably kill them first if he didn't do anything on it!

"Huang, we don't have the capital and poison. Although we can make money, but the 
conditions are not allowed, only one is left. Naturally, we are going to gamble!"

At the beginning, Qin Yuan had cosmic card skills and dice skills. If he wanted to make 
some money by gambling, it was like squeezing snails with three fingers.

gambling?

Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang heard Qin Yuan's description, but they were at a loss. Can they 
do something like gambling?

They knew that Qin Yuan wanted to go to the casino to gamble with the money above, but 
the people in his casino were very dark, could it not be enough to pay the 1 million in, and 
also expected to make a fortune with 1 million?

Is this dreaming?

Qin Yuan saw the suspicious eyes of the two people, but he smiled and said:

"You can't, but I can, Fang Xinwu, do you know where there is a casino, go, let you see how 
good I am!"



"Wait, didn't you say that your gambling skills are better? Then you play a few games with 
us first. If you win us, I will take you to the casino."

Fang Xinwu said to Qin Yuan, and Gao Gang nodded.

Going to the casino to make money really makes people feel hopeless.

"okay then."

Qin Yuan saw the appearance of the two people, and understood that if they didn't show their 
hands, they would not let themselves go.

It just so happened that Fang Xinwu's house also had poker dice and the like, so the three of 
them started playing together.

Five minutes later, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang looked at Qin Yuan blankly, and gave Qin 
Yuan the last change in their hands.

In just five minutes, Qin Yuan had already won all the money in them!

At this moment, the two of them were completely speechless.

After that, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang went directly to the casino in the city with Qin 
Yuan'er. After all, this is the Silver Triangle. Casinos and other places are almost as common 
as roadside shops.

What Qin Yuan wants to do today is to win back the money, and he set a goal for himself, at 
least to make 50 million!

When they arrived at the casino, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang looked at the beaming crowd, 
but they looked at Qin Yuan a little worried. Although they knew that Qin Yuan was better, 
they were still a little scared.

If this is to compensate for the 1 million, how can they explain to it?



Qin Yuan also changed his outfit at this time, dressed meticulously, he didn't look like a rich 
young master, while Fang Xin and Wu Gaogang were just like a servant by his side.

"Hey, Qin Yuan, otherwise we will go back and think of a way. If we lose all and make a 
name for embezzling public funds, then we will have a big joke!"

At this time Gao Gang still felt that this method would not work, but Qin Yuan smiled and 
said to Gao Gang:

"Please, don't worry about it. I still have one million. If I really lose, I can't pay it personally. 
Don't worry!"

"That's, naturally, be so nervous all the time, be careful to be seen through your identity!"

Fang Xinwu also put on a moustache at this time. All three of them were dressed in disguise, 
and then changed some chips.

After that, Qin Yuan placed bets on the table at will, not much each time, but winning a lot!

Moreover, Qin Yuan is absolutely not in love with battle, as long as he wins money, he will 
leave soon, and will not give anyone any opportunity.

After all, they are not only to win money this time, but more importantly, not to expose 
themselves. If this is to let the Nuojia people know that their money is won from the casino, 
wouldn't it be revealing?

But even so, Qin Yuan was caught in a large casino!

"Leopard! Go!"

"This gentleman won!"

Qin Yuan looked at the chips on the table, took it and left.



He has now won more than 20 million. This is the 38th casino where he is located. 

The scale of this casino is not small, and the decoration is also good, a bit of Xiangjiang 
Casino.

Seeing that Qin Yuan had won again, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang both laughed.

At the beginning they were extremely excited, but now that Qin Yuan has won so much, they 
are already numb, just happy for them to get closer to the goal.

But when Qin Yuan wanted to take the money and leave, several people directly surrounded 
Qin Yuan:

"Sir, our boss is going to see you, I don't know if you can follow us!"

Hearing this, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang's hearts squatted. The thing they worry about the 
most has happened!

Fang Xinwu squeezed directly to Qin Yuan's side. When he was always ready to violently 
break through the encirclement, Qin Yuan smiled and comforted Xinwu and Gao Gang, and 
then said to these people:

"Okay, I'll follow you."

Chapter 229: 1 bet!

　　 Seeing this situation, Fang Xinwu hurriedly stood in front of a few people, and then 
sneered at these thugs and said:

　　 "Brothers, I'm sorry, and give me a face. We will hand over all the money we won from 
here. Let's go back empty-handed. You just assume that we have never been.

　　 After hearing this, Qin Yuan was unwilling, and Fang Xinwu quickly turned his head 
and whispered to Qin Yuan:



　　 "You can't go. If they don't admit it, they will definitely fight."

　　 But Qin Yuan smiled slightly and didn't say anything, because he already knew that no 
matter what they did, these people in front of him would not let them go easily.

　　 As expected by Qin Yuan, Fang Xinwu hadn't finished speaking, and a thug sneered and 
said in an unpleasant native language:

"To give you face, how old are you? What do you think we are? We are a serious casino 
here. Can we do such a thing? If you want to go, it's not impossible, but you have to take you 
anyway. Take out the money from him to give my brother some filial piety."

Hearing this, Fang Xinwu's face also turned gloomy. Tonight they brought a lot of cash. 
Obviously these guys were staring at this point, so they came to contain them, but it was 
their hard work. The results of the evening will of course not be handed over to the other 
party easily.

　　 Just as Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang were thinking about whether to directly break out, 
knock these people down, and rush out, Qin Yuan gently patted the shoulders of the two 
people, and then said to the leading thug:

　　 "I'm sorry, this big brother, my two little brothers don't know the rules, didn't you say 
that your boss wants to see me? Walk around, let's go."

　　 After saying this, Qin Yuan gave Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang a wink, and Fang Xinwu 
and Gao Gang could only sink their hearts and slowly followed behind Qin Yuan.

　　 In fact, Qin Yuan has not experienced such an encounter before. When he was in 
Xiangjiang, people came to make such ideas from time to time.

These people's routines are very easy to guess. Most of them are courtesy first and then 
soldiers. If they are reasonable, they will send someone to gamble with Qin Yuan. If they 
win, they will let Qin Yuan go. If they lose, they will only let Qin Yuan win. All the money 
that came in was handed over.



　　 Of course, there are also unethical people who want to kill Qin Yuan directly or put Qin 
Yuan under house arrest.

　　 But Qin Yuan all walked out step by step, didn't he earn money in the end?

　　 At that time, Qin Yuan, who had only a few skills, could come out of the Xiangjiang 
Casino all in his shadow. Now that he has so many skills, Qin Yuan is still afraid of these 
silver triangle drug dealers?

　　 "It's okay, let's follow along together."

　　 Gao Gang said to Fang Xinwu, and at this moment, seeing that Qin Yuan had already 
discussed it, this thug also sneered:

"Come with me!"

After 　　, the three Qin Yuan followed this man into a small door, and this door completely 
isolated the noisy noise of the gaming table outside, and turned it into a kind of screaming.

　　 Hearing this voice, Qin Yuan's eyes changed slightly, and a smile appeared at the corner 
of his mouth.

　　 The thug also heard this voice, and turned his head to show a sullen smile at Qin Yuan 
and others:

　　 "These are all people who were caught in our casino. You don't have to be afraid."

　　 Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang both stared at the thugs coldly, not knowing what they were 
thinking.

After leaving for a while, this thug took Qin Yuan and the three into a room, but this room 
was decorated very gorgeously and brightly. There was a big gaming table in the middle, and 
a boss chair was placed opposite the gaming table. , The boss chair is facing them now, but 
there are obviously people sitting on it.



　　 "Boss, I brought people!"

　　 At this time, the thug was very respectful and said, and the person sitting in the boss 
chair also trembled at this time, as if he was nodding his head, indicating that he already 
knew!

　　Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang are constantly looking around at this time. They naturally 
understand what the situation is now. The most urgent thing is to find a way to escape safely.

　　 But Qin Yuan raised the corner of his mouth and said directly to this person.

　　 "What? The guest is here, you are the host, don't you please?"

　　 As expected, after hearing what Qin Yuan said, the person in the boss chair turned 
around and said to Qin Yuan:

　　 "Let's talk about it, how did you get out of here!"

　　 But when they saw this person, Qin Yuan and the three were all surprised.

　　Because of this person, she is a very beautiful woman!

　　 This woman is just wearing a simple red camisole, with most of her **** exposed 
outside, and these places are all tattooed with angry arhats, with a wild beauty!

　　 Of course, this is not the reason why Qin Yuan and the others are surprised, because the 
person in front of them has a more important identity, that is, Garuda, the third poisonous 
rice in the Silver Triangle!

　　The legendary Garuda is a giant bird in the mythology of the Three Kingdoms. It has a 
human body with a bird head and hands as wings. It is one of the eight heavenly dragons, the 
eating dragon.



All in all, it is a very cruel creature and this woman dared to call this name, and she can also 
become the third most powerful drug dealer in places like the Silver Triangle. I have to say, 
this woman, absolutely Will not be a simple woman.

　　 But Qin Yuan quickly reacted and said with a smile:

"Hey, Garuda, what you said is a bit unreasonable. If you have something like a thousand-
year-old, as long as you are caught, you are considered a thousand-year-old. You didn't catch 
me at all, but you said I was a thousand-year-old. Do you put the darts on first, and then 
draw circles?"

　　 And Jialou Luo heard that Qin Yuan knew him, not surprised, just smiled softly and 
said to Qin Yuan:

“I’ve noticed you from the very beginning. You made a total of 14 bets in our casino. You 
won 8 times and you lost twice. There were four times you didn’t lose or you won. You won 
8 times. Unexpectedly outrageous, but the two losses are not painful, not to mention the 4 
times that did not win or lose. Obviously it was our casino's tricks, but you all escaped and 
said you It's not a thousand!"

　　 Hearing this, Qin Yuan was speechless for a while. Is this woman too unreasonable? 
Because they went out of thousands and escaped by Qin Yuan, they decided that Qin Yuan 
came out of thousands. What kind of **** is this!

　　 "Hey, you are a casino player. Is it okay to say so upright?"

　　 "So what? Just like you said just now, you will be called a thousand if you are caught, 
and a thousand will not be called if you are not caught!".

　　 After finishing these words, Jialou Luo looked at Qin Yuan with an extremely 
dangerous look, and said to Qin Yuan:

　　 "Dare you gamble with me?"

Chapter 230: Just one point!



　　 After hearing this, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang became nervous. The other party 
obviously used a thousand means. If Qin Yuan gambled against them, wouldn’t it be more 
fortunate?

　　 However, Qin Yuan did not even consider it, and directly agreed:

　　 "Okay, what shall we bet on? Let's say in advance. If the bet is not enough, then I am 
not willing to bet with you."

"Hey!"

Fang Xinwugang wanted to stop, but Gao Gang stopped Fang Xinwu. It was obvious that 
Qin Yuan knew what he was doing. Gao Gang just took a look and found that the defense 
here is very tight, and the waists of these thugs are bulging. , Obviously they are all carrying 
guys, and it is not easy to rush out directly.

　　 If they really fall out and start their hands, they are not sure they can get out of their 
bodies.

　　 Seeing that Qin Yuan didn’t hesitate at all, Garuda was also a little surprised. He walked 
directly in front of Qin Yuan and looked at Qin Yuan with a provocative look:

　　 "How about a 100 million bet? Of course, if you lose, then you not only have to hand 
over the money, but I have to use your hands. Twenty years, how about it? My request is not 
too much."

　　 Obviously, Garuda was also a little curious about Qin Yuan's gambling skills and 
wanted to earn Qin Yuan directly under his command.

　　 Seeing such a situation, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang both breathed a sigh of relief. If 
Jialou Luo wanted to regain Qin Yuan, he would not do it directly. As long as the matter was 
over, the matter would be much easier to handle.

　　 But when Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang were happy, Garuda said directly:



　　 "Of course, in order to let you stay with me, you need to kill your two little brothers 
directly, how about?"

　　 Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang heard these words, and they were all mmp.

　　 You two gods fight together, so what about the two of us?

　　 But Qin Yuan smiled and said to Garuda:

　　 "Okay, but how do you gamble?"

　　 "How about playing dice?"

　　 Jialou Luo directly grabbed the dice on the table and put it directly into the dice cup.

　　 And Qin Yuan also showed a smile at the corner of his mouth. Playing dice with him is 
simply looking for death.

　　 But Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang were a little nervous, and said to Qin Yuan

　　 "Qin Yuan, can't it, dice is too easy to cheat!"

　　 "It's okay, look at me."

　　 Qin Yuan smiled confidently, then said to Garuda:

　　 "Okay! How to bet?"

　　 "Since I have chosen the equipment, let you choose how to bet."

　　 Jialou Luo said calmly, as if she had already won.



　　 And Qin Yuan also smiled, looked at Garuda and said:

　　 "That line, let's guess the points. Guess the opponent's points!"

"it is good."

　　 Jia Lou Luo was also full of disdain, and then the two people sat on both sides and 
began to compete.

　　 While Fang Xinwu was extremely worried, he said directly:

　　 "This won't work. Before the gambling starts, we have to check the gambling 
equipment of both sides, or what if someone makes a fraud?"

　　 When he heard this, Garuda's face remained unchanged, but the faces of the 
surrounding thugs became a little gloomy.

　　 Seeing this, Fang Xinwu made sure that there is something tricky in this gambling tool!

　　 What is the point of playing this inevitable game?

　　 And just when Fang Xinwu was wondering if he was going to explode directly, his 
hands had touched the belt around his waist, a big hand was placed on Fang Xinwu's 
shoulder:

　　 "No, I think Garuda is so beautiful, he is not a deceitful person. Let's start directly."

　　 Of course Qin Yuan knew that Jialouluo would be deceiving, but Qin Yuan didn't care.

　　 At least people are still willing to maintain the balance on the surface, without directly 
doing it, this is already very good!



　　 "Okay! Refreshing! Let's just start, I have to say, you are a smart person, I love to deal 
with smart people, and now, I want you to stay by my side even more."

　　 Jialou Luoman glanced at Qin Yuan greedily, stretched out his long tongue, and gently 
licked his lips, appearing extremely seductive.

It’s just that after Qin Yuan took a look, he couldn’t help but complain. It’s just you, 
obviously not enough. If you really leave me here, believe it or not, several tigresses will 
come and kill you in a few days. I'll give you all of his nests!

　　 Qin Yuan believed that those women could really do such a thing, and in the face of the 
anger of those tigresses, Garuda was obviously not enough.

　　 "Come on, don't talk nonsense, let's just start with the two of us."

　　 Saying this, Qin Yuan picked up the dice cup on the table and started to shake it!

　　 And Garuda smiled directly, and like Qin Yuan, he shook the dice cup.

　　 Soon the two of them snapped, and directly smashed the dice cup on the table, and then 
Jialou Luo looked at Qin Yuan and said to Qin Yuan:

　　 "You are a guest from afar, since you are a guest, then you can guess first."

　　 Qin Yuan smiled directly when he heard this. Just now, Garuda deliberately made some 
noise on the side to affect Qin Yuan's hearing, but Qin Yuan has cosmic dice skills, and of 
course he will not be confused by the other party.

　　 "1 o'clock, right?"

Hearing this, Garuda's face changed a little, but he picked up his dice cup very neatly. As 
expected, he saw the 6 dice neatly stacked in a row, and the top one The point is exactly 1 
point!



　　 "Hey, I won!"

　　 At this time, Fang Xinwu and Gao Gang are both in their hearts Although they know 
that this game is not fair, they are also afraid that Qin Yuan will really lose.

At this time, Jialouluo looked at Qin Yuan's eyes a little bit wrong, she thought that Qin Yuan 
was just a person who relied on a thousand talents to be invincible, who would have thought 
that Qin Yuan's listening position could be so powerful, this is enough It proved that Qin 
Yuan still had some ability.

　　 Qin Yuan looked at Garuda, showing a smile, and said to Garuda:

　　 "It's your turn now, guess what time I have?"

　　 Jia Lou Luo heard Qin Yuan's words, smiled confidently on his face, and said to Qin 
Yuan:

　　 "You have 123456, a total of 21 o'clock!"

　　 Jia Lou Luo was extremely proud. Although her listening ability was not as strong as 
Qin Yuan's, she couldn't help but have black technology.

She installed a special electronic component in Qin Yuan’s dice, which was able to feel the 
electronic frequency of each face, so now in Jialouluo’s view, the dice in Qin Yuan’s hand is 
as if there is no cover. Isn't it easy for her?

　　 But Qin Yuan smiled slightly, opened the dice cup in his hand, and said to Garuda:

　　 "Sorry, you lost."

　　 Everyone took a closer look and found that the dice in Qin Yuan's hand was not 123456, 
but 223456! A total of 22 points! !

"This is impossible!"



　　 Jia Lou Luo's face changed. Just now she clearly saw that the dice in Qin Yuan's hand 
was 21 o'clock. Why is it wrong to open it now? More importantly, it was only a little too 
close.
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