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Chapter 371: Gentle power

After killing two people at this time, Ye Cunxin was relieved and said to Shen Lanni:

"Are you OK?"

A blood stain appeared on Shen Lanni's face. Obviously, if her speed had been slower just now, 
there would be a big problem.

"It's okay, this man's marksmanship is too inaccurate. The first shot was shot crooked. Fortunately, I 
slowed it down a bit, otherwise it would be the end!"

Shen Lanni was also a little afraid, and a layer of cold sweat broke out on her forehead.

"Okay, let's go to the monitoring room and watch out for someone inside."

At this moment, Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni cautiously walked towards the door of the monitoring 
room, and at this moment, the door of the monitoring room suddenly opened, and a round object 
was thrown out!

This is exactly a grenade!

But Ye Cunxin's eyes were quick, and the pistol in his hand was instantly excited, and he hit the 
man's arm with a single shot. This grenade instantly fell to the door, and Shen Lanni rushed towards 
Ye Cunxin!

boom!

With a muffled sound, the grenade exploded instantly, directly exploding the person who threw the 
grenade at the door into blood!

Ye Cunxin also coughed, struggling to turn over, only to find that Shen Lanni had a piece of 
shrapnel in her body!



"Shen Lanni! Are you okay!"

At this moment Ye Cunxin was full of tension, but Shen Lanni said helplessly:

"It's okay. It's stuck on the **** this time. You can help me see if it's stuck in a blood vessel. If not, 
just pull it out for me."

Ye Cunxin breathed a sigh of relief at this moment when she heard Shen Lanni's enraged words. 
Then she took a closer look and found that Shen Lanni had indeed hit a shrapnel, which was not 
big, but the wound was a bit deep.

"You endure it first, the wound is not big, it should be fine, and I will go to the manager's office to 
get the medicine box in a while before pulling it out!"

Ye Cunxin said to Shen Lanni in a deep voice, although she knew that the wound did not hurt her 
artery, Shen Lanni is now an effective combat force, and she must try to maintain her combat 
ability!

Shen Lanni was also relieved when she heard Ye Cunxin's words, which means that there is no big 
problem with her injury, so Shen Lanni said directly to Ye Cunxin.

"I'm okay, go and contact your superiors now!"

Ye Cunxin also nodded, only to find that the door of the monitoring room had been blown up. After 
a careful look inside, he found that apart from some computers, there was no other place to hide 
people, so he just left. When I came in, sure enough, after a while, I finally found a satellite phone.

"This satellite phone cannot be used here. I will find a place where the satellite phone can be used, 
and then contact it."

Satellite phones are easily intercepted by various magnetic fields or iron products, so they must be 
used in a relatively open place, but its wavelength is too special, so it will not be blocked by 
ordinary mobile phone signal jammers.

Ye Cunxin took a look and found that only the window was relatively empty, so she opened the 
window directly, leaned her whole body outside, and started calling.



After all, Ye Cunxin was in contact with Qin Yuan before, so now that she got her mobile phone, Ye 
Cunxin’s first reaction was to call Qin Yuan, but when she prayed in her heart, Qin Yuan quickly 
answered the phone. I heard a buzzing mobile phone vibrating from behind me!

Ye Cunxin's eyes suddenly became the staring boss, she turned her head suddenly, just wanting to 
shoot towards the top of the building, but Ye Cunxin hadn't shot yet, the pistol in her hand was 
grabbed by someone!

Ye Cunxin was immediately anxious, and just about to activate the pistol, he heard a voice:

"The enemy kills, you give me such a meeting ceremony?"

At this moment, Ye Cunxin was shocked when she heard this. He looked at this person carefully 
and found that a man was squatting on the roof like a big bird, with one hand still holding his hand. 
This pistol!

And this man, who is not Qin Yuan?

Seeing Qin Yuan at this time, Ye Cunxin's eyes suddenly brightened, and he said to Qin Yuan in 
surprise:

"Master! Why are you here? Why did you make no sound just now, come down quickly, Shen Lanni 
is injured, won't you be able to heal the injuries? Help Shen Lanni have a look quickly!"

Ye Cunxin is really excited now. After all, they finally got here, and now they finally see someone 
who can be counted on. How can they not be excited?

At this moment, Qin Yuan also turned over, hooked the window smoothly, turned in directly, looked 
at the three corpses in the corridor and the door, and gently patted Ye Cunxin's shoulder.

To be honest, although Ye Cunxin is well-trained, she is only a ten-year-old girl. Faced with such a 
thing for the first time, she was able to calm down and not collapse. This was enough for Qin Yuan. 
Look at it differently,



After all, when He Chenguang and others killed for the first time before, they also had a long time 
of discomfort, but these female soldiers did not have time to alleviate. They could only continue to 
participate in the battle. Sure enough, the ability of male and female soldiers to bear Not the same, 
the women's special forces are very necessary.

But at this moment, Ye Cunxin felt Qin Yuan’s concern, and his tears almost fell. After all, they 
were originally on vacation here with peace of mind, but who knew that such a thing happened 
suddenly and there were many hostages. Being killed, and their hearts are also extremely sad.

And Ye Cunxin also knew that it was not the time to cry, so she said directly to Qin Yuan: "You go 
and see Shen Lanni first."

Ye Cunxin knew that Shen Lanni was injured just to protect herself. If Shen Lanni really had any 
problems, she might not forget it in her life.

And Qin Yuan also showed a smile, and then walked out of the room directly, checked Shen Lanni’s 
wound, and found that it was just cutting off some muscles, not a big problem, so he directly helped 
Shen Lanni get the shrapnel Take it out, and then moxibustion with silver needles.

And Shen Lanni was extremely surprised when she saw Qin Yuan. She really didn't expect Qin 
Yuan to appear on this island, and what was even more unexpected was that Qin Yuan came out of 
this monitoring room.

But just when Shen Lanni wanted to ask Qin Yuan something, she found that Qin Yuan directly 
touched her **** with her hand. Just about to say something, she suddenly felt a sharp pain in her 
ass. Shen Lanni took a deep breath, didn't say anything, just felt a gentle force.

Looking back, he found that Qin Yuan was giving her a needle.

Chapter 372: Isn't this a nonsense

Feeling the temperature of Qin Yuan's hands, Shen Lanni couldn't stop her face flushing, but she 
also knew that she would endure this numb, itchy and painful feeling when she was not in love with 
her children.

In just two minutes, Qin Yuan had already treated Shen Lanni. Shen Lanni stood up and found that 
the pain on her **** seemed to have disappeared, as if she had never been injured.



At this time, Qin Yuan looked at Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni with a smile on his face, gently hugged 
the two female soldiers, and then said to them:

"What you did is really great, it is beyond my expectation, oh yes, how about the others?"

At this time, Ye Cunxin said: "I was with Tian Guo and Ouyang Qian just now. We came to this 
monitoring room, and they went to find the rest of the people, but their vigilance is very high, I 
guess it should not What will be the problem."

At this time, Qin Yuan directly turned on the thermal imaging ability, looked at a group of six 
people who were at a distance from him, and nodded, understanding that these six people must be 
the remaining players.

Since none of them died yet, Qin Yuan was relieved a lot. Qin Yuan walked directly into the 
monitoring room, and then said to Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni:

"Well, since you are all okay, then I will give you the real task. You can assist me. We are going to 
fight back!"

Hearing Qin Yuan's words, both Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni's faces showed a hint of excitement, and 
they were finally able to stand behind Qin Yuan and fight side by side with Qin Yuan. This was 
what they dreamed of.

At this time, most of the monitoring in the monitoring room has been blown up, and the few 
remaining are constantly flashing snowflakes, and Qin Yuan didn't even look at the monitoring, and 
said directly to Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni:

"Now there are two tasks. The first is to meet up with the remaining team members and report the 
situation here to see what assistance can be given to us outside.

Second, try to make some noise as much as possible. I have already investigated. Now there are 60 
enemies in total, and we have eliminated 20, so there are still 40 people on the opposite side. It’s 
just starting now. The opponent must not You will be allowed to make noise, and a clean-up team 
will inevitably be sent to suppress you."

On the other hand, I will find a way to go directly into the hall where the hostages are held, and see 
if there is any way to rescue the people."



Qin Yuan said in a deep voice at this time, and Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni couldn't help nodding, 
because they understood that the key to this mission was not whether they could escape, but 
whether they could protect the hostages.

After all, once the criminals begin to kill the hostages, then the unarmed people are likely to suffer 
heavy casualties.

Seeing that Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni were full of fighting spirit, Qin Yuan also showed a satisfied 
smile and said directly to the two of them:

"I have prepared a map for you. We are now in area c. Next, you are going to meet with Tan Xiaolin 
and others. Then in this bathroom, I have prepared enough equipment for you, and then pick up 
When you come down, you just want to make a big enough noise and slowly move towards the 
central hall."

When Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni heard this, they were a little at a loss. Didn't this hotel have been 
occupied by those people? How could they hear what Qin Yuan said, as if this hotel was prepared 
by Qin Yuan?

However, the two also knew that it was not the time to ask this, but Ye Cunxin asked:

"But there are hostages on the opposite hand. What if they threaten us with hostages?"

"That's right, I saw a lot of people hiding in various places just now. If these people are also caught, 
we won't be able to save each other."

When Qin Yuan heard this, he gently touched the shoulders of the two people, and then said to 
them:

"It depends on your circumstances. There will be many actions we take to save the hostages. Maybe 
every time we face these people, they will have hostages in their hands. Is it because of the hostages 
that we don't act? This is the first real test I have given you, and it depends on whether you can 
survive it!"



As for the appearance of Qin Yuan, Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni's heart sank. They thought that they 
would be able to sit back and relax with Qin Yuan, but now it seems that Qin Yuan also wants to use 
this thing to hone it. they!

Shen Lanni wanted to say something, but Ye Cunxin agreed in a deep voice:

"Okay, we get it."

Hearing this, Qin Yuan smiled with satisfaction, and then made a start gesture to the two people, 
and then he and Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni separated directly and slowly moved towards the central 
hall.

Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni were also full of heavy heart and began to look for their other 
teammates. They moved towards the edge of Zone C according to Qin Yuan's instructions, but they 
were extremely surprised to find that although they saw some blood on the ground, But the body 
cannot be seen.

Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni were even more surprised. After reaching the edge, Ye Cunxin suddenly 
heard a rustling sound in front of him, and suddenly became vigilant, but suddenly, she heard a bird 
cry. , I was relieved immediately, and directly whispered:

"pistachio?"

"it's me!"

Sure enough, Tian Guo and the others were on the opposite side. Ye Cunxin and Shen Lanni also 
had a hint of joy, and then they hurried into a room.

In this room, it was Tan Xiaolin and others who saw that their teammates were safe and sound, and 
all of them were extremely excited.

But soon, Ye Cunxin calmed down, and then told Tan Xiaolin and He Lu all the plans Qin Yuan had 
told her.

"Oh? You mean, he made us make enough noise?"



"Yes' also said, if the place takes hostages, let us deal with it ourselves."

Ye Cunxin replied, and Tan Xiaolin and He Lu looked at each other, and their faces became a little 
ugly.

The two of them are the highest-ranking people. Without a captain, they will automatically occupy 
the leadership position.

And leaders not only have enough power, but also have to take responsibility. If the hostages suffer 
casualties, let alone responsibility, I am afraid that their psychological self-blame is enough for 
them to drink a pot.

"Forget it, this is the task given to us above, by the way, what about Qin Yuan?"

"He said he was going to the center hall..."

Shen Lanni whispered.

"what?"

Tan Xiaolin's face changed suddenly:

"Isn't this a nonsense, even if he is powerful, but what use can a person do?"

Chapter 373: Zhazhong

Tan Xiaolin knows Qin Yuan’s identity. It’s not good to say that even if their Fire Phoenix squad is 
wiped out, it’s not as important as Qin Yuan’s safety alone. If Qin Yuan is broken because of this 
incident, it’s for the military. Say, but a major loss!

But seeing Tan Xiaolin's angry look, Ye Cunxin said cautiously:

"He also said that weapons have been prepared for us, let us be careful."

arms?



After hearing this, Tan Xiaolin asked a little strangely:

"Prepare weapons for us? By the way, how many enemies did we kill? We killed 4 in total, so 
everyone has some weapons. What about you?"

"We killed two at the beginning, and we also killed two at the door of the monitoring room, also 
four."

Shen Lanni said directly, counting in this way, there are a total of eight people, and the weapons of 
eight people are enough to equip them, but there is a problem with ammunition.

"Actually, this is enough, what Qin Yuan said about preparing weapons for us?"

"Just look at it and you'll find out!"

He Lu whispered, and when everyone heard this, they also nodded, and then slowly walked out of 
the room.

Soon, they arrived at the place designated by Qin Yuan and opened the door carefully, but the sight 
in front of them completely shocked them!

I saw that the room was not full of weapons, all kinds of rifles, pistols, body armor, and even some 
strange-shaped grenades!

Even Qin Yuan used very ugly words to remind:

"The grenade is powerful, use it carefully."

"This……"

At this time, Tan Xiaolin was completely dumbfounded. Looking at such weapons and ammunition, 
she knew that she was too ignorant!



With so many weapons, let alone make a fuss, they can even counterattack back if there is no 
hostage in the other's hands!

"There are eleven pistols in it, that is to say, Qin Yuan killed at least eleven people just now."

He Lu said in a deep voice, while the members of the Phoenix Team were silent.

They had already fought with these people. Naturally, they knew that these people were not weak. It 
took them a lot of effort to kill them all by surprise.

But now looking at these weapons in front of them, there was a heartfelt shock in their hearts.

The ammunition for these weapons is still there, which means that Qin Yuan didn't have to spend 
much effort at all to kill all these people!

It was as if I had already seen how Qin Yuan downplayed and killed all these people.

"Is this guy still a human..."

Tian Guo whispered at this time, but this was the voice of everyone. Originally, they thought that 
the gap between themselves and Qin Yuan might not be too big. Even if Qin Yuan is powerful, he 
can deal with these criminals at best. Can kill two or three, but now it seems that Qin Yuan's 
strength is beyond their imagination.

"This guy is not human, but we misunderstood it before!"

At this time, Tan Xiaolin understood why Qin Yuan was the treasure of their military area. It was 
not only Qin Yuan who could train, but because Qin Yuan himself was a sharp knife, so powerful!

"Okay, don’t talk about it, everyone, now get the equipment quickly, we are going to carry out the 
task that the instructor gave us! He Lu, contact your superiors, I will take people out to investigate 
first, and we will have a good fight. !"

At this time, Tan Xiaolin said, everyone in Shen Lanni agreed in unison and began to equip these 
weapons.



No one noticed that when they heard that Qin Yuan was here, all the confusion and hesitation in 
their hearts had disappeared!

Even if Qin Yuan was not by their side, their hearts were completely settled down.

With Qin Yuan, they even have the backbone!

This is the power of a senior leader.

...

In the hall, the wild dog had just finished the interrogation of Zhao Yunming, and when he wanted 
to rest with a relaxed face, he saw a man with a covered face coming over and said in 
embarrassment:

"Chief, the people we sent to Area C have lost contact now! There seems to be a group of people 
resisting."

When the wild dog heard this, he was very angry and cursed directly:

"Trash! Who is it? I won't be touched by those people. Remember, if they dare to do it, we will do it 
and kill everyone in the hall!"

"No... No, it doesn't seem to be an intrusion, but it was here. Do you remember the group of women 
we met before? It seems that they are these people!"

The tone of this subordinate was also full of helplessness, and the wild dog yelled:

"Go, go over and take a look, yes, the defense of the hall must not be slack, understand? Just set up 
the bomb, if the person on the opposite side dares to raid the hall, then everyone will die together!"

After saying this, the wild dog took the person directly towards the direction of the c area.



And watching the wild dog leave, a smile appeared under the mask under this masked man.

That's right, this person is exactly what Qin Yuan faked!

His first thought was that he wanted to find a chance to rush in and kill all these people directly, but 
afterwards Qin Yuan carefully recalled it, and then he thought, as if these people still had a bomb.

This bomb is a dirty bomb with great power and a large explosion range. If it is directly exploded, it 
will be dangerous within fifty miles of this area. Even for decades, the island of Lovers cannot be 
visited, causing losses. It is simply impossible to estimate.

Therefore, if Qin Yuan wants to do something, he must first find this bomb!

And this bomb, just put it aside!

At this time, Qin Yuan could faintly feel a tingling sensation in his body' This is Qin Yuan's spider 
induction reminding Qin Yuan that this thing is dangerous.

But Qin Yuan walked directly towards the bomb at this time and said to the person guarding the 
bomb:

"The chief said he wants to put this thing up."

"Okay, then you can help!"

At this time, the person guarding the bomb did not have any suspicions, and directly opened the 
luggage bag with the bomb, revealing a slightly crude bomb.

After opening this luggage bag, Qin Yuan felt that the tingling on his skin became stronger, 
knowing that it was indeed a genuine product.

"Thanks for your hard work, this thing is dangerous."



At this moment, Qin Yuan glanced at the few people next to him, then gently patted the shoulder of 
the person in front of him, and a small silver needle instantly pierced this person's body.

This silver needle was extremely small, and the person in front of him did not even feel that he had 
been pierced.

Chapter 374: burden

But this person did not notice anything, but complained to Qin Yuan:

"Isn't this all for organization? Get things quickly, and we will leave quickly. Although this thing is 
fake, I feel panicked by guarding it."

Hearing this, Qin Yuan glanced at the man with a slight pity. This thing was real, but listening to 
this man's statement, it seemed as if a wild dog told him that this thing was fake.

But there is no difference between the real and the fake, he is dying anyway.

Although Qin Yuan’s silver needle was small, the things on the silver needle were incredibly hot. It 
only took a few seconds. This guy felt his feet soft, his head fainted, and he was about to fall. 
However, Yuan gently resisted this person, preventing this person's body from falling directly.

"Rest in peace, you don't need to feel panicked."

Qin Yuan carefully controlled this person to squat down, looking as if he was untying a rope. It just 
so happened that this guy was huge in size, just enough to block the sight of those around him.

Seeing that no one else noticed this, Qin Yuan smiled satisfied, and then muttered in his heart:

"System, recycling!"

At this time, Qin Yuan directly put his hand on the bomb, and then, following Qin Yuan's voice, the 
bomb in front of him disappeared instantly!

"Ding Dong~ The system was successfully recovered, please start the selection!"



With the prompt sound of this system, three options suddenly appeared in front of Qin Yuan!

"1. Get world-class Muhai weapon research!!"

"2, get world-class Muhai physics theory!"

"3, get world-class Muhai weapon manufacturing!"

Looking at these three options at this time, Qin Yuan was completely stunned. He originally wanted 
to put the bomb up, but who would have thought that he would get a skill!

Qin Yuan knows that these three skills are extremely precious. After all, knowledge in this area is 
still relatively rare, but Qin Yuan knows that the current weapon power is sufficient, and it is not 
necessary to make the weapon bigger. In the war, then everyone will get the benefit.

But this knowledge is still very useful, for example, it is good to use it to generate electricity, so Qin 
Yuan directly chose the second item.

"The system I choose item 2."

"Ding Dong, the host chooses to succeed and obtain the world-class Muhai physics theory!"

At this moment, with the sound of the system, Qin Yuan suddenly had a lot of knowledge in his 
mind, and Qin Yuan took a look at it slowly, and found that there are some boring physical symbols 
in it, if Qin Yuan wants to Without some prior physics knowledge, it is even difficult to understand.

It seems that if you want to use these theories, you still need some basic physics.

Qin Yuan scratched his head when he saw this, but he just threw this thing behind his head. After 
all, under normal circumstances, he wouldn't use this knowledge.

When the grid is more abundant, then learn all this knowledge.



But when Qin Yuan was thinking about this, he suddenly heard a scream from the side hall, which 
immediately attracted Qin Yuan's attention.

At this time, Qin Yuan just remembered that there was a hapless scientist named Zhao Yunming in 
the side hall. The purpose of this group of people was to get the password of the information from 
this person's mouth.

And now seeing this situation, it seems that this guy hasn't recruited yet.

And Qin Yuan has a slight respect for Zhao Yunming. After all, a scientist can persist for so long, it 
is already very good.

However, if you want to save him, you need to solve some other hidden dangers.

At this moment, looking at the people around, Qin Yuan's eyes flashed with a glimmer of light.

Qin Yuan looked at the people in this hall and found that there were a total of 24 people in this hall. 
Qin Yuan had already killed one, and there were five in the side hall, while the wild dogs had taken 
10 away. This means that everyone is here.

Qin Yuan's heart was calculating frantically, and his hand slowly stretched out into his pocket, and 
Qin Yuan's pocket contained two playing cards.

These two poker cards were obtained by Qin Yuan when he came from Zone C just now, for this is 
the situation now!

At this time, a small boss looked like a person, and saw Qin Yuan's chirping here, the strong man 
beside Qin Yuan was still squatting on the ground, and suddenly said a little impatiently:

"What are you doing? Hurry up!"

As the little boss said, he walked over here, as if he wanted to help Qin Yuan and the others, but 
when he took a closer look, he found that the brawny man squatting on the ground was salivating 
and looked very serious. Something is wrong!



Even more frightening is that the bomb in the duffel bag has now disappeared!

The little boss’s eyes suddenly widened, and he just wanted to make a sound, but at this moment, he 
suddenly heard a buzzing noise, like ten thousand cicadas screaming together, the whole person was 
instantly Stuck in!

Then he saw that he had killed the possible **** in front of him with a single shot. This time the 
action was a great success, directly forcing these countries to recognize their status as an 
organization!

And the leader is also very happy, thinking that he has made great achievements, and even made 
himself the new leader!

Countless beauties are throwing arms towards themselves!

Countless food and wine were poured into my arms!

But he did not sink, he is an ideal person!

But just when he planned to take these people and continue to climb to the top, he suddenly felt a 
sore throat, and instantly he woke up!

He was still in that hall' the strange person just now stood still, but there was an extra poker card at 
his throat!

This poker card directly severed his throat, making it difficult for him to breathe. With a mouth, 
blood suddenly spilled out of his mouth.

He wanted to remind his teammates loudly, but at the moment he turned around, he heard the sound 
of falling around.

After hearing this, the little boss couldn't hold on, and fell straight down.

At the moment he fell, he saw from the outside of his eyes that all the companions around him were 
lying on the ground, falling in a pool of blood.



"The mission failed... it's all over..."

This was his last thought, and finally fell into eternal darkness.

At this time, Qin Yuan was also panting violently, feeling that his head was about to explode. Using 
the cicada technique and hypnotism to hypnotize more than 20 people at one time, this was a big 
burden for Qin Yuan.

Chapter 375: Tiaohulishan

At this moment, Qin Yuan felt that his temples were beating constantly, as if his brain was about to 
be squeezed out of the temples. Just now Qin Yuan used all his abilities to directly hypnotize these 
more than 20 criminals in an instant, and then He used his own poker skills to kill all of them.

These people didn't even hum, they were completely killed by Qin Yuan!

At this moment, those people who were lying on the ground heard the sound and raised their heads. 
Seeing such a scene, they wanted to scream, but at this moment, Qin Yuan suddenly turned towards 
this person. Staring over, this person was shocked instantly and covered his mouth.

After all, they also know that once they make any noise, these people in front of them may shoot!

And Qin Yuan looked at these people with helplessness, and then made a sound in his mouth:

"You are now in the middle of a sea, sinking, sinking, you are already very tired and need to rest..."

When these people heard this voice, they looked at Qin Yuan in an instant, and then they felt that 
their bodies were indeed very exhausted and fell asleep directly.

Looking at the hostages who had calmed down, Qin Yuan was also relieved. These people didn't 
take much effort. After all, these people have not been systematically trained. At this time, they are 
also in a very excited mood. It is a good time for hypnosis. .

And the more than 20 criminals just now are different. They are all persevering in their hearts, and 
all of them are proficient in anti-hypnosis training, so Qin Yuan directly blasted his mental power 
over, leaving these people in their minds. Blank, too late to make any resistance.



It's just that Qin Yuan also understands that the task has not yet been completed, he directly stood 
up from the ground and headed towards the side hall.

At this time, the people in the side hall still didn't know what happened outside, and they still said to 
Zhao Yunming:

"Zhao Yunming, you have also heard it. If you don't say anything, I will cut off your third finger 
too!"

At this time, Zhao Yunming's eyes were about to kick open, as the so-called ten fingers connected to 
the heart, one by one cut off his own fingers, such pain, ordinary people simply cannot imagine!

Zhao Yunming didn't know what perseverance he needed to persist in not speaking.

But thinking about the information he had researched, if these people get it, then thousands of 
people will die. He immediately gritted his teeth and said something out of his teeth:

"I don't know, just kill me directly."

And this man with a beard and codenamed Sea Lion, seeing Zhao Yunming's answer, also showed 
an expression of admiration towards Zhao Yunming.

But no matter what, the task is still to be done, so he tried **** his hand and immediately wanted to 
cut off Zhao Yunming's third finger!

But at this moment, another person yelled at the door:

"What's the matter? What are you doing in here?"

At this time, the sea lion heard this, turned his head, and found that a person was staggering, slowly 
walking towards it.

Seeing this person, the sea lion frowned. Isn't this person the one who reminded the leader that Area 
C was occupied?



Shouldn't he go to the c area with the leader to clean up? Why are you back now? How long has just 
passed?

"Why are you here, boss?"

The sea lion saw something wrong with this person, so he walked over directly, but as soon as he 
arrived in front of this person, he saw a dagger in this person's hand and suddenly wiped it towards 
his throat!

At this moment, the sea lion was shocked, and immediately wanted to avoid it, but the man who had 
been slow to make his shot was extremely fierce. This blow was simply impossible to hide!

Barra!

The sea lion’s neck was cut open in an instant, blood gushing out, the sea lion covered his neck, 
looking at the person in front of him, his eyes widened:

"you are not……"

"Yes, you are right!"

Qin Yuan impatiently pushed this guy aside, and then raised his hand with a shot, directly killing the 
guy behind!

Then Qin Yuan directly sat in front of Zhao Yunming and said to Zhao Yunming:

"Zhao Yunming?"

At this moment, Zhao Yunming saw Qin Yuan's movements and froze his whole person. Hearing 
Qin Yuan's questioning, he said in a daze:

"Yes, I am……"



"Oh, that's good. You are saved. I will kill you now. Your finger hasn't been broken for a long time. 
You should be able to connect it."

After saying this, Qin Yuan directly took out the silver needle and stuck it in Zhao Yunming's hand!

"I!"

Before Zhao Yunming had time to speak, he felt an unprecedented pain and passed out again!

Qin Yuan looked at Zhao Yunming, who had passed out, and raised his eyebrows. Whether he 
passed out, he was anesthetized.

But what Qin Yuan didn't know was that because of this shot, the people outside were fried!

And Director Mao of the command headquarters outside heard the shot, and his heart was tense:

"What's wrong, did the other party start killing hostages? No, we can't wait any longer and prepare 
to attack!"

"No, Director, our people are not yet in place. If we can't kill all of them at once, the hostages will 
suffer even more damage!"

Zhao Cheng, who was on the side at this time, said, and Director Mao was anxious, knowing that 
there was no time. Once the opponent started killing the hostages, this meant that the opponent had 
lost patience!

"Hurry up, ' sends our experts to negotiate with the other party to see what the other party wants, 
and to further strengthen the information blockade, we must not let the other party send out any 
information. I doubt Zhao Yun Ming has now confessed!"

At this time, Fan Tianlei also said directly:

"I took a look at the terrain, and there was a cliff behind, which happened to be a blind spot for the 
other party to monitor. We might be able to climb up from this cliff!"



"Anyway, we must start to act!"

At this time, Hong Feng also said something, and then rushed out!

And when the people in the headquarters outside were distraught, the wild dog who had just arrived 
in area c heard a burst of gunfire from the direction of the hall, and it was shocked. The wild dog is 
also a smart person. After understanding it, he opened his eyes wide and yelled:

"No, I was fooled, this is to tune the tiger away from the mountain!"

After saying this, the wild dog immediately took his men and swiftly headed towards the hall!

Chapter 376: 1 die!

But the closer he got to the hall, the more panicked the wild dog's heart was, because he heard the 
silence in the hall at this time, without any sound at all.

This is simply impossible, no matter if the gunshot was an attack by someone from outside or 
someone under him killed the hostage, it would not be like this!

How could there be no sound at all, how could those hostages just lie on the ground honestly?

So when the wild dog arrived in the hall, he didn't dare to go directly in. Instead, he hid in the 
corridor outside the hall and made a gesture to the opposing subordinate, indicating that the other 
party rushed in first and probed the situation!

And this subordinate nodded suddenly, and was about to rush into the hall immediately!

But the wild dog saw his subordinates, before he had time to act, he suddenly heard a whistling 
flashing in his ears!

Crackling!

At this time, the sound of various things breaking directly sounded, and a burst of fragments 
splashed directly toward the black cat's face!



The wild dog quickly covered his eyes, but before he could make any response, he heard a muffled 
snort from his subordinates and fell straight down!

At this time, the wild dog opened his eyes in horror, but found that a big hole had been directly 
blasted open in the opposite corridor. The few of his own men seemed to have been hit by a 
cannonball, and a big hole appeared in their chest. !

These nine people lost their combat effectiveness at the same time!

At this moment, there was a sound of footsteps in the hall, and a person slowly walked over here.

At this time, Qin Yuan threw a dragon pecking cone, looked at the black cat in front of him, and 
said lightly:

"Your luck is pretty good."

The black cat looked at the man lying in a pool of blood in front of him, his eyes filled with 
disbelief, staring at Qin Yuan and said:

"You... who are you?"

"Who? The one who wants your life, I am puzzled. You and Black Cat are not in the same 
organization? Didn't he tell you not to do things within Yan Nation's sphere of influence? We are not 
China Move, it’s not the Philippines. If you can’t beat people from a beautiful country, can you beat 
us?”

At this moment, Qin Yuan looked at the wild dog in front of him and said lightly.

"Hmph, what do you know, people like you who live in a safe area can understand what the world is 
like? Do you know that my family was shot by a drone, so I will retaliate! Revenge you, revenge 
the world, revenge everyone!"

The wild dog also knew that the situation was over, and screamed in anger. Although he knew that 
he was not Qin Yuan's opponent, he still raised the gun and pulled the trigger directly at Qin Yuan!



But Qin Yuan's hand flashed, and the wild dog's fingers that grabbed the gun suddenly broke, and 
the gun in his hand fell to the ground instantly.

The wild dog looked at his hand in disbelief and felt the pain in his heart, and suddenly he couldn't 
restrain himself and screamed frantically!

But looking at the wild dog's extremely embarrassed look, Qin Yuan said indifferently:

"I don't object to your revenge, but you are wronged, you are indebted, whoever hits you, you 
should go to whomever you are, like a mad dog, you will bite when you see people, that's what it is, 
that is not our no one Machine, it's not that we killed your family, if you are really good, go directly 
to the beautiful country.

You’ve never heard of it. You had a fierce guy before. He drove a plane and ran into someone’s 
building. He scared those people out. After all, this is to let those people know that it hurts. That’s 
the real ability. And like you, just take some ordinary people to exhale, that is asshole, useless 
waste! "

Seeing the merciless ridicule in Qin Yuan's eyes at this time, the wild dog was completely stunned. 
What's the matter, why is this guy in front of him even more angry than himself?

Who is the criminal?

When the wild dog heard such words, he also quibbled at Qin Yuan:

"Aren't we not having enough weapons? When we get the weapons from your hands, we will 
naturally retaliate."

"Nonsense, take revenge, believe it or not? With this weapon, wouldn’t it be better for you to sell 
for money? Don’t think I don’t know what you guys are thinking. I’ll tell you this. We have played 
more than you, do you know how many years of history we have? All of your set is left over from 
our play!

Qin Yuan said to the wild dog with disdain:



"A person like you, unfortunately, will only stretch his fist to the weaker people. There is no faith in 
his heart, no persistence at all, and he is worthy of revenge? Shit, if you are beaten to death, look. 
When you are so spineless, I would rather jump off the building and die again!"

At this time, the wild dog was scolded by Qin Yuan. What is more important is that what Qin Yuan 
said is true. The wild dog himself understands that although their organization has done such a 
thing, you Let them really target those people, they really don't have the guts!

After all, the lesson from the past is here, and the man who drove the plane and hit the building has 
been killed!

But if you face the Yan Nation, it is much easier. As long as you leave the border, there is always a 
place to hide, so that one day a missile will fall directly from your head, and your face will bloom!

At this time, the wild dog's complexion was flushed, but the more so, the less he knew how to refute 
it!

The wild dog also knows that although he intends to directly attack the beautiful country after 
obtaining the weapon, but if the thing is really done, relying on the people in the organization, he 
will definitely not agree to do it!

So the reason why I did everything was in vain!

The person in front of me was right. I really didn't have the courage, I was really running away!

But things have reached this point' The wild dog has no chance to regret, he looked at Qin Yuan in 
front of him, put his hand in his pocket directly, and said to Qin Yuan:

"I know what you said is right, and I also admit that I am indeed running away, but so many people 
die, there must always be a result, since I came this time to increase the reputation of our 
organization, then I Will do this to the end."

At this time, the wild dog's eyes were full of madness. His family was dead, so his heart was also 
dead, causing the whole person to become a little nervous.



And when he came to perform this task, he was already prepared to die here, and now Qin Yuan has 
pierced his last dream, and it can be regarded as the last trace of his survival.

At this time, the wild dog looked at Qin Yuan and showed a sad smile:

"Do you know that I still have a hole card this time, which is a super bomb, but now you know it's 
too late, die with me."

The wild dog was laughing frantically at this time, and then the hand hidden in his pocket suddenly 
pressed a button.

Chapter 377: long time no see

After pressing this button, the wild dog lay directly on the floor, waiting for the final moment to 
come.

It's just that he saw Qin Yuan's mocking eyes.

After a while, the explosion that the wild dog was waiting for did not sound!

Then the wild dog completely collapsed, and suddenly jumped up from the ground, looking at the 
direction of the hall, and found that all the hostages in the hall were lying on the ground, not 
moving at all!

But that bomb has disappeared. What's the matter?

Where is my bomb? Where did I put such a big bomb?

Qin Yuan looked at the wild dog like an idiot, and then said to the wild dog:

"Fortunately, you said that you have undergone formal training. Don't you know that when we 
perform tasks, we will negotiate with others after we have eliminated all threats?"

"Impossible! That is a dirty..."



It's a pity that the wild dog hadn't finished speaking, and Qin Yuan shot directly, and instantly hit the 
wild dog's eyebrows!

The wild dog's eyes were wide and staring.

At this time, Qin Yuan also heard a voice in his mind:

"Ding Dong, congratulations to the host for completing the task, defending the island of Valentine, 
and protecting more than 80% of the hostages, rewarding three grids!"

Hearing this voice, Qin Yuan showed a smile even more at the corner of his mouth. Looking at the 
wild dog lying in a pool of blood, Qin Yuan spat at the guy with disdain, and then left directly.

At this time, they heard the gunshots, and the people from the Fire Phoenix squad who rushed over 
saw the wild dogs that had fallen on the ground and the criminals who had been killed. They were 
all shocked!

Ye Cunxin said to Tan Xiaolin:

"My mother, this... is this all done by the master? This... this can be done by himself, so what do we 
need to do?"

"Oh my God, are we so far from the top masters?"

At this time, Shen Lanni couldn't stop her tongue.

They have also fought against these people, knowing that these people are stubborn, even if it is to 
deal with one, it takes a lot of effort, but Qin Yuan alone killed all these dozens of people!

This... really shocked them from the heart!

And Tan Xiaolin looked at these people on the ground and swallowed, but she still pressed her 
mind, and then said to everyone:



"Okay, we know that there is a gap with Qin Yuan, and we can just try to catch up. Although we 
may not be able to catch up, but what the instructor said, there will be further surprises! So, don't be 
discouraged!"

Hearing these words at this time, all the female soldiers could be regarded as calm down.

The instructor was right. No matter how great Qin Yuan is, there is only one person. He will not be 
a clone. There will always be things they can do. They can't. Let Qin Yuan do everything alone!

Since Qin Yuan is the sharpest point of the sword, they should do that blade anyway!

And at this time, the tiger assault team outside suddenly rushed in!

"Don't move! Everyone get down and put down their weapons!"

At this time, Hong Feng led the team in, but he originally wanted to face the rain of bullets, but 
when he entered the door, he saw that except for a few women, most of the people lying on the 
ground were hostages, those criminals with weapons in their hands. , There is no breathing 
anymore!

"This!"

At this time, Hong Feng's eyes were about to stare out, looking at the Fire Phoenix team with 
weapons in his hand, Qi Ai Ai said:

"This...this is what you did?"

Ye Cunxin looked at these corpses and said embarrassedly:

"How is it possible, this is our instructor..."

But before Ye Cunxin's words were finished, Tan Xiaolin on the side spoke directly:

"Yes, we did it!"



The female soldiers suddenly showed a panic expression, not knowing what Tan Xiaolin was doing.

However, Tan Xiaolin glanced around and found no trace of Qin Yuan after looking around, and 
then said directly to Hong Feng:

"This is what we did. Of course, there are other people's help, but he is not here now."

"amount……"

At this time, Hong Feng heard this and extended a thumb to the person in the Fire Phoenix Team:

"It's really amazing. I thought the women's special forces team would be unbearable. I thought you 
would only become hostages here. Now it seems that I was wrong, and it was very wrong. I 
apologize to you here!"

Having said this, Hong Feng bowed very seriously to the people of the Fire Phoenix team, and 
seeing Hong Feng’s reaction, Ye Cunxin and others were even more uncomfortable. After all, they 
also knew that this battle was not theirs. call taxi.

But at this time, He Lu also understood, and said directly to Hong Feng:

"You are welcome, we will use our strength in the future, that proves that our Fire Phoenix, well, we 
need to report to the superior, so let's go!"

Having said this, He Lu led the team directly away, and looking at the heroic figure of the Fire 
Phoenix team, Hong Feng couldn't help but sigh:

"Sure enough, the people in the military area are not rubbish. Even women are so powerful. I really 
want to see who trains them, who can train such a powerful team!"

But at this time, the Fire Phoenix team, who was hiding from everyone's sight, had blown up the 
pot. At this time, Ye Cunxin quickly said to Tan Xiaolin:

"Instructor, how do you say such a thing, and He Lu. Why did you agree with it?"



It’s just that everyone around was looking at Tan Xiaolin and He Lu' and Tan Xiaolin saw the doubt 
in everyone’s eyes and said directly:

"We all knew that this was made by Qin Yuan, but since Qin Yuan is unwilling to show up, then we 
can only bear this name. Although I don't know why Qin Yuan is unwilling to come out, I think it 
must be. Because of his difficulties, I think we should do him a favor. I will explain this to the 
leaders of the military region in a while, and they will decide what the situation is."

Upon hearing this, He Lu also said:

"Yes, it is for this reason that I have admitted this matter. If Qin Yuan wants to have other tasks, 
wouldn't we expose him, even if Qin Yuan was delayed because of other things, turn around? It’s 
easy to say, at best we’ll lose face."

Hearing this, everyone was relieved. Ye Cunxin asked with some doubts: "By the way, where did 
the instructor go?"

At this time, Qin Yuan was hiding in a small corner, looking at the woman in front of him, and he 
smiled:

"Beauty, long time no see! Why, do you miss me?"

Chapter 378: Report

And standing in front of Qin Yuan was indeed a big beauty. At this moment, Anfisa looked at Qin 
Yuan with a smile on his face, hugged Qin Yuan directly, and kissed Qin Yuan:

"Handsome brother, elder sister, I really want to kill you. This time you are really handsome. I 
didn't even react to my elder sister. These people are all dead. They are really amazing!"

At this time, Anfisa was like an octopus, hanging from Qin Yuan's body, looking extremely clingy.

Qin Yuan smiled helplessly while avoiding Anfisa's attack.

This time, An Ran was in the hall, and she was very anxious at first, how should we pass this matter 
out?



It's a pity that the wild dogs don't trust Anfisa very much. They always keep Anfisa by their side. 
Later, Anfisa is looking for a chance to get out of suspended animation.

But before Anfissa had time to release the news here, he heard gunshots. Then I saw the moment 
when Xu Fan showed his power.

And Qin Yuan felt a touch of softness, knowing that Anfisa might not like him that much. It's just 
that Anfisa grew up in a foreign country, so it seemed more enthusiastic, but Qin Yuan knew that 
Anfisa was still relatively conservative. People, if you really want to do something to her, I'm afraid 
you have to be prepared to be responsible.

But this did not hinder Qin Yuan. Feeling the softness of his body, he directly avoided Anfisa's kiss, 
and then said directly to her:

"I have killed all these people now. Does it affect you? Since you have not appeared, it means that 
your mission has not been completed yet?"

Hearing Qin Yuan talking about business, Anfisa also let out a long sigh, this breath was so long, it 
was as if she had drained herself.

At this time, Anfisa lay weakly on Qin Yuan's body, and said directly to Qin Yuan: "Oh, why do you 
think my life is so bitter? It's hard to find a stable career. , As a result, he has become such a sprinter 
again, and has no time for a moment."

When Qin Yuan heard this, he spread his hands helplessly. This sentence was obviously a nonsense. 
Although Anfisa is currently performing a task, Qin Yuan understands that with the identity of 
Anfisa, if he refuses Performing these tasks, I am afraid that those above will not say anything to 
Anfisado.

After all, Anfisa came in from the outside. Although this identity is very useful, there are some 
things that Anfisa does not have to perform. According to Qin Yuan’s guess, it must be Anfisa who 
is unwilling to live in this ordinary life and takes the initiative. Go outside to find something to do.

"Well, don't tell me these things, I will ask you if there is anything I can help you with?"



Although Qin Yuan understands that this is the life Anfisa wants to live, but thinking that a woman 
is in a dangerous situation, Qin Yuan can't help but feel pity for Anfisa and gently touched it. A look 
at Anfisa's hair.

But Qin Yuan’s simple move caused Anfisa’s body to tremble, and the whole person was lying on 
Qin Yuan’s body like a mermaid, completely relaxed, and then muttered to him. Qin Yuan said:

"You have done the things that are most useful to me. I still have to rely on myself for other things."

After a while, Anfisa got up from Qin Yuan, looked at Qin Yuan confidently and said:

"Just watch it, and see how I play with those idiots in the applause. If one day you find me sitting in 
the position of the leader of the organization, don’t be too surprised, in case one day you are If you 
can’t keep going, you can come to me. I will definitely give you a second-in-command."

When Qin Yuan heard this, he couldn't laugh or cry for a while. He wouldn't be so miserable, would 
he want to be the second in command? And still the second in command of an undercover man?

Seeing Qin Yuan's disapproval, Anfisa gently stroked Qin Yuan's cheek, and said lightly:

"An Ran has already told me that although you have passed the test of those above, you will 
probably become busy in the future. The situation is not very good recently. You must have a lot of 
things to do. I don’t ask. What kind of results do you make, but please ensure your own safety. I 
don’t want to see you next time, I will only see a black and white photo of you.”

Qin Yuan was speechless for a while, then gently touched Anfisa's forehead, and said lightly:

"The same is true for you. In case something is wrong, run away immediately. As long as you 
survive, no matter what, I can save you back. Don’t die. As for me, you don’t have to worry. I am 
afraid that no one who can kill me in this world has been born yet."

Upon hearing this, Anfisa thought of Qin Yuan's abnormal physical ability again, and said 
helplessly:

"I know you are talking big, but think about it carefully, it seems that what you are saying is indeed 
true."



"Hey, just know it!"

Having said this, Qin Yuan hugged Anfisa tightly again, and Anfisa felt the incomparable warmth of 
Qin Yuan's embrace, and also revealed a trace of fascination.

However, Anfisa was considered a woman with strong self-control, and soon pushed Qin Yuan 
away, and then said to Qin Yuan:

"What I said was not a joke. If you really can’t hang around here someday, and you’re tired, then 
come to me. In fact, I don’t have much nostalgia for my current identity. , I’m the only ones who 
can really involve me. If you’re not there anymore, then what I’m doing is not certain' Qin Yuan 
also understands what Anfisa means, after all, Anfisa does not What relatives can worry Anfisa, I 
am afraid that only An Ran and herself.

If something happens to both himself and Enron, I really don't know what Anfisa will do.

"Okay, I'll pay attention. It's getting late, so let's separate. By the way, what can I do for you?"

But after hearing this, Anfisa waved his hand directly and said to Qin Yuan:

"Hurry up and get out now. I have made a backup plan. I am still looking forward to taking this 
opportunity to get to the next level. Hurry up and get out. By the way, when we meet next time, I 
will try to get that little girl from Anran. How long has it been since I got it, and I haven't gotten it, 
I'm panicking for you!"

Seeing Anfisa's appearance, Qin Yuan immediately smiled, and then left this small corner directly to 
the front of the island.

After all, Qin Yuan had already done things. Although this was not Qin Yuan's task, he still needed 
to report to Fan Tianlei.

Chapter 379: library

After getting on the island, Qin Yuan found that the hotel was already full of people. After all, such 
a big thing had happened and so many people had been disturbed. The follow-up processing also 
required a certain amount of manpower.



Qin Yuan asked casually the location of the headquarters, and then headed towards where Fan 
Tianlei was.

After entering the lobby of the hotel, Qin Yuan found that the corpses and hostages had disappeared. 
Only a few big men were watching these traces. Ye Cunxin and others were standing aside, 
accepting the praise of these big men.

"This time, thanks to the Fire Phoenix Squad, it's really amazing. Who says that women are inferior 
to men? This Fire Phoenix Squad really opened my eyes!"

At this time, Director Mao praised Ye Cunxin and the others, but Ye Cunxin and the others turned 
red. After all, they all knew that this was Qin Yuan’s contribution. When it came to Director Mao, 
they all felt a little ashamed!

When Fan Tianlei and Wen Guoqiang heard this, they looked at each other, a trace of doubt flashed 
in their eyes.

If there were no Qin Yuan, the Fire Phoenix team did this thing, then they would naturally have no 
doubts at all, but Qin Yuan had already arrived. Could it be that Qin Yuan just watched and didn't do 
it?

This is simply impossible!

However, I haven’t seen Qin Yuan until now. Fan Tianlei and Wen Guoqiang both had a little 
thought. After all, although Qin Yuan is more famous in the military area, there are still a few 
people who really know how good Qin Yuan is. , I have only heard of Qin Yuan's name, and know 
that there is this person.

But this old Mao is different. His level is half a level higher than that of them. If you know Qin 
Yuan's power, if this really moves the military area and transfers Qin Yuan away, then their Isn't 
there a trump card missing in your hand?

Although they also knew that this was just their imagination, it is better to do more than less. Since 
Qin Yuan did not appear, it would be better to hide it.



After Qin Yuan entered here, he soon discovered the clues, but he didn't care. For Qin Yuan, Grid 
was more important. As for the credit this time, he couldn't be promoted directly anyway, it didn't 
matter. Up.

At this moment, Ye Cunxin and others saw Qin Yuan, their eyes lit up, and they just wanted to tell 
the truth about the matter to Director Mao, but suddenly they heard Qin Yuan say:

"Not bad, you did a great job. It's worth noting that I trained you for such a long time. Very good. 
This time I have made great achievements. After I go back, I will be rewarded for all!"

At this time, Tan Xiaolin and others were completely dumbfounded. They also expected that after 
Qin Yuan came, they would be able to tell the truth about the matter. Who knew that Qin Yuan 
actually put this credit on them? Suddenly, Tan Xiaolin and others felt as uncomfortable as if they 
had eaten a fly.

But even so, they understood that they couldn't tell the truth about the matter, so they had to 
dejectedly agreed.

And this time seeing Qin Yuan coming, Director Mao also praised Qin Yuan for a while, and they 
did not doubt that Qin Yuan had exerted any strength in this matter. After all, in their knowledge, 
even Qin Yuan No matter how powerful, there is only one person, and it must be through teamwork 
to achieve such an outcome.

However, Qin Yuan was able to train masters like the Fire Phoenix, and they were also full of 
respect for Qin Yuan. It took a long time for this matter to be completely completed.

Only after those people left, Fan Tianlei grabbed Qin Yuan, and asked Qin Yuan playfully:

"What the **** is going on? Are you going to tell us a bit?"

However, Qin Yuan slapped Fan Tianlei's hand aside in an angry manner, and directly answered Fan 
Tianlei:

"If you want to know the truth, then ask the female soldiers. There are still people waiting for me."



At this time, Fan Tianlei looked up and found that An Ran was standing on the side with a smile, 
and seeing An Ran, it was natural that Fan Tianlei could not stay with Qin Yuan more, and then 
asked Tan Xiaolin on the side:

"What the **** are these things?"

And Tan Xiaolin finally heard Fan Tianlei ask this question, she was relieved, and saw that Qin 
Yuan had agreed with them to tell the truth about the matter, and she was like a bamboo tube 
pouring beans, and all the depression in her heart The surprise was all vented.

At this time, when he heard what happened, Fan Tianlei also opened his eyes. He really did not 
expect that Qin Yuan's skill was already so high that a single person would directly wipe out more 
than 20 criminals. Such skill has already It is beyond his imagination!

"Damn, I don't know how he did it. Is this ability still a person?"

Fan Tianlei murmured at this time, and when he heard Fan Tianlei's words, Wen Guoqiang who 
stood aside lightly patted Fan Tianlei's shoulder, and said directly to Fan Tianlei:

"Qin Yuan's surprise is not a day or two. Why is he still so surprised? Oh, yes, in a few days, I want 
to borrow this team from you."

Fan Tianlei was in shock, he nodded and agreed, and seeing that Fan Tianlei had already agreed, 
Wen Guoqiang was overjoyed and left quickly.

But Fan Tianlei looked at Wen Guoqiang's back, but he was a little confused:

"What did he just say?"

Fan Tianlei thought about it, but he didn't think about it. but now is not the time to entangle this. 
Since Qin Yuan has passed the test and his ability has been confirmed, then he must report this 
matter. Going up, maybe the people above have more important tasks to be completed by Qin Yuan!

At this time, on Qin Yuan's side, he was leaving with An Ran.



After all, things are done now, and Qin Yuan is still on vacation, so he doesn't need to stay in place 
to deal with the funeral.

Looking at An Ran at this time, Qin Yuan couldn't help but remembered Anfisa's statement, and 
there was a burst of heat in his heart unknowingly.

However, Qin Yuan also knew that now was not the time, this problem had to be solved completely, 
otherwise there would always be many hidden dangers.

And An Ran was also able to feel the heat in Qin Yuan's eyes, pushed Qin Yuan angrily, and then 
directly parked the car in front of a library.

"Okay, go and buy a few books with me. I have read all the novels I have read."

At this time An Ran said to Qin Yuan, and Qin Yuan agreed, and then went into the library with An 
Ran.

Chapter 380: World-class French

When I arrived in a small corner of the library, An Ran took a book and read it slowly, and Qin 
Yuan hadn’t read it like this for a long time, so he picked one too. This novel, just sit down and 
look.

Just looking at it, An Ran asked Qin Yuan:

"Did you see Anfisa? How is she, what did she say?"

Qin Yuan also showed a slight smile when he heard this. He thought that An Ran really didn't care 
about this matter, so he whispered:

"She said that she is fine now, and she is about to become the boss of the organization, and she 
seems to have seen you, let me get you quickly."

Hearing this, An Ran couldn't help but flushed, and sighed at Qin Yuanjiao:

"This girl is still as indifferent as before!"



Qin Yuan smiled, and just wanted to continue to say something to An Ran, but at this moment, An 
Ran's cell phone suddenly rang, and An Ran showed Qin Yuan an apologetic smile, and then walked 
directly to the side. Answer the phone.

But Qin Yuan stood here honestly, provoked the book, and to be honest, the novel he had on hand 
was really boring, so it's better to read the novel of special forces.

But at this moment, Qin Yuan suddenly thought, should he take this opportunity to recover some 
skills?

Qin Yuan took a look at the system at this time, and found that there were still 6 grids left. There 
were a lot of them before. Now that they have three more grids, Qin Yuan has become completely 
rich.

Looking at An Ran for a while, it seemed that he couldn't finish the phone call. Qin Yuan looked 
directly at the bookshelf.

Now Qin Yuan has acquired a lot of abilities, and looking at the dazzling array of books in front of 
him, Qin Yuan is really a bit picky for a while, not knowing what abilities he needs to acquire.

However, when Qin Yuan was a little tangled, An Ran hung up the phone and walked over directly.

At this time, An Ran said directly to Qin Yuan:

"Qin Yuan, I have a question for you, is your foreign language good?"

Hearing such words at this time, Qin Yuan was a little puzzled and asked An Ran:

"What's wrong, I am fairly fluent in English and Thai, but other languages are not good enough."

Qin Yuan had acquired these two languages when he was in the Philippines and the Silver Triangle. 
If Qin Yuan now speaks these two languages, he is not even different from the locals.

Hearing Qin Yuan's answer at this time, An Ran was immediately relieved, and then said to Qin 
Yuan:



"Fortunately, your English is good, otherwise it would be a little troublesome."

It's just that Qin Yuan was even more puzzled, and then asked An Ran:

"What the **** is going on? Why do I have to be able to speak English?"

And An Ran said to Qin Yuan with a smile on his face:

"Lieutenant General Gao Shiwei has revealed to me that you are going to be promoted."

"Promoted? A foreign language is necessary for promotion?"

Qin Yuan was a little bit puzzled. This was new. It was the first time I heard that a foreign language 
was necessary for promotion.

An Ran saw Qin Yuan's puzzled look and said with a slight smile:

"Of course you don’t need a foreign language to be promoted, but I heard from General Gao. 
Looking back, it seems that I want you to participate in a special forces competition internationally. 
There are people from all countries in this special forces competition. Although there is an 
interpreter, it is still Personally, these languages are better."

At this moment, Qin Yuan's eyes lit up when he heard this. He had an impression of this. Qin Yuan 
had seen the news of this special forces competition in the newspapers of the military, and even the 
turbulent special teams were posted online. Most of them are discharged through such special forces 
competitions.

In the past, the special forces of Yan Country were not well-known. In addition to having less 
famous international combat experience, it was mainly because they did not rank high in such 
special competitions, so they seemed a little embarrassed.

"Xinglai, I know, are you going to meet the high school general now?"

At this time Qin Yuan directly asked An Ran, and An Ran also nodded.



But before leaving, Qin Yuan suddenly thought of something, his eyes lit up.

Didn’t I just worry about what to use? Isn’t this language a good choice?

After all, although Qin Yuan knew English and Thai now, he was still not familiar with other 
languages. Taking advantage of the plentiful grid, he didn't rush to learn other useful languages in 
the world.

As soon as he thought of it, Qin Yuan first asked An Ran to wait at the door, but he returned directly 
to the library, and then found some books on language learning, and he was directly caught in the 
grid!

"Ding Dong~ The system was successfully recovered, please start choosing the host!"

With the prompt sound of this system, three options suddenly appeared in front of Qin Yuan!

"1, get world-class French!"

"2, get world-class paper manufacturing technology!"

"3, get world-class illustration skills!"

Looking at these three options at this time, Qin Yuan was stunned. How can I learn French and still 
get illustration skills?

However, when Qin Yuan opened these books and looked at it, he realized that this legal person 
deserves the title of a romantic city. The books for learning French are full of illustrations.

And this illustration really has a lot of artistry, thanks to Qin Yuan's long-standing experience of the 
island country young lady, or looking at these illustrations, it might be hard for Jill.

Qin Yuan looked at this ability a little regretfully. He wanted to get this illustrator ability from '. If 
he returned to this, he might not ask for anything in the future, but it is a pity that Qin Yuan’s 
current grid It's not a lot, but I just want to use it on the blade. This illustration ability is a pity.



"System, I choose the first item!"

"Ding Dong, congratulations to the host for choosing to succeed and get world-class French!"

At this moment, with the sound of the system, Qin Yuan's mind was suddenly clear, as if he had 
eaten a piece of mint. At this time, Qin Yuan looked at the book in front of him and found that he 
could understand it.

Qin Yuan couldn't help feeling happy, and then using this method, he directly received all Dao 
Guoyu and Maozi into the grid, and directly obtained these two languages.

And now Qin Yuan already knows six languages: English, Thai, French, Island Mandarin, Teddy 
Bear, and Chinese, so he can be regarded as a language master!

Feeling the language in his head, Qin Yuan couldn't help but become happy, hehe, this is also 
considered to have real talents, and in the future, even if he is not a soldier, he will be regarded as a 
cultural man if he goes out.
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