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Chapter 59: Shocked Anfisa!

　　 Three Fusang people sat in front of Fatty Liu. Seeing Fatty Liu's ugly face, the corners 
of their mouths showed a playful smile.

　　 At this time, Fatty Liu was slightly angry.

　　 Although they are partners, Fatty Liu knows exactly what these people are. These 
people must be laughing at themselves in their hearts!

　　 "It doesn't need to be, Mr. Fukushima, it was just a hairy boy who came in. I can 
definitely handle it."

　　 After Fatty Liu finished speaking, he beckoned to the younger brother on one side, and 
then whispered:

　　 "Let the 5 guys on the 3rd floor hurriedly take action, so that one person made such a 
fuss. Didn't Mr. Fukushima watch our jokes?"

　　 The little brother nodded when he heard this, and rushed directly downstairs.

　　 But what this little brother didn't expect was that Qin Yuan had already reached the 
third floor at this time.

After killing the bodyguards on the second floor, Qin Yuan directly turned on the thermal 
imaging capability and found that there were only five people on the third floor, and these 
five people were very strange. In addition to carrying guns, they also carried a lot of cold 
weapons. .

　　 "Hehe, these five people still seem to be melee masters?"

　　 Qin Yuan was immediately happy, he just got a mantis boxing technique today, just to 
try his moves!



　　 Then Qin Yuan directly walked up the stairs. At this time, the five people on the third 
floor saw that Qin Yuan actually came up, and instantly pointed their gun at Qin Yuan.

　　 It's just that they saw Qin Yuan's bare hands, with a hint of surprise in his eyes. This kid 
didn't even hold a gun?

　　 Qin Yuan also had a sneer at the corner of his mouth. Sure enough, when these people 
saw him, they didn't shoot him directly!

　　 At this time, a person with a scar on his face saw this situation, and his face suddenly 
showed an extremely ferocious smile:

　　 "Boy, do you think you will feel ashamed if you get rid of the waste below? How dare 
you come straight up!"

　　 With an untouchable smile on Qin Yuan’s face, he looked at this knife-handled face and 
said directly:

　　 "Why? Don't you come up? Do you want you to lift me up?"

　　 Seeing that Qin Yuan was still so arrogant, this scarred face suddenly became angry and 
shouted:

　　 "Boy, look for death!"

　　 Scarface pulled out a Nepalese saber when he finished speaking, and slashed towards 
Qin Yuan!

　　 Now they have several guns aimed at Qin Yuan, thinking that they have taken Qin 
Yuan, naturally there is no pressure in their hearts.

　　 So now they want to use a knife to teach Qin Yuan a good lesson, let Qin Yuan know, 
and dare to anger the fate of these people!



　　 But Qin Yuan watched the opponent cut it with this knife.

　　 There was a hint of disappointment in his eyes!

　　 He thought that these five people occupied one floor.

　　 how powerful will it be.

　　 But this first cut has already revealed its cowardice!

slow!

slow!

　　 is too slow!

　　 At this time, the knife in Scarface's hand is almost like a snail in Qin Yuan's eyes, 
extremely slow!

An opponent like 　　 has no training effect.

　　 Qin Yuan directly looked like a praying mantis. He raised his wrist and made a side 
blow, which instantly stuck to the neck of this knife-handled face, bringing out a touch of 
blood!

　　 Spike!

　　 "Hey..."

　　 This Scarface didn't expect that in front of Qin Yuan, he didn't even survive a single 
face.



　　 And Qin Yuan's fingers were almost like a sharp long knife, slashing across his neck 
without hindrance.

　　 Qin Yuan was also a little surprised, he originally wanted to smash the opponent's 
throat, who knew that his fingers were as sharp as a knife!

　　 This mantis sword technique is really amazing!

　　 There was a hint of excitement in Qin Yuan's eyes, he directly grabbed the scarred 
corpse and threw it at the other people!

　　 And at this time, those people saw that Scarface was dead, and there was a panic in an 
instant!

　　Scarface is already the strongest player among the five of them!

　　 It turned out to be killed by Qin Yuan after a single encounter?

　　 "Shoot! Kill him!"

　　 The remaining four people screamed, but it was a pity that it was already too late. Qin 
Yuan had already rushed directly in front of them under the cover of the scarred corpse!

"Go together!"

　　 These four people are also masters of martial arts.

　　 naturally understand,

　　 At close range, close weapons are more reliable than firearms, he directly drew out his 
dagger, and slashed towards Qin Yuan!



　　 Qin Yuan smiled disdainfully, pinched **** into claws, and directly pierced the four 
people's necks!

　　 With two crisp sounds, the two people in front covered their necks and fell directly to 
the ground!

　　 The remaining two people looked at the blood hole on the necks of the three who had 
already died, and their eyes were full of horror. They no longer had the courage to fight with 
Qin Yuan, and they couldn't help backing away.

　　 But they found that their speed was not as fast as Qin Yuan, so they had to put their 
dagger next to their neck, hoping to block Qin Yuan's attack!

　　 Qin Yuan saw the man's movements, but the traces on his hand remained unchanged, 
and he slammed heavily on this stainless steel dagger!

　　 And with this blow, Qin Yuan forcibly interrupted the dagger from the middle!

　　 The broken dagger, castrated!

　　 struck that person's neck directly!

　　 Qin Yuan took the other hand back, and looked at the five people who had turned into 
corpses, feeling a little bit unconscious.

　　 Sure enough, he used melee to kill people and killed people with guns.

　　 is a completely different experience.

　　 And the strength of these five people is really bad.

　　 Qin Yuan didn't show the true strength of the mantis boxing at all!



　　 And at this time,  Qin Yuan suddenly heard a sound from the stairs, and instantly 
pinched a playing card in his hand

　　 And this person is the little brother sent by Fatty Liu to inform him. Before he got here, 
he shouted:

　　 "The boss asks you to go down and solve..."

　　 But before he finished shouting this sentence, he saw 5 dead bodies lying on the 
ground, and a person he hadn't seen before was staring at him.

"you……"

　　 Qin Yuan flew out a piece of poker, and it was inserted in the throat of this little brother 
in an instant, and the little brother directly covered his neck and fell down!

　　 But when Qin Yuan just wanted to go up, his eyes were cold, the poker in his hand was 
instantly excited, and he flew directly towards the floor!

　　 At this time, Anfisa, who was on the floor, saw the corpse on the ground and stepped 
away in disgust, but this time, it happened to escape Qin Yuan's poker!

　　 snorted, this poker was inserted on the steps made of marble abruptly, frightening 
Anfisa in a cold sweat!

　　 almost!

　　 I almost finished myself!

　　 Qin Yuan didn't stay any longer, and leapt directly!

　　 Now the mercenaries downstairs have been completely resolved!



　　 Only Enron Anfisa on the fourth floor and... Fatty Liu on the fifth floor are left!

　　 "Huh? Is it you?".

　　 Qin Yuan rushed to the fourth floor instantly!

　　 However, as soon as he showed up, there was an exclamation on the other side. It was 
to see Qin Yuan, Anfisa with a pair of beautiful eyes shining with surprise!
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