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Chapter 2741: Chapter 2741: He Really Pulled It Off! 

"Brother Yang, should we fight or retreat now?" 

Wu Qiansheng asked. 

Yang Luo said coldly, "First, let’s help these guys wipe out some of Huang Yuchen’s 
people! 

Once the two sides are fiercely fighting, we’ll make a swift retreat!" 

"Alright!" 

Everyone nodded in agreement. 

At this moment. 

Hundreds of guards from the Great Desolate Immortal Country and Da Mang Immortal 
Country, as well as hundreds of disciples from the Heavenly Netherworld Immortal Sect, 
charged toward Yang Luo and the others! 

"Attack!" 

Yang Luo shouted sharply, leading everyone to charge forward! 

"Brothers, weren’t you curious about what exactly Wutian Demon Venerable passed 
down to me? 

Now I’ll let you witness it for yourselves!" 

Bujie laughed loudly, rushing at the forefront, twisting his fist and striking out fiercely! 

"Slaughter Demon Fist!" 

A massive black fist, surrounded by rolling demonic qi and soaring magic power, 
blasted out! 



With one punch, ancient and imposing, it stirred the heavens and the earth, shaking the 
Cangqiong and stirring the sea! 

The Void was rippling and twisting, incredibly terrifying! 

In an instant! 

Boom! Boom! Boom! 

The hundreds of guards and disciples at the forefront were blasted apart in mid-air, 
exploding into pieces of flesh and bone fragments! 

"Hahaha..." 

Bujie laughed up to the heavens, "Very good, the power of this ’Slaughter Demon Fist’ 
is indeed formidable! 

Let me try some other techniques!" 

Saying this, he directly rose to the sky, his right hand rapidly forming seals! 

"Wutian Great Demon Seal!" 

In an instant! 

A massive black seal condensed, engraved with ancient totems and runes, the demonic 
light blazing fiercely, the demonic qi surging! 

"Suppress!" 

Bujie’s eyes flickered with black light, his right hand forcefully pressing downward! 

The demon seal rapidly expanded, shrouding the sky and descending to suppress and 
kill those guards and disciples below! 

"Be careful!" 

"Fight back quickly!" 

"This monk is too wicked, isn’t he a monk? Why is he cultivating demon techniques?!" 

Those guards and disciples were terrified, launching fierce attacks skyward. 

A series of attacks soared into the sky, bombarding the descending demon seal! 

Rumble! Rumble! Rumble! 



Collisions and explosions resounded continuously, exploding into dazzling lights and 
energy! 

Yet, no matter how fierce the attacks from those guards and disciples were, they 
couldn’t withstand the crushing force of the demon seal! 

"Quick, get out of the way!" 

"Retreat! Retreat now!" 

The guards and disciples shouted in panic, wanting to dodge and retreat, but it was too 
late. 

Accompanied by the deafening explosive sound! 

The vast Void surged with ripples! 

The sea below surged with gigantic waves reaching the skies! 

As for those guards and disciples below, they were directly crushed into minced meat, 
completely dead! 

Seeing this scene! 

Everyone embroiled in the fierce battle was stunned! 

"What is going on with this little monk, isn’t he supposed to be a Buddhist practitioner, 
not a demon cultivator?!" 

"Such powerful demon combat skills, they’re simply unbeatable, indestructible!" 

"If his cultivation continues to advance, the power of these demon combat skills he 
employs will be even greater!" 

"I understand now! This little monk must have gained a legacy from that ancient relic!" 

The elders were astounded, looking at Bujie with eyes full of shock. 

Yet some guessed Bujie had gained a legacy from the ancient relics. 

Huang Yuchen, Mang Tianci, and Nangong Yao were also extremely shocked. 

Gazing at the looks and expressions of everyone. 

Bujie laughed loudly, saying, "Those not afraid of death, come at me together, Lord 
Buddha is going on a killing spree today!" 



Ning Jianfeng shook his head, "Well, this time he actually pulled it off!" 

Xu Ying laughed, "This guy rarely gets a chance to show off, let him enjoy it!" 

"You damned monk, you are courting death!" 

Huang Yuchen roared, charging skyward, attacking Bujie! 

"You’re the one courting death!" 

Bujie roared back, unafraid, meeting the challenge head-on! 

In the instant of proximity! 

Huang Yuchen swung the halberd in his hand, slashing at Bujie! 

Rumble! Rumble! 

The huge halberd slashed out, cleaving a section of the Cloud Sea, unleashing terrifying 
power! 

Bujie, on his part, twisted a fist and struck out! 

The demon fist emerged, suppressing Heaven and Earth, chaotically overturning 
Qiankun, overwhelmingly puissant! 

Bang! Bang! Bang! 

The huge halberd and colossal fist collided heavily, unleashing an earth-shattering 
impact sound! 

Intense light and vast energy erupted, sweeping the Cangqiong and the sea! 

Under this collision! 

Bujie and Huang Yuchen were both sent flying backward! 

Huang Yuchen was sent flying five hundred meters before stabilizing his body! 

Bujie was sent flying eight hundred meters before stabilizing! 

Although slightly at a disadvantage, Bujie still withstood Huang Yuchen’s offensive! 

"How could it be?!" 



Huang Yuchen’s eyes were filled with shock, "Damn monk, I’m a Golden Immortal, how 
can you withstand my attack?!" 

Even though he was only at the Golden Immortal early-stage, he was still a Golden 
Immortal. 

And Bujie was only at the Heavenly Immortal Perfected Stage. 

Logically, a Heavenly Immortal shouldn’t withstand a Golden Immortal’s attack. 

Unexpectedly, this damn monk did withstand it. 

"Is being a Golden Immortal something remarkable?" 

Bujie sneered, "Lord Buddha is just a tribulation away from the Golden Immortal, why 
should I fear you?" 

"Damn it!" 

Huang Yuchen roared angrily, his whole body trembling, directly activating his physique! 

The phenomena unique to his physique manifested above him! 

"Damn monk, give me your life!" 

Huang Yuchen roared, holding the halberd, charging again at Bujie. 

Bujie also trembled, continuously mobilizing the energy within his body, then swung his 
massive hand! 

"Slaughter Demon Chain!" 

In the blink of an eye! 

Thick black chains, like arms, broke through the Cangqiong, the Void, and the sea, 
sweeping out, heading straight for Huang Yuchen! 

Each chain contained the power of the Heavenly Earth Dao, Power of Laws, immense 
magic power, and the power of slaughter! 

Like black Demon Dragons, they surged toward Huang Yuchen! 

Huang Yuchen was startled, continuously swinging the halberd in his hand, cutting off 
the sweeping demon chains! 

At this moment! 



Bujie swung his massive hand, shouting again! 

"Wutian Demon Stele!" 

In one breath! 

Buzz! Buzz! Buzz! 

An ancient, broken stone tablet flew out from the storage bag in his sleeve, expanding 
massively like a towering mountain, crashing toward Huang Yuchen! 

Perhaps excited to see the light of day again, the Wutian Demon Stele trembled 
violently, emitting dazzling demonic light, erupting with rolling demonic qi and magic 
power! 

Seeing the Wutian Demon Stele incoming! 

Huang Yuchen’s face changed drastically, immediately raising the halberd to block! 

Clang! clang! clang! 

Accompanied by intense collision sounds! 

"Poof..." 

Huang Yuchen was directly smashed away, spitting a large mouthful of blood. 

Everyone embroiled in the fierce battle was shocked! 

"My God, how can a broken stele have such tremendous power?!" 

"Divine Grade... Is that broken stele actually a Divine Artifact?!" 

"Was it also obtained from the ancient relics under the sea?!" 

The shocked cultivators exclaimed, even more excited. 

"Eldest Prince!" 

Sun Yanxiu, an elder of the Great Desolate Immortal Country, shouted, breaking 
through the encirclement and charged toward Bujie! 

Chapter 2742: Chapter 2742: Chaotic Battle at Sea! 

Sun Yanxiu’s cultivation was at the Daluo Golden Immortal Middle Stage, incredibly 
powerful! 



Upon seeing Huang Yuchen injured, he naturally couldn’t tolerate it! 

“Don’t even think about it!” 

With a thunderous roar, Yang Luo soared into the sky, unleashing his full momentum, 
battle power, and physique secret technique as he advanced to confront the enemy! 

His body shimmered with golden light, rising like a divine dragon to the skies, 
dominating all! 

Seeing Yang Luo charging toward him! 

Sun Yanxiu’s face turned cold as he lifted his hand and struck out heavily! 

“Great Desolate Divine Palm!” 

A vast blue-grey palm condensed, carrying the immense Heavenly Earth Dao Power, 
the Power of Laws, and palm intent, slamming towards Yang Luo! 

Moreover, beams of immortal rainbows carrying the power of desolation attacked! 

The void trembled, the ocean surged with massive waves reaching a thousand feet! 

“Nirvana Dragon Fist!” 

Yang Luo twisted and punched directly to meet the attack. 

“Roar! Roar! Roar!” 

With one punch, Ten Thousand Dragons roared! 

A golden fist carrying an antiquated and profound aura, wielding the Power of Laws and 
unparalleled fist intent, struck out! 

Tens of thousands of enormous golden dragons roared upwards! 

Boom! Boom! 

The sounds of earth-shattering collisions and explosions echoed, shaking the heavens 
and earth! 

A massive burst of light and energy erupted from the collision site, exploding into a 
gigantic ball of energy! 

In this massive clash! 



Yang Luo was directly sent flying hundreds of meters away! 

Even Sun Yanxiu was forced to step back over a dozen steps before steadying himself! 

He narrowed his eyes and said coldly, “Kid, despite being only at the Golden Immortal 
Late Stage, you can unleash such formidable power! 

No wonder you could defeat the five Heavenly Pride of Huangzhou by yourself, and still 
show great divine might in the battle between the Da Yi Immortal Country and the 
Southern Barbarian Demon Country, truly remarkable! 

It seems if I want to kill you, I have to get serious!” 

Saying this, he vibrated with power! 

Boom! 

A blue-grey beam of light shot up from him, piercing through the clouds! 

His hair and robe fluttered as his momentum and battle power surged! 

“You brat, surrender your life!” 

He took a step, transforming into a swift stream of light, charging towards Yang Luo. 

“Dragon Emperor Sword!” 

Yang Luo roared mightily. 

Clang! 

Accompanied by a crisp sword hum! 

The Dragon Emperor Sword flew out from his storage ring, tightly grasped by him! 

“Slash!” 

He shouted, gripping the Dragon Emperor Sword with both hands, slashing heavily at 
the charging Sun Yanxiu! 

Whoosh! 

The sound of the blade slicing through the air echoed! 

The golden sword sliced through the Cloud Sea and sunset, drawing a gigantic golden 
crescent arc in the sky, slashing down heavily towards Sun Yanxiu! 



“Trifling skills!” 

Sun Yanxiu sneered contemptuously, quivering his entire body! 

“Great Desolate Divine Gang!” 

A massive blue-grey gang shield condensed, with runes flowing across its barrier, 
enveloping him within! 

Clang! Clang! 

The golden sword slashed heavily against the gang shield, bursting forth with a crisp 
collision sound! 

Sparks flew, energy surged, dazzling and terrifying! 

However, the defensive barrier Sun Yanxiu condensed was extremely formidable, 
forcibly blocking Yang Luo’s sword slash! 

“Brother Yang, let me lend you a hand!” 

Bujie roared, rushing forward, throwing out a powerful punch! 

“Slaughter Demon Fist” was unleashed again! 

The Wutian Demon Stele also erupted a thick black demonic light, charging towards 
Sun Yanxiu! 

“Together!” 

“Help out!” 

Wu Qiansheng, Lu Yunqi, Xia Chaoyang, Lord Blue Luan, and Song Zhixin also soared 
into the sky, attacking Sun Yanxiu! 

On their way up, they unleashed a series of fierce attacks! 

In an instant! 

Boom! Boom! 

Their collective onslaught struck heavily at Sun Yanxiu’s gang shield, producing the 
sound of a muffled rolling thunder! 

“Brother Mang, Brother Nangong, attack together, let’s kill that Yang Luo first!” 



Huang Yuchen shouted angrily, charging towards them. 

Xu Ying, Ning Jianfeng, Lin Wenxuan, Mo Qingkuang, and Xiang Kunlun also flashed 
forward, attacking the three of Huang Yuchen. 

In an instant, Xu Ying and the others were engaged in a fierce battle with them! 

“A bunch of Golden Immortals dare to challenge this old man, courting death!” 

Sun Yanxiu sneered, rushing towards them. 

Cangqiong and the ocean trembled violently! 

Vast and immense energies surged from within him, washing over all directions! 

Boom! Boom! Boom! 

The onslaught launched by Yang Luo and Bujie was destroyed, and they were all sent 
flying! 

“Come and meet your fate!” 

Yang Luo steadied himself, unleashing a series of lethal moves! 

“Beast Blood Boiling!” 

“Nine Emperor Dragon Seal!” 

“Chaos Slaughter Array Map!” 

“Roar! Roar! Roar!” 

The Holy Dragon, Four Great Divine Beasts, and Four Great Fierce Beasts roared and 
charged forward! 

An array map congealed, like a golden heavenly curtain, bearing down! 

“Slaughter Demon Fist!” 

Bujie’s eyes and body flashed with dazzling black light, and he fiercely punched out! 

Innumerable black demonic lights erupted from the Wutian Demon Stele, shooting 
towards Sun Yanxiu! 

An enormous Demon Slaying Seal condensed, towering like a Demon Mountain, 
suppressing everything in its path! 



“Nine Yang Dominator Fist!” 

“Bright Moon and Star Palm!” 

“Da Xia Dragon Spear!” 

“Blue Luan Sword Technique!” 

“Holy Lotus Treasure Seal!” 

Wu Qiansheng, Lu Yunqi, Xia Chaoyang, Flame Emperor, and Song Zhixin unleashed 
their attacks toward Sun Yanxiu! 

“You really think a bunch of Golden Immortals can contend with this old man? 

How naive!” 

Sun Yanxiu sneered, charging forward with a longsword, slashing ahead! 

“Great Desolate Seven Absolute Swords!” 

Whoosh! Whoosh! Whoosh! 

Seven blue-grey giant swords ripped through the sky, blasting out in unison! 

Their fierce attacks were shattered mid-air, exploding and sending their bodies flying! 

“Hurry and help!” 

“If these kids die, we won’t get the ancient relics at all!” 

At that moment, a group of elders rushed over from a distance, charging at Sun Yanxiu. 

Yang Luo and Bujie, along with the others, also charged forward. 

Above the sea, the battle grew even more intense! 

Many people had already died! 

Bodies floated on the sea, staining the waters with blood! 

The fierce battle raged on for an hour! 

Finally, the intense clash reached its peak! 



Yang Luo communicated internally: “Brothers, don’t get entangled with them, retreat 
quickly!” 

“Alright!” 

Wu Qiansheng and the others replied through transmissions. 

Soon, Yang Luo and the others rapidly withdrew from the battlefield, transforming into 
streams of light, swiftly flying toward the direction of Donghua Divine Continent! 

Due to the chaos on the battlefield, no one noticed their retreat at once! 

Huang Yuchen, after sending a group of people flying, glanced around angrily and 
roared, “What are you still fighting for, they’re already gone!” 

“”” 

Chapter 2743: Chapter 2743: Must Not Let Them Live! 

Hearing Huang Yuchen’s words. 

Everyone present was initially stunned, then glanced around, and indeed did not find 
Yang Luo and the others. 

"Damn it!" 

Nangong Yao said angrily, "Those guys deliberately incited you, just to stall us and 
seize the chance to escape! 

You’re still foolishly fighting here, do you really think those guys will hand over the 
inheritance they got?" 

Mang Tianci also said harshly, "If those guys escape, none of us will benefit!" 

Huang Yuchen shouted loudly, "Everyone, why not let us join forces, catch up with 
those guys, and subdue them! 

By then, you can force them to hand over the treasures and inheritances obtained from 
the ancient relics! 

After that, we’ll take their lives, how about that?" 

"Alright, let’s do it!" 

"Those little bastards dare to trick us, they’re courting death!" 



"What are we waiting for, let’s catch up, they must not escape!" 

The cultivators eager to force Yang Luo and the others to hand over their treasures and 
inheritances roared out. 

"Chase!" 

Huang Yuchen’s lips curled into a successful smile as he led everyone in pursuit. 

Meanwhile. 

After escaping that sea area, Yang Luo and the others accelerated, flying towards 
Donghua Divine Continent. 

Along the way. 

Bujie said disgruntled, "Damn, that bastard Huang Yuchen is really detestable! 

Brother Yang, you spared his life last time, and now he comes with so many people to 
kill us!" 

Wu Qiansheng clenched his fists, saying harshly, "Huang Yuchen, Mang Tianci, and 
Nangong Yao are trying to curry favor with the Golden Crow Sacred Land! 

They even fear not the Da Wu Immortal Country, Da Xia Immortal Country, or Taixuan 
Sacred Land, they’ve gone mad!" 

Lu Yunqi said coldly, "Since they want to tear off the mask, there’s nothing more to say! 

As long as we survive today, we’ll definitely kill those three guys next time!" 

Yang Luo’s gaze turned extremely grim, his eyes flashing with killing intent. 

Huang Yuchen was already on his must-kill list! 

Such a villain, absolutely cannot be left alive! 

But just at this moment! 

Roaring voices came from behind! 

"Those little beasts are there!" 

"You still want to run, where can you escape to!" 

"Run, go ahead and keep running!" 



Yang Luo and the others turned their heads to look. 

As expected. 

Huang Yuchen and the others had already caught up. 

"Damn it!" 

Bujie gritted his teeth, "These guys have caught up so quickly!" 

Wu Qiansheng shouted forcefully, "Then let’s fight them!" 

"Fight!" 

Ning Jianfeng and others also shouted loudly. 

"Kill!!" 

Bujie and the others roared and instead of running, charged directly forward! 

Yang Luo put away the Dragon Emperor Sword and summoned the Sunset Divine Bow 
and three Sun-shooting Divine Arrows! 

He held the bow in his left hand, the arrows in his right, spread his feet apart, and 
nocked the bowstring! 

He continuously mobilized his internal energy, infusing it into the Sunset Divine Bow 
and three Sun-shooting Divine Arrows! 

"Broken Cloud Arrow, Sky Splitting Arrow, Red Spirit Arrow, go!" 

Accompanied by a loud roar! 

Whoosh, whoosh, whoosh! 

The three Sun-shooting Divine Arrows gleamed with brilliant golden light, streaking 
across the sky, shooting towards the charging men! 

In an instant! 

Puff, puff, puff! 

The three Sun-shooting Divine Arrows pierced through those people’s bodies like 
electricity and light! 



With just one bowstring draw and release, over three hundred cultivators were shot 
dead! 

There were Earth Immortals, True Immortals, Heavenly Immortals, and even Golden 
Immortals! 

Bang, bang, bang! 

Those who were shot exploded into clouds of blood mist, their physical bodies and 
essence souls completely obliterated! 

A large amount of flesh and bone fragments splattered through the air, shocking to 
behold! 

After shooting over three hundred cultivators! 

The three Sun-shooting Divine Arrows transformed into three streaks of light and 
returned to Yang Luo’s hand! 

"This... what’s the origin of this bow and arrows... how can it be so powerful?!" 

"Could it be the Ancestor Artifact of Da Yi Immortal Country... the Sunset Divine Bow 
and Sun-shooting Divine Arrow?!" 

"Strange... why is the Sunset Divine Bow and Sun-shooting Divine Arrows in this guy’s 
hands?!" 

"Did Da Yi Immortal Country give the Ancestor Artifact to this guy?!" 

"How is that possible?! No matter how generous Da Yi Immortal Country is, it couldn’t 
hand over the Ancestor Artifact, right?!" 

The cultivators’ faces were terrified, and they dared not approach for a moment. 

After all, quite a few had heard about the earlier war between Da Yi Immortal Country 
and the Southern Barbarian Demon Country. 

In that battle, Yang Luo used the Sunset Divine Bow and the Sun-shooting Divine Arrow 
to shoot and kill two Crown Princes from the Golden Crow Sacred Land and a Daluo 
Golden Immortal elder. 

Yi Jiuxiao and Yi Pingsheng used the Sunset Divine Bow and the Sun-shooting Divine 
Arrow to slay the "Southern Barbarian Demon Emperor" Yan Juetian and several 
Country Protecting Elders from the Southern Barbarian Demon Country. 



Holding the Sunset Divine Bow and Sun-shooting Divine Arrows, Yang Luo shouted 
loudly, "If you’re not afraid to die, come on!" 

Yet, still, no one dared to come closer. 

At this point, Bujie, Ning Jianfeng, and the others also returned to Yang Luo, stained 
with blood, coldly staring at the crowd opposite. 

Elder Qiao Qingshi from the Great Desolate Immortal Country shouted, "No need to 
fear, everyone, as far as I know, the Sunset Divine Bow and Sun-shooting Divine Arrow 
have only been partially repaired, their power is far from enough! 

Moreover, this guy is only at the Golden Immortal late-stage cultivation, unable to fully 
unleash the greater killing power of the Sunset Divine Bow and Sun-shooting Divine 
Arrow!" 

"Elder Qiao is correct!" 

Huang Yuchen took over the conversation and said, "As long as we join forces, we can 
surely subdue them easily! 

Once subdued, the Sunset Divine Bow, Sun-shooting Divine Arrows, and treasures on 
them will all be ours!" 

Upon hearing this! 

Everyone’s eyes lit up, breathing heavily! 

They had noticed earlier that these young ones had quite a few good things on them! 

Huang Yuchen continued to incite, "Everyone, what are we waiting for, let’s team up, 
subdue them first and talk later!" 

"Alright!" 

Everyone responded in unison. 

Immediately, Huang Yuchen and the others simultaneously mobilized their internal 
energy, launching heavy attacks towards Yang Luo and the others! 

"Brothers, fight!" 

Yang Luo shouted forcefully. 

"Fight!!!" 



Bujie, Xu Ying, Wu Qiansheng, and others shouted in response. 

In no time! 

Bujie, Xu Ying, and others released their full aura and power, launching heavy 
offensives towards their opponents, counterattacking fiercely! 

Moreover, they all summoned their Dharma artifacts, colliding fiercely, deploying 
Dharma Idols, and charging fiercely! 

"Kill!!!" 

Yang Luo roared loudly, once again bursting out his internal energy, nocking the 
bowstring and drawing the arrows! 

Whoosh, whoosh, whoosh! 

The three Sun-shooting Divine Arrows carried even more powerful killing force, 
destructive and catastrophic power, volleying forth! 

The Dragon Emperor Sword also tore through the sky, shooting out fiercely! 

"Immortal Suppression Pagoda, Ten Thousand Dragon Cauldron, Chaos Bell, 
Primordial Dragon Stele, Holy Dragon Ancient Mirror, Dragon Soul Tao Seal!" 

Six Dharma artifacts flew out from his storage ring, expanded in the wind, colliding up! 

"Roar, roar, roar!" 

Tens of thousands of Holy Dragons roared out! 

Waves of violent dragon qi and dragon might surged forth! 

Over the sky, dragon talismans flashed with dazzling brilliance, striking down! 

Streaks of immortal rainbows burst forth! 

Of course, besides drawing the bow and shooting arrows, and summoning Dharma 
artifacts! 

Yang Luo also deployed Dharma Idols, launching heavy killing moves, viciously 
attacking! 

Boom rumble! 

Crash rumble! 



The sounds of collisions and explosions resounded simultaneously in the sky, reaching 
unknown distances! 

Chapter 2744: Chapter 2744: Brothers Reunited! 

The light and energy that erupted were like the Raging Sea Violent Waves, sweeping 
across Heaven and Earth in all directions! 

“Ughhhh…” 

Screams echoed endlessly! 

Under the joint fierce assault of Yang Luo and the others, numerous adversaries were 
annihilated on the spot! 

Yang Luo and the others were also blasted away! 

“Continue the attack!” 

Huang Yuchen brandished his halberd, roaring aloud. 

“I just don’t believe so many of us can’t handle a bunch of young punks!” 

“Without even a Daluo Golden Immortal, yet they dare to challenge us, it’s simply 
courting death!” 

All the adversaries roared out, continuing their fierce assault on Yang Luo and the 
others. 

The assaults intertwined together, seemingly transforming into a sea of energy light, 
aiming to engulf Yang Luo and the others flying backward! 

“Defense!” 

Yang Luo shouted aloud, conjuring layers of Defensive Shields and Great Formation, 
enveloping himself and Bujie and others! 

Bujie and the others also conjured layers of Defensive Shields and Great Formation! 

Yang Luo’s Immortal Suppression Pagoda, Ten Thousand Dragon Cauldron, Chaos 
Bell, Primordial Dragon Stele, Holy Dragon Ancient Mirror, and Dragon Soul Tao Seal 
stood in the foremost position! 

Bujie’s Wutian Demon Stele also stood in the forefront! 

The Dharma artifacts summoned by Wu Qiansheng and others brought up the rear! 



“Slaughter Demon Palace!” 

Bujie shouted again. 

Buzzing sound! 

The broken Slaughter Demon Palace flew out, continuously expanding and growing 
larger, emitting a dazzling demonic light, and stood in the forefront! 

Of course, while defending, Yang Luo and the others also continued to mobilize the 
energy within their bodies, striking with layers of assaults, fiercely attacking! 

Bang, bang, bang!… 

Boom, boom, boom!… 

The sounds of clashing and explosions echoed continuously! 

The vast expanse of light and energy exploded, rushing upward to Cangqiong and 
downward to the sea! 

The Cloud Sea above Cangqiong was completely scattered, and a huge whirlpool was 
blasted out in the sea below! 

Gigantic waves were stirred up all around, overwhelmingly majestic! 

However, there were thousands of adversaries, with eight Daluo Golden Immortals 
among them! 

Despite Yang Luo and the others’ strong defense and aggressive assaults, they couldn’t 
withstand such a fierce assault from so many adversaries! 

“Aaaaa…” 

Yang Luo and the others cried out in pain, retreating repeatedly under the pressure! 

Yet, everyone remained fiercely resilient, fighting desperately to resist! 

“You dare resist!” 

Qiao Qingshi’s face was cold and severe, resonantly saying: “Everyone, no need to hold 
back, let’s go all out! 

Otherwise, it won’t be easy to capture them!” 

“Alright!” 



The crowd responded in unison. 

Immediately, thousands of people continued to mobilize the energy within their bodies, 
launching even stronger assaults, fiercely attacking Yang Luo and the others! 

But just at this critical moment! 

Resounding voices came from afar! 

“Who dares to hurt my Brother Yang!” 

“You dare harm Little Luo, you’re courting death!” 

“Little Luo, we’re coming!” 

In an instant! 

Immortal rainbows shot out from afar, tearing through Changkong, blasting towards the 
assaults launched by Huang Yuchen and others! 

Bang bang boom! 

Boom boom boom! 

Amidst the sounds of clashing and explosions, the assaults launched by Huang Yuchen 
and others were completely destroyed! 

“Ughhhh…” 

Huang Yuchen and others let out waves of miserable screams, all being blown away. 

Bujie asked in shock, “What happened, why do I seem to hear the voices of King of 
Creation and the others, am I hallucinating?” 

“I seem to have heard it too!” 

Ning Jianfeng said in a daze, “Besides the voices of King of Creation and them, I also 
seem to have heard the voices of Uncle Yi and them!” 

Yang Luo naturally heard it as well. 

Suppressing the excitement in his heart, he suddenly turned his head to look into the 
distance. 

He saw a group of people flying rapidly from afar, quickly reaching this aerial space. 



Upon seeing the newcomers. 

Yang Luo, Bujie, and the others were initially stunned, then faces filled with intense 
excitement! 

The newcomers were none other than the King of Creation, Sacred Prison King, 
Emperor of the Dead, Ice Empress, and Divine Light and Darkness! 

Besides the five from King of Creation! 

The five Grand Elders of Reincarnation Sacred Land, Xu Tingshen, Jiang Lanyue, Cao 
Yunhan, Cheng Qianfan, Fang Yizhou also arrived! 

Even the ruler of Da Yi Immortal Country, Yi Jiuxiao, and four elders Yi Pingsheng, Yi 
Tianhong, Zhao Tingyu, and Zheng Fengshi also arrived! 

“Hahaha…” 

The King of Creation laughed loudly, “Brother Yang, Brother Bujie, Brother Xu…We 
finally found you all!” 

Emperor of the Dead raised an eyebrow, jokingly said, “Brothers, you really look too 
shabby right now, huh?” 

The Sacred Prison King, Ice Empress, and Divine Light and Darkness each laughed, 
looking at Yang Luo and the others. 

“Damn it, it really is you, I thought I heard wrong!” 

“Where were you guys, why couldn’t we find you!” 

Bujie and Ning Jianfeng and the others soared into the sky, flying toward the King of 
Creation and the others. 

Everyone’s eyes turned red, deeply embracing each other. 

Months ago, they had arrived from Earth to Jiuzhou Immortal Domain, but a spatial 
turbulence caused them to scatter. 

During these months, everyone was searching for each other, yet no news was found. 

Now finally meeting, everyone was naturally very delighted and excited. 

Yang Luo looked at the five from King of Creation, feeling deeply, “Quite impressive, I 
didn’t expect such a period of absence, you’ve all made considerable progress.” 



Therefore, now the five from King of Creation have all achieved the Heavenly Immortal 
Perfected Stage, just one step away from being Golden Immortals. 

Emperor of the Dead pouted, “Hey, our progress isn’t as fast as Brother Yang’s. 

Mr. Yi said you have already reached Golden Immortal Late Stage, just one step from 
Perfected Stage.” 

King of Creation smiled and said, “Brother Yang, after hearing about your deeds in 
Huangzhou and Xuanzhou during this period, we were quite shocked!” 

Sacred Prison King laughed, “Brother Yang, indeed, whether in Lower World or Upper 
World, you shine brightly!” 

“Uncle Yi, why did you come? 

And why did you join my brothers in coming together?” 

Yang Luo asked in confusion. 

Yi Jiuxiao replied, “Recently, our people discovered someone tracking you. 

I sensed something was amiss, so I rallied four elders and intended to come and check. 

However, just as we were preparing to set off, these individuals from Reincarnation 
Sacred Land approached us. 

Upon knowing these individuals were your bros, we came together.” 

“Oh…” 

Yang Luo nodded in realization. 

The King of Creation introduced, “Brother Yang, these five are the elders of Heavenly 
State Reincarnation Sacred Land, and also our masters…” 

After hearing the introduction. 

Yang Luo bowed towards Xu Tingshen and the five elders, “Junior Yang Luo greets the 
five elders!” 

Xu Tingshen stroked his beard and smiled, “Little Friend Yang, having such cultivation 
and strength at such a young age, is impressive!” 

Jiang Lanyue smiled and said, “Little Friend Yang, the significant deeds you have 
accomplished in Huangzhou and Xuanzhou during this period have made us all in awe!” 



Yang Luo shook his head and said, “The elders flatter me, what I have accomplished 
means nothing.” 

“Little Luo, what exactly happened, why are these guys trying to kill you?” 

Yi Jiuxiao asked a question. 

Yi Pingsheng and others also looked towards Yang Luo with confusion. 

Yang Luo briefly explained the situation to Yi Jiuxiao and the others. 

After hearing Yang Luo’s explanation. 

Yi Jiuxiao and the others were instantly furious, glaring coldly at Huang Yuchen and 
others! 

Chapter 2745: Chapter 2745: Do You Still Want to Run? 

Yi Jiuxiao roared, “Great Desolate Immortal Country, Da Mang Immortal Country, 
Heavenly Netherworld Immortal Sect, you are indeed impressive, daring to even lay a 
hand on friends of the Da Yi Immortal Country?” 

“You want to kill Little Luo to curry favor with the Golden Crow Sacred Land? You’re 
courting death!” 

Yi Pingsheng also shouted loudly. 

Yi Tianhong, Zhao Tingyu, and Zheng Fengshi’s eyes were also filled with fury. 

Yang Luo not only helped them repair the Sunset Divine Bow and Sun-shooting Divine 
Arrow but also helped them repel the Southern Barbarian Demon Country, holding great 
favor with them. 

Yet, unexpectedly, as soon as Yang Luo left Xuanzhou, someone wanted to kill him. 

The key issue was it also involved the Golden Crow Sacred Land, which truly enraged 
them. 

Xu Tingshen also stepped forward, loudly declaring, “Our five disciples are brothers with 
Little Friend Yang, so Little Friend Yang is also a friend of our Reincarnation Sacred 
Land! 

If you dare to harm Little Friend Yang, our Reincarnation Sacred Land will not tolerate 
it!” 



They had originally intended to take this opportunity to befriend Yang Luo, so naturally, 
they had to step forward. 

For a moment. 

The scene became chaotic. 

“Both the Da Yi Immortal Country from Xuanzhou and the Reincarnation Sacred Land 
from Heavenly State have arrived; what should we do?!” 

“The Da Yi Immortal Country is the first Great Immortal Country of Xuanzhou, while the 
Reincarnation Sacred Land is one of the top three Sacred Lands in Heavenly State, 
each not to be trifled with!” 

“The key is, Yi Pingsheng and Yi Tianhong are both Late Stage Taiyi Xuanxian, while Yi 
Jiuxiao and others are Daluo Golden Immortals; we cannot afford to provoke them!” 

Those cultivators who wanted to force Yang Luo and others to hand over the Ancient 
Relic’s inheritance were trembling, discussing incessantly. 

Huang Yuchen, Mang Tianci, and Nangong Yao’s expressions were incredibly grim. 

They had deliberately left Xuanzhou to attack Yang Luo and others to avoid involving 
the Da Yi Immortal Country. 

But unexpectedly, people from the Da Yi Immortal Country still arrived. 

More crucially, even the Reincarnation Sacred Land from Heavenly State sent people. 

It must be known that among the four small states, Heavenly State is undisputedly the 
first. 

In terms of area, abundance of spiritual energy, cultivation resources, and overall 
strength, it surpasses the other three small states. 

The overall strength of the Reincarnation Sacred Land far exceeds that of our Great 
Desolate Immortal Country, Da Mang Immortal Country, and Heavenly Netherworld 
Immortal Sect. 

“Emperor Da Yi, Elder Xu, we never intended to kill Mr. Yang and his people, we merely 
wanted them to share the treasures and inheritances they found in the Ancient Relic 
with us!” 

“Indeed, it was Huang Yuchen who incited us to deal with Mr. Yang and his people; we 
hope all of you, with great mercy, will spare us!” 



“As long as you let us go, we promise never to trouble Mr. Yang and his people again!” 

Originally, the cultivators who wanted to force Yang Luo and others to hand over the 
treasures and inheritances from the Ancient Relics hurriedly begged for forgiveness. 

They dared not provoke the Da Yi Immortal Country and the Reincarnation Sacred 
Land. 

Huang Yuchen immediately panicked, hurriedly saying, “These guys must have 
obtained numerous treasures and inheritances from that Ancient Relic, don’t you want 
them?” 

“As long as we join forces, we can still contend with them!” 

Nangong Yao also hurriedly spoke up. 

“If you want to seek death, don’t drag us into it!” 

“Treasures and inheritances are indeed tempting, but you must have a life to take 
them!” 

“We harbor no life-and-death grudge against Little Friend Yang and his people; why 
should we risk our lives for you?” 

The crowd of cultivators coldly shouted, utterly unmoved. 

Yi Jiuxiao looked at Yang Luo, asking, “Little Luo, how do you want to deal with these 
guys?” 

Yang Luo replied, “Uncle Yi, I indeed have no life-and-death grudge with these guys! 

Since these guys want to leave, then let them go!” 

To him, these people were merely opportunistic, whether killed or set free wouldn’t 
make much difference. 

However, Huang Yuchen and his kind must die! 

Yi Jiuxiao cast a cold glance and said, “Get lost now!” 

“Thank you, Mr. Yang!” 

“Thank you, Emperor Da Yi!” 

These people thanked repeatedly before quickly fleeing the scene. 



Once they left. 

Only over five hundred guards and disciples from the Great Desolate Immortal Country, 
Da Mang Immortal Country, and Heavenly Netherworld Immortal Sect remained. 

And only four Daluo Golden Immortals: Qiao Qingshi, Sun Yanxiu, Fu Sinian, and Feng 
Ziqin were left. 

“Little Luo, what about these guys, how should we handle them?” 

Yi Jiuxiao asked a question. 

Yang Luo’s eyes flared with killing intent, he thundered, “Leave none behind, kill without 
mercy!” 

Qiao Qingshi’s face changed drastically, exclaiming in shock, “We belong to the Great 
Desolate Immortal Country, Da Mang Immortal Country, and Heavenly Netherworld 
Immortal Sect! 

If you kill us, are you not afraid of inciting a war?” 

“So what if a war is incited!” 

Yi Jiuxiao was immensely domineering, stepping forward, he thundered, “Little Friend 
Yang is our Da Yi Immortal Country’s most cherished friend! 

For Little Friend Yang, we are willing to fight!” 

Yi Pingsheng, Yi Tianhong, Zhao Tingyu, and Zheng Fengshi also took a step forward, 
exuding immense dominance! 

Xu Tingshen and the other five elders also stepped forward, standing up. 

“Damn it!” 

Qiao Qingshi gritted his teeth and roared angrily, “You really won’t let us go?” 

“Won’t let you go!” 

Yi Jiuxiao thundered back. 

“Alright, alright, alright!” 

Qiao Qingshi’s face twisted with malice, “You will pay for what you’ve done today!” 

“Kill!” 



Yi Jiuxiao did not waste more words, roaring the word ‘kill’, charging forward! 

Yi Tianhong, along with the four elders, including Xu Tingshen and the five elders, 
charged forward as well! 

Bujie laughed heartily and excitedly said, “Brothers, we can fight side by side again!” 

Yang Luo’s face was icy, he thundered, “Brothers, charge together, kill without mercy!” 

“Finish them!” 

“Kill them!” 

Ning Jianfeng and others were also extremely excited, charging forward with Yang Luo! 

Seeing Yang Luo and others charging over. 

Huang Yuchen immediately panicked, “What should we do, what should we do now?!” 

Nangong Yao said in a deep voice, “This place is too far from Huangzhou, we can’t call 
for reinforcements!” 

“Huang Yuchen!” 

Mang Tianci roared angrily, “You were the one insistent on killing Yang Luo, now you’ve 
ruined us!” 

Huang Yuchen shouted viciously, “You agreed to this plan too, why blame me!” 

“Enough!” 

Qiao Qingshi roared, “At a crucial moment, yet you’re fighting amongst yourselves! 

Find a way to escape!” 

Saying this, Qiao Qingshi turned to flee, taking Huang Yuchen and others with him! 

“No escape!” 

Yi Pingsheng waved his large sleeve! 

In an instant! 

A solid and heavy golden barrier materialized in front, connecting the sky and the sea, 
blocking Huang Yuchen and others’ path! 



Huang Yuchen and others crazily attacked the golden barrier, but they couldn’t break 
through! 

It must be known that Yi Pingsheng possessed Late Stage Taiyi Xuanxian cultivation, 
and the barrier he condensed naturally couldn’t be breached by Huang Yuchen and 
others! 

“No escape, let’s fight them!” 

Qiao Qingshi roared hoarsely, unleashing his full aura and battle power, charging 
towards Yi Pingsheng and others! 

“Kill!!!” 

Sun Yanxiu and others all roared, unleashing full battle power, charging forward! 

The battle erupted again! 

Huang Yuchen was scared out of his mind, still trying to find a way to escape! 

But, right at this moment! 

A cold, eerie voice came over! 

“Still trying to escape?” 

Upon hearing this voice. 

He looked up sharply, only to see Yang Luo, wielding the Dragon Emperor Sword, had 
somehow appeared above him. 

Chapter 2746: Chapter 2746: Slaying the Emperor’s Son! 

"Ah..." 

Seeing Yang Luo appear like a ghost, Huang Yuchen was startled and screamed, 
turning to flee. 

"You can’t escape." 

Yang Luo spoke indifferently, stepping forward and instantly appearing in front of Huang 
Yuchen. 

He looked up at Huang Yuchen, coldly saying, "Huang Yuchen, the first time at the 
Immortal Desolate Ancient Mine, I just taught you a lesson and didn’t take your life! 



The second time in Donghuang City, to avoid causing trouble for the Da Xia Immortal 
Country, I still didn’t take your life! 

But this time, you brought so many people to kill me! 

Once, twice, but there won’t be a third, this time, I must kill you!" 

Huang Yuchen was trembling with fear, stammering, "Brother Yang... I... I know I was 
wrong! 

I will never dare again... I hope you can spare my life!" 

"Spare your life?" 

Yang Luo’s gaze became even colder, "Are you dreaming?" 

"You..." 

Huang Yuchen stared at Yang Luo, eyes filled with determination, "I’ll fight you to the 
death!" 

He held his halberd, going berserk, charging towards Yang Luo! 

At the moment of approach! 

He suddenly mobilized the energy within him to the extreme, unleashing all his combat 
strength, and activated his physique! 

He then swung his halberd, slashing at Yang Luo! 

Rumble, rumble, rumble! 

The huge halberd split a large section of the Cloud Sea, shaking the firmament and the 
ocean, as if to cleave everything apart! 

But, Yang Luo remained calm, his right hand flipped and he directly slashed out with his 
sword! 

Swish! 

A sword cut through the sky, the golden sword light was dazzling, and the sword might 
and sword intent it exploded with were terrifying beyond measure! 

Clang clang clang! 

The huge sword and halberd collided heavily, a crisp collision sound echoing! 



Blazing light and majestic energy erupted, sweeping in all directions! 

Collision lasted less than half a minute! 

Crunch! 

The halberd in Huang Yuchen’s hand was directly severed by Yang Luo’s sword! 

After severing Huang Yuchen’s weapon, the sword continued to slash towards his right 
arm! 

Pfft! 

His right arm was directly severed by Yang Luo’s sword! 

A severed arm fell from the sky, splattering a large amount of blood! 

"Ahh..." 

He let out a painful scream, his body staggering back! 

Yang Luo’s face was cold, without any mercy or pity, and once again swung his sword! 

Pfft! 

Huang Yuchen’s left arm was also severed by the sword! 

"Aahhhh..." 

He let out a scream of extreme pain, shouting with rage, "Yang Luo, I’ll drag you down 
with me!!!" 

With the roar of anger! 

He mobilized the energy within him to the extreme, crazily charging at Yang Luo, 
wanting to self-destruct his physical body and Essence Soul, taking Yang Luo with him! 

Yang Luo’s eyes flashed with killing intent, his hands tightly gripping the Dragon 
Emperor Sword, slashing angrily at Huang Yuchen! 

"Die!!!" 

Swish! 

A world-shaking sword move, the sword might swept the Jiutian, the sword intent broke 
the firmament! 



"Ah!!!" 

With the final scream. 

Huang Yuchen’s physical body and Essence Soul were directly severed by Yang Luo’s 
sword! 

His two halves fell, a large amount of blood raining down from the air! 

A long abyss-like chasm was cleaved open in the sea below, terrifying beyond belief! 

The "Beihuang Emperor’s Son" Huang Yuchen, thus perished! 

After slaying Huang Yuchen! 

Yang Luo’s figure flashed, charging directly towards Mang Tianci who was fiercely 
battling Wu Qiansheng and the others! 

In an instant! 

Yang Luo was upon Mang Tianci! 

He soared into the sky, his right hand gripping the Dragon Emperor Sword tightly, 
slashing fiercely at Mang Tianci! 

"You will die too!" 

Swish! 

The golden sword cut through the sky once more, the sword light flashed brilliantly, 
sword might and sword intent bursting forth, engulfing the heavens and the seas! 

"Don’t even think about it!" 

Mang Tianci roared, swinging his huge axe to meet the attack! 

Clang, clang, clang! 

The huge sword and axe collided heavily, the momentum shocking the heavens! 

Even though Mang Tianci barely blocked Yang Luo’s sword, he was being pushed down 
continuously! 

"Ten Thousand Mang Mountain!" 



Mang Tianci shouted hoarsely, mountains towering above formed a mountain range, 
crashing towards Yang Luo! 

Yang Luo merely shook all over, mobilizing the power of the blood essence within him! 

"Roar, roar, roar!" 

The Holy Dragons, Four Great Divine Beasts, and Four Great Fierce Beasts roared out, 
crashing into the mountains! 

Rumble, rumble, rumble! 

The Holy Dragons, Four Great Divine Beasts, and Four Great Fierce Beasts directly 
smashed through the mountains, crashing fiercely into Mang Tianci’s body! 

Pfft... 

He spat out a mouthful of blood, being blasted away. 

Yang Luo stepped forward once more, continuously wielding his sword, slashing at 
Mang Tianci! 

Mang Tianci was terrified, hastily raising his huge axe to block! 

Clang, clang, clang! 

After blocking the first three swords! 

The fourth sword directly severed Mang Tianci’s huge axe! 

"What?!" 

Mang Tianci’s expression was filled with fear, quickly forming a Defensive Shield to 
block! 

But it still could not withstand! 

Boom! 

The fifth sword directly shattered the Defensive Shield formed by Mang Tianci! 

The sixth sword continued to fall, slashing towards Mang Tianci himself! 

"No, don’t, don’t!!!" 

Mang Tianci screamed in terror, "Brother Yang, I was wrong, please spare me... Ah!!!" 



Under the final scream! 

Pfft! 

Mang Tianci’s physical body and Essence Soul were directly severed by the sixth 
sword! 

The "Emperor Da Mang" Mang Tianci, thus died! 

At the very moment Yang Luo slew Mang Tianci! 

Wu Qiansheng, Lu Yunqi, Xia Chaoyang, and Bujie launched a full-scale ferocious 
assault on Nangong Yao! 

"Nine Yang Kill Seal!" 

"Star Moon Array Map!" 

"World Destruction Spear!" 

"Wutian Great Demon Seal!" 

In the blink of an eye! 

A crimson huge seal burned with raging fire, scorching the heavens and the earth! 

A Zijin Star Moon Array Map emitted brilliant light, illuminating the sky! 

A black Demon Seal surrounded by rolling demonic qi, swept the Jiutian! 

Two huge seals and an array map simultaneously suppressed and killed! 

A platinum huge spear pierced through the Void, wrapped with an Azure Dragon, shot 
explosively upwards! 

At this time. 

The King of Creation, Sacred Prison King, Emperor of the Dead, Ice Empress, and 
Divine Light and Darkness also charged over! 

"Slaughter Reincarnation Fist!" 

"Ten Thousand Paths to Saint Palm!" 

"Six Harmonies Sky-reaching Finger!" 



"Ice Soul Frost Technique!" 

"Five Directions Divine Sky Seal!" 

The fist and palm pressed down on the firmament, the giant finger pierced through the 
sky! 

Ice waves surged up in thousands, washing upwards! 

The Five Directions Immortal Seal was condensed, like five Immortal Mountains, 
suppressing upwards! 

Nangong Yao was terrified, his face pale, immediately mobilizing all the energy within 
him, wielding his sword! 

"Heavenly Netherworld Ten Killings Sword!" 

Swish, swish, swish! 

Ten cyan-black huge swords condensed, emitting dazzling immortal light, shooting out 
together! 

Each sword contained vast sword intent, Heaven and Earth Great Dao power and 
Power of Laws! 

Bang, bang, bang! 

Rumble, rumble, rumble! 

Clashes and explosions resounded, the Jiutian echoed, the ocean surged, raising giant 
waves in thousands! 

But, under the fierce attack of Wu Qiansheng and the others, Nangong Yao simply 
couldn’t withstand it! 

"Ah..." 

He let out a scream, flying backwards, blood spurting from his mouth, his body 
splattered with large amounts of blood! 

Bujie laughed and said, "Yo, King of Creation, the cultivation techniques and immortal 
techniques you’re using now, I’ve never seen them before, they’re quite powerful!" 

Chapter 2747: Chapter 2747: God Slaying the Divine Son! 



The King of Creation laughed heartily and said, “We learned all this from the 
Reincarnation Sacred Land!” 

The Ice Empress said, “Elder Xiu and the others taught us many powerful cultivation 
techniques and also helped us improve the ones we already knew! 

Because of this, our strength has greatly advanced!” 

“I see.” 

Bujie nodded in realization, curling his lips, “You all are really lucky, landing directly in 
the Heavenly State! 

Unlike us, who landed in Huangzhou, it was like starting in hell mode, almost lost our 
lives!” 

“Starting in hell mode?” 

The Divine Light and Darkness were puzzled, “What do you mean by that? What exactly 
did you experience after arriving in the Jiuzhou Immortal Domain?” 

The King of Creation, the Sacred Prison King, the Emperor of the Dead, and the Ice 
Empress were all puzzled as well. 

Just as Bujie was about to speak! 

“Brothers, stop talking; that guy is trying to run!” 

Wu Qiansheng shouted loudly. 

Bujie said, “Let’s finish the fight before we chat properly!” 

“Alright!” 

The five of them, the King of Creation, nodded in agreement. 

Then, Wu Qiansheng and the nine, including Bujie, directly pursued the fleeing 
Nangong Yao. 

Nangong Yao couldn’t escape and was caught up by the nine, including Bujie. 

In a panic, he retreated and pleaded, “Brother Wu, Brother Lu, Brother Xia, I was only 
ensnared by Huang Yuchen to attack you! 

I truly realize my mistake, and I hope you can spare my life for the sake of our long-
standing friendship!” 



Wu Qiansheng looked decisively and said, “Nangong Yao, the moment you allied with 
Huang Yuchen and tried to take our lives, our friendship ended!” 

Lu Yunqi also said with booming voice, “Different paths, we cannot collaborate!” 

“Blame yourself for choosing the wrong path!” 

Xia Chaoyang shouted coldly. 

“Ah!!!” 

Nangong Yao howled wildly, his long hair flying, mobilizing the energy within him to the 
extreme, a blinding beam burst from him! 

A Dharma Idol immediately towered up, head reaching the Cangqiong, feet standing on 
the Void! 

Then, he and his Dharma Idol raised their arms simultaneously, surging energy 
gathered between their palms! 

“Heavenly Netherworld Immortal Transformation Technique!” 

Accompanied by a resonant roar! 

He and his Dharma Idol simultaneously unleashed the gathered immortal power! 

Bang! 

Two massive cyan-black immortal rainbows shot out simultaneously, intertwining to 
form a wave-like blast, striking forward! 

“Nine-layered Immortal Destruction Technique!” 

Wu Qiansheng’s body trembled as he continued to mobilize the energy within, then 
fiercely swung his right hand! 

Nine crimson Fire Waterfalls pierced the Cangqiong, rushing down towards Nangong 
Yao and his Dharma Idol! 

“Star Moon Divine Killing Technique!” 

Lu Yunqi also brought his body’s energy to the extreme, then waved his large hand! 

A full moon gathered in the sky above, surrounded by a vast array of stars! 



Moonlight and starlight burst from the full moon and stars, their destructive power 
boundless! 

“Connate Dao Formula·Nine Character Mantra!” 

Xia Chaoyang stomped down heavily in mid-air! 

The Cangqiong and the sea trembled violently! 

“Pro, Soldier, Battle, Person, All, Formation, Row, Front, Line” nine ancient characters 
gathered! 

Seemingly transforming into several ancient character seals, emanating dazzling 
immortal light, suppressing and killing! 

“Wutian Demon Domain!” 

Bujie also frantically mobilized the energy within, demonic light flickering on his body, 
demonic qi soaring! 

A Dharma Domain evolved above him, a mountain of corpses and a sea of blood, 
Demon Mountain countless layers, overwhelming killing aura, as if evolving into a small 
world, suppressing and killing! 

“Reincarnation Immortal Suppressing Map!” 

“Life and Death Immortal Burial Tomb!” 

“Heavenly Cold Xuanming Break!” 

“Tian Gang Nine Thunders Destruction!” 

“Yuan Ling Extermination Seal!” 

The King of Creation, the Sacred Prison King, the Emperor of the Dead, the Ice 
Empress, and the Divine Light and Darkness launched a fierce attack! 

In an instant! 

Immortal Map, Immortal Tomb, ice, lightning bolt, huge seal carried the power of 
Destroying Heaven and Earth, suppressing and killing! 

In a flash! 

Bang bang bang! 



Crash boom! 

Striking and exploding sounds resounded continuously, echoing through the Cangqiong 
and sea, ringing across the four seas and eight wastelands! 

“Ah…” 

Nangong Yao could no longer hold on, letting out a wretched scream, as his physical 
body exploded in the air! 

His Essence Soul rushed out of his body, burning with Primordial Spirit Fire, charging 
towards Bujie and the nine, intending to self-detonate and severely injure the nine! 

“Courting death!” 

Bujie shouted coldly, moving his thoughts. 

Bzz bzz bzz! 

The Wutian Demon Stele suspended above him emitted a beam of demonic light, 
directly obliterating Nangong Yao’s Essence Soul! 

“Heavenly Netherworld Divine Son” Nangong Yao, thus perished! 

Wu Qiansheng exclaimed, “The power of this Wutian Demon Stele is indeed 
impressive! 

If the Wutian Demon Stele could be restored to its original state, its power would be 
unimaginable!” 

Lu Yunqi and Xia Chaoyang were also greatly shocked. 

In this battle, they witnessed the power of the Wutian Demon Stele. 

The key is that this Wutian Demon Stele is already severely damaged, yet it can still 
unleash such power, truly remarkable. 

“That’s a must!” 

Bujie smiled smugly and said, “If we find good materials in the future, I’ll have Brother 
Yang help me repair the Wutian Demon Stele and Slaughter Demon Palace! 

Then, carrying these two Dharma artifacts, I’ll definitely wreak havoc!” 

Lu Yunqi laughed and said, “If it can be repaired, that would be excellent! 



I’d also like to witness the power of the repaired Wutian Demon Stele and Slaughter 
Demon Palace!” 

“Brother Bujie, where did you get this broken stele, and why is its power so terrifying?” 

The King of Creation also asked curiously. 

The Sacred Prison King, the Emperor of the Dead, the Ice Empress, and the Divine 
Light and Darkness all looked at the Wutian Demon Stele suspended above Bujie. 

They naturally noticed the Wutian Demon Stele earlier, but because it was so damaged, 
they didn’t pay much attention. 

However, the power that the Wutian Demon Stele unleashed truly astounded them. 

This broken stele is definitely not as simple as it appears on the surface. 

Bujie chuckled and said, “I’ll tell you in detail once the battle is over! 

By then, you’ll definitely be astonished and worship Lord Buddha!” 

“Tch!” 

The Emperor of the Dead rolled his eyes, “You’re still as cocky as ever!” 

The King of Creation, the Sacred Prison King, the Ice Empress, and the Divine Light 
and Darkness were also rendered speechless. 

They originally thought Bujie would become more composed after following Yang Luo 
through so much in the Jiuzhou Immortal Domain. 

However, who would have thought, this guy’s personality hasn’t changed at all. 

But then again, if he changed, he wouldn’t be Bujie. 

Wu Qiansheng laughed heartily and said, “Brothers, let’s go, let’s wipe out those guys 
from the Great Desolate Immortal Country, Da Mang Immortal Country, and the 
Heavenly Netherworld Immortal Sect too!” 

“Alright!” 

Bujie and the others responded with booming voices. 

Subsequently, Bujie and the others flashed and directly charged towards those guards 
and disciples. 



Also at that moment. 

Crash boom! 

A ground-shaking explosion sounded from the distant sky. 

“Ah…” 

Qiao Qingshi let out a miserable scream, directly blasted away. 

He spat blood, and his body was torn apart, covered in blood. 

Yi Pingsheng stood quietly in the distant sky, hair and beard flowing, robe fluttering, his 
body shining with immortal light, completely unscathed. 

Chapter 2748: Chapter 2748: You Can’t Escape! 

Although Qiao Qingshi possessed a late-stage Daluo Golden Immortal cultivation. 

Yi Pingsheng, however, had a late-stage Taiyi Xuanxian cultivation. 

The difference between them was like that between heaven and earth. 

Therefore, no matter what kind of offensive Qiao Qingshi launched, it was easily 
neutralized by Yi Pingsheng. 

Moreover, every attack Yi Pingsheng made gravely injured Qiao Qingshi. 

"Yi Pingsheng, I’ll fight you to the death!" 

Qiao Qingshi, appearing frenzied, pushed the energy in his body to the extreme, 
activated his Dharma Idols, and charged toward Yi Pingsheng. 

In the midst of his charge. 

He unleashed a barrage of lethal attacks, fiercely attacking Yi Pingsheng! 

"Great Desolate Burial Immortal Technique!" 

"Yin Yang Chaos Map!" 

"Heavenly Net Aurora Slash!" 

A sea of gray-black energy light rose in thousand-zhang waves, surging from all 
directions toward Yi Pingsheng! 



An Immortal Map coagulated in the sky, gathering the power of yin and yang, carrying 
the mighty Power of Laws, and advancing to suppress and kill! 

The surging energy transformed into a massive blade, tearing through the sky, slashing 
with fury! 

Yi Pingsheng did not dodge or retreat but directly threw a punch! 

"Emperor Yi’s Dominating Sky Fist!" 

A golden fist was thrown, seemingly plain, but it shattered the void, unleashing the 
strongest Heavenly Earth Dao Power, Power of Laws, and fist intent! 

Rumble! 

Under this punch, all of Qiao Qingshi’s offensives were blasted apart! 

His Dharma Idols were also destroyed by this punch, erupting in the sky! 

"Pfft..." 

He spat out another mouthful of blood, sent flying backward! 

After flying more than a thousand meters away, he barely managed to stabilize himself! 

He was covered in blood, his skin torn and flesh gaping, his hair and beard in disarray, 
no longer the arrogant and spirited person from before! 

Blood flowed from his mouth, making him look extremely miserable! 

He pleaded hoarsely, "Elder Yi, please spare my life! 

I don’t want to die, I really don’t want to die!" 

He had finally reached the late stage of Daluo Golden Immortal, on the cusp of entering 
Taiyi Xuanxian, and naturally didn’t want to lose his life here. 

More importantly, he was still the Country Protecting Elder of the Great Desolate 
Immortal Country, revered by tens of thousands. 

If he died here, all would be lost. 

Yi Pingsheng regarded Qiao Qingshi with cold indifference, speaking flatly, "You don’t 
want to die, but did Little Luo and the others want to die? 

Moreover, you killed Little Luo to collude with the Golden Crow Sacred Land! 



The Golden Crow Sacred Land is a sworn enemy of our Da Yi Immortal Country! 

Anyone who dares to collude with Da Yi Immortal Country’s enemies is our foe! 

Whether for Little Luo or for our Da Yi Immortal Country, you cannot be spared!" 

"You... vile! Hateful!!" 

Qiao Qingshi trembled with anger, roaring furiously, using all his strength, he turned and 
fled! 

At this moment! 

His speed reached its peak, transforming into a swift lightning stream headed into the 
distance, trying to escape from this place! 

Only by escaping and returning to the Great Desolate Immortal Country, could he have 
a chance for revenge! 

"You can’t escape." 

Yi Pingsheng spoke indifferently, then waved his sleeve! 

"Jiu Ling Refining Immortal Formation!" 

In an instant! 

A massive golden formation was laid in the sky, trapping Qiao Qingshi! 

The entire formation covered the heavens and obscured the sun, blooming with 
dazzling golden immortal light, illuminating the night sky! 

"Formation, activate!" 

Yi Pingsheng waved his sleeve again, activating the formation! 

The sun, the moon, and the stars, mountains, rivers, all transformed, moving to 
suppress and kill! 

One by one, the Law Immortal Chains shot from the formation, attacking! 

One after another, golden immortal rainbows burst forth! 

Nine golden giants towered upward, as if summoning the heroic spirits of Da Yi 
Immortal Country’s nine peerless warriors of the past, charging to attack! 



Qiao Qingshi retaliated madly, deploying various weapons and Dharma artifacts to 
attack the formation! 

But he couldn’t shatter the formation, nor could he even shake it! 

Thud, thud, thud!... 

Bang, bang, bang!... 

The sounds of collisions and explosions rang ceaselessly! 

All the offensives he launched were destroyed, his weapons and Dharma artifacts all 
shattered! 

Brilliant light, and mighty energy waves rippled out! 

A large number of weapons and artifact fragments scattered in mid-air! 

"Help! Help!" 

He screamed for help, his body riddled with holes. 

"Ah..." 

With the last scream echoing. 

Rumble! 

The entire formation suddenly exploded in the sky, its energy and light transforming into 
a massive ball of energy, enveloping heaven and earth! 

Until all light and energy dissipated, everything returned to calm! 

Only the vast sky and void were left with two large voids blasted apart! 

The sea beneath was also left with an abyssal whirlpool, unable to heal for a long time! 

As for Qiao Qingshi, both his physical body and Essence Soul were annihilated, 
completely dead! 

And at the moment Qiao Qingshi died! 

Bang, bang, bang! 

Rumble! 



From the sky in the distance came the sounds of earth-shattering collisions and 
explosions! 

"Ugh..." 

"Ah..." 

Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian let out a shrill scream, directly blown away! 

His hair and beard were disheveled, his body stained with blood, skin torn and flesh 
gaping, utterly miserable! 

Across from him in the sky stood four silhouettes! 

It was Yi Jiuxiao, Yi Tianhong, Zhao Tingyu, and Zheng Fengshi! 

The four had cold expressions, with no injuries on their bodies! 

Even though Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian had middle-stage Daluo Golden Immortal 
cultivation, they were ultimately no match for the four! 

After all, Yi Tianhong was a Taiyi Xuanxian, and Yi Jiuxiao, Zhao Tingyu, and Zheng 
Fengshi were all Daluo Golden Immortals! 

Sun Yanxiu roared hoarsely, "Yi Jiuxiao, if you really kill us! 

Our Great Desolate Immortal Country, Da Mang Immortal Country, and Heavenly 
Netherworld Immortal Sect will not let you go!" 

Fu Sinian also snarled viciously, "If you can spare us, we can pretend none of this 
happened today!" 

Yi Jiuxiao’s eyes were cold, "Sun Yanxiu, even at this point, you’re still threatening us? 

Do you really think our Da Yi Immortal Country fears you?" 

Yi Tianhong also looked coldly at Fu Sinian, saying, "And you, do you really think we 
are so easily deceived? 

If we let you go today, it won’t be long before you bring an army to attack our Da Yi 
Immortal Country, will it?" 

Hearing the words of Yi Jiuxiao and Yi Tianhong, Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian’s faces 
turned extremely gloomy. 

Sun Yanxiu gritted his teeth and asked, "Are you really unwilling to let us go?" 



"No release!" 

Yi Jiuxiao responded in a resounding voice, completely severing Sun Yanxiu and Fu 
Sinian’s hope. 

"Good, excellent!" 

Sun Yanxiu’s face was fierce, "This is what you pushed us to! 

Since that’s the case, then let’s battle! 

Even if we die, we’ll drag you down with us!" 

"Nothing to lose but mutual destruction!" 

Fu Sinian also let out a hoarse shout. 

Before the words finished! 

Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian’s eyes were resolute, their bodies quaking, pushing the 
energy within to the extreme! 

And they began frantically burning their own blood essence! 

Boom! 

Boom! 

Two scorching light beams shot up from them, immortal light glimmering, hair and robes 
flying! 

Their previously unwrinkled faces were now covered in wrinkles, and their hair and 
beards turned completely white! 

Rumble! 

Immense and vast pressure and aura erupted from the two, disrupting the heavens, 
shaking all directions... 

Chapter 2749: Chapter 2749: Die a Miserable Death! 

Yi Tianhong shouted in a resonant voice, “No need to hold back, eliminate them 
completely!” 

“Understood!” 



Yi Jiuxiao, Zhao Tingyu, and Zheng Fengshi responded in unison. 

In an instant! 

Boom boom boom! 

All four of Yi Tianhong’s group mobilized their inner energy, beams of light surging from 
their bodies! 

Waves of even more immense power radiated from the four of them, engulfing the vast 
sky and endless sea! 

Rumble rumble rumble! 

The sky and sea trembled violently! 

The clouds churned, and enormous waves rose on the sea! 

“Kill!!!” 

Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian let out a howl, charging madly at Yi Jiuxiao’s group of four! 

On the way! 

The two unleashed their Dharma Idols and summoned all weapons and Dharma 
artifacts, intending to fight to the death! 

“Fight!!!” 

Yi Jiuxiao’s group also shouted loudly, stepping forward to attack the two! 

In the blink of an eye! 

Both sides rapidly closed the distance in the sky and launched a fierce assault! 

“Great Amplification Slaying Immortal Technique!” 

“Wu Liang Sky-reaching Technique!” 

Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian simultaneously launched ferocious attacks! 

Bursts of Immortal rainbows emitted dazzling immortal light, shooting forth! 

Chains of Law Divine Chains swept across the skies, striking up at them! 

Their Dharma Idols swung massive fists and palms, charging in the assault! 



Their weapons and Dharma artifacts unleashed successive offensives, launching a 
suppression kill! 

The desperate attacks they unleashed seemed to destroy and annihilate everything! 

“Even if you burn your blood essence, so what? Are we afraid of you?” 

Yi Jiuxiao, with unparalleled dominance, swung the saber in his hand with a mighty 
slash! 

“Emperor Yi’s Slaying Immortal Blade!” 

Swish! 

With one slash, the saber rays soared to the sky, saber intent raged, wildly 
domineering! 

The vast Cangqiong and Void seemed to be split open, forming an abyssal gorge, dark 
and profound! 

“Chaos Immortal Sword!” 

Zheng Fengshi ascended to the sky, wielding his Immortal Sword and struck heavily! 

Swish! 

A gray-white huge sword tore through the heavens, unleashing terrifying Heavenly 
Earth Dao Power, Power of Laws, and immense sword intent! 

Countless gray-white flying swords shot forth, as if a shocking sword rain was falling! 

Yi Tianhong and Zhao Tingyu also held nothing back, launching fierce attacks 
simultaneously! 

“Qiankun Extinguishing Immortal Map!” 

“Nine Revolutions Mountain Opening Seal!” 

A cyan-gold Immortal Map expanded rapidly, like a curtain, ready to envelop heaven 
and sea! 

The Nine Directions Purple-Gold Seal also expanded with the wind, resembling nine 
towering mountains, launching a suppression kill! 

In no time! 



Clang clang clang! 

Explosive explosion blasting scores echoed everywhere! 

The offensive launched by Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian was continuously destroyed! 

Their weapons and Dharma artifacts disintegrated and exploded in the sky! 

“Ahhh…” 

The two let out heart-wrenching screams, spitting blood, their bodies spattering as they 
were sent flying backward! 

“Continue the attack, we’ll fight them to the end!” 

Sun Yanxiu, blood in his mouth, roared, launching another fierce assault! 

Fu Sinian hesitated not, driving his inner energy to its peak, launching an attack! 

“Reckless!” 

Yi Tianhong shouted, immediately raising his right hand! 

Heavenly Earth Dao Power and Power of Laws converged in his hand instantly, glowing 
with dazzling immortal light! 

His right hand seemed to transform into a giant palm, striking with force! 

Yi Jiuxiao, Zhao Tingyu, and Zheng Fengshi also launched fierce attacks once more! 

Rumble rumble rumble! 

Another earth-shattering explosion resounded throughout the heavens! 

Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian still couldn’t withstand, being crushed back, their flesh 
exploded and flew away! 

“Kill kill kill!!!” 

The two, faces contorted with rage, roared, their Essence Souls emerged from their 
heads, soaring through Changkong, charging at Yi Tianhong and others! 

Their Essence Souls blazed with scorching Primordial Spirit Fire, expanding as if 
preparing to explode their Essence Souls, dragging Yi Tianhong’s group to the grave! 

However, just as their Essence Souls rushed out! 



Whoosh whoosh whoosh! 

Three piercing tearing the air sounds suddenly echoed! 

Accompanied by this piercing sound! 

Three golden divine arrows pierced through the sky like resplendent meteors, shooting 
towards the Essence Souls of Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian! 

These were the “Broken Cloud Arrow,” “Sky Splitting Arrow,” and “Red Spirit Arrow” 
from the Sun-shooting Divine Arrow! 

In the next second! 

Puff puff puff! 

The Broken Cloud Arrow and Sky Splitting Arrow pierced through Sun Yanxiu’s 
Essence Soul! 

The Red Spirit Arrow pierced through Fu Sinian’s Essence Soul! 

“Who?!” 

“Who is it?!” 

Their physical bodies and Essence Souls simultaneously turned to look towards the 
distant sky. 

A slender, upright figure with a calm face, holding a golden Divine Bow, stood there! 

It was Yang Luo! 

“You little beast… it’s you!” 

“Damn it… you!” 

They had intended to self-destruct their Essence Souls to take Yi Tianhong’s group 
down with them! 

But then, a brat had interfered, causing their plan to fail! 

With cold eyes, Yang Luo looked at the two and said heavily, “Just a while ago, you 
were happily trying to hunt me and my brother, weren’t you?” 

“You little beast…” 



“Aaaaaahhh!!!” 

With their final roars and screams. 

Bang bang bang bang! 

Their Essence Souls exploded in the air, and their bodies were shattered by the 
onslaught from Yi Tianhong’s group! 

And so. 

Sun Yanxiu and Fu Sinian of the Great Desolate Immortal Country and Heavenly 
Netherworld Immortal Sect were annihilated! 

At that moment. 

In the distant sky, the Five of Them—King of Creation, Emperor of the Dead, Ice 
Empress, and Divine Light and Darkness were all dumbstruck! 

The Emperor of the Dead’s eyes widened in amazement, “It seems the rumors from 
some time ago were true, huh? 

Little Brother Yang really did shoot dead the Crown Prince and Elder of Golden Crow 
Sacred Land during the great battle!” 

The Ice Empress’s lips curved slightly, revealing a charming smile. 

The King of Creation laughed out loud, “Well done, Brother Yang!” 

Even the Sacred Prison King gave a strong punch. “Truly worthy of our Divine Emperor, 
indeed powerful!” 

Even in the distance, where the Heavenly Netherworld Immortal Sect elders were 
battling. 

“Little Friend Yang is truly impressive; his true power remains a mystery to us!” 

“Who would have thought that the incomplete Sunset Divine Bow and the Sun-shooting 
Divine Arrow would show such power in Little Friend Yang’s hands!” 

“If Little Friend Yang could join us at the Reincarnation Sacred Land!” 

The five of them spoke one after another. 

Hahahaha… 



Chapter 2750: Chapter 2750: Send Him on His Way! 

At this moment! 

"Damn, that dog is trying to run!" 

Bujie suddenly shouted. 

Everyone turned to look. 

They saw the elder of the Heavenly Netherworld Immortal Sect, Feng Ziqin, trying to 
escape amidst the chaos. 

"Everyone, rest assured, this old guy won’t escape!" 

Xu Tingshen said loudly and then took a step forward to chase after him. 

Jiang Lanyue, Cao Yunhan, Cheng Qianfan, and Fang Yizhou also stepped forward, 
pursuing as well. 

The five of them moved with incredible speed, like five streaks of lightning across the 
sky! 

Within just a few breaths, Xu Tingshen and the others caught up to Feng Ziqin! 

Feng Ziqin, in a panic, dove straight down, crashing into the sea with a "boom," trying to 
escape through the waters! 

"You can’t escape!" 

Xu Tingshen shouted, stomping heavily in mid-air. 

Bang! 

The sky and sea trembled violently! 

Crash! 

A huge wave directly flushed Feng Ziqin out! 

"Damn!" 

Feng Ziqin, in disgrace, roared in anger, "I’ll fight you to the death!" 

He shuddered all over, mobilizing the energy within his body to the extreme, and also 
burned his own blood essence, unleashing even greater combat strength! 



As he burned his blood essence, his momentum and battle strength continued to rise, 
and a massive silvery-gray beam of light erupted from his body! 

Rumble! 

The sky and sea without knowing how many miles around began to tremble violently, as 
if about to overturn! 

"Kill!!!" 

Feng Ziqin let out a screeching roar, wielding an Immortal Sword, unveiling the Dharma 
Idol, and unleashed all his weapons and artifacts, charging towards Xu Tingshen and 
the others! 

In the midst of the assault! 

He swung his sword furiously towards Xu Tingshen and the others! 

"Ten Thousand Beasts Sword Technique!" 

Swish! 

With one sword swing, the sword light dazzled the world, and the sword intent soared to 
the sky! 

Countless silvery-gray flying swords transformed into a sea of swords, surging forward! 

Even more countless immortal beasts coalesced, charging wildly on the sea of swords 
towards Xu Tingshen and his group! 

Facing Feng Ziqin’s frenzied attack! 

Xu Tingshen’s group of five remained calm and composed, their eyes unmoved! 

"Feng Ziqin, even if you burn your blood essence, so what!" 

Xu Tingshen shouted energetically, continuously mobilizing the energy within his body, 
then waved his wide sleeves! 

"Reincarnation Treasure Technique!" 

"Annihilate!" 

In an instant! 

Swish! 



A green-gold immortal rainbow, containing terrifying immortal power, the power of the 
Heavenly Earth Dao, and the power of laws, burst out! 

This green-gold immortal rainbow may not seem huge, only a few yards thick, but the 
power it contained was terrifying to the extreme! 

In a flash of lightning! 

Boom! 

This green-gold immortal rainbow fiercely struck the surging sea of swords, erupting 
with an earth-shaking collision sound! 

Under the impact! 

The surging sea of swords shattered and disintegrated on a large scale! 

The numerous charging immortal beasts also exploded in the sky! 

"Ahhh!!!" 

Feng Ziqin went completely mad, continuing to unleash the energy within his body into 
the sea of swords! 

The number of flying swords continued to increase explosively, rampaging through the 
sky, shooting out! 

More immortal beasts continued to coalesce, charging upwards! 

His Dharma Idol also swung the huge sword, slashing fiercely towards Xu Tingshen and 
his group! 

"Reincarnation Burial Immortal Tomb!" 

Jiang Lanyue also mobilized the energy within her body, waving her wide sleeves! 

A Black Gold Tomb rose abruptly, expanding and striking out continuously! 

Ancient runes and immortal patterns were engraved on the tomb, mysterious and 
marvelous, resembling an ancient Immortal Tomb, awe-inspiring! 

As the Immortal Tomb flew out, countless Immortal Illusions flew out as well, charging 
upwards! 

Rumble! 



Boom! 

The sounds of collisions and explosions echoed in the sky and sea, resonating far 
away! 

Xu Tingshen alone was already hard for Feng Ziqin to contend with! 

Now, with Jiang Lanyue also attacking, he was even more unable to resist! 

"Ah..." 

He let out a miserable scream, his body blasted away! 

Blood sprayed from his mouth, flesh and blood splattered, revealing ghastly white bones 
everywhere! 

His Dharma Idol was directly shattered by the Immortal Tomb! 

The evolved sea of swords, and countless immortal beasts all exploded in the air! 

Xu Tingshen’s eyes went cold, he said in a resonant voice, "Give him the final blow, 
send him on his way!" 

"Got it!" 

Jiang Lanyue, Cao Yunhan, Cheng Qianfan, and Fang Yizhou all responded in unison. 

Immediately, the five of them simultaneously mobilized the energy within their bodies, 
launching a fierce assault on the flying Feng Ziqin! 

Five massive energy beams burst out, bombarding towards Feng Ziqin! 

"No... no... no!!!" 

Feng Ziqin shouted in terror, forming layer upon layer of defensive barriers, setting up 
heavy defensive formations, trying to withstand the assault of the five! 

In an instant! 

Bang bang bang! 

The five attacks struck fiercely on the defensive formations and barriers, booming like 
rolling thunder! 

In less than half a minute! 



Boom! 

The layer upon layer of defensive barriers and heavy defensive formations Feng Ziqin 
had formed were all shattered! 

Five energy beams struck fiercely on his body! 

"I am unwilling... I don’t want to die... Ah!!!" 

With the last anguished roar. 

Boom! 

Feng Ziqin’s physical body and Essence Soul exploded in the sky! 

A giant energy mushroom cloud erupted in the sky, soaring high, spectacular! 

Until the light and energy dispersed. 

Only a pool of blood and bone fragments remained in the sky, falling down. 

The elder of the Heavenly Netherworld Immortal Sect, Feng Ziqin, had fallen! 

"Good, well killed!" 

"Weren’t those dogs chasing us relentlessly just now, now they’re dead at last!" 

"The five elders of the Reincarnation Sacred Land, their strength is indeed formidable, 
admirable!" 

Bujie, Ning Jianfeng and others exclaimed, heavily punching the air in triumph. 

At this moment. 

The sky was darkened, stars and the moon hung high. 

The sea was littered with floating bodies, blood, bone fragments, and weapon artifact 
shards. 

Yang Luo glanced around and asked, "Brothers, any fish that slipped through the net?" 

"None!" 

"The Great Desolate Immortal Country, Da Mang Immortal Country, and the Heavenly 
Netherworld Immortal Sect’s people have all been annihilated!" 



Wu Qiansheng and others responded loudly. 

"Very good!" 

Yang Luo nodded, then cupped his hands towards Yi Jiuxiao and Xu Tingshen and 
others, saying, "Junior thanks you all for your help! 

Without your help, my brothers and I would have been in grave danger tonight!" 

Yi Jiuxiao waved it off, "Little Luo, no need to thank your uncle, you are too formal!" 

Xu Tingshen smiled faintly, "Little Friend Yang, I had only heard of your formidable 
strength and your emergence as a new rising young Heavenly Pride! 

Seeing you today, we are truly impressed!" 

Jiang Lanyue stroked his beard and laughed, "Indeed, you are much stronger than we 
imagined!" 

Yang Luo scratched his head and said, "Seniors, my strength is nothing much. 

Otherwise, I wouldn’t have been chased so miserably by those guys." 

"Little Friend Yang, you shouldn’t say that!" 

Xu Tingshen shook his head, "You see, you just faced a chase by thousands, with 
numerous Daluo Golden Immortals! 

It’s already impressive that you’ve managed to hold out until now!" 

 


