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Chapter 261 259. Unexpected Reward 

[Ding! It's detected Sandra has emotional overflow…. 

Requirements for the reward have been met…. 

Congratulations to the host for getting Male Lead experience card…. 

Congratulations to the host, You hit a critical strike…. 

Congratulations to the host for getting a Super Protagonist experience card…. 

Male Lead experience Card : As its name suggests it's an experience card for Male 
Lead experience in the novels. 

When a card is used the host would get the opportunities, reaction, favor and all of the 
Male leads benefits for one time after the use. 

From the time it is activated, All other titles or aura like Villain or side character would be 
ignored by the world and would not have any effect on the working of the card. 

Keep in mind, World will would be one who ignores the title of host but title effects would 
not be affected, So hosts don't have to worry about it. 

(Note : Card would take effect right after using it, So it's suggested to use it in ideal 
condition.) 

Super Protagonist experience card : This is the same as Male Lead experience card but 
higher grade in rarity. 

The function of this card is the same but it gives the benefits of the Protagonist of the 
novel world to the user after being used. 

But because this is a higher rarity card it has additional benefits like of, this card can be 
used indefinitely. 

Indefinitely meaning as long as host has enough RP (Raider Points), Host can use the 
card). 



This card can also be targeted to the specific genre. 

For example hosts can host to target opportunities like treasures, elixirs, weapons, 
cultivation techniques or likes of women (Heroines) and men (Support) encounters. 

This way the host does not have to worry about getting the wrong thing. 

(Note : This is said to be a card but because of its indefinite nature, Once it's used it 
would integrate into the system as an add-on like the netori system. 

Also first time use is free.)] 

'How?!!' 

Now it's Alex's time to become speechless, He swore he did not know what happened, 
He did not foresaw this event. 

He had to heal Sandra, If not he would not even be able to win against her. He was her 
opportunity and for that she was beaten, not the other way around. 

If he did not have means to improve her physique, There would have not been even the 
slightest chance of him ever winning. 

It's highly likely he would have slipped and let her land a hit on him. 

So this is not something he planned, It just happened on its own. 

Which is strange, He is villain not protagonist for whom everything just fall in the place, 
He has to work his ass off, overclocking his brain just to barely able to survive. 

This thing is unexpected to him. 

[Ding! Host this happens because your luck as Villain increases and there is also a new 
ML title of yours. 

Villain also has luck and it too has it's own role, Protagonist luck grants them various 
heaven and earth treasures and opportunities. 

While Villains luck grant them protective means and subordinates to help them in it. 

Both luck has its own role and working but because Protagonist is a good protagonist. 
Villains do not get a chance to shine. 

Right now both affection FL (Sandra) and your luck long surpassed the average limit 
and so your luck triggered this opportunity.] 



System as always seeing Alex has a query jumped out and explains it to him. 

Alex's hearing system stopped for a second and thought it made sense, So he did not 
paid much attention afterwards as his eyes were currently locked on the rewards. 

'I hit the jackpot.' 

That's what he thought and rightly so, What is not can be said to be taking away the 
bread and butter of the protagonist, What's their value now? 

Before he kept Jake alive for two reasons, One is that he was afraid if he killed him 
other baits would pop up, He swear he would cry like a man if that happen. 

He really does not want to deal with many cockroaches like those at once, He would 
burn out from over working his brain. 

Of course the 2nd reason why they were alive is because of their opportunities. He 
knows he can't take those away from protagonists until they themselves pull it out in the 
world. 

He is still waiting for the secret technique Jack has to strengthen his physique, Though 
he already has a very extreme physique two times over thanks to the blessing of 2 
intent physiques of legendary Incubus and SSS-rank Beastmaster along with extra stats 
added on the physique by him before. 

But it does not hurt to get stronger, Especially for someone like him, It would never be 
enough strength, the more whole cards there are the more he would feel safe 
encountering protagonists. 

And the special technique Jake as its main protagonist Golden Finger, Which not going 
to be weak. That technique Jake used till the end of the novel, So it transcends the 
current power level of the world. 

Of course, there is a condition of the technique in which the user has to be a man and 
need constant Yin supplements for nourishment, which they get from having sex with 
various women. 

Which was no problem for Jack, Rather he used that as an excuse to open a harem and 
thanks to his halo these psycho women even allowed it without much problem, Which 
made Alex jealous. 

That's why Alex needs that technique. Unfortunately, that once-in-a-blue-moon 
smartass destroyed the original copy of that technique. Now there are only two copies 
that exist in this world. 



One is known by the master of Jake but as a woman, She is not qualified for to use it 
and for that reason, she can't even fully pass it down to others as to fully pass down the 
technique one first needs to actually know the inner workings of the technique. 

It's like knowing how to drive a car and actually driving a car. Both have a huge 
difference, and then information has to be transferred through spiritual power. 

This is known to the master and hence why she kept the original copy with her as on it 
given through instructions on how to use that technique, Though she read it but the 
subtle details she did not pay attention to and so is missing in her memory. 

The second one of course Jake, He knew how important the copy his master gave him 
was but because of that he destroyed it. 

As he too figured out how powerful that technique was, So how come the protagonist 
left it for others? His master wanted to teach that technique to others but Jake lied to 
her saying he still needed to practice and he needed it to study for a breakthrough. 

Because Jake was a once in a lifetime genius, His master did not doubt him. She 
wanted others to give it a try but knowing how high level that technique is, She thought 
there would be no one in Dragon Gate who was qualified to actually practice it. 

Which is true, though that technique doesn't have much harsh requirement but to start 
one needs quite strong foundation, Which of course only the protagonist should have 
from get go. 

So Jake can hide the fact he destroyed the original copy, Which was the reason he is 
still alive, Though Alex knows Jake would not barf out the whole technique but if Alex 
just boils him like a frog in water, Then he would reveal parts of it. 

Alex just wanted to know the key parts of it. For rest, he can turn into a good student 
and go to ask the dear master for it. 

At least it was a plan before, But after the Legendary Protagonist Card, Things 
changed. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁.) 

Chapter 262 260. Unexpected Events 

'System, what would happen if I killed Jake now?' 

Now that there is no need to keep Jake alive, As he can just use the Protagonist card 
near the master of his or even near Jake choosing cultivation technique, That would 
guarantee that he would get that technique. 



Even if not that same technique at least it would get equivalent to that or even stronger, 
So there is no point in keeping Jake jumping around. 

After all he is a wild variable, Not only has Stregenten equal to the B-Rank warrior but 
his true rank is S-Rank. 

Right now he is injured and hence why Alex is able to beat him because his power is 
locked on B-Rank. 

But there is no saying of his broken luck just kicking in and making heaven defying 
healing medicine fall from out of nowhere to him. 

If that happens then it's hard to deal with Jake, Though right now there are at least 3 S-
Rank around him, Which would be hard even for the protagonist to deal with but Jake 
also has his broken luck to make an escape and come back stronger. 

He really does not want to face that situation, If he can then he wants to finish Jake 
before he pulls any stunt. 

Of course there is a chance another one pops up to fill his place but as long as the initial 
force is not too much, Alex is sure he can nip them in the bud. 

[Ding! Host Jake is just a bait protagonist, His luck is already down, If the host wants 
you can kill him there would not no backlash thanks to the Villain halo of host. 

But the system suggests against it, Jake still has a lot of luck on him, Which may create 
variables and because there is that luck, the system would also release missions from 
time to time. 

It's better to shed him of every last bit of luck before killing him, Which not only grant 
better reward for doing so but luck and villain aura of you also strengthen, giving you 
more mobility for the future maneuvers.] 

System quick on response to him, And the proposition is put forward by it also soild. 

Alex needed a second to decided, It's a clasic high risk high reward thing. 

If he just go and kill Jake, He would not going to get all the luck on his body, Some 
would belos lost in process as it try to protect Jake. 

Same because there was not much luck on Jake, System would not going going to give 
that good reward rhought it would be not bad either. 

But if he stop and make Jake bleed till last drop, Not onky he would get all luck but also 
reward would be also better, and rightly be so as risk of keepping Jake around was too 
much and if he killeed it then reward also be astronomical. 



'Well let's keep dear brother-in-law around for while.' 

Alex decided, Yeah it is a risky ordeal but he too needs rewards for it. He has to build 
his foundation as strong as possible as there is no saying what kinda new protagonist 
would be. 

He comes out of the system place after the talk, It's been decided for the safety and 
unforeseen problems which would arise after the death of Jake, It's smart to keep him 
around for milking. 

Of course making sure his claws were cut and teeths were uprooted all the time, Alex 
did not wanted to face yiger going back in the mountain and then killing it's way back in. 

"Alex, how do you do it?" 

Outside the system space time was flowing normal, So after Sandra overwhelmed from 
the emotions she quickly suppressed and asked Alex out. 

But as soon as she spoke she regretted it. In their world it's taboo to ask how someone 
does it. 

It often does not end well for the party that was being asked this question, It's similar to 
the "I like your shoes". 

It's a threat and if you do not do as they want you to hand it over, There is even a threat 
to their life. 

Of course Sandra did not wanted this to come like this, Sbe was genuinely surprised but 
this act does not has a good reputation. 

Sandra wanted to slap tightly to herself for being this stupid. The problem related to 
misunderstanding of her being a secret agent who wanted to get to her yet to solve and 
here she dig herself another grave to jump in. 

Even if Alex understood and spoke up, It's still bad as revealing secrets like this would 
start wizard hunt level trouble. 

No matter how strong the family of Alex is, In front of the treasure like this, They would 
not give face to the others as benefits are too much. 

"...." 

Alex was stunned. He was ready to answer her but just as she asked the question her 
lake-like pure beautiful eyes became watery as if the next moment she would burst out 
crying. 



He didn't know what happened to her nor was he able to figure out what to do, It was so 
unexpected. 

So he did what he knew how to do best, He cupped her cheeks with his soft hands and 
captured her lips with his. 

"Mumhh~!!!" 

This time it was Sandra's turn to be taken aback, She was ready to face the wrath of 
Alex but this unexpected surprise for her. 

Her body suddenly became tense but after a moment nearly melted in his arms after 
realizing he was kissing her. 

All the negative emotions of hers that birthed because of events happens last d 

a few hours was instantly forgotten and forgiven by her. 

What about him sleeping with another woman? She truly didn't care at this moment, Nor 
did she have any insecurity or bad blood about him beating her. 

She at this moment didn't care about anything other than being happy that the man she 
was so in love kissing her back with the same passion he did before. 

*Cough* *Ahem* 

An awkward cough breaks the loving fantasy of hers. 

(A/N : I first wanted to rush Jake arc but then again it did not feel right to me, So other 
than doing that, I decided to upload. ore chapters which fasten the story. 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁.) 

Chapter 263 261. Not Spying 

Sandra felt reluctant as she felt his lips were drifting away from hers but she could not 
do anything other than to blame that damn voice. 

"It seems your old way of shutting people off from crying still hasn't changed." 

Sandra wanted to be angry and make a new one of the person who destroyed her good 
deeds but before she spoke an amused laughing voice rang in the ward making her 
swallow her words back. 

She quickly turned around in curiosity to take a look at a person who spoke like she had 
known Alex for ages. 



As she didn't want to provoke anyone who is close to Alex fearing it might angre him. 

'How can someone be so seductive?' 

But just as she took a look at the person who spoke she was shocked by the tempting 
seductive aura of the woman in front of her. 

Sandra never felt self-conscious especially when it's come to the look and why should 
she? 

She as a female lead has a perfect face and body. There is no place she was lacking 
but that is a thing that now bothers her. 

Yeah she has a perfect body but because of that it gives off a vibe of pure and 
gentleness, It makes people have a hard time raising a strong primal desire. 

But this woman in front of her is like a walking aphrodisiac, Her bountiful breasts 
swaying and bouncing, her flexible waist which is filled with elasticity as it moves with 
her body, Those luscious long hair along with the feminine brave face like the ancient 
general that led the army of millions give a strong touch. 

There was even an unknown threat surrounding her like a wild beast warning people not 
to come close to her or they would have to pay the heavy price. 

Yet this dangerous aura on her body is what's making her irresistible. It's like forbidden 
fruit. It is tempting because it was forbidden. 

Even she as a woman is affected by the seductive aura of this woman, Which makes 
her restless and insecure. 

Yes even though she said and thought she didn't care about Alex being with another 
woman multiple times now and to a certain degree she is right. 

But when Alex thought that Alex being with this woman scared her. 

Because unlike other women, She for the first time felt threatened by this woman not 
only as a threat that she would steal her man but also the threat that she can't provoke 
this woman. 

Never in her life she got that threat, Even in front of the S-Rank of that dumbass name 
organization she never felt that she couldn't provoke it. 

She had that inherent confidence for some reason. She was never afraid to do or say 
things that may be considered taboo to say to powerhouse and dignitaries. 



But this woman gave her vibe that if she touched her taboo, The consequences of it she 
would not be able to afford. 

"Well nor did yours to spy on me." 

Alex already knows the existence of Amara since she came here as he smelled faint but 
unique to her scent. 

So when he broke the kiss he was ready to answer her. 

It's not that he is worried about her being possessive and going haywire, She is the 2nd 
person he did not have to worry about that from happening after Grace. 

But she would feel being left out and so try to tease him as revenge. 

So he just talked back quickly to make her flustered, After all even if Amamra was not 
that crazy but there were Sandra and Liza on top of that Gloria present here. 

Yeah Gloria woke up not long ago. She is just pretending to be asleep to avoid facing 
him and Grace. How can she face her own daughter after she banged the man her 
daughter is so madly in love with? 

There is no way Gloria thinks Grace still has an unrequited love for Alex, So it just 
makes it more messy. 

Well come to think about it, if she knows Grace's wish was fulfilled, not only that but she 
herself gives the green light to Alex to do this, It would be a lot more messy and 
complicated, wouldn't it? 

"*Ahem* How do you know I am here?" 

As expected Amara had to drop the idea of teasing Alex as she was embarrassed when 
Alex pointed out that she was still spying on him, though in her eyes it was not spying, 
She was just keeping tabs on what he did and who he met. 

If you call it spying then you are wrong, that's it, She is just protecting her younger 
brother. 

But how can she embarrass her little brother in front of others? So I just decided to stop 
teasing him. That is all the reason for hers , nothing else. 

So she changed the subject and asked the question she was curious about. From Alex's 
attitude it's easy to say that he already knew her presence hence why he was not 
surprised. 



But the question is how did he know? When she arrived here she concealed her 
presence as she did. did not want Alex to think she was spying on him. 

She just came here to see what he was doing and who he was without him finding out. 

So it was impossible to think he saw her when she came here as only another S-Rank 
with razor sharp senses can detect her presence. 

Yet Alex being super talented but still F-Rank is able to detect her which is impossible. 

Which she would have said if she didn't see how magical her brother isshe, There is a 
habit of his to change the norm. 

He having dual cultivation physique is thought to be impossible and yet he had it, SS-
Rank superpower is said to not exist in this world and yet he is the holder of such 
power. 

Even the mystical beast that only exists in legends and was said to be just a legend 
after failing to find it by the world was his pet. 

So other than being skeptical, She was looking forward to what her younger brother 
would say and once again change her worldview. 

Of course if it was too serious information then she just had to "shut" the mouth of the 
people present, which is not a big deal. 

"Oh I just smelled your scent." 

Alex was not sure why Amara asked this question, Which is weird as he was someone 
whose brain never stops cooking. 

So all blame can be put on Rose once again. After all, her power is really too broken. 

"Huh?!!!" 

Amara, taken aback hearing this, thought Alex would say he had a device or has a 
passive to detect his loved ones in proximity. 

It's not strange to think as dual cultivation physique in man is in itself a new thing, So 
there is a chance that Alex has that passive after all every physique has passives. 

Like she does, Her beast master physique made her instincts sharp and so do all her 
rest of 20 or so senses. 

From sight, touch to temperature senses were all enhanced to a supernatural degree 
even compared with other awakened warriors. 



But she never thought that Alex's secret of him finding her out was her scent, There is 
no connection with that with cultivation physique as that's an auxiliary system. 

While enhanced senses are from battle system physique like her-!!! 

"Show me your hand!!!!" 

Amara suddenly panicked and shouted to Alex in anxiousness trying to grab his hand 
which is unlike her. 

She never even in her dreams have raise her voice against Alex, So it was quote weird 
for her to do that. 

Liza was already in shock and fear seeing Amara appearing out of nowhere, She also 
noticed her strenge reaction and wanted to also go ahead to check him in worry but 
remembering the threat of Amara that if Liza ever allowed Alex to be in a dangerous 
situation, They would feed her to the wolfs. 

So she decided to stay back try to minimize her existence as low as possible because 
Amara has guts and power to do what she said she would. 

Amara ignored everyone even Alex who was also taken aback finally realizing he 
fucked up saying the real reason as he understood why Amara panicking now. 

He blamed innocent dumbass Rose for this as he tried to cook ways to stop Amara 
taking drastic measures. 

"No no, It can't be, How?!!" 

Amara was not in a state to answer others, She ran her spiritual power in his body and 
started checking for things she feared. 

Alex knew what she was searching for, But there would have been no way she could 
find it as a system shielding that information from others for his safety hence why Liza 
didn't find it before. 

But he knows that hiding this thing from Amara is just going to invite more trouble and 
hence he lifted protection for her to find out, Which she did in instance when the shield 
lowered for her. 

Amara already had what it was but still could not able to believe it after confirming it by 
herself. 

"What did mother eat before she gave birth to you brother?" 



She lifted her head looking at her beloved brother with complicated emotions before 
asking out her query. 

(A/N : There would be one more update today, Don't worry I would not leave you guys 
on a cliffhanger. 

Still any idea what it was? Hint : That came up not long ago. 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁. ) 

Chapter 264 262. World's Most Talented Waste 

"....." 

Silence, Whole ward fell into the pin drop silence after Amara's words, Like how can 
anyone answer that? 

When they don't even know why that question was even being asked? 

Grace and Sandra don't even know who this new woman is that jumped out and was all 
over their Alex. 

Sandra yet to still figure out if this woman is a threat to her and Alex relationship or not 
before planning her next steps. 

So she is super wary of her, If not for the warning her insects gave her not to provoke 
this woman, Sandra had already jumped in the middle of them to separate those two. 

Grace on the other hand was just curious, She pretty much knows all the people in life 
not because she stalks him. 

But Alex has a very small group of people that he is in contact with because most 
people didn't understand that he didn't mean what he said. 

In Grace's eyes those people are idiots for not knowing how good Alex is. 

Is it too much to just ignore a few not-so-nice words without ill intentions for him? 

Anyway, because of those blind people there are not many people Alex is close to, 
Before only her and Alia along with that music teacher Alex hate are this close to home. 

So she is genuinely curious about Amara, As there is a huge possibility that this woman 
is also one of their "sister". 

Gloria on the other hand was terrified, When Amara panicking now she for a brief 
moment revealed her real power level. 



Others are too weak and inexperienced to detect it but as a formal young lady of a big 
hidden family knows it immediately. 

This new young woman who appeared here is not a normal one. Even if she looks like a 
woman in her late 20s, she is definitely some old monster who looks young because of 
her cultivation level. 

So now the question was is this woman is friend or foe? If she is friend then she 
underestimated Alex, He has way deeper background then she thought before. 

But if she is foe then Gloria wants to be ready to burn her bloodline to take Grace and 
Alex away from here. 

Though bruning her ancient family bloodline not going to help her fight off against S-
rank warrior but it would surely grant enough strength for short while to keep them safe. 

Of course burning bloodline means not only would she lose her right to join the family 
back also it would become a lot weaker lowering its rank. 

After all, to get power to defend against S-Rank without any cultivation has to be huge. 

So she prayed that this new woman is friend not foe as the price had to pay was too 
much but if it came to that she was ready to do it. 

"Sister, I think mother ate sugar, spice and everything nice. Why do you think I am 
beautiful?" 

Alex just truthfully answered her, Well it's been awhile since his narcissist side got to 
shine, How can he miss this opportunity to praise himself? 

He just jumped on it, I would also work as comedic relief to relax the atmosphere. 

".....Ptfff~ hahaa, So what mother had eaten at my time? Snip, Snail and Puppy-bitch 
tails?" 

Amara took a second before it sank in making her tense emotions relax as she burst out 
laughing repeating her part of the old nursery rhyme. 

Her mother when they were little used to sing this them, Those are one of the few fond 
memories of her mother. 

She remembers she often used to run around the whole Winchester palace after Alex, 
Who was refusing to exercise. 



Then when she used to catch him, He some somehow weasel his way out of it, Still she 
was never discouraged or disappointed because his way mostly was to bribe her with 
kisses on cheeks. 

So it was rewarding for her, Anyway she used to make sure not to catch him early as 
running was enough exercise, it was a trick but she enjoyed every second of it. 

Now that she was reminded of this in this way, her tense nerves calm down instantly, 
Making her think clearly. 

"Why? I am sure mothers in your time also ate sugar, spice and everything nice. If not, 
how can you be this sweet and good?" 

Alex, seeing Amara's become relaxed, decided to love bomb his dear sister, after all 
they do love each other deeply both figuratively and literally. 

*Thump* *Bang* 

Amara was done, after hearing him Amamra felt like her heart got rammed, How can 
her brother be so sweet???? 

She really wanted to hug her brother tightly so that they would never separate. If these 
people were not here and she didn't wanna embarrass him, She would have already 
hopped on him long ago like a beast. 

"*Ahem* That aside, Alex, we need to have a serious talk about your "condition"." 

Amara finally controls her wild steamy imagination. They have time to do that later on. 
This is a serious issue. 

If Alex really has a 2nd special physique then he broke the norm that there can be only 
one special physique. 

Which was true, After all each physique has their own special characteristics and 
elements. 

The balance between them are critical and if you add another thing into the mix, there is 
a high chance of both elements countering each other and creating a boom. 

You don't need to have an IQ over room temperature to know that having a boom inside 
your body is bad. 

There were experiments done by those lunatics at science and experiment fields 
though, but mostly they all ended in boom. 



Even if there was some survive they either gain a low level of physique, losing most 
power in the encounter with other elements or worse. 

They lose their special physique altogether because elements did not counter each 
other and now prevent each other from working. 

Like one survivor who had an S-Rank ice element related physique, normally she would 
have awakened an ice related superpower for sure. 

But because of an experiment she had an anomaly creating a new fire element inside 
her body putting her in immense pain as both elements were each other's natural 
enemy. 

But thanks to her special physique she survived and even awakened S-Rank 
superpower making this lunatics hopeful of breakthrough. 

But sadly she awakened a fire related superpower. Yeah it was a strong superpower 
giving her the capital to reach S-Rank without struggle like others but sadly she was not 
able to cultivate. 

Her ice physique strongly opposed her fire power and even her fire power was not a fan 
of her ice physique making a stalemate between them. 

Which in turn means she can't use any, If she tries to use her superpower her physique 
nullifies it and if she tries to use her physique to cultivate, her superpower jumps up and 
nullifies it. 

This made her world's most talented waste. 

So as a waste, those lunatics lost interest in her way too quickly. Then like a child who 
got bored with an old toy, they threw her aside. 

Hmmm…It sounds familiar for some reason, I wonder why? 

Anyway the context is that it was impossible to have two different kinds of powers until 
her dear brother had it. 

(A/N : I don't know what's wrong, that day I slept for like 15-18 hours and then later for 
the next 2 days I was not able to sleep at all, I just lay in bed surfing the internet. 

It used to happen from time to time before but it's been around a year since it did not 
happen until now. It's weird. 

But the good news is that anytime it happens afterwards I am filled with immense 
motivation and energy, So there will be a lot of news chapters, So that's a plus point. 



Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁. ) 

Chapter 265 263. Prolonged Stupidity 

"No need to worry sister, It's just an SSS-Rank beast physique, It would not interfere 
with my other physique." 

Alex seems to understand what Amara was worried about, So he just spilled the beans 
of his physique. 

The legendary Incubus physique is not combat focus, It's rather quite passive physique, 
only triggering during intercorse. 

And it is also not leveled by the system. There is no rating of S, A, B, C and all. It just 
has its name. 

It's given because his physique can't be rated by the current world's standards, So there 
was a huge possibility that it would overpower his beast physique. 

But thankfully it was given under system administration, So Alex did not have any worry 
of put into shackles because of his own super qualifications. 

'.....Did I just say that?' 

It's just that the moment those words escape his mouth, He wanted to give himself a 
tight slap for being this stupid. 

What the fuck did he said just now? Is this news something to reveal this casually? 

In this world even having SS-Rank power is said to be impossible, Yeah few like Alia 
and Amara have those superpowers and physique but that's a thing. 

It's taboo to reveal such a rank of power as it would guarantee that you would attract 
some old monsters trying to breakthrough the SS-Rank warrior to live longer. 

If they found out there is SS-rank power appare in the world they would do anything to 
get their hands on it. 

After all, It's true rank of superpower and physique does not limit promotion to the rank 
beyond power rank. 

But it would make it harder, Like if one has S-Rank power until they reach S-Rank they 
would like taking the elevator there, It would be a smooth journey. 

It's just after that trying to go for an SS-Rank is like trying to climb a 110° mountain. It's 
nearly impossible. People can still do it but it would be way way harder and inefficient. 



Most of the spiritual power would be wasted in just keeping themselves in their current 
position then to push upwards in the realm1. 

The stronger the realm is the more power needed to push forwardIts. 

You can see it as those frustrating platformer games,The current realm is like a 
checkpoint unless they made a severe mistake or damaged their core the realm would 
not fall. 

So once those powerhouse reach S-Rank they mostly do not have to worry about the 
realm falling but to increase their realm they have to claim upward. 

In doing that there has to be steady growth because if they were not careful they would 
fall straight to the starting point which in this case is S-Rank not to mention they would 
be in weak period and can't actually use full strength os S-Rank. 

At best they can use A or in worse situation B rank strength of course until they recover 
from their injuries which take a maximum of 10 years. 

Which sounds a lot to those who have a lifespan of 1000s of years. It's like a few days 
of rest. 

If administered a high level of medicine the recovery time also decreases a lot, Just like 
in the original novel, Jake only took 2 and half years before he fully recovered his S-
Rank power. 

That's okay but why was it being told? Simple, This is because to show how dumb thing 
Alex had just said. 

If someone found out about his SSS-rank physique then hell would break loose. 

No matter how strong Winchester family will be there would be countless moths rushed 
directly into the flames just in hopes of getting their hands in it. 

They would have been not a problem as Winchester is behemoth, those small shrimps 
can't even put a scratch on neither family nor on him. 

But these small fry would not be the only one who jump out. It's more than likely that the 
whole world, including the so-called friends of family, would stand against and try to get 
him. 

It's okay for the Winchester family to take on 1, 2, 3, 4 or even 5 of the same level of 
family given those families do not want to die together with the Winchesters. 

But against the whole world? Be realistic, Villains do not have wishful thinking. 



Even if this is a wish fulfillment novel, It was for the protagonist not the Villain, Villains 
still have the norm of this world along with its stupid logic. 

"Pfft- Haha nice joke brother, I see you are in a good mood but for a moment be 
serious, It's not a matter to joke about." 

Well Amara did not believe Alex at all, If he has SS-Rank physique then she would have 
believed him without any question as it's possible, She herself has it. 

But SSS-Rank? You know the way ranking is given is quite simple, harsh but also 
reasonable. 

To gain E ranking one just needs to be twice more powerful or have potential then F 
rank, simple right? 

Wrong because for D ranking, One needs to be twice strong as E and F rank combine. 

Meaning to have an SS-Rank one needs to be twice as strong as S, A, B, C, D, E and 
F. 

So for to get SSS ranking superpowers or physiques they need to have twice of 
potential than all previous rating level combine. 

So just imagine how broken that superpower/physique would be? 

Yeah just imagine as it's impossible to have anything rated SSS, Not only especially in 
this period of after fall. 

Even in the ancient times SS rank was rare, So there seems to be no SSS rarity at all. 

"....Is it that ridiculous?" 

Alex could not help but ask once regretting as soon as he said it. 

He could not figure out what's wrong with him? Why is he acting this stupid? 

'Is Rose's passive has prolonged effects of Stupidity?' 

Alex could not help but thought about such a possibility, After all that's the only 
explanation for his current behavior. 

If this is the case then Alex praying that all effects would be temporary, He can't live 
being this brain dead. 



It's not a hyperbolic thing to say, He literally die if he is this stupid. He is a villain damn 
it, Heavenly will just searching for the opportunity to get rid of him, One wrong move and 
he would be digging his own grave. 

If it is not the protagonist then heroine not them then side character or even passerby 
but surely someone would hop on the opportunity under the hevely wills doing. 

His villain aura make it that it would not detect him directly but his villain title is still there 
they would create a villain encounter for him. 

Which in simple word just more trouble for him. 

"Huh?! What do you mea-!!! ARE YOU KIDDING ME!!?" 

Amara was taken aback hearing Alex saying it's ridiculous which is unlike his as he 
never explainbor ask about his jokes. 

So she looked at him in confusion but just as her eyes met his she knew he was not 
joking at all. 

(A/N : Sorry I am sick (Not sure what's wrong but has an idea), So yesterday I wasn't 
able to upload it. Just feeling tired and sleepy, feel hungry but too lazy to eat it. 

Anyway just lots of previous times it would go away, I am sure it's just a depression 
wave, I am used to it. 

Which is good like I said after it's gone. It makes me ridiculously motivated, So that's a 
plus point. 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁.) 

Chapter 266 264. Death Wind 

Amara could not believe it but she knew her brother very well. Those eyes of hers were 
not lying, He was telling the truth. 

A truth which is more unthinkable than a fantasy and is her current nightmare. 

She would have been the most excited and happy person in the world if Alex has SS-
rank physique or powers. 

As no matter how tempting SS-rank things are, Even if it is revealed no one had the 
guts to try and take it away from the heir of the Winchester family. 

But it's a completely different story when it's SSS-rank. This rank is said to not exist, So 
if it somehow revealed Alex has it then even the Winchester family can't save him. 



"Well, I am special, aren't I?" 

Alex sarcastically said, Yeah , he is special, special needs that is. 

He really could not believe he reveled this key information to the world, He did not have 
power nor enough background to resist if hell broke loose. 

[Ding! Host you should not worry, You are Villain with Villain halo, The things you think 
of would not happen to the villain it's protagonist script. 

If news of your SSS-rank powers were revealed, Around 95% of the forces would try to 
cater to you to gain your favor. 

As most of the strong forces are deemed villains because of the same things you fear 
they would do to you. 

So you as a villain with Villain halo only going to get respect from them, You would not 
be turned into a street rat like the protagonist.] 

System, seeing how panicked Alex became, decided to tell him the critical information. 

All the things Alex thought would happen are the things the protagonist experiences, not 
the villain. 

Villains live comfortable life and enjoy every bit of it till protagonist come knocking in 

on to their door. 

Then and only then does the villain suffer, As long as the protagonist is not involved, the 
Villain does not have to fear anything at all. 

'....Why can't I think that?' 

When the system spoke the first thing that Alex thought was, Why he didn't think that, 
It's obvious. 

He is a villain, Villain is beloved by the world and hated by heaven. 

As long as the protagonist does not interfere, Villain has a happy life. They would not be 
insulted and beaten off like dog for the face 

slapping like a protagonist. 

He first hand experience it, Even when world thought of him white face he only got 
praises not insults as for them with his face it's honor to be with him. 



It's all obvious and yet because of that dumbass he nearly gives himself a heart attack 
by over thinking. 

…. 

"Ahhcho!!~ Did I catch a cold?" 

Away from the hospital in the big shop dear innocent Rose said to herself as for while 
she was sneezing non-stop. 

"Miss, are you sure you want to buy this horse cart? We also sell top notch quality 
horses suitable for this cart." 

The attendant disturbed her thoughts and once again recommended good horses that 
go with the carts Rose brought. 

She has been saying this to Rose since she came into the store but Rose is adamant to 
just buy a cart not the horse. 

Normally there is no issue but it's a horse cart, It's given that you need a horse. 

Especially when Rose buying overpriced cart that cost in millions UC, For which need a 
special breed of horses for best performance . 

She even offered to give it to her at a quite discounted price on top of the combo offer 
that comes with buying a horse cart. 

"Horse? What am I going to do with the horse? They are not suitable for the city." 

Rose looked at the clerk annoyed as she was tired of answering this question over and 
over again. 

Horses are not suitable for the city, Where is she going to keep them? She didn't even 
know horse riding, so what's the point of buying it? 

"?????" 

Clerk was speechless hearing it, I mean it's true horses are not suitable for the city but 
so do carts. 

Actually horsecart is more useless and expensive than a horse in the city as it needs a 
horse to even work. 

"Wait! I got it, How dumb I was indeed why you need horses in the city? it's a waste of 
money, You are a smart young lady." 



Unfortunately for the clerk she just became a victim of the broken passive of Rose and 
became dumb making Rose the smartest person in the room. 

And so of course she finally saw the "logic" of Rose and sold just the cart to her. 

Rose too was happy with her purchase given the address of her 'secret' place and left 
completely forgetting Helen gave her clear instructions not to waste money on the 
useless thing. 

... 

[Ding! Host you are not in the influence of Rose's passive powers.] 

System seeing Alex once again misunderstood and blamed poor Rose come out and 
point it out. 

Rose power actually only remains for a little while and would go away without leaving 
residual effects. 

Rose is long since away from the hospital and from him, It's been hours so her passive 
is long since expired. 

'So what is it? Why did I suddenly become this dumb?' 

Alex was taken aback by the hearing system but then it made sense, Just while ago he 
was normal, Heck he even tricked Sandra. 

So it seems Rose is not all to blame but still that dumbass has blame to share, He sure 
of it. 

[Ding! It's Yin energy surrounding you host, Most of your soul is busy resisting it, And so 
for while your intelligence took a drop. 

Well it's not just yours, Everyone in this room becomes dumber because of it. 

But it's not a matter of concern. This Yin energy is not on purpose released. It's the 
aftermath of the very strong spirit of undead trying to spy on you. You don't have to 
worry. 

Just urge your SS-Rank fire emperor power to run in your body, It would cleanse it.] 

System responded to Alex and even gave the reason, telling him it's not a big deal, It's 
just that the strong undead took interest in him and were just spying on him. 

'Why do I think the system is also affected by it?' 



Alex was speechless hearing the system saying it's no matter of concern. For who? 

Because he damn sure that it is a matter of concern to him when he was being hunted 
by the spirit of the undead. 

Still before doing anything he just did as instructed and ran his blazing fire inside his 
body clearing the Yin in his body. 

Though normally Yin did not matter because of his Legendary Incubus body but level of 
this undead should be too much that it's Yin is like a death wind, There is no need to tell 
why it is dangerous for the living being. 

After all it's a wind that flow out of the underworld in the world of living, Which is 
forbidden to happen and has effecct of absorbing living energy of the living beings, 
Which make victims either fall into coma or at least bed ridden for while because of the 
weakness. 

The only reason why no one suffered by it in this room is because everyone in here has 
special identity in this world along with enough power to passively fight it off. 

'It seems even Amara and Sandra is affected by it.' 

Just as fire blaze through him, His mind becomes clear like someone just opened the 
window of some very stuffy room. 

Immediately he noticed that even Amara acted like stupid. She asked loudly about it 
without even sealing the space for private talk which is so easy for her to do. 

'I can use this to my advantage.' 

Alex wanted to snap his finger and let his flame dance around the ward to clear the air 
of death, After all fire is just like sunlight is natural and only one of few counters of such 
unholy forces. 

But stopped, His IQ is online now and so of course the first thing he thought of was how 
to take advantage of such a god given opportunity. 

(A/N : If you remember, It's mentioned why fire is a natural counter to the death wind. 

If you don't remember, In summary fire represents both life and death just like sun and 
so against Death wind it's best option in absence of sunlight. 
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By the way, I am feeling good now. It seems playing 7 hours straight games help, It 
would be no time till I would get that motivation hit. 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁 .) 

Chapter 267 265. Attack Sister (Light R-18) 

"Well enough about me, It's not important, Tell me what's brought you here sister." 

Alex already cooked something in his head, After all, iron is hot, So why not hit it? 

He thought was talking to Amara, his eyes wandering amongst others present in the 
ward, Normally they would have noticed Alex gazing at them and feel ecstatic about it. 

They all heard him saying he had an SSS-Rank physique, Which was even more 
unreasonable than having an SSS-Rank superpower. 

As a superpower more or less depends on luck along with good genes but physique 
totally depends on the parents and their generation. 

Only if parents or among ancestors have a physique can one be born with the physique. 

Of course, you can steal others using various taboo methods but it would downgrade 
one rank, Meaning if you have an SS-Rank physique or superpower. 

Then if you forcefully took that out of the person, It would turn into S-Rank power. 

This is also the reason why those old monsters do not make a move on SS-Rank as it's 
not worth it to provoke Nobles over it. 

After all, they are only gonna get S-Rank power, Which they can't even use as only one 
superpower and physique person can have, So they have to destroy their initial 
integrated one for it. 

And that replaced power would be not good as it meant it's not made for them unlike 
their original one, So it is really not worth it as it would not even be going to help them to 
reach SS-Rank, Which is the only reason they ever go against Nobles. 

Hence why Amara reacted strongly as Alex is a hot potato. Even if rank downgrades it 
would still have an SS-Rank physique which would make those stuck at S-Rank to 
ascend to SS-Rank. 

Fortunately, Alex is a villain, Which is one of the few times he was glad he was because 
those things would not happen to him but others here don't know that. 



Even Grace, who didn't know much about the hidden world, understands that if S-Rank 
is the pinnacle of this world then having SSS-Rank is indeed extraordinary. 

".....huh?! Alex do you even kno-" 

"Shhhh~ Sister, Why waste time on these unnecessary things? We met after so long 
and you did not even hug me." 

Amara is taken aback hearing Alex then she blows up. It's not a matter that can be 
taken lightly, It's about the life and death of her brother. 

It take utmost priority for her, If not for her being dumb right now, She long since picked 
him up and took him back to the capital in their castle. 

It was the only place in her eyes he could be safe right now, Even if he resisted she 
would harden her heart and ignore him. 

Later she would make up for him in any way possible but when it came to his safety she 
would not compromise. 

It's just that all the words she wanted to say were halted the moment she felt the soft 
warm slender finger land on her plump lips. 

The mighty S-Rank powerhouse becomes mute and docile like a puppy, Especially 
when she sees the pitiful face of his asking her in a resentment-filled voice asking for a 
hug. 

It just broke all her defences, Her heart melted feeling as sweet, She did not waste any 
time before she took him in her arms burying him in her bountiful softness. 

Yeah, it is indeed a long time. The last they met was in the morning. How can she 
spend that much time away from her brother? 

Especially after the meeting "gift" he gave her? 

So she hugged him tightly as if trying to merge him with her. This way she could protect 
him all the time and he would always be with her. 

'Why are you so comfortably warm?' 

Amara said in her heart as her brother was addictively warm, Like a comfortable warm 
blanket in winter, You just wanna let go. 

"Alex, We still have to tal-Ahh!~ Mumh" 



Amara, though reluctant, still tried to get Alex to talk about his issue as her worried side 
was still in control. 

But in mid-sentence, she jumped up like someone stepped on her tail as a sensual 
moan escaped from her half-opened mouth involuntary. 

She quickly attempted to muffle the voice, Then felt the reason for her sudden burst. 
Alex's hand was tightly grabbing her big tight ass trying to dig into it and mould it into 
different shapes. 

Instinctively her hug tightened pulling him even closer to hers but this time her hands 
also moved from his back to his head. 

This might be where she made a mistake as her doing so just pushed Alex close to her 
bosom giving him an opportunity to attack her again. 

Alex seeing the chance rubbed his face on her bountiful breasts from over her dress, It 
was weird but a good kind of sensation. 

His lips and nose rubbed over the outline of her mounds trying to find those sweet 
nectar giving grapes. 

Which he quickly found it. Even if a dress was covering them, It was not hard to find 
these erected hot nipples. 

"Ahh!~ Mhmmm…St-St…op." 

Just as he did that, There was once again that sweet melody of her moaning rang in the 
ward. 

Amara trying, Trying so hard to hold those monas back, Hold herself back from going 
out and just let him submerge in herself like in the morning. 

And she would have done so if not for these unexpected people staring daggers on her 
back right now. 

Normally she would have not care about these pesky pests but these pests are friends 
of Alex after all. She did not want to make him awkward. 

After all she is his sister, Though she did not care about it as she love her brother but if 
this spread out it would bring him trouble. 

She knows he can't control it, If she allows him to do that here then afterwards he would 
be super mad, So she has to hold back for a while. 

When they go back into his dorm, She can enjoy her brother as long as she wants. 



'Wait?! My back is to them, doesn't that mean they see everything?' 

Suddenly it clicked Amara that there is no point holding back her moans to hide it from 
them because her back was facing the group. 

Which means the craftswomanship Alex was performing on her ass was full-on display 
for them. 

First, she panicked as to what to say to them afterwards as she did not want Alex to get 
into trouble. 

"..al *gulp*..ex, s…p" 

She tried to tell Alex to stop secretly but to her surprise, she found how much her voice 
was shaking. 

She was stuttering, not even able to form a single word much less the whole sentence 
to convey her message. 

"EhhhAhh!!~" 

What did her brother do next that completely left her speechless and excited? 

(A/N : Question, should I do R-18 here now? Or wait? If here then the story would move 
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Chapter 268 266. Pitiful Gaze (Light R-18) 

Amara was frozen in shock, Not able to utter a word with a horrified and ecstatic face. 

She looked down at Alex, Who was still going in town on her mounds with both 
annoyance and expectation. 

How could she not have this strong mixed reaction? 



Right now the hand of Alex already slipped through the back of her dress, Rising up 
high and grabbing her tight ass directly. 

She would have no problem with it, Rather she would have enjoyed it if not for the fact 
that her ass was fully exposed to these annoying bystanders. 

What is more embarrassing is that she knew tonight Alex was going to ravage her once 
again. 

So to not waste unnecessary time, She not even wear any panties, She was going full 
commando thinking it was sexy. 

Now she had it, It backfired, Her two perfect white moons now full on display. 

Well not full on display as two hands were covering it like an eclipse, Still trying to mold 
it in different shapes like a child excited about his newfound toy. 

Sandra who was standing just a few meters from this stellar event. 

At first knowing this new woman was just a sister of Alex she let her guard down but 
then she was too taken aback like everybody else and was in shock the moment she 
saw his hand land on Amamra's ass. 

Aren't they sister and brother? Then isn't that inappropriate or it was just their way of 
fooling around? 

That's what Sandra thought, She still gave two of them the benefit of doubt thinking it's 
just how sister and brother act. After all it was Alex who grabbed the ass of his sister. 

But the next moments of Alex bundle up their all the doubts and sophistry and crushed 
them in one swift move. 

It took a moment to gather herself, Still she was first ti come out of her shock, Then 
thought of what to do next. 

It's just what can she even do? How to even start addressing it? 

Say, "Alex, why are you grabbing your sister's ass?" 

It's not take a genius to know it would not end well for her, As she was in no place to 
question him as her own place with him was rocky right now. 

So she moved close to Liza, As she has a feeling that if someone in this room can do 
something, Then it would be this lolita for some reason. 

"Should we say or do something?" 



She never questions her hunches as they alway right, So when she approaches Liza 
she asks in a low enough voice only two of them can hear. 

Liza just looked at her like mentally retarded person. 

This is Amara standing in front of them, Though she looks docile as a puppy in front of 
Alex but she is a real monster. 

If she had to pick the top three people she would never want to mess with, Amara is in 
3rd place after her mother Madam Winchester and that nightmare Belladonna. 

They are also the top three people who should not be disturbed when they are enjoying 
themselves with Alex. 

Even she as the head of White family does not have guts to say a word right now, Let 
them be. 

Anyway it's not that strange for Liza that Amara has this close relationship with Alex, 
She alway was bro-con, Honestly good for her. 

Now at least hope that this monster calms down a little and stops terrorizing poor 
people like her left and right. 

"....Why are you looking at me like that?" 

Sandra felt uncomfortable by the gaze of Liza, They were looking at her with….pity? 

Why was this little woman looking at her like that? Shouldn't they say something? 

"Sandra take a note, Always be ready to find unexpected and strange things if you want 
to be with Alex, It would make your life easy." 

Grace, seeing Sandra might do something stupid couldn't help but come to her and stop 
her in her tracks. 

She couldn't understand why but she wasn't able to sit back and see Sandra digging her 
own grave. 

It's weird doesn't it? She is her love rival. It's okay not to fight with her. Why is she even 
helping and giving her tips to get loved by her own man? 

She could not understand but still help Sandra, Anyway they are going to spend loys of 
time together, It's better to have good relationship. 

"Huh????" 



Sandra had nothing but question mark in her heart but then decided to shut her mouth 
as what Grace said made sense. 

Since she met with Alex, Which was not even that long, just half a day too many things 
have happened and all of them because of Alex. 

The man in her eyes who never made any lost making deal lost nearly 110 Billion UC in 
liquidity. 

That was unthinkable before but it did not only end there, There are even more 
supernatural powers on him that were said to be impossible for man to have. 

So it makes sense that if she wants to live with Alex, She should be used to these 
things. 

Well anyway even if it was incest as long as they don't have baby it's fine, right? 

Well unknown to her, Alex even has a way to deal with genes issues. It even makes it 
stronger thanks to the passive of his golden gun skill. 

'She is not over thinking?' 

Alex here while enjoying himself thought, Amara has a childlike personality, Only when 
she is with him though.  

It can be seen by how she fought with Rita and afterwards Isabella. 

She also has wild imaginations as she love to over exaggerate things, Especially the 
ones that are related to him. 

But right now she was calm, way too calm it was unlike her. 

'Maybe that Yin is affecting her overthinking part?' 

As now he is not under the influence of the Yin power, It did not take him a second to 
understand she was being affected by the Yin aura. 

Which is food for him, At least she would not overthink for a while, It would make his 
plan easy. 

"Sister, Are you peeing? Why is it so wet down here?" 

Well Alex being Alex, How could he not be sadistic? 

While he was molding her ass, He sneakily made his way little down towards her 
uncharted regions, Where currently flood season is going on. 



This made him smirk as he stopped teasing her grapes, Lifted his head to look at that 
crimson blushing face which was criminally seductive igniting fire in him making him 
think that he should take her right now. 

He still stopped himself, Met his deep enchanting eyes with hers the and asked her with 
straight face. 

This is where his god-level acting skill come to play, If not he would have burst out 
laughing especially when he saw the chances in her face. 

It went from ecstacy to confusion to shock and embarrassment but strangely back to 
ecstasy. 

"Ar..en't it's…al-hmm..Beca..Yo-Ahh!~" 

Amara tried, She really tried hard to explain it was not her fault, It's his and it's not pee 
but something else. 

But was she is in the condition to make a sentence? 

Alex's finger was though not on her pussy but rubbing just a few centimeters away from 
her scared cave. 

Even then she tried to speak up but was not able to continue as that naughty finger 
quickly traveled that little distance and landed on her labia. 

Oh she jolts in pleasure by such a sudden reaction, Not only that she felt like a current 
ran through her body breaking her all resistance. 

Her body became super tense as she was on edge and would break at any moment. 
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Chapter 269 267. A Pure Raw Bonking Between Brother And Sister 

"So it's not pee then sister?" 

Alex spoke up like his enchanting voice like a devil's whisper tempting a young maiden 
to do a sin. 

He pulled back his fingers from her juicy cave which Amara was not so happy about 
then held in front of her face with a smirk showing how they are glistening being coated 
by her love fluids. 

Amara took a look as she herself was taken aback by how much it was, His fingers 
were looking like he just dumped in a pool. 

There was no dry spot on them, Heck drop or two even dripping off them as he held his 
hand high. 

This set her body on fire, looking at her brother's hand covered in her juices just made 
her feel excited. 

There was an itch in her nether that she knows only her brother can scratch it. 

Why? Because she never masterbated, She knows what it is but does not do it as in her 
eyes it would be her cheating on Alex. 

Yeah, of course that would be cheating, How can she indulge herself in self-pleasure 
without her brother? Only he is allowed to do that, not even she herself has that right. 

So all her life she never experienced orgasum pleasure from masterbation but she 
never needed it too as a mere thought of being Alex was enough to make her cum. 

That is the only way she know how to pleasure herself and what's prevented her from 
exploding out because of lack of release. 

It was fine until morning, But ever since he took her anal virginity in the morning, She 
just could not able to release herself like before, She wants more now then mere 
thoughts off him. 



She wants him, Wants him to rearrange her inside, fill her up to the brim and dirtiest and 
secisted them all, Cuddle her till they are asleep holding her in his arms not like most 
women do with their man. 

"N..no, It's *Ahem* n-not." 

Amara's thoughts were going all over the places, Her body temperature was steadily 
increasing along with blazing desire in her heart. 

She wants him, She wants him now do her, Oh she somehow holds back all day but 
right now that he was right in front of her in such situations she was losing control of 
herself. 

She is already on partially autopilot mode as most of her brain is only thinking about one 
thing now and that is beautiful, A pure raw bonking between brother and sister, Just a 
sweet tale from fairy tales. 

Even now she answered him, It was by instinct. She was still thinking about how she 
would enjoy the night with Alex. She could not wait to go back to his college dormitory. 

Her voice was shaky, filled with hesitation, fear and of course excitement to relive that 
paramount of pleasure experience of this morning again. 

"Oh then prove it or I assume you are lying." 

Alex, still holding his sticky wet finger said to her, While his other hand warped around 
her surprisingly slender waist pulling her even close to him. 

It was this action of his putting Amara just a few centimeters away from his sticky 
fingers giving her the whiff of her own juices. 

First Amara did not react but her senses were heightened thanks to rank and physique 
the scent of it entered in her nose. 

It had a light but sweet scent like a flower nectar. Which brought not her old memories, 
She knows this scent because she used to sneak out and suck nectar out of flowers as 
a child along with her brother. 

Their mother was forbidden from doing so at first as there were lots of not so good for 
consumption flowers in their garden before as most of them were there just for 
decoration and of course there was fertilizer and pesticide issue. 

But when Alex threw a tantrum, Their mother had to renovate the whole garden making 
it not only beautiful but also safe to consume. 



Most of the flowers were imported as they are not native to the place just because they 
said to be sweetest among them. 

There was lots of care needed for them to just make them survive. Even a florist who 
had superpower related flowers was appointed there just to keep them alive and destroy 
any need for fertilizer and pesticide. 

It was done in just a day and half but it was still too late as Alex moved on from it and so 
did she as he decided to do something else with her, of course other than actually 
training which she was supposed to teach him. 

When their mother heard that her efforts of renovating the whole garden was futile had 
a helpless and defeated look, Which was and still is one of her fond memories of her. 

After all, any day when their mother is lost is a day of Amara's celebration. 

Hence why when she smells the scent it makes her instinctively good. 

Then she realized it was the scent of her love juices which made her feel relaxed and 
happy. 

She had heard before that it smells like a fish, Which is not a good smell. She was 
afraid Alex was going to smell it and hate it, So all these years she especially paid more 
attention to her body and hygiene. 

She also brought various magical medicines that help with not only making her pussy 
perfect for her brother but also add a good scent to it for him. 

Though she did not had any faith in it as she was 99% sure they all were wack doctors 
but right now she was fine with spending nearly billions on those medicines. 

Not knowing that it was an inheritance scent for having an SS- 

Rank physique which means she had nearly no impurities in her body especially at her 
rank. 

Even if she had known, It's not sure if she care about it as what she wanted she already 
got it, She doesn't care how or why as that billion uc is a small price to pay for her 
brother's liking.. 

"Hey are you even listening to me?" 

Alex asked Amara in a slightly unhappy tone, He was waiting for her answer and yet 
she lost in her own world. 



When Amara heard the unhappy tone of Alex, Her survival mode got activated. The 
worst thing that could happen to her was to make Alex unhappy and so she quickly 
pulled herself back and after a moment of remembering what he said, answered him. 

"How can I prove it?" 

Amara, because of fear making him unhappy, swiftly asked in a hurry in panic. // 

The fear even overrides her horney side which just wanted to get boned by him not 
while ago was now focusing on ways to make up with him. 

Alex seeing her in this state could not help but have an ear- 

to-ear grin as it was much better than he thought this would go on. 

He took a sneak peak at others whose eyes were locked on two of them like a pitbull 
does on a toddler…they babysit because they are great nanny dogs. 

"Simple, Lick it." 

(A/N : I would try my best to upload another chapter today, If I did leave comment, 
Doesn't matter what just drop any comment as it give me motivation to write more. 

Oh I decided to go with sexy comedy like you guys said, It would have been out at 27th 
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So it might push to 5th march, Sorry about that in advance. 
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Chapter 270 268. Devilish Desire (Light R-18 

Alex stretched out his drenched wet slender fingers close to Amara's soft lips. 

They were hovering just above her rosy lips, A few strands of her pink hairs sticking on 
her perfect cheeks making this dear sister of his even more beautiful and charming. 

The stunned face of hers with those unique to her pink eyes, She really looked like a 2-
D heroine walking out in 3-D. 

At this moment, If not for Alex wanting to use this god given moment to his advantage, 
He long since stopped playing games and jumped on her like a beast having wild 18+ 
adventures. 

"*Gulp* Huh?! I…W-What?" 



Amara was in heat, She really didn't understand what was happening surrounding her. 

The tiny bit of sanity which came back because of fear making Alex unhappy was also 
gone because of the moments of Alex. 

His arms wrapped around her waist felt like a flaming rope coiling around her, It was 
burning but it was not least bit uncomfortable. 

She was impatient. It's like a pan that was heated ready to use for cooking but was not 
able to do so. 

So when Alex asked her to do something, It did not proceed in her mind for a while, She 
just stared blankly at the breathtaking face of her beloved brother. 

"I said..." 

Alex can see Amara was not in the right mental condition right now. The lust was 
overwhelming her senses but it was a good thing for him. 

Even though normal Amara would never refuse to do anything he asked her to do, It's 
better to be in this semi-mobile state as he feels less bad for treating her this way. 

He really doesn't like to bully his sister, He loves it. 

The annoyed and reluctant face she makes as he teases her was equal if not better 
then the actual sex for him. 

So he did just that, He pushed his hand even more forward, slightly gazing at the outline 
of her soft rosy lips using his right hands index finger. 

His wet finger easily slid on her lips leaving a moist trail behind such a blood rushing 
act. 

Amara was still lost in admiring her brother and in lust as both of these things just 
fueling each other. 

Seeing how celestial like her brother is making her more lustful and her being lustful 
was making her more admire her brother creating a cycle. 

But still she felt it, Those cold wet fingers sliding on the outline of her lips slowly barely 
touching her but that was making her ticklish. 

This brought her out of her dreamland and saw it was her brother who was doing this, 
igniting the blaze in her heart. 



This time she had to use all her willpower to stop doing what she know later regret 
doing in front of so many people. 

"....Lick it." 

Seeing the watery eyes of Amara locking on him with surprise and ecstasy, Alex knew 
she understood what was happening and so directly ordered it. 

Amara just heard what he said and without any delay parted her lips slightly creating an 
opening for him. 

His fingers were still sliding on the outline of of lips, So when her lips parted they 
naturally slid inside her warm small moist mouth. 

Amara right now running on autopilot, She trained herself before just for her brother to 
give mouth service. 

She used the same technique in the morning and right now the same training kicked in 
out of instinct. 

Her small but flexible tongue quickly made and moved and warped around his right 
hand's index finger. 

Though small, Her tongue is still able to fully cover and reach the end of the finger 
licking it thoroughly. 

She this time got a taste, Though currently she would not care even if it tasted 
disgusting but to her surprise, She did not taste that bad. 

It still has the slight sweetness not saltiness she heard on the internet. 

It's not sure if the sweetness was actually there or thinking it was her brother's finger 
she imagining it but for her it was sweet like diluted honey. 

And so she started licking more and more, leaving no place untouched. 

This action of hers accumulates lots of saliva in her mouth, Sane person would let it 
drool out as it was mentally uncomfortable to drink one's own cum. 

But unfortunately one is sane in this room at this moment, Definitely not the current 
Amara.  

In her mind, how can she waste such a good thing? Every part of her brother is sacred 
to her, It's not wrong to say her obsession with him has long since turned into worship. 



Each part of his body was scared to her. Now that he gave it to her, There was nothing 
more honorable than to drink it up. 

*Slurp* *Glup* 

She quickly closed her lips warping around the finger that was in her mouth creating a 
tight seal before she slurped it all up as she gulped all that in one go. 

But she did not release the seal of her mouth. Her tongue became naughty after the first 
experience. 

Amara gave Alex a teasing look as she started licking and tickling his finger, not 
allowing him to escape her small dungeon. 

Alex here was having a comfortable experience. At first it felt weird as warm tongue was 
licking his finger but soon because of technique he was impressed. 

He never knew even a finger can make you feel this good. Before he just did as fun to 
set up next events but he started enjoying it. 

Especially when she closed her lips and quickly drank up all that was in her mouth. 

The mental stimulation of making someone as strong as her to do that was too much 
even for him. 

His little brother was already fully awake pulsating long ago, But this time it felt like it 
would tear through his pants. 

Then the naughty said of Amara kicked in as she started to tease him completely 
forgetting he is not someone to tease like this as he fight back. 

Which exactly what he did. 

"MUHMMM!!!?" 

Amara's eyes became wide open as she stared at Alex. 

AN immense pleasure hit her like a truck, She felt as if 420 volts current running through 
her body. She right now was drowning in pleasure. 

She wanted to throw her head back and moan on top of her lungs clutching her brother 
tightly in her arms. 

"Ah ah, You are not allowed to open your mouth, My dear sister or I would be unhappy." 



But Alex quickly stopped her doing that, He with a grin on his lips warned her with 
devilish desire written all over his face. 
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Chapter 271 269. Lust Meter (R-18) 

"Hummm…Ahmmm~" 

Muffled but somehow loud sensual moans reverberating in the ward. 

The originator of these moans, Amara right now was tightly hugging her brother with her 
slender arms. 

Her long nails were digging into his back from over the shirt of Alex in an attempt to 
distract and hold herself back from opening her out and moaning loudly. 

Though strength was not enough to harm him but it was enough to feel a pressure of it, 
but neither Alex nor Amara cared about it at this moment. 

Amara is still holding Alex's finger in her mouth doing her best licking and sucking on it 
in futile attempts to distract herself from the tsunami of pleasure trying to drown her. 

"It looks like you are enjoying the service of your brother, don't you little pervert sister of 
mine?" 



Alex, being hugged by her able, put his head on her shoulder on angle because his right 
hand was in a way and so now he was whispering her pinkish blushing ear. 

The warmth of his breath hit her earlobes making the already hot body of hers even 
more volatile, as if he just sprinkled water on the wet pot, especially words of his sent 
shivers down her spine pushing her towards that deep edge. 

She right now was both wet and hot just waiting to be filled with a load of joy, Sadly she 
couldn't as she was pussyblocked by him, She couldn't enjoy it or she couldn't hold 
herself back from busting out making him angry. 

Thankfully she is an S-rank who has a superhuwoman level of control over her body, 
Which normally can make her ignore and control pretty much any reaction of her body 
to the outside stimuli. 

But her brother also has a supernatural level of talent making her edge more and more, 
He just rubs his around her entrance but it is enough to nearly push her towards the 
edge waiting to rain down her pleasure. 

'System active Lust Aura and target Sandra and Gloria, Use 80/20 safety ratio on them.' 

While Alex teasing Amara using 1% of his ecstasy hands, He commanded the system 
to use the lust aura of those two. 

After all, they are the only variable present in this room, Sandra's possessive nature 
might jump out triggering her FL halo, Which may or may not bring someone in this 
room to prevent things from further escalating between him and Amara. 

He is afraid his luck would definitely be someone like Alia and if for some god forsaken 
reason, he came here and saw them in this state, Then hell would literally freeze over 
by that ice queen. 

There is still a worse outcome though, There still a chance that night empress aka his 
dear fiancee decide to show up thanks to FL luck, Then he can only say gg and let fate 
take its course, Belladonna is that scary. 

So he can't take chances at all, Sandra has to be horny because if she is not, she would 
start thinking making a nightmare of his turning into reality. 

At least if she was horny even if FL halo triggered, It would help her get into his pants, 
Which he is sufficient enough to handle it. 

As for Gloria is just treated like a wild card, He is sure she would not interfere but he still 
not took risk and heat her up. 

"Sister, be careful I am touching petals, You are still not allowed to do it." 



Alex used his sexy enchanting voice to deliver both frightening and exciting news to 
Amara. 

He already figure out that she misunderstood him. When he said to not open his mouth 
she thought he was asking her not to cum, Not her fault though as lust overwhelmed all 
her logical and reasoning parts. 

If she thinks this way then it's even better, he can both tease her and tame Sandra in 
one go satisfying his sadistic side. 

Thinking of this, He stopped rubbing her sensitive part in the awkward position as both 
hands coming in the way of her hugging him properly, preventing him from getting close 
to those twin peaks once again. 

"Huh..?" 

Amara was taken aback when Alex stopped, She was both glad and was unhappy by it 
showing the duality of womankind. 

She was glad that he stopped as if he really did more than what he was doing right now. 
She could not able to hold herself back from releasing her pent up desires she so dearly 
holding back. 

Yet she was unhappy that he stopped, It was torture for her to enjoy her brothers 
carfwomanship and not to express how much she enjoying it but at the same time she 
was unwillimg to tread for anything else. 

So she was in a very complicated mood, and could not figure out how to react to his 
action. 

*Plop* 

After removing his left hand from her crotch, Alex also pulled his right hand from her 
mouth. 

Though he was enjoying the service of hermo mom, He would also like to fully enjoy 
each part of her without any hindrance. 

When Alex did this Amara was even more confused and even started to panic a little 
thinking she did something wrong making Alex angry that he pulling himself back. 

'Did I do something wrong? What did I do wrong? Is he angry? Maybe I should be more 
proactive? Would he stop doing this from now on? What should I do? Should I do 
something? What if that makes him angry? But he is already angry? So do I want to 
make him more angry? But..Argggh What should I do? What do I do to make him touch 
me, desire me now?' 



This simple action of Alex sends Amara in spiral, Turning back into the Amara everyone 
knows and loves, The always overthinking one with wildest imaginations. 

Thankfully Alex did not let her be with her thoughts, He quickly wrapped his left hand 
around her waist and pulling her closer to him not leaving a slightest gap even for air to 
leave. 

Then lifted his right front of his face and then lick his still wet index finger which was just 
inside her mouth a moment ago under the wide eyes of Amara. 

"Mmm-mmm, Sister you taste sweet." 

Alex using seductive tone spoken to Amara before fully submerging the said finger in 
his mouth, keeping the eye contact with her. 

[Ding! Host hit a critical strike… 

+20 Favorability of Amara increased for the host (Current : 405 Unhealthy Obsession)] 

[Ding! A sudden spike in Sandra's lust is detected by Lust Meter (Current : 90). 

(Note : Once lust hit 100, Person can't think anything other then a sex, Host can make a 
move then for better resuts.)] 

Alex expected there would be increase in the favorability of Amara, But it still surprise 
by how high her affection is for him, It's crossed the 400 mark. 

But hat suprise him more was notification of the lust meter, Since he brought it he didn't 
had any opportunity to use it, Rather her forget that he had this add-on. 

Right now it jumped up when he needed the most, Especially note attached to it. 

This made gears in Alex's brain started to move creating even more borderline for 
Sandra. 

'This going to be fun.' 

Alex thought of in his mind with that devilish smirk. 
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Chapter 272 270. Taboo And...Freak? (R-18) 

"Humm Hum?" 

Amara asked or tried to ask him with her closed mouth, humming to her asking if what 
he said was true in delight. 

She was on cloud nine when sae the action of her brother. Her body, which was already 
hot, became even more feverish. 

She felt like thousands if not millions of ants crawling on her body making her irresistible 
to his charms. 

The pussy of hers was already drenching with her love juices it was secreting, A trail of 
it can be seen from the back as it was sliding down from her both legs. 

The amount of jucies she was releasing was inhuwoman, If someone did not know what 
that slightly sticky liquid was, They might have misunderstood it as pee because the 
sheer amount of it couldn't be released by a normal woman. This is not logical. 

But when did this world follow the logic? It follows wishfulliment novel logic and by it, As 
long as there is good R-18 with little reasoning it's all it needs to exist. 

It can be said that Amara as an S-Rank has higher bodily limits then normal but that's 
just an bearly reasonable answer, Which is all it can give. 

"*Yes you are the sweetest, hottest sister in the world, *Unbuckle* *Unzip* Here I even 
have a proof." 

Alex guessed what she was trying to say and so answered her in his way. 

He got close to her unparalleled beautiful face, just hovering his lips over hers barely 
keeping distance in-between them. 



Her eyes were looked into his, Their warm rapid breaths gasps hitting on to each other's 
face, The faint obvious fragrances of Alex was entering into her nostrils creating not so 
child friendly images in her mind. 

Alex also feeling the twin peaks of hers sticking on his chest, Even through the clothes 
he can feel the erected nipples of her trying to stick into his body. 

In fact they were so excited and erected that it can even cut through diamonds. 

Then as he spoke, His lower lip given the condition slightly gazed on hers sending 
shivers in her body. 

This pushed her limit of control over her body as she was barely holding the raging flood 
that was threatening to break through her floodgates trying to hold it back. 

Alex was also not in any different situation, His rod was also ragging hard in his pants 
for while now making him uncomfortable. 

There was a struggle inside his trousers, Even though pants Liza arranged was one 
size bigger, It still did not have enough space in it for his dragon to roar. 

It wanted to break these evil shackles and then soar in the open sky, explore the 
uncharted as it meant to be, not locked in this tiny cage like place. 

So Alex holds the chin of Amara with his right hand raising it up in a romantic manner 
speaking the lethal word to her as his left let his dragon off its bounding. 

Just using one he was able to unbuckle and unzip his pants, and because it's one size 
bigger and Liza neither brought him a belt nor underwear. 

The moment he did this action, His pants directly fallen down on the ground fully 
exposing his tight hot long rod wanting to be used. 

"Hummm mummm mmmm." 

Amaras eyes became misty as she heard his words. Oh how long she was waiting for 
him to say these words? 

Her brother thinks she is not only the sweetest but also the hottest sister in this world. 
Oh How can she not be happy? 

How can she not be horney hearing such sweet lewd words? Why can't she just hop on 
the proof of his to show him hers? 

She wanted to say so much, she wanted to do so much but words of his bound her to 
not able to achieve what she wanted. 



Still she decided to at least try to tell him how much she loves him even if it's 
incomprehensible, She tried to tell him. 

"Shut up and Kiss me already." 

Alex, though can guess what Amara is trying to say, did not try to have a conversation. 

He is not a robot nor an emotionless machine, even though he might act like one 
through his sadistic acts. 

But he too has desires, When he is teasing others, especially killer beauty like Amara in 
front of which even Alia who holds the title of heroine in 2 novel plots seem dull. 

Of course he is going to be impatient. The only reason he is able to hold off this far is 
because of his sage heart and the fact that he finished with Gloria just a while ago. 

So he was able to control his rampant desire but the raw allure of her inherent seductive 
sexual aura was enough to even ignite a wet wood, not to mention he is still a man with 
raging hormones. 

So how can he hold himself back seeing such an alluring beauty in front of him wanting 
to be ravaged by him? 

He ignored everything Amara trying to say, He scolded her and asked her to kiss, But 
just right after he finished his sentence without even a second of delay he captured 
those cherry pink lips of hers. 

"Mummm!!! Mummm~" 

Amara was not prepared for such a sneaky onslaught, When both of their lips met, The 
malicious agile tongue of his took advantage of her unpreparedness and successfully 
sneaked into her mouth. 

And even before she react, It searched and found her small pink tongue and started 
coiling with hers thoroughly bullying her as an payback of her previous actions. 

While they were kissing, Alex hands were also wondering all over her body, From her 
smooth back to her tight ass, from her flat stomach to her bountiful twins. 

No place was being left unexplored expect the nether one. 

Amara too was kissing his wildly, Her left leg even warping around Alex's body giving 
support to her body. 

Her hands were also wildly moving between his back and the luscious hair on his head, 
She was being erratic. 



This was too much pleasure and stimuli for Amara that she was on her last leg, This 
action of his pushed her to the edge so much that she was barely hanging by a thread. 

The only thing that she keeping herself from admitting defeat and drowning herself in 
pleasure was the fact that if she did, Alex would be angry. 

That was the only thought was keeping her together but even that thought became burly 
as her mind started to be clouded by lust. 

One more move and she would be utterly defeated in the explosive manner. 

"*Gasp* *Ahem* Sister, which one would you be? Backdoor like before or becoming a 
woman." 

Alex finally broken their kiss, and held his raging hard dick on the entrance of her 
uncharted slippery wet terrain. 

Because of the position of Amara wrapping her leg around him, It washarf easy for Alex 
to just put and his rod directly on her scorching hot lower lips covering the glans and the 
rod of his in her juices for better lubrication but seeing her state it seems it would be a 
smooth journey. 

He was right now waiting for her answer to see what and how she wanted him to do her. 

'What is happening to me? Why I am…am this hot? Is…is this turning me on? Why?' 

Not far away Sandra sees the love of her life doing this with another woman, Not only 
some random woman but his own sister was right now doubting her life. 

As not only it failed to make her angry and jealous as it was her man there but even 
seeing these brother and sister such a taboo was gruning her on. 

She is not a freak to turn on by seeing her man doing this, She is really not like that at 
all, She swears. 

But her damn eyes refused to look away from such this taboo. 

(A/N : Today would be another update which would either be in the afternoon or the 
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Chapter 273 271. Fall I (R-18) 

*Huff* *Huff* 

Loud husky rapid breathing was being heard in the VIP ward. 

Amara's pink eyes were locked on to Alex as he held his dick on her entrance drenching 
in her juices, Waiting for her to male a choice. 

Both things are so legendary that Alex doesn't care what she would choose. 

One is an unchartered territory, If she chose that then she would turn from girl to 
moment instantly the next moment. 

Which in Alex's eyes should not be the case as he love her and so wants her to have 
her special moment, Not lose her treasured V-card here this way. 

But he also understands how long she waited for this, If she can't wait anymore and 
wants to do it here, He was more than willing to fulfill such a small wish. 

But if she chose ass then that is a different story as it comes to his realization that he 
might be into ass more. 

Not sure about it but there might an chance as the moment he thought fucking her tight 
small pink ass, His glans swell double of it's size threatening to burst because of sudden 
blood flow. 

So there is hope that she should chose ass in his heart but seeing last time her small 
but still resistance to it seems she would not wanna do it. 

After all, Even though in this world women dream of their boyfriend wanting to do anal 
with them without them begging, not all women want the same thing. 

Amara might be a minority in them as with her favorability for him, It's strange that she 
showed initial resistance to him, She might really not like the anal. 

'What to do? What to do? What to do? How can I say I want anal? Didn't that send the 
wrong signal to him? What's the difference between those dirty harpies out there and 
me? 

But…But he liked it in the morning didn't he? My brother migh- no he definitely loves 
anal as he said with passion. 

But what if he did it for me? What if he does it because women dream of doing it? What 
if he hates it but he does it just for me? 



Did he do that for me? He did something he did not like for me? Why is my brother so 
lovely? 

But didn't he say he loves doing the anal? He looked like he too was enjoying it, So 
maybe he started liking anal and is not disgusted by it like other men? 

Yeah, My brother is indeed different, isn't he? So how can he be treated at the 
standards of other men? He is different from them, He is one and only. 

I should say what I wanted, If he didn't like it then just say I was kidding, This is the 
perfect plan.' 

Amara being Amara started her usual overthinking and wild imaginations. 

Before the Yin power was restricting her brain so she was not able to overthink but 
maybe because that undead got bored and stopped spying on them. 

Or Amara's inheart S-rank warrior class resistance finally kicked in and started passively 
countering the Yin side effects. 

Either the case, Her childish innocent but also cute and sexy self started to come out. 

Her misty pink eyes were confused and fearful as she trying to make up sentence to ask 
her brother to fuck her ass without sounding like too eager. 

"*Ahem* Tha- *Gulp* Bac- Why don't you choose? I-I am all yours do whatever you 
want brother." 

Amara tried, tried so hard to tell him she wanted him in her ass, She tasted the taste of 
forbidden and was addicted to it. 

But no matter how she tried, She wasn't able to bring herself to say it, Not in front of so 
many people present. 

Because apparently it's okay to be wanting to be fucked in ass by your brother in front of 
said peoples but saying is crossing a line, Oh a lovely hypocritical contradicting moral 
values. 

"Are you sure I should choose? You might not like it?" 

Alex hearing her crips full of lust voice barely able to hold himself back from bending her 
right away shoving his hard throbbing rod in her tiny pink asshole. 

He still gave her the last opportunity to choose, Because afterwards he would not be 
able to stop nor able to control himself. 



He held his hot busting tool on her folds, rubbing it slowly teasing her clit and entering 
just a few centimeters of his glans inside trying to seek peak off uncharted land before 
coming out hitting her fully erected clit sending shivers in her body. 

"Ahmmm uhmm, D-Do anything." 

Amara long since forgotten she was supposed to keep her mouth shut, Lust clouded her 
mind. 

She bite down her lower lip trying to hold back her lound lovely moans as Alex was 
teasing her. 

She could not wait to felt her brother once again inside, Felt that warmth, that uncanny 
paramount of pleasure and so she just give him all the control. 

Everything of hers belongs to him, That includes she herself, He can use it as much he 
wants, After all she is his. 

Remember she crossed 400 favorability mark for Alex, So don't even try to understand 
her mental thinking any more, She is fully obsessed with him. 

"Then that's it, *Exhale* I would do what I like sister, You are not allowed to be angry 
later *Bite*" 

Alex's rod hearing her saying what he wanted to hear started throbbing, His already big 
glans swell more as the excitement of banging his sisters ass took over his actions. 

Now that she given to him what he wanted, He to affectionately reached to her ears 
exhaling his warm neck whispering a tempting warning in her blushing ear. 

After which he bites and nibbles her earlobe, While his right hand rubs his dick on her 
pussy, properly coating it with her love juices for lubrication. 

While his left hand was on her buttocks lifting fully hervo purple dress, So it would not 
get in the way as he didn't want to hold back anymore. 

Amara never had any resistance to her brother anyway, So when he did that this time 
she did not hold back and moaned giving her consent to let him ravage her anyway he 
likes. 

Though she still hopes for the anal but she knows anything her brother would do to her 
is going to make her addicted to it, So she does not have any complaints. 

"Ah, Sandr- Never mind, Grace can yo-" 



"Wait? What Alex? What can I do for you? Please don't ignore me like this, I would do 
anything to prove I am not here to harm you." 

Alex had a smirk adorning his lips as he decided to take the 2nd step in his plan. 

He on purpose took Sandra's name on purpose but at the last moment changed his 
mind and decided to ask Grace. 

This made her quickly jump out like a drowning woman grasping for the straw. 

She even at her current lust level with mixed emotional turmoil is able to know this is her 
chance to prove to him she is not his enemy, For to prove she indeed ready to do 
anything. 

"Huh...Then stand here firmly and wait for further instructions." 

Seeing fish take the bait, Alex quickly pointed behind Amara and asked her to stand 
firmly, giving her a front view of Amara's smooth white tight ass. 

Sandra, though uncomfortable, did not resist and did as Alex said, trying to surpass the 
sudden rise of illicit desires. 

Alex just had the devilish smile on his face as he made a move. 

(A/N : I know it's late but I slept too much, Good thing is that I can't sleep now, So there 
might be another update in a few hours. 

But no comments as you know next chapter is very hard *Ba- 

dum-tss* 

Anyway, If it not come out in few hours then same time in evening, As I am sure I at 
least write more than half before I sleep, In any case there would be no wait for actual 
sega. 

Oh and It's just one more chapter or two if I decided to give POV after I would start to 
move back to the dormitory as it was a LONG day. 

By the way, I am starting to feel good. If you wanna know, Hence why normal updates, 
There would be the start of a new novel soon too, don't forget about it. 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁.) 
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Alex quickly shifted his position of his hands from her ass to on her slender waist 

Then before she even understood what happened, He using both of his hands gave her 
a spin turning her 180°. 

Her left leg was wrapped around Alex before so she was standing on her one foot and 
because of such a sudden moment, on top of the loose grip on her left foot. 

Her foot quickly separated from his body and that shifted her center of gravity as most 
of her body weight was on Alex for support. 

Still as an S-Rank her reaction time was quite sharp, When she turned 180° and was 
about to fall head first. 

Her core back support showed slowing down her fall giving her ample time to grab and 
hold the hands of Sandra who was standing uncomfortable behind her. 

The moment Amara touched her hands which Sandra out if instincts moved forward felt 
immense disgust in her heart. 

Her first reaction was to try and shake Amara from her body as the mere touch of her 
was repulsed by her. 

She tried to take a step back the next second and prevented herself from moving as she 
knew doing so would seal off her relationship with Alex forever. 

Alex here though saw her small reaction but did not pay any attention to Sandra as his 
whole focus was solely on Amara. 

His both hands landed on both sides of her uplifted asscheeks because of her current 
position. 

Then he spread them apart revealing her fleshy pink tiny asshole egear for attention. 

Alex did not wait to give any warning, His dick was already rock hard. So without even 
support of his hand he put on the hole and directly shoved half of it's length inside her 
asshole. 



Because it was without any warning, His dick rammed in her tearing it open, and 
because it was sudden the pain reaction tried to close it but creating a tight seal around 
his rob locking it in place. 

"AHhhh~ FUCKK!!!" 

*Squirt* *Squirt* *Squirt* *Squirt* 

Amara really was not prepared for this, She genuinely thought he would go for her other 
hole not back one one. 

A thought that Alex did this for her happiness even if he might dislike it along with the 
flood of pleasure hit her body and brain, she was not able to resist and finally her 
defenses. 

Her whole body became tense, Her back arched as her grip on Sandra's hands 
increased as she started squirting her love juices from her tempting pussy. 

Because of the position of Amara and the pressure of her extrem orgasum, She 
sprayed not directly downwards but on an angle front, Where Sandra was standing 
soiling her small hill shoes. 

Sandra, because the open part of her shoes was in direct contact with her warm sticky 
liquid, She felt like she was touched by the vilest thing possible. Every part of her body 
urgin-no begging her to get away from it. 

But the will of FL was there, She did not move inch not reacted even though her heart 
felt like it was just stabbed. 

She knows he has ro do this but why does she not only have to watch but hold the 
woman he was banging? 

And why is this woman more beautiful than her? Why? Why does this alway happen to 
her? 

Just why even though she was utterly disgusted by all this she can't shake off the 
feeling in her heart? Why is she feeling the heat in her nether? She didn't wanted to feel 
this way, She is not weirdo. 

*Huff* *Huff* *Gulp* *Huff* 

Even though Amara is S-Rank, The intense orgasum she just had because of the 
edging and cocktails of emotions along with the cock of her brother, She becomes 
exhausted. 

Her body becomes a little soft relaxed basking in the aftermath bliss of their act. 



"Sister, Are you done this soon? I didn't even put it fully inside you." 

Seeing Amara like this Alex once again reminded of his effect on women. 

Amara's body was still shaking after her intense orgasum, If not for Sandra holding her 
back, The powerhouse like her would not even be able to stand on her own legs. 

All this while he just put it inside her not even fully yet, He didn't even start moving, 
What would she do if she did? Isn't that fun to see? 

"Hu-Huh..Wh-No, I-!!! FUCKK ME!!!!" 

*Bang* *Pat* 

"That's exactly what I am doing sister." 

Amara was muddle headed because of bliss still when she heard the mocking teasing 
tone of her brother tried to justify why she cummed so early. 

She is not a 30 second woman, She can last more. It was just a happy accident and all 
but she was in no state to even think of words to convey her message. 

But Alex, seeing her state, smirked and with one push of his waist rammed his hot shaft 
deep in her. 

Amara was shocked by the one more wave of pleasure hit her body and soul, Her body 
yet to recover from the previous hit of orgasum and now even her soul felt like it found 
the bliss of Nirvana. 

Her grip of Sandra tightened as her nails dig into her flesh leaving behind small 
scratches lor an cat then like before there was once again over flow of her juices. 

Surprisingly it was even more than before completely soaking the foot of Sandra in her 
love juices making Sandra both disgusted and…horney for obvious reasons. 

[Ding! It's detected Sandra Lust is 95 and steadily increasing.] 

System voice popped-up in his mind reminding Alex his target is Sandra right now. He 
can have fun with Amara as much as he wants when he goes back home. 

Alex knows it, Sandra is a wild card that should be tamed as soon as possible. The 
more he waits the more he risks creating unseen variables. 

*Pull* *Rammed* 

"Ahhh!!!!~ Ge-GeMummmmh…Uhhhhh, AhMummm" 



*Pat* *Pat* *Slap* *Pat* *Pat* 

So Alex reluctantly decided to do moved quickly with Amara, And so he pulled his fully 
submerged cock out of her ass nearly all till his glans before he rammed back in. 

Amara was all this time passively enjoying everything, loving every moment of her 
brother's gentle care for her. 

How he was patient with her, letting her have her time before moving forward or at least 
it was from her perspective, A perspective of a woman with Unhealthy Obsession for 
her brother. 

So it came to her as shock when he suddenly became rough with her, He pulled out and 
then without any warning slammed it in giving her one more orgasum right there. 

She doesn't want to but can't help it, Her brother was like walking ecstasy to her, His 
touch was enough to send her on cloud nine, So her being inside her of course is going 
to have this effect. 

Especially when her brother was so good at it, It was his dick especially made for her, It 
fit into her like a well crafted puzzle piece. 

Her body was spasming because of the rush of pleasure she was feeling and then there 
was one more wave of pleasure even before she had time to recover. 

Alex once again pulled out and rammed her, Their naked flesh slammed on to each 
other creating a distinguished noise making her moan even louder in pleasure. 

This time she lost her mind, which she kinda did. The surge of pleasure along with the 
mental stimulation of her brother was the one who making her feel that way and made 
her mind muddle. 

And a cycle of waves of pleasure hitting her and her reacting each one to starts, Her 
exhilarating seductive voice filled the ward making everyone's bloodrush because of the 
lust. 

All the girls eyes were filled with envy, looking at Amara with jealousy as why can't it be 
them? 

Liza was pretending to not look in their direction but still watching them through her 
Peripheral vision. 

Well she couldn't help it. As a 42 years old virgin, She didn't even know how to do sex, 
So for her this was a historical educational moment. 

So she was trying to understand as much as she can. 



Xiao Bai thankfully leave the ward and was playing with Sapphira in the space pocket 
Amara was using before. 

Gloria though still pretending to be passed out, was burning with raged and mixed 
emotions as she heard everything that was happening in her ward. 

Of course only Grace, like a great girl she was not in the jealous list and her motto was 
if Alex is happy she is happy. 

She was rather more concerned about Sandra and was eyeing her as she noticed the 
weirdness of this dumb woman. 

Sandra was staring at Alex as he was railing his sister with the look in her eyes. 

Normally it's not a big deal to stare at Alex as his charm is that otherworldly but Grace 
did not feel right about the look in the eyes of Sandra. 

It was not a look of admiration but her gaze was filled with lust and passion, She looking 
at Alex like a hungry wolf looking at a white sheep. 

'What is she planning to do? Don't do anything irrational, idiot, He's not gonna like that.' 

It did not take her long to understand what this woman was lost in heat, Lust nearly 
overtook Sandra seeing her misty eyes with her red hot face as she was inching 
towards Alex who was still going all out on his sister. 

Grace already felt troubled. She knows the temper more than anyone, This is one of the 
few times people should not disturb him. 

Especially not the people he just throw a bone and gave one chance to prove 
themselves. 

If Sandra did anything stupid then that would be it for her. 

Grace didn't know why she didn't like that thought as she decided to go to Sandra and 
stop her dumbass. 

But when she looked up it was already too late. 

(A/N : Hello, I know I promised an update yesterday but I caught a cold. Turns out 
bathing at 3 a.m with cold water in winter is not a good idea. 

In my defense though I used to do it as I sleep better, It's just yesterday that it might be 
colder than before, So my tonsils decided to show up after a year of slumber. 

Anyway I am used to it, They go away on their own. 



Yes, today would be one more update, I promise there would be an update and that 
would end this ward scene, So it might be big or divided into two either the case 
tomorrow would end this saga. 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁. ) 
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*Pat* *Pat* *Pat* 

"Mmmmmm..Ahhh..mmmm" 

The sound of naked wet flesh slamming onto each other mixed with the seductive 
moaning was reverberating in the room. 

Alex was ramming his schlong in Amara's ass, While she was moaning enjoying every 
slam of her brother. 

She was also reciprocating, Her ass was also hitting back along with his action of 
entering. 

"Mmmmm Ye…Yesss, Har…harder Ahhhh." 

Amara was moaning and begging Alex to do it harder. 

Her mind was already out of it, Right now her body was responding on its own. 

Right now no one knows how many times she had orgasm in this small window but from 
the little puddle below her foot can be seen it was not a small number. 

'I…I also want it.'  

Sandra looking at Amara with jealousy in her eyes, She too wants it to have this feeling 
once again. 

Seeing Alex's mighty schlong servicing Amara makes her horney. 

Yeah horney then jealousy, The lust was taken over her body, Her neither was itching 
carving to be touched, begging for the attention of a man in front of her. 



Her newly blossomed petals were glistening with her love juices which were dripping 
from her red folds. 

Alex did not show any mercy to her when he deflowered her in the godown of the shop, 
Though she enjoyed every second of it. 

That pinche of the pain along with the flood of pleasure was the perfect cocktail for her 
to reach the paramount of the pleasure. 

She was still wearing those soiled panties when they left the mall, But when she came 
to the hospital, In the waiting room she removed it as she thought she would buy a new 
pair later. 

But then other events inspired, So she came here. Thankfully she wore the long loose 
pants of Grace before, So there was no issue of going commando. 

At least it was no issue until right now as her slit has become Niagara falls with a never-
ending supply of juices. 

It already soiled the pants and made them wet enough that it would start to drip out any 
moment if she continued watching. 

Though kinda loose pants, Because of the wetness her erected clit was also kinda 
visible as it created a little outline over her pants. 

*Huff* *Huff* 

'Please…Please notice me.' 

Sandra was hyperventilating, Not only her face but her whole body had the crimson 
tempting hue that was urging people to bully her more. 

Her thoughts were just putting fuel in the already blazing desire of hers. 

She was begging, praying that he would notice her, Leave his sister and care about his 
desires and wants. 

She was not asking much, All she wanted was to get her brain fucked out by the man in 
front of her, Is that too much to ask? 

"Yessshhhh!!! FUCK ME HARDER BROTHER." 

A loud shriek of Amara broke the thoughts of Sandra. 

She looked at Amara with envy-filled eyes as if this was having what she wanted, 
Rather Than was hers. 



Alex is hers and hers alone, No one can have it other than her, The only reason why 
she was even entertaining this thing is because he misunderstood her. 

When she solved that then she would get her happily ever after and have him all for 
herself. 

Grace might be the only woman she might share him with, Other than her no one else 
can have him. 

As for his needs? She can find a way if not she would just hire some good woman for it, 
Making sure they are clean. 

It's just a thought of the future but right now she also has her needs. She wants him, 
She wants to feel him inside her like before. 

That hot thing paving its way through her inside, opening her insides like before. 

"Sister…I...I am close to…Arghh." 

Then Sandra heard that dreadful voice, Her man enjoying the other woman not only that 
he was about to cum in her. 

Why? It belongs to her, How can other women do what is rightfully hers? She did not 
want to allow it. 

Sandra's thoughts were running rampant, And because of the lust which had already 
taken over her head, she was not able to think properly. 

The thought that he would get angry did not cross her mind at all and even if it did it 
could not sway her away from what she was about to do. 

"Insi…Hummm…Fill…me…Up mhmmm Ahhh~" 

Amara heard her brothers words and was suddenly filled with energy wanting to be filled 
by the baby batter of her brother. 

She can't get enough of it. Not only does it taste better but also when that warm hot 
liquid pours inside her she reaches the pinnacle of ecstasy-like bliss and so she was 
looking forward to it. 

"Here…Argghh!!!" 

*Slam* *Sprut* *Sprut* *Sprut* *Sprut* 

Alex hearing Amara, clawed his hand on her tight ass trying to dig into it before giving 
one final push slamming his dick as far as he can inside her. 



The glans of his swell as his balls tighten before he shoots his baby batter inside her 
trying to fill her up from inside. 

"OHHHH….YESSS!!! I AM CUMMING!! *Squirt* *Squirt*" 

Amara felt that hot lava like baby batter of her brother was pouring in her ass, This shot 
her pleasure level sky-high. 

She subconsciously tightened her asshole clenching around his cock trying to give him 
as much pleasure as she can. 

Then her back arched back towards Alex so as her head, and yelled top of her lungs 
without caring where she was or who might hear it. 

She instantly had multiple orgasms, Even though she had many at this point but it did 
not lower the amount of liquid she shot out. 

And now because of her angle, Her love juices did fall on the ground before but shot 
directly in front of her, specifically on Sandra. 

Sandra stand stupefied as her lower half was drenched in the love juices of a woman 
who cummed because of cock of her man. 

It took her a moment to process it and when she did, She hated it. She hated the fact 
she did not hate being drenched in the love juices of women. 

The fact that this happened because of her man just sent her into a spiral. Rather than 
make her disgusted, She strangely felt excited like a puppy wanting to hop on the man 
she loves. 

*Huff* *Huff* 

Amara was because her aftermath of multiple orgasms was huffing and was out of 
commission. 

*Plop* *Splutter* 

Alex pulled out his dick out of her ass making a plop sound telling how tight she was 
clenching on it that it created a partial vacuum. 

"Sister, are you happy now?" 

Alex took Amara in his arms, Pinching sticking hair on her sweaty smooth cheeks and 
putting it behind her ear as he gently spoke in her ears. 



Hearing this soft voice nearly melted her heart not just hers but everyone in the earshot 
as he had the blessing of the God-level singing making his already high on charm voice 
even more mellow. 

"Hummmp." 

All Amara could do was hum in satisfaction as she lay her head on Alex's shoulder. 

Her eyes were still closed maybe because she was enjoying the aftertaste of pleasure 
or she was just too exhausted or both. 

But from the satisfying smile adoring on her plump lips says that she is happy for 
whatever happens here. 

"Okay, you take a rest for a while here." 

Alex shook her head with a slight smile on his face, He then moved Aamara carefully, 
Don't look at her plump figure, She was quite light in weight than what one might think. 

So it was easy for him. He quickly moved her to the wall and helped her sit on the chair 
present there for visitors. 

Yeah someone really just put a visitor chair in the ICU ward, ignore that, It's a VIP one 
in a novel world, Ignore it. 

"Hey look at that, That would be a problem, wouldn't it?" 

After Alex put her down, He turned around and looked down at his still rock solid cock 
covered in a wetness and was still dripping his jizz. 

Then he looked at others in the room in a questioning manner, His meaning was clear. 

He was asking who is here to help him fix the "issue" he has right now. 

All woman in the ward understand the meaning of his, It's just that they just saw where 
that mighty tool of Alex has been a moment ago. 

So the initial hesitation was expecte… 

"M-Me I can do it." 

"Alex, Don't worry I will fix it for you." 

"No, Give me a chance, It's for me to prove myself." 



Well all these three women ran against the expectations and jumped on the opportunity 
that was presented right in front of them. 

If not for the fact that Gloria was still pretending to be asleep at this moment she might 
also have jumped on this opportunity but that was given as she was still under the effect 
of lust aura. 

Even Alex was surprised by them, He double checked to see if lust aura was on only 
two Sandra and Gloria. 

So he was expecting Sandra to make a move as lust overtook her thinking part of the 
brain. 

Not Liza and Grace, Well Grace might be understandable as her devotion is like love for 
him but not Liza. 

Liza still has not crossed that insanity mark as he has yet to do anything sexual with 
her. 

'She still had to wait, It's Sandra's turn.' 

Alex though wanted to taste the forbidden but milf loli, He still knew what was more 
important as he made way towards Sandba. 

After which he grabs her by her hair forcing her to kneel. 

(A/N : Sorry for not uploading for two days. Those tonsils gave me a fever which 
happened after a long time. Now I am feeling good, hence the update. 
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"Clean it up for me." 

Alex grabbing the hair of Sandra pulled her face close to his dick. 

He was not being the least bit gentle like he was with Amara moments ago. 



The grip of his hair was not light, Her scalp was being because of the pull of his he 
rudely yanked her head towards him. 

His every so enchanting voice right now is cold as an iceberg reminding of a certain ice 
queen and her persona. 

"I..Tha- Arghh *Choke* *Cough*" 

Sandra was in shock because of the sudden pain, She was not ready when he grabbed 
her head and forced her to kneel on the same ground which was wet because of the 
Aamar's carfwomanship. 

And yet it did not matter to her as the lower half of her body was already covered in it. 
The only problem is that her pants are made of cotton and so it absorbs the juices not 
only making her pants heavy but making that sticky liquid get on her skin. 

Then he without even giving her a time yanked her head towards himself practically 
dragging her whole body along with it. 

Thankfully on floor porcelain tiles were used, Though non-slip but because of the 
wetness working as a lubricant there was no force needed for Alex to pull her. 

So she did not feel that much pain but still the shock woke her from her shock. 

Then she heard the words of Alex, She knows what he wanted and what she sign up for 
but at this instance her mind went blank as she could not able to comprehend even a 
word he said. 

She hesitantly and fearfully opened her cheery small mouth to ask about but just as she 
did that, Alex seeing the opening shoved his dick directly in her mouth. 

It rudely marched forwards making its way deep in her mouth expanding as it moved 
forward using her pink tongue as a cushion for its overbearing act. 

Sandra's mind did not have any time to react but her body did, This action of his 
triggered the bodily instincts of hers. 

She started coughing again trying to throw out the awaited intruder as it's making its 
way towards her throat. 

"*Cough* *Cough* Mummm *Gag* *Cough* *Gag*" 

Sandra was struggling, Her body because of unexpected intrusion reacting strongly. 
There was no time for her to relax her muscles and throat for it to move forward without 
hindrance. 



Because Alex did not have her even a slightest moment to prepare or even wait till he 
move forward. 

His already well lubricated cock was forcing its way in triggering her bodily reaction 
making her unable to do anything then to try and suppress those reactions. 

Tears started to roll down from her eyes staining her smooth cheeks, The little 
remaining mascara of hers because of the previous encounter with Alex also started to 
wash away. 

But to her dismay or say surprise, The more Alex was rude and causing her pain the 
more she was turned on by this treatment. 

Yeah treatment as it was not pain that was making her excited and make her moan 
rather it was who and how he was doing it. 

She reacted the same when for her first time in the storeroom of the game store but 
both this time and that time she was in no condition to think about this issue. 

All she knows is that she loves to be hurted by Alex, But in reality it was that she loves 
to be treated like trash by him. 

It's not unique to her though as it's the problem of every FL in romance novel, More you 
treat them like trash the more they are attracted to the ML. 

Alex knew this very well and was using it against her but because he didn't have an ML 
title there was a risk of capsizing it. 

After all, FL also is one of the most unreasonable beings along with the protagonist. 

If he messed up and did too much before he would have destroyed her character and 
end up with a FL with Unhealthy Obsession without any rules and restrictions that 
normally they have to prevent them from having a smooth journey. 

But now that Alex has the ML title, He can go wild as he wants, Of course he is still not 
using his netori sex skills as unlike heroines, FL does not have strong inherent 
resistance to it. 

Alex is going to use it but not right away, because though FL don't have resistance to 
his sex skill specifically as FL not alway are monogamous but they do have protection of 
heaven and so FL does not lose her mind. 

"Stop coughing and use your tongue to clean it." 

Ice cold voice of Alex, void of any emotions, brought Sandra to her senses as she 
looked up at that breathtakingly unreasonable handsome face staring down at her. 



His black starry night like eyes were locked on her face making her blush and shy not 
having courage to look straight at him. 

Yup even when his dick literally was in her mouth trying to make its way towards her 
throat, She was shy to meet his eyes. 

That's the broken level of his charm that long since transcends the realm of possibility, 
FL didn't have resistance against his charm like heroines do. 

Which can be seen that the moment she showed his face to her, He not only raided her 
but also her favorability reached 200 directly. 

So even with those cold eyes looking at her like some ant, some insignificant thing that 
is not even worth his full attention, Sandra's heart was bubbly, wanting to be seen by 
him till eternity. 

"Didn't you hear what I said? Clean it" 

Sandra was lost in Alex's beauty and so she did not hear what he said. It's not her fault 
though as she even forgot to cough and choke. 

It can be seen how deep an effect Alex has on her that even her body's involuntary 
reaction was halted. 

It's just Alex had to play his role and he played exceptionally. 

He acted just like an overbearing cold ceo in those novels. It was not that hard for him 
though as he was with Alia for years. 

So he just did what Alia would do when people do not listen to her right away. 

He clenched her hair even more tightly and pulled back making her look up at him, 
While his half of cock was still inside her mouth as her lips were wrapped around the 
shaft. 

To be honest, Sandra though has many trigger points and is walking TNT for him, But at 
this moment she looked cute. 

Her big dark eyes had a slight red hue because of the tears, Still those eyes were 
perfect. 

Her face was though still just above average but because of her title of FL and the 
passiveness of Netori Halo, She too was looking like a precious art meticulously crafted 
by the artist. 



Alex would have felt bad for her treating this way, As who wouldn't? If he did not see the 
excitement and lust written all of face. 

He saw the jolt of happiness spread across her face when she got hit by that wave of 
pain. 

"Ahh~ *Gag* *Cough*" 

Seeing that Alex smirked and pushed his hip forward, It just moved just a half of 
centimeters inside because of her tight throat. 

But it was enough for his cock to move forward and touch her uvula causing her to snap 
out of her trance and cough and gag violently. 

This would have been a painful experience for anyone and it was true for her too much 
it's just other than trying to get away from it. She was enjoying it. 

Not only that, The moment it touched hercu uvula it made her cum, She was ashamed 
that she cummed this early. 

As post nut clarity halted the surge of lust in her mind giving her time to think but then 
feeling then wet ground, She ignored her shame as she was not the only 30 second 
woman here. 

Then she finally reacted, Her tongue which was below his throbbing cock started to 
move and lick as it started or at least try to move around it. 

As there was not much space left in her mouth, She still squeezed through the small 
gaps and licking it. 

She was expecting the foul smell and taste as she was doing this given the place it had 
been a moment ago before it entered her mouth. 

But to her surprise it smelled nice, Rather it has a nice scent like a flower for some 
reason. 

Even though the taste was slightly sweet, She didn't know how the antonym of S-Rank 
works but seeing they are still huwoman, She thought it would not be different but it 
seems that is not the case. 

*Glup* *Lick* *Lick* *Cough* *Gag* 

Sandra though still choking and gagging diligently doing her job eagerly like she was 
possessed by the spirits. 



Her small but agile tongue was coiling around the length of the shaft in her mouth 
collecting lots of saliva in her mouth. 

Obviously she was preparing for and trying to make it easy for him to enter even deep 
inside her. 

*Plop* 

"Huh..h?" 

Suddenly as she was preparing for the next route of action, Alex pulled his cock out of 
her mouth. 

Sandra was confused by his action and so looked at him with confusion. 

"That's enough, It's clean, Fuck off." 

What answered her confusion was these cold words of his. 

(A/N : Didn't I say there would be daily updates? I didn't forget it this time. 
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Sandra was kneeling on the ground looking at the cold face of Alex with a confused look 
on her face. 

It's clean, Fuck off. 

These words of his ringing in her mind as she tried to piece together what he did he 
mean by that? 

Because her mind already gave her the answer of what he meant by that but her heart 
refused to acknowledge it. 

How could she? She was enjoying him and it looked like he even forgave her. If not, he 
at least was on her way to forgive her and solve their misunderstanding. 



She was also eager to feel him inside her, She was preparing for that one last shot. 
There was enough saliva accumulated in her mouth that she would be able to push his 
member all the way till it's base. 

But she was rudely and heartlessly denied by him of that pleasure, She was still waiting 
to hear that he was joking and give her that mighty member back. 

It's just it was nothing but her futile dream as Alex already walked away from her. 

She wanted to ask, No rather question him but because of the saliva in her mouth she 
couldn't speak. 

She didn't want to swallow it yet as it would be needed for her to do that act. 

"What are you thinking about?" 

Alex in the stunned and jealous eyes of Sandra made his way to Garce, Who was 
standing there staring at him thinking who knows what. 

He saw her in this state and chuckled a little as she was looking too cute. 

Her hazel brown big eyes were locked on his figure in the same way as it was when 
they first met. 

The love in those eyes of undisguise and so was her desires though there was her 
failed attempts to cover it. 

He get close to her face looking at her eyes as they were lost looking at him, Her nose 
was just inch away from his as her moist plump red lips were tempting him to take a 
bite. 

"Wha- Me? Nothing." 

Grace jumped out as his words brought her back from her trance, She blinked and 
when she saw he was standing so close to her she startled. 

She instinctively moved back and was about to fall because of the wrong footing but 
Alex already prepared for something like this beforehand. 

He quickly made a move grabbing her slender waist pulling her towards him in his arms. 

*Thump* *Thump* 

Grace's heart was pounding like crazy at this moment as she found herself in the arms 
of a man she fell in love with at first sight. 



Her eyes could not look away from his face still not believing he is actually there and not 
just her hallucination. 

After all, Even if they already did the deed but Grace is still insecure about her position 
in his heart. 

Her having low self esteem also not helped at all. 

She knows she is not as rich as Alia, Nor is as smart or beautiful as her. Other than in 
the field of business, Grace could not compete with Alia in other things at all. 

Even then Alia has way more experience then her in the business and so she also not 
win in that field. 

Her seeing Alex so madly in "love" in Alia before also flamed her insecurities and so her 
self esteem also got a hit. 

Then she had that magical moment with Alex she always dreamed of, Though he used 
the "wrong" hole but it was still the best thing she ever experienced. 

Yet she knows that even in this she does not win over Alia as Alex had already done 
this with her after their break up, Giving his first time to Alia. 

She did not hate or even care about that as she just wanted to be with him but it still 
hurt her to see Alia having such a strong position in his heart that she was fearful that 
he would not have any place for her. 

But her fears did not become true as he still had a place for her in his heart and also 
that place was no less than Alia. 

She was so over the moon that because he wanted she decided she would help him get 
into her mothers pants. 

This action of his just brought two of them even more closer, and he showered her in 
love making her addicted to it. 

It's just now seeing him with other women, Seeing him doing with them all this time back 
to back makes her think. 

She was lost in thought and counted how many times he actually did it. 

Before she entered the room he was doing her brother and from looks of it, It was a long 
good one. 

Then he started doing his sister, After which he was able to do it with Sandra right 
away. 



His throbbing cock was also did not become flaccid as he took out from his sister's ass 
and just shoved straight into the mouth of Sandra. 

This shows how much stamina he has, So the question was, Why did he only do it one 
time with her? 

Not only did he do it only one time by cuming inside her and go flaccid afterwards but he 
also did not try to do it again. 

Why did he not do it again? He is able to do it and he is capable of doing so and yet he 
didn't do it. 

He just covered her in a blanket and let her sleep telling her he would come at night to 
her. 

But he didn't come as he promised, Now to think about it he also left right away after 
saying this to her. 

She was not at him for doing so, She was just afraid and fearful knowing she 
disappointed him. 

He clearly did not like doing to her, Maybe she was way worse than Alia even in that, 
He just didn't say it not to hurt her feelings. 

He definitely had gone to someone else afterwards, She just hope it was not Alia he go 
seeking for pleasure. 

She was going over everything on what she did wrong and how she could improve it. 

Answer was obvious in her mind. She was a virgin so she did not perform right but what 
if she added a more experienced person with her? 

She was thinking tag team Alex with someone else who had more experience and that 
someone else is no one but her dear mother. 

She didn't think about this fully as how can she when her mother was bed ridden? 

But now that Gloria is said to be fine, Well her moans do tell so, Grace started to think 
deeply about it. 

It's just when she saw Sandra and her desperate measures, She realized that if she 
didn't do anything, She would lose Alex. 

It's given after all, He didn't touched her second time but this new girl he fucked twice in 
just one day? She needs to fix it. 



Though she couldn't hate Sandra for some reason even try to help her, Grace still has a 
little selfish side. 

She too wants to be loved by him, Not just romantically as he didn't fail to show her but 
also physically too. 

Even if he would not be crazy about her body or thought of having sex with her, But if 
she had her mother on the side, She would get that physical love and also experience 
to improve. 

It's just that she was in a mental struggle on how to ask him or her mother about it. 

In her mind, It's rather easy to convince her mother for it then to ask Alex about it. 

There was question in her mind like what would he think of her and how he would feel 
when she asked him to be a mother daughter duo. 

How weird, perverted and insane this demand is, She feared he would think she was 
degrading him by asking such a wild demand. 

After all, It's okay for father and son to share a woman and it's widely accepted in the 
kinky stuff but mother and daughter thing still looked at with disgust. 

It was then when she was so lost in her thoughts questioning her decisions, 
contemplating her choices and what she can do, Alex's words rang in her ears. 

Her trance was broken, She feeling guilty 9f what she was thinking about shuttered 
trying to answer him then she saw him in front of her. 

She panic and her balance lost but there was no panic in her heart as she had the 
confidence that if he was here then he would not let her fall. 

And that's what happened. Her heart started throbbing but then there was also the 
immense guilt that he loved her so much and yet she could not satisfy him physically. 

There was ting of fear in her heart that she would lose him because of this but she 
cared more about the fact that she wasn't able to give him the same pleasure back as 
he gave her. 

She too wants to make him happy and satisfied as he make her, Show him through 
actions and please him too. 

"Huh? Are you angry or jealous?" 

Alex seeing Grace dodging his eyes thought that she was either angry or jealous. 



So he asked her out as unlike other woman he didn't need to do mental gymnastics for 
her, He can just ask like a normal person. 

"...Horney." 

Grace quitely mumbled. 

(A/N : I need to have her POV for the next plot, So had to add it, Segga would be in the 
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"Huh? Well I can help with that." 

Alex, who just wanted to tease Grace before was taken aback by how direct she said it. 

Before he really thought that she was jealous seeing him being with another woman in 
front of her. 

No matter how easy going she is but she is a woman after all, There would be 
possessiveness that comes with it. 

She might even be angry that he didn't ask her to join or chose Sandra over her, Which 
can hurt the heart of any woman. 

He didl chose the woman who came after her. 

So it's reasonable she was angry and trying to hide it from him. 

He knows those hazel eyes filled with complicated gaze looking at him, Hence why he 
goes close to her. 

Though he does have ulterior motives behind his actions but the fact also remains that 
he came to Grace to also please him. 

If not, Liza was standing right there, It would have been fun to tease Loli and FL at 
once. 



When he asked the question he really thought he needed to love bomb her to ease her, 
Her low self esteem is not hidden by him after all. 

But when she said she is horney it was a strange thing on her part, Not that Grace 
doesn't like to have sex. 

She does but she is not this straight like Alia, Who just takes what she wants. 

Rather Grace thinks of others' needs before herself, So it was really out of ordinary for 
her to say what she wants while other women here want the same. 

Yet Alex did not think of it. He didn't have to do mental gymnastics for her, So he just 
took her words as face value and accepted that she was just horney. 

And this is a thing he is damn sure he can give her till her satisfaction. 

"Don't mind me then." 

He whispered in Grace's ears and stretched out his other hand towards her, Who was 
also taken aback by what she said. She didn't want to say this but she panicked and 
uttered the first thing in her mind. 

She is horney no doubt about it, It is Alex she was talking about, She would never get 
enough of him at all. 

But she didn't want to do it with Alex right now, Not because she didn't like it but afraid 
that Alex would hate it once again, making him dissatisfied. 

She can face anything, She even didn't back down under the warnings of Alia, The 
chaebol of the beauty industry. 

But what she never wants to face is her disappointing him, What if he didn't like it and 
then leave her for other women forever? 

Unlike other women around him, She was not rich nor had any ties with hidden society, 
She is just a normal college girl. The only thing she can currently give him other than 
her love was her body. Other than that she had to give it to him. 

And even in that she failed miserably. 

"Alex tha- Ahhh!~" 

Grace parted her cherry lips to deny she didn't want to do it now, Not until she 
convinced both him and her mother for the threesome. 



But as she tried to say it, His soft large hand grabbed her mounds with not so light force 
and squeezed it. 

A wave of pleasure hit her soul and mind, As such her body reacted flooding her sacred 
cave with her fluids as a sensual moan escaped from her mouth as her legs became 
soft. 

She doesn't have any defenses against him at all, He knows all her weak points and 
what she likes the best. 

The force he used squeezing her mounds gave her such a strong feeling that she nearly 
forgot what she wanted him to do. 

But she still somehow holds on to that thought even though her panties right now might 
be qualified to be stated as the wettest place in the world. 

He knows she likes it when he is rough with her and glady exploiting that weakness of 
hers. 

"I take you liking this, right?" 

Alex asked Grace in his seductive voice, rudely rubbing her right side of breast. 

He knows she is M and the rougher it was with her the more she felt like she was on the 
moon. 

Though he didn't like to hurt her, Don't get it wrong he is sadistic but not the psychopath 
without any empathy. 

He just doesn't like to hurt her without any reason as she was the only one of few 
women he can be himself without needing to do much drama. 

But if she digs this kink he has no problem helping her with it, Though he still makes 
sure he would not go too far and cause more hurt than intended. 

"Hummmm…Th…That…I…ca..N…don…T." 

Grace was losing her mind, Every time he rub her breast it was sending shivers in her 
body like shock waves causing mini orgasums. 

The pleasure she was feeling can't be put into words as there were no words even exist 
to say what she was feeling. 

All can say it is pure bliss, He was just rubbing her breast with his hands, She should 
not be feeling this intense reaction from him but his hands like they were made to give 
pleasure. 



They were soft but not feeling even a bit weak as to how much force it was extracting. 
pulsating pleasure in her body. 

It surprised her before when she felt how good he was, And that surprise was still there 
with that much intensity. 

The fact that he was also exploiting her weakness was just surging her body with 
immense pleasure. 

While she enjoyed it to its fullest but this also increased is also guilt in her heart along 
with fear of losing him. 

He knows so much about her, How her body works, What she likes and doesn't know, 
Knowing the weakness and all her pleasure points. 

While she didn't know anything about his liking at all, All she knows is that he is also into 
her mother, Which may or not mean he is into older women and he likes ass. 

These are the only two things she knows about him making her feel guilty. 

Unlike Sandra she as a heroine has the inherent resistance to this strong pleasure but 
because of that even in this flood of pleasure her mind was racing, working overtime 
creating its own reality. 

'No wonder he didn't like to have sex with me, I don't know anything about him like he 
does about me, I really need a mentor in this to learn about him.' 

Grace thought about it and thought it made sense, Sex is not just one party thing. She 
read about it on the internet, a woman complaining about their man just lying there on 
bed making them do all the things. 

Hence why the cowgirl and reverse cowgirl position is the norm as men don't like to do 
work in it at all. 

And she is a man in this position. The first and only time they did it, She just lay there 
making Alex do all the things. 

She didn't realize how rare it was for a man to do a missionary position till she searched 
about it. 

Though in her defense she was and kinda still is a virgin but it did not excuse that she 
didn't reciprocate with him. 

She enjoyed herself and had all the fun while he work for two off them and only receive 
disappointment in return. 



It was not fair for him, He deserves bette- No to deserve best and he would make sure 
he would receive what he deserves. 

"Sto…P…I…*Gulp* Please…." 

Grace decided what to do, She couldn't be this unfair to him at all. 

She gathered her courage and spoke to Alex to stop. 

Though she wasn't able to form her words because of the surge in her emotions, She 
still hardened her heart and did her best to speak up. 

She wanted to wait till everyone was on the track of her plan but now because of her 
slip of tongue, She had to implement the plans right away. 

If he became angry then she would drop the idea and never bring it up again and do her 
best to get his sympathy. If not she would beg her mother to do it for her. 

In any case, She would try anything and everything for him to give the same pleasure 
back to him as he was giving her or at least try to give as much as possible. 

"Huh…What happened Grace? Wait?!! Did I hurt you?" 

Alex was enjoying the softness of Grace and was about to make the next move when 
he heard the plea of Grace. 

If it was someone else he would not understand what they were saying as she indeed 
wasn't able to form words. 

But because he was being careful or not harming her, He was paying special attention 
to her. 

So when spoke he understood she was begging for him to stop, Which he quickly did 
hastily asking whether he hurt her. 

"No…*Huff* No, I- That…mother…do" 

Grace hearing Alex's guilty panicked words quickly denied him hurting her. He was 
being rough but it was nowhere near the force to hurt her especially after he used that 
golden light skill on her yesterday. 

She quickly tried to express what she wanted but was stammering hard because of a 
mix of pleasure and fear. 

'Something wrong with Gloria?' 



Hearing Grace, Alex thought something was wrong with Gloria because why would 
Grace talk about her mother while doing such an act. 

So he quickly turned around to look at Gloria fearing the protagonist's luck pulled some 
new stunt or something. 

(A/N : I didn't mention bloodline one Smith family but it would come up in a few chapters 
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Alex quickly surveyed Gloria but he didn't find anything wrong with her.  

'System use the eye of truth on her and check if everything is alright.' 

But he was not satisfied, Though he knew once Holy Light skill is used it would 
destroy/cure each and any hidden injured and even enhance the ones body foundation 
to the mortal peak. 

He still did not take a chance as anything related to the protagonist should be treated 
with great care. 

[Ding! The target details are like the following... 

Name : Gloria Smith 

Species : Demi-Human (Current Human) 

Bloodline : Phoenix (SSS-Rank) (Locked) (Restricted) (Recovering : 60%) (Upgraded) 

(Note : Holy Blessing also improves the bloodline upgrading 1 rank, But because people 
not having enough knowledge of this bloodline would be confused to be SS-Rank, Don't 
be confused by them saying so.) 

Awakened Rank : S-Rank (Fallen) (Current : Mortal) 

Status : Injured recovered, Bloodline recovering, Awake, Horney (75) 

Strength : 135 

Agility : 140 



Stamina : 150 

Vitality : 169 

Mana : None 

Charm : 159 

Luck : 15000 (Heroine) 

Skills : 

Business (LV 10), Cooking (LV 10), Cleaning (LV 10), Martial Arts (LV 12)... 

Talent : 

Superpower : Phoenix Flames 

As the mystical being bestowed with partial immortality as .any perks, One of being the 
undying flames of the Phoenix. 

The Phoenix Flames possess not only high offensive powers but also have one of the 
highest supportive abilities. 

This superpower can only be inherent by the descent of Phoenix and can only be 
awakened by the only one who possessed the purest bloodline in their generation. 

Perks : 

? Undying flames grant it's possessor passive healing and resistance against forces of 
undead and anti-life elements. 

? Can permanently stop once own aging and can even reverse others using the flames 
as support ability. 

? Can regrow and reattach any part of body if it ever to be cut, destroy, mutilated or lost. 

? Can draw power from the flames to replenish mana consumption 

(Note : Phoenix Flames have higher affinity against other types of flame and fires, Once 
come into contact it can enhance the ability of its own flames.) 

Special Perk : 

Rebirth [Hidden] : As possessor of the Phoenix bloodline, Of course there would be the 
most iconic powers of Phoenix. 



As its name suggests, any time a possessor of this skill dies or comes close to dying, 
The flames of Phoenix burn the possessor into ashes. 

After which it reverses the cause and effect granting possessor a rebirth not only 
enhancing their base foundation but also granting invincibility bost for while along with 
increasing 1 rank permanently. 

(Note : This ability can only be triggered once a day and suicide would not trigger rebrith 
bonuses) 

?Daughter-Con : Has some strange attachment with her daughter 

?One minded : Once fallen for someone then that love would never break no matter 
what. 

Favorability : 140 (Unhealthy Obsession) 

Summary : Gloria is a one soft hearted woman, Her love for her daughter knows no 
bounds, For whom she left her heir position as Grace didn't possess a Phoenix 
Bloodline. 

Anyone who makes Grace happy and content, Gloria would also love them as much. 

(Summary : She is very possessive of her daughter and her safety, So make sure her 
daughter is treated nicely and lovingly, When daughter agrees, She would also do the 
same.)] 

[Ding! After the search there is nothing wrong with Gloria, Her hidden injures are 
properly healed and the bloodline she locked herself before leaving the Smith 
household was also breaking the restrictions and recovering at a steady pace.] 

As Alex's voice fell, the system instantly pulled out the stats of Gloria concluding that 
there is nothing for Alex to worry about. 

This calmed down the worry in his heart, He was really afraid that luck of Nathan pull 
something out pouring cold water on his plans. 

'Phoenix Bloodline hug, That too SSS-Rank, I wonder which is better this or The Old 
One.' 

Alex though know Gloria has a Phoenix Bloodline but it was still shook him when he 
saw the traits of it 

This made him curious thinking which is better this or Rebeccas The Old One bloodline, 
Which though just an S-Rank one but that is Upgradable and also has the possibility of 
awakening Desu of time superpower. 



But this one also has broken passive like rebirth, Which is no less than time one. 

'Why am I even wondering? I can have both.' 

Suddenly Alex remembered who he was and that he didn't have to decide. He can have 
both without any consequences. 

'Wait?! If everything is alright then why did she call out her mother?' 

It's just after Alex confirmed nothing wrong with Gloria visibly and otherwise, He become 
confused about the reaction of Grace. 

He tried to think about it but could not come up with any reason why she did that. He 
would have just asked her but seeing her state she was not in any condition to answer. 

So he decided to use deep thought skills on her to know what is happening in her little 
head. 

[How to ask him? Would he be angry? Of course he would be angry. Which man with 
even a shred of self respect would do that? But I really want to make him happy, Would 
he really get that angry if I asked him to be with me and my mother together? 

I mean he already did it for both of us separately, So there is no harm doing us together, 
right? He should not be angry at this, I know him enough to know it. 

But again, I didn't know what he likes and not in detail. Maybe he hates threesomes or 
something? It's just...] 

The moment the thought reader activated Grace, Alex's mind bombarded with a barrage 
of her voice going back and forth over and over. 

System had to step in and sort out the thoughts in a coherent manner for him, Even 
then it took him a while to figure out why Grace was acting strange. 

The reason for her left him speechless. 

'Is there something in the air or what?' 

Alex couldn't help but wonder what was happening with him. 

Just a while ago, Those heroines along with Alia and Helen suddenly became open for 
him without him doing anything. 

And now same for Grace, She convinced herself and even hesitating to ask him to fuck 
duo of mother and daughter. 



How this kinda luck was being used for him? A Villain? 

[Ding! Host your luck is exceeded 1000 long ago and now also has My status, Hence 
why you are getting man of heavens favorite treatment, This treatment also given to the 
heroines.] 

As always, a user-friendly system came out and explained what was happening. 

It's just a simple thing, Alex just getting the treatment of heronies as he is a man of FL 
giving him a boost in his luck. 

Once again reminding him how important Sandra is to him to survive. 

[Ding! Be warned host, Your primal title is still a Villain, If protagonists once again 
started to rise you would lose ML benefits till you once again lower protagonist.] 

System thinking Alex might become too relax decided to tell him about that he was still 
not out of the waters yet. 

As a villain he is still hated by heaven and the moment the protagonist rises, He would 
be treated like before. 

Alex already guessed this would be the case, So he was not surprised by it as it's 
logical, He is a villain after all. 

"Let me guess Grace, You want me to fuck you mother and let you watch right?" 

Alex decided to put those thoughts behind and put focus on Grace. 

He, knowing what Grace wanted, decided to give her. It's just a coincidence that he too 
wanted the same. 

After all there is a task to complete, Yet still he didn't want to take Grace virginity here 
not like this, So he had to improvise. 

"Huh?!.....Yes yes! Tha…can you do it? I mean it's okay if you don't, Or yo-Mhm!?" 

"Shhh! Stop talking, my dear cute girl." 

Grace panicked hearing what Alex said, Though he appeared to be confused for her 
she still thought it was better than nothing and quickly agreed. 

Yes, It's best to go slow and them talk about treesome, That too taboo like this one. 

It's just she started talking trying to convince him and herself while also making sure he 
would be angry. 



She turned into the woman he met for the first time, That clumsy, easy to fool cute girl 
who didn't know when to stop. 

So he always put his index finger on her plum lips, halting her in speech and saying his 
line he alway used to tease her with. 

*Thump* 

Grace felt like dear rammed in it as she felt the warmth of his finger along with the 
nostalgic words of his. 

She felt like she was on moon, Her happiness knowing no bounds as she just looked at 
Alex obediently ready to do what he wanted to do. 

"I know what you want and I too want that, You know me I do, It's just that I can't today. 

Auntie still yet to recover fully and you too need rest, I know you are not getting proper 
sleep. 

Tonight take a rest as much as you can because tomorrow you two are not going to get 
any sleep at all. 

This is my promise, Which I will not break.' 

Alex said all he wanted, Yeah he would have loved to do it with the mother daughter 
duo but he already spent too much time here. 

If he does not hurry back home now, He can't tell what would happen to his dormitory. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??. ) 

Chapter 280 278. Old Wounds 

In the ward, All eyes locked on the Alex when he said this thing. 

Gloria, who was pretending to be asleep, wanted to wake up and say she was healthy 
and can do it once again, When Alex talked about doing it with her. 

But then he said he would do it with both their mother and daughter together. It was 
when she came to her senses and realized what she was trying to do. 

Alex is and alway be the man Grace has in her heart and after tasting the forbidden 
taste of her future son-in-law, She can't even blame her. 

It's just Grace might tolerate any other woman in this world to be Alex seeing he has a 
condition in which he needs to have sex to survive. 



Her daughter might even ignore and forget the fact that he slept with her on this same 
bed just a while ago. 

But she is damn sure Grace can share a bed with any other woman other than she, her 
mother. 

After all, How could she? She is her mother, It's one thing to have laid with her man but 
it's another thing to ask Grace to be there. 

Even Gloria herself thinks this idea of his absurd. If he said he wants her to share with 
another woman, She might hesitate at first but can give in. 

But It's not only weird but outright taboo what Alex said he wanted do. 

Grace would never be willing to do this, Nor she thinks she would though there are 
forbidden thoughts of thinking just what if but it was just a muddle headed fantasy 
nothing else. 

"Really?!!" 

But to Glorias utter surprise Grace jumped up in surprise and asked Alex in excitement. 

Gloria couldn't see her face of Grace but her being the mother of her knows what kinda f 

expressions she would have on the face. 

She can bet from the voice of it. She would have wide eyes along with that full heartfelt 
smile on her plump lips. 

'Why is she so excited? Did…Did she really wanted this to happen? But why?' 

Gloria right now hunted by the questions as she tried to figure out the reason behind 
this action of hers but couldn't get any answers. 

It's taboo for the world, It's for society and it is for any man in this world. 

Though she herself didn't follow the world routine nor was bound by the rules and their 
morals. 

But she knows first hand how hard it is to go against them. 

Every time she remembers her past it sends shivers in her body. 

It started when she was born and to her misfortune she inherited the purest bloodline in 
the generation directly earning her the position of future heir of the family. 



Yeah misfortune as because only one person can inherit in the generation, She was a 
precious treasure of the family. 

Turning her from a living breathing huwoman into the priceless assets of the family. 

There was no free will remaining for her, All decisions were made by family for her, 
Including but not limited to what she can eat, wear, go, behave and even how to 
breathe. 

She was in constant surveillance from her childhood to adulthood, There was not one 
fond memory she had of that time. 

Though there were also not any bad memories but that's all because it was all pre 
decided for her. 

No one treated her badly as she was a future heir but she was never treated as an 
huwoman but a thing that the family owned. 

When she took over the head of family title, She really thought she would get some 
freedom but there was none. 

At that time she was just about to step into the S-Rank being one of the fastest people 
who stepped into S-Rank. 

It was then the family asked for the new generation, As a head with purest bloodline 
there was a higher chance that the offspring of her also receive that blessing. 

It happened before, Gloria herself was the daughter of the previous head of the family, 
so the family pretty much forced her to marry the young man with also quite pure 
bloodline of the other family with the same status as them. 

That is because the chance of a child inheriting bloodline increases exceptionally if 
parents have a two different bloodline then if they have the same. 

It also does it as a precautionary measure to prevent inbreeding. 

She didn't wanna marry as not to mention there was no love in between them but even 
the name of the other party was known to her after marriage was fixed. 

She tried to resist but elders quickly put down any attempts of her resistance, Even her 
birth giver threatened to disown her if she refused. 

And then they got married and thankfully from just one disgusting act on their wedding 
night she got pregnant. 



Everyone celebrated, That man stone cold though not that excited was still looking 
forward to see what bloodline the child would receive. 

It's just an anomaly happen, When she was given birth the shackles of the ranks 
suddenly broke, directly promoting her from A-Rank to the S-Rank. 

Other than to be happy she was horrified as she was in the middle of giving birth and 
this breakthrough appeared out of nowhere. 

Just as she was promoted to the S-Rank, Her body greedily started to absorb all 
spiritual powers in the surrounding trying to consolidate her rank. 

Because no one was prepared for this unexpected event, The necessary treasures 
were not present there to fulfill the demand of her body which was going crazy. 

It was then it happen, Wild flames arose from her body burning everyone who was in 
her surrounding helping her to give birth. 

These people from both of their families also had the bloodline but it was quite impure, 
But it did not matter for her body, It quickly started to absorb their remaining essence 
trying to fulfill the power needs of her. 

In just a matter of seconds the spiritual powers in the surrounding depleted, There was 
nothing remaining in room. 

Then to her horror, Her body started to absorb the essence of her unborn baby that was 
trying to step into this world. 

She tried, She tried her best to stop it but she had no control over her body's instinct to 
fulfill the void created by her breakthrough. 

Her body was greedily swallowing the essence of her unborn child. If she didn't do 
anything, Her child would have died. 

She knew that if she didn't do anything, Her child would not survive. She took drastic 
measures and directly shattered her spiritual core. 

Spiritual core, the weakest point of any awakened warrior and the place that stores all 
their stored spiritual energy. 

Even if that core gets damaged, awakened warriors have a high possibility of falling in 
the realm if not worse would be forever locked in the same realm. 

Here she shattered her core, the best outcome of it would be that she lose her 
cultivation and became cripple unable to cultivate anymore. 



Worse of course would be a painful death like each part of her tore slowly by slowly. 

But she didn't stop to think of what if and just did it. 

And it worked, The moment her core shattered everything in and including the building 
she blew up in an inferno like gas cylinder blast. 

The only thing that was unhurt by that was she and the bed she was in. 

Though weak, She still had little strength to give birth to her baby girl, Who she named 
Grace. 

Grace was a healthy baby even after all that happened it was just there was an issue, 
After all her essence was still pulled out of that little life. 

Grace didn't have any bloodline, It's not like she had impure or even light one she didn't 
have even a tiny speck of traits of any bloodline. 

She was nothing but an normal mortal huwoman, On top of that she was also was an 
natural waste meaning she can never cultivate nor able to never able to awaken any 
superpower. 

She still loved her daughter and felt guilty as she was responsible for the state of her 
child. 

She had only one duty to bring her safely in this world as her mother and yet she failed 
miserably in that small thing. 

It's just that it was not the norm in the family. That so called husband of hers refused to 
even see Grace the moment he found out she was a waste. 

Though hurt she didn't care as he was just a stranger living with her in her eyes, She 
was the head of the family and she was able to take care of her child. 

But it changed quickly. While she was still recovering from her injuries, She found out 
their elders decided to kill the child, saying the existence of that baby is a shame to the 
family. 

They couldn't accept a waste person related to them by blood, So it was the majority 
decision to kill Grace, Even though 30% of the family was against it. 

But when she find that out, She knows she had to leave, and that is exactly what she 
did. She ignored her injuries and consequences of doing so. 

Then grab her baby and run away from the family. She didn't have any other option of 
doing so. 



She at that time was just a normal mortal, Her powerbase was destroyed, There was no 
way she was able to fight it off. 

Her family also let them go because she ignored her injuries. It left dark wounds and 
hidden injuries also making her waste. 

She lost value in the eyes of family, As she couldn't provide a new generation Phoenix 
to them. 

So she and her daughter have been living life this way all this time, Her and her 
daughter only two are for themselves. 

"Yes, Really." 

Alex confirmed with Grace pulling Gloria out of her memories. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁.) 


