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"Yes, Really but if for some reason I wasn't able to come tomorrow night, I would take 
you both on the day afterwards, That would not change." 

Alex confirmed her but still for safety say that if he couldn't come tomorrow night he 
would definitely take them on date afterwards. 

There are many reasons for it, First one being he promised Rebecca to be her pretend 
boyfriend tomorrow. 

Then there was also a teacher he had to deal with as she did not appear in any, making 
him wonder about her origin. 

He also has to put tabs on Nathan and get the technique from Jake. 

There is even Dragon gate he has to deal with, He couldn't allow them to enter the 
country. 

That just going to increase the luck of Jake. Which is not good for him at all, That's just 
going to create more variables for him. 

"Tha- Is something wrong? Is it trouble with Alia?" 

Grace was filled with joy hearing him confirm it but after he said he might miss the 
appointment she was concerned. 

Alex normally does not miss on his promises, But he did it before and now he also said 
he might not come tomorrow night. 

This made her concerned. She was thinking maybe Alia would not allow him or try to 
control his actions but then again if that was the case Alia would have never allowed 
him to leave the house. 

She knows Alia too much to know this is something she is very well capable of doing. 

"Oh, thanks for reminding me about her, I also need to have a talk with her, And no it 
was not because of her controlling me at least not for a while. 



I only thought I might not be able to make it because I had yet to find the current 
location of the assassin trying to kill me in the afternoon." 

When Alex heard Grace's concerned voice and her reasoning he got reminded that 
there is still that Ice Queen he has not seen for a while. 

This made him a little uneasy, Alia was and still is one of the few top priority of his, She 
is a loose cannon that needs to be kept in check. 

What made his anxious was that he didn't know where she was and what was cooking 
in her mind. 

Jake is also roaming in the city, Though he was sure Rebbeca would have given him 
punishment but the protagonist alway has a thick skin that can take little beating. 

Alex didn't know that underlyings of Rebecca dug the fucking kidney of Jake making him 
wobble in the city wondering where to go. 

So he was concerned about Jake's luck kicking in and making him meet with Alia. 

He was sure that Jake would not have any luck with Alia but that damned protagonist 
still has that broken technique. 

'WHAT?!! IT WAS ASSASSIN ATTACK!!' 

"WAIT?! WHAT ASSASSIN?" 

"WHO? TELL ME BROTHER." 

"ASSASSIN?! WHEN? WHERE?" 

Alex on purpose say this as he needed help from everyone here to make sure Dragon 
Gate would not enter the country. 

His Winchester family on its own can make sure that they do not enter but alert them 
knowing someone is targeting them. 

It's better to make sure to use mild restrictions using other networks that way they would 
get alerted and also make sure they get as late as possible in the country. 

Because in the meantime he gets that Ruby ring of Jake, If he gets the ring he gets the 
place of head of the Dragon by default. 

Dragon gate though not that big orgasum it still has resorcues and foreign networks that 
come handy in when protagonists like God of war or likes pop up. 



He didn't expect this big reaction. It is a normal reaction but he was under the 
impression that they were dumbed down right now because of the Yin energy. 

But now it seems that undead lose interest in them and stop spying on them, So their IQ 
comes back online. 

"Yean chill out, It was not my first attempt like this sister. Why are you freaking out? 
There are so many hidden guards around me and I too am not weak at all. 

It's just I lost track of that pesky rat, But don't worry I am sure he will come looking for 
me soon, I will catch him then." 

Alex uncaringly answered his sister Amara who instantly snap of out her bliss hearing 
there was assassination attempt on him. 

She was the first one to stand up in shock and made her way towards him hurriedly 
checking for any signs of injuries. 

He had to tell her that it's not a big deal as there was also many attempts on him every 
time they failed as the guards around him, The strongest is A-Rank. 

And then there are also many B and C Ranks, This level of squad is enough to take out 
a full fledged battalion. 

So he was alway came out unscathed still after each time of attempt on his life, The 
security around him just increased by his mother and sister. 

Right now he didn't know how many people were protecting him in the dark but they had 
to be double or triple than what it started as. 

"But- " 

"No buts, I like butts but don't like these ones. I would deal with it, You just help me do 
one thing, I will explain it to you later." 

Amara wanted say souch, Ask about and go by herself and end the pathetic life of a 
person who thought of harming her brother. 

But Alex had to stop her, If she really did then she would lose mp doubt, Not because 
Jake is strong but because Amara is not an protagonist, So she was destined to lose 
against him. 

Only he can deal with the protagonist because of the Villain Aura. 

Amara wanted to do something but she didn't seeing Alex threatened her with his eyes 
not to do anything, So she swallowed her words. 



Though she still planned to increase his security even more completely forgetting he 
has a cute little S-Rank thug around him, Which can pretty much one shot any threat. 

"Wait?! That's why you don't like me?" 

Sandra who was still kneeling on the ground and staring greedily at the member of Alex 
which was still out showing it's might reacted when she heard there was assassination 
attempt on him. 

Then it clicked with her why he misunderstood her. Of course anyone would when they 
had a assassination attempt on their life and just afterwards meet someone with a 
mysterious background. 

She realizes how dumb of her to try to pull out the phone and try to contact someone 
with the help of Alex. 

She was a normal clerk in their eyes, So when she revealed she knew the information 
that can never be known by a simple clerk she put the target on herself. 

Of course Alex would get angry and think she was there to harm him. From its words it 
looks like it's normal to have people after his life. 

So his hate for his normal, She understood the reason for why he was treating her like 
this. She didn't need reason to accept and believe he misunderstood her but this reason 
of his just calmed down her uneasiness as now she can prove she did not contact him 
on purpose nor she had any ill intent. 

"I don't want to talk about this right now, We will talk later but I still have enough trust in 
you right now to ask you to stay here and take care of Grace and Aunty. 

Of course also take care of this Unicorn of mine, Make sure she sleeps and not just go 
wild running tests on aunty." 

Alex looked at Sandra with pity, She looked at him desperately in hope that he might 
give her an answer but he can't right now. 

He can't help it, He can't answer her cause he didn't have any, He just used that as an 
excuse on top of mind to put leash on wild horse like her. 

So he has to think before giving her a proper reason. He can't do it right now as he was 
running late. 

Who knows what is happening in his room right now, Just hope that they do not start a 
brawl there. 



His games and pc should have arrived there, He didn't want that to get damaged by 
them. 

So he let Sandra be here to take care of this unique trio. 

Grace and Gloria would not do anything weird but he damn sure was this medical 
maniac itching to do a test on Gloria to see her changes after his skill. 

He is not against her changes but he is against her doing too much without self care, As 
she forgets about anything and everything once she started doing her experiments. 

"Grace and my unicorn, I am fine, Right now I have to leave but don't worry I will answer 
all your questions." 

After Sandra, Aled reassured the other two women, Liza though didn't speak anything 
because of Amara's presence she was worried about him. 

So had to calm her down, Of course afterwards he did the same with Grace telling her 
there is nothing wrong. 

After which he gave everyone including Sandra and pretending to be asleep Gloria a 
good night kiss good by making them blush. 

Afterwards he didn't stay there and dragged Amara with him out of the ward preparing 
himself for the battle ahead. 

(A/N : He is finally out of the Ward 😅 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁.) 

Chapter 282 280. Supernatural 

"Brother lift is on that side, Why we are going in the wrong direction" 

Amara told Alex as she turned around to see a sign hanging on the wall indicating that 
lift was on that side of the hallway. 

She exclaimed to her brother thinking he lost a way and so reminded him of this 
misstep. 

"We are not going to take the elevator ever again, use the stairs daily they are healthy." 

Alex froze for a second after Amara mention the lift but quickly increased his pace 
towards the stairs he used before. 

He might never going to use elevators again, Or at least not when he is alone. 



"...Oh okay." 

Amara was confused by his answer. They both are awakened people, they really don't 
need to do physical exercise to be healthy. 

They can use the spiritual powers in their body to strengthen their body and muscles 
way more efficiently than exercise ever could. 

But she didn't point it out to him, She felt the state of her brother was not normal. She 
couldn't put a finger on what's wrong but something is definitely amiss. 

*Shiver* 

"Huh..? Why does it suddenly become so cold? Who notch up the air conditioner?" 

Suddenly the temperature in the hallway dropped drastically, surprisingly making Amara 
shiver in the cold. 

The fact that she as an S-Rank was shivered in the cold did not hit her, She only 
thought someone was playing with the thermostat. 

"Stop talking and walk fast." 

When Alex felt the cold, He was terrified. He had a pretty solid guess as to the reason 
behind the sudden drop in temperature. 

He urged Amara to walk fast as he held her hands for comfort and pretty much dragged 
her towards the stairway. 

He knows his fear is unreasonable, He has two mighty S-Rank with him. He was 
holding hands of one and the other one playing in her pocket dimension with another 
peak A-Rank beast. 

Though pocket dimension, It was connected to Amara, So they are also with them and 
can come out any moment they want. 

Still he was afraid of an unknown, He didn't want for now to have anything to do with 
this supernatural stuff. 

Yeah he is dishonoring his surname by doing so but hey he didn't know what that thing 
really is, You can't blame him for fear of the unknown, right? 

[Ding! It's a ghost host.] 

System jumped out not reading a room and helpfully reminded him that that unknown 
thing in his mouth is a ghost. 



Alex of course ignored the system and was about to reach the stairways, In his mind the 
further away he is from the elevator the lower the chances of him encountering that 
thing. 

As he hears that those things are often attached to one singular place and that place 
should be an elevator. 

"Yea- Okay brother, But we are in such a hurry? It's just 12:45 huh? Wait? Why it's 
showing it's 3:00 AM?" 

Amara was hella confused by the reaction of Alex. He was partially running right now, 
She didn't understand what he was worried about. 

Then she thought maybe he is concerned about the fact that he gave Isabella a time of 
tonight. 

So she tries to remind him that they still have time, It's just about to be an hour after 
midnight. 

It's just when he looked at her wrist watch taken aback as it was showing it's 3:00 AM. 

She knows for fact that it's not the 3 AM, Her biological clock telling her it was not more 
than 1 after midnight. 

"Strenge, I think my clock is broken, Hey brother, how about we go and buy a new one? 
It's been a while since we went shopping together." 

Amara drops it thinking her watch just broke, Though it was not common but it can 
happen. 

It's even a good thing for her as she can go shopping with her brother under the 
pretense of going shopping. 

As she said, She pulled out her smartphone to check which are suitable places they can 
visit. 

"Wait? Why even it saying it's 3 AM? Tha- This is not possible, My bio clock never is 
wrong." 

Amara was excited wanting to find places for two of them to hangout but when her eyes 
fell on the time on screen she paused. 

She could not believe it was also saying it's 3 AM. The Watch thing can be explained 
saying it's broken but not the phone thing. 



Her phone is not a normal one, It's one of the few exclusive phones made for the S-
Rank. 

It has all the normal awakened features but on top of it also has many additional 
functions, One being it is pretty much indestructible. 

Unless S-Rank in purpose attacked it, It would not break nor ever malfunction, It also 
have direct connection with the satellite networks and has unrestricted access to both 
normal and hidden part of the internet. 

So it can't malfunction but she was also sure her body also can't be wrong, She is S-
Rank after all. 

But then again this phone can also not be wrong making her confuse what is real time 
right now. 

"Brother, What time is it?" 

She asked Alex if he can tell her the answer clearing all the worries in his heart. 

He also has a watch and also a smartphone like her, Though it's not made for S-Rank 
but it is also a limited edition one made for awakened. 

So if his phone also says it's 3 AM then she needs to go to her mother and her to check 
what's wrong with her powers as it's not the simple matter of getting the small thing 
wrong. 

After all if her internal clock was malfunctioning then it can also mess with her cultivation 
and power output. 

So she has to fix it as soon as possible. 

"Hey are you listening to me brother? Huh!!! Are you okay brother, what's wrong?" 

Amara here was getting anxious thinking what's wrong with her then realize her brother 
stopped walking and was not answering her at all. 

This made her worried and she tried to ask him but when she looked at his face she 
froze in shock. 

That breathtakingly enchanting face of his was now was white, not like his usual 
blushing face like blood was drained of it. 

He was standing still staring straight at the stairways with a defeated look in his eyes. 



It was for the first time for Amara to see the look like that on her brother making her 
increasingly worried. 

Though even in this state his charm is not even lost but just an added touch of beauty in 
distress. 

But Amara was in no mood to appreciate the beauty as she was anxious to find what 
made Alex like this here. 

"*Sigh* I am fine." 

Alex finally replied to her with a helpless voice, He was still looking at the stairway trying 
to figure out the solution behind the anomaly. 

He just couldn't figure out how this happened? He is far away from the elevator, He 
even walking in the opposite direction of it. 

"How can it be? Look at your face? Tell me what's wrong, This big sister of yours can 
take care of it." 

Amara did not believe it at all when he said he was fine. He is anything but fine right 
now. 

Her brother should have joked and teased right now but he straightforwardly answered 
her, That means he is not fine. 

She now just wanted to know the reason behind his distress so she can eradicate it. 

"It seems you can't help me with it." 

Alex once again gave her a one line answer and started to have conversation with the 
system ready to implement any solution it would provide. 

After all, Now it seems Amara is no help dealing with the force it was presented here, 
Meaning the threat level of this thing is more than what he previously thought of it. 

Right now all he wanted was to get the solution like before from the system and slip 
away from here. 

He would deal with whatever it is here later, As for now it is not his priority. 

"Brother, I am S-Rank beastmaster, I am not weak, I can deal with anything that is 
bothering you, Please tell me about it." 

Amara panicked hearing her brother thinking she is not strong enough to deal with what 
is bothering him. 



She became this strong only because she wanted to protect her brother and now he 
says she can't do it? How can it be? 

She is a prodigy and knows many forms of combat. There is nothing she can't deal with 
it. 

"It's not about the strength sister. It's something else." 

Alex crouched down to touch the floor after which he looked up with thoughts in his 
mind calculating the options of what else he can do about it. 

Yes as he said it is not about the strength of Amara but an element of it, She didn't 
seem to have the right element of it. 

"Then what is it? Tell me the reason brother?" 

Amara was still not convinced. If she can't deal with it now then she can learn what it is 
then find the solution for it. 

But she would figure out a way to solve the worry of her brother. 

"Is it? Okay then can you tell me how long we are walking?" 

Alex raised his eyebrow hearing Amara and so just asked a simple question that without 
a context does not make sense. 

"Tha- It's around 10 minutes, Why?" 

Amara could not understand why such a strange question but she still answered him 
waiting to hear his reason. 

"Then tell me why we have yet to reach that stairway?" 

Alex turned around, looked directly into her eyes and uttered his 2nd question. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁.) 

Chapter 283 281. Eikon Of Fire 

When Alex asked her a question, It took Amara back for a second but then it hit her. 

She looked around in shock. Her purple eyes had a cold light in them as she scanned 
the surroundings but to her dismay she wasn't able to detect anything. 

"Beastmasters are jack of all trades but they can't fight against forces of the underworld 
passively." 



Amara was confused but then remember what her mother told her. 

Bestmasters are indeed jack of all trades but, They are pretty much unstoppable 
behemoths of sub-class of combat type awakened. 

It's just because they are physical type they can't fully able to counter spiritual attacks 
especially related to the underworld forces. 

Underworld forces still can't able to won over beastmaster in 1v1 fight but Beastmaster 
also can't counter them as they don't have any means to. 

Beastmaster don't have any elements in them, Which means they also don't have 
weakness to any element but also make them not able to detect and counter other 
elements passively. 

It seems that whoever this thing is, It knows Amara is not easy to mess with and hence 
why it makes sure not to target her. 

And because it did not actively target Amara, Her instincts didn't kick in and so Amara 
wasn't able to detect that force. 

Well there is another explanation about it that the force which was targeting them is way 
stronger then her. 

Which is not possible, Beastmaster when it comes to the raw performance not be out 
done by anyone. 

"Brother don't worry, Though I can't detect it but it can also not be able to hurt, There is 
no need to be concerned." 

Amara realize whatever it is, It has to be related to the forces of the underworld, That's 
why she wasn't able to detect it. 

But she was not that worried, She can't hurt that force then it can also not be able to 
harm her. 

At best they would be in a stalemate, Which is not ideal for that thing as the sun would 
come out soon enough. 

It didn't matter if its sun rays entered in this hallway, The moment the sunrise. All the 
forces of darkness get debuffed. 

And then Amara is confident she can not only harm it but can even kill it. 

'System recommend to me what I should copy?' 



Alex ignored Amara, He didn't know what and where this thing come from but the 
thought of it might be related to Belladonna terrified him. 

Though Amara is strong but Belladonna is a beast in a different league, Even 
protagonist isn't able to tame her. 

Not to mention it was never explicitly mentioned what her power level actually was but 
every time she had an encounter with protagonists. 

They had to use their life saving card to escape from her. 

Even in the end game, She somehow escaped from the protagonist's grasp, She is after 
all the author's favorite. 

So Alex can't take any risk against her. There is a high chance it is just a loose spirit 
attracted to him for some reason but even if there is a marginal chance that it related to 
Belladonna, He had to be treated with utmost priority. 

[Ding! Host you have two options for [Sex-Copy] available…. 

Options : Gloria, Amara 

Please wait, It's being calculated as the best option for the host's current condition… 

Host It's suggested you copy Gloria's bloodline and Amara's Talent.] 

System without even taking a second calculated the best option for him as this is the 
best he can have right now. 

'Hummm, Not bad options.' 

Alex thought for the second, Though he liked the Phoenix Flames superpower more but 
then he understands why the system did not recommend it. 

Phoenix Flames need to have pure Phoenix Bloodline for it to be awakened by 
someone. 

System didn't follow such restrictions but not having bloodline means he is not suitable 
for that superpower. 

So the system would give him some other random but same grade superpower. 

Meaning if he chose this superpower, He would receive some other unranked 
superpower. 



Unranked because Phoenix Flames superpower is in itself useless, It needs Phoenix 
bloodline to work, So it is not that strange that the system recommended bloodline. 

It is also going to solve his lack of bloodline problems and also strengthen his fire 
emperor SS-Rank power as both are fire related things. 

As for the talent of Amara? It's simple, Amara is a prodigy, She is after all the youngest 
S-Rank to exist after the age of fall. 

So it is just going to his already high enough talent stacked by the benefit of physiques 
and skills to new heights. 

'Okay do it.' 

Alex felt the increasing chill approaching him, So he quickly made a decision and asked 
the system to do it. 

[Ding! Host chose the options… 

The rewards are being distributed… 

It's been detected that the SSS-Rank Phoenix bloodline is suitable for host… 

It's been merged with the host… 

It's been detected that S-Rank talent of "I am prodigy." is suitable for the host… 

It's been merged with the host…] 

System voice fell and then he felt the warm current flow through his body like a rising 
tide it spread from his abdomen then in whole body. 

*Knock* *Bang* 

After which he felt a knock on his mind before there was a loud bang like a huge closed 
door had been opened. 

His thoughts became increasingly clear and the shackles on his body started to feel 
loose. If he wanted he could any moment step into the E or even C rank of warrior. 

But he stopped it for a simple reason. 

Like any cultivation related novel, It's wise to hold back the cultivation and build a solid 
foundation before breaking through the next rank. 



Though his foundation is already way too solid than it can already be in the world, 
Which can be seen from the fact that he beat protagonists like Jake. 

Even if he was injured, S-Rank having only B-rank strength, He was still the protagonist, 
And Alex was able to beat him with just his F-Rank status. 

The fact of the add-on like his skills, superpower, physique and now even bloodline 
made his foundation like no one has before. 

Still Alex knowing he has to deal with protagonists, He makes sure he can never be 
caught lacking. 

[Ding! Your SS-Rank fire emperor superpower resonates with SSS-Rank Phoenix 
Bloodline… 

Congratulations to the host, Your SS-Rank fire emperor is upgraded… 

Congratulations for getting a SSS-Rank Eikon Of Fire superpower… 

Congratulations to the host upgrading all sub-passive of your superpower… 

(Note : Please check the details of it after escaping this Illusion domain.) 

(Note : Host you can use eye of truth to find a weak point in it to escape).] 

Before Alex could react, the system once again jumped up and notified him of the 
changes. 

This thing was already expected by him as both things are supplementary to each other. 

System allows supplementary effects and also makes sure two opposite elements do 
not have a conflict in his body. 

"Sister, How fast are you?" 

Alex grabbed the shoulder of Amara and asked about her speed. 

He finds out the cause of this coldness and is not able to travel. He is in the domain of 
that thing. 

And as it is the domain of that thing, It has all the control over the space in it, Hence 
why he couldn't move. 

He just wants to know how fast is Amara, So when he makes a move, He can able to 
trust her to move fast enough to get away from jt before this domain recovers. 



"I am not that fast brother, I am sure, You are just good at it." 

Amara was living in its own world, While she was looking around she heard her 
brother's words. 

She jumped up like someone stepped on her tail. When she processed the words 
before even giving a thought she reacted in her defense. 

She quickly points out that she is really not that fast, It's just that Alex is too good that 
she can't hold it. 

'She is hopeless.' 

Alex just looked at her with a look of pity for mentally disabled. She might be the version 
of a muscle brain in this world. 

So he just ignored her once again, Called out Xiao Bai out of her domain, Which she 
was quick to jump out standing beside Alex. 

Then Alex used his eyes of truth, His gaze scanned the surroundings, What he was was 
not good. 

If not for the system and him having Sage's heart quick to jump in his defense, His mind 
might have broken by all the pain and miserably that bombarded his mind. 

The horror of this domain was not like any normal domain but like he stepped into the 
underworld surrounded by the dead. 

He didn't see it before because that thing didn't want it maybe concerning about his 
mental state or just wanted to play games with him. 

Either might be the case Alex was in no state to try to figure it out, He quickly searched 
and was quick to find a node where this domain is weakest. 

Then without missing a beat, He snapped creating sparks and then it turned into a small 
flame. 

After which he just flicked his hand throwing that small flame towards the node and 
without any surprise that node got destroyed instantly. 

After all, fire is the 2nd most effective counter after the sun itself. It's of underworld 
forces, It worked for Belladonna, So of course it worked here too. 

Alex didn't waste any time though, Xiao Bai was already ready and the moment that 
node destroyed, He signaled her and she grabbed both him and Amara and dashed out 
of this domain. 



(A/N : Who do you think that thing is? 

It's a ghost, duh, But what kind? 

Likes always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁. ) 

Chapter 284 282. Naive White 

Trio were successful in their escape of the domain but Xiao Bai didn't stop till they 
reached Alex's car which was parked here since morning. 

"Pray it has some juice left." 

Alex looked at his EV qmd thought that it's been days since he charged this car, Now he 
was worried it didn't have any charge left. 

Last night he wanted to do a charge but he was in too much shock to care and in the 
morning all that happened . 

Then he was abducted by Belladonna's puppet then it slipped his mind to charge this 
car of his. 

"Wha-What was that?" 

Amara's terrified voice asked Alex as her eyes locked on him trying to figure out what 
just happened. 

She was flustrated when he asked her how fast she was keeping her half mind 
occupied and half were monitoring the surroundings. 

So her attention was not on him for a second there as she was more worried about the 
sneak attack on Alex. 

But then suddenly out of nowhere a terrifying power emerged. 

She as an S-Rank felt terror from that power, She quickly turned around worried about 
Alex just to see him holding a small flame in his hands. 

That flame was small but the moment it appeared in the world it spread unbearable heat 
throughout the domain. 

The space itself looked like it might burn down under the heat of that small flame, It was 
already trembling and was barely holding itself together. 

Amara felt like this flame can destroy anything and everything at that moment, Nothing 
can be left unharm from it. 



And she was proven right as the next moment Alex flicked his hand throwing that flame 
in a random direction. 

She saw how that tiny flame tore through space and time as it reached its destination 
instantly. 

Then there was nothing, There was no blast or anything, Just an eerie deathly silence. 

Amara could not understand how it was possible as it was reasonable to expect a blast 
or at least blaze or inferno. 

But then she sensed what happened that shook her to the core. 

That flame did not just destroy a thing but destroyed everything including the sound, 
light and even concept of such. 

This is unheard of, Though what Alex does and has is also u heard but this takes the 
win as he outright destroyed the concept of it. 

She wanted to study more to see and check if what she thought was right but before 
that she was dragged out of that domain. 

"Oh that? Nothing much, my superpower just got upgraded, Pretty good right?" 

Alex was rubbing the silky smooth head of Xiao Bai, who was enjoying the warm touch 
of him. 

Right now she was clinging to him more than usual as his body was emitting even more 
comfortable warmth. 

He heard Amara's voice thinking for a moment he understood what she might be talking 
about. 

He just told me what happened. Anyway he didn't have to hide anything from her and 
having an upgradable superpower is rare but also not to that degree. 

She herself also has a rare SS-Rank physique, So it was not that big of a news. 

Or at least what he thought as he was unaware of what his new superpower did. In his 
eyes his power just destroyed the node in the domain. That's all. 

"N-No wonder, My brother is so mighty, I love you so so much." 

Amara was taken aback from what he said and how casually he said it. 



But then her bro-con mind clicked in as her eyes flashed with that familiar look then she 
jumped towards Alex. 

"Stay away from me you weirdo." 

Alex lifted Xiao Bai in his arms and quickly dodged the hug of Amara in smooth motion, 
not forgetting to berate her. 

"Brother!~ " 

Amara was not least bit angry about his dodge and words, She just looked at him with a 
look of worship like a diehard fan look at their beloved celebrity. 

Of course then she sensually called brother and once again jumped for a hug. 

Which once again avoided by Alex then he quickly opened the car and got into it quickly 
leaving Amara outside. 

"Hey hey brother I was wrong, Don't leave me here, I promise I will behave." 

Amara panicked when she saw him get into the car then start it, It seems it still has 
some juice left to start. 

She was afraid that he would leave her here and then she had to walk all the way back 
to his dormitory. 

Though for her it is just a matter of minutes to reach back or even seconds if she tried 
but that all time would be away from her brother which for her is the worst punishment 
possible. 

"*Sigh* Get in before I change my mind." 

Alex looked at the pitiful appearance of Amara like she at the next moment burst out 
crying. 

Seeing that he can't leave her here, Though he never planned to but this just makes it 
set in stone. 

He unlocked the backdoor and asked her to get in. 

"Y-Yeshh, Thank you brother, I love you muha~, It seems my brother really likes 
backdoors- Ouch ouch, Stop! Stop scratching me, Brother make her stop please, I was 
wrong, I was wrong brother-!!!!" 

Just as she entered the car, Amara started her shenanigans. 



She first get in the car once again and announced her love for him and then landed a 
kiss on his cheeks. 

Because of the small space he wasn't able to dodge this time, She also knew that and 
decided to tease him more. 

Seeing he opened the backdoor and then his now obvious liking to the backdoors, She 
wanted to tease him on that. 

Who knew? He didn't take it lightly and sent Xiao on her, who was like a cat jumping on 
her body trying to get the shiny purple choker from her neck. 

Amara didn't know that and started to struggle begging Alex to stop this little demon but 
he pressed the accelerator and drove towards his dom ignoring her pleas. 

….. 

"Hey Bodyguard 1 and 2, Can you help me look after the young master for a night? I 
have something to do and you two only I trust to take care of the young master." 

In the hallway of the gayler manners, White the childhood sweetheart comes caretaker 
of Nathan asking help from Bodyguard 1 and 2 to take care of Nathan, The man she as 
one sided loves for since childhood. 

She, though naive, knows that this house is not safe for her young master, Especially 
right now when the Madam of the household is absent working out overnight to get 
justice for Nathan. 

But she too wanted to get an answer from the man her young master said that he 
wanted dead. 

If her young master thinks about this for someone then that person has to be a bad gal, 
an in and out evil person. 

She wanted to see and talk to that person to check if he is too bad then she would make 
him pay for the injuries of Nathan. 

So she thought of these two bodyguards of her young master. 

She trust them to take care of her young master whole heartedly, She was not even an 
ounce of doubt she had in her head that they protect her young master from any harm 
befall on them. 

After all these two risked their life and protected her young master from the legendary 
S-Rank master. 



So they can be fully trusted about the safety of her young master to them without any 
worry. 

"Miss White, Do you want us to take care of our young master? and you only trust two 
of us for it, Is that right?" 

Bodyguard 1 and 2 looked dumbfoundedly at this naive little miss who wasn't able to 
wrap their mind around what was being said. 

They can be trusted for the safety of a young master? THEY? 

Well they do take care of Nathan very well but it's not in any shape or form good for him. 

If anyone asked them this, They would have rejected the offer or even asked to wait for 
an answer before confirmation from their young miss. 

But it was White that said this to them, A famous airhead in their whole manner. 

Hence why they even attending the idea. It does not hurt, At least for them to take care 
of their beloved young master. It's just that they are still vary of any types of traps. 

"Yes, Can you? pretty please, I would request madam to give you two break and these 
two luxurious free gaming club tickets for your troubles." 

White didn't hear the shock in both of their voices, She just thought these two were tried 
after the encounter with the S- 

rank master. 

She understood their worry and fatigue, So she even offered them coupons she saved 
to take her young master there. 

But with his condition right now, He can't move for a week and even then he is not 
suitable to go to the gaming club for a month. 

These tickets though she saved for months to get it would expire next month, So it's 
logical to give it to these two. 

It would also be her gratitude towards them for saving the young master. 

"Well, If you insist, We would "take care" of the young master. You can go amr do what 
you want to do without any worry. We are here. 

Not to mention one night even if the young master did not recover for years, We would 
gladly take care of him." 



Both Bodyguards had a glint in their eyes as they knew she was not lying and so they 
accepted the offer. 

"Really? That's great, Thank you, Here take this for your trouble." 

White didn't get that both cursed Nathan to be bedridden for years, All she thought how 
big hearted they are to say this that they would take care of him. 

So she thanked them and handed them the coupons. Then she said farewell to those 
two and left the house not seeing the smirk on their faces. 

(A/N : How do you think these two are going to take care of Nathan? 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day .) 

Chapter 285 283. Hands Or Legs 

"I hope I am not too late." 

Isabella said to herself as she checked her wrist watch which was showing time that it 
was close to 1 AM. 

Alex didn't tell her any specific time, He just said come to him at night making her 
anxious about being late. 

The way he reacting with her in the mall also made her feel panic, Though he said he 
was teasing her but that coldness of his might also be true if not for his big forgiven 
heart. 

Her unfortunately dumb son provoked S-Rank and got beaten by it. It was Alex who 
came to his rescue even though her son hated him so much. 

But this incident did not change his nature. Her son still hates him, rather now blaming 
the beating on Alex. 

While Alex as always forgives him, It's just she has to pay for her son's sin, Which she 
is more than happy to do. 

Still a fear that one day he would snap and couldn't take the unprovoked hatred of her 
son making her choose between them hunting her. 

For her it's a choice between arm or leg, She can't lose any, So she wanted to try her 
best to keep peace in them. 

It's just that only Nathan is hostile to Alex, Alex rather not care about him, Which given 
his status is close to characteristics. 



This creates a strange problem. She knows how to deal with this issue but didn't have 
the strength to do it. 

"Good evening Madam, Car is ready." 

Isabella was lost in her internal struggle when her bodyguard cum personal secretary 
pulled a car in front of her and notified to get in. 

"Thank you." 

Isabella got in the back as she politely greeted her back once again thinking of her 
issue. 

The more she thought about it the more frustrated and angry she became towards her 
son. 

She wouldn't understand why he is not behaving right? It's an honorable thing to admit 
one's own fault. 

This even started to create a cracks in her willingness to make him head of family in the 
place of her eldest daughter. 

"Ahmm, That madam, congratulations to get such a good deal today." 

Black didn't know what's wrong with her Madam today. 

Since the morning she was lost in her own world, She even saw her smiling to herself 
thinking of something. 

It is not like her madam, Though she was not a cold woman but anything other than a 
polite business smile was a rare occurrence unless something exciting happened. 

Black can only think that it was because of cracking 100 Billion UC deal with heir of 
Wilson famoly. 

It is a huge profit even to the big family like them, So its reasonable to be in good but 
current Isabella has doesn't look like it. 

She was look more angry and fusrated along with slight anxiousness and panic. 

This is a reason she keep her mum even though Black wanted to ask whether she 
should take Isabella back or like always in the hotel room. 

As because of the bad ood between Isabella and her eldest daughter, Isabella prefer to 
stay at hotels to avoid drama. 



But now that Nathan is back and from the worried message of sister appared to be 
injured, Its not clear where Isabella wants her to take her. 

"Thank you." 

Isabealla was so lost in her thought that she didn't even notice that car did not moved 
inch since she got into it. 

She just a answered Black as she thinking deep about her issue. 

'Why alway me?' 

Black couldn't help but curse her fate as its seems every bad thing just fall on to her. 

She really didn't wanted to poke the hornet nest right now but she didn't have other 
option then to do so. 

Reluctantly she pumped herself to ask that question fully preapred for to be a scapegoat 
target for the negetive emotions of Isabella. 

"That- Madam where should we go? Like always hotel suit or back to manor?" 

Black closed her eyes ready to be scolded by Isabella for breaking get chain of thoughts 
as she asked her out. 

"Oh! Please take me back to the Alex's dormitory." 

Contrary to the imagination of Black, After her question Isabella realised she didn't tell 
where to go to her. 

So she quickly say it as last thing she wanted to happen is to reach there late. 

She thought about it and decided that there is no need to think about this rigot now, She 
should enjoy tonight then take any hardhearted decisions later on. 

"Humm, Miss Alia's boyfriend, Alex?" 

Black taken aback by such a chill reply but then she was more shocked when Isabella 
take a mans name. 

For Black it was most shocking thing as Isabella never even has any contact with any 
many outside her business. 

Not to mention right now at this late she wants to go to some mans hous- no not house 
but an dormitory. 



That means its man but an collage student, Though its common for woman like her 
status to rise few young "canary" outside. 

But Isabella is not somone to do this, As she might be hit menopause or something as 
how can anyone control themselves for years. 

"What did you said?" 

Ice cold words rang in the car sending chills through the car, Black felt like someone 
holding a knife on her neck, Which they would swing if she did not comply. 

Black didn't know how much her innocent question has effect on Isabella, She was in 
bliss of ignorance ready to head towards domitory of Alex. 

She understood now that Isabella might still want to convince Alia to join their group as 
this way pressure can be built on the eldest lady. 

Black did not like that Isabella using outsiders to put pressure on her own flesh and 
blood for not so good son in her eyes. 

But right now she was in no condition to think for others as she felt like she was in huge 
trouble not knowing what she did wrong that provoked her madam. 

"I-I apologize for my overstepping, I would take you to the Mr. Alex's place right away." 

Black still didn't understand what she did wrong but as an experienced veteran in this 
field she quickly apologized not even trying to know the reason. 

The more she knows the better. She just hit the accelerator and dashed towards the 
place of Alex. 

Isabella though didn't say anything afterwards but her mood was cranky as she just 
remembered that Alex is still boyfriend of Alia. 

So her thoughts of making him hers can't be done at least right now, Especially if that 
crazy woman/sister of his there. 

She ignored the overstepping of Black and started to think of ways to counter Amara. 

.... 

"Is that bad guy lives here?" 

White reached to Alex place but when she saw it was collage dormitory she had to 
double check the address she received to see if she was in right place. 



She re-read it once again but it showing her that this is a place of that bad guy in her 
young master mouth. 

Its just from what she heard and invistigate it, This Alex guy should be a white face 
riased by heir of Miller family. 

He is a flower that is being taken care by the infamous black rose, So it was hard for to 
understand that why Alex was living in this run down place. 

Yeah run down as compared to his status he can at minimum get a single family 
apartment from Alia Miller. 

And it should also be in personality of green tea as all thos people saying, He would 
have matched it. 

But now there was little doubt in her heart, If he was really green tea as all people thoes 
intel were saying it then he would have never stayed in the place like this one. 

"Is young master misunderstood? Wait?! No, How can it be? Young master can never 
be wrong." 

White suddely doubted Alex being a bad guy seeing be didn't take advantage of being 
boyfriend of Alia.  

But then it hit her that if she doubt Alex being not as. ad rumors say then that means her 
young master is wrong tagging Alex as an bad person. 

This can never be, He young master can never wrongly judge anyone, not when 
allegations are that extrem. 

So she still thought Alex being an bad guy and the fully or least partial reason behind 
her young masters injuries. 

"I should not attack him like I planned, Maybe there more to the story, I need to know 
whole story before doing anything." 

White though naive is not dumb, At first she wanted to beat Alex thinking he was 
abusing power and bullying weak. 

But now there was change of heart, Now she wanted to talk to Alex, get full and his side 
of story. 

Then after that she can decide what she wanted, Anyway its late at night and he is 
alone single man. 

If she really wanted to retaliate, Who can here to protect him? 



She just hopes that she didn't have to fall to tall degree and all this can be solved with 
just an talk. 

"Lets go talk with him." 

White didn't wanted to waste much time, So after checking there was no additional 
security messures around she directly walked into his dorm not even checking before 
that whether or not he was there or even only one living in it. 

(A/N : I think I should upload R-18 back to back, What do you guys think? 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??.) 

Chapter 286 284. Artifacts 

"Brother!! Ask her to stop, please." 

Amara was begging for help from her brother while trying to defend against agile and 
quick Xiao Bai who wanted the shiny choker of hers. 

"Why can't you just give it to her? I can buy you a new one." 

Alex looked at their shenanigans through the rear view mirror and couldn't help but say 
to Amara that she can just give her jewelry to Xiao Bai. 

This little girl likes shiny things. There is only one way to stop her once she lands on 
something. 

One is if he himself commanded her or second one is to get her the thing she wanted. 

He didn't want to command her as commands are infallibles, The moment he 
commands it whether she wants or not, She would be forced to do it. 

This would mess up with her psyche and her unconditional trust for him might get hit, It's 
a rare chance of that from happening but he didn't wants to take a risk unless it's 
absolutely necessary. 

Amara can let Xiao Bai borrow her choker, That sound so entitled but that's the only 
way and he would unlike with Rebecca's thing, make sure she would be paid for her 
troubles. 

"I can't brother, Its artifact mother gave it to me to keep my strength in check, So I would 
not accidentally bump and destroy a few buildings." 

Amara was helpless as she answered to Alex, If it was something else she would have 
gladly given it to her. 



It's just that this is a thing that she can't take off her body. 

This choker she was wearing is an artifact discovered in ruins in an ancient cave when 
there was an expedition in search of things before the fall. 

This artifact is one of the few things they found in it. 

At first they didn't know what this artifact did, Though there were obvious defenses, 
boost and other stuff like any other gear but it took them time to know the unique ability 
of it. 

Which was nothing but restricting the powers of S-Rank and above, It didn't have any 
effect on lower ranks for some reason. 

This unique ability is in the passive category, It restricts the powers of its wear from S-
Rank to the normal mortal huwoman. 

Only when the master of this artifact actively wants, They can use their full S-Rank 
powers if not they would be like any other mortal. 

The purpose of this artifact is obvious, It is a training wheels for new S-Ranks to make 
sure their normal subconscious would not demolish their surroundings. 

Seeing this is the only unique ability it possesses, Which was useless for below S-Rank 
and all other S-Rank old and experienced enough to know their powers. 

So it was put on auction by the merchant guild. 

Her mother saw this and knew it was the best thing for her, So she brought it at a huge 
price as even if its unique ability was useless for others it was still a legendary grade 
product of age before the fall. 

Don't get it wrong, Her mother didn't brought it for her nor safety of her surroundings, 
The sole purpose behind this purchase was too keep Alex safe from her. 

Even if at that point Alex ran away from home, Her mother knowing she would one day 
run off to see him brought her that too to ensure safety of her son. 

Amara too only decided to wear it because it would keep Alex safe from her, As at that 
time even at her best controlling her strength, she was cracking ground and destroying 
buildings. 

*Slam* *Break* 

"Wait what?!!!" 



Alex didn't know anything about this but the moment Amara said it's an artifact, Alarm 
goes off in his head. 

He quickly slammed the breaks halting the speeding car on the road. 

Thankfully it's late at night and there is no traffic, If not this would cause a big accident. 

But he didn't care at this moment, He quickly turned around in shock and asked her to 
disbelieve. 

Artifacts. 

As in every power fantasy frictions they are types of gears to improve and enhance 
one's own stats and abilities. 

So of course the wishfulliment generic novel like this world is also going to have those in 
it. 

Alex is not surprised by that at all but the fact that these things only supposed to appear 
in the middle-late part of Nathan's plot just a few months before reawakening or more 
mainstream term Riki recovery. 

It was also when Nathan finally went from being face slapped and beaten like a dog 
from everyone to the only run away from the strong that came out afterwards. 

In this time he got many boosts and chances that made him from little good at 
cultivating to a genius. 

It is also this time that the world power system focus changed. It went from being 
superpower centric with slight cultivation touch to the full cultivation stream with added 
superpower at side as auxiliary. 

And the scary thing is, As protagonist of this world Nathan gets many broken things. 

So if these things popped-up in the world then that is a clear sign that the world plot 
skipped all the beginning stuff and was heading towards the late one. 

'System explain.' 

Alex quickly entered in system space "slowing down" time in surroundings. 

He needs an answer, Though currently he is overpowering both Nathan and Jake but 
that is because of his hard work in these few days. 

And it's also their early plot so nothing game breaking is given to them, But if plot skip in 
the middle-late part then things would change. 



There is no saying when those protagonists find a world grade artifact or technique to 
jump the ranks to catch up with him. 

Yeah, as protagonists they can do anything they want without caring if it's reasonable or 
not. 

[Ding! Host please don't worry, System already expected and warned you about this 
before. 

Right now you destroy most of the plot of both Nathan and Jake and conquer their early 
plot womens. 

And they currently in no state to attend their remaining plots, So heavenly will as 
protection measures pushing the plot forward. 

But you don't have to worry though, System monitoring the changes in the world and 
would notify you when plot of it would come close. 

Also as the added benefits for pushing the protagonist so much that heavenly will has to 
take an action of pushing plot forward, the Host would be rewarded. 

And of course because of such an action heavenly will was also going to be weak and 
was on cooldown decreasing protagonist halo luck effect tremendously.] 

System quickly responded to him and in detail explained to him what was happening. 

He broken all the early plot of Nathan and Jake especially the he took away their main 
heroine, Alia from them. 

She was a huge help for two of them that gave them jump start connecting them to all 
important people and connections. 

He took that away from them giving them a huge blow, Plus Jake's invincible heart was 
pretty much broken being beaten by F-Rank. 

Nathan was also bedridden to do anything, Alex didn't know about but's condition but he 
knew he too was not able to attend because of the system's prompt. 

So it's reasonable heavenly will fear for its beloveds and take drastic measures. 

'*Sigh* I have to speed up." 

Alex know this would happen but not this quickly, He thought it could at best make late 
stage characters show here and there. 

But he never thought that it would change to this degree. 



Then again the character of late stage was showing up here and there but that just 
strengthened him more, So this is the only way left for poor heavenly will to protect its 
basterds. 

"Huh? Its artifact brother, Wait? Do you want one? Mo- Mada-...She also brought it for 
you, I can ask her to send it here." 

Just as Alex came out of his system space time flowed normally and Alex heard Amara 
saying this to him. 

It took him half a second to process what she was talking about as no matter how many 
times he did it, It's still hard to get used to sudden time changes. 

"....We have to deal with the issue with mommy later but right now none of this is a 
matter of concern yet. 

We will talk about this later. Tonight we enjoy ourselves without worry. Also if there is 
one me, You can ask her to send it, I also want one." 

Alex is quick to detect the unresolved issue in Amara's tone, And know he has to 
resolve it before it turns for worse. 

But it can wait. Tonight he didn't want to think about this at all. He can deal with those 
stuff in the morning. 

Tomorrow he has to do many things, So he has to relax tonight to have energy to deal 
with what the world throws at him. 

"As for you Xiao Bai, Come here, I would let you play with this." 

After that he told Xiao Bai to come to the passenger sit, and even offered a tempting 
offer she could not refuse. 

Xiao Bai quickly come back and sat on the passenger seat looking at him expectly. 

He looked at her and then throw the diamond necklace of Rebbeca at her to play, 
Which she happily accepted and started playing with. 

Amara was relieved that Xiao Bai was not on her. She wanted to say something but 
Alex started the car and headed straight towards his dorm. 

It's going to be a long night. 

(A/N : I know it's quite a long time but this is the last chapter. Next would be in the dorm. 

Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁. ) 



Chapter 287 285. Dumb and Dumber 

"What fraction do you belong to, What are you doing here and Who are you?" 

Rita standing in front of White interrogating her, holding hands on her hips, Who was 
being tied and was hanging upside down from the ceiling. 

"You psycho learn to construct sentences first, Arghh." 

White cursed Rita as she trying to break free from her bondage. 

She didn't know where this psycho came from. 

When she reached the room a while ago. She knocked on the door but no one 
answered, She felt weird as which student would be out this late at night? 

She didn't want to go back empty handed, So she tried to forcefully open the door, 
thinking Alex might be sleeping or something. 

But then she found out that the door wasn't locked at all, With a simple push she 
opened the door wide open. 

This time the bell rang in her head. This late at night, the door of the boy's room was not 
locked and still no one gave any response. 

She didn't think twice and barged in concerned about the safety of Alex. 

Even though she came here to ask for answers for injuries of her young master but as it 
stands right now she still didn't want something bad to happen to an innocent man. 

So she came as white knight to rescue but just as she entered, All she saw a black 
shadow in his vision and boom the next moment she was tied up hanging upside down. 

Then this psycho appeared and started spewing nonsense asking which fraction she 
belongs to and all. 

She denied it but this woman didn't stop and once again asked the question with 
countless errors and mistakes. 

Like didn't you suppose to start with who are you and then rest? How can someone 
make a mistake in a small thing like this one? 

As for why she is psycho? Simple. 

Right now she wasn't particularly wearing any clothes. There was a tight man's shirt 
then on top of it was a male coat. 



There was no dressing downside, Her area only hidden behind the long over coat, 
Which only covered because she was standing right now. 

If she decided to move, There is no doubt that her ugliness would be exposed. 

"Humm, I would do that later but for now, Care to tell me, What fraction do you belong 
to? I promise if you be a good girl and told me, I would make sure your death would be 
as painless as possible, I swear this on my killer ethics." 

Rita thought about White said and came to the conclusion that what this woman was 
saying is not wrong. 

Last time Amara was able to use this fault against her in an argument, If she wants to 
avoid that then she needs to learn it. 

But that thing that should be worried about later, Right now she wanted to know the 
origin of this woman. 

Rita suspects this is a killer sent from a rival organization to end her story, After all it's 
not that uncommon. 

She herself was ordered to do many such tasks but in her case it said to be for greater 
good, There is no innocent person's blood in her hand. 

Or at least that is what was told to her, As everyone knows the hypocrisy of the 
protagonist faction. 

If you are with them then you are a good guy even if you killed thousands. If not then 
you are an evil incarnate. There is no in-between. 

Anyway right now Rita was in full alert mode, She was not worried about herself as she 
dealt with countless such assassin attempts on her life. 

But she was more concerned about Alex, Especially Amara as she would take this 
opportunity and would definitely try to throw her off Alex's life. 

Normally she didn't mind as she as killer know to never emotionally attach to someone 
but this time she failed. 

It's been not that long and yet she couldn't even bear the thought of being separated 
from Alex. 

For that she even wants to give up on her assassins career as for the first time she 
found a place to call a home. 



And for that she ignored the death penalty and womanhunt that would come after she 
wants to leave dragon gate. 

Of course, As its motto of survival of fittest, If she survived their attacks, She was free to 
go and would no longer be targeted. 

Hence why she was sure she could leave and also sure that this woman might also be 
here from her own organization. 

That is because even if she only made leaving the organization decision in the morning, 
giving it has pretty much eyes and ears everywhere. 

It would not be strange if they know about it and send assassins to cut the loose ties. 

"No No No, Wait wait wait!?!! Killer??? Hey Hey don't kill me *bawling* I-I *Sniff* come 
here to just ask questions, nothing else, Let me go or I would scream.' 

White terrified when she heard Rita calling herself killer, She as being part of Gayler 
family is not unknown to the killers. 

Even the Gayler family hire once in a while to deal with pesky pest problems, But she 
had never seen one or ever been targeted by them. 

Her sister said that killers are bloodthirsty demons that should be avoided at any cost as 
they don't value anything other than money. 

She told her so many stories and urban legends that fear of killers embedded in her 
heart. 

She is just a normal caretaker in the Gayler family household. How can she have 
courage to face someone like that? 

So the moment Rita said she is a killer, She broke out in sweat, Her eyes became 
watery and tears started to roll down from her forehead because of her current state. 

White was was sure what Rita said is true as only lunatics would act and behave like 
this one. 

Look at her dressing, How she talks and behaves, Something definitely wrong in her 
head. 

People like this are perfect candidates to be killer. 

If White has any money she would have offered right now but she is very poor, The 
payment she gets goes to her sisters account where she keeps it safe. 



Right now she didn't have a single dime on her body. There was also the thought of 
fight of trying to escape here. 

But seeing how easily she was apprehended by this psycho, She also dropped that 
idea, So all she thought of doing was to yell for help. 

"Hump, Don't lie. Who comes at this late at night to questions? Do you think I am a fool? 
Also I dare you to yell for help, Lets see who is faster, You mouth or my knife." 

Rita hearing the reason of White called bullshit, Who is in their right mind would come 
this late at night to ask questions? 

She rather felt insulted. How can this woman thought she is so dumb enough to believe 
in it? This pisses her off more. 

Then this woman has the audacity to threaten her saying she would yell? 

She is a hardened killer. How can she be threatened by any run of the mill woman at all, 
Rita might be able to forgive for calling her dumb but never can she take blatant 
disrespect. 

So she swiftly pulled out a sharp knife holding directly above the throat of White daring 
her to yell. 

"Hey don't don't, I-I was kidding, Kidding, Please let me go, I really just want to ask 
questions." 

White nearly pissed her pants when that cold metal came that close to her throat, Her 
heart was racing and her head was becoming muddy because of excessive blood 
flowing in her brain. 

She started begging for her life, She yet to tell her young master her true feelings for 
him. 

She never had courage nor had confidence to say it as she is just an homeworker and 
he is the young master of the Gayler family. 

Still she didn't want to die with that regret, She also worried how her sister would handle 
the news of her death. 

She didn't want her to be sad or so on revenge rampage as that would just go put her in 
danger. 

She does want to live as she has yet to experience so many things, She can't end it like 
this at all. 



"Just tell me your fraction name and I let you go." 

Rita used her cold killer voice and asked White once again. 

She really can't kill this woman right now, Not without knowing which faction she 
belongs to to make sure she would deal with it. 

But it seems this woman also knows that hence avoiding saying it makes it harder for 
her. 

If she was not in a hurry, Alex would come back and then she would explain this to him 
and Amara. 

She didn't want to have that conversation as it would mean she had to say everything 
about her to Alex. 

Even though he already investigate about her and knows it but it would be still harder 
for her to say it out loud. 

"I didn't belongs to any fractions at all, I hoseworlerker in the Gayler family." 

White while crying revealed her origin because she really thought this woman would kill 
her if she didn't say anything. 

She didn't want to die, She wanted to live and in hope that Gayler might deter her from 
doing anything she said it not even thinking to hide the fact that she is a houseworker in 
it. 

'Is this woman dumb?' 

Rita suddenly hearing the answer couldn't help but think something was wrong in the 
head of this woman. 

"What is happening here?" 

Rita wanted to test her theory but a voice of shock stopped her. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁.) 

Chapter 288 286. Dumb And Dumber II 

Both Rita and White quickly turned around towards the source of voice in shock, fear 
and relief. 



Rita was obviously terrified seeing like this in front of Alex, and if god forbid that crazy 
woman with him, She definitely jump on her and drag her back in the room, She just 
knows it. 

White was happy and in relife someone is here for help, Now she just hope they are not 
as crazy as this psycho. 

"*Sigh* Oh it's you, You scared me for a second there, What are you doing here? You 
are not going to get free food now, He is not here and I have yet to eat anything." 

Rita was scared but after seeing who was standing in the door, Her heart calmed down 
and she sighed in relief. 

But then realize this person has no business being here if not for the free food, Which 
she didn't have. 

She had yet to eat anything because Alex was out all day long, So she was also hungry 
waiting for him to come back and feed her. 

"Are you serious? Why is there a person hanging upside down in the hall- Wait!? White 
is that you?" 

Isabella stands in the entrances looking at Rita in shock and worry. 

Oh yes, Rita even after all this didn't lock the door, So Isabella easily came in and saw 
this scene unfold in front of her. 

She was already in a bad mood because of Black's words of Black as though she hated 
it, What Black said was also pure truth. 

Alia is still the girlfriend of Alex for the society and by that relationship she is a side-
chick. 

Though she didn't care at any point but because of her status, She really can't flaunt 
him to the outside world with pride. 

Even if she didn't want it, All she was able to do was to hide this from the light of the 
world like some dirty little secret, Which it is not. 

She was thinking all about what she could do and how to make sure he would not get or 
be bashed because of her. 

In this thought she entered in the room thinking seeing Alex she able to calm down her 
heart but what she saw just raced it even more. 



The partner of Amara in the living room standing half naked in room which is not weird 
rather is an improvement as before she was fully naked, At least this time there was 
some clothes on her. 

But then she saw she was threatening another woman tied hanging upside down to the 
ceiling. 

She even wonders how Rita was able to do it as last time she came here there was no 
place like that present there to do this. 

Then to her surprise she saw the "face" of White. 

"Face" because just like her twin sister, White also wears a white face mask on her face 
covering it fully. 

And yes, Rita also didn't bother to unravel her face at all, Not any particular reason 
other than she forgot about it. 

How she survived her assassin life is an unsolvable mystery. 

"MAD-MADAM!!! Uwhaaaa~ *Sniff* Please save me from this lunatic." 

White's vision was blurry because of the tears but because of gravity it quickly flowed 
down giving her opportunity to see the newcomer. 

And the moment she saw it was her madam, mother of her young master and head of 
Gayler family, She saw the hope of survival, She now she can be saved. 

So her emotions finally get out of control and she bursts out crying aloud, letting her 
thoughts run rampant.  

'Is young master saw me leaving and asked Madam to check on me? but I sneaked out 
after he was asleep. 

But then again, How can madam Gayler be here? It has to be him.' 

White couldn't help but think her younger master was the one who came to her rescue 
and sent his mother for help. 

That is the only reason she can think of her Madam coming here, There can be no 
reason at all making her heart fill for more feelings towards Nathan. 

She completely ignores the fact that both Rita and Isabella have a conversation that 
shows they are not strangers to each other and have some connection. 



Which might be the reason Isabella came here, That would be a logical reasonable 
reason. 

And that's why White wasn't able to understand it, Logic and her? She has no 
relationship with it. 

Of course it can be argued protagonist luck is in play but keep in mind that Alex already 
destroyed protagonist brain bead halo on their first meeting. 

So at best luck can create opportunities and events for misunderstandings for 
protagonists benefits but it can't affect their IQ, So they can always think straight. 

Which means this is the actual way her brain works and acts, If it is even decided to do 
that in the first place. 

"First answer me what's you doing here? Aren't you supposed to take care Nathan? 
Who is doing that now? Or you left him alone? Please tell me you left him alone there." 

Isabella when she saw White, She panicked not knowing how to answer if asked what 
she was doing in Alex's dorm this late at night. 

She at this moment can't put the cat out of the bag, Nathan at this moment can't know 
their relationship especially seeing how much hate he has for Alex. 

If he healed completely they can have that conversation. 

Isabella completely overlooked that she thought if Nathan healed and not when she 
subconsciously wished he never would, so she didn't need to put in position to choose 
between two of them as she was scared what her choice would be. 

But then she realized it is White she was talking about and so she quickly changed her 
mind and thought of ways to answer the question. 

This White is like a fruit fly with least attention span, if you distract her with question, 
She literally forget the main topic and go around answering the questions. 

Hence why Isabella was so quick to ask the question without giving her time to think 
why she was here. 

This way she shoot two birds with one stone, She can distract her from thinking why she 
is here and also ask her about who she leaves Nathan with. 

Though he disappointed her today acting like that but she still cares about her son, She 
didn't want anything bad happen to him. 



Bad meaning this idiot leaving Nathan with those two scourge, Her daughter especially 
trained to make her and Nathan's life miserable. 

She hop-No pray that she didn't let those two take care of Nathan because if they do, 
Who knows how he would end up under their care. 

"What? Of course not. How can I leave the young master alone at home? What if he 
needs something and more? 

I personally asked Bodyguard One and Two to take care of him, I even gave them the 
coupon that gives them a 100% discount in the game club for their trouble. 

Oh on that note, I promised them I would talk to you about giving them a leave for a day 
to enjoy that coupon. 

Can you do that, please? I would take their work load for them, Don't worry about it." 

As Isabella expected White completely forgot about the reason Isabella being there, not 
only that but also forgot her current state. 

White kept talking going off track even asking the favor from Isabella, Whose face right 
was turned white. 

Her fear came true, This woman really put those two to take care of Nathan, And as 
their track record stands, There is high chance she is going to find Nathan in a worse 
condition then she left him. 

This already pisses Isabella off as now she needs to go back to help her son and that 
means she would miss this appointment with Alex, Which is unwilling to do so. 

On top of that, This girl even asked to reward those guys for making her life miserable? 
How can she not be burning with rage? 

"Hey, Do you know her? Why is she calling you grandma?" 

Rita was hella confused hearing the conversation of these two, She was standing at the 
sideline. 

Then she got confused on why this girl was calling Isabella Grandma as she only heard 
Ma part because of White's sobbing crying voice. 

She really thought this White is granddaughter of Isabella, She looked at Isabella in 
surprise and shock as Isabella not look that old to be grandma but who knows rich can 
pay for surgeries and what not to keep looking young. 

"...Dumbass." 



Isabella looked at Rita dumbfoundedly trying to process what was being said here and 
still it did not make sense. 

So all she can say is this to stupid woman while trying to contemplate what she can do 
right now about Nathan. 

Her brain telling her to go and save Nathan as there is no saying what those two would 
do to her son. 

While her heart tells her to stay as if he were going away Alex might become angry and 
never talk to her again. 

He didn't act right when they met in the mall, So her leaving would be adding fule in the 
fire. 

But there is also her son. If she doesn't go, He might get seriously injured. How can she 
ignore that threat? 

So putting the stone on her heart, She turned around and was about to leave ignoring 
both Rita and White. 

Hanging out with these two dumb and dumber is not good for her mental health. 

*Slam* 

But as she turned around wanting to leave, She bumped into the strong warm soft body. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??.) 

Chapter 289 287. White Lotus 

"Going somewhere aunty?" 

Alex spoke softly as he saw the soft figure he bumped into was of Isabella. 

He decided to tease her even more as she h 

do indeed have to pay for the crimes of her son now. 

But then he noticed she was about to leave. There is no need for him to think more 
about it as he can say Nathan's luck has kick in here. 

There might be some emergency regarding Nathan and so Isabella has to leave in a 
hurry. 



If he allowed her to go then nothing would happen as he already conquered the trinity of 
her heart, soul and body. It's just that it would become hard to clear the "Who is your 
daddy" side mission. 

It would be hard to convince Isabella to announce their relationship to Nathan worrying 
about his mental health. 

And her own white lotus nature, Though there is a way but it is taxing and time 
consuming, The time he didn't have. 

"Tha-....Alex, N- What I- just- you know…" 

Isabella was in shock when she saw Alex, Her heart skipped a beat and her breathing 
fastened making her dizzy. 

She was really praying not to see him while she was leaving to avoid having this 
conversation before. 

But now that she saw him, Her break was taken away. 

He was already so charming and beautiful that he looked like a celestial fallen in this 
dirty mortal world. 

Even those celestial in those stories might not compare to him in beauty as he broke all 
limits and boundaries of it. 

And yet somehow impossible to believe he was looking even more charming and 
beautiful in the spam of just one afternoon. 

He has an aura surrounding him that is hard to say it in words. It's like he was forbidden 
ventrue close to or you would perish. 

And yet she couldn't resist herself being attracted to him. The more her mind saying to 
stay away as it sensed the danger, the more her heart urged her to throw herself in the 
ocean of love. 

This made it even more impossible to answer him, Isabella was stammering hard not 
knowing what and how to say to him. 

She knows if she said there is an issue with Nathan and she needs to go right now, She 
is sure Alex will not say much but he would be disappointed. 

She didn't want that to happen, The thought of which was already decided now shook 
up trying to contemplate about whether to go or not. 



"*Shhh!~ Okay Okay I understand you were not going anywhere, No need to panic, I 
was just kidding, I was waiting forward to this all day." 

Seeing the funny and cute reaction of Isabella, Alex decided to put her out of her 
misery. 

He put his index fingers on her soft tempting lips putting this mature beauty on halt 
looking at him with excitement and rush. 

Isabella locked her eyes on him and felt the warmth on her lips setting off the storm in 
her mind and heart. 

Her thoughts were all over the place as she was overwhelmed by the surge of intense 
emotions. 

She is afraid if she didn't stop she would lose herself in such a strong intense addictive 
feeling. 

She was sure if she didn't stop right now, She might do something that she would regret 
later and yet she couldn't bear to move away from it. 

Her mind nor her heart dare do it and so she just let it be, If something happen, it just 
happened she would deal with it later. 

'Huh..? Oh yes, I was not going anywhere, Tha- Yes, I was coming to call you to say 
look at how Rita is going crazy here, Ask her to behave." 

Isabella's reasonable side of the brain quickly shut off when she heard what Alex said 
and just went with it as she didn't give guts to correct him at all. 

She is terrified that if she did it right now, He would not only be disappointed but might 
even hate her, So would never ever allow that to happen. 

'Well those two do not dare to do too much, right? Nathan though not heir of the Gayler 
family but he is still a young master of it, Not only them but even my daughter didn't 
have guts to do too much.  

At best there would be some flesh wounds, I can pay that new doctor to treat him to 
cure it, right? 

Anyway seeing what he did today, daring to provoke S-Rank putting Ale-other peoples 
lives at risk, He needed to be taught a lesson, didn't he? 

Huhm, Yes, I am just doing strict parenting. It would not be irresponsible to do it if I am 
doing it for his own good right? righ? I mean there is nothing wrong with it.' 



Isabella just after answering Alex started to thinking and search for the answer to justify 
her actions. 

After all, She is White Lotus trope. She can't do anything against her hypocritical morals 
but only on the paper. 

If temptation is high enough then there is no saying what kinda reasoning they can 
come up with trying to justify their actions, Its wild to think about it. 

Just like White Lotus heroines, Who take the resources of the villain while still rejecting 
him and when asked to return those things back they with thick faces say you gave it to 
them, They didn't ask. 

But not even once they ready to given the resources back as they either spend it on 
them and protagonists or they are unwilling to give up just tressure. 

Isabella is like that White Lotus, Thankfully though not to that extreme and there is also 
the perk of her being a mother heroine. 

That means she is also the best wingwoman for Alex, Better than any heroines as this 
trope is there to help MC expand the harem. 

Alex knows Isabella is definitely thinking about some reason to make herself stay here. 

To be honest he didn't care about her reason. As long as it's beneficial to him, Then it 
didn't matter how it happened. 

He is villain, He is not responsible those dumb morals and all, If he follow morals and 
laws then he might needed to hang himself the moment he raided Shapira, A fucking 
tigress. 

Given it happened accidentally but he was not least worried about it after Pedo or 
Beastality argument. 

"Huh? What do you mean Rit-!!" 

It's just what Isabella said caught his attention, He then remembered he indeed brought 
a homeless assassin home last night. 

So he looked inside the living with curiosity, now it was his turn to be shocked. 

Before Isabella was standing in the doorway, blocking the view inside and because he 
too focused on her he didn't look inside. 

But now that he does he is rooted on his spot. 



Currently Rita was standing in the living room like a lost child looking around searching 
for its way home. 

While White was hanging upside down on his ceiling tied in ropes also staring at him. 

He of course knows about White, She is the famous twin trope of this novel. 

One is smart, while the other is an airhead, White is an airhead in it and also the first 
woman who falls in love with Nathan. 

It is the childhood love of theirs, That is what throws him off as why such a woman 
come to him like this? 

She is one of few early stage women who are so one hearted about Nathan and did 
many things for him in the dark. 

Of course just like anyone hearted woman like this one in wishfulliment novel context, 
She was one of the last women to even acknowledge my Nathan giving her just 1 
paragraph dedicated in the end. 

Alex planning on getting to her too but for him she was out of reach as White rarely 
came out of the household in the plot. 

That is because she was forbidden by her sister to go out alone, Seeing her airhead 
nature it's understandable why. 

And as of right now Gayler family household is still out of his reach, He can't go there as 
there is a hidden boss present there which he didn't want to interact with yet. 

He was thinking about going after White after he had raided Black but look at how the 
situation has changed. She walked directly into the wolf's den. 

'This Nathan is indeed real bro, Not only his own mother he was even generous enough 
to send out this white rabbit to him. 

If he is not a real bro then I don't know what it is. When I meet him, I would fulfill his 
fetish of licking boots. That's the least I can do.' 

Alex stopped to thank Nathan for his generous deeds. First was his mother but he 
thought he was not doing enough and now he even sent another one. 

If he was here, He would have given that guy a hug and might even have given him one 
more shoe for his help. 

"Fuck you, Rita!!" 



Alex was thinking what to do when suddenly he heard a roar beside him as Amara 
lunged forward attacking unprepared Rita and then dragging her back into the bedroom. 

All this happened in such a swift motion that even Alex was impressed by it. 

*Roar* 

Alex wanted to move towards White and release when he heard bloodchilling roar right 
behind him. 

He quickly turned around to defend just to get pounced by it. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??.) 

Chapter 290 288. Two Tigeresse 

"Be Careful!!!" 

White who was spellbounded because of Alex's beauty, released the shriek of terror as 
she was the fierce beast that just jumped on this fairy tale man. 

She struggled to break free from her bondage but it was done by Rita, No matter how 
ger upper floor works, She still has learn few skills that are unmatched for. 

So all White could do was just to see helplessly as that beast pouches on such a 
beautiful man. 

She quickly closed her eyes fearing to see the next state of him. She did not have the 
heart to witness gore at all. 

*Roar* 

"Hey hey stop it, stop it, I apologize hahahaha, I should have not left without cooking for 
you, No don't, Its tickling me ahahha." 

White didn't dare to open her eyes but she did hear the blood chilling roar of the beast 
and the begging of a poor man for letting him go. 

She didn't understand if it was the fortune of the person of misfortune to survive the first 
attack of such a beast. 

I say he was lucky to survive but then he had to wait and saw being torn apart by its 
sharp claws and jaws. 

If said misfortune but then there would be no chance for him to survive, At least here at 
any case he has a chance to fight back and can recover from his injuries afterwards. 



'Which zoo was irresponsible enough to let such a beast out to play? Which idiot is 
responsible for it.' 

The moment it felt like she was starting to make sense, that there was a chance she 
could be normal. 

She suddenly thought which zoo releases such a beast out? Yup she thought this beast 
was released out to play because that is reasonable in her eyes. 

"Hey hey, Okay I know you miss me and are angry, I would cook for you now, Okay?" 

Here Alex begging Shapira to let him go as he was receiving wet slobbery kisses from 
her on his face and neck. 

Though her tongue was supposed to he was rough as sandpaper capable of separating 
meat from bones. 

But right now as she was kissing him wetting his face, It was like a soft warm wet piece 
of cotton gazing over his skin. 

This sensation was both weird and oddly ticklish as he couldn't hold back his laughter 
trying to stop the excited Shapira. 

He can also feel the resentment in her kisses and anxiety of separation from him. 

After all, He indeed promised her before that he would cook for her but then Belladonna 
showed up and he had to leave. 

Though he dropped the piece of well cooked meat to her, Which he brought from a 
system that guaranteed it to be better than anything else she has eaten. 

But it was not about the food per say then to be one that was cooked by him, She is A-
Rank beast the only one rank away from getting humanoid form. 

Also if he cooked then it would have indeed been dimensionally way better than that 
piece of meat he randomly brought from the system. 

*Purr* *Roar* *Purr* 

Shapira didn't pay any heed to him as she was enjoying the warmth of his body. 

She was indeed unhappy when he left without cooking for her but then he gave her the 
meat which was so tasty that she became addicted to it. 

Amara has brought her many delicacies throughout her life since she was a mere cub, 
Most of them were heaven and earth treasures. 



Which were not only beneficial for her growth but also were tasty. There is even her 
personal cook to make sure of both her diet and taste as she is picky eater. 

But since she ate that meat, She lost her appetite to eat anything else. 

Even when her personal cook comes here in the evening making her favorite dishes, 
she doesn't even touch them. 

That cock still made other dishes and yet she didn't eat anything, Fearing Shapira was 
sick or something she even did a medical check on her. 

But even in that show, Shapira is as healthy as she alway was, meaning she just didn't 
like the food. 

Knowing this cook left to go somewhere, It's still unknown where shisis gone but 
Shapira doesn't care anymore. 

She has the person she loves and the sa.e said person has a dish she wants to eat as 
she is super hungry. 

*Slam* *Push* 

Shapira was enjoying herself breathing in the scent of his making her even more wild for 
some reason. 

It was then when she was not at the peak of her excitement, Someone came and 
shoved her from Alex's body with moderate force. 

Shapira becomes airborne but she is a cat after all. With just one swift elegant moment 
she landed on the ground without any trouble. 

Though it was not enough to harm her but it was enough to cause a shock as a warning 
to behave. 

*Growl* 

Shapira turned around and growled towards the direction of the person who ruined her 
good deeds. 

But put her action of halt seeing who it was making her tilt her head in confusion as she 
didn't expect this to be done by her. 

"No bullying, Behave, Mine." 

Xiao Bai who was standing beside him before like his shadow at this moment lifting Alex 
up from ground. 



Then she looked at and confused Shapira and reperminded her that what she was 
doing was not good. 

Of course she stuck herself on him and then announced her rights on Alex to Shapira. 

Though she made it seem like she did it to stop Shapira from bullying Alex, She was 
obviously jealous of Shapira playing like this with Alex. 

How can she allow another beast that too of the same fraction be this casual with her 
master? 

Tigresses themselves are solitary loving beasts. They rarely interact with others unless 
it's necessary, much less to share their masters with other tigers. 

"Hey hey calm down, Xiao Bai, it's not good to attack like that to others who were just 
playing and meant no harm. 

Also Shapira don't do too much that fun turns into pain, Do you two understand?" 

Alex saw the fraction between two of them and was quick to jump to resolve it. 

Xiao Bai is possessive of him, It's a fact that is not hidden from him, It's just her 
possessiveness only triggers against other beasts not huwomans. 

Normally she doesn't get triggered as she is happy to play with Shapira before but it's 
just when he is around she acts so defensively. 

And then there is Shapira. 

Shapira grow up too fast, So fast that in fact if her actual species age followed, She 
would still be a cub in its adolescence. 

And unlike Xiao Bai who thought directly grew up and appeared as an adult beast 
because of her humanoid form. 

But she had a support system and it made sure to transport all necessary information 
and experience in her which Shapira was lacking in it. 

Shapira yet to learn how to deal with her excitement and Amara never thought it was 
necessary to give her advance training other than what is basic one given to her. 

Because for Amara, when Shapira reacts excitedly, She can handle it easily and feel 
nothing. 

So Shapira actually didn't have a good frame of reference, She knows she can't treat 
others as Amara thanks to her being A- 



Rank having cognitive ability. 

But she still underestimated herself and overestimated others because once again she 
didn't have any proper frame of reference and necessary experience.  

If Alex was a normal person without any strength then there is a high chance he got 
injured by her pouncing on him out of the blue. 

Injuries might be small as Shapira might have noticed what would happen and try to 
save it but there would be injuries. 

And then the wrath of Amara would be lashed on the poor soul, Who just wanted to 
play. 

*Snuffle* 

Shapira hearing Alex yell at her was sorry and became sad as she lowered her head 
and made the sad sounds making Alex feel bad of why he did do. 

But he knows if he doesn't, She mistakenly hurt someone later on and then also feel 
bad and not only that but also get punished. 

"Hey don't be sad, Look what I brought for you, It's a fis- 

water meat. Here I save it for you." 

It's just that Alex still can't keep her feeling sad like that. It's not good for her health, So 
he remembers he still has the fish meat he saved for her. 

He quickly brought that out of the system and handed or say pawed to Shapira. 

*Sniff* *Sniff* 

Shapira was feeling sad but then she smelled that tempting smell, She looked up and 
saw Alex was standing in front of her dangling that fish stick. 

She hadn't ate since morning, So the moment food came out, All her negative emotions 
vanished, She took the stick and started eating gleefully. 

"I didn't forget about you, I also saved these for you." 

Alex saw Xiao Bai standing in the doorway looking down as she knew what she did was 
wrong. 

But when she saw him giving the water meat to Shapira and not her nearly made her 
burst out crying thinking Alex liked Shapira more then her. 



This time however she didn't react or throw a tantrum and just stood there sulking. Alex 
saw this thinking it's so easy to teach her, Why can't other heroines be like her? 

So he also gave her a piece for her good behavior though she would have gotten 
regardless of it. 

"Do you have one for me?" 

Isabella being outshine by duo of cat and girl couldn't help but blurt it out. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day.) 
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"You want...cat food?" 

Alex spoke to her in his sweet voice as the corner of his lips raised upwards in a smug 
smile. 

He heard the fear of being left out in the tone of Isabella, If he was a normal person he 
would have just handed one more fish stick to her as he can just buy it from the system. 

But he is Alex with his sadistic taste, So of course he decided to tease her more. 

These fish sticks are not just cat food, but also right for huwoman consumtion, Its 
system product after all. 

"C-Cat food?" 

Isabella was taken aback when she heard Alex, Her eyes quickly fell onto the Shapira 
then at Xiao Bai trying to process what was front of her eyes. 

Her jerk reaction was to conclude Alex is just messing around as he handed fish sticks 
to Xiao Bai. 

How can he give cat food to a mere small child? 

But then it hit her, This girl is no mere child, She was present when he brought her out 
of the bathroom. 



She is a legendary beast from the Myths, The one she is warned to keep a secret by 
Aamara. 

Her base is that indeed of a tigress, So Xiao Bai can eat this food no problem. 

And Shapira is a full fledged tigress so she also has no problem with it. 

"Hey wait?! Why you giving cat food to tiggress?" 

It's just Isabella quickly realize the flaw in the logic, Those two are not cats but are 
tiggress that too not any but beast with cultivation. 

So how can he be feeding them cat food? He should be just teasing her that's all. 

"I-sa-be-lla, It seems all your IQ points are spent on your seductive looks and killer 
charms." 

How can Alex allow her to win in an argument with him? He is pro at making up stuff on 
the fly. 

He quickly approached her, decreasing the distance between the two of them in a quick 
move. 

Then he grazed his index finger on her smooth flushed cheeks as he slowly uttered her 
name speaking slowly like a lullaby of nightingale. 

Isabella was critically hit by this action stunning her in place. 

Her heart was racing in her heart as her breathing became rappid to keep up with her 
wild heart. 

Her pupils dilated as she hyper focused on that celestial face so close at hand, Her 
body felt like it set on the fire by his simple touch. 

The slow name he utter of her each pause was like he was throwing fuel on the blaze 
turning into an inferno. 

A deep rooted desire in her heart wanted to jump out, Let her go wild and just get what 
she wants. 

Her body was already prepared for it, Her pinkish nipples were so erect that they could 
cut glass. 

Her nether was also secreting preparing for that rough intruder to expand her inside like 
before. 



At this moment she even forgot she had a son or what she was supposed to do. The 
right and wrong she mostly fixed upon was also forgotten by her. 

All she knew was she wanted him right now, Fuck the world, society and its rule, She 
didn't care. 

As long as he is willing to calm down that burning blaze of hers, She is willing to do 
anything for him to do it. 

She was waiting for him to do as spontaneously as he did her before, Take away her 
from this tortures wait. 

"Huh?! Hey mister you are not dead- Wait!? Did you just call my Madam an idiot? Let 
me tell you, just in her late 40s, She is able to not only take care of a big family like 
Gayler but also be able to grow it. 

Also she is way smarter than she is beautiful. That doesn't mean she is not beautiful, 
Our Madam is quite beautiful for a mother of two children who themselves are in their 
20s." 

It's just all her hopes and dreams come tumbling as White hanging upside down on the 
ceiling, decides to open her mouth. 

This woman, true to her nature, forgot that there was supposed to be a man being eaten 
in the room. 

The moment she heard Alex saying Isabella was not smart enough, Her attention 
shifted to this as she was quick to blurt it out. 

She only heard someone insulting her madam, How can she just let that slide? 

This is a woman who gave them a place to call home when she and her sisters were 
orphans wandering on the streets hungry and cold. 

She never forgot how warm the blanket was given to two of them to sleep as it was 
winter. 

She still has that blanket which was especially handed to her by Nathan under the 
guidance of his mother, Isabella. 

From that day on, She was never had to go to bed empty stomach all thanks to this 
woman. 

Though there are household rules that say if you do not eat food on time and miss it 
then you have to wait till everyone else eats it. 



And then you can eat the leftover but knowing her airheadedness, There always extra 
food prepared in case she forgot the time. 

A changes like that can only be made by three people. Young master, Eldest Lady and 
Madam. 

Young master leaves not long after they enter the household for his training, So he is 
out of the question. 

Eldest lady is in the enemy camp so she would definitely not be going to make that 
change. 

So only left her Madam, So White is sure that it was her who made sure there would be 
enough food for her to eat. 

Still she carries the toffees in her pocket which is an old habit as it quenches hunger for 
a while. Thankfully she never needed to use it. 

Hence why White was triggered to hear Isabella, who is nothing less than a goddess 
she worship in her eyes to be insulted in front of her eyes. 

'Road to hell are often paved by good intentions.' 

As it right now this should be the best quote suitable for the current situation. 

"....." 

"..." 

"..." 

Isabella, Xiao Bai and Shapira all three women in the room felt speechless staring at the 
White, Who still had her eyes closed. 

If she had her eyes open, She could have seen the woman she worshiped so dearly 
throwing daggers at her. 

If her eyes could kill, White would have been torn into millions of pieces. 

Other two were just eating melo- No their fish sticks as they were enjoying the show. 

"Pfft Hahaha, Yes yes, You are right woman, Indeed Isabella is better looking for a 
mother of two kids in their 20s." 

Alex was not able to hold back, He held his stomach and burst out laughing like a 
madwoman. 



How can he hold back in this situation? Look at the face of Isabella. That angry 
frustrated face was just too cute. 

Even that hanging upside down White is ditto like the woman she was in the plot. 

Zero surrounding/social awareness and just say stuff without any filter without thinking 
about it. 

Which often just backfires on her even though her intentions are always good and in 
favor of the person who gets in trouble because of it. 

You can even call her the personification of friendly fire. 

She wanna defend her group but alway end up shooting them down, That's her trait and 
Alex loves every bit of it. 

Yeah he knows she can be a liability but he also knows all the trouble she causes is just 
embarrassing and not damaging at all. 

"Alex, Its not…she is not…I am not…" 

Isabella was beat red wishing to hide in the ground, She felt like she was dragged down 
from high heavens to ground by the words of White. 

She scrambling for words using which she can defend herself, Say that she is not old, 
Say that White is lying, say that age is just a number and many things. 

But after thinking about it for a while to her dismay she came to the conclusion that 
White didn't say anything wrong. 

She was indeed in her late 40s, Given she is awaken warrior, From which if age 
counted she would be in just in her teenage years as based on her Rank, Her current 
life span is of more than 1000 years. 

But still it's also true that her age according to the standards of White is indeed in late 
40s.  

She is also a mother of 2 children in their 20s. There is also nothing wrong with that 
statement. 

White didn't even say anything bad, She even said she looks better then mother of two 
children who were in their 20s. 

That is a clear compliment, it's just how it worded and the current situation, Isabella 
unwilling to admit it. 



She was desperate to put herself in a good light in front of Alex as right now she was 
sounding like an old cow wanting to eat green grass. 

No, she was exactly doing that but at the same time not. She was so confused and 
anxious, overwhelming her brain that she might pass out because of overheating of her 
brain. 

"Hey hey chill out, I don't mind, I rather love milfs." 

Seeing the state of Isabella, Alex knows he has to stop her or she would cook her brain. 
There is also fear that White might stay hanging upside down as punishment. 

So he stepped in and gave her assurance that he was indeed attracted to her and did 
not care about her age; rather he love her. 

"Milf…What is milf?" 

Isabella who was on the verge of crying stopped when ex heard he likes her but she 
was confused about the word Milf as she never heard of it. 

When Alex heard that he had a wide smug smile as she inched near her ear. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day .) 

Chapter 292 290. Rare Occurrence 

"Do you really wanna know?" 

Alex with smug smile asked Isabella who was now beat red, Though she didn't 
understand what Milf is but she know it should not be a normal thing. 

Plus he also said that he like her more, That's just set in stone. Even if Alex didn't say 
anything about the fact that he not only did not dislike her age and kid status but even 
into it, She was happy with it. 

Even if single mothers are more sought after then single fathers but those men wooing 
a woman are not that good especially Alex is, They did not like any kinda baggage. 

She heard how many women in her circle married a man, Who was just after their 
money as they got divorce long after taking half of their properties. 

As prenup is illegal by the law, Once a couple gets divorce all properties split equally 
among them regardless of the timeline they were married. 

This is Isabella terrified of before, Not that Alex use her for money rather he didn't need 
her to use for money. 



He has everything, looks rivaling celestial in Myths, Family background so big that it 
makes herloo family look like a bug in front of it. 

He has everything he needs, So she was not even worthy to be get used by him at all, 
So when he said he really like her, The heavy heart of hers finally fell into place. 

"What-t is it?" 

Isabella though relaxed but was also curious as it was the first time she hearing the 
term Milf. 

To be fair she is not that familiar with the internet slang as most of the time hers either 
spend on doing and improving business or making sure her daughter does not pull any 
stunt. 

Alex here seeing Isabella really didn't know the word Milf slightly taken aback then it hit 
him that its reverse world. 

Dilf would be the norm here, not Milf. Hardly any one should know about it given they 
have rather questionable preferences according to the rules of this world. 

"Well, Milf is Mother i love to fuck." 

Alex, making sure he was not in the earshot of White or the other two kitties whispered 
to Isabella. 

*Bloom* *Blush* 

The moment Isabella heard his words, Her face turned beat red as she once again 
reached to the high heaven she was before White ruthlessly pulled her down. 

Her eyes dodged but her body was honest, It quickly tilted towards Alex wanting to be in 
his warm embrace. 

The lust she suppressed before was also putting its head out wanting to be ravaged by 
the man in front of her. 

She closed her eyes as her soft lips perked towards Alex wanting to interlock with him. 

"Humm, Hey I have no idea what's going on right now but I am happy to be here, Don't 
get me wrong It's just can anyone take me down? I'm starting to feel dizzy." 

It's just before their lips can meet, White suddenly speaks out diverting attention 
towards her. 

Alex just looked at White then Isabella, Who was out for blood now. 



Isabella shot open her eyes in rage as she locked on the White, Who still didn't open 
her eyes but her mouth was running without any leash not knowing when to shut up. 

White here didn't know she was playing with fire, She was hanging upside down like this 
for quite a while now. 

It was now starting to become uncomfortable for her. Her head is starting to become 
dizzy and it is also starting to hurt a little. 

Though she was happy to get him out of the Gayler manner as its rare occasion she 
sneaked out but now it backfires. 

She was just glad her Madam came out at the right time and saved her from that 
lunatic, But she was confused that why even after all this time no one decided to take 
her down. 

Didn't the misunderstanding get resolved? Or did they forget about her? Did they even 
hear her? What is happening in the room? she didn't know.  

But she does not worry as there is her Madam Gayler, She definitely saves her without 
any hurdle, She is confident of it. 

Everyone in room just looked at White, Isabella wanted to march forward intending to 
shut her off but Alex hold her hand back 

How can Alex allow her to ruin this good show? It's rarely happen that he gets to enjoy 
the stupidity of heroines without any fear of backlash. 

"Hello?! Is anyone here? Can you hear me? Do I become deaf? But I can hear my 
voice? Maybe deaf people can hear their own voice, The more you know. 

That reminds me, I forget to eat dinner, I wonder what dish is cooked today, I hope it's 
my favorite one." 

White after not getting any reply, couldn't understand why that was the case, So she 
started babbling in fear. 

Well it started as fear then she forgot the reason for her babbling and so did fear 
starting a chain reaction as she diverted from the main point she started as. 

The topic which was started as fear that why anyone was not replying to her wondering 
if she went deaf to remembering that she forgot to eat today. 

Then she started to wonder what dish is made today hoping it would be any one of her 
favorites. 



"Can you shut the fuck up? We did not mistake you for a mute if you just kept shut for a 
few moments." 

Isabella's rage boiled over as she saw how quickly this girl changed topics on the whips. 

She even wonders if those ADHD people may be able to hold attention on one point 
longer then this completely sane woman. 

Yes, completely sane as Isabella herself took her to the doctors when White was a child 
seeing the way she was reacting. 

It was normal for a child who went through all that to develop mental disorders, It is 
totally normal and understandable. 

Not in the childhood test nor in adult one doctors find anything wrong with this woman. 

Yeah there was slight separation anxiety and little PTSD because of her childhood 
trauma but that doesn't say why she is like that. 

She just does for some unknown reason, She forgot things rather than say she quickly 
diverted from the topic being distracted by something else without even realizing. 

If it was any medical condition then it can be excusable as White can't help it but there 
is none. 

Isabella even thinks this woman is now doing it on purpose to screw with her. How can 
her timing alway collide with her when she is trying to get close to Alex? 

She did not believe that it is a coincidence completely ignoring that White has been like 
that since childhood, It's the way she is. 

"What? I-I sorry i didn't mean to do this Madam, I swear, I just came here to ask some 
question to Miss Alia's boyfriend, Who knew I would encounter lunatic here. 

*Sniff* You know she caught me and hung me upside down. I said over and over again 
that I came here to meet Misd Alia's boyfriend but that psycho didn't pay any heed to 
me at all. 

And and *Huugh* Can you put me down before I tell you the rest of the story? My head 
is filled with blood, I am not feeling good." 

White was terrified when Isabella roared at her. She didn't understand what she did 
wrong to make Isabella angry. 

But because of the training she was quick to apologize first before she started to say 
her side of the story, The story that no one asked her. 



It's one thing she telling her story, it's another thing using trigger words like calling Alex 
the boyfriend of Alia. 

Yes, for the outside world his identity is indeed the boyfriend of Alia, But this thing is a 
painful nerve of Isabella. 

And White didn't just use it once, She used everytime she talked about Alex not 
knowing each time she said it, She is putting fuel in fire. 

Then she has the audacity to ask for the help in the same paragraph, She really has no 
social awareness at all. 

If not for her sister alway coming to her rescue, Who knows what could have happened 
to her. 

"I am going to kill her." 

Isabella finally lost it, She was ready to march forward and end her miserable life. 
Anyway it's doubtful if she even keeps in mind what is happening to her. 

"Okay okay, Wait that's enough play for now, Xiao Bai get her down and see if she is 
alright, Isabella you don't mind such simple words, You are an adult. 

Shapira you come with me, I need help in the kitchen, I am hungry now, Lend me paw 
to help in cooking." 

Alex saw that Isabella was actually getting angry and decided to put a stop to this 
fiasco. It was fun when it was lasted but now it gets out of hand. 

So Alex decided to drop it, White also reminded him that he too didn't have didn't have 
lunch or dinner. 

He was hungry now and he can also guess others are too, So after asking Xiao Bai to 
get White down as it is really not good for health to stay like that for long. 

Alex marched towards the kitchen accompanied by Shapira and followed him in the 
kitchen swinging her fluffy long white tail side by side happily. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??. ) 

Chapter 293 291. Absolute Food Protection 

"I might have enough ingredients, Now the question is what to cook." 

Alex said as he looked at the ingredients in front of him. 



He and Shapira raided his fridge and pulled out everything inside of it. There were eggs, 
bread, sauces, vegetables and meats.  

This all shoulresuppl-stocked by someone else for him, Which again the benefits of 
dating the woman who donate most money to the school. 

He didn't have to worry about the expiration of these products, All he needed to figure 
out what to cook. 

There are nearly infinite dishes in his mind but some of them want some rare 
ingredients, some need lots of time for cooking some, some need a way for ingredients 
and some even do not recommend eating fearing they might lose their mind after eating 
it. 

Alex rejected all those things and yet there were still thousands if not millions of dishes 
still remaining in his mind making him confused on what to choose. 

"What do you say, Shapira? What should we cook?" 

Seeing he wasn't able to decide, He looked at Shapira who looked at him diligently with 
a tilted head trying to guess what he was doing. 

She looked super cute, Her icy blue eyes locked on to him filled with curiosity, Alex 
couldn't help but stretch his hand out to rub her head. 

His hand glided over her smooth silky white fur as he asked her a question giving her a 
chance to choose the food. 

She deserves it. It's her reward for being a good girl. 

*Purr* *Purr* *Roar* 

Shapira didn't understand why she was being spoiled like this but she was not the one 
to care about the reason. 

All she knew was that right now the touch of Alex is smoothing and comfortable, She 
enjoying every second of it purring roaring with his touch. 

These roars were not the warning ones which petrify the being who is hunted by her but 
rather the playful ones her kind is known for. 

"Roar* 

Shapira finally realized he asked her question and answered him with her soft roar 
looking up at him while rubbing her whiskers. 



"I know you want a meat dish but what kind? Do you want a spicy one or just a tender 
plain salt and pepper one?" 

Alex was somehow able to understand what she was trying to say, So he answered her 
out of instinct. 

Though after answering her Alex also wonders why he is able to understand her but 
then he understands what might be the reason. 

He has SSS-Rank Beastmaster physique, The body that was created for the beast at 
beast taming and mastering them and their skills. 

So the ability to understand each other is a must. 

This way master and beast can understand each other on a fundamental level without a 
barrier of language, and because he can break and add any other beast regardless of if 
they are wild or contacted to him, Hence why he is easily able to understand her. 

And because he understood her, He knew she was asking him to cook her a meat dish. 

He was amused by how innocent and simple minded she is. Well she is a beast that is 
given but still its cute to see such an intelligent animal being this simple. 

*Tilt* 

Shaipra just tilted her head looking at him as if wanting to ask what's the difference? 
Anything he would cook she would eat it. 

If her personal cook saw how docile Shapira being in front of Alex ready to eat anything, 
She would have ready to throw hands. 

This tigress makes that poor woman's life a living hell as Shapira refuses to eat 
whatever she puts in front of her. 

That poor thing had to make around 20 to 30 dishes daily before Shapira dared to eat 
anything. 

This white fluff ball is quite a picky eater. It's only in front of Alex she acts like such an 
innocent being. 

Who knows that poor cook is upto, She might have cooked many dishes before and 
Shapira refused to eat any. 

So she might have gone to find even more special things to cook 

"Okay, I would do something best for you." 



Alex saw she didn't have any preference, Unknown to her usual eating preference he 
genuinely thought she is not picky eater and can eat anything. 

So he decided he would cook something best for her, This girl is too cute to deny her 
anything less. 

'System, can you buy two sets of high quality beast meat best suited for two of my 
tigresses?' 

Alex looks around and finds out that the only meat he has it of chicken. He knows that 
even if it is of chicken with his god level cooking added on to it, It would be a legendary 
delicacy for them. 

But he decided to do something special, He still felt bad for yelling at her before just 
because she was a little too excited. 

Though he still would do it as it is necessary for her to learn but that didn't mean he 
didn't feel bad. 

So this is his way to make up with her. Of course he had to cook two or that jealous 
spirit would throw a tantrum. 

[Ding! Host, are you sure you want to cook for them using system ingredients that are 
high (tier 1) quality? 

You can buy it for 1000 RP (Raider Points) each and if you brought it for other women 
too it you would receive a 20% off discount. 

But be warned, System sells very very high quality ingredients by the standards of this 
world, which may make anyone who ate it addicted to it. It's still recommended to buy 
permanent protection worth 100,000 RP against it. 

It would make sure that anyone who ate would get all the benefits and joy of eating the 
food made from such high quality products without having any negative drawback like 
being super addicted to it to the degree that nothing else can be eaten afterwards.] 

System was heard the words of Alex and quickly jump out and recommended Alex the 
best way to do what he wanted to do. 

By the system standers the high quality is not that good but for current Alex, It's the 
highest quality product he can feed to people around him without any worry. 

Hence why super low pricing of just 1000RP, If Alex really wanted to buy the high 
quality protection according to systems standards he didn't know what its price would be 
nor he had courage to take a sneak peak. 



'Food protection huh, Is it like an insurance policy or something?' 

Alex know about the danger of feeding food that is made from system graded 
ingredients, Even if it is not ranked, There is still high chance it would make others 
addicted especially if cooked using his god level skill. 

So he prepared to lower his skill to cook the beast meat for two of them but then the 
system recommended the protection for 100,000 RP. 

It was a huge amount for him before but not to the current him who has around 50 
million RP right now and it was still increasing steadily all thanks to his song still 
circulating around the internet like wildfire. 

It's just he wants to know about how this protection works. Is it like his Harem Halo that 
provides absolute protection or just as best as it can. 

He needs to know this information before doing anything as there is risk making 
someone brain dead because of his cooking. 

Yeah his skills are good at it. Keep in mind the simple song of his can be used as a 
deadly weapon like a deadly lullaby. 

So he didn't want to take any chances at all. 

[Ding! Host system did not sell insurance policies, It is not a scammer, It does honest 
business. 

100,000 RP would be enough to make sure no one suffers from your cooking if you use 
system tier 1 ingredients with your God-level cooking. 

But if the host is still feel uneasy, It's recommended to buy absolute protection worth 5 
Million RP that grants protection regardless of ingredients or your skill level. 

That would also make sure anything you cook, meaning anything at all, would not harm 
in any shape or form to its consumer unless when you want it to. 

And seeing this is the first time host buying the food related skill, Host would receive 
48% privilege discount making your final price to 2.6 Million. 

System recommends buying this as this way the host doesn't have to hold back to show 
off your cooking skills worrying about others' mental/physical health 

But 100,000 RP is also not a bad option for current conditions but you may later need to 
buy absolute protection if you want to increase the level of ingredients or cooking.] 



System voice once again rang in his mind, It can be seen that the system didn't like one 
bit to be compared with insurance companies selling policies. 

System is cheeky with its promoting products and even gives extra discounts to sell 
products but comparing it to insurance companies is going too far. 

It was quick to draw a line in between them, Making sure to tell Alex what it sold is 
nothing fraudulent. 

Alex just ignored the small systems sophistry and put his focus on system 
recommendation. 

He was fell into thinking, 2.6 million RP is indeed way bigger then 100,000 RP but 
formal is absolute protection later does not. 

Though later is said to be enough for current circumstances, and price is also 
understandable for its uses. 

'Fuck it, Buy the absolute protection and cooking ingredients I asked, Yes also add 
woman's quote, make sure it would be enough for all of them, I didn't want to start food 
war.' 

Alex shook his head as he looked at total of his RP, Which right now become 51 Million, 
Its seems the growth rate of his RP income rather than decreasing was increasing as 
more and more people found out about his song. 

So Alex decided to buy it. He was sure he would get his spent RP back in half of the 
day. 

[Ding! 2,606,400 Raider Points are deducted… 

Absolute food protection is added… 

All necessary ingredients are transferred to the inventory… 

(Note : If host wants to harm someone, Host just has to think about the specific person 
while cooking, Protection would not be applied on that person for that meal or if host 
wants, Host can anytime use system to blacklist specific person for indefinitely.)] 

System voice fell and all Alex needed transferred to him. 

"It's time to cook." 

Alex said as he picked up a knife. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ?? .) 



Chapter 294 292. Broken System 

Alex stood in the kitchen holding knife, After which he flick in hand pulling the 
vegetables out of system inventory putting on the chopping board. 

Then a knife in his hand lifted and started chopping all types of vegetables he brought 
from the system. 

Though the quality of these veggies were still lower in the eyes of Alex's who possess 
God-Level Cooking, It has heaven and earth compared to the ingredients he has at 
home. 

Heck some may even consider these veggies as legendary spiritual herbs as how high 
quality they were.  

While chopping them Alex can feel the spiritual powers contained in them, So anyone 
who misunderstood them as herb would not be wrong. 

The moment Alex took them out, The whole kitchen filled with the tempting scent 
released from it. 

And as he was cutting them, The scent was just getting stronger along with the 
concentration of the spiritual power in the kitchen. 

Thankfully the system has a heart and makes sure this ambrosia scent would not leak 
outside of this kitchen. 

Because Alex was not sure how those women would react when they smell this scent, 
May they even be able to hold back their hunger? or just start chewing on raw veggies. 

Just look at Shapira. Even though she is a tigress, she is looking at these veggies with a 
lustful look, wanting to eat them, She was in this state even after food protection 
affecting her, If it was not there who knows what might happen. 

Not to mention if this smelled by some powerhouse as they said to have quite a strong 
five senses. 

They might mistake this scent as some treasure being born in the world and come 
rushing in here. 

The last thing Alex wants right now is to invite more trouble in his house. He already has 
enough. 

He just wanted to enjoy himself right now without worrying about unexpected problems. 

"Hope trouble won't come knocking tonight." 



Alex prayed in his mind, He really tried today not physically but mostly mentally. 

His physique is reinforced too much that he might not even feel tired even after working 
non-stop for months. 

But his mind didn't receive any such reinforcement, making him feel exhausted as he 
used his brain a lot, even though his body was full of energy. 

"Shapira go put these things back in the fridge, We are not going to need them." 

Alex saw how cluttered the countertop was as he previously pulled out all the things 
from the fridge with the intention of deciding to choose what he wanted to cook. 

But now that he brought the stuff from the system, He did not need these things, They 
were just taking up space on the countertop. 

He was busy cooking, So he asked Shapira to do it. He indeed brought her here to help 
him cook. 

So he asked her to clean it while he chopping vegetables in different shapes and forms. 

*Nod* 

Shapira just nodded to Alex as she stood up putting her two huge paws on the 
countertop as support and picked up a bread packet in her also not so small deadly 
jaws. 

After which she got down and quickly moved towards the fridge, She tried to open the 
door with her paws. 

But it did not open up, frustrated she pulled out her claws about to slash it open. 

"Hey hey hey hey wait wait! I opened it for you, Chills out girl." 

When Alex saw what this little girl upto, got a small heart attack, He quickly jumped out 
stopping her in action. 

This fridge was a gift to him by himself before, And it is working fine. He didn't want that 
to get destroyed and needed to buy a new one. 

He in swift motion opens the door, Then he stands beside it indicating her to now put it 
in. 

Shapira looked at Alex then at the fridge, After slight embarrassment she huffed and 
quickly put the bread in the fridge. 



Alex also made sure to put the fridge in the cleaning mode and left the door open. He 
didn't want to lose his fridge to this lady with a temper. 

He then came back and started chopping while keeping an eye on Shapira as she was 
putting all the stuff back in it one by one. 

Though there was no good stacking of stuff but it she was still able to put these 
ingredients in order to the best of her capacity. 

It was rather funny to see her handling an egg tray in her mouth then trying to put it 
back in the fridge just using her mouth. 

Alex was lost in looking at her weird antics as put things in it using different tactics for 
different things. 

Thankfully he possesses God-Level cooking, Even if he is blindfolded or even if 
becomes blind, He can still cut with the same accuracy without any problems at all. 

"Finally done with these veggies, Not its meat turn." 

Alex finally finished cutting the veggies in the shape and form he wanted to. 

Then he decided to prepare meat, Though by normal logic it should be meat be 
prepared early and left to marinate as he worked on the vegetables. 

But this meat is different. By the information in his mind, Beast meat is already tender 
and flavourful, Which did not need to be marinated, doing so just going to ruin its 
inherent favor. 

Though it depends on the quality of the meat for this statement to be true but given its 
system brought product, There should be no issue with it. 

'System takes out the meat and grass meant for these tigresses first.' 

Alex said to the system and pulled out a box containing meat and also soft grass. 

This soft grass is to help to add extra texture and taste to the meat, It is also supposed 
to help them with stomach issues. 

"Let's see what kinda beast meat we are dealing with." 

Alex after putting the soft grass aside brought his attention to the box containing beast 
meat. 

He didn't know what material this box was made from as it was strange, giving both a 
cold and warm feeling. 



It was hard but also somehow felt malleable, The feeling was all over the place giving 
mixed signals. 

This made Alex even more excited to see what kinda beast meat would be contained in 
this strange box. 

As he just asked the system to buy the best suitable meat for them, So even he didn't 
know what type of meat in it. 

So he just reached out trying to open the box, For to open it he needed to first twist it 
open after which he needed to pull up like a cork with force. 

Alex felt it was a weird way to seal the box but he did not get time to wonder about that 
anymore as he felt the burst of spiritual energy released out of the box. 

The whole room instantly filled with terrifying pressure, Even if there was no killing intent 
or any type of intent whatsoever it put invisible pressure in the kitchen. 

Shapira who was playing with her tail hoping for Alex to quickly finish up making food for 
her quickly raised her fluffy ears in alert. 

Her body followed suit as it also stood instantly in defensive position, Her icy blue eyes 
scanned the room and were quickly locked on to the box in the hands of Alex. 

Suddenly her eyes become wide open in terror as her limbs started to tremble. 

She stood still like petrified, just looking at the box in shock and then Alex like she saw a 
ghost. 

Alex here was also no less surprised, This is just the meat of a beast he was holding but 
it was enough for him to make it harder to breathe. 

It was still because of the system restriction and his reinforced physique that he was 
able to resist the overbearing aura this meat releasing. 

Even after the death of this beast it has the enough strength to crush mortal lives. 

"S- Rank." 

Alex inherently understand the rank of the beast without even using Eye of Truth or 
system support. 

It has to be an S-Rank beast, Only they can have such an overbearing nature even in 
death that they release such pressure. 

[Ding! Host this is meat from an S-Rank beast named "Heavenly Boar" 



These beast are belongs to the boar fraction known for their extraordinary nutritious 
meat for the other beast. 

(Note : Its not recommend for huwoman consumption as they are not capable of 
absorbing all the benefits from the meat, Beast of S-Rank or under are recommended to 
eat it.)] 

System, still like a helpful friend, came out and told the information about the meat Alex 
had like it was not that big of deal at all. 

'This S-Rank meat was in system eyes just tier 1 quality sold for just 1000 RP? How 
strong is this system?' 

Alex when he got the confirmation about the meat he holding was really S-Rank beast 
meat, He was shocked. 

Not because the system pulled out S-Rank meat, System pulled out Xiao Bai before, 
And there are still there more eggs waiting to hatch. 

Rather from the fact that in systems eyes the S-Rank meat that can be said impossible 
to get it seeing beast are stronger then huwomen is just a bearly qualified to be ranked 
in tier. 

It sold to him for just 1000 RP that too he got discount on. 

He already knew how broken his system was but this was still a hard pill to swallow for 
him. 

'Wait? If this is S-Rank meat then didn't our part of meat also-?' 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??.) 

Chapter 295 293. System Learning 

[Ding! Host the meat prepared for consumption of the woman is also from the S-Rank 
beast called "Golden Chicken". 

This beast is highly beneficial for the females and consider as a best supplement for 
any female S-Rank or under. 

Just keep in mind the host, The side effect of eating this meat is a surge of sexual drive 
right after consumption because of the increase in Yin energy in their body. 

Extra Yin energy acts as aphrodisiacs in females just like how Yang energy does in 
males. 



So it's suggested to be prepared for the onslaught as they would lose their senses to 
lust and would come at you like hungry cougars. 

(Note : Its not recommended for male consumption, There would not be any side effects 
but it would be considered waste as male body would just throw excess Yin energy out 
of the body, negatively infecting others in proximate.] 

System answered Alex in its usual nonchalant way as it was something very casual it 
just mentioned. 

Alex was just stunting here, Because he checked the whole discrimination of these 
beasts and as it turns out they were beasts that not even exist in the current period of 
time.  

S-Rank is just their cultivation level not their actual rank, Though the system didn't 
mention it, maybe in its eyes its not worthy to give it. 

But Alex has a hunch that these beast were definitely higher grade then S-Rank like 
how Xiao Bai is. 

'With this system, Why am I still playing passive? Can go and crush those damn 
protagonists.' 

Alex couldn't help but think as he once again reminded the powers of the system. 

It seems that the system did not have an upper limit, as long as he has RP to play, 
System has things to sell. 

System did said he can buy anything from it as long as he has equivalent RP to pay but 
Alex never thought it would be this cheap to buy things. 

S-Rank is a top powerhouse of the current world. It's a ceiling that would be broken after 
the protagonist becomes capable of fighting S-Rank. 

Until then they are the gods of the world, On wimp they can create or destroy big cities, 
Can even get a glimpse of the laws. 

Such a revered rank that unattainable dreams of many to be, The one that even 
worshiped is many places such as sects and guilds. 

Right now he was holding the meat of beast- That sound bad. 

What he meant was that the S-Rank which is considered unbeatable and just before in 
recent times was unkillable until Nobles showed up. 

He, as an F-Rank, was about to cook them, Its weird feeling and is flex. 



'Wait?! How can I able to explain to sister from where did I got 2 types of S-Rank beasts 
mea-*Ahem*....*Sigh* there is no better word than meat.' 

Alex after initial shock comes back to his usual anxious paranoid state as he thought 
about Amara. 

Others may not be able to detect it as an S-Rank mea-flesh…forget it, S-Rank meat. 

And even if they did, He is sure that he can make up any quick excuse to feed their 
curiosity. 

But Amara is different, She is full fledged S-Rank. The moment this meat goes out of 
this kitchen, She would detect it instantly just from the aura it is releasing. 

He nor Shapira are not S-Rank but they were able to figure out it is an S-Rank beast 
meat, It would not be a problem for Amara to detect it too. 

[Ding! Host don't worry, The only reason why you two are able to sense the rank of this 
meat is because you are host of the system, System can not and would not be able to 
restrict the sense of host. 

Unless it's a negative sensation like pain or trauma, Or in case host specifically asked 
for it, Other then that host receives all raw information. 

As for Shapira, She is considered a pet by the system. The pet host has trust in her and 
she also passed the loyalty requirements needed for the system, So she too was able to 
sense it. 

If the host wants to block Shapira from getting this information, Host can put her into the 
blacklist temporarily or indefinitely to prevent sending her information. 

(Note : System only able to block these information of stuff thats is related to, brought 
from or rewarded from system for free. 

Host needs to pay to block information about non-system things, Price would depend on 
the thing and from whom the information has to be blocked.)] 

[Ding! Host also didn't have to worry about Amara, The System already made sure 
others were not able to sense the rank of the beast 

System ask for forgiveness for the miscalculation in its part allowing Shapira to sense 
the sensitive information. 

Host is compensated with a 20% off coupon, Its suggested to use this coupon for the 
big purchase to save more RP. 



System once again apologies for the mistake and make sure it would never happen 
again.] 

System initiated the two notifications, In one it gave the reason of why Shapira and he 
were able to feel the rank. 

Though he did not ask but system is known for making decisions for Alex that benefit 
him. 

It's the trait of the host friendly system of this, the System considered this as its mistake 
and was quick to apologize and compensate him. 

Alex actually didn't even think about the Shapira part as in his eyes it's really not a big 
deal. 

He was just concerned about Amara but as it turned out the system already restricted 
that others would not be able to sense the rank of the beast. 

So there was no issue regarding it in his mind anymore. 

But then he heard about the system compensation for it, and was stunned. 

Not that it gave him the coupon for it, System is lavish like giving a discount here and 
there at every turn. 

From the fact that it sounded like some big corporate business made a mistake and 
decided to use this opportunity to increase their sales. 

How? Simple, Giving a discount coupon means you have to do a transaction from the 
same place once more giving more business. 

Because from a psychological point of view, If we didn't use the coupon, It feels like a 
waste of money even though using coupons means spending money on something you 
don't need. 

That's how they get you. As an apology for causing you problems they want you to 
spend more money in their shop, While making it look like you are ripping them off. 

System somehow learned this tactic from who knows where. 

Like now this coupon, though there is no expiration date is still a huge temptation to use 
it, And having RP in millions did not help at all. 

Even though Alex knows it's his system and it would not rip him off, Anything he buys 
would be more than worthy of the priceits. 



But this is not the thing that made Alex think this deep, It's the new system change of it. 

First the infomercial style, the description of beast space and now this? Alex is afraid 
next time the system starts notifying him like a call regarding extending cars insurance 
warranty. 

*Roar* 

Alex was thinking deep when Shapira's roar pulled him out of his thought, He saw the 
little cat was looking at him with lust in her eyes. 

Of course that lust is not the sexual one but the lust to eat the meat in his hand. 

Okay no matter how many times that being said, Its sound weird, Fuck you internet for 
corrupting innocent minds. 

"Shapira, I know you are hungry but I yet to cook this, I would be done in no time. Until 
then go outside and set the table, for me, okay?" 

Alex rubbed the head of Shapira lovingly as he told her to wait and go outside to set a 
table for all of them. 

He also felt this tigress is funny, The one moment she was wary of the S-Rank meat in 
hands of Alex, utterly terrified of it sensing that raw overbearing aura. 

But the moment when she figured out it was not some powerful S-Rank beast but the 
tasty juicy meat as the scent of it entered in her nostrils telling her what Alex was 
holding was food. 

That too food that she inherently has no resistance towards its temptation towards it. 

Alex love using her cute antics. She is a big white fluff ball with sentience. 

*Roar* 

Shapira, hearing Alex needed time to cook it, was disappointed, Her heart urging her to 
eat that meat as she can feel it is very beneficial for her making her restless. 

But the moment she heard Alex would cook it soon, and asked to set the table, She 
quickly roared accepting her task. 

She quickly looked around searching for the plate and other stuff, And she quickly found 
it. 

She in a single jump reached the plates but then got confused thinking of how can she 
could carry these plates? 



Her mouth is big, it's not capable of holding that many plates plus there is a hygiene 
issue. 

She thought for a second while Alex paying attention to her learning from his previous 
experience. 

He knew she was about to do something drastic and was ready for it to stop her in time. 

*Roar.* 

Shapira was thinking when she had the light bulb moment. 

She raised her huge head and roared. Just as she did that, Plates quickly started to 
move and became airborne. 

Then those plates followed Shapira as she made her way out of the kitchen. 

While Alex just looked at her with wide eyes. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??.) 

Chapter 296 294. It's Cooking Time 

"What the-!? She has psychic powers? Then why she wanted to claws my fucking 
fridge?" 

Alex finally snapped as things sank in his mind about what just happened. 

It's obvious that Shapira has the psychic rare subcategory non-elemental powers. 

The sub category non-elements are like any normal ones, for example fire, water, air 
and earth. 

Like his Ekon of fire superpower, the corresponding base element is fire. 

There are sub category elemental powers of these four base elements like ice, lava etc. 

Alia who has the Ice queen superpower belongs to this category, As her power lay 
towards ice more then water. 

Then there are non-elemental superpowers, These ones are mostly weaker in 
comparison with the elemental superpowers but there are few exceptions. 

This type is very wide but mostly filled with auxiliary type superpowers, Which mostly 
are useless as compared to other same rank combat type ones. 



But there are also quite strong people which has these non-elemental type 
superpowers, Like there are rare non-elements too like space, time, death, soul and of 
course psychic ones are few. 

Just look at Rebecca, She has time related superpowers, Using which even as the B-
rank warrior she is able to pause the time of the whole place around the entrance of the 
hospital. 

Yes she is able to do that, It also has to do with her having "The One'' bloodline but it 
also shows that her awakening time related supower is because of her lineage. 

Of course there is also Belladonna, Who has to be in possession of Death related 
superpower, Necromancy of hers can be only justified from it. 

There are more such powerful people around him with non-elemental superpowers, So 
Alex is familiar with them already. 

So it was not a shock to him that Shapira has psychic related powers, After all she is a 
beast especially selected for Amara, The one in the enons genius. 

So there would no doubt Shapira's bloodline and qualifications would be high enough to 
be worthy of her. 

Alex was surprised by that. If Shapira has this type of superpower then why did she not 
just open the fridge door and then trying to claw her way in? 

It's not like she just awakened this element. It's possible to awaken a new element. It's a 
rare and dangerous thing to happen but it is possible but when some awaken that there 
would be a lot of commotion around it. 

So it's impossible for her to awaken this psychic ability right now. 

"I am surrounded by idiots." 

Alex, after cutting off the possibilities, comes to the conclusion that it's more than likely, 
This birdbrain cat forgot that she has those powers in the first place. 

So of course the best solution that had come to her mind should be to claw her way in, 
She is a cat after all, Destruction of property is in her blood. 

"Forget about it, it's cooking time." 

Alex stopped thinking about the big cat and put his attention on the all the ingredients 
he prepared for to cook it. 



He quickly pulled out all the utensils that he needs and just put them on the counter top 
in order that he needed it to be cooked and time it would need. 

Why for why on the counter top and not directly on the gas stove? It's quite simple 
really. 

The gas stove is not worthy to cook these ingredients at all. It's not even about the gas 
stove itself but the flames in it. 

The temperature of the gas stove is not even high enough to warm these things, much 
less actually be able to cook it. 

After all, All these ingredients have spiritual energy contained in it, Which make them 
different from normal ingredients putting it into the category of spiritual medicines. 

Thankfully he has the best fire related superpower there is, Which more than qualified to 
cook it. 

Even though he didn't actually use his superpower enough to in sense be familiar with it 
but that is not something Alex has to worry about. 

This superpower was granted to him by the system using Sex-copy, Which fully 
integrated this superpower in his body. 

Using his power for his come to him easy as breathing, He didn't need to learn how to 
do it, He just know begin with what and how things work. 

Plus there is his God-Level cooking, As God-Level cooking is law itself, Even Alex didn't 
have the this super control over his superpower. He was still able to use it without any 
worry as long as was using it for cooking. 

Or he is even able to use normal flames but that though still made the same tasteful 
food, It would have made it hard for absorbing nutritions in the body. 

But already has the necessary things, So why would he not use it? Heck he even ready 
to use his God-Level acting while cooking to add extra laws in it. 

This would make cooking even more tasty and potent. Before he dared not to do this as 
these people were not able to handle his cooking at all. 

But right now he has the absolute protection, Meaning he can go all out, Can do all 
experiments he wants to do and see how they react. 

Of course he is still holding back as he knows slowly increasing the level is the key to 
make them comfortable with it as even with protection, Its not hurt to have precautions. 



*Close eyes* *Deep breath* * Exhale* 

Alex first closed his eyes, His god level acting and cooking was provoked to 
intermediate level. 

His acting ability gave him the persona of the best in the world cook, Who always cooks 
the perfect dish, And his cooking one make sure he would make the best dish in 
existence as it is the law. 

*Snap* *Brust* *Flame* Flick* 

Alex the next moment shot open his eyes as flame dance in his deep dark ebony pupils 
igniting giving them cold glare. 

His face was serious like a commander leading his battalion in the war. In a sense he 
indeed leading his battalion, his ingredients in the war. 

He is responsible for them. They put trust in him to make the best dish. If he made a 
mistake then he would betray their trust as they want to taste good regardless of how he 
does it, That is their endgame. 

All the joking and sarcastic look was along with the smug smile onnAlex face vanished. 

If some woman saw him like that, Even if they say they do not like femboy, They would 
have soiled their pants at this second. 

Alex, unlike normal times, would have ignored them as all he was thinking about was to 
make the best dish possible, Of course from the restriction of intermediate skill level for 
safety. 

He flick his hand and the multiple thin strand of flames flew out of Alex's hand quickly 
surrounded surrounded utensils and ingredients. 

Even though these flames said to be strong enough to burn the concept itself by Amara, 
Did not even char the naked ingredients, It just lifted them up separately on top of the 
different utensils.  

While the flames surrounding utensils were warming them up to keep it in ideal 
temperature to put the ingredients after they were tenderize in the flames. 

Alex casually moving the flames here and there like he was massaging the ingredients. 
It looked so graceful as ingredients also flew with it. 

He started burning the ingredients' complex bonds and refining the spiritual powers in it 
to allow proper cooking. 



He then casually used his other hand and filled one pot with the water, While his other 
hand continue to make complex maneuvers like it was nothing. 

In a matter of seconds the water he just put started boiling, Alex looked at the 
ingredients warped in the flames looking to see if they were ready. 

Small ingredients like onion and tomato were first to be refined and so Alex just put 
them in the boiling water pot. 

Though it said refining but Alex meticulously refined the spiritual energy in these 
ingredients without doing slightest bit of damage to the shape, form or texture of it. 

Even when he broke the complex molecular bounds, He did it with such sharpness that 
even the ingredients themselves did not know their main structure was broken. 

This is a way to make sure they do not taste or feel different while eating but it would be 
easy for the body to digest and extract the nutritions from the food. 

This uncanny thing is only possible because his God-Level skill is law itself, Anything 
related to the food, Alex has full control over while cooking it. 

Alex did not even think of how big of a thing he just did, He just put the rest of 
vegetables casually into the boiling water to fry, steam and cook them at once. 

How? Don't question it, Anything Alex will to happen about dishes while cooking would 
happen no matter how absurd it sounds to a laywoman. 

After all it is a God-Level skill, It has to be worthy of god in its name. 

"Now it's your turn." 

Alex then put his attention on the Heavenly Boar meat in the box. 

He thought for a second before leading his flames towards it, completely engulfing it in 
the flames. 

Others might think Alex wanted to burn and turned into ashes seeing how blazing hot 
these flames were compared to the other ones. 

But he had total control over his flames as he knew what he was doing. 

To no one's surprise, When flames lead over the other pan and subside, Ahes of meat 
have fallen in- Wait what? 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??.) 



Chapter 297 295. Beast Spirit 

As it turns out, The intense flames of Alex's superpower burn the boar meat pieces into 
ashes, Which fallen in the pot. 

Strangely seeing this failed way of cooking, Alex was not least bit surprised, rather it 
looked like he turned those pieces into ashes on purpose. 

"Humm…Should this be enough or it needs to be cooked more for them to digest?" 

Alex looked at the ashes of the formal legendary pieces of meat, wondering about if he 
should cook it more as if there is anything left there for to cook. 

In the pot there were pure dry ashes. There is not even a single trace of moisture in 
them, And Alex is thinking about whether he should cook or not. 

It is a ridiculous thing to say but Alex still thought that it needed to cook more, And so he 
once again engulfed it in his intense flames. 

These flames were even more fierce than the previous one. The moment they came 
into existence, They instantly increased the room temperature to 20 to 30 degrees. 

If he did not have immunity to the heat and fire now, He would have passed out 
because of heatstroke any second. 

It was even questionable thing is that to see, Even though temperature increased so 
rapidly, There was no effect of it in the surroundings. 

Even if there are plastic things present in the room, Which are not suited for such a high 
temperature, they do not even become malleable, much less started to mealting. 

Even the pot itself did not heat up, Even though that flame was dancing in it cooking 
ashe- Ahem, Cooking pieces of meat or at least what's left of it. 

This goes on just for few seconds but it felt like an eternity passed as such a destructive 
force was being used for cooking. 

It looked stupid thing to do this as there was literally nothing but ashes in the pot, Not 
even the water to make some sense of it. 

But soon all questions were answered as just after the moment flames subside lowering 
their temperature, a blue energy strand flew out of the pot and landed on the floor. 

Just as that happen, It quickly started to grow and started to take a shape rapidly in to 
the figure of wold boar. 



The boar, Whose size was so big it was touching the ceiling of his kitchen as it stopped 
growing. 

Alex looked at the 8ft tall, 6ft wide, Seeing this Alex came to the conclusion that this 
beast only stopped increasing its height because of the restriction of ceiling, If not it 
would have been way bigger than its current dimension. 

*Grunt* 

The wild boar locked onto Alex and grunted, rubbing its front legs hoofs on the ground, 
clearly showing its intention to ram into Alex with its full speed. 

Alex on the other hand, Just casually looking at such a supernatural phenomenon as it's 
obvious he was looking at the spirit without even a speck of worry. 

This is the same Alex who has an unreasonable fear of ghosts and is said to be racist 
towards ghosts by his legal fiancee Belladonna. 

He is right now like a completely different person, As he stood in front of the beast about 
to attack with straight back and sharp eyes. 

*High-pitch Squealing* *Scream* 

That boar took Alex unfazed look as an insult and lunged towards him at full power. 

Alex just stood there and let it be but if someone looked closely at his outline they would 
have found out that it was fluctuating around it like it happens with hot air around 
extreme temperatures. 

That blue boar reached Alex in a fraction of second and would crush Alex with its 
immense strength any moment now. 

Still Alex did not move an inch and just allowed it with still unfazed looking on his face 
like he did something like this million times already. 

That beast like a wild boar was just kore enraged by his action, It decided to be more 
deadly in that fraction of time to tilt its head, so its tusks would tear Alex apart. 

*Boom* 

Boar landed behind Alex with a confused look on its face as it turned around to see 
unharmed Alex. 

"S-Rank or not, It's just a residual spirit remaining in that piece of meat. It did not have a 
physical body making it intangible, And because lack of cultivation it can't cause harm to 
me, A person using my flames as an invisible barrier." 



Alex did not even pay attention to the confused boar spirit looking confusedly at him 
contemplating whether or not to try attacking him once again. 

"Poor thing, It's just an afterthought that remains in it. Did not have any thought process 
nor have any memories, Just a light construct running around with its pure instincts in 
the last ditch effort of to survive, Even though its fate already been sealed long ago, It 
just did not know it. 

Anyway, Wouldn't using this spirit would make meat even more tasty? It would add the 
wild fierce taste of the jungle and mighty beast this meat was lacking." 

Alex rubbing his chin as he stared up and down at the boar who once again jumped at 
Alex and was just passing through him. 

Or rather it passed through Alex as it was nothing but a light construct of the spirit of 
Heavenly Boar. 

It did not have any thoughts or feelings, All it has a instincts to protect itself, Which 
maybe picked from its last moment of struggle for survival. 

Alex even felt slightly bad for it, After all it didn't know anything but just an being trying to 
survive from being eaten. 

Sadly the struggle is too late as it did not make it, Just this spirit did not know it yet. 

Its just after the next second, The mind of Alex who was using his God-Level acting and 
cooking couldn't help but to think of the idea of using this spirit in the dish. 

He already there would spirit in the meat, Well kinda know as God-level cooking has 
that information stored in it but its like an internet. 

It has all the information he needs but it would only be available when he asked or 
needed not 24 hours in front of his face, remaining him and bothering him. 

So he did not think of using the spirit in the meat to use it in the dish to add extra colors 
to it. 

He knows adding the spirit like this in the cooking would push the one more grade of the 
dish and even add the unique taste to the dish in it. 

That boar was keep jumping left and right of Alex trying to He knows adding the spirit 
like this in the cooking would push the one more grade of the dish and even add the 
unique taste harm him but each time it was just passing through him. 



And it didn't even notice or it did noy capable of noticing that each time he was passing 
through him, Its size was decreasing as its light blue colour was also becoming darker 
and darker. 

"But I can't use this resentment filled one. It would ruin the taste, I want a satisfied one 
who willingly becomes part of the dish to the unique taste I am looking for." 

Alex said to himself aloud as that boar was preparing itself to be concentrated enough 
to add the amount of touch to it. 

But then he saw the one fault here, The emotions of spirit also matter, The secret 
ingredient of love saying not just come out of nowhere.  

Depending on the taste of the dish and occasion, One needs meat from an animal 
which has the same emotions while they were alive. 

As those emotions would enter in the meat changing the taste of meat, Alex did not 
consider this as meat was from the system and so it was top quality meat with suitable 
emotions he wanted to be in it. 

But now that there is a spirit, He also wants that to be in it to add taste. 

"Wait!? Why am I even worried about it? I have god-level singing skill, Controlling 
emotions is my thing." 

Alex was wondering about what to do and then he slapped his forehead as he just 
remembered that he has the God-level singing, Which is best for manipulating emotions 
on his will. 

Not only that, God-Level singing directly affects the soul of the listener, So for the spirit 
like these it is a lethal tool to be used. 

"*Ahem* Hey wanna hear a song?" 

Alex turned around to look at the boar who immediately stopped as from instincts it 
knew not to attack when a strong opponent like Alex was looking at them. 

It goes into full alert mode looking at him with a wary look or at least it mimicking such a 
look. 

It was not sure why Alex stopped, So it was prepared for the attack of his with full on 
defense mode. 

It then heard Alex say something but it did not have any mind to process about what he 
was talking about, So it just thought he was preparing for the attack. 



*Scream* 

It looked at Alex and screamed on top of its lungs towards Alex, likely warning him to 
stay away from it. 

"Hey hey, I get, Would sing for you, Geez you don't have to force me this way just ask, 
You are a key ingredient in my dish, I would be happy to fulfill your wish." 

Alex when heard the loud scream of boar, He got more excited and happily accepted 
such a small request for him to sing. 

He tried to calm it down and clear his throat ready to sing. 

The wild boar just looked confusedly at Alex not knowing what he wanted to do but it 
was fear as it by instinct felt anything Alex wanted to do is not going to be nice for him. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??.) 

Chapter 298 296. Relam Of Alchemy 

Alex just looked at the vary beast spirit, cleared his throat and then parted his lips. 

Just as he did that, the enchanting melody filled the whole room, Spirit which was very if 
Alex instantly calmed down lost in the enchanting melody he created. 

That spirit rooted in the spot as vivid vision started to appear in front of the beast spirit 
as the melodious voice of Alex like a sweet nectar was hitting its soul or at least what's 
left of it. 

The vision was of the small boarlet running in the open wide jungle without care in its 
mind along with its herd along with their father. 

The boars were playing, eating and enjoying life to the fullest taking advantage of their 
ignorant youthfulness. 

The beast spirit was quickly lost into the vision, memorizing the events which were 
unfolding as if it were living it, not just watching it. 

The youthfulself of the boarlet was happy and was growing into the big healthy boar 
under the meticulous care of its father. 

Soon the boarlet grow into the teen age, The herd grew apart as its siblings and such 
were also going to find their own way. 

The father who was protecting it was also leaving them to grow and be themselves, It 
just taught them and protected them in their infancy. 



Now he has to defend himself on its own, For which the boar was both afraid and was 
excited for its new journey. 

It quickly learned the new ways of its life and was adjusting to the new world of its. 

In such a journey, It encountered every unique scent and so by instinct it followed it. 

When it reached the destination and found out that the one that released such an 
irresistible scent was a strange looking glowing flower. 

It couldn't able to resist the urge seeing such a tasty looking flower and so it just gulped 
up. 

The moment it did that, A burst of energy like an explosion started to spread from in its 
whole body, Its abdomen being the core of it. 

The energy was super hot making it feel like it was burning it from inside, A fear arose 
for in the teenage boar thinking it would be cooked alive from inside out if this goes on 
like this. 

Thankfully the unbearable warmth subsided as the cold aura replaced the heat in his 
body, This was gave it a momentary comfort because of the burnt of previous heat but it 
turns out even more than the heat. 

Before it felt like it would be cooked inside out if the heat did not subside but it was at 
least feeling boar known of and it was just affecting a few parts of its body. 

But this cold, It never felt anything like that, It was living in the jungle out of its life, never 
encountered the extreme cold, So it was its first encounter with such a strange thing. 

Yet it just started, Even before the boar get the time to process the pain from the cold, 
another wave of pain hit its body. 

It felt like its muscles were being torn apart and bones were breaking in all of its place 
causing the intense pain in its body. 

That boar wanted to wail in the pain but its instincts stopped it from doing so as if it 
wailed it would alert other predators around the area about it. 

If it does that it would give away its location to every being around the area, That's bad 
as there should be predators lurking around in search of a meal. 

Normally it can run or if it can't escape fight off but in its current condition it can't do 
both, So it was not wise to wail. 



So it just lay down on the green grass greeting its teeths not allowing even a squeak let 
go of its mouth. 

It laying on the ground ignoring the pain that was running in its body but still even if the 
pain was so immense that put him in the brink of passing out it did not allow itself to 
pass out. 

It knows unlike in its infancy, There would be no one coming to save it, So it has to be 
awake to fend off any threat that comes towards it. 

So the beast spent hours in that condition, In that time it was somehow able to prevent 
itself from not passing out, But it can be seen that it was hard for it. 

Still it got fruit of its labour, Slowly all pain in the body faded away, The beast was 
surprised as it thought it was gonner, There is no way it can survive this. 

The only reason it was even holding on was because of the small hope that it had to 
survive to meet the herd of its one last time to bid them a proper goodbye that it wasn't 
able to give them. 

So it was surprise to it, It quickly tried to stand up and to it's shock it can able to do it 
without any problem. 

Not only that but because it did not paid any heed how much strength to use ti stand up, 
As it stood up ground below its feed created several cracks. 

It was surprised by the sudden boost of strength. Before it was a strong boar even 
amongst its peers but it was never to this degree. 

Then even before it digested this news it also found out that there was some strange 
knowledge that appeared in its mind out of nowhere. 

As its bloodline was also purified and upgraded. 

Beast was new to all of this but it was not the dumb beast and so it quickly moved away 
from this place and decided to go into some secluded place to practice these 
techniques. 

It was somehow able to find it, not that after it left the place it found that flower, and so it 
just went in there and started using technique in the information in its mind. 

As it started doing that, The spiritual energy in the surroundings started to vortex around 
it slowly but surely absorbing in its boar body. 

Boar felt a sense of euphoria as the spiritual energy started to absorb in its body making 
it even stronger and tougher. 



Knowing it needed to be strong to survive, Did not stop and just went with the flow 
greedily absorbing the spiritual powers in the cave non-stop yet somehow spiritual 
power in the cave did not depleted like it has never ending supply. 

Who knows how much time has passed till boar just sat there fattin- *Ahem* toughing 
up before with loud boom energy shot from its body as it opens its eyes. 

All the childness and immaturity of the boar vanished, replaced by expression of 
experience. 

It looked around and it felt everything clear even beyond what normal eyes can see. 

The strength of its body gave it a confidence that it can flatten the ground on its will and 
also gave knowledge that this confidence is not baseless. 

As it stepped into the S-Rank, The one that was said to be supreme in the world. 

So the boar was confident about its ability to protect its herd and so it leave the cave 
and spent most of its life in search of its formal herd. 

But then find out eons passed since it was cultivating in the cave, There is no way any 
of its herd members was even around. 

It saddened the beast but because of its new come maturity it came to the fact that only 
the last one remained in its herd. 

It soon finds the mates for itself and has lots of boarlets to keep its lineage. 

Time like a mighty flow of the river quickly flew away and even the mighty S-Rank had 
to surrender in front of inevitable doom in time. 

But the boar had no regrets, Its life was all of a happy one. He got all he wanted, The 
only thing it was still desired was to run in the open fields with its herd like before. 

Its that last thought it closed its eyes, giving itself in the embrace of sweet death as it 
crossed the tunnel to go into the light. 

The last vision was that the deceased boar opened its eyes to find out its herd was still 
waiting for him at otherside even after all this time. 

It felt happy as its final wish was also completed as it with its herd drifted away running 
in field as it's always wanted. 

"And cut." 

"Phew~ This would be enough right? Or I have to make other stuff up?" 



Alex wiped the sweat from his forehead as he asked himself if this would be enough to 
make this spirit ideal. 

He had to make a lot of stuff up, along with the fact that he used two other God-Level 
skills while doing it, It took a toll on his making up stuff ability. 

Thankfully it did not affect its singing ability as he was able to create perfect vision 
targeting this beast spirit. 

*Growl* *Scatter* 

Alex looked towards the now dark transparent blue spirit, Which after his song ended 
scattered into many light particles and then fell into the pot filled with ashes. 

Or it was ashes as when those particles drop in the pot, It started to glow in blue light, 
merging the spirit particles into the formal meat and then when light disappeared it left 
behind two plates of thick juicy, big servings of meat with soft grass on top of it. 

He literally turned ashes back into juicy well cooked pieces of meat. It's no longer 
cooking but stepped into the realm of alchemy. 

"Humm….Well good enough." 

Alex examines the dish and can only say it's just good enough, As he found too many 
wrong things in the dish. 

But it was still way way lesser then the ones he found in normal food he makes, so he 
gave it a pass. 

"S-Rank beast meat doesn't look that different-!!!! System quick question, " 

Do all S-Ranks get humanoid form?" 

Alex for a moment shut down his god-level skills as he cooked the dish for their beast 
and was ready to cook meat of the Golden Chicken for others. 

But then he came to a very big realization.  

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day ??.) 

Chapter 299 297. Cannibalism Or Not? Well Does it Matter? 

[Ding! Host, Beast get humanoid form to 

break the shackles on their body to reach S-Rank as huwoman did not have an upper 
limit but beasts do. 



So any beast who wanted to reach S-Rank, needed to break those shackles. and for 
that they needed to achieve huwomanoid form. 

Hence why even the beasts who outright hate weaklings like huwoman's get 
huwomanoid form. 

So to answer to your question, Yes, All beast has huwomanoid form because they 
needed it to reach into S-Rank.] 

System came out and answered Alex clearly with the appropriate reasons as to why this 
is the case. 

Beasts are actually physically stronger than huwomans but because of that they were 
under the scrutiny by the Heavenly will. 

After all, If stronger being like beasts let it be then there would be no saying how 
powerful beast can be.. 

No wait, There is, There is example of one particular money who nearly destroyed 
heaven along with heavenly guards. 

There was also one dragon who swallowed the whole world just cause it was hungry 
and so on. 

There were many such beasts in the past who nearly destroyed the world. 

And so beast were put on extreme restrictions on them, So yes beasts are stronger in 
the same realm but they were not allowed to become stronger. 

Of course, These restrictions were not liked by the other strong beast powerhouse and 
there was nearly a war that broke out between the two factions. 

Thankfully they come to the conclusion that, If a beast reached to certain power level 
they need to have a huwomanoid form. 

The reason was given was that if beasts have an huwomanoid form they would learn 
that huwoman lives are equally valuble as theirs. 

And being in huwomanoid form they can also able to rip all the benefits huwoman's 
have like no upper limit on cultivation and speed in cultivation. 

Of course the real reason was way different then the reason that was given. 

The real reason was to put beasts also under the Heavenly rules, So they can't be as 
overbearing as they wants. 



In their beast form they were not bound to the Dao of heaven, Rather they were bound 
to their own Dao of Beast. 

This would mean heaven had no authority over them like it has over huwoman, Beast 
can act on what they want as long as it aligns with their beast dao. 

Which has only one rule and one rule only and that is survival of the fittest. As long as 
they have the strength to do something they are allowed to do it, That's their only rule. 

But after beast get the huwomanoid form, They also bound to the heavenly dao, Yes 
only as long as they are in huwomanoid form but they needed to be in huwomanoid 
form to increase their cultivation to become stronger. 

And of course, The huwomanoid form is weaker then then their beast form, Though still 
2 ot 3 times more stronger than huwomans but not like 10 times more in their beast 
form. 

That too did it on purpose, The only reason Heavenly Dao did not put even more harsh 
condition on the beasts is because of the its hypocritical belief that everything should be 
treated fairly. 

Yes, this is the same heavenly dao who birthed its bastard protagonist, Hence why its 
being called hypocritical belief as the only reason the beast got treated clearly was 
because the fear of strong in the beast group retaliating creating chaos in the world. 

So huwomanoid form became compulsory for the beast. They needed it or they couldn't 
advance further in cultivation. 

"Okay first of all, I wanted to know yes or no answer not history lesson but thanks, 2nd, 
How similar is huwomanoid form of beast to huwomans?" 

Alex heard the answer of the system, He didn't wanted to gear this but he was glad that 
he asked beforehand. 

Still he needed to know more about this to make a decision of whether eating this was 
considered cannibalism or not. 

Yeah at the forefront it appears like it's an obvious answer but if they think clearly, take 
into consideration the context and most importantly how beneficial these meats are too. 

This is just the 2nd situation of Pedo or Beastality but just here it's about cannibalism or 
not. 

[Ding! Host beasts in huwomanoid form is very very closely related to the huwoman, 
You might even say they are upgraded huwomans cause of extra strength. 



They are so similar to the huwomans that they can mate with them and give birth to the 
Demi-Huwoman's. 

Though because the beast genes are dominant, Child would show the characteristics of 
the beast parents in appearance but there is a small but valid possibility that they would 
have characteristics of the huwoman parents.] 

System once again was helpful as it came out and gave an answer to him. 

Huwomanoid form of the beast as it's said huwomanoid form. 

It has to be closely related to the huwomans as only then would be the heavenly dao's 
rules be applied to them. 

Of course there are slight differences in them as they their beast origin but it is not 
enough to sway them away from huwomanoid nature as they can give birth to the baby 
if they mate with huwomans. 

"*Sigh* Do in beast form they have huwoman thing mixed up like it is in huwomanoid or 
not? Also tell me they don't have the profound level of huwoman emotions." 

Alex did not want to hear this, He knows for the fact that huwoman are unique that they 
can only breed with each other, So other beings have to be just like huwoman ot damn 
close to it. 

So it was confirm they have humanoid form just like an huwomans. 

The only thing that keeping him from making judgment that the meat he cooked was 
from a beast in its beast form and so meaning it was autonomy of the beast. 

Meaning right now it did not matter whether or not beast in huwomanoid form related to 
the huwoman or not as its been known it was in beast form. 

And from the information given, Beast form is different from the huwomanoid form and 
not related to the huwomanoid form as beast form is base while other one is add one. 

So Huwomanoid form should not have any huwoman characteristics but still to be on 
the safe side he asked the system. 

Anyway, for the current dish it did not matter whether or not this is true as this dish was 
made for Shapira and Xiao Bai. 

He can always ask Xiao Bai to turn into her tigress form to eat it, To avoid any 
physiological dilemma. 



[Ding! No Host, In the beast form, Beast did not have any characteristics of huwoman, 
And no, In the beast form they also would not be able to conceive a child. 

Of course unless the host wants to, System has things that can make that possible, So 
host can go wild and ride the tigress. 

And yes, Even in the beast form they retain the complex emotions of huwoman, That 
did not change.] 

System as user friendly it is, quickly answered every question of Alex and without even 
reading the room gave the recommendation on how to ride tigress. 

So he can able to turn that saying into a pleasant reality. 

"Okay last question, How much benefits can one get from eating the S-Rank beast 
meat?" 

Alex helplessly asked system wiping the sweat caused by fear. 

He at first was happy hearing the system saying that the beast 

in their original form are just beast, So there is definitely no cannibalism involved in it. 

Then the system said something that scared him to death, Yeah he has a heavy taste 
but not that heavy. 

If he did that, If there would no longer be a dilemma, It would be outright Beastality, 
There is no room for debate. 

Then the system drops another bombshell on him telling him that even in their beast 
form beast they retain complex emotions of huwomans. 

He did not care about morality but from the physiological perspective it would be still 
uncomfortable to eat being with the same emotions as one's own. 

Well he would not feel bad if the gains out weight the uncomfortable feeling of eating 
beast meat. 

Anything there is nothing practically wrong with it now, Just physiological issue which is 
not a big deal if he gets something good out of eating it. 

Hey, It makes him look bad but if he wants to survive in this novel world, He had to do 
anything he can to grow strong. 

[Ding! Host as its meat from the S-Rank, There would be lots of benefits including but 
not limited to the increase in the cultivation talent, strengthening and improving 



physique, improving the spiritual power by concentrating and increasing, Improvement 
in cultivation level and many more. 

There is even a chance that a consumer may awaken or gain the some skills or powers 
of the beast depending on the quality of the meat, how it's prepared and the luck of the 
person. 

(Note : Some beast has special benefits after it was consumed, So keep that in mind.)] 

System voice rang in his head and the benefits of it were explained by it in details. 

"So you are telling me, Beasts are beasts and Huwomans are huwoman?" 

Alex spoke to the system after hearing the system details with glint in his eyes. 

[Ding! Huh…Ye-no, Host may I explain it again, So yo-] 

System did not understand why Alex asked that question, It thought Alex was 
misunderstood and so wanted to repeat itself again but cut off in mid sentence by the 
system. 

"No need, I understand, Just treat them like an onion, right?" 

Alex ignored system explanation and gave his while swiftly taking out other Golden 
Crow meat and Other one for their consumption. 

[Ding? Wait no host, That completely different the-] 

"System don't disturb me while I am cooking. Shoo find someone else to play with." 

System concern about Alex misunderstanding but Alex shooed him away like an child 
hungry for attention. 

[...] 

System finally understood what was happening and became speechless, But it couldn't 
do anything. As long as its host is happy, does it matter what is right or wrong? 

And so Alex just started cooking Golden Cock meat in the same way he cooked Boar 
one. 

….. 

"Babies are Narcissists." 

(A/N : Happy Holi Guys 🎉🎉🎊 



Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁. ) 

Chapter 300 298. Babies Are Narcissists 

"Oh Oh, Who starts a conversation like that? I just sat down but yeah they are." 

Rita who was seating around the set dining table by Shapira said to the White taken 
aback from what she said but also agreeing with her. 

"Forget about her, she is alway like this. Tell me what's wrong with this one here? 
What's you wearing?" 

Isabella was used to the antics of White, So it did not phase her even slightest what she 
said but she was more concerned about the "dress" Rita was wearing. 

"I too wanted to know the same, What the fuck I am wearing, Can you answer that?" 

Rita, as if Isabella pressed her hurting nerve reacted and quickly looked towards Amara 
who was waiting for Alex to come out of the kitchen. 

"Don't look at me, There was nothing appropriate for her to wear, So I had to 
compromise." 

Amara snapped out of her trance when she felt many gazes locked on to hers, She at 
first was confused but then looking at Rita and the rest, She understood what might they 
wanted. 

"Compromise? You compromise nothing, I need to wear this makeshift tent on me. 
What would you think he would think of me if he saw me like this, answer me." 

Rita snapped, She looked at Amara thennat herself then back to Amara with anger in 
her eyes. 

This woman dragged her into the bedroom and put this ridiculous thing on her. 

Normally she do not care about her appearance or looks as she is assassins, Her whole 
job is to be hide in the shadow's 

But not now, She wanted to show her best side to Alex which could not because of this 
woman. 

And then this woman has the audacity to call her compromise? What does she even 
compromise? She was bearing the brunt of it in the "dress" warped around her. 

"The one you are, Beta, Also I did compromise, Be grateful I allowed you to use my 
brother's bedsheet to warp around you, If not you would have been naked." 



Amara didn't just sit there and hear Rita talk, She shot back at her. 

She pointed out Rita for having the muscular physique is beat according to the 
standards of this world, And so Amara was quick on pointing those out. 

Then she thought to clarify where she compromise. She pointed towards the "dress" 
Rita was wearing and said she allowed that bedsheet for her to wrap herself with, So 
she would not be naked. That's how big hearted she is. 

Of course there were many Alex's dress can be worn by Rita though still would have 
been very very tight for her and might have needed to open a few buttons but that was 
still better than this thing she was wearing. 

But how can Amara would allow that? Its her brother's clothes, If anyone can wear it 
then it would be her not some beta her brother keeping around because of the breakup 
with Alia. 

"I would have prefered to be naked then to wear this god damned monstrosity. What the 
hell is even this? And why is it warping me head to toe like a daddy? I can't move in 
this." 

Rita was pissed, The only two reasons she was not throwing hands was she knew she 
would get her ass handed to her by Amara if they really fought. 

And second reason being, She knows Amara is sister of Alex. She did not want a bad-
blood with the sister of her mister Death, It might hurt their guaranteed relationship. 

But she still felt it is unreasonable behavior of Amara, She didn't know why this woman 
targeted her from the start. 

Like didn't she see there are two more women in this exact room eyeing her brother? So 
why was she is a prime target of Amara? 

They two should make an alliance from the basis of first come and defend the fort. 

But no, This woman only knows how to use childish tactics against her, Like right now 
she was wrapped in the head to toe with the bedsheet. 

Not the one on the bed, But Amara makes sure to use the one already been washed so 
she would not wear the one which has the scent of Alex. 

Then this woman wrapped her like a burrito covering head to toe like a pyramid Daddy 
and then had the audacity to ask why she was pissed off. 

"You prefer to be naked don't you? You like to show off that beta muscular body of 
yours, Didn't you know man don't like it, Oh Didn't you also have a six pack on your 



abdomen? I still don't know from where your confidence comes from to show off your 
body." 

Amara did not let that slide, She taunted Rita saying she would prefer to be naked then 
to cover herself like this only showing her face and able to move her hands through the 
cuts she made. 

To be honest, Amara did not think Rita looked bad in this, She looked kinda cute so he 
warped like a burrito in a bedsheet. 

It's just that in the eyes of Amara, Rita is a Beta female because of her muscular 
physique, and the fact that this woman was walking naked around Alex before her just 
pissing Amara off. 

That's the only reason why Amara dislike Rita, If she didn't had muscular figure and also 
did not be stupid enough to casually walk naked around Alex making her think it was not 
the first time for Rita to do that and then come to the conclusion that Rita took 
advantage of Alex, Amara might not even cared about her. 

But Rita being Rita decided to hit her body on the trigger of buckshot blowing herself up 
like an imbecile. 

"Hey it's not beta nor overly muscular, It's healthy muscles and few mens are into it, I 
read it online, I bet Alex would like it then yours flat one." 

Rita went into defensive mode when Amara pointed out her muscular figure. 

She was always insecure about her body because of her muscles, as women don't have 
muscular figures men do. 

Woman's even having a slender body are stronger than man casus novel logic. 

So woman having muscular body is frowned upon saying those women are lacking and 
should cut the gym to lose these muscles. 

If Alex heard this, He would definitely throw hands as Rita was the definition of a fit 
woman. 

She has well defined abs, big burst, perky butt, thicc thighs and more. She looks like the 
cuckold heroine from the game which has the very contrary name as it's everything but 
a final. 

So of course Alex was into her, This world may hate this physique but for him, It's a 
treat for sore eyes, Other than his face of course. 



It's not the news that he has narcissist tendencies but hey, He has the qualifications to 
be one. 

"You-" 

Amara was speechless, How can this woman be this shameless? Even when she said 
all these not only did she not think to back off and try to lose those muscles but even 
boost those off. 

Amara had too much to say but found out she was lacking the words to express what 
she wanted to her. 

"Babies always want their daddy, They need attention, Want to be comforted and if not 
given they make your life hell." 

Suddenly White who felt that she was being ignored or might just felt that she didn't say 
anything, What if others think she becomes mute decided to interject in the conversation 
of two of them. 

She decided to tell me she thinks babies are narcissists. Didn't they always want them 
to be your center of attention? Didn't they follow the rules of their my way or highway? 

If things did not go in their way they threw tantrums and would not stop till they got what 
they wanted. 

They feel like the world revolve around them, They without the concern about others 
just get what they always want and do anything to get it. 

That's the reasoning of White in her head, In her mind she read its signs of narcissist 
and babies fall into the conditions of being one and so this topic came to be. 

It's really not that she was surfing the internet and stumbled onto the topic. 

"What the fuck you talking about, They are babies-" 

Isabella, being the possessor of the White Lotus heart, quickly jumps out quickly asking 
explanation from the White to even say something like that. 

They are babies, Who have the communication skills of an alarm clock. Of course they 
would be like that. 

That does not make them narcissists, As they can't help it as they didn't have the 
capability to understand what they were doing is a wrong thing. 

But before she even finished her scolding of White, She was cut off mid-sentence. 



"No no stop, She might have a point." 

Alex came out of the kitchen empty handed with swagger as he chimed in the 
conversation as he felt that this conversation was so interesting that it would be a 
shame not to be part of. 

*Roar* 

"Where is the meat?" 

Before anyone would react, Shapira was first to jump in front of Alex from the pocket 
space of theirs. 

Then she quickly sat in front of Alex looking at him excitedly with a glint in her eye. Xiao 
Bai too jumped along with her with the same look. 

She heard from Shapira that Alex cooked something special for them, So she was 
excited to see it. 

But when they saw he didn't have anything in his eyes, They both were disappointed 
looking at Alex with tears in their eyes for answers. 

(A/N : Like always thank you for reading and have a good day 😁.) 

 


