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Chapter 2478
Crying was pointless, and they needed to find a way out. Thinking of this,
an idea crossed Grayson’s mind.

He abruptly turned around and said, “There is something we can do right
now, though!”

This stunned Jackie and Rudy for a moment.

They then turned to see Grayson facing the spiritual vessel, pointing at
the door as he said, sounding all too sure of himself, “The door isn’t
broken yet! We can still use the door!”

Jackie hurriedly asked, “Is it not broken? Can it still be closed?”

Grayson took a deep breath as Grayson wiped his face with his hand.
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After calming himself down thoroughly, Grayson said, “I actually forgot
about that. My master once had a small spirit vessel like this, but he sold
it for a middle-sized one eventually.

“Even though there are a lot of problems with spiritual vessels like this
and it’s low priced, there are still some practical functions. There’s more
than one way to open and close the door. This is to prevent the occupants
from being unable to get out if the array is ruined.

“There’s a button to open and close the door on the side of the vessel.
The button is also a small array itself. As long as spirit crystals are placed
inside, the door can be activated!”



Grayson did not wait for any reaction from Jackie and Rudy as he hurried
over and entered the vessel.
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He felt around the sides of the door and quickly exclaimed happily, “I
found it! It’s right here! Oh, thank goodness-we’d still be able to hide if
there’s any danger. I just don’t know how powerful of an attack the spirit

vessel can handle, though…”

Grayson’s words not only sparked hope within Rudy, but it relieved
Jackie as well.

Jackie’s tense self relaxed a little as he quickly walked into the small
vessel.

He followed where Grayson was pointing and saw a small array that
glowed faintly. That was the button to activate the door of the vessel.
There were still various runes lit up around the array. Compared to the
runes that controlled the vessel, the runes there did not seem affected at

all. They could still operate normally!

Rudy exclaimed happily, “Oh, thank goodness! The heavens are on our
side! I thought that we’re sure to be beast-food back there, and I can’t
believe we’ve been given a lifeline like that. It’ll let us survive a little
longer, at least.”

Grayson frowned as he looked at Rudy. “Can you stop with the
depressing words? As long as we can figure out a good plan, we might
even be able to leave.



“Even though we noticed the hair of a one eyed frost wolf earlier, it
doesn’t mean every beast around here is on the same level. The one-eyed
frost wolf might not even have mattered yet.

“That’d mean the beasts living around here would all be at the innate
stage, which is good news for us!”

Grayson’s eyes glimmered with hope all while he spoke.
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He coughed lightly before he added, “We all know that beasts have their

own territories they are active in. Low-level beasts will never enter the
territories of high-level beasts.

“As long as we can make sure that the beasts around here aren’t that
highly leveled, then we’ll be able to escape as long as we’re careful. We

can also try to figure out how far out we are by seeing how the beasts are
distributed!”

Chapter 2479
Grayson’s mind truly did digest the situation they were in. Jackie had
just thought about all of that when Grayson spoke of it.

Grayson was right. They could use the distribution of the weak and the
strong to determine where they should flee toward. The stronger beasts
would usually always be in the inner areas of any forest.

The weaker the beasts, the longer they would stay around the outskirts.
With this tactic, they would be able to leave this place. However, they
first needed to find somewhere they could be safe in before that.



The spiritual vessel might have been wrecked, but its hard outer shell
could still withstand a certain level of attacks. As long as it was not a
dangerously strong fiend, they would be able to hide inside for temporary
shelter should any danger present itself to them.

With the spiritual vessel as a temporary shelter, they could slowly start to
explore outward.

Grayson took a deep breath. “I guess there’s always a way-“

The moment he said that, the sound of frantic footsteps could be heard. It
did not sound like a fiend’s claws pacing on the ground. The three of
them could immediately tell the difference.

The moment they heard the footsteps, they immediately turned to look
toward the direction but dared not move. They did not leave the spirit
vessel.

They did not know whether the footsteps belonged to friend or foe. A
human’s heart was often more complicated than a beast’s, so the trio had
to be prepared for everything.

After a moment, they saw a white figure heading toward them from the

most northern direction. He seemed to be stumbling as he ran.

It looked like someone running for his life.

This individual was clad in a white robe, one that had tears in them
seemingly done by tree branches. At that point, it looked like he merely
had a ragged cloth that covered his body. The person seemed to have
sustained numerous wounds all over him, too.



The person’s lips were stained with blood, as was the poor white robe he
had on. He was not running that quickly and even grabbed the branches
around him for support as he ran. He looked incredibly pathetic.

The scene immediately conjured complicated thoughts in their heads.
That person should already be injured, so he would not be a big threat to
them.

However, he was obviously running away, so they wondered what was
behind him.

At that moment, the white-robed man suddenly noticed something
different. He first saw the vessel before he noticed the three next to it. He
reached out his hand toward them as he said with the last of his strength,
“Save me…!”

Right after he said those words, he collapsed on the ground after using
the last of his strength.

The corner of Rudy’s lips twitched as he looked toward Grayson and
Jackie in a panic.

“What should we do? Should we save him?”

Grayson shook his head. “No. His enemies might be hot on his trails
right now. If we save him, then his enemies would think we’re allies.
Would it not drag us into his problems? It’s best if we mind our own

business!”
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Chapter 2480
Jackie’s lips twitched as he looked at Grayson helplessly.



He had just praised Grayson for being somewhat smart when Grayson
decided to show his stupidity again.

“Do you think there would be any enemies. pursuing him deep in a forest

like this?” countered Jackie rather impatiently. “Before that, why don’t
you look at the wounds on his body? Those aren’t weapon-inflicted.
They must be wounds from the claws and teeth of beasts.”

Grayson was taken aback by Jackie’s words.

He immediately turned to look at the white-robed man’s wounds. Sure
enough, the man’s wounds did look like they had been caused by the
teeth of a beast.

Before Grayson could contest the idea, Jackie added, “This man must’ve
been chased by beasts. Normally, it’s best to mind our own business, but
this situation is different. The Fact that he’s in here should mean that he
knows how to get out. Don’t we need a guide right now?”
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Jackie’s words had hit them right where they needed to, reminding them
of their situation. After all, how were they supposed to get out before

they knew where they were?

Even though the man in front of them had fainted, he might know a way

out since he managed to get in. With that in mind, Grayson did not
hesitate to rush over immediately with Rudy close behind.

The two of them hurriedly picked the man up. Just as Rudy’s feet had
just stepped into the spirit vessel, a roar was heard behind them.



Jackie shifted his gaze instantly and spotted a massive wolf the size of
two humans. Its whole body radiated a chilling frost, and it was running
right at them ruthlessly. He could also spot bloodstains on the wolf’s
mouth, and bits of cloth were stuck in its claws as well. It was obvious at
a glance that they were from that white robed man.
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Sure enough, that unlucky man had encountered that hungry wolf, which
caused him to be in his state. The evil wolf had an uncannily sharp sight.
As it rushed over, it could already spot Rudy and Grayson carrying the
man into the spirit vessel

The hungry wolf, suddenly angered, looked up to the skies and let out a
long howl, and Rudy turned to look back at it. That one glance caused
Rudy to almost kneel on the floor in fear.

“A one-eyed frost wolf! It’s a mature one eyed frost wolf!”

Jackie inhaled sharply at this; it was just as he had thought. The fur they
had encountered before this belonged to the very wolf right ahead of
them!

This wolf had already matured, and a matured one-eyed frost wolf was
already at the spring-solidifying realm. It was a being that could kill
Rudy with one swipe of its claw!

Still seething with rage, the one-eyed frost wolf suddenly sprinted toward
them, its pace quickening in the process. Its speed doubled, not planning
on giving them a chance to escape.’

It wanted to kill them all.



“We’re done for! It’s coming right for us!” Grayson let out a hopeless
cry.

Jackie frowned.
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He reached his hand out and pulled Rudy inside. He took out a spirit
crystal from Mustard Seed as he placed it on the array next to the door as
fast as possible.

The array activated immediately, and the door started to close. The
hungry wolf’s eyes suddenly widened when it saw the door was
closingThe wolf seemed to possess a degree of intelligence, knowing that
killing them would be much harder with the door shut.

The one-eyed wolf started to increase its speed again. Jackie even started
to feel that. fatal murderous enveloping him.

The wolf opened its bloody jaws and lunged straight at them!

Rudy and Grayson gaped at the wolf that was only meters away from the
vessel with wide eyes. Their breaths stopped as they froze on the spot, so
petrified that they could not even tremble.

With a bang, the one-eyed wolf slammed against the closed door.

Chapter 2481
The wolf rammed right into the vessel, causing the men in the vessel to
jolt. Thankfully, the vessel’s door closed right in the nick of time, saving
them from their doom.



Rudy was so terror-stricken that he was speechless, petrified as merely
stood still. Grayson, on the other hand, did not feel any better, clutching
his chest as his heart pounded against his ribcage. If his heart had raced
any faster, it might have jumped out of his throat.

Jackie took a deep breath.

He was the calmest among the three of them, but what had happened still
shook him. They were mere breaths away from disaster, after all.

Jackie was quite confident in his own skills, but even he was not sure if
he would be able to escape a spring solidifying realm beast.

“That was horrendous! That was way too close. If we continue on like
this, I’d probably die of a heart attack if I’m not swallowed by a beast!”
bleated Rudy as he collapsed on the floor.

Grayson took a deep breath to calm himself down. “That was an actual
mature frost wolf…and that didn’t look like any ordinary frost wolf
either!

“It’s already at the peak of the early stage of the spring solidifying realm.
It’s only a sliver away from the middle stage!”

Rudy patted his chest. “Thankfully, we were right on time. We had the

vessel to shield us, or we’d be dead by now.”

Right after Rudy’s remark, however, a bang was heard from outside the

vessel, causing it to violently shake.

They did not need to look outside to know that the one-eyed frost wolf
was throwing itself against the vessel so ruthlessly. What followed was a



few more bangs, and the trio had no time to put themselves at complete
ease before they were thrown into panic once more.

Rudy’s eyes were wide as he suddenly stood from the floor. He turned to
look at Jackie. “What do we do? What should we do next? That thing

will rip us apart if it destroys this vessel and gets to us!”

Grayson shuddered. “I now regret saving this guy! If it weren’t for him,
the one-eyed wolf wouldn’t be ramming against the vessel right now so

derangedly!

“This wolf is no fool. The fact that it’s so angry definitely means that this
guy angered it. Now it hates us, too!”

Grayson glared viciously at the white-robed man, who was still
unconscious. If the man woke up, Grayson would surely give him an

earful.

Jackie frowned as he coldly looked at Grayson. “I’ve made my
assessment outside. This vessel is well-made, and as long as the wolf
doesn’t attack it for days on end, it should be able to hold on for now.”

The other two pursed their lips at the same time when they heard that, not
saying anything, but the assault against the vessel did not relent.

Each time the one-eyed wolf struck, it would cause the people inside to
shake as well. It was hard to even stand properly.

Their moods were erratic, much like how the vessel trembled against the

wolf’s might. Rudy and Grayson’s faces were dark the whole time.

After attacking for an entire hour, however, the one-eyed wolf suddenly
stopped.



The few of them in the ship let out sighs of relief. Rudy looked up at the
door. “Do you think the wolf left?”

Jackie shook his head before sitting on the floor. “It might be my first
time seeing a one-eyed wolf, but a wolf is still a wolf. They’re one of the
best hunters in the wild.

“For it to attack the vessel for a whole hour, it’s obvious how much it

hates that man. Since that’s the case, it won’t leave easily. Even though
he can’t see into the vessel, I’m very sure it’s quietly waiting for us

outside.”

With those words, Grayson and Rudy started to get anxious again.
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