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No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3891-Seymoure took a deep breath as he 
sipped some tea, “Have you looked into Jack?” 

Seymour had been training in seclusion recently and had only gotten out the 
day before. Desmond had been the one having others investigate the matter. 

Desmond nodded, “I’ve already looked into it. I’m very surprised by his 
origins…” 

Seymour raised an eyebrow curiously. 

Desmond was someone who relied on his talent to reach the top since he was 
young. He was firmly in the top three of the Whirling World. Anyone who could 
surprise him must not be a simple person. 

Desmond did not delay things. He took out a piece of paper from his spatial 
ring and placed it in front of Seymour. The paper had a lot of information 
about Jack. 

It included the fact that Jack came from Hestia Continent and what rank 
Hestia Continent was. It also had a detailed list of the opponents that Jack 
had faced. He had a lot of enemies, but all the enemies that had gone against 
him had ended with bad consequences. 

After looking at that, even Seymour could not remain calm. 

Someone that could be at the same level as him was actually from a trashy 
place like Hestia Continent. 

The only thing special about Hestia Continent was the fact that it had been 
sealed off by special energy tens of thousands of years ago. 

No one could enter, and those who were inside could not get out as well. It 
had basically cut them off from the other worlds. At the same time, it was 
because of that seal that Hestia Continent’s warriors fell so far behind the 
other worlds. 

Hestia Continent had been ranked in the middle of third-grade worlds in the 
past, but they were bottom feeders at this point. 



Other than Jack being a special exception, the other warriors from Hestia 
Continent were all stuck in level seven cities. Even those who were able to 
enter level seven cities were already amongst the strongest of Hestia 
Continent. 

A place as small as that was something they would not even bother giving a 
second look at. However, they were fully focused on it now! 

Seymour raised an eyebrow and said, “So how do you plan on dealing with 
this guy? When are you going to kill him?” 

After investigating Jack’s background, things became much easier. Even 
though Jack was incredibly talented and strong, he did not have a strong 
background. It meant that he was just a lone wolf. 

Getting rid of him would take some effort, and they might even need to act 
themselves, but it was not too much trouble. After all, the moment he dies, 
there would be no one to take revenge for him. 

Somewhere like Hestia Continent, even if it was not cut off from the rest of the 
world, it could be gotten rid of once they left the Whirling World just by finding 
a few experts. It was naturally not something they needed to be worried about. 

Desmond raised an eyebrow and thought about it seriously, “We can’t touch 
this guy yet. After all, we can’t leave this place right now to make sure 
everything goes well. We’ll need to make an appearance ourselves if we’re to 
kill this guy. Otherwise, if things go wrong and this guy notices, then things will 
be incredibly difficult. 
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No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3892-This time, even Desmond had to 
participate when the Toman Battlefield opened to prevent any problems. 
Seymour naturally had to join as well. Nothing else was more important than 
that, and everything needed to be pushed back. The two of them could not 
deal with Jack themselves. 

Desmond raised an eyebrow, “Let him be happy for a few more days. When 
we make our move, he’ll be dead.” 

There were only so many resources at the top. 



For the sake of those resources, they had gone through quite a bit of trouble, 
even having to sacrifice some things. 

Even though they had never met the guy before, they could still tell what 
would happen if they did not deal with him. As long as he was an ordinary 
person, he would definitely end up fighting for resources at the top with them. 

They could not stand the fact that someone had suddenly turned up to take a 
piece of all the resources they had tried hard to get! 

If they really let him do as he pleased, they would suffer a great deal, so they 
could not let something like that happen. 

Seymour said with a frown, “This plan being given to us looks easy, and 
should go smoothly as long as things go according to plan. We just need to 
make sure we assign the manpower carefully then things should go perfectly. 
However, that’s just the surface, it’s clearly going to be something 
laborious…” 

As he said that, Seymour had a dark look on his face. 

Desmond sighed as he shook his head helplessly, “You can only blame us for 
being unlucky. After all, this was completely random. We might not need to 
use true energy to maintain the array, but we still need to put in a lot of effort. 
If we’re not careful and something happens, we’ll definitely suffer a lot of 
complaints.” 

After thinking about that, Desmond started to get furious. 

When they were assigning the tasks, the few warriors who stood at the peak 
decided to randomly assign the tasks by drawing lots. Then, it would all be 
down to luck, and no one would have to fight over anything. 

After drawing the lots, Desmond and Seymour had gotten the Toman 
Battlefield. 

Everyone else got different tasks, but the Toman Battlefield was one of the 
harder tasks. It looked simple, only needing to allocate their manpower and 
mobilize when needed. However, there was a lot of room for problems to 
occur. 



They had to be careful at all moments. They might even need to personally 
turn up at important moments. If anything bad happened, they could suffer. 

At the time, the other warriors even had happy looks on their faces when they 
saw that Desmond and Seymour had gotten the Toman Battlefield. 

They teased Desmond and Seymour, saying that the two of them would only 
need to mobilize at the last moments, while they had to try hard to fight. 

When he heard that, Desmond almost started cursing at everyone. They 
clearly had the hardest task, and everyone else was acting like they had the 
easiest. 

They were no idiots, they naturally understood that they were being mocked. 
However, he was not someone who complained, neither was Seymour. 

They merely maintained a cold look on their face, acting like they did not hear 
anything. However, the more they thought about it, the angrier they got. 

Seymour saw the sour look on Desmond’s face and laughed lightly, saying, 
“It’s fine, there’s nothing we can do about it. What’s the point of getting angry? 
It’s better to focus on the task and make sure nothing goes wrong. It’d save us 
from a lot of trouble in the future.” 
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No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3893-Desmond nodded. Just like Seymour 
said, they had to accept things as they were. 

Desmond sighed, and a sudden thought flashed in his head. 

He looked up and said coldly, “It’s very possible that Jack will sign up for the 
Toman Battlefield!” 

After that was said, Desmond suddenly had an uneasy feeling in his heart. His 
heart skipped a few beats. 

Seymour raised an eyebrow before he thought about what Desmond said. 

He nodded slightly, “You’re right. He’s in Violet City right now. This news has 
already spread across the whole Whirling World. If he doesn’t have anything 
urgent to do, he will definitely sign up!” 



The moment that was said, Desmond’s face darkened completely. The two of 
them had actually forgotten about something so important. 

The Toman Battlefield did not just attract the attention of regular warriors, but 
also those that were stronger. 

Even someone that stood at the peak like Jack would probably be tempted as 
well. After all, killing a demon king would yield people one piece of purple gold 
normally, or even as much as two. 

A warrior that stood at the peak could deal with demon kings by himself. 

If he started a slaughter on the Toman Battlefield, he would probably be able 
to kill two or three dozen demon kings in seven days. Others might turn 
around and run if they meet any of the demon kings, but Jack would definitely 
not. 

To him, demon kings were just pieces of purple gold! 

Thinking about it, Desmond clenched his teeth in frustration. 

“I think there’s a very good chance he will sign up! With him around, the two of 
us will have a hard time! Even though we’ve never fought him before, just 
listening to the reports makes his general skill level obvious. If I fight him 
alone, it will probably be an even battle.” 

“The two of us should be able to beat him if we work together, but warriors at 
the peak will have ways to protect themselves. If we’re not careful and he 
manages to escape, then things will be very hard!” 

The two of their faces darkened the more they talked about it. They slowly 
realized that this was not just an incredibly difficult matter, but also something 
filled with a lot of variables. 

Jack was incredibly troublesome. 

They wanted to deal with him right away, but they did not have enough time, 
nor did they have the right opportunity. After all, they could not tell where Jack 
was at that moment. 

If Jack participated in the Toman Battlefield, then he would be the biggest 
variable. 



Seymour took a deep breath and said, “We have to plan for him beforehand..” 

The next morning, Jack brought Lourain to the place to sign up for the Toman 
Battlefield. Every single city had a special array and registration point setup 
once the Toman Battlefield was opened. Violet City’s sign-up spot was in the 
southwestern part of the city. 

When Jack and Lourain got there, there were already over ten thousand 
people there. Ever since they entered the Whirling World, what they saw the 
most were other warriors. It was easy to see tens of thousands of warriors 
gathered in lower-level cities. 

Yet, there were only ten thousand people there. 

They suddenly felt like there were very few people. However, the thought felt 
like quite a joke to Lourain. They were not in a low-level city. 

The warriors that gathered in Violet City were all Elites, except for the few who 
had gotten lucky enough to have someone help them. 
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No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3894-Anyone who entered Violet City needed 
to pass the Violet Seven Deaths Array. Just that alone would have stopped 
most warriors. 

The fact that ten thousand people were gathered there was already quite a big 
number. 

Many of them were eagerly heading to sign up, writing down their names in 
excitement before they quickly stepped on the transfer array, waiting to be 
sent to Toman Battlefield. They were all quite excited. After all, in their eyes, 
as long as they moved carefully, Tornan Battlefield was somewhere they 
could definitely make a profit. 

After killing the demons, it was not certain how much of a reward they could 
get. 

If they were lucky enough, it was possible to get millions from just one green 
demon. That would be a complete jackpot. 



A million spirit crystals were not that much for warriors at the peak or above 
average warriors. 

However, for most regular warriors, it was a completely different thing. A 
million spirit crystals were enough for resources that could bring them to a 
new level. There were quite a few warriors there hoping to get lucky. 

Looking at everyone’s expressions, Lourain merely sighed. 

If Jack had not told him, he would have been one of them, dreaming just like 
everyone else. Yet, they were all falling into a trap. 

Lourain took a deep breath before he said calmly, “Once word gets out and all 
the warriors realize it, they’ll fight back! If they want to get more Heartblood, 
they need to use cruel methods to torture someone. This plot will definitely 
cost a lot of lives…” 

“When word gets out, even regular warriors will get angered by this. The 
backlash will be immense. Those warriors at the top will definitely pay a price!” 

As he said that, Lourain clenched his teeth, practically hissing the words out. It 
was obvious how angry he was. 

Jack turned to look at Lourain and said, “You’re thinking about things too 
simply. Do you think they wouldn’t have thought about that?” 

“They’re already prepared. Furthermore, no matter how bad the backlash is, 
they won’t be the ones dying. It won’t put them in much danger either. What’s 
a bit of loss compared to the rewards of the Radiant Hall?” 

Lourain’s heart chilled as he suddenly turned around to look at Jack. 

He looked like he wanted to say something, but could not form the words. 

Jack was right. 

What could the regular warriors do even if they fought back? 

They could not enter a level one city. Even though the Toman Battlefield was 
a challenge from a level one city, they would be sent back after they 
completed the challenge. They would not be sent to Toman Battlefield, but 
where they originally were. 



It meant that they were just there for a challenge. There was no way they 
would enter a level one city. If they wanted to enter a level one city, they 
needed to have enough talent and power. Just that alone stopped almost all 
of the warriors. 

The ones that were left were clearly on the same side as those who stood at 
the top. They had the same goal, and they would not care about the lives of 
the regular warriors as well. They would even feel like it was perfectly 
reasonable for just a few people to die. 

Lourain got angrier as he thought about it, and could not help but clench his 
fist. However, he knew that the anger was only limited to his heart. 

With his skills, he could not even make those warriors at the top itch, let alone 
pay a price. 

Jack patted Lourain on the shoulder, “You should stop dreaming, it’s pointless 
anyway. Just pay attention to what’s in front of you.” 

Read No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3895 

No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3895-Lourain nodded, no longer thinking 
about that. 

At that moment, Jack had put on an elaborate disguise. As long as he did not 
attack, he would not be recognized. 

Lourain was far simpler, he just put on a mask. With that mask, no one could 
see what he looked like. 

The two of them queued up together and signed up after an hour then 
stepped onto the transfer array. It was the largest transfer array Jack had ever 
seen. 

It looked as large as a lake. It would be no problem for thousands of people to 
be on it. The two of them were not early, but not late either. They were forced 
to stand by the outskirts, and that was when Jack saw a familiar face. 

It was the square-faced man they had seen at the inn. 

At that moment, the square-faced man was waving his hand to someone. 



Jack and Lourain looked to where he was looking and saw the man with a 
unibrow in the crowd. 

The man with the unibrow had an incredibly bitter look on his face. He looked 
incredibly conflicted as helplessness and pity were evident on his face. Both 
of them had seen everything that had happened at the inn. On top of that, the 
two of them already guessed what was happening behind the scenes. 

They naturally understood how helpless the man with the unibrow felt. 

The square-faced man shouted, “Don’t worry! I’ll be fine! I’ll make sure to be 
very careful. I won’t act recklessly at all!” 

The man with the unibrow’s mouth twitched. He had a bitter look on his face. 
He opened his mouth to say something, but nothing came out in the end. 

He could only nod, indicating that he had heard what was said. 

Lourain shook his head helplessly. 

He whispered to Jack, “I can understand why that man was so insistent on 
joining.” 

Jack raised an eyebrow, looking at Lourain curiously. 

Lourain said with a wry expression, “Warriors like us who haven’t really 
stepped into the realm of being strong, always have the mentality of trying to 
get lucky.” 

“We won’t let up any chances, and we’ll go ahead unless something wrong 
happens! Even though we know how dangerous it is, we still have to give 
ourselves a chance despite it so we can improve!” 

As he said that, Lourain smiled bitterly, saying after a pause, “That’s the sad 
thing about being weak. Before arriving at the Whirling World, we were all 
considered quite talented in our respective worlds…” 

“After all, there are a limited number of geniuses in any given world. We were 
raised with praise and admiration around us as well. We entered the Whirling 
World under the hopeful gazes of all our elders. Yet, when we arrived here, it 
was so different.” 



“There are geniuses everywhere. We ended up being between regular 
warriors and above average ones. It’s so hard to accept, that’s why all of us 
lose our minds. We clearly know that something’s wrong, but we’re not willing 
to give it up at all.” 

Thinking about that, Lourain had a melancholic look on his face. 

Jack nodded. He could understand Lourain’s complicated feelings. 

Danger always existed alongside opportunity, but the warriors present would 

end up falling into danger eventually if they acted recklessly. 

Even though he understood Lourain’s feelings, that was not a good reason to 
lose control of their own fates. In a world where the strongest ruled, one would 
only have more chances if they survived! 
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No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3896-Time slowly ticked away. 

After four hours, all of the warriors who signed up stepped on the transfer 
array. 

A purple light shone beneath their feet, and space started to distort. The 
transfer array had been activated. 

While no one was noticing, Jack put his true energy into the nameless badge. 

The badge shone immediately. The light condensed into a thin line and slowly 
circled Lourain. At the final moment, the transfer array’s light would surround 
everyone individually, sending everyone to a different spot 

However, with that thin line, Lourain followed Jack the whole time! 

After fifteen minutes passed, the distorted space finally settled down. After the 
scenery stabilized, the two of them once again found themselves standing on 
solid ground. It felt gray and barren all around them. Even though there was a 
river and mountains in front, it felt devoid of life. 

Looking up, there was no blue sky or white clouds, there was only gray fog. 
They looked like dark clouds that had been dispersed, floating in the air. 



Lourain gulped subconsciously, feeling his body stiffen. 

They were at the foot of a hill. There were some short trees sparsely littered 
around the place. They would constantly hear the sounds of birds chirping. 
However, when they heard that, Lourain merely shuddered as a strange 
feeling crawled up his body. 

He sighed and said stiffly, “Jack, there are some animals, and there’s water 
and even some trees. It has a lot more life compared to Chaos City, but I feel 
like this place is far more terrifying than Chaos City.” 

They could clearly see signs of life around them. Even though it was not 
bursting with it, it was still better than Chaos City. Yet, everything still felt 
strange to Lourain. If Jack was not next to him, he would have started 
shuddering. 

Jack quietly studies his surroundings. 

He raised an eyebrow and said, “That’s because the air of death here is much 
thicker than in Chaos City. It’s not just filled with murderous and cold energy, 
it’s also filled with all sorts of chaotic energy flows. There should not be any 
life here, but there is, so it feels incredibly off.” 

Lourain nodded earnestly, Jack woke him up! 

That uncomfortable feeling came from the wrongness of it all. Everything 
around them felt wrong. It was all just incredibly strange, which caused him to 
shudder. 

Jack patted Lourain’s shoulder, “Let’s determine our direction first. After that, 
he’ll head to the center. Have you looked into what I asked you to?” 

Lourain nodded, “I asked all I could. Demon kings won’t appear in the outer 
regions. Even if we hurry up, we won’t be able to find where the demon kings 
are more active. Only after the battlefield shrinks three times, which is the 
third day, will we be able to find nests of demon kings.” 

Saying that, Lourain pursed his lips. 

There was just too much of a gulf between people. To warriors like him, 
looking into where demon kings were would be to avoid stumbling into them, 
for risk of being ripped apart. 



Yet, Jack was looking for demon kings because he wanted to rip the demon 
kings apart for rewards! 

Jack frowned, “We’ll have to wait for the third day?! It doesn’t seem worth it to 
waste our time on moving. The battlefield will shrink as time goes on anyway, 
and everyone who’s still alive will be moved. We’ll use the time for the smaller 
demons then. They’re still worth something.” 
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No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3897-After hearing what was said, Lourain’s 
eyes twitched. 

If anyone else heard that, they would be so shocked that they would be 
rendered speechless. In their eyes, unique demons and crimson demons 
were already hard enough to deal with. 

Regular warriors would even need to form teams to be able to deal with them. 
Yet, those three types of demons were small in Jack’s eyes. 

Jack felt like they were barely worth it. 

If Lourain did not know Jack’s skills, he would have thought that Jack was a 
complete braggart. They were a bit unlucky, but they had been sent to the 
furthest fringe of the place. 

After the two of them determined their location, they walked forward for 
around two hours. They did not even see a single green demon, let alone 
crimson or unique ones. The two of them even wondered if they were really 
on the Toman Battlefield. 

Even Lourain got a bit anxious. 

The two of them walked past some shallow water, and there was an endless 
field in front of them. There were various kinds ofter rains there. They had 
walked past rivers and forests, but other than the sounds of some birds and 
bugs, they had not seen a single living thing. 

Just as the two of them were wondering about things, a few figures suddenly 
appeared. Lourain was immediately on alert. He turned to look at Jack and 
immediately discarded the notion. He really was too anxious. 



Since the Seven Deaths Array allocated their teammates randomly, and 
thanks to his conflicts with Jack, he had not been able to move around freely. 
He was already separated from his fellow disciples. 

He would always have to move around with them before this, but no matter 
what, his fellow disciples were nothing compared to Jack. Even if they were 
stronger than Lourain, they were not that much stronger. 

They were above average at most and were like ants in front of Jack. 

Every time, they were always on full alert when they went anywhere 
dangerous. After all, there were so many strong warriors in the Whirling 
World. 

If they were not careful, it would end in disaster. Yet, there was no need for 
him to be that afraid at that moment. 

Jack was like a huge guardian. As long as he made sure to rely on Jack, there 
would be no surprises! 

The figures quickly sped toward Jack. 

Lourain raised an eyebrow before he said, “I think these people are probably 
trying to form a team with me.” 

Most of the warriors that entered the Toman Battlefield were regular warriors, 
some of them could barely even be considered that. If they wanted to kill any 
high-level demons, they would need to form teams. Even though they would 
need to split up the rewards, they would be able to guarantee their own safety. 

A total of four of them were coming over. 

As the distance shrunk, Lourain clearly saw how they looked. 

When he saw them, Lourain immediately froze. The four of them froze as well. 

However, they quickly started to look much different. 

There was a pleased smile on their faces, “What a coincidence! I’ve been 
looking for you and your fellow disciple for a month. I thought I wouldn’t be 
able to find you, but I can’t believe I meet you here. It’ll save some time. I 
won’t need to try and tempt you out of the restricted areas!” 



The warriors in front were looking coldly at Lourain as he spoke. 

Lourain’s mouth stiffened as he clenched his teeth, “Taios! Don’t talk like 
you’re all that strong. I know very well what level you’re at! If the two of us 
fight alone, you might not be able to beat me!” 
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No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3898-Taios was clearly angered by what was 
said. 

He narrowed his eyes, “Brat! Do you have eyes? You’re still trying to argue 
with me?! It’s fine, you’ll regret it soon! All of these men behind me are my 
fellow disciples!” 

“I was really lucky. After I was sent to the isolated space, I managed to find 
them very quickly! I came over because I wanted to ask some strangers to 
join us in hunting the demons, but I can’t believe I met you instead!” 

The two of them talked amongst themselves, and Jack more or less guessed 
their relationship. 

Lourain still looked at Jack anxiously. He had not even done anything for 
Jack, but he had already caused trouble. If he was Jack, he would definitely 
not be happy about the situation. 

Lourain tried to look at Jack’s expression, but Jack remained calm. It was hard 
to tell anything from it, which made him panic even more. 

The more emotionless Jack was, the harder it was to determine what Jack 
was thinking. 

At that moment, Jack suddenly said in a low voice, “You know each other?” 

Jack naturally already knew that they did, and knew that they had some past 
conflicts as well. He only said that to give Lourain a chance to explain things. 

Lourain was no idiot, he had naturally understood what Jack meant. 

He quickly tried to explain things simply, “Before entering the Whirling World, I 
got to know these people. However, we’re not from the same world, but we 
still ended up having some conflicts because of some competitive reasons. 



After that, my fellow disciples ended up conflicting with us because we were 
fighting over golden keys in Chaos City..” 

“Those guys were worse than my fellow disciples, and Taios’ hand was almost 
crippled. He had a younger disciple called Cayden as well. That guy’s skill is 
around my level. At the time, we had the number advantage, and Cayden was 
heavily injured by me. However, it’s already been a month, so he should have 
already recovered.” 

Jack nodded. There were constant fights in Chaos City. With the allure of the 
treasures that could be obtained, quite a few people had died in the city 
before. 

Conflict and death were the mainstays in Chaos City. 

Lourain did not know the other two who were behind Cayden and Taios at all. 
However, that did not stop the four of them from attacking together later. After 
all, they were all fellow disciples. 

Taios and the others were looking at Lourain angrily, wanting to rip Lourain 
apart. 

Lourain merely sighed helplessly before he looked at Jack. 

He was very afraid that Jack would not bother with it. After all, he was the 
cause of all of this, even if there was nothing they could do about this chance 
encounter! 

Just as Lourain was praying for Jack to help him, Taios suddenly said, “A 
warrior from a third-grade world? I guess the two of you are part of the same 
team. Since that’s the case, I’ll deal with you as well. After all, it’ll only cause 
trouble if word gets out.” 

“If you want to blame anyone, blame the person next to you. You wouldn’t die 
if you weren’t with him. When you’re in hell, don’t forget that you died because 
of him!” 

After that was said, Lourain immediately shut his mouth. There was a glint of 
excitement in his eyes 



That idiot had helped him at the right time. He had actually decided to attack 
Jack. If Taios had not said all of that, he would have needed to beg Jack, but 
it was all unnecessary at that moment! 

It really was such a stupid thing to do! Lourain almost laughed at that moment. 

Looking at Lourain’s rapidly changing expression, the three of them were 
stunned! 

That guy was feeling happy? 

Was he crazy? 
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No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3899-Taios frowned, “Brat, what are you 
acting so excited for?! Do you think that you’ll be able to stand up to the four 
of us with just you and a warrior from a third- grade world?” 

After that, he paused for a moment before he laughed coldly, “You really are 
falling further and further down. Even if you formed a group with others to kill 
demons, you should have chosen a warrior from a second-grade world. Most 
warriors from third-grade worlds are all rubbish.” 

“This time, the Toman Battlefield is open to everyone in the Whirling World so 
any idiot can join. You just randomly decided to team up with a warrior from a 
third- grade world, but he can’t even beat a servant!” 

Those words were all targeted at Jack, basically describing Jack as being 
completely useless. He did not bother to hide the mocking tone in his voice. 

After Lourain heard all of that, he could not help but desperately stop himself 
from laughing. After all, this guy mocking and laughing at Jack was just 
completely disrespecting Jack. 

He would never dare to do that, but this guy really was hilarious! Lourain’s 
face twisted as he tried to resist laughing. 

Taios’ lips stiffened, realizing that there was something wrong with Lourain. 

Could there be something different? 



However, no matter how he thought about it, he could not figure out what was 
wrong. He felt like Taios was probably just trying to scare them, showing that 
expression to confuse the four of them! 

If that were the case, then it would be much easier to understand. 

Taios took a deep breath, “Don’t think we’ll be afraid just because you’re 
acting like this. No matter what happens today, you won’t be able to escape 
our grasp! However, if you kneel and beg me right now, I can make it so you 
die a quicker death!” 

Lourain raised an eyebrow and said coldly, “Who do you think you are, asking 
me to beg you just like that? Remember what you’ve said. You’ll know very 
soon who the one begging for mercy should be!” 

Taios frowned as he looked at Lourain coldly. 

He appraised Lourain a few times, “What do you mean? Are you saying 
you’ve improved so much that you’re already firmly amongst the strong right 
now?” 

What if that was the case? 

Even if Lourain was already an above-average warrior, he was still probably at 
the tail end of those at that level. 

The four of them might not be above average, but if they worked together, 
Lourain would still be no match for them no matter how much he had 
improved. 

After thinking about that, Taios looked at Jack again. 

At that moment, Jack had already changed his looks, putting on a handsome 
appearance. He looked incredibly ordinary and introverted, not seeming any 
different from a regular warrior. 

On top of that, he was dressed quite ordinarily, not having any symbols of a 
second-grade world on him. It was hard to think of him as someone strong. 

Taios frowned before he pointed at Jack and said, “Are you two trying to fool 
us? You need to think about your acting skills first. This guy clearly looks like 
he’s not very capable.” 



Jack coldly looked at Taios before he said, “If you have so much to say, are 
you going to fight? If you are, then just attack right now!” 

They were not in a restricted area anyway, so there was nothing to be afraid 
of. 

Normally, Jack would always let his opponent make the first move. It was not 
because of any particular reason. It was just because he wanted to witness 
and experience other techniques. That was even though those techniques 
would not be threatening to him at all. 

Read No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3900 

No. 1 Supreme Warrior Chapter 3900-There were various benefits to seeing 
more techniques. 

Jack felt like he still lacked a lot of battle experience. The Whirling World had 
various rules in place, so he was naturally unrivaled within. 

However, once he was out of the Whirling World, he would definitely face 
warriors that were stronger than him. It would be much harder at that point. If 
he had enough experience, he could come up with strategies on the fly that 
would help him. 

Taios widened his eyes, not expecting the plain-looking man would dare to 
talk to him like that. 

He was acting so arrogantly, asking them to attack! 

It was as if he was the strongest person in the Whirling World! 

Taios clenched his teeth and said, “I’ve really seen everything now. It’s my 
first time seeing someone as suicidal as you!” 

When he heard that, Lourain’s lips constantly twitched. He had a lot to say, 
but he swallowed those words. Taios’ words were just too funny for Lourain. 

Taios mocked Jack for being suicidal! 

It was more and more amusing the more he listened to it. However, he 
thought about how he had said similar things before as well. 



At the plaza in front of the city, he had met Jack for the first time. He had 
completely looked down on Jack because Jack was from a third-grade world, 
and had mocked Jack quite a lot. At the time, Jack did not even want to bother 
with him. 

Thinking about that, Lourain took a deep breath, discarding all his errant 
thoughts. Various emotions were playing in his head. 

Jack did not even bother looking at the eyes that were fixed right at him in 
front of him. He did not show any emotion. 

Taios’ lips twitched. It was hard to blame him for having reservations. 

Mainly, Lourain’s expression was just too strange. Unless that guy was 
changed by something, there was no way Lourain’s expression would be like 
this when he met the four of them. 

Taios realized with some surprise that, the more he said, the stranger 
Lourain’s expression got. 

The hint of mockery in Lourain’s eyes grew. That mockery was not fake, it was 
completely sincere. If it was sincere, then there was definitely something 
strange about the situation. 

Taios’ lips twitched and his expression stiffened a bit. 

At that moment, various thoughts were playing in his head. He constantly 
made guesses, but he did not have much to go on! 

The only thing on his mind was that Lourain had improved himself to the peak 
in just a month. Even the four of them together would be no match for Lourain. 
Otherwise, there was no way Lourain would look like that. 

Cayden thought the same as Taios. 

He had a frown on his face as well, looking right at Lourain the whole time. 
Various thoughts constantly played in his mind, but he could not figure it out at 
all. 

It was like countless threats were entangled together, unable to be cut off and 
being incredibly chaotic. 



Cayden looked at Taios and said, “What is this guy doing? Is he really not 
afraid of the four of us working together? Could the third-grade warrior next to 
him be someone very strong?” 

Thinking about it for a long time, that was the only thing he could come up 
with. Taios frowned as he looked at Lourain. 

After that, he looked at Jack, carefully trying to make sense of it all. 

Jack looked incredibly ordinary. Whether it was his looks or demeanor, 
nothing seemed particularly out of place. 

If It was not for Lourain’s strange expression, he would have completely 
ignored that person. That person just felt completely inconsequential. No 
matter how one thinks of it, that person should not be strong at all. 

The fact that he came from a third-grade world only reinforced the idea. 

 


