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C15 It's All Right Now

The sun was shining brightly, and the cool breeze from under the shade of the trees
was making the air cool.

But even so, Xia Jinsheng did not feel relaxed or satisfied at all. On the contrary, her
forehead was drenched in cold sweat.

He raised his hand to wipe her sweat and asked with a puzzled expression, "Mommy,
are you very hot?"

Looking at that ignorant little face, Xia Jinsheng couldn't vent out any more anger in
her heart. She hugged the little guy in fear, her voice a little hoarse.

"lovely kid, next time you are not allowed to run away without saying a word. Do you
know that you're still a child?"

It was the first time Xia Jinsheng said such serious words to her, causing the little girl
to be stunned. She only knew that she had done something wrong and lowered her
head, "Mommy, I'm sorry."

rubbed her head, and out of the corner of her eyes, she saw Gu Wensheng, who had
just finished conversing, walking towards her. Immediately, her heart leaped into her
throat.

"How is it?" Xia Jinsheng looked at him in anticipation, hoping to hear the answer she
needed from his mouth.

Fortunately, Gu Wensheng did not disappoint her. Following his nod of his head, Xia
Jinsheng's legs softened and he almost fell to the ground in a sorry state. Gu Wensheng
reacted quickly and helped her up.

"Are you alright?" Gu Wensheng's voice was filled with concern, her pale white face
made him frown, no one expected such a thing to happen today.

Gu Nanchen did not know whether it was good or bad to know of the existence of the
lovely kid.



Seeing the culprit that caused all of this, Gu Wensheng had initially complained about
the little fellow's mischievousness, but when he saw Xia Guang pout her lips in
grievance, he no longer felt angry, just like Xia Jinsheng.

Xia Jinsheng shook her head, and raised her eyes to look through the tree to see Gu
Nanchen, who was not far away from the window on the second floor.

She couldn't see his expression, but she could feel his angry gaze locking onto her.

Pulling on Gu Wensheng's sleeve, Xia Jinsheng said in a low voice, "Let's go back
first."

Gu Wensheng also knew that staying near the Old Manor was not a safe thing to do.
Very soon, he drove Xia Jinsheng out of the place, back to the place where they settled
the little guy.

The little guy went out to do some crazy things, and when he returned home, he was
sound asleep. He knew that she had slept soundly in order to avoid Xia Jinsheng's
scolding. Xia Jinsheng helplessly placed her back into the children's room for her
afternoon nap.

When she came out of the room, Gu Wensheng had just came out of the kitchen and
poured her a cup of water. Xia Jinsheng took a look and saw that it was jasmine tea
that had just been brewed.

His drowsy mind had cleared up quite a bit.

"second uncle probably won't tell Grandfather, right?" Xia Jinsheng held the water in
her hand and took a sip. Just thinking of how the Gu family members might know of
the rolling existence of this place, felt her scalp go numb.

"Ugh …"

Gu Wensheng muttered to himself for a moment, then slowly answered, "Probably not,
after all my reasoning is quite convincing."

"Uncle, did you lie to second uncle about something?" Xia Jinsheng suddenly perked
up and looked at him mockingly.

In the Gu family, this uncle of his was famous for being loyal, honest, and easy to
bully. Now he was even lying to his doting second brother.

Xia Jinsheng looked ridiculing, she had discovered that her first uncle was not that
'virtuous', but how many of the people that lived in the Gu family were truly 'virtuous'?



Gu Wensheng was not moved in the slightest by her teasing, the words "Aren't you
talking nonsense" were clearly written on his handsome face.

After drinking the warm and fragrant flower tea, Xia Jinsheng comfortably squinted
her eyes and casually asked: "Uncle, how did you deceive my second uncle?"

"I said roll rolling is my child, we look so much like each other."

He sat opposite to her, with a face full of leisure and self-satisfaction, his expression
identical to Xia Jinsheng's, revealing the harmony of collusion between the two of
them.

"Puff …"

Xia Jinsheng very shamelessly spat out a mouthful of water. Gu Wensheng did not
react to her sudden attack, her handsome face was drenched and she was in a sorry
state. At the same time, the cold energy being emitted from her entire body could not
even be stopped.

"Xia, Jin, Sheng!" Gu Wensheng gritted his teeth as he looked at her, and angrily
wiped the water off his face. The sticky feeling on his face made Gu Wensheng want
to fiercely beat this girl up.

Xia Jinsheng laughed in embarrassment, and immediately went to the bathroom to get
a towel and ask for forgiveness.

"Uncle, please use it. Hurry up and wipe it."

He took the towel in her hand with a face full of black lines. Even though he knew it
was not dirty, he still felt that it was odd. After wiping it a few times, he threw it down
angrily and walked out.

"Hey hey hey, Uncle, where are you going?" Xia Jinsheng could not hold back her
laughter, but her shoulders still trembled uncontrollably.

Thus, Eldest Uncle must go back and thoroughly wash up.

But not long after Gu Wensheng left, Xia Jinsheng could no longer laugh.

Gu Wensheng still has a banquet to attend tonight. Although it's fine if you don't want
to go back to eat dinner, she won't be able to. He had a lot of things to settle recently,
but the little guy just came along with her. Now, everything was a mess, causing her to
have a big headache.



After thinking for a long time, sshe still couldn't think of a reason. Xia Jinsheng
stroked her hair, and without doing anything, he returned to her room and took a nap
with her arms folded across her chest.
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