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Contrary to the day outside, Gu Ge clearly handed a medicine bag to Qiao qiuruo.

The crimson lips are like elves in the dark night. Between opening and closing, people
have the magic of subconscious listening. "The things here can help you realize your
wishes."

When he came out of the bar, the cool wind dispersed the blush on his cheeks, and the
sun was dazzling. Qiao qiuruo summoned a car to Gu Wensheng's villa.

The medicine paper in her pocket had been wet with sweat. She was very nervous.
Thinking of the effect of this medicine and what to do next, every cell in my body was
full of energy.

In the tense atmosphere, he unknowingly arrived at his destination, paid a hundred
yuan, forgot to take his change, and pushed the door open.

Gu Wensheng sat in the living room and talked with a man happily. Qiao qiuruo's
pupils narrowed a little. The woman was Chu nianwan. Unexpectedly, she would be
here.

"Why are you here?" Gu Wensheng's smile faded and his eyebrows frowned slightly.
He clearly had asked Qiao qiuruo to leave, but she appeared again to disturb his calm
heart lake.

Subtle changes were seen by Qiao qiuruo, so hurtful that he wouldn't even give her a
smile?

"I'm here to pick up my luggage. Guests, let me go and pour you a glass of water first.
"

Early in the morning, she thought of an excuse, but she said it, and her mood was so
bitter. Before Gu Wensheng refused, she turned and went to the kitchen.

Gu Wensheng had planned to stop her, but he was sorry to find that he came from Chu
nianwan to deliver something to her without drinking a mouthful. It didn't stop.



She got three glasses of water, put her body on her back to block the sight of others,
and then took out a bag of medicine from her pocket, sprinkled it in two cups, stirred it
evenly, and then took it out.

Two glasses of water with medicine, one for Gu Wensheng and one for himself.

Yes, Qiao qiuruo, encouraged by Gu Ge, decides to give Gu Wensheng medicine to
facilitate a relationship. There's only one chance. She can't wait. According to his rigid
character, he will take responsibility even if he is reluctant afterwards.

If you can't get his heart, find a way to get his body. Qiao qiuruo doesn't think it's bad.

Unfortunately, Gu Wensheng didn't move the glass of water. Chu nianwan noticed that
the subtle atmosphere between them didn't stay long and went out.

Gu Wensheng sent her out. When she came back, Qiao qiuruo looked at the glass of
water with a strong persistence.

Thinking she was thirsty, Gu Wensheng said, "if you want to drink, you can drink it
directly. I haven't drunk it yet."

Qiao qiuruo shook her head and Gu Wensheng planned to drink by herself. She looked
at his every move.

Weird, it's so weird. Although Gu Wensheng had a ripple of doubt in his heart, he
didn't think much. His lips had touched the edge of the cup.

The melodious phone rang untimely. After Gu Wensheng connected, he answered, and
then got up to go outside.

"What's the matter?" How could Qiao qiuruo watch him leave? He got up excitedly
and wanted to stop him. He was worried that the action was too abrupt to arouse his
suspicion.

"Just go outside and get an express."

Their community here is heavily guarded. General express can only be taken at the
door of the community. Gu Wensheng can only take it in person.

"It's all right. I'll just get it."

Not allowing him to react, Qiao qiuruo rushed out with an arrow. Now she wants Gu
Wensheng to finish drinking water and don't go out.



In order to be efficient, she took a shortcut and walked in a hurry, so she didn't notice
Chu Nian's late return. The two people staggered.

In the villa, Gu Wensheng felt thirsty and drank the water. Then he went upstairs and
continued to stay in the studio.

After a while, I felt the heat rising, so I went to reduce the air conditioner by several
degrees. It was clear that the autumn season was about to turn, but it was still hot and
flustered.

At this time, the doorbell rang. He didn't think it was Qiao qiuruo, because the latter
had the key here. When he went down to open the door, he found that it was Chu
nianwan.

"Why are you back?"

Chu Nian was a little embarrassed on his face. He had a bad memory these days. He
was confused and pretended to calm up. "Do you remember what I asked you a few
days ago?"

Her face was white and red in the golden sun. Gu Wensheng's Adam's apple rolled. I
don't know why she felt a little thirsty.

Moving away from his sight, Gu Wensheng staggered and let her in, "remember, your
friend's painting still has a signature."

When the fragrant wind brushed his face, Gu Wensheng only felt that his lower
abdomen was tight and gave birth to some thoughts that he shouldn't have, and his
body was also hot and dry.

What's the matter?

To put her paintings in the studio, Chu nianwan has been walking in front. She is
familiar with here and doesn't need to be polite to Gu Wensheng. Just walking behind
her, Gu Wensheng felt more and more wrong.

The body is getting hotter and hotter, and there is a certain desire in the heart. He can't
wait to strip off all his clothes. In a twinkling of an eye, Chu Nian opened the door of
the studio to ask him which picture it was.

The words came to his mouth, but he didn't ask. Looking at Gu Wensheng's
appearance, he couldn't help shouting. God, he is flushed and looks like roasted shrimp.

"Why are you here?" As soon as his hand touched his skin, he was so hot that he was



scared to shrink his hand. However, he suddenly clasped her shoulder tightly, and all
the breath of fire sprayed on her face. She as like as two peas of the morning bell. She
suddenly remembered that after taking some medicine, the symptoms were exactly the
same as he is now. She was so scared that she wanted to run away, but it was late. Gu
Wensheng, who lost his reason, pushed her with red eyes and stripped her clothes one
by one. Rough and disorganized“ What are you doing? Let me go, or I'll be rude to
you. We can't do this. " In the past, Gu Wensheng would have let go of her long ago,
and would not have done such a strange thing, but now the medicine has destroyed his
reason. The brain with no thinking ability at all, and her chaotic eyes have been
bewitched by the snow-white skin in front of her. Gu Wensheng only knows that the
body is very cold, which can relieve the heat on him... There are some twists and turns
in the middle, and Qiao qiuruo runs back nonstop. Gu Ge gives her strong medicine,
just in case she takes it herself. But fortunately, the weight is small. It's OK to restrain.
Then she found a pair of women's shoes that shouldn't have appeared here in the
hallway. As soon as she breathed, she immediately had a bad feeling in her heart. She
couldn't go up and ran upstairs. The open study door made her uneasy. She didn't
notice that she fell on the stairs. Hiss... It really hurts, especially after the teeth
accidentally hit the lip. She didn't care. She almost crawled on the stairs, and then she
saw an unforgettable scene in her life. The man rushes on the woman rudely like a
creeping beast, and the people under him are tortured like minors. Tears spend his face,
and Bei teeth bite his lips white, so there is still a broken groan overflow... For a
moment, Qiao qiuruo only feels that his world has collapsed with a bang. She didn't
know that tears were pouring out like a flood breaking the dike. She covered her lips
and didn't want anyone to find out. Tears blurred her sight and burned in her body. She
swallowed the nerve called reason inch by inch. She knew she couldn't go anymore if
she didn't go now. He stumbled out and opened the door with the stunned eyes of his
aunt and his party“ How dare you come... "Before the old man finished his lesson,
Qiao qiuruo ran out without looking back. Her strange reaction confused the people
who came. Chu Yu patted Gu Jun's hand and took the hand of a girl with a strange face.
"Didn't he say he wanted to have a blind date? Let's go first and let Wen Sheng come
out. " There was no shadow of Gu Wensheng downstairs. It could only be upstairs.
Worried about Gu Jun's bad temper, Chu Yu kept walking in front. As a result, after
seeing the scene in the study, he fainted“ Ah, Mrs. Chu, you... My God. " The girl who
was brought has been sitting on the sofa. As a result, she went up to find someone
without any movement. When I saw her fall to the ground, I was scared and screamed.
I saw the picture in the study again, and my mind went blank. The old man also
followed up. After discovering this annoying thing, he was very angry, and the
movement in the study has been increasing. When he was about to rush in, an
accompanying junior stopped him: "Grandpa, wait for uncle. This symptom is a bit
like taking medicine." The young man studied medicine. At a glance, he saw that Gu
Wensheng was abnormal. The old man, with a black face and a cold hum, slammed the
door and took Chu Yu down to take her to the hospital. In such a large living room, the
window was slowly opened, and the flow of a trace of wind could not be felt. The
atmosphere was suppressed to a few points, which only made people feel suffocating



and out of breath. The little girl who came to the blind date didn't think she would
encounter such a thing. Her face was pale, and she didn't dare to go out. She bowed
her head like a quail“ Xiao He. " Mr. Gu made a sound, like a stable sound line of a
century old well, "today's thing..." "why didn't you see today's thing? I don't know
anything." He is worthy of being the person he chose himself. His skill of looking at
people's eyes is not ordinary. Gu Jun feels it's a pity to see such an exquisite girl now.
A good daughter-in-law should be gone now. The girl who asked Xiao He to leave
silently. She didn't dare to offend her family's power in the city, but felt it a pity. Gu
Jun's anger grew deeper and deeper, and asked the people around him to check the
whole story. Even if he was angry, his reason was still there. Gu Wensheng had always
refused him to give him a blind date. He could not change his mind so easily in a short
time, let alone have a relationship with Chu nianwan. There must be something behind
it that he doesn't know. Qiao qiuruo didn't know where she had gone. She only
remembered that it was a dark alley. The voices of several gangster youths nearby
made her nervous. Suddenly a clear voice sounded behind her, "Oh, I found a little
wild cat."
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