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Chapter 501: Chapter 197: Breaking the Five Elements Formation 

The white figure had appeared so abruptly, but thanks to Lin Jing’s timely reaction, he 
barely dodged it. 

After evading, Lin Jing realized that he and the others had been separated and could no 
longer see anyone else. 

Just as Lin Jing was pondering how to search for the others, a fluctuation suddenly 
came from not far behind him, followed by a muffled groan. 

Then came an exclamation: 

“What the hell is this thing?” 

Clearly, someone other than Lin Jing had also encountered an attack, just like him. 

Immediately after, Lin Jing felt strong fluctuations of cultivation energy behind him, with 
immense spiritual power erupting and stirring the mist into disarray. 

Since they were all close together before, Lin Jing felt it particularly keenly. 

Judging by the situation, it seemed that some of the others were engaged in a fight with 
the white figure. 

However, the fight didn’t last long, only a few breaths’ time before it ceased. 

At that moment, a voice came from ahead. 

“What’s going on?” 

This voice was somewhat aged, likely belonging to the Island Master of True Dragon 
Island. 

No sooner had the Island Master’s voice faded away than another voice arose from a 
short distance behind Lin Jing: 



“It’s nothing…” 

“Just now we ran into a puppet attack, but it’s been dealt with.” 

Then, Bai Yi’s voice came from the front: 

“Be careful. There are quite a few formations here. If we’re not cautious, even the three 
of us could end up in hot water.” 

“Don’t worry, Island Master, we’ll be careful…” from not far beside Lin Jing, Xue Yilin’s 
voice followed. 

Although they were not far apart, Lin Jing could not detect Xue Yilin’s presence even 
when expanding his Divine Sense. 

He could only determine his location by sound, which was not far from him. 

“Don’t get too far away; stay close to us…” 

Bai Yi’s voice came through again. 

“Okay…” 

Afterward, Lin Jing followed the voices, groping his way forward. 

Before long, the group had gathered again. 

Even the cultivator who had gotten a bit further away due to the puppet attack arrived 
shortly after the others had regrouped. 

After everyone had come together, Bai Yi brought out a copper candle Magical 
Treasure that emitted a bright red flame, casting a hazy red glow that enveloped them 
all. 

The light from the flame dispersed much of the white mist around them. 

Their line of sight instantly broadened from an initial range of about a meter to more 
than ten meters. 

“From here on out, be cautious…” 

Bai Yi spoke, issuing a warning, and then he led the group onward. 

With the copper candle illuminating the way, their visibility greatly improved. This time, 
when they encountered another sneak attack, Lin Jing finally got a clear view of the 
assailant. 



It was a humanoid puppet, completely white, blending in with the mist and hard to 
detect. 

This time, with a wide-open view. 

The humanoid puppet was noticed before it could launch an attack. 

The three Island Masters at the front, upon spotting the puppet, took action immediately. 
With a single strike, the puppet burst apart, scattering its materials all over the ground. 

The puppet was not very strong. 

Even Lin Jing and the others found it easy to deal with. 

The only issue was that the puppet could launch a surprise attack from within the mist, 
catching one off guard. 

Now, with the copper candle Magical Treasure enhancing their visibility, the puppet’s 
only advantage—its concealment—no longer existed, so naturally, it posed no threat to 
the group. 

In this manner, Lin Jing and the rest proceeded without incident, safely emerging from 
the range of the white fog. 

Leaving the range of the white mist, the group finally arrived in front of a valley. 

At the entrance of the valley, there was a huge Formation blocking the way. 

This Formation was different from others; it was a combination of five smaller 
Formations, each of a different color. These five smaller Formations overlapped to form 
the massive Formation before them. 

And furthermore, 

Atop this Formation, five-colored lights were intertwined, constantly shifting. 

Upon seeing this Formation, Bai Yi turned his head towards the others and said, 

“Next, it’s your turn.” 

Upon hearing this, Lin Jing and the others immediately stepped forward. 

At that moment, Xue Yilin turned his head to Lin Jing and said, 

“Lin Daoyou, when we start breaking the Formation, we’ll need your help.” 



“Just listen to me when the time comes. You act when I tell you to.” 

“Alright…” Lin Jing nodded in agreement. 

After that, Xue Yilin and the other four went up to the Formation and began to study it. 

To Lin Jing’s surprise, Xue Yilin turned out to be an Array Master as well. 

But on second thought, it made sense. 

Apart from the three Island Masters, there were only six of them brought for the 
exploration of the Five Elements Cave Mansion. 

Since they were brought along, obviously there was a need for their abilities. 

In this Cave Mansion, aside from the omnipresent Five Elements, the most abundant 
were the various Formations. 

In this way, it was quite reasonable. 

After the few of them stepped forward, the three Island Masters retreated to the side, 
quietly watching them. 

After exploring, Xue Yilin and the others discussed for a while and then each began to 
bring out their Array Plates. 

They started to work on solving the Formation. 

At the entrance’s Five Elements Great Formation, each of the five of them was 
responsible for one. 

Thus, they alternated between forming hand seals and manipulating their Array Plates, 
attempting to merge their Array Plates into the Formation. 

About an hour later, the large combined Formation that was originally mixed together 
had been separated, and the assorted Five Elements Power that had been swirling 
around it also returned to their respective smaller Formations. 

At this moment, Xue Yilin spoke to Lin Jing, 

“Lin Daoyou, it’s your turn now…” 

“Please use the Five Elements Divine Art and, according to the theory of the mutual 
conquest of the Five Elements, transfer the Five Elements Power within each 
Formation.” 



“Remember, you must do it simultaneously.” 

“Otherwise, if the Five Elements become imbalanced, the Formation will immediately 
become a Killing Formation, and we will all be in trouble.” 

Lin Jing nodded and then approached the Formation. 

At this time, Xue Yilin and the others, each controlling one Formation, were completely 
tied up with the task at hand. 

Lin Jing then came next to Xue Yilin. 

The Formation controlled by Xue Yilin was crimson, representing fire. 

Fire conquers metal, and metal is white. 

Next, Lin Jing looked towards the person controlling the white Formation, who was the 
Cultivator that had been attacked by a Puppet earlier. 

Lin Jing needed to transfer the fire attribute power within the Formation controlled by 
Xue Yilin to the metallic Five Elements Formation of the Cultivator who had been 
attacked, to break this smaller Formation. 

That was the method. 

However, the Formation was a combined Fusion Formation of the Five Elements, and 
Lin Jing needed to use the power within all five Formations simultaneously for the 
transfer. 

No wonder only Cultivators who had practiced the Five Elements Cultivation Technique 
could accomplish this task. 

If it were other Cultivators, due to their own attributes and the limitations of their 
Cultivation Methods, it would be very difficult to maintain the balance of the five 
properties during the transfer. 

Perhaps, if they were not careful, due to an imbalance of attributes, the entire endeavor 
would fail, turning the Formation into a Killing Formation. 
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Chapter 502: Chapter 198: Enter the Valley, Into the Palace 

Lin Jing first stood before the Formation, observing for a while. 

After observing, Lin Jing had devised a plan, and then began to take action. 

Subsequently. 

Lin Jing channelled the Spiritual Power within his body, using the method of the Five 
Elements Divine Art, releasing five different streams of Spiritual Power. 

These streams of Spiritual Power, each a different color, corresponded precisely with 
the five Formations. 

After Lin Jing’s Spiritual Power infiltrated them, it merged with the Formation’s Five 
Elements Spiritual Force within a short time. 

Once these powers merged, Lin Jing began to control his own Spiritual Power, using it 
as a primer to stimulate the Formation’s Spiritual Power and start to mobilize the Five 
Elements Power within it. 

At first, Lin Jing’s Spiritual Power only caused slight fluctuations in the Five Elements 
Power within the Formation. 

Gradually, as time passed, Lin Jing’s Spiritual Power slowly took the dominant role, 
drawing the Five Elements Spiritual Force to keep moving within the Formation. 

Only when he felt the timing was right, did Lin Jing control the transference of the Five 
Elements Power within each Formation. 

During this step, Lin Jing was extremely cautious. 

Even the Island Masters of the three great islands stretched out their Divine Sense, 
continuously scanning the surroundings to clear any interference for Lin Jing. 

If Lin Jing were to be disturbed at this moment, it would spell disaster. 

The Formation would transform into a Killing Formation, sweeping Lin Jing and the 
others into it. Even if they were fortunate enough to survive, they would surely be 
gravely injured. 

At that time, the Formation would become extremely dangerous, and breaking the 
Formation would become dozens of times more difficult. 

Therefore, the Island Masters from the three great islands also acted with extreme 
caution, fearing any unexpected incidents might occur. 



Time ticked away, and only after two quarters of an hour did the Five Elements Power 
within the Formation finally get transferred completely. 

Just as the Five Elements Power within the Formation had been fully transferred, the 
Formation began to show changes. 

Initially combined as one large Formation, it collapsed instantaneously after Lin Jing 
completed the transference of the Five Elements Power, reverting back to five smaller 
Formations. 

These five smaller Formations then dimmed and, moments later, sunk into the ground 
and disappeared. 

The Five Elements Formation at this entrance was thus broken. 

With the disappearance of the Five Elements Formation, the scenery inside the valley 
also re-emerged. 

Lin Jing stood at the entrance, looking inside… 

He could see the lush and verdant inside, full of vitality, with a vast palace occupying 
hundreds of mu, settled in the center of the valley. 

Lin Jing looked towards the palace in the valley and found that it was also built with the 
convergence of the Five Elements in mind. 

In each of the five directions of this Five Elements palace, there extended an annex hall. 

And. 

These five annex halls each had a distinct color. 

Red, yellow, blue, black, and white, these five palaces corresponded exactly to the Five 
Elements. 

However, of these five annexes, three had collapsed, leaving only the black and blue 
ones intact. 

If one were to consider the Five Elements, they would correspond precisely to the 
elements of water and wood within the Five Elements. 

A larger Five Elements Formation enveloped these palaces, within which the Five 
Elements Power circulated. 

But now only blue and black remained. 



Looking at the situation, this Five Elements Formation should be based on the five 
annex halls, ultimately converging at the central main hall, forming a large Formation. 

At this moment. 

The Island Masters of the three great islands also raised their heads, eyes flickering 
with unusual light, gazing at the palace within the valley. 

Soon after, Bai Yi opened his mouth, addressing everyone: 

“Let’s go…” 

“We’re going inside.” 

“There are many Formations inside that need to be deciphered slowly; this is not the 
time to rush.” 

The Demon Lord of Myriad Demons and the Island Master of True Dragon Island 
nodded, then followed Bai Yi towards the valley. 

Lin Jing and the others stood aside, allowing the three Island Masters to enter first. 

After the Island Masters had entered, Lin Jing and his group followed behind them. 

…… 

Walking through the valley, everyone was cautious. 

The valley wasn’t calm inside, though from the outside, it seemed quite ordinary. 

But once inside, the situation was entirely different. 

There were many formations here. 

Most of these formations were hidden, so Lin Jing and his companions found their 
journey far from smooth. 

It took several days for the group to break through the formations along the way and 
arrive at the entrance to the palace. 

When they reached the entrance to the palace, they all breathed a sigh of relief, 
including the three great Island Masters. 

After breaking through the valley’s formations, only the palace formations remained, 
bringing them closer to their destination. 



At that moment. 

At the entrance to the palace, another Five Elements Grand Formation appeared, much 
like the one at the entrance to the valley. 

It was also composed of five smaller Five Elements Formations. 

Afterward, 

the group followed the same steps as before, with Xue Yilin and his companions 
attempting to break the formation first, followed by Lin Jing using the Five Elements 
Divine Art to transfer the Five Elements Power. 

Along the way, they encountered dozens of similar formations, and Lin Jing’s group 
became more adept at breaking them. 

This time, they didn’t take too long to break through the formation at the palace 
entrance and then walked inside. 

Upon entering, there was a spacious square that seemed like a Five Elements 
formation diagram, divided into five smaller squares. 

Three of these smaller squares had been destroyed and were not protected by 
formations, corresponding to the three side halls that had already been breached. 

The other two were still protected by formations. 

At the back of the square was a luxurious palace with an ancient style. 

At this point, Xue Yilin approached Bai Yi and said: 

“Island Master…” 

“According to the message left by my grandfather before his death…” 

“When he and Li Mingwu came here last time, they only opened the Metal, Fire, and 
Earth side halls, taking away the corresponding three Five Elements Command 
Tokens.” 

“Now, only the Water Hall and the Wood Hall remain.” 

“And Li Mingwu, being injured, needs the Spiritual Medicine that can heal his Soul Spirit 
wounds, which is within the Five Elements Wood Hall.” 



“We just have to open these two side halls to get the two tokens, and then, Li Mingwu 
won’t be able to gather all Five Elements Command Tokens to enter the main hall and 
gain the Five Elements inheritance.” 

“Nor will he be able to use the Teleportation Array inside the main hall to enter the Five 
Elements ruins for greater opportunities.” 

“Even more, if possible, the Island Master could trade that Spiritual Medicine for the 
Five Elements Command held by Li Mingwu.” 

As Xue Yilin spoke, the other two Island Masters listened intently. 

When Xue Yilin finished speaking, the True Dragon Island was the first to respond: 

“Bai friend, let’s remember what we agreed upon beforehand…” 

“We help you deal with Li Mingwu, and after opening the two side halls, Demon Lord 
and I each take one Five Elements Command Token, with the rest belonging to you.” 

The Demon Lord of Wan Mo didn’t bother with pleasantries and directly said: 

“I want the Five Elements Water Command Token.” 

Bai Yi responded to the two of them with a smile: 

“Rest assured, dear friends, we already agreed on this beforehand, and I definitely 
won’t go back on my word.” 

“Moreover, once we open the Five Elements ruins, we will need the concerted effort 
from both of you.” 

The Island Master of True Dragon Island said with a smile: 

“In that case… very good…” 

The Demon Lord, meanwhile, simply looked up at the Five Elements Water Hall, paying 
no mind to the other two. 

At this moment, Bai Yi addressed Xue Yilin: 

“Next, taking care of the remaining two side halls will be up to you.” 

Xue Yilin hastened to assure: 

“Rest assured, Island Master.” 



After speaking, Xue Yilin signaled to Lin Jing and the others to approach the formation 
ahead. 

Chapter 503: Chapter 199: Breaking the Five Elements Water Formation 

The first Formation they arrived at was the one with the black Formation Patterns. 

This Formation differed from the ones they had encountered before; the Five Elements 
Power within had already fused together, presenting a five-colored radiance that 
permeated the entire Formation. 

Above the Formation were densely packed, black wave-like Formation Patterns. 

Approaching the Formation, Xue Yilin spoke directly to the group: 

“Fellow Daoists, this Formation is the Five Elements Water Formation, linked to the 
Water Hall. Inside, there is also a Teleportation Array. As long as we break this 
Formation, we’ll be able to enter it through the Teleportation Array.” 

“Furthermore, this Formation is different from those we’ve broken before. The power of 
the Five Elements inside is formidable, which is why we’re presently safe within this 
Formation.” 

“In a moment, the five of us will need to break the external Five Elements Water 
Formation first. Then, we’ll set up a Restraining Formation to contain the Five Elements 
Power inside.” 

“After that…” 

“It will be up to Lin Daoyou to use the Five Elements Cultivation Technique to control 
that Five Elements Power and transfer it out.” 

“This process may be somewhat cumbersome, so I hope my fellow Daoists will be 
cautious to prevent any mistakes.” 

After hearing this, everyone nodded in agreement. 

Then, Xue Yilin turned to Lin Jing and said: 

“Lin Daoyou, once we open the Formation, I’ll trouble you to transfer the Five Elements 
Power from within the Five Elements Water Formation. You’ll only need to move it 
outside the Formation.” 

“Once drawn out, this Five Elements Power will dissipate on its own.” 

Lin Jing nodded in response. 



The group then began to take action. 

Xue Yilin and the others, one at each position, started to deploy their methods to break 
the Formation. 

It wasn’t easy to break this Formation. 

It took them several hours just to dim the Formation slightly. 

Throughout this time, Lin Jing observed the others. 

He noticed that aside from Xue Yilin and the cultivator who had been previously 
attacked, the others struggled considerably. 

Only those two seemed more at ease. 

It seemed that their understanding of Formations was likely higher, which was why they 
appeared so. 

Especially that attacked cultivator, who possessed a late-stage Nascent Soul cultivation, 
it was no wonder he managed to easily resolve the attacking puppet earlier. 

Several more hours passed, and the Formation Patterns on the Formation dimmed, 
flickering on and off, and the whole Formation seemed on the verge of being broken. 

At this time, the Five Elements Power within the Formation roiled, trying to merge with 
the Formation. However, they were restrained by a small Formation set up jointly by the 
group, and like trapped beasts, they were unable to effect anything. 

Just then, Xue Yilin spoke to Lin Jing: 

“Lin Daoyou, get ready, it’s time for you to act.” 

Lin Jing nodded and prepared himself. 

Sure enough, before long… 

The external layer of the Formation was broken and vanished, and the Five Elements 
Power within the Formation became even more turbulent, causing the Formation that 
the group had set up to shake incessantly. 

Xue Yilin and the others quickly performed hand seals to stabilize the Formation again. 

At that moment, Lin Jing made his move. 



He employed the Five Elements Divine Art, attempting to control the Five Elements 
Power within the Formation. 

However, after trying for a while, Lin Jing found it was not easy to control these forces. 
He couldn’t even quell the Five Elements Power within the Formation slightly. 

Lin Jing furrowed his brow, then, he channeled the Five Elements Divine Art, 
condensing a stream of Wǔ Cǎi radiance that plunged into the Formation. 

With the entry of the Wǔ Cǎi radiance, Lin Jing’s perception of the Five Elements Power 
inside became even clearer. 

Lin Jing could distinctly feel the ferocious aura within; the Five Elements Power was 
incredibly potent, and if it was allowed to burst forth, the entire plaza would likely be 
destroyed. 

Beyond the ferocious aura, Lin Jing also distinctly felt that this Five Elements Power 
didn’t seem to be directly drawn from the natural Five Elements Power of heaven and 
earth. 

It seemed as though it had been cultivated by someone before being condensed into 
being. 

Lin Jing clearly sensed that although he could quell the Five Elements Power within the 
formation by using the Five Elements Divine Art, 

it was extremely draining. 

He feared that if he were to draw out all the Five Elements Power, he would likely 
collapse on the spot, utterly defenseless for the taking. 

Given his current predicament, if he were to expend himself without reserve, leaving no 
energy to resist, 

he might not only gain no advantage but could also potentially plunge himself into real 
danger. 

That would not be a wise move. 

If he did nothing, however, the island masters of the three large islands behind him 
would not let him off. 

Lin Jing looked at the Five Elements Power within the formation. 

Suddenly, an idea flashed through his mind… 



Why not try using the Immortal Five Elements Technique? 

If the Five Elements Power within the formation had indeed been cultivated by 
someone, then using the Immortal Five Elements Technique could likely establish some 
sort of connection with it and bring it under better control. 

And for him, it would be much easier, 

so that after transferring out this Five Elements Power, he wouldn’t be depleted of 
Spiritual Power, leaving him without any strength to resist. 

However, when operating the Immortal Five Elements Technique, he had to be careful 
not to be noticed by others. 

Especially Bai Yi and Xue Yilin. 

For safety’s sake, Lin Jingzhi had not previously revealed that he cultivated the 
Immortal Five Elements Technique. 

So they had always been unaware. 

Now that he wanted to use it, he had to be cautious and it would be best to conceal it 
somehow. 

As for concealing, he cultivated the Changyun Hidden Technique, so even Xue Yilin, let 
alone Bai Yi, couldn’t detect his true cultivation level—there shouldn’t be any major 
issue. 

…… 

While Lin Jing was hesitating, 

Xue Yilin noticed Lin Jing’s odd behavior and asked, 

“Lin Daoyou, what’s wrong?” 

“Is there a problem?” 

While Lin Jing was using the Five Elements Divine Art to control the Wu Cai flowing 
lights and trying to merge into the Five Elements Power of the formation, he replied, 

“This Five Elements Power is quite difficult to control…” 

Following that, Xue Yilin spoke to Lin Jing, 



“Hmm, this formation is the final defense of the side hall, and it is indeed not easy, Lin 
Daoyou, take your time, there is no need to rush…” 

Not only Lin Jing but also the others furrowed their brows at Xue Yilin’s words. 

After all, maintaining the formation was not easy for them either. 

Lin Jing hesitated briefly and then said to the cultivators, 

“I’ll trouble my fellow Daoists then, I will do my best to transfer these Five Elements 
Power out as quickly as possible.” 

Having said this, Lin Jing fell silent and sat down cross-legged, then he condensed 
several streams of Wu Cai lights again and merged them into the formation. 

At the same time, the aura about Lin Jing grew stronger; he appeared to be making an 
all-out effort. 

At this moment, Lin Jing was using the Wu Cai lights to merge into the Five Elements 
Power within the formation. 

At the same time… 

Lin Jing also quietly started to operate the Immortal Five Elements Technique, 
attempting to control the Five Elements Power within the formation with it. 

Chapter 504: Chapter 200: Sudden Change, Black Fog 
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As Lin Jing activated the Immortal Five Elements Technique, the violent Five Elements 
Power became somewhat stabilized. 

Indeed. 

Lin Jing’s guess was correct. 

The Five Elements Power could indeed be controlled by the Immortal Five Elements 
Technique. 

Even though it could be controlled, to completely pacify the Five Elements Power within 
the Formation would still require considerable effort. 

However, Lin Jing was not in a hurry right now. 

If he were to pacify it too quickly, that would truly be problematic. 



Thus, Lin Jing, while using the Five Elements Divine Art to control the colorful stream of 
light, continuously moved through the Formation. 

At the same time, he secretly utilized the Immortal Five Elements Technique to slowly 
control the violent Five Elements Power, allowing that power to gradually calm down. 

Throughout this time, Lin Jing maintained a deep frown, pretending to be fully exerting 
himself, and with the concealment effect of the Changyun Hidden Technique, no one 
noticed anything out of the ordinary. 

In this manner, several hours passed, and the Five Elements Power within the 
Formation slowly returned to a state of calm. 

At this moment, Lin Jing appeared much weaker compared to before, and his face 
showed signs of fatigue. 

Then, Xue Yilin spoke to Lin Jing: 

“Lin Daoyou…” 

“Next, all we need to do is transfer out this Five Elements Power.” 

Lin Jing nodded. 

After that, he controlled the Five Elements Power to move within the Formation, until 
after a moment, Lin Jing said to the others: 

“Fellow Daoists, we can now dismantle the Formation.” 

Hearing Lin Jing’s words, the others also sighed with relief, and then began to dismantle 
the Formation. 

With the dismantling of the Formation, Lin Jing then controlled the Five Elements Power 
to the center of the plaza. 

After that, Lin Jing released his control over the clump of Five Elements Power, and it 
began to slowly dissipate. 

Just as the Five Elements Power was dissipating… 

Suddenly… 

A violent fluctuation emanated throughout the entire space. 

Then, on the ground of the plaza, a gigantic Formation appeared, and upon its 
emergence, several beams of light in various colors shot up into the sky. 



These beams were divided into five colors: red, yellow, green, white, and black, two of 
each color. 

Furthermore, the light beams didn’t gather together but were distributed across the 
plaza in a Formation arrangement. 

After the appearance of the light columns, a pitch-black fog rose from outside the 
palace, and this black fog was slowly moving, crossing over the palace walls and 
surging into the plaza. 

Moreover, this black fog was approaching from all four directions, everywhere at once, 
and in a moment, the people were surrounded by it. 

Xue Yilin’s expression changed dramatically upon seeing the black fog, and his face 
sank as he said: 

“How can this be…” 

A moment later, Xue Yilin said to the others: 

“Fellow Daoists, this black fog is dangerous. Quickly take refuge inside the Formation 
Eyes.” 

As he spoke, Xue Yilin took shelter inside a nearby beam of light that radiated black 
luminance. 

Seeing Xue Yilin’s reaction, Bai Yi furrowed his brows and asked him: 

“What’s going on?” 

Xue Yilin hurriedly explained: 

“Island Master…” 

“An accident must have occurred in the Water Hall of the Five Elements, causing this 
situation. This black fog is different from the white fog outside. It must not be touched at 
all costs. Only by taking refuge within the Formation Eyes can one be safe.” 

Upon hearing Xue Yilin’s words, the first to react was not Bai Yi, but the Demon Lord, 
who promptly summoned a Flying Sword and charged into the black fog. 

However, upon contact with the black fog, the Flying Sword started to slowly dissolve. 

“` 



In just a short while, the Flying Sword lost control, and only half of it clanged onto the 
ground before being devoured by the surging black fog. 

Seeing this, everyone’s expression turned grim. 

At that moment, the Demon Lord spoke to Xue Yilin, asking: 

“How long will this black fog last?” 

Xue Yilin promptly replied: 

“Replying to the Demon Lord, the black fog will persist for three days before it gradually 
dissipates.” 

“We’ll wait here within the Formation Eye for three days, and then the square will be 
safe. At that time, we can head to the Water Hall of Five Elements to see what the 
situation is.” 

After hearing this, the Demon Lord spoke no further and walked straight towards a 
nearby column of light. 

Seeing this, 

the others chose a column of light and entered it as well. 

Lin Jing looked at the black column of light not far ahead, just as he thought to step into 
it. 

However, as soon as Lin Jing moved, the column was claimed by another, none other 
than the cultivator who had been attacked by a puppet before. 

Seeing the column taken, Lin Jing frowned slightly and then chose another direction, 
heading towards a red column of light a little further away. 

This time, they would have to hide within the Formation Eye for three days, and Lin Jing 
did not wish to stay with the others. 

Though Lin Jing preferred solitude, there were others who were close and prepared to 
move to one of the Formation Eyes together. 

Just then, Xue Yilin hurriedly spoke up: 

“Fellow Daoist…” 

“Only one person can be accommodated within each Formation Eye. If too many enter, 
it will not serve any protective purpose. Remember to stay separated.” 



Heeding Xue Yilin’s warning, the two immediately halted their steps and, cupping their 
fists towards Xue Yilin, said: 

“Many thanks for the reminder, Fellow Daoist…” 

After speaking, the two parted ways, heading towards different Formation Eyes. 

There were a total of ten Formation Eyes and there were nine of them, so there was no 
need to compete for space, as there were more than enough to accommodate 
everyone. 

It wasn’t until everyone had entered a Formation Eye that the black fog slowly drifted 
over. 

The black fog was dense, obscuring everything around it so tightly that nothing could be 
seen. 

Quickly, in just a dozen or so breaths, the black fog had already drifted close to the 
farthest unoccupied Formation Eye. 

However, as the black fog neared the Formation Eye, it was directly blocked by the 
column of light. 

It failed to enter the Formation Eye. 

Upon seeing this, everyone finally breathed a sigh of relief. 

Then, the black fog drifted again, approaching the second Formation Eye. 

At this moment, the cultivator inside that Formation Eye was also intently watching the 
black fog with furrowed brows. 

It wasn’t long before the second Formation Eye was engulfed. 

Just like with the first Formation Eye, the column of light kept the black fog at bay. 

The cultivator inside was at last able to ease up. 

In this manner, the black fog surged from all directions, confining Lin Jing and his 
companions within the Formation Eyes. 

The area inside the Formation Eye was not large, only about twenty feet in size, making 
it difficult to move around much. 

Fortunately, everyone was a cultivator, and three days’ time was simply a matter of 
meditating to pass it by. 



Outside the Formation Eye, it was truly ink-like black fog. 

Once outside the Formation Eye, nothing could be seen, such was the density of the 
black fog. 

Moreover, Lin Jing tried to extend his Divine Sense and discovered that even the Divine 
Sense could not probe outwards. If Lin Jing’s Divine Sense could not reach out, it was 
certainly the same for others. 

However, 

fortunately, Lin Jing still had the System Space. If he wanted to investigate, he could 
just use the Observation Mode, so there wasn’t too much to worry about… 
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“` 

Staying within this formation would require at least three days, and during this period, it 
was uncertain whether any accidents might occur. 

Lin Jing naturally did not wish to remain within the Eye of the Formation the entire time. 

Since there was nothing to do at the moment, it was a good opportunity to use the 
System’s Observation Mode to explore the outside situation. 

Having thought of this, Lin Jing immediately called out to the System and entered the 
System Space. 

Upon entering the System Space, Lin Jing spoke again: 

“System!” 

“Enter Observation Mode.” 

As his words fell, the scenery before Lin Jing’s eyes began to change, and moments 
later, his perspective was above the Eye of the Formation. 



At this time, outside was still pitch black. 

The black fog rolled continuously, attempting to invade the interior of the Eye of the 
Formation, but it was blocked by the column of light at the Eye, unable to enter. 

This situation was indeed as Xue Yilin had said; staying within this formation was the 
safest option. 

Previously, Xue Yilin mentioned that his grandfather had entered this place with Li 
Mingwu. 

His knowledge of the Five Elements Cave Mansion stemmed from his grandfather. 

Looking at it this way, the collapse of the three Five Elements Halls was likely caused 
by Li Mingwu during his last visit. 

The palace area was a hundred acres in size, and the location of the side halls was not 
too far from this main hall’s plaza. 

Apart from the three collapsed side halls, there were two intact side halls standing there. 

If Lin Jing wanted to enter the side halls, he could do so by directly using the Fixed 
Point Teleportation function. 

However, it was unknown what dangers, if any, lurked within the Five Elements Hall and 
what treasures it held? 

Lin Jing was quite curious. 

Logically speaking, treasures that would tempt a Divinity Transformation Cultivator must 
be extraordinary. 

At this thought, Lin Jing became somewhat tempted… 

“Perhaps…” 

“I should first use Observation Mode to explore, and if there is no danger, then wouldn’t 
the treasures inside be mine without any cost?” 

After contemplating for a moment, Lin Jing decided to take action. 

Before acting, to avoid any unexpected situations, Lin Jing wanted to first see what the 
others were doing. 

Subsequently, 



Lin Jing controlled Observation Mode to explore other areas. 

Although Lin Jing’s vision was obscured by the black fog in Observation Mode, making 
it impossible to see clearly, 

he already had a good sense of the location of the other Formation Eyes, so he did not 
exert much effort to find the others. 

Then, following the directions in his memory, Lin Jing set out to observe these people… 

Lin Jing first observed those who were closest, 

Some were meditating and cultivating; others were studying their Cultivation 
Techniques, and still, others were looking at the black fog outside, seemingly lost in 
thought. 

That was the state of the Cultivator who had previously been attacked, 

standing in the Eye of the Formation, staring at the black fog in front, seemingly thinking 
about something, 

Or perhaps waiting for something… 

After observing these people, Lin Jing turned his attention to observing the three Island 
Masters. 

The three Island Masters were much calmer, all meditating with their eyes closed. Lin 
Jing also observed the trio for some time and did not manage to discover any secrets 
on their persons. 

So he gave up. 

After checking on the three Island Masters, only Xue Yilin was left. 

Because the Eye of the Formation where Xue Yilin was located was somewhat further 
from Lin Jing, it was only at the end that Lin Jing checked this place. 

When Lin Jing investigated Xue Yilin’s location, he immediately perceived something 
was amiss. 

The black fog near the Eye of the Formation where Xue Yilin was appeared to churn 
violently. 

Confused, Lin Jing continued to probe deeper. 



When Lin Jing moved his observational perspective inside the Eye of the Formation 
where Xue Yilin was, he instantly understood what was happening. 

There before Xue Yilin floated a white token made of an unknown material; in front of 
the token was a Formation about a dozen inches across, suspended in mid-air. 

Moreover, the white token was embedded within this airy Formation. 

Lin Jing brought his observational perspective closer and could see the words “Five 
Elements” on the token. 

The token was strikingly similar to the one Lin Jing had previously obtained from the 
true mystic Ling Yin, 

The only difference being that Lin Jing’s token was red, while this one was white. 

Looking at Xue Yilin himself, he was at that moment forming seals with both hands, his 
lips moving slightly, as though reciting incantations, 

Seemingly in control of this Eye of the Formation. 

As Xue Yilin continued his hand seals, the entire Eye of the Formation, along with the 
black column of light, expanded continuously, eventually doubling in size. 

It was at this moment that a change occurred within the Eye of the Formation. The 
Formation Patterns at the base of the Eye began to operate, 

Before long, they actually formed a Teleportation Array. 

As this Teleportation Array took shape, it began operating immediately. 

At this time, was someone about to be teleported in? 

With the light on the Teleportation Array within the Eye of the Formation growing 
brighter, a vague figure began to appear at its center. 

When the Teleportation Array finished operating, a person materialized at its heart, 

Someone Lin Jing had not expected. 

This person was the very Cultivator who had been attacked by a puppet earlier. 

Xue Yilin had actually summoned this person through the Teleportation Array. 



Moreover, after being teleported in, the man stood within the same Eye of the Formation 
as Xue Yilin, and the Eye exhibited no issues, still blocking the black fog from the 
outside. 

Lin Jing couldn’t help but suspect whether Xue Yilin lied, and more than two people 
could indeed coexist within the pillar of light? 

“` 
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Just as Lin Jing was puzzled, Xue Yilin’s following words startled him as well. 

He saw Xue Yilin giving a respectful bow and said to the man: 

“Senior Li…” 

The cultivator nodded, subsequently starting to transform his appearance, and before 
long, the person turned into a withered old man. 

This old man was very familiar to Lin Jing. Wasn’t it the withered old man Lin Jing had 
encountered in the Devouring Spirit Blood Realm? 

It turned out to be Li Mingwu. 

Li Mingwu actually appeared here, right under the noses of the three Island Masters. 

At this moment, Li Mingwu looked even older and more haggard than last time. 

Upon closer observation, Lin Jing could also see some bloodshot in his eyes, and his 
complexion seemed off, as if he was injured and had not yet fully recovered. 

Then, Lin Jing shifted his Observation Mode to look at Xue Yilin who was nearby. 

From Xue Yilin’s attitude towards Li Mingwu, it was evident that this entire affair was 
closely related to Xue Yilin. 



Without Xue Yilin as an inside agent, it would probably have been difficult for Li Mingwu 
to come in. 

What was unknown was the true identity of Xue Yilin, who could deceive the three 
Island Masters, especially Bai Yi. 

At that moment, Li Mingwu spoke to Xue Yilin: 

“Ling Yi…” 

“Over these years, you’ve stayed by Bai Yi’s side under another identity, doing many 
things for me. It has been hard on you…” 

“After this matter is over, once I ascend to the Solidifying Body Realm, I will help you 
break through to Divinity Transformation.” 

Li Mingwu’s words shocked Lin Jing once more. 

Unexpectedly, Xue Yilin was actually the mastermind who had deceived them into the 
Devouring Spirit Blood Realm, the true Lord Ling Yi. 

Furthermore, Lin Jing also paid attention to the words Li Mingwu had said afterward. 

“Ascend to the Solidifying Body Realm!” 

This Solidifying Body Realm must be the realm above Divinity Transformation. 

Xue Yilin then respectfully said: 

“Thank you, senior…” 

Li Mingwu gave a slight nod, and then turned to Xue Yilin, who was also known as Lord 
Ling Yi, and said: 

“Enough…” 

“We should set off now, to the Five Elements Water Hall. My injuries cannot be delayed 
for too long.” 

Xue Yilin nodded and afterwards said: 

“Yes, senior…” 

Then, Xue Yilin placed his hand upon the Token, channeling Spiritual Power into it. 



Subsequently, several white Formation Patterns appeared within the Five Elements 
Command Token, connecting with the Teleportation Array within the Formation Eye. 

The Teleportation Array beneath their feet immediately underwent a change. 

Following that, the Teleportation Array lit up once more, emitting a light of interwoven 
black and white. As the light grew increasingly stronger to the point of being dazzling, it 
suddenly flashed intensely, and the two persons were directly transported away. 

After the pair had left, the Formation Eye returned to its calm state. 

Seeing the two being teleported away, Lin Jing gazed at the empty Formation Eye. After 
hesitating for a moment, he too controlled his Observation Mode to leave, probing 
toward the Five Elements Water Hall. 

Lin Jing wanted to find out exactly what the two were up to. 

Lin Jing was already clear about the location of the Five Elements Water Hall. Although 
there were black mists on the way that obstructed sight, even in Observation Mode, it 
was impossible to see through, but Lin Jing was confident he would not err. 

Sure enough, as Lin Jing controlled the Observation Mode, moving forward for a while 
and closing in on the extreme limit of the observable distance, he finally arrived at the 
Five Elements Water Hall. 

Inside the Five Elements Water Hall, there was no black mist. As soon as Lin Jing 
peered into the Five Elements Water Hall, he saw Li Mingwu and Xue Yilin. 

But that’s wrong, it wasn’t just the two of them; there was another person… 

Or rather, a corpse. 

This corpse looked exactly the same as the cultivator whom Li Mingwu had previously 
transformed into. 

Seeing the current situation made it not hard to guess. 

It was highly likely that this cultivator had suffered an attack by Li Mingwu and was killed 
by him. 

Li Mingwu then took his identity and followed the others into the Five Elements Cave 
Mansion. 

Lin Jing couldn’t help but recall the previous attack incident that occurred within the 
white fog. 



Because vision was obstructed in the white fog, making it extremely difficult to see, and 
Divine Sense could also not penetrate it. 

If it was indeed Li Mingwu who launched the stealth attack, it would have been during 
that time. 

For Li Mingwu, a Cultivator at the Nascent Soul Peak, to launch a surprise attack on a 
Nascent Soul Cultivator, clearly the latter would not have time to react. 

There wouldn’t even be a chance to sound an alarm. 

This would explain it all. 

The white fog and the white Puppet were all providing cover for these actions. 

But upon further thought, it made sense. 

In terms of understanding the Five Elements Cave Mansion, probably no one could 
surpass Li Mingwu. 

I estimate that the white fog, as well as the puppet, were both prepared in advance, and 
with Xue Yilin, who was familiar with the internal situation of the Five Elements Cave 
Mansion, the three Island Masters naturally wouldn’t suspect anything. 

After the sneak attack, Li Mingwu didn’t make much noise, and he didn’t dispose of the 
cultivator’s body either, but instead brought it to this Five Elements Water Hall. 

Just as Lin Jing was pondering, trying to sort out his thoughts, 

Xue Yilin made his move, conjuring a black light that shot towards the cultivator’s 
corpse. 

That cultivator’s body immediately began to decay, and eventually turned into black 
smoke that disappeared without a trace. 

Leaving behind only a set of robes and a Space Ring on the spot. 

Xue Yilin then picked up the robes and the Space Ring, and handed them directly to Li 
Mingwu. 

Li Mingwu just glanced at them and then said to Xue Yilin, 

“You keep these…” 

“Once I get the Elixir Medicine from the Wood Hall that treats injuries to the Soul Spirit, 
I’m going to go into seclusion for a while.” 



“By then, be careful when you handle these items, and don’t let anyone discover 
anything suspicious.” 

“I don’t want any accidents occurring before I advance to the Solidifying Body Realm.” 

Xue Yilin nodded and responded, 

“Thank you for your guidance, Senior.” 

After finishing his words, Xue Yilin stored away the Space Ring and the robes. 

After storing them, the two proceeded into the depths of the main hall. 

This Five Elements Water Hall was shaped like a convex character, with the 
Teleportation Array that they had arrived through at the upper half of the convex shape. 

Walking out led to the spacious main chamber of the Five Elements Water Hall. 

In the center of the great hall, there were three platforms, two low and one high, all 
protected by a Formation. 

Through the Formation, Lin Jing could see. 

On the higher platform in the middle, there lay a Token, which was black and also had 
the words ‘Five Elements’ inscribed on it. 

This must be the Five Elements Water Command. 

On the other two slightly lower platforms, one of them contained an Elixir Medicine 
stored in a Pure Jade Box. 

The other, a Cultivation Technique Jade Slip. 

Then, 

The two approached the middle platform, with Li Mingwu bringing out the Five Elements 
Command Token used for teleportation, placing it before the Formation. 

Then, he channeled his Spiritual Power into the Token, causing the white Formation 
Patterns within it to reappear and flow towards the Formation encapsulating the 
platform. 

The Formation dissipated as quickly as snow melts under the scorching sun. 

The platform was thus exposed before the two men. 



Afterward, Li Mingwu reached out and grasped the Token in his hand. 

With the Token in hand, a smile curled on Li Mingwu’s lips as he gazed at the black 
Token and said, 

“Five Elements Water Command!” 

“After so many years, it’s finally in my grasp.” 

“Having this Five Elements Water Command would allow us to enter the final Wood Hall 
early and obtain that last Five Elements Wood Command, as well as the Elixir Medicine 
to heal my Soul Spirit injuries.” 

At this moment, Xue Yilin also spoke up to Li Mingwu, 

“Congratulations, Senior…” 

“With these two Commands in your possession, Senior, you now have three of the Five 
Elements Command Tokens. You only need the last Earth Command and Fire 
Command to gather all five and enter the Five Elements relic.” 

“I have heard that within the Five Elements relic, there is not only the method to 
advance to the Solidifying Body Realm but even the unparalleled treasure, the Life 
Reversing Fruit. I wonder if it’s true…” 

Li Mingwu nodded and said, 

“Of course…” 

“However, these things are all within the very heart of the Five Elements relic, and the 
relic itself is no ordinary danger.” 

“Even with all five Five Elements Command Tokens and access to the relic, they won’t 
be easy to obtain.” 

At this point, Li Mingwu suddenly changed the subject, asking Xue Yilin, 

“Right… 

“Keep an eye on the Five Elements Earth Command carried by Bai Yi. If possible, it 
would be best to acquire it.” 

“And the whereabouts of the Five Elements Fire Command, how is your investigation 
going?” 

Xue Yilin then said, 



“Bai Yi is well aware of the importance of the Five Elements Earth Command and keeps 
it close to his heart. There’s no way for me to even approach it.” 

“Unless, after Senior’s injuries are healed, we could find a way to snatch it from him.” 

“As for the other Five Elements Fire Command…” 

At this point, Xue Yilin frowned and continued, 

“Originally, the Five Elements Fire Command was acquired by the gravely injured 
Cultivator Ling Yin.” 

“And when he fled with his critical injuries, he used a special shifting Formation, making 
it impossible to track where he was eventually transferred to. He may not even be within 
the Demonic Monster Sea anymore.” 

“Over the years, I’ve also been trying my best to assist you in the search…” 
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Li Mingwu snorted coldly after listening, 

“Hmph!” 

“I know Ling Yin’s injuries best. When I injured him, he was almost at death’s door, and 
there was no way he could have survived.” 

“Ling Yin was asking for trouble, opposing me like that. His fate was his own making.” 

“It’s just unfortunate that he escaped back then. Escaping would have been fine, but 
what’s most infuriating is that he took the Five Elements Fire Command with him when 
he ran away.” 

After listening, Xue Yilin hesitated for a moment before speaking up, 



“Senior Li, so much time has passed by now, it’s probably even harder to find that Five 
Elements Fire Command.” 

“We’re likely going to need to put in quite an effort.” 

Li Mingwu, upon hearing this, spoke directly, 

“If that Five Elements Fire Command really can’t be found, then let’s not look for it for 
the time being…” 

“As long as we obtain the other tokens, we can infer the location of that Five Elements 
Fire Command based on the connection between the tokens.” 

“To deduce the position of the Five Elements Fire Command, we need to gather at least 
three Five Elements Commands, and the price we have to pay is not small.” 

“However, the price to compute its position is too high, and unless it’s absolutely 
necessary, I don’t wish to use divination to find it…” 

“For now, we should still try our best to look for it.” 

Upon hearing this, Xue Yilin nodded and said, 

“Understood, senior…” 

Lin Jing couldn’t help but frown when he heard their conversation, not expecting that the 
Five Elements Command could be located through divination. 

Luckily, Lin Jing had come along this time and eavesdropped on this news; otherwise, 
he might have been caught off guard if Li Mingwu had suddenly found him one day. 

“No…” 

“I can’t keep carrying the Five Elements Fire Command with me from now on.” 

Lin Jing immediately resolved not to keep the Five Elements Fire Command in his 
Space Ring anymore. After all, the Five Elements Command was too special, and its 
position could be inferred using other tokens. 

He didn’t want to be caught off guard. 

However, 

though he couldn’t keep it in the Space Ring, he could place it in the System Space. 



Lin Jing didn’t fully understand the existence of the System Space, but its function was 
so powerful, far surpassing the Five Elements Command by more than one level, that it 
could surely avoid detection through divination. 

Lin Jing didn’t believe Li Mingwu could deduce the existence of the System Space. 

Afterward, Lin Jing made a decision in his heart, 

“Hmm…” 

“As soon as I get out, I’ll put the Five Elements Fire Command in the System Space, 
and they’ll never be able to deduce it no matter how hard they try.” 

Then, 

Lin Jing looked again towards the two individuals. 

By now, the two had used the same method to activate the formations on two other 
platforms. 

Within one of the formations was a Pure Elixir, the Soul Condensing Pills. 

The other platform contained a Water System Technique, which Li Mingwu gave to Xue 
Yilin. 

After obtaining the items from the three platforms, Li Mingwu and his companion didn’t 
leave but continued to converse. 

Xue Yilin, holding the Jade Slip of the Water System Technique, first examined it and 
then spoke up to ask Li Mingwu, 

“Senior Li…” 

“Each of these five halls contains a Cultivation Technique. I wonder if the one inside the 
central Five-Element Divine Temple is the final Five Elements Cultivation Technique?” 

Li Mingwu looked towards the central platform and nodded slightly, 

“If I’m not mistaken, it should be the last Five Elements Cultivation Technique.” 

“But I’m not interested in that Five Elements Cultivation Technique…” 

Xue Yilin, puzzled, asked, 

“Why?” 



Li Mingwu explained, 

“That Five Elements Cultivation Technique is indeed excellent, but it requires a 
Cultivator with the Five Elements Spiritual Root to cultivate it to achieve the best effect.” 

“Unlike the times of antiquity or the far ancient era, when Spiritual Energy was dense 
and there were many kinds of Spirit Plants and immortal liquids that could enhance 
one’s Spiritual Root.” 

“As for now…” 

“Spiritual Herb Elixirs capable of improving the quality of a Spiritual Root have almost 
disappeared. Possessing the Five Elements, that is to say, a Five Elements Mixed Spirit 
Root, makes cultivation exceptionally difficult. Without the support of Elixir Medicines to 
improve one’s qualities, even if one practices the Five Elements Cultivation Technique, 
achievements won’t be very high.” 

“If a person with other Spiritual Root qualities cultivates it, it would only slow down their 
own cultivation speed, which would be worse than cultivating other techniques.” 

After listening, Xue Yilin nodded, 

“I see. It seems that the Five Elements Cultivation Technique isn’t all that remarkable 
after all. It isn’t even as good as this Water System Technique I have.” 

Li Mingwu shook his head and said, 

“If that technique had appeared in earlier times, it would definitely have been a top-tier 
technique, causing countless powerful forces to compete for it.” 

“But now, the Spiritual Energy in the entire cultivation world is sparse, and there’s a 
severe shortage of rare resources. Without enough resources to support it, you can’t 
cultivate the Five Elements Cultivation Technique too highly, and it seems somewhat 
pointless.” 

“It’s not that the technique isn’t good; it’s just that times have changed…” 

After hearing this, Xue Yilin was silent for a while and then spoke up, 

“What if someone truly managed to cultivate that Five Elements Cultivation Technique 
to Divinity Transformation, or even to the physical embodiment stage?” 

“Senior Li, do you think there’s a chance of that happening?” 

Li Mingwu, after listening, pondered for a moment before speaking, 



“If someone really managed to cultivate that Five Elements Cultivation Technique to 
Divinity Transformation or the embodiment stage, then only two possibilities exist…” 

“Either this person has the support of a top-tier powerful force behind them, with 
unconditional, limitless resources, or,” 

“the person has profound luck and carries astonishing secrets…” 

“Those are the only two possibilities…” 

“This…” Xue Yilin was about to say something when he suddenly noticed that Li 
Mingwu’s face had drastically changed. 

Even the energy around his body began to fluctuate violently. 

Li Mingwu quickly sat down cross-legged and took out an Elixir Medicine from his Space 
Ring and put it in his mouth before closing his eyes and starting to meditate. 
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At this moment, Li Mingwu’s face was trembling slightly and becoming more and more 
pale, as if he was enduring immense pain. 

Xue Yilin also stepped back a bit to avoid disturbing Li Mingwu. 

… 

Not long after, probably less than an hour, Li Mingwu recovered and reopened his eyes. 

It was then that Xue Yilin approached cautiously and spoke: 

“Senior Li…” 

“The wounds to your Soul Spirit seem to be erupting more frequently.” 

Li Mingwu’s expression turned grave, he said: 



“Heavenly Tribulation, indeed, is not to be trifled with.” 

“Even with extensive preparations, and only daring to let my Divine Sense probe within 
the scope of the Heavenly Tribulation, I’ve still been so gravely injured.” 

“Had it not been for that special place, the Heavenly Tribulation would have likely locked 
onto me already.” 

After speaking, a strong hatred burst forth from Li Mingwu’s eyes as he said through 
gritted teeth: 

“That damned ant disrupted my plan at the critical moment, causing my advancement to 
Solidifying Body Realm to fail and making me suffer constantly from these Soul Spirit 
injuries.” 

“Rest assured…” 

“Once I heal my injuries, I will find that person and make them pay.” 

Xue Yilin then spoke up: 

“Senior Li, I am also helping you investigate the person who injured you.” 

“However, since the incident just happened, I dare not make too conspicuous inquiries; I 
can only find out indirectly through those who came out from the Devouring Spirit Blood 
Realm…” 

“And I have learned that there were two people undergoing the Tribulation at that time. 
Since they were undergoing the Tribulation together, they should have some 
connection.” 

“We just need to find one of them, and through him, we can find the other. Then, we can 
capture both of them.” 

After hearing this, a faint light flickered in Li Mingwu’s eyes: 

“Two people…” 

“They both deserve to die. Once my injuries are healed, I’ll no longer have to worry 
about anyone else. I’ll take action directly and capture those who came out from the 
Devouring Spirit Blood Realm, and perform a Soul Search on them personally.” 

“I refuse to believe that they cannot be found…” 

Hearing this, Lin Jing’s heart skipped a beat. 



Right now, because of his own injuries, Li Mingwu didn’t dare to act rashly. If Lin Jing 
allowed him to recover, then not only because of the Token, but just for having 
disrupted his advancement to Solidifying Body Realm, Li Mingwu would have enough 
reason to relentlessly pursue him. 

Therefore. 

Li Mingwu must not be allowed to recover from his injuries so quickly. 

And as for the Five Elements Wood Hall, he must enter it before anyone else, no matter 
what, and get the Elixir Medicine that can heal the Soul Spirit. 

Without that Elixir Medicine for the Soul Spirit, he won’t be able to recover. With such 
severe injuries, he wouldn’t dare to make any rash moves. 

As for the Five Elements Wood Command, it was less of a concern. 

With his own Five Elements Fire Command, they would never be able to gather all five 
of the Five Elements Command Tokens and thus would fail to enter the Five Elements 
relic. 

Of course. 

It would be even better if he could get his hands on the Five Elements Wood Command. 

Apart from these, there were also Xu Ye and Zhao Linxing. 

After entering the Devouring Spirit Blood Realm, Lin Jing rarely showed his true face. 

The only ones who might know his real appearance were probably just those two. Lin 
Jing had even told Xu Ye that he was on Li Yan Island. 

Therefore, once he got out, he would have to find them quickly to inform them, urging 
the two to hide as soon as possible. 

Regarding the others, Lin Jing had not disguised himself when he first attended the 
trade meeting; he had used his real appearance. 

At the time of the trade meeting, it was inevitable that other people might have 
remembered his face, intentionally or unintentionally. 

If Li Mingwu recovered from his injuries and started searching the souls of others upon 
going out, his own identity would likewise be exposed. 

Therefore, this further strengthened Lin Jing’s determination to explore the Five 
Elements Wood Hall. 



If possible, he even wanted to keep Li Mingwu trapped here forever. 

However, Li Mingwu’s Cultivation was too high, and Lin Jing was far from being his 
match , so he couldn’t possibly keep him here by himself. 

The only thing he could take advantage of were the three Island Masters. 

And. 

If he was to do this, Lin Jing himself must not expose his presence. 

Otherwise, if Li Mingwu were to escape, it would be dangerous for him. 

To accomplish this, Lin Jing would need to plan carefully. 

But before that, Lin Jing had to first get his hands on the healing Elixir Medicine, he 
absolutely couldn’t let it fall into Li Mingwu’s hands. 

To obtain the Elixir Medicine, it was necessary to enter the Five Elements Wood Hall; 
after entering the Wood Hall, he still needed to find a way to break the Formation at the 
high platform, 

Lin Jing only had a Five Elements Fire Command in his hand, and he didn’t know if it 
could be used to open that Formation. 

Or, if there were other methods to break the Formation. 

Therefore, 

Lin Jing still needed to continue observing, to see if he could get the method to break 
that Formation from their conversations. 

Lin Jing didn’t have to wait long; the two people began discussing how to enter the Five 
Elements Wood Hall. 

It was also at this moment that Lin Jing learned from Li Mingwu. 

They entered the side hall by following the rule of the Five Elements generating each 
other, holding the Five Elements Gold Order, they could pass through that black 
Formation Eye and enter the Five Elements Water Hall in advance. 

The other method would be to wait until the black fog dissipated, then enter the Five 
Elements Water Hall through the Teleportation Array where the formations were broken 
by several people afterward. 

This method did not require a Five Elements Command Token to enter. 



All these were arranged in advance by them, and even the sudden black fog was 
conjured up by Li Mingwu, who understood the rules of the Five Elements Cave 
Mansion. 

And if one were to enter the Five Elements Wood Hall, they would need to hold the Five 
Elements Water Command to use the same method to enter the Five Elements Wood 
Hall in advance. 

Moreover, 

To open the Formation at the high platform inside the Five Elements Wood Hall also 
required the Five Elements Water Command. 

Li Mingwu and Xue Yilin, if they wanted to go to the Five Elements Wood Hall, had to 
wait until at least three days after the black fog had cleared and everyone had explored 
the Five Elements Water Hall. 

Then at the time of opening another Wood Hall Formation, they would make a move 
and draw the fog in order to have a chance to enter the Five Elements Wood Hall. 

But Lin Jing didn’t have to do that. 

For Lin Jing, he just needed to use the Fixed Point Teleportation to directly enter the 
Wood Hall. 

However, although Lin Jing could enter the Wood Hall, he lacked the most crucial Five 
Elements Water Command. 

In Observation Mode, Lin Jing listened to the two people’s conversation for a while. 

The two also never discussed this issue, which made Lin Jing hesitate as to how exactly 
he should break the Formation at the high platform. 

Was he to use the Five Elements Fire Command? 

Or should he directly forcefully break it? 

After hesitating for a moment, Lin Jing decided to first try using the Five Elements Fire 
Command. 

If it really didn’t work, then he would forcefully decipher the Formation. 

Truth be told, Lin Jing didn’t hold much hope for forcibly breaking this Formation, given 
that its rank was truly not low. 

Even with Lin Jing’s current strength, it would probably be difficult to shake it. 



… 

Lin Jing then continued to observe the two people for a while longer. 

Lin Jing noticed that the two had no intention of leaving the Five Elements Water Hall 
for the time being. 

Therefore, 

Lin Jing gave up observing and changed direction to explore towards the Five Elements 
Wood Hall. 

The Five Elements Wood Hall was in another direction from the palace and was also 
somewhat easier to find. 

Lin Jing, following his previous memory, fumbled through the black fog towards the Five 
Elements Wood Hall. 

Before long, Lin Jing arrived at the Five Elements Wood Hall. 

At that moment, the Five Elements Wood Hall, like the Water Hall, was shaped like a 
raised platform. 

In the center of the Wood Hall, there were also three platforms, one high and two low, 
with items placed atop them just like in the Water Hall. 

However, the Token at the high platform in the center was different from the Water Hall; 
the Water Hall Command Token was black, while the Wood Hall Command Token was 
green. 

After arriving at the Five Elements Wood Hall, Lin Jing first observed in Observation 
Mode for a while to make sure there were no anomalies. 

Subsequently… 

Lin Jing prepared to use Fixed Point Teleportation to teleport inside the Wood Hall and 
‘take away’ the Elixir Medicine, Cultivation Technique, and Command Token on the high 
platform. 

Chapter 509: Chapter 203: The Frenzied Wood Attribute Spiritual Power 

Lin Jing exited Observation Mode and returned to the System Space. 

Then, Lin Jing spoke directly: 

“System…” 



“Activate Fixed Point Teleportation!” 

As his words fell, the scenery before Lin Jing’s eyes changed once again, and before 
long, the interior of the Wood Hall appeared again. 

With Lin Jing’s final confirmation, his entire being appeared out of thin air inside the 
Wood Hall. 

Arriving in the Wood Hall, Lin Jing examined his surroundings once more, ensuring 
there was no danger before he walked towards the high platform. 

On the tallest platform in the center, the Five Elements Wood Command lay there, while 
on an adjacent, slightly lower platform, there was a Pure Jade Box. Inside the Pure 
Jade Box, there was a Pure Elixir that emitted a faint glow, almost transparent. 

This Pure Elixir was something Lin Jing was very familiar with. 

It was the Revival Elixir that Lin Jing had once helped Qi Yan, the True Lord, to refine. 

However, the one Lin Jing had refined was a Supreme Elixir, whereas this elixir was of 
Pure quality. 

The Pure Revival Elixir that Li Mingwu had been relentlessly searching for was indeed 
this one. 

In fact, when you think about it, Li Mingwu’s injury was to his Soul Spirit, and only a 
Revival Elixir could heal an injury of the Soul Spirit. 

Moreover, the injury was inflicted to prevent Lin Jing from facing Tribulation, and 
ordinary Revival Elixirs likely wouldn’t be effective. 

Therefore, the only thing that could heal his Soul Spirit injury was the Pure Revival 
Elixir. 

And besides, Revival Elixirs were already scarce in the outside world, not to mention the 
Pure Revival Elixirs, even the Elixir Pavilion of Changyun probably didn’t have them. 

Hence, Li Mingwu set his sights on the Five Elements Cave Mansion, aiming to obtain 
the Pure Revival Elixir within the Wood Hall. 

In passing, he could also take possession of both the Water and Wood Five Elements 
Commands. 

One could say his plan was perfect, with Xue Yilin as an inside man, coupled with his 
knowledge of the Five Elements Cave Mansion, obtaining these treasures seemed to be 
a piece of cake. 



Unfortunately. 

He encountered Lin Jing, who, no matter what, was not going to let him have his way. 

At this time, at the edge of the platform, a layer of cyan Formation enveloped the three 
platforms. 

Lin Jing stepped forward and began to carefully observe the Formation. 

The Formation was cyan in color, and this Formation was also related to the wood 
element. 

Water nurtures wood, wood generates fire… 

Lin Jing didn’t have the Five Elements Water Command, but he did have the Five 
Elements Fire Command; regardless, it was worth a try. 

Afterward, Lin Jing took out the Five Elements Fire Command from his Space Ring and 
placed it in front of the Formation housing the Pure Revival Elixir, then he channeled the 
Immortal Five Elements Technique, infusing Spiritual Power into the Five Elements Fire 
Command. 

Then, through the Five Elements Fire Command, he infused Spiritual Power into the 
Formation. 

However… 

No sooner had Lin Jing’s Spiritual Power gone through the Five Elements Fire 
Command and entered the Formation, the Formation began to react. 

First, the entire Wood Hall shook violently, the tremor was so intense that Lin Jing 
staggered, nearly losing his balance. 

Following the violent shaking, a strong burst of cyan light suddenly erupted within the 
Formation, passing through the Five Elements Fire Command and counterattacking Lin 
Jing. 

Just as Lin Jing steadied his stance, the counterattacking cyan light had already 
penetrated into his body. 

Only after the cyan light entered his body did Lin Jing realize that this cyan light was the 
wildly rampaging Spiritual Power of the wood element. 

This wood element Spiritual Power exploded instantaneously within Lin Jing’s body and 
then began to wreak havoc… 



But, it didn’t end there. 

Soon after, a blue light lit up within the formation and violent spiritual power surged, 
attempting to backlash against Lin Jing through the Five Elements Fire Command. 

Seeing this, Lin Jing quickly stepped back several paces and severed the connection 
with the Five Elements Fire Command, which fell to the ground with a ‘clatter’. 

The blue light also flickered once more before disappearing. 

But Lin Jing couldn’t bother with anything else. 

At this point, the violent wood-attributed spiritual power was still rampaging inside his 
body. 

Lin Jing quickly sat down cross-legged and then circulated the Immortal Five Elements 
Technique, gathering spiritual power in an attempt to calm the cluster of Five Elements 
Spiritual Force. 

And the violent wood-attributed spiritual power surged over in an instant, violently 
clashing with the spiritual power that Lin Jing had gathered. 

At the moment the two powers made contact, they collided within Lin Jing’s body, 
causing a powerful shock to erupt. 

This shock not only injured Lin Jing in an instant but also affected his Divine Sense, 
making him experience a moment of dizziness and nearly losing control of the spiritual 
power inside his body. 

At the same time, a trace of blood flowed from the corner of Lin Jing’s mouth, a 
consequence of the violent spiritual power just now. 

Lin Jing’s dizziness was only momentary, and upon recovering, he quickly manipulated 
the spiritual power within his body, trying to envelop the uncontrollable violent spiritual 
power. 

Meanwhile, Lin Jing was also pondering what method could completely pacify the 
spiritual power. 

Fortunately, Lin Jing had timely retreated his own spiritual power, so not much of the 
violent spiritual power had entered his body; it became a tree without roots. 

And his own spiritual power was incessant, not long after which most of the violent 
spiritual power was consumed, leaving only a little left. 



Although this small amount of spiritual power still wanted to wreak havoc, it was 
enveloped by Lin Jing’s spiritual power and couldn’t do anything at all. 

However, Lin Jing didn’t immediately eradicate this cluster of spiritual power. 

Instead, he gathered his Divine Sense, reached out with spiritual power, and started to 
probe, little by little… 

To open the formation, he had to resolve these spiritual forces; to resolve them, the first 
thing to do was to understand them… 

And so, Lin Jing proceeded step by step with his probing. 

After the probing, Lin Jing found that these spiritual forces were very similar to those in 
the Water Formation he encountered while breaking the previous formation. 

Thus, 

A thought flashed through Lin Jing’s mind—could he control these spiritual forces with 
the Immortal Five Elements Technique as well? 

looking at it this way, it was very likely… 

So, Lin Jing directly circulated the Immortal Five Elements Technique and began to try 
to control the violent spiritual forces inside his body. 

… 

… 

After some time, Lin Jing used the Immortal Five Elements Technique to control a small 
cluster of spiritual power, moving it through his body. 

This cluster of Five Elements Spiritual Force could not merge with Lin Jing’s own 
spiritual power, but it was under his control. 

Like an exceedingly obedient beast pet. 

This cluster of spiritual power was exactly the violent wood-attributed spiritual power 
from before, and Lin Jing finally found a way to control it. 

Only now did Lin Jing understand why this spiritual power was so active. 

The person who set up this formation had certainly cultivated the Immortal Five 
Elements Technique before and had far higher cultivation than Lin Jing. 



The reason Lin Jing could control this spiritual power was naturally because of this. 
Although their spiritual powers could not merge, Lin Jing could control this cluster of 
spiritual power through the Immortal Five Elements Technique. 

However, the process of control might be a bit troublesome; despite the hassle, as long 
as there was a method of control, everything else would be easy. 

Subsequently, 

Lin Jing prepared himself, stepped forward a few paces, arrived in front of the high 
platform, and got ready to start breaking the formation… 

Chapter 510: Chapter 204: Obtaining the Treasure 

Standing beside the high platform, Lin Jing did as he had before, taking out the Five 
Elements Fire Command and sticking it on the formation that contained the Pure 
Revival Elixir. 

To draw out the spiritual power inside, the Five Elements Command Token was 
indispensable. Otherwise, one would have to confront the external formation directly. 

Lin Jing was not an Array Master, nor did he know how to break through formations; he 
could only use this method of controlling the spiritual power within the formation to 
break it from the inside. 

This time. 

Lin Jing dared not be as reckless as the first time. After making preparations, he began 
to slowly channel spiritual power into the Five Elements Fire Command. 

The spiritual power flowed through the Five Elements Fire Command, gradually surging 
into the formation. 

And the formation immediately struck back in response. 

It was still the fierce wood attribute spiritual power that came attacking Lin Jing through 
the Five Elements Fire Command. 

Because Lin Jing was channeling spiritual power slowly this time, the fierce wood 
attribute spiritual power was not as intense as it had been the first time. 

Like this, Lin Jing used his own spiritual power to envelope the wild spiritual energy and 
then once again circulated the Immortal Five Elements Technique, trying to control that 
spiritual power… 

… 



… 

This time, it took Lin Jing a full twelve hours to gain complete control over the spiritual 
power within the formation. 

The formation, having lost the support of this spiritual power, immediately became dim 
and lackluster, though it still hadn’t shattered. 

Immediately after. 

Lin Jing took direct control of that spiritual power, fiercely slamming it against the 
formation. 

With a loud “boom,” the entire Wood Hall shook violently once more. 

Afterward, the entire formation shattered with a “bang.” 

After breaking the formation, Lin Jing immediately took the Pure Jade Box on the high 
platform into his hands. 

Inside it was the Revival Elixir that could be used to treat injuries to the Soul Spirit, and 
it was even a Pure Revival Elixir. 

This Revival Elixir shone with a restrained brilliance, its pill body was nearly transparent, 
and the liquid inside it no longer circulated, lying quietly within the elixir. 

Clearly, this Pure Elixir had not been refined in a short time. 

However, although it had been refined for a long time, it had been preserved within the 
Pure Jade Box. Though the liquid no longer flowed, it was in a dormant state. 

This elixir might have lost a bit of its medicinal power, but it was indeed a complete Pure 
Revival Elixir. Its efficacy was definitely not lacking, and it should be sufficient to treat Li 
Mingwu’s injuries. 

Lin Jing picked up the elixir, observed it for a while, and then put it away. 

After storing the elixir, Lin Jing turned his head once again, looking toward the highest 
platform in the center where a green token lay. 

The Cultivation Technique in another high platform was also caught in Lin Jing’s view. 

“Now that I’ve got the elixir, and there’s still plenty of time left, why not take that token 
and the Cultivation Technique as well?” 



Lin Jing pondered for a moment, then directly began to move toward the high platform 
in the center… 

…… 

Another day passed, and Lin Jing finally got his hands on both the token and the 
Cultivation Technique. 

The token, needless to say, was the Five Elements Wood Command. With this Five 
Elements Wood Command in hand, Lin Jing now possessed two Five Elements 
Command Tokens. 

The Cultivation Technique was called the Yimu Changchun Technique, a wood attribute 
Cultivation Technique. 

The technique was pretty decent, but Lin Jing didn’t need it for himself. He could give it 
to someone close, or sell it in exchange for Spirit Stones. 

After acquiring the three treasures, Lin Jing did not leave but extended his Divine Sense 
once more to explore the Wood Hall. 

After exploring for a while and finding nothing, Lin Jing gave up the search. 

Now. 

The Five Elements Cave Mansion contained two subsidiary halls, from which Li Mingwu 
and Xue Yilin had taken the lead in entering the Water Hall and obtained the treasures 
within. 

As for the Wood Hall, Lin Jing had gotten there ahead of them, using the system to 
come in and also secured the treasures inside. 

Thus, this trip could be said to have concluded. 

Originally, the three Island Masters had entered the Five Elements Cave Mansion 
intending to obtain the Tokens inside these two subsidiary halls. 

Li Mingwu’s plan was not much different from that of the Island Masters; besides the 
Token, the Pure Revival Elixir inside the Wood Hall was also extremely important to 
him. 

As for the central Five Elements Main Hall, none of them had ever considered it. 

Because to enter that Five Elements Main Hall, one must collect all five Five Elements 
Command Tokens to activate the Teleportation Array. 



Furthermore, inside the Five Elements Main Hall, there is another Teleportation Array 
that leads to the Five Elements relics, and that array also requires the five Five 
Elements Command Tokens to enter. 

Since they did not have enough Tokens, they had never planned to set their sights on 
the main hall. 

But Lin Jing was different; he could use Fixed Point Teleportation to directly bypass the 
outer Formations and enter the main hall. 

Although he could not use the final Teleportation Array to enter the Five Elements relics, 
he could still obtain several treasures within the Five Elements Main Hall. 

He just did not know what treasures were inside the Five Elements Main Hall. 

However, the treasures placed inside the main hall were likely not to be inferior… 

After pondering for a moment, Lin Jing decided to go and check out the Five Elements 
Main Hall. 

If he could obtain the treasures inside the Five Elements Main Hall, that would be even 
better. 

Having thought this, Lin Jing directly called out the system again and then said, 

“Enter System Space!” 

As his voice fell, Lin Jing’s vision blurred, and when his vision cleared again, he found 
himself back in System Space. 

After entering System Space, Lin Jing did not hesitate and immediately entered 
Observation Mode, then used it to extend his perception outward. 

When Lin Jing used Observation Mode to check outside, he found that it was still pitch 
black, with the black mist not yet dispersed. 

Then, following the position he remembered, he extended his perception toward the 
others. 

Before entering the Five Elements Main Hall, Lin Jing wanted to assess the other 
situations first. 

After all, the tremors from breaking the Formation earlier had been tremendous, causing 
the entire Wood Hall to shake violently. 

Lin Jing was not sure if the violent shaking had penetrated the Formation. 



He wondered if the others had noticed it. 

That’s why he wanted to observe the reactions of the others first, so he could be 
prepared in advance. 

Otherwise, 

once the black mist dissipated and everyone gathered together, it would not be good if 
he slipped up in his response and gave himself away. 

Lin Jing controlled Observation Mode and returned to the central square, then extended 
his perception towards the Formation Eyes where the others were. 

When he observed the first person, that person was sitting with eyes closed in 
meditation, revealing nothing. 

Lin Jing only briefly observed before moving on to the second person, who was sitting 
cross-legged on the ground, holding a Jade Slip in hand, seemingly studying a 
Cultivation Technique. 

Lin Jing felt a little more at ease… 

Continuing to the third person, the situation was the same as with the first. 

Lin Jing breathed a sigh of relief; it seemed that the tremor was likely blocked by the 
Formation and had not been detected by anyone. 

Afterward, 

Lin Jing controlled the observation perspective and moved to the Formation Eye 
location of Bai Yi. 

At this moment, Bai Yi was standing there, frowning and looking in the direction of the 
Wood Hall as if pondering over something… 

 


