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Caroline heard a thud, and a muffled grunt escaped her as she felt the pain. 

Lying in her arms, Axel tensed and looked up, startled by the unusual noise. 

In disbelief, he gazed at Caroline. 

Caroline cradled Axel with one arm and soothed her painful lower back with 
the other. 

After ensuring Axel wasn’t injured, she asked, “Are you alright, boy?” 

Axel’s mind raced, but his body remained immobile. 

Caroline’s unique scent eased the uneasiness in his chest, and he found her 
touch acceptable, unlike others. 

Not only that, she had checked on him after her fall. 

Puzzled, Caroline looked at him. “Boy, are you in pain?” 

Axel’s eyes turned cold, and he quickly got up on his feet. Lowering his head 
and tightly pursing his lips, he muttered a barely discernible “thank you“. 

Then, he turned around and ran away without another word. 

Caroline stood up with a frown, sensing something unusual about the child’s 
personality. 

As she pondered this, a familiar voice echoed from downstairs. “Mr. Jordan Jr. 
Mr. Jordan sent me 

to ask you if you like the place here.” 



The voice took Caroline aback, and she discreetly leaned over to co 

a glimpse of Reuben. 

Soon after, her eyes fell upon a man dressed in a black suit, possessing 
striking facial features that exuded inherent elegance. 

He entered the academic building with an irresistible dignity, causing 
Caroline’s chest to tighten 

at the sight of him. 

Hastily, she stopped leaning over and positioned herself close to the wall, lost 
in memories that 

spanned five years. 

She vividly recalled how she had endured hardships in prison due to Evan. 
Assigned to the filthiest and most exhausting tasks, she even had her food 
stolen by others. 

Naively, she had believed that Evan would struggle to part with her, but her 
hopeful illusions were shattered when he proved otherwise. 

Evan approached Axel and asked in a deep voice, “Do you like it?” 
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Axel remained silent, but his glistening dark eyes betrayed his captivation with 
someone on the 

stairway. 

Puzzled, Evan followed Axel’s gaze, but he couldn’t spot anyone there. 

“What are you looking at?” Evan narrowed his eyes. 

Axel shook his head without uttering a word. 

Evan asked, “Axel, what are you avoiding?” 

Axel kept quiet for a moment. “Nothing.” 



“You shall go to school here starting the day after tomorrow,” said Evan 
authoritatively. 

Axel lowered his head even more. novelbin 

Caroline sneered after overhearing the conversation, thinking, ‘Why is he 
communicating with a child in such a domineering way?‘ 

Caroline assumed Axel’s personality was attributed to the lack of parental 
affection. 

* 

At three in the afternoon, Caroline drove back to Bayview Villa. 

As soon as she arrived home, her phone rang. She picked up the call with a 
smile upon realizing it 

was Paige. 

“Caroline!” Paige’s voice came through loudly. “You’re heartless for forgetting 
me as soon as you’re 

back.” 

Caroline pulled the phone away from her ear due to the loudness. 

in 

“I just arrived this morning. After getting my car, I enrolled the chi planned to 
call and invite you for dinner once I got home, but you met 

a kindergarten. I 

it.” 

Chapter 122 

Chapter 122 Can’t Let Him See You 

Paige said, “Wait for me. I’m coming right now!” 

“Paige!” Caroline said anxiously, “Don’t let his people find out.” 



Paige complained, “I have no idea that Evan has so much patience. Why is he 
still so persistent when your tombstone has been erected for five years?” 

Caroline said, “I’m sorry for burdening you.” 

“I’m just complaining!” Paige said teasingly, “He didn’t manage to find out that 
I’ve been interacting with you anyway, right?” 

Caroline smiled. “I’ll send you the location. We’ll talk more when we meet.” 

“Sure.” novelbin 

Caroline hung up the call and opened the door to hear Liora’s giggles. 

She smiled and looked at Liora, playing joyously in the living room. “I’m home, 
Lia.” 

Liora looked to the door and tossed away the doll in her hand before running 
to Caroline right 

away. 

She extended her chubby arms and said, “Welcome home, Mommy. Have 
you decided on where I will go to school? Will I be going to the same school 
as Ty?” 

Caroline leaned over to pick up Liora. “It’s done! Lia, do you remember what I 
told you before?” 

Liora blinked. “Not to mention Mommy to strangers after we start school. I 
remember, but I don’t 

know if Ty does.” 

Tyler was rendered speechless by the unexpected dissing. He looked away 
from his laptop to Liora in displeasure and said, “I won’t go to the 
kindergarten, so I won’t burden you.” 

Liora’s eyes widened in surprise. She turned and hugged Caroline’s neck. “I 
was only joking, 

Mommy.” 



Caroline was at a loss of whether to laugh or cry with her two mischievous 
children. 

She took a seat on the sofa, and Neil joined her. 

He asked, “How is it? Is everything going well?” 

Caroline urged Liora to play by herself. 

Liora ran away, and Caroline lowered her voice to say, “I ran into him, Neil‘ 

” 
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Neil was stunned and asked anxiously, “Did he recognize you?” 

Caroline shook her head. “No. I saw him, but he didn’t see me. I don’t know 
what happened next because his child with Daniella is attending the same 
school as Ty and Lia.” 

“Switch to another school then!” Neil was panic–stricken. “We can’t let him 
see you. We haven’t begun implementing our plan, so we shouldn’t expose 
ourselves too soon.” 

Caroline rejected the idea. “No, I’m not switching schools because this is the 
safest of all kindergartens. Moreover, he may not necessarily be picking up 
his child from school daily. I’m not worried about bumping into him. Also, I 
keep my shades on.” 

“Your presence is hard to conceal.” Neil heaved a sigh. “You are different from 
the past, but-” 

Caroline interrupted him. “Neil, I wouldn’t have returned if I were afraid of 
meeting him. In addition, I’m only disappointed with him, but I don’t hate him. 
I’m here to seek revenge on Daniella only!” 

Neil did not comment further after seeing Caroline’s determination. He then 
changed the subject. It’s three months until Grandpa’s birthday.” 

Caroline nodded. “As long as you don’t mind it.” 



“We will need to pay for what we do. If our mother were still around, she would 
do so too.” 

Caroline nodded. Her first goal was to destroy everything that Daniella was 
proud of! She wanted 

to show Grayson how foolish his choices were! 

Chapter 123 

Chapter 123 Slow Like Sloth 

Paige came over for dinner, and Caroline and Neil prepared a delicious 
spread for her. 

As soon as Paige arrived, Liora got attached to her. 

“Godmother!” Liora called out to Paige softly. 

Paige hugged Liora swiftly and said, “I missed you so much, Lia! Let me give 
you a kiss!” 

Liora leaned her face close to receive the kiss. 

After kissing Liora, Paige shifted her attention to Tyler. 

“Boy, why are you standing there, huh? Will you please learn from your 
sister?” Paige said with feigned anger. 

Tyler answered maturely, “My mother said that men and women should 
maintain proper 

boundaries.” 

Paige was rendered speechless, thinking, ‘This boy’s mannerism is really 
similar to Evan!‘ 

“Mommy’s boy,” Paige complained. 

“This shows that I love my mommy, and I’m proud of it,” refuted Tyler calmly. 

His handsome face was visibly proud. 



Paige widened her eyes in fake rage. “Teach your good son some manners, 
Caroline!” novelbin 

Caroline served the last course of the meal and said with a smile, “Alright, it’s 
time for dinner.” 

She took the two children to wash their hands and sat them at the table. 

With a faint smile, Neil pulled out a bottle of red wine and said, “Shall we have 
a drink after not 

meeting for so long, Paige?” 

Paige held out her glass. “Please!” 

Meanwhile, at Villa Rosa, 

Daniella tossed the phone to Axel. “Call your father 

Axel took a glance and extended his hand after a moment. 

“Will you move faster?” Daniella berated him, “Slow like a sloth!” 

Axel’s body tensed up as he pursed his lips and dialed Evan’s number. 
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Evan had just returned to his office after a meeting when he received 
Daniella’s call. 

Disgust filled Evan’s cold, piercing eyes. If it weren’t for Axel, he would have 
never allowed Daniella to stay in Villa Rosa nor given her a chance to be in 
his presence! 

Agitatedly, Evan picked up the phone and heard Axel’s childish voice. “It’s 
me.” 

Although Evan’s expression remained cold, his voice softened. “What’s going 
on?” 

Cautiously glancing at Daniella, Axel asked, “Will you be home for dinner?” 



“I’m not coming home for dinner. You can go ahead,” Evan replied before 
hanging up. 

Daniella tightened Axel’s grip on his thigh, but he didn’t have the courage to 
look at her. 

Daniella sneered. “What’s the point of keeping a deadbeat like you?” 

Axel’s little face tensed up, further enraging Daniella. 

In her rage, she turned around, grabbed a rolled–up magazine bound with 
tape from a cupboard, and approached Axel. 

Fear overcame Axel as he glimpsed the object, his face turning ghastly pale. 

In the next moment, Daniella pulled him off the chair and raised the rolled 
magazine, hitting Axel’s back ferociously. 

The muffled thuds of the beating accompanied Axel’s grunts of pain as he 
clenched his teeth and 

fists to endure Daniella’s assault and scolding. 

Coldness and terror filled his eyes as he noticed his nanny and maid huddling 
together nearby, 

shaken by witnessing the scene. 

The nanny said, “Mr. Jordan Jr. is going to be injured from the beating.” 

The servant said, “We can’t stop her, or we’ll be slapped by her too!” 

The nanny said, “A mother shouldn’t hurt her child! We must inform Mr. 
Jordan about this!” 

The maid said, “Don’t speak of it. Do you think Mr. Jordan will believe us if we 
tell him? The rolled 

magazine won’t leave any obvious marks after the beating!” 

Chapter 124 

Chapter 124 Is There Something You Need 
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Caroline woke up early to prepare breakfast for her children before sending 
them to Grace 

International Preschool. 

Upon arriving at the kindergarten’s entrance, she led the children inside, 
passing by other kids who were throwing tantrums along the way. 

Liora and Tyler were unusually obedient. 

Liora squeezed Caroline’s hand and asked, “Is it scary to go to school, 
Mommy? Why are they crying?” 

Before Caroline could respond, Tyler answered with a faint smile, “The 
teachers at school are not monsters, and the principal doesn’t punish children. 
You don’t have to worry about this, Liora.” 

Caroline felt a bit exasperated. ‘Is Ty trying to comfort or scare Lia?‘ 

Puffing up her cheeks, Liora retorted, “You’re trying to scare me again! I 
wasn’t raised in fear.” 

Tyler chuckled and teased, “Of course. You were raised in a fantasy world.” 

Feeling a bit helpless, Liora sought help from Caroline. “Ty is bad, Mommy.” 

Caroline was momentarily speechless as she realized there was nothing 
wrong with what Tyler 

said. novelbin 

Awkwardly, she looked away and changed the subject to the scenery. 

When they reached the classroom, Caroline lowered her head and 

Remember not to tell others about my name. Don’t leave with 

up after school.” 

eminded her children, ” 



strangers Im not here to pick you 

if 

Liora and Tyler nodded obediently, and Caroline felt relieved as she stood up. 

“Alright, all the best as you embark on your education journey. Bye.” 

As Caroline’s voice faded, a tall and imposing figure appeared at the 
classroom’s entrance, causing her body to tense abruptly. 

Tyler noticed her unusual behavior and followed her gaze to the man standing 
at the door. 

He was stunned when he saw the man, who looked remarkably similar to him. 

Liora chimed in softly. “Tyler! That man looks just like you!” 

Her gaze then shifted to the little boy standing next to the man. 

Gasping, she exclaimed, “Tyler! That boy looks even more like you!” 
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Tyler glanced at his mother, puzzled. ‘Something’s fishy,‘ he thought. 

Caroline adjusted her shades and mask before bidding her children goodbye. 

As she walked toward the door, her attire drew the attention of other parents 
in the classroom. 

Evan’s pupils constricted as he caught sight of Caroline. 

He commanded Axel coldly, “Be good and stay. Bye.” 

Axel watched Evan leave in silence, his body tensing up at the sight of 
unfamiliar faces in the 

room. 

Tyler had been observing Axel all this time. 



“Lia, he looks just like me, right?” he asked Liora. 

Excitedly, Liora nodded and said, “Yes! I’m going to talk to him, Tyler!” 

Tyler smiled cunningly and replied, “Go ahead.” 

He was eager to uncover any potentially unknown secrets. 

Caroline hurried across the corridor, but Evan managed to catch up to her. 

She stopped as Evan stood before her, his expression cold. 

In a feigned deep voice, she asked, “Is there something you need, sir?” 

Chapter 125 

Chapter 125 I Saw Her 

After hearing the voice, Evan’s eyes turned cold as he asked, “Who are you?” 

Caroline felt the urge to grumble, thinking, ‘Has he lost his mind? Why 
question the identity of a stranger?‘ 

“I don’t think we know each other, right? It’s rather rude to ask such a 
question.” Caroline responded. 

Evan narrowed his eyes and changed his tone, saying, “My child attends this 
kindergarten. I have the right to question someone who hides their face and 
behaves strangely, especially for my son’s safety.” 

Caroline was taken aback, thinking, ‘What a flawless excuse!‘ 

“I apologize.” Caroline said, “I have an allergic reaction, so I cover my face to 
avoid startling others. You can inquire with the principal if you wish to know 
who I am.” 

With that, Caroline circled past him and left. 

She had used a fake name and address on the application form, so she 
wasn’t concerned that Evan would uncover anything. 

Evan’s expression turned solemn as he watched her silhouette depart. 



To him, the woman felt like Caroline! 

After leaving the kindergarten, Evan got into his car and instructed Reuben, 
“Look into the 

students and their parents in Axel’s class.” 

Reuben was surprised. “Is there a dangerous person, Mr. Jordan?” 

“I saw her!” Evan murmured. 

“Her?” Reuben was confused. “Who are you referring to, Mr. Jordan?” 

“Caroline!” Evan replied. 

Reuben was astounded. He reminded, “Mr. Jordan, it has been five years 
since Ms. Shenton’s 

passing ” 

“Did you see a corpse?” Evan stared at Reuben coldly from the rearview 
mirror. 

Reuben answered, “No” 

Evan scoffed “Paige sent Caroline’s body to be cremated on the night she 
passed away! If it really was Caroline, why didn’t Paige inform us about it?” 
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Reuben heaved a sigh. 

For the past five years, Evan had repeatedly raised this matter. He had even 
hired people to watch over Paige, but they had found nothing so far. 

Reuben witnessed Evan’s immense pain. Evan had spent nearly six months in 
a constant state of intoxication. 

However, after Evan’s spirits lifted, he became fully engrossed in his work, 
sleeping no more than four hours a day. 

Even after a year, he had only shown slight improvement. What could have 
gone wrong again? 



Reuben did not dare to refute, so he nodded and said, “Yes, Mr. Jordan.” 

At 9:00 a.m., Caroline arrived at TYC Fashion located at Dansea Street. She 
got out of her car and had an ineffable feeling as she looked at the building 
before her. 

She purchased the building a year ago with 28,000,000 dollars, and she could 
finally operate the business now. 

She would make the TYC brand known across the world one day! 

rld one day! 

Caroline walked into the building and checked every floor. The office facilities 
were already 

prepared, so she would need to recruit staff members next. 

Caroline made her way to the tenth floor and sat in her office before she made 
a call. 

The call was picked up, and Caroline said smilingly, “Kenny, it’s time for you 
to fulfill your 

promise.” novelbin 

Kenny Hayes gasped and said, “G! Are you done with the preparation in just a 
year?” 

“Yes, I’m just waiting for you.” Caroline made her way to the floor–to–ceiling 
window. 

“Three days!” Kenny said excitedly, “I promise I will be there with a team!” 

Kenny had an office in Muricia, and every staff member of his was highly 
skilled in their 

professions. 

Caroline highly valued their ability to choose fabric, and they had their own 
channels to procure the best quality materials. 

Even her mentor, John, greatly appreciated them. 



However, Caroline knew that admiration alone wouldn’t be enough to recruit 
Kenny to her team. 

In a previous fashion design competition, Kenny’s design sketch was stolen, 
and the organizer 
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Thankfully, Caroline stepped in and advised Kenny to make some slight 
changes, saving his 

professional career and hard–earned reputation of ten years. 

With a chuckle, Caroline said, “Alright, I’ll wait for you.” 

After the call, Caroline immersed herself in recruitment and headhunting tasks 
for three hours. 

Just as she was about to order takeout, the preschool teacher called. 

Chapter 126 

Chapter 126 Fatherless Bastards 

Caroline picked up the call hastily. “Hello?” 

Alice said, “Will you please come to the school now, you Ms. Shenton? This is 
the situation. Liora got into a fight with a boy, and she scratched his face.” 

Caroline’s heart was racing. “How about Liora? How is she?” 

Alice said, “Liora is fine. Don’t worry.” 

Caroline said, “I’m coming over now.” 

After ending the call, Caroline hurried to the kindergarten, which was just a 
15–minute car ride away from her company. 

Swiftly, she went to the teacher’s office, where she immediately heard a 
woman’s scolding voice 

at the entrance. 



“What sort of student do you enroll in your school? How could you enroll such 
an uncultured child? I demand a justification for this incident and want 
compensation from her parent!” novelbin 

Mockingly, she muttered, “Fatherless bastards!” 

Caroline walked into the office with a cold expression and clenched fists. 

A slightly chubby woman sat on the sofa, holding her son overbearingly. The 
boy’s face bore two bloody scratches. 

The teacher stood by, apologizing repeatedly. 

Liora and Tyler confronted the woman, silently staring at her. 

Liora’s eyes were teary, and her fists trembled. 

Noticing Caroline, Alice hurriedly approached her and announced, “Lia’s 
mother is here!” 

Liora and Tyler turned their heads and saw Caroline. Liora burst into tears, 
exclaiming, “Mommy, I’m not a bastard! I’m not!” 

She pointed at the boy, sobbing and shouting, “He started the bullying first! He 
called the other boy who looked just like Tyler abnormal and claimed he 
looked like a madman.” 

Caroline understood the situation after Liora’s explanation. 

Her children became affiliated with Evan’s son. 

Caroline got down on her knees and gently wiped Liora’s tears with tissues. 
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Caroline said softly, “Lia, I know you did it to help someone. That is great, and 
you deserve to be praised. However, there are many ways to help a person. 
Hitting someone is not the way. What do you think, Lia?” 

Liora sobbed. “I know I was wrong, Mommy.” 

Caroline picked up Liora and patted her back before she looked toward Tyler 
and asked, “Ty, did 



you apologize on behalf of your sister?” 

Tyler’s eyes were cold. “I did, but his mother isn’t very pleased with that.” 

Caroline nodded, caressed Tyler’s head, and stood up. She looked at the 
woman and said, “I’m very sorry, madam! I will pay for the medical expenses 
because my child injured yours.” 

“The medical expenses won’t be much!” The chubby woman hit the table in 
rage. “My child is emotionally traumatized!” 

Caroline looked at the boy, engrossed in playing a game on the phone. He did 
not seem emotionally traumatized at all. 

She chuckled. “What would you like to do then?” 

Chapter 127 

Chapter 127 You’ve Mistaken Me for Someone Else 

The chubby woman grunted, “Compensate with money then! I’m not asking 
for much, just 700,000 

dollars! I won’t accept a penny less!” 

Caroline smiled and replied, “It’s not expensive to address a child’s emotional 
trauma with 700,000 

dollars.” 

The chubby woman was astonished and asked, “Can you afford it?” 

Caroline confidently said, “Yes, of course. However, should we consider the 
emotional trauma my 

child endured?” 

The chubby woman’s expression changed drastically, “Your child is fine. Why 
should we even 

consider it?” 



Caroline looked at the surveillance camera in the office and calmly said, “Shall 
we review the 

footage? I recall you scolding my children earlier, calling them fatherless 
bastards. Words hurt 

more than physical violence. I’m not asking for much, either. One million 
dollars to compensate 

for my two children’s emotional trauma.” 

The chubby woman stood up and scolded, “Your child bullied mine first, and 
now you want to 

blame me?” 

“I shall settle the score with you then.” A deep voice came from the office 
entrance just as the 

chubby woman’s voice faded. 

Caroline was stunned, her gaze shifting to the man walking into the room. He 
had a tall, muscular 

figure that felt oppressive to everyone present. 

The students attending this preschool were children of influential figures. 

The chubby woman recognized the person right away. “Mr… Mr. Jordan!” she 
stammered. 

Evan looked at her sternly. “How will you compensate for my child’s loss? One 
million or two million dollars? Or shall I take your whole Wunder Corp.?” 

The chubby woman’s face turned ghastly pale. “I was wrong, Mr. Jordan! 
Please forgive me just this once! It was my son’s fault. I’ll make sure he 
apologizes right away. I’m sorry!” 

“Do novelbin 

you think I need money?” Evan said in a cold, mocking voice, “Don’t let me 
see you again, or I’ll make Wunder Corp. disappear from Angelbay in three 
days.” 



“Yes, sir!” the chubby woman answered, swiftly running out of the office with 
her child. 

Alice introduced, “Mr. Jordan, these are the two children who helped Axel, as I 
mentioned earlier ” 

Caroline began to feel uneasy, having the urge to cover her children’s faces 
upon hearing Alice’s 
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Evan looked stunned upon seeing Liora and Tyler. The girl resembled 
Caroline, while the boy bore 

a striking resemblance to Axel. 

Abruptly, Evan shifted his gaze to the woman wearing shades. He had a 
strong feeling that the 

face hidden beneath them was the one he yearned for day and night. 

With a tense expression, Evan instructed, “Go outside, Ms. Young!” 

Alice hastily left the office, closing the door behind her. The atmosphere inside 
grew more 

awkward and intense. 

Caroline felt the urge to run, but her feet seemed frozen in place. Liora and 
Tyler examined Evan 

and their mother. 

Evan approached Caroline, and his voice shook slightly as he asked, “Who 
are you?” 

Caroline suppressed her panic and answered coldly, “You must be bored, sir. 
How many times are 

you going to ask this question?” 

With certainty in his tone but disbelief in his gaze, Evan insisted, “You’re 
Caroline Shenton, right?” 



Caroline frowned due to his unusually emotional expression–she had never 
seen him like this 

before. He seemed doubtful yet relieved as if he had finally found someone he 
had been searching 

for. 

Trying to clarify, Caroline said, “Sir, you’ve mistaken me for someone else. I’m 
not Caroline.” 

“You’re lying!” Evan pointed at the two children. “How do you explain how 
similar they look to me? 

Chapter 128 

Chapter 128 I’m Not Acquainted With Him 

Caroline sneered and bent over, firmly holding her two children’s hands. 
“There are many people who look similar to each other in this world. Please 
don’t ask these questions anymore in the 

future!” 

She circled past Evan, still clutching her children’s hands, and walked away. 

Evan’s eyes were cold and stern as he watched the three figures depart. He 
was convinced that the woman was Caroline, even if she refused to 
acknowledge it! 

However, he didn’t have the courage to remove her shades, fearing he might 
find a stranger’s face. 

Caroline swiftly made her way to her car with the children outside the 
academic building. But as she started the engine, she kept shifting the gears 
wrongly. 

Liora frowned and asked, “What’s going on with you, Mommy? Why are you 
shaking? Is that man your friend?” 

Caroline replied in an uneasy tone, “He’s not my friend! I’m not acquainted 
with him!” 



Tyler raised an eyebrow, thinking, ‘Why would Mommy be so anxious if she’s 
not acquainted with 

him?‘ 

He decided to investigate further when they got home. 

* 

Back at Bayview Villa, Caroline entered the kitchen. 

Liora and Tyler rushed upstairs to their rooms. 

After locking the door, Tyler sat in front of his laptop and typed swiftly on the 
keyboard. 

Liora leaned on the table and asked, “Why does the man look so similar to 
you, Tyler?” 

Liora didn’t consider the man to be her father because her mother had told her 
that her father had 

died a long time ago. 

Tyler stared at the codes on the screen. “Lia, Mommy has never shown us a 
photo of Daddy, right?” 

“That’s true.” Liora nodded. “Mommy said she threw away all of Daddy’s 
photos.” 

Tyler said, “Why is Mommy being so secretive?” 

Liora pouted and pondered over it. “Maybe Daddy was so ugly that Mommy 
worried his photos 

would scare us.” 

Tyler’s lips twitched. “That’s a bad speculation. Don’t do it anymore.” 
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In less than ten minutes, Tyler found Evan’s photos and information. He 
discovered that his 

mother had once worked as Evan’s secretary and was even romantically 
involved with him. 

Evan had also hired people to search for Caroline over the past five years. 

Tyler realized that Evan could very well be his and Liora’s father. He came to 
understand that 

Caroline had left Evan after he hurt her feelings, 

Liora, unable to read, asked Tyler for an explanation. 

Angrily, Tyler closed his laptop, jumped off the chair, and said, “I’ll tell you 
more when I find out.” 

Liora looked at Tyler in confusion, feeling misled. 

* 

Caroline was preparing to cook when she heard a knock on the door. She 
looked through the 

peephole and saw Lily outside, so she quickly opened the door. novelbin 

“Welcome back, Ms. Smith,” Caroline greeted Lily affectionately. 

Over the past five years, Lily had treated Caroline like a daughter, and 
Caroline had reciprocated, 

treating Lily like family. 

Lily entered with her luggage and commented, “You must be busy, huh?” 

Caroline smiled and replied, “It’s fine. I’m just worried about managing the two 
children when I get 

busy.” 

Lily walked past Caroline to remove her apron, saying, “Leave the children to 
me while you’re 



busy from now on.” 

Chapter 129 

Chapter 129 Too Alike 

Caroline glanced at Lily and said, “I think he’ll recognize me soon.” 

Lily asked in astonishment, “You mean Mr. Jordan?” 

Caroline nodded, recounting the incident at the kindergarten earlier that day. 

Lily sighed. “It’s inevitable, Carol. Maybe it’s not such a bad thing for him to 
find out.” 

Caroline was deeply concerned. “I worry he’ll stop me from seeking revenge. 
After all, Daniella is 

his child’s biological mother.” 

“Don’t see it that way,” Lily said, guiding Caroline to sit down. “I told you 
before, Mr. Jordan was 

heartbroken in the past. If he cares for you, he’ll support you and be on your 
side.” 

Caroline fell silent, unable to let go of the past incident when Evan doubted 
her and attempted to 

take her children away. Those two issues still haunted her. 

Trying to change the subject, Caroline said, “I’m hungry, Ms. Smith. What’s for 
dinner?” 

Lily smiled helplessly. 

* 

On Wednesday, Kenny and his team arrived in Angelbay City. 

Caroline had arranged a bus to pick them up from the airport. The team, 
consisting of over 20 



people, made a grand exit. 

As soon as the bus stopped, Caroline got out to welcome Kenny, calling out, 
“Kenny!” 

Kenny smiled and ran over to embrace her. “I’ve missed you so much! It’s 
been too long!” 

Caroline playfully pushed him away. “You’re hugging me too tightly!” 

Kenny then planted a kiss on Caroline’s cheek before loosening his grip. “I 
love your gentle, 

motherly aura the most.” 

Caroline blushed and said, “I’ll send you back to Ylesir if you keep behaving 
like this.” 

Kenny chuckled “Relax, woman.” 

Nearby, Evan stepped out of his car and witnessed the scene. 

Reuben was standing next to him and was stunned. The woman looked 
remarkably similar to 

Caroline, except for her concealed facial features. 

Reuben couldn’t help but wonder about the person’s ashes buried in the 
graveyard. He looked at 

Evan shifted his gaze and said abruptly, “Look into this!” 

Then he walked into the airport. 

+15 BONUS 

Meanwhile, at the kindergarten. 

Liora played with her toys next to Axel. novelbin 

“Axel, your father looks just like my brother,” she said. 

Axel looked at Tyler sitting opposite him and pursed his lips. 



Tyler smiled when their eyes met, but Axel quickly looked away, replying 
nonchalantly, “Hmm.” 

Liora put down her toys and asked, “Where is your house, Axel? My mommy 
said friends can have playdates at each other’s houses.” 

Tyler listened to Liora’s question with a smile. He had given Liora this task–to 
find something that could be used for a DNA match to prove that Evan was 
their father. 

Chapter 130 

Chapter 130 You Don’t Want to Be Friends With Me 

+15 BONUS 

Axel tightly clutched his top, offering no response to Liora’s remark. He didn’t 
want them to see 

how Daniella treated him. 

Seeing that Axel remained silent, Liora came up with another idea. “It seems 
you don’t want to be 

friends with me. I shouldn’t have helped you if that’s the case!” novelbin 

Tyler suppressed a smile as he observed Liora skillfully provoking Axel. 

For a brief moment, guilt and panic flickered in Axel’s eyes. “Villa Rosa. You 
can come on 

Saturday.” 

Liora sweetly smiled and extended her little finger toward Axel. “It’s a playdate 
then. We’re 

coming to you on Saturday!” 

The sight of her finger stunned Axel. He anxiously clenched his fist before 
slowly making a pinky 

promise with Liora. 



During the night, Reuben shared the investigation’s findings with Evan. One 
folder contained 

information about preschool students‘ parents, while the other was dedicated 
to Caroline. 

Upon reading Caroline’s folder, Evan frowned. “Carolyn Shenton?” 

Reuben confirmed, “Yes, her name is Carolyn Shenton. She used to live in 
Ylesir but recently 

returned to the country. She purchased a building across from ours to set up 
her company.” 

Evan placed the folder on the table and inquired, “Do we have a photo of 
her?” 

Reuben replied, “Unfortunately, Mr. Jordan, there’s no photo available.” 

“None?” Evan’s eyes narrowed. “That’s odd unless she purposely concealed 
it. Have you looked into 

her background?” 

Reuben explained, “Our team found an ID card, but it’s blurred out. 

Evan sneered, thinking, ‘Caroline’s guilt must be consuming her!‘ 

” 

He lit a cigarette, took a puff, and added, “Find out her current address.” 

Reuben said, “I can’t, Mr. Jordan. Her address has been blurred as well. Ms. 
Shenton has an 

excellent hacker working for her.” 

Evan frowned. “Send someone to watch her.” 

“Yes, sir!” 
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+15 BONUS 

Reuben left the room while Evan walked to the floor–to–ceiling window, 
gazing out into the night. 

If he hadn’t seen the two children, he would have believed the information to 
be authentic. 

Caroline’s failure to hide the children was a waste, especially since the 
children looked so much 

like him. 

He had been searching for her for five long years, and he wouldn’t let her 
disappear again this 

time. 

At Bayview Villa. 

Caroline suddenly woke up, sitting upright in bed. 

She had dreamt of Evan demanding his children back. 

When she refused, he made every effort to abduct them. 

Learning about this, Daniella beat up her children, and their cries haunted 
Caroline. 

Caroline hurried to check on her kids in their room, feeling relieved when she 
saw their adorable 

sleeping faces. 

After returning to her room, Caroline tossed and turned in bed. 

Having encountered Evan multiple times, she questioned her impulsive 
decision to insist on 

sending her children to the same preschool as his son’s. 

After all, most preschools had adequate security, making it unnecessary for 
her kids to attend the 



same one. 

She regretted her choice and wondered whether it was still possible to switch 
schools. 

* 

On Saturday morning, Caroline wanted to join Kenny in searching for a 
clothing factory for sale. 

She entrusted her sleeping children to Lily and left. 

Lily checked on the kids and found them still asleep before heading out for 
grocery shopping. 

As soon as the door closed, Tyler and Liora opened their eyes 
simultaneously. 

Tyler looked at Liora and said, “Lia, get dressed. We’re heading out.” 

 


