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Chapter 511 

Adrian's eyes darkened when he heard Patric. He looked away from Natalia and replied, 

"Can't you see how she is wandering around with another man? I wonder where 
Gamma Benjamin got this courage. Just because I can't shift right now, I am not 
teaching him a lesson." As soon as Patric heard Adrian, he turned to him and asked 
with a shocked face, 

"What! You can't shift?" 

Adrian ignored his question and walked ahead. "Stop questioning me. Tell me where 
have you been?" 

Patric followed him while observing him carefully. His gaze suddenly fell on Adrian's 
neck. He reached for Adrian's collar and pulled it down slightly to check something. 

"What are you doing?" Adrian asked angrily, feeling annoyed by his actions. 

Patric's eyes widened when he noticed that Natalia's marks on Adrian's neck were 
fading. It was like the skin was eating the mark away slowly. 

"Your mark!" 

Patric's whisper reached his ears as Adrian glanced at him. "It's good that it's fading. I 
don't like that woman. It's better if she leaves this pack as soon as possible." Patric's 
legs froze upon hearing Adrian. 

Adrian turned around and gave him a bored look. "What's wrong? Did you come here 
just to irritate me?" 

Patric was confused by what had happened to Adrian. "Did she do something? Why are 
you mad at her?" 

"She wants to ruin my life. She 

wants to take over my company and 

give it to his brother. Didn't you hear 

about her scheme to sell this 



company's stock to her brother?" 

Patric was silent for a while. He was taking a close look at Adrian. 

"What?" Adrian asked. 

"Didn't you almost give up your company to her? You nearly stepped down from your 
position a few weeks ago, just for her. Now what is bothering you? She must be mad 
that you made Hazel your mistress. 

Of 

rse, she is mad." 

Adrian raised a brow and questioned, "I did what? And what did you say? Why would 
she be mad? It's not like we have a good relationship with each other." Patric parted his 
lips in shock. Was he really talking to his best friend? Why was he speaking strangely? 

"Adrian, you love her. Have you forgotten about it?" 

Adrian's brows eased as Patric said that, but then furrowed even deeper. "What 
nonsense!" 

Patric grabbed his arm and dragged him to the elevator. When the elevator door closed, 
Patric spoke loudly as there was no one there to listen to them. 

"Adrian Miller, what's wrong with 

you? She is the woman you are 

madly in love with. You were the one 

who chased her after so many of divorce. You regretted it and wished to marry her 
again. When you remarried her, you wanted to live a peaceful life with her and your 
twins." 

Astonishment engulfed Adrian. Whatever Patric had just told him, he could not believe. 

"Beta Patric, are you cooking up stories?" 

Patric took a step back. He could not believe Adrian had completely forgotten 
everything. 

"I have heard that a few days ago you were in an accident. Are you suffering from 
memory loss?" 



 
Chapter 512 

When the elevator door opened and they arrived at the first floor, Adrian gave him a 
stern look and was ready to reprimand him. Adrian exited the elevator first, and Patric 
followed, intending to go check on Adrian's condition with the pack doctor. 

At that time, they ran into Benjamin. 

Adrian took a halt when Benjamin bowed to him. 

With a pair of cold eyes, Adrian said to him, 

"I warned you to stay away from that woman. She is not good for our pack." 

Benjamin lowered his head before glancing at Patric. Patric was staring at him. He 
exhaled and returned his gaze to Adrian. 

"Alpha, she is my Luna. It is my responsibility to protect her when everyone is against 
her." 

Adrian tightened his fists while glaring at Benjamin. Meanwhile, Patric focused his gaze 
on Adrian. "Didn't you say you don't like her? Why do you care if Benjamin roams 
around her? You want her to leave this pack anyway." Gamma Benjamin was shocked. 
He shook his head as he realized Adrian had misunderstood his pure intention. 

"My apologies, Alpha. I was just " 

Patric interrupted him while signaling him to close his mouth. Benjamin obeyed his 
instructions. Patric patted Benjamin's shoulder and said to Adrian, 

"Adrian, he is our Gamma. Natalia is also a powerful woman. He could not help it when 
it's about his heart." 

Benjamin's eyes widened. He glared at Patric, removing his hand from his shoulder, and 
spoke to him in their mind link, 

"Are you insane? He will kill me." 

Patric rolled his eyes and responded in the mind link, "Then you should have told me 
about everything that was going on behind my back." 

Adrian, on the other hand, felt his blood boiling inside. He did not know why he was 
feeling like this, but he did not like when Patric said Benjamin liked Natalia. 



"She is not going anywhere. I will 

keep her here and punish her for all 

of her conspiracy. So take your eyes off of her. I don't want to kill the gamma of the 
pack for personal reasons." en  

After saying that, Adrian turned around. 

Behind him, he overheard Patric and Benjamin's conversation. 

"Why didn't you tell me that he lost his memories?" 

"I don't know anything about it either. He is good at everything as usual. However, he 
has not been coming to training for the past few weeks I am confused with his new 
behavior too. In fact, he is not treating Natalia well." 

"Don't tell he has forgotten who saved him in the last war? He was almost dead, but 
Natalia came all the way over to him and saved him by marking him." 

Those voices were loud enough to reach his ears. Adrian was surprised to hear the 
conversation. He recalled Natalia telling him a few times that she regretted saving him. 
But no matter how hard he tried, he could not recall it. 

"Have I really forgotten everything? Was she right when she said she had saved me?" 

 
Chapter 513 

Adrian left the company, neglecting the idea of having lunch with Patric. 

He got inside the car and told his driver to drive to a restaurant. 

He was on his way back to the company after lunch when he received a message from 
Ansel informing him that tonight was Hazel's birthday and that he should give her a 
present. Adrian's car stopped in front of a jewelry shop. He went inside the shop and 
told the staff to pack something that would look good on a young woman. 

A female employee approached him and showed him a few designs. Adrian was not 
interested in choosing, but his eyes fell on a beautiful necklace. 

He did not know why, but looking at the necklace, his mind reflected Natalia's face. 

"Pack this one." 



The female employee smiled at him and packed the necklace. When she was about to 
hand it to him, he said, 

"I told you to pick one." 

The woman was stunned. "Oh, you want another one?" 

She thought he was going to buy only one necklace. The woman picked the best design 
and showed it to Adrian. He just nodded at her to let her pack it. After taking two 
necklaces with him, he went to his company. After reaching his cabin, he called Damia, 
Natalia's assistant. She recently joined the job. 

"Give it to Natalia," Adrian said while placing the bag on the desk. 

Damia blinked her eyes, not believing that Adrian was sending a gift to Natalia. 

She grabbed the bag and was about to leave the office when Adrian spoke from behind. 

"Tell her not to say anything about it to Hazel. It is Hazel's birthday today, so she can 
wear it at the party. I purchased one for Hazel and received this necklace as a 
complimentary gift from the manager." 

It left Damia speechless. Taking a quick look at Adrian, she turned her head. As all of 
her hopes for Natalia were dashed, she grimaced in dissatisfaction and shook her head 
in anger. 

Later that night, 

Adrian arrived at the pack house. He noticed that the house had been exquisitely 
decorated for Hazel, as it was her birthday. 

The moment Hazel saw him enter 

the pack house, she smiled brightly 

and walked toward him while wearing a gown that was a baby pink color. 

"Adrian" 

She held his arm and returned to the living room where the Leighton 

family and Miller family were present. The presence of Alpha Jason, along with a few 
business partners, came as a complete surprise to Adrian. It looked like he 

had arrived really late. 



An angry blaze could be seen in Jason's eyes, and he could see it. Adrian assumed it 
was because he wanted to take his sister away. Everyone involved in the Leighton 
family's business knew that Hazel was Adrian's mistress. But they had no idea about 
her child. Adrian's gaze darted around the room as if looking for someone until he 
settled on the woman in a red wine gown. 

He could not take his gaze away from her. He kept thinking about what Patric had told 
him today. 

He was madly in love with her? When? Was it really true? Then why could not he 
recall? 

He clenched his jaw when he felt pain in his head while trying to remember the past 
memories. 

He slightly averted his gaze, trying to calm his messy mind. 

"Alpha Adrian, Miss Natalia looks really beautiful today, doesn't she?" Ansel spoke up 
when she noticed Adrian looking at Natalia. 

Everyone's attention turned to 

Adrian. He frowned as he was about 

to say something to avoid the 

question. But before that, Ansel spoke again. 

"It's because she wears a very beautiful necklace." 

Adrian turned his head to look at Natalia again, expecting her to wear his necklace. 
However, he noticed it was not the necklace he had given her. Then he heard Ansel. 
"Alpha Jonas gave her the necklace." 

 
Chapter 514 

Adrian's eyes darkened when Natalia smiled with her red lips and looked in another 
direction. 

Adrian's gaze shifted on the way and found Alpha Jonas grinning at Natalia. 

"A beautiful necklace for a precious woman. I have always admired her when she was 
the CEO of her father's company. She is a pure beauty. It's bad luck that she decided to 



stay here. But if you want to come with me, I will not take any mistress for my whole 
life." Adrian glared at the man as he found his words mocking toward him. 

Jason scoffed at Jonas and said, "She is a stubborn woman. She doesn't listen to 
anyone. Otherwise, Alpha Adrian is ready to leave her. Isn't it Alpha Adrian?" Jason's 
gaze met Adrian's like a clash colliding. 

Hazel was about to say something, but Ansel shook her head at her. 

Natalia walked toward her brother and let out a chuckle. "Let's focus on the birthday girl. 
Looks like I took all the limelight away from her." 

Hazel stared at Natalia. There were some untold words that were conveyed through her 
eyes toward her. But Natalia could not understand them. 

Hazel cut the cake. When she was about to feed Adrian, he was too busy to look 
somewhere else. Her hand was in the middle of the air as she gazed at him. Suddenly 
her eyes moved to Jason, who was glaring at her. She immediately looked away and 
lowered her hand, putting down the piece of cake. One by one, everyone gave presents 
to Hazel. Adrian's parents went back to their room after giving her a set of ancient 
jewelry. 

"Alpha, don't you have anything to give Hazel?" Ansel asked. 

Adrian ordered a guard to bring the bag from his car. When he brought the bag, 
Natalia's eyes fell on it as she recognized it. But she did not react. 

Adrian gave Hazel the necklace. Hazel opened it and was shocked 

when she saw it was really 

expensive. Ansel snatched it away from her hand and said with a sweet 

tone, 

"I will ask the maids to put it in your room, Hazel." 

When she was about to leave the room, Jason spoke out. 

"Don't you want to see my present for her?" 

Everyone, including Ansel, turned their attention to Jason. 

He approached the old Leighton and handed him a folder. 



Hazel was curious about what he was doing. There was no way he would give her a 
present. 

The old Leighton opened the folder, and his brows shot up. 

"You are removing our pack from your alliance?" 

Everyone around them was astounded. Hazel's brother, Rick walked over to Jason and 
asked, "But why?" 

Jason smirked at him and replied, 

"All this time, I was only helping you because thought you could give me what I desired. 
Since I can't have it, 

why would I help you m 

Jason turned to face Hazel, his eyes meeting hers. Hazel took a step 

back, shaking her head as if pleading 

with him not to say anything ling 

"It's your birthday gift from me. No conversation from now on. Everything is over." 

 
Chapter 515 

Adrian tried to think why did Jason make an alliance with them in the first place. What 
exactly did he want? 

He was able to see the expressions of shock plastered across the faces of all of the 
Leightons. They were not expecting this. To them, it was like a blow to the head. Adrian 
assumed that Jason did that because Natalia wanted it. But Natalia's eyes were hazel 
all the time. Her eyes kept observing her when her brother was talking to her. Ansel's 
anger caused his fingers to become more firmly gripped on the jewelry boxes. The old 
Leighton looked mad at Jason while Rick appeared to be fierce. "You will pay for it, 
Alpha Jason," Ansel said, leaving the room. 

Her husband and the old Leighton followed her behind as if she were the main member 
of the family. 

Jason rolled his eyes. He turned his head to Adrian and said, 

"You will be next to face something like this." 



It was a warning. 

Adrian did not like it when he said that in front of other businessmen. 

Jason gave Natalia a small smile and then walked out of the pack house as if his work 
was done there. 

Hazel was shocked by what had happened just now. She blinked when Jason walked 
past her and exited the pack house. 

She turned around and saw him, leaving. 

She felt her heart pounding as she watched him leave. 

She gazed at others who were not looking at her. So she lifted her gown and rushed 
outside. 

As soon as she came out of the pack house, she looked around left and right to find 
Jason. 

Her gaze was drawn to a man walking toward the parking lot. 

She ran behind him until she was only a foot away from him. "Jason" 

His steps halted when he heard her. But he did not turn around. 

Tears scrambled in her eyes as she the man's broad shoulder. 

stared 

for the 

deflection of meeting h belongs to en.kikistorien 

first time came to her 

It was a few months ago when she was walking around the forest and bumped into him. 
She did not want to live, but he showed her a light of hope. .  

"If you came here to beg me for the allian-" 

"Please don't break the alliance," she begged him, sobbing. 

She could see him clenching his fists in fury. 

Swnov 



"Why? That man can give you expensive gifts and help you live a lavish lifestyle. He can 
also a your family what they desire. You all don't 

need me anymore." 

Hazel could not say anything as she lowered her head. Tears fell to the ground near her 
feet as she choked on her cry. 

Since she was silent, Jason did not want to say anything more. He was here for his 
sister. He did not want to see Hazel's face again. 

As soon as his body moved to take a step forward, he felt a pair of arms around his 
waist. 

Hazel hugged him from behind and said, 

"T-They will kill this child if you break the alliance. Please save me and our child, 
Jason." 

 

 

 

 

 

 


