
Talent 311

Chapter 311: Boundary Stone, Breaking the Fourteenth Physical Limit!

“Boundary Stone? What is its use?”

Ye Tian curiously looked towards Liu Qingyi, waiting for her explanation.

Liu Qingyi said, “Originally, the Boundary Stone was nothing special, but a long time ago, 
someone brought a Boundary Stone into the Wondrous Object Realm and discovered that it 
could seal a wondrous object within it. They then successfully brought it out of the wondrous 
object realm, maintaining the effect of the wondrous object in the outside world, though it 
couldn’t be separated from the Boundary Stone for too long. Even so, the Boundary Stone 
suddenly became precious. The only pity is that the Boundary Stone can only be used once and 
can only seal one treasure.”

“The Boundary Stone can bring wondrous objects out of their realm?”

Ye Tian was both shocked and delighted.

He still had three stalks of Dark Soul Star Grass on him. He could consume one stalk himself, 
and he initially thought the other two would have to be traded away, but now he didn’t have to 
worry about that.

He could completely use the Boundary Stone to take the two stalks of Dark Soul Star Grass 
out and then give them to his wife, Empress Yue, and his sister Ye Yu.

“Just three Boundary Stones?”

Ye Tian asked, staring at the Emperor Jinyang.

“Heavenly Emperor of Ten Thousand Laws, I really only have three Boundary Stones. They 
are very hard to come by, and I got them accidentally. I really don’t have any more!” Emperor 
Jinyang repeatedly assured and swore that he had no more Boundary Stones.



Ye Tian collected the Boundary Stone and other treasures, sharing some with Liu Qingyi and 
Qin Zixuan, then let Emperor Jinyang leave.

After Emperor Jinyang left, Liu Qingyi said, “Heavenly Emperor of Ten Thousand Laws, 
don’t worry. Emperor Jinyang definitely won’t dare to retaliate against you. When I go back, I 
will use my family’s connections to test Emperor Jinyang’s family. Emperor Jinyang dared to 
rob me and even Zixuan. His family won’t let him act recklessly.”

“I’m not worried!”

Ye Tian casually said.

He was indeed not worried. If someone really wanted to deal with him, he could simply 
disguise himself and leave Qingfeng Giant City.

Silver Universe Star was so vast; he didn’t have to stay in Qingfeng Giant City.

If someone dared to attack him in secret, he would definitely make them understand what fear 
and dread meant!

At that moment,

Some Emperor-level figures secretly observing Ye Tian’s strength decided to give up on their 
intentions.

Ye Tian’s strength was very strong, belonging to the second tier among the nine-star Emperor-
level, very powerful, only second to the first tier.

They admitted they were no match for Ye Tian and naturally wouldn’t rob him of his Dark 
Soul Star Grass.

Although Dark Soul Star Grass was good, it wasn’t an invaluable treasure and wasn’t worth 
risking their lives for.

Whoosh whoosh whoosh!!!



One after another, the Emperor-level figures retreated, conceding the Dark Soul Star Grass to 
Ye Tian.

“Let’s go!”

Ye Tian left the area with Liu Qingyi and Qin Zixuan.

…

“Let’s stop here!”

Ye Tian stopped.

He then handed the stalk of Dark Soul Star Grass to Qin Zixuan. “Zixuan, this Dark Soul Star 
Grass is for you!”

“For me? What about you…”

Qin Zixuan was somewhat embarrassed. Although she also desired the Dark Soul Star Grass, it 
was Ye Tian who found it and protected it.

If she just took it for granted, she would naturally feel uneasy.

“Take it. We had an agreement. If there are extra Dark Soul Star Grass, they belong to me. 
Besides, I’m not that keen on Dark Soul Star Grass. You can trade other treasures with me!” 
Ye Tian said.

Qin Zixuan was touched. She thought Ye Tian was deliberately saying this. Dark Soul Star 
Grass, such a treasure, who wouldn’t care about it?

But she really didn’t want to give up this stalk of Dark Soul Star Grass, so she took out other 
treasures she obtained, even some she already owned, and handed them to Ye Tian.



“These are too many!”

Ye Tian smiled bitterly as Qin Zixuan gave too many treasures.

With his treasure-hunting talent, he saw that among them were several treasures glowing with 
golden light.

“If you don’t take these, I won’t want the Dark Soul Star Grass!”

Qin Zixuan insisted.

“Alright then!”

Ye Tian had no choice but to accept these treasures, and Qin Zixuan also accepted the Dark 
Soul Star Grass.

“Let’s part ways here. It’s difficult to gain more benefits when we’re together!”

Ye Tian suggested.

“Alright, then let’s part ways here!”

Liu Qingyi agreed.

Their original plan was just that. The reason they stayed together at Star Sea Lake was to 
search for Dark Soul Star Grass and rely on Ye Tian’s strength to protect it.

Now that they had left Star Sea Lake, it wouldn’t be easy to distribute treasures if they 
continued to act together.

Moreover, with a year’s time, they each needed to cultivate independently, making it 
inconvenient to travel together.



Ye Tian was the first to leave, instantly teleporting away.

Ten minutes later,

Ye Tian arrived at a mountain range and established a temporary cave dwelling. He then set up 
a formation and began to organize his gains inside the cave.

First was the Dark Soul Star Grass.

“Let’s try sealing the Dark Soul Star Grass with the Boundary Stone!”

Ye Tian took out a gray Boundary Stone and activated its power with yuan force. In an instant, 
the Boundary Stone transformed into a gray light barrier and enveloped a stalk of Dark Soul 
Star Grass.

The next moment,

The Boundary Stone reverted to its appearance as a gray stone, but inside, an image of a stalk 
of Dark Soul Star Grass appeared.

At this point, one stalk of Dark Soul Star Grass had been successfully sealed by the Boundary 
Stone, and even if taken out of the Wondrous Object Realm, it wouldn’t turn into ordinary 
grass.

Then, Ye Tian used another Boundary Stone to seal the second stalk of Dark Soul Star Grass.

With this, two stalks of Dark Soul Star Grass were sealed.

Next, he swallowed the third stalk of Dark Soul Star Grass and began to slowly refine it.

Boom!!!

Waves of energy entered Ye Tian’s soul from the Dark Soul Star Grass, beginning the process 
of refining and enhancing his soul and intuitiveness.



Before long, Ye Tian opened his eyes and felt the changes in his soul.

“Comprehension really has doubled. Such a treasure, if it could be brought into the outside 
world without limits, would definitely cause a huge sensation!” Ye Tian murmured.

Then, he checked the other treasures.

Most of them were water-attribute treasures that could assist in body refinement, comparable 
to the fivefold weak water.

But with so many water-attribute treasures, if Ye Tian absorbed and refined them slowly, it 
would take too much time – within a year.

“I can only directly consume and refine them!”

Ye Tian decided.

Consuming and refining directly was the crudest method of cultivation. For example, if one 
directly consumed and refined fivefold weak water, most of the water yuan qi would dissipate, 
not having enough time to refine the body.

Placing the fivefold weak water nearby and absorbing its energy with a Mystic-level attribute 
talent to refine the body was the most efficient method of refinement.

But Ye Tian now had too many water-attributed treasures.

His current goal was rapid improvement in cultivation, not concerning himself with wasting 
resources.

If he swallowed the water-attribute treasures all at once and crazily refined his body, most of 
the energy would indeed be wasted, but the refining effect would be many times better than 
slowly absorbing energy.

“Let’s do it!”



Ye Tian swallowed a water-based treasure named Quiet Water Grass.

Boom!!!

The energy of the Quiet Water Grass exploded, and Ye Tian guided it to crazily refine his body, 
though most of the water yuan qi energy still dissipated into the environment.

Day after day passed,

Ye Tian consumed many water-based treasures, making his body increasingly stronger, not far 
from the fourteenth physical limit.

In a blink of an eye, a month passed!

Under the tenfold time acceleration, Ye Tian effectively cultivated for ten months. After 
rapidly consuming so many water-based treasures, he finally touched the fourteenth physical 
limit.

Crack!!!

With a gentle push, the fourteenth physical limit was broken!

In the past, Ye Tian was worried about the lack of energy when breaking physical limits, but 
now he was not worried at all. He swallowed one water-based treasure after another to 
replenish his body’s energy.

Soon, his body’s energy was fully replenished.

With this, Ye Tian successfully stepped into the fourteenth physical limit realm.

His next goal—

Breaking the fifteenth physical limit!



Chapter 312: Spatial Phasing, Sovereign Emperor-level Battle Power!

Ye Tian estimated his own strength after a breakthrough in cultivation,

“I have broken through the fourteenth physical limit. Whether it’s speed, defense, or strength, 
all have significantly improved. The power of my spatial talent has also undoubtedly become 
much stronger. With my numerous trump cards, I am now fully at the first tier of the nine-star 
Emperor-level, just one step away from breaking through to the battle power of a Sovereign 
Emperor!”

Ye Tian believed he had not yet stepped into the Sovereign Emperor-level battle power 
because his intuition told him he was still at the nine-star Emperor-level.

It was rumored that once one entered the Sovereign Emperor-level, the heavens and earth 
would respond, making it easy to discern.

Since he did not feel this response, he must not yet have the battle power of a Sovereign 
Emperor.

“If I break through the fifteenth bodily limit and then slightly improve my claw technique or 
sword technique, I should be able to step into the Sovereign Emperor-level and rank among 
the prodigies!”

Ye Tian pondered,

He did not think too much and continued his cultivation.

In the Wondrous Object Realm, one could only stay for a year, so naturally, he could not waste 
time.

One after another, treasures were crazily devoured and refined by Ye Tian. The energy they 
released even turned this mountain range into a treasure land!

In the blink of an eye, another month and a half passed, and Ye Tian emerged from seclusion.



He felt that he was not far from breaking through the fifteenth limit of his body, but he had to 
leave seclusion, not because he had used up those treasures, but because they were no longer 
useful!

That’s right, the grades of those treasures were somewhat low. Moreover, using the same type 
of water-based treasures too much had almost rendered them ineffective.

To break through the fifteenth bodily limit, he must consume higher-grade treasures or other 
types of elemental treasures, such as fire or earth-based ones.

In short, water-based treasures were really not very useful anymore!

Ordinary people indeed found it somewhat difficult to find treasures, even in the Wondrous 
Object Realm, which had many treasures but still required a lot of time to search. However, Ye 
Tian, with his treasure-finding talent, did not find it so laborious.

Swoosh!

Ye Tian flew out of his cave dwelling, flying low and starting to use his treasure-finding talent 
to search for various treasures on the earth.

An hour later,

“Golden light!”

Ye Tian flew into a small mountain peak below, following the golden light and found a tree.

This tree was ten meters tall and as thick as a person. Its bark was like scales, shining brightly. 
The tree bore some fruits, which were full of fragrance and obviously not ordinary fruits.

“Roar!”

A fiery red ape rushed out and roared at Ye Tian,



“Human, get away!”

Ye Tian used his copying talent to check the opponent’s talent and judged its strength based on 
its cultivation. It was a six-star Emperor-level beast. Although its strength was not bad, it was 
still too weak in his eyes.

Ye Tian used the Great Tearing Divine Claw to pin it to the ground and then hypnotized it with 
his hypnotism talent.

Soon, the opponent was hypnotized and at the mercy of Ye Tian.

“Tell me, what is this tree, and what is the use of the fruits on it?”

Ye Tian asked.

“This tree is a Yang Scale Tree, and the fruits are called Yang Scale Fruits. They are fire-
element spirit fruits. Consuming one can accelerate the bloodline transformation of fire-
element beasts. I have a fire-element talent, so I can use these Yang Scale Fruits to complete 
my bloodline transformation!” the ape narrated.

“Fire-element spirit fruits!!!”

Ye Tian’s heart stirred. This treasure was exactly what he needed.

He counted, and there were seven mature Yang Scale Fruits on the tree. The other fruits were 
not yet ripe.

So, he plucked the seven mature Yang Scale Fruits and placed them in his portable Xumi 
Storage Realm.

Ye Tian did not kill the ape but simply left.

Not long after Ye Tian left, the ape woke up from hypnosis.



When it saw that the mature Yang Scale Fruits were gone, it roared for a long time, and the 
other nearby beasts suffered its wrath.

Along the way,

Ye Tian continuously used his treasure-finding talent to find various treasures, indeed finding 
quite a few, including some high-grade ones.

Whenever he found some treasures, he would stop to establish a cave dwelling and dedicate 
time to cultivation.

Just like that,

Ye Tian had been in the Wondrous Object Realm for four months.

On this day, Ye Tian realized he was touching upon the fifteenth limit of his body.

“Break!”

Ye Tian activated the energy of various treasures within his body and fiercely broke through 
the fifteenth limit of his body with ease.

This transformation turned Ye Tian’s body into something akin to a black hole, frantically 
devouring the energy of various spiritual medicines, fruits, and herbs. It took several hours to 
finally stabilize his realm.

At that moment,

Ye Tian sensed a new level of battle power emerging from the depths — the Sovereign 
Emperor-level!

“Not yet at the Sovereign Emperor-level, but very close!” Ye Tian realized.



It was a kind of restraint that seemed visible yet was just out of reach.

“It’s close, very close. Just a bit more to step into the Sovereign Emperor-level. Perhaps, if I 
can comprehend another spatial technique from my spatial talent, I might break this restraint 
and be recognized by the universe to have stepped into the Sovereign Emperor-level battle 
power!” Ye Tian speculated.

Although he seemed close to the Sovereign Emperor-level, there was still a significant gap in 
actual battle power.

A nine-star Emperor-level facing a Sovereign Emperor-level Heavenly Pride would find it 
difficult to contend, not due to the vast gap in power but because of the difference in how 
strength was manifested.

A newly ascended Sovereign Emperor might seem only slightly stronger than a nine-star 
Emperor-level, but in reality, it was different.

Heavenly Prides could maximize their battle power and aura to the fullest, while nine-star 
Emperors, seemingly powerful and fully exerting their strength, were actually under the 
suppression of the universe.

For example, warriors from Silver Universe Star were under suppression. In fact, they were 
also suppressed in the cosmic space but were so accustomed to this suppression that they did 
not feel it.

But a Heavenly Pride could break this suppression and fully unleash their battle power.

That’s why a Sovereign Emperor-level Heavenly Pride could easily defeat a nine-star Emperor, 
even the first-tier ones, who would find it difficult to contend against even the weakest 
Heavenly Pride.

“Next, I will fully focus on comprehending my spatial talent, striving to understand new 
spatial techniques!” Ye Tian decided.

After all, he had already broken through the fifteenth bodily limit, and breaking through the 
sixteenth was not so simple. After breaking through the fifteenth limit, each subsequent limit 
became increasingly difficult, even for highly talented Emperors.



The difficulty of breaking through the sixteenth limit was estimated to be ten times that of the 
fifteenth, and breaking the seventeenth, ten times that of the sixteenth.

Because of this increasing difficulty, it was rare for a ‘Child of the Universe’ to emerge. 
Otherwise, the top powers of the universe would have already exerted all their efforts to 
cultivate such beings.

However, even vast galaxies like the Milky Way did not have a ‘Child of the Universe’.

Therefore, Ye Tian did not expect to break through the sixteenth bodily limit in the Wondrous 
Object Realm, and since those treasures could not be taken out, he lost interest in collecting 
them and decided to fully focus on his spatial talent.

Time passed day by day,

In the blink of an eye, Ye Tian spent half a year comprehending in the Wondrous Object 
Realm. Including the previous four months, he had been there for ten months and had only two 
months left before he had to leave.

On this day,

Laughter echoed from a large mountain — Ye Tian had grasped a hint and was about to 
comprehend a spatial technique.

He also felt in the depths of his being a calling from the Sovereign Emperor-level.

Comprehend!

Three more days passed,

Ye Tian stood in mid-air, took a step, and completely disappeared.

The next instant,



His hand emerged from the void, smashing a mountain range below with a slap, and then the 
hand vanished again.

With a tearing sound,

Ye Tian walked out from within space.

“Following spatial compression, spatial vibration, and spatial orb, I’ve comprehended another 
technique — Spatial Phasing!”

He had just completely hidden himself in space. This technique was not just invisibility — 
while invisibility rendered one unseen but still present in the same location, spatial phasing 
meant the enemy could not attack him unless they could penetrate space itself.

If the enemy lacked the means to break through space or locate him within it, he was virtually 
invincible.

Of course, he couldn’t stay in space indefinitely; with his current strength, he could remain 
there for one minute.

One minute was enough to end a battle!

At this moment, a profound force from the depths of the universe descended upon him.

Chapter 313: The Title of Heavenly Pride! The Nine Star Beyond Grass!

The universe bestows the title of Heavenly Pride!

At this moment, a power descending from the depths of the universe proved that Ye Tian has 
stepped into the level of a Sovereign Emperor in battle strength.

Boom!!!



The center of Ye Tian’s brows was branded by the cosmic laws, and gradually, a Heavenly 
Pride mark invisible to the naked eye appeared.

If Ye Tian wished, in the future, he could activate the Heavenly Pride mark to prove his 
identity, worthy of countless people’s admiration.

At this time,

Many great powers on Silver Universe Star, who were in closed-door cultivation, opened their 
eyes.

“Someone is becoming a Heavenly Pride!”

“We on Silver Universe Star have one more Heavenly Pride, what good news!”

“I wonder which old fellow’s descendant it is. It’s a pity it’s not my kid, or I could’ve bragged 
about it!”

Voices of the great powers echoed in the void and quickly returned to calm.

Although the birth of a Heavenly Pride caught the attention of these great powers, it wasn’t 
significant enough to move them deeply. After all, there were many Heavenly Prides on Silver 
Universe Star, and being just a Sovereign Emperor-level Heavenly Pride wasn’t a matter that 
shakes heaven and earth.

Only the birth of a peerless Supreme Emperor-level Heavenly Pride would truly move them.

But achieving the level of a peerless Supreme Emperor-level Heavenly Pride was extremely 
difficult. Most Heavenly Prides, even if they dragged on for a lifetime without advancing to 
the God level, cannot step into the power of a peerless Supreme Emperor-level Heavenly 
Pride.

They also didn’t think that this youngster who just stepped into the battle strength of a 
Sovereign Emperor-level Heavenly Pride could hope to step into the Supreme Emperor-level, 
so there was nothing worth paying attention to.



Wondrous Object Realm

At this moment, Ye Tian sensed his own strength and the binding of this world had greatly 
weakened.

This moment, he could easily defeat his former self.

“The Sovereign Emperor-level is indeed powerful!”

Ye Tian was filled with excitement.

If he returned to Earth at this time, not to mention sweeping the globe, he would also be able 
to contend with those sect forces and the top demigods of the dragon race, unless they had 
demigods transformed from the Sovereign Emperor-level.

But how rare were Sovereign Emperor-level Heavenly Prides? The dragon race on Earth was 
just one of the dragon races from a dragon planet, and those sect masters were merely forces 
from a small planetary system in the Milky Way, not significant enough to give birth to a 
Heavenly Pride.

“It’s only been a bit over a year. Wait till five years pass, I will definitely sweep everything on 
Earth, even Emperors and demigods!” Ye Tian was full of confidence in himself.

At this moment, his heart swelled immensely!

After spending a few days, Ye Tian completely familiarized himself with the Heavenly Pride 
level battle strength and was preparing for a period of cultivation when he received a message 
from Liu Qingyi.

“Heavenly Emperor of Ten Thousand Laws, we found an amazing opportunity! Come 
quickly!”

Liu Qingyi’s voice was very excited.



“Where is it?”

Ye Tian asked.

Liu Qingyi quickly mentioned a general area and urged Ye Tian to come over quickly.

Ye Tian didn’t ask for specifics and directly went there.

After becoming a Heavenly Pride, Ye Tian’s speed was much faster than before.

Whoosh, whoosh, whoosh!!!

Ye Tian traversed the void at an incredible speed, like a streak of light, covering millions of 
miles in an instant.

Since Liu Qingyi’s directions were not very clear, it took Ye Tian a while to finally find the 
right place.

Above the ocean,

Near an isolated island, Liu Qingyi stood in the air, watching from afar, not daring to 
approach, while Qin Zixuan also stood there.

“Qingyi, you called the Heavenly Emperor of Ten Thousand Laws here. Does he have a 
chance to snatch it?”

Qin Zixuan was somewhat worried.

“Ye Tian’s strength is not bad, just below the first tier of the nine-star Emperor-level, and he 
has cultivated here for ten months, perhaps he has broken through to the first tier of the nine-
star Emperor-level? Moreover, Ye Tian’s life-saving means are much stronger than ours. Even 
the God level Black Gold Kirin Beast couldn’t kill him. Even if he can’t snatch that treasure, 
he can surely retreat safely!” Liu Qingyi said.



“That’s true!”

Qin Zixuan nodded in agreement.

Swoosh!

A figure suddenly appeared beside the two women, who instinctively prepared to act.

“It’s me!”

It was Ye Tian’s voice.

Liu Qingyi and Qin Zixuan focused and realized that the person who had just teleported was 
Ye Tian.

“Qingyi, what exactly is this opportunity? I see many emperors battling on that island, and it 
seems that quite a few great emperors have fallen, right?”

Ye Tian asked, puzzled.

“It’s a truly amazing opportunity!” Liu Qingyi said gravely, “The Nine Star Beyond Grass has 
appeared. It’s on that island, guarded by a first-tier nine-star Emperor-level Lightning Winged 
Dragon Beast. The Peerless Sword Emperor and the Overlord Emperor, both first-tier nine-star 
Emperors, are attacking the beast. Other emperors are trying to seize the opportunity to snatch 
the Nine Star Beyond Grass. Some have been slain by the Peerless Sword Emperor and the 
Overlord Emperor, and others have been killed by the Lightning Winged Dragon Beast!”

“What is the Nine Star Beyond Grass?”

Ye Tian was curious.

Qin Zixuan couldn’t help but explain, “The Nine Star Beyond Grass is a fantastic thing. It can 
elevate someone’s talent from Mystic level to God level. How incredible is that ability! 
Normally, to form a God level talent, one must merge talents. For example, the Cold Ice Talent 
and the Water Ball Talent can be merged. If you attempt to fuse the Cold Ice Mystic with the 



Water Mystic and succeed, you can combine the two talents into a God level talent. But fusing 
Mystics is extremely difficult. Even top forces need many rare treasures and various methods 
to hopefully form a God level talent. Some talents have a traceable path to becoming God 
level, but others have almost no hope and can hardly become God level. But the Nine Star 
Beyond Grass can easily elevate a person’s talent to God level. How many emperors would be 
tempted by that?”

“The effect of the Nine Star Beyond Grass is so incredible!”

Ye Tian was also tempted.

Liu Qingyi said, “Ye Tian, we don’t have the strength to snatch the Nine Star Beyond Grass, 
but if you try, be careful. The Peerless Sword Emperor and the Overlord Emperor have gone 
completely mad. They’ve even killed emperors from top forces. To snatch the Nine Star 
Beyond Grass, they’re willing to kill anyone. They’re already first-tier nine-star Emperors. 
This Nine Star Beyond Grass could even allow them to step into the Sovereign Emperor-level 
and become a Heavenly Pride. The temptation of becoming a Heavenly Pride is immense, 
enough to make them betray their own forces!”

At that moment,

Another great emperor entered the island.

“It’s the Hate Mad Emperor!”

Ye Tian recognized the newcomer, also a member of the Qin family.

“Even the Hate Mad Emperor has come, the competition is fiercer. Heavenly Emperor of Ten 
Thousand Laws, maybe you shouldn’t go!” suggested Qin Zixuan.

“Don’t worry, my strength is much greater than before!”

Ye Tian smiled slightly and teleported onto the island in one step.

Though it was called an island, its area was no less than that of a continent.



At this moment,

The mountains on the island turned into rubble, numerous emperors rushed into the central 
mountain like madmen, but any emperor trying to approach the Nine Star Beyond Grass was 
killed.

The Peerless Sword Emperor and others didn’t want the Nine Star Beyond Grass to fall into 
other emperors’ hands. Anyone trying to snatch it had only one fate — death!

After the Hate Mad Emperor entered, he tried to snatch the Nine Star Beyond Grass. The 
Peerless Sword Emperor and the Overlord Emperor immediately abandoned the Lightning 
Winged Dragon Beast to stop him, and chaos ensued!

At that time,

The Lightning Winged Dragon Beast silently returned to its lair to guard the Nine Star Beyond 
Grass.

Ye Tian walked step by step, gradually approaching the Nine Star Beyond Grass.

Suddenly,

A feeling of desire surged, a sensation too familiar — it was from his copy talent.

“The Nine Star Beyond Grass can enhance my copy talent!!!”

Chapter 314: Successfully Seizing the Nine Star Beyond Grass!

Ye Tian was unclear about the specific level of his Copy Talent, but every upgrade and 
transformation of the Copy Talent brought him tremendous benefits, unmatched by other 
talents.

What Ye Tian wanted to improve most was his Copy Talent, but elevating it was extremely 
difficult. The treasures that could enhance other talents were useless for the Copy Talent.



However, once he encountered a treasure that could enhance the Copy Talent, it would 
automatically resonate.

Undoubtedly, the Nine Star Beyond Grass stirred the desire of the Copy Talent, surely capable 
of elevating its level and inducing a transformation.

“The Nine Star Beyond Grass, I must obtain it!”

Ye Tian moved, vanishing into the space.

He had the power to sweep through everything, but he feared that the Nine Star Beyond Grass 
would be destroyed. Killing everyone would then be pointless.

Therefore, he must ensure he obtains the Nine Star Beyond Grass first.

Once he had the Nine Star Beyond Grass, even if others wanted to confront him, he would 
have no worries.

Inside the space, Ye Tian looked out as if standing before a glass, observing everything 
outside.

In the space, Ye Tian took a few steps and arrived at the center of the island where the Nine 
Star Beyond Grass was located.

The Nine Star Beyond Grass was unique, with nine star-like lights twinkling on it, 
corresponding to its nine leaves, each leaf sharp and delicate, with patterns covering the plant.

The Nine Star Beyond Grass grew on a rock, protected by a faint light barrier, shielding it 
from external attacks.

At this moment,



The Lightning Wing Dragon Beast guarded the Nine Star Beyond Grass, preventing anyone 
from approaching, while the Peerless Sword Emperor, the Overlord Emperor, and the Hate 
Mad Emperor ceased fighting and were discussing.

“Peerless Sword Emperor, Overlord Emperor, we can’t keep this stalemate. How about we join 
forces to kill the Lightning Wing Dragon Beast and then fight for the Nine Star Beyond 
Grass?” proposed the Hate Mad Emperor.

The Peerless Sword Emperor snorted, “Hmph, originally, the Overlord Emperor and I agreed 
to kill the Lightning Wing Dragon Beast first, but you disrupted our plan by trying to snatch 
the Nine Star Beyond Grass. If you had helped us kill the beast from the start, it might already 
be dead!”

“Let’s not dwell on the past. Let’s join forces.”

The Overlord Emperor spoke.

Just as the three emperors were about to join forces against the Lightning Wing Dragon Beast,

But suddenly, a hand appeared beside the Nine Star Beyond Grass. The hand, shaped like a 
claw, grabbed it.

Boom!!!

The light barrier on the Nine Star Beyond Grass shattered, and the claw dug into the rock, 
pulling out the Nine Star Beyond Grass.

Then the hand, holding the Nine Star Beyond Grass, vanished into space.

“Roar!”

The Lightning Wing Dragon Beast went mad. Its treasure was stolen?

It furiously attacked the area,



But found no trace of the thief.

Nearby,

The Peerless Sword Emperor, the Overlord Emperor, and the Hate Mad Emperor were also 
stunned. The Nine Star Beyond Grass had disappeared suddenly.

“That person must be a space talent user. He must have phased into space. The rumors are 
true!”

The Hate Mad Emperor’s face was grim.

The Nine Star Beyond Grass was a treasure he had longed for. If he could obtain it, he might 
even elevate his Mystic-level strength talent to a God-level talent. This would break the 
shackles between the nine-star Emperor-level and the Sovereign Emperor-level, stepping into 
the Sovereign Emperor-level and becoming a Heavenly Pride.

But now, the Nine Star Beyond Grass was snatched by someone else.

“Phase into space? I will find you!” The Peerless Sword Emperor took out a treasure mirror.

“The Escape Space Mirror! Peerless Sword Emperor, you have such a treasure!” The Overlord 
Emperor and the Hate Mad Emperor were surprised.

The Escape Space Mirror was famous in Silver Universe Star, a trinket crafted by a Supreme 
being in a moment of boredom. Ninety-nine were made, each incredibly precious.

The Escape Space Mirror could reveal the trace of anyone hiding, peer through space, and 
track enemies.

If someone escaped into space, the Escape Space Mirror could detect them.

Boom!!!



The Escape Space Mirror revealed the surrounding environment.

“Peer into space!”

With the Peerless Sword Emperor’s manipulation, the power of the Escape Space Mirror 
permeated into the space, and the interior of the space appeared in the mirror.

Soon,

Ye Tian’s figure appeared in the Escape Space Mirror.

“He is the Heavenly Emperor of Ten Thousand Laws!”

The Peerless Sword Emperor frowned.

He had recently heard of the Heavenly Emperor of Ten Thousand Laws, a newly risen nine-
star Emperor of the second tier in Qingfeng Giant City.

It was said that in the Wondrous Object Realm, the Heavenly Emperor of Ten Thousand Laws 
had obtained a Dark Soul Star Grass and defeated three second-tier nine-star Emperors, his 
power approaching that of the first tier.

But according to the rumors, Ye Tian didn’t possess the ability to enter space!

“Who among you can penetrate space?”

The Hate Mad Emperor inquired.

The Peerless Sword Emperor gravely said, “Even if we can, so what? We can attack him, but 
can’t he just evade? Besides, if we can see him, he can also see us. The Escape Space Mirror 
can only detect an enemy’s presence. Its real usefulness is limited. If the Heavenly Emperor of 
Ten Thousand Laws decides to leave, we probably can’t catch up!”

“Leave? I have no intention of fleeing!”



Ye Tian’s voice emerged.

The next moment, he stepped out from the space, hands behind his back, facing the crowd.

“Human, it was you who stole my treasure!”

The Lightning Wing Dragon Beast glared at Ye Tian and rushed over with a fury.

Seeing the Lightning Wing Dragon Beast make a move, the Peerless Sword Emperor and the 
others just watched.

The Lightning Wing Dragon Beast, also a first-tier nine-star Emperor, was no less than any of 
them.

Thus, they did not need to act.

“It would be best if it could kill him!”

The Peerless Sword Emperor and the others secretly hoped.

But they also knew the possibility was slim because Ye Tian could phase into space.

“Begone!”

Ye Tian unleashed his God-level strength talent and the God-level claw technique, the Great 
Tearing Divine Claw, launching an attack.

Boom!!!

The Lightning Wing Dragon Beast was directly blown away by Ye Tian’s strike, its scales 
shattered, and a huge wound appeared on its chest, almost piercing through its body.



The beast was severely injured by a single strike.

“Impossible!!!”

The Peerless Sword Emperor and others were shocked and disbelieving.

They had fought the Lightning Wing Dragon Beast and knew its physique was truly of the 
first-tier nine-star Emperor-level, while Ye Tian was rumored to be only of the second tier!

Even if Ye Tian had made a breakthrough to the first tier, at best, he should only be on par with 
the Lightning Wing Dragon Beast. How could he severely injure it in one strike?

This made no sense!

“Heavenly Pride! Have you stepped into the rank of Heavenly Pride?”

The Peerless Sword Emperor asked tremulously.

The others looked at Ye Tian in shock.

Heavenly Pride! What an honorable title. Qingfeng Giant City had produced Heavenly Prides 
in the past, but they had left for higher pursuits, leaving no Heavenly Prides in this generation.

The first-tier nine-star Emperors were the strongest of the young generation in Qingfeng Giant 
City!

But now, Ye Tian had displayed strength akin to a Heavenly Pride, leaving them astonished.

“I refuse to believe he’s a Heavenly Pride!”

The Hate Mad Emperor launched an attack.



Desperate for the Nine Star Beyond Grass, he didn’t want to give up. He preferred to believe 
that Ye Tian had used some forbidden technique to forcibly enhance his strength and severely 
injure the Lightning Wing Dragon Beast.

If that were the case, he could severely injure Ye Tian and seize the Nine Star Beyond Grass!

“Begone!”

Ye Tian pointed, and a space sphere appeared, instantly enveloping the Hate Mad Emperor.

“Spatial Orb!!!”

The Hate Mad Emperor was alarmed.

He manifested a Dawn-level defensive armor, activated his yuan force defensive technique, 
and his Mystic-level defensive talent.

Boom!!!

The space sphere exploded, completely shattering the interior space. A blood-covered figure 
was thrown out, unmistakably the Hate Mad Emperor, now severely injured.

“Heavenly Pride, he really is a Heavenly Pride!”

The Peerless Sword Emperor murmured, utterly convinced of Ye Tian’s strength.

Chapter 315: Transformation of the Talent Copying Ability, Seizing and Bestowing!

Merely a space sphere inflicted severe injuries on a nine-star Emperor of the first tier, 
something that only a genius could achieve.

Geniuses can negate a part of the suppression of the natural world, truly unleashing their 
strength, making their combat power much stronger than that of a nine-star Emperor of the 
first tier.



That is precisely why a genius could easily inflict heavy injuries on a nine-star Emperor.

At that moment,

A Heavenly Pride imprint appeared on Ye Tian’s forehead.

“Get lost!”

His clear voice echoed throughout the venue.

“Heavenly Pride Imprint!!!”

Many Emperors were stunned and immediately fled.

Facing a genius, they lacked even the courage to fight.

“Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, I shall leave at once!”

The Peerless Sword Emperor clasped his hands and swiftly retreated, not daring to confront Ye 
Tian.

Hate Mad Emperor too didn’t dare show any hostility, quickly saying, “Heavenly Pride of Ten 
Thousand Laws, I was impolite just now, please forgive me!”

“Aren’t you leaving yet?”

Ye Tian stared at Hate Mad Emperor.

Startled, Hate Mad Emperor hurriedly fled with his injuries, fearing Ye Tian might change his 
mind.



Overlord Emperor also completely gave up on the Nine Star Beyond Grass. Snatching it from 
the hands of a Heavenly Pride was nearly impossible.

In a blink, all the Emperors on the island had left.

Whoosh whoosh!!

Two Emperors arrived on the island, namely Liu Qingyi and Qin Zixuan.

“Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, you are a Heavenly Pride!!!”

Qin Zixuan was incredibly shocked as she looked at Ye Tian, still somewhat in disbelief.

“Yes!”

Ye Tian admitted.

There was nothing to hide about being a Heavenly Pride, it only incited fear in others.

Like just now, his display of a Heavenly Pride’s power deterred many Emperors from 
attacking him. Such was the deterrent power of a Heavenly Pride.

Had he been just a nine-star Emperor of the first tier, other Emperors might have joined forces 
against him.

This was the difference between a Heavenly Pride and a nine-star Emperor!

“My God, you really are a Heavenly Pride!” Liu Qingyi covered her mouth in astonishment.

If another first-tier Emperor had become a He aven’s Pridewith the help of the Nine Star 
Beyond Grass, it wouldn’t have been surprising, but Ye Tian had become a genius without 
even refining the Nine Star Beyond Grass.



Wouldn’t he be even stronger if he refined the Nine Star Beyond Grass?

“Just luck!”

Ye Tian smiled slightly.

This time, his advancement to the Emperor Genius level indeed owed much to Liu Qingyi and 
Qin Zixuan. Without their help in granting him entry to the wondrous object realm, who 
knows how long it would have taken him to become a Heavenly Pride!

Despite nowing Ye Tian was a Heavenly Pride, Liu Qingyi and Qin Zixuan weren’t restrained.

With their status, they weren’t afraid of a Heavenly Pride.

How could a Heavenly Pride be stronger than their grandfathers?

Besides, Ye Tian wasn’t their enemy, so naturally, they had no reason to fear.

Ye Tian didn’t chat with Liu Qingyi and the others for long before they went their separate 
ways.

With only two months left, careful searching might yield some benefits, so naturally, he 
couldn’t waste time.

Ye Tian flew over the sea and soon found another island, where he established a temporary 
cave dwelling for seclusion.

Inside the cave dwelling,

Ye Tian took out the Nine Star Beyond Grass and immediately swallowed it, beginning to 
refine it.

Boom!!!



The talent copying imprint crazily absorbed the energy of the Nine Star Beyond Grass. This 
time, Ye Tian didn’t faint but clearly sensed the transformation of the talent copying ability.

Half a day later,

The transformation of the talent copying ability was finally complete!

Ye Tian quickly connected with the talent copying imprint with his consciousness and 
understood the changes in the talent copying ability.

Firstly,

On Silver Universe Star, the range of the talent copying ability expanded from 100 meters to 
3000 meters, a significant increase, truly a transformation.

Secondly,

The talent copying ability could now copy five talents at a time with a cooldown of one day.

Furthermore, the talent copying ability gained an additional power – Seizure and Bestowal!

Seizure means to strip someone of their talent, while Bestowal is to grant someone a talent.

For instance, he could seize the Supreme level cultivation talent from someone and bestow it 
upon another person. Then, the person bestowed with the talent would possess the Supreme 
level cultivation talent.

Such an ability was incredibly heaven-defying!

Thus, his wife and sister were fortunate, as they no longer need to worry about their talents!

Of course,



This ability was also limited, as it can only seize the talent of martial warriors with a weaker 
soul strength than his. If the opponent’s soul was very strong, his copy talent could not seize 
their talent.

Additionally, this ability could only be used once a year.

“Now I don’t have to worry about Yue’er and Little Yu’s talents anymore. I was concerned that 
in the future, they would be limited to the God level and couldn’t advance further. Even the 
Gods with strong powers will die once their lifespan reaches its limit!”

Ye Tian murmured.

To be with Yue’er forever, he must ensure her talent was high enough to reach a higher realm. 
But Dawn level cultivation talent was almost impossible to improve.

He had previously searched on the network of Silver Universe Star and consulted Liu Qingyi 
and Qin Zixuan. He knew that items capable of birthing Dawn level cultivation talents were 
not rare on Silver Universe Star and could be bought at a price. However, items that could 
elevate to the Supreme level cultivation talent were extremely rare, even the most powerful 
forces in the Milky Way might not possess them.

He had little hope of obtaining such treasures, so he was always worried about his wife and 
sister’s cultivation talents.

But now, he no longer needs to worry!

“Seizure and Bestowal must be used wisely, only on my enemies!”

Ye Tian was principled and would not use such an ability on a stranger.

Because once the Seizure and Bestowal ability was used, the opponent would lose their 
cultivation talent and could never cultivate again.

To avoid exposing this ability, he had to kill the opponent, so it could only be used on his 
enemies.



“The benefits of this transformation of the talent copying ability are immense. I really have to 
thank Liu Qingyi. If she hadn’t sent me a message, I wouldn’t have known about the Nine Star 
Beyond Grass and wouldn’t have been able to obtain it, and thus wouldn’t have been able to 
transform my talent copying ability!”

Ye Tian thought.

He decided to help Liu Qingyi if she ever faced trouble in the future.

With two months left before the closure of the wondrous object realm, he still had many 
treasures from the realm. It would be a waste not to use them.

Thus, Ye Tian crazily consumed these treasures to temper his body.

He didn’t seek to break through the sixteenth physical limit, only to temper his body stronger, 
so he could save some time in cultivation in the future.

Time passed day by day.

In the blink of an eye, nearly two months had passed.

There were only three days left until the complete closure of the wondrous object realm, and 
Ye Tian had exhausted all the treasures from the realm.

“It’s time to go back!”

After determining the direction, Ye Tian flew towards the entrance of the wondrous object 
realm.

Emperors could travel quickly, and three days were enough to reach the entrance of the 
wondrous object realm.



On his way, Ye Tian flew slowly, using his treasure-seeking talent to see if he could find 
treasures comparable to the Nine Star Beyond Grass and then seal them with the last boundary 
stone to take out.

Unfortunately, his luck wasn’t that good. Until he reached the entrance of the wondrous object 
realm, he didn’t find any particularly precious treasures.

“Forget it, I’ll keep the last boundary stone for later use. It might come in handy!”

Ye Tian thought.

Whoosh!

He flew into the entrance of the wondrous object realm and flew out, leaving the realm.

When Ye Tian flew out, he saw many Emperors.

By then, the news of Ye Tian being a Heavenly Pride had spread, and many Emperors looked 
at him with respect, awe, fear, and even envy.

“Greetings, Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws!”

“Greetings, Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws!”

“Greetings, Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws!”

Emperors clasped their fists and bowed.

This shows how great the reputation of a Heavenly Pride was, even the Emperors who were 
displeased with Ye Tian had to be respectful.

Liu Qingyi and Qin Zixuan had also come out earlier, and when Ye Tian arrived, they came 
over.



“Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, let’s go back!” Qin Zixuan said.

Chapter 316: Heavenly Prides Cannot Be Insulted!

Shortly after Ye Tian, along with Liu Qingyi and Qin Zixuan, left, they soon returned to 
Qingfeng Giant City.

“Ye Tian, we must leave now. Let’s meet again next time!” Liu Qingyi and Qin Zixuan bid 
farewell to Ye Tian.

“Others may call me the Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws’, but we are friends. From 
now on, just call me Ye Tian. If that’s too informal, ‘Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws’ is 
also fine,” Ye Tian said.

Suddenly, Liu Qingyi, with a serious expression, said, “A Heavenly Pride cannot be insulted. 
Don’t think that it’s just a mere title; it holds an extraordinary significance!”

“A Heavenly Pride cannot be insulted? It has an extraordinary significance?” Ye Tian was 
surprised, hearing this for the first time.

“Many Emperors treated you courteously, some from Qingfeng Giant City’s top powers. Why 
were they so polite? Is it truly out of fear for your strength? No, it’s the title of Heavenly Pride 
they fear, not your strength. Even God level experts won’t overstep. Even if they could easily 
kill a God level being, they still fear offending a Heavenly Pride. Do you know why?” Liu 
Qingyi asked.

“Why?” Ye Tian was equally curious.

“A Heavenly Pride cannot be insulted!” Liu Qingyi explained. “If someone insults a Heavenly 
Pride and gets killed by them, the offender’s backing forces wouldn’t dare to retaliate. That 
person deserved to die. ‘Heavenly Pride cannot be insulted’ is not just an empty phrase but a 
rule. Once, a major power, with many True Gods, was destroyed by humanity’s higher 
echelons because they sent a True God to kill a Heavenly Pride. That incident led to the death 
of many True Gods, Gods, and Emperors.”

“What!” Ye Tian was shocked.



The death of a Heavenly Pride led to so many True Gods and God level beings being buried 
along, even destroying the entire force!

This…

Ye Tian didn’t know what to say.

Liu Qingyi continued, “You might think that Heavenly Pride had a powerful master or an 
extraordinary background. But that Heavenly Pride was just a native emerging from a human 
planet. They had just stepped out of their own world not long ago. Their demise was due to 
provoking a spoiled brat, leading to the destruction of a major force. This incident made 
everyone aware that ‘Heavenly Pride cannot be insulted’ is not a mere saying. No force dares 
to attack a Heavenly Pride. Only a Heavenly Pride can kill a being above the God level. 
Anyone who dares to strike against a Heavenly Pride meets a fatal end!”

“The title of Heavenly Pride has such benefits!” Ye Tian was surprised and also pleased.

It seems that as long as he doesn’t act recklessly, he should be relatively safe at the Emperor-
level.

However, the protection of Heavenly Pride only applies to humans; other races don’t care 
whether one is a Heavenly Pride or not.

With the title of Heavenly Pride, Ye Tian doesn’t have to worry about forces in Qingfeng Giant 
City harming him, but he won’t become overly arrogant.

The protection for a Heavenly Pride only lasts until the Emperor-level. Once one becomes a 
God level being, they are no longer considered a Heavenly Pride.

Humanity’s protection for Heavenly Prides is just to ensure they don’t fall before growing up. 
They can’t protect them forever; otherwise, humanity would be in chaos.

Qin Zixuan and Liu Qingyi, out of respect, initially addressed Ye Tian as the ‘Heavenly Pride 
of Ten Thousand Laws’, but at Ye Tian’s insistence, they changed to calling him by his real 
name.



This brought Ye Tian closer to the two women, becoming true friends rather than just 
seemingly good friends with a bit of unfamiliarity.

After Liu Qingyi and Qin Zixuan left, Ye Tian returned to his residence.

In the following days, numerous forces sent people to woo Ye Tian, but he handled them 
perfunctorily.

Clearly, they all hoped Ye Tian would join their forces. Having a Heavenly Pride in their ranks 
would bring many benefits!

Relying on the prestige of the Heavenly Pride could bring many advantages to their forces.

Unfortunately, Ye Tian had no interest in joining any of them.

One day,

Ye Tian was in seclusion for cultivation when Qin Zixuan came to visit.

In the hall…

“Zixuan, what brings you here to see me?” Ye Tian asked.

“I’m here because my father wishes to invite you to the City Lord’s Mansion,” Qin Zixuan 
said.

“Your father?” Ye Tian frowned. Qin Zixuan’s father, being the son of the City Lord, was a 
minor City Lord himself. Rumored to possess God level cultivation, he wasn’t far from 
reaching the True God level, a very powerful figure indeed.

Why would such an important person invite him to the City Lord’s Mansion? Could it be…



“Zixuan, does your father want me to join the Qin family or the City Lord’s Mansion? If that’s 
the case, I must decline,” Ye Tian warned, hoping to avoid any awkwardness in their 
relationship.

“That’s not it,” Qin Zixuan clarified. “It seems to be about something else. Don’t worry, if he 
really invites you to join the City Lord’s Mansion or the Qin family, you can simply refuse. 
However, my father mentioned something about the Heavenly Pride Order. I’m not clear about 
the details.”

After a moment of silence, Ye Tian agreed, “Alright, then I’ll visit the City Lord’s Mansion.”

Qin Zixuan led the way, and Ye Tian followed her towards the City Lord’s Mansion.

…

At the City Lord’s Mansion, Ye Tian followed Qin Zixuan to this place, his first visit to the 
City Lord’s Mansion. The mansion was large and enveloped by a very powerful array. Even 
with his talent in arrays, Ye Tian could hardly discern the intricacies of this formation, clearly 
indicating its level was beyond his imagination.

Apart from the array’s protection, the City Lord’s Mansion’s army consisted of Emperor-level 
warriors, with the presence of God level beings around, indicating the guards included many 
of them. Deep within the mansion, there were faint but powerful auras far surpassing the God 
level, surely belonging to beings of the True God level.

“Miss!”

“Miss!”

“Miss!”

One after another, the guards and servants of the City Lord’s Mansion greeted Qin Zixuan, but 
since they did not recognize Ye Tian, they naturally ignored him.

Soon, Ye Tian arrived at a side hall in the City Lord’s Mansion.



“Ye Tian, please sit here. I will go inform my father,” Qin Zixuan said.

Just then, a voice came, “No need to inform me, I’m here.”

A young man dressed in a green robe entered. He was Qin Zixuan’s father. Due to the long 
lifespan of God level beings, Qin Zixuan’s father looked very young, quite different from the 
middle-aged father Ye Tian had imagined.

“Greetings to Great God Zilun!” Ye Tian stood up and respectfully said.

There are specific titles for each level: Emperors have their titles, and so do God level beings. 
A God level expert must be addressed as ‘Great God’. Zilun, known as the Great Emperor 
Zilun when at the Emperor-level, should be addressed as Great God Zilun at the God level.

“Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, please, no need for formalities, have a seat,” Great 
God Zilun said with a smile.

Then, turning to Qin Zixuan, he instructed, “Xuan’er, go tend to your matters.”

The implication was clear: he wanted Qin Zixuan to leave.

“Father, I’ll just sit here quietly and listen, I won’t cause any trouble!” Qin Zixuan, curious, 
wanted to stay and listen.

Great God Zilun, with a serious expression, said, “Xuan’er, some matters are only for 
Heavenly Prides or those at the God level to know. You shouldn’t learn of them prematurely, 
understand?”

Hearing this, Qin Zixuan realized that the conversation between her father and Ye Tian 
involved secrets. She dared not stay and quickly left.

Once Qin Zixuan had gone, Great God Zilun said, “Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, 
I’m not here to ask you to join the Qin family or the City Lord’s Mansion. A Heavenly Pride 
has his pride and wouldn’t join a force so easily. Actually, I’m here to discuss another matter. 



It’s about asking for your help, which would also benefit you. It’s a mutually beneficial 
matter.”

“Please speak plainly, Great God Zilun!” Ye Tian was also interested in what Great God Zilun 
had to say, as long as there were benefits and no harm to him, he wouldn’t mind undertaking 
such a task.

Chapter 317: The Ye Family Owns the Solar System Now!

Great God Zilun, seeing the conversation had reached this point, spoke candidly, “There are 
many talents on Silver Universe Star, and through generations, these talents have formed a 
force known as the ‘Heavenly Pride Pavilion.’ It’s a loosely organized entity of the Heavenly 
Prides, not strictly a power in itself, but many talents are associated with it. Progressing further 
is tough for them, and the Pavilion holds numerous resources and legacies that are very 
beneficial. Moreover, it’s a place for top forces to contend. Once a talent from a subordinate 
force makes a name in the Pavilion, it benefits that force significantly.”

“Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, as an outsider martial warrior on Silver Universe 
Star, you have no deep roots here and progressing further might be challenging. You probably 
aren’t even aware of the strength divisions above the rank of ‘Heavenly Pride.’ But once 
you’re associated with Heavenly Pride Pavilion, you can easily access a lot of useful 
information and legacies, and even compete with many other talents. The Pavilion has many 
great opportunities and legacies to offer. Without an association, you wouldn’t have a chance 
to access them. My main reason for approaching you is to hope that when you associate 
yourself with Heavenly Pride Pavilion, you do it under the banner of Qingfeng Giant City.”

After Zilun finished speaking, he awaited Ye Tian’s response.

“Associate with Qingfeng Giant City?” Ye Tian pondered for a while and then asked, “What 
benefits would this bring to Qingfeng Giant City and to me?”

Zilun explained, “There are numerous benefits for Qingfeng Giant City. Due to certain special 
reasons, some opportunities are only available to cities that have a ‘Heavenly Pride.’ Even if 
we don’t invite you, other giant cities will. In short, Qingfeng Giant City stands to gain a lot. 
As for the benefits to you, the Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, I can offer you a few 
choices. The first is a batch of resources and treasures. The second option is the ownership of a 
small planetary system. You could become the lord of a small planetary system. For the forces 
of Silver Universe Star and Qingfeng Giant City, this is not difficult to achieve. Or, if you have 
other demands, feel free to state them.”



“I could own a small planetary system?” Ye Tian was astonished.

The value of a small planetary system was immense. Controlling one could bring numerous 
benefits!

“Exactly!” said Zilun. “The Milky Way is vast, containing countless small planetary systems. 
The nine primary stars have absolute authority. Apart from these, other planetary systems are 
mostly under the territories of various empires, but these royal families are generally 
manipulated by us, the major forces of the nine primary stars. To us, a small planetary system 
is just a tiny place. I proposed this offer guessing you might be from a small planetary system 
and would value this condition.”

Zilun’s guess was correct. Ye Tian indeed came from a small planetary system—the Solar 
System. He had learned during his time in the Centauri Planetary System that the Solar 
System, Centauri, and many others were under the domain of an empire—the Sun Wheel 
Empire. However, the Sun Wheel Empire was only the nominal ruler. The real territory of the 
Sun Wheel Empire only included the Sun Wheel Planetary System, and they hardly managed 
other systems.

This was why a small planetary system like the Solar System went unnoticed. After all, 
crossing planetary systems was troublesome. Moreover, due to covert interference from forces 
like the Glory Pavilion over the years, the Solar System remained under the radar.

However, if any powerful force desired to occupy the Solar System, Earth would be in danger, 
likely becoming a colony of a powerful force, making life difficult for Earthlings.

Now, hearing Zilun’s offer, Ye Tian was immediately intrigued. If he claimed the Solar 
System, other forces in the Milky Way would definitely not dare to meddle with it, not wanting 
to antagonize Silver Universe Star.

“Any planetary system?” Ye Tian inquired.

“Not exactly!” Zilun replied with a smile. “We can’t arrange for planetary systems under the 
control of certain powerful entities. But we can give you some unallocated planetary systems 
or those under smaller forces.”



“Can you give me the Solar System?” Ye Tian asked.

“Let me check the Solar System,” Zilun responded, waving his hand to conjure a virtual frame.

He opened a map of the Milky Way, typed in ‘Solar System,’ and there it was!

Whoosh!

The Solar System appeared on the map, located on the edge of the Milky Way.

“I found it. The Solar System is on the edge of this region of the Milky Way. The value of such 
small systems is not high, and the Solar System is currently under the Sun Wheel Empire, a 
minor empire. Moreover, the Solar System is an unclaimed system. If you want it, our Qin 
family can arrange to transfer it under your name!” Zilun assured.

“Alright, I’ll take the Solar System. As long as you handle this, I’m willing to associate with 
Heavenly Pride Pavilion under the banner of Qingfeng Giant City. How about that?”

Ye Tian said, “Alright!”

Great God Zilun, smiled broadly, having reached an agreement with Ye Tian. “Take this, the 
Heavenly Pride Order of Qingfeng Giant City. With this Order, when you register at the 
Heavenly Pride Pavilion, it will prove that you are a Heavenly Pride from Qingfeng Giant 
City, representing us.”

Zilun handed over a token, which Ye Tian accepted. The front of the Heavenly Pride Order had 
the word ‘Heavenly Pride’ inscribed, and the back bore the word ‘Qingfeng.’

“Where is the Heavenly Pride Pavilion?” Ye Tian inquired.

Great God Zilun replied, “There are Heavenly Pride Pavilion branches on all nine 
supercontinents of Silver Universe Star, but the headquarters is located on Silver Universe 
Continent. We also have a branch of Heavenly Pride Pavilion here on our Tianzhan Continent, 
located in the main city of Tianzhan! Qingfeng Giant City has a teleportation array leading 
directly to the main city of Tianzhan. If you wish to go now, I can take you to the Heavenly 
Pride Pavilion branch.”



“I’ll wait a bit longer,” Ye Tian thought for a moment and then said.

Understanding Ye Tian’s intention, Zilun responded, “Alright, I’ll arrange everything in the 
next few days. It shouldn’t take long for the Solar System to be transferred under your name. 
We can go to Heavenly Pride Pavilion then.”

“Thank you, Zilun,” Ye Tian said, bowing his fists in gratitude before leaving.

After Ye Tian’s departure, the City Lord’s Mansion dispatched a God-level emissary from 
Silver Universe Star to handle the matter of the Solar System.

Five days later, in the Sun Wheel Empire of the Sun Wheel Planetary System, inside a palace,

A corpulent middle-aged man was enjoying a dance performed by a group of beautiful women. 
He was the current emperor of the Sun Wheel Empire, Emperor Zi Feng. He was a God-level 
cultivator, albeit a relatively weak one, who had relied on various treasures to reach his level 
and lacked significant combat strength.

Suddenly, a God-level guard appeared. “Your Majesty, a command has arrived from Silver 
Universe Star,” the guard announced.

Emperor Zi Feng frowned and dismissed the dancing women.

Alone in the great hall, Emperor Zi Feng asked, “What command? Why would Silver Universe 
Star send orders to this forsaken place?”

The God-level guard produced a scroll, which unfurled to reveal golden letters forming a 
command: The Sun Wheel Royal Family is ordered to transfer the Solar System to the 
Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, Ye Tian, without resistance, or face annihilation.

“What? A Heavenly Pride wants the Solar System? Hurry, hurry, go take care of it! A mere 
Solar System, don’t offend a Heavenly Pride and Silver Universe Star!” Emperor Zi Feng 
became anxious.



He couldn’t afford to offend a Heavenly Pride, and even less so, the powers of Silver Universe 
Star. Though the Sun Wheel Empire was not weak, it was nothing compared to the powerful 
sects within its territory, let alone the forces of Silver Universe Star. He knew that those forces 
could dethrone him with a single word.

The command from Silver Universe Star was not something he could defy. He didn’t want to 
lose his life over a small Solar System.

“Yes, Your Majesty!” the God-level guard responded.

The Sun Wheel Empire quickly issued an order to transfer the Solar System to the Heavenly 
Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, Ye Tian, making it his territory. Other forces were forbidden to 
enter or exit the Solar System without permission.

This matter didn’t cause much stir since many weren’t aware of what the Solar System was. 
After all, what was noteworthy about a Heavenly Pride wanting a trashy planetary system to 
play with?

Regardless, from that point on, the Solar System belonged to Ye Tian, bearing the Ye surname!

Chapter 318: Heavenly Pride Pavilion, Successful Registration!

In Qingfeng Giant City of Silver Universe Star

The city lord’s mansion sent a box to Ye Tian, who opened it upon receipt

“This is…”

He saw that these were various documents and proofs, along with the imperial seal of the Sun 
Wheel Empire. All the agreements were witnessed by the Contractual Laws, making them all 
authentic and impossible to forge

These documents and agreements proved that the Solar System now belonged to Ye Tian. He 
only needed to integrate his soul’s essence into these documents for the agreements to take 
effect



“The efficiency of Qingfeng Giant City is impressive; they managed to settle this so quickly!”

Ye Tian immediately activated these documents with his soul’s essence

Boom!!!!!

The Contractual Laws appeared and merged into the void

The agreement officially took effect!

From this point on, Ye Tian became the master of the Solar System, recognized by both the 
Sun Wheel Empire and Silver Universe Star, signifying approval from all the forces in the 
entire Milky Way

As long as Ye Tian didn’t relinquish the Solar System, other forces there couldn’t contest his 
ownership. If anyone caused destruction in the Solar System, he, as its master, had the 
authority over life and death

Snap!

Ye Tian closed the box and stored all these documents in his personal space, the Xumi Storage 
Realm

“To the city lord’s mansion!”

Ye Tian stood up

Given such a significant favor from Qingfeng Giant City, it would be disrespectful not to visit 
the Heavenly Pride Pavilion

Soon, Ye Tian was in the city lord’s mansion, meeting the Great God Zilun again

“Great God Zilun, let’s go to the Heavenly Pride Pavilion!”



Ye Tian said directly

“Okay!” The Great God Zilun agreed with a smile

Then,

The Great God Zilun took Ye Tian to a teleportation hall in the center of Qingfeng Giant City. 
This hall was usually not open to ordinary martial warriors but only to God-level and above

This teleportation hall could transport people to other giant cities in the Tianzhan Continent 
and the main city, so it was strictly controlled to prevent the loss of talents from Qingfeng 
Giant City

Otherwise, if everyone aspired to go to the main city and never returned, wouldn’t it cause a 
severe talent drain in the giant city?

Considering this, the warriors of the giant city strictly controlled travel. Going to other giant 
cities was somewhat manageable, but going to the main city was extremely difficult

Great God Zilun and Ye Tian were exceptions, one a God and the other a Heavenly Pride, 
naturally unrestricted

The two traveled a great distance via the teleportation array and arrived at the main city of 
Tianzhan

Tianzhan Continent had eighteen main cities, and Tianzhan Main City was the first among 
them, so powerful and prosperous that the entire supercontinent was named after it

“Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, you will encounter many Heavenly Prides in 
Tianzhan Main City. After registering in the Heavenly Pride Pavilion, you will understand 
more. However, it’s best not to be too ostentatious at first, or you might become a target for 
some Heavenly Prides.”

The Great God Zilun advised



“Thank you for the reminder, Great God Zilun. I understand!”

Ye Tian nodded

He had just entered the Emperor-level strength, and above that was the Supreme Emperor-
level. Although he was unsure if there were any peerless Heavenly Prides at Silver Universe 
Star at the Supreme Emperor-level, with his current strength, he definitely couldn’t contend 
with those truly powerful Heavenly Prides

Upon entering Tianzhan Main City, Ye Tian used his talent copying ability to scan the talents 
of the warriors within a thousand kilometers radius

To his surprise,

There were hardly any ordinary people in Tianzhan Main City, almost all were martial 
warriors, and most had top-level cultivation talents or higher. There were quite a few at the 
Morning Star and Moonlight levels, and even the Dawn level cultivation talents weren’t rare

In a group of 1000 people, there was roughly one warrior with Dawn level cultivation talent

It’s notable that a Morning Star level cultivation talent in an Earth-based super base was 
extremely rare, but it became common in Tianzhan Main City

“As expected of Tianzhan Main City!”

Ye Tian thought to himself

Along the way, Ye Tian kept checking and even saw a few warriors with Supreme level 
cultivation talents

This was just from observing on the streets. As for certain areas shielded by powerful laws and 
formations, his talent copying ability couldn’t penetrate, so he couldn’t investigate the talents 
of the warriors in those areas



But it was undeniable that the overall talent level of the warriors in Tianzhan Main City was 
very high

Before long,

Great God Zilun took Ye Tian to a magnificent nine-story pavilion

This pavilion was actually a branch of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion

“Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, this is the branch of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion. You 
can enter by yourself. Only members of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion are allowed inside, others 
are prohibited,” the Great God Zilun said.

He wasn’t a member of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion, so he didn’t have the qualifications to 
enter.

“Great God Zilun, then I will go in!” Ye Tian headed towards the Heavenly Pride Pavilion.

When Ye Tian approached the entrance of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion, a voice rang out: 
“Entry is prohibited for non-members!”

Ye Tian activated the Heavenly Pride mark on his forehead to prove his identity.

“New Heavenly Pride, you may enter!” the voice sounded again.

Ye Tian passed through the array of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion and successfully entered.

Whoosh!

An artifact spirit appeared before Ye Tian: “New Heavenly Pride, are you here to register as a 
member of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion?”

Artifact Spirit?



Ye Tian was familiar with artifact spirits. Many weapons could nurture artifact spirits, 
especially those above the Dawn level. It depended on whether the weapon’s owner was 
willing. If not, the consciousness of the artifact spirit could be erased.

But sometimes, artifact spirits could assist their masters in tasks, proving more useful than 
mere human effort.

“I would like to ask, are there any restrictions to registering with the Heavenly Pride 
Pavilion?” Ye Tian asked.

He trusted Great God Zilun, but confirming wouldn’t hurt to avoid future pitfalls.

“There are no restrictions. Heavenly Pride Pavilion grants its members great freedom and does 
not limit the actions of Heavenly Prides. If a Heavenly Pride reaches the God level, they can 
directly join and become one of the elders of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion,” the artifact spirit 
explained.

After Ye Tian asked many questions and confirmed there were no issues, he declared his 
registration with the Heavenly Pride Pavilion.

“Artifact spirit, this is my Heavenly Pride token!” Ye Tian said, presenting the token from 
Great God Zilun.

The artifact spirit took the token and began registering Ye Tian.

“Registering now!”

“New Heavenly Pride — Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, real name: Ye Tian, affiliated 
location: Qingfeng Giant City!”

“Registration successful. Congratulations on becoming the 135,632nd Heavenly Pride of the 
Heavenly Pride Pavilion!”

Whoosh!



A ring suddenly appeared in front of Ye Tian.

The artifact spirit explained, “This ring is the Heavenly Pride Ring. It connects to the virtual 
world of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion. You can log into the virtual world from anywhere on 
Silver Universe Star. In the virtual world of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion, you can spar and 
communicate with other Heavenly Prides…”

Ye Tian accepted and wore the Heavenly Pride Ring after refining it.

“Here is the basic information about the Heavenly Pride Pavilion for you to browse,” the 
artifact spirit handed over a booklet to Ye Tian.

Ye Tian didn’t look at it immediately but stored it away, and the artifact spirit disappeared.

Heavenly Pride Pavilion was vast and empty, but Ye Tian knew there must be powerful beings 
stationed there.

Ye Tian tried to use his talent copying ability to cover the entire branch of the Heavenly Pride 
Pavilion, but it was suppressed to a ten-meter range.

His plan to copy the talents of the powerful beings guarding the Heavenly Pride Pavilion was 
thwarted!

At this time,

Ye Tian had successfully registered with the Heavenly Pride Pavilion, and his personal 
information was recorded in all branches and the headquarters of the Pavilion, making it 
unnecessary for him to stay.

In fact, other Heavenly Prides rarely visited the branch, or else it wouldn’t have been so quiet.

Thus, Ye Tian turned and left.

When Ye Tian came out, Great God Zilun was still standing there.



Clearly, Great God Zilun knew a lot about the Heavenly Pride Pavilion and knew that Ye Tian 
would come out soon, so he hadn’t left.

“Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, it seems you have registered. If we are heading back, 
let’s go together,” Great God Zilun said.

“Okay!” Ye Tian nodded.

The two left together, returning to Qingfeng Giant City.

On the way back, Great God Zilun reminded Ye Tian of some matters, such as familiarizing 
himself with the Heavenly Pride Pavilion, especially regarding the points system of the 
Pavilion. Every point in the Heavenly Pride Pavilion was precious and should not be used 
carelessly.

Ye Tian kept Great God Zilun’s reminders in mind.

Back at home,

Ye Tian opened the basic information of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion and began flipping 
through it page by page.

Chapter 319: The Heavenly Sword Secret Realm!

After a long while, Ye Tian finished reading the basic information about the Heavenly Pride 
Pavilion.

As he knew, the Heavenly Pride Pavilion was a loosely organized group initially founded by 
several powerful Heavenly Prides who had already grown up to become top existences in 
Silver Universe Star. It was established solely for the nurturing of Heavenly Prides.

The powerful Heavenly Prides of Silver Universe Star, once they ventured out, naturally 
brought a good reputation to Silver Universe Star. It was a mutually beneficial relationship.



Moreover, the real high-ranking humans of the universe also provide various supports to the 
Heavenly Pride. The existence of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion benefited those top existences, 
who naturally helped the Heavenly Pride grow.

There were many benefits to being named in the Heavenly Pride Pavilion.

First, it broadened one’s horizons so as not to become a frog in a well.

Second, one could access numerous opportunities, and being in Heavenly Pride of the 
Heavenly Pride Pavilion undoubtedly gave priority qualification. Without being in the 
Pavilion, naturally, there was no chance to obtain those big opportunities.

One of the greatest benefits of becoming a member of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion was 
inheritance.

For instance, some nine-star defensive secret techniques, which top forces were reluctant to 
reveal, could be learned in the Heavenly Pride Pavilion using points.

Additionally, various knife techniques, sword techniques, claw techniques, etc., were available 
to Ye Tian as long as he had points to purchase them.

These precious knowledges were almost impossible to learn in the outside world, but they 
were easily accessible in the Heavenly Pride Pavilion.

However, what the Heavenly Pride Pavilion lacked was cultivation resources.

Cultivation resources required the Heavenly Prides themselves to seek and obtain. Otherwise, 
providing everything would make the Heavenly Prides lazy and lose their competitive spirit, 
essentially nurturing a group of Heavenly Prides incapable of fighting.

For this reason, the Heavenly Pride Pavilion could provide inherited knowledge and big 
opportunities, but one must strive to achieve them on their own.

Ye Tian just registered as a member of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion and received 100 points. 
Although these points seemed few, they were very precious.



Gaining points in the Heavenly Pride Pavilion was very difficult because the Pavilion did not 
accept exchanges. You can’t exchange other treasures for points. The only ways to become a 
point earner are as follows:

First: Heavenly Pride betting in the virtual world. Occasionally, Heavenly Prides sparred with 
points being the stakes. Winning naturally resulted in a good amount of points.

Second: Reporting big opportunities could earn a certain number of points.

For example, if Ye Tian reported that Earth had a Yuan Realm, he would absolutely gain a 
large number of points. Though, he wouldn’t report it.

Third: Completing tasks of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion. The Pavilion occasionally releases 
tasks, and once completed, some points can be earned. This was the main channel for 
Heavenly Pride to gain points.

Fourth: Conquer the Heavenly Pride Tower!

Emperors had their own classification of strength, from one-star Emperor-level to nine-star 
Emperor-level. Heavenly Prides also had a similar classification, just that ordinary people 
were unaware.

Heavenly Prides at the Emperor-level were classified from one-star to five-star. Six-star 
Heavenly Prides were called peerless Heavenly Prides, or Supreme Emperors.

Ye Tian was currently at the one-star Heavenly Pride level, belonging to the weakest category. 
The combat power of a six-star peerless Heavenly Pride is comparable to that of a God 
transformed from a nine-star Emperor.

The power of a nine-star peerless Heavenly Pride was even more terrifying. They could easily 
defeat those nine-star Emperor ascended Gods, extremely terrifying.

To become a nine-star peerless Heavenly Pride was extremely difficult. At the very least, one 
had to break through the nineteenth physical limit and possess several extraordinary combat 



talents. Only by combining various strengths and breaking through limits could one hope to 
achieve the status of a nine-star peerless Heavenly Pride.

The Heavenly Pride Tower was the place to verify the strength of a Heavenly Pride. A one-star 
Heavenly Pride wouldn’t even pass the first level of the Tower. Only two-star Heavenly Prides 
could pass the first level and earn some points.

“Each time a physical limit is broken after the fifteenth, the body undergoes a minor 
transformation. The strength of the body becomes three times what it was before, and the 
increase in body strength is quite significant. If I now break the sixteenth physical limit, my 
strength, speed, defense, and the power of my talents will greatly increase. My strength should 
be enough to enter the two-star Heavenly Pride level, or even the three-star Heavenly Pride 
level!” Ye Tian estimated quietly.

But breaking the sixteenth physical limit was very difficult. Lacking sufficient resources, he 
wouldn’t think about it for now.

So, he couldn’t use the Heavenly Pride Tower to earn points at the moment.

What he was thinking about now was how to use the Heavenly Pride Pavilion to improve his 
own strength.

“First, I’ll enter the virtual world of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion to have a look!”

Ye Tian activated the Heavenly Pride Ring and entered the virtual world.

Whoosh!

His soul consciousness entered the virtual world, and Ye Tian arrived at a temple, which was 
his residence in the virtual world of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion.

“Ding, you have an unknown message!”

“Ding, you have an unknown message!”



“Ding, you have an unknown message!”

A series of sounds rang out.

Ye Tian opened these messages one by one, only to find that they were all challenges.

The content was mostly from Heavenly Prides who wanted to meet him and spar to enhance 
their relationship.

Undoubtedly, these Heavenly Prides wanted to win his points. If he hadn’t read the basic 
information of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion and rashly entered the virtual world, he might have 
been deceived.

In the virtual world of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion, there was also a virtual network where you 
could find a lot of useful information, such as Silver Universe Star Heavenly Pride Ranking.

Since its establishment, the Heavenly Pride Pavilion has produced many Heavenly Prides. Ye 
Tian was the 135,632nd Heavenly Pride throughout its history, but this generation’s Silver 
Universe Star Heavenly Pride Pavilion didn’t have many Heavenly Pride.

“312 Heavenly Prides!”

Ye Tian counted the names on the Heavenly Pride Ranking.

That was a small number for the entire Silver Universe Star, averaging over thirty Heavenly 
Pride per supercontinent. This was very few indeed.

It wasn’t that cultivating Heavenly Prides was extremely difficult. The top forces on Silver 
Universe Star could cultivate some, but Heavenly Prides wouldn’t always remain at the 
Emperor-level. Many Heavenly Prides, seeing no chance to improve their strength further, 
chose to strive for Godhood rather than staying at the Emperor-level too long.

This resulted in the constant scarcity of Heavenly Pride.



Ye Tian glanced at the Heavenly Pride rankings and found himself not at the 312th place but at 
the 311th. There was another Heavenly Pride’s name below his, probably a recent addition, 
hence ranking below him.

Closing the Heavenly Pride Ranking list, Ye Tian visited the points mall.

The Heavenly Pride Pavilion’s points mall sold inherited knowledge and also opportunities.

Ye Tian browsed around and was particularly interested in an opportunity—

[Silver Universe Star Heavenly Sword Secret Realm opens in fifteen days, costing 30 points to 
gain entry]

The Heavenly Sword Secret Realm!

Ye Tian felt that the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm must be related to swords, and as a sword 
practitioner, he looked up information about it.

Inside the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm, there was a Heavenly Sword Stele, an eight star 
wondrous object.

The eight-star wondrous object, Heavenly Sword Stele, could greatly assist sword practitioners 
in comprehending the Dao of the sword, accelerating their learning. However, each opening of 
the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm lasted only a month. Therefore, it cost 30 points to enter, a 
price even Heavenly Prides were reluctant to pay.

But it was undeniable that the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm was a treasure for sword 
practitioners. However, the number of people who could comprehend the Heavenly Sword 
Stele was limited. If too many people did so, the wondrous power of the Stele would be 
depleted.

The Enlightenment Stele worked similarly; it didn’t allow unlimited comprehension. The 
number of people had to be restricted, or the effect of the Enlightenment Stele would diminish. 
Only by limiting the number could the wondrous object maintain its effectiveness for a long 
time.



Therefore, the spots for comprehending the Heavenly Sword Stele were limited.

Heavenly Prides could enter by spending some points, but other martial warriors had to pay a 
certain price to enter the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm.

If Ye Tian were not a member of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion, he wouldn’t even dream of 
entering the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm.

“With the Heavenly Sword Stele, I have a tenfold time acceleration and top-level 
comprehension. If I go to the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm to comprehend, wouldn’t the 
effect be heaven-defying?! And I won’t be the only Heavenly Pride there. Those Heavenly 
Prides might possess Moonlight-level sword technique talents, which I can copy to transform 
my sword technique talent into Dawn-level!” Ye Tian was tempted.

“Purchase!”

Ye Tian spent 30 points and obtained an entry to the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm.

Chapter 320: Copying Moonlight-level Swordsmanship Talents!

Ye Tian, having purchased a spot in the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm, was notified by the 
points mall to collect the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm key from the Heavenly Pride Pavilion 
branch. Only with the key can one enter the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm.

Thus, Ye Tian used the teleportation array to reach the Tianzhan Main City and entered the 
Heavenly Pride Pavilion branch to obtain the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm key.

The Heavenly Sword Secret Realm was set to open in just over ten days, and Ye Tian needed 
to make his way there on his own; the Heavenly Pride Pavilion would not send him.

The Heavenly Sword Secret Realm was located near the Red River Giant City on the Tianzhan 
Continent.

Consequently, Ye Tian took the teleportation array in advance to the Red River Giant City.



The Red River Giant City was one of the seventy-two giant cities on the Tianzhan Continent, 
with a scale and strength no lesser than that of Qingfeng Giant City.

Since there was still some time before the opening of the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm, Ye 
Tian stayed at a hotel in the Red River Giant City, spending his days cultivating and strolling 
around the city, searching for useful talents.

Over these days, he indeed copied many talents, but they weren’t much help to his strength. 
However, adhering to the principle of copying when possible to not waste the opportunity, he 
copied more, thinking they might come in handy later.

Before he knew it, the day the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm opened had arrived.

Ye Tian left the Red River Giant City and hurried towards the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm.

After a long flight, he finally arrived at the location of the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm — 
the Red Wind River.

The Red Wind River, a tributary of the Red River, was where the Heavenly Sword Secret 
Realm was located.

At this moment, numerous martial warriors were gathered above the Red Wind River.

Ye Tian’s arrival caught the attention of some.

“A young fellow, which power’s junior are you? Do you have the Heavenly Sword Secret 
Realm key? Why are you here alone?” asked a God-level warrior, his gaze revealing a hint of 
ill-intent.

Ye Tian looked at him indifferently, and the Heavenly Pride mark on his forehead emerged.

“Heavenly Pride!”

Seeing the Heavenly Pride mark on Ye Tian, the God-level warrior immediately shifted his 
gaze, his ill-intentions vanishing instantly. If Ye Tian had been just an ordinary person who 



serendipitously obtained the key, he might have robbed him, but he dared not make a move 
against a Heavenly Pride – that would be courting death!

“You must be the newly promoted Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws,” a young Emperor-
level warrior said.

Ye Tian looked over and saw a Heavenly Pride mark also appear on the young man’s forehead, 
indicating that he was also a Heavenly Pride.

Whoosh! Whoosh! Whoosh!

One after another, Emperor-level warriors displayed their Heavenly Pride marks, totaling 
seven Heavenly Prides including himself.

“I am the Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws!” Ye Tian admitted.

“I am the Purple Force Heavenly Pride!”

“I am the Thunder Roar Heavenly Pride!”

“I am the Wind Void Heavenly Pride!”

…

One after another, the Heavenly Prides introduced themselves, and Ye Tian’s mind filled with 
information about these Heavenly Prides.

Apart from the Purple Force Heavenly Pride, the other six were mostly two-star and three-star 
Heavenly Prides, but the Purple Force Heavenly Pride was a four-star Heavenly Pride, very 
powerful.

Seven Heavenly Prides appeared before Ye Tian, and he immediately approached and used his 
copying talent.



Whoosh!

The talents of the Heavenly Prides appeared on Ye Tian’s retina.

“They all have Moonlight-level swordsmanship talents!”

Ye Tian was secretly overjoyed.

Without a second thought, he copied two Moonlight-level swordsmanship talents. By 
integrating these two talents, his swordsmanship talent could be elevated to the Dawn-level.

Then Ye Tian checked the talents of other warriors, the highest being only Moonlight-level 
swordsmanship talents. There were no Dawn-level swordsmanship talents, showing how rare 
they were.

“Heavenly Pride of Ten Thousand Laws, you really are generous. You just became a member 
of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion with only 100 points, yet you were willing to spend 30 points 
to come to the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm,” said the Thunder Roar Heavenly Pride.

“Why not spend when points are meant to be spent? Since I use a sword, the Heavenly Sword 
Secret Realm is very beneficial to me.” Ye Tian replied solemnly.

The Heavenly Prides chatted with one another, and time quickly passed.

Suddenly, three figures appeared in the void, exuding terrifying auras. They were three True 
Gods.

“Greetings to Black Water True God!”

“Greetings to Long Crane True God!”

“Greetings to Golden Radiance True God!”

All the God-level warriors paid their respects to the three True Gods.



The other Heavenly Prides also greeted the three True Gods. Though they were Heavenly 
Prides, it didn’t mean they had the status of True Gods.

Heavenly Prides were merely protected, so others dared not provoke them. However, True 
Gods were different. They relied on real strength and commanded vast powers.

Ordinary God-level warriors might not fear Heavenly Prides but had to fear True Gods. If a 
True God made a move, they could annihilate a God-level being from thousands of miles away 
with just a thought.

To become a True God-level powerhouse, one’s talent must be at least Supreme level, possibly 
even Desolate level.

This was Ye Tian’s first encounter with True God-level powerhouses, and he was eager to 
know their talents. If he could copy two Desolate-level cultivation talents, he could then fuse 
them into a higher-level cultivation talent.

Approaching slowly, he only needed to get within 1000 meters to view their talents.

Soon, Ye Tian was within 1000 meters.

“Check!”

Ye Tian activated his copying talent.

Instantly, the talents of the three True Gods appeared before his eyes.

After seeing them, Ye Tian was greatly disappointed.

These three True Gods had Supreme-level cultivation talents, and their other talents were not 
earth-shattering either. None of them possessed God-level talents; some even had Pseudo-
Mystic-level talents.



For the Heavenly Prides, these True Gods’ talents were not worth mentioning; they were just 
much higher in cultivation.

“What a pity!” Ye Tian thought to himself.

However, it was quite normal not to copy Desolate-level cultivation talents. Even the talents of 
these seven Heavenly Prides were only of Supreme level, not Desolate level. Desolate-level 
cultivation talents were still extremely rare on Silver Universe Star.

Qin Zixuan’s grandfather likely had Desolate-level cultivation talent, but there were only a few 
such talents in the entire Qingfeng Giant City. He had no chance to meet or copy their 
Desolate-level cultivation talents.

Of course, Ye Tian was not too disheartened. After all, he had copied Moonlight-level 
swordsmanship talents, which was enough to raise his swordsmanship talent to the Dawn 
level. What more could he ask for?

After a while, another Heavenly Pride arrived, making a total of nine Heavenly Prides entering 
the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm.

Boom! Boom! Boom!!!

A series of thunderous roars echoed through the void.

The Heavenly Sword Secret Realm was about to open!!!

Crack!!!

Space tore open, revealing a massive portal in the sky, a bronze gate adorned with countless 
law patterns.

“The entrance to the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm has been transformed into this. What a 
powerful method!” Ye Tian exclaimed in surprise.

Whoosh! Whoosh! Whoosh!!!



One by one, the warriors rushed into the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm.

Suddenly, a warrior attempting to enter the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm was repelled by a 
beam of light, sustaining severe injuries.

That warrior was actually a God-level warrior!

“How can this be? Why can’t I enter?” the God-level powerhouse said, completely bewildered.

“Your Heavenly Sword Secret Realm key is fake, so naturally, you can’t enter!” another God-
level warrior spoke up.

“That’s impossible! I paid a huge price for it; how could it be fake?” the God-level warrior 
exclaimed, eyes wide with disbelief.

“If you don’t believe it, so be it!” the other God-level warriors shook their heads and flew into 
the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm.

The God-level warrior who couldn’t enter tried several times, but it was clear his key was 
indeed fake.

He then left in a rage to settle accounts!

“Poor guy!” Ye Tian thought.

Even if he went to settle accounts, it was unlikely he would find anyone.

Without a certain background, it was almost impossible to obtain a real key to the Heavenly 
Sword Secret Realm. Even if purchased through certain channels, they were mostly fakes, and 
it was rare to get a real one.

Ye Tian wasn’t worried about his key being fake, as it was given by the Heavenly Pride 
Pavilion.



The Heavenly Prides of the Heavenly Pride Pavilion had the first right of entry, so the keys 
they possessed were naturally real.

Whoosh! Whoosh! Whoosh!!!

One by one, the Heavenly Prides passed through the bronze gate and flew into the Heavenly 
Sword Secret Realm.

Ye Tian also successfully entered the Heavenly Sword Secret Realm.
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