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“Every courtyard has a legacy or treasure left behind by the Yang Sect. Only 
after receiving all of them can it be considered complete.” 

“All received?” 

Chen Yang looked at the dense courtyard and swallowed his saliva. There 
were so many inheritances. If he accepted all of them, how long would they 
have to wait! 

“Why? Do you want to obtain the entire inheritance at once? With your current 
strength, you can’t do it.” 

“But don’t worry, you can leave at will. You can come back to accept the 
inheritance when you’re ready,” the giant moth said. 

“Senior, aren’t you afraid that we won’t be able to return?” Chen Yang was 
really not used to the giant moth suddenly being so easy to talk to. He 
subconsciously felt that there was a conspiracy. 

“Hmph! Ask yourself that. See if you’ll come back on your own?” 

“That’s true. How can I give up with such a precious treasure in front of me?” 
Chen Yang smiled and ignored this question. 

It was impossible for anyone to give up such a precious inheritance. The Giant 
Moth was naturally not afraid that they would never return. 

“By the way, you’re the first person to come in after all these years. As a 
reward, I’ve decided that anyone who follows you in is an inheritor.” 

“Hurry up and call everyone you know. Complete this damn inheritance so I 
can be freed.” 

The light voice carried the thick resentment of the giant moth and sounded in 
Chen Yang and the others’ ears again. 



The light voice carried the thick resentment of the giant moth and sounded in 
Chen Yang and the others’ ears again. 

Chen Yang was stunned. This giant moth would do anything to hand over this 
inheritance. 

“Why not? That Old Li didn’t say that he could only choose one heir. I think the 
people who came with you are all dragons and phoenixes among men. They 
are favored by the heavens, so they can naturally be heirs,” the Giant Moth 
said disdainfully. 

Chen Yang was speechless. 

“Since Senior has said so, I will thank you.” As he spoke, Chen Yang glanced 
back. “Aren’t you going to thank Senior?” 

“Thank you, Senior!” 

“Alright, alright, hypocrites. If you really want to thank me, hurry up and take 
the assessment.” 

The sudden shout of the giant moth made everyone jump and run to the 
courtyard area. Everyone chose a courtyard. 

“After entering, don’t force the inheritance. Your safety is the most important.” 
Before entering, Chen Yang reminded them one last time. 

“We understand.” 

Whoosh! 

Taking a deep breath, Chen Yang officially pushed open the courtyard door in 
front of him. 

… 

In the outside world, the appearance of the Demon Venerable made all the 
aristocratic families participating in the hunt gather together to fight against the 
Demon Venerable with the Ningdan Patriarch of the Song family. 

“Spirit Eye Python, how dare you attack my Nanyang people? Aren’t you 
afraid that the Beastmaster Sect will skin you alive?” The Song Family 
Ningdan Patriarch berated. 



Upon hearing the words ‘Beastmaster Sect’, a trace of conflict flashed across 
the Spirit Eye Python’s eyes. However, it was quickly invaded by its bloodlust 
and continued to charge at the aristocratic families. 

“Damn it, isn’t it said that this Spirit Eye Python is extremely intelligent and 
calm and won’t attack humans easily? This Spirit Eye Python is simply crazy.” 
Gongsun Miao broke down. 

As a beast-taming family, Gongsun Miao did not dare to say that he knew all 
the demon beasts, but he still knew the famous Spirit Eye Python in the Great 
Qian Dynasty. 

However, the Spirit Eye Python in front of him was completely different from 
the usual Spirit Eye Python. It was bloodthirsty and impulsive. It did everything 
that a Spirit Eye Python does not do. 

“Could it be that it’s pregnant?” The head of the Mo family, another Beast 
Tamer family, raised a different opinion. 

“Pregnant?” After being reminded by the head of the Mo family, Gongsun 
Miao snapped out of his daze. “Yes! It’s rumored that once the Spiritual Eye 
Python gets pregnant, its temperament will change drastically.” 

“Not only is it bloodthirsty, but it will also rush out and tear apart anything in 
the outside world.” 

“Although this Spirit Eye Python is quite strong and has a certain level of self-
control, it caused too much commotion when we hunted. This beast’s nature 
has already suppressed its rationality.” 

Hearing Gongsun Miao’s words, everyone finally understood why the Spirit 
Eye Python was charging at them without any regard for its life. 

At the same time, he also felt a little resentful towards the Song family. This 
was because during the hunt just now, only the Song family had caused a 
huge commotion. 

However, what they did not know was that the Song family had done this on 
purpose to lure the Spirit Eye Python out. 

Two flowers bloomed, one on each side. 



In the cave of the Spirit Eye Python, a man in black entered. He ignored the 
small Spirit Eye Pythons and picked up a small red snake. 

After putting the little snake into the Beast Taming Bag, this person 
immediately turned around and left. At this moment, a cold snort entered his 
ears. 

“Hmph! Did you want to swallow this Scarlet Flame Python alone?” 

Following the cold snort, three Ningdan Venerables, who were dressed in the 
uniforms of the Beastmaster Sect, emitted a terrifying aura. 

“Heh, I didn’t expect to see a Scarlet Flame Python in the Spirit Eye Python’s 
cave. This is really strange. Could it be that the female Spirit Eye Python has 
mated with a Scarlet Flame Python?” 

“Elder Qiu, you can’t spout nonsense. The disciples will misunderstand. The 
Scarlet Flame Python and the Spirit Eye Python are mortal enemies. How can 
they reconcile?” 

“Then Elder Wu, why do you think there’s a Scarlet Flame Python in the Spirit 
Eye Python Cave?” Elder Qiu smiled. 

Elder Wu snorted at the man in black. “Hmph! There are many situations. For 
example, although the Spirit Eye Python and the Scarlet Flame Python are 
mortal enemies, it still likes some snake-type demon beasts with the Scarlet 
Flame Python bloodline.” 

“There were some fortuitous encounters that led to his bloodline reverting to 
its original state and becoming a Scarlet Flame Python.” 

Besides, it might be the Spirit Eye Python that captured it as food for the Little 
Spirit Eye Pythons. But based on the current situation, the first possibility is 
very likely.” 

“After all, this man pointed straight here. He must have received the news in 
advance.” 

“Oh, I see.” Elder Qiu agreed exaggeratedly. Then, he stared at the man in 
black in front of him and a murderous aura gradually surrounded him. 



Surrounded by three Ningdan experts, the man in black was not nervous at 
all. Instead, he showed a golden token. 

“This is what my master wants. Please give me some face.” 

Seeing this token, the three of them narrowed their eyes at the same time. 
Elder Qiu braced himself and said, “I didn’t expect it to be that person’s 
request. Then we will naturally give in.” 

“However, I’m very curious. With that person’s strength, he shouldn’t be 
interested in this Scarlet Flame Python.” 

“Not interested? Hmph! Everyone from the Beastmaster Sect is so arrogant. 
You don’t even like the Scarlet Flame Python with the Demon King bloodline.” 

“Besides, this thing is for my little master to use as a beast tamer. Please give 
my master some face.” 

Although the man in black sounded like he was pleading with the Beastmaster 
Sect, his expression was provocative, aii he was afraid that these people 
would not attack. 

“Well …” 

The three elders of the Beastmaster Sect looked at each other. Then, Elder 
Wu took a step forward. “Since your family needs it, we naturally have to give 
in.” 

“I just have a question for you. With your family’s power, you can easily obtain 
the Scarlet Python without revealing anything. Why are you making such a big 
fuss?” 
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“This is my master’s assessment for Little Master. To see if my Little Master 
can obtain the Scarlet Flame Python with my help alone.” 

“I wonder if you will accept this reason.” 



“By the way, the Spirit Eye Python in this nest is attacking many families in 
Nanyang County. As the ruler of Jiangzhou, shouldn’t your Beastmaster Sect 
interfere?” 

With that, the man in black left in front of the three Beastmaster Sect elders. 

After the man in black completely disappeared, Elder Qiu said, “Do you 
believe him?” 

“How is that possible? Everyone in the Great Qian knows that that guy dotes 
on his children the most. What test? All nonsense.” 

“Well for what reason they did this, I’m not sure either. However, a Scarlet 
Flame Python cub is not enough to make our Beastmaster Sect become 
enemies with that person. 

“Besides, that guy hasn’t emitted a trace of aura from the beginning to the 
end. It’s obvious that he doesn’t want to fight us. In that case, let him go,” 
Elder Wu said. 

“Fair enough.” 

Immediately, the three elders quickly left and rushed towards the Spirit Eye 
Python Demon Venerable. The black-robed man said something right. As the 
ruler of Jiangzhou, the Beastmaster Sect naturally could not watch the demon 
beasts attack the Jiangzhou families. 

In the Endless Mountains, beside a stream, the young prince was squatting by 
the shore, teasing the fish in the stream. 

Suddenly, the man in black arrived. The young prince said without turning his 
head, “How did it go?” 

“Young Lord, I did not disappoint you.” 

“Alright, let’s go.” A hint of joy appeared on the young prince’s face. Then, he 
pinched the baby fish in his hand to death and washed his hands with the 
stream water before leaving with the man in black. 

On the way, the man in black looked at the young prince hesitantly. In the 
end, he couldn’t help but ask, “Young prince, please forgive me for saying too 
much. Why did you do something unnecessary?” 



“You have to know that if our prince’s residence secretly takes action, we can 
also obtain this Scarlet Flame Python cub. This way, we can save a lot of 
trouble.” 

“Do you know who the father of this Scarlet Flame Python is?” The young 
prince did not answer the man in black but asked another question. 

“Father? There are too many demon beasts with the bloodline of the Scarlet 
Python. I’m not sure.” 

“Let me tell you, this beast’s father is the Scarlet Flame Demon King.” The 
young prince smiled. 

“What?” The man in black revealed a look of disbelief. “How is that possible?! 
The Scarlet Flame Python and the Spirit Eye Python are mortal enemies. How 
can they bear children together?!” 

“Are you doubting my information?” The young prince paused slightly and 
glanced at the man in black. 

Sensing the young prince’s gaze, cold sweat appeared on the man in black’s 
forehead. “I wouldn’t dare!” 

“It’s best if you don’t dare.” The young prince snorted and continued to explain 
the situation. 

“Although this Scarlet Flame Python might have reached the Demon King 
level, its bloodline is at the Demon King level. There’s still a clear difference in 
talent between it and a genuine Demon Prince’s descendant.” 

“Take this Scarlet Flame Python for example. Only if my father is a Demon 
King will I have an 80% chance of becoming a Demon King in the future.” 

“As for ordinary Scarlet Flame Pythons, there’s only a 40% chance,” the 
young prince said. 

“But, as far as I know, that Scarlet Flame Demon King is the son of that 
person.” 

“We made an agreement with that person. If they don’t attack the Great Qian, 
our royal family won’t attack its descendants. 



If the patriarch finds out about what we’re doing now, I’m afraid even the king 
won’t be able to protect you. Is it worth it for a beast that might become a 
Demon King in the future?” The man in black was a little worried. 

When the young prince heard this, he glanced in the direction of Nanyang 
County. “That’s why we need these guys.” 

“This place is filled with the auras of the Beastmaster Sect and the Jiangzhou 
aristocratic families. You didn’t reveal your aura, so even if that Scarlet Flame 
Demon King finds out, he will only find trouble with the Beastmaster Sect.” 

“Besides, even if things get out of hand, do you think the Patriarch will believe 
that the Scarlet Flame Python and the Spirit Eye Python are harmonious?” 

“Not to mention the patriarch, even that person wouldn’t believe that his son 
would take a fancy to a Spirit Eye Python. At that time, the patriarch would 
definitely think that that person deliberately broke the agreement and looked 
for trouble.” 

After hearing the young prince’s plan, the man in black could not help but 
break out in a cold sweat. This plan was too bold. If it was really exposed, it 
would be beyond redemption. 

“Prince, is this worth it?” the man in black suddenly asked. 

“Of course it’s worth it,” the young prince replied without thinking. 

Yes, of course, if it was just a Scarlet Python, careful consideration on 
whether it was worth it would be needed, but if it was matched with Heavenly 
Poison Fire Gold, everything would be worth it. 

The young prince could still remember the words recorded in that ancient 
book: Heavenly Poison Fire Gold, a fifth-stage rare treasure that can help a 
Scarlet Flame Python become a King 

… 

BANG! 

Song Family’s Ningdan Patriarch, who had once again withstood the attack of 
the Spirit Eye Python, was looking into the depths of the mountain range. 



Damn it, he had already sensed the aura of many old fellows, but these 
bastards refused to attack. They planned to watch his Song family be dragged 
to death by this Spirit Eye Python. 

Although the Song family had already received many treasures from the 
young master, he didn’t want to die if he could survive. 

Immediately, Patriarch Song shouted, “How long do you want to watch? It’s 
just a late-stage Demon Venerable demon beast. If we join forces, we can 
definitely kill it.” 

“If we kill the Spirit Eye Python, our Song family doesn’t want anything from it!” 

“Hahaha, Old Song, you’re wrong. How can we let you be killed by the Spirit 
Eye Python?” 

“That’s right, that’s right. We’re just afraid that other demon beasts will barge 
in. Now that we’ve investigated clearly, we should take action.” 

Immediately, Ningdan Venerable Masters emitting terrifying auras appeared 
one after another. They circulated his spiritual energy and attacked the Spirit 
Eye Python. 

Although the Spirit Eye Python was a late-stage Demon Venerable, it had 
already lost its mind. Coupled with the fact that it was surrounded by so many 
Ningdan Masters, it fell to the ground not long after. 

Looking at the fallen Spirit Eye Python, the Song family’s Patriarch heaved a 
sigh of relief. Then, he reluctantly cupped his hands at the other ancestors. 
“Our Song family owes you all a favor.” 

Although it was painful, it was nothing compared to the young prince’s reward. 

“Yes? You’ve settled it?” 

At this moment, the three elders of the Beastmaster Sect had also arrived. 
Seeing that the Spirit Eye Python had been dealt with, they immediately 
circulated their spiritual energy and quickly left. 

As elders of the Beastmaster Sect, they would not covet the corpse of this 
Spirit Eye Python. 



Seeing the Beastmaster Sect elders leave, the various Ningdan Masters 
heaved a sigh of relief. They immediately split up the Spirit Eye Python and 
distributed the spoils of war. 

“Why do you think this Spirit Eye Python is here alone? Where’s the male 
Spirit Eye Python?” 

“Heh, you’re too ignorant. The Spirit Eye Python is extremely sensitive before 
giving birth. It will stay away from all powerful creatures, even its husband.” 

“I see. That certainly gave us an advantage.” 

While the many Ningdan Masters were dividing the Spirit Eye Python, in a 
cold pool five thousand miles away, a fifty-meter-long Scarlet Flame Python 
slowly raised its head. 
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Calculating the time, Madam’s manic period should have passed. I’ll go and 
see if the Scarlet Python that carries my bloodline has appeared. 

After thinking for a moment, Scarlet Flame Demon King slowly left. 

… 

In the underground cave, after an hour of assessment, the Chen family 
gathered together again. 

“Family Head, I agree with your idea of collecting martial arts. In my opinion, 
not only are offensive martial arts and movement techniques equally 
important, but defensive martial arts are also important.” 

Chen Xuan covered his slightly purple cheeks with a hateful expression. 

“What the First Elder said is true. It’s not just martial arts. The cultivation of 
your natal beast and the equipment on your spiritual artifacts have to be 
displayed openly.” Chen Yang wiped the blood from the corner of his mouth. 

Later, they looked at each other and sighed together. 

“Alas!” 



“Tell me, how did you all fail?” Chen Yang looked at everyone. 

“I’ll go first. Mine is the inheritance of a blacksmith. However, before accepting 
the inheritance, I have to undergo a small test. That is to defeat a puppet at 
the peak of Qi Refinement.” 

“I was puzzled. Why does an alchemist have to check his own strength? In the 
end, people say that if you can’t even swing a hammer, how can you become 
a grandmaster refiner?” 

“Mine is even more ridiculous. The alchemist assessment said that if your 
strength is not strong, what if your furnace explodes in the future?” 

“My inheritance of an array master is similar…” 

After hearing everyone’s complaints, Chen Yang nodded. “In that case, in the 
first round of inheritance, we have to defeat the puppets at the peak of Qi 
Refinement before we can accept the inheritance.” 

“In that case, the first round of inheritance isn’t too precious. Our Chen family 
should be able to digest it.” 

“Why don’t we go back and increase our strength first? In any case, the 
strength of this puppet won’t change. When we become stronger, we can 
accept this first round of inheritance,” Chen Xuan suggested. 

Chen Xuan’s words caught Chen Yang’s attention. Only then did I realize that 
even the First Elder who broke through the Genesis Realm had failed. 

Sensing Chen Xuan’s slightly suspicious gaze, Chen Xuan blushed and 
stammered, “Family Head, you know me.” 

Although I’ve broken through to the Genesis Realm, I don’t have good martial 
arts, hence I can’t unleash the advantage of being a Genesis Realm expert.” 

“Besides, my natal beast is only at the late-stage of level one. It’s useless.” 

“But Family Head, don’t worry. When I return, I will definitely find a powerful 
martial art. At that time, the one lying on the ground will be that puppet.” 

A smile appeared on Chen Yang’s face. “First Elder, I didn’t say anything.” 



When Chen Xuan heard this, his face turned even redder. He waved his hand 
repeatedly. “Go back, go back. Our families must be waiting anxiously.” 

Immediately, after a discussion, they decided to go back and rest before 
returning to accept the inheritance. 

At the same time, other than Chen Yang and Chen Xuan, the others had all 
sworn an oath not to tell outsiders about this place. 

As for the Chen family, they could only be informed after the family’s 
assessment and with the approval of the family head. 

“Senior, we know that our strength is low. We plan to go back and increase 
our strength first before coming back for the assessment.” 

Before leaving, Chen Yang asked the giant moth for instructions. If he left 
without permission, who knew what would happen? 

“Take the map. It records the entrance to the maze and the way to enter. You 
can increase your strength without worry. I’ve already waited for so long. A 
few more years won’t make a difference.” 

Accompanied by a light sound, a map floated in front of Chen Yang. 

After putting away the map, Chen Yang cupped his hands at the giant moth 
again. “Senior, we’ll take our leave!” 

Then, under Chen Yang’s lead, the Chen family left the dome one after 
another and entered the tunnel, slowly leaving the land of inheritance. 

After there was no one around, a light voice sounded again, “Soon, it won’t be 
long before I break free from the shackles of this damn place.” 

“Those bastards at the Cliff of Beasts must be surprised that I’m still alive. 
Moo…” 

Outside the ruins, looking at the scorching sun above his head, Chen Yang 
wanted to roar to vent his excitement. 

“Finally out!” 

In the end, Chen Yang couldn’t help but roar. 



Although there were many treasures in this land of inheritance, there was a 
huge beast staring at them from above. This treasure did not feel that good 
anymore. 

“Everyone, rest up. Let’s leave quickly. Otherwise, that giant snake will 
probably come again.” Chen Yang did not know that the Spirit Eye Python had 
already been killed, so he immediately urged everyone to leave. 

Immediately, under Chen Yang’s lead, the Chen family urged their Gale 
Wolves to quickly escape. 

“Eh? Family Head Chen, you’re still alive?” 

After walking for about ten miles or so, Chen Yang bumped into someone he 
knew. He looked up and saw that not far to his right was the group led by the 
Song family. 

“Hmph! This guy is quite lucky!” Seeing Chen Yang and the others return, 
Gongsun Miao snorted coldly and turned his head away. 

Hearing Family Head Song call him, Chen Yang hurriedly urged the Gale Wolf 
forward. “Family Head Song, you don’t know what we encountered. Good 
lord, it’s a Demon Venerable-level demon beast!” 

“If that demon beast hadn’t stopped chasing us, I probably wouldn’t have been 
able to see you again.” 

Hearing Chen Yang’s sobbing voice, Family Head Song grinned awkwardly. 

Good lord, this person’s luck was so different from others. On their side, the 
Spirit Eye Python was fighting desperately, while on Chen Yang’s side, the 
Spirit Eye Python could not even be bothered to chase after them. 

Family Head Song did not doubt Chen Yang’s words. After all, the Chen 
family was not the first family to escape. 

The Gongsun family, the Mo family, and the Lin family also stopped chasing 
after the Spirit Eye Python. 

However, what Family Head Song did not know was that the Spirit Eye Python 
did not intend to let the Chen family off. It was just that it was separated by the 



maze and had no choice but to give up. It was still different from the other 
families. 

“It’s good that we survived. The various families suffered casualties during this 
hunt. The people of Nanyang County will not forget us.” 

“When we get back, I’ll report this to the county governor and have him report 
this to the state magistrate to reward everyone.” 

Seeing that Chen Yang was still planning to complain,Family Head Song 
quickly comforted him. 

“Thank you, Family Head Song!” Immediately, all the family heads thanked 
him. This was a pleasant surprise. Family Head Song was really a good 
person. 

Under the lead of the Song family, the group rushed back. They finally 
returned to the family before the end of the year and did not miss the 
ancestral worship ceremony. 

However, what these families did not know was that the Scarlet Flame Demon 
King arrived here a few days after they left. 

Looking at the remains of the Spirit Eye Python, the Scarlet Flame Demon 
King roared at the sky. An aura that swept out for hundreds of miles made the 
demon beasts in the Endless Mountains tremble. 

Then, the Scarlet Flame Demon King came to the Spirit Eye Python Cave. 
After carefully identifying the aura left behind, a bloodthirsty look flowed in the 
Scarlet Flame Demon King’s beast eyes. 

Immediately, the Scarlet Flame Demon King turned around and left. 
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In the Chen family’s residence in Maple City, Nanyang County. 

“I’m finally back.” Looking at the Chen family’s residence, Chen Yang could 
not hide his excitement. 

“You’re finally back, Family Head. I have something important to report.” 



Just as Chen Yang stood in front of the residence and sighed, Second Elder 
Chen Meng quickly rushed over and said excitedly. 

“Second Elder, what is it?” 

“Family Head, the fertilizer plan you set has borne fruit. The person in charge 
of the estate reported that the spirit rice that was sprinkled with fertilizer is 
clearly much stronger than the others.” 

“According to the person in charge, the yield of this spiritual rice will probably 
double.” Chen Meng smiled. 

“Really? Quickly bring me to take a look.” Chen Yang could not be bothered to 
return to the family at this moment and hurriedly followed the Second Elder to 
the Chen family farm. 

On the farm. 

Chen Yang looked at the rice that was obviously stronger than the other 
spiritual rice and couldn’t help but laugh. “I didn’t expect this fertilizer to really 
be useful. If it’s used well, wouldn’t spirit stones roll in?” 

Immediately, Chen Yang decided that all the spirit rice in the Chen Manor had 
to be fertilized. As for ordinary rice, Maple City never lacked it anyway, so it 
didn’t matter. 

In the following period of time, what the Chen family needed to pay attention 
to was the annual worship of the ancestors and the Genesis Feast for the First 
Elder. 

Neither of these two major events had any accidents. This made Chen Yang 
heave a sigh of relief and focus on cultivating. 

Time flew by. In the blink of an eye, a month had passed. 

In this month, nothing major happened to the major families and forces in 
Jiangzhou. All of them were developing steadily. 

However, an undercurrent had already quietly arrived on Jiangzhou’s 
Beastmaster Sect. 

“ROAR!” 



Inside the Beastmaster Sect, an angry roar suddenly sounded. 

Immediately after, under the shocked gazes of many disciples of the 
Beastmaster Sect, a 50-meter-long Scarlet Flame Python that emitted a soul-
stirring aura appeared in the air. 

On the Scarlet Flame Python stood a fox. This fox was a Demon Venerable-
level Spirit Ear Fox. It was talented and could speak human language at the 
third level of the Demon Venerable realm. 

Usually, if demon beasts wanted to talk to humans, they would communicate 
through the Spirit Ear Fox. 

“Purple Core Patriarch of the Beastmaster Sect, come out. My king wants to 
see you!” The spirit-eared fox said arrogantly. 

“I was wondering who it was. So it’s Scarlet Flame Demon King. What can I 
do for you?” 

As soon as the Spirit Ear Fox finished speaking, an aura that was no weaker 
than Scarlet Flame Demon King’s burst out from the Beastmaster Sect. 
Immediately after, a white-haired, youthful-looking old man came to Scarlet 
Flame Demon King with a smile. 

“Hiss, hiss, hiss.” 

“My king said that you people of the Beastmaster Sect killed my wife and 
snatched away the descendant that contains my king’s bloodline.” 

“As long as you hand over the murderer and return the king’s son, my king will 
leave,” the Spirit Ear Fox translated. 

Hearing this, the Patriarch of the Beastmaster Sect frowned. “Kill the son of 
the king? Scarlet Flame Demon King, are you sure?” 

“Hiss, hiss, hiss.” 

“Of course. My king has already smelled the aura of your Beastmaster Sect 
from Madam. Hurry up and hand over the murderer and the eldest prince. 
Otherwise, the entire Beastmaster Sect will be wiped out.” 

“Hmph! Scarlet Flame Demon King is so arrogant. If you want to slaughter my 
Beastmaster Sect, you have to consider your strength.” 



Seeing the Scarlet Flame Demon King pressuring him, the expression of the 
Beastmaster Sect’s Patriarch instantly turned cold. 

Hiss! Hiss! Hiss! 

When the Scarlet Flame Demon King saw this, he was also prepared to 
attack. For a moment, dark clouds covered the Beastmaster Sect. 

After a while, it was Scarlet Flame Demon King who compromised first. 

“My king said that as long as your sect hands over the murderer, he will leave. 
If you don’t believe my king, you can confront him.” 

When the Beastmaster Sect’s Patriarch heard this, he frowned. In the end, he 
also took a step back. “May I ask, Your Majesty, how strong is Madam?” 

“Demon Venerable.” 

The Patriarch nodded and said to the back, “All of you, come over and let the 
king identify you.” 

Immediately, all the Ningdan Venerable Masters appeared. They stood in the 
open space and activated their spiritual energies, waiting for the Scarlet 
Flame Demon King to identify the person. 

Only those at the Purple Core Realm could fly in the air, so this group of 
Ningdan experts could only stand on the ground and wait. 

The Scarlet Flame Demon King sniffed carefully and immediately recognized 
the murderer. His eyes were red as he rushed towards the three of them. 

BANG! 

At this moment, the Beastmaster Sect’s Patriarch stood in front of the three of 
them and looked at the Scarlet Flame Demon King with an unfriendly 
expression. “Scarlet Flame Demon King, don’t go overboard. This matter has 
yet to be concluded!” 

The Scarlet Flame Demon King knew that if he could not produce any 
evidence, this old thing would definitely not let him make a move. 

Immediately, the Scarlet Flame Demon King roared at the Spirit Ear Fox. 



“My Great King said that those three people are the murderers of Madam. My 
Great King remembers the auras of the three of them.” The Spirit Ear Fox 
pointed at Elder Qiu and the other two. 

Seeing that the Spirit Ear Fox was pointing at the three of them, the 
Beastmaster Sect’s Patriarch thought to himself that this was not good. This 
was because he had personally sent these three people out. Could they have 
really killed the wife of the Scarlet Flame Demon King? 

Immediately, the Patriarch of the Beastmaster Sect flew to the three of them. 
“Did the three of you kill Scarlet Flame Demon King’s wife?” 

The three of them shook their heads. “Never.” 

“Your Majesty, did you see that?” The Beastmaster Sect’s Patriarch glanced 
at the Scarlet Flame Demon King. 

Roar! Roar! Roar! 

“My king has said that your words do not count. Let these three confront my 
king.” The Spirit Ear Fox quickly translated what the Scarlet Flame Demon 
King had said. 

“Alright, which one of you will go forward and confront the Scarlet Flame 
Demon King?” The Patriarch looked at Elder Qiu and the others. 

The three elders looked at each other, then Elder Qiu took a step forward. 
“Forget it, let me answer the king’s question.” 

The Patriarch nodded and immediately used his spiritual energy to lift Elder 
Qiu into the air. “Your Majesty, ask away.” 

Hiss! Hiss! Hiss! 

“The king said if you’ve been out in the last three months.” 

“I went out two months ago.” Elder Qiu’s expression did not change. 

Hiss! Hiss! Hiss! 

“Then what’s there to talk about? It was during this period of time that the 
three of you killed my King’s wife and took away my King’s heir!” 



After the Spirit Ear Fox translated, the Scarlet Flame Demon King was about 
to attack. At this moment, Elder Qiu raised his hand to stop him. “Wait!” 

“Your Majesty, it’s true that the three of us went out, but the only snake-type 
demon beast we killed was the Spirit Eye Python. If you don’t believe me, you 
can ask a mighty figure who’s good at soul searching to search my soul!” 

Elder Qiu was confident that it was impossible for him to kill the wife of the 
Scarlet Flame Demon King. 

“Hiss!” Unexpectedly, as soon as Elder Qiu said this, the Scarlet Flame 
Demon King became even angrier. 

The Spirit Ear Fox looked at the Scarlet Flame Demon King in disbelief. In the 
end, he braced himself and translated, “My king said that the Spirit Eye 
Python was his wife.” 

“Hmph! Scarlet Flame Demon King, are you looking for trouble?” The 
Beastmaster Sect’s Patriarch instantly mobilized the spiritual energy in his 
body and emitted a terrifying aura. 

“The Scarlet Flame Python and the Spirit Eye Python are mortal enemies. If 
you say that the Spirit Eye Python was your wife, you might as well say that a 
human was your wife!” 

Chapter 20 

 

“Not to mention us, would your father believe your nonsense?” 

“Scarlet Flame Python and Spirit Eye Python mating? Hmph! If you want to 
cause trouble for my Beastmaster Sect, why don’t you find a better reason?!” 

The Beastmaster Sect’s Patriarch was a little angry now. This Scarlet Flame 
Demon King was obviously treating him like a fool. He did not say anything 
good and postured to fight him. 

At this moment, the Scarlet Flame Demon King could not say anything. This 
old man was right about one thing. Even his father did not believe that his wife 
was a Spirit Eye Python. 

Hiss! Hiss! Hiss! 



“My king has said that these three must be handed over to him, whether you 
believe him or not!” 

“Evil creature! You have a death wish!” 

Seeing that the Scarlet Flame Demon King was forcing him, the Beastmaster 
Sect’s Patriarch immediately summoned his Demon King-level natal beast. 

The battle had officially begun! 

This battle severed the spiritual mountains beside the Beastmaster Sect. The 
rivers flowed in reverse. The entire Beastmaster Sect was like hell on earth. 

If not for the help of the sect’s protective array formation, the Beastmaster 
Sect would probably have been destroyed by the aftershock. 

The battle lasted for three days before it ended with the victory of the 
Beastmaster Sect’s patriarch. Although the Scarlet Flame Demon King was 
not weak, this was the Beastmaster Sect’s territory after all. 

In addition, with the cooperation of the Beastmaster Sect’s Patriarch and his 
Demon King Beast, even the Scarlet Flame Demon King would be defeated. 

“Old man, listen. My king said that this matter is not over yet. 

“Two years later, the king will return. At that time, it won’t be your Beastmaster 
Sect anymore. The entire Jiangzhou will have to bear the anger of my king!” 

After the Scarlet Flame Demon King left, the Beastmaster Sect’s ancestor 
wiped the blood from the corner of his mouth and came to Elder Qiu and the 
other two. “Tell me the truth. Did you kill that bastard’s spouse?” 

“Patriarch, we’re telling the truth. We only killed one Spirit Eye Python on this 
trip.” 

“Have you seen that little Scarlet Flame Python?” The Patriarch asked again. 

“I’ve seen the Scarlet Python before, but it’s the descendant of the Spirit Eye 
Python. It’s probably also mating with other demon beasts with the Scarlet 
Python bloodline.” 

“And that Scarlet Flame Python was also taken away by the young prince of 
the Estate of King De.” 



“The young prince of King De?” The Patriarch sensed that something was 
wrong. “Do you mean that the Estate of King De is involved? Is there anything 
special about this? 

Elder Qiu carefully recalled for a while. “There doesn’t seem to be anything 
special. If there is anything, it’s that people of the Estate of King De first got 
the Nanyang Family to lure the Spirit Eye Python away, then sneaked in and 
stole the Scarlet Flame Python. 

“Did the people with Prince De’s reveal their auras?” The Patriarch continued 
to ask. 

“No.” Elder Qiu shook his head.P 

When the Beastmaster Sect’s Patriarch heard this, his expression turned ugly. 
“It seems that what this Scarlet Flame Demon King said is true. That Spirit 
Eye Python is its spouse. All of you have been used by Prince De.” 

“How… how is this possible?” Elder Qiu still could not believe it. 

After all, the Scarlet Flame Python and the Spirit Eye Python were mortal 
enemies. It was clearly illogical for the two of them to get together. 

“That’s most likely what happened.” 

The people of King De’s Estate are domineering. Now that they’re so careful 
about snatching a Scarlet Flame Python and don’t dare to reveal their aura, 
they probably already know that it’s the descendant of the Scarlet Flame 
Demon King.” The Patriarch analyzed. 

When the three elders heard this, their expressions instantly turned ugly. They 
did not expect that the three of them would actually be used by the people 
from King De’s Estate. 

“Patriarch, why don’t we report this matter to the Human King? This matter is 
clearly the fault of the royal family, but the consequences are for our 
Beastmaster Sect to bear?” 

Elder Qiu was a quick-tempered person to begin with. After knowing that he 
had been used, he immediately planned to expose this matter. 



“No.” The Patriarch shook his head. “King De’s estate is powerful. The Human 
King might not favor us.” 

“Besides, who will believe this if word gets out? At that time, people will only 
think that we angered the Scarlet Flame Demon King and made the people of 
the King De’s Estate take the blame.” 

“It’s better to endure it for now. When the Scarlet Flame Demon King really 
plans to make a big deal out of it, we’ll report this matter to the Human King in 
the name of asking for help.” 

“The reason is that this Scarlet Flame Demon King intends to break the 
agreement and casually found a reason to attack Jiangzhou. 

“When the time comes, we’ll secretly advise the Estate of King De. The Prince 
of De’s Estate will know that they’re in the wrong and will definitely speak up 
for us. No matter how big this matter gets, the ones who suffer will be the 
demon beasts.” 

“After all, let alone us humans, even demon beasts wouldn’t believe that a 
Scarlet Flame Python could get together with a Spirit Eye Python.” 

Hearing the Patriarch’s words, the three elders revealed admiration in their 
eyes. 

As expected of the Patriarch, he was able to turn something that was 
unreasonable into reasonable. At the same time, he could make King De’s 
Estate owe them a favor. 

The battle in the Beastmaster Sect quickly spread throughout the entire 
Jiangzhou. Even the Chen family in Maple City knew about this. 

However, the Chen family did not have the time to care about such gossip. At 
this moment, the Chen family was cultivating crazily for the sake of the ruins. 

In the blink of an eye, a year passed. 

Due to the sequence system set last year and the fact that there were more 
spirit stones than in previous years, the cultivation levels of the Chen family 
had improved significantly. 



However, after a year of extravagant cultivation, the Chen family would enter 
a new round of frugal cultivation. 

After all, the Green-horned Bull had already begun to give birth. In order to 
ensure the production of the Green-horned Bull, the Chen family could only 
save on their cultivation plans. 

Everyone knew that this was a necessary investment in order to have more 
resources to cultivate in the future. No one had any complaints. 

The only consolation was that the production of the spiritual rice with fertilizer 
had doubled compared to the previous year, providing the family with 200 
spirit stones. 

The profit of 200 spirit stones was quite a lot. Even if the cultivation resources 
of the family head doubled last year, it was only 100 spirit stones. 

If these spirit stones were provided to Chen Yang, it would be enough for him 
to cultivate extravagantly for two years. 

In Chen Yang’s courtyard. 

Whoosh!” 

Taking a deep breath, Chen Yang slowly opened his eyes. “In a year, I’ve 
reached the peak of Qi Refinement. It seems that this body’s aptitude is very 
extraordinary.” 

“It’s said that seventh-grade factions all have spirit artifacts that test aptitude. I 
wonder how far my aptitude will reach.” 

‘Not too bad, though, come to think of it.’ 

The Chen family also had something to test one’s aptitude, but it was a little 
inaccurate. It could only test if one could cultivate, but not accurately test 
one’s specific aptitude. 

The Chen family’s judgment of aptitude basically depended on how much 
one’s cultivation had increased in a year. 

“I’ve already reached the peak of Qi Refinement. In addition, this Dao 
Integration Bead has also accumulated 122 points of energy this year.” 



“Using this energy to increase the cultivation of the Mystic Wind Wolf, we 
should be able to defeat a puppet at the peak of the Qi Refinement realm.” 

Ever since Chen Xuan broke through to the Genesis Realm, the Chen family’s 
luck had doubled, and the speed of recovery had also doubled. The energy 
that Chen Yang could absorb had also doubled. 

To put it simply, although they all recovered one percent in seven days, 
because the total amount of clan luck had doubled, the energy that Chen 
Yang could absorb had also doubled. 


