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Chapter 301 You Are the Mad One 

Wyatt grew more curious about Joaquin as he approached him and asked, 
“Do you really understand it?” 

“Of course.” “Both Pierre and you are mad!” “You are the mad one,” Joaquin 
refuted dispassionately. Wyatt took the book from his hands. “Stop reading 
and have a chat with me.” 

“Sure, but you have to explain this to me first.” Joaquin took back the book 
and pointed at somewhere on a page. Seeing that, Wyatt gasped. It wasn’t 
that he couldn’t explain it, but he just felt that the young kid wouldn’t 
understand it. After all, he was only four years old. “Brat, this is a professional 
topic.” 

“Oh, so you don’t understand it either.” Joaquin tried to look for his laptop as 
he wanted to run a search online. 

“Who told you I didn’t understand it? There’s nothing about medicine that I 
don’t know!” Wyatt grabbed the book and started explaining it to him, but he 
wasn’t sure if the young kid could grasp it. 

Upon listening to the explanation, Joaquin nodded and remarked, “You’re 
quite knowledgeable as a doctor.” 

“Of course, damn it!” Wyatt felt helpless at the little prodigy. “Alright. Can we 
have a chat now?” 

“What do you want to talk about?” 

Gazing at the young kid, who looked identical to his father, Wyatt asked, “If 
you were given a choice, would you want your dad to get together with your 
mom or Selena?” He put on a smug smile as he wanted to find out what this 
mature-looking kid thought about this. 

“My dad can choose whoever he loves. I don’t mind.” 

“What the… You’re really supportive of your dad. What if your mom wanted to 
get together with your dad? Whose side would you be on then?” Wyatt posed 
a more difficult question. Staring at him, Joaquin replied, “I don’t know.” 



“Aha! I knew you would say so!” Wyatt appeared to be gleeful. 

This question caused trouble to Joaquin, for this was the harsh reality he had 
to face—he indeed would have to make a decision whether he should side 
with Selena or his own mother. It would be wonderful if Selena and his mother 
were the same person. 

Inside the dining hall, Pierre and Selena had finished their meals and put 
down their utensils. After that, she rose from the chair and wanted to clean up 
the table, but she felt a grab on her arm. She looked dazedly at Pierre as 
there were complicated feelings behind their gazes. 

In the end, Pierre still couldn’t bring himself to express his feelings. “I’ll help 
you look for him.” Then, he turned his wheelchair toward the door. “Please 
take care of Jojo for the next few days.” Upon finishing his words, he left the 
place. 

Feeling disappointed, Selena hung her head low. 

Meanwhile, Meredith was surprised to receive a call from Pierre as he rarely 
called her. Since she still had some scenes to shoot, Pierre decided to go to a 
cafe near the film studio and wait for her. 

After she got off work, she rushed into the cafe and asked, “Pierre, why did 
you have to see me?” 

She was shooting a film that was set in the Victorian Era, so she was clad in a 
costume dress and sporting a hairstyle popular in that era. It had to be said 
that her outfit perfectly outlined her curvy figure, and she looked just like a 
charming Victorian lady. 

Even the bodyguard drooled over her beauty. 
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Meredith flashed a bashful smile at Pierre. “I’m sorry. I didn’t want to make 
you wait, so I came here directly without removing my make-up. This make-up 
is hard to remove completely.” 



“Do you know who Juniper’s father is?” Pierre never paid attention to her 
outfit. “What do you mean?” Shocked by his question, Meredith tucked her 
hair behind her ear to cover up her embarrassment. 

“I’m talking about the guy Megan found for Selena because she wanted to 
snatch Finneas from her.” 

Hearing that, Meredith was disappointed that he wanted to meet up with her to 
get some information for Selena, so she sipped her coffee and replied, “Why 
would I know that?” 

“You don’t know?” Pierre questioned doubtfully. The two of them were twins 
and had never separated, so it wasn’t possible that Meredith knew nothing 
about this. 

At that instant, Meredith wasn’t sure how to reply to him. If she knew what 
happened but didn’t stop Megan, she would be seen to be as despicable as 
her sister. However, she spent most of her time with Megan, so it was hard for 
her to justify the statement that she knew nothing about this. 

Seeing how hesitant she was, Pierre quickly explained, “You don’t have to be 
afraid. Just tell me whatever you know. I’m looking for that man to do a 
matching test because Juniper is stricken with leukemia.” 

Hearing that, Meredith knew that her speculation was right, and she had found 
a way to divert his attention. “Juniper is stricken with leukemia? How is she 
now? Do you want me to go through the matching test?” 

“There’s no need for that now. I only have to look for her father.” 

With a sorrowful expression, Meredith gazed at him and replied, “But I really 
have no idea. Megan was obsessed about Finneas in the past, so she had to 
get him at all costs. I had told her countless times that Selena and Finneas 
had known each other since young and that they were engaged, so she 
should stop dreaming. However, she just told me that she had her own way—I 
didn’t expect that she would look for a man for Selena! I only found out about 
it after the event happened. Pierre, you have to trust me.” 

“Did she tell you where the man came from or what he looked like?” There 
was no emotion on Pierre’s face, and he sounded like he was interrogating a 
suspect. 



Meredith shook her head. “I heard her say something like ‘beggar’ and 
‘scarred face’, then we… You know, I got pregnant, so I stopped caring about 
it.” 

Upon finishing her words, she hung her head low bashfully. She intentionally 
mentioned the fact that they had slept together to divert his attention, but he 
just ignored her. 

“Try to recall what she said. I need more details.” 

Meredith shook her head. “No… there’s really nothing else.” 

“Just call me if you recall anything.” Pierre pressed a button on his wheelchair 
after he finished speaking. 

“Pierre!” Meredith stood straight up. “Why are you so good to Selena? Have 
you forgotten that she killed our son?” Her eyes welled up with tears. “I don’t 
know how much you love her, but one thing will never change—she killed 
Jamie. How could you do this to Jamie and get together with her?” 

Pierre stopped his wheelchair. 

Sobbing, Meredith continued, “Perhaps this is karma. She killed my son, 
which explains why her kid is stricken with leukemia. Everything happens for a 
reason. She has to pay for what she has done!” 

Task NO 1 How to Pursue Miss CEO Chapter 303 

Chapter 303 It’s Not Your Fault 

At that moment, although Pierre was facing away from Meredith, he could 
hear her sobbing. “Then did Jamie lose his life because we did something 
wrong?” 

Meredith’s chest tightened when she heard that, and she cried harder. “Yes, 
it’s all because of what I did. I’m not a responsible mother. In order to become 
famous, I marginalized other actresses and spread false rumors. My sister did 
the wrong thing, but I never stopped her. It’s all my fault! If God wanted to 
punish anyone, He should punish me instead of my son!” She fell on her 
bottom and started wailing. 



Feeling sorry for her, Pierre approached her and helped her up. Instantly, 
Meredith plunged into his embrace and said, “I’m sorry, Pierre. I couldn’t 
protect our son. It’s all because of me!” 

“It’s not your fault.” He gave her a brief consolation. “Pierre, I know you love 
Selena, but what about our son? Did he lose his life for nothing?” Meredith 
raised her head and gazed at him with her teary eyes. 

She concluded that Jameson was dead because that was what Big Ben told 
her. Therefore, she believed that Pierre’s investigation would also lead him to 
the conclusion that Jameson had passed away. 

After a moment of hesitation, Pierre replied, “The kid is innocent. Just see it as 
doing good deeds for Jojo.” 

Meredith fell silent as he indeed had the right to do good deeds for his son by 
forgiving Selena. Lowering her head, she said, “Since you’ve said so, there’s 
nothing else I can say.” 

Just then, Pierre caught a glimpse of the lucky charm on her neck. The 
lamplights in the cafe were dim, but the lucky charm happened to reflect the 
light. Seeing that, he frowned. 

Outside the cafe, Selena was heartbroken to see that they were hugging each 
other. 

Pierre was a man who refrained from any physical contact. Perhaps it was 
due to Jameson that he stopped minding it and held her in his embrace now, 
which showed that they were in an intimate relationship. 

She’s his son’s mother, and this fact will never change. So who am I in his 
heart? 

Selena reckoned that Meredith knew a thing or two about the matter, so she 
came to look for her, but she didn’t expect that Pierre was here as well. 
Disappointed by the scene, she ended up leaving the place. 

After that, Pierre left the cafe and got into his car. Seeing his expression, Niall 
held his breath. 

“Do one thing for me.” 



Hurriedly, Niall leaned closer to him. 

“There’s someone in prison that I want you to look for.” 

Niall nodded. “I’ll do it right away.” 

“Make sure not to alert anyone.” Pierre was sympathetic toward Meredith 
because she was his son’s mother, but besides that, he didn’t care if he would 
hurt Megan to get what he wanted. 

“Wait a minute.” He raised his hand. “Pass me a pen and a piece of paper.” 

Niall quickly got the items from his bag and passed them to him. 

After jotting down something, Pierre passed the paper back to him. “Find out 
where this thing is from.” 

Upon a closer look, Niall realized that the drawing appeared to be a lucky 
charm. Without asking any question, he kept the paper. “Alright. I’ll investigate 
it.” 

During lunchtime in the prison, all the prisoners had to line up for food. After a 
long time of hard work, Megan was exhausted. She wasn’t used to it as she 
was born to be a wealthy lady. However, she had to do work in the prison, and 
despite that, she would still be chided. 
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The line at the food counter was unbelievably long. All of a sudden, some 
prisoners jumped the line and stood in front of Megan. She knew who they 
were, but she didn’t dare to rebuke them, so she kept her silence. 

Unexpectedly, more prisoners jumped the line and pushed her backward. 
Soon, she was at the end of the line. She was already starving when it was 
her turn. After getting her food, she took a seat in the corner. 

Just when she was about to have her meal, some prisoners were done with 
theirs. When they walked past her, they spat on her plate. Disgusted, Megan 
snarled, “Hey!” She stood straight up and wanted to reprimand them. 



“Don’t eat it if you don’t like it!” They laughed and provoked her. 

In silence, Megan sat back down and was still disgusted by the phlegm on her 
plate. However, she was famished, and she had to eat it because there was 
more work to do in the afternoon. 

After a laugh, the prisoners left the place. Just then, someone took a seat 
across Megan and said, “You can have mine. I can’t eat so much.” 

Megan gazed at the person as her eyes welled up with tears. It was the first 
time she was offered help in this prison. She was a wealthy and willful young 
lady, so those prisoners bullied her because of that, and even the prison 
guards were contemptuous of her. That was why she had never experienced 
any kindness in prison. 

“Stop crying and eat it now. You’ll be barred from eating when time is up,” the 
person urged. 

“Thanks,” Megan replied as she guzzled down the food. 

During a break in the afternoon, those prisoners came to provoke her again. 
“7783, I’ve lost something. Help me look for it on the lawn.” 

“I…” Megan took a look at the lawn and found nothing. 

“Chop-chop!” A prisoner directly pinned Megan’s head down, causing her face 
to come into contact with the ground. Left with no choice, she remained down 
and tried to look for the non-existent thing. 

“Pay more attention. I won’t let you off if you can’t find it.” 

“What did you lose?” Megan asked meekly. 

“I lost a fart! Hahaha…” All of them guffawed. 

Megan felt utterly humiliated, as this kind of thing had happened countless 
times before, but she still tried to look for it on the ground. 

“Have you found my fart? 7783, you have to be more attentive.” 

“7783 is looking for a fart. Hahaha…” All of them were mocking her. 

Megan remained kneeling on the ground and searched for it. 



Just then, the person, who gave Megan her food, came over and said, “Be 
careful. The prison guards are watching all of you.” 

Frightened, these people dispersed immediately. 

Getting to her feet, Megan gazed at the person who had helped her twice. 
“Thanks. Why didn’t I see you before?” 

“Oh, I’m new here.” The woman smiled. Her skin appeared to be fair, so it was 
apparent that she was different from the other prisoners. Megan had a feeling 
that they might be the same kind of people. 

Then, they took a seat on the ground and talked about their past. 

All of a sudden, the woman asked, “By the way, as soon as I came here, 
someone told me that you’re a bad person who tried to snatch your sister’s 
fiancé by getting another man for her. Is that true?” 
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At that moment, Megan still wasn’t aware of the danger she was facing. “They 
know nothing about my sister, and hey, she’s just a slut. Indeed, I found her a 
man, but she had sex with him willingly!” She spoke as if she wasn’t in the 
wrong. 

The woman continued, “You’re right. No one could force her to have sex with 
a man, right? You don’t look like a bad person, but I’m curious—what kind of 
man did you find for your sister?” 

Just when Megan wanted to reveal it to her, she realized that something was 
off. She had never seen this woman before, but the latter had heard about 
what she did and even approached her. Could she be someone’s mole? 

With an embarrassed expression, she put on a smile. “Of course, I found her 
a good man.” 

“I don’t believe you. If he was a good man, you would have kept him instead 
of pushing him to your sister.” The woman burst out laughing. “I guess you 
must have found her an ugly old man, right? The man I found for my sister 
was an old man who collected trash.” She guffawed. 



Megan gazed at her in shock. “Did you do such a thing as well?” 

“Of course. I loved my sister’s man, so I had to snatch him from her. We have 
to do something for ourselves, right?” The woman shrugged, and it was upon 
hearing her words that Megan put her guard down. 

“So, tell me, what kind of man did you get for your sister?” 

Megan didn’t dare to reveal it, for she was worried that this woman might be a 
mole, so she repeated what Meredith told her. “Alright, I’ll let you in on this 
secret. I didn’t clearly see what he looked like because he appeared to be 
dirty and sick. However, I do remember that there’s a scar on his face.” 

“A scar?” 

“Yes, and in fact, it was a hideous one, so I thought that he might be a 
ruthless man. If he accidentally strangled my sister, then I’d have one less 
trouble.” Megan laughed. 

The news was soon made known to Pierre. 

The moment Pierre personally looked for Meredith, she knew that things had 
come to a point where she had to do something, so she decided to go to the 
Fowler Residence. 

Right after Meredith stepped into the house, Helen knew that something must 
have happened. 

“Mrs. Fowler, is Jojo home? I’ve bought some clothes for him. He told me that 
he loved car toys, so I bought some for him as well. I hope he’ll like them.” 

“Well, he’s been with Pierre recently.” 

The smile on Meredith’s face froze. “I see…” Embarrassed, she hung her 
head low. 

Appearing to be caring, Helen asked, “What happened? Didn’t you contact 
Pierre?” 

Meredith shook her head. “He’s been busy recently. I sent him some 
messages, but he never replied to me. I guess he’s swamped with work.” 



John happened to pass by and heard what she said. There’s not much work 
at Fowler Corporation lately, and Pierre has delegated his work at Empire 
Group to his subordinates, so what is he up to? He grew curious about it. 

“A few days ago, Pierre met up with me in a cafe and talked about Juniper’s 
father. He said that Juniper was stricken with leukemia, so he wanted to look 
for her father to do a matching test. 

Mrs. Fowler, don’t you think this is karma? Selena killed Jamie, which is why 
her daughter has come down with this kind of illness.” Meredith put on a bitter 
smile. At the mention of Jameson, her eyes welled up with tears. 
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Seeing Meredith almost tearing up, Helen immediately grabbed her hands. 
“Merry, it’s all over now, so please stop mentioning it again. It’s indeed 
Pierre’s fault. He knew that Selena killed his son, but he still let her go.” She 
sighed. 

How did that woman have the guts to come back? Upon hearing their 
conversation, John left the place. Meredith was aware that John was there, 
which was why she spoke to Helen in such a pitiful manner. 

Meanwhile, Pierre was trying to hunt down a long-haired man with a scar on 
his face. A man with such features was conspicuous, but in reality, it was hard 
to find him. 

Some of the long-haired beggars were gathered together and stood in line. 
They didn’t know what they had done wrong, but they had to obey these 
people due to their power. Even though Pierre was wheelchair-bound, he still 
gave off a kingly vibe. 

“Raise your heads. Don’t be afraid because we won’t hurt you!” Niall shouted. 

After receiving the order, all of them lifted their heads and pulled their hair 
away to reveal their faces. Upon inspection, Niall didn’t find any man with a 
scar on his face. “President Fowler…” 

“Have you inspected all of them?” 



“Yes, but there’s no one with a scar on his face. These are the last few 
people,” Niall replied. 

Pierre was disappointed that he still couldn’t find Juniper’s father, so he waved 
his hand. 

“Alright, all of you can leave now. You’ll receive some clean clothes, food, and 
one thousand.” Niall then shifted his attention to Pierre. “President Fowler, we 
might be going in the wrong direction. After all, the event happened a long 
time ago. The beggar might have been dead or relocated to another city.” 

Upon hearing that, Pierre scowled. Just like what Niall said, many things could 
change in five years. The beggar might get lucky and quit living on the streets. 

All the beggars left the place as they were happy to have received some 
money and food. Just then, a beggar approached Pierre. Seeing that, a 
bodyguard immediately blocked his way. The beggar smiled and asked, “Who 
are you looking for? I might be able to help you.” 

He was probably the most pitiful beggar among them as one of his eyes was 
blind, and one of his legs was crippled. 

“Go away!” the bodyguard chided. 

However, Pierre waved his hand to motion for the bodyguard to step aside. 

“I guess you’re looking for someone who is long-haired and has other special 
features, right? I’ve been living on the streets for seven years, so I might know 
him.” 

Pierre and Niall gazed at that beggar. Just then, Pierre caught a glimpse of 
the tattoo on his left hand. 

“Oh, you’ve been a beggar for seven years, so you probably know him. We’re 
looking for a long-haired man with a scar on his face. Did you see such a man 
before?” Niall asked. “If you can help us find him, we’ll reward you 
handsomely,” he added. 

The beggar put on a smile. “A long-haired man with a scar. I think I saw him 
somewhere.” He touched his chin and gave it a thought. 

“So, where did you see him?” Niall saw a glimpse of hope. 



The beggar smacked his head. “I don’t remember it. I’ve relocated to different 
places over the years, but I really saw such a man before. Where was it? 
Hmm…” 
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Pierre leaned against his wheelchair and put on an eerie smile. “I’ll give you 
some time to think about it then. Niall, bring him to my place. Give him some 
clean clothes and prepare some delicious food for him as well.” 

Niall knew that Pierre wouldn’t give up on any hope, so he executed his order. 
Joyfully, the beggar followed Niall. 

Meanwhile, Selena and Joaquin had been staying at Wyatt’s place. Wyatt was 
busy with work, so most of the time, he would stay over in his office in the 
hospital instead of going home. As for Selena and Joaquin, they had been 
getting along well. Even though they didn’t talk much, they would do their own 
things in the same room. 

After getting her work done, Selena took a look at Joaquin, who was reading a 
book. “Jojo, are you hungry?” 

“We had dinner,” Joaquin replied dispassionately. 

“Why don’t we have supper?” Selena walked over and carried him up. “Let’s 
go.” 

“It’s not good for our health to eat supper.” 

“We don’t do it very often. It should be alright.” 

After putting on their shoes, they stepped out of the house. She just felt that 
the young kid was too quiet, so she wanted to bring him to have supper to 
cheer him up. After the meal, both of them were full, so they decided to take a 
stroll. 

“Jojo, what do you think Jamie is doing?” 

“He’s eating.” 



“Really?” 

“Yes. When I eat, he’ll feel hungry, so he’ll have to eat as well.” 

Juniper, who was getting ready to sleep in Springvale, felt hungry all of a 
sudden. 

“Is it really so magical?” Selena stroked his head and looked lovingly at him. 

Joaquin nodded. “It’s a secret.” 

“Alright, I’ll keep this secret for you.” Selena looked up at the night sky. “I 
wonder where Jamie is. I went through the information you sent to me, but I 
couldn’t find any clue. Maybe I’m just not meticulous enough.” She hung her 
head low as she was deep in self-blame. After all, Jameson was lost when he 
was with her. 

“I believe he’s doing well now, so you don’t have to be anxious. We’ll find him 
one day.” 

Meeting with the young kid’s determined gaze, Selena realized that she 
wasn’t as steadfast as he was. Therefore, she decided that she had to hope 
for the better as well. We’ll find Jamie, and Juniper will get well. Everything will 
get better. 

“Alright, it’s getting late now. Let’s go back.” 

Just when Selena took Joaquin’s hand and was ready to go back to Wyatt’s 
home, a car screeched to a stop beside them. Selena immediately pulled 
Joaquin behind her and wondered why the driver was so reckless. 

Unexpectedly, a few burly men got out of the car. Sensing danger, Selena 
carried the young kid up and tried to run away, but it was too late. She 
couldn’t run fast with a kid in her arms. On the other hand, all of them were 
martial arts experts, so they reached her very quickly. Retreating, Selena 
yelled, “What do you want?!” 

“We want your life!” a man said and raised his knife before trying to slash at 
her. However, when he caught a glimpse of the kid in her arms, he 
immediately stopped what he was doing. 



It was apparent to Selena that their target was herself instead of Joaquin, so 
she hurriedly put him down and said, “Jojo, run!” 

After all, Selena had received some training from Hades, so she could deal 
with these people for a short moment. 

With a scowl, Joaquin realized that these were John’s people because he had 
seen some of them before. 
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“Watch out!” Joaquin was too young, and at that moment, he wished he could 
grow up instantly so that he could help Selena. 

Selena was soon defeated because her shoulder was wounded in the first 
place. After all, they were all martial arts experts. Staring at Joaquin, she 
shouted, “Jojo, run!” 

She collapsed to the ground after a kick on her stomach, and these people 
started surrounding her with blades in their hands. Just then, Joaquin rushed 
over and hugged her. “If you dare hurt me, my grandpa won’t let you off!” 

Upon hearing that, they stopped in their tracks and traded glances. Joaquin 
was the only grandson in the Fowler Family now. If he was hurt as well, John 
would go mad. 

Seeing that, Selena carried him up and tried to leave with difficulty. These 
people followed her relentlessly because they had to complete their mission. 
John had ordered that they must end her life. 

John was already resentful of Selena, and after a series of events, he decided 
to kill her in order to restore peace to his family. 

Selena felt an excruciating pain in her wound, and she believed that her artery 
was injured, as her blood was streaming out of her wound endlessly. 
Meanwhile, those people were still behind her. She had to come up with a 
solution quickly. Otherwise, she would die of exhaustion. 

“Put me down,” Joaquin said. 



With her forehead beaded with sweat, Selena replied, “No.” 

“Don’t worry. These are all my grandpa’s people, so they won’t hurt me. Put 
me down and find somewhere to hide.” He looked worriedly at her. “You won’t 
be able to run away with me in your arms.” 

Selena looked ahead as her vision was becoming blurred. Perhaps Joaquin’s 
suggestion was her only way out now. Just then, she realized that there was a 
turn ahead of them, and beside that was a large area of bush. That’s the right 
place! I have to make a bet now! 

After putting him down, she hid in the bush and took a deep breath to stabilize 
her breathing. While she was observing Joaquin in the dark, she saw that he 
crouched down suddenly and picked up a twig before slashing at his shoulder. 

Just when she was shocked and ready to get out, she heard a series of rapid 
footsteps, so she immediately covered her mouth. 

“Young Master Jojo!” one of them rushed over and carried him up. 

“I’m hurt,” Joaquin replied impassively. “Bring me back now. I have to meet 
my grandpa.” 

After receiving the order, none of them dared to disobey him. “Young Master, 
we’ll send you home now, but where’s that woman?” 

“She ran away,” Joaquin replied dispassionately. 

All of them became flustered in an instant. Now that Selena had run away, 
they couldn’t complete their mission. However, with Joaquin injured, they 
couldn’t explain themselves to John either. 

“Bring me back now!” Joaquin ordered. 

It was then Selena realized why Joaquin had to hurt himself—he wanted to 
pressure these people to stop hunting her down. At that instant, she felt 
warmth in her heart. 

Seeing that they were hesitant, Joaquin yelled, “Did you hear me? Don’t you 
see I’m bleeding? If my grandpa finds out that you didn’t send me back 
immediately when I’m bleeding, he’ll kill all of you!” 
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Not daring to waste any more time, they were ready to send Joaquin home. At 
that moment, Selena couldn’t hold up her hand any longer, so she pressed it 
against the ground. Unexpectedly, she immediately heard the cracking sound 
of some twigs. 

The assassin at the end of the line heard the sound. “Someone is here!” 
Flustered, Joaquin yelled, “No one is here! She’s gone!” After all, he was still a 
kid, so he couldn’t control his emotions. 

“She’s right there!” The assassin walked toward the bush. 

Despairingly, Selena closed her eyes, as this was her final moment. However, 
she couldn’t die because she still had to take care of Juniper and look for 
Jameson. There were many things she needed to do. Selena, you can never 
die! 

“Come out! I can see you now!” the assassin shouted and inched closer to the 
bush. 

Joaquin could do nothing but be anxious. In a slow manner, Selena moved 
away from the bush, readying herself for this life-or-death battle. 

“Come back! Don’t hurt her!” Joaquin snarled and struggled out of his 
grandfather’s man’s grip. However, he soon grabbed him back as he couldn’t 
let this young kid ruin their plan. 

“Go to hell!” The other assassin raised his knife and hacked at Selena. 

At that instant, Selena thought she would lose her life here, but just then, the 
assassin collapsed to the ground all of a sudden. After seeing that, the other 
assassins charged toward Selena in an attempt to kill her. Selena covered her 
bleeding arm and tried to parry their attacks. Finally, my help is here! When 
she was exhausted and about to lose consciousness, she saw a familiar 
figure. It didn’t take the person much effort to knock out the assassins. 

Selena closed her eyes, but she couldn’t open her eyes again when she tried 
to. Hades walked over and examined her injuries before shifting his attention 
to Joaquin. 



“Why did you risk your life to save a kid?” After a snort, he was ready to carry 
Selena up, but he soon realized that he couldn’t move his legs. Lowering his 
head, he saw that Joaquin was hugging his legs. 

“Where are you taking her?” Joaquin glowered at him. 

“Of course I’m taking her to where she’s supposed to go. Brat, call your dad 
now. Do you think you can stop me?” 

Joaquin released him, for he knew that he was no match for this man. He 
understood that this man wouldn’t hurt Selena, so he just let him take her 
away. 

After the two of them disappeared into the darkness, he rushed over to the 
assassins’ car and opened the door. Following that, he pushed the emergency 
button inside the vehicle, and soon enough, some people came to fetch him. 

Upon learning that his assassins were all knocked out, John growled, “What a 
bunch of toads! They couldn’t even kill a woman!” 

Not only did they not kill Selena, but they also almost hurt his grandson. 
Seeing how incensed John was, Joaquin couldn’t bring himself to speak his 
mind. 

When Selena opened her eyes again, she realized that she was inside Hades’ 
castle. Seeing the familiar room, she thought she was dreaming. However, 
just then, she saw that Hades was beside her bed, which then led her to 
disappointment. I thought Pierre was the one who saved me, but I suppose it 
was a wrong guess. 

“What? Don’t you know how to say thanks now?” Hades was displeased at 
her silence. 
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Chapter 310 It’s Because I’ve Fallen in Love With You 

“Thanks,” Selena said in a hoarse voice. “Just thanks? Who do you think I 
am?” Hades was disgruntled. This man had always been this way. 
Sometimes, Selena thought that there might be two souls inside his body: 
One was the ruthless Hades, and the other was his childish self. 



“What do you want me to do, then?” As soon as she finished her words, 
Hades growled, “Marry me!” 

Selena opened her mouth but couldn’t utter a word. “I’ve saved your life twice, 
so I don’t think it’s outrageous to ask you to marry me. I’m not even going to 
propose to you. You’ll get married to me after you recover.” 

Hades stood straight up and turned to leave. When he reached the door, he 
realized that he shouldn’t have been so rude, so he returned to her bed and 
gazed gently at her before stroking her head. “Stay here to recuperate. I’ll 
settle all the problems for you.” 

“Are you serious?” 

“What do you mean? Have I ever not been serious?” Hades replied 
impatiently. 

“Why do you want to marry me all of a sudden?” Selena didn’t understand 
why he wanted to marry her and said that he wouldn’t propose to her. 

“What do you think?” Seeing how sluggish she was, Hades was displeased. “I 
don’t know.” 

“It’s because I’ve fallen in love with you! Damn it!” Hades left the room as 
soon as he finished speaking. “How could there be such a dumb woman like 
her? What is her brain made up of?” he mumbled. 

Ken and Barbie happened to arrive at this place to visit Selena, so they heard 
what Hades said. 

“You two, stop right there!” Hades stared at them. Ken subconsciously hid 
Barbie behind him. This man is like a time bomb, so I gotta be careful. 

“Is it so not obvious?” Hades placed his hands behind his back and scowled. 
“I mean the fact that I’ve fallen in love with Selena.” 

“Boss, you’re finally willing to admit that you love Selena! Congratulations!” 
Barbie clapped her hands. Ken immediately pushed her behind his back 
again. “Boss, it really isn’t obvious that you’ve fallen for Selena.” 

Hades’ expression darkened in an instant. Seeing that, Ken and Barbie 
hurriedly stopped smiling and walked away. 



Hades continued to mumble, “Why did no one realize that?” 

When Ken and Barbie stepped into the room, Selena was still reeling from the 
shock of what Hades had told her. “Oh, it seems that someone has confessed 
his love to you! Was it a particular man?” 

Selena came to her senses and stared at them. “Why are you here?” 

“Of course we’re here to make fun… Oh, no, we’re here to visit you.” Barbie 
always loved to pull a prank on others. “Selena, what do you think about Boss’ 
confession?” She pushed her hand forward as though there was a 
microphone in her hand. 

Selena pulled her hand away. “Why would he fall in love with me? That’s 
ridiculous.” 

“Why is it ridiculous? We all knew it, so only you were not aware of it.” Barbie 
shook her head. “Girl, you’re so dull.” 

“Really?” At that instant, Selena could confirm that Hades had honestly fallen 
for her, which was troublesome. How could he love me? 

“Selena, I’m sure you know that Hades thinks differently from what he says. 
He even went to Astoria alone. He must have been following you because 
he’s worried about you.” 

 


