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Bradley explained to Pierre the purpose of his visit. “There are a few other 
antique collections in my room. Why don’t you pick one that you like?” 

Upon hearing that, Pierre asked with a frown, “What do you mean by that?” 

Even though Bradley’s patience was running thin, he forced himself to remain 
coolheaded. “Mr. Fowler, you know I want the scrolls back, so stop playing the 
guessing game with me.” 

“Oh, so that’s what you’re after! Mr. Oberlin, my son was the one who brought 
the scrolls, so there is no need for us to return them to you. Haven’t I already 
cleared up the misunderstanding with you during the birthday banquet?” Of 
course, Pierre would never admit to stealing them. If he did, he would be 
admitting that his son was a thief, which could potentially be troublesome. 

“You—” Bradley was so frustrated that he had no words to express himself. 
“Mr. Fowler, this won’t be handled as a case of thievery, so your son didn’t 
steal anything. The scrolls are important to me, so I hope you will be able to 
return them as soon as possible.” 

However, Pierre only waved his hand. “Of course this isn’t a case of thievery! 
The scrolls belong to the Fowlers, and my son was merely having fun with 
them. As I said, I don’t see why we should return them to you.” 

Bradley shot up from his seat in rage upon witnessing Pierre’s stubbornness. 
“Fowler, stop messing around with me! Both of us know that the scrolls belong 
to us, the Oberlin Family! Just tell me if you will return them to me or not!” 

In the face of Bradley’s wrath, Pierre was still all smiles as he replied, “Mr. 
Oberlin, as I have told you countless times, the scrolls belong to our family, so 
there’s no such thing as returning them to your family.” 

Upon hearing that, Bradley was finally able to grasp what Pierre meant. “So 
you have made up your mind to keep the scrolls, haven’t you?” There was a 
fierceness to his gaze as he stared at Pierre. I never knew he could be such a 
douche! 



“Mr. Oberlin, you say such interesting things. The scrolls had always been in 
the Fowlers’ possession.” 

“Okay! Pierre Fowler, just you wait, you b*stard! You won’t be able to leave 
here just like this! Hmph!” Bradley stomped away in anger as Joaquin 
watched everything with his own eyes from upstairs. 

Still in his seat, Pierre took a sip out of his cup of tea. To deal with rascals like 
the Oberlins, we will have to give them a taste of their own medicine, he 
thought. All of a sudden, he realized that he hadn’t received any updates from 
Selena in a while. He was so focused on dealing with Bradley that he had 
forgotten about her. Therefore, he took out his phone to check her 
coordinates. 

At that moment, a call came through to inform him of breaking news. News 
broke in Yucaria that a woman from Astoria murdered Scott Jensen when they 
met up in secret. The police had already arrested the woman on the spot, and 
they had started an investigation. Also, the incident had made it to the 
headlines of newspapers as well as TV stations. 

A smile tugged on the corner of Linda’s lips when she saw the news. It never 
was her plan to only have Selena sleep with Scott. If she could get rid of 
Scott, which would in turn frame Selena as the murderer, she could kill two 
birds with one stone. 

After all, she was already bored of Scott, who was a lecherous man. If it 
weren’t for the fact that he was her only choice, she wouldn’t have gotten 
involved with an old pervert like him. However, she no longer needed Scott 
now that she had the Murrays to back her up. Besides, Scott already knew too 
much about her, so he had to be dealt with lest he gave her more trouble. 

Linda put the newspaper down on the table. Pierre might be able to do 
something if Selena was arrested in Astoria, but she’s in Yucaria, so he can’t 
possibly do anything to rescue her no matter how powerful he might be! 
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could be easily incriminated under Yucarian law. Since Linda had some 
connections in Yucaria, and the Jensens would not let things slide, she was 



certain that Selena would soon be given the death penalty. In the meantime, 
Linda would simply wait to be married into the Murray Family. 

On the other hand, the Oberlins also caught wind of Selena’s arrest. After 
being shut down by Pierre, Bradley was feeling frustrated, so the news 
brought him great joy, which lifted his spirits significantly. 

Jane was also extremely elated when she saw the news. Running into her 
father’s study with the newspaper in hand, she cried, “Daddy! Daddy! Have 
you read the news? This is great! Selena Yard was arrested!” At that moment, 
she was literally on cloud nine. 

While casually sipping on his wine, Bradley was beaming. “Yes, my darling. 
I’ve already read the news.” 

Sitting down on her father’s lap, she chirped, “Daddy, I am so happy! Selena 
finally got what she deserved! I always knew she was a b*tch, but I never 
expected her to hook up with Scott! I suppose Jason had somehow misjudged 
her character.” Since the incident would serve to sever Jason’s affection 
toward Selena, Jane was undoubtedly happy about it. 

“Would she date Scott though? I don’t think that sly woman would have her 
eyes on Scott. I’m inclined to believe that there must have been some sort of 
misunderstanding.” Unlike his daughter, Bradley wasn’t so focused on 
relationships. 

“Daddy, what do you mean? Are you thinking of helping Pierre to rescue 
Selena?” 

With a sinister smile on his face, he replied, “Yeah. How else will I be able to 
get the scrolls back? What say you, my sweetheart?” 

“Daddy, but… but I don’t like the idea! Are the scrolls more important than 
your own daughter?” Jane would like to believe that she had the most 
important place in Bradley’s heart. 

“Both you and the scrolls are precious to me!” After giving Jane’s nose a 
pinch, he went on to say, “Although Pierre Fowler might be the most influential 
man in Astoria, his influence doesn’t reach Yucaria. Therefore, he will come to 
us for help, which means he will offer up the scrolls in exchange for our 
assistance.” 



Overjoyed, Jane said tentatively, “By that, you mean…” 

“That’s right! We will rob him of both his possessions and the woman he 
loves! Hahaha!” 

Jane burst into laughter while sitting on her father’s lap. “Daddy, you sure are 
the best! You’re so thoughtful!” 

Snickering, he declared, “Nobody ever goes against me! I have a target 
marked on Pierre’s back now! I will make sure he pays for what he did!” 

Suddenly, Jane seemed to have realized something. “Daddy, I think my 
dearest Jason might be willing to offer Pierre his assistance.” 

“Why would he, my dear?” 

The smile on Jane’s face vanished. “I don’t know. I could never shake off the 
feeling that he likes Selena, so I’m worried that he might disrupt our plan. I will 
have to take precautions.” 

“I will leave that to you then, my dear.” 

Jane nodded to show that she was determined to prevent Jason from 
meddling, or else her father’s plans would fail. Where should I start though? I 
can’t tell Jason, as he will definitely throw a tantrum. He already said such 
harsh words last time, so I have to make sure that I don’t cross him anymore. 

Therefore, Jane went to the hotel where Pierre was staying, just in time to 
bump into Pierre himself, who was in a hurry to leave. On the other hand, he 
didn’t want to waste time dealing with Jane, as he had more pressing things 
that he needed to handle. 
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Jane shrugged as she blocked Pierre’s way. “You should stay away from me!” 
Pierre had always been annoyed by Jane. 

“You’d better let me go in if you wish to rescue your wife.” Persistently 
standing in front of Pierre, Jane wasn’t about to relent. In the end, Pierre let 
her in, for part of him wanted to see what tricks Jane had up her sleeve. 



While sitting on the sofa, Jane crossed her legs elegantly. “I know you must 
be feeling anxious, so I am certain the news I brought will help you relax a bit.” 

“What news?” Pierre stared straight at the woman before him. “My fiancé, 
Jason, is already making moves to rescue Selena in secret.” 

Upon hearing Jason’s name being mentioned, Pierre wore a deep frown. It’s 
him again! 

“That’s right. My fiancé, Jason Murray. From what I gathered, he has been 
trying to find out more about the incident through the police. I’m sure you are 
aware that the Murrays are an influential family in Yucaria. With his help, you 
should be able to save time and effort.” 

No man will be able to stand the fact that some other man is after his woman, 
Jane thought. That was the basis for her plan, so regardless of what she was 
scheming, she wasn’t lying. Jason went to the police for more info as soon as 
he caught wind of what happened. 

Although Jane was irked when she found out about it, she was also aware 
that it could help her advance her plan. “Your wife, Selena Yard, sure is a 
whore. If I am not mistaken, both Scott and her were naked in bed when Scott 
died. It’s such a tantalizing sight to behold!” 

“Shut up!” 

“I don’t get why you would fall for a whore like Selena. Do you know why I 
went out of my way to hassle her during my birthday banquet? It’s all because 
she was involved with my fiancé! Why else would I do all of that, right?” 
Shaking her head, she continued, “I already told you what I came to tell you, 
so the ball is in your court now. Goodbye.” With that, Jane stood to leave. 

As soon as she got home, Bradley held her up. “How did things go, my 
darling?” 

Jane skipped over to him happily. “It’s done! My dear father, I had someone 
stand watch at the hotel. Pierre was on his way out when I arrived, but he 
remained in the hotel after I messed with his mind a bit.” 

“Pray tell, my dear. How did you do that?” 



Rolling her eyes, Jane shrugged. “It’s easy! Daddy, no man would be able to 
stand another man lusting after his woman! I told Pierre that Selena was 
seeing Jason. He couldn’t possibly stand that. By now, he must be fighting 
with Jason already!” 

“Hahaha, you sure are my daughter! This is incredible!” Bradley gave her 
daughter a thumbs up. 

Jane was so proud of herself for her swift actions. As long as Pierre would 
stop Jason from meddling, things would be considered as settled. She wished 
for Selena to be executed as soon as possible, for the moment Selena was 
gone, there would be nobody to stop Jason from marrying her. “But Daddy, I 
wish to move my wedding with Jason to an earlier date. I can’t wait to marry 
him! God knows what else might happen if I don’t marry him soon!” 

“Don’t you worry, my darling. I will talk to Jerry about this. However, the 
Murrays seem to currently be dealing with family issues, so Jerry hasn’t been 
allowing visitors.” 
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“What might they be dealing with?” Meanwhile, Linda had arrived at the 
Murrays’ house. After Jerry moved his family and belongings to Yucaria, he 
bought the famous Vince Manor when he gradually gained more foothold in 
Yucaria. 

Vince Manor was a romantic place. Other than the fact that it occupied a 
larger area, it could hardly compare to other manors. Therefore, it didn’t cost 
Jerry much when he bought it. After acquiring it, he began refurbishing it. 
Aside from setting up a beautiful garden, he even repaired whatever that 
remained of the maze that was left behind by previous owners. 

By now, Vince Manor had become a place that was filled with a romantic and 
artistic atmosphere, which was exceptionally loved by girls. Reportedly, 
tourists who came to Yucaria would love to visit the place, but it wasn’t open 
to the public due to the fact that it was a private manor. 

Linda had heard of the manor when she arrived in the city. Back when she 
first started going after Jason, she used to fantasize about becoming the lady 



of Vince Manor. She never expected her fantasies to come true in such a 
manner. 

“This way please, Miss Dunn.” The servant had been waiting for a while. It 
wasn’t until Linda entered the manor that she bore witness to the romantic air 
and the enchanting sceneries within the manor. With every turn, she found 
herself being surprised by the architecture, which made her yearn for the 
place even more. 

Jerry and his wife, Lindsay Davis, were already waiting at the entrance while 
supporting each other. Despite the tears on their faces, they were smiling. 
Jason already explained to them that their daughter, Jessica Murray, had 
passed away, but she had left behind a daughter. Although they were grieving 
over Jessica’s passing, the fact that they still had a granddaughter was solace 
to them. 

After taking a deep breath, Linda approached them with tears in her eyes. 
Jerry was a man who had gone through the ordeals of life, so he straightened 
his posture without a word in a show of forbearance. 

On the contrary, Lindsay walked up to Linda to hold her hand. “Child, I’ve 
been wanting to see you.” She couldn’t help but shed tears. In order to take a 
better look at Linda’s face, she kept on wiping her tears away. “You look just 
like her! You’re almost identical to her!” 

All the while, Linda was rejoicing internally. This must be a show of 
benevolence from the heavens, she thought. Back when she decided to go for 
plastic surgery, she showed an image of Selena’s face to the doctor as 
Selena was the most beautiful woman she had ever met. 

Although Linda’s original face looked nothing like Selena, a few tweaks to 
Linda’s face was enough to make her resemble Selena, owing to the advance 
technology and techniques in the plastic surgery industry. In a twist of fate, it 
turned out that the semblance she bore also made her look more like Selena’s 
mother. 

“Alright, let’s not stand here. We should have a chat inside the house.” 
Lindsay was all smiles when she held Linda’s hand. “It’s my fault that we are 
standing here. I was so engrossed in checking out my granddaughter. Come 
on, in we go.” 



Although Jason was also there, he thought he shouldn’t be disturbing them, 
so he left straightaway. After that, Jerry and Lindsay brought Linda to the 
reception hall. Lindsay refused to let go of Linda’s hand even when the three 
of them sat down. Then, she asked curiously, “Why is she so quiet?” 

Like a wounded bunny, Linda glanced at both Jerry and Lindsay with fear 
written in her eyes. 

“I suppose she is just too frightened. Child, you have nothing to worry about. 
We are your grandparents. Has your mother never mentioned to you about 
us?” It wasn’t until then that Jerry finally spoke. 

“Are you really my grandparents?” Linda’s voice sounded full of timidness as 
she questioned them tentatively. 
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grandparents!” Lindsay replied in a hurry while eagerly hoping for Linda to 
recognize her as her grandmother. “I am your grandmother!” 

“Grandma!” Linda pounced into Lindsay’s arms. “I’m here!” Once again, 
Lindsay began crying. Beside them, Jerry wiped his tears away without a 
word. “Alright, let us stop crying. Your grandmother’s eyes are already failing, 
so crying too much won’t do her any good.” 

Upon hearing that, Linda scrambled up to get some tissues for Lindsay to 
wipe her tears. “Jason told me that Grandma had been crying because of 
what happened to my mother. Due to her age and incessant crying, her eyes 
are beginning to fail her. Grandma, it’s all my fault. Please stop crying. It’s a 
good thing that we’re now reunited.” 

“Yes, yes. I’ll stop.” Lindsay was holding onto the tissue as if it were 
something precious. “My dear child, tell us more about your mother.” 
Thoughts of her poor, stubborn daughter brought tears to Lindsay’s eyes 
again, but she held them back. 

“My mother suffered a lot. She married my father, who ended up having an 
affair. His mistress’ children are only a few months younger than me. Due to a 
broken heart and severe depression, my mother passed away afterward. Her 



jade bracelets were sold in order to help sustain my father’s company. After 
my mother passed, Dad married that mistress, so I have stepsisters. My 
stepmother treated me poorly, while my sisters were constantly bullying me. 
However, my father got dealt his share of karma, as his company eventually 
went bankrupt. Then, my stepmother ran away with all the money.” 

After listening to Linda’s version of events, Lindsay was feeling both vexed 
and distressed. “My child, how did you survive all these? My poor Ceci, why 
are you so silly?” Lindsay couldn’t help but bawl. 

“Grandma, don’t cry. Mom passed away long ago. I suppose she never 
contacted you because she didn’t want you to feel sad and worried about her.” 

“Yeah, Ceci had passed, so there’s no longer any reason to feel sad for her.” 
Jerry managed to keep a cool head despite everything. No amount of grieving 
would change anything since it already happened. Fortunately, we still have 
our granddaughter. 

With a nod, Lindsay replied, “My child, things will get better from now on. 
Nobody will bully you ever again now that you have your grandparents.” 

Linda leaned against Lindsay as she spoke. “Grandma, it feels great to have a 
family again. I assumed that I no longer have any relatives after my mother 
passed away. The heavens sure are benevolent to me.” 

Upon hearing that, Lindsay patted her on the back lightly. “You’re such a good 
girl,” she said. She must have had a lot of tough experiences that taught her 
to maintain such a positive attitude despite her circumstances. 

“My child, where have you been staying while you’re here?” Jerry asked. 

“I’m already married.” Linda hung her head low. 

“You’re married? To whom? Why did you not bring your husband along? Is he 
nice to you?” The topic piqued Lindsay’s interest. After all, it was an important 
matter that should be treated with care. 

“His name is Scott Jensen.” Linda carefully revealed the name. 

As soon as the elderly couple heard that name, they exchanged a knowing 
glance with each other. Having lived in this city for such a long time, they 
couldn’t possibly not know who Scott was. “Why would you—” 



“I was forced to marry him!” Linda blurted out. “I came to this city alone, and I 
had neither money nor connections. Scott noticed my beauty, so he…” While 
covering her mouth, she sobbed, which prompted Lindsay to pull her into an 
embrace. 

“My dear girl, don’t cry.” 

They believed in what Linda told them. After all, Scott was indeed a greedy 
pervert. Considering how pretty Linda was, it wasn’t out of their expectations 
that he would rape her. 
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me, so I submitted to him. With his wealth and influence, I thought he might be 
able to find my mother’s bracelets, which was why I stuck with him. However, 
things are getting better now that I have found you, and Scott is also… He’s 
also dead.” 

Both Jerry and Lindsay cried in unison, “Dead?” 

“He got what he deserved. He was murdered when he was sleeping with 
another woman.” 

Although both Jerry and Lindsay felt that what happened was rather absurd, 
they figured it was for the best, since it meant that Linda was free from him. 

“It’s good that he’s dead. Scum like him should’ve been banished to hell since 
long ago!” Lindsay patted Linda on the back. “Now that he’s dead, you should 
move in with us. Keep me company, won’t you?” 

“Grandma, I don’t think this is appropriate. I am an outsider after all, while Mr. 
Jason—” 

“It’s not Mr. Jason, and you’re not an outsider! Jason is your cousin, so stop 
being so formal! Your uncle and aunt were thinking of coming back from your 
aunt’s hometown today. In fact, your uncle was overjoyed when he heard that 
you’re coming home. Back in those days, he used to dote on your mother a 
lot.” With a smile, Lindsay patted Linda’s hand as she spoke. “It’s great that 
our family is finally reunited. We will be able to live together happily from now 
on, and I should be able to die without regrets now.” 



Linda quickly covered Lindsay’s mouth. “Grandma, don’t you dare mention 
that! You will have a long life!” 

“Alright, I will live up until I am a hundred for your sake, if nothing else!” 

After that, the family had a jolly meal before dispatching someone to fetch 
Linda home to pack her stuff. Both Lindsay and Jerry were sighing after 
Linda’s departure. Although their daughter’s death left them heartbroken, they 
were feeling fortunate enough to still have a granddaughter like Linda. 

“Jerry, we have to do all we can to make it up to Linda. Even though she only 
mentioned it in passing, I can see that she had it rough as a kid. She is 
mature and obedient for her age.” 

“What good would obedience do her? Ceci also used to be such an obedient 
kid, but didn’t you hear what happened to her?” 

Jessica’s death was a trauma that Lindsay and Jerry had yet to heal from. 
Back then, Jessica was also a chubby girl who was mild-tempered. Everybody 
who met her would comment that she was the most mature and obedient kid 
that they had ever met. She was so obedient and mature for a child that her 
parents ended up neglecting her feelings, as they began to assume that she 
would and should remain as such. 

During Jessica’s more rebellious teenage years, Jerry opposed her for doing 
something that she liked. Everybody thought she would defer to her parents’ 
wishes just like how she always did. However, nobody expected her to have 
such a stubborn streak. She ended up running away from home and never 
returned. Even after she got hurt because of her marriage, she never 
contacted her family again. 

“Jerry, promise me that you’ll let Linda do whatever that she wishes to do. I 
don’t need her to be obedient. I just need her to be my granddaughter who will 
keep me company.” Lindsay’s words sounded like a plea. 

Similar to Lindsay, Jessica’s death also came as a major blow for Jerry. 
Therefore, he nodded solemnly. “I promise you.” 

We will have to offer Linda everything that we didn’t offer Ceci, Lindsay swore 
to herself. I will love my granddaughter as if my life depends on it. 



That night, Linda moved into Vince Manor with her luggage in tow. Jerry had 
instructed the servants to clear out the largest and most spacious room for 
her. When she stared at the high ceiling, vast space, as well as everything 
else that came with her new room while standing in it, she was utterly 
overjoyed. After all, every girl like her wished to be treated like a princess. 
Finally, she was able to live her dream life without having to constantly check 
herself. 
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on the door pulled Linda back to reality. Upon turning around, she saw Jason 
at the door. With a smile on his face, he asked, “Have you gotten used to the 
place?” 

“Well…” As soon as Jason made the inquiry, he let out a chuckle. “I’m sorry. I 
suppose it’s still too early to ask such a question. You can make a request to 
the butler regarding things that you need. Just think of this place as your 
home, so you don’t need to be so formal with us. Still, I am quite busy with 
work, so please forgive me if I have neglected you in any way.” 

Tilting her head with a smile on her face as she squinted, she said, “Since I 
should be thinking of this place as my home, I believe there’s no such thing as 
you being inhospitable.” 

Jason scratched his head while smiling after hearing her opinion. My cousin 
sure is cute, he thought. “You look like my aunt when you smile. 
Unfortunately, I never got to meet her.” When he noticed that Linda had 
lowered her gaze, he realized he might have said something that he shouldn’t 
have. “I’m sorry. I suppose I shouldn’t have mentioned her.” After all, she had 
passed away a long time ago. 

“It’s okay. Mom would be happy to see that she has such an outstanding 
nephew.” 

With a faint smile, Jason added, “Take your time to familiarize yourself with 
the environment. You can come get me if you need anything.” 



“Sure.” After Jason left, Linda checked the spacious room again. Then, she 
dashed toward the queen-sized bed before flopping onto it. I am so lucky! The 
wheel of fortune must be turning in my favor! 

All that was left for her to do was to wait until news of Selena’s execution 
broke out. As soon as Selena was executed, her claim to the position as the 
Murrays’ only granddaughter would be unshakable. 

Meanwhile, Bradley and Jane were still waiting for Pierre to beg them for their 
help. However, there was no news of Selena’s sentence, and neither did 
Pierre drop by at the Oberlins’ place. It was as if Pierre had flown under the 
radar. 

Bradley was pacing around in the room with his hands behind him. All the 
while, he was wearing a frown with a solemn look on his face. On the other 
hand, Jane was also feeling uneasy about the fact that their plan had yet to 
succeed, or rather, had no progress. 

“Shoot, Jane!” Bradley cried out abruptly. 

“What is it, Daddy?” 

“We might have made a wrong move. Tell me; who will be the greatest 
beneficiary if Selena dies?” 

After some thought, Jane replied, “Her husband and her kids.” 

“Exactly! Her kids are still so young, so the greatest beneficiary will be her 
husband, Pierre Fowler! That’s why he won’t be coming to me, because he is 
after Selena’s assets that are worth billions!” 

With a look of horror, Jane stared at Bradley. “T-This can’t be! Daddy, they’re 
a married couple with three children. Pierre wouldn’t be that ruthless!” 

“Marriage and relationships mean nothing in the face of wealth.” Bradley was 
extremely frustrated for having miscalculated. Although he wanted so much to 
retrieve the scrolls from Pierre, the fact that Pierre might want Selena dead 
meant that the scrolls were possibly gone for good. While sitting on the sofa, 
he was expressing his grief by stomping his feet and thumping his chest, 
lamenting about his pain. 



On the other hand, Linda was enjoying life as a rich young lady of the Murray 
Family. Her maternal uncle, Reuben Murray, and aunt, Jocelyn Lloyd, had 
both returned. They were both gentle people with warm personalities. 

Jocelyn was a prim and proper woman with elegant mannerisms. While 
holding Linda’s hand, she couldn’t stop herself from chirping, “You must be 
our precious niece. You’re so pretty! I don’t think I will be able to have a 
daughter of my own, but I am grateful that the heavens have given me a niece 
whom I can still care for at this age.” 

On the other hand, Reuben Murray had mixed feelings when he saw his 
niece. He had always missed the younger sister whom he loved dearly since a 
young age. Having spent so many years failing in his search for her after her 
disappearance, he already had a feeling that she might have passed away. 
However, the truth still hit him hard when he finally came face-to-face with his 
sister’s passing. 
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with his sister, and he was the one who doted on her the most. Despite the 
fact that he was already well past his fifties, he couldn’t help but shed tears of 
sorrow upon recalling memories of his sister. 

“Hey, it’s all in the past now. I’ve finally managed to stop it, so don’t make me 
start crying again,” Lindsay quickly chided. During the past few days, she had 
been immersed in the happiness of having a granddaughter, so she didn’t 
want to cry anymore. 

Reuben was a man after all, so he turned around to wipe away his tears 
quietly. “Alright. It’s all in the past now. I’ll stop crying. Linda, your aunt and I 
prepared for you a present when we got news that you’re coming home. We 
hope you will like the present.” 

Then, he signaled Jocelyn with a look, which prompted her to go into their 
room with a smile on her face. After retrieving a pretty box with a folk design, 
she handed it to Linda. “Open the box and check it out.” 

When Linda opened the box, she found out that it contained a set of jewelry. 
Glimmering under the light, the ornate jewelry was obviously worth a lot. Upon 



seeing that, Linda reacted as if she was given a bar of hot steel, which she 
quickly tried to pass back to Jocelyn. “Uncle Reuben, Aunt Jocelyn, I can’t 
take this present. It’s too expensive.” 

“Just take it if people are giving it to you! The price doesn’t matter! We’re 
family after all,” Lindsay quickly said. 

“Yeah, Linda. This is nothing. We had planned to give you these to be added 
to your dowry, but… Oh, let’s leave those behind us. Now that we have given 
it to you as a present, you should wear this when you get married in a glorious 
wedding.” 

However, Lindsay pouted before retorting, “That won’t do! She can wear this 
during other more casual occasions. I will order better ones for her when she 
gets married!” Despite the fact that she was eighty years old, she looked all 
childish when she pouted. 

“Okay, it’s up to you.” 

Enamored of the set of jewelry, Linda was still holding onto them when she 
returned to her room. Lindsay declared that she will present me with better 
jewelry when I get married despite the fact that these look expensive enough! 
The Murrays sure are filthy rich! 

Immediately, she did a quick search online to find out more about the Murrays’ 
assets, only to end up finding nothing. She couldn’t even find Jerry’s name on 
the list of the world’s richest people. That’s impossible! Judging from the 
architecture of Vince Manor, it should be worth hundreds of millions! It’s 
impossible that Jerry isn’t on the list of rich people! 

However, she just couldn’t find Jerry’s name on it even after spending a long 
time looking through the list. Eventually, the conclusion she came to was that 
Jerry was so rich that he bribed the people who made the list in order to wipe 
his name off of it. 

Whenever the list was renewed annually, a lot of rich people would contact 
the producers to have their names removed from the list. Selena had been 
listed among the richest women before this, so she had told Linda about it. 
With that, Linda thought, It’s perfect that I have such a rich grandfather! When 
will Selena be sentenced to death? Why is there no news about it yet? 



During dinnertime, the Murrays sat in the dining room, livening up the space. 
After that, they gathered in the living room for a pleasant chat. They were so 
engrossed in their conversation that nobody was watching the TV even 
though it was turned on. In spite of the lively atmosphere, Jason seemed a 
little distracted, as he was fiddling with his phone while sitting on the sofa. 

All of a sudden, Jocelyn brought up the topic he dreaded. “Jason, I met Lina 
recently, who told me about your marriage with Jane. When do you plan on 
holding it?” 

The mention of Jane’s name was enough to give Jason a headache, but he 
couldn’t bring himself to tell Jocelyn he didn’t want to marry Jane, as the 
family marriage was already decided long ago. “I’ve been busy as of late. 
Besides, Jane and I aren’t well-acquainted with each other, so I suppose I 
should postpone it.” 

“That’s true. The two of you aren’t that close, so you’ll probably need time to 
build up a relationship with her.” Jocelyn didn’t want to force things on her 
son, so she let it slide for the time being. 
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from the topic, Linda settled down tentatively beside Jason before asking, 
“Jason, you don’t seem to like the wedding.” 

With a faint smile on his face, he answered, “What difference does my 
preference make? Let’s talk about something else.” Apparently, he didn’t want 
to talk about that. 

“Sure. By the way, are there any updates regarding Scott’s murder?” Linda 
tried to gain more info on that, as she was certain that Jason would know 
about it. 

“Miss Yard was acquitted. There might be further investigations regarding the 
case,” Jason informed her. When she heard that, the glass that she was 
holding slipped from her hand before shattering to pieces after falling onto the 
ground. The noise attracted everybody’s attention at once. 



“Linda, did you hurt your hand? Let me take a look at it!” Lindsay was getting 
anxious all of a sudden. While the servants retrieved some utensils to proceed 
with cleaning up the shards, Jason was staring at Linda, looking perplexed. 
After all, he didn’t expect her to have such an exaggerated reaction. 

As soon as Linda snapped back to her senses, she quickly consoled Lindsay. 
“It’s alright, Grandma. I’m fine. I just lost my grip on the glass. I’m sorry, 
Grandma. I didn’t do it on purpose.” 

“It’s no big deal. Don’t apologize. All is well as long as you aren’t hurt,” said 
Lindsay while holding Linda’s hand. She was so worried that something wrong 
might happen to Linda. With that, the incident was over. 

When it was time to sleep, Linda went to knock on Jason’s door. As soon as 
he saw her, a faint smile crept onto his face before he brought her into his 
room. “What’s the matter? Why are you here at this hour?” 

“Jason, you told me that Selena Yard was acquitted, and it was deemed that 
more investigation was required for the case. What actually happened after 
the arrest? According to the news, Selena was alone with Scott, so I’m fairly 
certain that she is the murderer,” Linda explained. 

She had just moved into Vince Manor, so she wasn’t quite free to do anything 
she wanted for the time being. All she could do was enjoy life in the mansion, 
so she could only try to glean more info from Jason. 

“Do you mean the murder? I’m not entirely sure what happened. In short, 
Selena was acquitted, and more investigation will be required.” From the 
beginning, Jason was quite concerned about the case. Knowing that Selena 
would never associate herself with someone the likes of Scott, he knew 
something must be wrong. However, Selena ended up being given an 
acquittal before he could even come up with a solution. 

What happened didn’t seem to go according to the law in Yucaria, nor was it 
characteristic of the police force in Yucaria. Nonetheless, Jason was relieved 
that Selena was acquitted. As long as Selena was safe, he didn’t care who 
killed Scott. 

“What’s the matter, Linda?” Jason noticed that Linda had an odd look in her 
eyes. 



“It’s nothing. Scott and I used to be married to each other, so I figured I should 
at least find out who the murderer is even though Scott is dead.” A look of 
dejection flashed across her face. In fact, she was using a look of sorrow to 
mask her panic. 

“You should forget about Scott. He’s scum anyway. You have a new life now, 
so just forget about the past.” Although Jason didn’t have an in-depth 
conversation with Linda, he heard from his grandparents about her unhappy 
childhood. As her cousin, he wished for her to find happiness, and in order to 
do that, she would have to bid goodbye to her past. 

“Yeah, you’re right. I need to forget about the past. I will put the case out of 
my mind and let it be.” 

“That’s the attitude.” Then, Jason reached out to caress her forehead. 

At that moment, she felt her blood gushing to her face. His gaze and 
movements are so gentle! 
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to her room, she shed all pretense. How could Selena even leave the police 
station? This is ridiculous! Pierre couldn’t have possibly been powerful enough 
to secure her release from the police force in Yucaria, say less of getting an 
acquittal! 

Linda was clenching her fists. Selena can’t live! Her being alive is a threat to 
my current position! She must die! No, this can’t go on. I need to come up with 
a solution. 

At the same time, the Oberlins also caught wind of Selena’s acquittal and 
subsequent release. Bradley had been pacing up and down in his room in a 
frenzy as soon as he heard the news. When Jane heard the noise he was 
making, she hurried downstairs. “Daddy, what’s wrong?” 

“Selena got acquitted and released!” 

“What? That’s impossible!” Jane couldn’t believe her ears. How could Pierre 
and Selena pull off such a feat? 



The Oberlins themselves might have been able to pull something like that off, 
but both Pierre and Selena were not locals, so the law enforcers in Yucaria 
couldn’t possibly have given them any leeway. 

“Jane, your plan failed miserably!” 

“Daddy, didn’t you tell me back then it was brilliant?” Jane was feeling 
wronged. 

“It’s all your fault!” Bradley yelled at her. “Great! Now my scrolls are lost 
forever!” He was sitting on the sofa with his head under his hands while 
stomping his feet. My scrolls! I don’t think I will be getting them back anymore! 

“Daddy, I am skeptical about how things turned out. Neither Pierre nor Selena 
are of any importance in Yucaria, so Selena should be as good as being 
convicted. Why is it that she ended up being acquitted?” Jane’s mind was 
buzzing. Just when she thought she would be able to sit back and relax, 
Selena was released. “Did Jason help them out? Yeah, that is very likely the 
case!” 

Other than Jason, she couldn’t think of anybody else who would help Selena. 
However, she didn’t expect someone as proud as Pierre to beg for Jason’s 
help to rescue his wife. Is this true love that is only heard of in fairytales? The 
thought of it was enough to make her burn with jealousy. 

Back in the hotel, an odd atmosphere filled the living room as Selena stood 
beside the sofa in an upright posture, while her three kids stood beside her in 
utter silence. Meanwhile, the elderly man who was sitting on the sofa had gray 
hair, which matched nicely with the white military uniform he wore. Despite his 
age, he seemed sturdy. As a military serviceman in Yucaria, his face showed 
a stoicism that befit his identity, but he seemed benevolent nonetheless. 

Compared to the elderly man, Pierre seemed almost indolent as he sat on the 
sofa with his legs crossed while scrolling on his phone. When he glanced at 
Selena, he asked, “Why are you standing there?” 

Selena didn’t know who the elderly man was, so she gave Pierre a look. It 
wasn’t until then that he realized he hadn’t made an introduction. After walking 
up to Selena, he told her, “He is my maternal grandfather, Admiral Evan 
Moody. Grandpa, she is my wife, Selena Yard, and these are our three kids.” 
Pierre tapped on their heads as he spoke. 



As soon as she heard Pierre’s introduction, she gawked at him in awe. He 
said the old man in front of me is his maternal grandfather, who also happens 
to be an admiral! Gosh, are my ears playing tricks on me? 

“Hello? You heard me?” Pierre knocked on her head slightly. “Sit down.” 

Admiral Evan also nodded his head. “Please take a seat.” 

It wasn’t until then that Selena sat down. Even though she was still in a daze, 
she soon realized that Francesca Moody was indeed a stage name, and the 
woman was also of mixed blood. However, she didn’t look like a foreigner at 
all, so the public always overlooked the fact that she was multiracial. 

 


