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back, the Fowler Residence instantly became lively. When the couple came 
down from upstairs, they saw Pollux sitting on the sofa in the living room like 
he was the master of the house. Crossing his legs, he was drinking wine while 
eating peanuts and watching TV. When Pierre saw him, his face sank. “Why is 
this guy here?” 

“Hey! Didn’t you ask me to come?” Pollux threw a peanut into his mouth. 

“I…” Pierre tilted his head to think about it. It seemed that before he left for 
home, he did indeed send Pollux a text. 

Pollux stole a glance at Pierre and Selena. “Well, distance makes the heart 
grow fonder, I guess. You’ve really vocalized your fondness for each other just 
now. Pierre, your voice was really unpleasant, like a mule. But your wife’s 
voice is okay. In fact, it’s quite nice.” 

Selena’s face instantly turned red at his words. Why is this old geezer 
speaking in such an unscrupulous manner? I’m still here! Maybe it was 
because it’s been too long since I’ve seen Pierre, so when we were making 
out, I didn’t think about my voice that much! 

Pierre picked up the vase next to him and threw it at Pollux. “Get out!” 

Pollux caught the vase and threw it over instead. “Don’t be so upset.” 

Pierre glared fiercely at him. “Go back to wherever you came from!” 

For the first time, Selena found that Pierre had met a rival; there had never 
been anyone who could make Pierre so angry. But there really should be such 
people. Otherwise, he really would have no rival. 

“Didn’t you ask me to teach your son? Well, I’ve acknowledged him as my 
disciple. I can tell you right now that your son is a genius like me.” Pollux 
winked at Pierre. 

When Selena looked at Pollux’s expression, she always felt that these two 
had some kind of improper relationship going on because Pollux kept being so 
suggestive about things! 



Pierre was so angry that he couldn’t say a word. Ugh, why did I invite Pollux 
over? 

When school ended in the afternoon, Selena and Pierre appeared together at 
the entrance of the kindergarten. When the three little ones lined up, waiting to 
be picked up, they saw the tall and handsome Pierre in the crowd at once. 

“Daddy!” Juniper ran toward Pierre with an excited scream. 

Pierre then picked up Juniper, who held his face and kissed him all over. On 
the other hand, Joaquin and Jameson looked as if their time was up. “It’s over, 
and now we don’t have any good days again.” 

Juniper was simply too excited, and her shrill laughter drew the attention of 
many people. Selena, who was standing to the side, sighed deeply. In the 
end, Juniper was still closest to her father. Pierre held Juniper in his arms and 
looked at the two boys standing nearby. 

“Now that you two have seen me, is there nothing you’d like to say?” 

Jameson slowly clapped with an awkward smile. “Daddy, welcome home.” 

Joaquin, on the other hand, still had a taut expression on. “Daddy.” 

Pierre thought it was extremely boring and simply said, “Forget it. Let’s go 
home!” 

Anyway, he had his darling girl, so what did he need the boys for? 

Since Pierre came back, Juniper seemed to lose the function of her legs. In 
fact, she became an accessory on Pierre’s body, clinging to him wherever he 
went, while Pierre was also happy to entertain her. However, Selena was a 
little jealous of that. 

The house became lively again, but there was the addition of Pollux, who kept 
saying things to annoy Pierre from time to time, which made the latter cranky. 

At night, Pierre came to the basement, where Rick was still locked up. After 
Rick woke up, he screamed until his voice turned hoarse. “Help! Anyone 
there? Let me out! What kind of place is this? This is a country with laws! Let 
me out! I’ll sue you for illegal imprisonment! It’s against the law!” 
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Pierre came down from the basement and walked up to Rick with his 
bodyguard. When Rick saw Pierre’s handsome face, he was so scared that 
his legs went weak. “I-I’m sorry. You’re Selena’s husband, right? Nothing 
happened between us at all. I swear, nothing happened. Please let me go!” 

Pierre raised his chin, and at that gesture, the bodyguard opened the door 
and moved a chair over. Next, Pierre sat firmly down in the chair, and the 
bodyguard released Rick. 

“Tell me, who arranged for you to do this?” Pierre’s voice was as if it came 
from hell, making everyone shiver at the sound of it. 

This man was akin to Lucifer himself. Even a glance from him could make 
anyone tremble from head to toe. 

Rick’s gaze shifted, and he replied, “N-No one arranged for me to do this. I 
was just greedy for money and thought that if I could get such a wealthy 
woman like Selena to be interested in me, then I would have more money to 
spend. That’s all!” 

Pierre lifted his chin, and the bodyguard immediately brought over a small and 
delicate knife. 

“Do you know what this is?” 

When Rick saw the knife, he instantly fell to his knees in fear. 

“This knife cuts through iron like mud. But the flesh on a human body is much 
softer than iron. If we cut your body piece by piece, I wonder how many 
pieces of flesh can be cut from it.” 

Pierre brought the small knife over to Rick. As the light glinted off the surface 
of the knife, Rick was so scared he nearly fainted. 

“Are you going to tell me?” Pierre leaned forward. 

“If you say even one word less, I’ll cut an extra piece of flesh off you!” 



“W-Well, it was someone who called me and said that Selena Yard’s husband 
was not at home, and she was lonely and felt unbearable to be alone. If I 
could seduce her and get her to sleep with me, then I would be given a large 
sum of money! S-So that’s why I went and did it.” Rick was sweating profusely 
with fear. 

“What else?” 

“T-There’s nothing else!” Rick fell to his knees. 

“There’s really nothing else. It’s just a straightforward matter. I thought that if 
Selena really became interested in me, I wouldn’t have to be a fitness 
instructor anymore since she’s so wealthy. I was blinded by my greed for 
money. I’m sorry! I’m an animal and not even human to have tricked her! 
Please, let me go!” Rick was slamming his forehead against the ground. 

“Who was the other party?” Pierre asked coldly. 

“I don’t know.” 

“Don’t know?” Pierre spun the knife. 

“I really don’t know! That person only called me to tell me Selena’s 
whereabouts; we have not even met! I swear to God, I truly don’t know!” 

“You haven’t even met that person, yet you could believe what they said?” 

“Yes, because they sent me a sum of money in advance. That’s why I 
believed them.” 

Rick raised his hand. “I swear that if I’m telling lies, I will be struck by lightning 
and die a painful death!” 

“Is that person a man or a woman?” 

“I don’t know.” Rick shook his head and insisted, “I honestly don’t know!” 

Pierre suddenly frowned. “You don’t know whether it was a man or a woman? 
Previously, you said that you answered the phone.” 

“Yes, but the other party used a voice changer, so it was impossible to tell.” 



Rick looked at Pierre with an awkward expression. “I really don’t know; this is 
all I can tell you!” 

Pierre threw the knife on the ground. “Keep him for later.” 

After saying that, he took a look at Rick on the ground and left the basement. 
In the bedroom, Selena had not yet slept, so when she saw Pierre coming 
back, she hurriedly asked, “How did it go? Did he say anything?” 

“No.” With some exasperation, Pierre undressed and got under the quilt. 

“He said the other party used a voice changer, so he didn’t even know if it was 
a man or a woman.” 

“It’s exactly the same as last time. When we interrogated those few men, they 
also just said that the other party used a voice changer. It seems like it’s the 
same person’s doing. Besides, their aim is very clear, and they’re not willing to 
expose themselves.” 
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who this person is exactly and kill them!” Pierre would never allow such a 
person to exist. 

The next day, he checked Rick’s bank information and found that the transfer 
came from a foreign account. If the money came from abroad, it would not be 
easy to check, since all the information would be censored. Then, he also 
checked Rick’s phone and found that when he hit Rick yesterday, he broke 
the latter’s phone, which was completely unusable now. Although he 
recovered some information about the call records, even the phone that the 
other party used to make the call was a public payphone, which was 
untraceable. 

Meanwhile, when Meredith called Rick, she found that the phone could not be 
reached. Later, she called the gym, and the gym staff said that Rick had not 
come to work for several days. Only then did Meredith realize that something 
was wrong. Rick must have been exposed! 



Just at this time, she received a call. “When we followed Selena, we found 
that Pierre came back, and he noticed us too. Surely, we can’t continue to 
follow her. Otherwise, we will be exposed.” 

“So, Pierre has returned!” Meredith’s heart constricted all of a sudden. 

I didn’t expect him to return so soon. Now that he’s back, this situation would 
be trickier than before. 

“All of you retreat for now. Leave no trace behind! You must not leave any 
tracks for them to find.” 

Now that Pierre was back, this matter would become much more difficult. She 
originally wanted to take advantage of his absence to ruin Selena, but now… 

The gaze in her eyes became more ruthless as she sat on the sofa in her 
apartment. 

Urgh! This game is no longer fun anymore! 

Then, she immediately called Linda, who sounded very impatient when 
answering the phone. 

“If you are telling me that Selena is not dead yet, then there is no need to call 
me!” Linda was obviously very dissatisfied with the efficiency of Meredith’s 
work. 

“She is not dead yet, but she’s definitely dying soon. Send me a sum of 
money.” 

“You want money again?” 

Linda hastily lowered her voice. “I just gave you 20 million last time. You 
wouldn’t have spent it so quickly, would you?” 

“I believe you’re aware how much money it costs to hire people to do things, 
especially bad things. For such a big thing, you definitely need to hire the best 
people to ensure that nothing goes wrong, which would cost even more!” 
Meredith spoke in a straightforward manner. “If you won’t give it to me, then I 
will ask for it from your grandfather.” 

“You—” Linda forced down the anger that rose in her heart. 



“What are you trying to do?” 

Linda had never talked to Meredith about her grandparents, so how did 
Meredith know she had a grandfather? 

“Oh, Linda. Your move is just too smart. You took the identity of Selena and 
got into the Murray Family so as to become the young mistress of the Murray 
Family. Then, you attempt to kill her once and for all. That’s really too clever of 
you.” 

“What nonsense are you talking about?” Of course, Linda did not dare to 
admit it; the fewer people knew about this matter, the better. After all, this was 
her weak point, and if people knew about it, then it would be equivalent to her 
life being in someone else’s hands. In the end, she would be at the mercy of 
others! 

“I’m sure you know in your heart whether I am talking nonsense or not. 
Anyway, I have found your grandfather’s number, so I will be calling him now 
to give him information about what his granddaughter has been up to. I 
believe he is willing to listen to me, right?” 

Meredith smiled on the other side of the phone. She seemed to be able to 
hear Linda gnashing her teeth over there. In fact, she was just testing out her 
theory, and she didn’t expect to get it right so easily. 

“How much do you want?” Linda finally swallowed and asked. Honestly, she 
did not expect that Meredith would be so smart, so she had to admit defeat for 
now. 

“Not much. Only 30 million.” 

“30 million, and you’re saying it’s not much?” Linda tried to suppress her 
anger. This woman’s getting greedier by the day! 
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Murray Family has hundreds of billions of assets, and as the beloved daughter 
of the Murray Family, you can reap countless benefits when the time comes. I 
only need 30 million; isn’t it considered just a light drizzle for you and the 
Murray Family?” 



Meredith knew that with this, Linda would forever become her cash machine. 

“I don’t have that much money. The Murray Family hasn’t given me any 
shares yet, and they only gave me a bank card. I really don’t have that much 
money to give you right now. If you kill Selena and let me sit properly in this 
position, Meredith, I can give you all the money you want!” 

Meredith snickered. “You’re joking, right? How could you, the daughter of the 
Murray Family, have no money? Besides, if you don’t give me money, how 
can I kill Selena? Don’t you need money to hire someone to do something? 
Anyway, you have to be quick. Selena is such a smart woman, so it is 
possible that she has already become suspicious. By that time, you’ll be 
finished, liar.” 

Linda currently had no way to leave Yucaria, as she had no legitimate reason 
to leave, so she could only get Meredith to do things for her. 

“I’ll come up with something.” 

Meredith knew that Linda would definitely compromise because she had no 
other choice. “Then you have to make it quick because I’m also in urgent need 
of money, and I have no choice. Miss Murray, I’ll hang up now then.” 

After hanging up, Meredith felt much better and more relaxed. She hoped that 
Linda could really take the position of the daughter of the Murray Family, as in 
this way, she could use this to blackmail Linda for the rest of her life, and thus 
she would not need to earn any money. 

However, right now, she had to get rid of Selena first. 

After receiving the phone call from Meredith, Linda felt on edge. Meredith was 
becoming more and more greedy now, and if it weren’t for the fact that she 
had nobody else to count on, she would never continue using her assistance. 
I would definitely have to find a way to get rid of Meredith after she gets rid of 
Selena! Otherwise, keeping her around would definitely be harmful to me! 

But right now, Linda had to collect the money, so she immediately drove out of 
the house. She could indeed overdraw 30 million on this card, but if she did, it 
would certainly arouse suspicion. But she couldn’t care too much about it 
anymore and immediately transferred 30 million to Meredith. Next, she sent 
Meredith a message: ‘This is the last 30 million. If I’m exposed over here, my 



identity will be gone. By that time, no matter how much money you want, it 
would be useless. If I die, you won’t be able to live either.’ 

‘Don’t worry. I know what I’m doing.’ 

Seeing Meredith’s message, Linda was finally relieved. When she returned to 
the Murray Family, the butler Danny approached her. “Miss, I have received 
this month’s bill. I-It’s just that this month’s bill is rather…” 

Danny really did not know how Linda, who did not go out much every day, 
spent so much money. As the amount was outrageous, he had no choice but 
to ask her about it. Although he was just a butler, this money belonged to the 
Murray Family after all, so he needed to be responsible for it. 

Nevertheless, Linda coldly snorted. “Rather what?” 

It was not appropriate for Danny to be so straightforward, so he simply said, 
“The amount is just a bit much. I wondered if there is a problem with the bank, 
so I hope we can go through the accounts together.” 

“Is the amount really that much?” Linda smiled. “Danny, you’re just a butler. 
Surely, you’re meddling a little too much? The money I spent is just a drop in 
the bucket for the Murray Family. Besides, Danny, the money I spent is the 
Murray Family’s, not yours.” 

“Um…” Danny was at a loss for words. 

“Also, during this period of time, my grandmother is bedridden, and my 
grandfather is bothered by too many things. It’s better not to bother him with 
these small money matters.” 
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the end, he was just the butler of the Murray Family, while Linda was the 
owner of this family. “Alright.” Danny nodded, not daring to continue. 

Linda looked at Danny contemptuously and went straight upstairs. Although 
she was also scared, there was nothing she could do, and she could only 
hope that Meredith could get rid of Selena this time and spare her worries. 



When Danny looked at all the accounts, he felt a headache coming. Although 
the Murray Family was very rich, they were never wasteful. As their butler, 
Danny naturally needed to report and manage some things, not to mention the 
reason he had been working in the Murray Family as a butler all this time was 
that he owed Jerry a favor. 

Most importantly, Danny was an upright person. 

That night, Danny came to Jerry’s room. Jerry had been sitting by Lindsay’s 
bedside all this while, but Lindsay was still the same. The original decision 
was to euthanize Lindsay so that she would no longer be in such pain, but 
Lindsay struggled desperately when this suggestion was brought up. As Jerry 
seemed to see the reluctance in her eyes, he decided to treat Lindsay 
properly and not to mention euthanasia anymore. Nevertheless, they had 
used acupuncture, traditional medicine, modern medicine, rehabilitation 
equipment, and so on, but all to no avail. 

Danny came to the bedside and looked at Jerry, who was in tears. Suddenly, 
he couldn’t bear to disturb him with other matters. But Jerry seemed to 
understand that something was on Danny’s mind. “Danny, just let me know 
what’s wrong. We’ve been friends for so many years.” 

Although Danny was only a butler in the Murray Family, and in the eyes of 
outsiders, a butler was a subordinate, Jerry never considered Danny as a 
subordinate but an old friend instead. 

“Mr. Murray, I don’t know if I should tell you about this.” Danny still had some 
difficulties voicing his thoughts because he knew how precious Linda was in 
Jerry and Lindsay’s hearts. 

“Go ahead, Danny. You know I prefer you to be more candid.” 

“It’s about Miss Linda’s bill.” Danny handed the bill to Jerry, who took it over 
and looked at it. The 30 million that had just been spent was very striking. 

Frowning, Jerry did not feel that Linda needed so much money. Girls usually 
liked to buy clothes and cosmetics, but even if she bought all the biggest 
international brands, she would not end up spending so much money. 

“I think it is necessary for me to tell you about such a large amount because 
the Murray Family has never had such a large sum of expenses before.” 



Linda had just walked to the door when she heard Danny’s voice, which made 
her frown. 

Just now, Danny had been respectful in front of her, but then he had gone to 
snitch on her the next moment. I’ve really underestimated him. 

Jerry returned the bill to Danny. “What do you think about this matter?” 

“Miss Linda had suffered a lot in the past. Perhaps becoming the daughter of 
a wealthy family all of a sudden might have…” Danny politely refrained from 
continuing further. 

Jerry nodded. “You’re right. Linda has suffered a lot since she was a child. 
Now that she has suddenly become the daughter of a wealthy family and 
holds a bank card with an unlimited overdraft, she must have grown a little 
conceited and could not control her spending.” 

Danny smiled a little. “Actually, it’s not a big deal. I’m sure she just needs a 
little financial advice, Mr. Murray.” 

Jerry, however, sighed while shaking his head. “I’m afraid I don’t have the 
time.” 

He looked at Lindsay worriedly; when he was younger, he was busy working 
on his career, so it was Lindsay who raised their children alone. Then, 
because of him, his daughter also left home and died in another place. Now 
that Lindsay was bedridden and paralyzed, he felt guilty and just wanted to 
give all his remaining time to her. 

“Thank you, Danny, for telling me this. Recently, I’ve been preparing my will, 
and originally I wanted to give Linda some shares so that she can live worry-
free for the rest of her life. However, it seems now that this is obviously not 
going to work.” 
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Linda was so angry that she gritted her teeth. Ugh, Danny has gone and 
ruined all my plans! My Murray Group shares! 



She had checked it long ago and realized that even if she were given just a 
small amount, she would have instantly become a rich woman! If she was only 
given some cash or property, the money would eventually run out one day, 
but income from shares was inexhaustible. Yet at this critical moment, Danny 
had complained to Jerry about her. 

Biting her lip, Linda cursed in her heart and left. 

This won’t do. Jerry is old now and coupled with Lindsay’s illness, he must be 
eager to settle his will as soon as possible. So, I must fight for more 
inheritance so that I would have something to rely on for the rest of my life. 

“I suppose it’s better to leave the shares to Jason. That child is more 
levelheaded, and I also believe that he is a caring and upright man. He 
certainly would take care of his cousin’s affairs and provide for her. When the 
time comes, Jason can consider the situation, and maybe when Linda is older 
and more levelheaded, he can give some shares to her. What do you think?” 

Danny nodded profusely. “Mr. Murray, this is a wonderful arrangement, but I 
am worried that Miss Linda will be sad if she knows that you’re not going to 
give her any shares.” 

Instead of agreeing, Jerry shook his head repeatedly. “No, Linda is like my 
daughter. She doesn’t like to fight for anything, so she won’t be angry. She will 
understand my intentions.” 

Danny did not say anything; when he saw Linda’s overbearing look just now, 
she did not seem to fit Jerry’s description at all. However, he thought that he 
had said enough already, so he decided to wait and see. 

The next day, Jerry called Jason to his room and talked to him about the 
matter. Jason remembered the last time Linda tried to get himself to have sex 
with Selena, and his heart began to pound. Why did he suddenly feel that this 
cousin of his was not at all as kind and innocent as she appeared to be? 

“Jason, your aunt and your cousin had suffered a lot in Astoria. In the future, 
when we are gone, you must take good care of her,” Jerry explained. 

“Grandpa, don’t worry. I only have Linda as my cousin, so I will definitely treat 
her well.” 



Jerry nodded. “Alright, I have my trust in you. You’re the only hope of the 
Murray Family, and I’m certainly going to hand Murray Group to you. Initially, I 
wanted to have Linda enter the company to learn something so that she can 
help you. Besides, I wanted to give her some shares, but I’m worried that she 
is too young, and she even got rich overnight, so she might not be able to 
control herself.” 

Without replying, Jason gave a slight nod as a sign of acknowledgement. 

“So, you still have to watch over her. In the future, when you feel that she has 
become more rational and down-to-earth, you can give her some of the 
shares in your hands as a gift.” 

“Okay, Grandpa. I promise you.” Jason thought it was nothing as they were all 
family. 

“Grandpa, last time, there was a problem with the group’s internal system. 
Although it was saved in the end, we lost a lot of money. I want to go to 
Astoria to develop the market there. What do you think?” 

Jerry tugged at his beard, then nodded. “Astoria is where we belong, so if you 
want to go, go. We have been living overseas for so many years. In fact, I 
occasionally wonder whether it’s right to move here. By the way, move your 
aunt’s remains back as well.” 

Moving one’s remains was a big deal, so Jason did not dare to wing it. As 
Lindsay was ill, the matter of moving the remains was put on hold; otherwise, 
this matter should have been done long ago. 

“Okay.” 

… 

In Astoria, Selena woke up at 10.00 AM. Her back was sore, and her legs 
were cramping. In the past, she kept wishing for Pierre to come back, but now 
that he returned, she kept wishing for him to leave instead. This man torments 
me too much! 

The good thing was that she could use Dr. Werner as an excuse now and 
then, or this man would really torment her to death. 
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sore arms while asking, “Where’s Pollux?” 

During this period of time, Pollux was fed and clothed in the Fowler 
Residence, and after he changed into clean and tidy clothes, he looked quite 
handsome and suave without any trace of having been a beggar before. 

“What? Do you miss him when you don’t see him for a day?” Pierre was sitting 
on the sofa playing a mobile game, and the words coming out of his mouth 
were rather unpleasant. 

At this moment, Joaquin was fiddling with his computer. He looked up at 
Selena and replied, “Master has left.” 

“Where did he go?” Selena could not talk to Pierre properly, so she could only 
hope to get information from her son. 

“Didn’t he say he would teach you well during this period? Why did he leave 
just like that?” 

Joaquin subconsciously looked at Pierre, and Selena instantly understood. It 
must be Pierre who had said something. These two people were fighting and 
arguing every day, causing havoc in the house. Selena had never seen Pierre 
so grumpy before, and clearly, Pollux knew Pierre very well and was aware of 
many things about him. 

“What are you looking at me for? Did I tell him to leave? He was the one who 
wanted to go!” Pierre rolled his eyes at Joaquin, then followed up with, “Also, 
you are not allowed to call him as your master any more. It’s his honor to 
teach my son, so he is not qualified to be your master!” 

Selena put out her tongue, then pulled Joaquin to the side. “What the hell is 
going on?” 

“I only heard Daddy mention someone.” 

“Who?” Selena was suddenly very curious. 



“He mentioned someone called Penny. Daddy said if it were not for Master’s 
indecisiveness back then, Penny would not have died. Master looked very 
upset at that time, so he left.” 

Selena could guess that this person Pierre mentioned should be the most 
important person in Pollux’s heart. This person had already died, so when 
Pierre said this, Pollux left in anger. 

“Ah, it’s okay.” 

Joaquin raised his head to look at Selena. “Mommy, do you think Master will 
come back? I still have so many things I haven’t learned yet.” 

Selena stroked Joaquin’s head while saying, “If you’re destined to learn from 
him, you will definitely meet again.” 

Hearing this, Joaquin nodded. 

When Selena sat down next to Pierre, the man spoke furiously without waiting 
for her to speak. “I didn’t do it on purpose! He keeps listening to rumors every 
day, and then he comes up with all sorts of nonsense comments and 
opinions! I couldn’t hold back for a moment, so I said it!” 

Pierre shouted in a righteous manner, as if he was the one who was hurt, and 
Pollux was to blame. 

Shaking her head, Selena knew that Pierre was also aware that he had gone 
overboard. 

“Who is this Penny?” It sounds like a girl’s name. 

“Who else could it be? Pollux’s lover.” Pierre looked frustrated. Ever since he 
got together with Selena, he had changed. Now, he even cared about whether 
he had gone overboard. 

In the past, it was rare for him to consider other people’s feelings. 

“Pollux had a lover?” 

“Of course! So, you should give up on him. He already has someone in his 
heart, and even though that person had died, he would never be interested in 
anyone else!” 



Selena rolled her eyes. What has it got to do with me? Pierre’s ability to 
become jealous is truly increasing day by day. 

“Then tell me, what happened?” 

“Pollux had a young apprentice who was twelve years younger than him. He 
watched her grow up, and then the two grew fond of each other. But Pollux 
felt that he could not be with her. After all, there was such a big age 
difference, and he did not want to mess up her life. But Penny had fallen in 
love with him and would not leave.” 
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and even threatened to break off the master-disciple relationship. In fact, he 
even drove Penny away, and as a result, Penny was kidnapped. Before Pollux 
could think of a way to save her, the kidnappers had killed her by blowing her 
up. Not even her corpse was left, and since this incident, Pollux acted like a 
beggar all day without a will to live.” 

When Selena heard this story, she sighed a few times. “Pollux is such a 
romantic and sentimental man.” 

Pierre gave her a sidelong glance. “Now that you’re done listening to the 
story, it’s time to cook, right?” 

Selena glanced at the time and saw that it was indeed lunchtime. Thus, she 
glared at Pierre before going into the kitchen. 

… 

After Jude officially signed under Stardom Entertainment, she immediately got 
the role of the second female lead in a drama. As Kenneth said before, it was 
not appropriate for her to take on the female lead’s role so quickly after getting 
back into the industry. Besides, Jude had already read the script and found 
that the second female lead was one that would attract the audience’s 
attention with many scenes. 

On the day of the opening ceremony, Jude came to attend the ceremony. Just 
as she was curious about who the female lead of this drama was, she saw 
Mia being escorted by a large group of people! The production team of this 



drama was the very famous Rainbow Studio—a studio that had produced 
many dramas with a good reputation. 

They actually want Mia, an online celebrity, to play the role of the female lead! 
Wouldn’t this hurt their reputation? Jude felt shivers down her spine; it was 
only now that she realized how much they valued the biracial Mia. 

Looking at the way Mia behaved, Jude felt that her acting skills were not much 
better. But this was a good thing for her because she could use this to test 
whether she was Meredith or not. 

“Hello, Mia. My name is Jude Knight, and I’ll be playing the second female 
lead in this drama. I hope that we’ll be able to learn from each other well.” As 
a veteran, Jude was giving a lot of respect to Mia by coming over and greeting 
her first. 

However, Mia simply looked at her in an arrogant manner and said, “Yes, I’ll 
definitely give you some pointers.” 

When these words came out, Jude’s face turned unpleasant. 

I’ve always been the one to give snarky comments and not the other way 
around! 

Smiling awkwardly, Jude stopped talking. She realized that Mia was not a 
simple woman, as the latter dared to disrespect her in such a way. 

Meredith was delighted in her heart. In the past, it had always been Jude who 
gave her snarky comments, and because she herself was carrying the 
persona of a goddess, she had to be humble and kind. This time, she had 
managed to hit back at Jude! 

In the future, she would no longer use the persona of a goddess, as it was too 
suffocating. Right now, it was just perfect; she could talk back if she wanted, 
and people would even like her for being candid. 

After the opening ceremony, Jude went home. This drama was set in modern 
times, so the shooting locations were not in the film studio. Thus, she basically 
could go home every day. 

It just so happened that today was Wyatt’s day off, and he had long prepared 
a delicious meal that was waiting for her. 



While gorging on the food, Jude praised, “It’s so good! Ugh, why are you 
doing this to me? I need to lose weight for the drama, and if I continue to eat 
like this, sooner or later, I will have to quit the entertainment industry! But how 
should I lose weight if I don’t eat enough? Hahaha…” 

“You’re already very thin!” Wyatt put a piece of meat into Jude’s bowl. 

“Oh, by the way, I’ve got the keys to our new home. Jude, I want to renovate it 
as soon as possible, and then we should plan our marriage. What do you 
think?” 

Upon hearing Wyatt mentioning their marriage, Jude paused her chewing. At 
that moment, Satan’s face came to her mind. 

Indeed, she had come back to marry Wyatt and live a good life, but when it 
was actually brought up, she suddenly felt at a loss. 
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Wyatt saw Jude in a daze, he hurriedly asked. Jude shook her head. “Nothing. 
I was just thinking about the script for my drama. What did you say?” 

“I was saying that I’ve gotten the keys to our home, and we can renovate it as 
soon as possible and then settle the issue of our marriage. What do you 
think?” 

Wyatt looked excited. “What do you want the house to look like? We’ll go with 
whatever style you like.” 

“Actually, it would be nice as long as we can live comfortably. Why not get an 
interior design company to come up with a design first?” 

“Okay!” Wyatt agreed and put another piece of meat into Jude’s bowl. 

Lying in bed that night, Jude could not sleep because her mind was full of 
Satan. 

Am I going to live like this forever? 



Suddenly, she kept questioning herself. Isn’t this the life I’ve wanted? This is 
the choice I made! Wyatt is such a good man, and he has done so much for 
me. 

Jude hurriedly banished Satan from her mind, deciding to live a good life with 
Wyatt. Then, with this thought in mind, she drifted off to sleep. 

She told Selena about her drama shoot with Mia, and when Selena heard 
about it, she stared at the phone for a long time without coming back to her 
senses. For some reason, she felt that there was something wrong with Mia. 

All of a sudden, her phone was suddenly taken away, and when she raised 
her head, Pierre’s face came into vision. “Oh! Come on! It’s Jude, not a 
random man!” 

Pierre coldly snorted. “You’ll get it if you dare to talk to a random man!” 
Immediately, he lifted the quilt and got under it, then held Selena in his arms. 
It was really not easy to hold this woman in his arms again; when he was 
away, he could only dream about it, and it was nothing but torture. 

“Jude said that Mia is playing the female lead of that drama she is starring in. 
So, Mia is planning to enter the film and television industry.” 

For some reason, Selena felt wary about that woman who looked like 
Meredith. However, Pierre looked disdainful. “I don’t care who she is. I just 
want to meet her!” 

No matter who this person really was, Pierre definitely had to investigate 
thoroughly, since she made Selena uneasy. 

“How are you going to meet her?” 

“Wait! I think I have a plan!” Pierre looked at Selena with his lips curved. All of 
a sudden, Selena felt that something was wrong and was just about to escape 
when she was pulled back by the man into the quilt. 

Alas… 

For men, absence makes the heart grow fonder… 

The TV series ‘The Woman and Her Crown’ had officially started filming, and 
Jude played the second female lead, Henrietta Sadler, in the series. Henrietta 



was a woman who was not good at expressing her feelings. She was smart 
and kind, but she was too shy to express herself and thus silently stayed by 
the male lead’s side. In the end, she lost her career and her life because of 
him. 

As for the female lead played by Mia, she was a down-and-out woman born 
with a silver spoon. Due to her family filing for bankruptcy, she had to re-plan 
her life. At first, she was enemies with the male lead, but later they developed 
feelings for each other. Finally, she successfully transformed into a crowned 
woman and lived happily ever after with the male lead. 

On the first day of the shoot, Jude finally witnessed Mia’s powerful acting 
skills. She thought that the latter’s level was so high that it was definitely not 
an amateurish level, and not to mention the fact that her memorization skill of 
the lines was on point as well. 

Later, Mia was praised to high heavens by the director, which made Jude 
become suspicious. As Jude had never acted with Meredith in a movie before, 
she did not know Meredith’s quirks and habits when acting; thus, she was 
unable to discern whether Mia was indeed Meredith through her great acting 
alone. 

When the first day of the shoot was over, the director found Jude and said, 
“Jude, let’s have a meal together tonight. This drama has caught a lot of the 
public’s attention, and it also gained a new investor who is so generous that 
they gave us 30 million.” 
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As the director spoke, he gestured excitedly. Jude naturally understood what 
the director meant; he wanted her to go and have a meal with the investor. 

Actually, it was fine for an actress to have dinner with the investor, but Jude 
had never done so before, so she had to politely decline. “Sir, I’m really sorry, 
but I have some things to do tonight. I don’t think I’ll be able to have dinner 
with you guys.” 



The director’s expression immediately changed; he did not expect that the 
now-outdated Jude was still so arrogant. “What are you even big-headed 
about?” The director strode away in annoyance and found Mia, who was still 
removing her makeup. 

“Mia, tonight we’re having dinner with a new investor. Do you want to go?” 
The investor was the pillar of support for the drama, so surely a few of the 
main cast should go. The director didn’t think of Mia at first because he was 
worried that she wasn’t accustomed to local culture because she was biracial. 

“Oh, Sir, I’m the best at such things. Why didn’t you tell me earlier? I’ve just 
removed my makeup, and I have to put it on again!” Mia pouted and stared at 
the director. 

“It’s okay. It’s okay. We can wait for you, so there is no rush.” 

“Alright, Sir. Please give me a few moments because I’m slow when it comes 
to makeup, and there’s no other way about it. After all, I have to look pretty; 
otherwise, what would we do if the investor is not okay with it?” 

The director smiled at her. Mia’s a much more sensible girl! She’s so young, 
yet she already knows the ins and outs of the entertainment industry. 
Excellent! 

When Jude saw Mia pouting and trying to look cute, goosebumps rose all over 
her body. Surely, Meredith can’t act like this, right? 

Although she had not had dinner with Meredith before, she felt that Meredith 
was not the type to accompany directors and investors for dinner. When the 
director saw that Mia had agreed so quickly, he cast a sidelong glance at Jude 
as if he was showing off something. 

Jude didn’t care much; after all, she was no longer popular, so it was common 
to be disgraced. Anyway, the entertainment industry had always been so. 

In the evening, Mia wore a low-cut silver sequined dress, and when she 
walked, the sequins glittered beautifully. Even the director who came with her 
could not help but keep glancing at her. 

In fact, Meredith was looking for such opportunities. She needed more contact 
with rich people, preferably investors and bosses. It did not matter even if she 
had to sleep with them as long as she would be paid. After all, she needed 



money and connections, as that was why she entered the entertainment 
industry. Moreover, she still wanted to be in the limelight like before. 

The director, as well as the two minor actors and staff, walked into the private 
room of the restaurant together. 

When Mia went in, she could not believe her eyes. No way! Pierre Fowler! 
The Pierre Fowler! 

In fact, she had not seen Pierre for a long time. When she was taken away by 
the people sent by John, she had wanted to see Pierre, but unfortunately, he 
did not come to see her. At that time, she was in despair. 

All this while, she had given her all to this man who had never left her mind. 
Furthermore, she had used every imaginable method she could think of just to 
marry him. Otherwise, she wouldn’t have had the idea of bringing Selena’s 
two children to the Fowler Residence. 

At that moment, he looked as if he hadn’t changed at all, still in good spirits. 

Pierre saw Mia instantly because her silver sequined dress was too eye-
catching. He stared at her closely, trying to find something about her, but after 
a long time, he didn’t seem to see anything of value. What was more, Mia’s 
gaze was quite different from Meredith’s. 

The two of them looked at each other for a long time, and then Mia walked 
straight toward Pierre while swaying her hips. As she came up to him, he 
looked at her while sipping on his whiskey as if he could see through her. 

“Hello, who is this dashing gentleman? You’re so handsome! In fact, you’re 
the most handsome man I’ve ever seen in this world!” Mia’s candid praises 
made everyone feel a cold shiver down their spines. 

 


