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Chapter 1181 The promised happiness (3)

pei qiqi stayed in the hospital for a week. when she was free, she would visit old kan and pei huan.

Old kan’s injuries were relatively more serious. The muscle tissues on his back were all bruised. In 
order to support the stones and not crush her, he had to stay for another week.

In the ward, old kan closed his eyes and lay on his stomach. His upper body was bare, and PEI 
Huan was applying medicine for old kan.

pei qiqi looked at the bruises on old kan’s back and felt a little guilty. she took the medicine from 
pei huan’s hands and gently applied it on him.

Old kan didn’t know that PEI Qiqi had come over. He gritted his teeth in pain, ” Huanhuan, be 
gentle!

pei qiqi glanced at pei huan and then gently applied medicine for old kan.

This old kan thought that she was his wife, so he didn’t speak properly in private. He half-closed his 
eyes and seemed a little intoxicated. my wife’s small hands are so powerful. It’s just that it’s 
comfortable to have a walk tomorrow. I’ll let you have a walk too.

before pei huan could act up, pei qiqi pressed down on his back, ” teacher, who are you making 
comfortable? ”

old kan was scared out of his wits.

He turned around and saw PEI Qiqi. He quickly sat up and put on his clothes.

PEI Qiqi saw that old Tan’s chest hair was also sparse and didn’t look like it was in shape. It seemed 
like PEI Huan had pulled it all out.

“qi qi?” “you remember?” old kan asked tentatively.

PEI Qiqi grunted and said with a smile, ” it looks like master is doing well.

Old kan glanced at PEI Huan and scratched his head. not bad!

PEI Huan also glanced at him. The lust in her eyes couldn’t be hidden. PEI Qiqi sighed. Who would 
have thought that PEI Huan and old kan would be so compatible?

At this moment, PEI Huan slowly opened her mouth and stared at old kan. Oh right, su Yue is back.

as she said that, pei qiqi and pei huan looked at old kan, especially pei huan. she said very slowly, ” 
“It’s been a few years, and most people don’t remember what happened in the past. Su Yue probably 
didn’t have a good time overseas, so she came back. When she heard that you were hospitalized, 
she came to visit you. But you weren’t around that day, so the things are here.”

pei huan had some brains now. she didn’t say it before but now that pei qiqi was here, she said it.

She went to get a set of good medicine for external injuries. It was su Yue’s good intention.



Old kan’s eyes were a little straight. He sat down on the bed and laughed dryly. what medicine does 
this hospital not have? huanhuan, you can do whatever you want with her!”

PEI Huan’s gaze was still fixed on old kan. where’s that person? do you want to see him? ” He left 
his number.”

As she spoke, PEI Huan generously passed su Yue’s business card to old kan. She looked as if she 
was very open about it.

Old kan’s heart pounded as he held onto the card. It wasn’t because of su Yue’s name card, but 
because he didn’t know what his Huanhuan was thinking. Would she be angry and run away with 
kanxing?

He was injured now, so he couldn’t chase after her.

“If you want to see her, I won’t stop you!” PEI Huan played with her nails. old 
kan, you gave my son and saved Qiqi. You have done us a favor. You are free to 
leave. We will not stop you.

PEI Qiqi pursed her lips and smiled- 

pei huan’s little mouth was amazing now, she talked like a seeder.

Old kan’s mood was the same. Although he was angry, he still licked his face and looked at his 
wife, trying to please her. why should I go and see her? she’s an old woman. If I want to see her, I 
should at least look at our Huanhuan’s little face.

Chapter 1182 The promised happiness (4)

“Don’t make me happy! i can’t compare to su yue, i look like a little girl now.” PEI 
Huan was speaking the truth. Su Yue seemed to have gotten an injection and 
was at least ten years younger.

However, that face looked awkward no matter how she looked at it.

the old man chuckled. ” no matter how young you are, you won’t look as good as our huanhuan 
even if you’re naked! ”

PEI Qiqi couldn’t stop laughing. PEI Huan glared at old kan-

this old fogey!

that night, pei huan fell asleep. old kan leaned against the bed and wanted to smoke.

He didn’t touch the cigarette box, but su Yue’s name card.

his expression was a little complicated. he held it in his hand and looked at it for a while, then his 
brows slowly relaxed.

the past seemed to relax in this subtle expression, as if a heavy burden had been lifted.

perhaps all these years, he still felt guilty towards su yue. but after this incident, he was finally 
certain that xuxu was right.

It’s all in the past!



old kan threw the business card into the trash can and slid down to hug pei huan. he kissed her hair 
and said with a smile, ” you’re pretending to be asleep, right? ”

pei huan acknowledged nonchalantly.

Old kan laughed. I’m not seeing you anymore, Huanhuan. I won’t see you anymore in the future.

His voice was particularly low in the middle of the night.”it’s me who doesn’t want to see you 
again. it’s boring.”

PEI Huan turned around and hugged him, burying her face in his arms.

His arms were warm, and after a while, PEI Huan asked, ” “Old kan, I’m up there?”

old kan’s breath was burning, and his eyes seemed to be spurting fire as he looked at her. it was so 
dark that it seemed like a hidden flame. his voice was hoarse.”Really?”

PEI Huan was the type who could move and definitely wouldn’t talk nonsense. She grabbed his fur 
on his chest and pulled it down. later, be good and lie down.

She patted old kan’s face with her hand. otherwise, it will hurt.

Lao kan was so excited that he immediately sat up straight and rubbed his hands. honey, hurry up.

Su Yue had probably turned into bubbles by now. Old kan only had his Little Vixen in his eyes.

The next morning, the cleaner came to check on the room and took away the three condoms that old 
kan and PEI Huan had used that night. There was also su Yue’s business card in a wastebasket.

The cleaners whispered to each other. The man in the VIP Ward was amazing. He went to work 
three times a night with his injuries!

Old kan became famous in Sheng Yuan hospital, and PEI Huan was also accused of having a strong 
sexual desire.

after that, su yue came to the hospital again. pei huan was very generous and let them meet. she 
even went out. anyway, old kan loved her in his heart. no matter how capable su yue was, she 
couldn’t do anything.

after su yue left, pei huan returned to the ward. when the two women passed each other, their gazes 
were unfriendly.

Su Yue couldn’t accept it because she had missed out on a good man, a good man who had once 
loved her deeply, and PEI Huan had gotten all of old kan’s thoughts.

When she was talking to old kan just now, old kan’s eyes were always looking outside the ward. Su 
Yue was an intelligent person, how could she not see through old kan’s thoughts?

su yue finally gave up and went overseas. she never returned to B city again.

PEI Huan told PEI Qiqi that the Eight-Nation Alliance had finally retreated.

pei qiqi couldn’t stop laughing. however, she still had to be discharged. there was nothing wrong 
with her body, so it wasn’t good for her to stay in the hospital. besides, she also missed little xin xin. 

Tang Yu picked up PEI Qiqi and returned to the Rose Garden.



old zhao was driving the car. pei qiqi and tang yu sat in the back seat. she lay on his lap like a docile 
kitten.

Chapter 1183 The promised happiness (5)

She was willing to put on an act, and he was willing to cooperate. He reached out and stroked her 
long hair, his voice a little hoarse.”Little Xin Xin might be more enthusiastic later.”

She buried herself in his arms and laughed, calling him brother.

This little fool, she’s so good at pretending!

When he was her older brother, she hated him so much. How could she be so obedient now?

Tang Yu patted the little guy in his arms and smiled.

when she arrived at the rose garden, she got out of the car and a fat little thing was wrapped around 
her leg. 

PEI Qiqi was very careful. Her heart was filled with different emotions.

She forgot about it before. She only knew that little Xinxin was her child. But now, things were 
different. She remembered how hard it was for her to get this child. She remembered how hard it 
was for her to make this decision on the day she married Tang Yu.

it didn’t hurt at first, but the moment she saw little xinxin, all her emotions crumbled.

she was very careful, feeling as if she had regained what she had lost.

tang yu reached out and pinched her little face. he carried the two upstairs and carried them straight 
to the bed.

as soon as little xinxin got on the bed, she rolled around happily.

Tang Yu placed his hands on both sides of PEI Qiqi’s body and pressed his face against hers. His 
voice was a little hoarse, ” “qi qi, do you still want to keep pretending?”

He kissed her every time he said a word. PEI Qiqi bit her lip as he pressed on. In the end, she lay 
down on the bed. He hovered above her and kissed her with restraint, ” we’ll continue tonight, 
Yueyue.

pei qiqi’s little hands wrapped around his neck and she placed her face on his neck, ” tang yu, you 
noticed? ”

“such bad acting!” he rapped her on the head.

PEI Qiqi laughed gloomily and hugged him. She pressed her face against his body and took in the 
nice smell of his body.

After a while, she said softly, ” Tang Yu, I’m back.

his heart skipped a beat. even though little xinxin was still around, he couldn’t help but lower his 
head to look for her small lips and kiss her deeply. their lips and teeth intertwined, and there was an 
endless lingering feeling.

Xiao Xinxin kneeled at the side and stared blankly at her Daddy and Mommy kissing.



Daddi looked like he was daddling and eating Mama!

Eat?

Little Xin suddenly burst into tears. So this was what it felt like to eat it!

she didn’t want to be eaten by that little brother. be careful, don’t exchange saliva like this ...

It was so dirty!

little xin’s crying couldn’t stop her parents. tang yu covered pei qiqi’s ear with his hand and kissed 
her on the lips. he chuckled, ” she’s too noisy. ”

she lifted her small face to receive his kiss. ” then, wait until tonight? ”

tang yu let go of her mouth with difficulty. his eyes were burning, ” five times? ”

pei qiqi bit her lip, ” six times! ”

Tang Yu’s dark eyes were clear and bright. He pinched her little face, ” deal.

At noon, Lin Yun, Zhao Yi, and little Zhao Yan came over for lunch. Tang Zhiyuan was also there.

pei qiqi successfully got drunk and only woke up at night.

She opened her eyes and saw that the light around her was yellow. She turned around and saw that 
she was wearing a white evening dress. The white bed sheet was covered with a layer of rose petals.

“You’re awake?” an elegant male voice sounded in her ears. it was very 
pleasant to hear.

she raised her head and looked at tang yu.

just like the first time she saw him, he was dressed in a formal three-piece outfit. he leaned over 
slightly and kissed her on the forehead. ” miss pei, can i have a dance with you? ”

pei qiqi smiled, ” what’s your name? ”

“Tang Yu.” he held her hand and pulled her up, pressing his body against hers. ” 
“Now, focus.”

her little hands wrapped around his neck and her voice was soft, ” tang yu, i don’t want to dance 
right now. i want to make love with you! 

Chapter 1184 The promised happiness (6)

He chuckled and hugged her, their foreheads touching. Let’s Dance first.

the lights flickered, and the night wind outside the window blew up the white curtains, piling up 
layers of waves.

he held her in his arms as they danced in the large space. she stepped on the back of his foot with 
her bare feet, her small face on his shoulder, and her arms softly wrapped around his neck.

occasionally, he would kiss her lightly and kiss her little mouth lightly. after a few times, she would 
be out of breath and look up at him. her eyes were full of dependence and love ...



it was very intoxicating.

She didn’t know when she fell into the sofa, but her body gently bumped into it, and he knelt on one 
knee on the sofa and kissed her.

she raised her head and helplessly accepted his kiss. her little hand gently rubbed the back of his 
neck. this was a habit of pei qiqi’s in the past. after she lost her memory, she didn’t do this.

tang yu’s heart softened and his body was burning with beastly blood. however, he still restrained 
himself from kissing her lightly even though his body was already in pain.

he still insisted on taking it slowly.

PEI Qiqi bit his lips and her long eyelashes trembled. She was extremely shy, ” Tang Yu, what are 
you waiting for? ”

He raised his eyebrows and looked down at the little person in his arms. After a long time, he 
smiled gently.

He raised his hand to look at the time and said in a hoarse voice, ” “It’s 12 o ‘clock now. If we do it 
six times, it’ll be around 7 o’ clock tomorrow morning, Yingluo.”

he kissed her as he spoke, his voice warm. ” “mrs. tang, are you sure you can handle it?”

her little hand moved back and pulled gently. then, her body moved slightly.

Tang Yu’s breathing suddenly heated up. He squinted at the beautiful scene in front of him. Even 
though they had done it countless times, she rarely took the initiative like this. Not to mention, after 
she lost her memory, they did it together. She was like a little wood. Although it was interesting, 
there was always something missing.

at this moment, tang yu realized that it was because he lacked the combination of the soul and the 
body.

He reached out his hand and caressed her red lips. Qiqi, it might be very painful next. Aren’t you 
afraid? ” hmm?”

she lowered her eyes and her long eyelashes trembled slightly. there seemed to be a flash of light in 
her eyes.

tang yu blocked her eyes and kissed her hard. he pulled her out of the dress and pressed her tightly 
against his body.

She was so tender that even his expensive clothes seemed rough, especially the contrast between 
black and white, which was so dazzling.

tang yu’s face was close to her little face. his voice was low and hoarse, ” qiqi, i might be a little 
rough. if it hurts, call me yingluo. ”

she bit her lip. she would not scream! 

Her small hands wrapped around his shoulder shamelessly, and she said in a small voice, ” be 
gentle.



He was torturing her very lightly and evilly, and she was almost driven crazy by his non-stop 
torture.

in the end, she softened her voice and begged him to be more rough.

he didn’t let her go that night.

to tang yu and pei qiqi, this time, it wasn’t just ten days. it was two and a half years.

How long she had lost her memory and how long he had waited for her, this moment was as 
beautiful and touching as it was.

Just as old kan said, absence makes the heart grow fonder, and that feeling will go to the heavens. 
Moreover, their hearts had been separated for so long.

She wanted to end it and even climbed into his arms to please him, but he still didn’t let her go after 
enjoying it.

After one night, PEI Qiqi’s body was covered in hickeys.

Chapter 1185 The promised happiness (7)

Early in the morning, the morning light shone through the glass and the person on the bed was 
sleeping soundly.

tang mo was lying flat with the quilt covering his waist.

pei qiqi’s little face was resting on his waist and her little hands were hugging his waist. her long 
hair was scattered all over the place and her long hair was entangled.

A small hand grabbed the door and sneaked into the master bedroom. When she saw the clothes on 
the floor, she gasped.

oh my god! daddy and mommy are fighting with demons again!

Little Xin stood there and immediately closed her eyes!

It was tightly shut.

The little person felt as if the whole world was spinning, and his chubby little hand held his head!

oh my god, she was going to faint!

he had to stay calm!

daddi must not have eaten mama. even if he did, he should have vomited it out by now!

little xin opened her eyes and looked in the direction of her parents.

mama was still there, but she couldn’t see what was below her waist. could she have been eaten by 
daddi?

little xin tiptoed over, half-closed her eyes, and suddenly lifted the quilt.

After that, her eyes widened in shock. She couldn’t believe what she had seen. 

how could it be like this?



It wasn’t Daddi who ate mommy, it was Daddi.

Tang mo woke up, looked down, and quickly covered himself with the quilt again. His voice was a 
little angry.”tang xue ‘er!”

as a father, he would only call her by her full name when he was the most, most, most angry.

Xiao Xinxin’s eyes were filled with tears and she looked at her father in horror.

After a long time, little Xinxin finally said, ” “daddi was eaten.”

in the future, if that little brother showed an expression that he wanted to eat her, she could also eat 
him!

Awoo!

little xinxin felt that she was very smart.

However, Papa looked like he was going to eat someone now. Little Xin Xin immediately ran to the 
door, her little white lace dress flying up.

tang yu laid back down heavily and reached out to touch pei qiqi who was in his arms. he smiled 
helplessly, ” what should i do? you’re so young and you’re already seeing this.”

As he said that, he even slid his finger over to PEI Qiqi.

PEI Qiqi had just woken up. Now that she was buried in his arms, she felt too ashamed to face 
anyone.

Tang Yu chuckled and whispered into her ear, ” she thought you ate me.

her small face was buried in his arms, and her small hand was on his waist. her voice was delicate 
as she said, ” you’re not allowed to say anymore, you’re not allowed to say anymore. ”

Tang Yu chuckled in a deep voice. They were still together and now that she was making a scene, it 
made PEI Qiqi even more angry. She stopped after a while and stared at him in disbelief.

didn’t yueyue get a vasectomy?

why did its functions become more powerful than before?

her eyes were watery as she looked at him softly.

tang yu chuckled and reached out to pull her into his arms. he gave her a light kiss, ” i’ll go for a 
recovery one day? ” hmm?”

She was still silly.

he paused for a moment before speaking. ” in the past, it was just in case we were plotted against. if 
that happened, qiqi, we might not be together again. now, we don’t need it anymore. if you don’t 
like me using protection, i don’t have to recover. ”

pei qiqi lay in his arms and said softly, ” but ten years will affect your fertility. ”

“qiqi, are you ready to give birth?” He patted her little head with a face full of 
love.



In fact, the doctor had told him in the past two days that there was basically no problem with her 
body. If she wanted to give birth, it was not impossible.

However, Tang Yu still had to see what she wanted. If Qiqi didn’t want to have children, he 
wouldn’t force her.

Chapter 1186 The promised happiness (8)

when he said that, pei qiqi hugged his waist, ” tang yu, do you still want another child? ”

his voice was a little low. ” someone has to inherit boyi and jin taihe. qiqi, do you think little xin can 
do it? ”

PEI Qiqi lay in his arms and said in a low voice, ” ” tang yu, do you think it’s especially hard? ”

“it’s alright!” His voice was gentle, and there was a subtle chuckle. no matter 
how much work I have, it won’t be as hard as last night.

He was hinting at something. PEI Qiqi blushed and punched his shoulder. She stared at him blankly.

Tang Yu chuckled and then chuckled, ” Qiqi, let’s just go with the flow for the child!

dr. mei had also said that she might not be able to get pregnant at will with her body. now that she 
did not object, he decided to go for a recovery and leave the rest to fate. 

PEI Qiqi grunted and placed her face in his arms. Her small hands secretly wrapped around his 
waist.

it was not bad to raise a child who was like little xinxin from a young age.

one had to admit that pei qiqi was quite useless. she never thought of giving birth to a smart and 
brilliant boy like tang yu, qianqian.

Because she didn’t know how to teach A Boy Like That!

Tang Yu looked at her troubled expression and laughed, ” “alright, time to get up. otherwise, 
yingluo, you probably won’t be able to get up.”

PEI Qiqi bit her lips and stared at him. How was she supposed to get out of bed when he was like 
this?

tang yu pulled her into his arms and kissed her. his voice was a little muffled, ” then let’s do it 
again. ”

By the time they woke up, it was already 2 pm. When Tang Yu brought PEI Qiqi downstairs, Lin 
Yun gave him a look of disapproval.

he was too indulgent!

How could PEI Qiqi’s small body take it?

however, lin yun couldn’t really say it out loud. after all, it was between the two of them. after 
dinner, tang yu said to pei qiqi in a low voice, ” “shall we go visit uncle shen later? Hmm?”

PEI Qiqi nodded and looked at Tang Yu, ” “Do dad and aunt Shen live in the elegant building?”



tang yu’s expression was a little hard to read. lin yun was the same. it was indescribably 
complicated.

However, both mother and son were profound. Naturally, PEI Qiqi wouldn’t be able to see through 
anything.

lin yun only sighed in her heart. qiqi would still be sad.

Things had remained the same for more than two years, but people had changed!

at 4 pm, tang yu drove pei qiqi out. she sat in the front passenger seat and looked happy, ” my dad 
knows i’m back, right? ”

As she said this, she lowered her head and said a little girly, ” he didn’t even come to see me! you 
definitely don’t know that i’ve recovered my memories.”

Then, she smiled and grabbed Tang Yu’s arm, ” let’s go buy my dad’s favorite tea, okay? He would 
definitely be very happy to see her. But you can’t make me drink anymore, Yingluo!”

Every time, Tang Yu would make her drunk on purpose and then take advantage of her. She knew 
all his tricks.

tang mo glanced at her and said in a heavy voice,”Alright,” he said.

He still went to a famous teahouse and picked out a box of good red robes. When he put it in the 
trunk, he looked at her and suddenly said, ” “Uncle Shen is not living in the elegant building now.”

PEI Qiqi was stunned for a moment. Then, she forced a smile, ” where does he live? ”

did he go abroad?

however, she felt a little uneasy, as if the real situation was worse than she thought.

she got into the car again and did not ask any more questions. instead, she looked in the direction of 
the road sign.

They counted the stones one by one, and finally, the car arrived at a private nursing home.

Chapter 1187 The promised happiness (9)

PEI Qiqi sat in the car and didn’t get out. She looked at Tang Yao and her chest heaved up and 
down, ” Tang Yu, what’s wrong with him? ”

his nerves were severely damaged. Not long after the accident, he slowly slipped away, ” Tang Yu 
said the cruel words, ” “alzheimer’s disease,”

PEI Qiqi’s eyes dimmed. She stared into his eyes, not daring to believe what he said.

tang yu lowered his voice, ” qiqi, i’m sorry. ” When you weren’t around, I didn’t take good care of 
them.

pei qiqi looked at him and said softly after a long time, ” “Bring me there.”

tang yu got out of the car and took out da hong pao from the trunk. he held pei qiqi’s hand with one 
hand and went upstairs with the other.



as he walked, he said, ” aunt shen’s health isn’t very good, especially her eyes. she can’t take care of 
uncle shen alone, so i arranged for two nurses to take care of them. ran ran is doing pretty well now. 
”

PEI Qiqi knew that when Tang Yu said ‘good’, he meant’ good ‘in Shen Zhongshan’s world.

She felt a little sad. She reached out and hugged his arm, ” Tang Yu, I still have to thank you. she 
knew that he must have put in a lot of thought.

Tang Yu just patted her hand and didn’t say anything.

When she saw Shen Zhongshan, PEI Qiqi’s eyes welled up. Although she had already imagined 
what would happen, she still felt sad.

Shen Chongshan sat there, looking into the distance without saying a word.

PEI Qiqi stood behind him for a long time, but he didn’t turn around.

she really wished that she could hear him call her ‘little sister’. that way, she would feel better.

the nurse’s voice was a little soft. ” mr. shen doesn’t talk much after he fell sick. other than eating 
and sleeping every day, he’s been drawing. ”

PEI Qiqi half-knelt in front of Shen Zhongshan and placed her hand on the back of his hand. Her 
voice trembled, ” “Dad, I’m back.”

The warmth on the back of his hand made Shen Chongshan slowly turn his head. He looked at PEI 
Qiqi and his lips moved but he didn’t say a word.

after a long while, shen chongshan suddenly opened his mouth and shouted with difficulty, ” 
“painting, painting.”

the young nurse quickly took the drawing he usually drew and flipped it open for him to see while 
she patiently coaxed him.”Look, the painting is here!”

Shen Zhongshan’s hands were caressing the paintings. His movements were a little stiff as if he was 
caressing some treasure. After a long time, he looked up and saw PEI Qiqi lifting her fingers up 
with difficulty.

pei qiqi placed her face on his knees and let his fingers touch her face.

Shen Chongshan’s fingers moved little by little on her small face, and then he looked very anxious, 
as if he was looking for some darling.

PEI Qiqi’s lips trembled, ” dad.

Shen Zhongshan’s body trembled. Then, he shook his head as if he was thinking about something. 
He shook his head again and finally let go of his hand. He looked at PEI Qiqi in a daze.

“I’m Qi Qi!” Her fingers caressed the pages of the painting. Every page was a 
mess, but she could see that every page was of herself. 

even so, shen chongshan still missed him.



perhaps it was because of her disappearance that his condition worsened and became like this in 
advance.

she grabbed his hand and let his palm rest on her small face.

tears suddenly welled up in shen chongshan’s eyes as he spat out a word with difficulty, ” 
“Wailing.”

after a while, she said softly,”if you don’t cry, cry, cry.”

there was a strange glint in his eyes, as if he had found the treasure he had been looking for.

Chapter 1188 the promised happiness (10)

PEI Qiqi reached out and hugged him. She wanted to cry, but she was afraid that he would be sad.

she hoped that he would be happy and forget everything!

Shen Chongshan’s movements were very slow. He looked down at the little girl on his knees, and 
there was a little gentleness in his usually dull eyes.

Perhaps it was because he knew that she was the one he had been waiting for.

Shen Chongshan’s fingers patted her back stiffly. His voice was very soft, so soft that it was almost 
inaudible. 

However, PEI Qiqi could still tell that he was telling her not to cry. He was coaxing her and telling 
her to be good, Yueyue.

she closed her eyes, but her tears did not stop flowing.

She had hoped that Shen Chongshan’s condition would improve after seeing her, but the doctor told 
her that it was impossible, because this was the best ending for Shen Chongshan.

pei qiqi was disappointed.

she was back, but he couldn’t understand why qianqian called him ‘dad’ again.

After that, she met Mrs. Shen again.

mrs. shen’s vision was so bad that she could barely see anything. she could only tell from the 
sounds outside that someone had come in.

“it’s mr. tang and mrs. tang,” the nurse said softly.

Mrs. Shen looked up and was stunned for a moment. She mumbled,”Which Mr. And Mrs. Tang?”

tang yu knelt in front of her and said in a low voice, ” aunty shen, it’s me! ” tang yu! qi qi is back, i 
brought her to see you.”

Mrs. Shen’s entire body trembled. Her eyes were unfocused as she looked at Tang Yu. Then, she 
looked over at PEI Qiqi. She couldn’t see the person clearly. All she could see was a black shadow.

“is it qi qi?” mrs. shen began to cry. she cried so sadly.

ever since her eyes were damaged, she had not cried like this.



Tang Yu said, ” now that PEI Qiqi is back, will her daughter Shen Lian’s sins be reduced a little? ”

PEI Qiqi held her trembling hand and said softly, ” it’s me!

mrs. shen held her hand in return.

in the past few years, mrs. shen had become thinner and thinner. her fingers were so thin that they 
were almost like a layer of skin. when she held pei qiqi, she squeezed her hand so hard that it hurt.

However, PEI Qiqi only felt pity for her. She used to be so full, but now, she became like this.

she could not say that it was all shen lian’s fault. back then, if it was not for zhao ke, there might not 
be today.

mrs. shen was very strong. she held pei qiqi’s hand tightly and looked at pei qiqi’s face without any 
focus. her voice was dry, ” qiqi, i beg you to talk to tang yu. let shen lian go, okay? ”

PEI Qiqi was stunned.

She slowly turned her head to look at Tang Yu, but she didn’t say anything.

The expression on Tang Mo’s face was a bit complicated. After a long time, he whispered,”alright,” 
he said.

PEI Qiqi’s expression was even more shocked. She looked at Tang Yu with a doubtful expression.

mrs. shen burst into tears.

After they left, PEI Qiqi sat in the car and asked softly, ” “Shen Lian, where are you?”

tang yu’s fingers were on the steering wheel. after a long silence, he turned his head and looked at 
pei qiqi, ” she’s crazy. ”

She continued to look at him and did not say anything for a long time.

tang yu said slowly, ” auntie shen is like this because of shen lian. but i won’t be soft-hearted. ”

“Where is she?” pei qiqi asked with much difficulty.

Tang Yu took out a cigarette from the dashboard and lit it. After a long time, he said softly, ” she’s in 
this nursing home, but she can never leave that room.

pei qiqi finally knew why mrs. shen begged tang yan to let shen lian go. it was because mrs. shen 
knew where shen lian was.

Chapter 1189 the promised happiness (part eleven)

tang yu didn’t let them meet because if they did, mrs. shen might soften her heart and let shen lian 
go!

“i’m not cruel!” tang yu rolled down the window to stop her from smoking 
second-hand smoke.

he exhaled a long puff of smoke and said slowly, ” uncle Shen’s previous plan was to bring Shen 
Lian overseas to settle down. Now, I want them to be together. It can be considered as fulfilling 
your wish.



“there’s another option. shen lian can go to jail. however, in that dark place, shen 
lian would have died long ago.” tang yan paused. ” qiqi, don’t beg me. if it wasn’t 
for uncle shen, i would have killed her. ”

To Tang Yu, that day was a nightmare that would last forever.

qi qi turned around and looked at his eyes, which broke his heart.

PEI Qiqi’s heart was wet. She looked at Tang Yu but didn’t say anything.

she was not a soft-hearted saint. that day was also a nightmare for her.

When Shen Lian’s knife was placed on Xiao Xinxin’s neck, she felt that she could die at any time 
because of her heartbeat.

Tang Yu finished his last cigarette and leaned his head on the back of his chair. He smiled bitterly, ” 
Qiqi, do you know why you were able to survive? your nerves weren’t damaged like uncle Shen 
and Shen Lian? ”

pei qiqi looked at him.

“Because when you fell into the sea and were fished out, your stomach was so 
big that it was equivalent to a gastric lavage.” he patted her. ” a blessing in 
disguise. ”

Oh, ” PEI Qiqi replied, looking a little silly.

” qiqi, i won’t let you leave me again. ” he ruffled her hair. ” go to my company to 
work! ”

She looked at him, her face full of surprise and confusion.

” i’ve asked xiao ran to add a small desk in the office. you’ll be my hanhan from 
now on, ” he said. ” personal assistant. ”

her voice was soft. ” what about meng qingcheng? ”

Tang Yu smiled faintly, ” Qingcheng might be very busy these days.

She looked at him.

Tang Yu threw the cigarette butt away and patted her hand, ” “i think he might propose to xiao ran 
soon!”

propose?

PEI Qiqi’s eyes widened,”but they don’t seem to be together!” 

“When I was in Zengcheng, I saw them sleeping in the same Ward,” he held her 
little hand and laughed at her foolishness.



xiao ran had sprained his ankle in zengcheng. after staying there for two days, he accidentally found 
out that they were living together.

qingcheng had probably thought things through, but he was not sure if xiao ran had forgiven him.

PEI Qiqi still looked at him pitifully. After a while, she asked, ” “maybe they didn’t share the same 
bed? It’s normal for colleagues to take care of you.”

tang yu looked at her. his eyes were burning. pei qiqi thought about what he did to her at the 
hospital and shut up!

He started the car. PEI Qiqi looked at the green bricks and white tiles and said softly, ” Tang Yu, we 
will come here often in the future, right? ”

he hummed in acknowledgment and slowly drove away.

PEI Qiqi didn’t request to see Shen Lian, so he didn’t let Mrs. Shen see Yueyue.

in fact, shen lian had committed suicide a year ago! 

however, he didn’t say it. perhaps it would be better if this matter remained a secret forever.

At least, Mrs. Shen would always have hope and would not commit suicide.

and qi qi would not feel guilty.

Tang Yu knew that when necessary, his heart would be colder than anyone else’s.

And his Qiqi was in charge of happiness.

PEI Qiqi looked back one last time and was a little reluctant to leave.

After she returned home, she was still unhappy. Tang Yu accompanied her for a few more days and 
then took her to work. Of course, he took her along carefully.

Chapter 1190 The promised happiness (Part Twelve)

that morning, in front of the boyi building, a black rv slowly stopped in front of the building.

as usual, the single female employees of the company had to show off in front of tang yu, either 
intentionally or unintentionally. after all, the president was single!

However, today was different. The president pulled PEI Qiqi out of the car. PEI Qiqi was wearing a 
white t-shirt and Black Cropped Pants. Her long hair was tied up in a bun. She didn’t look like she 
was 25 or 26 years old.

she got out of the car and said something with a frown. their wise and mighty ceo smiled lovingly 
and bent down to carry little xinxin out. little xinxin was wearing a floral dress today and looked 
especially cute.

tang yu held his young wife’s hand in one hand and little xin’s heart in the other. that scene was 
super pink.

Bo Yi’s unmarried women all covered their faces, extremely envious.

PEI Qiqi carried her little bag and followed behind Tang Yu like a little girl.



don’t you think that boss pei didn’t change at all when he was working at sheng yuan? ” An 
employee was whispering.

the other one looked at the family of three leaving and laughed. ” boss pei has president wanwan’s 
special skincare routine. do you? ”

just by looking at the president’s two-meter-long legs, she could be five years younger!

A bunch of people joked around and didn’t dare to say anything more. After all, he was the 
president. It was enough to stop at a certain point. Who dared to say more?

on the other side, pei qiqi followed tang yu to his private elevator. she looked at him, ” actually, it’s 
fine if little xin and i stay at home. ”

she quite liked the life of a rice weeper now, and she really felt that he was a little too careful now. 
she had an accident on the mountain, but it didn’t mean that she had to follow him every day like 
his companion. he wasn’t afraid of being laughed at, but she felt tired.

however, pei qiqi was still too innocent. of course, tang yu had the ability to protect her. the reason 
he did this was because he wanted to make it more interesting.

Tang Yu lowered his head and looked at her. After a while, he chuckled, ” “Let’s follow them for 
now!”

PEI Qiqi pouted. I’m telling you. I don’t want to be a Secretary.

“Then what do you want to do?” Tang Yu chuckled.

pei qiqi snorted,”it’s not love.” 

Tang Yu looked at his little heart and then at PEI Qiqi. He helplessly held his forehead-

His Qi Qi was really getting more and more daring.

however, tang yu didn’t correct her in front of little xin xin. instead, he planned to educate pei xiao 
qi when he got home tonight.

the elevator door opened, and xiao ran was standing outside.

“President, Qiqi,” Xiao ran said with a smile.

PEI Qiqi greeted Xiao ran with a smile. Then, she clenched her fists and hit Tang Yu’s back. Her 
voice was soft and she gritted her teeth, ” you said Xiao ran took leave.

“i said it’s possible.” tang mo held her little hand and didn’t let her behave 
atrociously. then, he used his eyes to signal xiao ran to take xin xin away.

Xiao ran took little Xin away with a smile. Little Xin cried out in dissatisfaction, but she was still 
deceived by the delicious food.

the door to the president’s office closed. pei qi leaned against the door and said like a rascal, ” tang 
yu, you said that meng qingcheng wanted to propose to xiao ran. you said that their marriage was 
fake. ”



now, xiao ran was working here!

tang yu walked over to the sofa and casually threw his briefcase there. then, he slowly walked back 
and placed his hands on both sides of her body. one of his long legs was stuck in the middle of her 
body, firmly holding her in place.
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