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Chapter 2341: You’re still hugging me, you’re disgusting (3)

then, she raised her hand and slapped him across the face. her little face was cold.”Get lost,” he 
said.

Zhou chongguang’s handsome face was also stunned. He did not expect her to still have the strength 
to hit him at this time. However, he was not angry.

after qin mu was done, he laid back down. he was so angry that he didn’t want to look at him, so he 
simply shifted his back.

Zhou chongguang hugged her waist from behind, his voice a little low. are you still angry? ”

Qin Mu didn’t open his mouth and only said faintly, ” “Zhou chongguang, I’m tired.”

as she said this, she burst into tears.

she thought that she didn’t care about those women anymore. she didn’t care about xue lin and gu 
mei’s existence. but now, she was still a little disheartened.

The better he treated her, the more she cared.

she didn’t want to tell him about this feeling. it was too embarrassing.

and he was too despicable.

zhou chongguang was initially a little angry as well. he lay flat and felt that it was useless to coax a 
woman like this.

He was also thinking a little too much, thinking that maybe Qin Mu and Wanwan would really like 
someone like Zhao Yan. After all, Zhao Yan was very much like the Zhou chongguang of the past, 
young and beautiful.



The more Zhou chongguang thought about it, the angrier and more worried he felt. He reached out 
and brought Qin Mu over. He had wanted to force her to answer, but he was stunned when he saw 
her little face.

Qin Mu was crying very hard. Although he didn’t make a sound, his little face was covered in tears.

after zhou chongguang was stunned for a moment, he reached out to wipe the tears from the corners 
of her eyes. he rubbed them bit by bit, and she immediately started crying again. as he rubbed them, 
his heart ached.

“mumu.” he said in a low voice, ” mumu, don’t cry anymore. it’s my fault. i shouldn’t have treated 
you like that.”

Tonight, he had done it really hard in the bathroom. He didn’t even change his position and just did 
it like that.

as time passed, she would naturally feel pain.

qin mu’s little face drooped down. he refused to speak and only trembled his delicate body.

the bathrobe slipped down, and the wound on her shoulder was a ghastly sight.

Zhou chongguang sighed slightly and kissed her eyelids again and again. Mumu, it’s okay. I was 
wrong. I’ll apologize, okay? ”

qin mu continued smoking and ignored him. after a long time, she slowly opened her eyes and 
looked at him.”you raped her before marriage!”

zhou chongguang let out a low sigh. ” yes, i’m a bastard. don’t cry, okay? ”

but the more he coaxed her, the more she cried.

He gently took off his bathrobe and looked at the scars. He felt so guilty.



he kissed her bit by bit, to those scars, to soothe her pain. she had been trembling, resisting his 
existence.

In the end, he did it with her gently once. He was very, very gentle, and it was something he had 
never done before.

baby, don’t cry anymore, Yingluo. this was the first time he coaxed her like this. He kissed her and 
wanted her at the same time. He didn’t know how to treat her.

qin mu was still crying hard, but no matter how much she cried, he didn’t let her go. he was 
determined.

in the end, she turned her small face to the side and her slender fingers clutched the bed sheet 
tightly.

Zhou chongguang kissed her, kissing her long eyelashes, kissing her small red lips, and kept calling 
her baby Yingluo.

Even though it was so gentle, it was a feeling that she had never felt before.

“hug me, mumu.” he coaxed her in a hoarse voice.

Qin Mu bit his lip, unwilling to get close to her. He simply grabbed her small hand and wrapped it 
around his neck.

he hugged her so hard and kissed her. it was the first time he said these words clearly in such a hot 
and clear state, ” “I love you.”

Chapter 2342: mrs. zhou, i’m trying to please you (1)

Qin MU’s tears fell like rain.



this bad guy, he clearly knew that she hated him and hated him, but he still said those three words.

These three words, however, seemed to have injected new life into their dried up marriage.

Qin Mu bit his shoulder, and his fingernails dug deep into his shoulder, leaving a few long bloody 
marks.

looking at the wound, qin mu was stunned. then, as if he was addicted to scratching, he grabbed his 
body until it was beyond recognition. zhou chongguang let her do as she pleased. not only did he 
not lose his temper, he became even more excited.

He did not rest for the entire night and only let her off at dawn. When he let her go, Zhou 
chongguang felt that Qin Mu was on the verge of death.

only then did he realize that he had gone a little too far. he whispered into her ear, ” ” mumu, i’ll go 
downstairs and get you something to eat. you can sleep after eating, okay? ”

Qin Mu laid on the pillow and didn’t make a sound. His brown curly hair was spread on the pillow, 
and the blanket was covering his shoulders. He looked so beautiful that he was alive and fragrant. 
Zhou chongguang took a deep breath and admitted to himself that she actually had a lot of capital.

There was a reason for those men to hang around her.

he had to convince himself that she was zhou chongguang’s wife now.

He should be grateful that she was born into the Qin family and had a strong spirit of contract. 
Otherwise, a contract would not be able to bind her.

He kissed her back, removed the blanket, got up, put on a pair of long pants and a shirt, and opened 
the door to go downstairs.

although it was only dawn, the servants in the villa were already up. it was probably because of the 
movements all night that everyone was worried about and couldn’t sleep.



seeing zhou chongguang come down, the manager went up and smiled, ” “mr. zhou, you’re up?”

However, his heart was as clear as a mirror. He hadn’t slept since he started playing!

thinking about it, it was really rare that mr. zhou’s body had not been drained even though he had 
been away for so many years. now, he still had so much energy to put on miss.

However, to be honest, when Mr. Zhou had a woman outside in the past, he was also very 
restrained. He was not as unrestrained as he was now. In the past, he would come back before 12 o 
‘clock. He had never played all night like this.

zhou chongguang nodded his head lightly and looked at the servant. ” do you have the porridge that 
was just cooked? ”

I just got up, ” the manager immediately said. I’ll be done in five minutes.

zhou chongguang personally went to take care of it. when it was done, he served a medium bowl on 
a tray and brought it up.

In the bedroom, it was quiet. Qin Mu was still lying there, as if he had fallen asleep.

Zhou chongguang placed the tray at the head of the bed and called out her name in a low voice, ” 
Mumu.

Qin Mu raised his eyes and laid down again after taking a look at him. His voice was a little 
muffled. Zhou chongguang, I want to sleep. Don’t come, Yingluo. I can’t take it anymore.

she laid down heavily, looking extremely tired.

He basked in the sun and then simply carried her up. Qin Mu was probably in a little pain, so he 
snorted softly.

Zhou chongguang held her in his arms and kissed the corner of his lips. “eat something hot before 
you sleep.”



she closed her eyes, did not make a sound, and did not resist.

Hence, he hugged her with one hand and fed her with the other.

it was general manager zhou’s first time doing this kind of thing, his first time serving a woman like 
this, and his heart was filled with unspeakable satisfaction.

He fed her like this and looked at her fragile little face, which reminded him of the first time they 
had sex.

It was their wedding night.

it was her first time, but it was not his.

He had given his first time to an unknown woman in a bar. After a night of indulgence, all that was 
left was emptiness.

Chapter 2343: Mrs. Zhou, I’m trying to please you (2)

when he married qin mu, he was no longer the zhou chongguang from back then. he already had 
other women outside, gu mei, and countless lin xues. he didn’t really remember the names of those 
women.

during their first time, qin mu was also in so much pain. however, that time, he wasn’t gentle at all. 
he knew how much pain she was in, so he tormented her with all his heart.

zhou chongguang collected his expression and scooped a small spoonful to her lips. his voice was 
unbelievably gentle, ” “mumu, be good and eat something.”

She actually didn’t feel that he was being mushy, but that it was all very natural.

Qin Mu didn’t open his eyes, but he ate it.



Zhou chongguang smiled lightly. He felt an indescribable satisfaction in his heart. It was as if 
feeding her like this was an especially blissful thing.

at this moment, there were no more intense gazes like just now. instead, it was quiet, but this silence 
was even better than just now-(pei, when general manager zhou is angry, he thinks that real knives 
are more powerful happiness.)

He fed him in small mouthfuls, and Qin Mu ate obediently as well. In this way, he actually finished 
feeding a small bowl.

zhou chongguang put the bowl aside and lay down with her in his arms.

qin mu was really tired and in pain. he fell asleep very quickly in his arms.

zhou chongguang looked at her sleeping face and suddenly hugged her closer. he pressed his face 
against hers and said in a low voice, ” ” mumu, be good. i’ll be good to you. ”

But she was in a deep sleep, lying in his arms and looking very obedient.

But Zhou chongguang laughed bitterly. When she woke up, she probably wouldn’t be so obedient 
anymore.

And that was the truth.

Qin Mu woke up around two in the afternoon. Zhou chongguang also accompanied him to sleep 
until the afternoon. During this period, he only took a short nap. The rest of the time, he kept his 
eyes open to look at her, afraid that he would miss the time when she woke up.

Qin Mu had just woken up, and he kissed her on the face. you’re awake. Are you hungry? ”

qin mu looked at him in a daze. then, his eyes slowly became clear. he stared at him for a while and 
then closed his eyes again. ” i don’t want to eat. ”

“then, take a shower first? hmm?” his voice was very soft as he kissed her on the lips.



Qin MU’s expression was somewhat patient. After a long time, he slowly opened his eyes and 
looked at him. ” zhou chongguang, are you trying to rape me in the bathroom again? ”

His pupils contracted violently, as if he had been stabbed.

he loosened his fingers and then held her tightly again. he buried his face in her neck and said in a 
deep voice, ” mumu, i’m sorry. ”

” if everything can be explained by ‘sorry’, what’s the use of the law? ” qin mu said coldly.

zhou chongguang’s breathing was starting to hurt. ” you want to sue me? ”

“I won’t!” Qin MU’s tone was indifferent. because I enjoyed it too.

“Pain, and happiness!” She spat out word by word.

zhou chongguang could not do anything about her. he reached out and wanted to carry her up, but 
she pushed his hand away and said in an excited voice for the first time, ” “don’t touch me!”

he looked at her in shock.

qin mu’s eyes were filled with disgust. ” i want to go and take a shower. zhou chongguang, let me 
go. ”

he refused to let go, and qin mu was furious. ” “zhou chongguang, even prisoners have time to be 
released!”

his breathing was painful. she was comparing their married life to xuxu’s prison?

while he was still in a daze, qin mu had already pushed him away and walked towards the 
bathroom.

he caught her in time and asked with some difficulty, ” “If Yingluo”



Chapter 2344: Mrs. Zhou, I’m currying favor with you (3)

when he asked, he realized how difficult it was. he was afraid of getting an answer he didn’t want to 
hear, but he couldn’t help but ask, ” “Qin Mu, if we didn’t sign that agreement and I let you go, 
would you consider Zhao Yan?”

qin mu’s body froze.

She didn’t turn around. She seemed to think for a moment before quietly saying, ” “i won’t,”

Just as a glimmer of hope rose in his heart, she continued, ” “Because he’s too good!”

at this moment, zhou chongguang’s heart felt as if a basin of cold water had been poured on it. it 
was indescribably cold.

He had never felt so depressed before.

other than tang xue ‘er, he had never fallen for any other woman. tang xue’ er didn’t love him, but 
qin mu had loved him before. deep love. now, yingluo should have feelings for him too, but she just 
wouldn’t dump him.

this made it very, very difficult for him. he was completely helpless against her.

Of course, he had also used force last night, so no matter how she coaxed him, he would not be 
happy.

qin mu walked into the bathroom, and zhou chongguang got off the bed gently. he walked to the 
cabinet where she usually kept her medicine and opened her medicine bottle.

there were still more than a dozen pills in the bottle, which would be finished in a few days.



He opened the drawer without a sound, took out a bottle of vitamins, and added more than ten of 
them.

After doing all this, he went back to the bed and lay down. Then he took out a cigarette and lit it, 
smoking it in a somewhat distracted manner.

qin mu went in for a long time. when he came out, zhou chongguang had already smoked four to 
five cigarettes.

He looked at her. you think I’m dirty and want to wash me clean? ”

qin mu was only wearing a bathrobe, and his hair was slightly wet. he sat in front of the dressing 
mirror to dry his hair.

the sound of the hairdryer deepened zhou chongguang’s frustration. zhou chongguang pursed his 
lips and reached out to put out the cigarette, looking at her quietly.

He patiently waited for her to dry his hair before he said in a hoarse voice, ” “Mumu, am I that 
unbearable?”

Qin Mu put down the hairdryer and started to apply the skincare products. She did not avoid him 
and took off her bathrobe in front of him. She applied the moisturizer all over her body.

zhou chongguang leaned there, his eyes slightly narrowed, and his adam’s apple bobbed.

Of course, other than his soft and delicate body, he also saw red marks all over his body, all left 
behind by his rough and rough actions.

her throat seemed to be blocked.

just as he was a little moved, qin mu said indifferently, ” “sometimes, it’s hard to bear.”

Zhou chongguang’s eyes narrowed slightly as he looked at her. After a long time, he said stiffly, ” 
“you still have to endure it!”



Qin Mu didn’t make a sound. He just quietly took care of his soft and delicate skin. The man who 
was full of vigor couldn’t stand his wife’s behavior. He lifted the blanket and walked towards her.

he hugged her from behind and buried his face in her neck. it was the fragrance of her favorite 
shower gel.

“mumu, can we talk?” he muttered.

Qin Mu looked at his reflection in the mirror and said calmly, ” Zhou chongguang, I’ve given you 
everything you wanted.

“But it’s not enough, Mumu.” His voice was deep. what I want is not only your body’s submission, 
but also your love.

Qin Mu glared at him from the mirror.

What did it mean to submit physically?

She was so disgusted!

The anger in his heart subsided a little when she was like this. He laughed deeply and bit her small 
neck. didn’t you surrender last night? who was the one who kept crying out in pain and begging me 
to let you go? who was the one who told me not to stop, huh? ”

He was simply shameless!

Chapter 2345: i want to love you for the rest of my life (1)

Qin Mu couldn’t bear to listen to him anymore and ignored him. He reached out and arranged the 
bottles and jars.

He didn’t let go and breathed hot air on the back of her neck.”Mumu, love me, okay?”

“i can’t control that!” qin mu paused for a moment. ” okay! i love you! ”



“you don’t sound very sincere,” he said with a frown.

“zhou chongguang, from the day you cheated on me, don’t expect my love anymore.” qin mu 
looked at him and snorted coldly.

After she finished speaking, not only him, but she herself was also a little stunned.

After that, there was a long silence, and that silence made her feel a little bitter.

zhou chongguang was the same. the heartache that he had hidden in his heart emerged again. he 
hugged her tightly from behind, his face pressed against hers, not allowing her to reject 
him.”mumu, i know it’s my fault! i’ve made you angry. next time i see them, i’ll walk around them, 
okay?”

Qin Mu pursed his lips and didn’t say anything.

she was a little embarrassed.

She felt that she had made a fuss because she cared, but at this moment, he had discovered her 
thoughts.

Zhou chongguang stared at her side profile and coaxed her gently, ” “Why aren’t you making any 
sound, huh?”

Qin Mu suddenly stood up. I’m hungry!

Zhou chongguang laughed softly,”I’ll go get some food.” hmm?”

she was probably unwilling to go downstairs now that she was covered in red marks.

Qin Mu didn’t make a sound. He was half-lying on the sofa and reading a book.

he looked at her deeply and thought, this should be considered making up!



After Zhou chongguang left, Qin MU’s heart was in a mess. He walked to the front of the cabinet 
out of habit.

she had already taken her medicine today, but she seemed to have some kind of obsessive-
compulsive disorder. she would feel more at ease when she saw the medicine.

when she unscrewed the bottle cap and took a look, she was stunned.

There was more medicine.

Qin Mu poured out all the medicine and counted them one by one. She was a person with some 
obsessive-compulsive disorder, so she knew how many medicines there were. It was obviously 
different from before.

She looked at it and then opened the other cabinets. She rummaged inside and out and finally found 
a medicine bottle.

to be precise, it was a bottle of vitamins. she opened it, poured out the vitamins and counted them.

Out of the standard of 100 pills, more than ten were missing.

She compared it to the medicine in her bottle, and it was exactly the same.

the medicine bottle in her hand fell to the ground.

All this while, she had been taking vitamins and not contraceptives!

while qin mu was in a daze, zhou chongguang was standing at the door with her lunch and dinner in 
his hands.

seeing the vitamins scattered all over the ground, he knew that the matter had been exposed. he said 
calmly, ” “I’ve always wanted a child.”



“When did it start?” qin mu’s voice was a little low and hoarse.

zhou chongguang pursed his lips slightly. ” it started back in yunnan. mumu, it’s not for my mother, 
but for yingluo. ”

he slowly walked in, put the things aside, and gently hugged her. ” “i want to continue walking 
down this path with you.”

As he spoke, his voice was somewhat suppressed and trembling.

he was actually very afraid that she would be angry. he was afraid that she would be angry.

qin mu raised his head, his gaze calm. ” ” what if i still don’t love you anymore, zhou chongguang? 
do you want our-our child to be born under such circumstances? ”

“no,” she said. He hugged her and said very softly,”I will give him a lot of love, and I will also give 
you more love. Mumu, believe me this once.” &Nbsp;

He closed his eyes and muttered,”shall we try?” mumu, give birth to a child. i promise to be very, 
very good to the child, and also very, very good to you. i won’t go out at night to socialize, and even 
if i go out, i’ll take you with me. Hmm?”

Chapter 2346: i want to love you for the rest of my life (2)

Qin Mu was trapped in his arms and couldn’t say a word.

it wasn’t that she wasn’t tempted.

he seemed to have sensed that she was moved, so he hugged her tighter and said in a warmer voice, 
” “Let’s not use birth control. Let’s just make love and get pregnant, okay?”

qin mu bit his lip, and his voice trembled. ” “what if i can’t get pregnant?”



zhou chongguang’s heart tightened. he knew that he had softened and was actually extremely 
excited. he bit her little ear and said in a hoarse voice, ” “mrs. zhou, are you questioning your 
husband’s ability, hmm?”

he reached out and carried her horizontally, walking towards the bed. as he walked, he kissed and 
rubbed her. ” let’s do it now, okay? ”

Qin Mu shrieked, his voice trembling. Zhou chongguang, you’re crazy!

she had never known that he had such strong desires. he was simply too greedy.

in the blink of an eye, he had already pressed her down and kissed her. qin mu’s body softened and 
allowed him to kiss her for a while before he pursed his lips.”Zhou chongguang, I’m hungry.”

His voice was actually a little pitiful. Qin Mu had never acted coquettishly with him before. To him, 
this was very rare.

he stared at her with his dark eyes and laughed.”Mumu, say it again?”

Qin Mu bit his lip and said in a light voice, ” “I’m hungry, let’s eat first, okay?”

however, he deliberately misunderstood her meaning and smiled faintly. ” alright, eat first and then 
cook! ”

qin mu couldn’t stand his shamelessness. he turned his little face to the side. ” shameless! ”

however, he loved her bashful little appearance. he reached out and gently scratched her small face, 
his gaze incredibly gentle.

She didn’t move. She just turned her small face away. It was soft and fragrant.

he was a man, a mature man with strong desires. he naturally desired her like this.



he leaned forward and kissed the corner of her lips lightly for a long time. however, he was 
obviously restraining himself. after a long time, he only kissed her lips and did not even kiss her 
deeply.

Finally, when he was done kissing her, he let go of her and said in a low and hoarse voice, ” “It’s 
time to eat,”

Qin Mu laid down softly and didn’t get up. Zhou chongguang bit her little face. “you want a hug? 
hmm?”

Qin Mu looked at him pitifully and didn’t say anything.

His heart softened and he reached out to hug her gently. “It’s getting smaller and smaller.”

however, he liked it when she was like this.

he held her in his arms and gently asked her what she wanted to eat, then fed her carefully.

Qin Mu was in his arms, eating in small mouthfuls. It had never been so soft.

Zhou chongguang felt as if his heart was about to melt. It was an indescribable feeling. In short, he 
felt that in the entire world, there was only her, and it was full of Qin Mu.

He continued to feed her and ate a little himself.

when he brought the tray downstairs, his eyes were full of smiles.

the servants in the house were all silent because mr. zhou and miss zhou had been locked in the 
bedroom for a day and had not come out yet.

Zhou chongguang stood still and instructed, ” don’t come out again at night.

The servant was stunned, and then he looked at Mr. Zhou with a meaningful look in his eyes. Mr. 
Zhou is really amazing.



after zhou chongguang finished speaking, he slowly went upstairs. however, it was not what the 
servants thought.

He carried Qin Mu downstairs and placed her on the sofa. He wrapped a blanket around her and 
played the piano for her the entire night.

qin mu sat beside him with a small blanket wrapped around him. he reached out and placed his 
hands on the piano keys, gently playing with him.

Zhou chongguang was stunned for a moment. He didn’t expect Qin Mu to play the zither so well. 
He turned his head and looked at her gently.

Chapter 2347: i want to love you for the rest of my life (3)

then, he picked her up with one hand and placed her in his arms. he rested his chin on her 
shoulder.”You play.”

As for him, he was hugging her, and as he hugged her, he started to act a little unruly.

qin mu called out in a low voice, his voice trembling like a little beast. ” “zhou chongguang!”

He was crazy. This was the main hall, and people could come in at any time.

qin mu struggled, but the more she struggled, the worse her situation became.

He bit her small shoulder and said in a low voice, ” “Be good and be quiet. Someone will come.”

qin mu was about to go crazy. he bit his lips and didn’t dare to make a sound. however, the more he 
suppressed it, the harder it was for him to control his emotions.

She was extremely fragile, while his strong and gentle piano music was in a mess.



it was just like their entangled bodies.

After a long time, he finally let her go. He kissed the side of her face and called her name. Mumu, 
are you okay? ”

Qin Mu curled up in his arms and cried softly.

He knew that he had gone too far. She was such a shy little thing, but he had forced her to do it in 
the living room.

Although the servants in the house were all old and it was not a big deal for a couple to do it once in 
the living room, Qin Mu still could not let go. He bit his lips and grabbed his shoulder with his 
small hand. He said in a low voice, ” “I want to go upstairs.”

he chuckled softly, kissed her forehead, and carried her upstairs.

When Qin Mu laid on the bed, he was a little angry and didn’t pay much attention to him.

zhou chongguang laughed softly and leaned over to coax her, ” “are you angry?”

“No!” Qin MU’s back was facing him.

he looked at her small head and kissed her hair from behind. ” “So you’re shy?”

qin mu’s voice was a little angry from embarrassment.”No, I didn’t!”

“Mumu.” “it’s nothing for a husband and wife to do it in the living room!” he said with a smile.

As he said this, his voice became heated again. the servants at home shouldn’t be surprised!

He spoke for a long time before Qin Mu suddenly said in a low voice, ” “zhou chongguang, i’m not 
used to this!”



“Do you like to do it in the bedroom or the bathroom? hmm?” he continued to ask.

Qin Mu couldn’t take it anymore. He turned around and bit his chin.

zhou chongguang laughed, and his laughter was especially meaningful.

He thought that they should be considered to have reconciled!

from that day on, under qin mu’s silent approval, zhou chongguang worked especially hard to sow 
his seeds. he wanted to have a child as soon as possible. Qin Mu felt it too. Although it was a little 
tiring to deal with him during the day and night, she didn’t resist.

In the following period of time, they could be considered to have gotten along the best.

He did what he said. He didn’t eat and socialize outside, but came back early to accompany her.

however, half a month later, qin mu’s period came.

She looked at him in a daze, her feelings a little complicated.

She didn’t know if she wanted to get pregnant or not.

Walking out of the bathroom, Zhou chongguang was leaning against the head of the bed, only 
wearing a bathrobe.

He was holding a magazine in his hand and reading it very casually.

She knew that he was waiting for her to make love. She pursed her lips, pulled the collar of her 
pajamas, and slowly walked over to lie down beside him.

She had just laid down when Zhou chongguang immediately put down the magazine in his hand. 
His large palm cupped her small face and kissed it. After kissing for a while, he pulled back a little, 
but he was still kissing the corner of her lips. He muttered, ” why did you leave for so long? ”



qin mu’s long eyelashes trembled slightly. he slowly opened his eyes and said softly, ” “my 
yingluo’s period is here!”

Chapter 2348: I want to love you for the rest of my life (4)

Zhou chongguang was stunned for a moment, then he laughed and bit her little nose. I really want to 
do it, huh? ”

Qin Mu turned his little face to the side and bit his lip. “Zhou chongguang, I mean, I’m not 
pregnant.”

“if you’re not pregnant, we’ll work harder next month!” He helped her lie down and carefully 
placed her in his arms. He said gently, ” “Mumu, don’t feel pressured! We’re still young, we’ll have 
children.”

qin mu nestled in his arms and didn’t make a sound. after a long time, he said softly, ” “zhou 
chongguang, do you like boys or girls?”

Zhou chongguang smiled and pinched her face. I like Mumu.

“You’re not serious!” she glanced at him and closed her eyes to sleep.

however, the man leaned over and held her little hand, hinting, ” “I’ve been waiting for you for so 
long. What if you wake me up in your sleep now?”

qin mu’s small face rested on his shoulder and he took a light bite. ” then what do you want? ”

“help me!” He softly spat out two words.

Qin Mu raised his eyes and looked at him silently. He blushed and lay in his arms. His small hand 
broke free from his big palm …



Ten thousand words were omitted!

Zhou chongguang took a deep breath. He had never thought that a girl like Qin Mu would be 
willing to help him in this way.

However, this was the first time that they had fallen in love with each other after their marriage. It 
was no longer a one-sided effort, but a cooperation between the two of them.

Deep in the night, the love was even stronger.

The next day, Qin Mu went back to the Qin family with Zhou chongguang accompanying her. 
Unexpectedly, ye Muyun actually brought Xue ‘er and little Yishu back too.

what qin mu couldn’t accept the most was that little yi shu was clearly a girl, and his brother knew 
about it, but now, she was wearing a little suit again!

However, Qin Mu didn’t ask for the time being. He only observed Xue ‘er’s reaction at the Qin 
family.

She seemed to have really forgotten everything about Yingluo.

she had forgotten the pain she had suffered back then and how she had been separated from her 
brother.

Qin Mu looked at her cautious appearance and even tried to please her brother. He felt a little bitter 
in his heart.

now, the way xue ‘er and her brother interacted seemed to have returned to the time when she was 
afraid of her brother.

was this the way her brother wanted to get along?

qin mu and zhou chongguang sat on the sofa together, with xue ‘er opposite them.



Zhou chongguang was rather calm. He had indeed treated Tang Xue ‘er as a goddess in the past. He 
had also caused Tang Xue’ er and ye Muyun to separate, but he had let it go now.

he felt a little guilty towards xue ‘er. however, a man’s perspective was different from a woman’s. 
he would not lose his happiness because of guilt. this was the essential difference between him and 
qin mu.

xue ‘er smiled at them, looking quite normal.

Qin Mu returned a smile and looked around. He remembered that eight years ago, she and Xue ‘er 
were upstairs talking about her younger daughter’s thoughts. Her girlish feelings had hurt Xue’ er.

She was a little dazed, even a little dazed.

zhou chongguang reached out to hold her cold little hand, and said in a very low voice, ” “guilt 
can’t help you or anyone else at any time.”

Qin Mu tilted his head and looked at him.

zhou chongguang smiled slightly, and his fingers clenched into fists.”you can be friends with her 
again.”

In Qin MU’s eyes, it was as if countless little stars had lit up. She looked at Zhou chongguang just 
like that. At this moment, he was her faith. He was like a drowning person who had touched a piece 
of floating wood.

All these years, Xue ‘er had been a thorn in her heart.

as for her, there was no medicine that could cure her.

she looked at zhou chongguang, and the corners of her lips curled up slightly.

[I’ll be releasing a new book tomorrow ~ Goodnight, everyone ~]



Chapter 2349: Of course it’s to dote on her!

She thought that since he had let it go, it was time for her to let it go slowly too. Zhou chongguang 
was right, guilt could not help anyone.

qin mu found some time to find ye muyun. he brought little yi shu to play in the courtyard.

other than the little suit jacket, the little guy was lying on the lawn looking for something!

qin mu walked over slowly and stood side by side with his brother. he looked at little yi shu for a 
while and couldn’t help but say, ” “Brother, Yishu is a girl!”

Ye mu Yun glanced at her and said expressionlessly, ” “i know!”

“Then why did you let her continue to dress like this?” qin mu couldn’t help but say, ” brother, this 
will greatly affect yishu’s sexual orientation. ”

After she finished speaking, ye Muyun turned his head and slowly looked at her. He sighed. “You 
think I don’t want to?”

Qin Mu looked at him, a hint of confusion in his eyes.

Ye Muyun sighed. Yishu isn’t willing and Xue ‘er is protecting her. I have no choice!

He had never been able to do anything to them, especially when they cried. It was simply killing 
him.

as he said this, he laughed bitterly and looked at qin mu. ” think about it. since she was young, what 
did xue ‘er want that i couldn’t satisfy? ”

although he was quite fierce to her, he really gave in to her in almost everything.



Qin Mu was still a little shocked. Other things were fine, but when it came to little Yishu’s sexual 
orientation, he let Xue ‘er do as she pleased.

She looked at ye Muyun for a long time and saw his helpless face.

qin mu was really convinced. it couldn’t be, right, brother!

her voice was very low. ” in the future, is this it? ”

chairman ye was also very helpless. he looked at his sister.”We’ll see! If she really likes it, then 
there’s nothing we can do!”

at this moment, he wanted to kill lan yu in his heart. his precious little heart was clearly a custard, 
but now, it had become a flower roll!

however, this did not stop him from doting on the little bun. just looking at the chubby little person 
made his heart melt.

qin mu was the same.

She looked at little Yi Shu’s forehead that was covered in sweat, and she couldn’t help but laugh, ” 
brother, I think Lan Yu dotes on her a lot too. She’s like Xue ‘er when she was young. She’s so 
lovable.

Ye Muyun’s gaze quietly looked at his sister. In his heart, he was thinking, Yi Shu was like Xue ‘er, 
so Lan Yu loved the house and its Crow. Just thinking about these five years, there was a man who 
always loved her and lived with her for five years.

It wasn’t that he didn’t care!

he was not that generous!

Ye Muyun let out a long breath and looked at his ‘son’. He reached out and wiped her sweat. He 
patted her and told her to continue playing.



he stood up and looked at her, his voice a little low. ” you and Zhou chongguang seem to be quite 
good. Have you made up? ”

There was a difference between not getting a divorce and making up.

it was obvious that qin mu and zhou chongguang were now on the track of a normal marriage. or 
rather, they were finally in love.

Qin Mu acknowledged and then held ye Muyun’s arm. He said in a low voice, ” “brother, i don’t 
know if it’s right or wrong, but i want to try.”

She had not been brave for a long time. The last time she was brave was when she liked Zhou 
chongguang when she was young.

qin mu thought that her feelings for him had used up everything she had. if one day she and zhou 
chong could not walk to the end, she would probably lose the ability to love.

Ye mu Yun patted her shoulder and smiled.”yes.”

He was a man, and men understood men the best. In Zhou chongguang’s eyes, he could see the 
passion for Qin Mu.

this kind of fervour was something that only a man in love would have. he was very clear about it.

Chapter 2350: pamper her! of course!(2)

qin mu raised his head and looked at him. his voice was a little low. ” what about you and xue ‘er? 
are you just hanging like this? ”

as brother and sister, if her brother couldn’t control himself, xue ‘er would probably think that her 
brother was a pervert!



Qin Mu couldn’t help but laugh when he thought about that scene.

Ye mu Yun looked at his sister and said unhappily,”What are you laughing at?”

qin mu was still smiling. ” brother, you must be having a hard time holding it in, right? ”

In the eight years in between, when Xue ‘er first came back, her brother probably vented his anger 
for a while, but recently, he probably had a hard time holding it in.

Ye Muyun glared at her. Qin Mu!

“Brother, you used to have a way with Xue ‘er.” Qin Mu smiled happily.

“don’t waste your good looks,” she said, looking at him.

Actually, she could tell that Xue ‘er had feelings for her brother, but with the memories of Lan Yu 
here, she probably wouldn’t take this step easily.

Qin Mu laughed lightly. As her brother, he was a little annoyed. He reached out and dragged her 
over to fix her.

he was pinching her face, the kind that deliberately made her feel pain. it was very intimate.

And this scene happened to be seen by Xue ‘er and Zhou chongguang, who were standing at the 
door.

Xue ‘er’s brows furrowed slightly, and she bit her lip for a long time without making a sound.

zhou chongguang turned his face to the side and looked at her. he said in a low voice, ” that’s Ye 
Muyun’s younger sister. Did you see that? his feelings for you are different from his feelings for 
Qin Mu.

Xue ‘er’s eyes were a little dazed, and she turned her head to look at Zhou chongguang.



Zhou chongguang’s hands were in his pockets, and he said indifferently, ” “I used to like you.”

Xue ‘er looked at him in surprise. His voice was very calm.”Now, I like Qin Mu.”

he could clearly feel xue ‘er heaved a sigh of relief, so he smiled. ” “Does it trouble you?”

xue ‘er’s gaze shifted to ye mu yun. after a long while, she said,”No, didn’t you say it was 
something that happened in the past?”

she didn’t know why zhou chongguang wanted to tell her all this. she didn’t remember those things 
in the past, but he obviously didn’t have to say it, so that everyone wouldn’t feel uncomfortable 
when they met.

Moreover, Qin Mu was still in the middle.

Zhou chongguang followed her gaze and looked at ye Muyun. Then, he smiled and reminded her, ” 
“Then, is his current love troubling you?”

Xue ‘er suddenly retracted her gaze and looked at Zhou chongguang. Her small face was filled with 
wariness.

” look, you don’t remember anything now, but you’re still so guarded against others. as for you, you 
clearly know that he liked you in the past and now, but you’re still at ease living with him. tang xue 
‘er, you’ve forgotten him, but your body still remembers him. ” zhou chongguang said naturally.

These words were quite embarrassing. At least, Xue ‘er’s face turned red.

zhou chongguang had been saying these things too much recently, and he didn’t feel that he had 
gone too far.

“i’m sorry,” he continued in a low voice.

Xue ‘er looked at him in a daze, not understanding why he was apologizing.



the way he and qin mu looked at her was a little different.

Xue ‘er bit her lip and looked up at the warm sun. She felt dizzy and a thin layer of sweat appeared 
on her back.

At this moment, ye mu Yun turned his head and his gaze landed on her small face.

his face was so handsome that it was almost cold and noble, making people not dare to look at him 
directly. especially now that he was looking at her like that, she did not dare to look at him clearly.

Xue ‘er’s face turned red.

Zhou chongguang’s smile deepened. He just smiled lightly and didn’t say anything else.

qin mu had always been worried, but now, he felt that there was nothing to worry about.
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