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the little guy was already able to sit on the small chair. qin mu asked someone to make mashed 
potatoes and steamed eggs for him. they were very fragrant, and little shui mu ate happily.

Qin Chen was a little distracted. He looked at Shui mu for a long time and smiled.”you’re already 
so big, but you were still a little monkey before?”

“Is your digestion alright?” she asked Zhou chongguang.

“They’re all good.” Zhou chongguang’s eyes were filled with warmth. First, he looked at Shui mu, 
then at his wife. he likes Mumu a lot. He would hug Mumu to sleep every night.

“that’s a good thing.” qin chen smiled.

Zhou chongguang smiled slightly, and his eyes were filled with love.

...

Qin Chen lowered his head to eat, but it was obvious that the pregnant woman didn’t want to let 
him go.

Under repeated questioning, Qin Chen finally said, ” “Oh, I’m separated from Lan Yu for the time 
being. It’s my problem.”

“Then, did you smoke because you were separated from Lanyu? or was it because you were 
smoking that caused you to be separated from Lanyu?” Qin Mu asked sharply, which was rare.

she beat around the bush, but qin chen still understood.

“it’s the latter,” he said in a low voice after a moment of hesitation.



Qin Mu bit his lip and reached out to cover Qin Chen’s hand. ” chenchen, so many years have 
passed. i’ve never said anything, but now i know that you can’t get over your own problems, so 
you’re not sure if you can continue with lan yu. you’re afraid that he’ll fall deeper and deeper, so 
you said that you want to separate for the time being, right? ”

qin chen had always been smarter than qin mu. qin mu was always silly. at the age of 14, he fell in 
love with a man and couldn’t help but fall madly in love with him, while qin chen felt a lot more 
guilty.

However, at this moment, Qin Mu, who had experienced so much, had a kind of calmness.

qin chen actually had nowhere to run. she looked at qin mu and sighed.”Do you have to do this-
fiery golden eyes?”

Qin Mu laughed. it’s all because we’re in the same place. We hugged each other for ten months!

Qin Chen didn’t reply.

At this time, Zhou chongguang was almost done eating. He took the initiative to leave with little 
Shui mu, giving them some private space.

Although they were family, there were some things that a man like him should not listen to.

Especially with Qin Chen’s proud personality.

zhou chongguang left. qin chen looked at his back view, then looked at qin mu and smiled. ” 
“You’ve trained him well!”

Qin Mu patted the back of her hand. “don’t try to change the subject. tell me what happened.”

qin chen’s gaze fell on qin mu’s face. after a long time, he said, ” “Qin Mu, I saw him.”

He?



Qin MU’s lips were tightly pursed, and he spat out a few words.”Rong Lei?”

This name was a taboo in the Qin family. No one had dared to mention it for so many years. It was 
even more taboo than Xue ‘er’s name.

Because of Rong Lei’s death and Qin Chen’s ice seal for so many years, her whole family was still 
very happy when she was with Lan Yu. No matter what happened to Lan Yu, at least they were 
decent. Even if it didn’t last long, as long as Qin Chen could be happy for a while, it was a good 
thing.

It had to be said that the thoughts of the entire Qin family were not right. However, they did not 
think too highly of Lan Yu. After all, he had a grudge with mu Yun and had even married Xue ‘er.

everyone in the qin family was a bunch of f * ckers. it seemed like qin mu and qin chen’s men had 
all liked xue ‘er before.

forget about zhou chongguang, he had only liked him before, but lan yu had already married him. if 
he were to marry qin chen again, it would be weird.

Moreover, no one would have thought that Qin Chen would get married!

They all thought that Qin Chen was just doing it on a whim, but now, she was obviously serious. 
Her feelings for Lan Yu were not just for fun.

otherwise, she wouldn’t be in so much pain and wouldn’t be struggling like this.
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qin chen pursed his lips and shook his head. ” “I might have seen another person, but they looked 
very similar.”



“So you’re wavering, aren’t you?” qin mu placed his hand on the back of qin chen’s and asked in a 
low voice, ” where’s lan yu? what did he say? ”

“He’s angry.” “i sent him a message, but he didn’t reply,” qin chen replied softly.

Qin Mu laughed. Qin Chen, you’re not that easy to coax. Especially men.

If it was a date, Qin Chen would definitely not be willing.

However, it was obvious that she cared about Lan Yu now. That was why she couldn’t let it go.

...

qin mu smiled slightly. ” if you care, then go and coax him back. qin chen, i can see that lan yu is 
sincere towards you. if you like him, then don’t miss it. ”

Qin Chen’s expression was a little subtle. I’m afraid ran ran can’t give him happiness.

“I won’t try. how would you know?” Qin MU’s smile was very warm. Chenchen, you’ve always 
been smart. But if you want to walk out of it, you have to accept something new. Only then can you 
walk out of Rong Lei’s influence on you.

“Mumu, can I really do it?” Qin Chen’s expression was a little dazed.

She had held on to her belief for more than ten years. Could she just abandon it like that?

after seeing that person, she felt that she was in extreme pain.

she didn’t want lan yu to feel her pain.

Qin Mu looked into her eyes. let go a little. Let Lan Yu in. He will slowly seep into your life.

Qin Chen’s facial muscles trembled. After a long time, he suddenly whispered, ” “Mumu, I know.”



“i’ll be leaving then,” she said, pursing her lips.

Qin Mu pulled her back and said in a gentle voice, ” “Let the driver send you.”

qin chen hesitated for a moment before nodding.

qin mu called the driver over and personally sent qin chen to the car.

Qin Chen sat in the car, deep in thought. Her expression had never been so gentle.

qin mu waved at her and watched the black limousine leave.

“where are you going, second miss?” the chauffeur asked softly.

qin chen looked at the dark night outside, paused for a moment, and then slowly said the name of 
the blue universe apartment.

the driver nodded, turned the car around, and drove in that direction.

In the villa, Zhou chongguang walked closer slowly, took a knitted jacket, and draped it over Qin 
MU’s shoulders. “It’s cold at night, and I’ve been standing here for a long time. Let’s go back.”

qin mu’s hand was on his shoulder, resting on the back of his hand. he said in a low voice, ” “I’m a 
little worried about Qin Chen.”

Zhou chongguang was also looking into the distance, his gaze a little unreal.

“Is it her past that’s bothering her?” he lowered his head after a long time.

qin mu nodded. ” yes, that man’s name is rong lei. he’s a very good-looking man and is the heir of a 
corporation in France. however, twelve years ago, he jumped from the 22nd floor and then slipped 
away. ”



she lowered her voice and muttered, ” “Chenchen became like this. She imitated Rong Lei and 
turned herself into another Rong Lei.”

zhou chongguang frowned.

“rong lei has congenital heart disease. he’s qin chen’s patient,” qin mu turned around and said 
indifferently.

Twelve years ago?

how old was qin chen then?

” they grew up together. rong lei was eight years older than qin chen. at that time, he was already an 
adult, while qin chen was only twelve. ” “Chongguang, she has been living like this for the past 
twelve years.” Qin Mu sighed.

Zhou chongguang looked at his little wife. Her little face was full of worry.
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he caressed her long hair. ” don’t worry. when you’re free, ask her to come over for a meal. then, 
call lan yu. ”

qin mu acknowledged and then recalled something. ” “meet my brother tomorrow and ask him to 
check on rong lei.”

Zhou chongguang looked at her and slowly said, ” “Mumu, you’re saying that it’s possible that 
Rong Lei really didn’t die?”

“we can’t rule out that possibility. otherwise, why would qin chen keep meeting that person? do you 
think it’s a coincidence? or is it a conspiracy?” Qin Mu raised his head and looked into his eyes.



zhou chongguang pondered for a moment, then patted her little head. ” “now that you’ve put it this 
way, i think it’s somewhat believable.”

He reached out and pulled her into his arms. “let’s go back first, your hands are cold.”

...

qin mu nodded and obediently followed him in.

Zhou chongguang carried her to the master bedroom upstairs and brought her a cup of warm water. 
He then went to call ye Muyun.

The call went through. He spoke for about five minutes, and Qin Mu sat on the bed and looked at 
him.

There was gentleness in her eyes, and the way she looked at him was different from before.

in the past, qin mu used to look at zhou chongguang with adoring eyes. but now, it was different. 
now, she and he were equal, and they were sisters-in-law who supported each other.

This kind of life was plain but very warm.

Qin Mu felt very satisfied. She looked at Zhou chongguang walking over and smiled. “what did big 
brother say?”

zhou chongguang walked over and sat down, his voice a little low. your brother said that people 
from the Third World like Rong Lei can only be found through a special data network, and it’s not 
necessarily possible to find out if he doesn’t use Rong Lei’s identity to trace his tracks in this world.

qin mu looked at him, his little face puzzled.

if he’s dead, we definitely can’t find him. If he’s alive, we might not be able to find him either. We 
need to use all kinds of data to draw up an analysis. zhou chongguang sighed softly. ” but he’s still 
alive. if he hasn’t been seen for so long, i don’t think he’ll be easily found out. ”



qin mu lowered his eyes and nodded in agreement.

Zhou chongguang ruffled her hair,”don’t worry!” It all depends on Qin Chen’s heart. If she likes 
Lan Yu, no one can tear her apart.”

As he spoke, he suddenly restrained his expression.”if rong lei was still alive, he probably wouldn’t 
be the rong lei of the past, and he wouldn’t be the person qin chen loved. if he really loved her, he 
wouldn’t have let her suffer so much for so many years.”

“i also think so.” Qin Mu bit his lip and leaned his head on his husband’s chest. ” chongguang, i 
hope that chenchen can be with lanyu and lead an ordinary life. ”

“But Qin Chen is destined to be extraordinary.” Zhou chongguang smiled bitterly.

the advanced medical technology that she had mastered had destined her to be extraordinary for life.

in zhou chongguang’s heart, he suddenly had a bad premonition. if that person was not dead, was he 
looking for qin chen now because of qin chen or because of qin chen’s identity?

He didn’t know. He didn’t even dare to imagine it.

just as he was speculating, qin chen yawned and said in a low voice, ” my feet are so sore. ”

Zhou chongguang’s eyes wanted to interrupt, and then he looked at the little face on his shoulder, 
which was as fresh as a painting.

“zhou chongguang, you haven’t kissed me for a long time.” she looked at him.

zhou chongguang touched his forehead and laughed a little. he said in a low voice, ” “Mumu.”

“I want you to kiss me.” Qin Mu bit his lip.

“you’re getting younger and younger,” he laughed.
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qin mu blinked his eyes and put his fingers on his stomach. he said confidently, ” ” it’s the baby in 
my stomach that lowered my average age. so, zhou chongguang, i’m only twelve years old now. ”

“Are you inviting me to kiss an underaged girl?” he asked, pinching her cheeks.

He carefully laid her down and leaned over to look at her. His eyes were clear. ” what i want to do 
might not just be kissing. 12-year-old girl, are you sure you want me to kiss you? ”

qin mu closed her eyes slightly. her long eyelashes were trembling. she was trying her best to hold 
back her laughter.”I want kisses and hugs, and I want to pinch my feet.”

she stretched out her hand and extended her foot to let him see her slightly swollen foot.

A fair and tender little foot, which was slightly swollen due to her pregnancy, was stretched out in 
front of him like a little pig’s trotter.

...

The little bit of affection in his heart disappeared all of a sudden.

He held her little foot and squeezed it gently.”Is this okay?”

Qin Mu closed his eyes comfortably and let him pinch him. After pinching one, he moved on to the 
other.

After Zhou chongguang finished serving his two little feet, he put them down gently. Qin Mu 
seemed to have fallen asleep.

He leaned over and said in a low voice, ” “Qin Mu.”



she opened her eyes in a daze and wrapped her arms around his neck.”Zhou chongguang? You’re 
done?”

She wanted to sleep because it was too comfortable.

zhou chongguang bit her little ear hatefully. ” “I’m done flirting with you, so just let me go, okay?”

“Then what do you want!” Qin MU’s eyes were still closed, but his small hands were busy 
unbuttoning his shirt.

she undid one, two, and then her small hand fell.

She fell asleep in no time.

Mr. Zhou was originally full of passion, but he hadn’t had it for a long time. He didn’t dare to act 
rashly because of her pregnancy, and she didn’t allow him to say that his body wasn’t well.

tonight, she finally relaxed, but she fell asleep halfway.

that one hour of foot massage had been in vain.

he held his forehead and laughed softly, ” in fact, how was it a waste?

When he was with her, he would be happy no matter what he did.

Faintly, he felt very happy.

the wine, women, and wealth that he had once pursued seemed so pale in front of the life he was 
living now.

zhou chongguang smiled slightly and leaned over to kiss the corner of her lips. ” good night, mumu. 
”



he covered her with the blanket and caressed their child through the blanket.

the little fellow was almost five months old and would be born in less than four months.

Their lives would be more complete.

zhou chongguang’s heart was very full, and he felt that all the happiness in his heart was about to 
burst out.

he couldn’t help but kiss qin mu again. then, he left the master bedroom gently and went to the 
children’s room next door.

little shui mu had already been coaxed to sleep by the servants. his little face was clean and white, 
and he was quiet.

shui mu had grown up a little, and his eyes and brows had opened up. he no longer looked like qin 
mu when he was young, but he could still see gu mei’s shadow.

in the past, he had been a little worried that qin mu would be unhappy.

but sometimes, when he was not around, qin mu would look at shui mu and smile. he would hug 
shui mu and kiss him.

Qin Mu didn’t seem to mind.

she didn’t mind, and zhou chongguang also didn’t mind anymore.

gu mei was their past. she was shui mu’s mother. the past was the past, and shui mu was real.

zhou chongguang sat on the side of the small bed and looked at shui mu quietly. occasionally, he 
would think of gu mei.

however, when she thought about it, all the hatred and anger disappeared.
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zhou chongguang watched on until it was late at night. he kissed little shui mu’s little face and 
slowly walked out, returning to his room.

Qin Mu was in a deep sleep. She had a good sleep, probably due to the lack of sleep in the early 
stages of her pregnancy.

He pursed his lips and reached out to touch her small face. Then, he went to take a shower. His 
body warmed up and he hugged her.

qin mu woke up slightly. he rubbed his little face on his shoulder and said in a low voice, ” “You’re 
back?”

She knew that he went to see little Shui mu every night. He was a very good husband and father 
now.

she wasn’t angry, because shui mu was their son now.

...

In the future, she would probably never mention Gu Mei to Shui mu. It was not because she was 
cruel, but because she wanted to protect her.

Shui mu should have a complete life, and Gu Mei probably hoped for that as well.

Qin MU’s small face rubbed against it and he said in a daze, ” “chongguang, are you going to 
sleep?”

he hummed in acknowledgment and rubbed her little head. ” “quickly sleep!”



Qin Mu laughed in a low voice. we haven’t made love yet. Chongguang, do you feel bad? ”

Her little hand went down naively.

“I’ve caught you,” he said, panting.

He had no choice but to kiss her little mouth. I’m fine. Mumu, go to sleep. Be good.

But her little hand kept moving around, making him feel sleepy.

His voice became more serious,’Qin Mu, stop playing! if you continue playing, you’ll probably 
break it. ”

seeing that she was very sleepy, he really didn’t dare to touch her for fear that yueyue would wake 
up their child.

Sometimes, Zhou chongguang still had some obstacles. Because she was a girl, the way he treated 
Qin Mu seemed to make Wanwan feel guilty.

However, he had never mentioned this before. Qin Mu did not know that he would have such 
perverted thoughts.

as he said that, qin mu pursed his lower lip, turned over, and kissed him on the lips. he said a little 
mischievously, ” “I don’t believe that you don’t want to!”

he clearly wanted to, but he still pretended to be serious.

she kissed him and placed her small hand on his lips. ” “Zhou chongguang, you weren’t like this in 
the past. You were always very direct!”

although he didn’t use it much in the past, he wanted it whenever he wanted it. why would he have 
so many scruples?

Qin Mu bit his lip and coughed lightly. “don’t tell me you can’t do it anymore?”



These words were simply the greatest challenge to men!

zhou chongguang bit her small mouth. ” “Is that what you think? Hmm?”

before qin mu could answer, he suddenly cried out and bit his shoulder. ” “zhou chongguang, you’re 
so bad!”

he laughed in a low voice and began to bully her.

she was pregnant, and he didn’t dare to use too much force. he only dared to do it gently, and she 
snorted like a kitten.

After a long time, she grabbed his shoulder and cried softly, ” “zhou chongguang.”

of course, he knew what was wrong with her. he coaxed her, ” alright, be good. you have to take it 
slow when you’re pregnant. It won’t be good if the child is hurt.”

in fact, he was having a harder time holding it in than she was. he had already held it in for a long 
time, and now he could let it go. how could he be satisfied just like this? but for the sake of the 
child, he still gently gave it to her once.

after they were done, she closed her eyes to calm herself down, while he kept kissing her little face 
to comfort her.

It took a long time for her to calm down.

he was full of love, and after a long time, he said in a low voice, ” “Mumu, I’m going to the 
washroom.”

“Zhou chongguang?” Qin Mu was a little surprised and looked at him.

he smiled bitterly and kissed her. ” i’m fine. i’ll be back to accompany you in a while! ”



She looked at him, her eyes gentler than the night.
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Qin Mu bit his lip and reached out to pull him, but he had already walked towards the bathroom.

He left in a hurry, as if he was in a hurry.

Qin Mu leaned against the head of the bed. Suddenly, he bit the blanket and smiled lightly. She 
suddenly felt that he was very cute.

then, she held her stomach and walked towards the bathroom under the warm yellow light.

he gently opened the bathroom door. zhou chongguang was standing under the shower, doing what 
all men would do.

qin mu’s face was a little hot. although they were husband and wife, he was sure that no man liked 
to be seen by his wife in such a scene.

...

She bit her lip and walked over. She hugged him from behind and kissed his back. let me do it.

zhou chongguang’s body froze, and he asked with uncertainty, ” “Mumu?”

“yes.” her little face was pressed against his back, and there was a round belly between them.

her small hand moved down, trying to please him.

But after all, she didn’t really do such things. Not only did Zhou chongguang not feel any joy, but 
he felt some pain instead. His voice was even more hoarse as he called her name, ” “mumu.”



although it was painful, he was happy.

Qin MU’s face was extremely hot. He kept burying his face in his back. Under his lead, his small 
hands slowly tasted something.

zhou chongguang panted lightly, raised his head slightly, and took a deep breath, ” “Mumu, you 
make me feel that this kind of enjoyment is somewhat sinful.”

As he spoke, he pulled her in front of him and gently kissed the corner of her lips.”you’re my wife. i 
should cherish you.”

qin mu climbed onto his body and rested his face on his shoulder. his body was drenched in the 
warm water with him.

as she kissed him, she murmured, ” you’re my husband. isn’t it normal to please you, hanhan? ”

She looked up at him as she spoke.

zhou chongguang was the same. their eyes met, and there was an indescribable feeling.

under his gaze, qin mu slowly squatted down and staggered.

in the next second, zhou chongguang let out an embarrassed snort.

his palm gently caressed his wife’s small face, and he snorted in a happy voice. ” “mumu!”

she ignored him and focused on pleasing him. zhou chongguang groaned in embarrassment again 
and again.

in the end, he pulled her up and pressed her into his arms.

She could feel his heart beating too fast. She smiled naughtily and poked his shoulder carefully.”Do 
you like it, Mr. Zhou?”



zhou chongguang calmed down for a while, before he said in a low and hoarse voice, ” “I like it, I 
like it very much.”

any man would like his wife to do this. this would definitely satisfy all the wild imaginations of 
men. zhou chongguang never thought that qin mu would still be willing to do this for him.

In the past, when they were at their best, they had sex. But after he had disappointed her, she was 
still willing to have sex with him.

he hugged her. his heart was beating fast, but he was also moved.

Qin Mu had let go of everything.

She had let it go, so what else could he not let go of?

he held his little wife gently and looked up. his eyes seemed to contain billions of stars, but they 
also seemed to only contain qin mu.

It was quiet as they hugged each other. It was such an intense affair, but when they finally calmed 
down, their hearts felt even more full.

this was probably what happiness was!

zhou chongguang lowered his head and kissed qin mu’s belly. he smiled.”little guy, time to sleep.”

the night.

qin chen sat in the back seat of the rv, quietly watching the dark night outside.
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The night.

Qin Chen sat in the back seat of the RV, quietly watching the dark night outside.

the streets of B city were brightly lit, but in her eyes, it was lonely.

her heart was empty.

After a long time, she finally realized that the emptiness was loneliness.

because she was alone again, and there was no one to accompany her.

...

He pursed his good-looking thin lips and turned to look at the driver in front. “Uncle Zhao, please 
drive faster.”

old zhao chuckled. ” second miss, this car is already going very fast. if it goes any faster, uncle zhao 
will have to issue a fine. ”

Qin Chen didn’t say anything else.

However, uncle Zhao’s Chatterbox seemed to have been opened up. He was unwilling to give up 
this opportunity to chat.”second miss, are you looking for a boyfriend?”

qin chen looked at him indifferently and didn’t say anything for a long time.

Old Zhao thought that she wouldn’t answer. This second miss was too cold. Not only did she treat 
herself like a man, but she also didn’t talk much. When she spoke, Xuanji wasn’t a good word.

but after a while, qin chen spoke with a faint tone, ” “yes.”



old zhao was shocked, and the rv that was in good performance floated a little, but he quickly got 
back on track and laughed. ” “No wonder the second miss is so impatient!”

impatient?

“Uncle Zhao, isn’t that a term used to describe men?” Qin Chen retorted.

old zhao chuckled again. ” second miss, look at yourself from head to toe. if you don’t look like a 
man, are you a woman? ”

in the entire qin family, only old zhao would dare to say such words. qin chen glared at him for a 
long time, but it was useless.

Old Zhao’s trick was successful. He smiled in satisfaction while brainwashing, ” ” i say, second 
miss, all men like girls to have long hair and wear dresses. you’re fine for the time being, but it 
won’t last long. ”

old zhao revealed a mysterious smile. ” i think mr. lan and the second miss are together. you’ve long 
been prepared to be a g-man. however, the result might be a surprise for zhenzhen. ”

old zhao got more and more excited as he spoke. ” the most important thing between a husband and 
wife is trust and honesty. ”

“trust is a matter of spirit, but honesty is different. it’s a matter of flesh and blood. when people are 
together, they can’t hide it, right? Otherwise, you’ll have to take off all your clothes and do that 
thing?”

After saying this, old Zhao took a sip of water. also, sometimes, when there’s an additional layer of 
muslin, it’ll be hazy and add another layer of beauty. It’s the current popular inner Y. This year’s 
Victoria Secret show is being held in H city. Look at those fat and thin people. They all look 
different when they wear those clothes. Look at those big legs, long legs, and strong boars. Even 
those men with exquisite waists can come back to life. They’re simply like aphrodisiacs.

“uncle zhao, aunt zhao, do you know that you’re obsessed with these little vixens?” qin chen 
couldn’t help but ask.



“hehehe, you can look at it, but how can you be infatuated with it? In my heart, your aunt Zhao is 
still the best looking. Just wearing a big undershirt and shorts, I still feel that she’s mighty and 
domineering, and then whiny ”

“I’ll lie flat on my own,” old Zhao said, a little embarrassed.

qin chen was stunned, he didn’t know what to say. it turned out that uncle zhao was still a little 
bottom …

However, with old Zhao’s nonsense, she was not as anxious as before. Half an hour later, the car 
stopped in front of Lan Yu’s Villa.

qin chen got out of the car and walked a few steps before turning back. he instructed old zhao, ” 
“drive back. i’m not going back tonight.”

Old Zhao gave her a thumbs up. second miss, you’re the best.

Qin Chen couldn’t help but roll her eyes. She waved at old Zhao and walked in quickly.
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qin chen couldn’t help but roll her eyes. she waved at old zhao and walked in quickly.

After they entered, they found it strange that the door was open.

however, she soon noticed a red ferrari sports car in the parking lot in front of her.

qin chen recognized that model. it was a global limited edition, a super favorite car for the second 
generation of the rich and the second generation G.

The red ones were mostly female.



Qin Chen felt that he could narrow down the scope to one person who had a relationship with Lan 
Yu, drove a limited edition car worth tens of millions, and had a flamboyant personality.

...

she pursed her lips tightly.

Originally, she could have acted as if nothing had happened and left this place, completely 
separating herself from Lan Yu. However, at this moment, she actually felt a touch of unwillingness 
in her heart.

She slowly walked into the living room. The lights were on everywhere, but the first floor was 
empty.

And upstairs, there was the sound of men and women panting, and the screams of girls …

Qin Chen’s raised foot shrank back.

At this moment, she remembered what old Zhao said-

Men all liked little vixens who wore thin and transparent clothes. Lan Yu was no exception!

Qin Chen stood downstairs quietly for about a minute before she went upstairs.

as she walked through the corridor, the lights flickered on her face …

When she reached the master bedroom on the second floor, she saw a mess on the floor.

blue universe’s long pants, blue universe’s shirt, blue universe’s belt

Also, women’s dresses were stacked together in an ambiguous way.



And on the luxurious bed, the big bed that she and Lan Yu had spent the night together, there was 
someone else.

lan yu half-leaned against the head of the bed. qin chen thought to himself, should i be glad that i 
have an extra pair of underwear on me?

They didn’t have the time to have sex. It’s her, it’s not a good time!

And the one in his arms, from behind, really looked like a fire-breathing little stunner.

She was wearing a fiery red tulle, which reflected her snow-white skin. She was small and delicate, 
but she was full of assets in all the places that should be there. Her body was faintly discernible. She 
was the kind of extremely attractive person that uncle Zhao had described!

qin chen didn’t need to look at her face to know that it was lin sisi.

there was no expression on qin chen’s face. she quietly watched them kiss and intertwine.

About a minute later, Lan Yu suddenly raised his eyes and looked at Qin Chen in shock.

His face turned ashen in that instant as he stared at her.

His body stiffened, and he forgot to push Lin sisi away from him, allowing Lin sisi to kiss him.

“sorry to disturb you.” qin chen smiled lightly.

At this moment, Lin sisi turned around and smiled charmingly.

She touched Lan Yu’s body with her fingers and said sweetly, ” “Doctor Qin, you’re the one who 
didn’t want Lan Yu. I’m only here to accompany him for a drink.”

So, they rolled onto the bed, right?



Qin Chen ignored Lin sisi and only looked at Lan Yu. He said calmly, ” “Are you drunk?”

“No,” Lan Yu replied, closing his eyes.

“Did she drug you?” Qin Chen’s expression became extremely cold and calmer.

however, this kind of calmness was suffocating.

It was as if she had made an important decision.

Lan Yu did not speak for a long time.

“did you?” qin chen smiled sadly.

Lan Yu smiled bitterly and pushed Lin sisi away. He got off the bed and walked over to Qin Chen.

he couldn’t lie in front of qin chen because she was a top doctor. she could tell with one look 
whether he was drugged or not.

Chapter 2799: lan yu, you bastard (3)

as for him, he did drink a little and was slightly drunk, but not to the point of not knowing who the 
woman in bed was.

he was with lin sisi because he wanted to give up on qin chen.

he was a little tired.

so, he tried it out with the woman who came to him. he wanted to see if he was still interested in 
other women.



But even after half an hour in bed, he wasn’t as excited as Qianqian.

however, he couldn’t tell qin chen about this.

...

He could tell her, ” Chenchen, I found someone else because I wanted to give you up.

he would rather let her believe him, and he would rather be lonely.

lan yu heaved a long sigh of relief and looked into her eyes. ” no. ”

qin chen’s gaze locked onto him. after about five seconds, she smiled. ” you guys continue. ”

Then, she quickly walked towards the stairs.

she couldn’t stay here any longer.

“qin chen!” lan yu grabbed her arm.

She was pulled by him and tried to break free, but she couldn’t.

She turned around slowly and looked at him. Lan Yu, let’s part on good terms. You have things that 
you can’t accept. Similarly, I also have things that I can’t accept.

He was still holding on to her, unwilling to let go. He only said in a low voice, ” “i’m sorry, 
chenchen. i promise i won’t do it again.”

He didn’t like Lin sisi, but he wanted to give up on Qin Chen. This was an undeniable fact.

his apology was because he wanted to give up on him, not lin sisi. he had no interest in lin sisi at all.



He didn’t let go, and Qin Chen finally got angry and raised his hand to slap him.

a five-fingered handprint immediately appeared on lan yu’s face. he turned his face away. he was a 
little embarrassed, but he was more embarrassed.

Qin Chen’s expression was extremely cold. don’t think that I can forgive you for cheating on me 
like Zhou chongguang. Lan Yu, I’m not such a magnanimous person.

With that, she headed downstairs.

this time, lan yu didn’t catch her. he only watched her leave and felt that all the strength in his body 
had been sucked out.

This time, he seemed to have really lost her.

at this moment, lin sisi came over. she had already put on her clothes and was holding a small bag. 
she walked over and smiled.”As expected, men can’t stand loneliness.”

actually, she clearly knew that this man had no feelings for her. he was just confused and in pain, so 
he wanted to give up.

He had succeeded, so of course, Yingluo had succeeded.

“Did you call her to come?” Lan Yu narrowed his eyes.

lin sisi smiled sweetly, then bit her delicate nails. ” “I don’t have any!”

” she probably came so late to reconcile with you. perhaps she would have agreed to your 
engagement or something, but it’s a pity, ran ran. ” lin sisi’s slender fingers slid on his shoulder. ” 
you’ve ruined everything. you should know how much of a clean freak dr. qin is, and how proud he 
is. it wasn’t easy for her to accept you, a second-hand good, previously. now, ran ran … ”

Lin sisi’s face was right in front of him. “lan yu, you’ve been eliminated with three strikes.”



It was just a small strategy and he was killed. It was really useless.

Next, she had to focus on dealing with Rong Lei.

Different from Lan Yu, that man and Qin Chen’s temperament were the same. She thought that it 
was easier to deal with such a man than Lan Yu.

however, lin sisi had never thought that her greatest enemy wasn’t who was powerful, but who was 
the one who ridiculed qin chen in his heart.

Chapter 2800: lan yu, you bastard (4)

after lin sisi left, lan yu started to call qin chen.

However, the phone rang again and again, but she did not pick up.

lan yu casually put on some clothes and walked to the entrance of the villa. he asked the guard, ” 
“How did doctor Qin get here?”

” it’s from a black rv, ” the guard said carefully. ” the rv left after dr. qin came. ”

lan yu grabbed his hair and cursed in a low voice, ” damn it!

He narrowed his eyes, went straight back to the villa to get his car keys, got into the car, and drove 
out.

...

the night was late.

Lan Yu drove the car and looked for her in the night.



with her personality, she probably needed to calm down at this time and wouldn’t want to see 
anyone. she would also be proud and wouldn’t want anyone to pick her up.

Qin Chen’s tears were not something anyone could see.

He just knew that she would cry.

lin sisi’s words kept on replaying in his mind.

Qin Chen had come so late because he wanted to make up.

lan yu pursed his lips tightly. other than being anxious, he was most worried about her safety.

he searched little by little, and finally, two hours later, he found her in a suburbs park.

qin chen sat there, quietly smoking his cigarette.

her smoking posture was more languid than a man’s, and it was also more beautiful.

Lan Yu sat in the car and looked at her quietly. She had also noticed him.

she didn’t stop smoking and just looked at him without any intention of running away.

this was his qin chen.

After a long time, Lan Yu got out of the car and walked towards her in the dark.

Qin Chen patted the dust off his body and walked forward, treating him as air.

“chenchen, i can explain.” lan yu frowned.



“No need!” Qin Chen turned around and looked at him under the moonlight. ” lan yu, i wanted to 
please you and say that we’re making up, but there’s no need for that. ”

She laughed at herself. we were forced to be together. Now, it’s perfect!

lan yu narrowed his eyes and stared at her. ” do you really think so? ”

Qin Chen smiled faintly. yes! lan yu, you see, neither of us can trust each other unconditionally. no 
matter whether you and lin sisi did it or not today, in my opinion, you’ve betrayed wanwan.”

Lan Yu’s breathing hurt.

he stared into her eyes. ” qin chen, give me one more chance. ”

“There’s nothing else,” “once is enough,” qin chen said softly.

She stepped back slightly and smiled. “actually, you can find a normal girl to date. i’ve said it 
before, we can’t get along. i can’t give you anything.”

Therefore, it was right to say that they were going to separate.

He would probably be sad for a while, but soon, Li Sisi and Wang Sisi would appear.

A handsome, talented, and rich man would not lack women.

She was just his obsession during this period of time. It was fine as long as it was over.

Lin sisi’s appearance on his bed was the best proof.

qin chen lowered his eyes and watched as he took another step forward. she said in a low voice, Lan 
Yu, don’t come any closer. We’re over.

“Is that so?” he punched the wall beside him.



There was a loud sound, and she almost suspected that he had broken the bones in his hand.

She suppressed the sorrow in her heart. Lan Yu, it’s just a breakup. There’s no need to do this.

Her face was also stained with a few drops of warm blood. It was Lan Yu’s blood.

“Stop it, it’s meaningless.” “i won’t like it either,” she said lightly.
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