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Chapter 4631: Offended, someone you shouldn’t have offended (3)

in the middle of the night, rong yue suddenly felt warm. then, he lowered his head and looked at his 
arms.

the little girl who gave him warmth!

Mengmeng had always thought that he was the one taking care of her in real life. However, she did 
not know that in reality, he was the one who relied on her.

after such a long time, she had already become a part of his life. sometimes, in the middle of the 
night, he would suddenly wake up and look at her quietly under the weak moonlight. at that time, he 
would think, if mengmeng wasn’t around, what would he be like now?

He was probably not happy. Every day, he wrote scripts, wrote other people’s love stories, and then 
missed a woman who didn’t belong to him.

Now that he had Mengmeng, AI Mengmeng had no idea how blissful he was. She didn’t know that 
she had the ability to make him happy either. She was just a little fool!

...

now that this little fool had crashed into his arms, he was caught off guard. his originally calm heart 
suddenly heated up.

he wanted to kiss her, but they were in the middle of the street, so he was a little troubled. he didn’t 
know what to do, how to express his emotions.

He could only slowly tighten his arms and carefully hold her in his arms.

Rong Yue lowered his head and looked at her small face that was raised. His voice was slightly 
hoarse. why are you suddenly acting coquettishly? ”



ai mengmeng put her face close to his neck. it was a little cold there, but it became warm after a 
while. she stayed there for a while before she muttered,”I’m not acting coquettishly. I just want to 
feel your warmth.”

When she said that, her eyes were especially delicate and lovely, and she was indescribably cute.

no matter how much he tried to restrain himself, he could not help but lower his head and kiss her. 
this kiss was exceptionally warm in the middle of the night.

ai mengmeng looked at him quietly. after a long time, she mumbled,”do you like me?”

His answer was to gently pull her hair and say in a helpless tone, ” “What do you think, Mrs. 
Rong?”

AI Mengmeng was still looking at him. There was a slight smile in her eyes, and there was the 
unique high-spirited look of a young girl. She even pouted her little mouth. I think you like me.

after she finished speaking, she looked at him!

Rong Yue patted it lightly and said very quickly, ” “Let’s go home,”

Pressing down on her shoulders, AI Mengmeng led him forward gently. She continued eating the 
skewers in her hands. As she ate, she said in a blur, ” I’m not done eating yet.

“Just like a little pig.” rong yue sighed softly. ” fortunately, i’m only raising one! ”

after ai mengmeng finished eating, she threw the skewers away and gave him a strange look.

“What’s wrong?” Rong Yue chuckled. why do I feel that Mrs. Rong has a request? ”

ai mengmeng snorted softly. ” it’s definitely not what you think. ”

he smiled happily. ” if you’re not, you can tell me. ”



“I don’t want to say.” AI Mengmeng snorted, then wrapped her arms around her waist and walked 
towards the apartment.”it’s getting late. the old people should sleep.”

He chuckled. are you sure I’m an old man? ”

For some reason, AI Mengmeng’s face turned red. He didn’t say anything overboard, but she was 
still a little shy.

However, he didn’t know that it was because he liked her.

“rongyue, i think i like you too.” she suddenly stopped and whispered.

Mr. Rong looked at her, amused. you’re being reserved, Mrs. Rong!

ai mengmeng bit her lower lip and lowered her eyes. ” it was eaten by a dog! ”
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rong yue chuckled. ” oh, the puppy tried a lot of things just now! ”

AI Mengmeng immediately exploded. I’m not a dog.

“Isn’t it?” He patted her little head. the little doggy is home!

ai mengmeng didn’t move.

Rong Yue chuckled again and said,”you’re not going back?” then i’ll go find other dogs.”

as soon as she finished speaking, she grabbed his hand. ” fine, let’s go with the puppy. ”



...

Rong Yue smiled again. where’s your backbone?”

“I don’t need any.” she said sulkily.

Thus, Rong Yue was even happier. He kissed her forehead. Oh, you only need me.

She blushed again. shameless!

Rong Yue just smiled.

after they left, edgar still stood there, watching them leave in the cold wind.

she had noticed that from the beginning to the end, ai mengmeng had only looked at her once, and 
then she had disappeared from ai mengmeng’s eyes.

Only Rong Yue!

AI Jia didn’t know what kind of situation could make a person forget their pain so quickly.

she had always thought that ai mengmeng would be scared when she saw her, but she wasn’t.

She was a woman who was immersed in happiness!

there was a trace of hatred in ai jia’s eyes. this little b * tch didn’t put her in her eyes at all. she had 
forgotten who she was!

Rong Yue brought AI Mengmeng home. After all, he was not in good health, so he immediately 
went to take a hot bath while AI Mengmeng tidied up the room alone.

As she thought about it, she couldn’t help but smile.



But later, she couldn’t help but think of Edgar.

A woman she once admired, but now she was afraid of.

she also noticed that ai jia was different from before. she looked haggard and only wore a long dress 
on such a cold day.

She knew that all her movies had been taken down, she had been banned in various ways, and she 
was in debt.

That’s why she came out to socialize!

ai mengmeng didn’t feel that happy. fame and fortune were no longer that important to her.

Perhaps, she was still a little sad, but she didn’t know if it was for herself or for someone else.

she was just thinking about it and did not notice that rong yue had come out.

in the warm room, rong yue was wearing a bathrobe. as soon as he walked out of the bathroom, he 
saw his little wife in a daze as she made the bed.

He walked over and hugged her gently from behind. He lowered his head and leaned against her 
neck. what are you thinking about? ”

“you’ve recovered!” ai mengmeng was shocked and turned her head.

He chuckled. I’m asking you, what are you thinking about? ”

“No, I didn’t,” she subconsciously avoided him and lowered her eyes to hide herself.

however, they had been married for a long time. how could he not know what she was thinking?



He was still holding her, and his voice was hoarse. He said hesitantly, ” I think I saw Edgar in the 
parking lot just now.

As soon as she finished speaking, the body in her arms stiffened.

“what’s wrong?” Rong Yue asked softly in her ear.

AI Mengmeng’s heart was in a mess. nothing. I’m going to take a shower.

he had only taken two steps when his arm was caught.

She turned her head and bit her lip. rongyue!

he smiled slightly. ” it’s not that much of a difference. keep me company.”

she looked at him and finally understood what he meant.

The previous topic had long been thrown out of the window. She was sure that he had mentioned 
Aijia unintentionally and did not think too much about it.

She heaved a sigh of relief and looked at him. I think I’ll take a shower first.
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rong yue looked at her quietly and smiled. ” go! I’ll make the bed.”

only then did ai mengmeng realize that she hadn’t finished her work. she wanted to say that she 
would do it herself, but she really needed to be alone for a while to calm her emotions. thus, she 
nodded and immediately ran into the bathroom, closing the door.

In a place where she could not see, Rong Yue stood there, his gaze a little unfathomable!

there were many things that mengmeng did not know.



For example, AI Jia had offended Qin mo. For example, he Huan had been hospitalized. How was 
she now? Even he himself didn’t know.

mengmeng didn’t know about all these.

...

as a scriptwriter, rong yue had the most sensitive intuition. when he mentioned ai jia just now, 
mengmeng seemed to have a big reaction.

Moreover, their surnames were all AI!

Rong Yue was suspicious, but he didn’t want to alarm her!

what happened last time might be related to edgar!

Just thinking about it made his heart ache a little, and he couldn’t describe the feeling.

He was her husband, but he had never been able to help her find out the truth, only accompanying 
her to heal!

he didn’t want to expose her scars, but he was afraid that the pain would come back again.

He lit a cigarette and stood in front of the floor-to-ceiling window, smoking from time to time in 
frustration.

In fact, he had quit smoking a long time ago, but he needed a cigarette to calm himself down.

he had to think of how to face his little wife and how to calm her emotions.

he had too many things to think about.



When AI Mengmeng walked out, she saw him smoking.

she was stunned for a moment and immediately went forward to snatch the cigarette from his hand. 
she said disapprovingly, ” the doctor said you can’t smoke. ”

Rong Yue turned his head and smiled. His voice was very hoarse. the doctor said that I can’t have a 
woman yet.

After he finished speaking, AI Mengmeng’s face immediately turned red and her heart raced. She 
bit her lower lip. you’re talking nonsense again.

however, he quickly realized something and asked softly, ” “Do you have something on your 
mind?”

rong yue gently held her in his arms and rested his chin on her head. his voice was deep and hoarse. 
” you must have had a hard time before we went to your hometown to play mahjong! ”

AI Mengmeng looked at him. why did you suddenly think of this? ”

he raised the cigarette in his hand again. ” you’re even smoking. ”

rong yue smiled. ” are you interfering now? ”

She reached out and gently grabbed his collar, stunned. am I not qualified? ”

“probably,” He chuckled and kissed her!

After a long time, Rong Yue realized that she had not fallen asleep. He patted her shoulder and said, 
” “What are you thinking about?”

ai mengmeng turned her head and bit her lip as she stared at him for a while. ” i’m thinking about 
my childhood. ”



it was really tough back then. It was even tougher than the last time you saw it. her voice was full of 
reminiscence. it was hard to even have meat during the new year.

Rong Yue suddenly felt very sad. He put his arm around her shoulders and said, ” I won’t do it 
again. I will take care of you.

“There’s meat to eat?” she stammered.

his eyes were very bright, and there was a profound meaning in them.

AI Mengmeng didn’t know why, but her face turned red again. She pulled up the blanket and said, ” 
I’m going to sleep.

the solution chuckled and pulled her hair. ” aren’t you afraid that you won’t be able to breathe? ”

after a while, she came over and put her arm around his shoulder again. she leaned her head gently 
against him and asked, ” are you still going to smoke in the future? ”

“What?” He lowered his head.
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ai mengmeng’s voice was very low. ” i want you to be well. ”

She looked up at him again. you’re such a good person.

“what’s good about it?” rong yue smiled gently.

AI Mengmeng’s eyes welled up with tears as she glared at him!

After that, they didn’t talk anymore and went to sleep together.



However, this night was not peaceful for the man.

...

After his little wife fell asleep, Rong Yue gently got up and covered her with the blanket. Then, he 
went to the study room!

he turned on the computer, looked at the browser, and slowly typed the two words ” aijia “. his 
intuition told him that this person was inextricably related to his wife.

especially tonight, when he saw aijia, he actually felt that she looked 60% similar to mengmeng.

Rong Yue subconsciously rejected this possibility. However, he was a man, and as a man, he would 
not escape from reality.

Instead, he would do everything possible to protect his woman!

Of course, when all the information about Edgar appeared on the computer, it was all official 
information-there was nothing he wanted to know.

he grew up in a wealthy family, and later on, everything went smoothly. he entered the 
entertainment industry and developed his career abroad for a long time.

it doesn’t seem to be related to mengmeng!

However, Rong Yue’s intuition told him that it was not that simple.

tonight, ai mengmeng’s nervousness was obvious!

she had an inexplicable fear of ai jia, and rong yue’s heart was getting more and more uncertain. he 
reached out for his phone and dialed a number!



a few seconds later, the call went through. ” president qin, can you help me investigate this person, 
ai jia? ”

On the other end, Qin mo was silent for a while before he asked in a low voice, ” why do you want 
to investigate? ”

“i suspect that she’s related to ai mengmeng!” rong yue told her about what happened tonight!

Qin Mo’s voice was very low. I can help you investigate.

“Thank you,” he said. After Rong Yue finished speaking, he asked something else. he Huan, how 
are you now? ”

this time, qin mo’s silence was obviously longer. after a long time, he said bitterly, ” her memory 
has returned to when she was 18! ”

After that, she hung up the phone. Rong Yue was a little shocked.

18 years old was the age when he and he huan liked each other.

he huan had returned to the past!

the reason why qin mo was willing to tell him was probably because he had other motives. after 
thinking about it carefully, he understood everything.

There was some bitterness and a faint stir about that period of youth.

however, he already had a wife, he huan. it was just a memory.

he had gone back, but he couldn’t!

Hence, he interpreted Qin Mo’s words as a threat or a declaration.



She wanted his position!

Rong Yue picked up another cigarette, lit it, and smoked it gently. His heart ached faintly.

ai mengmeng stood by the door, her face full of shock.

She didn’t expect that Rong Yue would investigate AI Jia behind her back. She thought that he 
didn’t suspect anything!

so it was …

she was very flustered and didn’t know what to do. after a long time, rong yue got up and turned 
around, just in time to see her standing outside the door.

he was stunned for a moment, then immediately asked, ” why aren’t you sleeping? ”

“you said you don’t smoke.” AI Mengmeng said softly!

Rong Yue smiled. it’s a little bad. Come and smoke two.

“Are you just here for a smoke?” She still asked in a very, very soft tone!

Rong Yue smiled slightly. of course. Is there anything else? ” by the way, how long have you been 
standing here?”

Suddenly, AI Mengmeng felt a little tired. She said in a low voice, ” can you not go and check? ”
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Rong Yue looked at her quietly and then said very slowly, ” “You heard it. Now, are you willing to 
tell me?”



ai mengmeng pursed her lips and only muttered after a long time,”it’s late, i want to sleep.”

“mengmeng,” just as she was about to turn around and leave, rong yue called out to her.

AI Mengmeng’s body froze. Then, she slowly turned her head and looked at Rong Yue silently.

after a long time, she said softly, ” “rongyue, why won’t you let me go? why do you have to 
investigate the past? it’s not like you don’t know that the past isn’t good.”

She placed her hand on her heart and said in a soft voice, ” every time I’m lifted up, it hurts. 
Rongyue, don’t you know? I just want to live a normal life. Is that wrong? ”

...

rong yue looked at her quietly and only spoke after a long time, ” “But have you ever thought that if 
you run away, others will let you go? I know that you want to live a peaceful life, but sometimes, 
it’s not enough just because you want to live a peaceful life.”

ai mengmeng bit her lip and shook her head with all her might. after a long time, she 
muttered,”Don’t force me, Rong Yue, don’t force me.”

She kept shaking her head and stepped back.

Rong Yue stood up and walked towards her. The expression on his face was a little deep, an 
expression that AI Mengmeng had never seen before.

This was a man’s unique expression, strong and aggressive.

in the past, rong yue had never revealed such an expression.ai mengmeng felt that it was a little 
dangerous and instinctively wanted to run, but rong yue reached out and caught her.

She had never known that he was so strong when he held her wrist.



ai mengmeng bit her lip. ” rongyue, you’re hurting me. ”

he stared into her eyes and turned her around forcefully, pressing his hand on her shoulder.”if you 
can feel pain like this, then it will be even more painful after being hurt by others.”

He stared into her eyes, leaving her with nowhere to run.

ai mengmeng looked at him with a weakness that she had never shown before.

she felt loved by him, and she loved him too.

All the damage done to them added together was not even worth a single sentence from him.

This was probably because she cared too much.

AI Mengmeng stared at him, but she swung her hand hard, trying to shake him off.

However, how could she get rid of Rong Yue?

his fingers were still holding onto her arm, and his expression had turned a little ugly.

“rongyue, didn’t you say you wanted to buy a piece of land?” ai mengmeng bit her lip.

“do you want to be a coward?” his expression turned even uglier.

AI Mengmeng bit her lip, her eyes welling up.”Rongyue, are you reluctant to part with this 
prosperity?”

Rong Yue looked at her quietly and smiled very lightly. it’s not that I don’t want to, but do you 
really think that you’ll be fine if you hide? if you think it’s okay, we can leave here tonight. but 
what i want to tell you is that he huan is in the hospital now. she lost her memory because she was 
pushed down. who do you think did it?”



AI Mengmeng’s face was pale, and her lips trembled slightly. After a long time, she finally spat out 
a few words.”It’s Edgar?”

“Yes, that’s what you think,” he nodded.

“so are you still going to say that you want to hide?” he paused.

“AI Jia is a lunatic. He Huan dared to do anything with Qin Mo’s protection, let alone you and me,” 
he said softly. mengmeng, it’s no use no matter where you hide.”
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“AI Jia is a lunatic. He Huan dared to do anything with Qin Mo’s protection, let alone you and me,” 
he said softly. mengmeng, it’s no use no matter where you hide.”

he wasn’t trying to downplay his own prestige, but he had a feeling that ai jia had something on ai 
mengmeng. there must be a complicated relationship between them.

if rong yue did not love her so much, he could not have asked. however, he was her husband.

she had been hurt so badly in the past, and no one could guarantee the future.

as a man, he had the responsibility to protect her.

a lunatic like edgar would never let anyone off.

...

AI Mengmeng looked at him in a daze and mumbled subconsciously, rongyue, AI Jia is a lunatic. 
She will do anything. I’m scared.



rong yue stared at her for a long time. then, he slowly lowered his fingers and held her hand.

AI Mengmeng’s hand was very cold, but Rong Yue’s hand was slightly warm.

This warmth slowly warmed her.

ai mengmeng raised her head, her voice dreamy. ” rongyue, you don’t want to know this story. i’m 
far worse and dirtier than you think. ”

As she spoke, she shook her head, probably because she couldn’t stand the past.

in ai mengmeng’s heart, she could only accept her current life with rong yue. in the past, she had 
selectively filtered it out.

At this moment, she felt sorry for Rong Yue just by thinking about the past.

When she was still in her hometown, she was ridiculed by others.

suddenly, ai mengmeng thought of something, and her face turned pale.

rong yue looked at her and said in a very low voice, ” “What’s wrong?”

ai mengmeng’s fingers grabbed his hand so tightly that her nails were almost digging into his flesh.

At that moment, AI Mengmeng’s expression was almost twisted, and she looked like she was on the 
verge of a mental breakdown.

Mengmeng! Rong Yue frowned and hugged her. Mengmeng!

ai mengmeng’s expression was extremely ugly. she stared at rong yue’s face and said in a trembling 
voice, ” ” my generation was ruined by her. how could she be so cruel? i’m her sister. how could 
she do this to me? ”



after she said the last word, she finally couldn’t hold back her tears.

“How could she do this to me!” He muttered.

Rong Yue’s heart ached, and he held her in his arms to comfort her.

she couldn’t help but tremble, and it took a long time before she slowly calmed down.

Rong Yue took her to the study, turned the heater to the maximum, and poured her a cup of hot 
cocoa.

Then, he sat opposite her.

perhaps it was because of the warmth, or perhaps it was because she had drunk half a cup of hot 
cocoa, but her emotions slowly calmed down.

“now, can you tell me?” rong yue’s voice was very soft.

AI Mengmeng had already calmed down a lot. She held the cup in her hands, which was filled with 
hot cocoa.

After that, she pursed her lips and said softly, ” Aijia was adopted by someone else from my family. 
I was still young then, probably less than two years old. Aijia was about seven or eight years old 
then. I don’t have any memories, and I always thought I was the only child in the family until Aijia 
appeared in my hometown.

rong yue looked at her quietly. he knew that what was going to happen next would not be very 
pleasant or would be ai mengmeng’s pain for the rest of her life.

Rong Yue’s intuition told him that the scumbag who molested her might have been hired by AI Jia.

AI Mengmeng’s voice was very calm, but there was a hint of trembling in this calm.
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ai mengmeng’s voice was very calm, but there was a hint of trembling in this calm.

she said very softly, ” the first time she came, i refused. i said i didn’t want to leave home, i didn’t 
want to leave mom and dad. after that, ran ran … ”

There was a trace of confusion in her eyes. She looked at Rong Yue quietly and said softly, ” “Then 
I got into an accident. That scumbag was arrested and sentenced to six years in prison. He might 
have been released by now. after that incident, i followed aijia to B city. you know everything that 
happened after that.”

” everything is so coincidental. you suspect yingluo? ” rong yue’s voice was a little low.”You 
suspect that AI Jia ordered someone to do it so that you can’t stay here, right?”

AI Mengmeng bit her lip and nodded lightly.

Rong Yue got up from the sofa, leaned over, and squatted in front of her. He placed his hand on the 
back of her hand and then gently wrapped it around her.

...

“It’s all in the past. Mengmeng, it’s all in the past.” His voice was even more hoarse.

AI Mengmeng was still looking at him. She bit her lip.”If it was Aijia, I can’t forgive myself. I 
helped her do so many bad things, but in the end, it was her who harmed me. Yingluo was also the 
one who found out about me. ”

At this point, AI Mengmeng’s expression became a little dazed. rongyue, I will never forget that 
day. I will never forget the feeling of being pressed down by someone and watching the needle 
Pierce into my skin.

Her body trembled slightly and she looked up into Rong Yue’s eyes. that was the darkest moment of 
my life. I was so afraid. When I woke up, I lost everything. I’ve tried so hard for so long, but I 



couldn’t compare to the needle that Aijia gave me. I don’t know why she did that to me. Even if I’m 
not that obedient, she’s my sister. Why did she do that to me?”

ai mengmeng closed her eyes slightly, and there was a glimmer of tears in the corners of her eyes. ” 
i’ve always thought that she’s very good, so i’m willing to do many things for her. i don’t 
understand how she can be so cruel. ”

for a long time after that, she was afraid even when she was sleeping. she often woke up in the dark 
and felt that there was someone in her room who wanted to press her down and hit her with those 
harmful things.

She was extremely afraid.

After that, she didn’t dare to turn off the lights again, because she couldn’t fall asleep once she did.

She was afraid that those harmful things would come out again.

She was not so afraid until Rong Yue appeared.

but now, when she thought of those past events, her entire body was still trembling.

she couldn’t help but be afraid.

Her hand was held by Rong Yue, and his voice was very low. “you have me now. she can’t hurt you 
anymore.”

AI Mengmeng’s gaze was a little listless. After a long while, she asked softly,”rongyue, let’s move 
to another place to live, okay?”

without waiting for his reply, she reached out and hugged herself gently. I’m scared. I’m really 
scared. I’m scared that she’ll be holding me in her hands again like she’s holding a bug. I’ll die 
easily.

In the past, it didn’t matter if she died or not. But now, she had Rong Yue.



they had the present and the future, and maybe one day, they would have a child.ai mengmeng 
couldn’t bear to die, so she wanted to leave this place with him, away from ai jia.

after she finished speaking, rong yue looked at her quietly.

AI Mengmeng bit her lip, her voice soft.”you, don’t agree? You don’t want to live in a different 
place with me?”
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Rong Yue sighed. it’s not that I don’t agree, but Mengmeng, are you really going to run away like 
this and let her go? ”

AI Mengmeng bit her lip so hard that it almost bled.

after a long time, she finally spoke in a low voice. ” i don’t want to have anything to do with her 
anymore. rongyue, i don’t want to think about the past either. let’s just pretend that this person never 
appeared in huahua’s life. ”

rong yue sighed again. ” oh, you. ”

he reached out and ruffled her hair. ” if this is what you want, we can move to another place to live. 
there’s no need to move it to the deep mountains, isn’t that unrealistic?”

AI Mengmeng looked straight at him.

...

She couldn’t believe that Rong Yue would really agree.

She thought that he wouldn’t. She thought that he would try his best to convince himself to face it.



But he didn’t. He said he was willing to move out.

She looked at Rong Yue and didn’t know what to say for a moment. Rong Yue only smiled warmly. 
“alright, it’s a deal.”

He picked up his phone and looked at the time. it’s late. Let’s sleep.

” oh, ” ai mengmeng replied. she had completely calmed down by now.

it was just as she had said. as long as aijia wasn’t in front of her, as long as she didn’t think about 
those things, she would forget them. all she wanted was an ordinary happiness. that was all.

AI Mengmeng bit her lower lip and looked at him.

Rong Yue directly pulled her hand and stood up. “Alright, let’s go to sleep.”

she then followed him back to the bedroom.

AI Mengmeng calmed down, but because of Rong Yue’s worry, she had a high fever in the second 
half of the night. At about eight o ‘clock in the morning, AI Mengmeng felt that the person beside 
her was very, very hot. She was shocked and immediately sat up.

she reached out and felt rong yue’s forehead. it was hot, and his face had an abnormal flush.

He had a high fever.

“Rongyue,” AI Mengmeng shook him.

rong yue opened his eyes with some difficulty, and his voice was also extremely hoarse.”what’s 
wrong?”

ai mengmeng looked like she was about to cry. ” you have a fever. it’s very hot. i’ll go get the 
thermometer. ”



She had been taking care of him for a long time. She was panicking, but she knew what to do now.

Crying was the most useless thing, and she chose to do things while crying.

Very quickly, she brought the thermometer over and swiftly placed it under Rong Yue’s armpit. 
After she was done with everything, she looked up at him and said, ” “How are you?”

Rong Yue was a little weak, and he felt very uncomfortable. He was very dizzy.

However, he still gave her a comforting smile. it’s alright. You’re not that pampered.

ai mengmeng didn’t say anything. she just stared at the thermometer, as if that small thing could 
decide her fate.

Rong Yue also looked at her and just smiled.

About two minutes later, she carefully took out the thing. When it touched his skin, she felt an 
abnormal heat.

AI Mengmeng’s nose twitched, and she suddenly regretted it.

she shouldn’t have stood at the door last night. if she hadn’t made a fuss and went out to order 
skewers, she wouldn’t have met ai jia and rong yue wouldn’t have been in such a miserable state.

AI Mengmeng’s heart was filled with regret. With tears in her eyes, she looked down at the 
thermometer.

40 degrees.

Her heart sank. To Rong Yue, this temperature was fatal. He had to go to the hospital immediately.

” rongyue, can you walk? if you can, i’ll drive to the hospital now. ” She held him and asked softly.



rong yue closed his eyes and nodded gently.”i should be fine after resting for a while.”
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Rong Yue closed his eyes and nodded gently.”I should be fine after resting for a while.”

He was probably very weak, so he did not open his eyes. He only moved his hand, and finally found 
her hand. He held it gently, and his voice was hoarse and gentle.”Are you crying, silly?”

AI Mengmeng sniffled. I’m not crying. I’ll go get some clothes. Rongyue, don’t sleep. Wait for me.

he hummed in acknowledgment and pinched her.

However, when AI Mengmeng took the clothes back, she saw Rong Yue’s head tilted to the side, 
and his face seemed to be even redder.

no matter how she called out, she couldn’t wake up.

...

he fell into a coma.

In the chaos, AI Mengmeng didn’t know if she had cried or who she had called. She didn’t even 
know how long it had been before she went to the hospital.

Qin Chen came out of the examination room and told her that Rong Yue had acute pneumonia 
because he had caught a cold and was tired.

ai mengmeng bit her lip, unable to speak for a long time.



there’s no danger to his life, but he can’t take it. It’s best if he doesn’t work and recuperates. Qin 
Chen opened the list and looked up after a while. “is he still writing the script?”

“Probably not.” AI Mengmeng shook her head.

Qin Chen’s gaze deepened,”you don’t know?” Rong Yue can’t be tired with his illness.”

“I’ll tell him,” AI Mengmeng said, lowering her eyes.

Qin Chen smiled faintly, then wrote a list for the nurse to get his medicine and get an IV drip. He 
then continued to talk to AI Mengmeng.”I’ll have to stay for a week this time. It’s a little serious.”

She paused. Rong Yue’s health is not good. It’s best if he doesn’t go on a trip. He should stay in B 
city.

AI Mengmeng’s heart skipped a beat, and she immediately asked Qin Chen, ” “he can’t travel?”

qin chen smiled. ” of course, who can be responsible for his health? besides, his illness can only be 
controlled by sheng yuan. staying in B city is the best choice. i don’t usually go abroad. ”

she had not left the country since many years ago.

Everyone had a little secret in their heart, and Qin Chen was no exception.

and lan yu didn’t know this either.

they were husband and wife, it was good to have some little secrets.

After Qin Chen finished speaking, AI Mengmeng was dumbfounded.”we were just talking about 
moving to city H last night.”

qin chen glanced at her and smiled. ” but there’s no doctor suitable for rong yue in city H. ”



his gaze was fixed on ai mengmeng, then he sighed. I don’t have any other intentions. However, 
Rong Yue and he Huan had a little relationship before. Qin MO will definitely take care of them. 
You can do as you see fit.

ai mengmeng was stunned again.

Then, she returned to the ward.

rong yue had a brief moment of consciousness. when he saw her come in, he smiled weakly.

However, he did not say anything.

ai mengmeng knew that he was feeling very uncomfortable. his illness had been tormenting him. 
perhaps he felt uncomfortable all the time, but he had to bear with it all by himself. only she felt 
very blessed.

It was because everything she enjoyed was exchanged for Rong Yue’s health.

Qin Chen asked her if Rong Yue had written a script. She didn’t know, but now she thought that he 
should have written it so that she could live a better life.

all of a sudden, she felt that she was very selfish.

He was really too selfish.

AI Mengmeng sat beside him and held his hand. His hand was very hot.

rong yue just looked at her quietly.

ai mengmeng’s voice was very low. ” rongyue, we’re not moving. we’ll stay in B city. ”

He still looked at her gently, and after a long time, he smiled weakly.”Why did you change your 
mind?”
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he still looked at her gently, and after a long time, he smiled weakly.”Why did you change your 
mind?”

AI Mengmeng was also looking at him. Suddenly, she shook her head hard, unable to stand herself.

He was so good, so good, always thinking for her, but she was still living in the past.

“no, i just can’t bear to leave this place,” she said in a very low voice.

Rong Yue’s gaze was gentle, but it seemed to be able to penetrate people’s hearts.

he was quiet for a long time before he held her hand.”we’ll talk about it when we get home.”

...

ai mengmeng shook her head vigorously. ” rongyue, i’m not leaving. i’ll stay here and not go 
anywhere. this time, listen to me. ”

He smiled and then closed his eyes again.

Just then, the nurse came over and saw Rong Yue closing his eyes while AI Mengmeng was crying.

They were also experienced staff at the hospital. The nurse had seen many jokes before, so she 
wouldn’t let go of the opportunity to tease him. why are you crying again? the water is free too.

rong yue was very famous. he was talented and handsome.ai mengmeng’s recent movie was also 
very popular. many people didn’t like her before, but after this movie, ai mengmeng’s reputation 
was completely cleared.



now, she was crying so miserably while guarding rong yue. the young nurses felt that this girl was 
really very cute.

ai mengmeng was embarrassed by the nurse’s teasing.

Her eyes were red, and she didn’t dare to cry anymore. She got up and let the nurse put her on the 
drip.

When she got up, Rong Yue pulled her hand and said nothing.

After the drip, Rong Yue’s fever finally subsided. However, he continued to sleep, looking very 
tired.

AI Mengmeng kept staring into his eyes, afraid that he would disappear.

She would never wake up.

Time passed little by little, like torture.

she didn’t eat or sleep and just stayed by his side.

As long as there was any movement, she would immediately look at him, for fear of missing 
Yingluo.

Rong Yue only woke up in the evening.

When she woke up, she saw AI Mengmeng sitting there, her eyes red.

His Adam’s apple bobbed, and his voice was particularly hoarse. have you eaten? ”

at first, she was stunned, but then she shook her head. ” “i’m not hungry.”

“what time is it?” Rong Yue turned his head.



“it’s five in the afternoon,” ai mengmeng bit her lower lip.

rong yue quietly looked out of the window, as if he was lost in thought. after a while, he whispered, 
” “it’s getting dark. i’ve been sleeping the whole day. what happened today?”

As he spoke, he turned around and looked at her quietly.

AI Mengmeng shook her head.

Rong Yue smiled again. it’s already so late. Why aren’t you hungry? how can there be such a stupid 
person? ”

“i’m not stupid.” she said stupidly.

Rong Yue was probably too tired. He closed his eyes and said, ” I’m hungry, Yingluo. Go get two 
sets of food and we’ll eat together.

when ai mengmeng heard that he wanted to eat, she immediately ordered a meal.

after ordering, she realized that rong yue had fallen asleep again.

she waited patiently and then wrung a towel to wipe his body again.

after that, the food came, but rong yue still did not wake up.

Qin Chen was shocked and came over to check, then said meaningfully, ” “He’s probably too tired!”

AI Mengmeng didn’t know why, but she felt guilty.

Qin Chen didn’t say anything else. After all, this was a matter between a married couple. It wasn’t 
like he was a monk when he fell sick.
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