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the streets were filled with neon lights. she walked slowly and realized that she had not 
been in such a state of mind for a long time. 

All these years, she had been busy making money and taking care of ye Jie, so she 
was actually a little tired. 

it was a rare moment of relaxation, and even the small lights on the street were flashing 
in an unusually cute way. 

Su mu stomped his feet and looked at the small lamps quietly. 

her eyes suddenly stopped at a high-class restaurant by the road. 

She saw Shen Wenxuan through the glass. 

... 

He was sitting face to face with a young and delicate woman. The woman had an elder 
beside her, while Shen Wenxuan had Shen Wenyuan beside him. 

B city was so big, but she had seen it. 

this was the blind date ye xiangnan told her about, right? 

su mu stood there quietly and didn’t move his eyes away for a long time. 

until the person inside the glass noticed her and looked over. 

shen wenxuan’s eyes were filled with confusion and a hint of pain. 

he said a few words to the people around him and ran out, quickly walking to her. 

he was standing in front of the bright lights with her. 

Their eyes met, and su mu broke the silence.”a blind date?” 

shen wenxuan did not deny it. with his hands in his pockets, he chuckled.”yes, what 
about you? i heard you went to work.” 



“yes, i work in a newspaper company.” After saying that, su mu looked around the 
dining room. 

Shen Wenyuan’s eyes looked like she wanted to eat her! 

“Go back, they’re still waiting for you.” She smiled. 

“what about you?” shen wenxuan asked, staring at her. 

“I’m going to take a walk.” “hurry up. it’s not good to leave the guests behind,” su mu 
said with a smile. 

in the end, shen wenxuan left. 

In the restaurant, Shen Wenyuan naturally wouldn’t say anything nice about su mu. 
While cutting the high-quality steak, she said softly, ” that was Wen Xuan’s University 
classmate in the past. She’s not a very good person. She had an affair before she 
graduated and got pregnant. Isn’t that a little too much? I’ve always told Wen Xuan not 
to date such a person. Wen Xuan pitied her but our Wen Xuan is too soft-hearted and I 
heard that he would even help her sometimes. What can we do? his family and 
business are being targeted by others. 

The girl opposite her was quite well-mannered, and her eyes widened. there’s such a 
person? I must remind him to be careful. 

she smiled shyly as she spoke. 

Shen Wenyuan knew that the other party had intentions. 

This was to be expected. Wen Xuan was outstanding, had a refined appearance, and 
had a good character. He was well-liked by girls. If he had not been waiting for su mu all 
these years, he would have gotten married and started his own career. 

Now, Wen Xuan finally understood. As long as he understood, what kind of girl could he 
not find? 

She would rather die than fall for that su mu. He was so dry and meatless that he could 
not be considered good-looking. She did not know what Wen Xuan wanted from her, 
and she even heard that her family was becoming more and more unreliable. 

Thankfully, that woman was not with Wen Xuan or she would not have let her parents 
down! 

When Shen Wenxuan came back, the girl chatted with him for a while. Although she 
was polite, Shen Wenxuan could tell that she didn’t agree with su mu. 



shen wenxuan looked at his sister quietly and didn’t say anything. he didn’t reject the 
girl either. his intention was to continue dating her. 

However, he wasn’t very enthusiastic after that. 

This relationship, which could not be called a relationship, ended in a few months. Not 
only did it fade, but it was also because of ye Hui’s intervention. 
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su mu watched as shen wenxuan walked in. then, she walked forward slowly on her 
own. 

it was just that the mood just now was gone, and it became a little heavy. 

After all, he was someone she had liked when she was young. Even if they were 
unlikely to be together in the future, she still felt a little emotional when she saw him 
going on blind dates. 

it was the same feeling he had when he saw her with ye xiangnan. 

Su mu raised his head and looked at those little lights. A layer of mist appeared in his 
eyes. 

At that time, he must have felt a little sad. 

... 

Sometimes, people were just like that. Even though they were still here, they still liked 
each other. 

however, things changed with the passage of time and they could no longer be 
together. 

They had once been deeply in love with each other and had waited for each other with a 
tacit understanding. However, when they realized that their existence would bring pain 
to each other, the only choice was to let go. 

while su mu was lost in his thoughts, ye xiangnan had been sitting in the car. 

He kept looking at her. 

he watched her in pain, and he watched her grieve over another man. 



This was a fatal blow to the arrogant President ye. 

How was he inferior to Shen Wenxuan? 

he could understand if something had happened between her and shen wenxuan. 

Was it worth remembering that little incident in school? he had been with Qin yihuan for 
so many years, but he still let it go. 

ye xiangnan also looked at su mu quietly with his hands on the window sill. 

he wanted to see when she would notice him. 

However, su mu did not notice him at all. 

She only had Shen Wenxuan in her heart. 

Ye xiangnan felt that he was being too cheap. Su mu was not even qualified to be the 
receptionist of his company with his looks. Why did he have to be with her outside when 
he couldn’t find any fun? 

ye xiangnan thought about it and stepped on the gas. 

A white Bentley whizzed past su mu. Su MU’s eyes flashed and he looked over. 

She wasn’t sure if she had seen ye xiangnan’s car, but the license plate was really 
similar. Also, she heard that this Bentley was rare in B city. 

If she missed Nan at night, would he have followed her? 

He was really abnormal. 

Su MU’s sad mood was also diluted. He cooked a bowl of noodles for himself after he 
went back and read the information while eating. 

The information that sister Hong had given her was very useful and complete. She was 
engrossed in it and before she knew it, it was already 10:30 in the evening. 

By the time she finished half of the noodles, the other half had already turned cold. 

Su mu was not in the mood to continue eating. He poured the noodles out and washed 
the bowls. Then, he went to the bathroom to take a shower and blow-dry his hair. When 
he was eating, there was a knock on the door. 

she furrowed her brows, unable to think of anyone who would come looking for her at 
this time. 



She was stunned when she looked through the peephole. 

He thought of the South at night. 

What was he doing here? 

She didn’t want to open the door. She leaned against the door as if it could give her a 
sense of security. 

however, she couldn’t pretend just because she wasn’t there. ye xiangnan dialed her 
phone, and the phone on the table rang. the soundproofing here was not good, so 
people outside would definitely hear it. 

su mu went over and answered the call. he said in a low voice, ” “What are you doing, 
Ye Xiang Nan?” 

was the wine outside not good, or was the beauty not good looking? 

What are you doing here? 

“open the door,” ye xiangnan said in a hoarse voice. 

su mu didn’t know how to turn on the phone, so she hung up and turned it off. 

She thought that if she ignored him and went to sleep, he would not be able to do 
anything to her. 

However, she had really underestimated President ye’s shamelessness. She had just 
returned to her room when he kicked her door with all his might, his voice deafening. 
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She was sure that everyone upstairs and downstairs could hear her. 

su mu didn’t want to pay attention to him, but he couldn’t ignore the fact that it would 
affect her desire to continue living here. 

so, she ran out, opened the door, and dragged ye xiangnan in. 

As soon as she entered, she smelled the alcohol on him and frowned. “Did you drink?” 

then how did he get here? 



ye xiangnan pressed su mu against the door like an eagle pouncing on a chick. he 
couldn’t say that he was drunk after drinking some wine, but he felt a little lazy. 

... 

he looked at her with hatred. 

su mu had no idea how he had offended him. was it because of shen wenxuan? 

She bit her lower lip and explained, ” if we really missed each other, we could have lived 
our own lives. There’s no need to tire ourselves out. 

“Let go of me,” she said as she pushed him. 

However, the man had trapped her and did not want to let her go. His expression 
became even more languid, and his hoarse voice was a little seductive. Mrs. Ye, aren’t 
you going to ask me where I went last night? ” 

su mu couldn’t stand his flirtatious attitude. he stretched out his foot and stepped on 
him. it wasn’t a light step. 

ye xiangnan stepped aside and chuckled, ” “You hate me that much?” 

he went to the dining table and sat down in the small dining room. he stretched out his 
long arms and legs. ” make me a bowl of noodles. ” 

as he spoke, he lit a cigarette and took a puff. 

his attitude was as if he was treating this place as his own home. 

Su mu was speechless and glared at him. you go home.” 

“I’m drunk, and you want me to drive?” He asked in return and evilly blew out a ring of 
smoke, which happened to land on su MU’s face. 

su mu dodged, but he still choked. 

Ye xiangnan chuckled and grabbed her wrist with the hand that was holding the 
cigarette. 

Su mu was afraid that the cigarette would burn him, so he did not dare to struggle. He 
was pulled over in an intimate way. 

“You’ve taken a bath?” he smelled her hair and thought it smelled good. 

She was quite thin, so it was just right to carry her. 



su mu couldn’t resist him at all. he struggled free and glared at him.”Ye xiangnan, what 
do you want to do?” 

He smiled and asked very slowly, ” “What do you want me to do?” 

su mu was still glaring at him. he smiled and said in a friendly manner, ” “Go and cook a 
bowl of noodles for me.” 

“you can leave after you’re done eating.” she had a non-negotiable look on her face. 

ye xiangnan chuckled. ” look at you. you can’t get shen wenxuan off your mind, but 
you’re so cruel to me. su mu, you’re too double-standard. besides, i’m your legal 
husband. ” 

su mu glared at him. 

“Go cook some noodles, I’m hungry,” ye xiangnan said with a faint smile. 

He hadn’t had dinner yet. After drinking two glasses of wine, he really wasn’t in the 
mood to come over. 

He disliked this place as well, but he had no choice since su mu was here. 

su mu glared at him for a long time, and he stretched out his arms and legs, as if he 
owed su mu. 

she was so angry that she went to cook noodles, only begging him to leave after eating. 

Su MU’s cooking skills were actually not bad. The simple noodles were also fragrant. 

Ye xiangnan lit another cigarette while he was eating. Su mu opened the window a 
little.”Can you not smoke here in the future?” 

After she finished speaking, he looked at her with a clear gaze. 

Su mu pursed his lips. why are you looking at me like that? ” 

“you said in the future.” Ye xiangnan didn’t eat much, so he pushed the bowl away and 
started to smoke. 

he knew that she was choking, so he opened the window. 

After a day of meetings, his smoking addiction kicked in. 
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The window was opened, and the cool air from outside immediately seeped in. Su mu 
let out a t-breath. 

ye xiangnan put out the cigarette and closed the window, ” “You’re too weak to stand up 
to the wind.” 

he looked around again and complained,”the house is empty.” 

Su mu didn’t feel inferior. no one asked you to come. You can leave now.” 

Ye xiangnan played with a cigarette in his hand, but he didn’t light it. He looked at her 
and said with a smile, ” it’s Mrs. Ye’s right not to ask about what happened last night. 

he seemed to have recalled something. ” of course, i’ve got something on you today. su 
mu, we’re even. ” 

... 

“How can that be the same?” su mu said without thinking. 

She regretted it immediately and wanted to bite off her tongue. 

ye xiangnan’s eyes were sparkling. 

Su mu stopped talking. He leaned against the wall and looked a little tired. 

Ye xiangnan picked up the stack of documents on the table. you’re reading this when 
you’re back. Su mu, do you have to work so hard? why do you have to be a 
professional woman instead of being a good Mrs. Ye? tell me how much you make in a 
month and I’ll pay you ten times. Just make ye Jie happy at home. 

in the end, he was just discriminating against women. su mu didn’t want to talk to him 
about this. 

ye xiangnan was reading the files carefully. after a few pages, he looked up at su mu 
and said, ” ” are you really going to do this? do you know that this industry has a certain 
degree of danger? ” 

su mu pursed his lower lips and said,”someone has to do it. this job …” 

Without waiting for her to finish, ye xiangnan put the documents on the table and said in 
a cold voice, ” ” being a paparazzi is better than doing this. that zhuo guy is doing a 
good job. in the future, i’ll send you news and you can just write it. ” 



su mu felt that he had been insulted. was she the kind of person who would pull strings? 
moreover, the paparazzi had really insulted her. 

su mu tidied up the documents. ” when are you leaving? ” 

“i said i’m leaving?” He said shamelessly, ” and su mu, we haven’t finished our 
discussion just now. 

She didn’t appreciate it. there’s no need to discuss it. Ye xiangnan, I’ve told you about 
our certificate. 

he stared at her. 

Su mu suddenly couldn’t go on. She felt helpless. 

after a long while, she said tiredly, ” i’ve been working all day. i’m tired. can you let me 
rest? ” 

ye xiangnan was still staring at her. after a moment, he said in a hoarse voice, ” ” you’re 
tired because of shen wenxuan. that’s why you don’t want me to be here. do you want 
to reminisce about the past on a night like this? do you want to reminisce about the 
good times you had with him? ” 

“It’s not related to you.” su mu felt extremely weak. he rubbed his forehead and said, ” 
“Thinking of the South at night, how many times do you want me to say it?” 

what if I tell you that I really want to marry you and be an ordinary couple? are these 
things not attractive to you at all? ” he asked her quietly. 

when he said this, there was not much expression on his face, and he seemed to be 
serious. 

Su mu was stunned. 

Ye xiangnan stood up at this moment and lit a cigarette as he walked out. “you don’t 
have to answer. i know your answer.” 

He opened the door and walked out. 

There was still the smell of smoke in the air, which he had just lit. 

Su mu lightly licked his lower lip. He couldn’t believe that he had left just like that. 

would ye xiangnan be so kind? 



she sat for a long time before finally getting up. when she walked to the door, she 
should have locked it from the inside, but for some reason, she wanted to look outside. 

The door opened. 

he was caught and pressed against the dark gray wall. 
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the walls were old and full of dust, and there was a faint moldy smell. usually, young 
master ye would care about the environment and mood, but at this time, he couldn’t 
care less about it. 

ye xiangnan pressed his forehead against hers, his voice hoarse, ” “Why would I fall for 
such an ordinary woman like you?” 

after that, he kicked the door open. 

that night, he was so overbearing that he did not allow her to think about shen wenxuan. 

she was his wife. she was not allowed to think or be sad when other men went on blind 
dates. 

late at night. 

... 

Su mu leaned on his shoulder and was lost in his thoughts. 

She was wondering what her relationship with ye xiangnan was now. She kept saying 
that their marriage certificate was just a piece of paper, but Yingluo knew that they were 
already together. 

The only thing left was to move to the same place. 

they were either at his place or here with her. 

She turned over. 

Ye xiangnan didn’t sleep either, and his voice was light.”What are you thinking about?” 

Su mu swallowed the words he blurted out. 

she wanted to give in, but her pride did not allow her to. 



in the end, she didn’t say anything and fell asleep in his arms. 

Ye xiangnan lowered his head and gave a faint smile. He wasn’t used to the small bed, 
but su MU’s hair smelled nice. He finally fell asleep after half an hour. 

At dawn, they got up like an old couple. Su mu made two sets of breakfast. 

Ye xiangnan wasn’t picky, but his expensive clothes didn’t fit in here, especially when su 
mu served him breakfast. He felt like a waiter in a small restaurant. 

Young master ye’s appearance, clothing, and taste were all of the highest quality. She 
was not worthy of standing next to him. 

ye xiangnan didn’t care. after breakfast, he said lightly, ” “i’ll help you move your things 
tonight?” 

It was rare for him to be so accommodating. He could let others do these things, but 
because some things were private and she was his wife, he was not willing to let others 
do it. 

su mu looked at him for a while and still refused, ” “I’m fine staying here.” 

ye xiangnan frowned. ” then what do you think i am? A free lover? it’s easy to use and 
can be called at any time.” 

“I didn’t call you, you came on your own.” after saying that, su mu felt that his words 
were quite mean. 

Last night, she did have a moment of impulse to be husband and wife with him, but now 
that she had calmed down, she realized that they were indeed not suitable for each 
other. 

hence, she retreated. 

She thought that he was probably feeling excited or something new. He must get her 
and make her obedient. 

in fact, wasn’t this good? although he didn’t say it in such a bad way, it was good that 
they were like this. no one needed to take responsibility. 

he was an adult now, and he had a certificate. 

It was pretty good. 

Su MU’s expression showed what she meant. 



Ye xiangnan was a little embarrassed. 

yes, young master ye was ashamed and angry. 

He had always taken pleasure in other people. When had a woman not taken him 
seriously? 

he stared at her coldly. ” you’re so open-minded, mrs. ye. ” 

“Don’t call me that.” “wouldn’t it be more convenient for you to stay single?” she asked 
as she ate her egg roll. 

” i told you, i didn’t do anything the night before, ” he said. ” i only did what i saw in the 
photos. ” 

“Wouldn’t that be considered cheating?” Su mu said softly, ” I’ve talked to Shen 
Wenxuan for a while, but you’re always like that. You’ve been hugging women in bars 
and drinking together. You can cheat on me at any time. I think we’re fine like this. 
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ye xiangnan felt that he could not communicate with her at all. this woman simply did 
not know what was good for her. 

he had deliberately given her a cold shoulder. 

So, he went downstairs. 

fortunately, he was not so low-class that he finally sent su mu to the newspaper she 
worked for. 

“just stop at the intersection ahead.” Su mu said softly. 

ye xiangnan looked at the signboard of the newspaper in front of him and said, ” “i can’t 
be seen?” 

... 

“no.” Su mu bit his lower lip and said, I just think it’s too ostentatious. 

He was driving a limited edition Bentley that cost more than 20 million Yuan. It would 
not be good if anyone saw him. 



Ye xiangnan looked at her. if you marry into the ye family, you won’t feel that it’s 
ostentatious anymore. 

Su MU’s expression was a little complicated and he didn’t say anything else. 

Ye xiangnan stopped the car at the intersection. Su mu opened the door and got out of 
the car. He rolled down the window, but he didn’t say anything with a dark face. 

He couldn’t possibly curry favor with a woman. 

Ye xiangnan pursed his lips, put on his sunglasses, and slowly drove away. 

It took su mu about five minutes to walk to the newspaper office from the place where 
he got off the car and he had to cross the road. 

When she was crossing the road, someone patted her on the back, and then Xiaowen 
walked side by side with her. 

su mu was startled at first, but he smiled when he saw her. 

” i saw you when i got off the bus, ” xiaowen said in a low voice. ” you take a bentley to 
work? ” 

su mu was about to say something when xiao wen said, ” ” don’t tell me that’s not you. 
i’m not seeing things. the driver is a very handsome man. he’s wearing sunglasses and 
his nose is really sharp. su mu, who is that? ” 

Oh, ” su mu replied. I took a ride. That’s the driver. 

xiaowen chuckled. ” the owner of a bentley also does this. the 180 yuan you’re paying 
for the car is not even enough for him to pay for his gas. ” 

su mu looked at little wen. 

Xiaowen suddenly said in a mysterious tone, ” some rich men are just bored. They do 
this to get to know beautiful women. Su mu, you have to be careful. 

Su mu chuckled. I’m so ordinary. Nothing will happen to me. 

“Su mu, you’re actually quite good-looking,” Xiao Wen disagreed. 

Although su mu could only be called delicate and pretty, he seemed to have a good 
figure. He was so thin that people would want to hug him. 

Su mu only smiled when she said that. 



when she arrived at the newspaper office, everyone was looking at her with a strange 
look. su mu was not a blockhead, so he could naturally sense it. 

She and Xiaowen looked at each other, somewhat baffled. 

Xiaowen leaned in. you must’ve been in a luxury car. Someone must’ve seen you. 
They’re all staring at you now. 

She paused for a moment and lowered her voice. I guess they think you’ve been ‘done’ 
by some rich man. 

Su mu just looked at her. what? ” 

xiaowen felt that she was really ignorant and coughed lightly. ” “It means to be my 
mistress!” 

su mu responded with an “oh” and lowered his head to look at himself.”if someone really 
did hire me, i wouldn’t have to work here. i would have enjoyed my life a long time ago.” 

you’re right. Xiao Wen supported her chin with her hand. besides, I don’t think you’re 
that kind of person. 

“i’ve always felt that you’re the kind of person who’ll get rich and then find a man to 
ruthlessly sleep with.” xiaowen joked. 

su mu’s expression was hard to describe in a few words. he sat down and concentrated 
on reading the information. 

She had heard from sister Hong that she would be going on a business trip in two or 
three days. If she couldn’t go out, she wouldn’t know how to do anything. 

At this moment, the chief editor also came to work. Suddenly, no one dared to laugh 
anymore. 
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Su mu read the materials for a long time. He had a casual lunch at noon and went to the 
tea room to make a cup of tea. He didn’t plan to rest at noon. 

xiaowen said that she was stupid. she only got an internship salary of 4000 yuan. did 
she have to work so hard? 

su mu didn’t care about this. she was a newcomer and had to work harder. 



As she was making tea, a fragrant wind blew past her. 

She looked up and saw du Meili from the entertainment team. 

Du Meili was the editor-in-chief’s favorite and had a special relationship with her. Su mu 
didn’t want to get into trouble, so he greeted her with a smile and a nod. 

... 

However, du Meili seemed to have something to say to her. She leaned against the wall 
and fiddled with her nails. I heard that you work in a Bentley. 

su mu’s eyebrows twitched. he knew that this woman was not easy to deal with and she 
did not come with good intentions. 

but she didn’t know du meili’s intention. 

She pursed her lips and was about to say something when du Meili came over. 

the strong smell of perfume made su mu choke. 

“Can you even eat such a rich man?” du meili snorted. 

Su mu heaved a sigh inwardly. He had probably figured out the other party’s intention. 

she was a little surprised. didn’t xiaowen say that du meili was the chief editor’s 
woman? 

Why? 

Du Meili looked at her expression and was a little annoyed. “It’s fine if you’re not willing, 
what’s the big deal! Who are you trying to show off your aloofness for? if you’re really 
that powerful, you would have already captured a man’s heart and wouldn’t have to 
work here!” 

after she finished speaking, she snorted and left in her high heels. 

su mu was speechless, but he had no choice. 

in the afternoon, the news of su mu being taken care of by a rich man spread like 
wildfire. her colleagues all looked at her with strange eyes, and some of them even 
spoke sourly and in a strange tone. 

sister hong couldn’t stand it anymore. she came out of her private office and lectured 
those few people. then, she called su mu into her office. 



sister hong was extremely strict. she asked su mu to sit on the sofa while she lit a 
cigarette and asked su mu if he wanted one too. su mu said he didn’t smoke. 

sister hong’s smoking posture was very social. she looked very straightforward, but at 
this moment, she looked quite charming. 

she stubbed out her cigarette and looked at su mu. ” is it okay for you to go on a 
business trip here? is your lunch box okay with that? ” i don’t want to go on a business 
trip together. you call me non-stop every night, and there’s no way to get along with me. 
” 

su mu was stunned for a moment and then said in a low voice, ” sister Hong, you’ve 
misunderstood. That’s not a Pixiu. It’s Pixiu this morning. 

She didn’t want to say it, but in order to dispel sister Hong’s doubts, she still said it, ” 
“That’s my husband.” 

“the one who sent you to work?” sister hong tilted her head and asked her. 

Su mu nodded. 

She asked sister Hong to keep it a secret. 

Sister Hong finished her cigarette, her expression thoughtful. After a while, she patted 
her shoulder and said, ” ” alright, as long as you can stop the rumors, i won’t say a 
word. just don’t let it affect my work. ” 

” i know, sister hong. ” su mu nodded. ” i’m going out to work. ” 

Sister Hong patted her on the shoulder. ” sure, su mu. you’re rich and handsome. i’ll 
write a secret book on flirting with men in the future. ” 

Su mu lowered his eyes. I got lost by accident. It’s like this when I have a child. 

sister hong was rather surprised that su mu, who had a dull temperament, was actually 
so avant-garde. 

But then again, su mu didn’t look like he had any skills. 

su mu walked out. xiao wen was a little worried. ” “i didn’t make things difficult for you, 
right?” 

Sister Hong couldn’t stand people who acted coquettishly. 

su mu shook his head. 



Xiaowen felt a little strange. Did sister Hong change her personality? 
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After work, the editor-in-chief announced that they would be going out for dinner, and 
there would be a small group activity after dinner. 

The staff in the club were all very happy. The two groups had about 20 people in total. 
They got a private room in a restaurant and ate until 10 O ‘clock in the evening. 

after the meal, they picked a high-end club to sing at. originally, they wouldn’t have this 
level of singing, but du meili knew a customer and gave him a VIP price. 

her colleagues in the news agency couldn’t help but be envious of her omnipotence, 
and she was full of flattery. 

du meili ran her fingers through her hair, looking like she didn’t care. 

it was very impressive. 

... 

su mu didn’t know what she meant by looking at him, but he didn’t care. 

du meili saw su mu in the bathroom and smiled. ” it’s good to share things you can’t eat 
with others. You’ll get some benefits. 

su muman was speechless. what’s this about being able to eat or not? daydreaming 
about the south wasn’t food. 

She suddenly felt a little angry. She took out a piece of paper from her bag and wrote 
down a phone number to du Meili. 

It was ye xiangnan’s private phone. 

this is a call from me. I want to see if Yingluo is able to eat. After she finished speaking, 
she was about to leave. 

Du Meili pulled her back and dialed a number on her phone. She snorted, ” “i have to 
see if there’s such an account. there are many people who play this kind of trick.” 

the call went through. 

she was a little dazed. 



it really was a real number. 

what surprised her even more was that the phone rang right next to them, which was 
near the bathroom. 

a slender figure came out of the men’s bathroom with a phone in his hand. 

Su mu recognized that it was the one he had bought last time. 

the man was none other than ye xiangnan. 

she wanted to hide in a hole, but she was a little scared. she could only pretend that she 
didn’t see him and quietly turned around to leave. 

“don’t leave.” ye xiangnan stopped her and looked at the phone in his hand. 

and the paper in du meili’s hand. 

It was su MU’s handwriting, which he recognized. 

he squinted his eyes and looked at her quietly, as if he wanted an explanation. 

Su mu forced a smile and said, team leader du, we should go in now. 

She was about to leave when ye xiangnan caught her. shouldn’t I explain it to you? ” 

Su mu was still playing dumb. explain? explain what? ” 

“su mu,” Ye xiangnan glared at her. 

Du Meili was petrified. She didn’t expect su mu to be willing to share. He was such a 
charming and Noble man, but he looked familiar. 

however, du meili wouldn’t let go of any opportunity for a rich and good-looking man. 

Besides, that fatty Zhang fucai had been called home by his wife, so she didn’t need to 
be afraid. 

moreover, if she could hook up with the man in front of her, she could give up 100 
zhang fucais. 

Du Meili revealed her signature smile and leaned forward, trying to let ye xiangnan see 
all her assets. Unfortunately, President ye was an entertainment company and had 
seen all kinds of beautiful women. He couldn’t even compare to the front desk like du 
Meili. At most, she was a little flirtatious. 



he ignored the woman and only stared at su mu, wishing he could take her home 
immediately and teach her a lesson. 

What did she think he was? a woman? 

Ye xiangnan got angry thinking about it and glared at su mu. 

su mu even had the guts to introduce her to him. ” “This is Mr. Ye and this is miss du 
from our newspaper. That’s all.” 

she withdrew her hand and wanted to escape. 
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But ye xiangnan held on to her tightly and said through gritted teeth, ” “What about you? 
why don’t you tell us what our relationship is? Hmm?” 

he was quite curious. how did she talk about him in the news agency? did she say that 
he was a sugar daddy or something? 

congratulations, mr. ye, you’re right. 

Su mu blinked. us? it’s the kind of relationship that people think it is.” 

ye xiangnan angrily shook her hand off and stared at du meili. ” “you’d better forget this 
number.” 

he did not have a good impression of such a woman at all. even now, he wished he 
could strangle su mu, this hateful woman. 

... 

he glared at su mu again and then went to his private room. 

he must have something important to do. otherwise, he would have dealt with her right 
now. 

After he left, du Meili came back to her senses first. Her voice was a little weak.”this 
person is really not easy to serve.” 

Zhang fucai was a little fat. He wasn’t very rich, but he had tender feelings for women. 

The man just now had a strong aura and he was definitely not one who would allow a 
woman to pamper her. Su mu must have suffered a lot in his hands. 



just thinking about it made du meili feel better. 

He wondered what su mu could use to exchange for this bit of vanity. 

she hoped that it was as she thought. the more tragic the better. 

later, they went to the private room together. the atmosphere inside was just right. when 
he saw them enter, he immediately pulled them over to sing and have fun together. 

su mu didn’t drink, but today was a special day, so he still had a small cup. 

Later, when someone came to persuade her, sister Hong helped her block it. 

Everyone could tell that sister Hong liked su mu very much because she usually didn’t 
meddle in other people’s business and didn’t have much contact with the people in the 
club. However, she treated su mu quite special. 

some people even speculated that sister hong had some special feelings for su mu. 

But he only dared to whisper. 

du meili was singing “brother bitter love” on the side. her heart was quite bitter today. 

She had originally wanted to find a rich man, but in the end, she had been ruthlessly 
humiliated. 

She just couldn’t understand why that man would like su mu but not her. 

Which part of her was inferior to su mu? 

as she sang, she looked at su mu, feeling that he had neither a face nor a figure. he 
was nowhere to be found. 

it was too normal. 

Du Meili’s song was even more poignant, and she said something else after that, all of 
which were harsh words. 

sister hong tried to block it a little, but later she also felt that du meili was too 
outrageous. taking advantage of zhang fucai’s love, she seduced other men. zhang 
fucai really couldn’t change his mind. 

sister hong thought to herself,’that person is just like that. he can’t change in this 
lifetime.’ 



Later, Xiao Wen secretly told su mu that Zhang fucai was sister Hong’s ex-husband. He 
divorced Zhang fucai because he had an affair with du Meili. However, du Meili was 
very smart. How could she marry Zhang fucai? 

she hung him up for some benefits while she played outside. 

Compared to du Meili, the editor-in-chief was more innocent. 

Sister Hong had drunk quite a bit of wine and was smoking a cigarette, looking quite 
alluring. 

Su mu felt that it was getting late, but she felt that she had to look after sister Hong. 
Sister Hong usually took good care of her. 

that was why she had to endure it. she didn’t really like this kind of occasion, but since 
she was going to work, she still had to be sociable. 

speaking of which, most of the people working in the newspaper were experts at 
socializing because they usually had to wait on their advertising sponsor’s father. 

Should he accompany her for a drink or say something good? 

that was a must. su mu was not so naïve as to think that it was enough as long as the 
interview was done well. the drinking culture was prevalent everywhere. 
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Sister Hong turned around and cast a glance at her. She probably guessed su MU’s 
thoughts and smiled.”I’m fine. You can go back first if you want to. This little bit of wine 
is nothing to me.” 

Su mu nodded and planned to go back first. She went to bed very early. 

du meili said, ” are you here to accompany Mr. Ye? su mu, why don’t you introduce him 
to us? ” 

su mu felt that she was going on and on. was it because every man had not shown 
interest in her that she would not give up? 

Su mu wanted to ignore her, but he had to. 

“senior du, he’s just my friend. There’s no such thing as accompanying or not.” 

... 



She regretted giving her ye xiangnan’s phone number in a fit of anger. 

but now, they would be entangled in the future. 

She didn’t even know if ye xiangnan would punish her when he got drunk later. 

Su mu thought that if her family could trust her, she would definitely hide tonight. But 
she was alone and there was no way to hide. 

Besides, she was in the wrong tonight. With his status, she shouldn’t have given his 
number to du Meili no matter how angry she was. He was angry with her. 

thinking about it, su mu had a headache. 

Du Meili was in a bad mood, so she wouldn’t listen to her and force her to drink. 

Sister Hong was unhappy and her face turned cold.”Du Meili, there’s a limit to your 
jokes. Don’t bully su mu just because he’s honest.” 

Du Meili was sister Hong’s nemesis. She was wearing a tight-fitting dress and leaning 
against the sofa. She flipped her long wavy hair and said, ” sister Hong, don’t you hate 
mistresses the most? su mu has become her mistress, and he’s an especially rich one 
at that. Aren’t you going to do something about it? ” 

as she spoke, she laughed mockingly.”Don’t you hate evil the most?” 

sister hong was an experienced person and wouldn’t be frightened by a few words. she 
lit another cigarette and smoked.”who told you that su mu is a mistress? du meili, don’t 
think that everyone in the world is a mistress.” 

Du Meili smiled and ran her fingers through her hair. her sugar daddy is right here. I 
don’t know which private room he is in. Anyway, su mu has offended him today. If he’s 
in a hurry to go back and please him, I wonder if he’ll be skinned alive. 

as she spoke, she laughed exaggeratedly and gloated at his misfortune. 

xiaowen said in a low voice,”ignore her.” you’re mentally ill.” 

Sister Hong directly said, ” du Meili, you don’t have a psychological problem, do you? if 
you’re sick, you can go to see Zhang fucai. Zhang fucai will definitely approve your 
leave. 

more than 20 people stood in line in order to make sure that zhang fucai and the other 
man would fight again. 



However, people were realistic and stood on du Meili’s side. After all, sister Hong and 
the chief editor had already divorced. 

and du meili was now the chief editor’s favorite. 

For a moment, the private room was in a mess. Most of them were blaming su mu, the 
third. 

Sister Hong looked at her, wondering if she should continue hiding and clarify her 
identity. 

Su mu didn’t think it was necessary. Sister Hong didn’t know ye xiangnan’s identity. If 
she told him about it, it would be more troublesome than being a mistress. 

At this moment, the door of the private room suddenly opened. 

The person who came in surprised everyone, especially du Meili. 

She stopped singing The Love Song and looked at ye xiangnan pitifully, as if asking if 
he was looking for her. 

ye xiangnan couldn’t care less about her. he said something to her on the phone and 
then looked at su mu.”mom called to say that ye jie has a low fever and asked for mom. 
are you done here? Come with me to the old residence.” 

 

 


