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Chapter 5291: Is this son mine?(4)

There was only one possibility-the child was Yingluo’s, that crude-looking man’s, child.

and it was the one that had beaten up his son.

“This child doesn’t belong to the Lin family, does he?” Lin fan’s parents “voices trembled.

seeing that they didn’t want to admit it, master cheng felt that his woman had been insulted. he 
snorted coldly.”Pfft, if your Lin family has this kind of ability, can you even give birth to a child? 
That’s my son.”

the last sentence was full of confidence, but he actually felt a little guilty.

“The child is mine,” sister Hong replied, glancing at him.

...

These words were quite subtle. Although he denied it, it was equivalent to denying that he was a 
pretty boy. No one else but master Cheng had such great ability.

master cheng didn’t dare to look at sister hong and whispered, ” “i will take responsibility.”

Hmph! sister Hong snorted. it’s my own child. What responsibility do I need you to take? ”

Master Cheng was a little scared and lowered his head.

Sister Hong spoke politely to Mr. And Mrs. Lin. Mr. And Mrs. Lin tried to probe, afraid that this 
child would fall for their son. Professor Lin was also a little embarrassed, and his heart ached for 
sister Hong.



He had spent some time with sister Hong and knew her character. He let out a long sigh.

he knew that he had no chance.

professor lin’s parents felt sorry for their son and abhorred scum like master cheng. they tried to 
persuade him.”Young lady, I can see that you are also a person of status. You can’t hang out with 
such a man.”

Sister Hong smiled. I won’t.

master cheng also quickly said, no need, no need. I’m fine squatting inside. It’s suitable for scum 
like me.

The Lin family was a little speechless.

Miss Liu seemed to be quite magnanimous and had a newspaper company. Why did she have such 
unique taste?

in the end, master cheng called xiao mao over and kindly accompanied professor lin to the hospital. 
during this period, professor lin had been taking care of his wife and son for him and had been 
working very hard.

Master Cheng gave another five million Yuan, which was really scary.

Hence, Mr. And Mrs. Lin knew that this boorish man was rich. He was really rich and could get any 
woman.

Since they were from different worlds, they couldn’t be calculative. Mr. And Mrs. Lin didn’t ask for 
the money and left with their son.

professor lin sighed as he left.

Sister Hong was also a little apologetic. However, given today’s situation, she definitely couldn’t 
say that the child was professor Lin’s. Even if she did, no one would believe her.



besides, she wasn’t naive enough to think that love was all that mattered. there were too many ways 
to get married.

When everyone left, Xiao Mao was elated. “sister-in-law, you’ve reconciled with our master cheng, 
right?”

Sister Hong didn’t even look at master Cheng. I have nothing to do with him.

master cheng squatted in the corner. ” i’ll do a good job. take the child and wait for me to come out. 
”

The police officer couldn’t stand it anymore. it’s just eight to ten days. You have the nerve to say 
that.

sister hong left immediately, not even bothering with him.

gritting his teeth, master cheng grinned after a while.”Little Mao, send your sister-in-law off. I’ll 
give you a reward when I come out.”

Xiao Mao was very happy and immediately followed him.

Master Cheng touched his head and squatted down with peace of mind.

Wasn’t it just eight to ten days? after this period of time, sister Hong’s temper would also be over. 
He could move into her villa smoothly. At the thought of having a wife and a child, master Cheng’s 
heart was particularly happy.

however, he was indeed dreaming. sister hong was completely ignoring him.

master cheng came out from inside, full of vigor, especially that thing.

He even listened to Xiao Mao’s suggestion and bought a bouquet of flowers before heading over to 
sister Hong’s place.
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sister hong stood in the courtyard, watching the man climb over the wall.

master cheng specially took a shower and changed his clothes. yo, a spirited young man!

He brought flowers, supplements, and even a big diamond ring to visit his wife and child.

but he missed. where was he?

Master Cheng threw the flowers aside and patted Xiao Mao’s head. “Where is he? I told you to keep 
an eye on him. Where did he go?”

“He was still here last night.” Xiao Mao touched his head.

...

Master Cheng thought for a moment. Oh, then she must have moved back to her original place. I 
also said that it’s inconvenient to move up and down in this villa. It’s not as good as the flat floor 
we used to live in.

when master cheng went over, sister hong had indeed moved back.

however, she was not at home. she had gone to the news agency.

master cheng was too shy to go over and look for her, so he sat in the car and waited.

The chauffeur Only sent sister Hong back at eight in the evening. She didn’t usually go to the news 
agency, but today was the day of her bonus, so she had to go.

sister hong looked at master cheng and smiled. ” you’re out? ”



“madam, i’m back,” master cheng said respectfully.

sister hong held her stomach and smiled gently.”Who’s your wife?”

She walked toward the elevator, and master Cheng followed her like a Wolf.

sister hong paused for a moment. ” don’t follow me. it’s useless. ”

Master Cheng smiled cheekily and followed her.

In the elevator, sister Hong was holding a bag in her hands. She looked up at the red number above 
her and said softly, ” “Unless you want to have a miscarriage, you really shouldn’t follow me.”

A miscarriage?

master cheng was stunned and stuttered, ” “It’s not that serious! I’m this kid’s father, he only looks 
at me with happiness, how could he have a miscarriage? besides, where else can he go other than 
your stomach? I’m willing to take him in, but where do you think I should be?”

Master Cheng thought that he had said something cheeky, so he touched his head and chuckled. 
Sister Hong looked at him as if she was looking at an idiot.

after a long time, sister hong said softly, ” let’s leave it at that, cheng zheng. actually, you still don’t 
understand. it doesn’t matter who the father of this child is. ”

” why is it not important? it’s especially important to me. ” “woman, why do you keep saying things 
to make me angry?” master cheng’s voice was a little hoarse.

“You’re angry already?” she smiled faintly.

master cheng was about to say something when the elevator door opened. sister hong swiped her 
card and went home.



He also wanted to stick around, but sister Hong stopped him. Cheng Zheng, we’re done.

master cheng was not convinced and said in a rough voice, ” ” you’re pregnant with my child, so 
you’re my woman. and the child is also mine. without me, where would you have a child? ”

Sister Hong didn’t want to bother with him.

She lowered her eyes, her expression indifferent.

master cheng was also a little uncomfortable, and his voice was hoarse.”can’t you give me another 
chance?”

“You’re the one who didn’t want it.” Sister Hong remained calm. Cheng Zheng, do you think that 
everyone else doesn’t have a temper? do you think that you’re the only one who does? ”

He was depressed and did not speak.

don’t follow me, ” sister Hong said in a low voice after a long while. I won’t be with you anymore.

Master Cheng was completely dumbfounded. In his calculations, knowing that his son was his 
meant that they had made up and raised this child together.

in the future, he wouldn’t look for a young lady anymore. he would only treat her well with all his 
heart.

In fact, after he had broken up with her, he had been like that. He would rather face her alone than 
face so many women every day.
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In fact, after he had broken up with her, he had been like that. He would rather face her alone than 
face so many women every day.



“are you serious?” master cheng touched his head.

sister hong pursed her lips and didn’t say anything.

Master Cheng still wanted to squeeze into the apartment, but sister Hong closed the door with force. 
However, perhaps because she had used too much force, her emotions had been agitated, and her 
lower abdomen actually hurt a little.

she clutched her stomach and frowned. her forehead was covered in sweat.

She bit her lip and used all her strength to open the door.

...

when master cheng saw the door open, he was happy at first. ” “i knew you couldn’t bear to part 
with me.”

But just as he finished speaking, he was a little stunned. What was going on?

master cheng was dumbfounded. he supported her. “Is the baby coming?”

sister hong wanted to kill him. she was only a few months old, how could she have a child?

take me to the hospital. Otherwise, I’m going to have a miscarriage. Sister Hong gritted her teeth as 
she felt waves of pain in her stomach.

she was a little scared, and master cheng was even more at a loss. however, he probably thought that 
this child would affect his happiness for the rest of his life, so he carried sister hong downstairs 
without thinking. fortunately, he knew how to take care of women and carried her flat.

His car was big enough, so he put her down carefully. hold on tight, don’t fall down.

after that, he quickly got into the car and drove to the nearest hospital quickly and steadily.



indeed, the fetus had been affected. if they had come a little later, the child would not have been 
saved.

After hearing the doctor’s words, master Cheng was stunned for a long time.

a miscarriage must be very painful!

Master Cheng was stunned for a long time before he said softly,”If the child is gone, I’ll blow up 
your hospital.”

the doctor saw his gangster-like aura and immediately went to the operating room in fear.

Fortunately, the child was lucky and was saved. However, she had to be hospitalized for a few days. 
She had to be especially careful in the future and must not agitate the pregnant woman again.

how would master cheng dare to?

He went to the ward to keep watch and asked Xiao Mao to find the best nutritionist to nourish his 
son and his woman.

Xiao Mao was also quite speechless. What was master Cheng doing?

Sister Hong had yet to wake up, so how was she supposed to get her nutrients?

Besides, in his opinion, sister Hong might not be able to let master Cheng get close to her. This 
time, he almost caused sister Hong to lose her child, so she probably hated him to death.

However, Xiao Mao still went to do as he was told.

Master Cheng stayed by sister Hong’s side, feeling like he had regained something he had lost.

He sat there quietly, feeling satisfied just by looking at her.



She was his woman!

She was pregnant with his child!

Weren’t they getting married?

tie! she could get married however she wanted, as many times as she wanted!

Master Cheng couldn’t wait for her to wake up. He walked back and forth in the ward, wishing he 
could get this done immediately …

a long night brings many dreams!

he waited for her to wake up, but she was still asleep at dawn.

Master Cheng grabbed the doctor and asked him what was going on. The doctor looked at him as if 
he was an idiot.”Isn’t it normal to sleep at night?”

Master Cheng scratched his head. I think so.

Sister Hong only woke up at nine in the morning.

As soon as she opened her eyes, she saw master Cheng, who had shaven his beard cleanly and was 
guarding the door in high spirits, except for the red lines under his eyes.

she looked at him quietly. master cheng was especially manly.”you’re awake. let’s eat something. 
it’s a diet recommended by a special nutritionist. it’s said to be nutritious and won’t make you fat. 
you’re only good for being thin. it’s good to hold you.”

As he said this shamelessly, sister Hong listened quietly without any expression on her face.
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seeing him, sister hong was really angry.

he turned his face to the other side and said in a cold voice, ” “Get lost.”

Seeing this situation, master Cheng immediately rolled to the other side of her face. He didn’t dare 
to provoke her anymore, so he slapped himself repeatedly.”It’s my fault, it’s my fault. I’m sorry. 
Fine, you can ruin me however you want, as long as it doesn’t hurt yourself and the child.”

sister hong looked at him quietly, her eyes a little red.

Master Cheng also felt that he was a little shameless. His eyes were bloodshot and his voice was a 
little rough.”If you don’t want to see me, I’ll get lost. I only beg you to keep the child.”

“This child belongs to both of us. It’s possible that we won’t have another child in the future,” he 
added.

...

As she spoke, she felt a little sad. She wiped her eyes and said, ” I don’t like children, but I like the 
one you gave birth to.

sister hong didn’t know whether to laugh or cry. she didn’t know what to do with him.

she pursed her lips and her voice was soft. ” cheng zheng, if you want to keep this child, then please 
don’t disturb me. i’m afraid that i can’t take this. ”

Hence, master Cheng said, ” Okay, okay, okay. She can do whatever she wants.

however, how could he really leave? his wife and children were here, and he was worried.

There wasn’t any space for him to squat in the ward. Master Cheng had paid the hospital to get him 
a single bed in the corridor. He would squat at the door during the day and sleep there at night, 
afraid that something would happen to sister Hong.



The nurses in the hospital were all panicking because of his behavior, but this God of Fortune threw 
a card worth five million Yuan in the director’s office, and the director accepted it with a smile. He 
treated him like a god of Fortune.

The doctors and nurses looked at master Cheng every day as if he was a new human being. 
Everyone in B city knew that master Cheng was a scumbag. At this time, his look was funny and 
annoying.

su mu and du meili came to see sister hong and saw master cheng squatting at the door. he couldn’t 
wait for sister hong to open the door and see his infatuated look.

su mu found it funny and coughed. ” ” cheng zheng, you eat, drink, pee, and poop here? ”

“yes, there’s a woman who won’t let me in,” master cheng said, feeling aggrieved.

su mu smiled and said, that’s what you should do.

master cheng’s eyes were burning as he rubbed his rough hands. Mumu, why don’t you put in a few 
good words for me? that woman, Liu Hong, doesn’t listen to you the most. I’ll thank you properly 
for helping me with this.

“i can’t afford that.” Su mu sneered,”you’re the one who did it.”

“i can’t wipe it anymore, can i?” master cheng touched his head.

su mu sneered, ” you can only blame yourself. anyway, i only have one thing to say. don’t provoke 
sister hong. ”

I wouldn’t dare. I’m serving her like she’s the Empress, but she doesn’t appreciate it, ” master 
Cheng said in a wronged voice.

Du Meili was disgusted. when you look for the little girl, why don’t you think about whether sister 
Hong will appreciate it or not? if she does, she’ll thank you.



su mu looked at du meili, thinking that she could talk.

du meili was also bold enough to say this. master cheng’s temper was fierce, and she didn’t dare to 
offend him easily.

But now, master Cheng had a son and was as obedient as a cat. She couldn’t help but bully him.

master cheng wanted to explode, but then he thought of the one lying in the ward and sighed.”You 
guys can go in, I can’t go in anyway.”

after saying that, she pitifully squatted in a corner like a stray dog.
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Su mu looked at him and felt that he was like Cheng Zheng when he saw her in the past. She would 
squat there without food and look at others with longing eyes when someone came, hoping that they 
would give her food.

She sighed in her heart. Cheng Zheng was not a bad person. He liked sister Hong too, but he was 
used to being alone since he was young. He did whatever he wanted and did not know how to love 
someone.

Now, he wanted to love, but he had made an unforgivable mistake.

Su mu felt sorry for Cheng Zheng, perhaps from a different perspective.

however, it was even more hateful.

Of course, she would not speak up for him. Sister Hong was a mature woman. Furthermore, when 
sister Hong was suffering in love, she had to endure it all by herself. She had no right to speak up 
for Cheng Zheng.

...



After entering, he closed the door.

master cheng’s eyes turned from eagerness to disappointment, and then to squatting in the corner.

In the ward, sister Hong looked at Gu Anxi and du Meili and smiled. “sorry for letting you guys see 
this.”

“Don’t forgive him!” Du Meili said fiercely. Sister Hong, you’re rich, you have a good figure, 
you’re good-looking, and you’re very charming. It’s only a matter of minutes before you find a man 
with good taste, so don’t think about getting involved with this uncouth fellow anymore. Cheng 
Zheng is like a piece of sticky candy, once you’re attached to her, you can’t get rid of her. ”

“you’re quite emotional,” sister hong smiled as she drank her soup.

du meili sighed. ” i’m doing this for your own good. look at your current condition. i’m so jealous 
of you. why do you still care about him? it’s fine as long as you have money. it’s not like you can 
spend that much money. also, you talked about life and ideals with him, but he turned around and 
looked for a young girl to anger you to death. ”

Sister Hong didn’t say anything more and just drank her soup in silence.

su mu gave du meili a look, and du meili said in a low voice, ” ” i’m sorry, sister hong. i didn’t 
mean to say it. please don’t take it to heart. ”

sister hong smiled. ” no, how could that be? oh right, how’s the club? ”

Du Meili explained the situation, and sister Hong nodded.”I’ll have to trouble you and Zhang fucai 
to pay more attention during this period. Let’s work hard and strive to get listed next year.”

“Really?” du Meili’s eyes widened.

Sister Hong smiled,”why Would I Lie to You?” It’s true. Do it well, and when I give you some 
shares, you’ll have everything. Men won’t be so important anymore.”

Du Meili immediately looked forward to it. Sister Hong was right!



She was excited for a moment, but su mu could tell that sister Hong was changing the topic on 
purpose.

Sister Hong probably did not want to mention Cheng Zheng!

However, du Meili was a fool and couldn’t think of it at all.

su mu didn’t say anything and quietly accompanied sister hong. now that she had married into the 
ye family, there were some things that sister hong relied on her and would more or less discuss with 
her.

du meili tidied up the place and went to buy flowers to put them in order to make sister hong’s 
mood better.

It’s over. She looked at the three-bedroom Ward, at sister Hong’s clothes, and the child in her 
stomach. She felt that it was worth it. A woman’s life was worth it. It really didn’t matter if she had 
a man or not.

After su mu and sister Hong finished their discussion, they stayed for a long time before leaving.

du meili also had work to do, so she left with her. when the nurse was the only one left in the ward, 
sister hong finally calmed down and could think about her relationship with cheng zheng.

she knew that cheng zheng had been living in the corridor and this was probably the most 
embarrassing moment of his life in recent years. she was not touched at all.

how could a woman who had been hurt be touched?
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“Mr. Cheng; please come in for; moment;” she called the nurse;

the young nurse was stunned for a moment before she said softly,”alright, i’ll go get him.”



Sister Hong was still sitting there quietly, a little lost in thought.

When the nurse walked out, master Cheng was still squatting, looking very pitiful.

seeing the nurse come out, master cheng coughed lightly. ” “How are the people inside?”

“he’s asking you to go in,” the nurse said with a smile.

...

Master Cheng was a little confused. you’re really asking me to go in? are you joking? ”

The young nurse turned her head. it’s fine if you don’t want to go. It’s like you’re begging me.

master cheng saw that it didn’t seem like a joke, so he bent over and went.

as soon as she entered, she grinned cheekily. ” did you miss me? ”

He closed the door and rubbed his hands excitedly.

Sister Hong was much better. She had woken up and was standing by the window in White Home 
clothes. She was carefully trimming a bouquet of flowers in her hands.

Master Cheng stood a few steps away from her, looking at her greedily.

in the past, he had only thought that she wasn’t pretty, but later on, he thought that she was very 
charming. but now, he felt that she was like a little angel.

master cheng lowered his head and felt embarrassed. he was already so old, but he still thought it 
was cute.

it was probably because the children in her stomach were balanced out that she looked young!



Master Cheng was overjoyed. He looked at his woman eagerly, his heart full of pride.

sister hong guessed that he was behind her and said softly, ” “I called you here because I want to tell 
you something.”

Master Cheng touched his head and said,”go on.”

sister hong’s eyes drooped. ” i’m preparing to be discharged. before that, i have to make three rules 
with you. ”

when master cheng heard this, he thought that there was a chance, so he immediately stood up 
straight.”Which three chapters? I’m sure I can do it?”

Sister Hong put down the scissors in her hand and turned around.”Really? you can do it?”

Master Cheng puffed up his chest. I’ll be a dog if I lie to you. As long as Madam says it, I’ll do it in 
the future.

Sister Hong looked at him and smiled. then I’ll believe you this once.

Master Cheng rubbed his hands excitedly again. then I’ll help you get discharged. Where are we 
going to live? ”

sister hong nodded and said,”yeah, where do you live?” Cheng Zheng, you have so many houses 
but none of them is our home.”

Master Cheng was a little dumbfounded. There was something wrong with these words.

“the three things i’m talking about,” sister hong said indifferently.

Master Cheng’s heart was about to jump out of his chest as he looked at sister Hong.”Go ahead,”

“First, you can’t follow me.” Sister Hong said softly.



master cheng was completely displeased. ” what are you saying? if i don’t follow you, how can we 
be husband and wife? ”

no one wants to be your wife. Cheng Zheng, don’t you understand? ” sister hong was still calm. ” 
also, since you think you have a part to play in this child, you can see him. you can even accompany 
me for my prenatal examination. however, we won’t be together. after the child is born, you can 
come and see hanhan once a week. ”

“woman, aren’t you going too far?” master cheng was unhappy.

“is that too much?” sister hong asked.

Master Cheng shouted, ” how is it not too much? he’s my son. Why can I only see him once a 
week? ”

“then how many times do you want to see him? I can make the arrangements.” Sister Hong said 
softly.

Master Cheng looked at the woman in front of him as if he had lost his breath, and then he said 
softly, ” “Liu Hong, you’re different from before.”
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she smiled lightly. ” yes, it’s different. cheng zheng, do you think that i will wait for you at home 
forever? wait for you to come back with a perfume smell and pretend that nothing happened? ”

or, even though I know that you don’t want to get married, I still want to be with you. It’s just 
because I think that you’re still immature and don’t know what love is. Sister Hong’s eyes welled 
up with tears. I’ve waited for you many times. I don’t want to wait this time.

She continued very calmly. when the child is older, I can arrange for you two to be together. For 
example, you can stay at your place for a few days. Cheng Zheng, I will try my best to be fair to 
you. This is the biggest compromise I can make.



master cheng gritted his white teeth as he listened.”the biggest compromise! I’m just an uneducated 
person, I don’t understand these things. I only heard him squint and felt that something was wrong. 
You let the child live with me for a short while. Are you going to find a man to live a quick life 
during this time?”

sister hong simply didn’t want to hear these vulgarities. she turned her head and said softly, ” Cheng 
Zheng, I’m still pregnant. Are you really going to say that? ”

master cheng suddenly sobered up. then, he thought about it and realized that he had gone too far.

...

he then recalled what su mu had said. he said that he was always unwilling to accept sister hong’s 
thoughts and life. was this also the reason for their quarrel?

She was educated. He was a rough man, so he could say whatever he wanted.

Sister Hong had her back facing him. Master Cheng felt regretful, so he went over to take a look.

Her nose was a little red. He was frightened. Was he crying?

Master Cheng leaned over to take a look. Sure enough, she was crying.

he suddenly felt particularly uncomfortable and coughed lightly. ” ” you’re already an adult and 
you’re still crying? besides, you were the one who bullied me just now and made me sign that 
humiliating treaty. su mu, tell me, which man can stand this? ”

su mu ignored him and said indifferently,

Cheng Zheng, ” she turned around and said softly, ” if you don’t agree, I have no choice but to go 
abroad.

Overseas?



Master Cheng was stunned.

he really didn’t have a choice if he were to go abroad. his status had long been restricted, and he 
didn’t even know a few words in chinese. how could he adapt to going abroad? besides, there were 
many of his brothers here. he couldn’t just throw away such a big mess.

master cheng reached out and touched his head, feeling quite embarrassed.

“are you serious?” he asked.

Sister Hong didn’t make a sound. She just stood there without tears, but her eyes were red.

master cheng suddenly felt very upset. after a long time, he said in a hoarse voice, ” ” alright, 
alright. i’m scared of you, old lady. it’s just that we can’t live together. my wife and child are mine. 
what am i afraid of? ”

However, he immediately narrowed his eyes. but I won’t allow you to be in contact with that pretty 
boy. Not even for a moment. If I find out, I’ll take the child away.

“Cheng Zheng, do you still have to be so unreasonable?” sister Hong said softly.

“If I’m unreasonable, I won’t agree to such a humiliating condition. Liu Hong, don’t push your 
luck. I’m telling you, I’m just a rough man.” Master Cheng remembered su MU’s words and his 
voice became lower.”Actually, I rarely accommodate others like this.”

Sister Hong looked at him quietly and said in a faint voice, ” “Then I’ll thank you.”

Chapter 5298: he always made her angry and cry (2)

These words made master Cheng’s heart turn cold, and he couldn’t describe the feeling.

“as long as you’re happy,” she finally said in a hoarse voice.

Master Cheng probably felt really sad, so he turned around and left.



he squatted at the door and remained silent for a long time.

He knew that this time, he couldn’t use any shameless methods to make her stay. He knew Liu 
Hong’s character to a certain extent. If she said she didn’t want it, she really didn’t want it. If she 
said she wanted to go abroad, she would really go abroad.

master cheng didn’t want his son to have a blond foreigner as his father. he also didn’t want liu 
hong to have a foreigner as her man. he couldn’t accept the thought of his woman being with a 
foreigner.

...

Alright, alright, just stay in B city. She said that anything was fine.

If sister Hong doesn’t want him to stay at her place, then it’s easy. He can just buy an apartment 
downstairs and live there every day.

So today, master Cheng drove her back, carefully helped her to sit on the sofa, and attentively 
poured her a glass of water. After observing that the Auntie here was reliable, he carefully and 
obsequiously said, ” “um, i’ll go back first.”

“Alright.” Sister Hong looked at him and smiled faintly.

master cheng added,”i live downstairs. call me if you need anything.”

sister hong’s expression didn’t look good. master cheng immediately said,”I’ll install a Bell 
tomorrow. If you want to see me or if you’re thinking of a man, I’ll be there at any time.”

At this moment, the Auntie came over with a plate of cut fruits. She couldn’t stand it anymore and 
coughed lightly.

“i mean, the child misses me, right?” master cheng immediately changed his words.

“You bought it downstairs. I remember there’s someone living there,” sister Hong said quietly.



“i’ll double the price, of course they’ll be willing.” as usual, master cheng settled things with 
money. sister hong was so angry that she didn’t say anything and just sipped her tea calmly.

master cheng saw her expression and realized that it had been a long time since he had spoken to 
her in such a soft voice. for a moment, a desire rose in his heart. he hoped that she would talk to him 
more, even if it was to scold him.

Sister Hong didn’t want to argue with him. After drinking half a glass of water, she said that she 
wanted to rest. The Auntie helped her up. Master Cheng immediately said,”i’ll do this kind of rough 
work.”

Sister Hong glanced at him, and he stood still obediently. He looked a little helpless.

The Auntie helped sister Hong into the bedroom and smiled. Mr. Cheng is so big, but he’s actually 
quite afraid of you.

sister hong lay down and after feeling comfortable, she said, ” “He’s not afraid of me, he’s just 
doing something that he’s guilty of.”

She was dazed for a moment before she said softly, ” “He’s always been like this. When he’s better, 
he’ll be like before.”

The Auntie covered her with the blanket and said softly, ” “if you really can’t take it, you can live 
on your own. you have a child anyway, and you have money and status. you don’t have to worry 
about not being able to find a good man.”

Sister Hong smiled bitterly.

it was easier said than done. as long as cheng zheng refused to give in and kept pestering her, no 
matter which man she found, it would be ruined. now that she said that they would have children in 
the future, their quarrel would be even uglier.

She was pregnant now and did not want to think about these things. She just wanted to be alone for 
the time being.



Seeing that she had laid down, the helper tidied up everything before going out.

Master Cheng was still standing there alone.

it looked like a big cat.

The Auntie smiled. Mr. Cheng, you haven’t left yet? ”

Master Cheng’s voice was a little soft and gentle.”She’s asleep?”

“yes, he’s sleeping.” the auntie nodded her head in all seriousness.
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“That’s good. How’s the child?” master Cheng touched his head.

the auntie laughed again. ” how can you tell? the child is still young. besides, it’s in the stomach. 
how can you tell with the naked eye? ”

“that’s true,” master cheng nodded in agreement.

On second thought, the prenatal examination was in half a month’s time, and he would accompany 
her. Wouldn’t she be able to see the baby then?

master cheng liked sons. sons were strong and could withstand falls. after giving birth to a son, he 
would have his most precious little daughter. this way, the older brother could protect his younger 
sister.

but later, master cheng thought sadly,’i can’t even touch it, what’s the point of giving birth!’

...

master cheng’s heart was cold. he went downstairs while she was sleeping.



xiao mao was cleaning his new apartment. the apartment was decorated in a very heartwarming 
manner. it was pink and girlish. it was a little funny for a man like him to live in it, but he thought 
about it. if liu hong came over one day, she would definitely be happy.

Master Cheng sat on the sofa and asked about the situation in the small fur farm. Xiao Mao 
explained in detail.

Master Cheng was stunned. why do you speak like a woman? be normal. How can you do great 
things in the future? ”

Xiao Mao immediately returned to normal. Master Cheng: that’s more like it. Take the people 
around me as an example. Although they’re my people, don’t make them look like eunuchs all the 
time. They’ll be laughed at.

the little furry monster felt wronged and responded with an “oh.”

Master Cheng asked a few more questions and then closed his eyes.”be careful when you go out. 
that mi guy has run away, so you have to be careful.”

For him to be able to get to where he was today, he also had some skill.

Xiao Mao nodded and said very determinedly, ” I’ve also sent people to protect sister Hong. There 
are capable brothers on the upper floor 24/7.

Master Cheng was surprised. He had not even instructed Xiao Mao to get things done, so he 
nodded. well done. You’re going to do big things.

“Master Cheng, you just said that I’m like a eunuch,” Xiao Mao replied shyly.

Master Cheng saw him coming again and kicked him. “when i go, you and your mother, you’re 
putting on this kind of appearance again. Just like a woman.”

xiao mao smiled and came over. ” do i need women? can you get me a few good ones? ”



master cheng’s bull eyes were wide open. ” do you not want to work anymore? you’re with women. 
your sister hong lives upstairs. ”

“Then take him to the villa. Master Cheng, you can go and relax when you have time.” Xiao Mao 
suggested.

It wasn’t that he wasn’t loyal to sister Hong, but that was just how men were. Sister Hong was 
pregnant and didn’t care about master Cheng. Master Cheng had always been a man who ate a lot of 
meat. If things didn’t go well for a few years, master Cheng would be a vegetarian for a few years.

that was absolutely impossible.

Therefore, Xiao Mao was ready to present the young girl to master Cheng and make him happy.

“Did I say I wanted to relax?” master Cheng rolled his eyes.

He patted the sofa on both sides. I’m all alone here. I don’t know how relaxed I am.

Xiao Mao was dumbfounded. After a long time, he finally said, ” “Master Cheng, you’re really 
going to be a vegetarian!”

In the past, master Cheng would feel weak if he didn’t eat meat for a day. Recently, he had been 
suffering for a long time. How many more years did he want to suffer?

would it work?

xiao mao was suspicious.

Master Cheng didn’t really believe that he could control himself, but he wanted to try.

Xiao Mao, ” he said softly, ” you know what? I’m happy, but I don’t want your sister Hong to cry 
anymore.

Xiao Mao was stunned. master Cheng, this is true love!
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master cheng thought for a moment. ” i don’t know if it’s love. i don’t know anything about it. i 
only know that i don’t want to see her cry. i feel bad seeing her cry. i’m willing to do anything for 
her. ” he said. It’s that simple.”

Xiao Mao held it in for a while and asked carefully, ” master Cheng, you’re like a brother to sister 
Hong. Please think twice!

After saying that, he left. Master Cheng stared at Xiao Mao, stunned.

Xiao Mao didn’t dare to speak and looked at master Cheng.

Master Cheng didn’t say anything and just took out a cigarette.

After smoking for a long time, he finally said softly, ” I don’t look for women. I don’t play around. 
If I stay by her side every day, will she be touched one day? ”

...

xiao mao felt uncomfortable when he heard this. master cheng was also a sentimental person.

” actually, i know that she looks down on me, ” master cheng said again. ” i’m more detestable than 
zhang fucai. ”

Master Cheng smoked his cigarette and couldn’t calm down when he thought of The Woman 
Upstairs.

His woman was just upstairs, but he couldn’t see or touch her. This was really a very uncomfortable 
thing for master Cheng.

“as time passes, sister-in-law will change her mind,” xiao mao persuaded.



“is that so?” “why do i feel like she’ll never forgive me?” master cheng smiled faintly.

he suddenly gave himself a slap.

You didn’t cherish it and went to have sex with women. Now, I’m ignoring you and won’t forgive 
you.

in the future, you’ll still have to see the child once a week. when she goes on vacation with the 
pretty boy, you’ll still have to take care of the child!

thinking about it, master cheng gave himself another slap.

you deserve it for not being able to control yourself and showing off your power.

little mao looked at him and thought that master cheng had gone crazy.

master cheng wasn’t crazy. he had just thought it through.

In the following days, master Cheng’s work and rest were like nine to five. In the day, he would 
finish his work and go home early. Sometimes, he would be thick-skinned and go upstairs to eat. 
The Auntie had told him several times that sister Hong didn’t want to see him.

but master cheng was so thick-skinned that he refused to leave, and the auntie had no choice.

Sister Hong came out of the room. Her stomach was already quite big, and she was holding her bag. 
” i’m going for a checkup. help me drive. ”

master cheng jumped up in joy. ” alright, alright. i’ll be the driver. i’ll also take a look at this kid. ”

Sister Hong didn’t say anything, but the auntie’s eyes secretly reddened …

Really, he looked like a good father now, why didn’t he cherish him back then?



Master Cheng thought that their relationship had eased and wanted to help Sister Hong up, but sister 
Hong flatly refused, ” “i’ll walk on my own.”

master cheng was disappointed for a while, but he quickly forced a smile. ” then be careful. It’s not 
easy to see the way with a big stomach. It’s better to hold it.

No one paid any attention to him, and he didn’t feel embarrassed at all.

the auntie thought that this mr. cheng was good-looking, but he had a bad temper and was very 
thick-skinned.

what did miss liu like about him?

master cheng trotted all the way to serve them. he looked even more fawning than xiao mao. he 
looked like a big brother, but he was doing the work of a little brother. it was a bit ridiculous.

sister hong pursed her lips. ” that’s enough. stop acting like this. it’s disgusting. ”

“i thought you liked the feeling of being valued,” master cheng said while touching his head.

Sister Hong cursed in her heart, but she didn’t say anything. She just sat in master Cheng’s car.

master cheng carefully fastened her seat belt for her and said very cautiously, ” “Be careful, you 
have to wear your seat belt in the back seat.”
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