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Chapter 320 Tang Rui’s Secret 
Dong Nianshuang knows she must seize the opportunity. Since Lang Ruoxian 
loves Tang Duo best, she does not believe that he will refuse. She touches 
the medicine in her bag, and do not care those rules. As long as she has sex 
with Lang Ruoxian, Tang Duo will not be with him any more in her character. 
At that time, Lang Ruoxian will belong to her. 

But Lang Ruoxian says indifferently, “I’m not interested.” 

Dong Nianshuang is very surprised and asks, “You love her very much, don’t 
you? Don’t you want to know the truth?” 

“It’s none of your business.” Tang Cao thinks she is not in good faith. And why 
does she talk about his sister’s business with Lang Ruoxian alone? Isn’t he 
Tang Duo’s brother?” 

Dong Nianshuang ignores him, her eyes are fixed on Lang Ruoxian, she says, 
“I really know something. You give me a minute. I will leave when I finish.” 

“Just say it!” Tang Cao stands beside Lang Ruoxian, attempting to join them. 

“It’s a secret thing, I want to talk to Mr. Lang alone.” Tang Cao is staring at her 
when Dong Nianshuang finishes. 

OK! This woman has an evil motive for Lang Ruoxian! Tang Cao finally 
discovered, he says fiercely, “F**k, how dare you to seduce Ruoxian in front of 
me. Dong Nianshuang! You are really shameless.” 

Dong Nianshuang probably has no choice, and doesn’t feel embarrassed at 
all. Instead, she smiles slightly, “Mr. Tang, is it appropriate for a man like you 
to abuse a girl like me? And how do you see that I have an evil motive?” 

Tang Cao snorts, “Do you think I am blind? Are there any problems for me to 
abuse you? I have never said that I don’t abuse women. Not only do I abuse 



you, but I even want to beat you. Oh! You used to be jealous of my sister, and 
secretly liked Hua Yan.” 

“Now my sister is married to Ruoxian, and you like him again…” Tang Cao 
says, “Are you despicable? Why do you always like to follow my sister?” 

Even if Dong Nianshuang is thick-skinned, she can’t be completely indifferent 
hearing this. Moreover, Lang Ruoxian is expressionless, unable to see 
emotion. She clenches her hand and takes a long breath. 

“OK! I was kind originally. I didn’t expect Mr. Tang to humiliate me. If so, then I 
won’t say anymore. Anyway, Tang Duo’s trouble has nothing to do with me. 
I’m sorry to bother you.” 

When she finishes, she turns around and quickly enters the elevator. 

“Brother Ruoxian?” Tang Cao looks at Lang Ruoxian vigilantly, “What are you 
looking at? Dong Nianshuang?” 

Lang Ruoxian glances at him and says, “Don’t you feel thirsty for saying so 
much?” 

“Not thirsty, I am hungry… No, don’t go too close with that woman. Otherwise 
I… Hey? Ruoxian? Why are you walking so fast? Wait for me…” 

The dinner on the yacht is very rich, and everyone starts to do their business 
after eating. Each has his/her own goals and goes to their places. 

“Let’s go to play with Qiao Liang!” Chen Xiaopang asks Tang Cao. 

Tang Cao asks Lang Ruoxian, “Ruoxian, are you going?” 

“No.” Lang Ruoxian has already made an appointment with Qiao Liang and 
specially chose to talk at breakfast time tomorrow. 

“Then where are you going?” 

Lang Ruoxian looks at him and says, “Go back to the room. What do you want 
to do?” 

Tang Cao shakes his head, “It’s okay! I just ask.” 



After Lang Ruoxian leaves, Tang Cao also secretly follows. Chen Xiaopang 
rolls his eyes, “Are you going to steal something?” 

“Hush!” Tang Cao stares at him, “Hush, I have to watch Ruoxian.” 

“Why do you watch Ruoxian?” 

“What if Dong Nianshuang comes to him again?” Tang Cao says, “That 
woman is absolutely not in good faith. Oh no! There are a lot of aphrodisiacs 
in the room, will she use them on Ruoxian?” 

Chen Xiaopang pinches his face, “Wake up! Who is he? Lang Ruoxian! Who 
is Lang Ruoxian? He is the devil! Only he calculates others. A Dong 
Nianshuang is not enough, okay…” 

“…You’re right.” Tang Cao has been only wary of women, forgetting that Lang 
Ruoxian is a devil. 

So the two men went away shoulder to shoulder and arm in arm. 

Seeing Tang Cao leave, Dong Nianshuang quietly returns to the top floor, but 
unfortunately she is late, Lang Ruoxian has entered the room. She also 
rushes back to her room and rushes into the balcony, but only saw the thick 
curtains of the next room, even couldn’t see a beam of light. 

Dong Nianshuang blows the sea breeze for half an hour and kept playing 
songs on her mobile phone, but the room next door was still very quiet. She 
has to go back to the room in low spirits and looks at the aphrodisiac in the 
drawer. She decides to try again tomorrow. 

“Brother Ruoxian, Brother Ruoxian!” Tang Cao doesn’t get up until noon, and 
runs to Lang Ruoxian’s room and asks, “How’s it? Have you talked to Qiao 
Liang?” 

Lang Ruoxian looks in a good mood, “Yes, I have a chance to meet his dad.” 

“It should be no problem, Chen Xiaopang told him yesterday!” Tang Cao rubs 
his stomach and says, “I’m so hungry, I am going to have a meal first!” 

Dong Nianshuang watches Tang Cao walk into the restaurant and says, “This 
is your only chance. Tomorrow the yacht will come ashore.” 



There is a sexy woman standing beside her, and she looks at Tang Cao who 
is eating, “But… but I don’t dare, if he refuses me…” 

“Fool!” Dong Nianshuang smiles, “Aren’t you the most popular model now?” 
There are few men who can reject you. Besides, you try so hard to get on 
board only wanting to find a rich man! Mr. Tang doesn’t even have a girlfriend. 
It is possible to marry him if he really falls in love with you.” 

The woman is not stupid, she doubts, “So why don’t you go?” 

“Do I need this?” Dong Nianshuang picks eyebrows, “I am different from you.” 

The woman knows that Dong Nianshuang is popular now, and has Bai Family 
to support her, of course, unlike them… 

“If you can’t do it, you still have medicine in your bag!” After Dong Nianshuang 
finishes, the woman is a little scared, “How do you know?” 

Guess… The women on board probably all carry those things with them. 

Dong Nianshuang says with a smile, “It doesn’t matter. The important thing is 
that if you don’t go, you really have no chance.” 

“Young Master…” Shu Sheng takes a room call and his expression is a bit 
strange, “The restaurant man said that Childe Tang is drinking with a woman 
who secretly added something into the wine.” 

Lang Ruoxian frowns, “Go and see, whether it is true or not, bring him back.” 

When Shu Sheng leaves, someone rings the doorbell. Lang Ruoxian opens 
the door to see the male waiter of the ship pushing the car filled with red wine. 

“Sir, this is the wine that Childe Qiao brought back from a foreign winery. It is 
a gift for everyone.” Lang Ruoxian sees a waiter on the other side of the 
corridor pushing the car to the other room. 

“Every guest has it.” The waiter walks in and pours the wine into the glass, 
and takes a bottle of unopened wine, “You can take it back and taste it slowly. 
The wine in the cup is already decanted. It’s just time.” 

Lang Ruoxian thanks him and sends the man out. This brand of wine is good. 
Yan Hua likes to drink it. Lang Ruoxian looks at the vintage. Although the 
vintage is not long enough, it is enough to drink ordinarily. 



The red wine in the wine glass is crystal clear. Lang Ruoxian takes a sip and 
the door behind him slowly opens, and someone steps closer to him. 

“If I were you, I would go out now.” Lang Ruoxian turns around and says, “But 
I don’t think you should leave.” 

Dong Nianshuang wears a red low-cut skirt, half of her breast is exposed to 
the outside. The entire red yarn is transparent, and only the lustrous 
rhinestones between the legs are used as a cover. 

She believes that no man can resist such a beauty like her, let alone Lang 
Ruoxian who just drank the aphrodisiac. 

“Since I am here, of course I will not go.” Dong Nianshuang smiles shyly and it 
is a success! 

Lang Ruoxian puts down the glass and looks at her with his head tilted 
slightly, “You said that you knew why my wife had disappeared in the past, 
and now I want to hear it.” 

“You still remember that woman at this time? Do you really only have her in 
your eyes!” Dong Nianshuang is a little angry, but when she sees that Lang 
Ruoxian’s face is still normal, she doesn’t mind delaying the time to wait for 
the medicine to work, “It was Tang Rui. It was Tang Rui who found a corpse to 
pretend to be her and deceived everyone.” 

Dong Nianshuang suddenly smiles, “Do you know why Tang Rui hates Tang 
Duo so much? Because Tang Duo was the first person of his lust, he liked 
Tang Duo when he was a teenager.” 

Lang Ruoxian’s expression instantly became grim. Dong Nianshuang almost 
retreats, but she quickly calms down, “He knew that he and Tang Duo were 
impossible, and he did not know when this affection became hate. Probably 
because he couldn’t get her, so he just ruined her, and no one can get her!” 

“How do you know.” Lang Ruoxian stared at her. 

Dong Nianshuang hesitates, “Once Tang Rui drank too much and treated me 
as Tang Duo, he said it himself…” 

Everyone has only Tang Duo in their eyes. Even if she works hard, those 
people would say that she almost caught up with Miss. Tang. 



“Ha ha! A person who does not learn anything.” Dong Nianshuang is 
somewhat proud, “I spread the message that Tang Duo only has a beautiful 
face and nothing else. She is arrogance and looks down on people, gradually 
no one is willing to play with her, ho ho ho!” 

“But even then, she still despised me!” Dong Nianshuang’s expression 
became ferocious, “Why? She had no friends, and men only treated her as a 
person of sexual desire. Needless to say those celebrities who were jealous of 
her, they thought that she was worthless.” 

“In the end, even the fiancé didn’t want her.” Dong Nianshuang’s eyes were in 
a trance. As if she sees that she was hiding behind the tree and watching a 
few celebrities ridiculed that Tang Duo was abandoned by Hua Yan. What 
does Tang Duo say at that time? 

She looks in contempt at the women and says, “I never care about a man. If 
you want to make me uncomfortable, then I really feel a little bit. If I knew that 
he had so bad vision, I would never agree to the marriage.” 

“She was still so confident and proud when she was abandoned by a man.” 
Dong Nianshuang held her head, “I even don’t dare to express my love to my 
favorite man. Do you know how much I hate her? Why? Why did Tang Duo 
come back?” 

“She shouldn’t exist, I want her to disappear, and disappear forever…” Dong 
Nianshuang’s voice gradually became smaller, and finally she falls slowly on 
the carpet, and motionless. 
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Chapter 321 Suffering from Her Own Actions 

Tang Cao sits on the plane and sneezes. 

“Atishoo!” He rubs his nose and complains, “I must have caught a cold. 
Brother Ruoxian, you are so cruel.” 

He drank the drugged wine and was taken back to his room by Shu Sheng to 
take a cold bath for half an hour. Only later did he know that Dong 
Nianshuang had played the trick, but Lang Ruoxian had no problem. 



“You are indeed a devil as expected…” Tang Cao sneezes again, “How did 
you know that there was something wrong with the wine the waiter had sent to 
the room?” 

Xiaokai raises his hand, “Because I had put a bug on Dong Nianshuang!” 

Since having known that Dong Nianshuang was on the yacht, Lang Ruoxian 
let Xiaokai keep an eye on her. So he knew who she met and what she said. 

“The yacht was borrowed by Child Qiao, and the crew were all foreigners. 
They did not know who the guests on the yacht were, so Dong Nianshuang 
easily bribed one with money.” 

Xiaokai shrugs, “If she could bribe someone, we could, too!” 

So another waiter who delivered the wine received the money from Lang 
Ruoxian, and what he had to do was to put some drug in Dong Nianshuang’s 
wine. 

“Brother Ruoxian, you were not cruel enough.” Chen Xiaopang says, “Why did 
you only get her faint? You should just give her some aphrodisiac and throw 
her into the bar.” 

No sooner has he finished speaking than he hears Tang Cao exclaims, “You 
quickly read news on the internet. Dong Nianshuang hits the headlines!” 

“What do you mean, Miss Dong?” The middle-aged man lights a cigarette and 
smiles, “You came back to the room with me yourself. Since it was with our 
mutual agreement, who are you crying to now?” 

Dong Nianshuang is sitting in the corner, clutching the bed sheet. She is 
totally bare under the bed sheet. Her body is full of traces left by the man. Her 
legs hurt and she can’t stand up. There is blood in one corner of the bed 
sheet. 

The bright red color is like a knife cut in her heart. The sex toys scatter all over 
the floor messily. Last night’s scenes were replayed in her mind like 
nightmares. Her virginity was given to a strange man of 50. 

“You are talking nonsense!” She looks at the man with hatred, “You wait. I will 
sue you. I will sue you for raping!” 



The smile on the man’s face fades, “You want to sue me? You should see this 
first.” 

Dong Nianshuang’s mobile phone drops on the carpet with a sound. Its 
screen still pauses on the video page. She hurriedly picks it up and clicks on 
it. The voice of a woman groaning spreads out. She was riding on a man, 
taking the video while moving, and urging him to exert himself. 

“No… That’s impossible!” Dong Nianshuang drops her mobile phone but 
quickly picks up to delete the video when she thinks about something the next 
second. 

The man laughs mockingly, “You can delete it as you wish. I still have the 
copy in my mobile phone. Do you want to have a look? Your performance 
afterwards is even more amazing.” 

Dong Nianshuang closes her eyes. She remembers going to Lang Ruoxian’s 
room last night. Clearly Lang Ruoxian had drunk the glass of wine, but she 
fainted. Then she woke up in her room. She was unwilling to give up, and 
wanted to find Lang Ruoxian. 

Then she met this man in the corridor… 

“Do you remember it?” The man smiles when he sees her open her eyes, “I 
met Miss Dong and saw that your face was pale. I kindly went up and showed 
solicitudes to you. But you rubbed yourself against my body. I am a man! The 
beauty delivered herself to the door, why couldn’t accept?” 

Dong Nianshuang bites her lip hard. Yes! She took the initiative to come back 
with this person. She doesn’t know why she did that. She seemed to be out of 
control and just want to let off the desire… 

“You must have taken some aphrodisiac!” The man kindly reminds her. He 
wears clothes well and looks at his watch, “I’m getting off the yacht. Miss 
Dong, you are a popular star and the younger sister-in-law of Bai Yuanqi. I 
don’t expect you to be my secret lover. About what happened last night… 
Forget it and just regard it as a one-night stand!” 

Dong Nianshuang watches him walk out of the room. She can’t help smashing 
the bedside vase at his direction. With a bang, the fragments of the vase 
scatter on the ground, which is just like her heart at this moment, broken into 
pieces. 



“Nianshuang?” The agent finally gets through the phone and showers 
questions on her, “Why didn’t you answer the phone? Are you all right?” 

“I was just taking a bath just now.” Dong Nianshuang is anxious to rub off a 
layer of her skin. She wraps herself tightly and doesn’t want to face the traces 
on her body. 

“Don’t get off the yacht now. The docks are full of reporters.” 

“Reporters?” A bad feeling wells up in her mind, “Why are there reporters?” 

The agent is stunned for a moment, “Didn’t you read micro blog?” 

Dong Nianshuang immediately opens her micro blog and finds herself hit the 
headlines. 

#Popular Young Actress Throws Herself on a Business Leader in the Yacht 
Party Organized by Rich Second Generation# 

There is a clip of video. She hugged a man and kissed him in the corridor and 
then followed him into the room. Her micro blog is set in frenzy and fans keep 
asking whether the video is real. 

Dong Nianshuang shakes her hand and puts her mobile phone to her ear, 
“What… What can I do? Netizens all know about it. I… What can I do?” 

“You stay in the yacht and don’t move first. I am negotiating with Childe Qiao, 
asking him to let me go on board. Please wait in the room and don’t come 
out!” 

A few minutes later, Qiao Liang comes to the room with Dong Nianshuang’s 
agent. He still has an impression of Dong Nianshuang. After all, she is a star 
and looks very beautiful. He is also responsible for what happened to her in 
his party. 

“Miss Dong, I’m sorry!” Qiao Liang says, “I have investigated who sent the 
surveillance video on board to the Internet. Please feel free to ask for 
anything.” 

Dong Nianshuang is about to open her mouth when her agent gives her a 
severe pinch. 



“Childe Qiao, how nice you are! Since Nianshuang now is so afraid, can you 
arrange us to go first? We’ll talk about other things later.” 

Qiao Liang naturally has no objection. Although the video has been circulated, 
Dong Nianshuang did follow the man back to his room yesterday. Qiao Liang 
also clearly knows about the dirty trick here. Either Dong Nianshuang 
offended someone or someone framed her. 

Now that her agent does not investigate and affix the responsibility, he is 
happy to save trouble. He specially lets bodyguards escort them to leave. 

“I didn’t drug her!” Xiaokai shouts, “I took her back to her room and left.” 

Tang Cao points to the video on the internet, “Then what happened to her?” 

“Why do you care what happened to her!” Chen Xiaopang says, “She just 
suffers from her own actions. Is she the only one who can drug others?” 

Shu Sheng looks at Lang Ruoxian and Lang Ruoxian frowns, “Have an 
investigation.” 

He doesn’t care what happens to Dong Nianshuang, but he needs to know 
who has taken the advantage in the matter. 

“I know who it is.” Chen Xiaopang suddenly says when getting off the plane. 

Qiao Liang just sends him a message, sharing the progress of the battle 
between women. 

“It us the model who drugged Tang Cao in the restaurant. Surveillance 
photographed her entering Dong Nianshuang’s room. Dong Nianshuang came 
out a few minutes later, and then she left with the man in that way.” 

Tang Cao says, “So she fed some aphrodisiac to Dong Nianshuang?” 

“It should be so.” Chen Xiaopang shakes his head, “So don’t offend women!” 

Lang Ruoxian narrows his eyes, “Find the model and ask her clearly.” 

Returning to Tang Family’s house, Tang Cao finds that their family even don’t 
know there is such a headline. 



“Mom says that mobile phone has radiation, so she prevents me from using it 
all day. What’s the matter?” Seeing her brother asks her whether she has 
read the news on the internet as soon as he comes back, Yan Hua wonders 
“Have you hit the headlines again?” 

“Not me!” Tang Cao affably turns on his mobile phone and says, “Look, look!” 

Lang Ruoxian helps her to sit on the sofa, “There’s nothing important to see, 
just other people’s business.” 

“Ah, Brother Ruoxian, don’t say so! Didn’t it involve us at first?” Tang Cao sits 
down on the opposite side alone. The three old people in the family are not at 
home for they go to the temple today to fulfill their promises. 

After watching the video, Yan Hua clicks the tongue, “What’s wrong with her?” 

“I don’t know.” Tang Cao tells the story from beginning to end. He doesn’t 
mention much about Dong Nianshuang seducing Lang Ruoxian, but Yan Hua 
doesn’t question. She is just as curious as they are about whether the female 
model did it. 

Lang Ruoxian hugs her and touches her belly which is still flat, “I didn’t want to 
tell you at first, but if you don’t know what someone gossips about in the 
future, I’d rather tell you.” 

“Yes! You should have told me all,” Yan Hua praises him and then curls her 
lips bitterly, “It seems that participating in activities is a dangerous act. If you 
weren’t on guard for her, you might have been calculated.” 

“That can’t be!” Without waiting for Lang Ruoxian’s assurance, Tang Cao 
shouts first, “Brother Ruoxian is the devil who can only be handled by you, 
and everyone else will be played dead by him.” 

Shu Sheng goes to find the model on the yacht, and the model all confesses. 
It is indeed she who fed Dong Nianshuang some drug. The reason is that she 
was scolded by Tang Cao that day, but when she left the restaurant, she 
happened to hear the crew say that Dong Nianshuang had just called, so she 
took an extra look. 

“It turned out that that b***h had called Mr. Lang’s room. She used me!” The 
model wanted to beat Dong Nianshuang and went to her room to look for her 
in anger. 



But she found that the door of Dong Nianshuang’s room was unlocked. She 
thought Dong Nianshuang and Lang Ruoxian were inside, so she thought of 
going in quietly to take a picture. As a result, she saw Dong Nianshuang lying 
on the bed alone, so she had an idea and fed Dong Nianshuang some 
aphrodisiac. 

“So it was because Xiaokai didn’t lock the door when sending her back to the 
room…” Yan Hua doesn’t know what expression she should have after 
hearing. 

Chang Pei’e and Bai Susu nods with great satisfaction, “This is retribution. 
She suffers from her own actions!” 

“She is still whitewashing the scandal!” Tang Cao reads through the micro 
blog, “Her public relations team now says that the woman in the video is not 
her.” 

Yan Hua looks at Lang Ruoxian and says, “She said so. Is she not afraid of 
the man who slept with her that night coming out to confront with her?” 

“No.” Lang Ruoxian feels that Dong Nianshuang is lucky, “The man who slept 
with her is surnamed Liu, the boss of a large supermarket chain. He has 
already had son and daughter, and he is of this age…” 

He just regards this to be like sleeping with a woman at ordinary times. 
Besides, Dong Nianshuang has some relationship with Bai Family, so Liu 
Gang also doesn’t want to tread in muddy water. 

“Then she is really lucky in misfortune…” Yan Hua nods, “If she slept with an 
ordinary man, he might even blackmail her with a sum of money.” 

Lang Ruoxian, however, did not want Dong Nianshuang to be so lucky. The 
day after Dong Nianshuang’s public relations team whitewashes the scandal, 
an internet celebrity reveals a list, which is the names of the guests on the 
yacht that day. Dong Nianshuang is impressively listed on it. 

“Now let’s see how she can whitewash the scandal!” How anxious is Tang 
Cao to instigate and see chaos! He posts on micro blog and @Chen 
Xiaopang. 

@The World’s Fattest Man, did we see @Dong Nianshuang while playing on 
the yacht that day? 



Chen Xiaopang replies soon. 

@Hey, hey! We not only saw her, but also spoke to her! @The World’s Fattest 
Man, Did we see @Dong Nianshuang while playing on the yacht that day? 

If you find any errors ( broken links, non-standard content, etc.. ), Please let 
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Chapter 322 Two Small Crossed Shapes 
With the first playboy in Yanjing testifying, all netizens are instantly sided with 
them. Except some brainless fans, most people believe that the person in the 
video is Dong Nianshuang. Dong Nianshuang’s working team members stay 
up several nights and finally decide on a solution. 

“We have already notified the reporters and posted on the micro blog. We will 
hold an explanation meeting at the Jin Yue Hotel tomorrow afternoon. Have 
you memorized everything you will say?” 

Dong Nianshuang looks gaunt and even her makeup cannot hide her black 
circles. She holds her mobile phone and reads what those people on the 
Internet scold her. They say that she is menial, calling her a street girl, and 
say that she has been famous for sleeping with directors and sponsors. 

“Don’t look at these!” The agent takes the mobile phone away from her hands, 
“Now it’s time to solve the problem. What’s the use of looking at all this?” 

Dong Nianshuang screams like crazy, “It’s no use! I am finished! I am 
finished!” 

She doesn’t know what to do. Dong Nianqiu called and scolded her. Bai 
Yuanqi wouldn’t take care of her any more, or even her sister would be 
affected. 

“Calm down!” The agent hugs her, “Though Bai Family said that they wouldn’t 
involve, they still provided us with the public relations team, and the company 
has also been helping you with public relations. How significant is this? Did 
you forget that a movie queen’s sex video was exposed by her ex-husband, 
but she only disappeared for several years and then came back?” 

Dong Nianshuang looks at her blankly, “I can turn over… Impossible…” 



“Why impossible?” The agent presses her onto the sofa to sit down and pours 
her a glass of water, “You were only photographed pandering to a man in the 
corridor, not entering the room with him.” 

She puts a piece of paper into Dong Nianshuang’s hand, “Recite this quickly. I 
promise you will be OK this time!” 

Dong Nianshuang’s explanation meeting is broadcast live on the Internet 
simultaneously. The three women in Yan Hua’s family are all sitting in front of 
the TV because they are not busy. 

“Is she wearing makeup?” Chang Pei’e is shocked when Dong Nianshuang 
comes out. 

The woman who used to be delicate and beautiful looks withered. She wears 
a white dress and doesn’t dress her hair, only simply draping over her 
shoulders. No makeup can be seen on her face, or she just makes a light 
makeup. 

Yan Hua doesn’t believe that Dong Nianshuang has no makeup. She once 
looked at Dong Nianshuang closely. Dong Nianshuang’s skin is not so good, 
at least it is not as mellow and flawless as that of Yan Hua. Yan Hua is 
confident. 

“She must have had makeup!” Bai Susu says, “She deliberately made up to 
be withered and poor, otherwise how can she win public sympathy?” 

Yan Hua casually eats a walnut, “I don’t know what she will say…” 

“She can only admit it.” Bai Susu smiles, “She can do nothing but this.” 

Sure enough, Dong Nianshuang starts crying after sitting down. 

“I’m sorry to everyone, to my fans who care about me. I didn’t set a good 
example for them. What happened on the yacht was a nightmare to me.” 

She blabbers… 

She cries and says, admitting that she went to a party on the yacht with her 
friends. After drinking too much, she grabbed a stranger and let him hug her. 
She cried and made a noise if the man didn’t hug her. 



“I know I have this problem. When I got drunk, I’d like to let others hold me. It 
is probably because my parents were busy when I was a child and didn’t have 
time to accompany me, only leaving sister to take care of me. Therefore, I lack 
the sense of security. 

“I used to be very careful, and my agent and assistants kept an eye on me, so 
I seldom got drunk. Even if I was drunk, they would take good care of me.” 

“This time I was careless. In fact, when I realized that I was drunk, I hurried 
back to my room and locked myself up myself. I didn’t think it didn’t work. I 
was too drunk to know how I got out, “ 

Dong Nianshuang stands up, choking with sobs, and bows deeply to the 
audience. 

“I’m sorry! As a public figure, I have not establish the right social atmosphere 
and set a bad example. I will do self-criticism and will never touch alcohol 
again in the future. I also hope you will give me a chance to forgive me and 
supervise me!” 

It has to be said to be a very wonderful public relations. Dong Nianshuang 
suddenly changes from dissolute shameless b***ch whose personal life is 
corrupted and disgusting into a little poor girl who has moral loss after being 
drunk but regrets helplessly. 

“It’s really a good show.” Chang Pei’e takes off the reading glasses, “People 
are really smart now. It is estimated that it won’t be long before the thing will 
completely pass and be forgotten.” 

Bai Susu coldly looks at Dong Nianshuang, who is still crying in the TV. Lang 
Ruoxian has told her that all the bad words about Hua in her childhood came 
from this woman’s mouth. If it was before, she could have regarded Dong 
Nianshuang as a fart, but it will be different now. 

This woman is obviously hostile to Hua. She must be on guard. If necessary, 
she must take the initiative to gain the upper hand to deal with Dong 
Nianshuang first! 

“Mr. Lang!” Liu Gang strides into the private room, “You’ve chosen a good 
place. Their tea is the best. I hear there are still some teas belong to personal 
storage that you can’t buy.” 



Lang Ruoxian makes a gesture of invitation, “Mr. Liu, try this cup.” 

“Kam melon tea! Ha ha, we should say the living conditions are good now. 
Kam melon tea used to be all hidden in the Forbidden City, which is a national 
second-class cultural relic!” Liu Gang smells it and carefully drinks a mouthful 
of the tea. His pupils suddenly enlarge, “This… This is Royal Tea King Xiang 
Zhuqing?” 

Royal Tea King Xiang Zhuqing, the world’s largest ancient tea tree, is more 
than 3,200 years old and is a true ancestor tea tree. Now its tea leaves are 
used for exhibitions, and occasionally some are sent to leaders. 

“I remember a few years ago a businessman of Gang City bought 200g of 
compacted tea of Xiang Zhuqing at a price of 400,000 in an auction, but I 
haven’t seen any of this kind of the tea on the market since then.” Liu Gang 
loves tea as much as his life, holding the small cup like holding something 
precious. His tears almost drop. 

“Good tea needs someone who can appreciate to drink.” Lang Ruoxian fills 
him cup, “In Mr. Liu’s mouth, it is the king of tea, but in my mouth, it is just a 
cup of ordinary tea.” 

Liu Gang takes a deep breath of tea fragrance and puts down the cup to look 
at Lang Ruoxian. 

“Mr. Lang, our lives have no intersection, and my company’s business has 
nothing to do with Lang Consortium. Is this cup of tea today… Too precious 
for me?” 

Lang Ruoxian smiles, “Mr. Liu is a wise man, so I’ll just say it. Do you have a 
video of you with Dong Nianshuang on a yacht?” 

“…” Liu Gang is stunned, and an embarrassed expression flashes across his 
face. Even if everyone has a tacit understanding, it is still quite embarrassing 
to talk about sleeping with women in public. 

He curiously asks, “Mr. Lang, do you bear grudges against each other with 
that Miss Dong?” 

“Yes.” Lang Ruoxian duly admits, “So I invite Mr. Liu to have tea today. I hope 
you can give me that video.” Lang Ruoxian takes out a delicate wooden box 
from the drawer of the tea table and pushes it over. 



Liu Gang shakes his hands and opens it. It is indeed a cake of compacted tea 
inside, a cake of compacted tea of king of tea Xiang Zhujing!! 

“Mr. Lang…” Liu Gang prevents himself from rushing at it with great effort, “I 
don’t know what you want to do, but I was in the video, and I promised Dong 
Nianshuang to have destroyed it.” 

Lang Ruoxian covers the cup with a smile and pushes it forward again, “Mr. 
Liu, I mentioned just now that the good tea needs someone who can 
appreciate to drink. You are a tea lover, so I should send you the tea today 
whether you promise me or not.” 

He puts the wooden box into Liu Gang’s hands, “How can the things sent out 
be returned? Mr. Liu, you say, isn’t it?” 

“Alas…” Liu Gang sighs, “How can I refuse you like this?” 

“Mr. Liu, rest assured. I promise no one will see you in the video.” Lang 
Ruoxian smiles faintly, “Now the technology is so advanced. It’s quite easy to 
cut one person in the video. Even you want to add one person in the video, it 
is still very easy, isn’t it?” 

Half an hour later, Liu Gang walks away with satisfactory expression, holding 
the cup in his hand. Lang Ruoxian turns the USB flash disk in his hand and 
gives it to Xiaokai. 

“Blur the image of Liu Gang and then send it to Dong Nianshuang.” After a 
pause, he adds, “It will be the end of the month soon. Send it after this 
month.” 

At the end of the month, it is Gungun’s birthday. After the birthday, it is the 
date for Yan Hua to take the birth inspection. The babies in her belly are 
nearly three months old after counting. The doctor is still the dean of the 
obstetrics and gynecology department who they met last time. But this time 
when she looks at the color Doppler ultrasound image, her expression is a 
little strange. 

“Doctor, is there a problem?” Lang Ruoxian holds Yan Hua’s hand tightly. 
Only the two of them come today. If there is anything wrong, he cannot panic. 



The doctor smiles suddenly and happily shows them the color Doppler 
ultrasound list, “Congratulations, Mr. Lang! Mrs. Lang, you are pregnant with 
twins!” 

Lang Ruoxian and Yan Hua are shocked. 

“Look, here!” The doctor points to the small crossed shapes that separate like 
two small bean sprouts, “It is already clear that they are two fraternal twins.” 

“God!” Yan Hua covers her chest, feeling eyes sore, “How… How is it 
possible! Our family has no history of twins!” 

Lang Ruoxian quickly calms down after the surprise, “Hua, you forgot my 
family has it.” 

Yeah! Lang Ruoxian’s father and Lang Li are identical twins! 

“Then it can be seen whether there are two boys or two girls, or a boy and a 
girl, right?” Yan Hua quickly asks the doctor. 

The doctor smiles and says, “Yes! If they are identical twins, it will only be two 
boys or two girls. If they are fraternal twins, either gender is possible. It’s not 
clear yet. We’ll know until the prenatal check-up next month, “ 

Generally hospitals are not allowed to tell pregnant women about the gender 
of the fetus, but this hospital is run by Tong Yue’s family. He pulled strings 
long ago, so the doctor takes the initiative to tell Yan Hua about the genders 
of the babies. 

“Now that you have two babies, you should pay more attention to the 
absorption of nutrition and don’t be particular about food for keeping your 
figure.” The doctor reminds her and writes several notes to Lang Ruoxian. 

“You also need maintain a happy mood. Apart from things that are easily 
irritating and that pregnant women cannot eat, everything else can be eaten 
according to your own preferences. You can eat whatever you want without 
any burden.” 

The two happily go home. Chang Pei’e and Bai Susu take the old playboy 
Tang Yao and the young playboy Tang Cao to wait in the living room. They all 
ask when Yan Hua and Lang Ruoxian come in. 



“How is the baby?” 

“Are you all healthy?” 

“How is your body? What did the doctor say?” 

Yan Hua doesn’t say a word and stands looking at them smiling. 

“Sister…” Tang Cao steps back a few steps, “Don’t laugh like that. I’m afraid 
of it.” 

Chang Pei’e anxiously asks, “Hua? Is there a problem?” 

“Oh, you child!” Bai Susu doesn’t ask her, but asks Lang Ruoxian, “Ruoxian, 
you say!” 

Lang Ruoxian hands over the color Doppler ultrasound list and Tang Yao 
grabs it to see for a long time. 

“Can’t understand… Which is the baby? Or is it the black spot?” 

Lang Ruoxian helps Yan Hua sit down. Yan Hua pointed to the crossed 
shapes and asks, “Here, have you seen it? Two crossed shapes.” 

“Ah, bifurcation! I say, it’s not the same as the one I saw last time.” 

Bai Susu is stunned instead and suddenly raises her voice, “Hua! You are 
pregnant with twins!” 
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Chapter 323 He Has an Ulterior Idea about You 

The whole family is shocked by the surprise. Tang Yao giggles with the color 
Doppler ultrasound list in hand, “Our family is going to have two identical 
babies. Shall I be able to tell them apart? Shall I bathe a baby twice?” 

“How is it possible, Dad?” Tang Cao despises, “You don’t have presbyopia.” 

Tang Yao despises him back, “You know nothing. Haven’t you heard about 
the joke? A mother bathed the twins. The eldest was bathed twice, but the 
second wasn’t bathed once.” 



“Dad, no!” Yan Hua explains what the doctor said, “Because they are fraternal 
twins, the probability of being identical is relatively small.” She wanted to say 
that the twins would not look the same, but she thinks that Lang Ruoxian and 
Lang Zeyu’s fathers were two people, and they were exactly the same… 

Genetic power is great and mysterious. Who knows what will happen? 

Gungun is very excited about having two younger brothers or sisters. In 
private, he also tells Wuyou that they will take care of the babies one another. 
But at the same time Gungun is a little bit selfish, hoping that Wuyou will only 
take care of him, “ 

Yan Hua soon discovers that something is wrong with her son, and finds a 
chance to ask why. Gungun is very embarrassed to say that he is afraid of 
being out of favor. 

“No.” Yan Hua holds laughing. Now even a 10-year-old child knows the word 
‘be out of favor’. If you don’t believe it, why don’t you ask Wuyou yourself?” 

Burying his face in rolling ran away, for he is embarrassed to ask such a 
question. Yan Hua knows that her son is just jealous of what has not yet 
happened, so she calms down to continue her life as a pregnant woman only 
focusing on eating and drinking. 

Then after half a month, suddenly one day when eating, Wuyou looks at her 
belly and says. 

“There is a younger brother and a younger sister.” 

Bai Susu is stunned, “Wuyou, what did you say?” 

“There is a younger brother and a younger sister in mother’s belly.” Wuyou 
touches Yan Hua’s belly, “ 

Yan Hua looks at her belly and asks uncertainly, “how does Wuyou know?” 

“It smells different.” 

Others are puzzled. 

“Maybe she can smell something we can’t smell.” Lang Ruoxian puts the egg 
into Yan Hua’s bowl, “Since Wuyou says that there is one son and one 
daughter, it should be true.” 



Tang Cao looks at Wuyou shockingly, “Is it so amazing? Wuyou, do you really 
smell it?” 

“I depend on feeling not smelling.” Wuyou shakes her head, “It’s probably my 
instinct. Uncle, you can’t learn.” 

Tang Cao squints. 

“Wuyou, you’ve become bad. How can you be as sharp-tongued as your 
father?” 

Gungun hurriedly takes hold of Wuyou’s hand, “Uncle, you talk nonsense. 
Wuyou is not sharp-tongued. Wuyou is best!” 

“You are a heartless bad boy!” Tang Cao stretches out his hand to catch 
Gungun, and the two roll onto the carpet and laugh. 

Lulu barks to join in. It presses Tang Cao’s face with its buttocks to prevent 
Tang Cao from bullying Gungun. Tang Cao has a hard time getting up, with 
his mouth full of the dog’s fur. 

“Gungun and Lulu, when you asked me to be your driver during the summer 
vacation, your attitude was so good. Now you don’t need me to be a driver so 
you bully me together. We are no longer pal playing together!” 

Gungun laughs. He and Wuyou take Lulu to run away. 

Lang Consortium 

“Young Master, I’ve sent the video to Dong Nianshuang.” Xiaokai says as 
soon as he goes to work. 

Lang Ruoxian is looking at the documents to be used for the meeting 
immediately. He raises his head and says, “Don’t say anything. Remember to 
send it to her every three days.” 

“Then she must have been frightened to death!” Xiaokai gloats to say. 

Dong Nianshuang isn’t frightened to death, but it is almost the same. Since 
the last explanation meeting, her popularity has finally stopped declining, and 
several of her endorsements have been retained. 



Just when a new movie is released, in which her role is very pleasing, thus 
her popularity recovers a lot. But Dong Nianshuang’s condition is still not 
good. Only she knows what happened that day, and she doesn’t even tell her 
agent. 

Thinking that her virginity was ended in the hand of the old man in that case, 
Dong Nianshuang feels her heart bleeding. She has taken the contraceptives 
and tells herself desperately that it is a dream and it is all over. 

But just then she receives the video, in which Liu Gang’s face is blurred, but 
her face is very clear. Looking at the intoxicated and lascivious face, Dong 
Nianshuang doesn’t want to admit that is her. She doesn’t believe that it is 
her. 

“Ahhh…” She throws her mobile phone into the toilet like crazy and presses 
the flush button, as if she can wash away the video. And then she runs back 
to the room to crawl under the bed. 

The agent calls and can’t find Dong Nianshuang. She runs to Dong 
Nianshuang’s house at two o’clock in the middle of the night. When she finds 
Dong Nianshuang sleeping under the bed, she gets a fright and quickly drags 
Dong Nianshuang out. 

“What’s the matter with you? Where’s the mobile phone? Why can’t I get 
through all the time?” Dong Nianshuang’s eyes glaze over as she holds the 
quilt. The agent touches her face, “Don’t frighten me, Nianshuang. What’s 
wrong with you?” 

Dong Nianshuang lets out a cry. She runs into the bathroom to take out the 
mobile phone from the toilet and turns it on desperately. 

“Did you fall it into the water?” The agent comes over and has a look, “This is 
definitely not going to work. I’ll buy you a new one tomorrow.” 

Dong Nianshuang finally responds, “No. No. No. I don’t want.” 

“Don’t be capricious.” The agent takes the mobile phone over, “Where’s your 
ID card? You have to renew a SIM card.” 

Dong Nianshuang ignorantly gets through the night till dawn. The agent 
changes a new mobile phone for her. After turning it on, Dong Nianshuang 



nervously checks the photo album and finds that there is no video in the 
synchronized album. She comforts herself that she must have been wrong. 

“Yes, it’s wrong! Impossible, impossible…” 

Three days later, Dong Nianshuang receives the video again. She drops her 
mobile phone in panic. At that time she is just about to enter the cast and start 
filming. Her performance is naturally very bad. The director can do nothing 
about it but has to give her two days off to adjust. 

“What’s wrong with you?” The agent can’t help pressing for an answer, “Are 
you hiding something from me?” 

Dong Nianshuang shakes her head, “No, I’m just too tired. I’ve been under a 
lot of pressure recently.” 

“Then go back and rest for two days.” Although the agent still doubts, she can 
do nothing about it for Dong Nianshuang doesn’t say anything. So she has to 
warn Dong Nianshuang of the consequences, “We have just returned to Bai 
Consortium, and there are many people look on you. If you go on like this, you 
won’t have to compete with others, and all the resources you have will not be 
available.” 

“If you really don’t want to make a movie, you might as well announce the 
quitting of the entertainment circle, which can let fans remember you forever.” 

Dong Nianshuang is shocked. She also knows that she can’t be like this. The 
video has been sent twice. She checked the registered mobile phone number 
of the email box and called back, but no one answered and did not return the 
messages. 

Obviously, the other party just wanted to make her afraid. Dong Nianshuang 
feels refreshed immediately after she figures out. She knows that she has to 
solve the problem, so she calls Liu Gang. 

“Miss Dong, I really don’t know what’s going on. I’ve deleted the video. How 
can I send it to you?” 

Dong Nianshuang laughs, “Mr. Liu, your face has been blurred in the video 
and can’t be recognized who it is. Obviously, it only aims at me. I really can’t 
believe you said it wasn’t you.” 



“Ha ha! Miss Dong, to be honest, I really don’t need to do such a thing, right? 
You might as well think about who you have offended. In short, I promise that 
I didn’t send you the video, and I don’t want everyone knows about the thing 
that night.” 

Then Liu Gang hangs up. Dong Nianshuang ponders for a while. If she really 
offended someone, then… 

Only one person may do this. That is, Lang Ruoxian! 

“Tang Duo, this is Dong Nianshuang.” 

Yan Hua thinks she hears wrong when she gets a call from Dong Nianshuang. 
Why does this woman call her? 

“What’s the matter?” 

Dong Nianshuang hears her voice so calm that resentment surges up again in 
her heart. She sneers, “What’s the matter? Your attitude is so casual.” 

“Otherwise I should hang up directly, right?” Yan Hua says and really hangs 
up. 

A few seconds later, Dong Nianshuang calls again. As soon as she gets 
through, she screams, “Tang Duo, do you know what Lang Ruoxian and I did 
on the yacht?” 

“What did you do?” Yan Hua laughs mockingly, “Didn’t you do something with 
a boss whose surname is Liu? Why is there anything else to do with Lang 
Ruoxian?” 

Dong Nianshuang feels a chill in her heart. She thought Lang Ruoxian would 
not tell Tang Duo what happened on the yacht. Obviously she was wrong… 

“It seems that he’s told you everything.” Dong Nianshuang maliciously says, 
“Did he say what I was wearing when I went to his room? And did he tell you 
about our conversation?” 

This is really not… Yan Hua didn’t ask. Lang Ruoxian just said that Dong 
Nianshuang put the aphrodisiac in red wine, and then ran to his room. 

“He didn’t tell you, did he?” Dong Nianshuang laughs over the phone, “Do you 
know why he didn’t tell you? The reason is that he can’t say it. There was 



another man who regarded you as the object of psychosexuality, lying on the 
bed, masturbating, calling your name in his mouth, and looking at your photos. 
You say, how can Lang Ruoxian tell you this?” 

Yan Hua regrets. She should not have answered the phone. 

“What on earth are you trying to say?” Her voice cools down. 

Dong Nianshuang laughs mockingly, “Lang Ruoxian has my video in his hand. 
Let him destroy it, or I will spread the scandal between you and Tang Rui. 
Tang Rui is dead, but you aren’t. If everyone knows that Tang Rui hated you 
so much because he had ulterior ideas about you and love begot hate. What 
will they think of you?” 

“It doesn’t matter whatever they think.” Yan Hua suppresses her shock and 
hangs up directly. 

Lang Ruoxian just comes back from the company and sees Yan Hua standing 
alone in front of the French window. He is about to speak to her when she 
covers her mouth and rushes into the kitchen. 

“Hua!” Lang Ruoxian drops his coat and runs after her. 

Yan Hua throws up on the sink badly. She doesn’t stop vomiting until her head 
hurts, and then she feels slightly better. Lang Ruoxian has been holding her. 
And then he holds a glass of water to let her gargle. Tang Yao, who rushes 
here at the sound, is frightened. 

“Call an ambulance! Call an ambulance!” He shouts. 

Bai Susu glares at him and claps Yan Hua on the back, “Stop shouting. 
Pregnant women are all like this.” 

“I think that Hua’s vomiting during the pregnancy stops, but actually her time is 
late.” Chang Pei’e looks at her, “Are you feeling better?” 

Yan Hua looks pale. When she is about to speak, her stomach churns and 
she vomits again. 

“Oh, this is all spitting water. I ate my lunch for nothing.” 



Finally Yan Hua stops vomiting. Lang Ruoxian holds her back to the room to 
rest. Yan Hua feels wronged, lying in the quilt and looking at him. Her gaze 
makes Lang Ruoxian’s heart crisp. He simply changes clothes to lie with her. 

“Blame it on Dong Nianshuang!” Yan Hua suddenly says. 

Lang Ruoxian sits up, “Did she trouble you?” 
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Chapter 324 You’re Finished. This Deserves Going to Jail 
Being aware of the body of the man who is beside her suddenly tenses, Yan 
Hua hurriedly pats him. 

“She called me and said some nonsense. I think what she said is too 
disgusting and I vomits during pregnancy.” Yan Hua doesn’t feel capricious at 
all. It is the woman who caused her vomit! 

Lang Ruoxian hugs her into his arms, “Did she tell you about Tang Rui?” 

“Mmm.” Yan Hua drills into the man’s arms, “You know it, don’t you?” 

“She told me the other day. I didn’t tell you because I was afraid of you feeling 
nausea.” Lang Ruoxian pats her on the back, “No matter what she said is true 
or not, what can a dead person pursue again.” 

Yan Hua nods, “You know me. Even if Dong Nianshuang always said what 
Tang Rui did to me, but what does that have to do with me? She even 
threatened me with this.” 

Both of them know that Yan Hua’s pregnancy and vomiting is normal reaction, 
but because she feels uncomfortable, Yan Hua counts this on Dong 
Nianshuang. 

“She knew that the video was sent by you and wanted to threaten you to 
delete it.” Yan Hua feels funny, “How can she who is so stupid get along in the 
entertainment circle?” 

Lang Ruoxian kisses her hair tip, “Don’t worry about her. Just relax and eat 
and drink.” 



Dong Nianshuang not only contacts Yan Hua, she also contacts the model on 
the yacht. 

“What if it was me?” The other party readily admits it. 

Dong Nianshuang is so angry that she raises her hand and wants to hit the 
model, but she is pushed away by the model. 

“Dong Nianshuang, you are so ridiculous! You used me first, but I did it only 
as revenge.” 

Dong Nianshuang grits her teeth and looks at her, “You wanted to find a sugar 
daddy yourself. I just provided you with an idea.” 

“Did you not make the phone call?” The female model sneers, “My 
background is not as powerful as yours, but I know very well what happened 
on the yacht that day. If you dare to harm me, I’ll spread the story!” 

Dong Nianshuang looks at her coldly. The female model suddenly smiles, “No 
wonder you wanted to frame me. Your target was Lang Ruoxian originally. Ha 
ha! You are really thick-skinned. How can you compare with that Ms. Tang? 
You actually wanted to cut the ground from under her feet.” 

“Shut up!” Dong Nianshuang’s face changes color, “What nonsense are you 
talking about?” 

“Whether I am talking nonsense, you should know it.” The female model 
stands up and says, “In a word, we will never know each other in the future 
and none of us will make trouble for the other.” 

Dong Nianshuang watches the model leave and waves in the air hard. They 
will never know each other? It is impossible. The model has made her lose the 
most precious thing, so Dong Nianshuang will definitely let the model pay the 
price. 

However, before she can do anything, the female model suddenly announces 
that she is going to develop in Mi Country. Dong Nianshuang isn’t capable to 
influence things in that country. She passes all this hatred on to Tang Duo, 
vowing to make her pay the price. 



“Don’t drink at today’s celebration dinner, or you’ll be in trouble if the reporters 
take pictures of it.” Dong Nianshuang’s new movie is a big hit, and the 
producers host a dinner for the director and all the leading actors today. 

The agent specially reminds her that she must be careful now that the 
limelight has just passed. 

Dong Nianshuang knows it herself, so she only drinks fruit juice for the whole 
celebration dinner. As everyone knows her previous speech at the explanation 
meeting, few people come to force her to drink. After the celebration dinner, 
the producer takes several rich second generations to sing karaoke. Dong 
Nianshuang is embarrassed to leave and has to follow. 

Then everything is like a movie. The police suddenly rush into the private 
room. The rich second generations flee hurriedly and are caught one by one. 
Although Dong Nianshuang doesn’t know what happened, she also knows 
that something is wrong. 

“You are Miss Dong, aren’t you?” A female police officer measures her with 
eyes, “We suspect that you are gathering people to take drugs. Please come 
back to the police station with us.” 

Dong Nianshuang is shocked, “Taking… Taking drugs?” 

Only when she gets into the police car does she react and begins to protest, 
“You are mistaken. I didn’t take drugs, and I didn’t know they took drugs.” 

“Miss Dong, from now on everything you say may be brought to court.” The 
police remind her. 

Dong Nianshuang immediately realizes something, “I want to call my agent.” 

In the middle of the night, the Chao Yang District police station is brightly lit. 
There are a large number of luxury cars parking at the door, and lawyers hurry 
in and out. Those rich second generations have an attitude that they are not 
frightened because they are rich, but Dong Nianshuang is not. She is very 
afraid. 

In Hua Country, once an actor is involved in drug abuse, her career is over… 

“Nianshuang, you listen, lawyers are talking to the police outside. No matter 
what they ask you later, you must insist that you do not know,” The agent 



rushes in a hurry, and she knows it might not end well this time. But whatever 
it is, she tries her best to get Dong Nianshuang out of the police station first. 

Dong Nianshuang is trembling all over, “I didn’t know it. They said that those 
were exciting things, but I didn’t eat them! I didn’t even have a bite.” 

“Miss Dong.” She has just finished speaking when the police come in with the 
test report, “Your blood is positive, and we have detected that it also contains 
methamphetamine. Now you are officially charged with drug abuse.” 

“What?” Dong Nianshuang excitedly rushes at them, “I didn’t take drugs! I 
didn’t!” 

The agent is also worried, “Officer, our Nianshuang didn’t touch those things. 
You… What is methamphetamine you just mentioned?” 

“It is ice narcotics.” The police says while controlling Dong Nianshuang, “It is 
the most common drug, which is also the favorite one of the rich second 
generations.” 

Dong Nianshuang frantically pushes aside the police and runs outside.” You 
framed me, I didn’t take drugs. I didn’t!” 

“Stop her quickly!” Several policemen catch Dong Nianshuang back, but this 
time they don’t treat her politely and handcuff her directly. 

The agent is so scared. She just stands aside, looking at all this blankly, with 
only one thought in her heart. 

It’s over. It’s completely over… 

“Am I not wrong?” Tang Cao returns home after playing at midnight. He 
glances at his mobile phone and finds a new push. When he clicks on it, he 
sees that someone breaks the news that some rich second generations and 
stars were caught gathering to take drugs. 

“Dong Nianshuang?” Tang Cao is happy. He immediately sends the 
screenshot to the chatting group of playboys. A rich second generation says it 
to be true, for he also played in the entertainment city, and saw the police take 
those people away. 



The common people pay special attention to such things as stars taking 
drugs, especially when Dong Nianshuang gets involved. Some people dig out 
what happened to her on the yacht before. This time many people don’t trust 
her. First she slept with a man on the yacht, and then she took drugs. How 
dare does this young actress? 

The next day the thing continues to develop. Yan Hua also reads the news 
and discusses with her mother and grandmother after Lang Ruoxian sends his 
two children to school. 

“Mom, are you hiding something from me?” Yan Hua stares at Bai Susu with 
intense eyes. 

Bai Susu smiles, “I still want to ask you! Does Ruoxian do it?” 

Chang Pei’e looks at the two with her reading glasses, “If you ask me, I’d like 
to answer yes!” 

“I also think so…” Yan Hua nods, “However stupid Dong Nianshuang is, she 
doesn’t dare to make fun of her career. That is drug abuse! If she was caught 
taking drugs, she can’t turn over. 

“Ask him when he comes back.” Bai Susu also wants to know what method 
her son-in-law used, “Dong Nianshuang can’t get along in the entertainment 
circle. If Bai Family doesn’t protect her, she is expected to stay in prison for 
several years.” 

Lang Ruoxian didn’t have much trouble this time. The rich second generations 
had already taken drugs. He just let people secretly put drugs in the juice of 
Dong Nianshuang that night, and the dose was not much. 

This is also what makes him dissatisfied. If too much drug is put in, Dong 
Nianshuang can easily find something wrong. But too little is put, he is afraid 
that she can’t be convicted. 

“Young Master, Dong Nianqiu takes Bai Family’s lawyers to the police 
station.” 

Lang Ruoxian puts down his pen, “Do you know there is a Swallow Village at 
the foot of Yanshan Mountain?” 



“…Is it one of the three villages we went to when Childe Tang Cao was 
kidnapped last time?” 

Lang Ruoxian nods, “The biggest one is Swallow Village. I receive information 
that Yanshan Hot Spring has been bought by Bai Family.” 

Yanshan Hot Spring is the earliest hot spring resort around Yanjing. When it 
was first built, it was even a special place for national leaders. Later, many 
new hot springs have been built around Yanjing one after another, and 
Yanshan Hot Spring was abandoned. 

Gradually, due to outdated facilities and equipment, there are few guests. 

“Bai Family wants to redevelop it?” Shu Sheng pushes his glasses, “Do they 
want to buy land in Swallow Village?” 

“Yes.” Lang Ruoxian hooks the corner of his mouth, “Otherwise, it will be 
meaningless for them to buy Yanshan Hot Spring. Only by buying Swallow 
Village with it together can they rebuild a high-grade Hot Spring Villa.” 

Shu Sheng’s eyes light up, “Young Master, you mean…” 

“Bai Family thinks that no one knows about it. According to their progress, 
they won’t publicize the information until the second half of the year. You take 
lawyers to Swallow Village immediately to sign a contract with them and take 
the land usage right.” 

Bai Family is willing to take care of Dong Nianshuang, then he will let them 
know the consequences. Let them see which one is more important, the 
sister-in-law of Bai Yuanqi or hundreds of millions yuan. 

The lawyers of the big financial clique are not paid for nothing. The Bai 
Family’s lawyers try their best to make Dong Nianshuang get rid of the charge 
of drug abuse charge. She only is judged as taking the wrong medication. The 
reason is that she has very little ice narcotics in her body, and Dong 
Nianshuang also insists that she just doesn’t know. 

But whether she knew it or not, she participated in the drug abuse incident. 
Although she could escape jail, the official documents of National Radio and 
Television Administration explicitly require that no company should sign 
contracts with artists with drug abuse history, and any production involving 
artists with drug abuse history must not pass censorship. 



Therefore, Dong Nianshuang’s career in the entertainment circle… is over. 

“Do you have any plans for the future?” The agent knows that Dong 
Nianshuang has returned home and calls her immediately. 

Dong Nianshuang laughs wryly, “I don’t know.” 

She doesn’t know what else she can do after leaving the entertainment circle. 

“It’s not so bad. Your family is rich, and your sister and brother-in-law can help 
you. You can work at Bai Consortium, or do whatever you like.” The agent 
comforts her a little, “We will contact later when we are free!” 

Dong Nianshuang knows that the company has found a new actor for her to 
manage. Dong Nianshuang has left the circle, but others will have to continue 
life in the circle. 

“Congratulations, Mrs. Lang. You are pregnant with a pigeon pair!” Today is 
Yan Hua’s birth inspection day. The doctor tells her that it can already be seen 
clearly that the babies are one boy and one girl. 

Bai Susu and Tang Yao who accompany her are excited. Yan Hua who is in 
the arms of Lang Ruoxian also has a face of excitement. When the family 
leave the hospital, they are all very happy. 

The reporter just takes the picture and posts it on the internet. Some netizens 
guess whether Yan Hua is pregnant with twins. 

Dong Nianshuang also reads the news. She grimly looks at Yan Hua in the 
photo. 
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Chapter 325 The Nervous Man 
“Are you all right?” Bai Jingzhu takes a sip of coffee, “The internet said you 
took… took drugs. Is it true?” 

Dong Nianshuang sits opposite her, looking very withered. Hearing her words, 
Dong Nianshuang takes off her sunglasses, “Do you think it is possible? I am 
an actor. How could I do something that would ruin my career?” 



“Oh, your dark circle is very obvious. Aren’t you sleeping well?” Bai Jingzhu 
cries, “You have to think positively. You won’t starve to death if you don’t act 
anyway. We will have more time to go shopping and watch the show 
together.” 

Dong Nianshuang is anxious to slap Bai Jingzhu in her heart. If it weren’t for 
Bai Jingzhu’s usefulness, she would never talk to this fool. 

“Didn’t my brother-in-law tell you that I had been framed?” She squeezes a 
smile, “I didn’t know it was drugs, and I didn’t know who put the drugs in my 
drink.” 

Bai Yuanqi said it of course, but he did not say whether Dong Nianshuang had 
been framed. Instead, he told Bai Jingzhu that it is unknown whom Dong 
Nianshuang had offended, so she was dealt with. Bai Yuanqi asked Bai 
Jingzhu to stay away from Dong Nianshuang. 

But Bai Jingzhu is not afraid. She does not believe that anyone would dare to 
frame her. So she is bashful to tell Dong Nianshuang the truth. She speaks 
with hesitation, “What are you going to do then? You don’t know who did this 
to you…” 

“I know!” Dong Nianshuang narrows her eyes, “It is Tang Duo! Tang Duo let 
Lang Ruoxian frame me.” 

Bai Jingzhu stares, “Tang Duo? Why did she harm you?” 

“Because…” Dong Nianshuang’s rim of eyes become red and she starts to 
cry, “Because I was drunk on the yacht and had sex with Lang Ruoxian.” 

“Oh, my god!” Bai Jingzhu opens her mouth and doesn’t react for a long time. 
Then she happily hugs Dong Nianshuang, “You are too good! Well done! 
Make that b***h Tang Duo angry to death.” 

Dong Nianshuang wipes her tears, “But you have seen what she did to me. It 
was clearly Lang Ruoxian who got into bed with me through drunkenness, but 
she blames me and is hard to me.” 

“Women are all like this, aren’t they? If something happens, they don’t mind 
their husbands. It takes two to tango, doesn’t it?” 

Bai Jingzhu asks, “Do you like Lang Ruoxian?” 



“I used to like him, otherwise I wouldn’t have slept with him.” Dong 
Nianshuang says with a firm face, “But now I hate him so much. He doesn’t 
dare to offend Tang Family and he wants to coax Tang Duo to be happy, so 
he has sacrificed me. How can I continue loving such a man?” 

Yes! Since it is so, we can’t let Tang Duo feel better.” Bai Jingzhu bangs the 
table, “She’s made you be about to leave the entertainment circle, so you can 
also let her lose… By the way, what does she like best?” 

Dong Nianshuang hides her smile and thinks for a moment, “It should be the 
children in her belly. It seems that she is pregnant with a pigeon pair.” 

“What makes this b***h so lucky!” Bai Jingzhu curses, hoping that Yan Hua 
will fall and miscarry.” 

“It’s not that easy.” Dong Nianshuang sighs, “Do you think it’s a palace 
struggling story? You just push a woman casually and she will have an 
abortion.” 

Bai Jingzhu grabs her hand and says, “Yes! We can make kind of accident 
and let her fall herself.” 

The two stay in the cafe for a whole afternoon. When they leave, Bai Jingzhu 
looks at the opposite building and doesn’t move. 

“You want to see Hua Yan?” Dong Nianshuang asks her. The opposite is Hua 
Family’s company. 

Bai Jingzhu blinks, “It’s no use seeing him now. But after hearing what you 
just said, I find out what if he gets married! Since you can sleep with Lang 
Ruoxian, then I can also seduce Hua Yan in the future. Men! When his wife 
becomes pregnant, it will be my chance.” 

“…You are right.” Dong Nianshuang sneers in her heart, but she says, “Men 
are all like that. After they get married, they will feel better about the women 
outside.” 

Bai Jingzhu nods. Her eyes suddenly brighten and she rushes out of the road, 
“Hua Yan!” 



Dong Nianshuang sees Hua Yan coming out of the building, Bai Jingzhu runs 
up to him to talk. It is unknown what they talk. Hua Yan looks at Dong 
Nianshuang. Dong Nianshuang smiles. Hua Yan nods and drives away. 

“How disappointing it is! It ends this way every time!” Bai Jingzhu comes back 
with a face of disappointment. 

Dong Nianshuang pats her, “Let’s go. I’ll take you home first.” 

When Hua Yan comes home, Hua Zhong is just about to go out. Hua Yan 
stops him. 

“Have you been in touch with Tang Duo recently?” 

Hua Zhong glances at him, “I used WeChat to chat with her a few days ago. 
She is now pregnant with twins and seldom comes out. What’s the matter?” 

“Then you remind her. I saw Dong Nianshuang and Bai Jingzhu stay together 
today.” Hua Yan frowns, “Dong Nianshuang is just a muckraker. I suspect 
Lang Ruoxian is behind the matter of her taking drugs.” 

“Do you mean that she wants revenge on Tang Duo?” 

Hua Yan shrugs, “Who knows? Please remind Tang Duo! She is in a special 
situation now, and any accident will be fatal.” 

“I see.” Hua Zhong nods. 

Sitting into the car, he thinks for a moment and takes out his mobile phone. 

Yan Hua is listening to music and giving prenatal education to the babies. She 
isn’t surprised to hear Hua Zhong say that Dong Nianshuang might find Bai 
Jingzhu to plan to harm her. 

“The two of them, one will do whatever it takes to achieve her goals, while the 
other is a brainless fool whose brain is full of paste. When they stay together, 
they certainly will do something bad.” 

Hua Zhong grunts, “My eldest brother said so, so he let me remind you.” 

“Thanks. I will pay attention to that.” 



Hua Zhong is quiet for a few seconds and then he asks, “How are the 
babies?” 

“They are quite good. Maybe because they are twins, they create more 
disturbance than when I was pregnant with Gungun.” Yan Hua’s voice is full of 
laughing. Hua Zhong also smiles, “That’s good. I’ll go to see them when they 
are born.” 

“Welcome, remember to bring gifts!” 

The two chat casually and Hua Zhong takes the initiative to hang up. Yan Hua 
tells Lang Ruoxian about this. Lang Ruoxian says with gloomy eyes, “Last 
time, she should have been given a lot of drugs and sent to jail directly.” 

“You see, someone has already quit the entertainment circle and is still 
unwilling to accept the lesson until she reaches her goal.” Yan Hua shakes 
her head, “I don’t have any previous memory. I don’t know what happened 
between me and Dong Nianshuang and why she hated me so much.” 

“No reason is needed.” What reasons does she need to be jealous of a 
person? 

Lang Ruoxian touches her belly. When he sees her yawn, he dims the 
bedside lamp, “Sleep for a while. Eat when you wake up.” 

Yan Hua says that she has slept in the afternoon, but her eyes are closed. 
Soon she is heard breathing smoothly. Lang Ruoxian smiles and gets out of 
bed carefully. He picks up his mobile phone and walks out of the door. 

“Call someone to keep an eye on Dong Nianshuang. No matter what she 
does, I must be informed in the first place.” 

Lang Ruoxian doesn’t dare to gamble. He decides to catch Dong Nianshuang 
as soon as something is wrong. 

Dong Nianshuang is actually a very careful person. She can think calmly most 
of the time. Except when facing Tang Duo, she will become stupid because of 
jealousy. Otherwise, she won’t think of using Bai Jingzhu, but she never thinks 
of the consequences of doing so. 

Or maybe she thinks, but she can’t care so much. 



“You remember, your daughter will be my daughter-in-law in the future!” Ever 
since she knows that Yan Hua has a pigeon pair in her belly, Fei Ying says so 
every time in the video phone call. And she is especially envious. 

“Why didn’t I have twins?” 

Yan Hua rolls her eyes, “I told you that twins depend on genetic inheritance. 
There is no such gene even in your ancestral grave.” 

“I don’t know where my ancestral grave is.” Fei Ying curls her lips, “Fei Family 
never has twins. It is said that traditional Chinese medicine can regulate to 
have twins now, but I am afraid that the children born in that way will have 
problems.” 

“It is better to let nature take its course.” Yan Hua says, “Anyway, you are 
healthy. If you really want to have twins, just have another try later.” 

“No, I don’t want to have more children. Two is enough!” 

It is summer vacation time again. Yan Hua’s belly has already been very big. 
Gungun now doesn’t dare to touch her. He always feels that mother’s belly will 
be broken if it is poked. The weather is getting hotter and hotter, but everyone 
hasn’t gone out to avoid summer heat this year, for fear that Yan Hua will not 
adapt to a strange place. 

But at this time, Lang Ruoxian has to fly to Eastern Europe. 

“I would have been there in September, but your due date is in early October, 
and the doctor says that twins are mostly premature, so I want to go there 
ahead of schedule and deal with things well.” 

Lang Ruoxian massages Yan Hua’s calves. Yan Hua now has to be 
supported to turn over. If it weren’t for that he had to go there to solve the 
problem himself, Lang Ruoxian would never have left home. 

“Don’t worry. There are so many people in the family!” Yan Hua doesn’t feel 
worried, “Is three days enough? Is the schedule too tight?” 

It takes two days to go and return, which means that he only has one day to 
deal with things. 



“That’s enough.” Lang Ruoxian touches her face, “Let Mom sleep with you 
these three days.” 

Even if this is set, but after two days Lang Ruoxian decides not to go but let 
Shu Sheng have the trip. 

“I cannot leave you.” He seems to have an obsession with leaving Yan Hua 
alone, insisting that he must accompany her until the babies are born. 

Yan Hua sees him so nervous that she cannot help hugging the man and 
patting him, “I’m fine! You see, I don’t go out and stay at home all day long. 
How can I have a chance of an accident?” 

Lang Ruoxian compresses his lips. Yesterday his men reported that Dong 
Nianshuang met Bai Jingzhu again. This time they were at Dong 
Nianshuang’s house. He always has a very bad presentiment. 

“What’s wrong with you?” Yan Hua cannot help but ask, “I’m really fine. You 
don’t frighten yourself.” 

Lang Ruoxian hugs her, “What would you like to eat in the evening?” 

Yan Hua’s attention can be easily diverted after she is pregnant. She 
swallows immediately after hearing the man’s question, “Milk egg stew, I 
especially want to eat it when I watched the TV program which teaches 
people how to do it yesterday.” 

“Well, I’ll tell the housemaid.” 

Dong Nianshuang knows that Lang Ruoxian sends someone to keep an eye 
on her. She pretends not to know anything and keeps waiting. Finally, when it 
is cool after a heavy rain, Yan Hua comes out from home to enjoy fresh air. 
Lang Ruoxian accompanies her and Bai Susu to the shopping mall to buy 
baby products. 

Before that, Lang Ruoxian has Dong Nianshuang caught. When Dong 
Nianshuang sees these bodyguards in the parking lot, she secretly sends a 
message to Bai Jingzhu, and then fights hard. Finally she is knocked out and 
taken away. 



“Are you tired? Shall we go to the cafe over there and have a rest?” Bai Susu 
is afraid that Yan Hua is uncomfortable for walking too much, so Lang 
Ruoxian helps Yan Hua walk in. 

“I want to go to the bathroom.” Yan Hua doesn’t sit down and looks at the 
direction of the bathroom. 

Lang Ruoxian says, “I’ll go with you.” 
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Chapter 326 Yan Hua Is Missing 

Lang Ruoxian waits at the door of the bathroom. When Yan Hua enters, he 
waves to her. A few minutes later, Shu Sheng calls and he is a little flustered. 

“Young Master, Bai Jingzhu brings the police and takes Dong Nianshuang 
away.” 

Lang Ruoxian’s face suddenly changes. He goes to kick the door of the 
bathroom but he finds that the door is locked. 

“Hua? Hua?” No one answers. Lang Ruoxian hurries to find the waiter in the 
cafe for the key. 

Before he opens his mouth, he hears the alarm. There are not many 
customers in the cafe but there is a mall outside. Everyone hears the alarm. 
Bai Susu runs here hastily. The waiter wants to run away but is caught by 
Lang Ruoxian. 

“Ruoxian, where is Hua?” Bai Susu’s face changes with fear. She sees the 
waiter give Lang Ruoxian the key. 

“She’s in the bathroom. Mom, you wait for us outside.” Lang Ruoxian doesn’t 
know where the fire is, but it sounds like it’s in the bathroom. 

Bai Susu doesn’t leave. She runs after Lang Ruoxian. After the door of the 
bathroom is opened, they find that the bathroom is full of smoke. Because the 
alarm is triggered, the faucet on the roof is spraying water. 

“Hua?” They look for Yan Hua but they find that Yan Hua is not in it. 



Bai Susu coughs and covers her mouth. She is so anxious that she wants to 
cry, “Hua? Where is Hua?” 

Lang Ruoxian finds a window in the back storage room, from which the fire 
was started. Now it has been watered out. The window is half open. Lang 
Ruoxian jumps up and finds that although it is the eighth floor, there is a 
staircase directly leading to the ground outside. And he sees a lace hanging 
on a nail. 

“This is Hua’s clothes!” Bai Susu recognizes it at a glance, “Is Hua outside?” 

Lang Ruoxian’s face is gloomy and terrible. He shakes his head and says, 
“Mom, call the police. I will look for her.” 

The bodyguards run over when they hear the alarm. Seeing only Lang 
Ruoxian and Bai Susu, they know the situation is not good. 

“Check the monitor.” Lang Ruoxian says to the bodyguards and asks Shu 
Sheng to find Dong Nianshuang. 

Bai Susu knows that Dong Nianshuang has been taken away by Bai Jingzhu. 
She calls Bai Family. Bai Yuanqi’s mother doesn’t know what happens. Bai 
Yuanqi is at home and answers the phone. 

“Aunt Tang, I’m Bai Yuanqi. Don’t worry. We’ll go to find Jingzhu right away. 
We’ll contact you as soon as we find her.” 

Bai Susu is not polite to him, “If something happens to my daughter, I won’t let 
you go!” 

Bai Yuanqi’s mother is also flustered. She doesn’t expect Bai Jingzhu to be so 
bold. 

“She doesn’t answer the phone.” Bai Yuanqi turns twice, “Mom, you contact 
Jingzhu at home. If she doesn’t answer the phone, you can send her 
messages and tell her to get Yan Hua back quickly.” 

“Where are you going?” 

“I’ll go out and look for her!” 



“Young master!” Lang Ruoxian runs to the back door of the shopping mall and 
meets Shu Sheng who comes over, “Xiaokai has gone to the monitoring room. 
If there is any news, he will inform us immediately.” 

The police arrive soon. Shu Sheng tells Lang Ruoxian that one of the 
policemen was the one who took Dong Nianshuang away. 

“Mr. Lang, we know you are in a hurry, but we hope you can cooperate with 
us to answer some questions.” The leading policeman says, “Mrs. Lang…” 

“You might as well ask your colleague first.” Lang Ruoxian ignores him and 
looks at the young policeman next to him. 

Liu Yang is stunned, “Mr. Lang, what’s wrong with Li?” 

Li dares not to say a word. He has already guessed what’s going on in his 
heart, but… 

When Bai Jingzhu came to the police, she showed her identity. He had just 
been a policeman for two years and he felt that this was an opportunity. It was 
good for him to have a good relationship with these rich families. Especially 
when Bai Jingzhu told him that the person under house arrest was Dong 
Nianshuang, he was even more active. 

That’s the goddess he liked since he was a student. She was recently 
exposed to a drug scandal. But the entertainment industry is so messy. No 
one knows what’s going on. So he wanted to save her first. He didn’t expect 
that after he went, the other side said that they were from the Tang Family. 

“If I knew it was Mr. Lang, I…” 

Li regrets so much. But at that time Bai Jingzhu kept forcing him. He thought it 
was not a big deal to take Dong Nianshuang away first. He didn’t expect… 

“Because of you, my wife was taken away by those two women.” Lang 
Ruoxian looks at him coldly, “How can such a stupid person become a 
policeman?” 

Liu Yang looks at Li and doesn’t know what to say. At last, he asks Li to stand 
aside. Then he says, “Mr. Lang, are you sure that Mrs. Lang was taken away 
by Ms. Dong and Ms. Bai?” 



“I’m sure.” Lang Ruoxian says coldly, “I’ve been sending someone to stare at 
her. If it weren’t for this stupid policeman, I would have taken my wife home.” 

Hearing what Lang Ruoxian says, Liu Yang’s face gets darker, but he can’t 
say anything. At this time Xiaokai runs back, “Young Master, I found it!” 

Half an hour ago, two people left the back door pushing a half-man high trash 
can. The bodyguards have already gone to look for them according to the 
video. 

“They are two women. They are fat and dressed as cleaners.” 

The bodyguards don’t find anyone in the cleaning room. The person in charge 
of the shopping mall says that they are temporary workers and have already 
left work. 

“Mr. Lang, leave it to us! We’ll go to their house right away.” Liu Yang 
arranges people quickly. At the same time, he informs the Ministry of 
Transport that it is a malignant kidnapping. 

At this time, Bai Jingzhu stands in front of Dong Nianshuang and stops her in 
an old house in Nancheng. 

“Are you crazy?” 

This woman even says that she is going to cut open Tang Duo’s belly. 

“Didn’t we say that? We just leave her here to frighten her. Maybe she will 
miscarry because of shock.” Bai Jingzhu looks at Dong Nianshuang 
inconceivably, “She will die if you open her belly.” 

Dong Nianshuang stares at her. After a few seconds, she shows a creepy 
smile, “Well, listen to you.” 

“You… What’s wrong with you?” Bai Jingzhu has never seen Dong 
Nianshuang like this, like a stranger. 

“I’m OK!” Dong Nianshuang smiles and looks at Tang Duo, who is sleeping on 
the sofa, “Let’s go. Now they must be looking for her all over the world.” 

Bai Jingzhu nods. She pulls the rope tied to Yan Hua, “It should not be untied! 
Hum, Tang Duo, I didn’t expect you to have today. Don’t blame us. There’s 
water and bread in this room. It’s enough for you to live for a week.” 



She thinks that Tang Duo will be found in a week. There is no danger at all. 
The thing will develop in the direction she discussed with Dong Nianshuang at 
the beginning. They just scare Tang Duo. It will be better if Tang Duo has a 
bad luck and miscarry. 

“Let’s go!” Bai Jingzhu picks up her bag. Dong Nianshuang smiles, “I’ll check 
the kitchen again. You can go to check the bedroom. We must make sure 
there is no potential danger. We just scare her. If anything happens to her, 
we’ll be in trouble.” 

“What a bother!” Bai Jingzhu mumbles and walks into the bedroom, while 
Dong Nianshuang goes to the kitchen with a strange smile. 

Soon Bai Jingzhu shouts in the sitting room, “Alright? Hurry up. Otherwise we 
can’t catch the plane.” 

They made an appointment to leave here and go straight to the airport. They 
will go abroad for a few days and then come back. 

“Okay!” Dong Nianshuang runs out, glances at Tang Duo coldly and reminds 
Bai Jingzhu, “Where is the key? Take it away and throw it out later.” 

Bai Jingzhu shakes the key in her hand, “I have taken it. Let’s go!” 

When the door is closed, Dong Nianshuang sees Tang Duo move. She shows 
a cruel smile on her face. 

It’s great that she wakes up! She can feel death step by step. No one will help 
her, “Tang Duo, I want you to disappear in this world forever…” Dong 
Nianshuang thinks. 

“Hmm…” Yan Hua feels a pain in her stomach. She instinctively calls Lang 
Ruoxian, but no one answers her for a long time. Yan Hua tries to open her 
eyes and finds that she is not lying on the bed at home, but a shabby room. 

Her heart jolts. She sits up with her hands on the sofa and sees a rope on her 
legs. There are buckets of water and a box of bread on the dirty tea table and 
there is an empty bucket next to them. 

Yan Hua is afraid. She knew that it was bad when someone covered her 
mouth in the bathroom and then she fainted. She thinks she will see Dong 
Nianshuang. Then she can delay time and negotiate with Dong Nianshuang. 



But now, Dong Nianshuang is not even there. It seems that she intends to 
lock her here. Yan Hua is flustered for a while and then calms down slowly. 
Well, at least she’s not in danger now. 

“Lang Ruoxian will find me soon!” Yan Hua is very confident in her man. So 
she sits down and begins to find a way to untie the rope. 

But soon she finds something wrong. There is a burning smell in the room. 
She stands up quickly. The rope on her legs restricts her. She can only walk a 
few steps. But she still sees smoke coming out of the kitchen. 

“Damn it!” Yan Hua’s eyes shrink. Dong Nianshuang wants to burn her. 

She hurries back to the sofa. Now she has to untie the rope to escape. Yan 
Hua spends a long time but the rope is not loose at all. The smoke in the 
kitchen has gone to the sitting room. Yan Hua feels suffocated. Yan Hua tries 
to stand up to find if there is any tool to untie the rope. 

Bai Yuanqi’s mother can’t get in touch with Bai Jingzhu all the time, so she 
goes to her room to have a look. Maybe she can find some clues. Then she 
finds that Bai Jingzhu’s suitcase and passport are missing. 

“Yuanqi!” She immediately calls her son, “Your sister may go to the airport. 
Her passport is missing.” 

Bai Yuanqi is looking for Bai Jingzhu in the place where Bai Jingzhu often 
goes. After hanging up, he drives to the airport and tells Bai Susu about the 
situation. 

“Ruoxian, Ruoxian.” Bai Susu has been in the shopping mall. Tang Yao just 
came here. Tang Cao stays at home because he dares not to let Chang Pei’e 
and the two little guys know what happened. 

“Bai Yuanqi said that Bai Jingzhu’s passport and suitcase were missing. They 
suspected that she would go abroad.” 

Lang Ruoxian takes a look at Xiaokai. Xiaokai immediately turns on the 
computer. A few minutes later, he shouts, “I found it! They booked a flight to 
the Mi Country. The plane will take off in an hour!” 

“Go to the airport!” Lang Ruoxian rushes into the elevator. Shu Sheng hurries 
to ask the bodyguard to drive the car to the gate of the mall. 



When the car is halfway, Officer Liu calls to say that they have found one of 
the cleaners. She said she sent people to a public parking lot near the mall 
and provided the model and color of the car. 

A few minutes later, the phone rings again. 
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Chapter 327 Save Your Wife Or Save Your Babies 
“Mr. Lang, we find that the last time the car appeared was at the crossing of 
Huaguang Road in Nancheng. We have dispatched all the police forces of the 
nearby police station out. I believe we can find Mrs. Lang soon.” 

Lang Ruoxian hangs up the phone and ponders for a moment. Bai Susu 
keeps crying quietly. Seeing Lang Ruoxian like this, she is afraid of the bad 
news, so she can’t help asking with tears. 

“The police just said they found the car that took Hua away.” Lang Ruoxian 
asks Shu Sheng to stop the car, “Mom, Dad, you go to the airport. I will go to 
the place provided by the police. I suspect that Hua is locked there.” 

Dong Nianshuang and Bai Jingzhu can’t take Yan Hua with them. The place 
where they park is most likely where they hide Yan Hua. 

“Well, you go!” Bai Susu says and thinks again, “No, I’ll go with you.” 

Finally, Lang Ruoxian asks Shu Sheng and Xiaokai to go to the airport. He 
takes the two elders to Huaguang Road. 

At this time, Yan Hua is soaked in sweat. It is hot in July and August. There is 
no air conditioner in the old house. Something in the kitchen has burned. She 
can hear the occasional crackling. 

The sitting room has been covered with a thin layer of gray smoke. Yan Hua 
can’t untie the rope. She can’t find any tools around. Her two fingernails have 
been broken. She has no time to care about the pain. She opens the mineral 
water and pulls off the sofa cover to get wet. 

“Yan Hua! You must keep on. Lang Ruoxian will come to save you.” Yan Hua 
cheers herself up. She takes off her coat, wets it with water and then covers 
her mouth with the wet coat. 



It’s impossible to untie the rope. Now she has to try to save herself. She is 
glad to have learned how to help herself at the scene of the fire when she was 
at a foundation in G City. 

“Don’t smoke too much. Try to make things around me wet. Stand low 
because the smoke is coming up.” Yan Hua says and does so. 

Her stomach is too big to go prone, so she lies on the ground. The floor of the 
old house is made of cement. After lying for a while, she feels the chill seeping 
into her skin. Her stomach began to ache just now. But she can’t take care of 
the chill. She touches her stomach and says to the two babies. 

“Be good and work hard with Mom, will you? Let’s hold on a little longer. Dad 
will come to save us.” 

But Yan Hua obviously feels that her stomach is getting more and more 
painful. She is a little flustered. She has an impression of this kind of pain. 
She was so painful when Gungun was about to be born. 

“No!” Yan Hua cries and continues to say to the babies in her stomach, “Mom 
doesn’t give up. You can’t give up. Grandpa, Grandmas, your brother and 
sister… And Lulu, everyone is waiting for you to be born. You haven’t seen 
them. You must be okay…” 

Boom! It seems that something has hit the ground. Yan Hua holds on to the 
sofa and stands up. She sees that the kitchen wall is half fallen. There aren’t 
any steel bars in this old house and the wall seems to have been added later. 
In addition, as time goes on, the brick structure is not firm. So the wall directly 
collapsed in half. 

“Lang Ruoxian… Hurry up!” Because the wall collapsed, Yan Hua directly 
sees the kitchen. 

Some wooden furniture has been burned. The fire has spread to the overhead 
cabinets on the wall. Yan Hua is desperate because there is only one window 
in the whole kitchen. When Yan Hua sees the window, she has a surprise for 
a moment. 

But soon she finds that the window is sealed and the smoke can’t go out. 

“Ah…” Her stomach is still painful. Yan Hua lies back on the ground and 
continues to talk to the babies. 



She doesn’t know what else to do. The smoke in the room becomes so thick 
that she can’t see the ceiling. Yan Hua slowly closes her eyes. Her tears drop 
on the ground. 

“I’m sorry…” She touches her stomach, “Mom is useless. I can’t show you the 
world. I’m sorry…” 

Boom! There is a loud noise again. But Yan Hua doesn’t move. So she 
doesn’t see the wires in the kitchen causing the explosion, which just blows a 
hole in the window. 

“Mr. Lang, come with me!” Liu Yang sees Lang Ruoxian arrive, he shouts and 
runs. 

Lang Ruoxian follows up and hears him saying, “The surveillance of a fruit 
shop just caught the car passing by here. There is only one community 
ahead.” 

A group of people run to the entrance of the community. They just see a few 
old ladies playing mahjong in the shade of the trees pointing to a building 
behind them in panic. 

“How can there be smoke?” 

“Yes, isn’t it a fire?” 

“No, the house is empty after the family moved away for more than half a 
year.” 

“Oh, it’s on fire. You see the smoke is black. Call 119 now!” 

Lang Ruoxian and Liu Yang look at each other and rush to the corridor 
together. 

“Fourth floor, the one on the right!” 

The police in the back run up together. Tang Yao and Bai Susu follow behind 
them. As soon as they run to the second floor, they can smell the smoke. 
When they get to the third floor, they can see the smoke floating down. 

The security door on the right side of the fourth floor is almost covered by 
smoke. Lang Ruoxian kicks it. The security door creaks and becomes askew. 
Liu Yang kicks it again and kicks the door lock out. 



“Mr. Lang, you can’t go in!” He stops Lang Ruoxian at the first time, “We don’t 
know what’s going on inside. Wait for the fire brigade. I’ll go in and save your 
wife.” 

Lang Ruoxian pushes him away directly and rushes in. Liu Yang hurries to 
catch up. 

“Hua!” Bai Susu is stopped. She kneels on the ground and cries. 

Tang Yao sobs. They just hope that Yan Hua is here, but now they hope that 
Yan Hua is not in it. 

The room is very small. Lang Ruoxian runs into the sofa within a few steps. 
He vaguely sees a big thing on the ground and rushes to it without thinking. 
His eyes brighten when he finds that it is Yan Hua. 

“Hua! Hua!” He picks up Yan Hua carefully. Yan Hua doesn’t respond at all. 
He immediately picks her up and runs out. When Liu Yang sees them, he 
hurries to get out of the way and shouts to the people outside. 

“Go away! Get out of the way!” 

Lang Ruoxian holds Yan Hua and runs to the yard directly. Bai Susu wants to 
touch Yan Hua with her shaking hands. Tang Yao suddenly cries loudly. 

“Blood. Hua is bleeding!” 

At the airport, Bai Jingzhu wants to run away when she sees Bai Yuanqi. 

“You run!” Bai Yuanqi sneers, “If you run away today, you will be flee from 
justice. When you come back, you will be in jail.” 

Bai Jingzhu looks at Dong Nianshuang. Dong Nianshuang lowers her head. 
Bai Jingzhu doesn’t know what she is thinking. Bai Jingzhu still says, “Don’t 
scare me. What are you saying? I didn’t do anything.” 

“You didn’t do anything?” Bai Yuanqi grabs her, “You locked Tang Duo in the 
house and wanted to burn and kill her. Why do you still have the face to say 
you didn’t do anything?” 

Bai Jingzhu is shocked, “You… What are you saying?” She says in a hurry, 
“No one burns her. We just scare her. Now that you know it, she must have 
been found by now.” 



“She can’t be founded!” Dong Nianshuang suddenly raises her head and 
smiles strangely, “She’s burned to cinders. How can she be founded?” 

Bai Yuanqi looks at the woman directly, “I’m afraid I will let you down. Just 
now the police told me that Lang Ruoxian has found Tang Duo. Now she has 
been sent to the hospital.” 

“What?” Dong Nianshuang’s pupils dilate. She rushes up crazily. 

But she is pressed to the ground by the rushed bodyguards and police. Shu 
Sheng walks over slowly. He looks at Dong Nianshuang, who is a psycho in 
her eyes. Then he looks at Bai Jingzhu, who is scared to be silly. Finally, he 
puts his eyes on Bai Yuanqi. 

“Young Master Bai, I hope you don’t stop the police. You should give Bai 
Jingzhu to them.” 

Bai Yuanqi nods and hands Bai Jingzhu over to the police, “Don’t worry. We 
Bai Family won’t shield her.” 

“Yuanqi! Yuanqi, you can’t let them take me away.” Bai Jingzhu responds, 
crying and shouting, “I don’t know anything. I thought it was just…” 

“Jingzhu.” Bai Yuanqi sighs, “Don’t make trouble. Go back with the police and 
make it clear. I’ll go to the police station with you.” 

At the hospital, Yan Hua is pushed into the operating room. The director who 
has been in charge of her checkup comes out and looks at the Tang Family 
solemnly. 

“Doctor…” Bai Susu dares not to ask. 

Lang Ruoxian stares at the doctor. His eyes are like a calm black storm, which 
can break people at any time. 

“Mrs. Lang must have a Caesarean operation immediately to get the babies 
out.” The doctor pauses and says, “I can’t guarantee that the fetuses will 
survive.” 

Bai Susu cries sadly and falls down on Tang Cao. Tang Cao, who has come 
from home secretly, bursts into tears. Tang Yao is also very sad. But they 
don’t say anything. They just look at Lang Ruoxian. 



“I only want my wife to live.” Lang Ruoxian says without any hesitation, “As for 
the babies, try your best.” 

The doctor asks him to sign, “We must try our best to save a fetus.” 

The door of the operating room is closed again. Tang Cao secretly checks the 
premature birth of the fetus online. He sees that many children who were born 
prematurely at seven or eight months have survived. He feels hopeful. He 
also sees a proverb. 

In the case of preterm delivery, 7-month-old newborns can live, while 8-
month-old newborns are not easy to live. Tang Cao hurries to show it to Bai 
Susu. 

“Mom, look! My sister has been pregnant for more than seven months. Her 
babies can live, her babies can live!” 

Of course, Bai Susu knows this proverb, but it’s just a folk good moral to the 
mother and the fetus. She once saw a seven-month premature baby on TV, 
as big as a newborn kitten. She can hold the baby in one hand. 

And even if the babies can survive, they will also be ill because of congenital 
deficiency. 

But she doesn’t want so much now. As the doctor said, it’s good to have one 
alive. If… How sad Hua will be when she wakes up and knows that she lives 
at the cost of her two babies’ lives… 

Bai Susu sobs. 

“Tang Cao!” Fang Diandian and Chen Xiaopang runs down the corridor. 

Fang Diandian sees Tang Cao squatting in the ground from afar, and finds 
him sobbing when she approaches. 

“Is Sister Duo okay?” Chen Xiaopang sees Lang Ruoxian standing motionless 
next to the operating room door, so he dares not to ask loudly. 

Tang Cao wipes his tears and whispers, “The babies may not be safe.” 

“Stop crying.” Fang Diandian’s eyes are also red, “Sister Duo is so good. Her 
babies will be okay! Didn’t we ask for peace for her in the temple when we 
went on a trip before! Everything will be fine.” 
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Chapter 328 Who Are You 
An hour later, both nurses come out with little babies in their hands. 

Members of the Tang Family approach. Bai Susu wants to hug the babies but 
she dares not to reach out. The babies are too small just like kittens. 

“Now the babies are not out of danger. We’re going to send the babies to 
check and put them in the incubators.” One of the nurses says, “But the doctor 
just said that the situation was good.” 

“What about my wife?” Lang Ruoxian only glances at the little red babies and 
then stares at the nurse and asks. 

The nurse is frightened by his eyes and says, “Mrs. Lang is fine. The doctor is 
stitching her up.” 

Tang Yao and Tang Cao follow the nurse. They heard that holding the wrong 
baby may happen in the hospital. They firmly want to stare at the babies. 

“Great! Great!” Bai Susu bows with her hands together. Seeing Lang Ruoxian 
standing at the door of the operating room again, she can’t help saying, 
“Ruoxian, sit for a while.” 

Lang Ruoxian turns his head and glances at her, “Mom, I am okay. I’m not 
tired.” 

Bai Susu didn’t look at him carefully just now. She is also frightened at this 
time. Ruoxian’s eyes are very terrible as if trying to restrain something. She 
sighs and doesn’t say much. She sends a message to Fang Diandian. 

Chen Xiaopang and Fang Diandian are sent to the Tang Family to accompany 
the elderly and children. Fang Diandian said that Tang Duo’s grandma had 
begun to doubt. There’s no way to hide it. Sure enough, Chang Pei’e’s call 
arrives within minutes after the message is sent. 

“Which hospital are you in? Are Hua and the babies okay?” 

“Don’t worry, Mom. They are out of danger.” 



“How can you keep it from me?” Chang Pei’e says and is going to cry. Bai 
Susu comforts her for a long time. At last, Chang Pei’e says that she will bring 
two children over. 

Bai Susu knows that she can’t persuade her. So she asks Chen Xiaopang to 
drive them over and ask the housemaid to bring some daily necessities with 
her. 

Another hour later, Yan Hua is pushed out. 

“Hua?” Lang Ruoxian stares at Yan Hua’s face to make sure that she 
breathes smoothly. Then he takes over the position of the nurse and pushes 
the operating bed. 

The doctor takes off the mask and says, “Mrs. Lang is okay. She will wake up 
after the anesthetic. She can’t eat without venting. In the evening, she will 
keep people around her. If you have anything, please call me.” 

“Thank you, Doctor!” Bai Susu thanks and pushes Yan Hua back to the ward 
with Lang Ruoxian. 

Lang Ruoxian has already booked the Postpartum Care Center. Now he can 
only wait for Yan Hua to wake up and see if she wants to move. Although the 
ward here is a VIP room on the top floor, it is certainly not as professional as 
the Postpartum Care Center. 

Bai Susu wipes Yan Hua’s face while crying. Yan Hua looks pale and her 
hands are cold. 

“Mom, it’s okay. It’s over.” Lang Ruoxian sits beside the bed holding Yan 
Hua’s hand. Bai Susu covers her mouth and nods, “I know. I just feel sad.” 

Her daughter has never harmed anyone. But it’s the second time she’s been 
at a critical moment. If they hadn’t arrived in time, Yan Hua and the babies in 
her stomach would have died. 

“Since they don’t want to live, they can die.” Bai Susu wipes away her tears 
and calms down, “Ruoxian, you accompany Hua. I will solve this problem.” 

Lang Ruoxian looks at her and frowns. 



“Leave it to me!” Bai Susu pats him on the shoulder, “This time I’ll figure out 
what they owe me and what they owe Hua.” 

After saying this, Bai Susu walks out. Lang Ruoxian watches her close the 
door and then takes back his eyes. He thinks of the thing. If he is not satisfied 
with the solution of Bai Susu, he will deal with it again. 

What’s the most important right now is Yan Hua. He touches Yan Hua’s face 
and whispers, “Do you know that when I saw you lying there, my heart was 
gray as if the whole world had disappeared. I thought then that it was great 
that the world had disappeared. Anyway, without you, there was no need for 
the world to exist.” 

Lang Ruoxian believes that he will never forget the scene. The rope on Yan 
Hua’s legs had been burned. That is to say, if he arrived a few seconds later, 
the fire would have burnt on Yan Hua’s body. 

“Hua, don’t frighten me again, or I will tie you with me in the future, wherever 
you go.” 

Tang Cao just opens the door and comes in. After hearing this, the corner of 
his mouth twitches. He pretends not to hear… 

“Hua! Hua!” Chang Pei’e rushes in. 

Gungun runs in front and shouts, “Mom! Mom!” 

“Grandma, Hua hasn’t woken up yet. The doctor says the strength of the 
anesthetic hasn’t dissipated.” Lang Ruoxian sees his son look at him with 
tears in his eyes so he stretches out his hands. 

Gungun jumps into his arms and cries, “Are my brother and sister gone?” 

“They are very good but they are too small. Grandpa will show you later.” 

“What about Mom?” Gungun sobs, “When will Mom wake up?” 

“It’s going to be a while.” Lang Ruoxian hands him over to Wuyou and says, 
“Take your brother to wash his face.” 

Wuyou coaxes Gungun to go to the bathroom. Everyone hears her say. 

“Don’t be afraid. When Mom wakes up, I’ll kill the bad guys who harmed her.” 



Everyone is speechless. 

Chang Pei’e wipes her tears and keeps saying that Buddha will bless Hua. 
They told her that Hua and the babies were okay on the phone. But she’s still 
worried about them because she didn’t see them with her own eyes. 

“Mom, do you want to see the babies? We can come back when Hua wakes 
up.” Bai Susu comes in and looks at Lang Ruoxian. They are tacit. 

Chang Pei’e and two children are taken by Tang Yao to see the babies. Tang 
Cao runs back instead. 

“Is my sister okay?” He looks at Yan Hua on the bed and breathes a sigh of 
relief. Chen Xiaopang and Fang Diandian who follow him also breathe a sigh 
of relief. Then they say goodbye and leave first. 

It’s not appropriate for them to stay at such a time. As soon as they leave the 
hospital, someone calls Chen Xiaopang in the group of playboys. 

“Are you with Tang Cao? What is his family going to do?” 

Chen Xiaopang is confused. He asks the other side what’s going on. The 
other side asks him to read the financial news. 

Fang Diandian has opened micro blog. The shares of two companies of Dong 
Family are bought in a hostile takeover. In just half an hour, its market value 
has shrunk by a third. 

This causes panic in the stock market. Some shareholders don’t know what 
happens. 

“It’s good. They deserve it.” Chen Xiaopang knows that this is the action of the 
Tang Family. This time, Tang Family acts so fast. It seems that the Tang 
Family is going to destroy the Dong Family. 

“Don’t say I don’t remind you! Don’t meddle with the Dong Family. The Dong 
Family is doomed this time!” 

A bunch of the rich second generations express that they are not stupid. They 
will avoid the Dong Family. 

At the Bai Family. 



“Why don’t you talk?” Bai Jingzhu’s mother shouts at Bai Jiancheng. 

Bai Jiancheng says, “What do you want me to say? She made a big mistake. 
She almost killed Tang Duo! It’s said that Tang Duo was still pregnant with 
twins.” 

“I know. But don’t you say there’s news from the hospital that Tang Duo have 
been saved? But Jingzhu is still at the police station…” 

“Look by yourself.” Bai Jiancheng throws his phone over, “Look what they 
say.” 

On the mobile interface is a group of several business tycoons. Everyone 
says that the Tang Family is crazy. The Tang Family’s action will affect the 
whole stock market. What did the Dong Family do to make the Tang Family so 
crazy? 

“The Tang Family won’t give up this time. Do you see what they say? Now no 
one dares to meddle with the Dong Family.” Bai Jiancheng rubs his eyebrows, 
“It is the safest for Jingzhu to stay at the police station. Otherwise I’m afraid 
that the Tang Family will kill her directly.” 

“We can’t care about her now. Believe it or not, if I get her out, the Tang 
Family will turn to our company. Do you want our shares to be maliciously 
acquired?” 

Bai Jingzhu’s mother is stunned, “They… Will they? Our company is so big. It 
is not like the Dong Family. If they really do that, both sides will lose!” 

“They are not afraid.” Bai Jiancheng sighs, “Don’t you understand? The Tang 
Family is crazy. It’s about three lives and two unborn babies. Although they 
are saved, who knows what will happen in the future? They will not worry 
about the cost this time. They just want to revenge.” 

Bai Jiancheng stands up, “But we can’t. If Tang Family really deals with us, 
Tang Ming’s company and the Hua Family will take advantage of the 
situation.” 

“I see…” Bai Jingzhu’s mother is downcast, “I don’t care for the moment. I’ll 
see what happens in a few days.” 

Dong Nianqiu suddenly runs in from outside, kneels down and cries. 



“Dad! Mom! Please help the Dong family, please…” 

Bai Jingzhu’s mother looks at Bai Jiancheng. Bai Jiancheng sits on the sofa 
and says in a calm voice, “Have you found Yuanqi? What did he say?” 

“He…” 

Dong Nianqiu bites her lips and thinks of Bai Yuanqi’s words. 

“Nianqiu, don’t mention your family. It’s a question whether Jingzhu can be 
saved this time. I can’t sacrifice my family for your family. Without the 
company, I will buy a house for my father-in-law and mother-in-law. I will give 
them money. They can enjoy their old age.” 

“As for the company of your family, I’m sorry! I have no way.” 

Bai Jiancheng sighs, “Nianqiu, you and Yuanqi have been married for so 
many years. We know you’re a good person. So we don’t blame you for what 
Dong Nianshuang did. Otherwise, I can kill her this time because she framed 
Jingzhu!” 

“But you should think it clearly. In the future, if you still associate with her, you 
should go back to the Dong Family. Now Jingzhu is still at the police station. I 
don’t know if I can protect her. If there’s something wrong with her, I’ll settle 
with your sister, let alone the Tang Family!” 

Dong Nianqiu cries bitterly, “Thank you, Dad. I know…” 

She trembles and stands up. In fact, after knowing what Dong Nianshuang 
did, she knows that the Bai Family will no longer care about the Dong Family. 
What Dong Nianshuang did this time is irreparable. She isn’t driven out by the 
Bai Family. The Bai Family has done its best. 

“Dad, I’ll go to the police station now. Anyway, I will not get Jingzhu involved 
in.” 

Bai Jingzhu’s mother is very pleased. She was just afraid that Dong Nianqiu 
would be stupid and would speak for her sister. 

Bai Jiancheng nods, “You are sisters. She should listen to you. Hurry up.” 

In the hospital. 



“Hmm…” Yan Hua suddenly makes a sound, which scares everyone. 

Lang Ruoxian, who has been staring at her, hurries to shout, “Hua? Hua?” 

“Is my sister awake?” Tang Cao hurries to approach. 

Yan Hua opens her eyes slowly but she frowns. 

“Do you have any pain?” Lang Ruoxian reaches out and rings the bell. 

Then he sees Yan Hua look at him and ask, “Who are you?” 
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Chapter 329 She Really Wants to Complain 
The air becomes silent suddenly. A few seconds later, Tang Cao throws 
himself on Tang Duo’s hospital bed and shouts, “Sister, don’t scare us! Don’t 
you remember who I am?” 

“How did you make yourself like this?” Tang Duo stares at him with her 
beautiful eyes and says, “You look older!” 

Tang Cao is speechless. 

“Hua, do you remember us?” Tang Yao asks her in a wobbly voice. 

Tang Duo rubs between her eyebrows and answers, “You are my handsome 
and charming father.” 

Then she takes a look at Bai Susu and asks, “Mom, you won’t be insane like 
them, right?” 

“Hua… You finally remember everything. You regain your memory!” Bai Susu 
says happily. But the next second, she is shocked after seeing Lang 
Ruoxian’s gloomy face, “Don’t you remember Ruoxian?” Bai Susu asks. 

Tang Duo looks at Lang Ruoxian for a while and says, “Do we know each 
other? When did Yanjing have such a handsome person?” 

That night, Tang Duo is transferred to the Postpartum Care Center. At the 
same time, Bai Susu’s close friend, the brain doctor abroad, returns home by 



plane. It takes Tang Duo an hour to accept that she lost memory eight years 
ago and got married, becoming the mother of four children. 

“Mom…” Gungun and Wuyou stand beside the hospital bed and look at her 
carefully. 

Tang Duo looks calm in her face. But in her heart, she actually wants to 
escape. She didn’t expect that she would be 30 years old when she fell down 
the cliff and woke up again. Have her young days just gone like that? 

But she can’t do that definitely… Tang Duo sighs silently. Then she reaches 
out and touches the heads of two children, “What’s the matter?” Tang Duo 
asks. 

“Mom, you remember us!” Gungun happily holds her hands and says, “Uncle 
just said outside that you became silly after childbirth and forgot many 
people.” 

Tang Cao is not the foolish but cute youth anymore, Tang Duo thinks. He 
becomes a foolish and stupid youth. 

“I just feel… a little uncomfortable.” Tang Duo tries to play her mother’s role 
and says, “I never forget you. I…” 

When she is racking her brains to think what to say, Lang Ruoxian comes in. 

“Gungun, Wuyou. It’s too late. Mom just finished the operation and needs to 
rest. You should go back with grandparents, and come to see Mom 
tomorrow.” 

Tang Duo closes her mouth. Gungun nods his head like a good boy, then he 
leans forward to kiss Tang Duo and says, “Mom, good night. I’ll see you and 
younger siblings tomorrow.” 

“Good… Good night.” Tang Duo says quickly. 

After two children leave hand in hand, Lang Ruoxian sits next to the hospital 
bed and looks at her. 

“Sorry.” Tang Duo says. Tang Duo is less nervous to face Lang Ruoxian than 
children. She thinks it may due to the man’s good look… 



“You know, I can’t control this kind of thing.” Tang Duo looks at him and 
explains, “I don’t want to lose my memory, either.” 

Lang Ruoxian stares at her all the time with his flickering eyes. 

Tang Duo frowns her eyebrows and asks, “Do we really love each other?” 

“Why do you ask that?” The man keeps the same posture to stare at her and 
says, “You believed what your parents said just now, didn’t you?” 

“Yes. But that is because I just saw your face at that time. So I thought it was 
normal for me to marry you because you were good-looking.” Tang Duo looks 
at him, with a little disgust in her eyes, “But now I find that your character must 
be terrible. I’m sure I won’t like that.” Tang Duo says. 

Lang Ruoxian doesn’t know what to say for a while. 

“It’s my fault.” Then the man in front of her suddenly smiles and says. The 
thick ink of his eyes disappear, which makes him become gentle. He explains, 
“You forget me all of a sudden, which makes me a little freak.” 

Oh my god, is this man insane? Or does he have double personality? How 
can he change his character so fast? Tang Duo thinks that in her heart. 

“Well…” She makes no attempt to show her doubts. 

But Lang Ruoxian doesn’t seem to care about that. He stands up to take the 
cotton swab and makes it get wet. Then he wipes Tang Duo’s lips with it. He 
comforts her, “Stand it for a while. You can eat and drink tomorrow after you 
fart.” 

“…Thank you.” Tang Duo is a little unaccustomed to it. In her memory, no 
man treats her so gently. 

Well, some Phoenix men treat her like that sometimes. But they are always 
scared away by Tang Rui and Tang Cao. 

“Are you sleepy?” Lang Ruoxian sits back and tucks her in. 

Tang Duo shakes her head and says, “It’s OK. I just feel my belly cold.” 



“The doctor said it was normal. You’ll feel better several days later.” Lang 
Ruoxian takes out his mobile phone and says, “Do you want to see our 
babies?” 

Tang Duo nods her head excitedly. She didn’t expect that she could have 
twins one day. Gungun looks so good. So she believes her twins must look 
better! 

Then she finds she is totally wrong. 

“Are they my babies?” Tang Duo looks at the two little red chubby babies in 
the picture surprisingly. Will she be blamed as a bad mother if she says the 
babies are like little mice? 

Lang Ruoxian smiles, “Babies are born just like this. Besides, they are born 
prematurely. After a few months, they will become as good-looking as you.” 

“I believe you.” Tang Duo nods and feels that this man is very good at talking. 

But… 

“Why did I give birth prematurely?” Tang Duo asks. There are many out dated 
stories of rich family flashed in her mind. But she doesn’t think it will happen to 
her! If Lang Ruoxian has a mistress, she will absolutely deal with the mistress. 
Did her combat effectiveness become lower after losing memory? 

“If you’re not sleepy, I’ll tell you what you forget.” Lang Ruoxian opens a very 
lyrical foreign song in his mobile phone and says, “Just now, your family only 
told you a little thing about your past. If you want to know more, I’ll tell you 
everything gradually.” 

Tang Duo looks at the song’s name in his mobile phone and finds it is her 
favorite song. 

“Okay! Please tell me. I’ll listen.” She rubs against the pillow and says, “But 
don’t mind me if I fall asleep later.” 

Lang Ruoxian nods smilingly, and begins to talk slowly about the eight years 
that Tang Duo has forgotten and her past life when she was Yan Hua. 
Gradually, even Lang Ruoxian himself is not satisfied. 



Because the memories of him and Hua are too few. They met each other in 
the third year, and then Tang Duo lived in Lang Family for two years in the 
name of his sister-in-law. In fact, the real time they lived together in G City is 
only one year. 

Then they went back to Yanjing. Although they’ve been together these years, 
there are too many memories that are about other people. Now Lang Ruoxian 
regrets that he didn’t take Tang Duo away when he found her true identity. If 
they left with their child then, everything wouldn’t happen now. 

But Lang Ruoxian sighs in his heart when he sees that Tang Duo debunks 
Dong Nianshuang and Bai Jingzhu. It will be unfair for Tang Duo if he really 
do that. Anyway, they are together now. No matter whether Tang Duo 
remembers him or not, they will be together forever, and no one will separate 
them. 

“When Dong Nianshuang was a little girl, I knew that she was contrived. So 
I’m not surprised that she could do such a thing. As for Bai Jingzhu, as 
expected, she didn’t become smart these years. So she was used by Dong 
Nianshuang easily.” Tang Duo says. 

Tang Duo scolds the two women for a moment. Then she sees that Lang 
Ruoxian becomes silent suddenly. Tang Duo thinks he is angry. So she adds, 
“Thank you for those years. Without you, I can’t go back to Yanjing and I 
might have been dead.” 

“We are lovers. You don’t need to thank me.” Lang Ruoxian holds her hand 
smilingly and asks, “How do you feel when I touch you? Do you hate it?” 

Tang Duo feels it seriously and shakes her head. She answers, “I don’t hate 
it.” 

It’s probably the reaction of her body’s instinct. Although she can’t respond to 
Lang Ruoxian emotionally, she really doesn’t hate this man. After all… He 
looks so good! 

“Well, go to sleep!” Lang Ruoxian seems to be very happy. He says, “You just 
finished the operation and should take a good rest.” He turns off the light, 
leaving only a dim bedside lamp, and then goes to the sofa next to her and 
lies down, “I’ll sleep here. You can rest assured.” Lang Ruoxian says. 



Seeing his long legs are almost on the ground, Tang Duo suggests, “You can 
go to the inner room to sleep. I will call you at night if I need your help.” 

“It’s OK. I feel at ease when I’m next to you.” Lang Ruoxian curls the corner of 
his mouth and says, “Sleep quickly!” 

Tang Duo closes her eyes. For the god’s sake, she thinks shyly, he just 
laughed so well! 

Tang Family. 

“How unlucky we are!” Chang Pei’e goes to worship the Bodhisattva as soon 
as she comes back. Bai Susu goes upstairs to let Gungun and Wuyou to go to 
bed. Then she comes down and the family of four sit on the sofa. 

“Alas…” They sigh together. 

Tang Cao is the first to say, “Well… It’s not too bad actually! We always 
wanted to make my elder sister recover her memory before!” 

“It’s good to restore her memory. But she forgets the previous one.” Tang Yao 
says sadly, “My dear daughter remembers us, but forgets her husband and 
children.” 

Then he adds, “She doesn’t only forget her husband, but she also forget the 
two babies that she just gave birth. This is really…” 

“It’s worse that she forgets Gungun.” Bai Susu stares at him and says, 
“Ruoxian is an adult. He can understand her. The two babies are too young to 
know that. But Gungun is different. You all know how close he is with Hua. If 
Hua lets Gungun find the truth by accident, I’m afraid he will be sad.” 

Chang Pei’e nods, “Gungun is very sensitive. But I don’t worry about Wuyou. 
Let’s pay more attention when Hua is better. Also, don’t make Hua have too 
much pressure. It’s even worse in case that she has postpartum depression.” 

“I don’t know if I should be sad or happy.” Bai Susu rubs between her 
eyebrows and says, “Let’s talk about that later after the doctor arrives 
tomorrow and has a check-up for her.” 

On the early morning of the next day, the whole family go to the Postpartum 
Care Center together. Tang Duo doesn’t wake up when they arrives there. 



Lang Ruoxian is standing outside the door and talks with a nurse in a low 
voice. 

“Ruoxian.” Chang Pei’e looks him up and down and asks, “Didn’t you sleep all 
night?” 

Lang Ruoxian shows a helpless expression and answers, “I can’t sleep. And 
Hua still has a risk of bleeding last night. I need to look after her all the time.” 

“You’d better go back to sleep!” Tang Yao pats him and says, “I know you’re 
so sad. But the truth is that Hua forgets you now. You have to think like this. 
She didn’t remember us before, but she still loved us very much. So it doesn’t 
matter whether she remembers you or not. You can pursue her again!” 

“Dad, let’s go to see my elder sister first!” Tang Cao hurriedly pulls him in. 

Doesn’t his father see that his brother-in-law’s face turn black? Lang Ruoxian 
is the devil! If he becomes angry, Tang Cao thinks, he won’t quarrel with Tang 
Duo but he will make trouble with them! 

“Don’t listen to your father’s nonsense.” Chang Pei’e takes a look at Bai Susu 
who is walking here with Gungun and Wuyou, and whispers, “Don’t worry. 
You look good. Hua must like you.” 

Lang Ruoxian smiles, “Grandma, I know it. Let me help you in.” 
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Chapter 330 the Lost Memory 
When Tang Duo wakes up, she sees a circle of people around her bed staring 
at her. 

“…Are you freaking me out?” She moves her body a little and still feels her 
belly uncomfortable. Then she hears a poof. 

Bai Susu immediately calls the professional confinement lady and says, “Hua 
farted. She can eat now!” 

“You can drink the soup stewed by us first.” Chang Pei’e takes out an 
insulation barrel. 

Tang Cao is still confused. He asks, “Does it means she is out of danger?” 



The doctor of the Postpartum Care Center comes to check for Tang Duo, and 
then says, “Well, you can have a confinement in childbirth at ease now!” 

“Doctor, how are the babies?” Bai Susu asks. 

“They’re not bad. They have passed 24 hours and now they are in a stable 
period. We will observe if they can grow normally these days. It needs at least 
one month to make sure they are really fine.” 

Tang Duo is drinking chicken soup. But she is a little embarrassed at that 
time. Her babies are not out of danger. It might be inappropriate for her to eat 
and drink so much… 

“Don’t think too much.” After the doctor leaves, Chang Pei’e comforts her and 
lets the paramedics put lots of dishes in front of Tang Duo. She says, “Your 
task now is to have a good meal and take good care of yourself. When the 
babies come out of the incubators, maybe you can suckle them.” 

The professional confinement lady on one side hurriedly says, “Yes, yes, yes! 
She is right. Let’s observe your situation these days. After your wound is 
healed, we will start to do massage care for you. According to Mrs. Lang’s 
condition, it doesn’t need to promote secretion of milk too fast, otherwise it will 
be wasted. We just need to make sure that her mammary gland is well.” 

Tang Cao runs to his father with a red face. Tang Yao is taking Gungun and 
Wuyou to see babies, mainly because he wants Wuyou to confirm the smell of 
babies. Yesterday when Wuyou went to see babies, Tang Yao suddenly 
asked her a question. 

“Wuyou, can you still smell the babies’ smell now?” 

“Yes.” Wuyou nodded yesterday, “Everyone has different body smell.” 

Tang Yao’s eyes brightened instantly. He said, “You remember the smell of 
babies now. When we come here tomorrow morning, you will see if there is 
any change.” 

It would not change definitely. The nurse who overheard this secretly would 
like to show the whites of her eyes extremely. You were so strange to smell 
the babies’ smell… 



“The doctor is here. Ruoxian, have you arranged for someone to go to the 
airport?” After seeing Tang Duo eating with a good appetite, Bai Susu begins 
to ask Lang Ruoxian. 

Lang Ruoxian takes a look at his watch and says, “Shu Sheng has gone in 
person. He might be on the way to the hospital over there at present.” 

“Well, let’s go after Hua finishes eating.” 

This kind of check should be done in a reliable place. Tang Duo just needs to 
lie still. The doctor who was asked by them said that there was no problem in 
carrying her like this. 

“Mom.” Tang Duo asks, “Do you bring my mobile phone?” 

Bai Susu casts a glance at her and says, “You can’t use mobile phone for fun 
in the confinement period.” 

“Why?” Tang Duo is shocked. She was shy to ask Lang Ruoxian to let her 
play his phone when she saw it yesterday. After eight years, she didn’t know 
that the Fruit Phone had advanced to this level. 

“It’s not good for your eyes.” Chang Pei’e coaxes her, “Be good. You can play 
it after the confinement.” 

Tang Duo thinks in her heart that she should play Lang Ruoxian’s phone 
yesterday… 

“You shouldn’t let her play your phone, either.” Bai Susu obviously knows her 
daughter well. So she reminds Lang Ruoxian, “Do you know?” 

Lang Ruoxian looks at Tang Duo smilingly, who is twitching her mouth. He 
says, “Mom, I know.” 

In the afternoon, in a private hospital that is not public, Tang Duo is lying on a 
huge machine, and others are looking at her through the glass. 

“There’s nothing wrong with the brain.” The doctor says, “In fact, you don’t 
have to worry. Her condition is very normal.” 

When Tang Duo is pushed out, the doctor says to Tang Family, “The human’s 
brain is actually very smart. It has a self-warning consciousness. When it 
occurs, the brain will activate the self-protection device.” 



“Ms. Tang’s first amnesia is due to the self-protection consciousness of her 
brain when it is struck by external forces. Amnesia is actually its sequel.” The 
doctor says. 

Then the doctor tells them that Tang Duo’s brain has a sense of crisis when 
she was in a fire. So the stimulation this time reminds her of memories that 
has been blocked by the brain. 

“What about Hua’s lost memory?” Lang Ruoxian asks. 

The doctor coughs and explains, “Strictly speaking, it’s also a kind of self-
protection of the brain.” 

The brain’s memory bank is like many different rooms, which will automatically 
separate the memories and puts them in different rooms according to their 
categories. 

“Before, the brain locked all the rooms because of self-protection. So Ms. 
Tang didn’t remember anything.” 

But this accident lets her brain open those rooms, and Tang Duo naturally 
recovers her memory. 

“But as we just said, the brain is very smart.” When they deal with the memory 
system, they find a memory that doesn’t belong to Ms. Tang. In the brain’s 
eyes, it’s another person’s memory. So they lock it up automatically again.” 

Lang Ruoxian thinks for a moment and then asks, “Do you mean that this door 
will open sooner or later?” 

“Yes. But it does not the same as your thought.” The doctor thinks about it and 
says, “The brain does not completely lock this memory. In fact, it locks the 
door because it is for its own good. Let’s think about this. Will you be very 
afraid if you suddenly have something else on you?” 

“It’s the same with the brain. They won’t open the door all of a sudden. The 
brain will open it slowly to make it accept these memories gradually.” 

The doctor also mentions that when he came to check for Tang Duo last time, 
the Tang Family asked whether it would be easier to regain the memory if 
Tang Duo touched the previous things. 



“I said it might be possible at that time. But this time I would say it’s useful 
definitely.” 

Everyone is relieved. It’s a good thing! 

“Son-in-law, you can rest assured now!” Tang Yao pats Lang Ruoxian again 
and says, “Hua will slowly recover her memory, and remember you sooner or 
later. In fact, it doesn’t matter whether she remembers you it or not. What is 
important is that she can remember Gungun, Wuyou and the twins…” 

Tang Cao covers his mouth quickly and says, “Dad, I know you are happy. 
But you should hide it in your heart.” 

“Why do you think I am happy? I just comforted Ruoxian!” 

“Don’t forget, Dad, who gives you pocket money every month now.” Tang Cao 
whispers. 

Tang Yao is speechless. 

Is it too late for him to change his words now? 

“Thank you, doctor. I’ll ask my people to send you to the hotel for a rest.” Lang 
Ruoxian asks Shu Sheng to arrange the doctor and to send him to the 
airplane on time tomorrow. Then the whole family go back to the Postpartum 
Care Center. Tang Cao asks Bai Susu secretly. 

“Mom, do you think my brother-in-law is weird?” 

“Why do you think so?” Bai Susu is busy giving orders in her mobile phone to 
let her people make Dong Family in trouble. So she just says casually, “Your 
elder sister forgets him. He must be in a bad mood now. You shouldn’t bother 
him all the time.” 

“No!” Tang Cao drags her sleeve and says, “Look, look!” 

Bai Susu looks up and sees Lang Ruoxian gently holding Tang Duo to the 
hospital bed. Then he pours water and peels fruit for her immediately. 

“He is the same as before.” 

Tang Cao almost shows the whites of his eyes and says, “He was so awful 
before and treated everyone coldly. I was scared to death when he took a look 



at me. But look at him now, he seems to have changed his personality totally, 
and his temperament becomes different.” 

“…Maybe he doesn’t want to scare your sister.” Bai Susu twitches the corner 
of her mouth. She investigated Lang Ruoxian before. So she naturally knows 
that he has played the real Lang Ruoxian who is gentle like this now. 

“Well, remember to tell Diandian that your elder sister doesn’t remember her 
now.” Bai Susu says to Tang Cao. 

Tang Duo is also relieved after hearing the doctor’s words. She wants to find 
her memory, too. After listening to Lang Ruoxian’s words, she feels that many 
things happened when she lost her memory. It’s more interesting than her life 
in Yanjing. 

“Are Dong Nianshuang and Bai Jingzhu still at the police station?” 

Lang Ruoxian wipes her hands and says, “Yes. The Dong Family has 
declined. I guess they only have a few houses now.” 

“Is it worth the trouble?” Tang Duo smiles, “Do you know that Dong 
Nianshuang once asked me to go to the ball of her adult ceremony? At that 
time, she called me that everyone had decided the color of their clothes on 
that day so that their dressing in photos would be like flowers.” 

As a result, Tang Duo listened to her advice and wore a purple skirt. Then she 
found Dong Nianshuang also wore purple. 

“Ha, ha, do you think she is so boring?” Tang Duo says with a smile, “She 
overreached to wear the same color with me. Because she wanted me to be 
accused of stealing her limelight intentionally. But she forgot that I looked 
much better than she did.” 

After that, some fashion figures said that Dong Nianshuang and Tang Duo 
wore the same style of C Company, and Dong Nianshuang looked like a 
village girl when standing next to Tang Duo. 

“She’s still ugly now.” Lang Ruoxian shows his look of disgust and says, “She 
can’t compare with you.” 

Tang Duo nods, “Yes! But she never understands it. She takes me as her 
opponent, which makes her fail from the beginning. You said that she used to 



like Hua Yan and then she changed to like you. However, she did that just 
because you and Hua Yan had something to do with me.” 

“Hua Yan has no relationship with you.” Lang Ruoxian looks at her with fixed 
eyes. 

Tang Duo shivers suddenly. This feeling comes again! The man is really a 
lunatic, Tang Duo thinks. 

“I just want to say that she’s always staring at my life, even trying to copy it, 
and now she brings trouble to herself.” Tang Duo sneers, “If I’m health now, I 
will go to laugh at her.” 

Lang Ruoxian frowns, “There will be many opportunities in the future. You 
can’t move around now.” 

“I know!” Tang Duo yawns, “I’m just saying. By the way, I’ll sleep for a while. 
You can go to see the babies and take some pictures for me. I want to see if 
they look better today.” 

Lang Ruoxian agrees with a smile. Then he tucks her in when he sees that 
Tang Duo’s breath is gradually steady. While he doesn’t go to see babies until 
Bai Susu and Chang Pei’e come back from babies’ room. When he comes 
back to Tang Duo’s room again, Tang Cao has sent Tang Yao, Chang Pei’e 
and two children back. 

“Mom, is she always sleeping?” Lang Ruoxian asks in a low voice. 

Bai Susu puts down the computer and answers, “Yes. She has fallen into a 
heavy sleep.” 

“Dong Family is looking for help everywhere. You’d better get bodyguards 
guarding you. It’s said that they want to see you.” Bai Susu reminds him. She 
thinks that Dong Nianshuang’s family always refuse to realize the reality. 
What else can they do to find Lang Ruoxian? They just want to drive a wedge 
between Lang Ruoxian and Tang Family. 

In the detention center, Bai Jingzhu hugs Bai Yuanfei and cries breathlessly. 

“Elder brother, I really didn’t know that she was going to burn Tang Duo. I was 
used by her… Hum, hum, hum… Help me out quickly. I don’t want to stay 
here.” 
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