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Chapter 1351: The 1st Heaven Acknowledges Allegiance!
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The Mountain and Sea Realm counterattacked with full force. The flames of war climbed high into 
the sky, in a way that was different from before. This time, it was not the Mountain and Sea 
cultivators who suffered defeat after defeat, it was the Outsiders.

In the First Mountain and Sea, Echelon cultivator Dao-Heaven led the army of cultivators into 
battle. On every front, the Outsiders were routed and crushed. Many of them didn’t even dare to 
fight back. Anyone could see that at this moment, the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm 
wore expressions of utter self-confidence, and that their fighting spirit was indomitable.

Sometimes in battle, practicers of cultivation were known to self-detonate, to literally explode in a 
final burst of grandeur for their people. However, such acts were born of grief and desperation, and 
led to nothing but death.

Using tactics like that could cause the enemy to respect or even fear you, but could not make that 
enemy feel powerless.

In sharp contrast... when an entire people was bursting with confidence and spirit combined, they 
became truly fear-inspiring. As of this moment, that was exactly how the cultivators of the 
Mountain and Sea Realm were!

Upon awakening, they were filled with a madness, with a majesty that caused the Outsiders’ minds 
to tremble. It wasn’t that the Outsiders never thought to go all out in a mad scramble to fight back, 
or that they didn’t consider resorting to self-detonation. Those things... were useless.

They tried. As the Mountain and Sea cultivators fought back, Outsiders self-detonated, or went all 
out in various attempts drag their opponents with them into mutual destruction.

And yet... none of that did any good!

In the Second Mountain and Sea, fierce fighting raged. As for the Third Mountain and Sea, it was 
completely filled with the stench of blood. The cultivators there had experienced something like a 



baptism in blood. Their eyes shone brightly, glowing with confidence, with hope, with ferocity, and 
with madness.

The hatred they felt surpassed the hatred within the hearts of the Outsiders, as did their confidence. 
When it came to their hope, even their hope was something the Outsiders could never match.

Rumbling could be heard as the battle for the Fourth Mountain and Sea neared its conclusion even 
more quickly. Under Xu Qing’s leadership, and with the return of Ksitigarbha to the battlefield, the 
grand army there swept across the enemy with virtually no resistance.

However, Ksitigarbha himself did not join in the fighting unless necessary. It was the same with 
Meng Hao, who despite having a Paragon puppet and peak 6-Essences battle prowess, also held 
back.

Sea Dream and the other Mountain and Sea Lords were the same. Unless facing powerful Outsider 
experts, they merely observed the battle.

They allowed the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm to do most of the fighting, to help 
them understand that now, the true war was only just beginning. Only by bathing in the blood of the 
enemy could the cultivators truly be qualified to grow into seasoned veterans.

It was the same in the Eighth and Ninth Mountains and Seas.

The Outsiders had nowhere to run to. Upon their initial invasion, they had established nine main 
camps in the Nine Mountains and Seas. Originally, they had been in the superior position in the 
fight, which made those camps like nine sharp blades stabbing down into the Mountain and Sea 
Realm, threatening to slice it into pieces.

However, such troop placement was why they were now hovering on the brink of being 
exterminated completely. They were scattered, surrounded, with only the Sixth and Seventh 
Mountains and Seas being united and relatively free of Mountain and Sea cultivators. Those two 
locations had been their primary base of operations, and now, they were their last point of refuge.

Within the span of seven days, the First, Second, Third and Fourth Mountains and Seas all clinched 
victories, completely cutting off and surrounding the Outsiders, killing nearly eighty percent of 
them.



Blood spread out through the starry sky, and fierce fighting raged everywhere. The cultivators of the 
Mountain and Sea Realm fought with upright fearlessness. Xu Qing shone with her own type of 
glory, and in the end, the Fourth Mountain and Sea was where the greatest slaughter of Outsiders 
was carried out. Next, they turned to help the cultivators in the Third Mountain and Sea.

After that, they all joined forces in grandiose fashion. Under Xu Qing’s leadership, they marched 
toward the Fifth Mountain and Sea, their target being... the Outsider encampment that stretched 
through the Sixth and Seventh Mountains and Seas.

As for the Eighth and Ninth Mountains and Seas, after wiping out the Outsiders on the field of 
battle, they joined forces and invaded the Seventh Mountain and Sea.

The fighting dragged on for several months. However, during those months, everything changed in 
a monumental and even spectacular way.

Eventually, the day came in which the final battle began in the Sixth and Seventh Mountains and 
Seas. Meng Hao fought in that battle with his Paragon puppet, leading to both grief and despair 
among the final resisting Outsiders.

The strongest among their number was Long Linzi. The bitter agony which engulfed him was too 
difficult to put into words.

The cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm were like floodwaters smashing into the Outsiders. 
With Paragon Sea Dream, the Paragon puppet, Ksitigarbha, and Meng Hao himself leading the 
armies of cultivators into battle, the Outsiders in the Seventh and Sixth Mountains and Seas were 
powerless to fight back.

“Acknowledge allegiance, or perish!” said Meng Hao. As his voice echoed out across the 
battlefield, the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm ceased attacking, and instead began to 
echo his words.

Their voices were grand and filled with unswerving determination. This was the spirit of a people 
on the rise. It was almost as if they were back in the Paragon Immortal Realm, in the position to 
look down on all creation.

“Acknowledge allegiance, or perish!”



“Acknowledge allegiance, or perish!!” The sound of their voices filled the Mountain and Sea 
Realm, echoing about with intense pressure that caused the Outsiders to tremble even more than 
before.

Meng Hao did not want to completely exterminate the Outsiders. That would be a waste. If they 
chose to acknowledge allegiance, then not only would the overall power of the Mountain and Sea 
Realm not be reduced any further, but it would actually grow.

That in turn was the true hope to be able to fight this war to the end.

In response to Meng Hao’s words, Paragon Sea Dream nodded slightly. Apparently, if Meng Hao 
hadn’t spoken the words himself, she would have. As for Ksitigarbha and the other Mountain and 
Sea Lords, although each one had slightly different ideas about how to go about things, Meng Hao 
was a paramount figure in the Mountain and Sea Realm, and they would listen to him.

In fact, the incredible fleshly body power of the Mountain and Sea Realm cultivators was thanks to 
Meng Hao, so of course they wouldn’t go against his wishes.

The Outsiders didn’t need much time to think. The most powerful of their number, the golden-
armored Dao Sovereign Long Linzi, laughed bitterly and dispersed his cultivation base power. 
Then, bowing his head, he said, “I acknowledge allegiance!”

They really had no choice but to acknowledge allegiance. It was either that... or die as a people.

When Long Linzi’s words echoed out across the battlefield and throughout the Seventh and Sixth 
Mountains and Seas, the Outsiders heard them, and they sighed. They, too, dispersed their 
cultivation base power and bowed their heads.

There were a few who refused, and they were quickly subdued and summarily executed. Their 
flowing blood bore witness to a grand victory on the part of the Mountain and Sea Realm!

It was a victory in which the 1st Heaven collapsed, a Paragon was enslaved, an Imperial Lord was 
killed, and of two Dao Sovereigns, one was killed and the other surrendered. Nearly seventy percent 
of the invading force was killed....

However, the Mountain and Sea Realm had also paid a grievous price. Nearly forty percent of the 
Mountain and Sea cultivators had been killed, most of them in the initial battles.



If Meng Hao hadn’t destroyed the 1st Heaven and awakened the spirits of the cultivators, then 
enslaved their Paragon before giving the Outsiders any time to regroup, then even more of the 
Mountain and Sea cultivators would be dead.

The first phase of the war was over....

Although there were cheers of victory, massive pressure still weighed down on the shield created by 
the will of the Mountains and Seas. That shield separated them from the 32 Heavens, and right now 
there seemed to be some enormous figure pushing down onto it.

Everyone knew that the 32 Heavens would be coming for them soon. The will of the Mountains and 
Seas could only hold them off for so long, and when they came, it would be with force that far 
exceeded that of the 1st Heaven.

This time... a far larger army would be coming against them!

Could the Mountain and Sea Realm prevail...?

That was the question all the cultivators in the Mountain and Sea Realm were pondering. However, 
when they saw the enormous Paragon Puppet, and Meng Hao on its head, their eyes shone with 
brilliant light.

An ancient voice suddenly rang out into the minds and hearts of all of the Mountain and Sea Realm 
cultivators. It was none other than the will of the Mountain and Sea Realm itself.

“Three months.... At the most, we have three months.... At that time, the 32 Heavens will break 
through the barrier and descend upon us! This time, it will not just be a single Heaven....”

Next, the will of the Mountain and Sea Realm asked a question which reverberated out in all 
directions. “Should we activate Mountain and Sea Siege Mode?!”

A look of surprise appeared on Meng Hao’s face, and Ksitigarbha suddenly looked up. However, 
Paragon Sea Dream turned to look at the Ninth Mountain and Sea, and after a long moment spoke, 
her voice cool.



“Activate Siege Mode!

“Mountain and Sea Lords, hear my orders. Immediately evacuate all life forms from the planets in 
your Mountain and Sea. Take them to the Ninth Mountain and Sea, which will now serve as our 
command headquarters!

“Mountain and Sea cultivators, return to your respective Mountains and Seas and await further 
orders. We will work together in concert with the Mountain and Sea Siege Mode... to once again 
battle the 32 Heavens!

“Mountain and Sea Siege Mode takes one month to activate; it was prepared by Paragon Nine Seals 
for the express purpose of being used in this war!

“In Siege Mode, the entire Mountain and Sea Realm will be transformed from a horizontal layout to 
a vertical one. All of the Mountains and Seas will be lined up on top of each other!

“The First Mountain and Sea will be our first line of defense. The Second Mountain and Sea, our 
second. After eight lines of defenses is the Ninth Mountain and Sea.

“Fellow Daoists from all Mountains and Seas, we have three months.... This war will determine the 
fate of our Realm. As for me, I have only one thing left to say... Mountain and Sea Cultivators, fight 
to the death!” After Paragon Sea Dream’s words faded away, the cultivators of the Mountain and 
Sea Realm were silent for a moment before their voices erupted out in unison.

“Mountain and Sea Cultivators, fight to the death!” The sound of their voices shook the entire 
Realm.

Meng Hao took a deep breath, and within his eyes flickered the desire to do battle. He looked up at 
the starry sky, and the void which existed beyond the barrier. That was where the 32 Heavens were, 
and from that barrier emanated numerous ripples.

“The war really has begun....”

Chapter 1352: Crown Prince of the Mountains and Seas!

[/expand]



The entire Mountain and Sea Realm was transforming. Although one might initially assume that 
such a huge transformation would happen slowly, it was actually visible to the naked eye! As such, 
one could well imagine how rapidly the transformation took place!

The change was happening at a speed which all cultivators could perceive, and yet did not cause 
any sense of unease or disorientation. Originally, the Mountain and Sea Realm was laid out in a 
horizontal line, from the First Mountain and Sea all the way to the Ninth. It was like a giant laying 
there, with the sun and moon orbiting the entire Realm.

But now, that giant... was slowly standing up!

The First Mountain was rising high up into the starry sky, as was the First Sea. Even as intense 
rumbling sounds echoed out, the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm adhered to Paragon Sea 
Dream’s orders. Under the leadership of the various Mountain and Sea Lords, the occupants of the 
mortal worlds were all transported to the Ninth Mountain and Sea.

The Mountain and Sea Realm buzzed with activity, and was changing by the moment.

There was no time for Xu Qing to reunite with Meng Hao. She had put on an extraordinary display 
of her command of strategy and tactics, and as such, was whisked away by Paragon Sea Dream. 
She, along with Li Ling’er, were appointed by Sea Dream as the Two Great Holy Daughters of the 
Mountain and Sea Realm.

Meng Hao sent the Paragon puppet high up into the starry sky, and tasked it with standing guard 
against any early incursions by the 32 Heavens. At the same time, it sent divine will out through the 
entire Mountain and Sea Realm, constantly exerting a slight pressure to cow any potential double-
crossers.

After all, despite the awakening of the spirit of the people, when it came to ultimate survival, there 
were some cultivators, and even some entire sects and clans, who weren’t completely loyal. They 
didn’t understand what it meant for all the eggs to be lost when the nest was overturned. They 
wanted to preserve their strength either to join everyone else in a comeback or, if things looked bad, 
to surrender and attempt to somehow impress the 32 Heavens.

Of course, with the Paragon puppet there, such double-crossers didn’t dare to take any action.

Everyone in the entire Mountain and Sea Realm was at work, busily preparing for war. Time was of 
the essence, and unless something unexpected happened, they had at most three months....



Unexpectedly, Meng Hao experienced a rare situation in which he was left with nothing pertinent to 
do, so he strolled amidst the starry sky, watching the Mountain and Sea Realm transform. The First 
Mountain and Sea led the rise as the Mountain and Sea Realm slowly transformed from a horizontal 
layout to a vertical one. At the moment, that left it tilted at an angle.

“It starting to look... a bit unfamiliar,” Meng Hao thought reticently. Finally, he sighed. He had 
known for a long time that war was coming. However, to him and all the other cultivators of the 
Mountain and Sea Realm, that war had arrived too suddenly.

It had started with the sudden outbreak of violence between the Seventh and Eighth Mountains and 
Seas. Then came the conflict between the Fifth and Sixth Mountains and Seas. After that was the 
decision to start the fighting the 33 Heavens ahead of schedule. That decision had been the right 
one, and yet it didn’t change the suddenness of it all.

Meng Hao felt somewhat blank inside, even uncertain about the future. However, he couldn’t give 
voice to such doubts. He couldn’t allow anyone to see anything except staunch confidence and 
faith.

Sadly, the truth of the matter was that... he wasn’t confident.

Wherever he went, the cultivators who saw him clasped hands and bowed, looks of deep reverence 
in their eyes no matter which Mountain and Sea they came from.

Meng Hao now symbolized the spirit of the Mountain and Sea Realm cultivators. To many people, 
he also symbolized hope.

Meng Hao put aside the pressure he felt, allowing a faint, self-assured smile to appear on his face. 
He would nod at people and then proceed along. He passed through the Fifth, Sixth, Seventh, and 
Eighth Mountains and Seas. Finally... he ended up in the Ninth Mountain and Sea.

This was his first time back since he had left, oh so long ago. Looking out at the Ninth Mountain 
and Sea, his heart finally grew calm. However, there were still many things left for him to 
accomplish.

“Chu Yuyan’s soul....” he thought, pain stabbing at his heart. As he walked through the starry sky, 
there was really no other place that he wanted to go to other than home.



Planet South Heaven.

There were vast numbers of cultivators garrisoned on Planet South Heaven now. Because of their 
connection to Meng Hao, the Fang Clan was well known not just in the Ninth Mountain and Sea, 
but throughout the Mountain and Sea Realm. Everyone was aware that Meng Hao was the Crown 
Prince of the Fang Clan.

Meng Hao’s return caused a big stir. The entire Fang Clan emerged to receive him, and a ceremony 
was held that surpassed the kind which would be held for even a Clan Chief. Only Patriarchs 
received such treatment.

Of course, it wasn’t just the Fang Clan that went out to receive Meng Hao. All of the sects and clans 
on Planet South Heaven made appearances. Even the Emperor of the Great Tang could be seen.

As soon as Meng Hao appeared outside of Planet South Heaven, he saw tens of millions of 
cultivators lined up to welcome him. The looks on their faces were those of excitement, enthusiasm, 
and worship.

In almost the same instant that he appeared, tens of millions of cultivators clasped hands and bowed 
deeply.

“We offer respectful greetings upon the return of the Crown Prince!”

“Respectful greetings upon your return, Crown Prince!”

“Crown Prince, the divine abilities you unleashed in the battle with the 1st Heaven are without 
parallel!!”

Ever since Meng Hao destroyed the 1st Heaven and enslaved the Outsider Paragon, the Mountain 
and Sea Realm cultivators had come to view him... as a Crown Prince, not just of the Fang Clan, but 
of the entire Mountain and Sea Realm.

As their voices boomed out, Meng Hao looked over the group, and eventually his gaze came to fall 
on a separate group of people who stood behind everyone else, within the actual borders of the 
planet.



There, he saw his father, his mother, his sister, and the familiar faces of the Chosen he had 
interacted with in the past.

Meng Hao saw his father smiling, a smile of excitement and pride. He saw the kindness in his 
mother’s face, as well as pride that only a mother could feel.

Meng Hao looked back at the cultivators congregated outside of Planet South Heaven, then clasped 
his hands and bowed deeply to them.

“What I did in the battle with the 1st Heaven is what any other Mountain and Sea cultivator would 
have done. I alone cannot determine the outcome of this war. If we want to win, we of the 
Mountains and Seas must fight together!”

Due to how powerful of a warrior he was in battle, Meng Hao didn’t need to add any extra power to 
his voice. The words alone radiated passion and ardor.

It was when the fighting broke out with the 1st Heaven that Meng Hao came to understand that he 
no longer had the luxury of thinking about only himself. He had a responsibility to bear, and that 
responsibility had already begun to weigh down on him.

As his words echoed out, the tens of millions of cultivators outside of Planet South Heaven once 
again clasped hands and bowed. Meng Hao proceeded forward, and they parted to create a path for 
him.

Everyone watched as he strode forward and then entered Planet South Heaven. As Meng Hao 
looked at his father and mother, and the various Patriarchs, he suddenly felt as if the powerful spirit 
that had driven him in battle had somehow transformed into a deep exhaustion which threatened to 
overwhelm him.

Home. The place where it was truly possible to relax....

Meng Hao stepped up to his father and mother, then dropped to his knees and kowtowed.

“Dad, mom... I’m back.”



Countless cultivators looked on as Meng Li stepped forward and lifted Meng Hao to his feet. She 
looked at him for a moment, a flicker pain in her eyes, and then pulled him into a warm embrace.

It was at that point that a huge cheer rose up from Planet South Heaven. In the hearts of the 
Mountain and Sea cultivators, Meng Hao was a supreme being. However, in the Ninth Mountain 
and Sea, and especially among the cultivators on Planet South Heaven, he was something beyond 
that. He was... THEIR Meng Hao!

Meng Hao was back!

Planet South Heaven was shaken, as was the entire Ninth Mountain and Sea. In the following half 
month, countless cultivators came to visit Planet South Heaven in the hopes of meeting Meng Hao. 
As for Meng Hao, he did his best to meet with as many as he could.

Although he was exhausted and only wished to rest, he couldn’t disappoint the cultivators of the 
Ninth Mountain and Sea.

When Meng Li realized what a strain it was putting on him, she erupted like a thunderclap, and 
refused to let any visitors through the front gate. Fang Xiufeng then began to stand in for Meng Hao 
to receive the guests, after which the crowds waned.

At long last, Meng Hao had some personal time. He was able to spend some time with his mother 
and sister, to truly enjoy the happiness of being with family.

He did not meditate, nor did he practice cultivation. He didn’t even leave the Fang Clan to visit all 
the places he was familiar with on Planet South Heaven. He stayed in the ancestral mansion, slowly 
allowing his heart to grow calm.

He was only now coming to realize that the way the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm 
viewed him had changed. Fan Dong’er and all the other Chosen he knew treated him... differently.

Occasionally, even his father would look at him with a reverence in his eyes that had never been 
there before. It left Meng Hao feeling somewhat bitter, and even sad.

And then there was his sister. When they were both young, she had promised that she would always 
protect him. And yet, she had also changed. She loved him more than ever, but when she looked at 
him, he could see the awe in her eyes. 



There almost wasn’t a need to even mention Sun Hai. He had long since come to revere Meng Hao, 
but now, he looked at him, not just with reverence, but with fanatical zealotry.

His mother was the only one who didn’t seem to have changed. To her, it didn’t matter what Realm 
Meng Hao was in; even if he was a Paragon, he would always be her son.

As he spent time with his family, he would sometimes look off into the distance, where he knew Xu 
Qing was. Occasionally, he would ponder the matter of Chu Yuyan’s soul....

As for everyone else he knew, it wasn’t that he didn’t want to see them. Rather, in this moment of 
incredible crisis for the Mountain and Sea Realm, he simply didn’t have the mental energy to think 
about too many things at one time.

Meng Hao got the feeling that he was changing. He was becoming quieter, and even spirit stones 
somehow didn’t seem as important to him as they had in the past. Now, his thoughts were occupied 
more and more by the Mountain and Sea Realm....

“If I could have my way,” he thought, “I would live in an era in which there was no war....” Sighing, 
he felt more tired than ever.

Another half month passed. The Mountain and Sea Realm Siege Mode was completely activated. 
The First Mountain and Sea was at the apex, with the First Sea being in the highest position, 
followed by the First Mountain. After that was the Second Sea and the Second Mountain....

The entire Mountain and Sea Realm had risen up like a giant that propped up Heaven and Earth!

The sun and moon no longer orbited around the Realm, but were motionless in guard positions on 
either side. Although that left certain parts of the Mountain and Sea Realm in perpetual day, and 
other parts in perpetual night, in this critical moment, that wasn’t something that people worried 
about.

At the same time, the vast numbers of mortals who lived in the Mountain and Sea Realm had been 
transported to the Ninth Mountain and Sea, which was now... the most important place in the entire 
Realm!



In the instant that the Mountain and Sea Realm Siege Mode was completely activated, the will of 
the Mountain and Sea Realm spoke out into the minds of all cultivators, seemingly emotionless.

“My interference with the 32 Heavens cannot be maintained for much longer. In a month and a 
half... they... will come.”

Chapter 1353: I Demand An Explanation!

The voice echoed out into the minds of all of the cultivators in the Mountain and Sea Realm, and 
regardless of what they were doing, they stopped in place. The entire Realm went silent.

Soon, eyes began to shine with the desire to fight. The bewilderment and fear that had existed in 
those eyes were now replaced by a brilliant glow that reflected their spirits.

Although they maintained their silence, they went back to whatever important tasks they had been 
working on with renewed haste.

In accord with the requirements of Paragon Sea Dream and the Mountain and Sea Lords, the First 
Mountain became the first line of defense. Furthermore, innumerable spell formations and 
restrictive spells were set up, until the entire place was like a gigantic restrictive spell formation.

As for the denizens of the First Sea, they were also part of the war, and their survival was also on 
the line, so they held nothing back in their preparations.

Each successive Mountain and Sea was an additional line of defense, after eight of which was the 
nucleus, the headquarters of the entire Mountain and Sea Realm.

As the Mountain and Sea Realm prepared for war, Meng Hao sat cross-legged in the Fang Clan 
ancestral mansion. Another half month passed before he chose to leave.

There was someone he wished to see on Planet South Heaven... as well as someone on the Ninth 
Mountain!

The first person was... Shui Dongliu!



He had recently learned from his Grandpa Meng that Shui Dongliu was the Outsider he had known 
of for some time. After thinking about everything that had happened throughout the years, and 
putting many pieces of the puzzle together, Meng Hao was increasingly certain that there was more 
to Shui Dongliu than met the eye.

In fact, he even had the feeling that there was some monumental secret connected to Shui Dongliu, 
a secret that perhaps... had something to do with the entire Mountain and Sea Realm.

“Shui Dongliu used a single sentence to get my grandfather to become the Lord of the Eighth 
Mountain and Sea. Just... who exactly is he?

“According to what Grandma Meng said, my Grandpa Fang isn’t in the Mountain and Sea Realm. 
Could it be... that he’s in....” Meng Hao looked up. His gaze seemed to pass through all eight lines 
of defense, out into the starry sky, to the 32 Heavens.

During his more than one month on Planet South Heaven, Meng Hao had frequently sent divine 
sense out to cover Planet South Heaven in search of Shui Dongliu. He was certain that Shui 
Dongliu was there, somewhere.

However, he hadn’t been able to turn up even the slightest clue about his actual location. In the end, 
he sighed. Trusting in his own senses, but having no other recourse, he bid farewell to his parents 
and everyone else. Upon leaving, he hovered just outside of Planet South Heaven and looked back 
down.

“Don’t want to see me, huh?” Meng Hao said coolly.

In that same moment, back down on a high mountain peak on Planet South Heaven, Shui Dongliu 
was looking up into the sky at Meng Hao.

Apparently, he could see Meng Hao, but Meng Hao couldn’t see him.

Meng Hao hovered there for some time before his eyes glittered. He quickly blinked his left eye 
nine times in a row, causing his view of the world to change and magnify. Soon, he could see all of 
the lands below in complete detail.

Suddenly, he vanished. Shockingly, when he appeared... he was standing on the mountain peak 
directly in front of Shui Dongliu.



Shui Dongliu didn’t move a muscle, although a look of surprise could be seen in his eyes as he 
looked at Meng Hao.

Except... Meng Hao could see nothing in front of him at all. He got a very strange feeling from this 
mountain, as if it were somehow connected by Karma to Shui Dongliu.

After standing there silently for a moment, Meng Hao suddenly smiled in a relaxed fashion. Finally 
giving up on the idea of tracking down Shui Dongliu, he clasped hands and bowed deeply to the air 
in front of him.

“Senior, since you don’t wish to meet with me right now, then I’ll take my leave. I will never forget 
the kindness you have shown me. I’m not sure what your plan is, Senior, but... the Mountain and 
Sea Realm is weak now, so please... don’t play with fire and get burned!” The words he spoke were 
icy, and a bitter coldness emanated from him. Even the Paragon puppet up in the starry sky radiated 
a coldness that seemed to lock down onto that mountaintop.

With that, Meng Hao looked up and made his way out into the void, paying the mountain no more 
heed. There, he transformed into a beam of light that left Planet South Heaven.

As he made his way off, Shui Dongliu continued to stand there, and a flicker of praise could be seen 
in his eyes. After a moment passed, he smiled.

“So, kid,” he murmured, his smile deepening, “you’ve finally grown up... grown some teeth too, I 
see. You know what it means to protect your home. Excellent. Excellent....

“As for the Mountain and Sea Realm, let’s just say... I care about it more than you do. More... than 
anyone.”

Outside of Planet South Heaven, Meng Hao proceeded along through the starry sky. Throughout the 
Ninth Mountain and Sea, cultivators were crafting planets and land masses in numerous locations, 
filling the starry sky.

Gathered upon those planets and land masses were all of the mortals of the Mountain and Sea 
Realm, and all of the bloodlines of all the cultivators....



There was only one Mountain and Sea Lord here, though, and that was Ji Tian. Paragon Sea Dream 
had personally come to visit him and appoint him as guardian of the place.

Meng Hao looked out at this vastly changed Ninth Mountain and Sea, and eventually, his gaze came 
to rest upon a certain mountain.... The Ninth Mountain!

Meng Hao wanted to meet a certain person and put an end to the Karma which tied them together. 
That person was none other than Ji Tian!

Ji Tian had interfered when Fang Xiufeng stepped into the Dao, and had attempted to possess Meng 
Hao in the Eighth Mountain and Sea. Because of things such as these, the Karma between them was 
varied and strong.

Meng Hao proceeded through the starry sky toward the Ninth Mountain, then began to walk up the 
steps leading to the peak. Soon he was there, at the highest part of the Mountain.

He saw a celestial pond, within which was a sleeping Xuanwu turtle. Sitting cross-legged next to 
the pond was an old man in a violet robe. His eyes were unclouded and bright, and boundless 
Karma was visible upon his person.

In the instant in which Meng Hao saw him, he knew that this was the man he had come to see... Ji 
Tian!

He was a former subordinate of Lord Li, a powerful expert from the same era as the first generation 
Patriarch of the Fang Clan. He was also the Lord of the Ninth Mountain and Sea!

Ji Tian was not alone. A young man and a young woman stood behind him. Meng Hao was 
unfamiliar with the man, having never seen him before, but could see that he had an extraordinary 
cultivation base in the mid Ancient Realm. When he looked at Meng Hao, the awe in his eyes was 
evident, and although he was apparently trying to hold back from revealing it, Meng Hao could see 
it clearly.

As soon as Meng Hao laid eyes on the young woman, he recognized her. It was Ji Yin, and as soon 
as she saw him, a complex look could be seen in her eyes, and her expression darkened. 

Ji Tian’s expression was the same as ever when he looked up at Meng Hao. It was almost as if he 
considered him to be an old friend. He smiled, and in a casual tone said, “You’ve come.”



Meng Hao looked at Ji Tian, expression calm as he approached and stood before him. Then he 
looked down at the Xuanwu turtle in the pond water, and his eyes suddenly glittered.

“So you can see it?” Ji Tian said, smiling. “I knew there would be no way of hiding the truth. The 
only question is, will I be able to calm your anger, Crown Prince of the Mountains and Seas?”

Meng Hao stood there silently, eyes flashing. What he saw was that there were innumerable 
powerful Karma threads binding Ji Tian to the Xuanwu turtle, creating a connection between the 
two of them that vastly exceeded the connection between an ordinary Mountain and Sea Lord and 
Xuanwu turtle. In fact, the life forces of Ji Tian and the Xuanwu turtle seemed to be bound together.

Furthermore, it was not a situation in which Ji Tian was in the dominant position, with the Xuanwu 
turtle being bound to him. Instead, the Xuanwu turtle was dominant!

If the Xuanwu turtle died, Ji Tian would perish. However, if Ji Tian died, it wouldn’t have any 
negative effect on the Xuanwu turtle at all. In fact, if Ji Tian died, the Xuanwu turtle would be able 
to absorb the power of his cultivation base, and thus have an explosive increase in battle prowess.

The way Meng Hao saw it was that this was an oath sworn by Ji Tian that he would live or die with 
the Ninth Mountain and Sea!

Meng Hao examined the situation for a very long moment before turning to look Ji Tian in the eye. 
“Why have you done this?”

Ji Tian looked back at Meng Hao and began to speak slowly, sounding as proud as the Lord of the 
Ninth Mountain and Sea should. “That is the wrong question to ask, Crown Prince. Let us make 
things clear. I have a grudge with your Fang Clan. Furthermore, although there are many sects and 
clans in the Ninth Mountain and Sea who venerate me, most of them fear me, but don’t respect me.

“However, after becoming the Mountain and Sea Lord, I have committed no depraved acts of 
inhumanity! Perhaps I haven’t lead the Ninth Mountain and Sea into riches and glory, but I haven’t 
led it into decline either!

“As a matter of fact, many Chosen have appeared here, one after another. I never had a single one of 
those Chosen killed, no matter what sect or clan they come from, nor have I engaged in any 
wholesale slaughter!



“It’s true that the Ji Clan has grown large and powerful thanks to the Immortality Bestowal Dais I 
created, which allowed many people to become false Immortals by means of my name. However, in 
the end, I have done nothing to harm the Ninth Mountain and Sea. If anything, I gave more people 
the hope, and the chance, to reach Immortal Ascension.

“As for the Fang Clan, the only reason I ever targeted them was because of the old enmities that 
exist between our two clans.

“Despite that, from the very beginning until now, when you still haven’t stepped into the Dao, I 
never made a move to attack you... with the exception of that one time in the Eighth Mountain and 
Sea.”

Meng Hao thought for a moment, then responded in a cool voice, “Nice soliloquy, but it’s not 
enough. I demand a complete explanation.”

Ji Yin couldn’t hold back from jumping in. “Meng Hao, y-you’re pushing things too far. What the 
Patriarch did to you and your father wasn’t his true wish. He actually--”

“That’s enough,” Ji Tian said, waving his hand to interrupt Ji Yin. He looked at Meng Hao, and he 
seemed to have come to a decision.

“I can give you that complete explanation, Crown Prince.” With that, he rose to his feet and waved 
his hand, causing a rift to appear in front of him, which he immediately entered.

Meng Hao glanced over at Ji Yin. Based on what she had just said, he already had an idea of what 
was going on. He strode forward into the rift, then appeared in a small dimension.

The surroundings weren’t very large. It was a sepulcher.

“Crown Prince, the explanation I owe you lies in here,” Ji Tian said, his voice hoarse.

Meng Hao looked around, and was instantly moved. Within the sepulcher were eight coffins, none 
of which contained bones, only piles of skin.



There was also a strong Karmic power that caused Meng Hao’s eyes to glitter. It only took a 
moment of extrapolation on his part to determine the general function of this place, although he 
couldn’t determine the specific grand magic at play.

“Clone possession,” he said. “Crafting the perfect body.... Eight possessions were like eight lives, 
and from the look of it, Ji Dongyang was your eighth life. He wanted to possess me in order to 
become the ninth life!

“Therefore, what you want to tell me is that the divine magic you unleashed actually took control of 
you. The ‘you’ that I encountered before wasn’t really you. Furthermore, after cutting down Ji 
Dongyang, the magic was broken, and you recovered control?” Eyes glittering, he looked over at Ji 
Tian!

Chapter 1354: The 32 Heavens are Coming!

Ji Tian stood there for a while without responding. Then he sighed, looking around the sepulcher 
with mixed emotions.

“Ke Yunhai was the hero of an entire generation.... His reincarnation magic worked for Ke Jiusi. 
But even though I obtained the same magical technique, I couldn’t get it to work right.”

Meng Hao’s mind reeled as he realized why this magical technique seemed so familiar. It was 
obviously... the same legendary transmigration technique Ke Yunhai had mentioned! 

“Crown Prince, does this explanation of mine meet with your satisfaction?” Ji Tian asked slowly.

Meng Hao waved his hand, causing the dimension they were in to shrink down until it was nothing 
more than a dot of light in the palm of his hand. Then, he and Ji Tian reappeared back out on the 
Ninth Mountain.

Ji Tian had made things very simple. He knew that he had offended Meng Hao and the Fang Clan 
far too deeply. That was in fact why he had connected his life force to the Ninth Mountain’s 
Xuanwu turtle. Such an act clearly demonstrated how determined he was to fight for the Mountains 
and Seas. Then, he had actually handed over to Meng Hao the very pocket dimension which was 
inextricably bound to his own life.

All of that showed that he was placing his life in Meng Hao’s hands. If Meng Hao wanted to, he 
could easily use the pocket dimension to torture him endlessly, even kill him.



After providing all of these things to Meng Hao, Ji Tian stood quietly off to the side, waiting for 
Meng Hao to make his decision.

Meng Hao thought for a moment, then gave Ji Tian a profound look. If there were no war in the 
Mountains and Seas, then he would definitely kill Ji Tian on the spot. But now....

A profound gleam flickered in his eyes as he turned, taking the pocket dimension with him as he left 
the Ninth Mountain.

After Meng Hao left, Ji Tian seemed to age, and much of his energy drained away. After standing 
there bitterly for a moment, he sighed.

He knew that he had just sidestepped a huge catastrophe. Before Meng Hao had destroyed the 1st 
Heaven, he had felt confident in being able to personally prevent him from taking action. But after 
what happened with the 1st Heaven, and after he enslaved the Paragon, Ji Tian was filled with an 
unprecedented level of fear.

At that point, he realized that all the preparations he had made would be useless in dealing with 
Meng Hao. The only way to have a shot at living... was to place his life in Meng Hao’s hands.

Even then, he only had a sliver of a chance!

After resolving matters with Ji Tian, Meng Hao proceeded along through the starry sky, observing 
the Mountain and Sea Realm preparing for war. His heart grew calm, and his will to fight grew 
stronger. He was like a sword being sharpened, a sword that, when it was unsheathed, could sever 
the Heavens.

The preparations continued, and one by one, various projects were completed. The eight lines of 
defense were set up, and the Nine Seas were filled with astonishing restrictive spells.

The Mountain and Sea cultivators were also organized into armies. Roughly thirty percent were sent 
to the First Mountain and Sea, with the rest being sent to the other Mountains and Seas, where they 
would wait to relieve troops on the battlefield or act as reinforcements.



Ancient treasures from various sects and clans were distributed, and large numbers of cultivators 
were stationed on the sun and moon, which were in and of themselves precious treasures no weaker 
than Paragons!

During the battle with the 1st Heaven, the will of the Mountain and Sea Realm had been solely 
focused on maintaining the barrier against the other Heavens. Therefore, the sun and the moon had 
not been used. Now that the barrier was breaking, and the 32 Heavens were coming, the sun and 
moon... were ready to explode into battle!

Ksitigarbha was stationed on the moon. Considering the level of his cultivation base, as well as the 
fact that he commanded the river of reincarnation, the sea of the Yellow Springs, as well as 
numerous Yama King palaces, the moon was the best place for him to unleash his peak power. Most 
of the power of the moon was focused, not on attacking, but defending!

The brightest glow of all came from the sun! The person who had been appointed to that station 
was... Meng Hao!

As per Paragon Sea Dream’s orders, Meng Hao was to take control of the sun, and would wield the 
Mountain and Sea Realm’s most deadly weapon!

As for the paragon puppet, Meng Hao sent it to the peak of the First Mountain, where it had a 
perfect view of the First Sea, and would be able to observe all of the battlefields which would make 
up the first line of defense.

Conveniently, Meng Hao’s incredible divine sense made it possible for him multitask, and thus 
personally control the incredible power of the Paragon puppet. To him, it was a perfectly suitable 
thing to do, although to anyone else it would be impossible.

Everyone took everything very seriously, and soon, a powerful will to fight pervaded the entire 
Mountain and Sea Realm. With the Siege Mode activated, the Realm was like a razor-sharp sword.

The most important aspect of the Siege Mode was that everything surrounding the entire Mountain 
and Sea Realm was locked down by its will. The only way in or out was through the First Sea and 
the First Mountain!

If the 32 Heavens wanted to exterminate all life in the Mountain and Sea Realm, then there was 
really only one way to do it. They could not resort to trickery like the 1st Heaven had, and try to 
divide the Mountain and Sea Realm.



All cultivators in the Mountains and Seas, regardless of whether they wanted to or not, were ready 
for war. Some of them were thinking of themselves, but most were thinking of their clans and their 
sects!

Perhaps few people were worried about the Mountain and Sea Realm as a whole, but everyone had 
a clan or sect, as well as a family, and all of those existed within the Mountain and Sea Realm!

It was now only about three days until the 32 Heavens were expected to break through the barrier. 
Everything was still and quiet, although the will to fight and the killing intent in the Realm grew 
stronger and more pervasive.

Meng Hao made his way through the starry sky until eventually he... reached the sun. There were 
100,000 cultivators posted there, arranged in both military and spell formations.

The minimum cultivation level among those cultivators was the Immortal Realm, with about thirty 
percent being Ancient Realm experts. They did not come from one particular Mountain and Sea, but 
had been picked from all of them. These people all cultivated fire-type techniques, and with them 
present, the power of the sun would be even further increased.

As soon as Meng Hao arrived, the 100,000 cultivators clasped hands and bowed deeply, fanatical 
gleams shining in their eyes.

“Greetings, Crown Prince of the Mountains and Seas!

“We shall live and die with the Mountains and Seas! We are willing to give our lives and souls for 
the Crown Prince!” The voices of 100,000 cultivators joined together into a powerful roar that 
echoed out, and within their eyes burned passion, and an intense desire to do battle.

Meng Hao looked at them, looked at the sun, and then clasped hands and bowed deeply. He made 
no speech, but instead stepped forward into the nucleus spell formation at the center of the sun, 
where he sat down cross-legged and closed his eyes.

Now that Meng Hao had arrived, all of the 100,000 cultivators sat down cross-legged.



Meng Hao had previously believed this sun to be huge, definitely larger than a planet, and most 
likely as large as one of the Mountains of the Realm. But now he realized that actually... it wasn’t 
very big.

The reason it seemed so spectacular was because of the dazzling, majestic light which constantly 
shone off of it, and the intense heat which made it impossible for ordinary cultivators to even get 
near it.

In fact, these 100,000 cultivators were wearing a special type of armor provided by Paragon Sea 
Dream which allowed them to stay on the surface of the sun. As for Meng Hao, considering the 
current level of his fleshly body, he needed nothing of the sort.

Numerous powerful spell formations could be seen which had apparently existed since time 
immemorial. As the 100,000 cultivators sat down cross-legged onto those spell formations, they 
merged into them, becoming part of the formations.

Meng Hao, of course, sat down cross-legged at the spell formation in the very center.

When he sent his divine sense out to cover the entire sun, he could sense a power there that could 
shake Heaven and Earth.

It was not his first time sensing that power. Back in the Windswept Realm, he had used his drop of 
Paragon’s blood to summon the light of this very sun, and the energy he had sensed at that time was 
the same as the energy he sensed now!

With his divine sense unleashed, he could utilize the spell formation, and with a mere thought, 
could merge into that power, and even... control it without the slightest interference!

Meng Hao could also sense that deep within the recesses of the sun was... the true precious treasure 
that this spell formation could unleash.

“According to the legends,” he murmured, “Paragon Nine Seals created the Mountain and Sea 
Realm, and then used his two Battle Weapons to make the sun and moon.... As for the sun, it 
focuses on battle, and the moon focuses on defense.” With that, he looked over in the direction of 
the moon, which was on the opposite side of the Mountain and Sea Realm.



That was where Ksitigarbha was stationed, who Meng Hao had still not met in person. He was the 
most peerless expert in the Mountain and Sea Realm, and he was tasked with using the moon to 
coordinate the defenses in battle.

Meng Hao took a deep breath and looked away. Then he sent his divine sense throughout the sun, 
linking himself with the 100,000 cultivators.

With that, he closed his eyes and began to wait.

Time passed. One day. Two days.... The cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm were itching to 
fight, and their killing intent shook Heaven and Earth. Everyone was now completely focused on 
the starry sky up above.

By now, boundless ripples were spreading out through the starry sky, as well as crashing booms, all 
from the barrier created by the will of the Mountains and Seas. Something terrifying was bashing at 
that barrier, causing the starry sky to burn, and sending crevices snaking out!

As the crevices grew wider, the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm calmed their spirits. No 
one spoke. They stood there silently. Waiting. Waiting for the 32 Heavens to attack!

It was in that moment that Paragon Sea Dream’s voice suddenly echoed out in Meng Hao’s mind.

“Meng Hao....”

Meng Hao opened his eyes.

“The sun is extremely important, and is in fact the key to the war. The sun... must not be lost! The 
Tailuo Redthunder Formation was one of the most powerful spell formations back in the days of the 
Paragon Immortal Realm.

“Paragon Nine Seals himself set up the formation, and having built up energy for tens upon tens of 
thousands of years, it can unleash supreme power. However, that power is limited. It can attack only 
nineteen times at one hundred percent strength. Eventually, the formation may break, and at that 
time, there is something you must remember. When it comes to the power of the sun, the spell 
formation is the first layer, the structure of the sun is the second layer, and the precious treasure in 
the nucleus is the third layer!



“Hold on for as long as you can.... This war is going to go on for a long time....”

Paragon Sea Dream’s voice echoed away into nothing. Meng Hao sat there silently. He didn’t 
respond to her words, but his eyes shone with a sharp, brilliant light. As for his divine sense, he sent 
some of it out toward the peak of the First Mountain where... the Paragon puppet sat cross-legged.

In the instant his divine sense poured into it, the Paragon puppet’s eyes opened, and they glittered 
brightly as it slowly looked up.

That was the moment in which a Heaven-shaking, Earth-shattering explosion rang out through the 
Mountain and Sea Realm. Up above in the starry sky, visible to all, was a huge black scorpion claw, 
slashing down through the barrier up above!!

The barrier was ripped open, and rumbling sounds like thunder filled the starry sky of the entire 
Mountain and Sea Realm.

The rift which had been opened in the barrier was thousands of meters wide, and on the other side 
was an army of Outsiders so large it was impossible to number. Countless eyes stared toward the 
Mountains and Seas, filled with greed and ruthlessness.

The 32 Heavens... were coming!!

Chapter 1355: Paragon Xuan Fang!
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The rumbling was so intense that the heavenly bodies shook. The scorpion pincer retracted, then 
appeared once again in another area off to the side. More booms could be heard as a second huge 
rift was ripped open.

Meng Hao watched silently, as did all of the other cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm. Their 
cold eyes were fixed on the starry sky up above as they awaited orders from Paragon Sea Dream.

The gigantic scorpion pincer appeared again and again, and soon ten rifts had been slashed open 
into the barrier in the starry sky. The strangest thing was that the ten rifts did not connect at all.



With every slash of the pincer, it seemed to grow weaker, until the final slash was delivered, 
whereupon a blast of energy surged out from the pincer.

Everything trembled, and a huge shockwave surged out, although it seemed as if the source of that 
blast was actually beyond the barrier itself!

After all, the scorpion pincer itself was more than 30,000 meters long, so it could only be imagined 
how gigantic the scorpion itself was!

The aura emanating from the scorpion pincer spread out in all directions, and the pressure of a 
Paragon superseded that of Heaven and Earth, dispersing everything in its path as it descended 
toward the Mountain and Sea Realm, a will unto itself!

“Heathens of the Paragon Immortal Realm, henceforth all of ye... shall cease to exist!

“All Immortals shall perish!

“All Immortal bloodlines will be cut off!

“All memories will be expunged!”

Massive rumbling echoed out in concert with the voice, causing the Mountains to shake and the 
Seas to seethe. The minds of all the cultivators in the Mountain and Sea Realm shook.

That was the will of a Paragon, and not that of a 7-Essences Paragon.... No, this was... an 8-
Essences Paragon!!

The Mountains and Seas were trembling. The lands shook and mountains were rocked as Heaven 
and Earth crumbled. The enormous scorpion pincer gradually retracted, as if the Outsider Paragon 
were temporarily incapable of actually descending into the Mountains and Seas, but first needed to 
widen the passageway before its true form could come.

As the pincer pulled back through the huge 3,000-meter rift it had just opened, a sea of countless 
Outsiders began to swarm through. Their eyes blazed with greed and a thirst for blood, and their 
laughter rang out in all directions.



At the same time, countless Outsiders began to fly out from the other rifts.

“The flesh and blood of Immortals.... I haven’t savored that flavor for a long, long time....”

“Immortals, huh? So this is the Immortal World we’ve been suppressing for so many millennia? 
They actually managed to wipe out the 1st Heaven?”

“Hahaha! Attack!!”

Screams that could twist the mind and heart echoed out as huge waves of Outsiders poured out. For 
the most part, they looked completely different than ordinary cultivators. Some had scaly skin, 
others had bone spurs protruding out all over their bodies. Some of them even looked like enormous 
crocodiles.

There were Outsiders that had human bodies but the heads of lions, and others with even more 
bizarre appearances. At a single glance, it was possible to tell that these beings were from outside 
the Mountain and Sea Realm.

When Meng Hao saw them pouring through the rifts, he frowned, and wondered why the Paragon 
Immortal Realm had ever ruled over Lower Realms filled with Outsiders such as these.

It was at this point that Paragon Sea Dream’s icy voice suddenly rang out in the minds of all 
Mountain and Sea cultivators.

“Fight!”

It was one word, but it was a word that called for a battle to the death. The resolve of the cultivators 
exploded like a whirlwind, and their hearts burned as if with fire.

Rumbling could be heard as the cultivators on the first line of defense attacked, unleashing their 
most powerful divine abilities. The starry sky trembled as the might of millions of cultivators 
exploded out. Instantly, the starry sky was not black, but instead filled with a riot of dazzling colors.



Countless divine abilities and magical techniques emanated scintillating colors, and were backed by 
the will and resolve of all the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm. It was like an ocean of 
magic that surged with fatal power toward the Outsiders. And this... was just the first showdown!

The fighting exploded in an instant. The Outsiders also unleashed their most profound divine 
abilities, some of them moving so fast they were mere blurs. Others laughed maniacally as they 
grew to incredible sizes, using their natural armor-like flesh to fight back. Some even transformed 
into multiple clones.

However, there were quite a few who were immediately cut down by the raging ocean of magic that 
blasted into them. This time, the Mountain and Sea Realm had entered its Siege Mode, and the 
spirits of its cultivators burned with passion. They were completely and utterly prepared for battle.

The ocean of magic swept over the Outsiders, and even as it was destroyed, another salvo surged 
out from the First Mountain and Sea.

As Meng Hao sat cross-legged in the sun, he refrained from attacking. This precious treasure of the 
Mountain and Sea Realm could not be squandered casually. It was impossible to say exactly how 
long the war would last, and Meng Hao wanted to ensure that each attack he unleashed... would 
inflict maximum damage on the invading 32 Heavens.

His Paragon puppet was also waiting to attack. Currently, the only fighters on the field of battle 
were the cultivators from the First Mountain and Sea.

Rumbling sounds echoed out as the initial advance of the Outsiders was shoved back, making it 
impossible for them to descend into the Mountain and Sea Realm. However, despite being sent 
spinning back by the ocean of magic, the number of Outsiders was vast, and more and more of them 
poured out of the ten rifts. Furthermore, additional rifts were now opening up.

As the forces of the Outsiders swelled in number, they were slowly able to push back against the 
ocean of magic unleashed by the Mountain and Sea Realm.

Meng Hao frowned in thought. Then, the sun’s spell formation began to flicker with light as he 
prepared to launch an attack. However, it was at this point that a cold snort echoed out from within 
the rift, and a new figure appeared.

It was a lion-headed Outsider, and as soon as he appeared, he exploded with the aura of an Imperial 
Lord. As he advanced, his aura transformed into an enormous circular shield of light!



The shield of light grew larger and larger as he moved in front of all the others, until it was over 
9,000 meters in diameter. This was what the Outsider Imperial Lord used to defend against the 
ocean of magic.

Meng Hao’s eyes glittered, and without hesitation, he took action. The boundless light of the sun 
became the most dazzling light on the battlefield. A beam of light shot out, and if you looked 
closely, within that beam of light was a glowing arrow!

The arrow pierced through the void to appear directly in front of the lion-headed Imperial Lord. His 
light shield instantly shattered, and the Imperial Lord’s face fell. Pupils constricting, he shot 
backward. However, the arrow’s speed hadn’t been reduced in the slightest.

Just as the arrow was about to slam into him, the lion-headed Imperial Lord threw his head back 
and roared. At the same time, his body rapidly expanded and changed shape into that of a golden 
lion. He then butted his head into the light shooting toward him from the sun.

Intense, blistering light radiated out from the Outsider Imperial Lord, and he let out a miserable 
shriek. Just when he was on the verge of being wiped out of existence, he suddenly spit a marionette 
out of his mouth. It was hard to tell whether the marionette was laughing or crying, and apparently, 
it was taking the place of the Outsider Imperial Lord’s soul as it cracked into pieces.

After the marionette was destroyed, the Outsider Imperial Lord’s body grew blurry and then 
vanished. When he reappeared near the border of the one of the rifts, he was trembling, and was 
clearly much weaker than before. Enraged, he turned to look in the direction of Meng Hao and the 
sun.

Meng Hao’s expression was calm as he snorted coldly. At the same time, the Outsider Imperial Lord 
suddenly looked back in the direction of his destroyed marionette to find that the light arrow had 
reformed. It then shot forth at incredible speed, and before he could react, it stabbed into his 
forehead.

A boom rang out, and a look of disbelief flashed across his face in the moment before he exploded. 
In the lasts moments before he died, the only thing that filled his mind was disbelief that he was 
dying after having just stepped foot onto the battlefield. Then, he was completely wiped out of 
existence!



Countless cultivators within the Mountain and Sea Realm saw this happen, and they were instantly 
enlivened.

Upon the death of the lion-headed Imperial Lord, another astonishing stream of aura pierced out 
from within one of the rifts. It was a second Imperial Lord who moved so fast it was difficult to see 
him. Only when he stopped moving was it possible to see that his appearance was not humanoid. 
Instead, he was a huge ant, thousands of meters tall.

He was pitch black and emanated a boundless black glow that fought back against the ocean of 
magic. Even as he looked over warily at Meng Hao, a third Imperial Lord appeared!

Shockingly, this third Imperial Lord... was not an Outsider, but a cultivator. He emanated profound 
ancientness, and wore a long white robe. He was an old man who had apparently lived for countless 
years, and emanated boundless cultivation base ripples. As soon as he appeared, he looked down at 
the Mountain and Sea Realm with a complex expression. Seemingly reminiscent, he finally snorted 
coldly, waving his right hand to cause a crimson flame phoenix to appear, fully 3,000 meters long. 
Instantly, it shot toward the ocean of magic.

Two Imperial Lords were now attacking simultaneously, causing the ocean of magic to begin to 
vibrate. After a long moment, just when it seemed as if it couldn’t sustain itself for any longer, the 
invading Outsiders built up enough troops to unleash a magical ocean of their own.

Meng Hao quickly prepared the sun’s spell formation for a second attack. In the blink of an eye, 
another light arrow shot out, toward... the white-robed Imperial Lord who was... clearly a cultivator 
who had originally come from in the Mountain and Sea Realm.

However, it was at this point that the starry sky trembled. Everything shook as a huge hand 
stretched out from one of the rifts. It was completely golden, and covered with boundless fur that 
floated about elegantly. That hand stretched out with incredible speed to simply grab the second 
light arrow Meng Hao had just shot from the sun!

The hand clenched down viciously, and the light arrow shattered.

Meng Hao’s eyes flickered. He hadn’t used the full power of the sun in his previous two attacks, 
only about sixty to seventy percent. Even still, the only type of person who could crush those 
arrows would be a Paragon!

Chapter 1356: Plot To Fragment the Heavens!



Massive rumbling could be heard as the light arrow collapsed into pieces. The Paragon’s enormous 
hand stopped in place, then opened slowly, causing a drop of blood to drop down. That blood drop 
sizzled, and then exploded into a boundless sea covered with innumerable magical symbols. It 
descended like a millstone toward the ocean of magic unleashed by the huge army of Mountain and 
Sea cultivators.

Meng Hao’s pupils constricted in response.

“He definitely deserves to be a Paragon. He clearly has copious experience in battle, and is adept at 
changing tactics in the middle of fighting. He actually took the drop of blood that resulted from 
being struck by the light arrow and turned it into a powerful attack....”

There was no time for Meng Hao to stop what was happening. Frowning, he watched as the 
Paragon’s sea of blood shoved down onto the ocean of magic, instantly causing its light to fade 
wherever they connected.

Simultaneously, the two Imperial Lords also attacked. Rumbling sounds could be heard as, for the 
first time, the Mountain and Sea Realm’s ocean of magic was suppressed, and began to fade away.

It was also at this point that the rifts in the starry sky were relentlessly ripped open wider and wider. 
Vast quantities of Outsiders appeared. There were no less than a million at this point, and their 
expressions were all fierce and vicious as they charged toward the First Mountain and Sea.

The rifts only continued to open wider, and it was possible to see that even more Outsiders were 
waiting beyond. They kept pouring through the openings without stop.

Furthermore, behind all of those Outsiders was... a land mass!

It was... the 2nd Heaven. This 2nd Heaven was clearly larger than the 1st Heaven, and beyond it, 
Meng Hao could see the 3rd Heaven, the 4th Heaven, and the 5th Heaven....

Each of the 33 Heavens was larger than the one before it, with the smallest being the 1st Heaven, 
and the largest Heaven being... the 33rd Heaven.

Rumbling could be heard as the 2nd Heaven... battered the barrier, causing the rifts to grow larger, 
and allowing more and more Outsiders to enter the Mountain and Sea Realm.



From the look of it, the barrier wouldn’t stay intact for very much longer.

Meng Hao looked back toward the rifts, and his eyes flickered as he caught sight of the Paragon 
who had just shattered his arrow. He was enormous, and golden-colored, with the head of a lion, the 
type of figure to be the subject of all attention.

Golden light shimmered off of him, and Meng Hao could even sense that this lion-headed Paragon 
possessed terrifying, world-destructive power.

Sensing Meng Hao’s gaze, the lion-headed Paragon looked over, and his lightning-like eyes pierced 
through the void to land on the sun, and Meng Hao. Voice cool, he said, “I am Xuan Fang.”

Meng Hao snorted coldly as he sent his divine sense out to defend himself.

Xuan Fang’s eyes glittered. Ignoring Meng Hao, he turned to face the Paragon puppet which waited 
on the First Mountain. His expression was mixed as he extended his hand and pointed toward the 
First Mountain and Sea.

“Let the war of extermination begin!” In response to his words, countless Outsiders roared and 
charged toward the First Mountain and Sea, unleashing numerous magical techniques and divine 
abilities.

The army that comprised the first line of defense for the Mountain and Sea Realm was separated 
from the Outsiders by the First Sea, but they still fought back directly with various magics. 
However, the number of Outsiders was vast, and more were pouring in by the moment. Their charge 
was relentless and awe-inspiring, and their advance drew them ever closer to the First Sea.

The seawater boiled and screamed, and began to vaporize into a mist, as if it were being eternally 
wiped away.

Unexpectedly, Paragon Xuan Fang stayed in place, an enigmatic smile on his face as he studied the 
Mountain and Sea Realm. Then he shot up into the starry sky and stretched out both hands, as if he 
were going to grab hold of the expanse and rip it apart.

Rumbling sounds could be heard as the barrier in the starry sky was ripped open even wider.



Apparently, a tipping point had been reached. Massive rumbling could be heard as the barrier 
became completely inundated with cracks and tears, and then shattered into pieces like a mirror.

As it did, everything that was up above was then revealed. All of the... 32 Heavens!!

Now that the barrier was down, the Mountain and Sea Realm and the 32 Heavens were connected. 
Both sides... could look directly at each other.

However, it was in that moment that all of the Outsiders from the 32 Heavens suddenly grew blurry 
and then faded away. Shockingly, they returned back to the land masses from whence they had 
come! This strange development caused Meng Hao’s heart to begin to thump. Something strange 
was happening, and although he wasn’t sure what it was, it seemed like something big was about to 
occur.

Paragon Xuan Fang’s expression flickered with scorn as he looked coldly at the Mountain and Sea 
Realm.

“I have to admire your little plot. But... I couldn’t care less about it!” In almost the exact same 
instant that Xuan Fang’s words echoed out, Meng Hao’s heart trembled from the intense foreboding 
that was growing stronger by the moment. Suddenly, all of the shattered remnants of the barrier 
began to emit a droning sound as they spun around to form a huge tempest. Then, they began to rise 
up toward the 32 Heavens.

At the same time, Paragon Sea Dream’s voice echoed out into the minds of the Mountain and Sea 
cultivators.

“Attack!!”

Rumbling sounds echoed out, starting from the Ninth Mountain and Sea and then moving to the 
Eighth, the Seventh, and all the way to the First Mountain and Sea, as the Mountain and Sea 
cultivators unleashed explosive divine abilities and magical techniques. They rocketed up, then shot 
out from the First Mountain and Sea in an ocean of magic which exceeded the ferocity of the 
previous oceans by ten times. It shot out toward the tempest, merging into it and thus experiencing 
an exponential growth in size and power.

That indescribably powerful force was heading directly toward... the 32 Heavens.



This was the Mountain and Sea Realm plot that Xuan Fang had referred to, something that had been 
enacted by Paragon Sea Dream, but originally planned out by Paragon Nine Seals.

It really was a plot. Although it wasn’t possible to tell from the perspective of the Mountain and Sea 
Realm itself, from the direction of the 33 Heavens, it was easier to distinguish. The barrier which 
had been erected by the will of the Mountain and Sea Realm, once shattered, would clearly be able 
to unleash a shocking attack.

That shocking attack, that intense tempest, would combine all of the magical techniques of the 
Mountain and Sea Realm cultivators to create a power similar to that of a Paragon, which would 
then be used to strike at the 2nd Heaven!

The massive tempest swept out to cover the 2nd Heaven, smashing its mountains and buildings, 
then moving on to batter the 3rd Heaven, the 4th Heaven, and then the 5th Heaven.

As of this moment, Meng Hao had already unleashed two powerful attacks, leaving him with less 
than sixteen left. However, he didn’t hesitate to add the power of one more light arrow into the huge 
tempest, making it even more glorious than before.

Meng Hao could also sense that there were likely more tricks hidden within the shattered barrier, so 
despite the sense of foreboding he had, he still chose to join in.

The windstorm screamed, backed by the madness of the Mountain and Sea Realm cultivators, by 
the explosive power of the will of the Mountain and Sea Realm, as if they wanted to bash all of the 
32 Heavens to pieces!

However, even as the windstorm blasted into the 6th Heaven, and before it could charge on toward 
the 7th Heaven, blinding light shone out to cover the land mass that was the 7th Heaven. It then 
covered the 8th Heaven above it, and the 9th and onward all the way to the 33rd Heaven. Then, all 
of those Heavens began to fade into blurriness.

At the same time, a barrier appeared, cutting the connection between the 6th Heaven and the 7th 
Heaven.



Simultaneously, a gigantic scorpion appeared in the vast expanse above the 7th Heaven. It was 
blurry, but its eyes glittered with oppressive coldness as it stared down at the Mountain and Sea 
Realm.

“The tactics of Nine Seals, carried out by Sea Dream. Our 33 Heavens have no choice but to face 
the power of your plot. As it turns out... that power of extermination is as terrifying as ever.

“However... tens upon tens of thousands of years have passed. We are different than we used to be. 
In the past, you might have been able to blast through all 33 Heavens, to open up a path for the 
Mountain and Sea Realm to flee. But now... you shall be stopped at the 6th Heaven.

“That Mountain and Sea Siege Mode might seem like it is intended to converge power for defense, 
but there is no question that its shape is that of an arrow. In all likelihood, Paragon Nine Seals 
planned this out all those tens of thousands of years ago. His plan for the final battle was actually... 
to open a corridor to make your getaway.

“I wonder how many cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm actually knew about this little 
plan? Based on what I know of your personality, Sea Dream, my guess is... that you didn’t tell 
anyone!” The scorpion’s laughter rang out through the Mountain and Sea Realm as it slowly 
disappeared.

His words were filled with sinister malevolence, and when they entered the ears of the cultivators of 
the Mountain and Sea Realm, their hearts trembled with shock. Not even Meng Hao had been aware 
that Sea Dream would do something like this.

Although he could disregard the allegation of the scorpion-shaped Paragon if he wanted to, after 
some thought, he realized that what he had said didn’t seem like a complete fabrication.

If Meng Hao was affected in such a way, then it could only be imagined how the rest of the 
Mountain and Sea Cultivators felt. They couldn’t help... but suddenly lose a bit of confidence 
regarding the war. After all... even their Paragon wanted to escape, not fight to the death....

The sensation of hope they had felt after Meng Hao destroyed the 1st Heaven and enslaved a 
Paragon... suddenly faded a bit thanks to the words of the scorpion-shaped Paragon.

Meng Hao’s eyes flickered, and his heart sank. He knew that cultivators who could reach the level 
of Paragon were by no means weak, and would also be profound schemers.



As the scorpion-shaped Paragon disappeared, and the 7th through 33rd Heavens faded into a state of 
invisibility, the land masses of the 6th, 5th, 4th, 3rd, and 2nd Heavens all began to descend.

Although they were broken and in ruins, the Outsiders on them clearly had ways to defend from the 
attack just now. All of them boiled forth, tens of millions of them, backed by their land masses as 
they charged in attack.

There were also numerous black cubes which spread out from the five land masses, no less than a 
million of them.

At this point, Paragon Sea Dream’s cold voice echoed out into the starry skies. “What a pack of lies! 
You think a measly Scorpion Tribe Priest like yourself can understand the ways and means of 
Paragon Nine Seals...? Cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm, the 7th Heaven and all the other 
Heavens have unleashed their Heaven Concealing sorcery. For the next year, they will be incapable 
of emerging from their current state. Nor will they be able to fight us. They will only be able to 
watch!

“They have abandoned the 2nd through 6th Heavens. Their armies are alone! Outsider cultivators of 
the Lower Realms, did you know that? Did you know that you have been forsaken?”

Chapter 1357: Throw Myself Out as Bait!
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It didn’t matter whether or not Paragon Sea Dream really had planned to flee with the Mountain and 
Sea Realm, or whether or not she felt the war to be hopeless. As of this moment, her echoing words 
not only solidified the hearts of the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm, it was also a 
rhetorical counterpunch that caused the Outsiders who remained behind in the 2nd through 6th 
Heavens to turn very grim-faced.

Meng Hao breathed a sigh of relief, then looked toward the Ninth Mountain with a complex 
expression. Deep in his heart, he was convinced that Paragon Sea Dream really had intended to lead 
the Mountain and Sea Realm into flight.

However, now was not the time to ponder the matter. He settled his thoughts and then focused 
completely on the spell formation, causing brilliant sunlight to shine out into the starry sky.



Meanwhile, as if giving their reply to Sea Dream’s words, the millions of black cubes floating in the 
starry sky suddenly erupted with boundless lightning, which then lashed downward and bombarded 
the Mountain and Sea Realm’s first line of defense. If that were all there were to it, it might not be a 
big deal, but in addition, the surging energy of a Paragon also erupted out from the 6th Heaven.

A hoarse voice could be heard, filled with seemingly infinite pride, “Still as slippery with words as 
ever, Fellow Daoist Sea Dream. How amusing.”

The 33 Heavens originally had five powerful Paragons. Of those, one had been enslaved by Meng 
Hao. That left four, and now... two were present to fight!

The words spoken by this Paragon instantly filled the Outsiders with confidence. After all, if the 32 
Heavens sent two Paragons to support them, then how could it be as Sea Dream said, that they had 
been abandoned?

Their fighting spirit soared. Roaring, millions upon millions of Outsiders charged toward the First 
Sea, whose waters boiled and bubbled as countless restrictive spells exploded out. The First 
Mountain and Sea was the first line of defense, and the cultivators there had no time to think or 
ponder. They could only begin to fight!

Millions of cultivators charged forth in attack. Countless scintillating beams of light shot through 
the First Sea, joining the power of the restrictive spells and spell formations to unleash carnage 
upon the Outsiders.

The First Sea seethed as innumerable Outsiders poured into the battle. In the blink of an eye, 
miserable shrieks and cries filled the air, and countless grievous injuries and even deaths occurred. 
The First Sea almost instantly turned crimson, making the entire sea look like... a sea of blood.

As for the Paragon who had just spoken out from the 6th Heaven, he did not appear in body. 
Clearly, his only goal had been to put pressure on the Mountain and Sea Realm, and to calm the 
Outsiders. Even more so, he wanted to buy time.

Time was needed for the 7th through 33rd Heavens to emerge from the special state created by the 
magic they had used to evade the destructive tempest.

As for the Outsider Imperial Lords, their number had increased from four to six, and they were 
making a grand display in battle.



Out in the starry sky, Xuan Fang’s eyes glittered as he looked over at the six Imperial Lords, then 
pointed in the direction of the sun.

“All of you--” However, before he could finish speaking, his expression flickered. “Not good....”

In that same instant, a glowing shield exploded out from the moon. Ksitigarbha was using all the 
power he could unleash to utilize the moon’s spell formation power. The moon was devoted to 
defense, and now it created a shield that covered the Mountain and Sea Realm, including the First 
Sea.

That shield locked down the Mountain and Sea Realm, and at the same time... cut off all of the 
Outsiders who were within the First Sea from the others!

It was as if the Outsiders’ huge army had suddenly been cut apart!

One portion was isolated in the First Sea, with the majority of the army being stuck outside. At the 
same time, Meng Hao sent divine will into the Paragon puppet that was waiting atop the First 
Mountain. Suddenly, it looked up, its eyes flashing.

The puppet’s face was expressionless, but when Xuan Fang saw it, his face fell. The puppet rose to 
its feet, the pressure of a Paragon exploding out from the First Mountain to fill the First Sea. Then, 
it took a step forward.

“Eegoo, what are you doing!?!?” Xuan Fang roared from the other side of the shield. He took a step 
toward the shield, clenched his hand into a fist, and struck out. The entire shield shook as though it 
might break at any moment. However, Ksitigarbha’s eyes gleamed viciously, and blood oozed out 
of the corners of the mouths of the 100,000 cultivators under his command. As a result, the shield 
stabilized, and showed no further signs of being breached.

Xuan Fang roared with fury as he battered the shield again, but it did no good. He stared viciously 
at Meng Hao’s Paragon puppet as it took a step forward, then unleashed a fist strike toward the First 
Sea.

That fist strike contained Paragon power that could shake the Heavens. The entire First Sea sank 
down, and the Mountain and Sea cultivators were pushed back by an enormous force. In contrast, 
the Outsiders’ faces flickered with shock and despair.



“NO!!”

“Th-that’s... that’s Paragon Eegoo. How... how could this be possible!?!?’

“Paragon Eegoo has turned traitor!!”

Massive rumbling echoed out as the fist strike descended. The Outsiders began to cough up blood, 
and cracking sounds mixed with miserable shrieks could be heard as their bodies began to fall to 
pieces.

After the fist strike landed, a powerful shockwave surged out in all directions like a massive 
tempest. As it passed over the Outsiders in the First Sea, their bodies were flayed into masses of 
blood and gore. Their flesh became ash, and their bones were shattered into fragments, leaving 
nothing behind!

Their magical items, their bags of holding, everything about them was completely destroyed, until 
nothing was left behind but wisps of smoke.

However, the blood that filled the First Sea remained behind. Not a bit of it faded away, and in fact, 
it grew thicker, until the First Sea emanated a stench that struck fear into the hearts of the Outsiders 
on the other side of the shield.

One single punch exterminated all of the enemy forces in the First Sea.

The power of a Paragon, once unleashed... could exterminate Heaven and Earth.

The Paragon puppet slowly looked up, and its eyes were clearly not that of Eegoo, but Meng Hao. 
The icy madness therein, freezing killing intent which stabbed out of the Mountain and Sea Realm’s 
shield toward Xuan Fang.

Xuan Fang shivered, and his face darkened, but the killing intent in his own eyes burned brighter 
than ever as he then turned to look in the direction of the sun, and Meng Hao.



“As long as this kid remains alive,” he thought, “this war will be ten times as hard to win!” After a 
moment, he looked away. Without speaking another word, he turned his attention back to the shield. 
He was confident that he would be able to break it open, but he also knew that even if he did, his 
army wouldn’t be willing to casually step into the First Sea.

And yet, if he didn’t break the stalemate, then despite being able to buy some time, the morale of 
the troops would be significantly damaged. Furthermore, that would also give time for the Mountain 
and Sea Realm to make further preparations.

Xuan Fang’s eyes glittered. “We can’t let them dictate the tide of battle. To break this stalemate, I 
need... to throw out some bait! An Imperial Lord wouldn’t be enough. Only by offering myself up 
as bait can I force the Mountain and Sea Realm into making a move, whatever it is!”

After a moment of silence, the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm suddenly began to cheer, 
and their excitement grew. At the same time, the shield began to fade away.

As it did, the Outsiders stared at the bloody First Sea, and just as Xuan Fang had predicted, none of 
them dared to enter it. Although they clearly outnumbered the Mountain and Sea Realm cultivators, 
they were the scared ones.

None of them dared to enter, but Xuan Fang did. He shot through the vanishing shield at high speed, 
and in that same moment, Ksitigarbha suddenly rose to his feet from where he sat inside the moon.

“He actually dares to enter?!?!” he thought, eyes shining with a strange light. However, he 
hesitated. That hesitation came as he considered whether or not to activate the shield again, trapping 
the Outsider Paragon inside, and then using the power of the Mountains and Seas to kill him!

Accomplishing that... could potentially end the battle much earlier!

It wasn’t just Ksitigarbha who was hesitating. Sea Dream was frowning, and as for the rest of the 
Outsider army, they were stunned. However, some of the Outsiders were already beginning to roar, 
and charge forth to fight.

The six Imperial Lords were also shaken. The only person who seemed unfazed was the other 
Paragon in the 6th Heaven.



Meng Hao began to breathe heavily; the decisiveness being shown by Xuan Fang caused an icy 
coldness to glitter in his eyes.

“Offering himself up as bait?”

There was no time for lengthy consideration. Xuan Fang shot into the First Sea and appeared 
directly in front of the Paragon puppet. As he closed in, he performed an incantation gesture and 
pointed out, causing the surrounding sea of blood to solidify, almost as if it were being frozen by 
indescribable coldness.

“Seal!” Sea Dream barked in response, countering his move. Her eyes flickered with a fierce gleam. 
There was really no choice in the matter. If Xuan Fang was brave enough to offer himself up as bait, 
and the Mountain and Sea Realm was too cowardly to bite, then how could they possibly continue 
to fight the war?

Sea Dream normally planned things out carefully, but this situation was different.

Even as Sea Dream’s voice continued to echo out, and before she could act on her decision, the light 
of the sun around Meng Hao blazed brightly. He had made his choice too, which was... to take the 
bait!

Ksitigarbha took a deep breath as his cultivation base surged with power. The river of reincarnation 
appeared, along with the sea of the Yellow Springs, and the numerous underworld palaces. The 
100,000 cultivators on the moon all erupted with cultivation base power, pouring it into the spell 
formation, which Ksitigarbha then manipulated, causing the shield to spring up, covering the 
Mountain and Sea Realm, completely trapping Paragon Xuan Fang!

In the same moment that the shield appeared, the sun blazed with intense light as an attack was 
unleashed. An arrow of light shot through the starry sky, and at the same time, Paragon Sea Dream 
suddenly shot to her feet in the Ninth Mountain, then took a step forward to appear on the 
battlefield.

Rumbling could be heard as Meng Hao’s Paragon puppet began to fight with Xuan Fang. Even as 
the spectacular battle began to play out, the sunlight arrow was closing in.

Unexpectedly, Xuan Fang didn’t attempt to evade the arrow. In fact, he didn’t even pay any heed to 
Paragon Sea Dream.



“Do you people really think I threw myself out as bait to get revenge for the millions of my fellow 
clan members who have died already? Or perhaps because of this Eegoo puppet?

“Oh, no. No... I came here,” he suddenly looked toward the sun and smiled coldly, “for YOU.” 
Laughing, he reached up and grabbed the light arrow, crushing it with his hand. A massive boom 
rang out, and blood oozed out of his mouth as he seemed to be on the verge of exploding. However, 
a strange light then began to flicker within his eyes.

“Dao of Time, return to the origin, trace this light back, and converge my true form!” Even as he 
spoke, Xuan Fang vanished!

When he reappeared, he was on the sun, a black pearl in his hand, which he then slammed 
downward!

Chapter 1358: Battling Paragon Xuan Fang!

It was as if he had searched for the origin of the arrow, followed the light arrow back, used some 
incomprehensible divine ability to travel back in time by several breaths. Furthermore... Paragon 
Xuan Fang himself had traveled back in time!

The injuries that had just been inflicted on him by the light arrow suddenly faded away as he 
appeared on the surface of the sun!

Massive rumbling sounds could be heard, and the whole sun began to vibrate. The sudden turn of 
events caused Meng Hao’s eyes to narrow.

“The Essence of Time!!” Meng Hao had fought many people in his life, and although he might not 
have as much experience as Xuan Fang, he came close. Therefore, it was without the slightest 
hesitation that he reacted. In fact, his physical reaction was even faster than his mental reaction, as 
his cultivation base exploded with power, taking the power of the spell formation formed by the 
100,000 cultivators and sending a vicious attack out.

That attack contained the full power of the sun, becoming a beam of light that shot, not directly 
toward Xuan Fang, but toward the black pearl.

That pearl gave Meng Hao a very bad feeling.



The golden light which emanated off of Paragon Xuan Fang had faded some. Clearly, using the 
Heaven-defying Timeshift magic was not something he could easily do. In fact, most likely, he 
wouldn’t be able to unleash the same magic again any time soon; in that respect, it was similar to 
Meng Hao’s Essence of Space.

In any case, Paragon Xuan Fang’s sudden appearance on the sun not only caused Meng Hao’s eyes 
to widen, Paragon Sea Dream was clearly shocked.

Paragon Sea Dream instantly drew upon her full power to teleport over to the region of the sun. 
Meng Hao also used divine will to call his Paragon puppet over to help extricate himself from the 
danger!

Amidst rumbling sounds, brilliant light shot toward the pearl that Paragon Xuan Fang was 
slamming toward the surface of the sun with such speed that it seemed that it would surely be able 
to intercept the pearl before its impact.

Xuan Fang snorted coldly, then suddenly let go of the black pearl, allowing the light of the sun to 
slam into it. A huge boom then echoed out as the pearl was completely shattered.

As that happened, black mist spread out, which Meng Hao could instantly tell was filled with some 
sort of incredible sealing power. Thankfully, it had been destroyed before being fully unleashed; had 
it been used, even a Paragon would have been hard pressed to undo the sealing effect.

Clearly, the pearl had been a precious treasure that only a Paragon could create!

As soon as the black pearl shattered, Paragon Xuan Fang suddenly flickered into motion. In the 
blink of an eye, he was off in the distance. However, he was still on the surface of the sun, and 
shockingly, another black pearl could be seen in his hand. A vicious grin could be seen on his face 
as he completely ignored the incoming Sea Dream and Paragon puppet.

“When I attack, I plan things meticulously,” he said coolly. “Things rarely go awry when I make a 
move!” With that he viciously threw the black pearl down toward the surface of the sun.

“Why does he insist on slamming that thing into the sun...?” thought Meng Hao, frowning. 
Suddenly, an idea popped into his head, and at the same time, the Lightning Cauldron appeared. 
Electricity danced as Meng Hao teleported out of the spell formation. Xuan Fang’s jaw dropped as, 



in the blink of an eye, Form Displacement Transposition caused him to switch places with Meng 
Hao.

Meng Hao waved his hand, and just as the black pearl was about to slam into the surface of the sun, 
he scooped it up.

As soon as he touched it, he understood.

“He doesn’t want to seal this moment in time, and he doesn’t want to use the pearl to kill me, he 
wants... to seal the sun!” With that, he looked up, and his pupils constricted as he realized that 
Paragon Xuan Fang... had produced a third black pearl.

This time, Xuan Fang didn’t speak. In almost the same instant that Meng Hao laid eyes on him, he 
didn’t throw the pearl down, but simply crushed it.

As the pearl was crushed, thick black mist exploded out, instantly swirling out to cover the entire 
sun, creating something like a unique Domain.

It was at this point that Meng Hao’s Paragon puppet closed in and unleashed a fist strike upon the 
black mist. However, the power of that strike disappeared as quickly as a stone ox thrown into the 
ocean. Furthermore, there was no reaction whatsoever from the mist.

As for Paragon Sea Dream, as soon as she was close enough, she waved her finger, sending Paragon 
power exploding out. However, it did nothing to the mist except cause it to shudder and loosen 
slightly.

“Those are Gloompearls!!” An extremely unsightly expression appeared on Sea Dream’s face. 
Gloompearls were not something from the 33 Heavens. Back when the Paragon Immortal Realm 
faced complete catastrophe, one of the two major enemy forces created them with the express 
purpose of ensnaring powerful experts of the Immortal World. Once their power was unleashed, it 
couldn’t easily be dispelled.

At the very least, it could trap everything inside of it for a quarter of an hour.

During that quarter hour, whatever was inside the mist was completely cut off from the rest of the 
world!



Even as Sea Dream’s face flickered, Paragon Xuan Fang was within the mist, eyes flickering with 
icy killing intent. Although he initially appeared to be going after the Paragon puppet, in the blink 
of an eye, he changed his target to Meng Hao. But then, just when everyone thought he was actually 
trying to kill Meng Hao, he unleashed a Gloompearl to lock down the sun!

He had even prepared three pearls, all to ensure that the power of the sun could not be unleashed. 
That would remove one of the major obstacles to the invading army.

However just when people thought they knew what Xuan Fang was trying to do, he suddenly 
changed tactics again. Instead of trying to keep the sun sealed, he targeted Meng Hao. The truth was 
that few people would be able to guess... exactly what his goals were.

Right now, the sun was cut off because of the mist. Sea Dream and the Paragon puppet were on the 
outside, trying to batter their way in, trying to undo the seal. Meanwhile, Meng Hao was inside, 
facing incredible danger.

“I have a quarter of an hour to kill you, and that’s all I need!” Xuan Fang laughed loudly, erupting 
with the cultivation base power of a Paragon as he took a step forward toward Meng Hao.

Meng Hao’s face darkened. Xuan Fang was turning into a real headache; not only was his 
cultivation base incredibly powerful, his ability to scheme ran deep and profound. He was proving 
much more difficult to deal with than Eegoo.

Even as Xuan Fang bore down on him, Meng Hao backed up, sending out divine will to gather the 
power of the spell formation. Rumbling sounds could be heard as brilliant light exploded out, 
transforming into a light arrow that shot toward Xuan Fang.

Xuan Fang roared and performed a double-handed incantation gesture, causing an enormous golden 
lion to appear behind him. The lion rapidly grew in size, covering Xuan Fang and taking the hit of 
the arrow instead of him.

A boom rang out as the light arrow pierced into the image of the lion, which distorted, and then, 
before it could even roar, shattered into pieces. The light arrow, despite dimming somewhat, 
continued to stab toward Xuan Fang, who then reached out and grabbed it. As he crushed his hand 
down, the light arrow collapsed, and Xuan Fang backed up a few steps, his face pale and yet 
covered with an expression of scorn.



“The treasures passed down by Nine Seals are truly powerful. Unfortunately, you can only unleash 
a limited bit of its power. Perhaps if you struck me over and over again in quick succession, you 
would have a chance to kill me. However, you can only unleash the power with the help of that 
spell formation, and those 100,000 cultivators which maintain it. What a joke!

“Besides, for the next ten breaths of time at the minimum, you will not be able to unleash the power 
of this sun!” Even as he spoke, Xuan Fang launched himself toward Meng Hao, golden light 
flickering around him as he clenched his fist and punched out.

“Your fleshly body has the signs of fleshly body cultivation. Let’s see how well you cultivated it!”

The fist strike was powerful enough to shatter mountains and crush the earth. The sun trembled, and 
boundless golden light radiated out as a gigantic lion appeared within the fist strike, roaring as it 
charged toward Meng Hao.

Paragon power dispelled the natural laws in the area, causing the 100,000 cultivators to cough up 
mouthfuls of blood. There were even some who exploded into showers of blood and gore.

Meng Hao’s cultivation base suddenly teetered unstably, and he staggered backward. At the same 
time, Paragon Sea Dream’s voice echoed urgently from beyond the mist, sounding almost as if it 
were coming from a different time and space.

“Meng Hao, just hold on for a quarter of an hour!! That’s the longest it will take us to break this 
seal.”

The danger was intense, leaving Meng Hao’s heart pounding. He might be as powerful as the peak 
of 6-Essences, capable of fighting with Imperial Lords. However, the difference between that and a 
Paragon, was too vast. He was currently trapped, with nowhere to flee, and no choice but to fight to 
the death.

In this critical juncture, Meng Hao dismissed all notions of coming up with a clever idea. Instead, 
his mind thrummed with the desire... to fight!

“A quarter hour....” he thought, eyes flickering with killing intent. Then, he sent his divine sense 
rocketing toward Xuan Fang in a vicious attack. Instead of falling back, he fought back against the 
pressure, taking a step forward and unleashing his own fist strike!



Life-Extermination!

Everything shook violently, and a tempest sprang out in all direction as Meng Hao’s fist strike 
slammed into Paragon Xuan Fang’s. A huge boom could be heard, and blood sprayed out of Meng 
Hao’s mouth. However, his expression was extremely vicious as he took another step forward and 
unleashed a second fist strike.

Bedevilment Fist!

No survival without Bedevilment! Meng Hao laughed uproariously. Massive energy was unleashed 
by the fist strike, causing a deafening boom to ring out. Even Paragon Xuan Fang was taken aback. 
Meng Hao coughed up more blood, and cracking sounds could be heard coming from within him.

He might have a Dao Sovereign fleshly body, but Xuan Fang was a Paragon, with an even stronger 
fleshly body, one that vastly exceeded Meng Hao’s

“You really want to die?!” Xuan Fang laughed coldly. Rotating his cultivation base, he caused 
intense pressure to spread out. The golden lion roared, completely suppressing Meng Hao’s 
Bedevilment Fist, and then appearing directly in front of Meng Hao himself.

It was at this point that Meng Hao’s eyes shone with a brilliant light as he... unleashed a third fist 
strike!

It was none other than... the God-Slaying Fist!

Chapter 1359: Oh So Devious!

Merge my will with that of the Heavens. My fist arouses the sun, becoming a fist of light!

As of that moment, Meng Hao’s will converged in the form of the God-Slaying Fist. Advancing 
courageously and with complete determination, he unleashed the powerful blow.

When it slammed into Paragon Xuan Fang’s fist, massive booms rang out. A tremor ran through 
Meng Hao, and his right arm distorted. Blood sprayed out of his mouth, and he was sent tumbling 
backward as though he had been struck by a powerful blast.



However, at the same time, Xuan Fang’s eyes flickered with astonishment. Although he appeared to 
have been unfazed, the five fingers of his right hand were tingling in pain, and he couldn’t even 
stretch them out. An injury like this wasn’t something that would cause him to cough up blood. And 
yet, his finger bones were crushed, and the other bones in his arm were fractured. However, the 
intense pain only caused the killing intent in Xuan Fang’s eyes to deepen. Once again, he closed in 
on Meng Hao.

“Wish you could get away?” Xuan Fang chuckled. However, even as he closed in, Meng Hao 
suddenly stopped in place and looked up, his eyes gleaming with ferocity as his Green Emperor’s 
Eternal Incantation operated at full speed.

“The thought never crossed my mind,” he replied icily. Azure light shone out as he transformed into 
an azure roc, which then shot toward Xuan Fang at high speed. A piercing cry rang out, and at the 
same time, numerous mountains descended, along with the Paragon Bridge, which erupted with 
intense power.

Rumbling could be heard as Paragon Xuan Fang laughed coldly, choosing not to evade, but instead 
to step forward and make a grasping motion. Immediately, golden light sprang into being in front of 
him, within which flickered innumerable magical symbols. A spell formation was formed, which 
radiated the power of the stars, causing the five elements to be thrown into chaos, and strange lights 
to flicker.

The spell formation immediately shot toward Meng Hao, causing his mountains to shatter and 
destroying his azure roc form. Azure light scattered, and Meng Hao’s human form emerged, looking 
completely bedraggled. His chest was a mass of blood and gore, and even organs were visible.

Without the incredible effort of the Green Emperor’s Eternal Incantation, which constantly healed 
him, Meng Hao would already be dead. Even with it, he was clearly in an extremely precarious 
situation.

“Now this is a Paragon....” he thought, eyes flickering with an unyielding gleam. His fight with 
Eegoo hadn’t been nearly as intense as this. Right now, he was trapped, and had no other choice but 
to face the terrifying might of a Paragon.

And this was just a 7-Essences Paragon!

Rumbling sounds echoed out as the golden spell formation bore down on Meng Hao. He threw his 
head back and roared, causing brilliant light to shine off of the Paragon Bridge as it fought back.



The pressure from the Paragon Bridge caused the golden spell formation to tremble, and finally 
break into pieces. The Paragon Bridge shuddered, but continued to crush downward toward Xuan 
Fang.

Xuan Fang’s eyes widened. He suddenly looked more closely at the Paragon Bridge, and his 
expression flickered. Backing up, he performed a double-handed incantation gesture, then placed 
his finger onto his forehead. Instantly, golden light erupted from the top of his head, transforming 
into a golden lion. An expression of avarice appeared on Xuan Fang’s face, and he began to laugh.

“I can’t believe it’s THAT bridge.... I’ll take it!” The golden lion was a sliver of Xuan Fang’s 
psyche, and as it flew out, it began to swirl around the Paragon Bridge, attempting to use the power 
of a Paragon to sever the connection between it and Meng Hao.

Meng Hao had no time to try to stabilize the connection. It was a critical moment of deadly crisis, 
but Meng Hao was confident that as long as he himself didn’t die, the bridge couldn’t be taken away 
from him. Even as Xuan Fang was backing up, Meng Hao suddenly teleported back into the spell 
formation in the middle of the sun. There, he performed an incantation gesture and pointed out, 
causing scintillating light to swirl out from the sun.

Shockingly, he had already been fighting with Paragon Xuan Fang for more than ten breaths of 
time, which meant that the sunlight arrow could once again be unleashed. Rumbling sounds could 
be heard as intense light shot toward Paragon Xuan Fang. Because of how close he was, that light 
landed on him almost instantly.

It stabbed into his forehead, causing Xuan Fang to shudder and then cough up a mouthful of blood. 
His energy waned slightly, and although he wasn’t dead, a grievous wound could be seen on his 
forehead, which immediately began to heal up.

It only took a moment of analysis on Meng Hao’s part to come to the conclusion that Xuan Fang 
hadn’t come out unharmed. He was clearly using some sort of secret magic to suppress the 
harmfulness of the wound. In the future, he might suffer an incredible backlash because of that, but 
at the moment, his battle prowess was not decreased at all because of the wound.

“Dammit!” thought Meng Hao, his face darkening. At the same time, Xuan Fang gave a sinister 
laugh and charged toward Meng Hao. As he closed in, he waved his hand, causing a golden sea to 
spread out in all directions, then bash toward Meng Hao within the spell formation.



“Don’t even mention that quarter hour. You won’t even last long enough to fire another of those 
light arrows.”

Paragon Sea Dream was outside of the mist, her face pale as she realized that Xuan Fang was 
completely intent on killing Meng Hao. Even she didn’t believe that Meng Hao could last an entire 
quarter of an hour against him....

It was actually just as Xuan Fang had said. Meng Hao couldn’t hold out for that long, even if he... 
sacrificed the 100,000 cultivators to buy time.

“Xuan Fang!” Sea Dream roared, battering anxiously at the mist. At the same time, the divine sense 
which Meng Hao had sent to drive the Eegoo puppet was slowly fading. The puppet was already 
becoming sluggish, and it wouldn’t be long before the divine sense completely faded away. Then 
the puppet... would lose most of its battle prowess, and be left only with its basic instincts.

If that were all there were to it, it might not be a big deal. However, the Outsider army on the other 
side of the shield was getting stirred up, and was now trying to break through. At the same time, the 
cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm were completely shocked by what was happening with 
the sun.

Even more relevant was that, in the 6th Heaven outside of the Mountain and Sea Realm, a cold 
laugh rang out, which belonged to none other than the second Paragon.

If he didn’t understand how to take advantage of the opportunity Paragon Xuan Fang had created, 
then he didn’t deserve to be a Paragon himself. As he stepped out from the 6th Heaven into the 
starry sky, no one could see what he looked like, as he was covered by a rippling field of darkness. 
He looked coldly out at the Mountain and Sea Realm, and the shield, then at the battlefield that was 
the sun.

His lips twisted into a cold smile, and a merciless cruelty radiated out from him. He did not speak, 
but instead raised his right hand and performed an incantation gesture. Instantly, the rippling 
darkness around him twisted and distorted, then began to expand outward. Clearly, he was using all 
his power.

The aura of a Paragon erupted out from him as... the land mass that was the 2nd Heaven began to 
vibrate.



It suddenly began to move, as though some giant, invisible hand had grabbed it, and was sending 
it... hurtling toward the barrier protecting the Mountain and Sea Realm!

The sight of an entire land mass smashing toward the Mountain and Sea Realm’s shield was 
something that provoked shock on the part of both the Mountain and Sea Realm cultivators and the 
Outsiders.

Most nervous of all were the Outsiders from the 2nd Heaven itself. However, they didn’t dare to 
give voice to such feelings, and could only watch as the land mass, which had already been 
smashed by the tempest earlier, suddenly began to crush toward the Mountain and Sea Realm’s 
shield.

It seemed to be moving slowly, but the truth was that the power it contained was enough to shake 
Heaven and Earth!

As of this moment, the cultivators of the Mountain and Sea Realm were now witnessing... what a 
Paragon truly was!

A Paragon was a person who could influence the tide of an entire battle. They could use an entire 
massive land mass like a weapon to unleash unimaginably destructive power. In fact, were it not for 
certain limitations, a Paragon might even use the starry sky itself in that way.

The land mass that was the 2nd Heaven was the smallest among the five land masses present, but it 
was still difficult to put into words exactly how large it was. Even the mere pressure exuding from it 
was enough to shatter the starry sky. Instantly, the Mountain and Sea Realm’s shield began to show 
signs of buckling.

Ksitigarbha’s face was ashen, but he threw his head back and laughed uproariously. At the same 
time, he produced a medicinal pill bottle. After a moment of hesitation, he popped the contents into 
his mouth, and then his cultivation base exploded with power. Blue veins popped out on his face, 
and a vicious-looking green horn suddenly protruded from the top of his head.

His skin began to change color, turning green, and he grew to a size of 300 meters tall. His Daoist 
robe was shredded to pieces as his energy rocketed up. As of this moment, his energy was no longer 
that of a cultivator, but was instead that of... a Demon!

He lifted his right hand and then slapped it down onto the ground, using his life force, using 
everything he had, to fight against the incoming 2nd Heaven land mass.



The 100,000 cultivators on the moon all smiled bitterly as they also delivered up their life forces, 
their cultivation bases, their souls, pouring them into the spell formation to assist Ksitigarbha, to 
assist the Mountain and Sea Realm, to fight back against the enemy!

As of this moment, the sun and the moon were both in situations of deadly crisis. Moments ago, the 
Mountain and Sea Realm had held the upper hand, but now, it was the opposite. All of that was 
thanks to... Xuan Fang!!

Of the 33 Heavens’ five Paragons, Xuan Fang’s cultivation base was not the highest. However, in 
this critical moment in the war, the 33 Heavens had sent him, and were clearly intensely confident 
that under his leadership, the five Heavens’ worth of Outsiders could shake the Mountain and Sea 
Realm. At the very least... they could easily cause the fighting to last for a year.

Back on the sun, Xuan Fang was laughing. He took a step forward toward Meng Hao, who was still 
in the spell formation, and said, “There’s no harm in revealing my true plan now. My true goal is 
not Eegoo, or the sun, and not even you. Instead... it is something I haven’t spared a glance at this 
entire time... your moon!”

The surrounding cultivators were coughing up blood, and yet none of them abandoned their posts. 
Just like the cultivators on the moon, they unleashed their cultivation bases and their life forces. 
Even if they died, they would buy time for Meng Hao.

They would bear the brunt of Xuan Fang’s Paragon power to help Meng Hao.

Chapter 1360: Six Hexes Combine!

[/expand]

100,000 individuals were all thinking the same thing. Their life forces connected to the spell 
formation, and their souls thrummed with unyielding ardor. Their cultivation base power made them 
as one, as they fought together to protect Meng Hao.

Xuan Fang laughed coldly, then stomped his foot down. Instantly, everything began to shake 
violently, and an intense rumbling sound could be heard as the 100,000 cultivators coughed up 
mouthfuls of blood.

Meng Hao was in the middle of the spell formation, mind reeling. He couldn’t simply sit there and 
ignore what was happening. He knew that he wasn’t a match for a Paragon, and also knew that all 



he had to do was close his eyes and wait for enough time to pass. If enough time was bought it 
might be possible... to hold out for that full quarter hour until the mist dispersed.

At that time, he might be able to make it out alive!

However... Meng Hao did not choose to wait. Performing an incantation gesture, he ceased to draw 
upon the power of the sun. If he continued to do so in his current state, it would deplete the life 
forces of the 100,000 cultivators even faster than before, which was something he wouldn’t do.

He strode forward, leaving the spell formation and heading toward Xuan Fang, who laughed loudly, 
eyes shining with scorn. He had actually been worried that Meng Hao would hole up, which would 
have been a waste of his time.

As soon as Meng Hao took action, Xuan Fang suddenly vanished, and then re-appeared right in 
front of him. Then, he raised his right hand, sending power slamming into Meng Hao that he 
couldn’t possibly defend against. Meng Hao instantly staggered backward, blood spraying out of his 
mouth.

“Crown Prince!!”

“Crown Prince!!!” The cries of the 100,000 cultivators rang out in anguish.

As Meng Hao hovered there, his Green Emperor’s Eternal Incantation worked constantly to prevent 
his body from collapsing. However, under the pressure of a Paragon, he couldn’t hold out for very 
long, and besides, his wounds had already reached a critical level.

Once again, Xuan Fang closed in, raising his right hand high, killing intent flickering in his eyes as 
he grabbed at Meng Hao’s head.

“Just die, would you!?”

Even as Xuan Fang reached out to grab him, Meng Hao performed an incantation gesture with his 
right hand and then waved his finger.

Demon Sealing, Eighth Hex!



However, in the same moment that the Hexing magic was unleashed, and Xuan Fang stopped in 
place, the magic was shattered. The backlash slammed into Meng Hao, causing blood to spray out 
of his mouth. Even though it seemed as if he were staggering backward, suddenly, Time rippled in 
front of Meng Hao. Everything changed, causing a look of shock to appear on Xuan Fang’s face. 
His eyes widened as Meng Hao suddenly vanished, then reappeared behind him.

Xuan Fang turned and lunged toward him, but ended up passing right through Meng Hao, as if he 
were nothing more than a shadow.

“Time!” Xuan Fang’s eyes once again widened.

This was not some trivial change in time, but rather, contained the power of time travel. Apparently, 
Meng Hao had appeared several breaths of time before, right behind Xuan Fang!

This was none other than the strange time-walking technique that Meng Hao had learned from the 
black-robed Slaughter. When he reappeared, he was still directly behind Xuan Fang, and suddenly, 
his right hand transformed. Shockingly... the Battle Weapon appeared, which he raised high above 
his head as he took a step forward, seemingly walking from the past back into the present!

A shocking blade then slashed down!

Xuan Fang had no time to dodge. The blade slashed from the past into the present, making it 
impossible to evade. For the first time, a sensation of crisis filled Xuan Fang’s mind. Although it 
wasn’t a situation of deadly crisis, it was still something very rare for him to experience.

Rumbling could be heard echoing out in all directions as a bright flash of light descended onto 
Paragon Xuan Fang. Although he couldn’t completely dodge, he managed to move slightly, 
ensuring that the blow didn’t land on his forehead, but rather on his left shoulder!

A boom echoed out, and blood splashed as Paragon Xuan Fang’s left arm was completely severed. 
Xuan Fang fell back at top speed, face ashen, eyes flickering with killing intent toward Meng Hao. 
In the next instant, his severed arm exploded, transforming into a sea of golden blood which then 
swept out toward Meng Hao.

Meng Hao trembled; he had already sustained serious injuries, and now he was coughing up more 
blood. His consciousness was starting to fade, and he was laughing bitterly. And yet, an unyielding 



gleam flared up in his eyes, and he sprang into motion, ignoring the damage he sustained in the 
process.

In the instant in which he burst into motion, Paragon Xuan Fang’s right hand flashed with an 
incantation gesture, and stabbed out viciously with his finger, causing a long golden blade to appear. 
The blade slashed out with ferocious speed, and before Meng Hao could even react, the meat jelly 
flew out and blocked the blade.

A miserable shriek rang out as the meat jelly was sent flying back, clearly weakened. However, it 
didn’t return to the bag of holding, but instead started to drag Meng Hao back into the spell 
formation.

“You’re not going anywhere!” Paragon Xuan Fang said, his voice sinister and cold. All he had left 
was his right arm, which he stretched out toward Meng Hao. As he extended his fingers, Essence 
power erupted out.

Five Essences rumbled out, swirling together. Moments later, a sixth Essence appeared, and then a 
seventh. With the addition of the Essence of Time, the enormous hand that had been created was 
filled with completely unpredictable power. Once this hand was unleashed... it was certain to strike 
its target!

Meng Hao’s face was deathly pale. In this critical moment, he shoved the meat jelly away, then 
suddenly reached his right hand out toward the incoming hand, toward Xuan Fang, then pointed his 
finger!

Demon Sealing, Eighth Hex!

Rumbling sounds could be heard as the huge hand ground to a halt. However, it only lasted for a 
moment before it lurched into motion again. As a result, blood sprayed out of Meng Hao’s mouth 
because of the intense backlash. That was one of the reasons he had hesitated to use the Hexing 
magic before. If he tried to use it to tie up a Paragon, not only would he fail, he would also end up 
hurting himself.

When he had fought Eegoo, Choumen Tai had been in the process of enslaving him, which meant 
that the Hexing magic was possible to use. But now he was fighting a full Paragon, and it wasn’t 
that his Hexing magic had a problem, but rather...



“My cultivation base is too low!” Meng Hao laughed bitterly and gritted his teeth. As the hand 
closed in on him, he unleashed his Essence of Divine Flame, then performed an incantation gesture 
with his right hand and waved his finger multiple times.

“Demon Sealing, Seventh Hex!

“Sixth Hex!

“Fifth Hex!

“Third Hex!

“Second Hex!”

If he was going to risk his life, then he might as well go all out. His eyes gleamed with madness as 
he unleashed all of his Hexing magic. Everything shook violently, and Xuan Fang frowned as the qi 
around him was thrown into chaos, and a profoundly disturbing sensation rose up.

Meng Hao was trembling, and his body was collapsing into a bloody mass because of the backlash 
from the Demon Sealing Hexing magic. What he really wanted to do was use the Seal the Heavens 
Incantation, but that relied on the power of the Mountains and Seas and, considering that he was 
now isolated and cut off, it had thus failed when he tried it.

Instead, he had to risk death to... combine his Demon Sealing Hexing magics into one attack!

Combining nine Hexes was the ultimate transformation a Demon Sealer could perform. But right 
now, Meng Hao only had mastery of six Hexes. He was missing the First Hex and the Fourth, and 
had yet to create his own Ninth Hex.

However, there was nothing else he could do at the moment. More than half of the quarter hour had 
passed, but that meant that half of that amount of time still remained. He simply couldn’t hold on 
any longer. Meng Hao threw his head back and howled, pushing with all the power he had. His 
flesh and blood exploded, his bones shattered, all in his effort to fuse his Hexing magics together.

Massive rumbling sounds echoed out, and everyone on the sun was filled with shock. Xuan Fang 
gasped in astonishment at the sudden drastic transformations!



As of this moment, the entire Mountain and Sea Realm was trembling. The hosts of cultivators out 
in the starry sky were shocked, and the Outsiders were shaking. Even the Paragon from the 6th 
Heaven was astounded.

Sea Dream, and everyone else present, felt themselves trembling.

In sharp contrast was Shui Dongliu, who stood on Planet South Heaven, looking anxiously in Meng 
Hao’s direction. His eyes were filled with concern, and even... turmoil!

Massive energy was rising up from the sun. Meng Hao shook violently as, all of a sudden, a sphere 
of light appeared in front of him. The light was in chaos, as six powers swirled around therein. It 
almost seemed as if that sphere of light were thinking, as if it wanted to give birth to some new 
entity.

The intense pressure caused Paragon Xuan Fang’s face to flicker, and for the first time, he felt a 
sensation of deadly crisis. Without the slightest hesitation, he began to speed backward.

Even as he fell back, Meng Hao unleashed all the power he could muster, drawing upon even his 
life force, to push the turbid sphere of light forward. He was trembling, his flesh was being 
shredded to pieces, revealing his bones, which then shattered.

Rumbling could be heard as the sphere was pushed fully away from him. However, he was now 
completely drained of power. Even as he collapsed, the meat jelly scooped him up and carried him 
back inside the spell formation.

At the same time, the sphere of light shot toward Xuan Fang. As it closed in, Xuan Fang screamed. 
A sensation of deadly crisis overwhelmed him, and he suddenly began to grow in size. In the blink 
of an eye, he was 30,000 meters tall. Then, he instantly shrank back down, turning into a shocking 
golden lion.

His eyes flickered with the gleam of augury, as he drew upon his life force to unleash a magical 
technique that he hoped would help him identify the weakness in the magic he faced.

Death!



Death!

Death....

Xuan Fang’s face was a mass of shock and terror. In a very short time, he performed more than ten 
thousand augury calculations, but no matter how he analyzed it, the end result was always the same. 
Death!

“This is impossible! Just what type of divine ability is this!?” Xuan Fang was trembling as he fell 
back further. Unfortunately for him, the surrounding mist, which he had put in place to trap Meng 
Hao, now left him trapped!

“Incomplete! It’s an incomplete magic! That means I have a chance. He must have injured his soul 
to use it. Clearly this is a Dao in the midst of percolating, which he is drawing upon early!

“Until he completes the Daoist magic later, it won’t matter if he survives this day, he won’t be able 
to use it again until then!!” Xuan Fang’s eyes flickered.

“I still have a chance, and that is... in the shadows of Time!!”

Roaring, his body flickered into motion as he unleashed his Dao of Time with all the power he 
could. His body turned blurry, and in the blink of an eye, his Undying Soul appeared.

“I have lived for tens upon tens of thousands of years. Perhaps I have no hope of getting eight 
Essences, but even still, I have the ability to leave behind a soul at the end of every sixty-year-cycle. 
This is the ultimate magic of Time. Unless you destroy each and every one of those souls of mine, 
then you can never destroy my true soul!” Xuan Fang’s eyes were bright red. This was a magic he 
would only use if he had no other choice, if his life were truly in great danger!

This was a life-saving magic that he could use... only once in his life!

As of this moment, he was pushed to his very limit. If he didn’t use the magic now, then he would 
die beyond the shadow of a doubt.
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