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"Tinsley, you're back!" Rory exclaimed and pulled Tinsley into her villa happily. 

Tinsley nodded her head to Rory, "Mhm. I'm here to hear your story. How's it 
with Onyx?" Tinsley asked 

Rory, who became downcasted immediately after hearing Tinsley's question. 

"There's nothing between us. I told you we had broken up. Go in and see your 
cuties." She nudged and 

pushed Tinsley into the living room, switching the topic. 

Tinsley noticed her actions of switching the topic, "Mhm. We'll talk when I've 
seen the little kids." 

Tinsley uttered and entered the living room. 

Ariel was designing something on her pad while Jason and Mason were 
playing games. Tinsley smiled 

and stared at the peaceful little kids from a distance. 

"Mom." Jason was the first person to notice Tinsley's arrival, and he quickly 
jumped at Tinsley. Mason 

and Ariel were alerted as well, and they ran toward Tinsley, jumping on her 
altogether. 

"You miss mom?" Tinsley asked them with a carefree smile and hugged them 
closely. 

They wrapped their hands around Tinsley's neck and placed their head on her 
shoulder and chest. 

"Mom is not fair. You left us alone." Mason replied with a tearful expression. 

"I'm sorry, babies." Tinsley rubbed their head and led them to a sofa. 

"Where's dad?" Jason and Ariel asked Tinsley when they didn't see Jarek. 

"I'm here," Jarek replied and walked into the living room. 



"Dad." They quickly jumped down from Tinsley and ran to Jarek. "My little 
men." Jarek ruffled Jason 

and Mason's hair while he carried Ariel. "My little princess." 

Jason and Mason lifted their hands and Jarek threw them up in the air, which 
caused them to be 

excited and request more of it. 

Rory stared at the happy family with envy. She also wanted such warmth, but 
it seems that it may 

never happen in her lifetime. 

"Miss, Master Onyx is here again." A guard informed her, which made her 
expression change. 

"Don't let him in." She roared to the guard and immediately entered the living 
room. 

Ever since that incident, a persistent Onyx has always come to her house 
early in the morning with the 

hope of seeing her. And leaving late in the night, and whenever he saw her 
car, he'd follow her 

immediately. 

Seeing the kids busy with their dad, Tinsley stood up and pulled a reluctant 
Rory for an explanation. 

Unaware of what's happening. 

Tinsley immediately pulled Rory into the room and closed the door, "So, 
what's up with Onyx? Didn't he 

come to find you or were you the one to kick him out?" Tinsley stood arm 
akimbo and stared at Rory 

fixedly. 

"I don't know." She muttered quietly which made Tinsley stare at her in 
disbelief. 

"I don't believe Onyx is that type of guy. It's either you kicked him out when he 
came or you refused to 

meet him." Tinsley remarked, which made Rory roll her eyes. 



"We have nothing to do with each other, why would he be following me around 
if he's not a pervert?" 

Rory mumbled with a scoff which made Tinsley sigh. 

"Rory when I returned to Ryle with the kids. You repeatedly tried to make me 
introduce them to Jarek 

and introduced Jarek to them and when I refused you resulted in scheming 
us, right?" Tinsley said 

while staring at Rory intently. 

"You knew?" Rory asked with disbelief. She never expected that Tinsley knew 
about her telling the kids 

to tell Tinsley to take them to the set. 

"I figured it out," Tinsley replied with a shrug and sat on the soft bed. "You 
wanted me to find my 

happiness, but why do you keep running away from yours? Agreeing with 
Jarek was the best decision I 

ever made. I now have a happy life, a happy family, and a supportive 
husband, and it was all because 

of you." Tinsley said while watching Rory. 

Hearing Tinsley's words made Rory's face fall the more as she thought about 
the things between her 

and Onyx. 

Rory was first attracted to Onyx by his handsome and masculine appearance, 
and she began to crush 

on him like many of the females in the company. 

Even when she had heard several rumors mentioning how cold he was, and 
how he cruelly rejected 

many girls. It had never stopped her from getting attracted to him. 

Until that day, they both met in the elevator. "Rory, I want to pursue you." He 
said straightforwardly, 

which made her heart pound. 

And he was true to his word, he had repeatedly tried to pursue her. Now 
everything was just a memory 



she was trying to ease from her brain. 

"Why don't you sit down and talk about it with Onyx? I know you loved him." 
Tinsley advised her. 

Rory's fist clenched her clothes. "But he's a leader of the underworld. Did you 
know what that meant? 

His life and our family life will be sought by danger. Tinsley you know I valued 
peaceful life, I don't want 

something like that." She explained with a distressed sigh. 

"He's been with you for a few days and interacting with you for longer, did 
danger seek you those 

times? No! That means he knew how to protect you and your family in his own 
ways from danger." 

Tinsley explained, which made her shake her head. 

"I can't. Tinsley, I can't." She replied and hugged Tinsley with tears in her 
eyes. 

"Jarek told me that if one doesn't go to the enemies, the enemies will come to 
one just like Lillee and I, 

remember?" Tinsley tried to change her mind, but Rory only shook her head 
to explain that she 

couldn't. 

"Sigh!" Tinsley sighed while staring at Rory expressionlessly. "Jarek told me 
that Onyx had been 

betrothed ever since he was young, but he decided to break his engagement 
after meeting you. I heard 

that his parents had been pressuring him that if he didn't bring you back today, 
he'll be getting married 

to that person tonight..." 

Rory was stunned by Tinsley's explanation, "What did you say?" Rory 
separated from Tinsley in 

disbelief. 

Tinsley shrugged and nodded her head, "Mmm. Jarek will be taking me to the 
party tonight, since they 



were friends he can't do without going and as his wife, I'll be going with him 
also." Tinsley explained 

which made Rory begin to pale. "I heard the girl had grown up with him, and 
she had sworn that no one 

can marry Onyx but her," Tinsley said while feigning a female voice. 
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Rory flared up in anger. "Nonsense! He belonged to me." She remarked, 
which made Tinsley stare at 

her expressionlessly. 

"Uh! Wait. You said you have nothing to do with him." Tinsley squinted at 
Rory, who glared at her 

immediately. 

"Well, I've checked out the girl. More like we met during vacation and I can 
see that she loved Onyx so 

much, and she'd definitely take care of him after marrying him, so you don't 
have to worry about him 

following you around like a pervert. Not only that, she had a good character. 
She's a 10 out of 10. 

Perfect!" Tinsley clapped which made an angry Rory smack her angrily. 

"I'm your friend, who are you backing? Let me tell you, there's no way he's 
getting married. No way! I 

can't accept it." Rory stood up angrily. "He's mine. How dare he marry 
someone else?" 

Tinsley pretended to scratch her hair, "But. Didn't you break up with him 
because of the danger that 

came with..." 

"Who cares about that? I only want my Onyx." Rory roared angrily and quickly 
ran out of the mansion 

hoping to see Onyx. 



Rory can't help but become self-aware by Tinsley's words. Now what she had 
in mind was not to lose 

him. She finally realized that nothing compares to being with him. No matter 
how much danger lies on 

the ground, as long as she has him, she has the belief that they'll conquer it. 

Rory's eyes fell when she got out of the house. Onyx had left, and his car was 
nowhere to be found. 

And it made her tremble in disbelief; she thought that he had left to have a 
wedding with someone else 

besides her. 

Tinsley was stunned by Rory's action of running out of the house, but she 
quickly followed after Rory 

and when she arrived, she met Rory red-eyed while staring at a distance. 

Rory pointed at a distance with tears streaming down her eyes, "Onyx has 
always stayed here every 

day from morning to evening with the hope to see me but he had left now, 
does that mean that he had 

left me for her?" She cried out with tears streaming down her eyes with 
Tinsley patting her back with a 

sigh. 

"No, I didn't leave. I'll always be here for you." Onyx shouted from a distance 
which made Rory part 

from Tinsley with disbelief. 

"Onyx." Rory ran to Onyx's figure in the distance and jumped on him with 
happiness. "Onyx. You can't 

wed anyone except me." She warned him and hugged him tightly. 

"Hm. I won't." He replied with a happy smile and hugged her tightly. 

Rory grabbed his shoulder, "I'm ready. Let's go. Take me back to your family. 
Don't marry anyone. I'll 

marry you whenever you want. Just don't marry that girl." Rory stared at him 
determinedly which made 

him stare back at her in confusion. 



"I wasn't going to marry anyone." He replied to her with a coaxing smile that 
he was using to hide his 

regret. Had he known this was how it was going to turn out, he'd have 
prepared and proposed to her 

immediately. 

Rory was stunned and stared at Onyx in disbelief. "You mean you're not 
betrothed to a girl that you'll be 

having a wedding with today?" Rory stared at him in disbelief. 

But Onyx shook his head firmly, "No," he replied, which caused Rory to glare 
at the smiling Tinsley 

angrily. She wanted to get down from Onyx, but his hand locked on her waist 
firmly to prevent her from 

escaping again. 

Rory immediately glared at the approaching Tinsley, "Tinsley. You're a 
scheming vixen." She yelled 

angrily and in embarrassment. To think that she had yelled that she'd like to 
get married. Tinsley is so 

evil! 

Tinsley harrumphed deviously and sinisterly, "Hm, you schemed at me back 
then, this is my 

repayment." She held her head high proudly. 

"You devious bitch!" 

"You stupid hoe," Tinsley replied with a grin. She turned to stare at Onyx. 
"Baby," She called Onyx after 

seeing that the jealous Jarek wasn't present. "Don't dare hurt my friend or 
else... Kacha!" She 

squeezed her hand in the air to imitate that she'd break his balls if he dared to. 

Onyx kissed Rory's face and smiled at Tinsley knowing that she was behind 
Rory accepting them 

again, "Thank you." 

_____ 



Tinsley became very busy after she arrived at Ryle because the shooting was 
nearing its end, and 

they'll be starting promotion and marketing which involves visiting many states 
and some neighboring 

countries to do so. 

*** 

Despite that billionaire's deed was also coming to an end, Lillee was the 
happiest because she had 

three upcoming events in her life, one of it is getting married to Conrad, the 
second is destroying 

Tinsley after Lillee's wedding and the third is receiving the best acting award. 

Even though she was very busy she can't do without flaunting her upcoming 
wedding daily to receive 

envy of them, every one. 

Lillee even flaunts Conrad coming to the crew to support her and her movies 
which left many fans 

parading her comment happily. 

Conrad was a famous actor before he had to go on a break due to taking over 
Norton's family 

billionaire company and doing so had left many fans dissatisfied, so seeing 
Lillee posting about Conrad 

sent her fans skyrocketing. 

*** 

Three days before Lillee's wedding, Tinsley finally returned home from the 
shoot. Jarek had already 

collected the dress from Tinsley which she fell in love with immediately. She 
can't help smiling upon 

thinking about all that would happen on that day. "Hubby, you have it ready, 
right?" 
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The wedding of Conrad Norton and Lillee William had been famously known 
as one that would be 

breaking a record no one would be setting soon. 

Many famous reporters of reputable companies were said to be invited to 
Lillee's wedding while the 

wedding would also be shown on live by many reputable media companies, 
Lillee and Conrad's social 

media pages. 

The wedding will certainly be the talk of the century. There were many 
prominent people invited to the 

party which included politicians, businessmen, stars which included 
foreigners, etc. 

Tinsley was woken at dawn to get prepared for the day. Top famous 
hairdressers, make-up artists, etc. 

had been invited to style and make her up. The day before that day Jarek had 
taken her out to an 

expensive spa to undergo body wash, facial wash, massage, etc. 

Tinsley's skin was smooth and glowing like a baby which had attracted Jarek 
repeatedly and made her 

have a sleepless night in the first quarter of the night. 

"Miss, your skin looks so smooth and beautiful. You don't need makeup at all." 
The makeup artist 

praised Tinsley's skin with envy. 

"Thank you," Tinsley replied with a smile. 

After an hour or so, Tinsley was finally done with her hair and make-up and 
what was left was for her to 

get dressed. 

She entered the room to see Jarek talking with some foreign people on his 
phone. He cut off the call 

and froze when he saw the approaching Tinsley smiling at him. 



Tinsley walked toward him with a smile when she saw his state, "What's got 
you, President Jarek?" 

She asked while waving her hand in front of his face. 

Jarek snapped out of his state and pulled her by the wrist, which ended in her 
sitting on his lap. "I keep 

on falling for you more, wifey." He muttered helplessly while nuzzling her 
neck. 

Knowing that Jarek was planning to place hickeys on her neck again, Tinsley 
immediately shifted her 

neck away from him. 

Jarek held her face in place and began to kiss her intensely. 

Noticing the change in his body, Tinsley immediately pushed him away and 
tried to stand up, "Stop it. 

I've done my make-up." 

Jarek clamped her waist tightly, "Baby, you can do it all over again." 

"No way. I'm not sitting there again." She said and bit his hand angrily and ran 
away from him. 

Jarek chuckled when he saw the cute fingerprint on his hand. 

"Tinsley, be prepared not to sleep tonight." He says in a dark husky voice that 
made her tremble 

slightly. When he's being like this she knows that he'll definitely not let her 
sleep like he promised. 

Tinsley quickly went to hold his hand. "Hubby Jarek, you can't get angry with 
your beautiful, right?" She 

asked while batting her eyes at him cutely. 

Jarek immediately sighed, he couldn't escape her charm. "Hm..." 

"Mom. Dad. Good morning." Mason suddenly barged into the room with Jason 
and Ariel walking behind 

him 

President Jarek sighed in distress. They were back to the days when the 
children were always 

interrupting their parents' romantic time. 



"Morning babies." Tinsley bent to their level and kissed their soft cheeks, she 
was about to lean away 

when Mason suddenly wrapped his hand around her neck. "Mom is very 
beautiful. I'll marry Mom when 

I grow up." He declared. 

"Me too," Jason said which elicited a glare from the jealous Jarek. 

"Back off, she's my wife," Jarek said and pulled the two kids up by their 
collars. 

They quickly wrapped their hands around Jarek's neck with a wide grin. "Dad, 
throw us in the air." They 

demanded. 

"Is mom your wife?" Jarek asked them with a chiding glance. 

"No, Dad. Mom is our mummy." They replied which made him chuckle while 
he acted according to their 

demand. 

"Dad and Mom will be out to take you to school soon, okay?" 

"Yay!" They happily walked out of the room and shut the door with a bang 
which made Jarek massage 

his forehead. "And the kids will never learn about knocking before barging into 
an adult's room." 

"I told you." Tinsley stuck out her lips playfully before she went to the dressing 
room. 

"Jarek!" Tinsley yelled out angrily. She had chosen an armless black bustier 
lace ballroom gown with a 

leg slit for the wedding, but her domineering Jarek had changed the style in 
her absence; instead, he 

chose her a pink off-shoulder mermaid gown that was embedded with studs, 
stones, pearl, and silver 

sequins. 

"Baby," Jarek replied innocently which made her roll her eyes at him angrily. 
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"What's this?" She barged out of the dressing room angrily while holding the 
pink gown. 

"A pink dress." He replied while donning an innocent expression. 

"And that's definitely not my pick." She snapped at him angrily which made 
him take a few steps away 

from her. 

"Maybe Lucas made a mistake..." He hadn't finished his words when Tinsley 
glared at him angrily. 

"You think I'll believe that, Jarek?" She uttered angrily which made him fake a 
shiver. Why is his wife so 

scary? 

"Wife, don't be angry. No matter what you wear, you look the most beautiful in 
hubby's eyes." He 

coaxed her and placed his head on her shoulder. "Wife. Forgive hubby. Hm?" 
He continued to beg in 

an innocent voice which made her stomp his feet angrily. 

This pretender! Always secretly changing her clothes and then later 
pretending to be innocent. 

"This is certainly the last time you'll follow me to a designer." She glared at 
him before storming back 

into the dressing room. 

Tinsley broke into a smile and touched the pink gown with a grin. "So beautiful 
than the black one!" She 

thought and squealed happily before putting it on. At least he won't be letting 
her wear a long-sleeved 

turtleneck cloth this time. 

"Jarek, please help me," Tinsley yelled for him to help her wear her dress, and 
soon he entered the 

dressing room. 



Tinsley had run to the dressing room because she didn't want Jarek to mess 
with her during dressing 

but now that Jarek finally had a chance to enter, he was bedazzled by the 
beauty. 

Jarek's eyes darkened as he hungrily stared at her pale skin which was 
highlighted by the pink dress 

she wore. "Jarek, what are you... Mmmhh." 

Before Tinsley could complete her words, Jarek shut her lips with a deep kiss. 
He pressed her to the 

wall and his hand began to roam around her body. His hand suddenly pulled 
on her body, which made 

her alarmed. 

"Jarek. I swear if you don't let me be now, you won't be sleeping beside me for 
a month. I'll be with the 

triplet." She said in a harsh voice which made him sigh and depart from her 
unhappily. 

"Wife." Jarek feigned an innocent voice which made her sigh. 

"President Jarek, please help me and we'll leave for the party. We don't want 
the children to be late for 

school, also, or do we?" 

Tinsley sighed which made him patiently help her. 

"But I'll be taking it off tonight," Jarek said and walked out of the dressing 
room. 

Tinsley was about to leave in order to check the triplets when Jarek suddenly 
grabbed her hand. "Are 

you shy? You've seen it all." He flirted which made her roll her eyes. 

"Yes, boss. I'm really shy. Dress by yourself." She muttered and quickly 
walked out of the room with a 

fast-beating heart and red cheeks. 

President Jarek is really a walking temptation, she thought. 

"Mom. Mom is so beautiful." Ariel blinked in awe. Her hand reached out to 
touch Tinsley's gown, but 



she quickly placed her hand down before she could touch it. 

Tinsley took hold of Ariel's hand and placed it on her gown. "You can touch 
mom's clothes. Your hand 

won't dirty it." She said which made Ariel break into a smile. 

"It's beautiful, Mom," Ariel said in awe. 

"Baby want one?" Tinsley asked Ariel who began to play with the pearl and 
stone on the gown. 

Ariel quickly nods her head hurriedly. "Yes, mom." 

"Let's tell Dad," Tinsley said and Ariel nodded her head. 

"Mom. I'll marry you when I'm tall and richer than Dad," Mason said and 
wrapped his hand around 

Tinsley. 

"Dad is the richest." Tinsley joked. 

"I'll be richer than Dad," Jason said with determination. 

"Certainly! Mom will cheer you on." Tinsley said and kissed their forehead. 

"Let's wait for Dad in the car." 
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"Bye kids, be good at school for mom." Jarek and Tinsley waved to the little 
kids and watched them 

enter class. 

"Hungry?" Jarek asked while caressing her hair. 

"Hm. You?" She replied. The both of them didn't bother about the wedding 
that'll take place soon 

because that was their aim. 

By the time Tinsley and Jarek arrive, the wedding will have definitely begun. 

"Willing to give me?" Jarek asked her, which made her roll her eyes. 

The two went to a three-star Michelin restaurant to have their meal before 
getting into the car to begin 



an hour's journey, provided that they weren't in traffic. 

Tinsley continuously watched the live stream program while laying her head 
on Jarek's shoulder. "Lillee 

hadn't come down yet." Tinsley sighed excitedly. "Let's make it a 
coincidence." She suggested, which 

made him nod in agreement. 

"Beautiful ladies on the red carpet. I am so excited." She squealed happily 
which made him sigh while 

playing with her hair. 

*** 

The red carpet had almost come to an end when one of the most luxurious 
cars appeared at the venue. 

The reporters and the fans hanging outside were immediately thrown into a 
happy frenzy. 

They stared at the car excitedly because they knew that was Jarek's signature 
car. They stared at 

Jarek's car intently with cameras flashing and fans yelling excitedly. 

A bodyguard quickly got down from the car and opened Jarek's side of the 
car. Jarek got down from 

the car donning an expensive black tailor-made suit with a cold expression 
that gave all the fans a 

feeling that they were staring at an overbearing president. 

Jarek closed the door and turned to the other side, which made many fix their 
eyes on him excitedly 

while thinking if Jarek brought his woman to the party. 

Everyone knew that Tinsley and William's family had a feud. 

Now knowing that Tinsley had a feud, everyone was surprised to see that she 
still came to Lillee's 

wedding after all that the William family had done, and that increased Tinsley's 
love in the fans' heart. 

Jarek opened the door and what the people first saw was a smooth leg that 
broke the Livestream into 



chaos: 

'That beautiful leg. No doubt it belongs to White Tigress.' 

'I'm so eager to see White Tigress look.' 

People were sending lots of love and gifts as if that way, Tinsley would hurry 
out of the car. 

Jarek stretched out his hand to Tinsley, and she held onto his hand and came 
out of the car smiling at 

him. "Thank you." She uttered lightly and Jarek moved toward her and 
whispered into her ears, which 

made her blush and punch his chest lightly. 

The Livestream went into a loud commotion: 

'President Jarek and White Tigress are always spreading love food around.' 

'The wedding couple didn't reach their levels.' 

Massive discussions were ongoing while the oblivious Jarek and Tinsley 
confidently walked on the red 

carpet hand-in-hand. 

The two of them posed for the reporters and the fans with Tinsley enjoying 
every bit of it as if she was 

the star of the party while Jarek patiently supported her. 

"White Tigress, one question please." The reporters immediately began to 
throw, which made Tinsley 

stop in her tracks. 

"Okay, three questions only." She replied with a laugh that threw everyone 
into a massive frenzy about 

how beautiful she was. 

"We all knew that White Tigress and Actress Lillee and the William's family 
had a feud, have you got it 

settled or were you willing to congratulate the couples even though there were 
some unclear rumors 

about Actor Conrad and you?" 



Tinsley held Jarek's hand calmly, "Sorry, my hubby is a million times 
impressive, why will I be interested 

in Actor Conrad? If it was you, who would you choose? I'm not blind." She 
uttered which threw 

everyone gasping in disbelief at her daring words. 

"And as for your first question, well even if I wasn't invited, as Actress Lillee's 
younger sister, why won't 

I show my love to my elder sister?" Tinsley explained with a carefree grin that 
left everyone sighing 

about how good she was. 

The fans couldn't help but get enraged with how Conrad, Lillee, and William's 
family had invited all 

famous people to their wedding but refused to invite Tinsley, their family 
member. They all knew that it 

was definitely not a mistake, and they purposely did so yet Tinsley was still 
nice enough to show them 

love. Tinsley is so good. 

"White Tigress is putting on L&L tonight, a dress by one of the most famously 
known mysterious, 

eccentric designers in the world. How much of a friendship do you have with 
each other?" One reporter 

asked which made everyone yell in disbelief. 

Even though Lillee isn't wearing a L&L, Tinsley is rich enough to put on L&L, 
people can't help but 

evaluate Tinsley and Lillee again. 

"It's all thanks to hubby," Tinsley said while holding Jarek's hand. 

"Last question..." 

"It's enough," Jarek replied coldly and immediately pulled Tinsley away from 
the reporters' questions. 

He knew that if he didn't do that, they were likely to continue till the end of the 
wedding. 



The bodyguards was very shocked to see Tinsley coming toward them with 
Jarek, but they tried to stay 

cool on remembering what Lillee told them. 

However, they were shocked when Jarek handed out an invitation card and 
Tinsley also handed out 

one. 

Two? They screamed inwardly. How's it two? 

"Can we go in?" Tinsley smirked at them. 

"Yes, you can go in. Sorry for the delay." They replied. One of the guards 
secretly tapped another to 

inform Lillee about Tinsley's entrance. 

"They were shocked," Tinsley uttered with a laugh. Lillee had done her best to 
stop her, and she had 

done so by sending Rory, Brigitta, Jarek, and the wealthy members of Taming 
Her a single invitation 

card to prevent her from tagging along with them, but what she didn't expect 
was Onyx. 

They had sent Onyx a couple's invitation card which made Rory follow Onyx 
while she gave her 

invitation card to Tinsley. 

The entrance of Jarek and Tinsley shocked many people who thought no 
more guests were coming in. 

Unfortunately, it was also a coincidence with Lillee and Conrad's entry at the 
opposite door but Tinsley 

and Jarek's entrance caught people's eyes more than Conrad and Lillee's 
entrance. 

Tinsley smiled sweetly and waved, which sent people watching the 
Livestream into an excited frenzy. 

Even the cameraman had all continuously taken shots of Tinsley and Jarek 
only for a while to pass 

before they remembered that they should be taking Conrad and Lillee's 
instead. 



Lillee gritted her teeth, but she tried hard to restrain herself from glaring at 
Tinsley. She couldn't help 

wondering how Tinsley was able to come in after she had done many things 
to prevent her from doing 

so. 

 


