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Chapter 391: Acting Big

It was the truth that she got in through the back door. She got the audition through the back door, 
and she could also get the part through there.

Su Cha did not care what people were discussing. Amid the crowd’s noise, she found a seat after 
collecting a number plate and continued studying the script she had already read yesterday.

“Your name is Su Cha?”

Suddenly, a deep voice sounded. Su Cha raised her head and saw a handsome man in front of her. 
His appearance was suited for the entertainment industry.

The man had a pair of amorous eyes. Unexpectedly, Su Cha thought of Tan Yezhu, who also had 
amorous eyes.

Even though this was the first time they’d met, she could instantly kill the man in front of her.

The other party’s appearance was not bad, but his temperament was not good. Just like Zi You back 
then, he gave Su Cha a greasy feeling. Hearing his greeting, Su Cha raised her eyelids slightly. 
“Hmm?”

She’d answered lazily, and her voice sounded languid and seductive. At least, this was what the man 
heard.

He did not notice that Su Cha did not even introduce herself. He just felt that this beauty’s attitude 
was somewhat impolite.

But beauties were all like this.

The other party was also participating in the show. He was very popular even at such a young age, 
so it was natural for him to be arrogant.



He was interested. He stood in front of Su Cha and introduced himself. “I’m Zhong Xiangyang. I 
played the role of the King of the Nine Counts in a drama called ‘Meng Dian’…”

He directly said a long string of words. Su Cha waited for him to finish before she stopped looking 
up. “I haven’t seen it, I don’t know about it.”

Zhong Xiangyang: “…”

He felt a little awkward.

Many people saw him walking towards Su Cha in front of everyone.

They could not help but laugh when they saw Zhong Xiangyang being humiliated.

Zhong Xiangyang was not considered famous in the industry. It was just that some people in the 
industry knew about him. Where audiences were concerned, he was not famous at all. He only 
played a bunch of No. 1 supporting roles. Even if people could not name those roles, he could at 
least use them as capital.

This kind of capital, one can treat as work experience after one’s become famous. But if one does 
not become popular, it brands one as a side dish, never the main course.

Who would care about such a person?

“I think my acting is not bad. I don’t know what role you’re auditioning for, Su Cha, but if there’s 
anything you don’t understand, you can consult me. I’m your senior in the entertainment industry. I 
can give you some pointers.”

Zhong Xiangyang had found a topic to talk about and ran with it. Su Cha finally raised her eyes to 
look at him again. Zhong Xiangyang felt a chill down his spine. “I don’t know you.”

Su Cha was already being very polite while in public.

Normally, she would have already asked the person in front of her to scram.



Her words were so obvious that those who were smart would just leave.

Zhong Xiangyang could tell what Su Cha was implying and his face stiffened.

He was a good-looking man. It was rare for girls to be so straightforward with him.

Besides, the other party had not even entered the entertainment industry yet, but she did not respect 
her senior at all.

However, in this industry, seniority was dependent on the status of both people. No one cared about 
people like them who were not popular.

Zhong Xiangyang had no choice but to retreat. He thought to himself that he would definitely 
spread some rumors about Su Cha’s bad temper and disrespect of her seniors.

The others could not help but laugh when they saw Zhong Xiangyang’s dejected look.

Some people thought that Su Cha had personality, but some felt that Su Cha was rude and 
disrespectful to the seniors in the industry. She had not become famous yet, but even now she was 
acting like a big shot. Who knew how many more people she would offend?

Chapter 392: The Same Woman as Tan Yezhu

Han Yongbing was personally holding the auditions. This director was famous in the industry for 
not having a good temper, but he was not a bad person. He was simply very serious when dealing 
with work.

The performers who did not pass were quickly eliminated. Su Cha waited for a few hours, and in 
the long queue, her turn was about to come.

Most of the actors came out of the audition room with gloomy faces.

Even if some of them did not look that bad, it was hard to tell how good they usually looked.

There were almost no actors who’d received confirmation.



When it was Su Cha’s turn, she heard the staff calling her number.

Su Cha stood up and walked towards the audition room.

The door opened and the people inside were shocked.

The girl who entered could at least be considered pretty.

Su Cha was learning how to apply makeup, and today, she had not applied a heavy one. Not only 
was she more or less bare-faced, but she’d also put on a light and elegant nude makeup that was 
based on the character she was auditioning for.

At least, she looked a little delicate.

The director, Han Yongbing, sat in the middle with a serious expression on his face. If an actress 
who did not know the truth had walked in, she would think that the director had something against 
her. She would not help but feel nervous, but Su Cha’s expression never changed.

When she came in, she bowed slightly to the directors who were seated. “Hello, directors. I am Su 
Cha.”

It was a simple and straightforward introduction. She did not introduce herself to the panel in such a 
long-winded manner. After hearing the others talk so much nonsense, everyone was shocked.

A pretty girl had a special privilege. Moreover, this girl was not an ordinary girl. Her strong aura 
could make people pay attention to her. Han Yongbing relaxed slightly when he witnessed her polite 
and simple introduction.

The assistant director looked at the information and whispered to the director, “She was 
recommended by a friend. She is currently participating in the talent show Dreams in Progress. She 
is already in the Top 20 in the country.”

Han Yongbing frowned.



The assistant director felt awkward. He had wanted to introduce Su Cha as a friend, but why did it 
seem like he had said something wrong?

However, Su Cha did not notice them. After raising her head, she quickly scanned the room. When 
she saw someone there, she blinked twice and suspected that she was seeing things.

Sitting next to Han Yongbing was a stunning woman in a white dress.

She was truly peerless.

Her temperament was charming and gorgeous, but it did not seem tacky. Her amorous eyes were 
especially charming.

She sat on the stool with her body slightly tilted. Past the table in front of her, one could see a pair 
of long legs hidden within a gauze dress. Her entire person seemed to have a hazy aura, giving off a 
seductive beauty.

She and Su Cha were two completely different types of beauties. Not only was this woman top-
notch in appearance, but her temperament was also unparalleled. She was definitely stunning.

But Su Cha felt that she might be blind.

The more she looked, the more she felt that this woman resembled Bo Muyi’s brother, Tan Yezhu.

Seeing the look in Su Cha’s eyes, the beauty suddenly covered her mouth and smiled. Her fingers 
were slender and long, and so beautiful that one could not tell whether they’re a man’s or a 
woman’s. It seemed it wasn’t just her coquettish smile that she was covering…

Su Cha suddenly shivered.

Chapter 393: Wonderful Act

“You’re auditioning for the role of Chao Yun, correct?”

The assistant director had had no choice but to break the silence.



Su Cha forced back the goosebumps on her body and smiled. “Yes.”

The assistant director extended a hand. “We don’t have any requests. This role is relatively simple. 
You can first perform how you imagine Chao Yun to be.”

Su Cha nodded and did not say anything else. She glanced at the beauty and started to prepare.

The beauty smiled again.

Her smile could make one’s soul fall out. This made Han Yongbing, who was next to her, take 
another look. It seemed a little strange.

Su Cha restrained her aura and thought about Chao Yun in the script. Suddenly, her expression 
changed.

As sad as a cloud, Chao Yun found out that her life savior had fallen into a treacherous situation in 
the court, so she swore to give up everything for her life savior.

“When the benefactor saved my life back then, I returned the favor with a drop of water. No matter 
what, I cannot hope to repay such a great favor, but I am willing to give up everything for the 
benefactor in this lifetime. Whatever the benefactor says, I will do.”

Chao Yun, who had just entered the palace, was originally kind and innocent. After all, a girl who 
could remember her savior could not be bad.

It was just that the palace was treacherous and complicated. The master she had been following was 
unfortunately being targeted by someone. She had been through ups and downs for a while before 
she met her savior. She remembered the kindness she had been shown in the past and experienced 
the cruelty of today. The girl who was only 16 years old was no longer as calm as an ordinary girl.

But deep down, she was still the pure girl from a remote mountain village. Chao Yun.

And Chao Yun was just a name given by her master.



Her real name…

As if someone was playing with Su Cha in front of her, she suddenly showed a sad and beautiful 
expression that was neither crying nor laughing.

Then, the void gently intruded. “Benefactor, you still remember my name. I will never forget this 
kindness.”

Su Cha thought that this performance was not bad. It was not that she suddenly had amazing acting 
skills, but this segment had the same emotions as her struggles in the palace. They were both 
equally helpless.

She had perfectly portrayed Chao Yun’s helplessness and kindness in her heart, but she still did not 
want to be one with the role.

To put it bluntly, she had found only her shadow in the role of Chao Yun.

But this segment was quite surprising.

Even Han Yongbing’s expression softened. It was already a pleasant surprise that he did not 
interrupt.

The assistant director was also amazed. He did not expect the girl recommended by a friend to be so 
surprising.

The only difficult part of the role of Chao Yun was that she had an innocent temperament. After 
entering the palace, she had to be mature and experienced. It was not easy to find an actress who fit 
that. If one just looked at the plot, it did not seem difficult.

But Su Cha’s interpretation was quite good!

The assistant director could not help but want to say hello, but before the performance had ended, 
he did not dare to speak.



When Su Cha surfaced from the scene, her expression was calm. She no longer looked sad. 
“Directors, I’ve finished my performance.”

Han Yongbing picked up her documents from the table and said loudly, “You are still participating 
in a competition. Even before the competition ends, we won’t clash with each other when we start 
filming. But since you are participating in a singing competition, why would you want to act?”

Chapter 394: I Like You a Lot~

This question was more difficult to answer. Ordinary people would have to answer beautifully.

But Su Cha said concisely, “I came because I was interested and had a chance.”

The assistant director: “…”

What the hell, can’t you at least show a bit of love?

The beauty chuckled again. This time, her voice was low and gentle. As long as one could tell that it 
did not sound like a man’s, it was obvious that it was a female’s voice, but it also gave off a strange 
feeling.

Su Cha looked at her. In front of everyone else, there was an identity plate, but she did not have one.

For a moment, she did not know who this woman was.

One of the casting directors said to the beauty, “Miss Tan seems to be in a good mood. Could it be 
that you think this girl has acted well?”

What? Tan? Tan?

Su Cha squinted.

Noticing her expression, the beauty finally revealed her red lips. She opened her mouth gently and 
said, “Yes, I think she performed well. There were so many auditionees before her, but I’m not 
satisfied with their performance. Why don’t we just set her up? What do you think, Director Han?”



Everyone was surprised by her words.

Su Cha listened carefully to her voice. It was very soft and feminine.

She carefully observed Miss Tan’s facial features, together with the curvature in her eyes, there was 
also a hint of obliqueness…

Even if she was really gorgeous, Su Cha thought of Tan Yezhu from back then. The strange thoughts 
in her heart gradually merged. In the end, Tan Yezhu and the woman in front of her became one.

There really were such people in this world. Although she did not look feminine at all, she had a 
pretty and charming face. With just a little bit of makeup, she already became stunning.

It was just that such people usually disliked their beautiful features, but this Tan Yezhu was really 
too awesome.

Su Cha: “…”

Did Bo Muyi know that his brother was like this?

In the end, she became sure that the woman in front of her was not Tan Yezhu’s sibling but Tan 
Yezhu himself.

Although she did not know why Tan Yezhu would suddenly appear here as a woman, judging from 
Director Han and the rest’s behavior, it was impossible that they had just met.

In other words… how long had it been since Yezhu started acting as a woman?

Han Yongbing’s answer pulled Su Cha back from her train of thought. “Since Miss Tan has said as 
much, let’s do that. Su Cha, go back and prepare. This role will be yours.”

His words were swift and decisive.



Su Cha paused for a moment before she retracted her thoughts and smiled. “Thank you, Directors, 
and thank you, Miss Tan, for your support.”

Su Cha had emphasized the words “Miss Tan.”

Miss Tan smiled charmingly and said, “You’re welcome. I like you a lot. All the best!”

Even in the eyes of others, this Miss Tan was really feminine. She did not even speak or act 
inappropriately.

But Su Cha thought, This was a man…

She lit a candle for the men in the room. Su Cha smiled at them and left.

After she left, Su Cha called Bo Muyi directly.

After answering the phone, Bo Muyi sounded a little happy. “Cha Cha, the audition is over, huh?”

Basically, Su Cha would tell Bo Muyi everything she wanted to do every day, so Bo Muyi knew 
that Su Cha was auditioning right now.

Su Cha did not hide her surprise in front of him. “I saw someone who looked exactly like Tan 
Yezhu, but she was a woman.”

Bo Muyi: “…”

Chapter 395: He Is a Pervert

Bo Muyi did not speak, and his strange silence made Su Cha gasp. “Yezhu doesn’t happen to have 
siblings, does he?”

Although Bo Muyi was unhappy with Su Cha’s giving attention to other men, this matter made him 
hesitate.

“Hmm… No.”



Su Cha almost understood, and she almost wanted to laugh out loud. “How could he have such… 
Hmm, hobbies?”

She had already said it so implicitly.

Bo Muyi did not hide his disdain. “He is a pervert.”

Su Cha: “…”

For him to be described as a pervert by Bo Muyi, one could imagine how strange Tan Yezhu was.

After all, Su Cha had never seen a man like him have such a special hobby.

The main point was that Su Cha carefully recalled the scene with Tan Yezhu just now. Her graceful 
smile could not be concealed. The directors looked at her with admiration. She did not know how 
these people would feel if they knew that they liked a man.

“Where did you meet her? At the audition?”

“Yes.”

Su Cha did not expect him to appear at the audition and to have such a strange identity. “I didn’t 
expect him to be here. And he’s… Well, a woman. But I don’t know what his actual significance is.”

“An investor.”

Bo Muyi told Su Cha concisely, “That’s Yezhu’s career in the Imperial Capital.”

Su Cha suddenly understood. “No wonder.”

It was said that this film would have a very big production. It was normal for there to be investors.



With Yezhu’s status, it was normal for him to invest in such a production crew. The other part was 
just too unbelievable.

Bo Muyi’s voice was firm. “Then Cha Cha must have passed the audition.”

Su Cha raised her eyebrows. “Are you so confident in me?”

“If he doesn’t want you to live, he’s just asking for death.”

Su Cha: “…”

Is this considered a backdoor?

The main thing was that she did not expect to meet Tan Yezhu at such an audition.

As she talked to Bo Muyi on the phone, she walked out the door. However, she was stopped by 
someone. A burly man wearing sunglasses walked over and whispered, “Miss Su, Miss Tan would 
like you to wait awhile. She wants to discuss something with you.”

Su Cha glanced at the man and thought of Tan Yezhu’s female guise.

She nodded silently.

Bo Muyi also heard it from the other end of the phone. He sighed helplessly. “Cha Cha, it’s good 
that you know now. You have to get used to it sooner or later. He has had this hobby since he was 
young. He even wanted to pull me along.”

Su Cha could not help but think about that scenario. Then, she felt that it was too scary. She would 
rather that the world ended than for her to see such a scene.

“You can’t yield to him!”

She sounded anxious, afraid that Bo Muyi would go astray.



Bo Muyi chuckled. “No, he did not mention it again after I beat him up a few times.”

Su Cha suppressed her laughter and heaved a sigh of relief.

Then she thought of Tan Yezhu’s female guise and sighed. “Actually, his female self looks really 
good. As a woman, I… am a little envious…”

“Nonsense. My Cha Cha is the best. At least he will never have what you have.”

Su Cha: “…”

After a few seconds, she realized what Bo Muyi was talking about.

In the end, she could not hold it in and smiled. “There’s nothing impossible nowadays with 
advanced technology.”

Bo Muyi thought about it and agreed with Su Cha’s suggestion. “That’s true. You can give him this 
suggestion.”

Su Cha: “…”
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