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"How could you?"

******

JANE.

I internationally tell his friend about my wolf, Amber. I’m sure he's going to tell his alpha about me. I am planning my revenge slowly and
will deal with him. I’m happy for Ella that she finally met her mate. My biggest worry is my ex-mate. Ella will be living with her mate in the
pack. I am so worried. Won’t he hurt her because of me? I was still thinking when my phone rang. I pick up my phone. It is my mother.

"Hello, Mom."

"Hello, baby girl." "How are you?"

I can sense the worry in my mother’s voice. What is wrong? Did she fight with my father?

"Mother, what is wrong with you? I asked her.

"Nothing , baby girl," she responded.

"Mother, something is wrong. "This is not you. You can always tell me anything. "Please, tell me what is wrong with you?

I could hear her sigh over the phone. Something is definitely worrying her, but what could that be?

"Jane, it's about your mate," she stated. "He came here searching for you. He said he is ready to accept you.

"What!" You don't mean it, mother? I ask. "How can he be so shameless?" We are no longer mates.

"I know. He's not good enough for you. Your father told him I knew your whereabouts. He threatened to kill me if I refused to tell him, "she
said.

"How dare he! Did you tell him my whereabouts? I ask. "Did he know where I was staying?

"No, I would rather die than tell him where you stay," she utters. I will never allow my daughter to have a mate like him. You will never be
happy if you are together with him.

I am blessed to have a mother like her. She always loves and always protects me. He will soon find me even if she refuses to tell him,
because Raymond knows where I am staying.

"I won't lie to you, mother. "The alpha king will soon find me because his betta knows where I stay," I respond.

"What? "but how? She asked. "How did he know where you were staying?"

Mom, do you remember Uncle Tommy's beta daughter, Ella? I ask.

"Yes, I do." that beautiful angel, "she said.

"She's Raymond's mate," I let out. "They met each other at the club, and he escorted us home. He drives us home, after all. I'm sure he'll
inform his alpha of my whereabouts.

"Don't be afraid, darling. Your mother will be here for you. "I am going to protect you from that monster," she said. I won't allow him to hurt
you.

"Thank you, mother. I'm strong enough to protect myself. I won't allow him to hurt me.

"Mother, there is something I have to tell you. I let out: "I killed someone."

"You did what? She screamed. "Who did you kill?" "Why did you commit that?

"Don't you know the implication of that? Your mate will never let you go. You know, he is the alpha king."

Mom was so worried. She never allows me to talk. She kept asking questions.

"I killed him because he was trying to molest me at the club," I told her.

"Who is he? Which pack did he belong to? She questions.

"He is an alpha. "Alpha Jason," I said in response.

My mom went silent. "Mother, are you there? Can you hear me?

"Yes, I can. "I can hear you, my daughter," she said. "I'm just thinking: what kind of trouble do we land ourselves in? This is an alpha we are
talking about, Jane. You killed an alpha?

"Mother, is that serious? I asked her. She scared me.

"This is serious, Jane’ "Who is going to protect you from being punished or being hunted down? Your ex-mate will be the judge. He will be
the one to question you." she said. "If I know this has happened, I will never treat him the way i did last night." For goodness sake, you are
my only child. I don't want to lose you.

My mother started crying. I tried to calm her down, but she's not listening.

I should never have killed him. Who is going to believe me that I was only trying to protect myself from him. If I knew this was going to
cause my family some problems, I wouldn't have killed him.

"Mother, I can protect myself," I replied. "Stop worrying yourself.

"I have to tell your father about this," she stated. "I have to inform him.

I told her, "You can do anything you like, mom."

After talking to my mother. I keep thinking about what she told me. My mother seems very frightened. Will I be killed? Will they hurt me
because I was protecting myself from him? I hate these damn werewolves' rules. It only favors the strong, not the weak. No one is going to
hunt him down if he kills me instead. I fucking hate it. I will never bow to the rules. My life, my rules.

"That's it, girl," our life , our rules, "Amber said. I never regret what you did. I am so proud of you, girl.

I was still talking to Amber when Ella and Amira rushed into my room. I jumped up. "Hey, what is wrong? Who is running after you?

"Jane, there is trouble," Amira screams. 

"What trouble are you talking about?" I ask. "Tell me."

"They are looking for you," Ella said. "Alpha tommy pack betta is looking for you. They want revenge. Blood for blood.

"I regret dragging you to the club. I brought this trouble upon you" Amira sobbed. "I caused all this that is happening.

"Don't cry, please. You caused nothing, and I didn't regret killing him. He deserves it. "I am only worrying about my family. Won't it affect
them?

"You don't understand, Jane," Amira mutters. "Your mate will be the judge. He can never favor you. You will be at his mercy ``I cause all this.
This problem should never have occurred if I hadn't dragged you to the club in the first place.

It never occurs to me that I will be at his mercy. How will I get revenge when I am in trouble myself?

"We can kill all of them," my wolf whispered. "I have the power to kill them all.

"Let’s not do that." How many of them can we kill? I stated. "Can we kill all the werewolf race?

"What are we going to do now? I think we should inform my parents? Amira suggested.

"Okay, let's do that," I utter.

I accompany them to the alpha office. We met Luna and the beta with him.

"What are you doing here, girls?" Luna asked.

"Father, Amira started." There is something you must know.

The alpha abandons what he is doing and focuses on us.

"What is that, darling? You can tell your father anything, "he said. I'm listening.

"Alpha" I let out. "I killed someone.

I saw the shock all over their faces. Luna was very shocked.

"Who did you kill, Jane?" Luna asked.

I am getting scared now. Won't it affect them as well? They have been treating me like their daughter ever since I started living here.

"I killed an alpha," I reply.

"And what? The beta cried out. "Come again, Jane, you killed an alpha?

"Yes, I met Alpha Jason at the club, and he tries to force me to sleep with him, and when I refuse, he threatens my life," I say quietly.

He deserves to die. "That bastard: the alpha slams his desk." "You did the right thing, dear.

"I'm scared," I let out.

"You are scared of what? He asked. "Why are you scared? Everyone knows he is a monster, and you did a great job by killing him. If you
didn’t kill him, you would be the one to be killed. Don't you know that? Don't be scared, darling. I promise to protect you.

My aunt hugged me, "Come here, child." "I promise to protect you. You have nothing to be worried about. Every wolf member will protect
you.

I began to cry. They promise to protect me when I am sure my father will hand me over to them to do whatever they like with me. These
people here will protect me.

"About the alpha king," the alpha stated. "We will explain how it happened to him. I know he is a reasonable man. He won’t judge you. You
did a good thing.

I guess the alpha never knew him well. That's why he is saying he is reasonable. Who is reasonable? That piece of trash. I'm worried he is
going to sentence me to death along with my loved ones.

I smiled and thanked him.

"Is that why you are worried? Don't be worried about that. We got you, "the beta said.

We left the alpha office.

"Oh my goddess. I am just worried about nothing" Amira said.

"I will be able to eat now," Ella announced. Let's go get something to eat. I'm really hungry.

We left the alpha office for the kitchen.

"Nora, is there something we can eat? Amira asks the head maid.

"My princess, my ladies," she bows. Please sit. I will make some food for you.

We took our seats and started chatting. Ella never stops talking about her mate. She said he never allows her to rest since he keeps calling
and calling every minute.

"He's so cute anytime he does that," she blushes. He told me he refused to tell the Alpha King about your whereabouts. I laughed when he
told me he lied to him that you were still at the club when we were already home. I like him already.

No wonder he is unable to find me. Why is he looking for me? What did he want? Did he want me back?

"I think so," Amber said. Parker told me he was crazily searching for me. He said he wanted us back after his beta told him about me. He
wants us because of how powerful we have become.

I knew it. I know he wants something from me and that is why he is searching for me. Is he in his right sense? Did he think I was going to
accept him after he rejected me? He is full of himself.

"Don't mind him. We won't accept him no matter what, "she said. He didn't deserve us. We only have to accept his rejection when next we
see him and then start looking for our second chance mate.

"I agree with you woffy. We will do just that.

My ears hurt. She didn't have any other topic to talk about except her mate. 

"My ladies, the food is ready," Nora mumbles.

"Thank you," we said together before we began to eat.

"Mmm," I grumbled. It tastes good.

"You can say that again,'' Amira wails. It's so delicious. Thank you, Nora, for making this delicious food.

After we finish our food. We went up to Amira's room.

Ella never stops talking about Raymond. I wish he was here to take her away.

"Can you stop talking about this mate of yours?" Amira yells.

I guess I am not the only one who finds it annoying.

"Whattttt!!!’ Ella screamed. The Alpha king is what? The king is on his way here.
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