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There He Is Again, My Ex-Husband

Chapter 19 She's Had Enough

Nina has been filming in Riverside City recently. That day when

Emelia went to visit her scriptwriting teacher Kelaina Salkowski
and checked on Nina by the way.

No scriptwriter can write a play independently in one step.
Emelia has been studying under Kelaina Salkowski since being
introduced to the field by Nina. She wrote the outline of the script
for two years, and then wrote parts of the scene. And then slowly

began to write a specified unit independently.

Since having been married with Julian, Emelia began to do this in

private.

Fortunately, this job did not require attendance every day, so she

could be a conscientious Mrs. Hughes at that time, and she could

also pursue her own little hobbies.

This time when Viggo gave her this play, Emelia felt that she still

couldn’t handle this huge responsibility alone. She suggested
Viggo to ask Kelaina to be the lead scriptwriter, and she could

continue to work under her teacher.

But they both agreed that she had four years of experience and
was good enough to be an independent scriptwriter.



Their recognition and encouragement gave her a lot of confidence,
and Kelaina also said that if she had any questions, she could
always ask her for advice.

This was the time, and she could visit Nina by the way, and feed

Nina some delicacies made by herself.
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Chapter 20 Annoying as Always

Emelia didn’t want to pay attention to Caroline, so she tasted the

coffee she brought with Nina elegantly.

Although she didn’t wish to cause trouble, it didn’t mean that

Caroline wouldn’t bother her.

Seeing that Emelia ignored her completely, Caroline stood with

her hands on her hips in front of the table where Emelia and Nina
were sitting, and started dig at Emelia, “Oh, it seems like some

people have become deaf after going abroad for a year?”

Caroline was used to being superior in front of Emelia, and saying
bad words. Besides, she completely forgot that Emelia had

nothing to do with her after the divorce and naturally Emelia
would not tolerate her any longer.

Emelia sat steadily on her seat, looked up at Caroline and said

indifferently, “I seem to have changed, but Ms. Hughes hasn’t
changed at all.”



Emelia stared at her arrogant face and said calmly, “Annoying as
always.”

“Damn…” Caroline was used to Emelia’s tolerance. She didn’t
expect Emelia to come up and scold her without mercy.

She also scolded her in front of so many people in the crew,
making her look bad.

Caroline was so embarrassed and angry that the look on her face
was distorted, and out of control, she raised the coffee in her

hand and poured it on Emelia.
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Chapter 21 Apologizing to Emelia

Hearing Julian’s voice, Caroline immediately ran to him and said

with tears, “Brother, that bitch splashed coffee on my face!”

Emelia had experienced such a thing as a thief posing as judge
many times before.

She didn’t expect Julian to say anything for her, only whispered

to Nina, “I am going to the washroom first.”

Emelia didn’t want to stay there and continue arguing. Although
she was splashed with coffee, she also splashed it back, so they

were even.

What she needed was to treat the injury on her wrist. A cool flush

would help a lot.



Nina couldn’t bear to be insulted by Caroline, so she retorted

indignantly, “Miss Hughes, why didn't you tell your brother that

you splashed the coffee at Emelia first, and the coffee that you

splashed was hot?”

Nina grabbed Emelia and showed her arms to Caroline. she said
angrily, “Emelia’s arm has been burned like this, how can you

have the nerve to say that?”

“If things go to the worst, your face will be spoiled!”, Nina said
through gritted teeth.
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Chapter 22 Thought He Was Acting

In fact, people around them had all realized there was something

between Julian and Emelia, but no one dared say anything more.

After beat Caroline in argument, Nina just waited and saw the

Julian’s deflated expression after being rejected by Emelia and
Caroline’s glare. Watching her brother help his ex-wife, who she

had always despised and bullied, Caroline must be fuming in her

heart.

Kellan, who had been watching on the side, whispered to Emelia,
“Emelia, I think you’d better go to the hospital first.”

Emelia felt embarrassed and said, “Teacher, I was gonna ask you
some questions...”



Kelaina Salkowski was a top screenwriter, always busy. Emelia

managed to have a chance to make an appointment with Kelaina
and didn’t want to give it up.

Kelaina comforted her: “It’s all right. Go to the hospital first. We

can talk later.”

Emelia had such a good relationship with Kelaina, which was a

jaw-dropping fact to Caroline.

Who did she think she is? She even wanted to butter up Kelaina

Salkowski?
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Chapter 23 Unconcerned, Heartless and

Ruthless

Emelia didn’t want to face Julian ’s unaccountably angry look at
all. Anyway, she had made it clear, so she didn’t stay any longer

and turned to leave.

Julian pulled her back in anger and pressed her against the car
indignantly. The distance between them was so close that they

could smell the scent of each other, familiar and yet strange.

When they looked each other closely, Julian froze.

Emelia was really a beautiful woman, all her features were just in
such a perfect harmony.



She wore make up today, making her look more attractive than

usual with the help of eyeline.

Julian didn’t know what’s wrong with him. When they weren’t

divorced, he always looked at her with disparagement. He hated
her very much especially when he thought of her scheming
against him. Unexpectedly, after a year of divorce, he now thinks

she has a thrilling charm.

Compared with Julian, Emelia was calm, and her frown showed

her impatience.

“Mr. Hughes, what are you doing now? I’m afraid it’s not

appropriate for you to press your ex-wife like this.”, she said
with a glint of mockery. Hearing that, Julian suddenly recovered

and looked embarrassed. He opened the door and stuffed her into

the car, “Get in!”

Chapter 24 One-Hundred Dollar Bill

Emelia’s disregard made Julian very angry.

Her temper grew much worse after divorce that she dared not
answer him.

Had she even lost the basic manners?

Besides, apart from their relationship before, wasn't she afraid he

would make trouble for her?

With his rank and his power, he can make her not to established

herself in this society.



Well.

She was really a person who has never worked hard in society.
She didn’t even understand the basic rules of survival in the
workplace.

With such a character, she will have to suffer a lot in the future.

Chapter 25 He's Screwed

“Dude, what happened?”

Arthur glanced at the one-hundred dollars bill, and felt an

impulse to laugh, but due to Julian ’s gloomy look, he held back.

Julian gritted his teeth, took out the one-hundred dollars bill, and
left Arthur ’s office without saying a word.

Arthur immediately called Ezra, “Guess who Julian just brought

to my hospital?”

Ezra replied two words to him without suspense: “Emelia.”

“How do you know that?” Arthur asked in surprise, “Do you

know that Emelia has come back?”

Ezra said lazily, “Yes, I did, I has seen her roasting Julian and

making him completely speechless.

Arthur immediately burst into laugh, and then told Ezra the scene
of Emelia giving money to Julian.



After hearing this, Ezra gloated and said, “I’m afraid a similar

situation will occur all the time in the future.”

Chapter 26 She's Not Worthy

“What did you say? Your brother helped Emelia Jones?” Yvonne

asked Caroline incredulously.

Let alone the indifferent attitude of Julian towards Emelia during
their three-year marriage. It’s more than enough for Julian to

hate Emelia when Emelia made Julian so awkward during the
divorce.

How could he still help Emelia?

Yvonne didn't believe it.

“Yes.” Caroline cried and told Yvonne everything between her

and Emelia.

After speaking, Caroline accused Julian angrily, “If you have any

idea, please tell me how could my brother treat me like this? He

and Emelia are both divorced and he still protects her. What is

this situation!”

Caroline only cared about her own feelings, completely unaware

of how embarrassing Yvonne was when she heard her word. Not
to mention that Yvonne was now Julian's fiancée.

Yvonne took a deep breath to calm herself down, and then try to

relaxed Caroline while regaining some dignity for herself,
“Caroline, your brother may not be protecting her.”
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Chapter 27 She Has A Glamorous Career

After Emelia went abroad, she learned from Nina that Yvonne

was not pregnant at all, and that the pregnancy report was forged
by Yvonne in order to destroy her relationship with Julian.

Emelia didn't hate Yvonne much even after learning about

Yvonne's dirty move. Because even without Yvonne's pregnancy,
she and Julian would not be able to continue their relationship.

Julian didn't love her, and this was the root reason of her giving

up completely.

Emelia didn't tell Julian about Yvonne’s scheme. And all these

tricks made no difference after they had divorced.

Emelia found it ironic that Julian kept saying that Emelia was
setting him up and that she was insidious. But his "first true love"
didn't appear to be anything better, didn't she?

Seeing that she was so calm, Nina couldn't help but teased her,
“Although you don't own Julian anymore, what if Julian pesters

you?”

Emelia seemed to have heard some big joke, and said to Nina

while laughing, “Oh, our super star Nina Sanchez. Have your IQ
gotten low because you are busy acting all day? Why would he

pester me?”



Emelia couldn’t imagine Julian pestering her. Julian hated her so

much, and he was such a cocky guy.
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Chapter 28 Isn't he really letting go?

The assistant David Brennan on the side saw that Julian hadn't
spoken for a long time, and that his face was rather grim, so
David took the initiative to say, “I didn't expect Ms. Hughes to
be…”

But he soon realized his mistake and quickly corrected himself,
“Miss Jones turned out to be the screenwriter Wintry Frost. If you
don't want to hire her, I will contact Mr. Johansen immediately.”

David has been with Julian for many years, and he know very

well how much Julian was sick of Emelia.

Although David thought Emelia was much easier to get along
with than Yvonne, it's none of his concern about the relationships
between the three.

But he didn’t expect Julian to stop him, “No need.”

David paused in surprise. He thought Julian didn’t want to see

Emelia at all. If Emelia became their screenwriter, they would

have to meet her more frequently.

Julian explained, “Since Mr. Johansen strongly recommended

her, of course we have to believe in her ability. Besides, business
was business, there’s nothing personal.”



The implication was that he was aware of personal stuff and
business. He would not kick her out of this project because of his

personal prejudice against Emelia.

Chapter 29 Emelia Didn't Show Up

At nine o'clock the next morning, in the meeting room of Tymers

Entertainment.

This is the first formal meeting of the period drama project
Princess Leilania. It stood to reason that all important people

from investors to directors and screenwriters should attend.

Especially the screenwriter. She was the protagonist today. She
needed to introduce the outline and overall direction of the script
to every big guy.

When Julian and Yvonne appeared together, Viggo Johansen

raised his eyebrows and then stood up to welcome them.

He especially expressed his welcome to Yvonne. Viggo's words
seemed be implying something, “Miss Sullivan is also interested

in this show, right?”

Yvonne held Julian' arm, her exquisite bloomed a graceful smile,
“I am semi-retired, and there won’t be any chance for me. I am
just here to accompany Julian.”

Yvonne looked around the meeting room as he spoke, trying to

find Emelia.



Viggo glanced at Yvonne without saying anything. He then
turned around and invited the two to sit down.

There He Is Again, My Ex-Husband

Chapter 30 Surrounded by Glamorous Actors

Viggo knew the reason, but he didn't tell Julian. He did this on

purpose. He wanted to find out what Julian thought about his

ex-wife Emelia.

After Viggo dropped his words, Julian looked into Viggo's eyes
pensively.

As the boss of Emelia, if she couldn’t make it to such an

important meeting, she must give Viggo an explanation. It was
impossible for Viggo not to know the reason.

But Viggo deliberately didn't tell him, what is his purpose?

Not only do women have the sixth sense, men do too.

Julian feels that Viggo's purpose on Emelia were not simple.

Viggo was a pivotal figure in the entertainment industry. When

he was young, he debuted as a singer and later he transformed

into an actor. From TV drama series to movies, he went all the
way up and her career were loaded with awards.
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