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Chapter 321 All over the heart

Yun Chang's face darkened.

Since when did I like fighting?

I am a girl!

girls! ! !

My character is a cute, gentle and kind beautiful girl!

Not a woman!

Facing Bai Yancheng's expectant eyes, Yunshang puffed her cheeks and asked imposingly, "Are 
there any popsicles in the military area?"

"No..." Thinking of the old lady saying that Yunshang likes to drink sugar water, Bai Yancheng 
continued to coax Yunshang, "Daddy can put some sugar for you, and make sugar water for you 
when we arrive at the military area."

Yun Chang immediately turned her head to the side, showing a small look of disgust, and in front of 
Bai Yancheng, reached into her pocket with her small hand, and took out five liqueur chocolates.

"Now I like to eat chocolate and don't like to drink sugar water."

After finishing speaking, under Bai Yancheng's surprised eyes, he stuffed Lin Wenlan and the three 
brothers and sisters of the Bai family with a piece of chocolate, and stuffed the last piece of 
chocolate into his own mouth.

Bai Yancheng: "..." The whole family has it, but mine?

Why is the little girl's film even skinnier than that bastard in Qingming?



It's... so cute!

It's just that this chocolate is a high-end product, and it can only be bought at the Friendship Store in 
the capital. Where did this girl get it?

And it's five in one shot, and it doesn't feel distressed, it's even richer than him as an old man.

Bai Yancheng gasped, and asked curiously and depressedly, "Xiaoqi... Yunshang, where did you get 
this chocolate? Why do you have so many?"

He is the commander of the military region, and his monthly salary plus allowance is about 300 
yuan. This kind of bill, the family is really not short of money to spend.

But chocolate is not something that can be bought with money.

Without the overseas remittance voucher, no matter how rich he is, even if he is the commander of 
the military region, the Friendship Store will still not sell his account.

Lin Wenlan also came over and squatted beside Yunshang, looked at Yunshang's bulging cheeks, 
and asked softly, "Shangnan, tell mom quietly, who gave you this chocolate?"

"Second brother Gu gave it."

Yun Shang said vaguely, took the chocolate that Lin Wenlan was reluctant to eat, peeled off the 
outer skin three times, and stuffed it into Lin Wenlan's mouth, "I'll eat it for you. When I went back 
to Shenshi, the third grandpa gave me a lot of overseas remittances." Coupons, Second Brother Gu 
bought me chocolates."

The couple knew that the third grandpa that Yunshang was talking about belonged to the Gu family, 
and their hearts were relieved immediately.

It's just that Bai Yancheng watched the whole family eating chocolate with gusto, and he was the 
only one who didn't, so he felt a little uncomfortable.



He is an old man, and he loves the little girl very much, but why doesn't this baby give him good 
looks?

Giving chocolates to the whole family, but he was the only one left out.

Although he didn't like eating sweet things, the little girl asked him anyway, which made him feel at 
ease.

Seeing Bai Yancheng look at her with more and more aggrieved eyes, Yunshang pulled her small 
army bag from the sofa, and amidst Lin Wenlan's snickering, took out a small can of tea that had not 
been packaged.

Bai Yancheng was overjoyed, and reached out to take it, but Yunshang took a few steps back with 
the tea, raised her chin and said, "I'm a girl, please be gentle, you said I like to fight, and you still 
want to take me I am not happy to go to the military area to watch other people fight!"

Bai Yancheng: "..." But I see that you beat up Xiaoliuzi very neatly, you are not as fierce and tough 
as a girl, how gentle is it?

Bai Qingming: "..." Xiao Qi is too shameless!

You obviously like to bully me,

He likes to beat me up without admitting that he likes to fight.

Bai Yancheng was stunned for a while, but he could see it.

Yun Shang hit him with chocolate first, and then negotiated terms with him with tea, trying to 
completely dispel his desire to train her.

Seeing that Yun Shang is really lazy, all his heart and mind are used to negotiate conditions with 
him, and he is unwilling to go to the army with him, Bai Yancheng is completely out of control.

If the cow doesn't drink water, it can't force its head down.



Besides, with Lin Wenlan around, he didn't dare to throw his son directly into the army to practice 
like he did to teach Bai Qingming, so he could only temporarily dispel his small thoughts.

Lin Wenlan swallowed the chocolate in her mouth, and stared, "Do you still want to be like Xun 
Qingzheng Qingming?"

"No!" Bai Yancheng quickly shook his head in denial, "I just want to take Xiaoqi to the military 
area to make Lao Liang and the others greedy. Our daughter is a little hero who catches the enemy! 
A five-year-old little hero! A child in the military area, Which one is better than our little seven?"

"Hurry up and go to work! Why do you use my Xiao Qi as a face?" Lin Wenlan threw the small pot 
of tea in Yunshang's hand to Bai Yancheng, and dragged her into the house, "Xiao Qi can't go out 
with you today, the surrounding Everyone in the family knows that Xiaoqi is back, and the family 
will appoint someone to come later."

Bai Yancheng didn't dare to argue with Lin Wenlan, so he opened the tea pot and sniffed it, then put 
the lid on immediately, turned around and walked into the house.

"What are you going to do again?" Lin Wenlan glanced at the time and asked in surprise.

Bai Yancheng put the tea pot back into the study, said with a straight face, "This is the tea my 
daughter gave me, I have to keep it and drink it slowly, but I can't take it out and let those big 
bosses spoil it."

Yun Shang: "..." Cheap Dad! Where is the face?

He obviously thinks the quality of the tea is too good and he is reluctant to give it to others, so why 
use me as a cover.

When Bai Yancheng went out, the three youngest children in the family went to school one by one 
with their schoolbags on their backs. Lin Wenlan sent Aunt Wu out to buy groceries, while she 
dragged Yunshang upstairs, putting on a long conversation.

"Shangnan, Mom has something to ask you..."



Yun Chang stared at Lin Wenlan with round eyes, and looked at Lin Wenlan with a confused 
expression, "What's the matter?" It just so happens that I also have something to tell you.

"Shangnan, your Grandma Yun said that the house in Fenyang was bought for you by an aunt you 
know in the province. Why do you say it was bought for you in that year? Also, the aunt you 
know...from time to time with you looks alike?"

Knowing about Lin Dani from the mouths of the old couple in the Yun family, and knowing that Lin 
Dani and Yun Shang look very similar, Lin Wenlan had a guess in his heart.

It's just that at that time, she and Bai Yancheng were all focused on recognizing Yun Shang, and 
they didn't have the energy or time to inquire about Lin Dani carefully with Yun Shang and Gu 
Shinian.

Now that Yunshang has returned to the Bai family, and has adapted well and quickly integrated into 
the entire Bai family, Lin Wenlan is relieved, and finally can find out about Lin Wenlan's affairs.

Yun Shang was thinking about how to tell Lin Wenlan about Lin Dani, but she didn't expect Lin 
Wenlan to speak first. Immediately, he was shocked, and carefully explained Gu Shinian's concerns 
when he bought her a house, as well as Lin Dani's situation.

"...I just thought Aunt Lin was pretty. Brother Gu said that Aunt Lin looked a lot like me, and that 
we both picked them up. Maybe Aunt Lin is really my own aunt."

Chapter 322 Madam Diplomacy

Lin Wenlan was stunned when she heard Yun Shang say that Lin Dani was good-looking, and when 
she said, 'Gu Shinian thinks she looks like Lin Dani'.

Although Yunshang is emphasizing that Lin Dani looks very similar to her, Lin Wenlan always feels 
that Yunshang is going around in circles to praise her for her good looks.

This realization made Lin Wenlan a little bit more amused while being excited, and also a little bit 
emotional.

She really didn't expect that her Xiaoqi would be so open-minded and bright after suffering, just 
like a bud in early spring, immature but full of vitality.



The haze that appeared in her life was as illusory as the dark clouds in the sky. When the wind 
blows, the blue sky and clear sunlight will reappear, making people's mood brighten.

Seeing Yun Shang's narcissistic little expression, Lin Wenlan couldn't help laughing out loud, 
touched Yun Shang's smooth and tender face, and echoed her words, "My Xiao Qi is pretty, and she 
will definitely be better than my mother when she grows up." Even better."

Yun Chang's eyes lit up, and she immediately pretended to be embarrassed and said humbly, "I'm 
still young, so I can't tell if I'm good-looking or not. But my sister is very good-looking now, and 
she looks very similar to my mother."

Since Lin Wenlan praised her for being good-looking, out of politeness, she had to compliment her 
back anyway, not only for Lin Wenlan's good-looking, but also for Bai Qingyue who had shown 
kindness to her.

Lin Wenlan couldn't help laughing anymore, pulled Yunshang over, and kissed her loudly on the 
forehead.

What a treasure she is!

After the two mothers and daughters boasted about business, they also unknowingly finished their 
business while laughing.

Knowing Lin Dani's life experience, Lin Wenlan's guess was a little certain, and just about to go 
downstairs to make a phone call, Aunt Wu came to the door with a vegetable basket and brought a 
few guests.

Walking in the front, the woman with a bright smile and a neat short hair asked loudly as soon as 
she entered the door, "Wen Lan, this is your Xiaoqi? She looks so handsome!"

While talking, he threw half a catty of cakes in his hand on the coffee table, turned around and 
pulled Yun Shang and did not let go.

"Wen Lan, you know that my family is full of brats, and you're only greedy for other people's girls. 
Let's make an agreement, Xiaoqi must be a goddaughter to me!"



Yun Chang didn't know who came here, and she had never been hugged so warmly by a stranger. 
For a while, her hands and feet were so stiff that she didn't know how to let go, so she had to wink 
at Lin Wenlan frequently for help.

Lin Wenlan received Yunshang's call for help, pulled Yunshang out of the woman's arms in a funny 
way, and refused jokingly, "I'm so greedy, I will try to give birth to one myself! My Xiaoqi just 
came back, and I kissed her sweetly and kissed her." The fragrance is not enough, so I can't give it 
to you!"

"As for the donkey face of my old Liang, I dare not give birth to a girl. If I give birth to a girl with 
the face of Lao Liang, I will smash my hand!"

The woman responded, and everyone in the room burst into laughter.

Lin Wenlan smiled and beckoned everyone to sit down on the sofa, and pulled Yunshang to 
introduce, "This is my Xiaoqi, whose name is Yunshang, and everyone will take better care of them 
when we meet in the yard."

As he spoke, he pointed to a few people sitting on the sofa and introduced Yun Shang one by one.

It was only then that Yunshang knew that the women sitting on the sofa were all family members of 
the top leaders of the military region, and they were all from Bai Yancheng's faction.

Especially the one who wanted to recognize Yunshang as his goddaughter. The man was the deputy 
commander of the military region. In the circle of wives, the right to speak was second only to Lin 
Wenlan.

When everyone was talking, Yun Chang observed carefully and roughly understood that this was 
the so-called lady diplomacy.

Several women don't have deep friendship with each other, just because of the relationship between 
men,

Everyone has developed a 'friendship' with each other, but this kind of friendship born of interests is 
not strong. Several people can share the same hatred when they are external, and they can also tear 
each other down internally.



Fortunately, Bai Yancheng is the top leader of the military region, and Lin Wenlan also has her own 
job. She manages dozens of people in the art troupe under her command. Her status and aura are far 
from those of these unemployed housewives.

Lin Wenlan disdains, and has no time to play tricks with these people, and everyone will be cautious 
in front of Lin Wenlan, and they don't dare to involve Lin Wenlan in the occasional verbal dispute.

"Wen Lan, why did I hear from my old Liang that you plan to take Xiaoqi to the capital? When are 
you going to go?"

"In a few days. It's already May, and there are many things in the regiment, so we have to make 
arrangements before leaving."

"I have to go back. Xiaoqi finally came back. I have to take the child to identify the door."

"That's right. I see that Xiao Qi is so white and clean, she doesn't look like a child who grew up in 
the village. This is considered a good family. If she meets a bad embryo, Xiao Qi doesn't know what 
to suffer. "

"That's also Xiao Qi's cleverness. Take a look, this eyebrow looks so much like Captain Lin. How 
can such a handsome girl have the heart to treat her child harshly, anyway, I can't bear it."

"I don't believe this. It's not that there are no girls in your family, and I haven't seen how kind you 
are to your girls..."

...

After the few people finally left, Yunshang let out a long sigh of relief like a little adult, which made 
Lin Wenlan smirk endlessly.

"Shangnan, don't you like to eat dumplings? Aunt Wu bought a piece of beef in the morning and 
will make beef dumplings for you at noon?"



Yun Chang's eyes lit up, and she slobbered and asked, "Is it delicious? Are there any delicious pork 
dumplings?"

She hasn't eaten beef dumplings yet, but I heard that there is a dumpling restaurant in the provincial 
capital, and the beef dumplings they make are truly outstanding. Gu Shi brought her to the 
provincial capital twice a year ago, and she didn't touch it twice. It sells beef dumplings.

In the morning, Yunshang was thinking of urging Bai Qingzheng to take her to the dumpling 
restaurant to try her luck, but Aunt Wu brought back a piece of beef.

Lin Wenlan put away the teacups on the coffee table, and took Yunshang to the kitchen, "It's 
delicious. The beef dumplings made by Aunt Wu are not worse than those sold outside. You'll know 
when you eat them later."

Yun Chang nodded happily, and stood at the door of the kitchen, watching Aunt Wu swinging the 
kitchen knife into an afterimage, she was so shocked that she couldn't close her mouth.

Aunt Wu's knife skills are comparable to the special effects in the later God of Cooking movies, it's 
really amazing.

Lin Wenlan went out to make a phone call, went back to the kitchen to find the basin, and pulled 
Yunshang, who was afraid to approach Aunt Wu, and the mother and daughter started kneading the 
dough together, laughing and laughing.

When the two finally quarreled and reconciled the noodles, Aunt Wu had already mixed the 
dumpling stuffing and made two cold dishes.

Back in the kitchen, Aunt Wu couldn't help laughing when she saw Lin Wenlan, who was dignified 
and reserved on weekdays, was covered in flour, like Yun Shang, and her whole body was painted 
like a tabby cat.

It's great that Xiaoqi is back. The family finally gained popularity, and head Lin finally let go of the 
cold and hard shell and became like an ordinary mother.

Chapter 323 Shameless

As the top leader of the military region, Bai Yancheng has a special supply of fifteen catties of fine 
grains every month, half of which is divided between rice and white flour. For three adults, the Bai 
family's monthly food is not enough.



It's just over halfway through May, and there are only three catties of rice left in the Bai family's 
fine grains, and the white noodles have been scoured by today's dumpling.

Although the old lady brought Yun Shang the only fine grains left in the Yun family, Lin Wenlan 
had no intention of buying these fine grains, but handed the grains to Aunt Wu for storage, and 
planned to leave it to Yun Shang to start a small stove.

Yun Shang looked at the empty flour bag in Bai's house, and a large bag of dried sweet potatoes and 
yellow rice noodles next to her, and the corner of her mouth twitched unconsciously several times.

Did she join a foodie family?

The coarse grains were piled up to the point of overflowing, but the supply of fine grains was 
exhausted in the middle of the day. If a guest came to the house, the dignified commander’s family 
couldn’t even bring out the fine grains for the guests, so they were not afraid to spread the word and 
make people talk about it. ?

Yun Shang sighed, threw the flour bowl with only a handful of white flour into the bag, wiped the 
flour off her hands, and left the kitchen with a droopy face.

Alas, I am so sad.

In the past at Lao Yun's house, she could use the guise of Gu Shinian to buy fine grains from the 
house to fill the stomachs of the whole family, but when she arrived at Bai's house, how could she 
take out the whole grain?

And those sweet fruits and juicy vegetables, even Bai Yancheng might not be able to get them, who 
should she turn to as a cover?

Seeing Yun Shang coming out of the kitchen with a sigh, Lin Wenlan wrapped the last dumpling 
and put it down, looking at Yun Shang very curiously.

"Our family doesn't have white noodles to eat." Yun Shang said with her mouth drooping.



Lin Wenlan and Aunt Wu couldn't help being overjoyed, pointing to the small urn outside the 
kitchen and said, "Don't worry, Aunt Wu put away your white-faced mothers for you, and your little 
belly won't lose."

"Then what do you eat?" Yun Chang asked puzzled.

"There are yellow rice noodles and dried sweet potatoes. When the fine grains come out next 
month, our family will be able to eat fine grains again. Don't worry, we won't be hungry."

Therefore, the tradition of the Bai family is to eat fine grains in the first half of each month and 
coarse grains in the second half of the month?

Yun Chang was dumbfounded and worried about her belly.

Since she came to this world, she really hasn't eaten coarse grains a few times. If she has to eat 
coarse grains for half a month every month, won't her stomach suffer along with it?

Besides, she has returned to the Bai family and has become a member of the Bai family. She can't 
let the Bai family have two kinds of food, eat fine grains by herself, and watch the whole family eat 
coarse grains, right?

No, we have to get fine grains!

Be sure to get fine grains for the family!

Yun Shang hadn't thought of a way to get fine grains yet, the three brothers and sisters of the Bai 
family came back from school first, Aunt Wu had just entered the kitchen to make dumplings, and 
Bai Yancheng also entered the house talking loudly to others.

"...Old Liang! Are you still shameless? You came to my house for a little tea, and spread the word to 
let other soldiers think of you as the deputy commander of the military region?"

Thinking of the small handful of tea leaves that he brought to the office in the morning, half of 
which was taken away by Liang Xusheng with a shameless face, and now he chased him home to 
mix tea with him, Bai Yancheng wanted to kick this rascal out.



Liang Xusheng is five years older than Bai Yancheng. The two were comrades-in-arms in the same 
company at the beginning. They lived and died together on the line of fire many times. Later, Bai 
Yancheng stepped up to the position of commander of the military region. His old comrade-in-arms 
gave him a hand, transferred him from other places to the Linyang Military Region, and slowly 
pushed him to take the position of deputy commander.

It can be said that there is a relationship between Liang Xusheng and Bai Yancheng that can be 
entrusted to each other.

Even less polite when getting along.

Liang Xusheng was smiling so much that his mouth almost reached his ears, holding the tea mug, 
he drank a sip of the fragrant tea happily, and chattered with Bai Yancheng, "I said Bai Yancheng, 
you are the commander, why? Can you talk nonsense with a grin? I obviously came to see my 
daughter-in-law, who came for the tea?"

"That's my daughter! I want my daughter to let your mother-in-law give birth!" Bai Yancheng said 
something to Liang Xusheng, entered the door, pulled Yunshang and shook it in front of Liang 
Xusheng, "Hey, this is my Xiaoqi, five years old My little hero! Now that you’ve seen it, go back 
quickly, lest your mother-in-law look for you again.”

As Bai Yancheng said, he was about to push Liang Xusheng out of the door. Liang Xusheng put the 
tea mug on the ground, and got into the room from under Bai Yancheng's arm:

"Bai Yancheng, why are you so stingy? Is this how you treat your old comrades in arms? No, you 
just talked nonsense and slandered me for being greedy for your tea. I got angry, and you have to 
give me an explanation! Don't go!"

Liang Xusheng sat down on the sofa aggressively, waved at Yunshang, took out the bills in his 
pocket, and stuffed them into Yunshang's hands without even counting them.

"Take it! This is a gift from Uncle Liang to our little hero!"

Yun Shang was holding a lot of colorful bills, thinking that Liang Xusheng's wife had come to give 
her half a catty of special cakes in the morning, and she didn't know whether she should accept the 
money, so she hurriedly looked at Bai Yancheng for help.



"See what your dad is doing? Uncle Liang gave it to you, not your dad! Put it away, don't look at his 
ugly face!"

Yun Chang was speechless for a moment, glanced at Liang Xu's long shoehorn face, and couldn't 
figure out where he got the courage to complain that Bai Yancheng was ugly.

Obviously her cheap father looks very powerful and good-looking, how ugly is it?

Liang Xusheng is blatantly jealous!

Yun Chang turned her head and saw Bai Yancheng nodding lightly, she immediately understood, 
stuffed a large amount of money into her pocket, and thanked Liang Xusheng sweetly, "Thank you, 
Uncle Liang."

This handful of money was worth thirty or forty yuan. Seeing that Liang Xusheng was generous 
enough, Yunshang decided to forgive him for complaining that his family was cheap and ugly.

Bai Yancheng hung his hat behind the door, walked over and kicked Liang Xusheng very rudely, 
went to the study and took out a tea pot, wrapped half of it for him in front of Liang Xusheng, found 
a lunch box, and fished it for Liang Xusheng After a box full of dumplings, he pushed him out of 
the house.

Both of them had gone out, and Yun Chang heard Liang Xusheng chatting with Bai Yancheng, 
"Hey! Lao Bai, I'm only greedy for Aunt Wu's skill. This beef dumpling is really amazing! It's too 
late today, tomorrow I will Let the mother-in-law make sugar bags, and give our Xiao Qi a few 
more..."

As soon as Liang Xusheng left, the family hurriedly sat down to have lunch. Bai Qingming stuffed 
a dumpling into his mouth, and approached Yunshang thievingly, "Xiaoqi... Yunshang, how much 
did Uncle Liang give you?"

The beef dumplings made by Aunt Wu are really delicious. The skin is thin, the filling is big, and 
the meat is tender.



Seeing that Bai Qingming still wanted to ask more questions, Bai Qingyue knocked over with a 
chopstick and said:

"Ask a monthly ticket for Wen Yise!"

Chapter 324 Parent-child time

"What are you doing asking about Xiaoqi's money? Don't just lie to me about all my pocket money, 
and you want to lie to Xiaoqi's pocket money to buy delicious food?"

Bai Qingyue exposed Bai Qingming's old background, Yun Shang bluntly rolled her eyes.

It's really shameless for an older brother to cheat his younger sister's pocket money!

Seeing that Bai Yancheng and Lin Wenlan's faces darkened, Yun Chang quickly raised her face and 
said loudly, "Brother, don't worry, I won't eat popsicles or drink soda anymore, I'll save all the 
money for you flower!"

Bai Qingming looked at Yun Shang in horror, and every cell in his body expressed his rejection: 
No! I still want to live a few more years, you keep your own flowers!

Things like dividing pocket money can obviously be done in private, so why put it on the table?

Under the unkind eyes of his parents, Bai Qingming shrank his neck, and then he didn't even dare to 
lift his head, and he took the dumplings into his mouth with big mouthfuls.

Woohoo, that's terrible!

The new younger sister has a dark belly, she is obviously reluctant to spend money on me, and she 
deliberately said this in front of the whole family, she wants the family to form a group to scold 
him!

Bai Qingming ate a meal with trepidation, even the fresh and fragrant beef dumplings tasted waxy 
in his mouth.

After finally finishing the meal, Bai Qingming was about to rush out with his schoolbag on his 
back, but saw his mother change into a neat military uniform, and Yun Chang, who also changed 



into a new skirt, went downstairs, and the two mother and daughter went out hand in hand Visited a 
department store.

Bai Qingming almost cried from behind.

He also wants to go shopping... No, he also wants to buy toys and delicious food, and most 
importantly, he doesn't want to go to school either!

Yun Chang didn't care about Bai Qingming's envious eyes, and followed Lin Wenlan, looking 
around the entire family courtyard, while bouncing towards the gate.

Lin Wenlan was the head of the art troupe and also the wife of the commander. Walking in the 
compound, she looked like a star under the spotlight, both beautiful and energetic, and at the same 
time extremely dazzling.

Yun Chang followed Lin Wenlan, feeling that Lin Wenlan's halo was also on her body, and little 
stars were shining all over her body.

Lin Wenlan greeted the family members in the compound along the way, and at the same time 
introduced Yunshang to everyone. When the two mothers and daughters walked to the gate, half an 
hour had passed.

Yun Shang originally thought that Lin Wenlan would take her directly to the department store, but 
after getting on the tram, Lin Wenlan asked Lin Dani's address first, and planned to see Lin Dani 
first, and then went shopping.

Worried that Yunshang would be unhappy, Lin Wenlan still coaxed her like a child, coaxing her with 
delicious food, "Shangnan, let's go to see your Aunt Lin first, after we finish watching, mom will 
buy you toffee, soda, and then bring You go to the restaurant to eat delicious food, okay?"

Yunshang's eyelids twitched a few times, and she really wanted to tell Lin Wenlan that she was no 
longer a child, and she couldn't be coaxed with delicious food, but she somehow felt that being 
coaxed like a child was very good, and she enjoyed it very much this treatment.

Thinking of this, Yunshang leaned cheekily into Lin Wenlan's arms, nodded resignedly, and said, 
"My Aunt Lin is going to work now, we have to wait until after get off work at night to see anyone. 



You take it first Buy delicious food in the department store, and after Aunt Lin gets off work, let's 
call Aunt Lin and Brother Dacheng to eat delicious food together."

Lin Dani and Dacheng are used to frugality, and they must be reluctant to eat delicious food on 
weekdays. Anyway, her cheap mother is not short of money tickets, so today she will bring Lin 
Dani and Dacheng to eat together.

Lin Wenlan didn't know the little Jiujiu in Yunshang's heart. Hearing that Yunshang's arrangement 
was very good, she readily agreed.

The tram staggered all the way into the urban area, and the two got off at the entrance of the 
department store.

Under the sun, quickly walked into the department store.

Lin Wenlan was wearing a neat military uniform, and Yun Shang was also wearing a very beautiful 
little skirt. The two mothers and daughters had similar faces and good temperaments. It seemed that 
the senior cadres in the army had brought their children to go shopping.

At this time, the military-civilian relationship was very harmonious, and the status of the military 
was very high. Not only did the salespersons in the department store with their eyes above the roof 
not passively sabotage their work, but they also took the initiative to come over one by one, and 
entertained Lin Wenlan and Yunshang very enthusiastically. .

Especially the salesperson at the food counter, as soon as she saw Lin Wenlan coming with 
Yunshang, regardless of whether the two of them bought something, she first wrapped two pieces of 
biscuits that were broken in half under the counter, and took a few of the broken candies. Packed in 
oiled paper, stuffed into Yunshang's hand across the counter.

Yun Chang didn't expect such a good treatment for shopping with Lin Wenlan, not only no one gave 
cold faces, but also free food.

Thinking that she and Gu Shinian had to fight with the salesperson to buy two cans of malted milk 
in the department store, Yun Shang even grabbed Lin Wenlan's lapel.

She decided that if she went shopping in the future, she must bring Lin Wenlan or Bai Yancheng 
with her, and both of them should wear military uniforms.



Lin Wenlan took Yunshang upstairs and downstairs for a couple of laps, and spent 13 feet of cloth 
tickets to buy three pieces of fabric for Yunshang, a new pair of sneakers, a pair of sandals, and a 
catty of special gifts for Yunshang. Pastries, a pound of biscuits, two bottles of canned food, and 
several beautiful little hairpins.

Before leaving the department store, Yun Chang caught sight of the large buckets at the outermost 
booth, and immediately grabbed Lin Wenlan and stopped moving.

Lin Wenlan turned her head and saw Yunshang's eyes were fixed on the conspicuous bear pattern in 
front of the booth, and her mouth was still drooling. She hurriedly pulled Yunshang over and bought 
two bottles of iced soda in a very good way.

Yun Chang was lying on the edge of the counter, drinking the soda happily, and asking the 
salesperson when the popsicles would be available for sale. She didn't put down the soda bottle with 
satisfaction until her stomach and the surface of her body were cool, and followed Lin Wenlan out 
of the department store. .

On the way to the shoe factory, Yun Shang grabbed Lin Wenlan's hand and whispered about the 
troubles Lin Dani encountered some time ago:

"Brother Gu and I were in the provincial capital that time, and we happened to run into each other. 
Second brother Gu asked someone to put five yuan and food stamps on Liang Xigui, so that no one 
would know that Liang Xigui was trying to play hooligans on Aunt Lin. It's not robbery at 
knifepoint."

Seeing Lin Wenlan's gloomy and scary face, Yunshang lowered her voice again and said, "I didn't 
have time to tell you this morning. When I met Aunt Lin, Aunt Lin was almost killed by her 
husband's family.

Aunt Lin couldn't afford to get sick, and the Zhou family controlled Aunt Lin's salary and refused to 
let Aunt Lin eat. Brother Dacheng really had no choice, so he went to the state-run restaurant to 
grab braised noodles for Aunt Lin to eat. As a result, the waiter caught it, and half of the ears were 
torn off.

Later, with the help of people from the street and the Women's Federation, Aunt Lin was sent to the 
hospital, and the Zhou family was sent to reform through labor, so Aunt Lin's courtyard was saved. 
"



Chapter 325 She is your aunt

Lin Wenlan never thought that Lin Dani's life would be so bad. Thinking of the excited and nervous 
appearance of her natal family on the phone when she called in the morning, Lin Wenlan became 
more and more eager to see Lin Dani.

………………………

When it was time to get off work, Lin Dani wiped the sweat off her brow and tidied up the shoe 
uppers on the pallet.

Before finishing cleaning, someone shouted at the door of the workshop, "Comrade Lin Dani! 
Comrade Lin Dani! Come to the reception room, someone is looking for it! Someone is looking for 
it!"

Seeing Lin Dani running over from the back of the workshop in a hurry, the visitor wiped the sweat 
from his forehead and said pantingly, "Lin Dani, your niece is looking for you and brought a female 
officer. Go and have a look, don't delay People's Liberation Army comrades."

When they heard that the People's Liberation Army was looking for Lin Dani, who was still a 
female officer, the workers in the workshop were instantly blown away.

But Lin Dani didn't care about doubts at this time, she tore off her overalls and ran to the reception 
room.

She only has Yunshang as a niece, and she followed Gu Shinian back to Fenyang a few days ago, 
why did she go to the provincial capital again? Could it be that something happened to the two 
children?

Lin Dani thought all the way, and when she ran to the reception room, her face turned pale with 
fright.

Seeing Lin Dani coming, Yun Shang quickly jumped off the chair, hugged her and let go, "Aunt 
Lin! Aunt Lin, I'm here to see you again!"



"Shangnan!" Panting heavily, Lin Dani held Yunshang up and down to look her up and down, 
"When did you come to the provincial capital? Where is your older brother? Why did you come out 
alone?"

Yun Shang pointed to Lin Wenlan who was standing in the shade of the tree at the gate with a 
leather bag, and said to Lin Dani in a low voice, "Auntie, I found my family. My mother brought me 
to see you."

Lin Dani knew Yun Shang's life experience from Gu Shinian early in the morning. Hearing what 
Yun Shang said, she immediately reacted, knowing that when Yun Shang said to find her family, she 
meant to find her biological parents.

Seeing Yun Shang's face that resembled her very much, Lin Dani felt excited, slowly straightened 
up, looked at Lin Wenlan, then pushed open the door awkwardly, fell down the steps step by step, 
and walked towards Lin Wenlan.

Lin Wenlan's eyes turned red the moment she saw Lin Dani's face clearly.

This face is not so much like Yunshang, it is better to say that it looks like Yunshang's grandmother 
who is far away in the capital.

Standing in front of Lin Wenlan, Lin Dani stared closely at Lin Wenlan's face, trying to open her 
mouth to say something, but found that her lips were trembling badly, her throat was dry, and she 
couldn't squeeze out a word.

This comrade of the People's Liberation Army is not an ordinary person at first glance. Could she be 
his relative?

She has been married once, and her reputation in the shoe factory is rotten. Even if she finds her 
family, will the other party think her reputation is rotten and not want to recognize her...

Yun Shang jumped down the steps of the reception room with her little butt pouted, ran to the two 
of them, looked at Lin Wenlan, then at Lin Dani, and felt that the two of them stood together, and 
their faces became more and more alike.



It's just that the two have different growth experiences, and they also have similar delicate facial 
features. Lin Wenlan is more dignified and magnificent, while Lin Dani is ignorant and agile with 
ignorance of the world.

"Aunt Lin," Yun Shang grabbed Lin Dani's trembling hand and shook it, "My mother said she 
would take us to eat delicious food, you go and change your clothes, and when we pick up Brother 
Dacheng, we will go to the restaurant!"

Lin Wenlan moved her fingers, as if she wanted to lift it up, then put it down immediately, and 
smiled at Lin Dani, and said in a very gentle and soft tone, "Da Ni, go and change your clothes first, 
if you have anything to say, I will talk about it later .”

Lin Dani nodded awkwardly, turned around, walked a few steps with the same hands and feet, then 
turned her head to look at Lin Wenlan, saw that she was looking at her with a gentle smile, turned 
around,

Speed up and run to the factory.

As soon as Lin Dani left, Lin Wenlan held Yun Shang's hand tightly, as if shocked and heartbroken 
to the extreme, trembling her voice, said in a messy sentence:

"Xiaoqi, she, she, is your aunt... your grandma, that year... I, your aunt was lost, and there was a lot 
of fire outside, so I couldn't find anyone... Your grandma was ill for a long time... and later, you 
were born , your grandma is very happy, saying that you look like your aunt, holding you all day 
and not willing to let go..."

Yun Shang listened to Lin Wenlan's fragmentary words, and Yun Shang quickly pieced together 
what happened to the Lin family.

Lin Wenlan is the eldest in the Lin family, with three younger brothers and one younger sister.

During the war, the family went out to flee, and the youngest sister, Lin Wenjin, was lost on the 
way.

During the war, there was chaos outside, and the Lin family spent a lot of money, but they never got 
it back.



The two sisters of the Lin family, Lin Wenlan only resembled their mother to three points in 
appearance, while Lin Wenjin's facial features were almost exactly the same as their mother's.

After Lin Wenjin was lost, Mrs. Lin fell seriously ill. Every time the family reunites, she always 
thinks about her lost little daughter.

When Lin Wenlan gave birth to Yunshang, the old lady of the Lin family was worried that Bai 
Yancheng would not take good care of Lin Wenlan, so she ran from the capital to Linyang to serve 
Lin Wenlan during confinement.

As soon as Yunshang was born, the old lady of the Lin family said that the child looked exactly like 
the lost Lin Wenjin, insisting that Lin Wenjin was reluctant to leave the family and tried to return to 
the Lin family.

In this way, Mrs. Lin was crying and laughing while holding Yunshang, and she was not willing to 
let go all day. Even when she went to bed at night, she had to hold the child on her companion bed.

It's just that the old man is in the first grade after all, and he was overjoyed during the day, so he 
was not so vigilant when he went to bed at night. That night, the child was stolen when the old lady 
was sleeping in a daze.

At dawn the next day, Mrs. Lin and Lin Wenlan almost went crazy.

Back then, Lin Wenjin was lost because Mrs. Lin did not hold Lin Wenjin's hand firmly. This time, 
Lin Wenlan's child was also lost in Mrs. Lin's hands.

Even though the Bai family and Bai Yancheng didn't blame Mrs. Lin, Mrs. Lin was so self-blaming 
and heartbroken that she almost drove herself crazy. She lay in the hospital for more than half a 
year, and then her health was not very good, and sometimes she was confused Yes, even people 
can't recognize it.

At that time, Lin Wenlan couldn't care less about blaming the old lady, she didn't even sit on the 
confinement, and went out to find the child with all her heart, until she couldn't hold on anymore, 
and was sent back to the hospital by Bai Yancheng to lie in bed for two months.



Even though the Bai family and Bai Yancheng didn't blame Mrs. Lin, Mrs. Lin was so self-blaming 
and heartbroken that she almost drove herself crazy. She lay in the hospital for more than half a 
year, and then her health was not very good, and sometimes she was confused Yes, even people 
can't recognize it.

At that time, Lin Wenlan couldn't care less about blaming the old lady, she didn't even sit on the 
confinement, and went out to find the child with all her heart, until she couldn't hold on anymore, 
and was sent back to the hospital by Bai Yancheng to lie in bed for two months.

Chapter 326 My Aunt Doesn’t Want Me Anymore

Lin Dani was sitting at the dining table with a dazed expression on her face. Even Da Cheng kept a 
cold face and secretly watched back and forth between her and Lin Wenlan.

Lin Wenlan couldn't figure out Lin Dani's temperament, and since the Lin family hadn't come over 
yet, it was hard to mention Lin Dani's life experience.

Several people sat face to face, but they all pretended to be something in their hearts. The 
atmosphere at the dinner table was oppressive and quiet, and the dinner was very sumptuous, but 
the taste was rather dull.

Yun Chang swallowed a mouthful of egg soup, but before she put down the spoon, someone kicked 
her foot, and when she turned her head, she saw Dacheng winking at her.

"Gu, I'll take sister Yunshang to the door to digest food, and I'll be back later!" Dacheng ran towards 
the door while dragging Yunshang without looking at the expressions of Lin Wenlan and Lin Dani.

After leaving the door, Dacheng's eyes turned red, and he asked Yunshang with a choked voice, 
"Sister Yunshang, did you bring someone to snatch my aunt? Are you going to take my aunt away? 
Is my aunt... don't Me?"

Dacheng followed Lin Dani and was honed by Zhou's family for several years, and later learned to 
protect Lin Dani like a well-established man. His mind is more mature than children of the same 
age, and he is also more sensitive and suspicious.

Lin Wenlan and Lin Dani are very similar in appearance, coupled with the weird atmosphere 
between the two, Dacheng immediately remembered it.



Thinking that Yunshang was still a child of Lao Yun's family when she returned home last month, 
and in less than a month, Yunshang left Lao Yun's family and became the child of a senior official's 
family in the provincial capital military region.

Thinking of Lin Dani once mentioning that she is not his own aunt, and that she would not want any 
job in the family courtyard or the shoe factory, and would keep it for him, Dacheng unconsciously 
thought of it, is it Lin Dani? Like Yun Shang, she would leave him, leave the courtyard, and go back 
to her own home.

He has been with Lin Dani since he was sensible, and there is only Lin Dani as a relative. If Lin 
Dani does not want him, then he will not even have the last relative.

Thinking of this possibility, while Dacheng was afraid that Lin Dani would not want him, he felt a 
little angry.

He felt that Yunshang was going too far, stealing half of his aunt's care was not enough, and now he 
brought someone to the door, wanting someone to snatch his aunt away, it was really not enough 
friends.

Yun Shang was dumbfounded by Dacheng's question, and really didn't know how to answer him for 
a while.

Although Lin Wenlan was basically sure that Lin Dani was the youngest daughter of the Lin family, 
there was still a contingency in everything.

Even if Lin Dani is really the youngest daughter of the Lin family and she recognizes her back to 
the Lin family, Yunshang can't know Lin Dani's inner thoughts, let alone whether she will choose to 
return to the Lin family to live.

She comforted Dacheng and said that Lin Dani would not want him, but what if Lin Dani was 
willing to live in the capital?

After all, in a new environment, no one knows about Lin Dani's miserable past. She doesn't have to 
live under other people's finger pointing all day like she is now, and she doesn't have to be stared at 
by the male workers of the shoe factory every day because of a large courtyard. You don't have to 
be hard-pressed to get married just because you have Dacheng.



What choice Lin Dani will make, Yun Shang is really not sure.

Yunshang lowered his head and said nothing, Dacheng's tears fell immediately, he raised his arm 
and wiped away the tears, stretched out his hand and pushed Yunshang, and said angrily, "Sister 
Yunshang, how can you be so bad! What are you doing? Why do you want to bring someone to rob 
my aunt!"

Unprepared, Yun Chang was really pushed back a few steps by Da Cheng. Seeing Da Cheng's tears 
falling down, he still bit his mouth and kept silent. The little flame that had just risen in his heart 
was extinguished instantly .

She stepped forward and took Dacheng's arm, half comforting and half coaxing, "Brother Dacheng, 
no one is robbing you of your aunt. Aunt Lin will still be your aunt from now on. If you don't 
believe me, go back and ask Aunt Lin at night..."

"That's my aunt,

Not your aunt! " Dacheng didn't appreciate it, and interrupted Yunshang sobbing.

Shit!

That is clearly my aunt!

Lin Dani’s name is Lin Wenjin, and my aunt in the previous life was also named Lin Wenjin. Just 
because of the two identical faces, no matter in the previous life or this life, Lin Dani is my aunt!

Yun Shang wanted to say something to Da Cheng, but seeing Da Cheng crying like a second dog, 
she still couldn't bear to provoke him any more.

"Yes, yes, you are right. Aunt Lin is your aunt, not my aunt. I will take my mother back and not rob 
you of my aunt."

Forget it, what is there to care about with a second fool.



The two children were arguing outside, and the atmosphere on Lin Dani and Lin Wenlan's side was 
not easy.

The two sat facing each other, Lin Dani frowned, and didn't know what to say, but Lin Wenlan 
thought of what happened to Lin Dani in recent years, so she didn't dare to mention her sad things, 
so she could only ask about Lin Dani's grades in night school, and her Future plans.

It was getting dark outside, Lin Wenlan got up with her leather bag, raised her hand to pin the hair 
on Lin Dani's face behind her ears, and smiled softly and tolerantly, "Dani, it's getting late today, 
wait until this weekend, you bring Dacheng is here as a guest, I... will show you to my family."

Lin Dani clenched her fists tightly, then immediately relaxed, nodded vigorously, her eye circles 
were slightly red, "I, I will go there soon..."

Lin Wenlan spoke so clearly that Lin Dani understood immediately.

This is to take her to know relatives.

Several people separated at the entrance of the hotel. Lin Dani walked home with the crying and 
red-eyed Dacheng, while Lin Wenlan took Yunshang onto the tram and staggered all the way back 
to the military area.

After arriving home, Yun Chang looked at Bai Qingyue who was bouncing down the stairs, quickly 
pulled Lin Wenlan's purse, found a piece of goose-yellow material with floral flowers, and stuffed it 
into Bai Qingyue's hand:

"Sister, you have a white face. You look good in this fabric. I specially picked it to make a new skirt 
for you."

Lin Wenlan bought her three pieces of fabric, two pairs of shoes, and a lot of delicious food in one 
go today, but Bai Qingyue didn't buy anything.

Although Bai Yancheng and Lin Wenlan specially compensated her for these things, but Bai 
Qingyue was only in her teens, and she was in Aimei's grade. If she suddenly fell out of favor and 
was left out in the cold, she would definitely feel uncomfortable, and she might have opinions on 
her in the future.



She's not a real child, and she doesn't lack good-looking fabric clothes, but she can't just think about 
her beauty and ignore Bai Qingyue's feelings, that's not conducive to the stability and unity of the 
family.

Lin Wenlan just took a sip of water with her cup in her hand, when she saw that Yun Shang was 
showing favors with the things she bought, and brazenly said that she had specially picked out that 
piece of fabric for Bai Qingyue, the hot water in her mouth almost didn't spray go out.

That piece of fabric was obviously bought by her as a gift to Yunshang, when did it become a piece 
of fabric specially bought by Yunshang as a gift to Qingyue?

Lin Wenlan rubbed her stiff face, nodded to Bai Qingyue's searching gaze, "Qingyue, you, Xiao Qi 
is right, this piece of material was specially picked by Xiao Qi for you."

Chapter 327 Molesting Bai Qingzheng

Lin Wenlan didn't show it on the face, but she was very happy in her heart. She felt that her Xiao Qi 
was too clever and sensible.

A six-year-old boy is more considerate than some adults.

Bai Qingyue really didn't expect that Yunshang would miss her, even when she went shopping, she 
would buy her a new piece of fabric.

Compared to other sisters who only snatch things from their older sisters, her newly returned sister 
is really cute and caring.

Just praise Xiao Qi that her face is pale, she will treat Xiao Qi well in the future!

In the future, we must take good care of Xiao Qi, and resolutely prevent anyone from bullying her 
caring and lovely sister.

Especially Bai Qingming, he must watch Bai Qingming at home in the future, and not let Bai 
Qingming coax away Xiao Qi's pocket money.



Yun Chang didn't know that she bought Bai Qingyue with just a piece of fabric. After stuffing the 
fabric to Bai Qingyue, she lowered her head and dug out the pastry in her purse.

First leave a few dollars for Bai Yancheng and Lin Wenlan, and the remaining half a catty of cakes, 
Yunshang divided them into four parts, and each of the four brothers and sisters got one share.

Bai Qingming was so happy that he jumped three feet high, kissed Yunshang on the forehead, and 
then rushed upstairs with the pastry in his arms.

Run quickly, if you don't run, maybe the pastry will be returned to Xiao Qi by the elder brother.

This is a special pastry bought with military tickets!

Even if he is the child of the commander's family, he rarely eats it.

This time it's alright, Xiao Qi gave him this, and finally he can enjoy it all at once.

Bai Qing is the eldest of the family, very stable and mature, naturally he will not be naughty and 
greedy like Bai Qingming, holding the pastry stuffed by Yun Shang, eating a piece with a smile, and 
put the remaining pieces back into Yun Shang's hand "This is what mom bought for you. It's enough 
for big brother to taste one piece, and save the rest for Xiaoqi to eat slowly." He rubbed Yunshang's 
head while speaking.

Yun Shang looked at the pastry in hand, and then looked at Bai Qingzheng suspiciously, wondering 
for a long time: such a delicious pastry, is it really enough for Bai Qingzheng to eat one piece?

Seeing that Bai Qingzheng really didn't intend to eat pastries, Yun Shang's favorability towards Bai 
Qingzheng gradually increased.

Bai Qingzheng should be a good brother if he doesn't compete with his sister for food!

……………………………

The Lin family came faster than Yunshang imagined, and more people came.



Except for Mrs. Lin who was in a daze and didn't remember anything, and Mr. Lin who was not in 
good health, the three brothers of the Lin family all rushed to Linyang.

On the day when the Lin family came, Yun Shang naturally made friends with Lin Wenlan.

From the uncle's family to the third uncle's family, Yunshang called out in a large circle, and the red 
envelopes were really collected.

In addition to receiving red envelopes, Yunshang also has a lot of cousins. The uncle's family has a 
cousin and two cousins, the second uncle's family has a cousin and a cousin, and the third uncle's 
family has twin cousins.

After a series of recognitions, Yun Chang only remembered familiar faces, but couldn't remember 
everyone's names at all.

Fortunately, there are Bai Qingzheng and Bai Qingyue in the Bai family. After confirming their 
marriage, Yunshang just needs to quietly follow behind her brothers and sisters and be a well-
behaved and sensible child, without worrying about entertaining guests at all.

The next day was the weekend, Lin Wenlan went out to buy groceries with Aunt Wu early in the 
morning, and took the three younger sisters-in-law to work in the kitchen. Bai Yancheng and the 
three brothers-in-law were sitting in the study and talking, and the living room became The world of 
children.

Bai Qing was looking at the children playing devil-fighting games in the living room, and then 
glanced at Yunshang who was sticking to her side, unwilling to play with the children, and wiped 
off the cold sweat that didn't exist on her head. Leaving Bai Qingyue and Bai Qingming behind 
unjustly,

He slipped out the door with Yun Chang in his arms, and went to the door of the family courtyard.

"Phew...it's terrible!" Yun Chang lay on Bai Qingzheng's shoulder, sighing like a little adult, "When 
there are too many children, it's noisy."

Bai Qingzheng looked at Yunshang's frightened expression, and couldn't help laughing out loud.



She herself was a child,

Yun Chang looked at Bai Qing's smiling face, and said solemnly, "Brother, when you get married in 
the future, you can't have so many children. One boy and one girl are enough. If there are more, the 
family will really be in trouble. "

Bai Qingzheng is sixteen years old this year, and he will be able to get married and have children in 
another five or six years.

At this time, there is no family planning, and there are no entertainment activities at night. The only 
activity for young couples at night is to give birth to a child.

The Bai family is not worried about not being able to raise a baby, and even less scruples about 
having a baby.

Thinking that in the future there will be more than a dozen little boys chasing after him and calling 
him aunt or aunt, the living room at home will be more lively than today, and the hairs all over 
Yunshang's body will stand on end.

Bai Qingzheng was so startled by Yunshang's words that he almost fell down, his usually calm and 
self-possessed face was cracked for a moment, and the tips of his ears turned red quietly.

Looking at Yunshang's worried little eyes, Bai Qingzheng endured and endured, and finally couldn't 
help knocking Yunshang's head, "Don't talk nonsense! At a young age, just think about eating and 
playing, don't think about it It's not something you think about."

Yun Chang covered her head, glanced at her elder brother's red ears, and was secretly happy.

Are you shy?

It's so innocent.

If it was Gu Er Ge, he wouldn't even bother to show his face, and maybe he would discuss with her 
what name the baby should be given in the future.



Seeing that Bai Qingzheng's face was still a little unnatural, Yun Shang continued to tease her elder 
brother with bad intentions, "Brother, what kind of sister-in-law do you want to find me? Long hair 
or short hair, do you want me to help you find a wife..."

Before he finished speaking, Bai Qingzheng covered Yunshang's mouth, "Xiao Qi, if you talk 
nonsense again, I'll go back right away and let you play with the children of my uncle's family."

Yun Shang: "..."

Big brother is so bad!

How can you not play cards according to common sense?

Yun Chang became wilted for a moment, and lay on Bai Qingzheng's shoulder for a long time, not 
daring to move.

The two brothers and sisters waited at the gate of the family courtyard for less than five minutes. 
Lin Dani squeezed off the tram with Dacheng, carrying a few packs of snacks in his hands, and 
walked towards this side in three steps.

Yun Shang struggled to get off Bai Qingzheng, and ran towards Lin Dani, shouting as she ran, 
"Aunt Lin! Brother Dacheng! Why did you come here? I have been waiting for you at the door for a 
long time!"

Bai Qing was speechless.

Raising her wrist to check the time, she was very sure that Yunshang had waited for less than five 
minutes, and she didn't know why she yelled out what she had been waiting for for a long time.

Perhaps children have a different concept of time from adults?

Bai Qing was thinking so much in his heart, and followed Yun Shang to meet the two of them.

Seeing Yunshang, Lin Dani's smile was as gentle as ever, but Dacheng seemed to have some 
prejudice against Yunshang, turned his head away from Yunshang's face, and gave a small 'hum'.



"Dacheng..."

While Lin Dani looked at Dacheng in disapproval, Bai Qingzheng, who walked up to them, turned 
cold instantly.

Chapter 328 recognize relatives

"Brother, Brother Dacheng is angry that I took someone to rob his aunt. If Aunt Lin confesses, 
Brother Dacheng will have no family." Yun Chang lowered her voice and whispered to Bai 
Qingzheng.

Bai Qingzheng's expression softened a little, but thinking of Dacheng's behavior of throwing face at 
Yunshang, he still felt a little uncomfortable. Looking at Dacheng who was about to cry, Bai Qing 
was rubbing Yunshang's head, and followed Yunshang with a very clear voice. Calling Lin Da Ni 
"Aunt Lin", successfully made Da Cheng's eyes red with anger.

Yun Chang didn't expect Bai Qingzheng to be so black-bellied, and was speechless for a long time, 
and hurriedly dragged Dacheng, who was about to cry, into the courtyard.

Big Brother is too bad, she has to protect Big Brother Dacheng.

After completing the registration at the gate, Lin Dani and Dacheng finally stepped into the military 
compound that was mysterious and longing for outsiders.

The more she walked inside, the more nervous Lin Dani became. Even when family members 
passing by greeted Bai Qingzheng, or looked at Lin Dani curiously, she would subconsciously hold 
her breath and lower her head not daring to look at anyone.

Yun Shang noticed that Lin Dani's fingers holding the pastry were tightly clenched together, and 
even the fingertips were a little pale.

Dacheng next to him looked at the tall trees in the family courtyard and the rows of neat and 
beautiful small western-style buildings under the trees, and his mouth couldn't close his mouth in 
shock.

"Sister Yunshang, do you live here?" Dacheng forgot that he was still having trouble with Yunshang, 
and ran to Yunshang and asked.



Yunshang snickered, and pointed to a small western-style building not far away, "I live there. 
Brother Dacheng, when I get home later, I will introduce my little brother to you. My little brother 
is so fun."

Dacheng nodded, took a peek at Lin Dani, pulled Yunshang behind and said, "Sister Yunshang, can 
my aunt live in such a nice house in the future? If so... I won't be angry with you .”

Seeing Yun Shang looking over curiously, Dacheng blushed for a moment, then turned his head 
away to prevent Yun Shang from seeing his reddened eyes, "If my aunt can live here, there will be 
People's Liberation Army coming in and out, and those people in the shoe factory will not Dare to 
gossip about my aunt. I live in a large courtyard by myself... I am not afraid, I can cook, I can go to 
school by myself, I..."

Yunshang didn't expect Dacheng to think so. Hearing Dacheng's slightly choked voice, saying that 
he agreed to let Lin Dani confess his relatives, the corners of Yunshang's eyes also swelled and 
became hot.

She didn't expect that when it came to Lin Dani's confession of relatives, Dacheng, who was 
childish and ridiculous before, became sensible and distressing in a blink of an eye.

Yunshang held Dacheng's hand tightly, and promised him in a low voice, "Brother Dacheng, don't 
worry, even if Aunt Lin doesn't live here and there are uncles and uncles, those people from the shoe 
factory will not dare to bully Aunt Lin in the future. "

Lin Wenlan and the second uncle of the Lin family are both soldiers. Even if Lin Dani is unwilling 
to return to the Lin family in the capital, she is still the youngest daughter of the Lin family in the 
capital and a family member of the revolutionary soldiers.

The brothers and sisters of the Lin family will definitely come forward to support Lin Dani, so that 
no Liang Xigui-like characters will appear around Lin Dani, and as members of the military, the 
female workers in the factory will not dare to gossip about Lin Dani anymore.

Things were really as Yun Shang said, when the three brothers of the Lin family saw Lin Dani for 
the first time, they were almost dumbfounded.



After asking some more detailed questions, the brothers and sisters of the Lin family confirmed Lin 
Dani's identity 100%.

Lin Dani is the Lin Wenjin who the Lin family has lost for 20 years, searched for for 20 years, and 
made the family talk about it for 20 years.

Thinking of Lin Wenlan's private talk about Lin Dani's experiences over the years, the brothers 
couldn't sit still.

Dani Lin is the youngest child of their Lin family. She was also a delicate girl who was held in the 
palm of the family back then. She has suffered so much outside these years.

Being tortured by the vicious in-law's family, not to mention his life, he was almost forced into 
marriage by the leech-like Liang Xigui.

If the old lady at home is still awake, knowing that the little girl she has been thinking about for 
twenty years has suffered so much, how distressed she would be.

Lin Dani didn't know what the three brothers of the Lin family were thinking. Even though she 
knew that these people were her relatives, she still sat on the sofa restrainedly, with her arms around 
Dacheng, her head half down, and she didn't dare to look at the Lin family members for a long time.

The children in the family had already gone to the training ground to play, and there was silence in 
the living room. Lin Dani became more and more nervous, and the corner of the shirt that was being 
ironed was crumpled by her.

The three brothers of the Lin family told Lin Dani about the Lin family's affairs in bits and pieces, 
saying that after she was lost that year, the old lady Lin was anxious to get sick, and also said that 
even if the old lady became ill and confused a few years ago, she would always talk about it. She 
and Yunshang are two people.

Everyone's attitude is very good, but Lin Dani still feels nervous and inferior.

The eldest sister is the head of the military art troupe, the eldest brother and the second brother are 
also soldiers, and they both wear shiny epaulettes on their shoulders. The youngest brother said that 
he works in the planning committee. Like mud, it is an existence that everyone can't avoid.



The man was a bad guy who was shot, and his husband's family were all reform-through-labor 
prisoners. Their reputation in the factory was ruined, and even this job that was pointed out all day 
by others would have to be returned to Dacheng in the future.

She felt ashamed to speak out about her experiences. Can these family members in front of them 
really not despise her in their hearts?

Lin Dani tried her best to calm herself down, behaved a little better, and was more generous, but the 
several people sitting opposite each had a bigger aura than the other, and she could hardly raise her 
head because of their intimidating power.

This kind of embarrassing performance made Lin Dani so embarrassed that she wanted to find a 
crack in the ground and sneak in.

Lin Wenlan sighed secretly, and rubbed the head of Yunshang who was quietly staying beside her, 
"Shangnan, take Brother Dacheng upstairs to play for a while, and your uncles and I want to talk to 
your aunt, okay? ?”

Yun Shang nodded, dragged the reluctant Dacheng upstairs, and gave up the space downstairs to the 
adults.

Knowing that Dacheng was in a bad mood, Yunshang went upstairs and didn't bother him to talk, 
just dumped two comic books, leaned on the bed by herself, crossed her legs, consciously entered 
the space, and harvested the newly ripened crops.

The wheat is ripe again, and the corn can also be harvested. The connecting poles are pulled out and 
placed on the ground to dry slowly.

It was almost June now, and the vegetables in the space had to be sold on the black market as soon 
as possible.

There are quite a lot of radishes and cabbages piled up, you can go to find more than a dozen big 
urns, pickle radishes and cabbages, and sell kimchi to eat later.

As for the work of pickling vegetables, it was natural for Second Brother Gu to do it.



The fruit trees on the edge of the space are also fruiting, and they will mature in about ten days, and 
they can be sold on the black market at that time...

Yunshang worked in the space for most of the day, then patrolled around, and decided to go 
downstairs to urge Bai Yancheng later, and hurry up to buy a suite for Gu Erge, so she couldn't 
delay her big business of making money.

Chapter 329 Not Going to the Capital

Downstairs, the boss Lin Wenshan held down Lin Wenjun who was about to jump up, and 
reprimanded in a low voice, "Third brother! Sit down, don't scare Wenjin."

After finishing speaking, he looked at Lin Dani again, and asked in a slow voice, "Dani, can you tell 
us why you don't want to go back to the capital with us?"

Lin Dani pursed her lips tightly, squeezed her body into the sofa, her voice trembling slightly, "I 
was married, I am an adult..."

"This is not a problem. You are single now, and you are still an unmarried daughter of our old Lin 
family." Lin Wenshan waved his hand, interrupting Lin Dani's words.

"...I, I'm still in night school now, and I'm going to take the college entrance examination in a 
while." Seeing that the expressions on the faces of the three brothers of the Lin family eased a bit, 
Lin Dani regained her composure and said in a slightly louder voice, "There is still Dacheng ...It's 
my nephew, Dacheng is the only elder, I have to take care of Dacheng, I can't leave Dacheng alone."

"When you arrive in the capital, you can also go to night school. In the future, you can go to a 
university in the capital. Isn't it better than Linyang? As for Dacheng, you can also take it home. 
With so many children in our family, we can have companions after Dacheng. They are better than 
you Strong here."

It was the second brother Lin Wenfeng who spoke. Compared with the other two brothers, Lin 
Wenfeng's face was more majestic and fierce, and his momentum was more attractive. As soon as 
he opened his mouth, Lin Dani shivered subconsciously, and even his face turned pale.

Seeing that Lin Dani was frightened when he spoke, the second child closed his mouth resentfully, 
and winked at his eldest brother.



Seeing this, Lin Wenlan couldn't help laughing. Under the puzzled eyes of the Lin family brothers, 
Lin Wenlan smiled and said:

"I think it's good for Da Ni to stay in Linyang. With me here, no one can bully Da Ni. There is also 
that child Dacheng, who is about the same age as Qingming and can play with Xiao Qi. It's a 
playmate.

Besides, a golden nest and a silver nest are not as good as your own kennel, and you are not as 
comfortable as staying at your own home after going to someone else's house. Dacheng has a large 
courtyard in his own home, so how could he be willing to go to someone else's home to be 
wronged. "

After going to Lin's house, the child is dependent on others, no matter how good the family is to 
Dacheng, it is not his own home.

Seeing the whole family of the Lin family being so affectionate, Da Cheng couldn't feel at ease 
when he was the only outsider.

Besides, the Lin family also lived in the compound of the Beijing military region. After Dacheng 
passed, they could not easily integrate into the circle of children in the compound.

Lin Wenjun was dissatisfied, "Sister! Our family is all kind people, and we can't do anything to 
make a child feel wronged..."

Faced with Lin Wenlan's half-smile expression, Lin Wenjun's voice slowly lowered, and finally he 
muttered, "You've been in Linyang for so many years, and it's fine if you're not at home all the time. 
Now that Wenjin is back, how are you doing?" You have to go to the capital too. Our mother only 
has two daughters, but both of them stay in Linyang and don’t go back, so what’s the difference 
between having no daughters?”

Lin Wenlan put down her teacup heavily, and said without doubt, "I'm up to Wenjin on this matter. 
She is willing to stay in Linyang, and I will take care of her in the future. She is willing to take 
Dacheng to the capital, and I will leave it to you to take care of her in the future."

Lin Dani breathed a sigh of relief, and quickly said, "I'll stay in Linyang until I'm admitted to 
university, and then I'll change jobs when I come out. Besides, there's still my eldest sister here, so 
life is better than it is now."



If she had never been married, or if Dacheng had other relatives, she might be tempted by the 
proposal of the three brothers.

But with her current status and a nephew who is less than ten years old, it's okay to live in Lin's 
house for a short time, but if she lives for a long time, she will be disgusted sooner or later.

She has been separated from her relatives for twenty years, and apart from the same blood flowing 
in her body, there is no half of friendship.

Even though the brothers still had compassion and compensation for her at first,

But as time goes by, after these illusory feelings disappear, these stains on her body will be 
infinitely magnified, who can guarantee that the brothers will not despise her?

Even if the three elder brothers don't dislike it, there are still three sister-in-laws in the family.

Whose daughter-in-law is willing to let a sister-in-law who has been married before and has a bad 
reputation go back to live with her parents?

Besides, the three elder brothers said that the old man in the family is not in good health, and if she 
goes back to grow up at this juncture, will the sisters-in-law think that she wants to fight for the 
family property?

Lin Dani didn't say these things, but thought clearly in her heart.

Her original intention of recognizing relatives was not to rely on relatives for a living, but to know 
whose family she was a child of, what kind of people her parents, brothers and sisters were, and 
why her family didn't want her back then.

Now knowing that the Lin family lost her by accident, and they have not given up looking for her 
for so many years, Lin Dani is very satisfied.



Now that she lives in a spacious courtyard and can take the university entrance examination soon, 
her life will be better and better in the future. There is no need to go to the capital to break the 
peaceful life of the Lin family.

Lin Dani made a decision, and the three brothers of the Lin family were not very happy, but Lin 
Wenlan's eyes flashed with admiration.

Her younger sister has been forced by life to be cowardly and soft-tempered over the years, but the 
calmness and rationality belonging to the Lin family has never disappeared.

Even if she has not received the most comprehensive education from her parents, at the fork in her 
life, she can still clearly make choices that are beneficial to herself.

Lin Wenshan looked at Lin Dani with complicated emotions in his eyes. After a long time, he let out 
a long sigh, "You stay in Linyang, and we can't take care of anything. If you encounter problems in 
the future, just tell the eldest sister, don't go out with the eldest sister. .”

Seeing Lin Dani nodding repeatedly, Lin Wenshan was really depressed.

The brothers sincerely want to take Lin Dani back, and they have discussed it. Before Lin Dani 
marries again, the brothers will take good care of Lin Dani and make up for the family's debt to her 
for so many years.

But his youngest sister, seems not very close to the brothers, and also very repulsed to go home with 
them.

The most important thing is that Lin Dani doesn't seem to believe that they will treat her sincerely, 
and that they will not dislike her past.

Realizing this, the three brothers of the Lin family felt extremely aggrieved, and at the same time 
felt powerless in their hearts.

After thinking about it, I can only hand over Lin Dani to the elder sister to take care of her.

At this moment, the corners of Lin Wenlan's eyes and brows were filled with joy. He took Lin 
Dani's hand and said happily, "Wen... Dani, are you busy with work in the factory? I'm going to the 



capital in two days, you and The factory asks for a few more days off, and I will take you home to 
recognize the door and make your parents happy. They have been waiting for you to come home for 
twenty years."

Probably because of Yunshang, Lin Dani felt that compared to her three elder brothers, she devoted 
herself to Lin Wenlan. Hearing what Lin Wenlan said, she nodded and agreed.

Chapter 330: The New Suitor

After lunch, the brothers of the Lin family followed Lin Dani to the courtyard as guests. As a little 
tail who loves to join in the fun, Yun Shang naturally wanted to follow.

Dacheng walked on the road, grinning silly from time to time, Yun Chang endured and endured, and 
finally couldn't help running to Bai Qingzheng's side, letting Bai Qingzheng walk with him in his 
arms.

Dacheng is crazy!

Isn't it because Aunt Lin doesn't plan to go to the capital to settle down, but to stay in Linyang? As 
for the two idiots Le Cheng?

Yun Chang turned her head, glanced at the post office on the side of the road, and quickly patted 
Bai Qingzheng on the shoulder, motioning him to stop.

"Brother, let's go to the post office, I want to call my aunt!"

In the past two days, there were a lot of things going on at home, and there were a lot of people. 
Even if Gu Shinian called, she couldn't say a few words because of the noise here.

And Aunt Shuilian, she hasn't called Aunt Shuilian for many days, it's time to call back to supervise 
Yun Shuilian, she can't let her be lazy and not study hard.

Seeing that Bai Qing was carrying Yunshang into the post office, Dacheng hurriedly followed and 
asked in a flattering tone, "Sister Yunshang, what are you doing at the post office?"

"Call my aunt!" Looking at Dacheng's smiling face, and thinking of the recent incident of him 
flirting with her, Yunshang curled her mouth and said angrily, "Huh! I have an aunt too!" My aunt 
Shui Lian is also the world's most good aunt!



Dacheng knew that he was unhappy with Yunshang recently, and when Yunshang said something, 
he just smiled innocently, without the slightest dissatisfaction.

After getting along for a while, Bai Qingzheng has understood Yunshang's temperament.

My little sister is the youngest, but she has more eyes than Bai Qingyue and Bai Qingming 
combined. She seems to be generous and considerate, but she can't suffer the most. If anyone 
provokes her, she will have a small account in her heart. It is clear that sooner or later he will have 
to return it.

At this moment, seeing Yunshang looking for Dacheng's troubles like settling accounts, Bai 
Qingzheng pretended not to see it very wittily, and told the post office staff to help Yunshang call 
the Fenyang Women's Federation.

Yun Shang asked about Yun Shuilian's study situation in the evening school like a little adult, and 
after knowing that she was not lazy, she asked about the situation at home.

"Your grandma brought Shuanzi back to the village, and she was so busy every day that she couldn't 
see anyone. If it wasn't for your second uncle who came back to live every night, aunt would have 
to look after the third house by herself." Yun Shuilian said pitifully. .

Yunshang thought for a while, and asked curiously, "Gu, where is my mother? Has my mother 
followed me back to the village?"

"Well, I went back. There is no one at home during the day, and we are worried about your mother 
staying in the house alone. By the way, Shi Nian said last night that he found a suite for your 
mother, which is a single-family courtyard. Er, there are three rooms, your mother lives just right, 
and I can go to the housing management office to go through the transfer procedures tomorrow."

Yun Shang just responded, but Yun Shuilian then called her name, "Shang Nan... how are you doing 
in the provincial capital?"

"That's good! I have two older brothers and one older sister. The elder brother and the older sister 
love me very much. The younger brother is naughty all day long, but I'm not afraid. I can beat him 
with one hand..."



Yun Shuilian stood next to the phone, listening to Yun Shang talking about things in the provincial 
capital, but her eyes passed through the window and fell on the straight figure at the door of the 
Women's Federation.

"Auntie, Second Brother Gu has been busy recently, so he doesn't have time to pick you up from 
night school. Remember to go home with the students who are on the way. You can't be like Aunt 
Lin when you run into robbers..."

"Shangnan..." Yun Shuilian interrupted Yunshang, unconsciously lowered her voice, and whispered 
authentically, "I'm safe, these few days...someone picks me up from school, it's a comrade from the 
Armed Forces..."

When Yun Shang heard the words, the microphone in his hand almost fell to the ground, his mouth 
was open, and he couldn't recover for a long time.

She's not a real kid,

Naturally, she could understand the subtext in Yun Shuilian's words.

Yun Shuilian has a new suitor!

No matter how harmonious the military-civilian relationship is, and how enthusiastic the comrades 
in the armed forces are, they cannot escort unmarried lesbians home every day for no reason.

But what is the origin of this sudden suitor?

Why didn't she hear the wind?

"Gu, he, he, who is that person?" Yun Shang clenched the microphone tightly, her mouth 
unconsciously drooping.

"It's a comrade from the Armed Forces Department. His surname is Zhou, and his name is Zhou 
Minghui..."



"How did you two meet? When did you meet? How old is he? What does he do in the Armed Forces 
Department? At home..." Yun Shang asked halfway through, and realized that she was asking too 
much, not like a child should say. After saying that, he immediately pursed his lips, and said angrily, 
"Gu, did Comrade Zhou invite you to eat something delicious? Why don't you take me to eat?"

Yun Shuilian was really confused by Yun Shang's question at first, but she couldn't help laughing 
when she heard Yun Shang's last sentence:

"Shangnan, Comrade Zhou is simply helping me, and he didn't treat me to eat delicious food. Don't 
worry, I will save some delicious food for you in the future, and eat slowly when Changnan comes 
back."

Yun Chang pursed her mouth, feeling that her back molars were sore, she took a breath and said, 
"Gu, tell me how you and Comrade Zhou met." Let's find a qualified uncle!

Thinking that people from the Fenyang Armed Forces Department also went to Xiaoyanglou that 
day, Yunshang decided to act coquettishly when she returned home, and asked Bai Yancheng to 
check Zhou Minghui's details carefully, so that no one with ulterior motives could deliberately 
approach Aunt Shuilian.

"Shangnan, do you still remember Zhang Shouyi?"

"Remember, it's the one who made Director Yang's daughter play hooligans... No!" Yun Chang 
covered her mouth and paused, "It's Comrade Zhang from the Water Conservancy Bureau, I 
remember, what's wrong with him?"

"Zhang Shouyi changed jobs with a worker from the Fenyang Water Conservancy Bureau. It is said 
that he gave the other party 300 yuan and 100 catties of food stamps."

Yun Chang really didn't expect Zhang Shouyi to do what he said, and after only a few months, he 
managed to transfer to Fenyang. He was stunned for a moment, and asked Yun Shuilian, "Guy, 
Zhang Shouyi went to find you?"

"Well, Zhang Shouyi came to the work unit to look for me. I made it clear to him that our family 
will not marry the Zhang family. A few days ago I came back from the night school and ran into 
Zhang Shouyi at the school gate. Comrade Zhou Minghui happened to come The night school 
picked me up and sent me home on the way..."



Yun Chang was speechless for a long time, so this is giving someone away to get addicted, help to 
the end?

"Auntie, did Zhang Shouyi say anything when he went to your unit? Does Second Uncle know 
about this?" I've been tricked once, and this time I can't find another unreliable partner.

"I didn't tell your second uncle that the aluminum factory is about to start work. Your second uncle 
has been very busy recently, and it's midnight every day when he comes back..."

Yun Shuilian looked at the time as she spoke, and found that the call time was running out, so she 
quickly got down to business, "Shangnan, I will call you tomorrow, please ask him to take time to 
go back to the village and tell your grandma Zhang Shouyi's transfer to Fenyang, and Comrade 
Zhou's..."
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