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Chapter 711 Returning to the Art Troupe

Gu Shinian kicked Kong Longzheng in disdain, pulled his face, and said very bluntly, "Tidy up and 
cry? Who said that, you saw it with your own eyes? My family, A Chang, is a cultural person, so 
why don't you come to clean up people? Come on, don't put a hat on A Chang's head with 
nonsense."

If it gets out, does my A-shang still want to be famous?

Kong Changzheng: "..."

It is obvious that your child is relying on himself as a cultural person, and came to the door to 
criticize and scold Huai to clean up others. Why did I come to you and put a hat on your child's 
head out of conscience?

Shameless!

Seeing that Kong Changzheng was too angry to speak, Gu Shinian raised his eyebrows 
triumphantly, picked up the military cap on the table and prepared to go out.

"The work has been arranged. I will take A-Shang to the military division first. If you need 
anything, call the art troupe to find me."

"Hey! Old Gu, wait! There's still business to be said!" Seeing that Gu Shinian was about to go out, 
Kong Changzheng hurried to catch up and dragged him back several times.

Hearing that there was business to do, Gu Shinian was not in a hurry to leave, so he sat down on a 
chair and waited for Kong Changzheng's business.

"Didn't the organization say last year that two more companies would be transferred over? It's 
almost settled. What are your plans?"

"Who did you hear from?" Gu Shinian asked Kong Changzheng back, paused and continued, "This 
matter is still in the confidential stage, I only found out when I received a call two days ago, where 
did you call?" Got the news?"



"Hey! I don't need to ask deliberately. I went back to the military division yesterday, and the 
company below is busy with selection. The number of routes is exactly the same as when we 
selected people to join the Tiger Company. What does this mean? Explain the organizational 
documents It has been distributed to all military divisions..."

Kong Changzheng's spittle flew all over the place, but Gu Shinian frowned and said nothing, as if 
he didn't listen to Kong Changzheng's words.

"...Let me tell you, Lao Gu, our tiger company will soon become a tiger battalion. You didn't even 
mention it, and I don't see that you have any preparations. Are you really planning to let someone 
pick our ready-made peaches?"

"Old Kong, what will happen to the Tiger Company in the future? We have already made 
arrangements in the organization. These are not things we should consider."

Gu Shinian said and patted Kong Changzheng's shoulder, "Don't worry, I know this matter well."

After Gu Shinian left in a hurry, Kong Changzheng stood there stupidly, his expression changing for 
a long time, before finally returning to his office with suspicion.

...

Yun Chang and Gu Shinian entered the art troupe carrying fruit, and a raw-faced female soldier 
walked up to her, holding a kettle in her hand, as if she was going to fetch water.

Seeing a stranger coming to the regiment and walking straight in without being led by anyone, the 
female soldier stopped and asked in surprise, "Comrade, this is an art troupe, who are you looking 
for?"

Yun Shang looked the lesbian up and down, confirmed that she had not met her before, and asked 
with a smile, "Are you a new recruit?"

I heard Wu Xiang say that the regiment is going to recruit new recruits before, and counting the 
time, it is almost the end of the recruit training, but I don't know how many people the regiment has 
recruited this time.



The female soldier nodded, and wanted to ask something, but she heard Yunshang continue, "Are 
Head Yang and Deputy Head Guan in the regiment at the moment?"

"Yes, Head Yang and Deputy Head Guan are in the rehearsal hall. Comrade, do you want me to take 
you there?"

Faced with the enthusiastic question from the new recruit Danzi, Yun Shang couldn't help but point 
to Yao Ke who ran over from a distance, "No need, I know all the veterans in the regiment except 
you new recruits."

After speaking, he waved to Yao Ke and quickly went up to meet him.

"Yunshang! It's really you!" Yao Ke pulled Yunshang up and down to look around, full of surprises, 
"That's right, the spirit is much better than when he was discharged from the hospital. It can be seen 
that staying at home this year is quite comfortable."

I haven't seen Yao Ke for nearly a year, and Yun Shang was also a little bit worried, so he pulled her 
to ask about the situation in the group, and asked about the recent situation of several people who 
were close to her.

"Yunshang, it's not a coincidence that you came here today. Wu Xiang was admitted to university, 
and just finished the formalities and went home in the morning. That guy Wen Chengjie went to the 
provincial military area yesterday.

I won't be back until next week, if only you came here yesterday, everyone can get together..."

Yao Ke felt it was a pity, but Yunshang felt that there was nothing to regret. Wu Xiang was also 
admitted to a university in the capital city. Although the two of them are not in the same school, 
they can still get together on weekends or when there are few classes, and they are not in a hurry to 
see each other for a while.

As for Wen Chengjie, he is a pure foodie. What he misses is the delicious food in her pocket, not 
her friend.



For this kind of person who patronizes his mouth and disregards his friendship, Yunshang said that 
she doesn't want to be friends with him at all.

Yunshang took Yao Ke's arm, and said shamelessly, "Sister Yao Ke, Wu Xiang and I will both go to 
school in the capital from now on, and there are plenty of opportunities to meet each other. I'm here 
today mainly to see you and the two team leaders. As long as I can see you, it doesn't matter if I can 
see other people."

Gu Shinian: "..."

The little girl started coaxing people again.

Yun Shang's shameless coaxing words really made Yao Ke's eye circles feel hot.

What a girl!

When I came to the regiment, I was only sixteen years old, and I was still a half-grown baby. In the 
blink of an eye, I have grown into a big girl.

Now Yunshang has been admitted to university and has become a serious college student. I still 
remember to come back to see the old leader and see her as an old friend. It is so kind and touching.

The two soon arrived at the rehearsal hall. Guan Min and Yang Hongying were very happy to see 
Yun Shang coming.

Especially knowing that Yunshang was admitted to Capital University, the two were happy, but 
regretted that Yunshang changed jobs early, otherwise, the art troupe would have produced two 
serious college students this year.

Of course, Yu Min regretted Yun Shang's change of career more than the university entrance exam.

After all, Yunshang's violin level is quite high, and she has won a gold medal in the military art 
show. It would be a pity to change her career like this, and it would be a waste of Yunshang's talent.



It's just that this is Yunshang's own choice after all, and even the Bai family did not intervene. As an 
outsider, it is not good for her to intervene in this matter.

...

When Yunshang and Gu Shinian showed up at the art troupe, the rumors about their breakup 
dissipated immediately.

After the two left in the afternoon, Yao Ke called Wu Xiang very embarrassingly, and told about 
Yunshang returning to the art troupe to see her. Her triumphant tone could hardly be concealed, and 
Wu Xiang was so angry that she immediately called Gu Xiang. Shi Nian made a phone call and 
asked Yun Shang to go to the city to see her, otherwise she would go to the mountains and break up 
with Yun Shang face to face.

It was hard for Yunshang to untangle her heart, and accepted Gu Shinian again. The two of them 
were tired of being together every day and they were not sticky enough. How could they be willing 
to waste time on Wu Xiang? Going to the capital together' sent Wu Xiang away.

Chapter 712 Retaliation

Yunshang returned to the capital a week later, and Wu Xiang, who was about to go to school in the 
capital, was with her.

The two juicy girls had been on the train for three days, and after getting off the train, they were 
boiled into prunes without water, and they were listless.

The old man was bored at home and was really thinking about Yunshang, so he took Bai Yancheng's 
job to pick up Yunshang at the train station, dressed in a clean old military uniform, and led his 
guards, and came running in good spirits Picked up my granddaughter at the train station.

After Yunshang got off the train, she saw the old man standing majestically on the platform, 
pretending to be holding a cane in his hand, and looking at her with gray eyebrows, he almost fell to 
the ground.

"Master! Why did you come out alone? Where's my dad? Where's my mom?" Could it be that you 
sent me to work somewhere again?

The old man raised his brows, and asked very unhappy, "What's the matter, it's not enough for 
grandpa to pick you up, so you have to miss your unreliable father?"



His brain is not as good as his, and his speech is not as effective as his at home. The key is that he is 
not as handsome as he was when he was young. What is there to worry about?

The corners of Yunshang's mouth trembled, and she quickly grabbed the old man's arm, followed 
the old man's words and belittled Bai Yancheng a few words without limit, and even flattered the 
old man when it was done, making the old man happy with a few words.

"call!"

Yun Shang wiped off the cold sweat that didn't exist on her head, and quickly introduced Wu Xiang, 
who was wide-eyed and astonished, to the old man, "Master, this is Wu Xiang. When I was in 
Yicheng, a comrade in the dormitory also passed the exam. I’m in college, it’s the same school as 
my sister.”

Wu Xiang hurried forward and gave the old man a military salute, like a little soldier waiting for the 
chief inspector, with a straight posture and an excited expression.

This is the famous old general Bai, I never thought that she would be able to meet a real person one 
day!

It's just that old general Bai has a weird temper.

Seeing that there was an outsider, the old man immediately raised his face, looked Wu Xiang up and 
down, said "yes" a few times in an airy manner, and turned around to greet the two of them to get in 
the car and go home.

It was the first time for Wu Xiangchang to come to the capital, and everything he saw on the road 
was strange. In addition, Yunshang introduced Wu Xiang the route of the capital all the way. When 
the group arrived home, Wu Xiang already knew the location of the Normal University.

Pushing open the courtyard gate, Yun Chang just stepped in with one foot when she heard Bai 
Yancheng's roar in the room:

"...What are you bastards! You didn't know how to back someone up when you were fighting, and 
you dragged him outside to beat him up? Now, everyone in the compound knows that my son, Bai 



Yancheng, is behind someone's back in a fight. Punishment. I am too old to embarrass myself with 
you, you worthless thing!"

No need to ask, it was Bai Qingming who did something stupid again, and Bai Yancheng scolded 
Bai Qingming over the phone to relieve his anger.

The old man's face turned dark when he heard it, and he didn't even bother to take the crutches he 
used to put on airs. He strode into the house and scolded Bai Yancheng as he walked: "Bai 
Yancheng! You old bastard! I didn't teach you like that back then. Excuse me, what do you mean by 
training Xiaoliuzi every day!"

There are Xiaoqi's guests at home today, if you don't restrain your dog temper, you will scare the 
guests and embarrass Xiaoqi, I have to peel off your old skin!

Wu Xiang was frightened by the 'lively' of the Bai family, and stroked the door nervously, 
wondering if he should go in at this time.

Is everyone in Yunshang's family so 'hot'?

Old General Bai reprimanded Commander Bai as if he were reprimanding a three-year-old child. 
But Commander Bai secretly taught his son how to beat people with black hands, and evaded 
punishment. After the incident, he thought his son was too ugly, and gave him a scolding like a 
grandson.

This is too... Destroying the image.

Yun Chang covered her face in despair, she didn't know what reason to look for to restore the image 
of her father and father, so she had to grind her back molars, and brought Wu Xiang in just like that.

At this moment, Bai Yancheng also knew that Yunshang was back, and brought friends to the door, 
immediately put down the phone, picked up the parental airs and sat on the sofa to read the 
newspaper, pretending that he was not the one who got angry and scolded people just now.

Yun Shang: "..."

The vest fell to the ground and was so broken that I couldn't pick it up.



What else is there to dress up?

Wu Xiang was also speechless for a while, held back a smile and greeted Bai Yancheng, and ate a 
bowl of hot porridge with Yunshang, and carried his luggage to the guest room very interestingly, 
giving the family room to talk space.

With a straight face, Yun Chang looked at Bai Yancheng without saying a word, until Bai Yancheng 
felt guilty, and confessed why he scolded Bai Qingming.

"Little Six is so careless. He heard people say bad things about Dacheng, so he didn't know how to 
beat him quietly, but instead confronted people face to face. It's good now, he's beaten people until 
his nose is bruised and his face is swollen. He's had a good time beating him, but he's also got a 
wound on his back A punishment. It's embarrassing for me!"

Yunshang was stunned for a moment, and asked Bai Yancheng, "Dad, didn't my little brother say 
that he has the hope of going up another promotion this year? Will the punishment affect him at this 
time?"

"He is now in the probation period, how could it be unaffected?" Bai Yancheng became angry when 
he mentioned this matter, gasping for breath, "Hmph! How can you hit someone face-to-face when 
you beat someone? Say hello to a place you can't see! I don't believe that person can take off his 
pants and let everyone see his buttocks for an injury test!"

Yun Shang: "..." So this is the master!

Seeing that Bai Yancheng's words became more and more outrageous, the old man said angrily, 
"Speak politely in front of my granddaughter."

One is taking off his pants, and the other is looking at his ass, can he say this in front of Xiaoqi?

It's still too little to be cleaned up by Lin Wenlan!

Yun Shang doggedly poured a cup of tea for the old man and handed it to the old man, occupied the 
old man's mouth, and then asked Bai Yancheng, "Dad, what about Dacheng, little six are fighting 
with others because of Dacheng's matter, Dacheng didn't stop me ?"



"Hmph! Speaking of this makes me even more angry!" Bai Yancheng's face darkened even more, 
and he took a sip of water from the cup, and said angrily, "I asked that dog. But that bastard 
squeaked Woohoo, it took me a long time before I told me that Dacheng was admitted to university 
and returned to Linyang two days ago!"

Dacheng patted his ass and went back to be a college student, but the little six son, a fool, rushed to 
fight against Dacheng because others were behind his back, and he was punished when he was 
done.

This is too aggrieved panic!

He didn't even think about it, even if others talked about Dacheng behind his back, how could it be 
a coincidence that he heard it?

And it happened at the juncture when he was about to be promoted.

Alas, there have been no idiots in the Bai family for several generations, so why did such a weirdo 
like Bai Qingming suddenly pop up?

Yun Shang didn't know what to say, so she could only light a candle for Bai Qingming in her heart, 
and pray that he would not suffer from Bai Yancheng's soles next time he came back.

Chapter 713 University Registration

The old man looked at Bai Yancheng's darkened face, and smiled gloatingly, "Back then, I said to 
let the little six stay in the capital, and your mother and I will take care of you. Make you a fool."

Bai Yancheng: "..." The old man is so ugly, this kind of brain is born, does it have anything to do 
with who raises the child?

Based on the old man's family status, Yun Chang hugged the old man's thigh without hesitation, and 
helped the old man step on his own father's foot, "Yes! Dad, my father can raise more sons than 
you. Look, my father raised him The two sons are more successful than the other, how about you? 
Except for my elder brother who is still good, the younger brother has made you a fool, which is an 
embarrassment to our family. My father is more powerful in raising children."

Tiny! Your old man will always be your old man, and he can cut you in any way.



Bai Yancheng's face turned even darker, and now he didn't feel that Yunshang was his most intimate 
little padded jacket, but a black hearted padded jacket specially designed to trick me.

The corner of the old man's mouth twitched, and his brows were raised proudly.

Look, this is why he loves Xiao Qi the most!

There are more than a dozen people in the family, only Xiaoqi is the most caring. No matter what 
happens, she is unswervingly on the same front with him. Such a good granddaughter is naturally 
pampered.

Seeing that Bai Yancheng's face was getting more and more ugly, Yun Chang thought about it for a 
while, and comforted him very intimately:

"Dad, don't be angry. In fact, my little brother is very good. It's just that he is left in our house and is 
not noticed by my brothers. That's why you think that little brother can't do anything."

The three brothers of the big family of the Bai family have established themselves in their 
respective units, and their future is bright. Bai Qing of the second room is doing well in the 
southern military region. In addition, he has a good brain and wrist, and he also has a bright future. .

As an ordinary person, Bai Qingming naturally looks a little inferior against the backdrop of his 
four outstanding brothers.

But having said that, if Bai Qingming is taken out alone, compared with most people, Bai Qingming 
is still quite good.

At least Bai Qingming is good looking, tall and strong, with a good-looking face and a good temper. 
He has a good relationship with elders when he goes out, and he is also liked by older girls. He will 
definitely find a wife in the future.

It's better than those boys who no one wants to marry, right?



And Bai Qingming's brain is not that bad, it's just that when relatives and friends encounter 
troubles, they tend to get angry easily, and there is no other major problem except that they are not 
calm enough.

But doesn't this just show that Bai Qingming values friendship?

Besides, when something happens to one's relatives and friends, how many people can really calm 
down and not get angry?

Yun Chang spoke a few words of persuasion, Bai Yancheng finally felt less angry, and finally told 
Yun Shang when she went upstairs, asking her to call Bai Qingming in two days, and try to trick Bai 
Qingming into talking to someone else. The real reason for fighting.

After all, he is his own son, and Bai Yancheng knows exactly who Bai Qingming is.

The little six in their family don't have much wisdom, but they definitely don't lack little cleverness. 
It's impossible for a child who has been mischievous since childhood to fight with others just 
because of a few gossips. There must be other reasons for this.

Yun Chang also felt that Bai Qingming was not telling the truth, and after listening to Bai 
Yancheng's order, she readily agreed.

...

Wu Xiang lived in Bai's house for a day and was ready to report to school. It happened that Bai 
Qingyue was also going to report, so the two of them didn't need someone to send them off. One of 
them pushed a bicycle with two large packages to report to school.

But Bai Yancheng was still worried, and called the guards to drive the car past, and followed him 
from a distance, watching the two of them enter the school gate before turning back.

At this time, Yunshang's luggage was almost packed, and two large suitcases were taken out, one 
was full of seasonal clothes, and the other was full of food and daily necessities.

Lin Wenlan packed the quilts, washbasins, towels, lunch boxes and other things for the 
accommodation separately and put them downstairs early.



Yun Chang took her coat and went out the gate, and saw Bai Yancheng standing beside the car with 
a dark face,

The old man was wearing a new military uniform, holding the decorative cane, and the old man was 
always sitting in the co-pilot seat and confronting Bai Yancheng.

Seeing Yunshang coming out, the old man's eyes lit up, and he waved at Yunshang, "Xiaoqi, get in 
the car, your dad has to go to work, and it happens that my grandfather is going to your school to 
chat with the old guy, and I will take you there by the way." .”

Yun Shang: "..."

Lord, my dad is your son, my own son! Tap the pit next time.

Lin Wenlan smiled and opened the rear door, stuffed the bedding in the back, put the suitcase on it, 
and pushed Yunshang into the car, and the mother and daughter squeezed into the back row.

Seeing that there was no room left in the car, the old man ignored Bai Yancheng's black face and 
directed the guards to drive, and headed for the Capital University in no time.

Yun Shang once again expressed her deep sympathy to her father. When meeting an old man like 
Mr. Bai, Bai Yancheng is a dragon, and he can be rubbed into a snake.

Well, it's better to take a kind of small vegetable snake that can be served on the table after washing.

Capital University is not too far from the big courtyard, but even closer to the small courtyard. Lin 
Wenlan was still talking about it on the road. When she turned around, she and Aunt Wu would 
come over to tidy up the small courtyard. I can go home and eat.

The old man frowned more and more, and finally said before the car stopped, "Second daughter-in-
law, you go to the department store tomorrow to buy a bicycle for Xiao Qi, and you can buy that 
kind of lady's car. It is also convenient for Xiao Qi to get out of school and leave school." , I will 
pay for the car. By the way, buy me a pair of reading glasses and put them in the small courtyard so 
that I won’t delay reading the newspaper when I go there occasionally.”



Yun Chang almost laughed.

The old man is so cute, and he obviously wants to move here, but I'm too embarrassed to say it 
directly, so I just made such a stupid excuse and pointed out that he also wants to move here.

How could Lin Wenlan not know what the old man was thinking, she was amused in her heart, but 
said respectfully on her face, "Dad, we don't feel at ease if you live alone, the small courtyard room 
is enough, so you can move in and live with us."

The old man raised his eyebrows, hesitated for a long time, and nodded in order to avoid 
embarrassment, "That's all right, the second child has dozens of people, and life is still too old, I 
don't care if I go and look at it." worried……"

Yun Shang: "..." Master, you are being hypocritical!

The guard couldn't bear the pain in his stomach. Seeing that he was about to arrive at the school, he 
quickly parked the car on the side of the road, first helped the old man get out of the car, and then 
helped to carry the luggage.

The two suitcases were not particularly big, and Lin Wenlan carried one in each hand. Yun Chang 
hurried over to pick up the bedding roll, hung the net bag containing washbasin towels on the old 
man's arm, and the family walked to the school.

Chapter 714: The Reason for the Fight

This year's freshmen are the first batch of college students after the resumption of the college 
entrance examination. Capital University attaches great importance to it and takes care of it. The 
school not only has comrades who are responsible for receiving new students, but also repairs the 
student dormitory in advance.

Although there are eight people living in a dormitory, the dormitory walls look black on the east and 
white on the west, as if they have been patched, but after all this is the school's care and care for the 
students.

Yun Shang chose the Department of Economics. There are relatively few girls in the department, so 
she can only mix and match with students from other departments.

Fortunately, Yunshang came earlier. When they arrived at the dormitory, there were only two 
students. They were students from the Chinese Department. up.



Lin Wenlan chose the upper bunk next to the window for Yun Chang, pasted the wall with white 
paper, spread a thick quilt, and hung pink cotton curtains on the outside, and a simple and warm 
nest was settled.

Although it is inconvenient to sleep on the upper bunk and climb up and down, the benefits are 
obvious, at least it is clean, and no one will sit on it casually.

This is really the best thing for a person like Yunshang who has a mental cleanliness.

The old man walked around the dormitory with his hands behind his back, frowned and nodded, 
"Very good! Eight people are not too many in such a big dormitory. When we were fighting, we 
used to sleep more than a dozen people in one bunk, and turned over at night. There are no other 
places, which is much better than ours at that time.”

That's what the old man said, but he kept muttering in his heart, this house is not as clean as the 
house, and I don't know that Xiao Qi can't live in it.

Xiaoqi's illness is just right, what if he suffers from the problem of recognizing his bed again, and 
can't sleep all night?

Yun Shang is quite satisfied. Although the dormitory environment is not satisfactory, she is here to 
go to school, not to enjoy it. It makes no sense that others are used to living here, so it will not work 
when she comes here.

Besides, she is used to living in the dormitory of the army, and it is not so difficult to accept living 
in the school dormitory now.

After completing the registration procedures, Lin Wenlan and the old man went home with 
thousands of reminders. After Yunshang sent the two away, they were not in a hurry to return to the 
dormitory. Instead, they walked to the nearest post office and were called by Bai Qingming.

Little Six is the only Erha in the family. She must always care for Erha, pay attention to Erha's 
mental health, and not let Erha be bullied.



Bai Qingming didn't know that he was the image of a dog in Yunshang's heart. When he received 
Yunshang's call, his gloomy mood improved a lot, and he even had a smile on his face.

"Little Seven, did you report to school today? What else do you need, just tell me, I'll buy it for you 
next time I go back!"

He has been earning wages for several years. Although he doesn't have a lot of savings, he still has 
pocket money for his sister.

snort! He is not Bai Siling, he handed over all the monthly salary subsidies, his pockets are more 
clean than his face all the year round, he doesn't even have the money to buy cigarettes, and he 
doesn't have any dignity of a man.

Bai Qingming complained about his own father in his heart, and his depressed mood became 
clearer.

Although it was a bit immoral, he couldn't help but feel secretly refreshed when he thought of the 
old man who often beat him up and cried for his mother, who was always short of breath because he 
had no money in his pocket.

At the very least, he is much better than Commander Bai when it comes to controlling wages.

Yun Shang heard Bai Qingming's voice still alive and well, so she relaxed a lot and ordered several 
snacks in one go. After Bai Qingming promised to buy them all for her, she pretended to 
inadvertently ask him about the fight.

"Hey! That kid deserves a beating. It was a coincidence that he was beating someone. It happened 
to be seen by others. Otherwise, there would be nothing wrong with this time."

"Little six, my dad said that you went to beat him because that man talked about Brother Dacheng 
behind his back. Is it true?"

Bai Qingming was silent on the other end of the phone for a while, and replied in a low voice, 
"...well, that person has a bad mouth, and I wanted to beat him up a long time ago."



This is not the truth, Yunshang frowned, and immediately raised her tone, "Little six, you are not 
honest, you are not telling the truth to me."

The man who has never won a fight with me,

Others don't understand you, don't I understand?

When Yun Chang opened her mouth, the meaning of ridicule came out immediately. Bai Qingming 
pinched the microphone, feeling the chills in the back of her spine, and panicked inexplicably. She 
always felt that Yun Chang, who had suffered a serious illness, was more scary than before.

"Xiao Qi, what do you want to ask?"

"Ask why you fought with someone!" Before Bai Qingming could speak, Yun Shang added, "Don't 
fool me with the reason you fooled our dad."

Bai Qingming's words got stuck in his mouth, and after thinking for a while, he said helplessly, 
"Xiaoqi, this matter really has nothing to do with what that person said about Dacheng. I beat him 
because he owed it. As for the reason... Xiaoqi, don't ask if it's okay?"

Upon hearing this, Yun Shang put away the smile on her lips.

Since childhood, Bai Qingming has been the kind of flamboyant person who can't hide things in his 
heart. Because of his similar age, he will not hide anything from her.

This time it was uncharacteristically beating someone in public, and he didn't even tell her the 
reason, how strange it was.

Yun Chang pondered for a long time, and tentatively asked Bai Qingming, "Little Six, do you have 
a lesbian you like, and you were turned over by that person..."

"Nothing!" Before Yunshang finished speaking, Bai Qingming categorically denied it, and even 
criticized Yunshang seriously, "Xiaoqi, you are a party member, how can you ruin your brother's 
reputation with nonsense?"



Yun Chang breathed a sigh of relief, as long as there is no one she likes, she still wants to match Wu 
Xiang and Bai Qingming, but she can't make a mistake at a critical moment.

"That man didn't poach your corner, why are you so stubborn to beat him up? Could it be that you 
deliberately bullied people in the name of our father?"

Bai Qingming: "..."

I would, but would I dare?

If he really did this, Commander Bai could go to the troops and break his legs!

Yun Chang curled her lips, rubbed her forehead and continued to say, "Little six, you are not a 
troublesome person. If that person didn't really provoke you, you can't beat him. Tell me, is that 
person behind your back?" Talking about your identity, are you talking about our family members?"

Bai Qingming's eyes widened suddenly, and the hand holding the phone trembled.

It's amazing!

Does Xiao Qi have clairvoyance or ear? Xiao Qi guessed what he wanted to hide in a few words.

"Xiaoqi, my dad was transferred back to the capital city last year, which hindered many people's 
eyes. Someone in that boy's family made some contributions in the southwest. He originally wanted 
to be transferred to the capital city by virtue of his military merits, but he didn't succeed... He didn't 
have the guts to climb up. To talk about our grandfather and our father, we can only talk about 
things like our peers."

Chapter 715: Everyone in the dormitory

As soon as Bai Qingming finished speaking, Yun Chang knew what was going on.

The other party talked about people of the same generation, so he had to drag her and Bai Qingyue. 
How could he bear Bai Qingming's violent temper to protect the calf? If you don't smash the 
opponent's head, you will be merciful.

"Xiao Qi, don't tell Dad about this, lest he get angry after hearing it."



In Bai Yancheng's eyes, his son is the weeds on the side of the road, and only his daughter is the 
treasure he holds in his hands.

If Bai Yancheng knew that his two precious girls had been pulled out to talk, he would be so angry 
that he couldn't eat for three days.

As a filial son, Bai Qingming had to hide it from Bai Yancheng, so that his father would not lose his 
belly.

Yun Shang felt that she was also a filial daughter, so she readily agreed, "Okay, just pretend I didn't 
ask about it."

That's what he said, but Yun Chang made up his mind in his heart, when he had time later, he must 
go to the army to see Bai Qingming, and then knocked a sap by the way.

No matter what she said, she couldn't be scolded for nothing.

………………

Before the sun set, the people in the dormitory came one after another. Eight people, all of different 
ages, the youngest is like Yunshang, the real age is only nineteen years old, and the oldest lesbian is 
over thirty years old. Chang admired it.

After all, being able to get into the top universities in the country while raising children and 
working at the same time is enough to show the excellence of this lesbian.

Yun Shang asked herself that she couldn't do this.

On the first day of enrollment, after registering, everyone was busy getting things, changing meal 
tickets, making beds, etc. Everyone was so busy that they didn't have time to get to know each 
other.

In the evening, after all the people in the dormitory had arrived, everyone started talking and 
introduced their situation one by one.



The first person to speak was the educated youth sister who lives in the lower bunk next to the door, 
that is, the lesbian who reported for duty with her baby in her arms today:

"I'm from the Chinese Department. My name is Liu Min. I grew up in a small county below 
Rongcheng. I went to the northeast in 1961. I worked there as an educated youth for twelve years 
and settled down there.

I am a few years older than you, and I have experienced more things than you. If you encounter any 
difficulties in life or study in the future, just tell me, and I will definitely help if I can help. "

Liu Min's looks and clothes are not very good, but her clothes are clean and the patches on them are 
neatly applied. When the family members speak, they have a generous posture and a calm 
demeanor. As soon as they speak, they feel like an old lady. Come.

There are two young people in the dormitory. When they heard Liu Min's all-encompassing words, 
they felt as if they could rely on them. They put Liu Min at the center of their conversation without 
knowing it. Feel.

Yun Shang opened the curtain and looked at Liu Min's generous and confident face, and the 
importance she attached to Liu Min in her heart increased to a higher level.

She has a strong learning ability and can coordinate her family and career very well. In addition, her 
skills are not bad. As long as such a person has a decent temperament and does not go astray, no 
matter what kind of work she is engaged in in the future, she will be the best in the unit. By.

Liu Min raised his head, and everyone followed suit.

"My name is Qiao Yu, I'm also from the Department of Chinese, and I'm from Shenshi..."

"Lin Wenhua, from the English Department..."

"I'm also from the English department, from Yuncheng..."



After a while, all seven people in the dormitory except Yunshang introduced themselves. Only then 
did Yunshang know that everyone had a variety of jobs before, including educated youths, workers, 
small officers, and one without a job. Pure housewife. And among these seven people, three are 
married and have children.

After listening to everyone, Yunshang couldn't help but lamented that the situation of the first class 
of college students was complicated, and she was even more fortunate that the college entrance 
examination in this world was brought forward a few years, otherwise she would probably become 
a member of the college with a big belly.

Seeing that everyone was looking at her, Yun Chang briefly introduced her situation, then closed her 
mouth and acted as an audience.

There are eight people in the dormitory,

Except for Yunshang and Qiao Yu, one is a native of the capital and the other is a native of Shenshi, 
the others are all from some prefecture-level cities or counties.

The family composition is even more complicated. In addition to the pure military family like 
Yunshang, there are workers' families, some cadres' families, and Liu Min settled down in the 
countryside. They can be regarded as poor peasant families from the countryside.

However, people at this time were very simple. After everyone got to know each other, they all 
packed up their things, talked and laughed, and there was no phenomenon of anyone looking down 
on each other.

Of course, some people may have their own little thoughts in their hearts, but they just don't show 
them on the surface.

Although Yunshang's condition has almost recovered, the quality of sleep has not been very high. 
Hearing the sound of everyone whispering and laughing, he could not fall asleep for a long time in 
bed.

When Liu Min woke up the next morning, she saw Yun Shang staring down at the panda, and 
immediately jumped, "What's the matter? Did you not sleep well last night?"

"Yeah." Yun Shang nodded lazily, "I'm a bit reluctant, and I'll be fine in two days."



Seeing Yun Shang walking outside with a lunch box, Liu Min quickly followed up with a lunch box. 
Lin Wenhua and the two younger ones in the dormitory also followed up consciously.

Qiao Yu sat on the bed and saw several people going out surrounded by Yunshang, she rolled her 
eyes in disgust, and deliberately lagged behind everyone before going to the cafeteria to eat.

"Did you see that Qiao Yu is rolling his eyes at us?" Lin Wenhua, who was walking at the end, came 
over and whispered to everyone as soon as he came out.

Yun Shang pretended not to hear, and kept walking forward, while Liu Min frowned, and said, 
"Student Lin Wenhua, maybe you misunderstood. We just reported yesterday, and there was no 
conflict with each other before." How could classmate Qiao Yu roll her eyes at us so well?"

The expression on Lin Wenhua's face froze for a moment, and his eyes turned cold, "The five of us, 
who knows who Qiao Yu dislikes, maybe I was wrong."

Yun Chang rubbed the center of her eyebrows with a headache, and felt that it was not good that 
there were too many people in the dormitory, and it was easy to gossip and conflict with each other.

But girls, it's understandable.

It was probably the first day of school, and the breakfast in the school cafeteria was quite rich. Even 
the pickles were dripped with sesame oil, which tasted tangy, and even a tricky person like 
Yunshang could eat it very well.

After eating, a few people stuffed the cleaned lunch box into their schoolbags, and were about to go 
directly to class. As soon as they stepped down the steps, they heard someone shouting to Yun 
Chang from behind.

Yun Chang turned her head, raised her brows slightly, with a surprised expression, "It's you, long 
time no see."

Chapter 716 Go home

It was Jiang Shengnan who called Yunshang. When we were in the Linyang Military Region, we 
lived in a large courtyard, but we hadn't seen each other for a few years, and we became strangers to 
each other.



Seeing Yunshang, Jiang Shengnan was very happy. He chased after him a few steps and said, 
"Yunshang, it's really you! Why have you lost so much weight? I didn't dare to recognize you in the 
cafeteria before."

Yun Shang looked at Jiang Shengnan's round smiling face, and a smile appeared on his face, "You 
are also much taller than before. If I didn't pay special attention, I would never have thought that 
such a beautiful female classmate and I are old acquaintances."

"Yunshang, your mouth is still so good at coaxing people." Jiang Shengnan's cheeks were slightly 
red, and he smiled and 'compromised' Yunshang.

"By the way, Tian Li has also come to the capital. She is studying engineering, and she was 
admitted to the university next door. Let's have a good time together later."

After Yun Shang heard this, her complexion immediately became weird. Looking at Jiang 
Shengnan's smiling face, she asked curiously, "Are you reconciled with Tian Li?"

Back then when we were in Linyang, the school organized activities to support agriculture in the 
countryside. These two people had conflicts with the local villagers because of some bullshit. All 
right.

Thinking of Tian Li's childlike temperament, Yun Shang asked again, "You are the one who coaxed 
Tian Li?"

Jiang Shengnan blushed and nodded.

She really did not do it properly in that matter back then, and fortunately Tian Li is a good-natured 
person who does not hold grudges, otherwise she would have really lost such a good friend as Tian 
Li.

Yun Chang raised her wrist to check the time, and found that it was almost time for class, she 
walked towards the classroom and said, "Let's get together this Sunday, you and Tian Li go to my 
house for dinner, my mother must be happy to see you two. "



Old acquaintances who have lived in a large compound for more than ten years, and they are all 
promising juniors, Lin Wenlan can only be happy to see them.

"You just don't say that Tian Li and I will go to your house. Someone in our courtyard asked me and 
Tian Li to bring a gift to Aunt Lin. We are planning to send it to Aunt Lin this Sunday."

Yun Shang and Jiang Shengnan didn't deliberately avoid the crowd when they talked, and Liu Min 
and Lin Wenhua heard a lot of useful information at once.

Especially when Yunshang reported for duty yesterday, there were already two people in the 
dormitory, and they were the two lesbians who were following Liu Min at this moment.

Seeing Jiang Shengnan rushing to his department with the book in his arms, the lesbian named 
Cheng Chunxia said, "Yunshang, so your mother is also a soldier. I didn't realize it yesterday."

Yun Chang smiled and didn't say yes or no, but hurried to the classroom with the excuse that it was 
almost time for class.

After Yun Chang turned the corner and disappeared, Liu Min looked away with a thoughtful 
expression on his face, while Lin Wenhua's eyes flashed, and he deliberately said in a voice that Liu 
Min could hear, "I came to report yesterday, it seems I met Bai Yunshang at the school gate, and Bai 
Yunshang got off the car at that time."

"Did Bai Yunshang's family members drive a car to send her to report?" Cheng Chunxia asked with 
wide-eyed eyes.

Lin Wenhua glanced over Liu Min's calm face, nodded, and stopped talking.

...

After dinner, after Yunshang returned to the dormitory, she obviously felt that everyone was more 
enthusiastic about her. Even Qiao Yu, who rolled her eyes at everyone in the morning rumor, gave 
her a warm smile.

After answering Cheng Chunxia's question "Should I report by car?", Yun Chang was speechless.



When Mingming reported for duty before, she deliberately asked the guards to park the car a few 
hundred meters away, but she didn't expect that the people in the dormitory could see it like this. I 
have to say, it was really a coincidence.

Fortunately, although everyone was enthusiastic about her, their sense of proportion was still very 
good, and it didn't make Yun Shang feel uncomfortable.

In the first week of school, the freshmen and teachers passed by.

Yun Chang rushed back to the dormitory after class, packed her things, covered the bed tightly with 
a curtain, and ran to the school gate with her bag.

She hasn't seen her family for several days, to be honest,

I still miss it.

I don't know if the family misses her. Aunt Wu prepared some delicious food for her, as well as 
balls. She hasn't moved much recently, and I don't know if she has gotten better in the past two 
days.

By the way, Wu Xiang and his silly, sweet sister also went to the Normal University for a week of 
classes, and I don't know how those two are doing at school, whether the people in the dormitory 
get along well, whether they are being bullied...

As Yunshang walked, she pondered all kinds of thoughts in her heart. When she got out of the 
school gate, she saw Jiang Shengnan and Tian Li who were waiting at the gate early, and then she 
patted her forehead and reacted suddenly.

Yes! She had agreed with Jiang Shengnan early in the morning that she would invite the two of 
them to visit her home this week. In a hurry to go home, he forgot about this matter.

"Tian Li! Sheng Nan! Why are you two standing in front of the school so stupidly? Remember to 
find me in the dormitory next time."



Blocking people at the gate of the school has a feeling of 'don't leave after school', which doesn't 
always sound right.

As soon as Tian Li saw Yunshang, she ran over and hugged her, with a big smile on her face, 
pointed to a pile of packages on the ground and said:

"We are not stupid! There are so many things, and you have to carry them around when you go to 
your dormitory to find someone. It's troublesome! We wait for you at the school gate, so we don't 
have to walk too much, and we can wait for you. It's easy. !"

Yun Shang: "..."

Jiang Shengnan also nodded at the side, "These things have been in my place for a week, and they 
were supposed to be sent to Aunt Lin as soon as we arrived in the capital, but the train was delayed, 
and Tian Li and I rushed to report to the school as soon as we arrived in the capital, and we didn't 
have time to go your home."

Yun Chang looked at the packages on the ground. There were five packages, large and small, and 
each package was bulging, and she didn't know what was inside.

Fortunately, there is a bus going to the courtyard from the school side. After waiting for a few 
minutes on the side of the road, they jumped on the bus to go home.

...

The old man has been restless since he woke up this morning. When he took a nap in the afternoon, 
he didn’t go to play chess with his old comrades. Instead, he changed into new clothes, held a cup 
of freshly brewed tea, and sipped and strolled all the way. Da went to the gate of the courtyard.

After Yunshang got off the bus, she saw the old man sitting at the door of the reception room at a 
glance, her eyes were hot, and tears almost fell down.

"Master! It's still cold, you can just stay home and wait for me, why did you come out and wait for 
me?"



The old man raised his chin arrogantly, "Both our granddaughters are college students, I'm happy to 
wait for you when I come out!" Other old men want to pick up their granddaughters who are college 
students, but they have yet to pick them up!

After finishing the work, the old man looked at Yunshang's side, and then asked, "Xiaoqi, why are 
you back, where is my eldest granddaughter?"

Yun Shang: "..."

So, didn't the old man come out to pick her up alone?

Chapter 717 Visiting Relatives (2 in 1 Large Chapter)

Lin Wenlan was very happy to see Jiang Shengnan and Tian Li. While asking Aunt Wu to quickly 
add two meat dishes, she took out various sweets and snacks and stuffed them into their hands.

Tian Li has a lively personality and a sweet mouth. Sitting next to Yunshang, she chattered about 
the affairs of Linyang, and explained the situation of Linyang Military Region in recent years in just 
a few words.

Jiang Shengnan opened the package, took out the contents one by one, and introduced to Lin 
Wenlan, "This is the dried mushroom that Aunt Yu found from her hometown. I asked me to bring 
you a bag. This is the dried mushroom that my mother brought from her hometown. The millet I 
brought is particularly nutritious, and this is the bacon that Deputy Commander Liang asked me to 
bring..."

Yun Shang looked at the coffee table full of souvenirs, her eyes widened in shock, "Mom, there are 
so many things, what should we give in return?"

The Bai family has no relatives in the countryside, and the big family lives on the wages of Bai 
Yancheng and Lin Wenlan. Where can they find rare things to return gifts to their relatives and 
friends in Linyang?

Is it possible to send a few boxes of Beijing cakes back?

Do not make jokes!



Linyang is not far from the capital city, Linyang can occasionally find things unique to the capital 
city, and the salaries of the people in the courtyard are not low, who can care about the things that 
Linyang can find? ?

It's really exciting to receive the gift for a while, but heartbroken to return the gift.

Just thinking about it, Yun Shang gave Lin Wenlan a headache.

During the time they were talking, Bai Qingyue also came back from school, instead of going back 
to Han's house, she went directly to Bai's house.

Yun Shang glanced behind Bai Qingyue, and looked away disappointedly, "Sister, didn't Wu Xiang 
come back with you? I told her last time that she must come over for dinner this Sunday."

"I called Wu Xiang before I came back. It seems that there is some activity in their class, and Wu 
Xiang can't get away. Let me tell you."

"What's going on?"

Yun Chang chased after him, feeling very curious. It's just the beginning of school, and someone in 
Wu Xiang's class is organizing activities?

"It seems that someone in their class has joined the student union and wants to exchange ideas with 
the students in the class on Sunday. I didn't ask the specifics."

Yun Shang: "..."

It seems that there are capable people everywhere.

This person in Wu Xiang's class is more capable than Liu Min. He joined the student union less than 
a week after he came to school. It seems that he is also a character with long sleeves and good 
dancing.

Bai Qingyue came out after washing her face, sat down on the sofa and said, "Xiao Qi, Wu Xiang 
told you not to miss her. She will visit you at your school when she is free."



Yun Shang responded, and asked about the situation of the two at school.

Bai Qingyue has nothing to say, she is a local, her natal family is well-off, and her husband's 
background is also not ordinary, so no one dares to provoke her casually.

On the other hand, Wu Xiang had a conflict with a lesbian in the same dormitory on the day of 
reporting for the bed, and it was Bai Qingyue who came forward to help Wu Xiang to suppress the 
incident.

Jiang Shengnan and Tian Li were also listening with great interest, especially Tian Li, whose eyes 
widened and narrowed for a while, and the look of being startled and blinking was very amusing.

"Your school has a lot of lesbians. It's very lively to live in a dormitory with eight people. We only 
have four people in our dormitory, and they're all from different departments. We don't even have a 
companion when we go to the classroom."

After hearing Tian Li's complaints, the three of them were speechless.

Everyone wants to live in a four-person room without conditions, but Tian Li feels that it is not 
lively enough because of living in a four-person room. This is the big fool hiding among them!

...

Lin Wenlan packed up her things, greeted everyone to the table with a smile, and kept telling Jiang 
Shengnan and Tian Li to talk if they had something to do in the capital. From now on, every 
Sunday, she would come back with Yunshang to sit down and sit down. do not mention it……

After eating, the sky also darkened slightly, worried that there would be no bus later, Jiang 
Shengnan and Tian Li insisted on going back to school regardless of Yunshang and Lin Wenlan's 
persuasion.

Seeing Yun Shang finished seeing off people and coming in from the outside with his head lowered, 
Bai Yancheng coughed vigorously, and after getting Yun Shang's attention, he waved to her.



"Little Seven, have you called Little Six the past two days?" In the study, Bai Yancheng asked 
slowly while taking a sip of his tea while holding the air of a parent.

Yun Shang sat down opposite Bai Yancheng, and lied without blushing, "I beat him. The little 
brother said that he beat him because he was sloppy and talked about Brother Dacheng behind his 
back. He also chose it at that time." It's just a coincidence that someone happened to see it."

Bai Yancheng frowned, and his suspicious eyes fell on Yunshang's face, "Little Six told you so?"

"Yeah." Yun Chang blinked her eyes and nodded her head vigorously, as if her lies would come 
true, "I've been fooling around for a long time, but with the brains of our little six, I'm sure I won't 
be fooled."

Bai Yancheng looked at Yun Shang's extremely sincere face, and felt that his brain was starting to 
hurt.

It's over, Xiaoqi let Xiaoliuzi lead him badly, and they all started to learn to make up nonsense to 
coax him.

"Xiao Qi, do you know that when you tell lies, your eyes blink very quickly..."

Yun Chang was stunned, and looked at Bai Yancheng stupidly, unable to recover for a long time.

real or fake?

Does she blink very fast when she tells a lie?

Why didn't Second Brother Gu remind her!

Her family, Commander Bai, could not have lied to her, right?

With a straight face, Bai Yancheng gave a cold "hum", then raised his voice and continued to ask, 
"Say! What's going on!"



Yun Chang pursed her lips tightly, staring at Bai Yancheng like a fool, not knowing for a long time 
whether she should confess or not.

"Dad, I didn't coax you. That's what Little Six said. If you don't believe me, call and ask Little Six!"

After thinking about it for a while, Yun Shang decided to fight to the end, resolutely refusing to 
admit that she had lied to Bai Yancheng.

Her character design is the most intimate little padded jacket, how can she do things to deceive 
parents?

Yun Chang didn't know that she had been a black heart in Bai Yancheng's heart for a long time, and 
now the expression on her face was filled with resentment and resentment, as if Bai Yancheng didn't 
believe her anymore, she would go out to complain to Lin Wenlan.

Bai Yancheng was pinched seven inches by Yunshang, and he was immediately coaxed, "It's not that 
Dad doesn't believe you, it's not... It's not that Little Six is too cunning, Dad is afraid that you will 
be coaxed by Little Six."

What a black hearted cotton, he would sue at every turn, how could there be such an aggrieved 
father like him in the world.

Yun Chang's small eyes glanced at Bai Yancheng's face, the corners of her mouth suddenly turned 
up, she lay down on the table, and asked in a low voice, "Dad, how much pocket money did my 
mother send you this month?"

Bai Yancheng subconsciously touched his pocket. It was empty, only a few food stamps. He 
couldn't help blushing, and asked Yun Shang, "Why are you asking this? Is there no money to use? 
Wait, I will follow you tonight." Mom said, let her get you some money tomorrow."

As soon as Yun Chang heard it, she understood that Bai Yancheng's pockets were cleaner than his 
face again this month, and he tried hard to suppress the corners of his upturned mouth, and took out 
two ten-yuan bills from his pocket, and stuffed them into Bai Yancheng's hands.

"Dad, this is my filial piety money for you. You keep it quietly, don't let my mother know."



Look at you, you are poor, you are also the head of the famous side when you go out, but your 
pockets are so clean that you don't even have money to buy cigarettes, and there is no place to put 
your old face when it gets out.

Bai Yancheng has been taking pocket money from Yunshang in recent years, and he didn't feel 
ashamed, so he put the money in his pocket openly, and then asked Yunshang's purpose.

"Tell me, what do you want to do?"

"Dad, next replay week, I want to visit my little brother and send him some delicious food."

"No." Bai Yancheng refused without even thinking about it, "It's a hundred miles away from home 
to Xiaoliuzi, and it takes four or five hours to go back and forth on the light road, and your body 
can't bear it."

Seeing that the smile on Yun Chang's face disappeared, Bai Yancheng added, "Besides, the little six 
got punished and I haven't whipped him yet. You still want to give him delicious food? You're really 
used to him! "

Yun Chang's face darkened immediately, and she grabbed Bai Yancheng's sleeve with her hands, 
and said angrily, "Return the twenty yuan to me! Don't let me see my brother, and I won't buy you 
cigarettes!"

I gave you 20 yuan pocket money just to get you to agree to my going out to see Xiao Liuzi, but 
you just took the money and did nothing, so what good things are you thinking about!

Bai Yancheng quickly covered the money pocket, and said with a smile, "Xiaoqi, Dad will call 
Xiaoliuzi tomorrow and ask him to come back to see you when he is free recently, okay?"

"Not good!" Yunshang shook her head, and continued to ask Bai Yancheng for money, "I went to 
see Xiaoliuzi, mainly because I wanted to go out for a walk. If you won't let me go out, then I won't 
let you smoke either."

Bai Yancheng was helpless, and while clutching his pockets tightly, he coaxed Yunshang, "Xiao Qi, 
see if this will work, let your sister accompany you to the military area next week, when your sister 
goes to see Han Chen, you Go and see Little Six, okay?"



Yun Chang thought for a while, then nodded, "Okay, then I'll go tell my sister and ask her to prepare 
things in advance."

When Yunshang opened the door and went out, Bai Yancheng let out a soft cry, took out an iron jar 
full of money from under the cabinet, stuffed the twenty yuan that Yunshang had given into it, and 
put the jar back again.

………………

Once people get busy, the days go by quickly, and in a blink of an eye it will be time for worship 
again.

During the days when Yunshang went to school, Lin Wenlan took Aunt Wu to clean up the small 
courtyard from the inside to the outside, and moved the people who lived at home little by little.

Now Yunshang doesn't even need to take the bus when she goes home, she just rides on Lin 
Wenlan's newly bought bicycle and gets home in only ten minutes.

It's just that Yunshang and Bai Qingyue were going to see Han Chen and Bai Qingming this week, 
and when they came back, they didn't even bother to eat at home, so they took their packed things 
and hurried to the station.

The two delicate girls were about to go out, so Bai Yancheng couldn't be at ease no matter what he 
thought, so he personally sent them to the bus bound for the military region, and then called Bai 
Qingming and Han Chen, telling them to go to the station to pick them up , if Yunshang and Bai 
Qingyue lost one of them, he would go over and break their dog legs.

Knowing that Yunshang was coming, Bai Qingming's calves were spinning in fright.

He knows Yun Shang too well.

He said that he came to see him, but in fact he came for the purpose of causing trouble.



It's just that the military region is no better than at home. The family can let Yunshang do 
everything, but when he arrives at the military region, especially if he wants to trouble his grandson 
who has fought against him, he can see how difficult it is if he thinks about it with his toes.

The two of them had just fought in the war, and had just been criticized and educated by the 
organization. If something happened to the grandson at this time, no one would suspect that he did 
it.

Even if he goes all out and takes another punishment, hold down the grandson and beat him again, 
but what if he bumps into Yunshang when he strikes?

At that time, before the organization punishes him, Commander Bai will go into battle with sticks 
and shoe soles, beating him so hard that he can't take care of himself.

Bai Qingming's heart was pounding, but he still had to pull himself together and rushed to the 
station to pick him up.

Han Chen and Bai Qingming were not in the same camp. When he arrived at the station covered in 
mud, Bai Qingming was already waiting outside.

"Qingming, did something happen at home, how did your sister and Yunshang come here?"

The corners of Bai Qingming's mouth trembled, and he said calmly, "It's okay, Xiaoqi said she was 
bored at home and wanted to come out for a stroll, so she urged my sister to come over."

Han Chen raised his wrist to check the time, with a smile unconsciously on his face, "It's almost 
seven o'clock, the car is coming soon."

When Bai Qingming heard this, his face turned ugly again.

...

The sky gradually darkened, and the last bus stopped slowly by the side of the road.



Yun Chang clutched her chest, resisting the urge to vomit, and squeezed out of the car on Bai 
Qingyue's shoulder.

"Sister! Xiaoqi!" Bai Qingming rushed over, and was shocked when he saw Yunshang lying on Bai 
Qingyue's body as if he had no bones. He quickly helped Yunshang and asked, "Sister, Xiaoqi 
What's the matter? Sick again?"

Han Chen took the package from Bai Qingyue's hand and looked at Yunshang's face, "It must be 
motion sickness. I'll get some porridge for Yunshang when I go back. I should be fine after a night's 
rest."

Yun Shang also said weakly from the side, "It's a little motion sickness. Someone brought chickens 
in the car, and the whole car smells like chicken feces. It's really bad."

As he spoke, he raised his arm and smelled it, and smelled a faint smell of chicken excrement. He 
couldn't help but retched a few times, and his face became even uglier.

Bai Qingyue saw it anxiously, and pulled Bai Qingming away, stroking Yun Chang's back to give 
her comfort, and still muttered:

"Tell me about you. If you want to go out and wander around, you can't go there! There are parks 
and shopping malls near home, which are convenient and clean. Why come out and suffer this 
foreign crime..."

That's right, why did she come out and suffer this foreign crime!

Didn't she just want to come out and hit a sap, and before she had time to do it, she tormented 
herself enough, what was she planning.

No, Ming'er has to hit a few more sticks when she starts to do it, otherwise she will be sorry for the 
crime she has suffered.

"Xiao Qi, why don't you sleep with me at night, Xiao Liu can't even take care of himself, how can 
he take care of you."



As soon as Bai Qingyue opened her mouth, Han Chen's face turned dark, and Yun Shang panicked 
even more. She came here this time to beat the sap, not to make super big light bulbs.

"Sister, go back with Brother Han Chen, brother is fine, I'm not a child anymore, I can take care of 
myself."

The two sisters argued for a while, but Bai Qingyue couldn't hold back Yunshang after all, so she 
could only follow Han Chen and leave.

Chapter 718 Cheating

Bai Qingming originally wanted to take Yunshang to eat first, and then go to the guest house to rest, 
but Yunshang couldn't stand the smell of chicken feces all over her body, so she insisted on staying 
there first to take a shower, and then go to the small cafeteria for dinner.

Unable to resist Yunshang, Bai Qingming had no choice but to arrange for Yunshang to live in a 
guest house in the military region.

When Yunshang came out of the bathroom downstairs, Bai Qingming was sitting at the door of the 
guest house, talking to a gay man in military uniform. Seeing Yunshang coming out, Bai Qingming 
frowned and touched Yunshang's wet skin. hair, disapproving authentically:

"It's cold outside, why did you come out without wiping your hair, what should you do if you get 
sick later?"

Yun Shang patted Bai Qingming's hand away, half wrapped her head in a scarf, and gave him an 
annoyed sideways glance, "I've been wiping it for a long time, it's half dry."

Towels are not hair dryers, half-drying them will be enough, but what if you can dry them all at 
once?

Little Six is Moji!

Being dumped by his own sister, Bai Qingming was not angry, he smiled and pointed to the gay 
man next to him to introduce Yun Shang, "Xiao Qi, this is Gu Li, my old partner in the platoon. Gu 
Li, this is Our sister, my Xiaoqi!"



Seeing that Gu Li didn't know what to call her and became embarrassed, Yun Chang was speechless 
for a while.

This little six is really brainless, how could he introduce only his nickname and not his big name 
when he introduces it to others?

Her nickname is only called by her family members and those closest to her. Could it be that the 
first time they met, they let the gay men call her Comrade Xiaoqi?

Yunshang stepped on Bai Qingming directly, and greeted Gu Li with a smile, "Hello, Comrade Gu, 
my name is Bai Yunshang, just call me Comrade Bai."

Gu Li rubbed his clothes with his palms, and nodded uncomfortably at Yunshang, "Hello, Comrade 
Bai, uh, Qingming and I are partners, just call me by my name."

Bai Qingming also came to his senses at this moment, secretly tugged on Yunshang's sleeves, gave 
her a dry smile, put his arms around Gu Li's neck again, and led the two of them towards the 
military area.

"My Xiaoqi hasn't eaten yet, let's go, let's go to the small cafeteria to eat first, and then we'll find a 
way to get Zhang Hongqu's grandson out and beat him up..."

Gu Li was so worried that his intestines were knotted, "Do you really want to do this? You have just 
been punished. If it happens again, do you still want to do it in the army?"

Your sister finally came to visit her, not to mention playing around with your sister, but why do you 
want to trouble Zhang Hongqu at this time?

Do you want your sister to see how heroic you are when you beat someone up?

You just finished beating Zhang Hongqu last time, and the punishment on your body is not full 
moon yet. Do you want to take another punishment?

Gu Li doesn't understand Bai Qingming's strange mind, let alone his flamboyant manipulation, so 
he can only pin his hopes on Yunshang, hoping that Yunshang can persuade his unreliable brother 
not to catch Zhang Hongqu alone Can be beaten hard.



At the very least, with Bai Qingming still bearing punishment, don't cause any more trouble.

Yun Shang nodded in agreement, and criticized Bai Qingming very bluntly, "little six! How did our 
dad educate you? If you have conflicts or difficulties, remember to find an organization to 
coordinate, and you can't do it in private. You are seriously breaking the law. Violation of discipline, 
I want to criticize and educate you on behalf of the organization..."

A series of accusations made Bai Qingming's eyes turn in circles, and even his mind was stunned.

Didn't Xiaoqi come here just to settle accounts with Zhang Hongqu?

He pulled Gu Li and asked Gu Li to find a way to get Zhang Hongqu out. He wanted to beat Xiao 
Qi violently in front of Xiao Qi. Wasn't it to make Xiao Qi vent his anger and satisfy her purpose of 
visiting relatives?

When it came to Xiaoqi's mouth, it was all her fault.

Yun Chang really wanted to scold Bai Qingming at this moment, she came here to beat the sap, not 
to watch Bai Qingming beat someone in front of her.

If Bai Qingming got into a fight with someone because she came to visit relatives, and got punished 
on her body, then she would really be a bastard.

Besides, she just wanted to beat someone secretly, but she never thought that Bai Qingming would 
lose his future because of such a trivial matter.

Bai Qingming was reprimanded by Yun Shang in front of his comrades-in-arms,

He didn't feel ashamed, but seriously analyzed with Yunshang, "Xiao Qi, I ran away when I saw 
Zhang Hongqu recently, and I couldn't get him out. Only Gu Li, who is from the same town as that 
person , there is still some confidence in deceiving people out."

Gu Li: "..."



I believe your evil!

This Bai Qingming is a scam!

If he really listened to Bai Qingming's words, he would have to be punished at that time.

The co-author Bai Qingming invited him to the small cafeteria for dinner again today, and 
introduced his sister to him. He just wanted him to come forward and trick Zhang Hongqu out so 
that he could beat Zhang Hongqu violently in front of his sister?

Who are these people? What a shame!

Yun Shang was also speechless for a while, feeling a little sympathetic to Gu Li.

It's really hard for Comrade Gu Li to partner with his stupid and cute little six sons.

Apart from being Bai Qingming's partner in business matters, he did not forget to bring Gu Li along 
when he did bad things in private.

"Comrade Gu Li, I'm here to deliver seasonal clothes to my little brother, and I have to go back 
tomorrow afternoon. Don't listen to my little brother's nonsense, and don't listen to his nonsense 
instructions."

I'm here for business, not to beat people up, so if something bad happens to Zhang Hongqu, it's his 
own bad luck, and it has nothing to do with my little six.

When Yun Shang spoke, Gu Li finally felt relieved.

Fortunately, it's thanks to Bai Qingming's sister who was clear and didn't mess around with Bai 
Qingming, or else his name would have to be added to the punishment list next time.

When they arrived at the small cafeteria, Yun Chang only ordered a porridge and a plate of small 
pickles, and sat there to eat slowly.



Knowing that Yunshang still can't eat meat, Bai Qingming felt distressed and annoyed, brought the 
meat pie he ordered to Gu Li, and ate white porridge with Yunshang, and kept yelling that Yunshang 
was not blessed and could not taste it. Little cafeteria meatloaf tasted off.

Seeing that the two of them were running out of food, Yun Chang put down the untouched porridge, 
kicked Bai Qingming quietly under the table, and winked.

Bai Qingming put down his chopsticks, and asked Yunshang in a daze, "Xiaoqi, does Dad have 
anything else to say to me?"

"Well, don't you have a regular meeting tonight, or should I rest later and wait until you're done?"

When Gu Li heard this, he put down the meatloaf in his hand, and persuaded Bai Qingming, 
"Qingming, it's almost time to rest after the regular meeting. How about I ask for a leave of absence 
for you? It's not easy for Comrade Bai to come here, and he has serious business to do." Said, so as 
not to delay Comrade Bai's rest."

Before Bai Qingming could speak, Yun Chang immediately agreed with a smile on her face, "Thank 
you Comrade Gu Li, please help my little brother to ask for leave. Just say that I came to visit 
relatives and I have something to do in the small cafeteria. "

Chapter 719 Means

"Xiao Qi, tell me, why did Dad tell you to scold me?"

As soon as Gu Li left, Bai Qingming finished eating the porridge in a few mouthfuls, and asked Yun 
Shang as if having a long conversation.

Yun Chang glanced at Bai Qingming, and gave him another kick very bluntly, "Little Six, it's ok, 
you've grown up, you're almost a roundworm in my stomach, you know what I'm here for."

While avoiding Yun Shang's flying kick, Bai Qingming complained angrily, "How could I not know 
you! If it wasn't for cleaning up people, would you still come to see me? At that time, you would 
have been clingy to Gu Shinian! "

Yun Chang choked on Bai Qingming's choke, and wanted to tear his cap open.

This dude actually learned how to tease her, I really want to turn the world upside down!



The two brothers and sisters bickered for a few words before Yun Shang picked up the chopsticks 
and continued to eat this tasteless dinner.

"Little Six, this Gu Li looks quite honest, can he trick people over here?"

"I wouldn't choose him as a partner if I'm being dishonest." Bai Qingming raised his eyebrows 
proudly, "Don't worry, Gu Li is a well-known good man, what he said was Zhang Hongqu's 
appointment letter. That grandson just suffered a big loss , I’ve been looking for something to do 
with me recently, and if I know we’re in the cafeteria, I’ll definitely come over and have a look.”

Bai Qingming was right. As soon as Gu Li finished asking Bai Qingming for leave, Zhang Hongqu 
who was sitting at the bottom couldn't sit still.

A few minutes after the regular meeting started, a report was made, and he slipped out on the 
pretext of having a stomachache and going to the infirmary to get some medicine.

Yun Shang's mental strength has been poking outside, seeing someone sneaking up against the wall 
like a thief, hiding by the edge of the holly bushes and looking into the small cafeteria, the corners 
of his mouth slightly curled up.

"Brother, is it this person?" Through the window, Yunshang motioned Bai Qingming to look 
outside, and asked in a low voice.

Bai Qingming's face darkened, "It's this grandson!"

After speaking, he glanced to the side, saw that there was no one around, immediately clenched his 
fists, and decided to go out and drag him to a secluded place to beat him up again.

This is all delivered to the door, if he doesn't do anything, he will be sorry for Gu Li's leave for him.

How could Yun Shang not know what Bai Qingming was up to, squinting her eyes, and warned him 
coldly, "Little Six, I have arrangements for this person, don't mess with me, or I'll never end with 
you!"



It's hard to trick people out, if Bai Qingming scares people away, what's wrong with her?

Therefore, people must be beaten by her!

No one is allowed to rob.

Bai Qingming is upset, what does Xiao Qi mean by this, there are other arrangements for beating 
someone, is it because he can't trust him or can't he trust him?

Yun Shang ignored Bai Qingming, pointed to today's supply on the small blackboard and said, 
"Brother, I'm not full yet, go and buy me a pancake... some pickles."

As soon as he heard that Yunshang still wanted to eat, Bai Qingming was not in a hurry to beat 
someone up, and while walking towards the small window, he gave Yunshang a long-winded 
suggestion, "Dried pancakes with small pickles are not nutritious, how about giving them You 
boiled two eggs and sandwiched it? There are still fragrant dried, or you can fry a fragrant dried and 
sandwiched it..."

The moment Bai Qingming turned around, Yunshang used her mental strength to calmly attack 
Zhang Hongqu who was about to come in. After listening to Bai Qingming's suggestion, she nodded 
and said, "Then boil two eggs and put them in."

It takes at least ten minutes to boil an egg, and she has fifty minutes of hands-on time in the storage 
space, which is more than enough to beat someone up.

So, when Bai Qingming ran to buy pancakes and boiled eggs for Yunshang, Yunshang's mental 
power entered the space, and the two baseball bats swung fiercely, hitting the hemp sacks firmly 
one after another.

In just a few minutes, Zhang Hongqu was beaten so badly that his nose was bruised and his face 
was swollen.

After Bai Qingming finished ordering, he went to the window and took a look outside.

At this look, his face turned green.



What about Zhang Hongqu?

Isn't it all delivered to the door? Why did the people disappear in a blink of an eye?

Isn't this grandson afraid of being beaten, so he didn't have the guts to come in, so he slipped against 
the wall again?

Bai Qingming returned to the table with regret on his face, "Xiao Qi, that grandson has escaped!"

"I didn't run away, I was dragged away and beaten in another place."

The corners of Yunshang's mouth curled up slightly,

Bai Qingming laughed so hard that the white hairs all over his body broke out, "...Little, Xiao Qi, 
you found a helper!? Who is it?"

"Can I tell you my trump card?" Yun Shang squinted her eyes, and looked at Bai Qingming 
contemptuously, "You just wait and watch the show! I'll let you see it today, what does it mean to 
deal with people, and learn later. Be on your toes!"

Bai Qingming: "..."

Xiaoqi is scarier than before.

Yun Shang taught Bai Qingming one sentence after another, but her mental strength was not idle. 
After beating Zhang Hongqu violently, she took ether spray and sprayed it twice from the opening 
of the sack.

After waiting for more than ten seconds to confirm that Zhang Hongqu had passed out completely, 
Yunshang took out ink mixed with printer ink, and wrote a few words on Zhang Hongqu's face with 
a brush.



Printer ink is inherently difficult to wash, and in this day and age, the only washing products that 
people can use are soap and soap. It will take at least a month to completely clean the words on 
Zhang Hongqu's face.

What kind of punishment is beating Zhang Hongqu violently? To be honest, how many soldiers take 
the pain of flesh and blood seriously?

Everyone often loses money in training on weekdays. As long as it does not affect daily life, no one 
really takes it seriously.

A few punches to Zhang Hongqu can make Bai Qingming take a punishment, maybe in Zhang 
Hongqu's view, he has earned it.

Otherwise, Zhang Hongqu wouldn't have heard her coming to visit her relatives, so he would come 
here to beat her up again.

Since Zhang Hongqu is not afraid of being beaten, she will deal with Zhang Hongqu in another 
way, make him put on a big face, and dare not go out to meet people for a month, to see if he dares 
to set up a little six in the future.

"Company Commander Gu! It's good to put eggs in pancakes! Master Wang specially picked out 
two big eggs, eat them while they're hot!"

The helper in the cafeteria was carrying the tray and yelled loudly to deliver the pancakes. Bai 
Qingming was about to get up to pick up the tray when there was a "bang" at the cafeteria door, as if 
something had smashed down.

"Yo, what is that!? Why do I look like a human being?"

The cook was taken aback, put down the plate and ran towards the door, Bai Qingming also jumped 
up from the stool, ready to go over to have a look, but it was Yunshang who was quick to pull him, 
which made Bai Qingming fall behind the cook.

Several masters in the cafeteria also ran out of it, and when they got to the door, they all had weird 
expressions on their faces.



Really, it was too pitiful and ridiculous for this man to be beaten.

The whole face was swollen like a pig's head, and under the light, the large oily spots on the face 
shone brightly, as if they could be broken with a single poke.

Her forehead was swollen with two big bumps, and three large characters were written with a brush 
- gossip!

There are also bastards painted on the face, one on each side, which is very symmetrical.

Chapter 720 investigation

The news that Zhang Hongqu was beaten up with a sack and painted with big characters on his face 
quickly reached the leaders' ears.

Such a nasty incident happened in the heavily guarded military area, and the leaders were furious, 
digging deep to dig out the murderer.

But Zhang Hongqu seemed to have been beaten stupidly. He was beaten by several people. He 
couldn't explain the characteristics of the person who did it, as well as the time period and place of 
the beating. There is nowhere to check if I want to.

Besides, when Zhang Hongqu asked for leave, he said that he was going to the infirmary to get 
medicine, but after an investigation by the organization, Zhang Hongqu himself had never been to 
the infirmary, and he himself couldn't explain why he appeared at the entrance of the small 
cafeteria.

There were many doubts, but there was no way to investigate them. In the end, the comrades of the 
political engineering department could only investigate those who had conflicts with Zhang 
Hongqu.

Naturally, someone in the organization also talked to Bai Qingming, after all, he just beat up Zhang 
Hongqu a while ago, and he is still carrying the punishment on him. Coupled with the fact that Bai 
Qingming was in the small cafeteria at the time, the people in the political engineering department 
naturally felt that Bai Qingming was suspicious.

It's just that when Zhang Hongqu's accident happened, Bai Qingming was taking Yunshang to eat in 
the small cafeteria. All the staff in the cafeteria could testify to this, which ruled out the possibility 
of Bai Qingming's actions.



In the end, he could only ask Bai Qingming a few questions hastily, and then let him out.

After coming out of the political engineering department, Bai Qingming circled around Yunshang a 
few times with a strange expression, thinking of the three big characters on Zhang Hongqu's head 
and the two bastards on his face, he was covered in white sweat unconsciously.

"Xiao Qi, tell me honestly, what's going on... Who did it?"

This thing is too crazy!

According to people from the political engineering department, Zhang Hongqu firmly insisted that 
he was beaten for at least half an hour.

But from Zhang Hongqu's sneaky appearance at the entrance of the small cafeteria to when he was 
thrown at the entrance of the small cafeteria like trash, it took at most ten minutes.

In these ten minutes, the time for kidnapping people, the time for writing on Zhang Hongqu's face, 
and the time for throwing Zhang Hongqu back to the cafeteria door are all counted. Zhang Hongqu 
can be beaten for five or six minutes at most. Where can he get half of it? Hours of beating?

Bai Qingming felt that his sister was becoming more and more mysterious, holding a hole card he 
didn't know, and hallucinated Zhang Hongqu in just a few minutes.

Thinking of Yun Chang's person beside him, Bai Qingming's body got goosebumps, his back felt 
chilly, and he shivered abruptly.

It's over!

Is Xiao Qi planning to spy on him?

If he doesn't do well in the army, will Xiao Qi punish him like he punished Zhang Hongqu?

Once Naobudi starts to associate, he will make up reasonable reasons for all kinds of unreasonable 
things, and then scare himself to death.



The current Bai Qingming is Naobudi who has already started to associate.

Yun Chang looked at Bai Qingming's constantly changing face and terrified eyes, how could she not 
guess his simple thought, smiled with the corners of her lips curled up, and said:

"I said it was my hole card. Have you ever seen someone take the initiative to expose their hole 
card?"

After Yunshang finished speaking, she suddenly changed her expression to scare Bai Qingming, 
"little six, you'd better be more honest in the future, or else before my father cleans you up, I'll make 
you cry for your mother."

If you don't believe me, just look at what happened to Zhang Hongqu.

Bai Qingming: "..."

Can this day pass?

It's okay to bully me at home before, but now I'm hiding in the army, and they still don't let me go, 
what kind of grudge?

After sending Yunshang back to the guest house, Bai Qingming rubbed the goosebumps on his arms 
almost all the way back to the dormitory.

Just as he was holding a washbasin to wash up, Gu Li from the next room also followed out with a 
washbasin. While there was no one around, he asked Bai Qingming about the ins and outs of the 
matter.

"...What the hell is going on? I don't understand what you mean by this."

Bai Qingming looked hopeless, "I really want to do it tonight, but it's not that I haven't had time to 
do it,



Did something happen to Zhang Hongqu? I really don't know what's going on here, you might as 
well ask Zhang Hongqu if you ask me. "

"Ask Zhang Hongqu?" Gu Li smiled lightly, and told Bai Qingming about Zhang Hongqu's current 
situation, "After he came back, he plunged into the sink and washed his face vigorously. The big 
bump on his forehead was torn, and there was nothing he could do. After washing, I covered my 
face with a towel and went back to the dormitory. According to the people in their dormitory, Zhang 
Hongqu has to cover his face with a towel even when lying on the bed, otherwise he would not dare 
to raise his head to meet people."

It's so embarrassing.

An old man, with two big bastards painted on his face, and the words "Long Tongue Woman" 
written on his forehead, which can't be washed off even after washing, can become Zhang Hongqu's 
label.

The big man was labeled as a "gossip woman", and he was ashamed to go out to meet people after 
thinking about it, but Zhang Hongqu had to follow the training every day, and had to go out with a 
big face to be "watched" by people. I have to say that the person behind the scenes, this One move 
is too ruthless.

Bai Qingming laughed a few times, not hiding the gloating smile on his face, "From tomorrow 
onwards, I hit Zhang Hongqu 800 times a day, I must make a good joke about this grandson..."

Xiao Qi is really amazing!

As soon as he made a move, he turned Zhang Hongqu into a living bastard, so that he didn't even 
dare to leave the door. If anyone provoked him again in the future, he would learn from Xiao Qi. If 
he didn't show up, he asked others to help him deal with others. It was safe and relieved. There is 
nothing better than this Better idea.

After Gu Li laughed, he sighed, "This happened in the military area. I think the organization is 
determined to investigate to the end. I don't know how much mud can be brought out by pulling out 
the radish this time. Tomorrow and The soldiers in the platoon said, let everyone be more honest 
recently, and don't cause trouble."

"Okay, just do as you say."



………………………

When Yunshang and Bai Qingyue came back the next day, it was almost eight o'clock in the 
evening. Both Bai Yancheng and his wife have things to do at night, only old man Bai is waiting for 
the two sisters at home.

Seeing the two granddaughters coming in, the old man put down the sleeping old cat Qiuqiu, and 
while beckoning Aunt Wu to bring over dinner quickly, he asked about Bai Qingming and Han 
Chen's situation in the army.

Yun Shang was almost dazed in the car, forced herself to eat half a bowl of noodle soup, picked up 
the ball and sat on the sofa, talking to the old man in a low voice.

"...Little Six is pretty good. I don't think he took the punishment to heart, and he was happy all day 
long."

"En." The old man nodded in response, "Little Six is only twenty-one years old, and his 
temperament has not yet settled down. It's good for the organization to suppress him now. After two 
years, his temper has calmed down, and then he will go up a little bit." I can rest assured."
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