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Chapter 91 Buying a Stove

The most powerful is the statement of severance of relationship and the letter of guarantee. If any of 
these are taken out, it will be enough to ruin Zhang Chunni's son's reputation and despise him for 
the rest of his life.

In order to have a good future, she cut ties with her biological mother and wrote a letter of 
guarantee that she regarded her stepmother as her biological mother. With this stigma, Zhang 
Chunni's son would never be able to turn around in his life.

If he wants to stay at Gu's house properly, he has to break his wings and lie down on her territory, 
looking at her face and begging for food...

At this moment, Zhou Mingjuan was full of emotions, and her cheeks were flushed with excitement, 
"Sister Chen, you...you are really amazing! I, Sister Chen, don't worry, I will find a way to get you a 
penicillin!"

The woman took Zhou Mingjuan's hand and clapped it with a smile, "Sister, aren't you worried 
about the son in front of you dividing your daughter's property? Actually, you don't need to worry. 
The one who brought it home shouldn't dare to argue with your daughter. Family property, the one 
outside, take this opportunity to provoke a few words, if the child is not provoked, if you can make 
him cut off his relationship with your man, then..."

Zhou Mingjuan opened her mouth again. Can this woman come up with an idea?

What is her heart like?

How can it be so dirty, so vicious?

However, her heart beat faster and faster!

The woman closed it when she saw it, and quickly changed the subject and asked Zhou Mingjuan 
when the hospital would have penicillin. After the two made an appointment for the next meeting, 
the woman left with a warm smile on her face, leaving the big cake behind.



Zhou Mingjuan was sitting on the chair, her mind became a mess. If it weren't for the beautiful and 
attractive cake on the table, she would have thought that what she heard just now was just a dream 
of hers.

She stood up and walked to the window, watching the woman straighten her back, walk out of the 
hospital door with ease, then returned to the desk and sat down, falling into deep thought.

Gu Shinian and Yun Chang stood diagonally across from the hospital, and when they saw the 
woman came out, they smiled and greeted them.

"Little comrade, don't worry, I'll do it for you beautifully today, just go home and wait patiently for 
the news..."

Before the words were finished, the woman showed a sympathetic look on her face, "Little 
comrade, listen to Auntie's advice, be a person, you can't be too soft, you must fight for what you 
should fight for, you don't fight for anything, it's not right for the bad guys. What do you mean! You 
are young and ignorant, you don't know how rare a house in the provincial capital is, but you can't 
just make that bad woman so cheap!"

Gu Shinian nodded and thanked the woman, while Yun Chang looked up at the woman and felt that 
the more she looked, the more pleasing to the eye.

"Auntie, please wait here, I will take my sister to the hospital to get something and come out."

The woman said that she had done things well, but Gu Shinian couldn't believe it. He had to get 
back the recorder to confirm before he could make a conclusion. It's not that I feel bad for the food, 
but I'm afraid that this woman will make a mistake and delay his plan to send Gu Guangzong home 
for review.

"Little comrade, it's not that my aunt doesn't want to wait for you, it's really... I'm worried that 
Director Zhou will come out of the hospital and see that I'm still here."

As soon as these words came out, both Gu Shinian and Yun Chang understood, this woman should 
be afraid that they would take the opportunity to run away, and the food and big cake that promised 
her flew like this.



Yun Chang struggled to slip off Gu Shinian's body, "Second brother, you and auntie are waiting for 
me here, I'll go get something!"

A few people were at the entrance of the hospital, and the hospital was not big. Gu Shinian thought 
about it and agreed, "Okay, second brother is waiting for you at the gate."

Yun Chang flung her arms, ran into the hospital, went upstairs, stuck to the door of Zhou 
Mingjuan's office, stretched out her mental strength and retrieved the recorder.

When he was about to leave, he noticed that Zhou Mingjuan was lying on the table, carefully 
turning the cake while sniffing hard.

Yun Chang gave a wicked smile, and swept her mental energy over, only to see Zhou Mingjuan 
slipping her hand, the whole cake stuck directly in her arms, and then slid to the ground. Snow-
white cream stained all over her clothes and trousers,

The cake fell to the ground, and the strawberries rolled on the ground.

Zhou Mingjuan was dumbfounded. She didn't care about her distressed clothes or how she was 
going to meet people when she was so embarrassed. She quickly squatted down and picked up the 
cake. As a result, she smeared a hand of cream on the cake and left it on the cake. Two deep slap 
prints.

Yun Chang was relieved and happy when she saw Zhou Mingjuan's embarrassed appearance.

Just her scum still want to eat cake?

Go dream!

After doing the bad thing, Yun Chang pouted and left the crime scene quickly with short legs.

Back at the door of the hospital, Gu Shinian cooperated and hugged Yunshang, while Yunshang 
consciously entered the space, turned on the recorder, and began to listen to the coaxing scene in 
Zhou Mingjuan's office.



A few minutes later, Yun Chang patted Gu Shinian on the shoulder and smiled, "Second brother, it's 
wonderful!"

Gu Shinian had a smile in his eyes, knowing that Zhou Mingjuan had already taken the bait.

The woman walked beside the two of them, and after a while, she finally couldn't help but ask:

"Little comrade, I want to ask, where did you get that big cake? Where can you buy it in the 
capital?"

"I asked a friend to buy it from the Friendship Store in Beijing. If Auntie wants to buy it, she can go 
to the Friendship Store to try her luck."

Thinking that in the 1960s, there was a state-run pastry shop in Shanghai, Gu Shinian continued, 
"Auntie, there is a place that sells cakes in Shencheng. If you have the opportunity to go to 
Shencheng on business, Auntie can buy more and bring them back. ."

The woman licked her tongue. She is a drama school teacher. She probably has no chance to travel 
in her life, so how can she go to Shencheng.

Forget it, even if there is such an expensive food for sale, it is estimated that she is not willing to 
buy it.

A few people got on the tram and wandered all the way back to the guest house. Gu Shinian went 
upstairs and took the rice noodles and chocolate cake that had been prepared early in the morning 
and handed them over to the woman. After she left, she took Yunshang with him. Ready to go out 
and buy a stove.

The two came to the mall and asked the salesperson first. They knew that the mall had a flatbed 
truck. As long as they paid a little deposit, they could borrow the flatbed truck in the mall to send 
things home, which was very convenient.

Yun Chang was not worried at this moment that the two of them couldn't carry the stove, so she 
took out the stove ticket prepared early in the morning from her bag, went to the place where the 
stove was sold, and chose a large iron stove for burning honeycomb for herself.



Then I bought a copper teapot at the counter, and a basketball-sized flat-bottomed iron pan with a 
handle and a wooden lid.

Thinking of the large black pot hanging on the stove of Lao Yun's house, Yun Chang endured the 
distress and spent fifteen industrial coupons, plus 16 yuan and 80 cents, to buy a large iron pot for 
Lao Yun's house.

After paying the money ticket, Yun Chang said distressedly, "My small pot only needs four 
industrial coupons, and this big pot requires fifteen industrial coupons, which is too expensive..."
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