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Chapter 913 Watch the Hongmeng inheritance and improve the rules of the avenue

Qingyangzi was also helpless.

The inheritance of these classics is the accumulation of his many years of working in Hongmeng.

Just sent it out for no reason.

Naturally, he felt a little reluctant to give up.

But what can be done about this.

Because the origin of the Qingyang Realm has been almost completely eroded by the aura of 
destruction in the Jue Abyss.

The sealing ability of the Gate of Creation cannot last long.

Now is the last chance.

If he cannot break out of the abyss of destruction this time, he will truly perish.

Qingyangzi practiced for countless years and finally reached the Yin and Yang realm, and he was 
also a disciple of a saint.

How could he be willing to die like this?

He wants to live.

In fact, even without Zhang Yuhe's appearance.



Qingyangzi will also think of ways to bring Yuan Zun and others over to discuss the big plan.

He knew it very well.

You can't break out of the abyss of destruction by yourself.

Because he has tried countless.

However, every time it ended in failure.

If you can rush out with your own strength.

How could he possibly waste countless years here?

If you really can run.

He ran away a long time ago.

Isn’t the Shangqing Holy Land fragrant?

Why should he stay in this abyss?

Qingyangzi knows very well.

It's definitely not possible to rely on his own strength.

Fortunately, it has evolved over a long period of time.

The cultivation civilization in Qingyang Realm has developed fairly well.

Not only are there nine supreme realms such as Yuan Zun, but there are also a large number of 
pseudo-supremes, as well as countless eternal cultivators of the God King.



If these people are taken out alone, they may not be enough to crush the destruction in the abyss.

But if everyone is brought together, it will be a force that cannot be ignored.

Totally worth taking advantage of, or rather cooperating with.

It is precisely because of this.

Only Qingyangzi will publish everything he has learned throughout his life on the Gate of Creation.

In addition to those in the Shangqing Holy Land, there are countless special inheritances taught to 
the outside world.

Qingyangzi didn't have any reservations.

Because he needs strength.

More strength is needed to help him break out of the abyss of destruction.

Qingyangzi did not place all his hopes on Zhang Yuhe.

In his opinion.

Although Zhang Yuhe is a genius.

It turns out that in the eternal realm, all three thousand avenues can be understood and completed.

If Zhang Yuhe is really promoted to the Supreme Realm in the future.

It is estimated that his strength will be much stronger than when he was at his peak.



But Qingyangzi still has no confidence.

Because in the Jue Abyss, except for those ordinary destruction monsters.

There are also a number of destroying beasts.

The strength of these destructive monsters is almost only inferior to that of saints.

It was really difficult to deal with.

When he was at his peak, he couldn't even defeat a semi-holy realm destructive monster.

The first-class destruction monsters guarding the outside are not just one or two.

Rather, there are many.

Qingyang has been resurrected in the origin many times.

But every time he rushed out, he would face the siege of multiple first-class destruction monsters.

As few as three or five.

Sometimes, there are even as many as ten.

There are so many powerful destroying monsters guarding outside.

How could he have confidence in Zhang Yuhe?

not to mention.

In addition to those first-level destruction monsters, there are quite a few remaining levels of 
destruction monsters.



If there are not enough manpower, the overall strength will not be strong enough.

Even if he rushes out again, he will only die.

Qingyangzi doesn't want to die.

So as long as it can improve the overall strength, he is willing to do it.

As for saying.

Make these precious heritages available to the public for free.

So what does it matter?

No matter how precious your inheritance is, it is not as important as your own life.

If you really want to perish completely.

He is guarding these inheritances, so what's the point.

Qingyangzi looked into the distance, and then said with emotion.

"You should disseminate these inherited classics as soon as possible."

"I hope that everyone's strength can be improved before the final action."

"Only in this way will our chances of survival in the future be greater."

"Otherwise."

"Wait until the destruction monsters in the Jue Abyss pour into the Qingyang Realm."



"Everyone will be dead then."

Hearing Qingyangzi's words.

Everyone shouted respectfully in unison.

"Follow the teachings of our seniors."

"I will disseminate these inheritance classics widely in a moment."

"I will definitely not disappoint my seniors."

Everyone looked at the various inheritances on the Gate of Creation, feeling both excited and a little 
heavy in their hearts.

Because through Qingyangzi's actions.

Everyone is feeling tremendous pressure.

Those destroying monsters in the Jue Abyss must be very terrifying.

Otherwise.

Qingyangzi also spent so much money.

Everyone stared at the Gate of Creation high in the sky, silently making up their minds.

You must choose one as soon as possible that suits your own inherited technique.

Then quickly change your practice.



Try to improve your strength as much as possible before taking the final action.

Everyone knows it very well.

They are not helping Qing Yangzi, nor are they trying to protect the Chaos River.

This is for their own destiny and future.

"I hope everything goes well."

Everyone thought silently, and looked at Zhang Yuhe next to them.

In fact, everyone understood it very well.
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The key to whether he can completely break out of the abyss of destruction in the future lies in 
Zhang Yuhe.

Although they themselves rely on the inheritance of Qingyangzi's improved skills.

It can improve a lot of strength.

But no matter how much they improve, they can't break through to the Supreme Realm.

The strength that everyone can exert is at most equivalent to a third-level destruction monster.

There are even stronger, first- and second-class destroying monsters up there.

They definitely can't deal with these destruction monsters.

No matter how strong everyone is, no matter how much they improve.

It is also impossible to challenge those powerful first- and second-level destruction monsters.



So we can only rely on Zhang Yuhe.

Compared to everyone's nervous mood.

Zhang Yuhe still looked calm.

He was not worried that he would not be able to defeat those destroying monsters.

So what about the semi-sacred realm.

Just wait until he is promoted to the Supreme Realm.

That's nothing.

Zhang Yuhe doesn't care about future actions because there is no need.

It was the inheritance on the Gate of Creation that aroused his great interest.

These inheritances all come from Hongmeng, and some even come from major holy places.

Every inheritance here is extremely mysterious and perfect.

Far from being a river of chaos, the existing skills and magical powers are comparable.

Even the most precious magical powers and techniques in the Tao Alliance are not as good as one or 
two of them.

Because this is crushing from higher dimensions.

Stand taller and see further.



The skills and magical powers created will naturally become more mysterious and perfect.

Zhang Yuhe watched silently.

He passed on the scrolls above and studied them one by one.

Although the inheritance of these techniques is definitely not as good as the Chaos Gods and 
Demons Scripture.

It is impossible for Zhang Yuhe to change his martial arts.

But that doesn't mean that these inheritances have no effect on him.

Quite the opposite.

Zhang Yuhe feels that he has gained something more every time he reads a scroll.

By studying these, the inheritance of skills came from Hongmeng.

Zhang Yuhe felt that his understanding of the rules of the great road had deepened.

The great philosophy contained in the inheritance was of great help to him.

Zhang Yuhe believes it.

After he has read all the inheritance scrolls.

My own use of the power of rules will definitely improve me to a great level.

Zhang Yuhe was distracted and silently looked at the inheritance classics on the Gate of Creation.

For everyone's nervous and heavy mood.



He didn't take it to heart at all.

What's there to worry about?

After he is promoted to the Supreme Realm, everyone can just fight out together.

Zhang Yuhe still didn't believe it.

Back then, the saints in Hongmeng were able to drive those destructive monsters into this abyss.

Could it be that they couldn't even fight their way out of the abyss?

This is impossible.

To this.

Zhang Yuhe is completely confident.

…

Chapter 914 The potential for sanctification

Zhang Yuhe silently looked at the inheritance scrolls on the Gate of Creation, completely immersed 
in the understanding of the rules.

Seeing how focused he was, no one dared to disturb him.

Everyone also turned to look at the Gate of Creation, and slowly began to make choices that fit their 
own inheritance of techniques.

Because they also understand.



No matter how much I think about it now, no matter how many questions I ask, it actually doesn't 
make much sense.

No matter what happens in the future.

Try to improve your own strength first, which is the most important thing at the moment.

No matter how much you get if you don't have the strength, it's all in vain.

Everyone silently observed the inheritance scroll, and the scene gradually fell into silence.

On the Gate of Creation, the illusory figure of Qing Yangzi looked at Zhang Yuhe who was 
concentrating on his thoughts in the distance.

He couldn't help but sigh silently in his heart.

No wonder this little friend Zhang was able to break through to the eternal realm so quickly and 
master all three thousand avenues.

Although he didn't know how extraordinary Zhang Yuhe's qualifications were.

But with this kind of focused mind, few people can match it.

People like Zhang Yuhe seem to be able to enter a state of enlightenment at any time.

Qingyangzi can only feel envious.

He asked himself that he couldn't do this.

And Qingyangzi believes it.

People like Zhang Yuhe are so focused and dedicated to the great road.



I'm afraid there aren't even a few in the entire Hongmeng Source Realm.

"Maybe he can really create a miracle and lead us to the abyss of destruction."

Look at Zhang Yuhe's focused look.

Qingyangzi suddenly felt more confident.

Originally he thought.

Even if Zhang Yuhe is promoted to the Supreme Realm in the future, his strength will only be at 
best.

Better than ordinary Yin Yang monks.

But if you want to deal with the first-class destruction monsters in the semi-sacred realm, I'm afraid 
there's still a long way to go.

not to mention.

He couldn't be sure before.

Can Zhang Yuhe be promoted to the Supreme Realm before the end of this era?

But now he doesn't see it that way.

Qingyangzi finally understands now.

Zhang Yuhe was able to achieve his current achievements without any luck.

It's not just a matter of talent.



This is a Tao mentality.

The heart towards the Tao.

Qingyangzi believes it.

Even if a monk like Zhang Yuhe is slightly less talented.

The achievements that can be achieved in the end will definitely not be worse than ordinary people.

If combined with the heaven-defying qualifications.

Then the future is truly limitless.

"fair enough."

"The higher Zhang Xiaoyou's achievements, the greater our chances of breaking out of the Absolute 
Abyss in the future."

Thinking of this.

Qing Yangzi couldn't help but reveal a faint smile on his face.

He looked at Zhang Yuhe in the distance, and his heart became more and more fond of him.

He even thought.

After breaking out of the Absolute Abyss of Destruction in the future.
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We must find a way to introduce Zhang Yuhe to the master and bring him to the Shangqing Holy 
Land.



Such a peerless genius must be won over.

At least, we must not let the other party have any estrangement in his heart.

But we must not become enemies instead of friends.

If that happens.

That would be a big trouble.

Thinking of this.

Qingyangzi secretly made up his mind.

Never offend Zhang Yuhe.

…

Time passed slowly.

Everyone was immersed in the transmission scrolls.

Only Qingyangzi was left at the scene, and the illusory figure swayed gently on the Gate of 
Creation.

I don’t know how long it has been.

Yuanzun was the first to wake up.

He looked at a certain inheritance scroll on the Gate of Creation and muttered to himself.



"I finally found it."

"This is it."

"This book of the creation of all things is the best match for my talent and the great way."

"If I can change to this method, then I can exert my strength."

"It will at least increase by 20% to 30%.

Thinking of this.

Yuan Zun couldn't help but show joy on his face.

He took a deep breath and shouted respectfully to Qing Yangzi.

"Thank you for the inheritance, I will never forget it."

Qing Yangzi nodded gently, and then responded lightly.

"We are just cooperating with each other."

"Practice well, I hope we can all successfully rush out of the abyss of destruction in the future."

"Yes, senior."

Yuan Zun bowed and saluted, then quietly stepped aside.

He was not in a hurry to practice.

This is the source of the Chaos River, and it is also part of the Return to Void Land.



The spiritual energy in the Return to Void Land is thin and not suitable for practice.

If you want to switch to a new method, you have to wait until you return to the Dao League.

That is the most ideal holy place for practice in the entire Chaos River.

But Yuan Zun is obviously not in a hurry to go back now.

Others have not found the inheritance of the skills that match their own.

He has to wait by the side.

The most important thing is.

Zhang Yuhe is still immersed in the perception of the rules of the Tao.

Without Zhang Yuhe to open the transmission channel, can he fly back by himself?

That would be too much effort.

Yuan Zun doesn't want to make things difficult for himself.

Let's wait slowly.

After a while.

Several other Dao League masters also found the inheritance of the skills that match.

Everyone bowed to Qingyang sincerely to thank him, and then quietly retreated to the side.

I don't know how long it has been.



At this time.

A vast divine power suddenly radiated from Zhang Yuhe's body slowly to the surroundings.

The divine power rolled like a tide and crushed the four directions, as if it could ignore everything.

Seeing this situation.

Everyone was shocked.

The Void Lord said with deep emotion.

"Daoyou Yinhe's understanding of the Dao seems to have improved a lot."

"It's really hard for me to understand how he did it."

"After the Dao rules are perfected, aren't they already at their peak?"

"Why can he continue to improve?"

"This doesn't seem to be in line with common sense."

Hearing what Lord Void said, everyone was silent.

They were also full of doubts.

Why does Zhang Yuhe's understanding of the Dao rules seem to be endless?

There is no end.

It seems that it can be improved indefinitely.



If this is true.

Then isn't their so-called Dao perfection a joke?

It's already perfected, but it can still be improved.

Can it still be called perfect?

Could it be that.

Their previous theory was wrong?

In fact, there is no such thing as perfection after the rules are perfected?

Thinking of this.

Everyone couldn't help but look up at the same time and look at Qingyangzi in the distance.

Hope to get the right answer from him.

Looking at the vast and unparalleled divine power of the rules around Zhang Yuhe.

Qing Yangzi was silent for a long time, and then he slowly spoke.

"I am not sure whether the rules of the Great Dao are really endless."

"But one thing is certain, the state of perfection is definitely not the end of the rules of the Great 
Dao."

"To be precise."

"The perfection of the Great Dao is an alternative starting point."



"After the cultivator comprehends the rules of the Great Dao to the state of perfection, he can still 
continue to comprehend and advance."

"But for ordinary cultivators."

"This is almost impossible to do."

"Only a very small number of cultivators with extraordinary comprehension can continue to 
comprehend and advance after the Great Dao is perfect."

"Legend has it that those saints pushed certain rules of the Great Dao to the extreme, and then a 
qualitative change occurred."

"This allowed the rules of the Great Dao to sublimate and finally achieve the status of saints."

"Of course."

"This is just a way of saying it, not very accurate."

"There are 33 Hongmeng saints, and each of them has a different path to sainthood."

"It cannot be generalized."

At this point.

Qing Yangzi paused for a while.

He looked at Zhang Yuhe in the distance and sighed with envy.

"After completing the rules, Zhang Xiaoyou can still continue to advance his understanding."



"Maybe he is one of the few people who have extraordinary understanding and the potential to 
become a saint."

...

Chapter 915 Dao League Announcement

Looking at Zhang Yuhe in the distance, the vast power of rules surrounding him.

Qing Yangzi even had some doubts.
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Perhaps in the future, Zhang Yuhe will have a chance to become a saint.

He still doesn't know this.

The wisp of Hongmeng innate energy that he had been tracking hard.

It has long been transformed into the Chaos God and Demon Heavenly Scripture and was obtained 
by Zhang Yuhe.

If Qingyangzi knew this.

Then he would definitely think that Zhang Yuhe would have a great chance of becoming a saint.

Although Qingyangzi didn't know this.

But he still believed that.

Zhang Yuhe's future achievement must be limitless.

It is far beyond the ordinary Yin-Yang cultivators.



For such a peerless genius.

We must find a way to win him over.

Qingyangzi thought silently in his heart.

Zhang Yuhe slowly opened his eyes.

Feeling the changes in the power of rules around him, he couldn't help but show a look of joy.

He murmured to himself.

"It turns out that after the Great Dao is perfect, you can really continue to comprehend and 
advance."

In fact, a long time ago.

Zhang Yuhe had such a guess.

He believed that the perfection of rules should not be the end of the Great Dao.

The Great Dao is boundless.

How could there be an end?

However.

In the world of the Chaos River.

After the cultivators have pushed the rules of the Great Dao to perfection, they can no longer move 
forward half a step.



It seems that there is some mysterious shackles that seal everyone's way forward.

But when Zhang Yuhe observed the Hongmeng inheritance provided by Qing Yangzi.

He finally broke the shackles and crossed the threshold of perfect rules.

Pushing the rules of the Great Dao forward a big step.

Zhang Yuhe silently comprehended himself.

He could clearly feel his surging power.

Compared with before.

With the blessing of the power of rules.

The strength he can exert now has increased by at least 50%.

Zhang Yuhe is even a little eager to try.

Otherwise, don't wait.

Without waiting to be promoted to the Supreme Realm, let Qing Yangzi open the door of good 
fortune now.

Everyone just kills out?

In Zhang Yuhe's opinion.

With his current strength.



Those first-class destructive monsters in the semi-saint realm in the Absolute Abyss should not be 
able to stop me.

"No, I can't be arrogant."

"It doesn't matter how little time I have."

"Let's wait until I break through to the Supreme Realm."

"Be steady first."

Thinking of this.

Zhang Yuhe took a deep breath, and he slowly gathered the scattered rule power around him.

Then he looked at Qingyangzi in the distance and spoke respectfully.

"Thank you for the Dharma, senior. I am very grateful."

Qingyangzi responded with a smile.

"You don't have to be polite, Zhang Xiaoyou."

"In the future, I will have to rely on your divine power to lead us out of the Absolute Abyss of 
Destruction."

"A few inheritances of skills are not worth mentioning at all."

At this time, several other Dao League masters also flew over immediately.

Everyone stepped forward and congratulated in unison.



"Haha, fellow Daoist Yinhe has made further progress in strength, which is really a cause for 
celebration."

"I didn't expect that after the Great Dao is perfected, there is still another way forward."

"The divine power of the rules displayed by fellow Daoist Yinhe really opened our eyes."

"Thank you for the compliments, seniors."

Zhang Yuhe smiled and bowed to the masters of the Dao Alliance.

At this time.

Qing Yangzi looked at everyone and said lightly.

"Okay, you go back and prepare first."

"The Gate of Fortune cannot be manifested for a long time, and I will return to the origin."

"Wait until the next time we meet."

"That is when everyone fights out of the Absolute Abyss together."

"I hope you will prepare well so that you can smoothly enter the Hongmeng Source Heaven in the 
future."

After saying this.

Qing Yangzi's illusory figure began to slowly dissipate.

The vast Gate of Fortune also gradually retreated from the void until it disappeared.



Looking at the direction where the Gate of Fortune disappeared, everyone was silent for a long 
time.

This time coming to the source of the long river, everyone benefited a lot.

Not only did they obtain many profound and mysterious Hongmeng inheritances.

The most important thing is.

Now the way forward is clear.

Everyone no longer has to grope aimlessly in the Chaos River as before.

There is indeed another world outside the river.

That is Hongmeng Yuantian.

As long as they can successfully enter Hongmeng Yuantian.

Maybe they can go further in the future.

Everyone was silent for a long time.

At this time.

Zhang Yuhe said lightly.

"There are still many things to do next, let's go back first."

Yuan Zun immediately agreed.

"Yes, fellow Yinhe is right."



"We really have to go back quickly."

"Whether it is to modify the inheritance of the skills or to integrate the power of the Chaos River."

"These must be done immediately."

"After all, the time left for all of us is not very abundant."

Zhang Yuhe made a stroke with his right hand.

A huge vortex channel slowly appeared in the void.

Everyone jumped up and threw themselves into the vortex channel.

Seeing everyone leave.

Zhang Yuhe gently held Wu Yiyi's right hand and spoke softly.

"Yiyi, let's go back too."

"Yes."

The two of them flew into the vortex channel and soon disappeared.

The scene soon returned to nothingness, as if nothing had happened.

...

Section 1315

After returning to the Dao League.



Yuan Zun and others quickly released a shocking announcement in the Dao Discussion and 
Exchange Area.

[1. The Chaos River is a world with an owner. Senior Qingyangzi, who created this world, has 
appeared. ]

[2. There is a wider world outside the Chaos River. As long as you pass through the Gate of 
Creation, you can enter the Hongmeng Source Heaven. ]

[3. There are other realms above the Supreme, namely the Yin-Yang Realm and the Sage Realm. ]

[The Supreme Realm is the limit of what the Chaos River can carry, but as long as you walk out of 
the Chaos River and enter the Hongmeng Source Heaven, you will have the opportunity to be 
promoted to a higher realm. ]

[4. At present, outside the Chaos River is a terrible abyss, where many powerful destructive 
monsters live. ]

[If you want to successfully enter the Hongmeng Source Heaven, you have to kill your way out of 
the Destruction Abyss. ]

[5. The Gate of Creation seals the inside and outside, blocking the passage for the destructive 

monsters to enter the Chaos River. 】

【But now the sealing power of the Gate of Fortune can only last until the end of this era, so 

everyone must fight their way out of the Chaos River before the era comes. 】

【6. Senior Qing Yangzi issued a summons to merge the power of the entire Chaos River, and 
everyone will break through the Absolute Abyss and enter the Hongmeng Source Heaven together. 

】

【The time is set to be 500,000 years later. As long as the cultivators who have reached the Eternal 
Realm can follow everyone and fight into the Absolute Abyss of Destruction together, and from 

then on, they will transcend the Chaos River. 】



Yuan Zun and others made public what Qing Yangzi said without reservation.

Not only that.

They also sorted out all the Hongmeng inheritances left by Qing Yangzi and uploaded them to the 
Discussion Exchange Area.

And let the Eternal Deacons stationed in various places of the Void Palace quickly spread the 
announcement and these Hongmeng inheritances to the entire Chaos River.

These Hongmeng inheritances have no restrictions.

Everyone can learn.

…

Chapter 916: Kill a Blue Sky

With the announcement issued by the Dao League Master, it quickly spread to all directions.

The entire Chaos River was instantly shocked.

Lu Minghao and others gathered together again, and everyone couldn't help but show excitement on 
their faces.

Liu Chengjiang said excitedly.

"Haha, there is indeed another world outside this Chaos River."

"We finally have the opportunity to walk out of this long river world and head towards the vast 
Hongmeng."

Liu Chengjiang also said excitedly.



"Yes."

"We have been trapped in the long river for countless years, and the road ahead is cut off."

"I can't see the direction to move forward at all."

"Now the road to heaven has been opened, just follow the footsteps of Senior Qingyangzi."

"You can transcend this long river world and head towards a wider sky."

"I believe that as long as you can enter the Hongmeng Source Heaven."

"In the future, you will definitely be able to take off the hat of the pseudo-supreme and step into the 
real supreme realm."

Hearing this.

Everyone nodded repeatedly.

Due to the limitation of rules.

In the Chaos River, the upper limit they can reach has long been stuck.

As for the current pseudo-supreme realm, they still rely on tricks to achieve it.

In reality.

They are not much better than those eternal emperors.

It's nothing more than taking the path of tricks and integrating the origin of the universe.



It just raised their strength.

In fact, their real realm is still the eternal realm.

The so-called invincible supreme.

It's just gilding their own face.

If there is a chance.

They have long wanted to take off the pseudo-supreme hat.

Now the opportunity has come.

The announcements issued by the major masters of the Dao League must be true.

As long as they follow the footsteps of the masters and hit Senior Qingyangzi.

Everyone fights out of the Chaos River and into the Destruction Abyss.

Then there is a chance to fight out a vast sky.

Although everyone knows in their hearts.

This process must be accompanied by countless risks.

Otherwise,

The Dao Alliance masters would not make such a big fuss to integrate the power of the entire Chaos 
River.

Obviously.



The strength of those destructive monsters in the Absolute Abyss outside must be very powerful.

So powerful that even the nine supreme masters, and even Senior Qingyangzi who created the 
Chaos River, are not sure to deal with it.

They have to pull the power of the entire river together to fight out.

Despite this.

Everyone is still excited.

They are not afraid of risks.

As an invincible supreme master, they have already lived for countless years.

In everyone's view.

Death is just a part of the scenery in the process of cultivation.

As long as the road is ahead.

What is there to fear about death?

What's more.

This time it is the entire Chaos River, all the cultivators above the Eternal Realm act together.

And there are also the nine supreme masters and Senior Qingyangzi leading the team.

It is not necessarily that they will die.



Everyone believes.

Whether it is the nine supreme masters of the Dao Alliance or the Senior Qingyangzi who has never 
met.

They will definitely not do things without reason and without confidence.

With the tall man leading the way, why shouldn't they rush forward?

Everyone gathered together and toasted to celebrate.

The more they talked, the more excited they became.

At this moment.

Lin Luoshui said with deep emotion.

"Senior Qingyangzi is really generous. He actually made so many precious Hongmeng inheritances 
available to the entire Chaos River for free."

"Such a broad mind and courage is really admirable."

Hearing this.

Everyone nodded repeatedly.

"yes."

"Every inheritance passed down by senior Qingyangzi is extremely mysterious."

"When I take one look at it, I can't help but fall into intoxication."



"to be honest."

"Even if you can't break out of the river of chaos."

"Based on these Hongmeng inheritance, I am confident that I will cultivate to the true supreme state 
in the future."

"Hey, who says it isn't?"

"It's a pity that we don't have enough time."

"According to what the announcement says."

"The gate of creation that seals the long river of chaos can only last until the end of this era."

"Once the seal of the Gate of Creation weakens, those destructive monsters in the Jue Abyss will 
still come in."

"So no matter what, we have no choice."

"We can only follow the footsteps of our predecessors, fight together into the abyss of destruction, 
and fight our way out of the blue sky."

Everyone was excited and filled with emotion at the same time.

Section 1316

Just at this time.

Xia Yuanji, who was next to her, suddenly spoke.

"I don't know if Fellow Daoist Galaxy will follow the Lords to fight out."

Lu Minghao responded with a loud laugh.



"Do you even need to ask?"

"Brother Yinhe is such a peerless genius, how can he be trapped to death?"

"I will definitely follow the army and fight out of the river of chaos together."

"The only pity is that his cultivation time is still short."

"Now we have just broken through to the eternal realm."

"I don't know if Brother Yinhe can be promoted to the Supreme Realm before the final action."

"If Brother Yinhe is promoted to the Supreme Realm, then with his heaven-defying combat power."

"Even those destructive monsters in the Jue Abyss are no matter how powerful they are."

"It's impossible to block Brother Yinhe's sharp sword."

Liu Chengjiang glanced at Lu Minghao.

He put down the wine glass in his hand and responded calmly.

"Don't worry about this."

"Why do you think the Lords set the final action time in the announcement fifty trillion years later?"

"Are they waiting for the end of the era?"

"Obviously that's not going to be the case."

"Normally."



"The sooner we take action, the better."

"in my opinion."

"The reason why several Lords delayed their actions until the last moment."

"Actually, I'm just waiting for Fellow Taoist Galaxy to break through to the Supreme Realm."

"Only fellow Daoist Galaxy, with his unparalleled fighting power, can fight for everyone."

"Lead us out of the abyss and into Hongmeng Yuantian."

"As for whether fellow Daoists from the Galaxy can break through to the Supreme Realm in the 
next fifty trillion years."

"We don't need to worry about this."

"With the heaven-defying qualifications of Fellow Daoist Galaxy, it only took him less than a 
billion years to cultivate to his current level."

"The remaining fifty trillion years are more than enough to reach a big realm."

After hearing what Liu Chengjiang said, everyone's eyes couldn't help but light up, and they nodded 
in agreement.

"Brother Liu is right."

"Perhaps several lords and senior Qingyangzi have already discussed the countermeasures."

"Just wait for Fellow Daoist Galaxy to break through to the Supreme Realm, and then rush into the 
abyss of destruction in one fell swoop."

Lu Minghao and others gathered together and excitedly discussed the upcoming big changes.



The same thing is happening all over the Chaos River.

Whether it's the Dao Alliance station or those remote cosmic worlds.

Everyone was talking excitedly.

Although several Dao Alliance Lords made it very clear in the announcement.

This operation was not forced.

But as long as the cultivation level reaches the eternal state, who is willing to die in poverty?

Let’s not talk about it yet.

What if those destroying monsters flow into the river of chaos.

Will the people they left behind have a way to survive?

It's obviously impossible.

When the nest is overturned, how can there be any eggs?

not to mention.

Everyone knows it now.

The world of Chaos River was created by senior Qingyangzi.

Today, Qingyangzi is still around, and he has not died.

How could we all be willing to just stay in someone else's world?



Wouldn't that mean that in the future, you will be manipulated by others everywhere?

In fact, everyone thinks very clearly.

This time is their only chance to escape from the chaos.

Once you miss this opportunity.

In the future, Senior Qingyangzi may not necessarily let them go freely in and out of the Changhe 
world.

Just seize this opportunity.

Only then can they fly freely in a wider world.

…

Chapter 917 Hongmeng inheritance spreads everywhere

As the announcement from the Dao Alliance spread quickly, the entire Chaos River instantly boiled.

According to Qingyangzi's wishes.

The Dao League has set up a special sutra tower in each Vukongfang city.

Burn a copy of all the Hongmeng inheritance disclosed by Qingyangzi.

They are collected in scripture buildings in various places.

As long as the monks have stepped into the long river of chaos, they can go to the Sutra Tower to 
read the inheritance.



Daomeng does not set any restrictions.

no matter who.

You can browse freely.

Not only the monks themselves can check these Hongmeng inheritance.

The Taoist Alliance even allowed them to take these inheritance recordings away.

In short, it’s just one sentence.

The intention of several Taoist League lords is to hope that these Hongmeng inheritance will be 
passed down.

The wider it can spread in the long river of chaos, the better.

They hope that every monk in the river can have access to these inheritances.

You can have a better starting point so that you can go further in the future.

Of course.

This is also what Qingyangzi means.

After all, this Fang Changhe world was created by Qing Yangzi.

He did not show up before, nor did he open up the inheritance to guide.

That's because it's really inconvenient for him.



In order to break out of the abyss of destruction,

Qingyangzi has been resurrected many times, and he has consumed more than half of the source of 
Changhe Heaven and Earth.

After the rise of the Chaos River Civilization, he had already fallen into silence.

Naturally, it is impossible to leave any inheritance and guidance to everyone.

Take advantage of this opportunity to show up.

Qingyangzi had no reservations.

All that he has learned is manifested through the gate of creation.

Let several Dao Alliance Lords spread it widely throughout the country.

Firstly, it is to improve everyone's strength so that they can successfully fight their way out of the 
abyss of destruction in the future.

At the same time, Qingyangzi also hopes.

The stronger the overall strength of the cultivators in this Changhe world, the better.

After all, this is the world he evolved from.

The stronger the strength of the cultivators in the world, the stronger their origin will be, which will 
also feed back to themselves

so that he can recover quickly.

…



When the news spread.

The cultivators above the God King Realm in various places rushed out of their own universes and 
flew towards the nearest Void Market together.

Dao League. Shangyunfang.

Section 1317

A magnificent attic stands quietly near the teleportation array.

Wu Yuxi sat cross-legged at the top of the attic, watching the light flying around.

A large number of monks rushed over.

He held a golden jade slip in his hand and couldn't help but reveal a faint smile on his face.

This is called the first to get the moon near the water and the tower.

Serves as local town deacon.

Wu Yuxi was naturally the first person to see those Hongmeng inheritance.

He comes from that massive inheritance.

Pick out a technique that suits you best, burn it and save it, hold it in your hand and study it 
carefully.

Then the attic will be opened to allow other monks to enter and gain insights.

Sudden.

Wu Yuxi stood up abruptly.



He quickly flew down from the attic.

Just at this time.

Several streaks of light flashed quickly in the distance.

After a while.

Nangong Damo, taking care of the Galaxy Holy World group, flew down outside the attic.

Wu Yuxi hurriedly stepped forward and greeted him warmly.

"We haven't seen each other for so many years, but Brother Da Mo still looks as good as before."

Hear this.

Nangong Damo quickly responded with his hands raised.

"Deacon Wu, thank you very much."

"I've been practicing for many years, but I haven't made any progress at all. Brother Wu's words 
really make me ashamed."

Shangyunfang is the nearest Void City to the Galaxy Holy World.

As a deacon of the Taoist League who guards the local area.

Nangong Damo and Wu Yuxi had dealt with each other countless times.

But in the past, everyone was only polite on the surface.

Wu Yuxi has never been so enthusiastic as today.



Of course Nangong Damo knows.

Wu Yuxi's enthusiasm is naturally not because of himself.

But their legendary Holy Lord.

The Holy Lord of the Galaxy has been powerful for countless years, and now he has been promoted 
to the eternal emperor.

If we really want to talk about strength.

It is estimated that it is enough to stand shoulder to shoulder with several lords.

Nangong Damo and others came from the same realm as Zhang Yuhe, and could be regarded as 
Zhang Yuhe's disciples.

Wu Yuxi naturally had to receive him warmly.

I don't dare to be as arrogant as before.

It doesn't matter if he offends Nangong Damo.

But if the Holy Lord of the Galaxy is displeased, wouldn't he think his life is too long?

Wu Yuxi stepped forward quickly and asked enthusiastically.

"Brother Da Mo is here to read the inheritance, everyone, please come with me."

After saying this.

He stretched out his right hand and led everyone through the queue and into the attic.



Because the Jinglou in Shangyunfang has just been opened.

Countless monks from all over the place crowded around.

Due to limited space.

It is naturally impossible for the Dao Alliance to let everyone go in and read the inheritance 
together.

to this end.

Wu Yuxi had already established rules and laid out formations.

The monks who come here will each receive a medal in order of priority.

One round for every hundred monks.

Only after the monks from the previous round come out can the monks from the second round enter.

Because the Milky Way Holy World is far away, Nangong Damo and others arrived a little late.

Originally, they were supposed to wait slowly in line at the back.

But now that Wu Yuxi is leading them, they naturally don't have to wait any longer.

Everyone passed through the formation and quickly entered the attic.

Nangong Dasho looked around.

Only a wide hall appeared in front of everyone.



On the walls of the hall, mysterious paintings exude a faint Taoist aura.

At this time, the hundred people who came in early were sitting cross-legged in various places in 
the hall, observing and comprehending carefully.

Nangong Damo doesn’t talk nonsense either.

He cupped his hand towards Wu Yuxi and said gratefully.

"Thank you, Deacon Wu. I'll look at the inheritance first."

Wu Yuxi responded with a smile.

"Take your time and watch, don't be in a hurry."

"Each of these Hongmeng inheritances is extremely mysterious."

"You must understand it carefully before you can choose one that fits your own skill inheritance."

“Don’t be too impatient.”

After giving a serious reminder, Wu Yuxi slowly exited the attic hall.

Nangong Damo and others stood in the center of the hall.

Silently looking at the inheritance pictures filled with Taoist charm, I was extremely excited.

Just at this time.

Heihe next to him said in wonder.

"As expected of the inheritance from Hongmeng, it is indeed extremely mysterious."



"Compared with these inheritances, the techniques we have practiced are simply rubbish."

At this time, Emperor Beiyuan also echoed.

"yes."

"If we had done it before, we would have been able to obtain such a skill."

"How can we all be trapped in the eternal realm for such a long time?"

"Perhaps I have already used this to break through to the Supreme Realm."

"It is the true supreme state, not those pseudo-supreme beings who are integrated into the universe."

Hearing what Emperor Beiyuan said.

Everyone nodded silently.

As the most outstanding group of people in the Galaxy Holy World.

The talents of these eternal emperors are naturally extremely extraordinary.

Unfortunately.

Due to limited inheritance, vision, and resources.

For so many years.

They are still in the eternal realm.

Once upon a time everyone had accepted their fate.



I thought it would never be possible again in this life, and I would have even the slightest chance to 
break through.

However, after seeing these inheritance scrolls.

They just know.

Your chance has come.

With these Hongmeng inheritance and various conveniences brought by the rise of Galaxy Holy 
Lord.

They couldn't help but have strange thoughts in their hearts.

Maybe you can give it a try.

Even in the long river of chaos, they do not have enough time to break through to the supreme 
realm.

In the future, he will fight into the Destruction Abyss and reach behind Hongmeng Yuantian.

You can definitely break through to the Supreme Realm.

Section 1318

Think of this.

Everyone silently strengthened their faith.

We must follow the footsteps of the Holy Lord and fight our way out of the long river of chaos.

Go and see the vast Hongmeng world.

…



Chapter 918 Ten Thousand Sources Return to the Great Formation

Along with countless sutra towers, they were established and opened in various Void Square cities.

The entire chaotic river seemed to be glowing with infinite vitality.

A large number of monks above the God King level have found the nearest Void Square City.

Observe and comprehend the Hongmeng inheritance left by Qingyangzi.

Not only did everyone individually choose a method that suited them.

Moreover, a copy of all the Hongmeng inheritance in the Sutra Tower was burned.

Then take it back to your own universe and spread it more widely.

Qingyangzi did not set any restrictions on these inheritances.

As long as they are the creatures in this world.

Even ordinary people who have just entered the path of spiritual practice can also learn these 
advanced techniques.

We truly achieve education without distinction.

have to say.

Qingyang is indeed generous enough.

But it’s normal to think about it.



After all, this world was created by Qing Yangzi.

to him.

The monks in the entire Chaos River are all subjects under his banner.

If he waits until he recovers his cultivation and regains control of the world.

So these monks in the river of chaos are still at his disposal?

It can be said that it is his own strength.

So he is naturally very generous.

I am also willing to spread the truth so that everyone can practice further.

When those Hongmeng inheritance gradually spread.

The monks throughout the Chaos River have fallen into infinite enthusiasm for personal cultivation.

Especially those high-level supreme god kings.

for them.

As long as you take one more step, you will finally achieve eternal success.

Then they can follow the steps of the Dao Alliance Lord in the future.

Let’s transcend the long river of chaos and move towards the broader Hongmeng Yuantian.

From now on, the world is infinitely wide and there are no longer any restrictions.



Nothing can replace the monk's pursuit of freedom.

This is their last chance.

How could anyone give up?

Countless god king monks, after choosing the inheritance that suits them.

Soon he entered seclusion.

They even mobilized relatives, friends, and disciples to help collect various cultivation resources.

In order to launch the final impact to the eternal realm.

…

Daomeng station.

Not far from Chengtiantai.

A magnificent high platform rises from the ground.

The platform is ninety thousand feet high and has a radius of nearly ten million miles.

It is even nearly ten times higher than the Chengtiantai next to it.

On the outskirts of the high platform.

One by one, the giant pillars of the sky stood quietly in the void.

The giant pillar shines with spiritual light, and the Taoist charm is vertical and horizontal.



Astonishingly, they are all supreme weapons.

This is a super formation.

It also comes from the Hongmeng inheritance left by Qingyangzi.

All sources return to the formation.

In order to help Zhang Yuhe, create a suitable holy land for cultivation.

The nine lords of the Dao Alliance have completely revealed their old roots.

They spent all the Dao Alliance's inventory to refine the Origin Returning Pillars at the level of the 
Supreme Weapon.

The nine Lords worked together for millions of years.

Only now has this formation been completed.

Zhang Yuhe stands on a high platform.

Looking at the Guiyuan Pillars in the distance, towering into the sky.

Infinite emotion in my heart.

In order for him to be promoted to the Supreme Realm as soon as possible, the Lords of the Dao 
League really went to great lengths.

If this still doesn't work, I will be promoted smoothly before the end of this era.

Zhang Yuhe himself would feel a little embarrassed.



That would disappoint the expectations of his seniors.

Just when Zhang Yuhe was still sighing.

Several streaks of light passed by in the distance.

Yuan Zun and others flew down on the high platform.

Lord Yin Yang holds a jade array plate in his hand.

I saw him quickly pinching the magic formula, and then stretched his hand towards the array.

Boom...

A huge roar instantly shook the entire Changhe world.

The endless aura of divine power around them quickly swarmed toward the high platform.

"Haha, this Fang Wanyuan returns to the big formation, and he has finally arranged a great 
achievement."

"It's not like we have been busy for millions of years."

Lord Yin Yang laughed.

He was in charge of setting up this formation, and Yuan Zun and others were just doing it.

Just help refine the Return to Origin Pillar.

As for Zhang Yuhe.

He is not even qualified to intervene.



Although Zhang Yuhe's understanding is incredible, his talent for array formation is also very good.

All kinds of formations can be arranged at your fingertips.

But like Wanyuan Guiyi, this supreme-level formation.

He really had no choice.

It's beyond the scope.

No matter how defiant Zhang Yuhe is, even the step-up challenge is as easy as drinking water.

But setting up a large formation across steps is simply impossible.

Including refining the supreme artifact, or activating the supreme artifact.

The same is not possible.

This is limited by the rules of heaven.

If the realm is not enough, then it is impossible.

There is absolutely no possibility of cheating.

…

Lord Yin Yang held the array plate in his hand and watched the aura of divine power sweeping 
across the sky.

There was a hint of pride on his face.



It is not easy for Fang Wanyuan to return to the Great Formation.

Section 1319

This is the inheritance formation from Hongmeng.

He can arrange such a large formation in a world like Chaos River.

It is indeed enough to be proud of.

The Ten Thousand Sources Return Formation can gather on its own, the aura of divine power within 
a side of the world.

There is no need for monks to guide them.

Relying on the power of the large formation, the divine power in the entire world can be slowly 
gathered on the high platform.

Pulling the power of heaven and earth into unity.

If a monk sits cross-legged and sits high, his cultivation speed will inevitably increase 
exponentially.

For ordinary monks, perhaps this kind of large formation is not very critical.

After all, for most monks, the difficulty in their practice has never been a matter of divine power.

Rather, there are various bottlenecks and barriers.

But Zhang Yuhe is different.

He has never encountered any bottlenecks in his practice so far.

It was as if this test of heaven to the monks had completely ignored him.



For Zhang Yuhe.

He only needs to slowly fill his Dantian with breath.

You can naturally advance to the next level.

No difficulty at all.

As long as the aura of divine power is strong enough, his cultivation speed can be faster.

Looking at the distance, the spiritual wave is sweeping in.

Zhang Yuhe looked at the Lord Yin and Yang next to him, and said with gratitude.

"Thank you, senior, for your help."

"With this Fang Wanyuan Return Formation, this junior will be more confident about being 
promoted to the Supreme Realm."

Lord Yin Yang responded with a smile.

"You're welcome, fellow Daoist Galaxy."

"Speaking of which, we will all need it in the future and rely on the help of fellow Taoists."

"If fellow Taoist can successfully advance to the Supreme Realm, then we will have a chance to 
reach Hongmeng Yuantian safely."

"Moreover."

"This is not my fault alone."



"If Yuan Zun and others don't help each other."

"If I want to set up such a large array, I'm afraid I may not be able to succeed even if I have to work 
for hundreds of millions of years."

Hear this.

Zhang Yuhe turned to look at the others, quickly raised his hands and said.

"Thank you seniors for your help. I am really grateful."

Yuan Zun waved his hand, then smiled and responded.

"Don't think about anything now."

"for you."

"Nothing is more important than your breakthrough to the Supreme Realm."

"Only if you are successfully promoted, will we be able to fight our way out of the abyss of 
destruction in the future."

"Otherwise."

"It's just us old guys and senior Qingyangzi who has not recovered his strength."

"Even if you open the door of creation and fight out, you will probably die."

"There must be no return."

"Nothing was left to chance."



Speaking of which.

Yuan Zun paused for a while.

He looked at Zhang Yuhe beside him and spoke solemnly.

"Only you have the strength to lead everyone out of the abyss of destruction and towards the vast 
Hongmeng Origin Sky."

"So you don't have to worry about anything."

"As long as it's useful, please feel free to mention it to us old guys."

"Even if it only gives you a chance to improve your strength a little."

“We can all do it for you at any cost.”

"One word."

"You are the hope for all of us."

"For this hope, we can do anything."

…

Chapter 919 Heaven behaves as it should and everything is natural

Seeing Yuan Zun and others acting so solemnly.

Zhang Yuhe felt a little helpless.

In fact, he really wanted to say it.



Is it necessary to be so nervous?

Don't you just want to fight your way out of the abyss of destruction?

Although Qingyangzi had previously described the destructive monsters in the Jue Abyss as 
terrifying.

It is said that there are countless destructive monsters in the abyss.

Especially those first-class destruction beasts, whose strength is extremely terrifying.

It can be regarded as a semi-sacred existence.

It is almost impossible to cope with it under the saint.

But in Zhang Yuhe's view.

That's probably what happened.

Although he has never seen even one Destruction Monster.

It is even more impossible to see a first-class destruction monster in the semi-sacred realm.

But he never worried that after fighting his way out of the Chaos River in the future, he would be 
blocked by these destructive monsters.

Especially after observing the Hongmeng inheritance left by Qingyangzi.

Zhang Yuhe had a mysterious confidence in his own strength.

He didn't think that those semi-sacred realm destructive monsters could stop him.



No need to wait fifty trillion years.

Even if you break out of the chaos now.

Zhang Yuhe is also confident that he can find a way out of the abyss of destruction.

Although Qingyangzi exaggerated the strength of those first-class destruction monsters.

But in Zhang Yuhe's view.

Isn't the so-called semi-saint still in the Yin-Yang realm?

Got it.

That is to say, it is just a big level higher than what he is now.

It’s not like crossing two big realms.

Is it that scary?

Even now, I might not be able to defeat those first-class destruction monsters.

But it is absolutely impossible for the other party to keep him.

There will definitely be no problem in fighting a way out.

Zhang Yuhe is fully confident in this.

not to mention.

It's still early before the appointed time.



Nearly fifty trillion years.

Zhang Yuhe thinks.

Even if you don't practice deliberately, you can probably break through a few more small realms.

If you practice seriously.

Then there will be no problem in advancing to the Supreme Realm.

After all, there are still 50 trillion years.

A mortal's life cannot last for decades.

50 trillion years is enough for a mortal to reincarnate countless times.

Section 1320

Such a long time.

Wouldn't it be a joke if he couldn't be promoted to the Supreme Realm?

about this matter.

Zhang Yuhe has never been worried.

This is just a matter of course.

No need to worry at all.

despite this.



Looking at the Guiyuan Pillars soaring into the sky in the distance, I felt the frenzy of spiritual 
energy sweeping around them.

Zhang Yuhe's heart was still filled with infinite gratitude.

In order for him to break through successfully.

Yuan Zun and others are indeed worried.

It's just that Zhang Yuhe doesn't know what to say now.

Did he want to say it?

Seniors, don’t worry.

Those destructive monsters in the abyss are not terrible. Can I deal with them now?

If he really said that.

It is estimated that Yuan Zun and others will be even more worried.

Worried that he is an egomaniac.

Maybe something big will happen in the future.

"Well, I have to say something to make everyone feel at ease."

Think of this.

Zhang Yuhe looked at everyone, and then spoke slowly.

"Seniors, please feel free to worry."



"Let's use this Fangwanyuangui formation to help us."

"I am confident that I can be promoted to the Supreme Realm within ten trillion years."

"It will definitely not delay things."

Hearing Zhang Yuhe's words.

Everyone couldn't help but breathe a sigh of relief.

Yuan Zun said excitedly.

"Okay, just be sure."

"As long as you succeed in breaking through, we will have the confidence to break out of the abyss 
of destruction."

"Only then can we reach Hongmeng Yuantian safely and set foot on that vast world."

The Void Lord next to him also echoed.

"yes."

"If we don't have enough strength to fight our way out of the abyss of destruction, it would be 
equivalent to dying."

"Senior Lian Qingyangzi was a peerless expert in the Yin and Yang realm back then."

"They all fell into the abyss countless times, and even ended up hurting the origin of heaven and 
earth."

"We old guys, although we are somewhat confident in our own strength."



"But we all know it."

"There is a huge gap between me and senior Qingyangzi."

"Even he can't break out of the abyss of destruction, and it's even more impossible with us."

"Only you can truly lead everyone out."

"Fellow Taoist Master Yinhe masters three thousand avenues, and his combat power far exceeds 
that of monks of the same level."

"Once promoted to the Supreme Realm in the future, it may be enough to compete with the Semi-
Saints."

"Only then can we have any hope of success."

Hear this.

Zhang Yuhe nodded lightly, and then responded lightly.

"Senior, please rest assured, I will definitely live up to everyone's expectations."

Everyone stood on the high platform and chatted in detail about the next integration plan.

After a long time.

Yuan Zun looked at Zhang Yuhe slightly, smiled and said.

"Okay, you can practice well here first, and we won't disturb you."

"If you need anything, please ask."



"No need to be polite to us old guys."

"As long as there is anything in this chaotic river, we will find a way to get it for you."

Zhang Yuhe bowed his hands towards everyone, and then responded solemnly.

"Thank you, seniors. If you need anything, I won't bother you until then."

"Haha, easy to say."

After some polite greetings, Yuan Zun flew away with a group of Dao Alliance Lords.

After all, they are busy too.

Since choosing the inheritance method that suits them, they have not yet started to practice.

They have been busy building the Wanyuangui Formation for Zhang Yuhe.

Now that the great formation is activated, a frenzy of spiritual energy is rolling in from all around.

The array is operating normally.

Naturally, they have to go back and prepare to switch to practicing martial arts.

Zhang Yuhe stood on the high platform, looking in the direction where everyone was leaving, and 
remained silent for a long time.

After a while.

He just muttered to himself.



"Hope everything goes well."

"Don't make any mistakes and fail to break through to the Supreme Realm."

"That's a big joke."

Think of this.

Zhang Yuhe couldn't help but shook his head.

I saw him wave his right hand.

A mini world slowly emerged in front of him.

This is the world that evolves after joining the Tao.

Galaxy sky.

Zhang Yuhe looked towards the sky and the earth.

In the vast world, countless tiny cosmic worlds are blooming with vitality.

A large number of powerful creatures are constantly being born and growing in those cosmic 
worlds.

Some powerful creatures have even been promoted to the Golden Fairy Realm.

Become a tyrannical existence on both sides.

But what makes Zhang Yuhe regretful is that.

Currently, various races are emerging in the Milky Way, but the human race has not been born yet.



The human race is the leader of all spirits, and it is also the most complex and difficult race to 
evolve.

Zhang Yuhe did not intervene forcibly, nor did he move the human race from the outside into the 
Galaxy Sky.

Because in his opinion.

God's actions are constant, and everything is natural.

Natural evolution is the most perfect.

If there is too much interference, it may become an obstacle to his practice in the future.

Just let nature take its course.

Looking at the vast and vibrant scene in the Milky Way sky.

Zhang Yuhe thought silently in his heart.

…

Chapter 920: If you don’t break the Supreme, you won’t be able to escape.

Zhang Yuhe silently watched the mini world floating in front of him.

He saw a towering tree, quietly taking root in the void of heaven and earth.

The infinite and mysterious aura of Taoism rose up around the towering tree.

That was Wu Yiyi's true body.
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