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As Taiyi Immortal Perfection, it was almost impossible for Cheng Yuanshan and others to have a 
chance to kill Wu Tianyi quickly.

After all, no one would stand around and get beaten.

If you can't beat him, you can still run.

Even if you can't run away, you can still avoid some damage.

If there is no powerful trump card.

In a fight between Taiyi Immortals of the same level, it would be difficult to determine the winner 
without fighting for ten days and a half.

If one party deliberately avoids it, the time will drag on even longer.

However, in front of Zhang Yuhe, they not only couldn't run away.

Even if you want to avoid some harm, you can't do it.

It's just a stick to the flesh.

Not a stick is wasted.

Facing such intensive attacks, no matter how hard the turtle shell is.

That's unbearable.

Click...



Then Zhang Yuhe smashed it down with a stick.

Above Wu Tianer's head, the light curtain held up by the black beads finally couldn't hold it 
anymore.

The light curtain instantly shattered.

At this time, Wu Tianer knew that he was about to die.

It's just that he doesn't understand.

They have been delaying for so long, why hasn't Long Yuanguang come over yet.

Instead of letting them leave the people from Wanxian Sect and Chaotian Palace behind.

Then Long Yuanguang, will you come and handle it yourself?

It's been so long now.

All the members of their Divine Beast Sect will soon die.

But he didn't even see Long Yuanguang's shadow.

Could the majestic Da Luo Immortal King run so slowly?

It's just a scam.

At this time, Wu Tianer still didn’t know.

The sect master he expected was sent back to his hometown by the Wanshan Immortal King a long 
time ago.



the most important is.

This cheating sect leader actually forgot to inform them.

Maybe in Long Yuanguang's eyes.

Anyway, the Wu brothers can't suffer a big loss when facing the people from Wanxian Sect and 
Chaotian Palace.

If it doesn't work, then come back by yourself.

Do you think I, the sect leader, need to send someone to pick you up?

The light curtain held up by the black beads was shattered by Zhang Yuhe's stick.

Wu Tianer went completely crazy.

He gave up resistance and did not continue to use defensive weapons.

He only has this top-grade defensive immortal weapon.

As for the middle-grade immortal weapon, Zhang Yuhe might not even be able to stop it with a 
stick.

That being the case.

That's still a bit of a struggle.

Early death and early rebirth.

Wu Tianer shouted crazily.



"Ah ah ah, if you want to die, let's all die together."

Almost instantly.

Wu Tianer's body expanded rapidly.

"Hold the grass, he's going to blow himself up, get out of the way."

Zhang Yuhe couldn't help being shocked when he saw Wu Tianer's crazy behavior.

While he was using all his strength to activate the Galaxy Wandering Dragon Movement Technique, 
he shouted loudly towards Cheng Yuanshan and the others.

Boom...

With a loud bang.

The ferocious shock wave swept across tens of millions of miles in an instant.

The first one to bear the brunt was the Nine Heavens Hunyuan Sword Formation arranged by Zhang 
Yuhe.

Almost instantly.

The sword energy light curtain was directly shattered by this huge shock wave.

Not only that.

The light curtain held up by the Bahuang Forbidden Spirit Array on the periphery was also blasted 
away by this ferocious shock wave.

The peaks within tens of millions of miles were swept to the ground in an instant.



At the center of the explosion, a huge crater appeared.

Zhang Yuhe appeared from a distance.

Looking at the scene in front of him, he was completely stunned.

Fortunately, he ran fast just now.

Otherwise, I'm afraid I'll be blown to death.

Wu Tianer is really cruel.

Will actually self-destruct.

Normally.

A Taiyi Immortal with an eternal lifespan, no matter how desperate the situation is.

There will be some struggle.

After all, immortality is not easy.

However, Wu Tianer was so decisive.

Suddenly he blew himself up.

He beat Zhang Yuhe and others, catching them off guard.

Ahem...

Cheng Yuanshan and the other three appeared in disgrace.



The tall image of Taiyi Immortal Lord is completely gone.

Qian Yuanjiang spit out a mouthful of blood.

After a while, he finally recovered.

He was obviously seriously injured.

Fortunately, these three of them are all top experts in the Taiyi Realm.

In addition, there was a reminder from Zhang Yuhe.

They put up defensive measures in time and withstood the shock wave of Wu Tianer's self-
destruction.

Zhang Yuhe looked into the distance.

I saw those Jinxian disciples in the distance, all of them with sluggish auras.

Even these Golden Immortal disciples are at least millions of miles away from the location of the 
explosion.

Still not completely immune to the impact of the shock wave.

Fortunately, they are far enough apart.

So the damage suffered is not too great.

Otherwise.

A Perfect Taiyi Immortal self-destructed, enough to blow them all into ashes.



Qian Yuanjiang came to his senses and spoke with lingering fear.

"This Wu Laoer is so ruthless that he will blow himself up."

Because the distance is too close.

Even though he had already used immortal weapons to prop up his defense just now.

Wu Tianer was still shocked by the shock wave of self-destruction, causing him to vomit blood.

If only it were slower.

He might all be blown up.

Cheng Yuanshan and Li Chengqing also looked pale.

They were also seriously injured in that moment.

The power of a Perfect Taiyi Immortal to self-destruct is no joke.
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It's definitely no worse than Da Luo Immortal King's full blow.

But fortunately, I got through it.

Cheng Yuanshan glanced around.

He took a deep breath and then said to everyone.

"Let's rest for a while and then return to Fairy City."

…



Chapter 276 Zhang Yuhe’s worries

In the wilderness of Chaos Continent, two streams of light quickly crossed the sky.

The immortal ships of Wanxian Sect and Chaotian Palace were flying in the air at high speed.

Although Long Yuanguang had already been forced back by the Wanshan Immortal King.

Even everyone in the Divine Beast Sect who was accompanying him was killed.

Logically speaking.

Now on the way back, we will definitely not encounter danger again.

despite this.

Li Chengqing still insisted and followed the team from Wanxian Sect to go to Wanxian City first.

Then he took the disciples from Chaotian Palace and teleported back from Ten Thousand Immortals 
City.

Today's series of events really frightened him.

Li Chengqing thought, it would be better to be more stable.

Even if you don’t think about yourself.

He also has to consider the more than a thousand Golden Immortal disciples.

These are all elite disciples of Chaotian Palace.

They experienced life and death in the secret realm.



After finally returning from the secret realm, he encountered a series of changes.

But no more accidents can happen.

In order to bring this group of Golden Immortal disciples back to Chaotian Palace intact.

Li Chengqing felt that it didn't matter even if it was a big circle.

Just don't make any more mistakes.

On the Immortal Ship of Wanxian Sect.

Everyone was discussing something in excited whispers while quietly looking at Zhang Yuhe.

His eyes were full of admiration.

On the entire fairy ship, except for a few people such as Zhang Yuhe and Nangong Youxi, they were 
from subordinate forces.

The others are all core disciples from the Ten Thousand Immortals Sect.

In normal times.

They would not look twice at the disciples from the subordinate forces.

Compared with the Ten Thousand Immortals Sect, subordinate forces like the Nangong Immortal 
Clan are far behind.

In front of people from subordinate forces.

These disciples from the Ten Thousand Immortals Sect, a super powerful force, are naturally aloof.



However, Zhang Yuhe's performance today completely conquered everyone.

Everyone is also in the Golden Wonderland.

Even Zhang Yuhe's cultivation level was only in the late Golden Immortal stage.

There are many disciples on the Immortal Ship who are higher in cultivation than him.

But the strength Zhang Yuhe showed was really exaggerated.

Three thousand Divine Beast Sect disciples were wiped out with one sword.

Moreover, he can temporarily burst into cultivation and fight side by side with Taiyi Immortal Lord.

Even in everyone’s eyes.

After Zhang Yuhe broke out in cultivation, he was stronger than the three Taiyi Immortal Lords 
present.

It may be much stronger.

Didn’t you see that the three ancestors of the Immortal Lords are still a little sluggish even now?

However, nothing happened to Zhang Yuhe.

When Wu Tianer blew himself up just now.

Not only was Zhang Yuhe not injured, there was not even a trace of dust on his clothes.

A perfect image of a superior person.



Zhang Yuhe stood at the front of the fairy ship, playing with a storage bracelet in his hand.

This is Wu Tianyi’s storage bracelet.

After everyone discussed it just now.

It was decided to allocate Wu Tianyi's spoils to Zhang Yuhe, while Cheng Yuanshan and the other 
three would share Wu Tianer's spoils.

They all know it in their hearts.

If Zhang Yuhe hadn't been involved.

They may not even be able to keep one.

If the Wu brothers can't be beaten, they will run away.

In that case, they would most likely not be able to catch up.

But after Zhang Yuhe joined.

The situation was reversed in an instant.

The Wu brothers couldn't even run away.

in this battle.

Zhang Yuhe undoubtedly played a decisive role.

So, after everyone discussed it.

They unanimously decided to distribute Wu Tian’s loot to Zhang Yuhe.



Zhang Yuhe didn't have any objections to the distribution of spoils.

Compared to what he gained in the secret realm.

He really didn't pay much attention to what Wu Tianyi had on him.

But since it was something given to him, he wasn't being pretentious.

Just take it.

Compared to other disciples, their faces were all filled with excitement about surviving the disaster.

Zhang Yuhe stood at the front of the fairy ship with a worried look on his face.

This time he went all out and revealed all his trump cards.

I'm afraid I'll have to live in obscurity for a while from now on.

If he doesn't improve his strength, he won't dare to go out.

the reason is simple.

If others know his strength, they will naturally make targeted arrangements.

Especially this time, he had offended the Divine Beast Sect so badly.

Because Cheng Yuanshan was a cheat and did not tell him the news of Long Yuanguang's retreat in 
time.

Run away in order to get out of trouble earlier.



Zhang Yuhe used all his firepower and wiped out not only the Divine Beast Sect but also nearly 
three thousand Golden Immortal disciples.

They even killed the Wu brothers.

These are the backbone of the Divine Beast Sect.

Especially the Wu brothers, both have attained the Dzogchen cultivation level of Taiyi Immortal.

Even in the powerful Divine Beast Sect, there are only a few people with such cultivation.

Anyone who dies will be extremely distressed.

Not to mention, he killed two of them in a row.

Don't know what's next.

Will the Divine Beast Sect deal with him?

Thinking of this, Zhang Yuhe couldn't help but feel a little depressed.

Just blame Cheng Yuanshan.

If you had told him earlier, wouldn't everything be fine?

He just needs to endure quietly, and then follow the large army back home peacefully.

This is just great.

Even if the Divine Beast Sect didn't know, he defeated Long Aotian.

I probably won’t let him go either.
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It's really unfortunate.

I hope the Great Luo Immortal King of the Divine Beast Sect won't come to trouble him.

If it's just Taiyi Immortal Lord, then he's not too worried.

If he can't beat him, he can still run away.

I'm afraid that the Divine Beast Sect will send a Great Luo Immortal King, which will be a big 
trouble.

Qian Yuanjiang stood beside Zhang Yuhe with a pale face.

Wu Tianer's self-explosion really hurt him badly. I'm afraid he will have to rest for hundreds of 
years this time.

Seeing the worried expression on Zhang Yuhe's face.

Qian Yuanjiang quickly understood what was going on.

He smiled and said.

"Brother Zhang, don't worry."

"The Divine Beast Sect will definitely not find you. Even if they want to retaliate, they will come to 
the Wanxian Sect."

Hearing this, Zhang Yuhe couldn't help but be stunned?

How could it be?

I killed the person.



With so many people watching at the scene, it is impossible to keep it completely secret.

The Divine Beast Sect will definitely know it soon.

In this case.

Why did the Divine Beast Sect go to the Wanxian Sect instead of looking for himself?

Zhang Yuhe was very puzzled.

Qian Yuanjiang continued to explain.

"In the eyes of the Divine Beast Sect, you are all affiliated forces from the Wanxian Sect, and at best 
you are just a thug."

"Besides, even if the Divine Beast Sect wants to deal with you, they can't get around the Wanxian 
Sect."

"In that case, they must go directly to the Wanxian Sect."

"Don't worry, no matter how big the matter is, there is also the Wanshan Immortal King to take it."

Hearing Qian Yuanjiang's words, Zhang Yuhe was thoughtful.

It seems to be true.

In the eyes of the Divine Beast Sect.

He is just a soy sauce.

He just wants to go to the Taixu Secret Realm to find opportunities.



He has no grudge against the Divine Beast Sect, so naturally he will not take the initiative to 
provoke the people of the Divine Beast Sect.

He killed people because he had no choice.

Besides.

Even if the Divine Beast Sect wants to retaliate against him, it must first pass the Wanxian Sect.

No matter what the Divine Beast Sect wants to do.

We all have to find the Wanxian Sect first.

It's never his turn.

If you think about it this way.

It seems that he is too worried.

Thinking of this.

Zhang Yuhe breathed a sigh of relief in his heart.

I hope so.

…

Chapter 277 Return to Daosheng Sect

Ji'an Sea Area.



A stream of light quickly passed over the sea.

Zhang Yuhe urged his body skills and flew forward quickly.

After returning to Wanxian City from the secret realm.

He declined the invitation of Qian Yuanshan and others and did not continue to stay in the fairy city.

Instead, he returned to Nangong Sea Area with Nangong Youxi through the teleportation array.

Then he teleported to Ji'an Market.

Although Qian Yuanjiang's words of comforting him did make some sense.

The Divine Beast Sect should not come to trouble him for the time being.

But he still felt a sense of urgency in his heart.

He had to come back and practice in seclusion.

He couldn't hang out outside.

This time, Zhang Zhuhe was badly tricked by Cheng Yuanshan.

All the cards are exposed.

If he doesn't improve his strength quickly.

He really doesn't dare to go out again.

Zhang Yuhe thought in his heart.



At least he has to break through to Taiyi Immortal to feel safe.

Let's set a small goal first.

Spend 100,000 years to break through to Taiyi Immortal.

Zhang Yuhe turned into a stream of light and quickly passed over Yunfei Island.

After the merger of the three major sects, Daosheng Sect carried out a large-scale expansion of 
Yunfei Island.

Countless sect elders and disciples continuously displayed great magical powers to move mountains 
and fill the sea.

The area of the island has been expanded countless times.

Yunfei Island was originally only hundreds of thousands of miles in radius.

Now the area is tens of millions of miles in radius.

The current Yunfei Island is the largest island in the entire Ji'an Sea.

Zhang Yuhe passed Yunfei Island, quickly passed through the mountain gate, and landed outside the 
Galaxy Hall.

Walk into the hall.

He took out the Immortal Mirror, sent a message, and then sat down quietly beside the table.

In the Daotang Hall.

Lian Zhengyu was explaining something to a disciple.



Suddenly, his expression changed.

A Immortal Mirror appeared in his hand.

After casting a spell.

Seeing the information in the mirror, Lian Zhengyu couldn't help but be overjoyed.

"Is the Sect Master back?"

He quickly turned around and said to the disciples around him.

"You go down first, I still have things to deal with."

After saying this.

He quickly flew towards the Galaxy Hall.

After entering the hall, he saw Zhang Yuhe sitting at the top.

Lian Zhengyu shouted respectfully.

"Hello, Sect Master."

Zhang Yuhe responded with a smile.

"Sit down."

After sitting down, Lian Zhengyu asked with concern.

"Sect Master, did you have any accidents when you went to the Taixu Secret Realm this time?"



Although no one in the history of the Daosheng Sect had ever entered the Taixu Secret Realm.

But he had heard about the dangers in the secret realm.

In the rumors.

Almost all the people who are qualified to enter the Taixu Secret Realm are elite forces from the 
three major superpowers.

These people can be said to be the top golden immortals in the South Sea Immortal Realm.

Despite this.

Every time the secret realm is opened, there are still many people who fail to come out of the secret 
realm.
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The mortality rate in the Taixu Secret Realm is very high, which is known to everyone.

After Zhang Yuhe left, the entire Dao Sheng Sect had been worried about his safety.

Although everyone knows that Zhang Yuhe's strength far exceeds that of ordinary Golden Immortal 
monks.

As far as the Golden Immortal Realm is concerned, there should be no one stronger than him in the 
entire South China Sea Immortal Realm.

But even so, everyone is still worried.

If Zhang Yuhe cannot come back, what will the Holy Sect do?

The reason why the three major forces in the Ji'an sea area can merge together willingly.

It was nothing more than seeing hope in Zhang Yuhe.



I hope Zhang Yuhe can lead everyone to go further on the road to immortality.

Once Zhang Yuhe had an accident.

Then the seemingly powerful Tao Sheng Sect will immediately fall into pieces.

It was even far more serious than when Lu Yunfei disappeared.

Seeing Zhang Yuhe return safely, Lian Zhengyu finally breathed a sigh of relief.

Seeing Lian Zhengyu's worried look, Zhang Yuhe responded with a smile.

"It's okay. If we follow the team from Wanxian Sect, what accident can happen?"

He didn't mention a word about the various things that happened during this trip to the secret realm.

Although Dao Sheng Sect's current strength is indeed not weak.

The total number of Jinxian elders in the sect totals more than thirty.

In the entire South China Sea Immortal Territory, it is considered a not weak force.

However, it depends on who you are comparing to.

If compared with the Divine Beast Sect.

Then the strength of Dao Sheng Sect is simply as small as dust.

Not worth mentioning at all.

Zhang Yuhe didn't want to say too much to avoid worrying Lian Zhengyu and others.



After all, facing the pressure from the Divine Beast Sect, no one else could do much to help.

He can only rely on himself.

As long as your own strength improves quickly enough.

Naturally, you can deal with all threats.

The two of them sat in the main hall and talked about the affairs of the sect in detail.

Under Lian Zhengyu's management, Daosheng Sect developed smoothly.

The quantity and quality of sect disciples have been steadily improving.

Zhang Yuhe believes it.

As long as there is enough time, even without his care.

Sooner or later, the Dao Sheng Sect will develop into a major force in the South China Sea 
Immortal Domain.

Of course.

There must be a premise here.

That is, don't encounter some irresistible disasters.

After the two chatted in detail for a while.

Zhang Yuhe took out a space bracelet, handed it over and said.



"There are some things here, you can use them to enrich the sect's treasure house and sutra tower."

When he was in the Taixu Secret Realm, he gained a lot of resources.

There are countless secret books on various techniques and magical powers.

He basically has no use for most of them.

On the way back.

Zhang Yuhe specially organized these things.

I singled out some secret realms of magical powers and techniques that had no special markings and 
were very versatile.

It is planned to be used to enrich the Daosheng Sect’s library and scripture building.

As for those skills and magical powers that clearly bear traces of the Taixu Sect.

He didn't take it out.

These things are so eye-catching.

Just wait.

Let’s wait until he can occupy a place in the South China Sea Immortal Domain.

As for those cultivation resources, there is no problem.

After all, the resources are universal and no one can tell where they come from.

Zhang Yuhe will use those resources that he himself cannot use.



Pack them all up and put them individually in this space bracelet.

Hope to use these resources.

The elders and disciples of Daosheng Sect can grow quickly.

In that case, others can help him later.

After all, for such a large sect, he can't always rely on himself.

The strength of a sect still depends on its overall strength.

Lian Zhengyu took the space bracelet respectfully.

When his consciousness swept across the bracelet, he was stunned.

Originally, he thought it was an ordinary storage bracelet.

Little did he know that this bracelet was a precious space artifact.

The space inside the bracelet is vast.

But compared to the space bracelet itself, there were so many things inside that shocked him.

I saw all kinds of precious resources piled up in the bracelet space.

There are even some elixirs that even he himself dreams about.

In the bracelet space, they are piled randomly like weeds.

As for those cultivation resources suitable for true immortals and disciples below.



There are countless more.

Such a large number of resources simply exceeded Lian Zhengyu's imagination.

He even had some doubts as to whether Zhang Yuhe had gone to rob a super powerful force.

Otherwise, where did you get so many cultivation resources?

Are the resources in Taixu Secret Realm so abundant?

Are there so many resources that you can pick them up anywhere?

Zhang Yuhe collected resources for a year in the secret realm and then came back?

…

Chapter 278 Arrangements to establish a boundary-breaking formation

Lian Zhengyu was completely stunned when he looked at the vast amount of various cultivation 
resources in the space bracelet.

Don't say that he has never seen so many things in his life.

He didn't even dare to think about it.

There are simply too many.

Looking at the items in the space bracelet, Lian Zhengyu asked with a trembling voice.

"Sect Master, these things..."



Zhang Yuhe said with a smile.

"Don't worry, they are just some common resources, which I found in the Taixu Secret Realm."

"You put all these items into the sect's treasury and the book and scripture building."

"Open the supply to the sect elders and disciples, let everyone practice hard and improve their 
strength as much as possible."

"The strength of our Daosheng Sect is still a little weak."

"Once there is turmoil in the South Sea Fairyland, I am afraid it will be difficult to deal with it with 
our current strength."

To be honest.

Zhang Yuhe is not worrying about nothing.

Although it seems that the South Sea Fairyland is still peaceful at present.

Under the suppression of the three super powers, even if there are occasional disputes among other 
major forces.

They will not fight each other.

Except for the pressure of the Chaos Beast on the Chaos Continent.

Cultivators will not encounter too much danger in the South Sea Fairyland.

Section 335

But in Zhang Yuhe's opinion.

The problem lies with the three superpowers.



The Wanxian Sect and Chaotian Palace have joined forces to fight against the Divine Beast Sect, 
which has been going on for countless years.

For so many years, both sides have maintained a dangerous balance.

Once this balance is broken.

The entire South China Sea Immortal Territory will inevitably cause a bloody storm.

At that time, Dao Sheng Sect will definitely not be able to escape and will also be involved.

Especially this time, there has been such a big change in the Taixu Secret Realm.

Not only was Long Aotian suppressed by him in the secret realm, he would never be able to come 
back.

Even other members of the Divine Beast Sect, including the Wu brothers and the two Perfect Taiyi 
Immortals, were all beaten to death by him.

Zhang Yuhe didn't believe that the Divine Beast Sect could swallow this breath.

It would be weird if Long Yuanguang didn't do something.

It's just that he doesn't know.

What choice will Long Yuanguang make in the end?

Should he directly start a war with Wanxian Sect and Chaotian Palace, or make other moves 
secretly?

But Zhang Yuhe firmly believed.

At some point in the future, the Divine Beast Sect will inevitably take action.



So, on the way back.

Zhang Yuhe has always had a strong sense of urgency in his heart.

Not only does he want to improve his personal strength as soon as possible.

And we have to find a way to improve the overall strength of Daosheng Sect.

Otherwise.

In case the South China Sea Fairyland War starts.

They are afraid that they are not even qualified to be cannon fodder.

If that were to happen, it would definitely be a tragedy.

Looking at the space bracelet in his hand, Lian Zhengyu took a deep breath and said firmly.

"Sect Master, please rest assured that with these resources, the strength of our Dao Sheng Sect will 
inevitably reach a new level."

"If nothing else, the number of golden immortal elders in the sect will definitely increase 
significantly."

Zhang Yuhe nodded slightly.

In the immortal world, it is not too difficult to be promoted to Golden Immortal.

As long as the resources are sufficient and the talent is not too bad, it can still be piled up.

Just look at the Nangong Immortal Clan and you will know.



In the last beast wave.

The Nangong Immortal Clan at least mobilized more than a thousand Golden Immortal monks.

Although many of them are affiliated forces like Zhang Yuhe who were recruited.

But the Nangong Immortal Clan itself also had more than a thousand Golden Immortal monks 
going into battle.

The Nangong Immortal Clan can have so many Golden Immortal monks.

Naturally, this is due to their strong inheritance and various resources.

The inheritance and resources of the Dao Sheng Sect are now no worse than those of the Nangong 
Immortal Clan.

Even much stronger.

After all, Zhang Yuhe took away almost the entire Taixu Sect's foundation from the secret realm.

The inheritance and resources that Taixu Sect had accumulated over countless years basically fell 
into his hands.

With these inheritance and resources.

He didn't believe that Daosheng Sect would still be unable to develop.

Breaking through Taiyixian is a bit difficult.

But it should be no problem to bring out hundreds of Jinxian monks from the sect.

The two continued chatting for a while.



Zhang Yuhe suddenly remembered something and said to Lian Zhengyu.

"You let people build a boundary-breaking formation."

"I'm going to Yu Fantian in a while."

"Yes, Sect Master."

"It's just that we haven't collected the boundary-breaking stones yet. Even if the formation is built, it 
can't be activated."

Lian Zhengyu did not ask what Zhang Yuhe planned to do in the lower world.

There is no need to ask about this kind of thing.

Even if Zhang Yuhe just wants to return to the lower world to remember the past, he will support it.

It's just that they don't have the boundary-breaking stone in their hands.

Although Zhang Yuhe had specifically explained it before.

Long Xingxiu also kept trying to find ways.

It's just that the Boundary Breaking Stone is really hard to find.

After such a long time, Dao Sheng Sect still has not found the boundary-breaking stone.

Zhang Yuhe said with a smile.

"Just let people build a big formation. I have already found the boundary-breaking stone."



The resources in Taixu Secret Realm were much more than he imagined.

Although boundary-breaking stones were scarce, he still found several pieces in the secret realm.

Enough to use it several times.

Hearing this, Lian Zhengyu nodded and said.

"Okay, I'll make arrangements right away to have people start building the boundary-breaking 
formation."

The two chatted for a while, and then Lian Zhengyu got up and left.

Zhang Yuhe picked up the tea cup, took a sip, and then went to the training cave next to him.

He came to the side hall of the cave and erected the Nine Heavens Flying Spirit Stick on the high 
platform.

He has always used this innate treasure very well.

In many cases, it is even more powerful than the high-grade immortal weapon in the hands of Taiyi 
Immortal.

Zhang Yuhe has been thinking of ways to improve the level of the Nine Heavens Flying Spirit Stick.

The current grade of the Nine Heavens Flying Spirit Stick is still a middle-grade immortal weapon.

Based on his current cultivation level, it is enough for the time being.

But when he breaks through to the Taiyi realm, it will almost become meaningless.

Therefore, we cannot stop for a moment in improving this innate treasure.



Anyway, he has no shortage of resources.

He is just short of time, but not short of money.

If you want to improve the level of the innate treasure, you need to consume a lot of fairy minerals 
and fairy materials.

It still takes a long time.

After putting down a lot of various fairy mines, Zhang Yuhe slowly walked onto the training 
platform.

He took out a golden jade slip and looked at the contents on it carefully.

Soul-destroying finger.

This magical power obtained from the Taixu Secret Realm has a very strong spiritual soul.

Through this magical power, he will definitely be able to comprehend the law of soul.

Zhang Yuhe is confident.

Although he had already learned this magical power when he was in the Taixu Secret Realm.

But he still took out the jade slip and carefully pondered it.

Nine supreme laws in the fairy world.

At present, he has mastered the law of power, the law of time, and the law of space.

The remaining six laws.



They are the law of soul, the law of cause and effect, the law of reincarnation, the law of life, the 
law of death, and the law of yin and yang.

The most Golden Immortal cultivators can master are six laws.

Zhang Yuhe plans to comprehend the law of soul first, and then the law of yin and yang and the law 
of cause and effect.

As for the law of reincarnation, the law of life and the law of death, put them aside for the time 
being.

Let's talk about it after he breaks through to the Taiyi Realm.

...
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For the next several supreme laws, Zhang Yuhe plans to start with the Soul Law.

the reason is simple.

The Divine Soul Law can directly increase his combat effectiveness.

Even in all the supreme laws.

The Divine Soul Law is also one of the most powerful laws in combat.

Once you understand the law of soul and get started.

You can rely on the power of law to directly attack the depths of the enemy's soul.

Really killing people invisible.

No matter how strong the enemy's defense is, it can't prevent the soul attack.



After all, divine soul-type defensive weapons are extremely rare and precious.

Not many people have this kind of thing.

Zhang Yuhe obtained countless immortal weapons of various types in the Taixu secret realm.

But he really didn't see a few divine soul-type defensive weapons.

not to mention.

Chaos beasts cannot use fairy weapons.

If you use the Divine Soul Law to attack the Chaos Beast.

The powerful defensive capabilities of the Chaos Beast may be just for show.

Directly ignoring the defense, it shocked the soul of the Chaos Beast to death.

Zhang Yuhe has been jealous of this supreme law for a long time.

It's just that I have no way to start because I don't have the corresponding media.

Now that he has found the magical power of the Soul-Destroying Finger, he will naturally not let it 
go again.

First of all, we must master this supreme law.

As for the remaining supreme laws, they are all pretty good.

For example, the law of yin and yang integrates offense and defense, especially in defense, and has 
a unique effect.



There once was a supreme genius in the fairy world who understood the laws of yin and yang.

When he was in Taiyi Realm, he relied on the power of law to withstand the attacks of king-level 
chaos beasts.

All the way from the wilderness of Chaos Continent, he escaped back to the monk's territory.

Hence his fame.

The uniqueness of the Yin and Yang Law in defense also made Zhang Yuhe quite excited.

If you can master this law.

Not only can you improve your ability to save your life during a fight.

And it will definitely have a great assisting effect when overcoming the tribulation.

Naturally, Zhang Yuhe would not let go of this powerful supreme law.

It must be understood.

The law of cause and effect is relative.

In terms of combat effectiveness, there is not much improvement.

The greater role of the law of cause and effect is reflected in divination and curses.

If you control the law of cause and effect, you can use the power of the law.

Better to calculate cause and effect, avoid disaster and seek good luck.

Before the crisis comes, run away early.



And the law of cause and effect has another effect.

That is to directly curse the enemy to death through the power of law.

Kill the enemy hundreds of millions of miles away.

Even if it cannot directly curse death, it can still weaken the enemy's good luck.

Let the other party continue to suffer misfortune.

have to say.

The law of cause and effect is a particularly powerful and disgusting supreme law.

As for the remaining three supreme laws, although they have their own uses.

However, Zhang Yuhe planned to put it aside for the time being.

The law of reincarnation is too mysterious, and he doesn't even know the specific application 
scenarios and where it should be placed.

Is it used to reincarnate?

Probably not?

The laws of life and the laws of death are similar.

One death may be the end of a monk.

Zhang Yuhe felt that it might take a lot of time to understand these two laws.



What he lacks now is time.

So put that aside for now.

Zhang Yuhe put down the jade slip in his hand and silently realized the soul-destroying finger, the 
Taoist charm contained in this magical power.

…

Divine Dragon Sea Territory, Black Dragon Abyss.

A stream of light quickly crossed the sky.

Legend has it that the Black Dragon Abyss is the deepest place in the entire South China Sea 
Immortal Domain.

The sea water here is at least tens of thousands of feet deep.

Not only that.

Black Dragon Abyss is also one of the most mysterious and dangerous places in the South China 
Sea Immortal Domain.

Whenever a monk passes by.

Even if the sky is clear, there will suddenly be huge waves.

The huge waves contained powerful power and swallowed up the passing monks one by one.

Whether it is an ordinary true immortal monk or the powerful Taiyi Immortal Lord.

Neither can fly safely in the Black Dragon Abyss.



As time goes by, very few monks will come to Black Dragon Abyss to seek death.

But the strange thing is.

Black Dragon Abyss is located in the Shenlong Sea.

This is the base of the Divine Beast Sect.

I don’t know why, but the Divine Beast Sect has never eliminated the danger here.

someone said.

Black Dragon Abyss is the territory of the Divine Beast Sect, where immortal beasts are raised.

Those monks who passed by and disappeared were devoured by the immortal beasts of the Divine 
Beast Sect.

Others say.

Black Dragon Abyss is an ancient battlefield where Tao Ancestor once had a battle with Chaos 
Beasts.

The Tao Yun left on the battlefield occasionally breaks out.

That's why huge waves were set off in the sky, swallowing up the monks who were passing by.

There are even speculations.

Perhaps there is a top-notch innate Taoist artifact in the Black Dragon Abyss.

Dao tools occasionally emit part of their power.



Kill the monks who pass by.

No matter what the speculation is, it has never been confirmed.

As the landowner of Shenlong Sea Area.

The Divine Beast Sect has never said anything about the Black Dragon Abyss.

They only restricted the disciples of their sect and prohibited them from going to the Black Dragon 
Abyss.

Thus.

This gave Heilongyuan another mysterious veil.

Of course.

Although everyone is full of curiosity about Heilongyuan.

But unless you specifically seek death.

Otherwise, everyone would stay away from this place.

Countless bloody lessons have shown that.

Any cultivator who wanted to challenge Black Dragon Abyss would eventually disappear without a 
trace.

Not even a bone residue could be found.

Gradually, no one would come to Black Dragon Abyss anymore.
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Even if they need to pass by, everyone would rather go around in a big circle than be swallowed by 
the mysterious power of the Black Dragon Abyss.

The stream of light streaked across the sky and suddenly stopped on the sea.

Long Yuanguang appeared and stood quietly on the sea.

Suddenly, the surrounding wind and clouds changed color.

For no reason, huge waves rose on the sea.

Long Yuanguang stood on the sea, looking at the changes in front of him, his face was extremely 
calm.

It was as if he was used to it.

After a while.

A huge dragon head rose from the sea.

The dragon head poked out of the sea, like an oversized mountain.

It stood abruptly on the sea.

As for the dragon body, it was still hidden under the sea.

The huge dragon head slowly turned around and looked at Long Yuanguang in the distance.

A thunderous sound came from the dragon head's mouth.

"Yuanguang, why are you here?"



Long Yuanguang looked silent, and after a long while, he slowly said.

"Brother Ao, Aotian has disappeared in Taixu."

If someone passes by here at this time, they will be shocked.

There is really a dragon in Heilongyuan.

And this dragon is actually acquainted with the leader of the Divine Beast Sect.

This is really an amazing news.

But for those old-fashioned Daluo Immortal Kings.

This is not a big secret.

Because this black dragon was originally the guardian beast of the Divine Beast Sect, and his name 
is Ao Lie.

At the beginning, Long Yuanguang and Ao Lie established the Divine Beast Sect together in the 
Divine Dragon Sea.

They were originally close partners.

It can even be said that Ao Lie is also one of the founders of the Divine Beast Sect.

It is considered half the leader of the Divine Beast Sect.

…

Chapter 280 Ao Lie's Anger



Hearing Long Yuanguang's words, Ao Lie couldn't help but fall into silence.

Of course he knew Long Aotian.

At the beginning, Long Yuanguang, in order to continue his bloodline.

It was he who accompanied him to find the Black Dragon Daozu to ask for a Nine Heavens Flying 
Dragon Pill.

Otherwise.

Long Yuanguang himself might not even be able to see the Black Dragon Daozu.

Few people in the fairy world know this.

He Ao Lie is the legitimate son of the Black Dragon Daozu.

For some reason, he did not stay in the Black Dragon Demon Realm to practice.

Instead, he came to the distant South Sea Fairyland.

And together with Long Yuanguang, he established the Divine Beast Sect in the South Sea 
Fairyland.

He is also very optimistic about Long Aotian, the younger generation.

After Long Aotian was born, he was detected to have the Heavenly Saint Body.

This is definitely one of the most powerful physiques in the fairy world.

This special physique not only has a very fast training speed, but also has a strong combat power.



Once it grows up, the future is unimaginable.

However, what he didn't expect was.

Long Aotian actually disappeared.

And he disappeared in the Taixu Secret Realm.

After a long while, Ao Lie slowly asked.

"Why did Aotian go to the Taixu Secret Realm, and why did he disappear, have you found out the 
reason?"

Long Yuanguang shook his head and responded silently.

"I don't know. Aotian didn't say hello to me before he went to Taixu Secret Realm."

"You know, in order to cultivate Aotian's independence, I usually don't interfere with his actions."

"As for why he disappeared in Taixu Secret Realm, it's hard to say."

"Maybe he triggered some powerful formation in the secret realm, or maybe he was attacked and 
murdered by someone."

"Who knows."

Speaking of Long Aotian's disappearance, Long Yuanguang couldn't help showing a hint of sadness 
on his face.

It's said that a son comes in old age.

He practiced for countless billions of years and spent a lot of effort to get a Nine Heavens Flying 
Dragon Pill from the Black Dragon Daozu.



That's how Long Aotian was born.

However, this precious son who was finally obtained disappeared in the secret realm.

Although he should not have died for the time being.

But being trapped in the Taixu Secret Realm is actually no different from being dead.

Due to the special nature of the Taixu Secret Realm.

Even if the Daozu Emperor took action.

He couldn't get Long Aotian out of the secret realm.

What makes Long Yuanguang depressed the most is.

So far, he still doesn't know why Long Aotian is trapped in the secret realm.

Logically speaking.

With Long Aotian's ability and the trump card he carries.

There should be nothing in the entire Taixu Secret Realm that can threaten him.

However, this is the fact.

After the secret realm was closed, Long Aotian did not return in time.

Such a result is simply incredible.

Long Yuanguang always feels that there is something wrong here.



There must be something wrong, but he has not seen it through yet.

Ao Lie's huge dragon head stood up high, and he asked lightly.

"What about the other people who entered the secret realm together? Didn't they all come out?"

"I don't believe that you didn't find any clues from other people."

Hearing this, Long Yuanguang's face instantly darkened.

He responded hatefully.

"I came to you specifically for this matter."

"Of course, there are many people who have returned normally from the Taixu Secret Realm."

"Not only are there disciples from our Divine Beast Sect, but there are also disciples from Chaotian 
Palace and Wanxianmen."

"Almost half of the disciples have returned successfully from the secret realm, which is similar to 
the results of previous secret realm openings."

"When I received the news, I immediately rushed to the scene of the incident."

"But I was intercepted by Qian Wanshan on the way."

Speaking of this, Long Yuanguang paused.

Ao Lie sighed and took over the conversation.

"You can't beat Qian Wanshan, so you can't get there, and you missed the opportunity to find out the 
truth."



Ao Lie naturally knew that Long Yuanguang couldn't beat Wanshan Immortal King.

There have been many records of fighting between them.

Long Yuanguang has never taken any advantage of Wanshan Immortal King.

Unless the two of them join forces, they can suppress Wanshan Immortal King.

It's just that he usually cultivates in Heilongyuan, and he didn't know that such a big change would 
happen.

Long Yuanguang was silent.

After a long while, he slowly spoke.

"Because I didn't get there in time, all the disciples who entered the Taixu Secret Realm died."
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"Even the Wu brothers who led the team were killed."

"I still don't know who did it."

"It may be Qian Wanshan, or it may be other Daluo Immortal Kings."

Long Yuanguang had never set his suspicious eyes on Zhang Yuhe.

There is no doubt that Cheng Yuanshan and these Taiyi Immortal Lords are also going there.

In his opinion.

The person who can kill the Wu brothers must be Da Luo Immortal King.



Otherwise, even dozens of Taiyi Immortal Lords would attack together.

Even if the Wu brothers cannot be defeated, they should still be able to escape.

It will never be like this.

He died inexplicably.

Hearing Long Yuanguang's words.

Ao Lie couldn't help but be furious.

A giant black dragon rose into the sky, and the surrounding sea suddenly changed color.

A boundless tsunami swept across the world.

Ao Lie said angrily.

"How dare Qian Wanshan be so arrogant? Does he want to start a war in the South China Sea 
Immortal Domain?"

Compared to Ao Lie's anger, Long Yuanguang was quite indifferent.

After all, things have been in the past for a while.

He had already been angry.

And there is no point in being incompetent and furious.

All he wants now is revenge.



Under the condition of controlling the losses as much as possible, ruthlessly retaliate against 
Wanxian Sect.

Otherwise, he would not be able to let go of his bad breath.

After a while.

Ao Lie slowly calmed down his anger.

He took a deep breath and then asked slowly.

"What are you going to do?"

"How about the two of us kill Ten Thousand Immortals directly and catch him off guard?"

"Even if you can't destroy the Ten Thousand Immortals Sect, you can still beat him to a semi-
crippling state."

Hearing Ao Lie's words, Long Yuanguang couldn't help but sigh.

If it were in the past, he might have thought the same way.

But that’s definitely not possible now.

Long Yuanguang said helplessly.

"Brother Ao, do you know that Qian Wanshan has cultivated his immortal body to perfection."

"Now even if the two of us join forces, we probably won't be able to suppress him."

Hearing this, Ao Lie couldn't help but be stunned.



After a while, he sighed and said.

"Qian Wanshan is indeed a man of great opportunity."

"We should have dealt with him earlier."

"Keeping him here until now is already a recipe for disaster."

Originally, the two of them could suppress the Immortal King of Ten Thousand Mountains by 
joining forces.

Now the Immortal King of Wanshan has cultivated his Immortal Body to perfection.

They couldn't suppress it anymore.

Even in the Divine Beast Sect, the number of Da Luo Immortal Kings is twice that of the Ten 
Thousand Immortals Sect.

But if they don't deal with the Wanshan Immortal King, how can they dare to start a war.

The destructive power of a top monk is absolutely beyond imagination.

What's more, it's Qian Wanshan, the top-notch Great Luo Immortal King.

With the Immortal King of Ten Thousand Mountains around, they threw a rat weapon.

Don't dare to move at all.

…

Chapter 281 Liuhetian



I heard that Immortal King Wanshan has cultivated his Immortal Body to perfection.

Ao Lie fell silent.

Originally, the Immortal King of Wanshan was powerful.

Now that the immortal body is complete, it is even more unstoppable.

Even though the overall strength of the Divine Beast Sect is still stronger than that of the Ten 
Thousand Immortals Sect.

But they couldn't deal with the Immortal King Wanshan.

All ambitions are nothing but clouds.

more importantly.

Now it is no longer time to think about how to find the Wanxian Sect.

Rather, it should be considered.

How are they going to face the threat posed by the Ten Thousand Immortals Sect?

Now they are all unable to suppress Wanshan Immortal King.

As the time goes.

If Immortal King Wanshan is promoted to Taoist Ancestor in the future, what will they do?

If that day comes, they will definitely be dead.

And this is not unfounded.



Originally, neither Ao Lie nor Long Yuanguang thought that the Immortal King of Wanshan had the 
possibility of becoming the Taoist Ancestor.

After all, there are quite a few Daluo Immortal Kings in the Immortal World, but there are not many 
Dao Ancestors.

Among the ten thousand Daluo Immortal Kings, there may not be a Taoist ancestor.

It can be seen from this.

How difficult is it for a monk to achieve the state of Taoist ancestors.

But the Immortal King of Wanshan suddenly cultivated his Immortal Body to perfection.

This made them a little worried.

Immortal King Daluo cultivated his immortal body to perfection.

Then he only has the most critical step left to reach the realm of Tao Ancestor.

Once the Wanshan Immortal King found the original thing.

And if you successfully practice Taoism.

Then the possibility of him being promoted to Dao Ancestor will be greatly increased.

Thinking of the cultivation experience of Wanshan Immortal King, opportunities kept coming along 
the way.

Long Yuanguang and the others couldn't help but think so.

The two people were silent for a long time.



Ao Lie spoke slowly.

"Yuan Guang, what are you going to do?"

They couldn't beat him again and again, but it was impossible for them to let Wanshan Immortal 
King continue to grow.

We must find a way to curb the momentum of Immortal King Wanshan.

Just for a moment, Ao Lie couldn't think of any good solution.

But he knows.

Since Long Yuanguang came here, he must have already thought of a countermeasure.

That's why he asked this question.

Long Yuanguang was silent for a long time.

After a while.

He responded firmly, as if he had made some kind of difficult decision.

"I plan to contact He Ruobei and follow its original request."

Ao Lie was shocked when he heard Long Yuanguang's words.

He said with a trembling voice.

"Are you crazy? Do you really want to cooperate with Chaos Beast?"



"If you take this step, there will be no turning back."
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"And He Ruobei asked us to open the seal of Liuhetian and let the Chaos Beast from Helan 
Mountain in."

"If you really do this, aren't you afraid of getting burned?"

"The Chaos Beast doesn't care, whether it's the Wanxianmen or the Divine Beast Sect."

"Once the Chaos Beast enters the South Sea Fairyland, our Divine Beast Sect will definitely not be 
spared."

"The most important thing is that once this matter is known, there will be no place for the two of us 
in the entire fairyland."

Hearing Long Yuanguang's decision, Ao Lie almost thought he was crazy.

Many years ago, when the two of them were adventuring in the Chaos Continent.

They once encountered a Venerable Chaos Beast.

That was He Ruobei from the Helan Mountain Tribe.

Helan Mountain is one of the most powerful tribes among the Chaos Beasts.

In the entire tribe, there are more than ten Venerable Chaos Beasts alone.

As for the King-level Chaos Beasts, there are countless.

With their strength, they naturally cannot escape from the Venerable Chaos Beast.

After all, that is the existence equivalent to the Daozu.



However, they were lucky.

Perhaps it was the care of the goddess of luck.

He Ruobei did not use them as sacrifices.

Instead, he let them go directly.

But before leaving.

He Ruobei handed them a black horn.

He Ruobei told them at the beginning.

As long as they were still in the fairyland, they could contact Helan Mountain through the horn.

He Ruobei hoped that they could open the seal of Liuhetian.

In that case, the Chaos Beasts of Helan Mountain could bypass the Immortal City of Chaos 
Continent and directly enter the South Sea Fairyland.

And He Ruobei agreed.

As long as they could do this.

They could enter the Sea of Origin and look for the Origin Items.

Of course.

As for whether they could find it or not, it depended on their own luck.

After all, the Origin Items were not comparable to ordinary items.



Even in the Sea of Origin, if you want to find the Origin Items.

It also requires great luck.

After He Ruobei left, Long Yuanguang and Ao Lie immediately returned to the South Sea 
Fairyland.

After that, the two of them stayed in the mountain gate in fear.

They didn't dare to go out even half a step.

Originally, they thought that He Ruobei would do something to them.

For example, curses or mind control.

However, until hundreds of millions of years passed.

Long Yuanguang and Ao Lie didn't feel anything abnormal from themselves.

In fact, they also knew that Chaos Beasts didn't have similar means.

The cultivation path of Chaos Beasts was completely different from that of cultivators.

They took the path of sacrificial evolution.

Despite this.

Long Yuanguang and Ao Lie were still afraid.

After all, He Ruobei was a venerable Chaos Beast, equivalent to the existence of Daozu.



The means of such a terrifying existence were beyond their imagination.

So many years passed.

Ao Lie almost forgot about this matter.

Of course, they didn't follow He Ruobei's instructions to open the seal of Liuhetian.

All the cultivators in the fairy world knew that cooperating with Chaos Beasts never ended well.

As for what He Ruobei said, that they could go to the Sea of Origin to find the things of origin.

Even a fool would not believe it.

You know.

The Sea of Origin has always been the holy land of Chaos Beasts.

Chaos Beasts will not show mercy to any cultivator who enters the Sea of Origin.

Even if Daozu enters it, he will be chased by Chaos Beasts for hundreds of millions of miles.

So they just listened to this.

They were lucky to be able to save their lives.

They dared not think about the things of origin at all.

Besides.

The seal of Liuhetian is not so easy to open.



Liuhetian is the most dangerous Jedi in the South Sea Fairyland.

Legend has it that a long time ago.

A space channel suddenly appeared in the South Sea Fairyland.

One side of the channel is located in the Liuhe Sea, and the other side is connected to the Chaos 
Continent.

And it happens to be located in the hinterland of the Helan Mountain Tribe.

After the channel appeared.

Countless Chaos Beasts rushed into the South Sea Fairyland along the space channel.

The entire South Sea Fairyland instantly turned into a purgatory on earth.

A large number of cultivators were captured by Chaos Beasts as sacrifices.

They became Chaos Beasts and sacrificed them for evolution.

Since there was no Daozu in the South Sea Fairyland.

Facing the invasion of the Helan Mountain Tribe, there was no resistance at all.

After hearing the news, Tianxing Daozu immediately transferred a large number of people from 
Tianxing Fairyland to the South Sea Fairyland for support.

The two sides continued to fight for tens of thousands of years, and finally drove the Chaos Beasts 
out of the South Sea Fairyland.

Before leaving, Tianxing Daozu arranged a powerful fifth-level fairy formation.



The space channel was completely sealed.

To open the space channel, it is necessary to break the formation left by Tianxing Daozu.

In addition.

In the last battle.

Tianxing Daozu fought three supreme-level Chaos Beasts alone, and killed one of them.

Even the entire Liuhe Sea was turned into a wasteland.

The Dao rhyme left over from the battle was still extremely powerful.

Even if the Great Luo Immortal King entered it, there would be some danger.

So Long Yuanguang and Ao Lie never thought of opening the space channel of Liuhetian.

Even if He Ruobei tempted them with the origin of things, they were not moved at all.

Because there are too many risk factors involved.

…

Chapter 282 No matter how big the flood is

Ao Lie really couldn't understand why Long Yuanguang had such a crazy idea.

Let's not talk about whether the two of them can open the space channel.

Even if everything goes well.



They opened the space channel and no one else suspected them.

But what can they do.

Will the Chaos Beast of Helan Mountain let them go after entering the South Sea Fairyland?

Will He Ruobei really keep his promise and let them go to the Sea of Origin to find the Origin?

It's just a dream.

Once the Chaos Beast enters the South Sea Fairyland.

Then their Divine Beast Sect will not be able to escape either.
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Under the sweep of the beast tide.

There will be no pure land in the entire South Sea Immortal Realm.

Long Yuanguang's idea is to perish together with the Wanxian Sect.

He wants to open the space channel and use the Chaos Beast to destroy the Wanxian Sect.

Even kill the Wanshan Immortal King.

But in this way, what should they do?

What about the Divine Beast Sect?

Do they really have to perish together?

This idea is too crazy.



Facing Ao Lie's doubts, Long Yuanguang responded indifferently.

"I can't care so much. We don't have the strength to kill the Wanshan Immortal King, so we can only 
rely on the Chaos Beast."

"Otherwise, once the Wanshan Immortal King is promoted to Daozu, it will be our doomsday."

"As for the safety of the Divine Beast Sect? Don't consider it at all."

"What does the sect count for?"

"As long as we are still here, we can rebuild the sect at any time."

"It was because we came first that the Divine Beast Sect came into being."

Long Yuanguang became more and more excited.

He doesn't care about anything now, and only wants to kill the Immortal King Wanshan.

Because the Immortal King Wanshan has brought him great pressure.

The current Immortal King Wanshan can easily defeat him.

Then after a while, will the Immortal King Wanshan be able to kill him?

Long Yuanguang thought.

Even if the Immortal King Wanshan has not broken through to the realm of Daozu, he may be able 
to kill him.

Once the Immortal King Wanshan breaks through to the realm of Daozu, it is simply unthinkable.



This is too dangerous.

This danger must be killed in advance.

They have long had endless hatred with the Immortal King Wanshan.

This hatred cannot be resolved at all.

As long as there is a chance, they will definitely kill the other party without hesitation.

So, when he saw the Immortal King Wanshan showing the immortal body of the perfect state.

Long Yuanguang's heart was filled with an infinite sense of crisis.

The urgency of this sense of crisis even far exceeds the sadness brought by Long Aotian's 
disappearance.

The son is gone, and he can still find a way to regenerate in the future.

But if his life is gone, then everything is nothing.

Seeing Long Yuanguang's crazy look, Ao Lie was silent.

After a long while, he slowly persuaded.

"In fact, things haven't reached that level yet."

"We still have a chance."

"Although Wanshan Immortal King has cultivated his immortal body to perfection, he is not 
invincible."



"If we gather all the Daluo Immortals in the sect together."

"Maybe there is a chance to kill Wanshan Immortal King."

Long Yuanguang shook his head and responded.

"No chance."

"Wanshan Immortal King was originally difficult to deal with, and now his immortal body is 
perfect."

"He can take the attack of the top-grade immortal weapon with his physical body."

"Facing such a person, even if all the Daluo Immortals in our sect work together, it is impossible to 
kill him."

"The only people who can kill Wanshan are Daozu and the Zun-level Chaos Beast."

Long Yuanguang shook his head and rejected Ao Lie's suggestion.

Now Wanshan Immortal King has grown into a big worry for them.

It is simply a foolish dream to want to kill the Immortal King Wanshan by relying on the advantage 
of numbers.

In Long Yuanguang's opinion.

If you want to kill the Immortal King Wanshan, you can only rely on Daozu or Chaos Beast.

Daozu and the others cannot invite him.

Even if Black Dragon Daozu is Ao Lie's biological father, it won't work.



After all, the South Sea Immortal Domain belongs to the sphere of influence of Tianxing Daozu.

In theory.

They are all protected by Tianxing Daozu.

Black Dragon Daozu will never offend Tianxing Daozu because of Ao Lie.

After thinking about it, Long Yuanguang can only use the Chaos Beast to get rid of the Immortal 
King Wanshan.

It just so happens that they can contact the Chaos Beast.

The horn that He Ruobei gave him at the beginning.

Long Yuanguang did not throw it away.

This may be the will of heaven.

They want to open the seal array arranged by Tianxing Daozu, but it is not that easy.

They need to contact He Ruobei in advance.

Only by working together can the fifth-level immortal formation arranged by Tianxing Daozu be 
broken.

Then the space channel will be opened.

Long Yuanguang had thought about it long ago.

Once the space channel is opened, he will temporarily leave the Nanhai Immortal Realm.



Sit on the mountain and watch the tigers fight.

Wait until Wanshan Immortal King is killed by the Chaos Beast.

Then when Tianxing Daozu drives away the Chaos Beast, he will come back.

Ao Lie was silent for a long time, and then asked solemnly.

"Yuanguang, have you really decided."

Long Yuanguang nodded firmly.

"I have decided."

"Okay, then I will go crazy with you."

"I hope this is an opportunity."

Ao Lie did not hesitate for too long and agreed with Long Yuanguang's decision.

Although this plan looks very crazy.

It's simply suicide.

But Long Yuanguang is right.

As long as they abandon the Divine Beast Sect, there will be no big obstacles to this plan.

They don't even care about the sect, so what are they afraid of?

As for their actions, will they be exposed?



Will it be discovered by other cultivators?

Ao Lie was not worried about this at all.

Because they would definitely not discuss this matter with other people.

Just the two of them, quietly went to Liuhetian, and then tried to open the seal.

As long as they can find a way to avoid the perspective of Tianxing Daozu.

Then this matter will definitely not be known by a third person.

Of course.

He Ruobei is an exception.

Because it is not a human, but a chaos beast.

And He Ruobei has no reason to betray them.

Ao Lie even has some expectations in his heart.

What if He Ruobei really keeps his promise.

If he lets them enter the Sea of Origin, it will be a chance against the sky.

If they take the opportunity to find the origin.

Then it is not impossible to break through the realm of Daozu in the future.
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