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Alex was instantly stunned.

After looking at Aunt Rockefeller for quite a few seconds, he quickly scraped the sole of her foot with his
nails as he transmitted his voice to say, “What do you mean by that?!”

Aunt Rockefeller retracted her feet a little and gave him a glance before saying, “What the heck? I’m talking

about being her godfather, did you think it’s her real father? Is your heart moved after seeing how beautiful

her mother is?”

“You’re the one whose heart is moved! I can see that you’re the one covering someone else’s body!” Alex
found a certain acupoint on Aunt Rockefeller and pressed down on it forcefully.

“Ah!”

In an instant, Aunt Rockefeller had the urge to pee and she almost peed. She kicked Alex away and shed all
pretense of cordiality as she said, “If you mess with me again, do you believe it I’m going to beat you to

death?”

Alex stood up and said to Zella and her daughter, “Don’t listen to her nonsense. She has a slight intermittent
episode of mania. I’m going to the washroom.”

“Beat it!” Aunt Rockefeller exploded in anger.

Once Alex had left, she immediately went straight to the point with Zella. “The two of you are having a bad
time, aren’t you? I can tell that you usually work hard to hide it. Your daughter will also be in danger at any
time, but your capabilities are insufficient. You want to protect her, but you don’t have such strength.”

Zella was taken aback as her expression changed abruptly. “I… I don’t understand what you’re talking about.”



Aunt Rockefeller shook her head. “Whether you really don’t understand it or pretend not to understand it, I’m
giving you a chance here. Both you and your daughter have special physiques and bloodlines. In the eyes of
some people, they’re delicacies and supreme playthings. But on the other hand, they’re rare cultivation
foundations… It just so happens that I’ve been looking for people recently, and I think you’re quite suitable…
If you follow me, no one would dare to bully you anymore. I will also shield the aura around your daughter.
Consider it properly!”

Then, she concentrated on drinking her coffee and stopped talking.

Zella looked cautious. She seemed to be hesitant. Finally, she shook her head and said, “I’m sorry, I really
don’t know what you’re talking about. No one bullied us.”

Aunt Rockfeller glanced at her, then nodded. “It’s up to you!”

Very soon, Alex returned.

Aunt Rockefeller stood up and said, “Alright, let’s go!”

“Huh? So soon?”

“What? Do you really want to become someone’s daddy?”

Zella also stood up and turned to Alex as she said, “Savior, I still haven’t gotten your contact information.
Could you give me a way to contact you so that I can repay you at a later date?”

Alex shook his head. “You ’re welcome! Actually, you’re not some ordinary people, right? Winnie’s situation

wasn’t that serious at that time, she was just in a suspended animation. Even without my help, she most likely
would have woken up on her own.”



Zella looked like she wanted to say something, but then she stopped. It could be seen that she might be
reluctant to talk about it.

After all, they met for the first time and they were not familiar with each other. It wasn’t good to dig too far
as well. Then, they ended the conversation and walked out of the cafe together.

“Then, Winnie, goodbye!”

Winniefred pouted with an extremely reluctant look on her face. She looked like she was about to burst into
tears. She suddenly rushed forward and hugged Alex’s thigh and said, “Uncle, I really wish you were my
father! Then, I won’t have to move my house so frequently.”

Once the young and immature voice was done speaking, tears fell from her watery eyes.

A complicated expression was on Zella’s face, but she didn’ t say anything at all.

“Goodbye, Uncle. Winnie will miss you!”

After saying their farewells, the mother daughter pair held hands and walked towards the left.

Alex watched their retreating backs and said, “I feel like the mother daughter pair is a little strange. The
energy that exploded from the mother’s body was very similar to spiritual power, but not completely. What in

the world is it, then?”

Aunt Rockefeller said. “How many years have passed since humans started to reproduce? There will always

be some strange bloodlines. For example, all the Four Great Princesses from the Missouri’s Colemans are

existences with special bloodlines… If this was back in the ancient times, they would have been called
demons!”

“Demons?”



“And now, they call them transsexual!”

“…”

As expected, Aunt Rockefeller couldn’t even keep up being decent for fifteen minutes.
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