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Apart from what One-eye and Bloodmoon were doing, the exposure of Great 
Mountain was also part of Su Yu's plan. He had to expose his so-called trump 
cards to his enemies. It would be even better if he could show a bit more and 
tell his enemies that he had no other trump cards. His enemies would 
definitely be pleased to find out about that. 

The existence of the shadow and the water elemental was the second set of 
trump cards he was prepared to reveal. Since the Mountainseas wouldn't dare 
to openly pry on him for now, it was likely that the two still remained unknown. 
And if they were revealed as well, his enemies would believe that this was the 
end of Su Yu's trump card and he would be helpless against them after this. 
Using some less important secrets, he would hide other secrets. 

This was Su Yu's goal. He would lure his enemies in. If his enemies did not 
take the bait, how would he gain the excuse to kill them? If his enemies did 
not take the bait, the two experts sent by Xia Huyou would only focus on 
protecting him instead of killing his enemies for him. 

If his enemies did not take the bait, the sky horses would not help him either 
even if they were truly friendly toward humanity. He would be able to take this 
chance to force some people to stand on his side for now. He needed to do all 
that. Thus, he needed to ensure that he wouldn't accidentally scare his 
enemies off. 

Furthermore, if his enemies did not take the bait, the Zhu Family wouldn't 
have a good excuse to attack either. Was it a crime for the elders of the single 
character faction to take a stroll outside the academy? Before making a move 
against Su Yu, they could even shamelessly claim that they were there to 
protect him. 

"I need to give them the opportunity to make a move against me." 

He didn't care about the weaklings. He wanted the Mountainseas to attack 
him. He aimed to kill with a borrowed knife. Of course, to accomplish this, he 
had to achieve a tough act of balancing to not get himself killed. 



It would be even better if the single character faction sent a Sunmoon after 
him, but the premise for that was for the Sunmoon to attack after reaching the 
Starfall Mountain. At that time, the Zhu Family would be able to openly act 
against that expert. 

Thus, one could say that this was also a gamble on Su Yu's part. He was 
betting on the lack of information on his enemies' part. 

Very few people knew that this was going to be a one-way trip out of Great 
Xia for Su Yu before going under the Zhu Family's wings. Otherwise, the Zhu 
Family would probably be too lazy to do anything unless the fight was brought 
to their capital. 

If news about his defection to Great Ming were leaked, none of his plans 
would work anymore. Everyone in Great Xia believed that Su Yu would not 
defect to other prefectures. After all, Great Xia was very powerful and all his 
backers were in Great Xia. It wasn't like he had suffered too big of a loss in 
Great Xia yet. Why would he want to leave? And this was what he relied on to 
make this plan work. 

*** 

The group continued traveling while Su Yu was thinking about his plan. 

This was definitely a dangerous plan. But it was impossible to drag a few 
Mountainseas down without bracing some danger. He needed to take risks for 
greater rewards. 

Apart from the Mountainseas, he also wanted to know if there would be any 
Cloudbreach cultivators making a move against him. For example, he wanted 
to know if Zhou Pingsheng would be there. 

What must happen for these Cloudbreach cultivators to make an appearance? 
Their Mountainseas needed to be occupied, forcing the Cloudbreach 
cultivators to make a move to kill him since Skysoars wouldn't be able to kill 
him. And in such a situation, who would be the most likely Cloudbreach 
cultivator to make a move? 

Zhou Pingsheng! 



As Zhou Pingsheng was a seventh-stage Cloudbreach, nobody would doubt 
his ability to kill Su Yu. Considering how much Zhou Pingsheng hated Su Yu, 
he would not let go of a chance to make a move against Su Yu. 

Thus, Su Yu needed to ensure that all his Mountainseas were occupied. That 
was the only way to lure Zhou Pingsheng and the other Cloudbreach 
cultivators out. That was the only chance for him to take them out. 

Was Zhou Pingsheng nearby? Very likely. 

After all, he was the intermediary between Xia Qing and the single character 
faction. With how much he hated Su Yu, he had definitely arrived. He was 
merely hiding somewhere unknown for now. 

Su Yu continued traveling while thinking. 

Slowly, the attacks on them subsided. That was mainly because the rogue 
cultivators had been slowly gathered up by some other people, One-eye being 
one of them. Of course, some idiots would still appear now and then to attack 
the group. But that was basically the act of throwing their lives away. 

*** 

Spluuurt! 

After killing a random assassin hiding inside a hollow tree, Su Yu indifferently 
gazed at the mountain ahead of him. 

At this time, the sun was starting to rise again. 

Over the span of one night, Su Yu's group had traveled over 500 kilometers. If 
they maintained this speed, they would reach Nanyuan in around ten hours. 
After a night of travel, most of the people in the group were greatly exhausted. 
And a lot of them were already soaked in blood. At this time, the blood-soaked 
Zhou Hao approached Su Yu and said, "There is a mountain ahead of us. 
That is a good ambush location. Should we take a detour?" 

"We have five, no, six Mountainseas with us and we're still within Great Xia's 
borders. Why should we take a detour?" 

Su Yu disagreed. Why should he take a detour? Those Mountainseas would 
ensure his safety before reaching the so-called ruin. In that case, he wouldn't 



mind using these Mountainseas to get rid of some cultists and earn some 
merit points for himself. 

He wondered if there was a cult stronghold nearby. Wouldn't it be great if he 
could wipe out a stronghold or two with the help of these Mountainseas as 
well? After all, these Mountainseas wouldn't allow him to die before reaching 
the ruin. 

Sure, those Mountainseas had been trying to test Su Yu's strength, but they 
definitely didn't intend to kill him so early. 

Right before stepping onto the mountain path, Su Yu said, "Seniors, there is a 
mountain ahead of us. I believe things will get dangerous. Before that, we will 
be taking a short rest. Is any senior willing to scout ahead in the meantime?" 

A silhouette appeared in the sky as an old man said, "I'll go." 

Su Yu could sense that this person was a Mountainsea. After taking a closer 
look, he found out who this person was. 

After all, information on these myriad race dao protectors was available for the 
Xia Family. And with Xia Huyou's help, Su Yu had been given the basic 
information regarding these dao protectors as well. 

The dao protector from the sky horse race. 

Su Yu's expression remained the same. It was unlikely that the sky horses 
were his enemies, but he still couldn't be sure. 

"Which race are you from, Senior?" 

"The sky horse race." 

After a short thought, Su Yu said, "I see. Please be careful, Senior. All 
Mountainseas can fly, but mountainous terrain is still a difficult terrain for 
those from the sky horse race. That blood devourer from earlier could very 
well be hiding somewhere ahead of us. It would be better if you go with 
someone good with this terrain." 

A different voice laughed and said, "Don't worry, Young Friend. With all of us 
here, would that person dare to show up? In the event of an attack, we can 
cover this short distance and provide backup immediately." 



With a helpless tone, Su Yu said, "I'm just worried that any attack would be a 
ruse to lure all of you away..." 

The old man had nothing else to say. 

The expert from the sky horse laughed and said, "Sure. Fellow Daoist from 
the iron-winged bird race, why don't you go with me? You are good at flying so 
you might be able to detect any hidden enemies in advance. It would be 
embarrassing if we do end up falling into some ambush." 

"Sure." 

The iron-winged bird dao protector was only a ninth-stage Cloudbreach so 
there was no need to worry about him. In any case, they had agreed to not 
send any real experts out before reaching the ruin. As far as the iron-winged 
bird was concerned, they were only scouting ahead to put Su Yu's heart at 
ease. 

The air warped as two experts flew toward the mountain ahead of them. Su 
Yu said nothing else and sat down before taking some food from one of the 
bundles hanging on the suanni's body. He started eating alone. 

"Why are you eating something like this?" The sky horse youth asked 
curiously, "Can't you afford better food?" 

"..." 

Su Yu said nothing. It wasn't like he would enjoy the food these horses enjoy. 

"Su Yu, what's the point of opening so many acupoints? With your talent, you 
could have reached the Skysoar Realm long ago." 

Su Yu smiled, "What about the Skysoar Realm? I've killed plenty of Skysoars." 
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The sky horse youth found himself completely speechless. 

At this time, Xia Qing walked over and offered some food to Su Yu. He waved 
his hand and said, "Just eat your own food. It is not a good idea to eat the 
food of others while traveling in the wilderness. This is a basic rule of survival 
out here." 



At that, the sky horse youth turned stiff. He was just about to accept the food 
offered. 

Xia Qing smiled and stopped offering them food. After pushing some hair from 
her face aside, she asked, "Brother Su, are we near Nanyuan?" 

"If everything proceeds smoothly, we should be able to arrive by tonight." 

At the same time, Su Yu used voice transmission, "Remind the seniors to be 
careful. All our Mountainseas have been exposed. After seeing the number of 
Mountainseas we have, our enemies might have figured out something." 

Xia Qing nodded. She said, "Brother Su, we're still in Great Xia's borders so 
our safety is still somewhat guaranteed. But that will no longer be the case 
after leaving Great Xia. We won't be required to leave Great Xia for this 
mission, right? I heard that Nanyuan is located near the border. Things will get 
troublesome if we have to go outside Great Xia." 

"It depends." Seeing that everyone was listening to the conversation, Su Yu 
smiled and said, "Nanyuan is not too far from Great Ming. We probably won't 
need to leave Great Xia, but if the beast disturbance originates from Great 
Ming, we might need to cross the border for a bit. Of course, you are all free to 
stay in Nanyuan if you feel unsafe." 

Chapter 572: Continuous Fishing (2) 

Suddenly, intense source qi undulations erupted from the mountain ahead of 
them. The air warped as several dao protectors appeared. All of them were 
staring ahead with solemn expressions. 

"Damn it, it's the blood devourer!" A middle-aged man with some black fur on 
his face exclaimed with a fretful expression. 

The old man from the cloud tiger race said, "Stay calm. It's fine. That fellow 
won't be able to do much to Old Horse alone." 

He added, "We'll continue observing. Only leave if Old Horse asks for help. 
We can't leave this place." 

He might be saying that, but he was sneering inwardly. It would be even better 
if the old sky horse was killed. That would save them some trouble. 



At this moment, two Mountainseas were engaging each other in combat 
ahead of them. Bloodmoon had launched a surprise attack, successfully 
injuring the old sky horse. However, the old sky horse was no pushover. The 
mountain itself seemed to be on the verge of collapse as the two fought. 

A short while later, Bloodmoon fled as Great Mountain had shown himself. 

"Chase him!" 

With a roar, Great Mountain gave chase. The old sky horse did not hesitate 
and gave chase as well. Seeing that the old sky horse was still alive, the cloud 
tiger and the other dao protectors sighed inwardly in regret. 

They had nearly forgotten that Great Mountain was nearby as well. With Great 
Mountain around, the old sky horse would remain alive. 

Suddenly, the iron-winged bird, who was observing the pursuit in the sky, 
screeched. 

At the same time. 

A beam of light shot into the sky. 

In the blink of an eye, the beam pierced the iron-winged bird's head. With a 
boom, the iron-winged bird transformed into his original appearance of a 
massive bird. Alas, that bird was now headless. Its corpse started falling from 
the sky. 

"Bastard!" 

"Damn it!" 

The other Mountainseas exclaimed in alarm. The expert from the cloud tiger 
race rushed over. 

Seeing that, Su Yu hurriedly shouted, "Keep someone here. Watch out!" 

With that, the expert from the cloud tiger race turned stiff for a split second. 
That gave the attacker the chance to put the headless bird corpse away 
before fleeing. 

"Damn it!" 



At this time, the old sky horse and Great Mountain had returned. The old sky 
horse cursed in fury, "It's someone from the devileye race. Damn it! How dare 
you kill an ally of humanity in Great Xia?" 

Everything had happened too quickly. None of the dao protectors had 
expected that there would be a second Mountainsea hidden nearby. 

The devileye race was very good at illusions, and that hidden expert was very 
strong. He had been able to hide from everyone and instantly kill a ninth-stage 
Cloudbreach with a sneak attack. 

The attacker was none other than One-eye. Both One-eye and Bloodmoon 
had successfully escaped after the sneak attack. 

Before long, both Great Mountain and the old sky horse returned to the group. 
Meanwhile, Zhan Fei had turned deathly pale. Someone was killed just like 
that? Everything had happened too quickly. He had lost his dao protector in 
the blink of an eye. Someone had been killed right in front of six 
Mountainseas. 

Landing in front of Su Yu, Great Mountain's body shrunk to a regular size as 
he apologized, "Sorry. I failed to stop the attacker..." 

Su Yu waved his hand. He looked at the others with a frown and solemnly 
said, "Two Mountainseas." 

He then looked at Zhan Fei and apologetically said, "My apologies, Brother 
Zhan. I did not expect something like this to happen..." 

The old sky horse's gloomy voice rang out, "It's not your fault. We were too 
careless. I was too focused on pursuing the blood devourer. Who would have 
guessed that there is a second enemy? Damn it!" 

This was a bad start. There were six Mountainseas in the group yet a ninth-
stage Cloudbreach had still been killed in their presence. The old man from 
the cloud tiger race had an unsightly expression. One of them had perished. 
Sure, that wasn't a Mountainsea, but they hadn't even reached their 
destination. He had not expected any of them to die before that. 

*** 

At the same time. 



High in the sky. 

Two middle-aged men looked at each other silently. 

After a while, one of them spoke with voice transmission, "Why is there 
another Mountainsea? Big Brother, should we make a move?" Top 𝒏𝒐v𝒆l 
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These were the experts dispatched by Xia Huyou. 

They were brothers. 

The elder brother said, "No. Huyou said that we're only in charge of protecting 
Su Yu. We will ignore everything unless Su Yu himself requests for help. In 
any case, we still don't know who the true enemies are." 

He was very confused. He only knew that he needed to keep Su Yu safe. That 
was his top priority. Even if they were to encounter the cult, that would be a 
matter for someone else to deal with. 

With a gloomy expression, the younger brother asked, "Big Brother, who 
exactly are our targets? Su Yu must be keeping an eye out for the single 
character faction, right? Do you think that we're being tailed?" 

"That's likely." 

The elder brother said nothing else. He sighed inwardly as he gazed at the 
distant Su Yu. That was the cause of everything that had been happening. All 
the blood that would flow today would be on that youth's hands. 

What an impressive young man. Was the death of that iron-winged bird a 
result of that youth's plotting as well? Where did the two Mountainsea beasts 
come from? 

*** 

Even further away. 

Both Yu Hong and Old Zheng were frowning. Yu Hong said, "Are both those 
fellows from the cult?" 

"How am I supposed to know?" 



Old Zheng was speechless. This was Great Xia. Yu Hong should know more. 

Yu Hong took out a voice transmission talisman and started conversing with 
someone. After a short while, she said, "We're unclear. A lot of cultists have 
arrived. Not all of them know each other." 

Old Zheng nodded and did not push for more answers. He preferred to know 
less about this. There was no saying what Yu Hong's source of information 
was. 

"That iron-winged bird was too weak. How could he get himself killed so 
easily?" 

Old Zheng was filled with contempt. No matter what, that was a ninth-stage 
Cloudbreach. How could someone like that die so easily? Sure enough, these 
minor race fellows were unreliable. 

Somewhere else, Blood Rakshasha demanded, "Bloodmoon, what are you 
doing? We agreed to operate together. Why are you moving alone?" 

"Hmph!" Bloodmoon replied, "Fool! I told you to help me earlier! Why hadn't 
you done anything? We need to kill those fellows any chance we get. Are we 
supposed to wait until we reach the ruin before fighting all of them with our 
lives on the line? Are you stupid? They have six Mountainseas. Do you think 
we stand a chance? We should kill as many of them as possible while they 
are still busy protecting those kids. Blood Rakshasha, do you have a brain?" 

Bloodmoon added, "I already contacted a fellow daoist I know. We will be 
working together. Open a communication channel with your people. I'll talk to 
them. If we can't reach an agreement, we should just start working 
independently. Why are you waiting around doing nothing? This is stupid. 
Blood Rakshasha, is your Blood Fire Sect filled with idiots?" 

Bloodmoon started questioning Blood Rakshasha, "Don't ruin the plan with 
your stupidity. Blood Rakshasha, if you don't want to do this, just give up. No 
wonder your Blood Fire Sect is doing so badly nowadays. It's because of fools 
like you." 

He held nothing back, using this as a chance to blame the others for not trying 
hard enough. Otherwise, they would have been able to kill the old sky horse 
as well. Blood Rakshasha was rendered speechless. After a while, he created 
an open channel through the voice transmission talisman. 



Immediately after, someone spoke in the channel, "Is the friend from the blood 
devourer race looking for us?" 

"Yes. I am wondering if your group is really aiming for the ruin. Or perhaps 
you're planning something behind my back? They have six Mountainseas and 
several Cloudbreach cultivators. Why are we not weakening them any chance 
we get? Are we supposed to face them all head-on at the end? We should 
focus on capturing Su Yu." 

Someone replied, "What do you think, Blood Rakshasha? We're also getting 
curious. It's not a good idea to keep waiting and doing nothing." 

Blood Rakshasha said, "I understand your worries. Everyone, Su Yu is clearly 
aiming for the ruin. We don't necessarily need to capture him right now. We 
can let him lead us to the ruin instead. We don't want to alarm him before 
even reaching the ruin. He is already scared after the attacks earlier. I'm afraid 
that if we apply more pressure on him, he will give up on the ruin for now." 

Not everyone in the group had received the same information. Unlike some of 
the people in the group, Blood Rakshasha knew very well that Su Yu was 
heading toward the ruin. Some of the others were unaware of that, so they 
were planning to capture Su Yu before interrogating him about the ruin. 

Blood Rakshasha could understand Bloodmoon's urgency, so he couldn't help 
but feel rather helpless. This sense of urgency might end up ruining their plan. 
Left with no choice, he could only tell them the truth, "We can only make 
further plans after reaching the ruin. Even if we capture him now, we can't 
guarantee that he will tell us the location of the ruin. Fellow Daoist 
Bloodmoon, please don't do anything rash." 

After giving his explanation, he asked, "Is that devileye your friend, Fellow 
Daoist Bloodmoon?" 

"No." Bloodmoon said, "I encountered him not long ago. LIke you, he came to 
me with a proposal to work together after my previous attack. He sounded 
more reliable than you so we decided to work together. He suggested that we 
kill some of their experts and weaken them. The plan sounded feasible so we 
did just that." 

Blood Rakshasha was helpless to hear that. He asked, "Can you contact him? 
If this keeps happening, Su Yu will eventually change his plan and stop 
heading toward the ruin. That will only make things difficult for us." 



Bloodmoon said, "You only have yourself to blame for hiding important 
information from us. Blood Rakshasha, if you're not sincere in working 
together, we can part ways. If you really want to work together, stop hiding 
things from us. Six Mountainseas can't be dealt with so easily. Rather than 
killing six Mountainseas for the ruin later, I still think that we have a higher 
chance of kidnapping Su Yu from them and interrogate him for the ruin. 
Friends, what do you think?" 

"I agree. Capturing Su Yu is much easier than killing six Mountainseas. We 
only need to launch a few more attacks. Some of them might decide to turn 
around in order to protect the geniuses of their races. That would be our 
chance." 

Someone else started questioning Blood Rakshasha. Knowing what they were 
worried about, Blood Rakshasha hurriedly said, "Everyone, we still have other 
allies." 

"Are they Mountainseas?" 

"Yes." 

Bloodmoon asked, "Who are they? I feel like we should really part ways. We 
have too many Mountainseas. How are we supposed to split the rewards? We 
are better off working independently. The lucky one will get Su Yu." 

Blood Rakshasha said, "Our allies are not interested in the ruin." 

"Would anyone believe that?" Bloodmoon suddenly exclaimed, "You're not 
talking about the single character faction, right? It's possible that they're only 
here to kill Su Yu. I can't imagine anyone from the cult will be willing to give up 
on the ruin." 

"Yes." 

"How many of them are here? Be careful lest we end up stabbed by them in 
the back. Blood Rakshasha, I honestly can't bring myself to trust your plan. 
Maybe they're working with Great Xia to exterminate all of us instead." 

The Novel will be updated first on this website. Come back and continue 

reading tomorrow, everyone! 

 


