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Zhao Dong is still sleeping in his house at the moment. Last night, the social intercourse was too 
late. He went back home and slept until now. There was a doorbell outside his villa. His servant 
came to the door and opened it. When he looked at the person standing in the majestic uniform, he 
couldn't help but be shocked.

However, when they issued the arrest warrant, the servant immediately stood aside and did not dare 
to stop him.

Zhao Dong is still sleeping in a big dream. He dreams that Pei Yuehuang and LAN Qianchen broke 
up. Pei Yuehuang didn't care about the company, but brought his company back to life. He also 
dreams of chasing Pei Yuehuang in a private plane.

Just as he was going to have a big wedding with PEI Yuehuang in his dream, when he was going to 
get married, a majestic voice sounded.

"Zhao Dong!"

Zhao Dong immediately sat up and saw two people standing in front of his bed. The uniform made 
him wake up immediately.

"You're trespassing. Who let you in? Get out. " Zhao Fang quickly took the quilt to cover himself.

"Zhao Dong, please dress up and come with us in ten minutes."

Then they went out and waited.

Zhao Dong was so scared that he wiped his face. He quickly found clothes to put on, thinking about 
what he caused.

He thinks about it. He hasn't done anything against the law recently. In his eyes, it's not a crime to 
make an affair of LAN Qianchen's derailment, even in his eyes.



Zhao Dong calmed down as he thought. He opened the door and went out to look at the two people 
outside. "What have I done?"

"We suspect you are involved in a case. Please come with us."

"Who did I offend?"

"Just come with me."

Zhao Dong said coldly, "I can do it right now. If I'm afraid of anything, I'll go."

Then he said to the servant, "contact my lawyer and come to me."

In an interrogation room, Yang Tiantian, Wang Liang and Xiao Li are all in the interrogation room, 
and they are strictly interrogating the events involved.

Yang Tiantian looks at the dignified interrogator in front of her in a panic. She is treated like this for 
the first time.

"Yang Tiantian, please tell me the truth. How do you accept Zhao Dong's bribe, follow his order to 
approach LAN Qianchen and create a series of intimate disguises?"

Yang Tiantian retorted bravely, "I just happened to meet Mr. LAN. Is this against the law?"

"It's a coincidence or a premeditation. You can answer it if you think clearly."

Yang Tiantian immediately panicked, but she still insisted, just coincidentally, she didn't know what 
happened.

In the next interrogation room, Xiao Li truthfully confessed the incident and submitted the bag Zhao 
Dong gave her with 500000 cards. She regretted her behavior very much.



Wang Liang is an old Jianghu and an old fox. He doesn't want to carry any pot now. He only said 
that he was cheated by Zhao Dong and thought it was a real event. He just wanted to expose the 
ugly side of the world. He didn't commit a crime and asked for release. In addition, he wanted to 
contact his lawyer.

LAN Qianchen is sitting at the back of the screen, watching with him is a captain, who is 
responsible for investigating this matter. 

From the top of the screen, the cause of the whole incident, as well as the plan of the conspiracy, all 
emerge completely.

Just then, his assistant came up and said, "Captain, Zhao Dong is here."

"Let him go into the training room and take all the information collected to force him to admit the 
crime."

LAN Qianchen squints her eyes. After watching for more than ten minutes, Zhao Dong is taken into 
another training room. Zhao Dong's face is calm around his arm, like the expression of an old God.

Obviously, he has not realized that what he has done now constitutes a criminal case.

Of course, Zhao Dong didn't think about it until the examiner told him what he had done, and Zhao 
Dongli's face changed, "I can't understand what you are talking about."

"Zhao Dong, you have already committed many crimes. Please explain the process carefully."

"What crime have I committed?"

"First of all, by bribing Li, the assistant of Pei group, you steal the business secrets of Pei group, 
which constitutes the crime of infringing the business secrets. At the same time, you lure Yang 
Tiantian to approach LAN Qianchen for you, to make a false affair, to make false news, to frame up 
a false accusation, to attack LAN Qianchen personally, and to bribe others to spread freely."

Zhao Dong couldn't help being silly. He thought he had done all the things he didn't know. Now, all 
of them have been named.



"I want to see my lawyer. I don't admit that I did it."

"We've got all the evidence of your guilt. You'd better treat them truthfully."

, the captain of the blue side, also reported a good news. "Mr. LAN, we have let Yang Tian and 
Wang Liang confess, and use our official account to explain the incident for you."

LAN Qianchen nodded gratefully. "Thank you, Captain Yang. I'll be relieved if I have your 
maintenance.""You can rest assured that we will take this case seriously and never allow you to 
suffer injustice."

Blue thousand Chen smiles, "hard."

At the moment, netizens also want to eat a big melon, but they don't want to be in and send out 
information from such an authoritative place, which instantly covers the whole network again. 
Suddenly, a voice of angry Crusade immediately maintains the image of blue Qianchen.

Zhao Dong's lawyer arrived in a short time. LAN Qianchen was the main victim of this incident. 
Naturally, he couldn't bring a lawsuit for himself. However, there was a very suitable candidate for 
him to fight this lawsuit.

Of course, LAN Qianchen didn't want to bother Xing Yifan. It was Xing Yifan who took the 
initiative to call and ask to be his lawyer this time. He must return a beautiful turnaround.

LAN Qianchen walks to his car and listens to Xing Yifan who has to do this. He can only smile 
helplessly.

"Well, even if you are so active, I will not be polite."

"Good brother, isn't that right?"

After Zhao Dong's lawyer came over, he naturally found various ways to exonerate him. However, 
it was LAN Qianchen who was waiting for Zhao Dong.



The employees of Pei group immediately received the new news. Some people can't help but 
breathe a sigh of relief, but they are very optimistic about the two bosses together, so they don't 
have to worry.

And Yang Tiantian has become the curse of the whole network, Wang Liang has also been criticized 
by all parties, of course, this time he can not escape the responsibility.

That is to say, Zhao Dong's money was collected. That's the people who want to go in together.

Yang Tiantian has no place to cry. She didn't expect to help Zhao Dong take photos. Where did she 
get into such a big trouble?

Pei Yuehuang is at home. Xu Min beside her brushes the news for her from time to time, telling her 
good news one after another.

Pei Yuehuang looked at the document, red lips, for their own men are proud and proud.

"Mr. Pei, now the whole network is saying that blue is always a good man!"

"They don't need to judge. They just don't bother us." Pei Yuehuang is also calm about this matter.

"Blue is the kind of good man who can't be found with lanterns."

"Oh! What about Qu hao Pei Yuehuang joked.

Xu Min immediately chuckled, "Mr. Pei, you are kidding me."

Pei Yuehuang picked up her eyebrows and said, "do you want to have more wedding leave?"

"Think, think! Mr. Pei, will you give it? " Xu Min nodded and asked.

Pei Yuehuang could not help but say, "OK! You're all going to get married and don't tell me. "



Xu Min blushes. She and Qu Haocai just discussed this matter yesterday. How could she know that 
Pei Yuehuang came out after a try.

Xu Min finally knew that Mr. Pei was very good. She said with embarrassment, "we are going to 
have a wedding in August."

"Good! Then I'll give you a month's leave. " Pei Yuehuang said generously.

Chapter 1232

Zhao Dong's lawsuit was immediately launched. In front of absolute evidence, he could only stand 
in front of the law and bow his head to plead guilty. Xing Yifan became LAN Qianchen's lawyer. 
He would never let Zhao Dong escape from any of the charges and collect all the evidence. Zhao 
Dong was immediately charged with six charges, making him blind in the dock.

He was sentenced to eight years in one fell swoon.

Zhao's parents are eager to ask Pei's elders for help. Pei Yuehuang's parents are very firm this time, 
because their son-in-law was hurt this time, and Zhao Dong just got the crime he deserved.

Yang Tiantian was also sentenced for one year, and Zhang Liang was not able to escape, because the 
amount involved was relatively large this time, so he was sentenced for three years, which made 
him extremely unjust. He had done such a thing before, but he was safe and sound. How could he 
know that this time he got into trouble with people who dare not to provoke, so he was sent to 
prison at one stroke for reform.

Yang Tiantian sat on the defendant's seat, crying like a ghost girl, with hair on her head, makeup 
unwashed, and red eyes. The photos she had just taken on the screen were so charming and 
touching, which formed a sharp contrast and irony.

Pei Yuehuang, who was sitting in the audience seat, stared at the three people, and her heart was 
happy.

Bai Xia also accompanies Xing Yifan to come here to gather a lively scene. He looks at the 
handsome figure of his husband's speech in the public hall. Every word is very short and powerful. 
Even if the opposite lawyer's meaningless refutation is questioned by Xing Yifan several words, he 
is speechless. At last, the other lawyer looks at Xing Yifan, speechless.



Zhao Dong's face is pale. He stares at the blue Qianchen and Xing Yifan beside him. But now, 
where is his prestige? He only regret, regret to provoke blue thousand Chen and Pei Yue Huang.

In the auditorium, there are naturally people from the blue family. The parents of the blue family are 
also relieved for their son. They should know that they are worried when they see the photo on the 
Internet, but they absolutely believe in their son's character. They are definitely not such two legged 
people.

"My dear mother, we absolutely believe in Qianchen and never doubt his sincerity to Yuehuang." 
Mrs. Pei and Mrs. blue came out and chatted.

"My son is careless this time, or worried about you. I will let him be more careful later." Mrs. Lan 
also loves her son.

"It's not going to be a wedding soon. I can't wait." Mrs. Pei looked forward.

"Me too! Every day I look forward to it! I hope the time will pass quickly. " Mrs. blue also smiled 
and nodded.

LAN Qianchen steps up from the stage. Pei Yuehuang comes to him with a smile and gives him a 
hug. LAN Qianchen takes her hand and says, "let's go!"

"Well!" Pei Yuehuang smiles and nods.

Behind him, Xing Yifan holds a briefcase. Bai Xia is already waiting for him with a smile.

"You are so handsome today." Bai Xia directly boasted.

Xing Yifan asked, "when am I not handsome, your husband?"

Bai Xia immediately put out his hand and beat him on the chest. Just after beating the hand he 
wanted to take away, he was held by the man's big hand and led her out.

After coming out, the elders all went back first. Of course, LAN Qianchen would invite Xing Yifan 
and her two to have dinner. At the same time, the four young people got together.



Zhao Dong also smashed his foot with a stone this time and sent himself to prison.

There has been no scandal about LAN Qianchen on the Internet for a long time. It's really an 
acquaintance. At the same time, people familiar with the matter disclosed his love affair with PEI 
Yuehuang.

Not from bring the blessing of whole net and envy.

At noon, four people were in a quiet western restaurant, chatting and eating lunch. Xing Yifan 
should be alert to this incident. He must have anyone outside. Even though he was not afraid of 
others looking for him, he did not want to hurt his most beloved woman.

After this event, I began to look forward to the blue Millennium wedding on May 6, which is only 
12 days.

In the following time, Pei Yuehuang put more money into the wedding. The company has blue 
Qianchen, so she doesn't have to worry about it.

Xing Yifan and Bai Xia have already begun to attend their wedding. When they have time, they will 
go back to Xing's house to accompany their families and Xing Yitian's children.

Today, Xing Yifan and Bai Xia received a phone call from Jiang LAN, asking them to go home for 
lunch together. The guests were still relatives of Jiang Lan's parents.

Xing Yifan thought that it must be the little cousins who seldom come back from abroad all the year 
round. They are here to attend the wedding.

Xing Yifan takes Bai Xia to his home, and Bai Xia is very happy to know more about his family.

"My cousin is the only son of my grandmother's brother. He played with my mother since 
childhood. He is also my grandmother's closest relative. Since my grandmother died in the early 
years, many relatives and friends there have gone far." Xing Yifan thought that when he was 13 
years old, his grandparents were gone, so he had no influence on his relatives there.



The only thing that matters is the little cousin.As soon as Xing Yifan and Bai Xia got off the bus 
and walked towards the hall, they heard the laughter of their elders. Such a harmonious atmosphere 
made Xing Yifan and Bai Xia feel a strong family atmosphere.

Xing Yifan leads Bai Xia into the room and sees a very temperament couple sitting on the sofa. 
Xing Yifan cheerfully calls out, "uncle, aunt."

Although he is a cousin, Jiang LAN has asked his brother and sister to call him uncle since he was a 
child, so it seems more close to him to get rid of the words.

"Oh! It's extraordinary that we haven't seen each other for several years Jiang Tiansheng stood up, 
reached over and patted him on the shoulder. "It's getting more and more handsome."

The gentle lady looked at Bai Xia with a smile. Jiang LAN smiled and said, "this is Bai Xia, my 
second daughter-in-law."

"What a beautiful woman!"

Bai Xia politely sits beside Jiang LAN and says hello to her, "Auntie."

Madame Jiang smiled and nodded. Jiang Lan said to Bai Xia, "they have been flying from country f 
for more than 20 hours, and they have come back to attend your wedding."

Xing Yifan sat beside Bai Xia and looked around curiously.

Jiang LAN immediately knew who he was looking for. She said with a smile, "are you looking for 
Xinwei?"

"Didn't the girl come back?" Xing Yifan asked curiously.

"Of course, she's back. Where are we going? Can she follow?" Madame Jiang smiled and looked 
upstairs. "I'm with your niece!"

"Xinwei bought a gift. Now Yutian is pestering her!"



Bai Xia is listening. It seems that she is Xing Yifan's cousin. She gradually realizes his family. She 
is really happy with the people of this big family. Everyone is so cultured and polite. Even though 
they are successful, they treat each other with courtesy.

"The girl came back to let her go to Xiaoshan's shop to practice." "Jiang Tiansheng said with a 
smile," it's just that she also learned this aspect. "

"That's brave, let Xiaoshan teach well, and then cultivate an excellent designer."

"I'm afraid that the girl is naughty and can't sit still. She has talent, but she can't bear it." Mrs. Jiang 
sighed.

"Give it to Xiaoshan! Xiaoshan will train well. "

"Uncle, don't you go back to country f? Are you going to settle down in China? " Xing Yifan asked 
with a little surprise.

"This man is old! We'll have to go back to our roots. We're not too young to fight. We're going to 
have a good old age. " Said Jiang Tiansheng.

"Uncle, you are very old now. How old are you?" Xing Yifan said with a smile.

Jiang Tiansheng immediately felt happy, "I love to hear that, but I still have to come back! After 
drinking your wedding wine this time, we will choose a comfortable house and live here well. "

At this time, I heard the voice of a young girl coming from the corridor, "aunt Xinwei, I love the 
crown you gave me!" 

I saw a girl in a jeans skirt leading a little girl with a pink carving and jade carving downstairs.

The people on the sofa all look at the past. Bai Xia can't help looking at the girl who is holding the 
little guy curiously. The gene of Jiang's family is good. It's either a handsome man or a beautiful 
woman!

Chapter 1233



I saw the girl who led the little guy downstairs, in her early twenties, a lovely melon seed face, a 
long hair with a shawl falling naturally, beautiful crescent eyes, bending up and smiling, with a kind 
of ancient spirit and strange feeling.

Xing Yifan exclaimed, "I remember seeing this girl last time. It's so big! How can I not recognize it 
in a flash? "

"You were only thirteen or fourteen then, weren't you?" Jiang LAN replied with a smile.

Jiang Xinwei came over with a smile. She looked at Zhaoxing Yifan with some shame. "Is this 
brother Yifan?"

"Yes, this is your brother Yifan. Don't you recognize him?"

Jiang Xinwei can't help but cover her mouth and smile, "I remember that brother Yifan took me to 
pick peaches at the door of my house, when he was a teenager!"

"Yes! It was planted at the gate of grandma's house. In order to pick some peaches for you and make 
you happy, I was bitten by bees Xing Yifan immediately recalled the fun of his childhood.

Bai Xia can't help his brain to mend Xing Yifan's picture of being Ding Bao, thinking, where is 
Ding? It's not his handsome face!

"I was scared that time." Jiang Lan said with a smile.

"That's because the girl is crying for me to pick the tree. Even if I'm good at it, I didn't expect that 
there are several honey peaks on the tree. They are biting around me." When Xing Yifan mentioned 
the embarrassment when he was a child, there were just a few.

Since he was a boy God, he never did anything that didn't match his temperament. But those days, it 
was the second anniversary of grandma's sacrifice. He and Xing Yinuo went with their parents. 
Xing Yinuo accompanied their mother to the mountain, and he left to take care of Jiang Xinwei, 
who was only eight years old.

"This must be my sister-in-law!" Jiang Xinwei looks kindly at Bai Xia.



"Hello," she said with a smile

Jiang Lan said, "then you talk. I'm going to prepare lunch."

"I'll help you." Madame Jiang immediately got up, and Jiang Tiansheng said, "I'm going to have a 
rest first, and I'm tired."

"As soon as you and Bai Xia take care of Xinwei and Yutian!"

"Auntie, I miss you so much!" Xiaoyutian takes Bai Xia's hand. "When can I go to live with you 
and my uncle?"

White summer curved lips to smile a way, "when you want to come to play can ah!" 

"When will you give me a younger brother and sister?" I don't know from whom I heard this. It's 
not from the serious birth.

Jiang Lan was stunned. Her mother-in-law didn't plan to give birth! This little guy asked this 
question step by step.

Xing Yifan and Bai Xia can't help but be amused by the cute words. "Well, my uncle and your aunt 
will discuss when to have a sister for you." Xing Yifan nodded at her little nose.

"I want my brother." Said the little guy with a small mouth.

This amused everyone. Xing Yifan replied, "we have no way to decide. Then you will know 
whether it is brother or sister."

Jiang Xinwei led her out to play on the grass. Bai Xia got up to help Jiang LAN make lunch. Jiang 
LAN stopped her and asked her to have a good rest. Xing Yifan took her to his room.

Once entering the room, Bai Xia asked curiously, "you were bitten by bees when you were a child! 
Where did you bite? "



Xing Yifan put his hand around her waist, looked at her and wanted to laugh at his expression. He 
pinched her waist maliciously, "do you want to laugh at me?"

"No! I just want to know what you look like with a swollen face. " Bai Xia said as she was tickled 
to giggle.

Xing Yifan knew that she just wanted to see his jokes and immediately put her in her arms to make 
a good joke.

At twelve o'clock in the afternoon, Xing Liehan and his wife also came back, and the family had a 
happy lunch.

Pei group, after the LAN Qianchen incident subsided, the rumors in the company also stopped, and 
everyone believed their love more, and LAN Qianchen began to have a plan for the acquisition plan 
of Zhao group. Although Zhao Dong went in, but in the business world, the survival way of the 
weak and the strong will not change.

This is also the first project plan for LAN Qianchen to join Pei group. Three days before their 
wedding, this matter ended successfully.

Time goes by day, when there is expectation, everything seems to be of great significance. Pei 
Yuehuang is relaxing, going to bed early, getting up early, and exercising for the purpose of 
becoming the most beautiful bride on the wedding day.

And the wedding day, May 6 as scheduled.

In the morning, the sunshine outside the window is bright and bright, with a trace of spring and 
cool, and with a trace of summer passion. This is a very auspicious day.

The elders of Pei family and LAN family have moved into the manor where the wedding was held 
in advance, and the makeup team has all arrived. Xing Yifan and Bai Xia arrived in the morning. 
Bai Xia and Xing Yifan are their best men and bridesmaids!

Pei Yuehuang walked into a room with her wedding dress. In front of the mirror, in the body of a 
model, an elegant and charming wedding dress appeared in her eyes. This is her favorite style and 



color, which is also customized for her.Pei Yuehuang reached out and stroked gently, feeling the soft 
and silky touch. The design elements on the wedding dress are also made according to her 
preference.

This is, behind the door direction, blue thousand Chen came, his eyes looked at the woman standing 
in front of the wedding dress, his heart immediately touched, he walked behind her, around her 
waist, low way, "soon you will put it on, look forward to it?"

Pei Yuehuang nodded, and her expectant and sweet smile was reflected in the mirror. "I always 
imagined that I would put on my wedding dress, and I could see it right away."

"It must be beautiful." LAN Qianchen kissed her in her hair. "The makeup artist is waiting for you."

Pei Yuehuang nodded and accompanied him to the makeup division next door. The top team of 
makeup division was waiting for her. Pei Yuehuang sat down. She had a good rest recently, and her 
skin condition was also very good. She still kept the elastic and silky skin as a girl, with beautiful 
face and bright eyes full of amorous feelings and self-confidence. After communicating with her, 
the make-up artist went to make up according to what Pei Yuehuang wanted. The make-up artist's 
technique is very good. With PEI Yuehuang's natural and beautiful face, she will become the most 
beautiful bride today.

Bai Xia and Xing Yifan have a rest in the lounge. It's still early. The guests haven't come yet. LAN 
Qianchen is on the other side. He starts to take care of his hair. Although his face doesn't need to use 
any cosmetics, it's handsome and stylish, but today is a special day, and Xinlang is a little 
embellished.

Bai Xia feels today's wedding. She can't help but look forward to her wedding. There are five days 
left for her wedding.

Xing Yifan saw her in the early morning of last night's excitement, and woke up at six in the 
morning. He reached out his hand and pressed her into his arms. "Squint again, you will be very 
tired today."

Bai Xia nestles in his arms, squinting her eyes and nodding comfortably. Beside Xing Yifan, she 
always has a feeling of being taken care of by him, like treating her as a child.

Xing Yifan reaches out to play in her hair. Her long hair is smooth and soft. She holds it in her hand 
like silk, and he seems to love playing with her long hair.



Xing Yifan in the technique, as if in the hypnosis for Bai Xia, she really closed her eyes and slept in 
his arms.

Around 8:30, Bai Xia used to wear a make-up. She has a very elegant make-up. Her bridesmaid 
dress is also prepared by Pei Yuehuang. It's a nude pink dress with a very fairy air. It matches with 
Bai Xia's temperament very well.

Since nine o'clock, there are guests coming. Many of Pei's and blue's guests are from the business 
community. So today's wedding, it can be said, most of the a city's business tycoons have come.

LAN Qianhao comes here with LAN chunian. Her stomach is nearly eight months old, which 
makes her movement inconvenient. Therefore, LAN Qianhao hardly leaves her side and takes care 
of her properly.

With the help of Bai Xia, Pei Yuehuang put on her wedding dress, and the designer was also there. 
She arranged the long skirt for her, but she had not yet put on her headdress. In the bright sunlight, 
she exuded the elegance and elegance of the bride, with a gentle atmosphere.

Xu Min said excitedly, "Mr. Pei, it's so beautiful. I want to cry."

"Every bride is the most beautiful on her wedding day. You will, and so will white summer." Finish 
saying, Pei Yuehuang and Bai Xia look at each other and smile.

Chapter 1234

The weather in May, the summer solstice at the end of spring, is cool and bright, which is a good 
time for wedding.

Pei Yuehuang has put on her make-up and gone to the rest room. Mrs. Pei is there with several 
female relatives and friends to chat with her.

Blue Qianchen accompanies her parents to greet the guests outside. Bai Xia also makes a very 
elegant make-up. She has a long hair curled behind her head, picks up a few threads and holds a 
small ball behind her head. With her face full of gum and protein, she has a childlike and tender 
flavor. At the same time, it also exudes a touch of style. Bai Xia dressed up is really beautiful 
People hold their breath.



Xing Yifan is a dark suit. Today's blue Qianchen becomes the bridegroom in a white suit. His 
temperament is warm and elegant. He is driving a white suit like a charming prince charming.

Xing Yifan sent two representatives here to have a drink. That was the couple of Xing liehan and 
Tang Siyu. They were very honored to lead the elders of the blue family when they arrived. When 
they arrived at half past nine, Xing Yifan's mobile phone rang. It was elder brother's. He reached for 
it.

"Uncle, here we are. Where are you?" said the young voice

Xing Yifan listened to his niece's lovely cute voice and immediately hooked his lips and smiled, 
"OK, uncle, come to see you."

Xing Yifan and Bai Xia came out and walked towards the guests. They happened to be on a lawn 
with buffet. They saw the little guy running around like a little angel on the lawn.

Tonight, there are also a few children here. They are born from a rich family. They are all lovely and 
naive in their beautiful dresses. A little boy in a small suit comes to xingyutian actively. He has a 
bubble blowing artifact in his hand. At this moment, the grass is full of small bubbles made by him. 
The little guy turns around him in surprise.

The little boy looked at Xing Yutian's beautiful and lovely appearance, and he was very generous to 
make a gun for her to play with.

On the railing next to him, Xing liehan's eyes narrowed and his hands were fixed on red wine. 
However, at the moment, he forgot to drink red wine at all. Instead, he kept his eyes on his 
daughter's direction for fear that his lovely little princess would be abducted and run away.

Tang Siyu looks at her husband's nervous expression, and she looks at him with a smile and a 
crooked head. Xing liehan's eyes flow, and he sees his wife staring at him with a smile. He 
immediately holds her in his arms with embarrassment, "look what I do."

"I wonder if you want to hide and cry secretly when we get married after Yutian." Tang Siyu joked 
with him.

Xing liehan immediately clasped his lips and put them on her forehead with a smile? Don't you cry? 
"



Tang Siyu sighed and looked at her daughter's lovely figure. She felt that "when Yutian grows up, 
she will have her own choice, but I hope she can find a good man like her father when she grows 
up." 

After hearing this, Xing liehan immediately felt warm, and his thin lips fell a kiss on her forehead

Tang Siyu around his waist, nestled in his arms, two people together looking at the innocent 
appearance of his daughter.

At the moment, the eyes of the two people are full of love for the little guy running and jumping.

Not far away, Bai Xia and Xing Yifan came hand in hand. The little guy saw them at the tip of his 
eye and ran towards them happily. "Uncle, aunt."

Bai Xia let go of Xing Yifan's hand, took the lead in greeting him with a smile, and picked up the 
little guy, "Wow! Yutian is so beautiful today! "

The little guy immediately looked down at his princess dress happily. "My mommy bought it for 
me."

Xing liehan and Tang Siyu come over and the family smile.

"Big brother, big sister." Bai Xia calls kindly.

Tang Siyu came over with a smile. "This little guy has some weight. He will be tired after holding 
for a while. Let her go down and run!"

Bai Xia put the little guy in her arms down with a smile. Today, several children came. Xing Yutian 
immediately and quickly went to play.

Xing Yifan said to Bai Xia, "there is a buffet here. First, have something to eat."



Four people sat on the table and enjoyed breakfast together. On the big grass beside, Xing Yutian 
and some children had enough time to run. After a while, the little guy ran over in sweat and asked 
for water in Xing liehan's arms.

Xing liehan took a tissue and gently wiped her sweat. He held a water glass for her with one hand. It 
was like a real father. Tang Siyu next to her was just holding his chin and smiling at her little red 
face. He told her, "don't run. You're sweating all over."

Xing liehan feeds the water and kisses her daughter on her small head. "Go play!"

The little guy passed right away.

Tang Siyu said to Bai Xia and Xing Yifan, "do you plan to have children sometime?"

The concern of his sister-in-law naturally made Xing Yifan take it seriously. He and Bai Xia looked 
at each other. Bai Xia said with a smile, "maybe we will plan within half a year after marriage. We 
all like children very much."

"Well, the child is very lovely. If you are ready, you can make it earlier." Tang Siyu is a stranger. 
Her son is a 15-year-old now. But who knows that her mother is still very young?After chatting for 
a while, Xing Yifan and Bai Xia are going to go there first. I'll see them in the meeting hall later. 
They are in the same row.

In the rest room, other relatives and friends of Pei's family left first, leaving Pei's mother alone. She 
was still happy just now. At this moment, her eyes suddenly turned red. She put out her hand to 
cover her lips, as if looking at her daughter with joy.

Pei Yuehuang has always been a very strong character, but at this moment, when her mother looked 
at her, her nose was slightly sour, she reached out to hold her mother, "Mom, I will not leave you, I 
will always be by your side."

Mrs. Pei's tears were joyful and excited. Even if she didn't give up, she still hoped her daughter 
could find her happiness. She forced herself to bear the emotion, smiling and wiping her tears. 
"Mom is so happy."



"Qianchen and I will be by your side forever." Pei Yuehuang comforts her mother. She and LAN 
Qianchen will not be partial to any of their parents. Even if they get married, she will always be 
filial to her parents and grandpa.

Mrs. Pei nodded, "we know that you are all very filial children, especially Qianchen, who is a good 
son-in-law. We believe that you will be happy for a lifetime."

When Pei Yuehuang heard this, her tears rolled in her eyes. At this moment, she was glad to be 
happy for herself. She could find the one she loved most in this dry world.

Mrs. Pei wipes her daughter's eyes with a tissue. "Well, you can't cry. It's not nice to cry and make 
up."

Pei Yuehuang immediately sniffed, smiled and shook her head. "OK, then we are all happy."

At this time, there was a knock outside the door. Pei Yuehuang said quickly, "come in."

The door opened, and blue Qianchen stepped in. The white suit, with elegant black butterfly bow 
tie, was handsome and full of the breath of prince charming. When Mrs. Pei saw him coming, she 
immediately smiled and said, "Qianchen, you and Yuehuang have a talk. I'll go out to greet the 
guests first."

LAN Qianchen nodded, reached out to open the door, waited for Mrs. Pei to go out, then he closed 
the door gently, turned around and looked at his bride deeply.

On the leisure sofa, Pei Yuehuang is dressed in a white wedding dress, and her long tail gauze is 
dragged on the ground. She is like an elegant white Mermaid from the deep sea. How many men's 
dreams is that beautiful and sexy face?

Blue thousand Chen sits to her side, seem to feel her just now mood, he is low way, "what is 
chatting with mother?"

Pei Yuehuang took his arm and pasted it on his shoulder. "My mother won't give up on me."

Blue thousand Chen's heartstrings pulled, he said gently, "you tell mom, even if we get married, we 
are all her children, in the future we often go home to accompany them."



Pei Yuehuang raised her head and chuckled, "my mother knows, but this is a kind of emotion in her 
heart. Every mother will have this emotion when she marries her daughter."

Blue thousand Chen still some heartache her, he sighs lightly, take her into the bosom, "I won't let 
you suffer a trace of grievance."

Pei Yuehuang curved her eyes and smiled happily.

On the grass outside the manor, the guests passed towards the banquet hall one after another. 
Because the auspicious time was coming, the wedding of the bride and groom began.

Chapter 1235

Xing Lihan and Tang Siyu sat on the white table and talked about their son's next learning 
problems. After Xing Yutian separated from several small partners, they ran to their parents.

Running and running, two slender legs suddenly trip up. In an instant, the little one swoops and the 
whole person falls on the soft grass.

Xing liehan is looking at his daughter running over. At this moment, his heart immediately tightens 
and he gets up and strides to the little guy who falls down.

Xing Yutian immediately raised his small face, a pair of big eyes watery, small face wronged Baba 
looked at daddy.

"Does it hurt?" Xing liehan comes over and immediately holds his daughter in his arms. He takes 
the grass from his skirt and walks towards his wife.

Little guy in his father's arms, strong just tears hit a turn, but did not cry.

"Do you have any pain?" Xing liehan looks at his daughter with concern.

Xing Yutian wiped the sweat on his forehead, and the beautiful bangs were all awkwardly wet.

But the hairstyle didn't affect the beauty of the little guy. A little red face was as delicate as a doll, 
with big eyes like a mother, as beautiful as a sea of stars.



This is probably Xing liehan's favorite place, because it's like his wife.

Tang Siyu takes out the wet tissue from his bag, wipes a small face on the little guy, and comes out 
with a delicate comb. "Yutian, come to Mommy, Mommy will comb your hair."

The little guy walked up to Mommy and leaned in front of her. Tang Siyu made a beautiful hair for 
her daughter, braided two little braids and tied up a tall ponytail at the back of her head. She was 
lovely.

Xing liehan looks at his daughter as if she is a treasure at the top of his heart. It's like a pet maniac.

At this moment, all the guests outside walked towards the hall. Tang Siyu tied his daughter's hair 
and the three members of the family led the way to the hall.

Along the way, there are several business acquaintances who come forward from time to time to say 
hello. Xing liehan is one of the most powerful businessmen among the guests today. Therefore, 
many people who want to come here to say hello have to weigh their identities before they can go 
forward.

Bai Xia and Xing Yifan come to Pei Yuehuang's villa. Pei Yuehuang has put on a thin and 
transparent headdress. It's long and beautiful.

At this moment, it's only ten minutes from the auspicious time. LAN Qianchen said to Xing Yifan, 
"Yifan, let's go first."

Finish saying, gentle looked to Pei Yuehuang, "I wait for you on the stage."

"Well! Go! " Pei Yuehuang chuckles.

Two extraordinary men left, there are dedicated to the wedding dress of the staff, to Pei Yuehuang 
finishing the skirt, as well as makeup make-up of the make-up, carefully check her make-up, a little 
lipstick, Pei Yuehuang slightly deep breath.

One side of Xu Min can't help laughing, "Mr. Pei, you also have tense time!"



Pei Yuehuang couldn't help laughing, and her face relaxed a lot. Bai Xia came forward and arranged 
her necklace. Today's Pei Yuehuang is very beautiful.

"Well, the bride is ready. Let's go from here to the banquet hall." An experienced professional 
manager came up.

On the stage of the banquet hall, LAN Qianchen walked in front of him. Xing Yifan followed him. 
There were two slender and handsome figures, one white and one black, which surprised everyone 
present. Today's bridegroom and best man are all handsome men!

Among the more than 200 guests, many young girls also came. Their eyes passed the bridegroom's 
side and fell on the young man with a smile on his back, who was full of abstinence.

All thinking, is he single? But think of him as the best man that must be single! If you have the 
chance, you must get the best man's contact information today. What if you have the chance to meet 
him?

Blue thousand Chen is also naturally handsome, but who dares to take the idea of today's 
bridegroom? His bride today is also a unique beauty in the world!

Xing Yifan's eyes just looked at the little niece beside him. The little guy immediately waved 
excitedly. Xing Yifan blinked at her. He didn't know how many hearts he wanted to get.

Blue thousand Chen's eyes look forward to that still closed door, waiting for his bride to come.

It's only two minutes from the auspicious time. In the corridor, with the elegant steps of the bride, 
the layers of wedding dress hem spread gracefully, just like petals dancing on the ground, white and 
flawless.

Beautiful and dazzling.

Pei Yuehuang is holding a beautiful and fragrant bouquet in her hand, and her eyes are firmly 
moving forward.



White summer behind me is accompanied by a sweet smile.

In front of the gate, there are two rows of service personnel standing respectively. They are very 
respectful to meet the bride and marvel at her beauty. At this time, Bai Xia comes and reaches out to 
take Pei Yuehuang's veil off, covering her beautiful and atmospheric face, making all her beauty 
appear.

Pei Yuehuang reached out and shook Bai Xia's hand. The two people looked at each other and 
smiled. The friendship of becoming sisters was reflected at this moment.Bai Xia nodded and smiled 
to wish her well.

At this time, someone nearby said, "Miss Pei, it's a minute before auspicious time. Please be ready."

Pei Yuehuang nodded to the speaker. She was ready to marry the man she loved most after all the 
guests' blessing and witness. Bai Xia didn't feel nervous today. She accompanied Pei Yuehuang to 
the last minute of auspicious time.

Finally, two waiters opened the door from the side at the same time. A red carpet extending from the 
door to the romantic wedding platform was laid on the ground, with beautiful flower styles on both 
sides, a flower arch set up, and a falling veil, as if it was laying a door to happiness. 

Ears, the sacred wedding march melodious sound in every corner, Pei Yuehuang slightly breathed, 
her eyes far through the gauze, touch the deep vision on the stage, even if not clear, but she knew 
that there was a pair of eyes waiting for her.

Pei Yuehuang holds the flower in one hand and the wedding dress in the other hand. Her figure 
moves towards the red carpet gracefully and firmly. At this moment, the sunshine outside the door 
covers her, making her radiate a kind of crystal light, beautiful and dazzling.

At this moment, for LAN Qianchen on the stage, the woman who came to him was an angel sent to 
him by heaven.

Among the guests, I watched this beautiful and elegant bride quietly and firmly. Under the tulle, her 
delicate face and the happy and sweet smile on her red lips were reflected.

Bai Xia follows Pei Yuehuang's back. Her eyes see the black figure on the stage. Xing Yifan's eyes 
project from afar, filling her heart and making her mouth smile.



Pei Yuehuang step by step to the middle position, a formal Pei father waiting for her, he extended 
his hand, Pei Yuehuang smiled and took his father's arm, in his send off, walked to the blue 
millennium on the stage.

Pei's mother secretly wiped her tears again. Even Pei's eyes were moist. Finally, the biggest thing in 
their hearts could be put down.

LAN Qianchen stands at the step. When Pei Yuehuang steps to the second step, he reaches out to 
meet her. Pei Yuehuang hands him one hand, one side is her father, the other side is her beloved in 
her life.

Two men who love her most are with her.

Bai Xia steps onto the stage from the side, and she stands beside Xing Yifan. Xing Yifan's gentle 
eyes fall on her face. At this moment, those girls who are still thinking about Xing Yifan have a 
sense of loss.

It turns out that the beautiful bridesmaid and the handsome best man were originally a couple!

Pei's father handed Pei Yuehuang's other hand to LAN Qianchen. He sighed, "Qianchen, then I will 
give you my favorite daughter."

"Dad, don't worry. I'll have a good time with you." Blue thousand Chen low assurance.

Pei father's eyes, also full of recognition, he nodded, toward the new humanity, "I bless you."

After that, he turned back to his position, his heart is also a little reluctant, but the father's love, is 
deep, so he did not show more.

Chapter 1236

The sacred wedding march is still floating on the wedding platform. Pei Yuehuang and LAN 
Qianchen are close to each other. They look at each other tenderly and show their deep love.

When the host comes to the stage at the right time, a warm message makes people feel the beauty of 
love. The waiting priests have been waiting for their declaration for a long time.



Two without hesitation, I would like to make a warm applause.

Sitting at the chief table, Xing Lihan looks at a couple of new people on the stage. His eyes fall 
gently on his wife, smiling in her eyes. His hands find her slender hands on her knees under the 
table, and fasten them tightly.

Tang Siyu looked up at him, the smile on her red lips was brilliant, and her body naturally leaned 
against her husband's shoulder, feeling each other's warmth. Xing Yifan and Bai Xia, who are sitting 
on the other side, also bless the new couple happily.

On the other table beside, LAN Qianhao and his wife LAN chunian sit side by side, while beside 
LAN chunian, there is a beautiful girl with white skin, who has just given birth to a baby, with a 
little baby fat, pure but without losing style. She is Zhuang warm. Beside her, Qiao muzer is in a 
dark gray suit, with a little cold on her handsome face and a few more For the steadiness and 
tenderness of my father.

Two people didn't take their children out today, but after the wedding, they may leave for home.

Today, all of you are business tycoons, especially those sitting in the front seats, who are going to 
shake the business world by stamping their feet.

On stage, the host smiled and said, "OK, now our bridegroom can kiss our beautiful bride."

Pei Yuehuang is usually not shy, but at this time, in front of so many people, she is still a little shy. 
Her eyes are bent with a smile, and her slender arms are around blue Qianchen's neck.

Blue thousand Chen's eyes are full of happiness, but he can't wait to kiss his bride.

Under the stage, a father was in a hurry to hold his daughter in his arms and put his hand over her 
big watery eyes. This man was Xing liehan.

Tang Siyu looks at her husband in a funny way, but now her husband protects her daughter very 
well, which is also very gratifying for her.



Bai Xia is also buried in Xing Yifan's arms. She is a little shy. She is thinking all over her head at 
the moment. Must she kiss on the stage? Can you not kiss me! So shy.

Pei Yuehuang and LAN Qianchen just kissed each other gently. Pei Yuehuang took the microphone. 
Her clear and charming voice line thanked all the guests present. Her calm appearance made her 
feel confident.

After Pei Yuehuang thanked her, LAN Qianchen also took over the microphone and thanked their 
relatives. The applause on the stage was thunderous, and they ended the wedding and stepped back 
to the table.

Xing Yifan is also happy for his good brother, and is looking forward to his own wedding.

When LAN Qianchen and peiyuehuang toasted, their parents followed. Xing Yifan and Bai Xia sat 
down to eat. There was no such thing as drinking at such a wedding.

Little guy is a baby eater. Tang Siyu and Xing liehan are greeting her. A rich lunch is over.

Around two o'clock, most of the guests came here at leisure, so they left in the afternoon. Xing 
liehan and Tang Siyu took time to go to a nearby lake for a walk, and took the little guy to have a 
rest.

Xing Yifan and Bai Xia stay with LAN Qianchen. There is still a banquet tonight, and some guests 
stay. They will leave after the dinner.

In the morning, Pei Yuehuang got up too early, but she was tired. She sat on the sofa in the room, 
her face was on one side, her eyebrows were sleepy. LAN Qianchen took off her suit and came to 
hold her in her arms.

"If you're tired, I'll take a rest with you."

Pei Yuehuang bent her lips and smiled. She didn't count the days. It was just the time when she had 
a good thing. So she felt tired every time before she came.

Today, however, her wedding is really happy. It's like telling the whole world that she has a perfect 
lover.



"I'll squint. The evening party may be over late." After Pei Yuehuang finished, she changed her 
clothes and washed her make-up. Her face was clear and her eyes were clean. LAN Qianchen 
leaned down, kissed her on her forehead, and stroked her forehead hair painfully, "go to sleep! I'm 
here with you. "

"Don't you go and greet the guests?"

"With my big brother and my parents!" Blue thousand Chen low comforts a sentence, nothing is 
more important than to take care of her.

In another villa, Xing Yifan also took off his suit, with a black shirt and trousers inside, which made 
him a one meter eight five-year figure, fully showing the strong physique of men, elegant body line 
and invisible power.

Seeing Xing Yifan today, Bai Xia is more and more handsome. He has a feeling that he can't 
extricate himself.

Looking at him pouring water, she held him around her back to feel his proud figure.

Xing Yifan turned around, put his back against the cupboard, reached out to hold the girl glued up 
in his arms. After a sip of water, he asked, "thirsty?"Bai Xia raised her head and nodded, "well, 
thirsty! Give me a drink! "

"No!" Xing Yifan raised the cup high. With the length of his arm, Bai Xia could not get it even if he 
jumped up.

Although there is a cup beside him, Bai Xia wants the cup in his hand.

"Stingy, give me a drink quickly!" Bai Xia smiled and reached for his hand.

Xing Yifan flashed an evil smile in his eyes. Under the eager expression on Bai Xia's face, he could 
take another sip calmly.

"Xing Yifan." Bai Xia's warning is his name.



Xing Yifan was finally afraid. He asked in a low voice, "do you really have to drink my water?"

"Drink!" Bai Xia lights her head.

Xing Yifan took up the cup and took another sip, only to see that he had drunk all the water in the 
cup.

Bai Xia can't help staring. This guy really doesn't give her a drink, hateful.

However, it was in Baixia's boring retreat, ready to pour water on his own, that he saw a man 
holding her face in one hand and clasping her back head spoon in the other hand, and Junyan came 
close in a moment.

Bai Xia expected what he was going to do. She blushed and wanted to hide, but she couldn't hide. 
She had to accept the man's other way of feeding water.

Bai Xia, "..."

Bai Xia is going to faint. She looks at him with a pretty red face, while the man laughs with disgust.

"You said you had to drink!"

Bai Xia wanted to beat him. She poured a drink of water from the side, got up and went to the 
second floor. "I want to sleep."

Xing Yifan eyes a bright, follow the wife, smile Mimi way, "I am also sleepy."

Bai Xia immediately looked back at him. "I really need to sleep."

"It doesn't affect me that you sleep with you." Xing Yifan drank a few glasses of wine today. His 
handsome face exudes a few threads of masculine style without any reason.

Bai Xia knows that with him around, where can he sleep well?



On the side of the banquet hall, Pei Fu came and said to Qu Hao and Xu Min, who had been helping 
to greet the guests, "Xiaoqu, Xiaoxu, go to have a rest! There's no need to help here. "

Qu Hao nodded. "OK, uncle, let's go back to have a rest first."

"Go!" Pei's father smiled at the good assistant beside the two daughters.

Xu Min is really tired. She got up at six o'clock today. She arrived here from home. Today, she was 
busy greeting, and dared not relax a little.

"Hiss..." Walking Xu Min, immediately in a place with few people, reached out to hold the railing 
beside him and squatted down.

Qu Hao's eyes immediately fell on her, painfully, and reached for her. "What's the matter?"

"Feet hurt! I just went to buy a pair of brand shoes at a high price last night. It's not easy to wear at 
all. " Xu Min wants to cry without tears.

Qu Hao squatted down and saw that there was a trace of blood on her heel. He immediately said to 
her, "take it off! I'll get you a pair of shoes later. "

"Then am I barefoot?" Xu Min said shyly.

"I'll take you back." After Qu Hao finished, he bent down to hold her.

"No, go back to the room!" "Xu Min is a little embarrassed way," I insist

Qu Haocai doesn't care about her. He still bends down and picks her up. Xu Min immediately 
shouts and hugs his neck. "Qu Hao, don't do this. Let me down." 

"What are you afraid of holding my wife?" Qu Hao chuckled. Wearing gold glasses, he usually 
looked smart and smart, with a hint of gentleness. At this time, he was a power man. Xu Min was 
going to be fascinated by his smile.



Chapter 1237

She couldn't help thinking, why didn't she find out before?

"Qu Hao, when did you start to like me?" Xu Min asked curiously. Mingming has known each other 
for four years!

Qu Hao thought for a moment and said, "when you first came in."

Xu Min's head was blank for a few seconds. Wasn't that when she came out of college? At that time, 
how could he like her because she was so stupid?

However, although happiness arrived later, she didn't miss it. It's so good that she immediately 
ignored other people's eyes, reached for her sweet hand and leaned on quhao's arms and enjoyed it.

The scenery beside the lake is very good. Xing Yutian's children are very happy. They have a good 
time. Let's have a look at this and pull that.

Behind him, two men and women walking hand in hand follow leisurely. Xing liehan takes a look at 
the women around him, "let's take the little guy to mom tonight!" 

Tang Siyu could immediately feel another meaning in his words. She chuckled, "you can discuss it 
with her!"

Recently, the little guy is addicted to sleeping with them, so she likes to squeeze in the middle every 
day and touch her face every night to sleep.

"I can't get used to it. It's time to train her to sleep." Xing liehan feels that he needs to talk to his 
daughter about it.

Tang Siyu doesn't care. Sometimes she is tired. She takes her daughter as the way to refuse him. She 
often gets upset by the men around her. Then, he can catch up with the time.

Tang Siyu is now famous in the piano industry. She likes this industry and never plans to give up 
this career in her life. Moreover, this job cultivates her mind and cultivates her heart with a weak 
fame and wealth.



So, people who get along with her will feel a kind of calmness.

Xing liehan is decisive and arbitrary in the business world, but he strives not to be a businessman 
full of copper smell, and he also needs to keep up with his wife.

It's about 4:00 p.m. unconsciously. Xing liehan returns first with his wife and children. They don't 
attend the dinner party at night. After having a daughter, where is Xing liehan's personal time? He's 
closed even the social circle.

In the evening, after the break, all the guests went out for a walk, feeling the quiet and beautiful far 
away from the city. In the evening, on the grass, they set up a leisure platform, put on a buffet, and 
sounded quiet light music.

Make an appointment with a friend to have a drink, or enjoy some delicious dinner, enjoy the sunset 
in the distance, and have a unique flavor.

Tonight's dinner is a rich buffet prepared on the grass. It lasts until 7:30 p.m. tonight's night is very 
beautiful. The whole manor is like day, with crisscross wine glasses, beautiful clothes, and laughter 
everywhere.

After Bai Xia woke up, it was almost 6:30. He had a good afternoon nap, but Xing Yifan was 
struggling. Now, his legs are still soft.

Xing Yifan is so energetic that she envies him. This man can sleep for only a few hours every day, 
and his divine colors will fly all day.

Although the scenery outside the window is beautiful, Xing Yifan is also waiting for his wife to 
wake up on the balcony. Bai Xia, wearing a cool long skirt, walks to the balcony and just sees the 
spectacular scenery that is about to fall in the distance. She stretches her waist lazily. Xing Yifan 
reaches out and holds her in his arms. "Have a rest, let's go down and eat something."

Bai Xia nodded, such time seemed to be used to spend so easily, and do what he wanted to do with 
his beloved.



LAN Qianchen and peiyuehuang came out with their families. They chatted with the guests. After a 
while, Xing Yifan came down with Bai Xia.

Sitting together on the table on the grass, tasting the wine and enjoying the night, this kind of chat 
atmosphere is very relaxed and pleasant.

The banquet hall was also bustling, and the guests had a great time.

When LAN Qianchen and peiyuehuang arrived, the guests stopped automatically and invited the 
new couple to dance tonight.

Pei Yuehuang and LAN Qianchen enter together and dance gracefully. Then, the guests follow and 
dance in the music.

When Bai Xia and Xing Yifan came in, Xing Yifan reached out his hand and sent out an invitation 
to her. Bai Xia didn't know much about it. She refused shamefully once, but Xing Yifan still pulled 
her in.

Bai Xia stepped on his feet several times, and Xing Yifan was not angry at all. On the contrary, 
under several times of training, Bai Xia was able to follow his steps and accompany him to feel the 
joy of dancing.

Today, as long as the guests stay here, the music and joy will never stop. LAN Qianchen and 
peiyuehuang are going to die around 10 o'clock. They are so tired that they need to go back to have 
a rest.

Xing Yifan and Bai Xia also left later. However, they had another location. They drove up a 
mountain from here. Xing Yifan took her to see the stars.

Although Bai Xia was afraid, she was also very exciting. She prepared some fruit snacks and 
drinks, got on Xing Yifan's cross-country car, opened the skylight and watched the whole night.

Heavy shadows of trees are backing behind them, following the huge round moon. The Milky way 
is clearly visible, as if it is close to the universe."How beautiful!" Bai Xia could not help sighing.



After half an hour, Xing Yifan's car finally reached the top of a mountain. The winding mountain 
road is like a giant snake circling around. At the top of the mountain, under the moonlight, the scene 
of endless ups and downs of peaks is amazing.

Bai Xia stood beside Xing Yifan and looked at the distant scenery. She let go of her hand. Under the 
night wind, she was in a free mood.

Xing Yifan accompanied her to see mountains and water. Later, his dream is to take her around the 
world to see the beauty of the world. There is no regret in this life.

"Firefly." Bai Xia is surprised to see a few fireflies with silver yellow light flying by her side. She is 
surprised to reach out.

That firefly can't help but stop on the back of her hand, Bai Xia's novel looking at the children 
growing up in the city, really don't have such fun.

Xing Yifan reaches for her and looks for her together. On the grass nearby, the fireflies are shining 
all over the sky. Bai Xia stops to enjoy and refuses to leave.

As a caricaturist, her dream is to follow the beautiful things in the world.

Back next to the car, Xing Yifan reached out to open the door, and Bai Xia suddenly had the 
courage to rush up. She reached out to put the man on the door, and a pair of clear eyes flashed with 
a smile, "don't go so fast."

Xing Yifan's eyes immediately caught a smile. He bent down and asked with a smile, "what else can 
I do?"

"Come closer, I'll tell you." White summer hook lip is smiling, flirtatious this she is still clear and 
astringent.

Fortunately, her men are very cooperative with her.

He immediately bent down, thin lips several want to kiss down, Bai Xia smiled and kissed in the 
past, and told him with action what she wanted to do.



In such a time, do a little romantic things, just don't leave regret.

In the direction of the manor, the guests have also disappeared. The moonlight covers everything 
quietly. In a newly arranged room, Pei Yuehuang nestles in blue Qianchen's arms and has fallen 
asleep.

Xing Yifan takes Bai Xia down the mountain and back to the villa. It's already two o'clock in the 
morning. Bai Xia has fallen asleep in the copilot's seat. Xing Yifan stops the car and reaches out to 
take her in.

Bai Xia vaguely knows that she is back. She lies on the soft bed and feels that the man around her is 
going to leave. She stretches out her hand and says, "Yifan, sleep with me."

"I'll come in a bath." Xing Yifan kissed her face with a low voice.

Bai Xia just let her go. Xing Yifan also took a bath, supported her elbow, and took her to his arms. 
This day, it was full and wonderful.

Early morning.

The manor was awakened in the morning sun. The guests left after breakfast. Pei Yuehuang and 
LAN Qianchen left with their families.

Xing Yifan and Bai Xia had a late rest last night. LAN Qianchen sent a message to let them rest and 
then go back to the city.

The wedding was also blessed by the media. Among the guests, some of them sent out some photos. 
The media immediately smelled the breath and reprinted their wishes.

Pei Yuehuang and LAN Qianchen have no opinions about this, but they still don't want to be known 
by the outside world in their future life. They just want to live their own life in a low-key way.

Chapter 1238

After Pei Yuehuang and LAN Qianchen's wedding, Xing Yifan and Bai Xia's wedding will arrive as 
scheduled, and the family is already looking forward to their wedding.



Bai Xia and Xing Yifan have boarded the island first and started to prepare. They spend two days in 
the romantic island and enjoy the undisturbed life two days before the wedding.

In Jiang Shan's high-end evening dress customization shop, a new comer reported today that Jiang 
Shan has reached this age, and she has no experience of bringing any more apprentices. She has two 
excellent apprentices under her staff, but this time she is an exception to receive another one.

And this girl, or her cousin, Jiang Shan naturally very like, she is only 23-year-old Jiang Xinwei.

She has just graduated from a foreign design college. Although she has talent, she is inexperienced. 
Now there are many students graduated from the design college. However, designers who are truly 
international and famous need more practice.

In Jiang Shan's morning meeting, her staff trained 16 designers, plus her brand's employees, more 
than 300. She also set up branches in several foreign cities, with annual revenue exceeding many 
listed companies.

Jiang Shan also set up her own famous international fashion brand, but she didn't go on the market, 
just quietly focused on creating her own style.

Jiang Xinwei's white shirt, casual jeans and shorts, and pure college students' style make her very 
attractive when she comes in.

"Miss Jiang, our boss is waiting for you." The waiter came forward immediately and greeted her 
warmly.

"Your name is Xinwei." Jiang Xinwei is a very modest girl. She has a strong interest in design. Her 
dream is to become a senior fashion designer.

However, there are only a few students who have set up teachers' colleges all over the place and can 
really realize this dream.

Jiang Xinwei is led to an office on the third floor. The waiter knocks on the door and pushes it open. 
There is a manufacturing table inside. An elegant woman with gold glasses is leaning over to study 
a piece of cloth with exquisite patterns.



Jiang Xinwei met this aunt for the first time, because after she was born, she had rarely returned to 
China. When she was very young, it was said that she was very capable and always active in the 
foreign fashion industry, so she did not come back for many years. 

It's a person who goes around, so Jiang Xinwei hasn't seen this aunt since she was born, but her 
achievements in the fashion industry are quite impressive.

Jiang Shan looked at the girl who was looking at her with a trace of shyness outside the door. She 
immediately came over with a smile and called her, "it's Xinwei! Come in, my aunt has been 
waiting for you! "

"Aunt watch!" Jiang Xinwei immediately stepped in and shouted politely at her.

Jiang Shan has no children, so she is very kind to her family's children. At present, she has never 
seen this child since childhood, which makes her regret. This is her uncle's granddaughter, who is 
also a very close kinship.

"Just call it Auntie! Don't be too outspoken. Your father and I are still brothers and sisters! " 
Looking at the little niece, Jiang Shan inherited the beautiful goose egg face of their Jiang family. 
She was smart and attractive at first sight.

"Aunt." When Jiang Xinwei came, she heard her parents say that this aunt is very kind. Now it 
seems that the tension before she came gradually disappeared.

"Ah! Let me see. It's really the 18th female university! I saw you in the picture last time! When you 
were six or seven years old, your father held you and took a picture of your family. The small look 
is the same as it is now. It's still so beautiful. " In Jiang Shan's eyes, the color of liking overflowed.

Jiang Xinwei can't help but chuckle and blush.

The waiter on one side could not help admiring her. It seems that this is a new star in the future 
fashion industry! With the owner's wife, the future is immeasurable.

"Come on, my new cloth. Show me how it looks." Jiang Shan leads her hand to the fabric she just 
arrived at. The pattern and color are all her latest designs, unique.



Jiang Xinwei can not help but secretly wow a, praise way, "really beautiful, if used in cheongsam 
fabric, it will be very delicate and gorgeous."

Jiang Shan is also very happy to listen. She is a master of cheongsam design. This is a new show 
product that she is going to interview. It will definitely brighten people's eyes in the fashion industry 
in the future.

"This is a lotus design, but it's not like a common water lotus, like a snow lotus on the Tianshan 
Mountain. It's white and proud. It has a sacred feeling." Jiang Xinwei said what she thought.

Jiang Shan immediately rejoiced, "you really have an eye. You can see that this is not the ordinary 
color of snow lotus. Right, this is the inspiration I found from the snow lotus on the Tianshan 
Mountain."

Jiang Shan can't help looking at her fondly, "even if your parents give you to me for training, then 
you will follow me in the future! I will teach you what I can. "

"Thank you, aunt. I will live up to your expectations. "Jiang Xinwei is flattered, but she sincerely 
hopes that she can learn skills here and realize her wishes.

Next, Jiang Shan took her to visit the clothes, wedding dresses and dresses in her shop. Here, as 
long as you can imagine the clothes, Jiang Shan will dabble in them, and they are higher quality 
than those on the market.Jiang Shan does not want to give her more pressure, nor do she want to 
suppress her design and interfere with her ideas. Design must be a kind of soul thing. As long as the 
soul of design is clear, better value can be created.

Jiang Xinwei has her own office, where she can freely design her own works. Jiang Shan will give 
her some pertinent suggestions to help her progress.

On the island, two days before the wedding, Jiang's family has arrived. At this moment, on the 
beach of the island, four members of the family are walking on the beach. Tang Siyu is wearing a 
sun hat, a long dress with suspenders, and a light shirt cardigan outside. He is very rested.

Xing liehan is a linen leisure pants with a dark t-shirt. He has been working hard on sports. He is 
strong and straight, charming and full of mature men's breath.



In front of them, a pair of brothers and sisters are swimming in the shallow water hand in hand. 
Xing Yixi looks after his sister to play. Xing Yutian is barefoot and stomps in the water from time to 
time. Soon, water splashes up and moistens his brother's pants.

"Brother, it's fun!" Xing Yutian laughs and tries to step deeper.

At this time, a small wave came. Xing Yixi was close to one meter eight. He immediately 
mentioned his sister easily. After avoiding the wave, he put her down again.

"Brother, there are shells. Can you pick them up for me?" The little guy saw a bright shell in the 
water and cried excitedly.

Xing Yixi immediately took a long leg and reached in to pick up a beautiful white shell.

The little guy took it in his hand and happily circled around. Then he ran to daddy and mummy 
proudly, "Daddy, mummy, I found the shell."

Xing liehan bent down with a smile and boasted of his daughter, "xiaoyutian is really wonderful."

"I have to pick it up." The little guy jumped forward happily again.

At this moment, it is the setting sun, in this quiet and clean white beach, a family of four happy, 
very warm.

The wedding venue has been completely arranged, and the details are still improving. On the 
wedding day, the whole wedding site will be decorated with flowers, which will be a fragrant and 
perfect wedding.

Bai Xia is in the neighborhood of the wedding ceremony. She can't help being nervous. Although 
she has some experience after Pei Yuehuang's wedding, it's her turn to find out that she is really 
nervous in the face of so many guests!

Bai Xia and Xing Yifan took a group of romantic wedding photos in these days. On the wedding 
day, they will show their wedding photos on the wedding site and on the screen.



Their photos are almost real photos without PS trace, and Xing Yifan doesn't like artificial 
processing, so these photos are pictures recording their love on the island these days.

Xing Yifan asked the photographers to follow them to take photos at will, so the pictures are very 
real, recording their daily love pictures.

Chapter 1239

It's only one day from the wedding. All the guests who arrived in advance have been put into the 
hotel. For example, the Wenjia family, Xing Yinuo and his daughter have arrived in advance. There 
are also several Xing liehan's business partners, Xing's lifelong friends, Jiang Shan, Jiang Xinwei 
and his parents, peiyuehuang and LAN Qianchen have also arrived in advance. The night before the 
wedding, the hotels here were very busy.

Wen lichen and Xing liehan, the best brothers, and Tang Siyu and Su Xi, the good sisters, gave their 
children to their elders at nine o'clock in the evening. They hadn't come out for such a long time.

At the moment, they chose a balcony on the top floor of a villa, put a table for a night snack, open 
two bottles of red wine, while chatting about the future of life, while talking about the topic of 
family children, which is also another kind of fun.

Relaxed and happy time, laughter, there are men from time to time low, from time to time happy 
laughter.

Maybe the topic of children is what they are most interested in at the moment! Because the most 
precious meaning of their lives is those children.

Another group of people also have their party. Xing Yifan and Bai Xia, LAN Qianchen and 
peiyuehuang are also in a bar on the beach. Now in the open-air bar full of stars, only four of them 
are talking and laughing together.

Pei Yuehuang and LAN Qianchen are discussing about their honeymoon. Because they are going to 
attend their wedding, their honeymoon trip has been postponed. After attending their wedding, they 
will leave.

Xing Yifan and Bai Xia have also planned to go to the honeymoon place after marriage, discussing 
these topics, the atmosphere is very relaxed, and full of expectations for travel.



"Xiaoxia, are you nervous now?" Pei Yuehuang held her chin and asked with a smile. She was from 
the past, as if she had experienced a scene, and then she settled into the marriage life.

Bai Xia nodded and said honestly, "I'm really nervous!"

"With me, what are you nervous about?" Xing Yifan is drinking a small bottle of whiskey in his 
hand at the moment, which is full of the wild and handsome smell of men.

The blue thousand Chen on one side also drinks like this, probably tonight is too happy, also some 
want to indulge some.

Bai Xia looked at him, drank a few glasses of red wine, and also looked at him drunk and confused, 
with a look of adoration on her face. "Well, you can always accompany me, or I will be nervous."

Xing Yifan reached out to hold her small hand. "Don't worry if you have a husband."

Pei Yuehuang glanced at the time, it was ten o'clock in the evening. She looked at the two men as if 
they hadn't had enough to drink. She said to Bai Xia, "Xiao Xia, let's go back to have a rest first and 
let them continue!"

White summer also thinks so, she laughs way, "good! I'll go back and listen to the music. "

The two men immediately got up and watched them return to the villa. They continued to touch the 
cup and cheered.

Wen Liangyao and Xing Yinuo still spend most of their time with their daughter, because the little 
girl in her first year can't leave, and the little guy is also super sticky.

At the moment, the little guy is so noisy that he is asleep. Xing Yinuo looks at the big bed. The little 
guy is wearing diapers and a close fitting pajama. She sleeps on all sides. She can't help smiling and 
bending down, kissing her tender little face!

By this time, the little guy was tired and slept like a pig.



Xing Yinuo has taken a bath and is dressed in wine red suspender pajamas, which makes her 
charming and elegant. She has not been a girl for a long time. She has cultivated a goddess like 
temperament.

Her waist length curly hair makes her feel charming. Wen Liangyao stepped in from the door in his 
pajamas. He just went to the guest room next to her arm to take a bath.

Xing Yinuo looked back at her husband, and she immediately hissed. He was not allowed to come 
in and wake up his daughter who was not easy to pass by.

Wen Liangyao could not help standing in front of the bed, looking at his sleeping daughter. He 
wanted to kiss her in the past.

Xing Yinuo stooped down to make sure that her daughter fell asleep again and again. Then, she 
gave Wen Liangyao a significant smile.

Wen Liangyao's eyes immediately darkened. Xing Yinuo walked to him in a low voice, put his hand 
around his neck, looked up and smiled sweetly. In a low voice, he said, "honey, the next time is 
ours." 

Wen Liangyao smiles so much that he immediately reaches for her and leads her out. They go to the 
guest room next door. This is probably what the married people understand!

This night, the party on the top floor also broke up. The two couples went back to their rooms. After 
Xing liehan came back, he found that his daughter was too tired to hang out today and fell asleep in 
his mother's room, which means that tonight is his time and his wife's time.

"The little one's sleeping with mom." When Xing liehan said this, he couldn't conceal a surprise 
expression. Tang Siyu listened to it, and he couldn't help chuckling, "I see you are satisfied."

"Of course." Xing liehan said, with a smile of unknown meaning, he winked at her with a look you 
know.

In such a romantic night, Bai Xia fell asleep. As the wedding approached, she was under a lot of 
pressure. As soon as she got to the pillow, she fell asleep.When Xing Yifan came back, he saw a 
sweet figure curled up under the dim yellow wall lamp.



Although Xing Yifan and LAN Qianchen were talking and drinking several bottles of spirits, he was 
still awake.

He smelled the smell of wine on his body, and he immediately went to the direction of the 
bathroom. He didn't want the smell of wine on her.

After taking a bath, on a cool summer night, Xing Yinuo's way of sleeping also changed. He went to 
bed without pajamas, but he would not wake up the girl around him, just took her in his arms and 
accompanied her to sleep.

Pei Yuehuang is still planning their travel route, because she has worked for so many years and set 
out for the first time to travel in such a relaxed way. She needs to have a good time.

So, she was also very interested in the trip. LAN Qianchen came back, looking at the woman in the 
light, wearing a nightgown, with long hair, and taking the iPad seriously. He sat down in front of the 
bed, holding the back of her head, and then burned it on her forehead.

"Not sleeping yet? Waiting for my husband? " Blue thousand Chen a pair of blurred star Mou, 
twinkling a few silk is attractive.

Pei Yuehuang is also waiting for him. She nodded, put the iPad away and said, "go take a bath! I'll 
wait for you to sleep together. "

In blue thousand Chen's eyes, love is hard to stop. He said in a low voice, "OK, wait for me."

At about five o'clock in the morning, a cruise ship full of fresh picked flowers came to the shore. 
The staff of the wedding company immediately removed the flowers, took advantage of the night 
time, transported the flowers with dew to the flower deck, and began to decorate the whole wedding 
site.

In less than an hour, the well-organized staff will insert different kinds of flowers into the wedding 
reception, the flower stump and the table top beside the wedding, all places where flowers need to 
be placed.



There are brilliant roses and pure lilies. There are many kinds of flowers this time. This is a 
romantic wedding with flowers as the main part.

At six o'clock in the morning, Bai Xia, who was early to bed, heard the sound of the alarm clock. 
She quickly reached out her hand and pressed it. She slept well, but the man around her didn't know 
what time she went to bed last night, so she didn't want to wake him up so early.

As if I knew it was still early, an arm around her waist behind her, and the man murmured, "sleep a 
little longer."

Bai Xia turns around with her lips bent, facing this handsome and extraordinary face. Her eyes are 
full of longing. Today, she is going to be his bride.

Bai Xia nestles in his arms and continues to mend her sleep. Today, she must have enough spirit and 
face her wedding in the best condition.

At the moment, the two elders of Xing family have got up, and today's guests are nearly 200, so 
they also called together the staff of Xing group. At this moment, they have arrived on the island, 
headed by Han Yang, and nearly 100 bodyguards are present to protect the integrity of the wedding.

The vast number of people are very orderly around the island. Today's wedding guests are not only 
business people, but also the most distinguished people in the country. The wedding guests of Xing 
family are not small.

Chapter 1240

At about 7:30, Bai Xia really can't sleep any more. Xing Yifan also gets up with her. Bai Xia has 
washed her face. A clear little face is clean and white. She is wearing a leisure long T. anyway, she 
will wear a wedding dress later.

Thinking of the wedding dress, she was already excited and couldn't wait.

Xing Yifan comes out of the bathroom and watches her stooping to pack up her bag. He can't help 
holding her around, and a powerful and domineering kiss falls. Bai Xia can't help being teased to 
giggle and push him, "Xing Yifan, can you stop making trouble?"

Xing Yifan can't help but smell it. "Well, my wife is so sweet."



Bai Xia turned to him with a small bag and said, "I'll go to make up first, and you'll come later."

"Do you think your husband needs make-up?" Xing Yifan immediately made a handsome hair lift.

Bai Xia is going to be amused. Looking at his handsome and wild face, she suddenly comes 
forward, takes the initiative to hug his neck and kisses him on his thin lips, "husband, you are the 
most handsome."

Finish saying, in Xing Yifan still in there Zheng Leng, Bai Xia left with a smile.

Xing Yifan bit thin lips, but also a satisfied hook lip smile.

After Bai Xia arrives, the makeup artist has been waiting for her, and Pei Yuehuang has also come 
to accompany her. Bai Xia's bridesmaid, originally Pei Yuehuang came to be her bridesmaid, now 
has a more suitable person.

Jiang Xinwei, it was also proposed by Jiang Shan at dinner last night. Jiang Xinwei was flattered to 
take the post. Although Pei Yuehuang's bridesmaid dress was prepared in advance, Jiang Shan was 
there. Even if another bridesmaid dress was prepared immediately, it was very fast.

Pei Yuehuang is also very willing to give way to this, but the bridesmaid is more suitable for 
unmarried girls.

After a while, Jiang Xinwei came. She was appointed to be the bridesmaid, but the best man 
naturally had to be changed. It couldn't be blue thousand Chen.

However, last night, Xing liehan said that the best man had given it to him, and this was a 
mysterious guest. After receiving the call, the mysterious guest also promised very readily, and will 
be present before 8:30 this evening.

That is to say, Xing Yifan, a friend of big brother, is very happy to invite him to be his best man.

Jiang Xinwei's bridesmaid dress has been sent by an assistant of Jiang Shan. She is more nervous 
than Bai Xia when she is the bridesmaid for the first time.



"Sister in law, I'm a little nervous." Jiang Xinwei is one year younger than Bai Xia, plus she just left 
school, she really has no experience.

"It's OK. You can stand beside me in a moment. Xiaoyutian is also there. You take her to 
accompany me on the stage." Bai Xia comforts her that with a bridesmaid who is more nervous than 
her, her bride will calm down because she has to take care of her.

"And! Who is the best man! Big cousin didn't say either Jiang Xinwei is also curious.

"I don't know. After brother called last night, they had a party." Bai Xia shakes her head, but the 
person selected by elder brother must be very suitable!

Pei Yuehuang accompanied LAN Qianchen to breakfast, while the bride and bridesmaid began to 
make up.

At this time, Xing Yifan found his eldest brother, who was waiting for the best man to come 
together.

The two brothers are walking under the coconut forest in the sun. Xing liehan also sighs. Thinking 
of his marriage, the two brothers and sisters are only fifteen or six years old. Now, even his two 
brothers are going to get married. Time flies faster! "Big brother, don't buy any more. Tell me who 
my best man is!" Xing Yifan looks forward to elder brother.

That is to say, it must be a friend of elder brother.

"Don't steal my show!" Xing Yifan asked jokingly.

Xing liehan can't help being teased, "don't worry! He shouldn't be able to steal the limelight from 
you, because no one can recognize his identity here. "

"Oh! What is his identity? " Xing Yifan asked curiously.

"His identity is relatively complex. His family moved abroad as early as 100 years ago. He is the 
successor of the invisible medical empire. He has the most advanced medical team and medical 
knowledge in his hand. This is also a place I am very interested in. In addition, he has a number of 



cooperation. Therefore, I have known him for seven or eight years. We have been very good 
friends."

After hearing this, Xing Yifan also knew that although the family business was very big, he liked to 
explore new fields. It seems that he started medicine again.

"Big brother, as you say, he should be very old! Are you sure he can be my best man? " Xing Yifan 
asked with a smile around his arm.

Xing liehan could not help laughing, raised his eyebrows and said, "I'm about your age! You must 
be careful not to be robbed of the limelight

Xing Yifan laughed, "I'm not afraid of this. I'd like to know him now

Just then, Xing liehan's cell phone rang. He picked it up and said to his brother, "let's go! His 
private plane has arrived. "

There is an airport on this island. Today, it will be the venue of private jet luxury exhibition.

On the wharf next to nature, there are also various luxury yacht shows.Xing Yifan follows big 
brother to a nearby beach car. The two brothers go to meet the mysterious best man together. 

In the dressing room, Tang Siyu and Xing Yinuo come here with their daughters. Xing Yutian is 
going to make a beautiful hairstyle and put on her beautiful fairy skirt today.

Bai Xia's make-up has been turned into a beautiful and delicate face, and the makeup artist dare not 
do anything to make her more radiant, but dare not destroy her natural beauty.

Jiang Xinwei, on the other hand, inherits the gene of Jiang's beauty. A beautiful and light 
bridesmaid's makeup is also very charming.

Jiang Xinwei is worried about the best man now. She can't help wondering what kind of person she 
will be.

But the best man hasn't appeared yet!



Xing Yinuo looks at Bai Xia with a smile in his eyes. Finally, a beautiful second sister-in-law comes 
to educate her second brother. She is very happy!

Moreover, Xing Yifan is obviously very convinced of Bai Xia's discipline, which is to fall in love 
with a person and be managed willingly.

"It's beautiful in summer and summer." Tang Siyu praised it.

Bai Xia is a little shy now. At this time, her mobile phone rings. She picks it up. It's her father's. she 
hasn't seen her father for a long time. She smiles and says, "I'll take my father's phone."

Bai Xia went to the side and picked up, "Hello, Dad, are you here?"

"I just got off the boat." Bai Shize's voice came from him. He was much calmer after his distraction.

"Then I'll let everyone in line pick you up." White summer busy way.

"No, my family has come to pick me up in line. I'm coming now!"

Bai Xia's heart warmed. Her father-in-law and mother-in-law had already picked up her father. She 
smiled and said, "OK, come here and have some food!"

In the direction of the airport, I saw a tall and straight figure pulling a pull rod box, holding a suit in 
his hand, and a coffee cup in his other hand, a gray shirt, black trousers, the arm of the shirt pulled 
up, the strong and long arm, and two black arm hoops, the height and leg length, just like which 
platform just came off Top male models are average.

It's not enough just to have a good figure. It's necessary to have a handsome and charming face.

Therefore, this man is obviously the same as his identity, belonging to the arrogant son of heaven, 
God's favorite.



Under the background of such a spectacular wall, the service personnel all around were 
involuntarily staring at the background of the visitor's identity. Such a large private plane only 
carried him alone, and there was not even a bodyguard around him.

He is more like a traveler, a simple black gift box. He drinks coffee gracefully and looks at the two 
excellent brothers coming towards him. He immediately smiles.

Xing Lihan and Xing Yifan meet the visitor. Xing Yifan looks at the person in front of him and feels 
that his beauty is threatened. But fortunately, he is the bridegroom today, and no one wants to beat 
him.

"Brother Xing, long time no see." Very pure Mandarin, full of low magnetic flavor.

"Long time no see, Qinghao!" After Xing liehan finished, the two men reached out for a hug.

After embracing, Xing liehan introduces Xing Yifan to him, "this is my brother Yifan, today's 
bridegroom."
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