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Chapter 41 - New Owner Next Door 

Tang Siyu's face could not help but turn red, "That was an accident! "Who wants to talk 
to him about that?" 

"Xiao Xi has already come out. Why not that again?" Su Xi laughed out loud. 

Tang Siyu immediately made a move to hit her, "Shut up! And I'll slap you. " 

"Okay okay okay, I won't say it, I won't say it, okay? In short, I just want to tell you how 
popular Xiao Xi's father is with women. " 

"What does it have to do with me? For a man with a messy personal life like his, I hate 
dirt." Tang Siyu's face was full of disdain. 

Su Xi immediately blinked her eyes, "Eh! He's not dirty! He's got no information! 
Furthermore, she can be said to be the cleanest man in the world of the wealthiest men. 
" 

Tang Siyu didn't like hearing that, "Don't praise him so highly in front of me, you're not 
one of his people, how do you know that he's not dirty? Perhaps one woman a day will 
be exchanged for another, you don't know either. " 

Su Xi immediately pouted and thought about it, "What you said is right. For someone 
with his status, even if he played with women, we would not be able to see him! 
Furthermore, the moment his scandal was revealed, it was immediately deleted. Which 
media doesn't want to live anymore and dares to provoke him!? " 

"Yes, he is an extremely dirty man. In the future, I have to make Xiao Xi pay attention to 
not getting too close to him. When Tang Siyu thought about that, her entire body 
shivered. 

Su Xi also nodded in agreement, "You're right, it's better to pay attention." 

Su Xi's announcement had been stolen away by the female star. She took out some 
time to dress up and accompany Tang Siyu and her mother out to play. She would play 
in the morning at the amusement park and shop in the afternoon. 



On this day, Xing Liehan did not appear. 

It was best not to meet this bastard in the future. 

Monday morning, after sending off the little guy, Tang Siyu returned to her new home. 
She prepared to practice her music, but the sounds of the decorations on the side had 
become quieter, it seemed like the walls had been broken through, and she was 
probably decorating the house, but when she came out at noon, she realized that the 
furniture here were all luxurious and there were sports equipment. It seemed like the 
owner who lived opposite her was a very rich person. 

She didn't know if it was a man or a woman. She hoped it was a girl, because that way, 
she would be able to live more comfortably. 

In the blink of an eye, another week had passed. However, Xing Liehan, this man, did 
not appear again, which made Tang Siyu in a very good mood. 

Furthermore, she knew that the house next door was decorated very quickly. When she 
saw the door open one time, she curiously looked inside and was immediately shocked. 
This was the luxury of a 7-star hotel! Since all three suites had been connected, the 
panoramic window could be said to be a 270-degree panoramic room, and at a 
sufficient height. 

Who could enjoy it so much? Could it be a super rich child's parent? This was because 
those who settled their families here were all parents who were convenient for their 
children to go to school with. Furthermore, their families were the ones that could only 
afford to buy them with a lot of money. 

This man had spent a lot of money to buy three suites and renovated them to such an 
extravagant extent. It could be seen that this parent was extremely rich. 

"Teacher, may I ask if this owner is male or female!" Tang Siyu curiously asked. 

"We're not sure either. Our client hasn't come to visit." 

Chapter 42 - Mystery Neighbors 

"What?" The owner hasn't come over to take a look? " 

"That's right! We just did as he asked. We're a large refurbishment company, and it's 
only been less than a week. We're almost done, and we can close tomorrow. " 

"So fast!" Your efficiency is really good! " 

"It's not that our efficiency is good, but our customers are asking us to finish the 
decorations as quickly as possible. It looks like he's in a hurry to check in! One could tell 



that this owner was a rich person. The furniture he bought was all from famous brands, 
and he had spent a lot of money just to renovate them! " 

"Oh!" Tang Siyu laughed, it was obvious that she was rich! 

"So you're saying, you won't decorate anymore, and you won't argue? Because I'm 
going to move in, too. " 

"Don't worry Miss, we won't argue anymore." 

Hearing that, Tang Siyu was obviously happy. This meant that she could bring her son 
over soon, because she also wanted to practice her zither. The concert was next month. 

I've decided that I'll treat Su Xi's son to a big meal tomorrow night and move in! 

When Tang Siyu went downstairs, her father's phone call came in, he was also worrying 
about when she would stay at his new home, Tang Siyu told him that she could stay 
here tomorrow. 

"Siyu, the day after tomorrow is the wedding ceremony for Yi Yi and Yi Yi. If you don't 
want to come, then don't!" Tang Xiong said to her. 

"Good!" "Then I won't go over." Tang Siyu was more than willing to go. 

"Siyu, think carefully. You are a good girl, I will find half of your happiness in the future." 
Tang Xiong comforted her. 

"Dad, you don't have to worry about me, at least I don't have that kind of plan right now. 
I just want to take care of Xiao Xi." 

"Alright, since you're not that old, then take care of Xiao Xi first!" 

"Alright, Dad, I won't say anymore. I still need to go buy some things. Come over to my 
place when you have time." 

"Good!" I'll find time to go over a few days later. " Tang Xiong replied. 

Tang Siyu planned to buy a few music books from the Qin Credits. Tang Siyu thought 
about the shop that she would visit in the past, the things there were the best, even 
though the journey was a bit far, she still planned to go to that shop. 

After Tang Siyu parked the car nearby, she came to the music shop. It was a very quiet 
second floor shop, with all sorts of expensive pianos and musical instruments placed on 
the ground. Just as she entered, Tang Siyu heard the sound of the piano, and her 
heartstrings were suddenly pulled. 



This pianist was clearly very good at playing and had a very good rhythm. Moreover, he 
was also a bit sad, but the most important thing was this piece of music. This was her 
favorite song before, only, she didn't play this piece often because she had too many 
memories. 

Now that she had walked in and heard the song, she thought she had forgotten her 
past, but, obviously, she had not. 

She bit her lips, but no one called out to her. It was as if she was back in the old days, 
sitting at the piano with Mu Fei, and they had played this song together, his arms were 
long enough to wrap around her shoulders, and she was happily lying in his embrace, 
watching his long hands dance on the keyboard, listening to him singing the lyrics of this 
song. 

She was like a happy princess, humming a tune as she looked at him affectionately. 

Tang Siyu's eyes became moist, tears started to pour out, she suddenly wanted to 
know, at that moment, who was the one playing in the room? Why did she choose to 
play this song? 

Chapter 43 - Meeting an Old Love 

Tang Siyu walked into the room step by step, only to see beautiful curtains at both ends 
of the room. The afternoon sunlight shone in and a man wearing a dark blue suit sat in 
front of the piano. 

Tang Siyu watched her back as she suddenly retreated in a panic, crashing into the 
door and disturbing the man who was playing the zither. 

He quickly turned around and his eyes met. 

The two pairs of eyes looked at each other silently, as if they were entangled in love, 
and in that second, all of them appeared. 

The man playing the zither was Mu Fei. 

Tang Siyu almost wanted to escape. Even after five years, it was only on that day in the 
Tang Family's garden that they met once through the window. 

But now, he was playing the song she once liked best, directly meeting her face to face. 

Tang Siyu thought that her heart would be able to remain calm. However, she seemed 
to be unable to do so. 



Looking at the graceful man sitting beside the piano, all her past memories rushed into 
her mind like an uncontrollable flood, tearing open the wound she wanted to forget a 
little cruelly. 

Mu Fei also didn't dare believe that he would meet her here, just like five years ago, 
when he was waiting for her to come over to practice. She always had a beautiful smile 
on her face, wearing a white skirt. 

"Siyu, long time no see." Mu Fei was the first to speak. 

But just then, Tang Siyu wanted to escape, so she turned around in panic. 

"Siyu, don't go. 

Mu Fei suddenly chased after her, and without hurting her with his big palm, he caught 
up to her wrist. 

It was unknown if it was because this man's hand was too strong, or because he had 
previously entangled her, making her body that she wanted to escape seem as if she 
had lost all power. Just like that, she was pulled back by Mu Fei, watching as he 
approached. 

"Siyu, don't go. I have something to ask you." Mu Fei's voice carried a trace of guilt and 
pain. 

Tang Siyu took a deep breath, her small face pale as she stared at the traitor. Clenching 
her teeth, she sneered, "Do you still have anything else to ask me?" 

Mu Fei looked at the ridicule and cold smile on her face with some shock. He bit his lips, 
and said with a slightly heavy voice. Why did you leave without even saying goodbye? " 

Tang Siyu suddenly remembered something. Right, that year when she left without 
hesitation, she did not even tell him the reason why she broke up with him. A trace of 
anger appeared in her eyes, but she bit her lips, not wanting to say anything. 

"The past is already in the past, what are you still hesitating about? In the future, when 
you see me, you can call me Big Sis. " Tang Siyu continued to mock and hurt him. 

A flash of extreme pain passed through Mu Fei's eyes. It was as if a steel knife had 
stabbed into his chest, causing him to be unable to breathe. He had become her 
brother-in-law. 

"Whose child is that? Who were you with back then? " Mu Fei clenched his teeth, and 
stared deeply at her, wanting to know the truth. 

"What does it have to do with you?" Tang Siyu smirked. 



"Yes, I want to know how you loved me so much five years ago, and why you were with 
another man behind my back. I also want to know if you had children." Mu Fei's voice 
was full of questions, but when his pretty face appeared in his eyes, he didn't seem to 
be able to hate his. 

Tang Siyu was suddenly angered, she suddenly pushed him away, "When you and 
Tang Yiyi were sleeping together naked, did you ever think about me?" 

Chapter 44 - Origin of Children 

Mu Fei's expression instantly changed to one of astonishment and astonishment. He let 
out a sharp breath. How do you know about Yi Yi and I? " 

"Because I saw it with my own eyes when I went to your bedroom. I didn't expect that 
when I was traveling, you would actually be together with my sister. Mu Fei, this is the 
reason for my annulment. Tang Siyu took in a deep breath, her heart bleeding from the 
pain. 

One day, she would still personally question him. But now, she had asked him the 
question. Why was he still in such pain? 

Mu Fei's huge body stepped back, "You … You came back that morning... Sorry Si Yu, I 
was very drunk that night. I didn't know who the woman sleeping beside me was. I 
thought it was you … I thought that you had returned. That night, I treated Yi Yi as you 
… " 

Mu Fei painfully held his forehead. 

Tang Siyu gasped for breath, looking at him. Actually, she already knew that Mu Fei 
would not betray her, and everything was because of Tang Yiyi. Everything was done 
by her, but right now, she really could not forget that scene, nor could she forgive him. 

"Sorry, Siyu, sorry... I know I can't go back with you, but... I really do love you in my 
heart, and even now, the woman I love the most in my heart is still you. " Mu Fei's eyes 
were scarlet, as he spoke to her emotionally. 

Tang Siyu panted heavily, a heart-wrenching pain surging within her. She listened to the 
confession of the man she once deeply loved, but she could no longer accept it as such. 

This man was about to be her brother-in-law, about to become the husband of another 
woman. Even if she were to hear that he had admitted his wrongs from back then, it 
would be too late. 

She had a child, and he, had Tang Yiyi. 



"Stop it!" I wish you and her well. I will forget the past and also, please forget. Between 
us, don't disturb each other anymore. " Tang Siyu said coldly. 

Mu Fei continued to gaze at her lovingly, "Then, shouldn't you tell me who that child is? 
Why are you with that man? " 

"It was an accident. The child belonged to me alone." Tang Siyu responded indifferently, 
as she turned around to stop the tears from wresting away from her eyes. 

Mu Fei's eyes suddenly hurt, "When you were travelling, what exactly did you 
experience? Who bullied you? " 

Mu Fei clenched his fists tightly, as if he wanted to kill someone. 

Tang Siyu took a deep breath and said, "I don't need to tell you." 

"So, you intend to spend the rest of your life with this child?" Mu Fei continued to ask. 

Tang Siyu felt that he had asked too many questions, she did not want to reveal too 
much about herself. 

Tang Siyu turned her head calmly to look at Mu Fei. Now, she had to let go of him, 
because Mu Fei did not betray her. 

She only needed to know this point. That feeling from back then had left a perfect stop 
in her heart. 

"I heard that your wedding is going to be held the day after tomorrow. Congratulations, I 
wish you happiness." Although her tone was not sincere, at least, she spoke calmly. 

However, Mu Fei's face did not reveal the happiness of a bride-to-be. On the contrary, 
his expression was somewhat ugly. 

"Siyu, I know it's too late. I just hope that you can live a good life and have a happy life." 

Chapter 45 - He is here to pick up his son 

"I will." Tang Siyu answered. Right now, she was very happy. 

Mu Fei frowned slightly, "Are you really not planning to tell me who the father of this 
child is?" 

Tang Siyu bit her lips, "I don't know, and there's no need to tell you." 

A flash of anger appeared in Mu Fei's eyes. Which bastard had bullied her back then? 
His heart ached at the thought of him being bullied. 



The shop manager at the side did not dare to approach them, but just then, Tang Siyu 
raised her head and looked at the shop manager behind the counter, "Boss, I want to 
buy something from you." 

"Alright, Miss Tang, pick whatever you want to buy!" 

Tang Siyu saw that the shop manager still remembered her, so she pursed her lips and 
smiled. Behind her, Mu Fei also did not leave. 

It was as if he had returned to those days five years ago, and his heart was beating for 
her. 

Tang Siyu quickly took everything she wanted to pay, and at this time, Mu Fei spoke, 
"Put it in my account!" 

Tang Siyu did not listen, but handed over the money instead. The owner took it 
awkwardly, and after finding a zero, Tang Siyu picked up the things and prepared to 
leave. 

Mu Fei suddenly wanted to pull her back, but Tang Siyu turned his body and pulled his 
hand back. He did not dare touch her again, afraid that he would receive her resentful 
gaze if he did. 

Just like that, he helplessly watched Tang Siyu disappear from his sight, yet, he didn't 
recover for a long time. 

As Tang Siyu sat in the carriage, she also did not leave for a long time. Her heart was in 
chaos, she needed to calm down for a while to calm down the old grudges that had 
surged up. 

That's right, now, she really didn't blame him at all. Even if Tang Yiyi did not use a 
treacherous scheme to snatch him away, then, how could she, who had lost her body 
back then, be worthy of him? 

And it would be a mockery of their love if she were to marry him like that and conceive 
another man's child. 

Thus, this seemed to be the best ending. 

They all said their goodbyes and no longer interfered. 

After thinking it through, Tang Siyu was finally relieved. Five years of hatred had finally 
disappeared at this moment. 

Tang Siyu rushed to the school to pick up the little guy. She planned to go together with 
him to celebrate moving into her new home. 



She waited. Suddenly, she felt someone coming from outside the window. She looked 
up from her cell phone and saw a tall and deep figure walking towards her. 

Tang Siyu's scalp went numb, and her nerves immediately went into battle preparation 
mode. 

It was Xing Liehan. 

Damn it, why is this man lingering? 

She really wanted to roll up the window and not talk to him. 

However, the man had already spoken first, "I'm here to bring Xiao Xi back to my house 
today! My family wants to see him. " 

Tang Siyu almost said without thinking, "No!" 

"No? My son does not need your permission to see my family. I am only here to inform 
you. " Xing Liehan said coldly. 

Tang Siyu was immediately speechless, this man really wanted to fight with her for his 
son. 

"Regardless of whether you agree or not, I must take my son away later." Xing Liehan 
said firmly. 

Tang Siyu exhaled, she was not in a good mood today, she gritted her teeth and said, 
"Alright, only this one time, there won't be a next time." 

"What you said doesn't count." The man didn't give her any face at all. 

Chapter 46 - Heartache Son 

Tang Siyu was so angry that her face turned green, "If that's the case, then I'll take my 
son away." 

"No matter which end of the world you bring him to, I will find him. After I find him, don't 
even think about meeting my son again. It's best if you don't anger me." Xing Liehan 
warned, his gaze shooting straight at her like ice. 

Even though Tang Siyu was not afraid of him, this gaze still made her heart slightly 
tremble. 

Tang Siyu got off the car. When she was swiping her card to enter, she realised that the 
man behind her had the right to enter as well. Damn it, the school actually admitted that 
he was the father of her son? 



It seemed like she needed to have a good reaction. 

The little fellow who was playing in the wintersweet wood looked at his parents who had 
entered the classroom one after the other. He was so shocked that he couldn't believe 
his own eyes, "Mummy, Daddy!" 

As he shouted, all the children who had yet to pick him up looked towards the door. So, 
this was Tang Yixi's parents! 

"Xiao Xi, is this your father's place?" A child asked curiously. 

"Yes, this is my father's land!" Tang Yixi's little friend said loudly. His voice had a little 
pride in it. 

This made Tang Siyu's eyes flash slightly. His son really wanted this father, Xing Liehan 
also felt extremely satisfied in his heart, it was as if he had become the glory of his son. 

"Xiao Xi, how about I bring you to grandpa and grandma's house for dinner?" Xing 
Liehan bent over and talked to him. 

"Really? I can see my grandparents now. I want to go. " The little guy immediately said 
in excitement. 

Tang Siyu, who was at the side, wanted to stop her son, but right now, her son's smile 
made her swallow her words back down. 

"Xiao Xi, do you really want to go?" Tang Siyu stared at her son. 

Tang Yixi's little friend immediately heard Mummy's unhappiness, and his little face 
instantly became flustered. He blinked his big eyes, and looked at Mummy pitifully. 
"Mummy, you're not letting me go?" 

How could Tang Siyu bear to reject him when there was such a pitiful expression like a 
little white rabbit? Even if she threatened to use her mother's dignity to stop him from 
going, it would not stop him from wanting the thoughts of his other relatives, and she did 
not want to teach him in such a tough way. 

"Alright! You go! But you must come back before nine tonight. " Tang Siyu did not want 
him to stay the night at Xing Liehan's house. 

"Hm!" Mummy, I promise I will definitely come back on time. " After saying that, the little 
guy looked at his father, "Daddy, you have to send me back before 9 o'clock! Otherwise, 
Mummy will be unhappy. " 

Xing Liehan was unhappy! This woman was really on guard against him. She actually 
forbade him to spend an entire night with his son. 



"Alright, I promise to send you back." Xing Liehan could only agree, because he also 
loved his son, so he would listen to his son's words. 

"Give me your phone number." Tang Siyu immediately asked for his number. 

"You think my phone number can be given to you so easily?" Xing Liehan sneered, 
could this be considered as an excuse to take the initiative and hit on him? 

Tang Siyu wanted to laugh, but she mocked with a cold face, "You're thinking too much. 
If it wasn't to pick up your son at night, I wouldn't care about it!" 

"Daddy, hurry up and give it to Mummy! This way, I can call you in the future too! " The 
little guy quickly tried to persuade his father. This way, they would have a way to contact 
each other. 

Chapter 47 - Returning to the Xing Family 

"Give me your phone." It was impossible for Xing Liehan to read his phone number in 
public. 

Tang Siyu was a little displeased, and handed the phone over to her. Xing Liehan took 
it, and entered his private cell phone number to return it to her. 

In front of the school gate, his eyes followed Xing Liehan as he took his son's car away. 
Tang Siyu let out a breath of air and called Su Xi. 

Su Xi was extremely happy to accompany her, the two of them went to a high-class 
Western restaurant, where there were no spies from the paparazzi, and there were 
many popular affairs on Su Xi's side, there were also a few rumours, although it was all 
caused by the commotion, her life was still seriously disturbed. 

Tang Siyu told her about running into Mu Fei at the piano shop. Su Xi immediately 
became angry, "This trash still dare to stop you?" 

"No, he isn't considered a scumbag, right? It can only be said that Tang Yiyi had too 
many tricks and schemes back then, and took action while I was on my journey. " Tang 
Siyu's opinion of Mu Fei had changed too. 

Su Xi felt that it wasn't worth it for her, "Back then you and Mu Fei were such an 
enviable couple! Unfortunately, this Tang Yiyi is simply too lowly of him, and took the 
initiative to pounce towards us. " 

"Ever since she was young, as long as it's something mine, she would snatch it away. 
It's no surprise." Tang Siyu laughed at herself. 



Su Xi looked at her with a pained expression, "That's right! She had a mother behind 
her back! If she wants to rob you, what can't she rob you of? " 

Tang Siyu shook her head, "I don't want to bring them up anymore." With that, she 
began to eat absent-mindedly. 

Seeing her expression, Su Xi could not help but laugh, "Could it be that you are also 
worried that your son will be taken away by someone?!" 

"Of course I'm worried! Xiao Xi was still young! What if Xing Liehan taught him 
something, and he liked him even more? " Tang Siyu was really worried about this. 

Su Xi looked at her pitifully, "Don't worry, I believe that my foster son won't leave you 
behind. In his heart, the most important thing is you. 

Tang Siyu nodded her head, "Alright, I won't think about it anymore. Let's finish eating 
and go to my new home for the night." 

"Alright!" 

Just as Xing Liehan's car entered the garden gate of the Xing Family's mansion, he saw 
four waiting figures standing at the main entrance. The entire family came out to 
welcome little friend Tang Yixi. 

Amongst them, Xing Yinuo was the most active, because this Young Nephew was her 
idol! 

The car stopped at the entrance and she quickly took three flight of stairs. Xing Liehan 
was the first one to step down, following which, behind him, a handsome little guy 
wearing school uniform came down. 

"Young Nephew, you're finally back." Xing Yinuo bent his bright eyes and looked at him 
excitedly. 

"Xiao Nuo, stop scaring him. Let Xing Liehan bring him into the hall and properly 
introduce him!" Jiang Lan was really worried that the little guy would be scared. 

Xing Liehan bent down and carried his four-year-old son into the bright hall. Under the 
light, the people of Xing Family couldn't wait to size up this new member, and all of their 
faces revealed happy and excited smiles. 

Xing Liehan also immediately introduced him, pointing at his parents, "This is your 
grandfather, grandma." "This is your little uncle, your little aunt." 

Tang Yixi politely greeted them with his young and tender voice, "Grandpa, Grandma, 
Uncle, Aunt, nice to meet you, my name is Tang Yixi." 



Xing Yinuo couldn't wait to get out of his big brother's embrace and hold the little fellow 
in her arms, "From now on, you can call me Little Aunt. I like you so much." 

Chapter 48 - Collecting Children Together 

Xing Yifan, who was at the side, also reached out his hand and caressed the little 
fellow's head. A gentle smile flashed across his fair and handsome face. 

Jiang Lan and Xing Zhengting looked at each other and laughed. A hint of tears even 
flashed past Jiang Lan's eyes, when she thought about how this little guy had only lived 
with her mother since she was young, she felt as if her grandson was too wronged. At 
this moment, she couldn't help but feel sad. 

"Come, I have a lot of toys from my childhood. I'll take you to play in the toy room 
upstairs." Xing Yinuo was just a child who had not grown up yet. All she thought about 
all day long was playing, while Xing Yifan was at a different extreme. Even though he 
was only fifteen years old, his actions were already stable. 

Tang Yixi's little friend couldn't play with an adult, but he really liked this little aunt. She 
was beautiful, with a beautiful smile, and also, her little heart was like a mirror. 

Xing Liehan watched as his sister pulled his son up to the second floor. He helplessly 
shook his head and said to his mother, "Mom, stop making the kitchen food too spicy." 

"I've already told you, the dishes tonight are all things that children like to eat." 

Xing Zhengting looked at his eldest son and asked, "Your child's mother doesn't have 
any objections, right?" 

"The child is also from the Xing Family, does she have any objections?" Xing Liehan's 
voice carried a sharp edge. 

Jiang Lan immediately scolded him lightly, "In the end, you bullied her first. Now, can 
you treat her better, and apologize to her?" 

"Mom, this is my problem, I will take care of it." Xing Liehan frowned, then walked up the 
stairs. 

Jiang Lan looked at her eldest son's back, slightly annoyed. Even as a mother, she 
would feel ashamed for such a thing. 

In the toy house, Tang Yixi's eyes lit up. There were a lot of toys! That year, they were 
busy with the company and had just given birth to a son. They no longer had any plans 
to have a child, but who knew that the unexpected joy would come again twelve years 
later, and that it was a pair of rare dragon and phoenix pregnancies. 



Therefore, the Xing Family now had a toy house specially built for these two children. 

At this moment, Xing Yinuo knew that the little guy was a boy and that he definitely liked 
hooligans. She had brought over a few toys like racing cars, and the two of them sat on 
the floor and started to play happily. 

Xing Liehan leaned against the door with his arms crossed. He looked at the little girl 
sitting on the floor and couldn't believe that he actually had a child. 

Hearing Tang Yixi's tender laughter, the corner of his mouth unconsciously curled up 
into a smile, and a doting light gently shone down on the little fellow who was lying on 
the floor. 

At this time, Xing Yifan walked in from the side. These were all his toys from when he 
was young, he could teach the little guy how to play. 

Children also like to find children to play with, moreover, children like to play with older 
children. 

During dinner, the three children went downstairs and washed their hands and ate at 
the table. 

On the dining table, Tang Yixi's little friend had a very good education and ate 
obediently. He ate big mouthfuls, and didn't need to worry. 

Moreover, with the two big kids Xing Yinuo and Xing Yifan present, he was really happy. 

Xing Zhengting and Jiang Lan both didn't even have time to eat and were busy watching 
the little fellow eat. Xing Liehan sat beside him, occasionally placing food in his bowl to 
take care of his son. 

Tang Yixi's little friend also felt the affection of his family towards him. It was as if he had 
become the center of this family. 

After dinner, Xing Yinuo continued to bring him to the toy house, forming their child's 
world. 

After Tang Siyu and Su Xi finished their big meal, the two arrived at their new home 
around 8 PM. Tang Siyu sat at home for a while and continuously looked at the time, 
wondering if this man would send her son back before 9 PM. 

As soon as it was nine o'clock, she was ready to call. 

However, just as he arrived at 9 o'clock, the doorbell rang. Tang Siyu quickly went 
closer to the peephole to take a look, it was Xing Liehan and his son. 



She quickly opened the door and looked surprised at her son who had returned with a 
toy. "How did you get here?" 

"It was Father who brought me up here!" The little guy pointed at his father. 

Tang Siyu immediately became angry, "You actually dare to investigate my address, 
can you not do this, this is a violation of my privacy." 

Xing Liehan sneered, "You're thinking too much." 

"Am I overthinking it? "How else would you know my family lives here?" Tang Siyu 
asked angrily. 

"There's no need to tell you." Xing Liehan looked at her carefully, then gently warned his 
son, "Rest early, you still have lessons tomorrow!" 

"Hm!" "I will, Daddy. Goodbye." After the little guy finished, he begged again, "Daddy, 
can you treat Mummy a little better in the future?" 

These words made Tang Siyu snort, "I don't want him to call me that!" 

Xing Liehan squinted, "I'll try my best." 

Tang Siyu warned the man, "You better not send anyone to follow me again." With that, 
she closed the door. 

Closing the door, Tang Siyu pulled the little fellow to the sofa. Su Xi also came over 
curiously, "Xiao Xi, are you enjoying your stay in Xing Family?" 

"Hm!" "I'm very happy. I have a little aunt, a little uncle, and a grandpa and grandma. 
They all like me a lot." Tang Yixi spoke the truth. 

This caused Su Xi to laugh, "That's right, I seem to have heard that Xing Family also 
has a pair of beautiful Dragon and Phoenix calves, which is also Xing Liehan's younger 
brother and sister." 

"That's right! My little aunt and uncle gave me presents, robots that I love so much. " 
After saying that, he began to play around with it again. 

"Alright, it's late now. Let me give you a bath and go to bed!" Tang Siyu didn't want to 
mess up his son's work and rest. When it was time, he had to go to bed. 

It was very hard to nurture a child during his working hours. 

"Oh!" The little guy immediately drooped its head and followed Tang Siyu into the 
bathroom to shower. 



Su Xi was holding her phone as she watched the news on the sofa. Right now, the 
rumors about her and a male celebrity were actually being searched online, but as a 
celebrity, having a chance to shine was a good thing, however, the comments on the 
internet annoyed her immediately. Some of the fans spoke in sharp and harsh tones, 
saying that she wasn't worthy of the male celebrity. 

Su Xi was very clear in her heart. She was a pure person, and it was just that she 
couldn't stand being said like this. 

That night, Su Xi slept here. 

Chapter 49 - Moutang Engagement 

Early morning. 

Tang Siyu woke up at seven, took the little guy downstairs for breakfast, and then sent 
him to school after breakfast. At around eight, she would have enough time. 

Just as she sat in the elevator, Tang Siyu saw that the elevator was about to close. She 
quickly called out, "Please wait." 

Therefore, she quickly took out a bag of vegetables and squeezed inside. However, 
when she saw the man in the elevator, her pair of clear eyes immediately widened, 
while a trace of resentment clearly surged out. 

"You … What are you looking for me for again? " Tang Siyu glared at this tall man, and 
was extremely angry. 

Xing Liehan crossed his arms and smirked, "Who said I was looking for you?" 

His voice was as cold as usual, without any warmth. 

Even when he looked at her, his gaze did not fluctuate at all. There was also a 
profoundness that she could not see through. 

Tang Siyu couldn't help but sob. She studied art, and normally, her heart was as calm 
as water. She didn't know why, but when she met this man, it was as if her hot temper 
was automatically released. 

This made her very annoyed. She pressed down on her floor and decided to ignore him. 
But she was a little curious, why didn't this man follow her floor? Did she go to his level 
as well? 

The elevator arrived quickly. In a few seconds, it had arrived, and with a ding, it opened 
up. Tang Siyu quickly stepped out. 



Behind him, the sound of steady footsteps could be heard. 

Tang Siyu bit her lips, turned her head, and stared at him in embarrassment: "You're 
still saying that you're not looking for me, what are you trying to do?" 

Xing Liehan's sexy lips twitched, and he walked past her, taking the lead. Tang Siyu 
was still in a state of anger due to embarrassment. 

The man walked to the door in front of her, stretched out his slender white fingers, and 
pressed down on the password to enter. 

Tang Siyu's mind went blank, her beautiful eyes widened, and she blurted out a 
question, "Is this your home?" 

Xing Liehan looked at her coldly, then opened the high class room door and stepped in 
gracefully. In the next second, he slammed it shut. 

Behind him, Tang Siyu was holding onto a bag of vegetables, completely dumbfounded. 

God! She should have known that the three suites had been bought and decorated in 
such a luxurious and high-class manner that even the parents wouldn't be able to do it. 
There were even larger rooms that were over two hundred square meters in size, so 
why did they need to be completely rebuilt? 

Damn it, it was actually bought by this bastard, and he lived right across the street from 
her house. 

Could it be that she would have to face this man everyday? He felt as if he had been 
swallowed alive. 

Tang Siyu's fingerprint opened the door of her own room, and after entering, she 
became very bad. 

She stood up in anger and glared at her own door, as if she wanted to walk through it 
and stare at the man opposite it. Damn, why did he move here? 

It affected her mood. 

Tang Siyu clenched her teeth, took a deep breath, and did not let herself die from 
anger. Doesn't this mean that in the future, wouldn't his son be able to come to his 
house and nurture his son's relationship with him? 

If that was the case, she might as well move into Su Xi's house, so she wouldn't have to 
face him everyday. 



But, she knew it was inconvenient to stay in Su Xi's house! What if she had a boyfriend? 
Wasn't this just a precaution against her happiness? Thus, after thinking about it, she 
could only swallow her anger. 

Tang Siyu walked to the balcony and took a look. She was even angrier because she 
could see the balcony beside her. Wouldn't this mean that she would be able to see him 
from now on? 

There was nothing like this that made her so angry and frustrated. 

Tang Siyu had planned to practice the piano in the morning, but she was distracted and 
did not have the mood to do so. 

She picked up IPAD and sat on the sofa to watch the news. Just as she opened the 
web page, she saw that the third place on the search engine rankings was Mu Fei and 
Tang Yiyi's engagement ceremony. The Mu Clan and Tang Clan's reputation were 
enough to attract the attention of netizens. 

Tang Siyu threw the IPAD to the side. She crossed her arms and a bitter light flashed 
past her eyes, she had the urge to cry. 

She sat on the sofa in a daze for the entire morning. At 11 o'clock, Su Xi called back, 
and she was about to set off for a movie again. She might not see Su Xi again for a 
week, so Tang Siyu reminded her to be careful. 

At noon, she cooked two dishes alone to eat. Dinner was rather rich, because when the 
little guy grew up, he had to keep up with her nutrition. 

Tang Siyu practiced the zither for a while in the afternoon and always played the wrong 
note, causing her to be unable to continue practicing. She planned to stay in a daze 
until the afternoon when she could pick up her son. 

She was a little worried that Xing Liehan would beat her to it, so she had to go to school 
early to bring her son over to her own home. 

At 4 o'clock sharp, Tang Siyu pushed the door open and walked out. Looking at the tall 
and big anti-theft door, the hatred in her eyes flashed, from now on, only she and him, 
the owners of this whole floor, were left. This feeling was extremely unpleasant. 

When Tang Siyu arrived at school, she sat in the garden beside and waited. At around 
4: 20 PM, many luxurious carriages came from all directions to take care of the children. 

Tang Siyu stood up and walked out of the garden. Her emotions were all overcast, she 
anxiously looked around, and suddenly, she saw that among the crowd waiting to be 
admitted to the academy, his tall and straight body was extremely eye-catching. Even 



when he stood there, it was as if she had become a scenery, his entire body giving off a 
noble aura. 

At the same time, it was also filled with an unapproachable coldness. 

She had to enter the school faster than this man. She pretended that she did not see 
this man, and ran in front of him to cut the queue. She could not help but turn and glare 
at the man behind her. 

Xing Liehan had an indifferent, elegant and reserved expression as he stared unhappily 
at the woman in line. However, his lips were pursed slightly, and he didn't say anything. 

After entering the school, Tang Siyu quickly walked towards the small class his son was 
in. Behind him, Xing Liehan's footsteps were neither fast nor slow as he followed, and a 
parent beside recognized him. Immediately, they greeted him respectfully and carefully. 

The moment Tang Siyu entered the classroom, Tang Yixi called out to her, "Mummy, 
you're here." 

Tang Yixi thought that she had come alone, but then, he saw his father's land again. He 
asked with a smile of pleasant surprise, "Mummy, are you and his father coming to pick 
me up?" 

"Ugh …" No! He came by himself. " Tang Siyu explained. 

Tang Yixi looked at Xing Liehan happily, "Daddy, will you always come to pick me up 
from school?" 

Xing Liehan smiled and replied seriously, "I will, I will in the future." 

"Great! From now on, come and pick me up from school with Mummy everyday." The 
little guy was truly happy. 

Tang Siyu's face is not very good-looking, but in front of her son, she can't say anything. 
She leads her son out of the house. Behind him, Xing Lihan continues to follow him. He 
is wearing a dark shirt and trousers, and his beautiful looks make many young female 
parents look stupid. There are still some unknown ones to envy and envy Tang Siyu. 

It seems that in their eyes, this man and Tang Siyu are just a couple. 

Tang Siyu finds out the thoughts and eyes of the female parents nearby, and her face is 
cold for a moment. She doesn't intend to pay attention. 

The little guy behind Tang Siyu looks back and smiles with Daddy from time to time. He 
thinks daddy is driving to pick him up. However, when he follows Mommy all the way 



home, he finds daddy is also behind him. He asks curiously, "Daddy, are you going 
back to our home?" 

Xing liehan chuckled, "you will know in a moment." 

The little guy was curious by the mysterious appearance of his father. When he got on 
the elevator, Tang Siyu led the little guy. The little guy was surrounded by a tall man. At 
this time, a parent who picked up the child hurriedly came in and took her daughter. She 
smiled and said to Tang Siyu, "you are the father and mother of Tang Yixi's little friend! 
Your family looks so happy! " 

The family, three words make Tang Siyu's face instantly red. She wants to say that she 
is not a family, but her child is also in her son's class. She doesn't want her son to be 
gossiped at school, so she has to smile. 

And this woman is the kind that can be opened more. She looks up at the tall Xing 
liehan, and she turns her head to admire Tang Siyu and says with a smile, "your 
husband is so handsome!" 

Husband? 

The smile of Tang Siyu is stiff now. It's worse to laugh than to cry. 

The thin and beautiful lips of Xing lie's side were scratched for a moment, which means 
nothing. 

The little guy nodded at once, "yes! My father and my mother are very kind! " 

"Tang Yixi, I made Coke drumsticks today. Think about worrying about your bad teeth. 
You'd better not eat them." Tang Siyu can only use food to threaten his son to talk less. 

Tang Yixi immediately hugged mummy's thigh. "Mummy, I don't have cavities. Look, I 
can eat anything." 

Then he opened a white and tidy baby tooth, "Mommy, look, I have no cavities!" 

Tang Siyu continued with a stout smile, "it's not good to eat too many sweet things! 
Don't eat. " 

The little guy has big eyes and looks at Mommy pitifully. The chicken leg made by 
mommy is his favorite! 

Xing liehan looks at his son pitifully. Did he grow up under the pressure of this woman? 
The son who has been taught in this way will have no future. His sword brow is twisted 
a few points. 



At this time, the parents arrived, she turned back to a family of three behind her and 
said, "first off, goodbye." 

As soon as the parent left, Xing liehan bent down and took his son's hand and said, 
"come to daddy's house tonight." 

"Daddy, are we going to grandparents again?" 

"No, it's daddy's house." 

"Where is your home?" The little guy asked curiously. 

Elevator "Ding!" When it started, Tang Siyu suddenly took his son and said, "Xiaoxi, go, 
Mommy decided to let you eat two more, as long as you promised me to brush my teeth 
sooner or later." 

"Well! OK, thank you mommy. I want chicken legs. " The little guy is so happy. 

He looked back and saw daddy coming. He looked up and said to Mommy, "Mommy, 
can I divide two chicken legs for daddy to eat?" 

He thought daddy was coming to his house for dinner. 

Tang Siyu opens the door, and Xing liehan stops the little guy, and his long finger 
presses his fingerprint. "Xiaoxi, this is daddy's home." 

Tang Yixi's eyes widened. He looked at two open doors, one is mummy's house, the 
other is daddy's house. He was surprised and happy. 

"Daddy, this is your home! That's great. I can be with Daddy every day. " 

"Do you want to go into daddy's house?" Xing liehan asked. 

"Good!" The little guy immediately extended Tang Siyu's hand and wanted to go in and 
have a look. Tang Siyu hurriedly said, "Xiaoxi, go home and eat drumsticks." 

"But..." 

"No, but, come on in." 

Tang Yixi really wanted to go into daddy's house and have a look, but Mommy seemed 
very angry! 

"Xiao Xi, go ahead." Xing lie's face was a little gloomy. Then, when Tang Siyu wanted to 
go in, the man grabbed her arm mercilessly. His big palm closed the door in front of her. 
Next second, Tang Siyu's delicate body was pressed on the wall by the man. 



"Don't hinder me from communicating with my son." A low, bleak voice fell from above. 

The man is too tall. In order for this woman to see the eyes in his eyes, he leans down 
and his handsome face is very close in an instant. 

Tang Siyu's eyes widened slightly, reflecting the perfect outline of the man and the cold 
danger in his eyes.The distance between the two is very close. A sharp hormone breath 
belonging to men inhales the tip of Tang Siyu's nose, and her white face turns hot and 
red. 

"Asshole, you let me go." Tang Siyu struggles and hates his proximity. 

Xing lie's long and narrow eyes narrowed, "you are the best to hear clearly. Your son 
has the right to choose who to be with. You are not allowed to interfere with his ideas, 
otherwise..." 

"Or what?" Tang Siyu slightly raised his face and looked at him. 

The two red lips that she slightly tooted were tender and fragrant. Xing lie's eyes were 
bright and cold. He suddenly sucked her lips with his thin lips. 

Tang Siyu's eyes gaped to the greatest extent, her heart, is not fighting to jump, and the 
man kissed her, but his eyes with cold light, staring at her. 

Finally, the man pulled out, and Tang Siyu's instinct slapped his face in the face. 
However, the man was quick to buckle up, and she changed another one, and the other 
one was also buckled by the man, and directly copied to her head, forming a more 
warm posture. 

"Xing liehan, you dare to touch me again..." Tang Siyu wants to be mad. This man can 
bully people like this. Wasn't that night enough five years ago? He's a real pervert. 

Xing lie hooks his lips in cold, and the tall body just retreats again. Tang Siyu is scared 
to breathe hard and gasps, "you What else do you have to do? " 

Xing liehan knew that the best way to threaten this woman was this. He said with cold 
eyes, "if you dare not let me see my son, then I don't mind what happened five years 
ago. I will review it again." 

"Dare you..." 

As soon as her words fell, the man bent over and grabbed her lips directly. 

 


