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Chapter 2321 Fusing the Human Ancestor’s Blood, Fortune’s Shift, Heavenly Sovereign’s Betrayal

Chu Kuangren spent more time stripping the Infernal Dragon energy, the Devil’s Pupil, the Radiant 
Seed, and Doomsday Darkness. The various powers had helped him a lot in the past, but he felt 
nothing when he stripped them all away. He understood the importance of give and take. Besides, 
the powers were stripped from his body, not abandoned. The powers were just temporarily sealed 
away in his Pocket Universe. “Alright, now let us refine the Human Ancestor’s Blood,” Chu 
Kuangren murmured.

Without the excessive powers, the Human Ancestor’s Blood no longer rejected him and slowly 
fused with his body.

An ancient and profound energy circulated in his body, fusing with his Ultimate Almighty Source 
Physique, the only thing that resonated with the energy.

While he was fusing with the Human Ancestor’s Blood, there was a change in the human race’s 
fortune energy.

Many human great ones could feel the changes. “The human race’s fortune energy is changing. 
What is going on?” “The fortune energy seems to be gathering at a single point. That direction… 
Feng Domain’s Pan Gu Sect? It’s Chu Kuangren?”

“What is he up to this time?” Everyone else was surprised once again. Chu Kuangren was indeed a 
troublemaker. Not only had he caused a ton of problems that could reshape the universe before he 
went into closed-door cultivation, but even now that he was cultivating, he was causing troubles.

First, he cursed half of the Curse Tribe, and now, he was affecting the human race’s fortune energy. 
Although the human race’s great ones could sense the changes in the fortune energy of the Great 
Hongmeng Universe’s human race, it was actually beyond the Great Hongmeng Universe. The 
fortune energy of the human race across the Infiniverse was being affected! Only less than a handful 
of great ones noticed the vast area of effect, including the Heavenly Sovereign, one of the three 
Adjudicators. “The fortune energy of the human race across the Infiniverse is changing?



“It’s Chu Kuangren. He must be fusing the Human Ancestor’s Blood!” The Heavenly Sovereign’s 
expression shifted. The Daoist law energy circulated him, glimmering brightly as if it reflected his 
ever-changing emotions.

“No. Once the human race’s fortune energy finds a master, I will not be able to siphon energy from 
it to boost my cultivation! How am I going to ascend to the Overlord Realm? Chu Kuangren, you 
have crossed the line this time.”

Chu Kuangren had only seen the Heavenly Sovereign once, and there were practically no grudges 
between them.

Yet, the Heavenly Sovereign had intense killing intentions for Chu Kuangren after what the latter 
did, all because Chu Kuangren stood in his way.

Just as the Heavenly Sovereign tried to come up with a solution, golden rain descended in the 
realm.

The Human Empress had arrived.

“Oh? It’s you. What is it?” The Heavenly Sovereign calmed down for a moment when he saw the 
Human Empress.

The Human Empress looked at him with a deep gaze. She said, “The fortune energy of the human 
race across the Infiniverse is changing. You should’ve noticed it.”

“So what?”

“Are you nervous?”

“What do you mean?” The Heavenly Sovereign was baffled.

“Have a look at this.”

The Human Empress revealed a gemstone that contained a sliver of energy. She said, “In recent 
years, someone has been siphoning the fortune energy of the human race. This energy belongs to the 



mastermind, and if I’m correct, this should be the Heavenly Golden energy, unique to your 
Heavenly Golden Art.” The Heavenly Sovereign’s eyes narrowed. “What are you trying to say?”

“You’ve been stealing the human race’s fortune energy, am I right?”

“Nonsense! If I did that, you would’ve noticed a long time ago. Besides, I am also human. Why 
would I do something like that?” “In that case, can you show me your Monarch’s Heart?” the 
Human Empress asked.

Suddenly, the atmosphere turned serious.

The Heavenly Sovereign went silent for a while.

Then, he chuckled. “I didn’t expect the Tempest King to investigate this far. Maybe I should’ve 
killed her a long time ago.”

His Monarch’s Heart contained a large amount of fortune energy that he stole from the human race, 
and showing it to the Human Empress would expose him.

There was no way he would take it out.

Based on that, the Human Empress confirmed that the Heavenly Sovereign was the mastermind.

“It’s you. Why did you do it? You’re the Heavenly Sovereign of the Supreme Council, holding the 
superior authority over all in the human race. Why are you hurting the human race’s fortune 
energy?” the Human Empress questioned him with a frosty gaze.

“Superior authority? It’s nothing real! Only real power can last for eternity! I did it because I’m in 
search of a higher power! Human Empress, only by using the human race’s fortune energy can I 
ascend to the Overlord Realm in time,” the Heavenly Sovereign said with desire burning in his eyes.

The Overlord Realm was the realm beyond the Monarch Realm.

Monarchs were rare, but Overlords were rarer. The Human Ancestor, the Primal Infernal Dragon, 
the God of Slaughter, and all the ancient beings were all Overlords.



“The desire for power is not an excuse for you to hurt the entire human race! Heavenly Sovereign, 
you are unworthy of being the Adjudicator of the Supreme Council!” “Hmph. Is that so?” The 
Heavenly Sovereign’s eyes gleamed fiercely as he prepared himself to attack.

A large amount of Heavenly Gold Daoist law energy gathered at his palm, and he launched it at the 
Human Empress. The vast amount of energy crushed even the void.

The Human Empress raised her paper umbrella to block it.

The paper umbrella with the stars, moon, and sun on it seemed to contain countless universes, and it 
blocked the Heavenly Sovereign’s attack.

The blast, however, pushed her backward. “I am the Heavenly Sovereign! The Adjudicator of the 
Supreme Council who holds the highest authority of the human race! No one can judge me!” the 
Heavenly Sovereign shouted.

Rampant Heavenly Golden energy erupted, strong enough to annihilate a universe.

“You are nothing but a traitor of the human race,” a frosty voice said.

Earthen qi rumbled, and a tall figure arrived. His eyes were burning with the flames of anger as he 
stared at the Heavenly Sovereign. It was the other Adjudicator, Earthen Monarch. “I’m not afraid 
even if the two of you team up.” The Heavenly Sovereign channeled his terrifying Daoist law 
energy.

He had been stealing fortune energy from the human race for many years, and it boosted his power 
so much that he had long surpassed both the Human Empress and Earthen Monarch. However, he 
had just hidden it from them the entire time.

Now that his intention was exposed, there was no reason for him to hide it anymore.

The powerful energy put a grim look on the Human Empress’s and Earthen Monarch’s faces.

“What about me?” another frosty voice said.



A tall figure arrived, and her domineering and iron-willed qi filled the realm instantly.

It was the Tempest King, the Monarch who overpowered the previous era.

“It’s you again.”

The Heavenly Sovereign looked at her with frosty killing intents.

It was because of the Tempest King’s investigation that enabled the Human Empress to expose him. 
“You’re not even an Ultimate Monarch. How are you my match?” The Heavenly Sovereign scoffed.

The Tempest King may be powerful, but to the Adjudicator, who had been feeding off the human 
race’s fortune energy for years, she was not good enough.

“Ultimate Monarch?” The Tempest King grinned, and then a terrifying energy erupted from her.

Spiritual qi, earthen qi, life qi, and even the starlight energy and the sun-moon energy of the 
universe gathered on her.

As she consumed the unparalleled energy, her energy skyrocketed.

It surged to the limit, and she became an Ultimate Monarch in just an instant.

“I am now.”

Chapter 2322 - No One Knows The Outcome, Dark Demonic Ruler’s Presence, Devil King’s 
Information

When the Heaven-devouring Technique was cast, the Tempest King’s energy surged from First Step 
Monarch to Ultimate Monarch.

The Heavenly Sovereign’s eyes widened in shock. “Tempest King, I have underestimated you. All 
three of you, come at me together!”



It was the Tempest King, the Human Empress, and the Earthen Monarch versus the Heavenly 
Sovereign.

All four of them were the strongest of the human race, and the battle between them would be the 
rarest fight across the Infiniverse.

The fight was astonishing.

The heavens and earth were destroyed, while galaxies were annihilated.

With the Yin and Yang disrupted, the realm was turned upside down.

Realms were annihilated and forced to reset back to nothing but chaos.

The fight shook half of the Great Hongmeng Universe.

Many Monarchs sensed the fight, and it scared them.

They fought from the Great Hongmeng Universe to other universes before ending up in the void 
between universes.

The fight startled all in the Infiniverse.



However, the outcome of the fight was a mystery. Other than the four of them, no one knew who 
won or lost.

After the fight, the Tempest King returned to the Pan Gu Sect and went into close-door meditation.

“What an amazing fight.”

Somewhere in the universe, the Dark Demonic Ruler expressed his awe when he sensed the battle. 
Even he admired the power they possessed.

Though, he wondered if the Doomsday Darkness could rival them.

The Dark Demonic Ruler then looked at the man in front of him.

The man in black robes was the sect master of the Doomsday Sect, the person he would be working 
with.

“We’re down to the final details. When you decide to make a move, come to me again,” the Dark 
Demonic Ruler said before he left.

“Safe trip, Demonic Ruler.”



The Doomsday Sect Master bowed politely.

After that, he looked into the dark void and said sincerely, “My lord, you won’t have to wait any 
longer. Soon, you will be able to return.”

Inside the dark void was a strange consciousness circulating in nothingness.

The power formed a vague contour of a strange beast.

…

Back in the Divine Destiny Temple, Chu Kuangren continued fusing with the Human Ancestor’s 
Blood.

At the same time, his mind was in the space between Daos, comprehending all kinds of Daoist laws. 
He wanted to master three thousand Daoist laws as soon as possible.

Multitasking was not too difficult for him since he had multiple souls.

Even though they all fused back to one, he still had experience in controlling them.

In the space between Daos, he arrived at a Great Dao that was pitch-black.



It was the Darkness Dao.

Chu Kuangren was comprehending the Darkness Daoist law energy and met a few cultivators doing 
the same.

Suddenly, something further away caught his attention, and he sensed a familiar presence.

“This energy belongs to a Monarch. A Darkness Dao Monarch?”

Chu Kuangren was intrigued.

There were only so many Darkness Dao Monarchs.

Based on what he knew, there was only one Dark Demonic Ruler. In addition to the familiar 
presence, he was sure it was the Dark Demonic Ruler.

“I feel ashamed. I made a deal with him to search for a recovery item, but I still haven’t found it.” 
Chu Kuangren shook his head with a self-mocking smile.

The Dark Demonic Ruler had given him a list of items that could help his recovery, but Chu 
Kuangren had not found any of them.

It was either Chu Kuangren or the Dark Demonic Ruler who was having bad luck.



“Should I meet him?” Chu Kuangren thought to himself.

With the Dark Ruler Amulet, he could easily sense the Dark Demonic Ruler’s presence and identify 
him on the Great Dao.

When he was about to go up and greet the Dark Demonic Ruler, the presence disappeared.

The Dark Demonic Ruler must have left the space between Daos.

“Too bad.”

The odds were slim running into an acquaintance on the Great Dao. As he did not get to speak with 
the Dark Demonic Ruler this time, he had no idea when he would see the man again.

Chu Kuangren shook his head and completed his comprehension of the Darkness Daoist law before 
he left.

His cultivation went on for years.

Even Chu Kuangren had lost count of how many years he had been comprehending the Daoist laws.

The Daoist law energy on him got denser as he comprehended more Daoist laws.



He could already manifest the Monarch’s Heart and break through to the Monarch Realm, but he 
did not do it.

It was because he wanted to fuse three thousand Daoist laws first.

At that moment, he arrived at another Great Dao — the Greed Dao.

It was a Great Dao that only a few cultivated, and as soon as he arrived, he felt endless desire 
affecting his Daoist core.

If not for his steady Daoist core, he would have succumbed to the temptation.

The Greed Dao was indeed terrifying, and no common cultivators could get close.

“Bang!”

Before he could start comprehending, the Daoist law energy of the Greed Great Dao erupted. 
Endless evil spirits gushed outward and shook the entire Great Dao.

Like dark clouds, the swarm of evil spirits hovered in the sky.

It was terrifying to look at, even for Chu Kuangren.



Then, amidst the dark clouds came a slender figure in black robes. There was a pair of wings behind 
her back, and she had silky dark hair draped on her shoulders.

She was like a poppy flower that bloomed in darkness, exuding lethal temptation.

“Isn’t this my dear ally? How have you been?”

She recognized Chu Kuangren immediately.

“Greetings, Devil King.” Chu Kuangren bowed.

Other than the Devil King, who else possessed such intense wicked intentions?

“Little one, your Daoist law energies are a little messy. Don’t tell me you’re trying to master all 
three thousand.”

The Devil King was indeed a smart one to be able to see through Chu Kuangren at first glance.

Chu Kuangren admitted it frankly.

“This is a difficult path, but you might just succeed,” she said with a smile.



She had high hopes for Chu Kuangren, who seemed to have magical powers.

He could always turn impossible into possible.

“Oh, I heard something huge happened to the human race a while ago,” the Devil King said.

After that, she told him about the internal conflict between the three Adjudicators.

Chu Kuangren responded with a grim look.

“Is Lan okay?”

“Your little disciple is fine. In fact, she’s doing good.”

Chu Kuangren breathed a sigh of relief.

A while ago, the other tribes had plans to target the humans, and now, the three Adjudicators of the 
Supreme Council were fighting among themselves. It was quite an eventful era for the human race.

However, the humans were said to be the masters of the realm, so how could the human race be so 
unfortunate?



Fortune? Wait a minute.

Could someone be stealing the human race’s fortune?

Chu Kuangren pondered.

Then, the Devil King said, “The Darkness Tribe that you left at my place has left.”

“Where did they go?”

“The Dark Demonic Ruler took them away. That little one is pretty interesting. To think he can use 
the Doomsday Darkness’s power so skillfully and turn it into his own energy.”

The Devil King clicked her tongue and added, “And he made an interesting deal with me.”

That statement surprised Chu Kuangren.

The Dark Demonic Ruler had returned to the Great Hongmeng Universe?

Had he recovered from his injuries?



“What deal?” he asked.

“It’s a secret.”

If it were a secret, why would the Devil King mention it? To tease him?

It seemed like many interesting things had happened while he was away cultivating. However, he 
felt that the Dark Demonic Ruler’s return was a little out of the blue.

Chapter 2323 Spatial One’s Confidence, Holy Radiant Church’s Change, Left Sky King’s Betrayal

After having a chat with the Devil King, Chu Kuangren successfully comprehended the Greed 
Daoist law.

His speed in comprehending the Greed Dao left her in awe. “I have to say, this little one might 
really fuse three thousand Daoist laws,” the Devil King said with a grin as she watched as Chu 
Kuangren left. She stroked her chin and pondered. “I think that cutie Radiant Goddess is going to 
face some problems soon. Chu Kuangren, can you break through to Monarch before the worst 
happens? “The human race is also facing a lot of problems. What will you do after you break 
through to Monarch and gain the fortune of this era?” the Devil King muttered.

This era was unusual. Ancient beings had started to awake one after another as if they had tacitly 
agreed to it. There were also the contingency plans they had prepared for themselves. “Hmph. A 
new storm is coming soon.” …

Time flew by in the blink of an eye. Many years had passed, and the Great Hongmeng Universe 
remained lively as always.



With the appearance of more sky-prides and Prodigies, the names on the Hongmeng Leaderboards 
shifted many times. Cultivators from different tribes fought for a place on the leaderboards, and it 
was getting more competitive. There were the Dragon Tribe’s Ancient Monarch Seeds awakening 
and starting their conquest.

There were the Ancient Prodigies of the Celestial Divine Tribe waking from slumber and continuing 
their cultivation to break through to the Monarch Realm in an attempt to seize the fortune of this 
era.

There were the Pan Gu Sect’s cultivators who had also improved greatly over the years.

Other than the mentioned, there was the Spatial One from Spatial Tribe. He was a mysterious figure 
and was supposed to lead the Spatial Tribe to glory.

His status even surpassed that of the Spatial Tribe Leader.

After arriving in the Great Hongmeng Universe, he started a killing spree. Not even some of the 
Monarch Seeds of ancient Hongmeng tribes were his match.

He even challenged the Wine Honorable at the Pan Gu Sect and won but lost to the Tempest King in 
one attack. Fortunately, he did not die and successfully replaced the Wine Honorable as the second 
place on the Supreme Honorable Leaderboard. His achievement gained him a huge amount of 
fortune energy.

Meanwhile, in the Spatial Tribe’s territory, a young man in silver white robes and a pair of light 
wings on his back sat with his legs crossed. He was surrounded by mystical Daoist law energy. The 
young man was none other than the infamous Spatial One. He was recovering from the fight with 
the Tempest King.



“The Tempest King’s attack is indeed powerful,” the Spatial One muttered. Given his strength, not 
even a common Monarch could hurt him in one strike, yet the Tempest King struck him without 
showing herself and inflicted heavy damage on him. Rumor had it that the Tempest King was also 
hurt from the battle with the Heavenly Sovereign and was still in recovery. Otherwise, he would 
have had it worse than he did now. “I want to fight her again once I ascend to Monarch. It would 
definitely be more fun then,” the Spatial One said, his battle intent piqued.

Daoist law energy started to circulate him and form the shape of the Monarch’s Heart.

“My Monarch’s Heart is almost complete. Until then, I will be the first Monarch of this era. I will 
gain all the fortune of this era and overpower everyone!” the Spatial One said confidently.

He knew about Chu Kuangren but had never met the man before. Although he knew he should not 
underestimate Chu Kuangren, he was confident because he was the child given birth by space itself, 
the Spatial One.

He would ascend beyond the Monarch Realm in the future.

After a few hundred years had passed, a massive Radiant energy exploded in the starry sky and lit 
up the galaxy.

The explosion caught much attention.

“What is that?”

“The Holy Radiant Church is in that direction!”



“What is going on?”

All the cultivators sent their Immortal Consciousnesses to have a look.

A huge fight was happening at the Holy Radiant Church.

The Radiant Left Sky King and a group of cultivators were besieging the church, where the Radiant 
Goddess was. However, a barrier had been activated around the church, and the clergies were 
channeling their Great Dao energy to stop the siege.

“Radiant Left Sky King, why did you betray the Goddess?”

“Have you lost your mind?”

All the clergies were infuriated by the betrayal.

A while ago, the Radiant Left Sky King used a certain Supreme Treasure to ambush the Radiant 
Goddess while she was in cultivation. She was injured heavily, and it marked the beginning of the 
uprising.

Everyone was shocked.



The Radiant Left Sky King was one of the Radiant Goddess’ most trusted men. He had served the 
Goddess for a long time, and no one expected him to betray the goddess.

“From today onward, the Radiant Goddess is no more. There’s only me, the Radiant Sky King!” the 
Radiant Left Sky King bellowed.

His ambitions were obvious — he wanted to replace the Radiant Goddess and take over the Holy 
Radiant Church.

“You piece of garbage! How dare you call yourself king?” A frosty voice sounded.

Ming Fei came out from the church with icy-cold eyes, and an intense killing intent was brewing 
inside her. She resented a traitor the most, especially the ones who betrayed the Goddess.

Ming Fei’s figure flashed and appeared outside the barrier.

The Radiant Left Sky King’s men jumped on her immediately.

“Ming Fei, surrender!”

“The Radiant Goddess is incapacitated. She can’t fight anymore, and you alone are no match for us! 
Surrender, and you still can keep your position as the Radiant Right Sky King!”

“Kabaam!”



Radiant Daoist law energy erupted.

The rampant energy blasted the Holy Knights away. The weaker ones were killed on the spot as 
their Great Daos were destroyed.

“Daoist law? You’ve manifested the Daoist law?”

Everyone was shocked.

Ming Fei had only ascended to a Grand Dao Supreme Honorable a while ago, yet she had 
manifested the Daoist law already. Her cultivation speed was terrifyingly fast.

“It must be the Goddess! She must be helping you with your cultivation!” The Radiant Left Sky 
King was jealous. “We’re both the Left and Right Sky Kings who serve the Goddess, but she treats 
us so differently. My Daoist law is nowhere in sight despite having cultivated it for tens of 
thousands of years, yet you, who have only ascended a while ago, have manifested yours. This is 
unfair, and the Goddess is biased!

“Not only you, but she even made Chu Kuangren, someone whom she had met not for long, the 
Child of Light! He used to be a heretic, yet his status is higher than mine, you say? I have served the 
goddess for so many years, but what do I have? Nothing!” the Radiant Left Sky King grumbled.

Ming Fei’s gaze turned frosty. “You trash! Look at the armor you’re wearing! The Goddess gave 
you that, didn’t she? Back then, you were hunted by your enemies, and it was the Goddess who 
saved you. You’re the Radiant Left Sky King whom everyone respected, and you say you received 
nothing? You’re just greedy!”



She then swung her sword at the Radiant Left Sky King.

The icy-cold sword ray was like snowy white silk. The sword ray overpowered the Radiant Left 
Sky King, and the loud bang sent him flying with blood gushing from his mouth. His face turned 
pale.

He was injured and left speechless by Ming Fei’s questions.

“I can’t go back now! The arrow has been fired. I must do it no matter what! I can’t fail!”

“Then, you will die!”

Before Ming Fei could attack, she sensed a vast amount of Darkness energy coming from further 
away.

Her expression shifted into horror. “This aura… Could it be…”

Chapter 2324

Things took a sudden turn at the Holy Radiant Church. A vast amount of Darkness aura swept 
across the place.

From within the extreme darkness came a familiar presence that Ming Fei recognized. A figure 
emerged from the darkness, wearing glamorous black robes and looking handsome with his 
bewitching presence.



Ming Fei’s expression turned grim.

“Dark Demonic Ruler!”

It was the Dark Demonic Ruler himself, the biggest heretic recorded in the church’s history!

“Oh, isn’t this the little kitty by my sister’s side? Look how much you’ve grown. How surprising.” 
The Dark Demonic Ruler chuckled when he saw Ming Fei.

“It’s you! You planned all this!”

“Yes and no,” he said.

Then, with his hand raised, he shot a beam of black light at Ming Fei. It was so powerful that it 
punctured the void.

Ming Fei’s eyes widened. She channeled her energy to the limit and countered it with a slash with 
her great sword.

When the blinding sword ray clashed with the demonic beam, a massive explosion erupted.

Ming Fei was blasted backward by the explosion, her face pale.



She may have manifested the Daoist law energy, but she was still not a Monarch.

Further away, the Radiant Left Sky King watched with utmost admiration. “This is the power of a 
Monarch! If I kill the Radiant Goddess and get her Monarch’s Heart, I’ll be able to obtain such 
power as well!”

The Dark Demonic Ruler overheard him and sneered with disdain.

“You traitor. How dare you call yourself King?”

A gloomy energy erupted and was blasted at the Radiant Left Sky King.

Bloosh gushed from his mouth immediately.

However, the Dark Demonic Ruler did not kill the Radiant Left Sky King since they practically 
worked together before.

“Damn it!”

The Radiant Left Sky King was blasted to the ground, looking horrified and angry. His wretched 
state and bloody appearance made him look like a clown. The prestigious demeanor of a king was 
gone.



“I remember you. You’re Ming Fei, right?” the Dark Demonic Ruler said. “I admire you. Serve me, 
and I will grant you power you can never imagine.”

Instead of answering, Ming Fei wielded the Radiant sword and stood straight like a pole in front of 
the church.

“I will fight for the Goddess and the Goddess only,” Ming Fei announced.

“Very well. I shall grant you your wish.”

The Dark Demonic Ruler chuckled and then pointed his finger at her.

Domineering Darkness Daoist law energy erupted.

However, a beam of Radiant Daoist law energy was fired at him from inside the church.

The clash between the Radiant and Darkness energies caused the realm to flicker between day and 
night before an explosion erupted. The blast sent Ming Fei flying away, but she fell into a warm 
embrace. She looked up and saw a beautiful face looking at her.

It was the Radiant Goddess.

“Are you okay, Ming Fei?”



The Radiant Goddess looked worriedly at Ming Fei.

Ming Fei shook her head and got up immediately. She said, “Goddess, how’s your injury?”

The Radiant Left Sky King had ambushed the Goddess during her cultivation with a strange 
Supreme Treasure to make sure the damage inflicted was severe.

“I’m fine. Don’t worry.”

The Radiant Goddess shook her head.

However, Ming Fei noticed an unusual blush on her face, and the Goddess’ Great Dao seemed to be 
suppressing something.

She was not as fine as she claimed to be. “My dear big sister, it’s been a while since we saw each 
other.” The Dark Demonic Ruler smiled at the Radiant Goddess.

The Radiant Goddess looked at him coldly. “Demonic Ruler, I didn’t expect you to recover so fast. 
Have you forgotten how I punished you before?”

“Oh, no. Of course, not. That’s why I came prepared this time.”



“My foolish brother, do you really think these kinds of tricks can defeat me?” The Radiant Goddess 
scoffed.

She was strict and kind before her people — the embodiment of Light. However, she was unusually 
harsh and vicious against the Dark Demonic Ruler.

A few words, plus a scornful tone and a disdainful smile, infuriated the Dark Demonic Ruler. 
“Hmph. I know you’ve always looked down on me, but one day, I will make you understand that I 
was right.”

“Just because you always run away from me?”

“You…”

The Dark Demonic Ruler’s expression turned bitter. “Since when will you understand that 
suppressing the Doomsday Darkness won’t solve the problem? We must understand it, control it, 
and then solve the problem from there.”

“Understand it? Control it? Is that the reason why you betrayed the Radiant Tribe?”

“You never understood me. When I was in the Radiant Tribe–”

“What happened when you were in the Radiant Tribe? Did I lock you up and strip you of your 
freedom or hit and scold you?”



“You didn’t let me–”

“I didn’t let you study the Doomsday Darkness because it’s forbidden! You broke the rules of the 
Radiant Tribe! If I didn’t protect you, you would’ve died!”

“Hmph. Those foolish–”

“Even though they were foolish, they knew what to stay away from, unlike you. You were too 
confident in your talents, and it drove you to approach the Doomsday Darkness.”

The Dark Demonic Ruler and the Radiant Goddess were arguing, but unfortunately, the Dark 
Demonic Ruler was silenced every time.

He could not even speak a full sentence before he was interrupted.

The others were stunned.

It really looked like siblings bickering with each other.

Were they really arch nemesis? Ming Fei, however, was not surprised. Back in the day, the Dark 
Demonic Ruler and the Radiant Goddess would argue whenever they met. It was also the reason 
why their relationship exacerbated over the years. To put it bluntly, they both had different ideals.

“Can you let me finish?” the Dark Demonic Ruler shouted.



The Radiant Goddess chuckled. “What are you trying to say? It’s so lame that I’ve grown bored of 
it.”

“If that’s the case, there’s nothing left for me to say.”

The Dark Demonic Ruler’s expression turned grim, and he attacked using the strongest Darkness 
Daoist law energy.

“Let me see how much you’ve grown over the years.”

The Radiant Goddess raised her scepter, and the Radiant Daoist law energy formed a torrential river 
of light to counter the Darkness energy.

Light and Darkness clashed, forming a black-and-white tornado that shook the entire church.

“Stay back!”

Ming Fei told the weaker clergies to retreat.

“Great Judgment of Light!”

“Darkness Hand!”



“Radiant Divine Arrow!”

“Darkness Slash!”

All kinds of powerful techniques were cast, and neither of them held back.

It was only then that the others believed they were arch-nemesis.

Each of their attacks was aimed directly at each other’s weak spots. Not all were qualified to see the 
quarrel between the brother and sister. The battle between Monarchs required a certain level of 
power to watch.

Even Ming Fei, a Supreme Honorable, could not find the window to intervene. She got anxious as 
she watched.

Suddenly, she noticed something when she scanned over the field.

“Where’s the Radiant Left Sky King?”

Chapter 2325 Break The Seal, Physical Body Vessel, Doomsday Darkness Appears

“Bang! Bang!”



Light and Darkness clashed above the Holy Radiant Church. The energy shockwaves from the clash 
were terrifying. It lit up the entire sky, causing it to shift between day and night in an instant.

The Dark Demonic Ruler and the Radiant Goddess’ fight escalated from the exchange of different 
Grand Dao-level cultivation techniques to Hongmeng-level cultivation techniques.

“Darkness Fall!”

As the Dark Demonic Ruler raised both his hands, the Darkness energy erupted and swept across 
the field, creating a world of darkness.

A black waterfall appeared from the void, carrying the densest Darkness Daoist law energy that 
could devour all light in its path.

“Shining Overworld!”

The Radiant Goddess, however, refused to step back. She raised her scepter, which released a 
blinding light across the field. It reflected a river of light that connected the past and present.

It was the black waterfall versus the light river.

The moment the two energies clashed, the void around the field shattered, and the starry sky 
collapsed under the impact of the blast.

Countless stars were devoured by Darkness and Light before they vanished.



“You’re still such a pain in the *ss.” The Dark Demonic Ruler, who was pushed back by the blast, 
clicked his tongue and pursed his lips. The Radiant Goddess was pushed back as well. Her face 
flushed for a moment, but she quickly suppressed it.

Unfortunately, it did not escape the Dark Demonic Ruler’s eyes.

“Oh, it seems like the Dark Blood Sword is not entirely useless.”

The Dark Blood Sword was a treasure from the Doomsday Sect. It was forged using the Doomsday 
Darkness’s energy and created to counter the Radiant energy.

It was also the item that the Radiant Left Sky King used to sneak up on the Radiant Goddess.

“Your cultivation hasn’t grown much, but you’ve become more despicable.” The Radiant Goddess 
snickered at the Dark Demonic Ruler.

The old Dark Demonic Ruler would never use dirty tactics against her. What changed after all these 
years?

The Dark Demonic Ruler’s lips moved, but he did not say a word.

The Doomsday Sect was the one who contacted the Radiant Left Sky King, so the Dark Demonic 
Ruler had no idea about the ambush.



Even so, his explanation was useless. The Radiant Goddess was his enemy, and no excessive 
explanation should be provided.

“But if you think you can defeat me with this, I’m afraid you’re still too naive!” The Radiant 
Goddess took a deep breath and then unleashed an unparalleled surge of Radiant Daoist law energy.

A massive projection of a goddess manifested behind her, radiating endless light in the area.

It was her Monarch Avatar!

“My dear sister, I have never underestimated you.”

The Dark Demonic Ruler bellowed and unleashed his Darkness energy, summoning darkness in the 
sky.

That was his own Monarch Avatar.

“I didn’t expect you to have your own Monarch Avatar.”

“My body may be injured, but my comprehension of the Daoist law continues while I recover. Let’s 
see whose Monarch Avatar is stronger!”

When the two Monarch Avatars clashed, the battle escalated to the next level.



Meanwhile, deep inside the Radiant Tribe, where the formation that sealed the Doomsday Darkness 
was located, a group of invaders barged in.

They all possessed strange Darkness energy.

Following their appearance, the Doomsday Darkness buzzed violently as if it had sensed them and 
attacked the seal.

“No!”

An elite of the Radiant Tribe, who was guarding the seal, noticed the unusual reaction.

Before he could react, a sword stabbed into his chest from the back and destroyed his Great Dao.

The one who stabbed him was the Radiant Left Sky King.

The others then attacked the formation.

The Radiant Tribe’s cultivators tried resisting, but the invaders came prepared, and they were 
powerful.

With the help of the Radiant Left Sky King, the Radiant Tribe cultivators were soon defeated.



“Left Sky King, you will pay for this!” A dying cultivator glared at the Radiant Left Sky King as 
signs of life left his body.

“Hahaha! Nicely done, Left Sky King. We have to thank you for leading us here where the 
Doomsday Darkness is sealed.”

“Don’t worry. We will reward you for your effort,” said a man in black robes.

“Thank you, Sect Master.” The Radiant Left Sky King bowed and thanked the man.

Many years ago, when he was tasked to investigate the Doomsday Darkness with Ming Fei, he 
encountered the Sect Master, who proposed to work together.

The Sect Master promised to help him ascend to the Monarch Realm once the dust settled.

The Radiant Left Sky King agreed, which led to today.

“Next would be releasing this power.”

The Doomsday Sect Master looked at the massive power of the Doomsday Darkness in front of him 
with fervor. “What a powerful Doomsday Darkness. This is the most powerful one we’ve found in 
all the years we’ve been collecting it!”



Then, the Sect Master took out a black sculpture.

The sculpture emanated a strange surge of energy, and it seemed to contain a strange willpower. It 
was the vessel that contained the Doomsday Darkness’ will! The moment the sculpture was brought 
out, the massive Doomsday Darkness and the sculpture resonated together, releasing a terrifying 
energy fluctuation.

The seals were broken instantly. The moment the black sculpture flew to the Doomsday Darkness, 
the pitch-black energy grew restless like boiling water. A massive tendril crawled out from it, 
exuding an eerie energy presence.

“The Lord is searching for the body vessel!”

The Doomsday Sect Master’s eyes widened as a realization struck him.

Since the Doomsday Darkness’ energy and will had combined, all that was left was a physical body 
to act as its vessel.

The most suitable person to be the Doomsday Darkness would be…

The Doomsday Sect Master gulped nervously. As he watched the tendril reach for him, he grabbed 
the Radiant Left Sky King without a second thought to block the tendril.

“No!” The Radiant Left Sky King was horrified, but it was too late.



The moment the tendril caught him, immense Doomsday Darkness energy gushed into his body.

The energy crushed his Great Dao and replaced it with a whole new energy.

The excruciating process caused him to scream in pain.

Then, a terrifying energy blast expanded from his body, crushing the stars in the galaxies. The realm 
was in total chaos following the awakening.

Upon sensing the commotion, many Monarchs of the Great Hongmeng Universe looked in the 
direction of the Holy Radiant Chruch.

“This energy is powerful!”

“It has extreme darkness in it! Could it be the Doomsday Darkness that the Radiant Goddess 
mentioned? I never thought it existed.”

All the Monarchs were scared.

Meanwhile, in the Devil’s Territory, the Devil King opened her eyes and looked in the same 
direction. “Doomsday Darkness, eh? Now, everything is coming out one by one.”



Outside the church, the Radiant Goddess was shocked by the sudden commotion. While she was 
distracted, the Dark Demonic Ruler struck her, causing her to bleed black qi.

It was the energy from the Dark Blood Sword, and she could no longer suppress the injury 
anymore.

However, she was not too concerned about her injury as she looked at the church with a mortified 
look. “Doomsday Darkness? The Doomsday Darkness has appeared!”

Chapter 2326 Confident Left Sky King, Endless Phenomena

“Goddess!” Ming Fei rushed to the Radiant Goddess, trying to help her. However, the black qi 
around the Radiant Goddess prevented Ming Fei from getting close. As soon as she got close, the 
Radiant Dao inside her felt like it was being corroded, and it hurt her. Ming Fei was horrified. If it 
hurt so badly from just a touch, how much pain was the Radiant Goddess in?

At that thought, she glared at the Dark Demonic Ruler furiously. “Something has happened to the 
Doomsday Darkness’s seal. We must go there at once!” The Radiant Goddess forced herself to get 
up, but she spat a mouthful of blood again. “Tsk, tsk. How dutiful of you, Radiant Goddess. Since 
the Doomsday Darkness has appeared, there’s nothing you can do even if you go now.” “You have 
no right to say a word, Demonic Ruler!” The Radiant Goddess glared at him. She had never hated 
the Dark Demonic Ruler so much. She wished she could skin him alive. The Dark Demonic Ruler, 
however, remained unbothered. “Even if you want to go, you must get my permission.”

He unleashed a palm strike with a domineering power, blasting Ming Fei and the Radiant Goddess 
away. Having been affected by the Darkness energy, the Radiant Goddess tried to resist, but the 
Dark Blood Blade’s effect continued to corrode her energy. She was rendered defenseless. “Ming 
Dao, release me! The Doomsday Darkness has appeared! I must stop him!” the Radiant Goddess 
bellowed angrily. The Dark Demonic Ruler’s eyes widened when he heard the name. Ming Dao was 
his original name, and it had been many years since he heard his name.



“There’s nothing you can do in your state.” “Even if I die, I must go! My people need me!” “You 
really are a dutiful tribe leader.” The Dark Demonic Ruler scoffed.

If roles were reversed, he would never sacrifice himself for the tribe that humiliated and bullied him 
in the past.

With a thought from his mind, the Doomsday Darkness energy in the Radiant Goddess was stripped 
out and absorbed into his body.

“What are you…” The Radiant Goddess was confused. Was the Dark Demonic Ruler helping her? 
Had he regained his conscience? However, she did not have time to figure it out. Even though she 
was still hurt after the Doomsday Darkness energy was stripped away, she could already suppress 
the injuries. She flew away in a streak of light and headed to the Doomsday Darkness with Ming 
Fei following her away.

Looking at the Radiant Goddess and Ming Fei, the Dark Demonic Ruler smiled. “My dear sister, 
buy me as much time as you can. As for whether you can make it out alive, it’ll be up to you.” 
Then, his figure flashed and disappeared from the spot.

…

“Ah!” Excruciating cries echoed across the realm.

The Radiant Left Sky King’s body was being crushed and reformed over and over again, causing 
him excruciating pain.



At the same time, he felt a powerful energy brewing in his body. Its power was stronger than 
anything he had seen. As minutes went by, the Radiant Left Sky King’s aura grew stronger and so 
terrifying that the Doomsday Sect Master and his men shuddered.

When the Radiant Goddess and Ming Fei arrived, the Doomsday Darkness that the Radiant Tribe 
sealed off had completely taken over the Radiant Left Sky King’s body. “This power is amazing! 
This is the power of the Doomsday Darkness! I can’t believe it’s been by my side for so long, but I 
was too scared to approach it. I was a fool!” The Radiant Left Sky King was thrilled as he savored 
the new power in his body.

After the excruciating pain, he gained control of the Doomsday Darkness, and the power he felt 
excited him.

The Doomsday Sect Master and his men, on the other hand, were baffled.

What happened to the Doomsday Darkness’ will?

The Radiant Left Sky King seemed to be able to control his body and remain as himself.

However, when they sensed the terrifying aura on him, they knelt on the ground respectfully. “My 
Lord!”

The Radiant Left Sky King looked at the Doomsday Sect Master.

A while ago, he was forced to bow before the Sect Master, but now the tables had turned. They even 
called him their lord!



That was the beauty of absolute power!

The Radiant Left Sky King was over the moon. He looked at the Radiant Goddess and said, “This is 
such a strong power, yet you’ve been rejecting it all along. Radiant Goddess, you’re a fool 
compared to your brother.”

He dared not speak to the Radiant Goddess so arrogantly before, but now, he was not afraid of her.

“Radiant Left Sky King, that is something you cannot control!” the Radiant Goddess said solemnly.

“Hahaha! Are you afraid?”

The Radiant Left Sky King was not concerned. He simply thought the Goddess was afraid of him, 
and knowing that the superior goddess was afraid of him excited him even more.

“Goddess, Ming Fei, since we’ve known each other for so long, I’ll give you a chance. Serve me, 
and I will make you two my consorts. You can enjoy superior privilege,” the Radiant Left Sky King 
said.

“Shut it!” Ming Fei’s expression turned cold as she slashed her sword forward.

The Radiant Left Sky King raised his hand and unleashed a sliver of Darkness Daoist law energy, 
breaking the sword ray with ease.



Seeing that, the Radiant Goddess channeled the Daoist law energy around her to summon the 
Monarch Avatar. The boundless Radiant Daoist law energy immediately gushed out at its enemy.

“Break!” The Radiant Left Sky King punched forward. An extremely domineering Darkness Daoist 
law energy crushed the Radiant Daoist law energy and dealt a huge blow to the Monarch Avatar.

“He’s so strong!”

The Doomsday Sect Master and his men were in awe.

“Shining Overworld!” The Radiant Goddess cast her strongest attack together with the Monarch 
Avatar. A ray of blinding light that shone through the past and present was shot at the Radiant Left 
Sky King.

“Break!”

Again, the Radiant Left Sky King punched forward, and his Daoist Law energy consumed the light 
like a Darkness energy tide.

The Radiant Goddess was blasted away, and her Monarch Avatar cracked.

“Radiant Goddess, I’m not the old me anymore. The Doomsday Darkness you’ve feared for so 
many years is in my control now! I am above you! I will bring doomsday upon the Infiniverse!”

The Radiant Left Sky King was thrilled as Darkness Daoist law surrounded him.



He was like an untouchable God of Darkness.

He looked at the Radiant Goddess. “Goddess, if you refuse to serve me, I will destroy you and the 
entire Radiant Tribe. You will become the stepping stone of my ultimate conquest!”

Then, he raised his hand, ready to fire the Darkness Daoist law energy at her when all Daos in the 
realm suddenly buzzed.

As if it had sensed something, the entire Great Hongmeng Universe started to tremble while 
different phenomena were happening across the universe.

Golden lotus bloomed from the ground as golden rain descended.

Violet qi gathered from all over the universe.

Dragons and phoenixes soared in the sky as kylins galloped in the sea.

Music reverberated in the realm, along with the Daoist Rhymes ringing across the Infiniverse.

Immortals and deities had the strange urge to bow and kneel before the unusual phenomena.

Chapter 2327 Chu Kuangren Ascends to Monarch, Three Thousand Daoist Law Monarch’s Heart, 
You Call Yourself Doomsday?



Endless unusual phenomena happened across the universe.

The whole Great Hongmeng Universe was shaken like never before.

All the Monarchs sensed the unusual commotion, and it put a horrified look on their faces.

“Such phenomena means the first Monarch of this era is about to be born! Who could it be?”

“The amount of phenomena surpasses all the previous eras!”

“Who is going to ascend to Monarch?”

“I think I already know who…”

Meanwhile, at the Spatial Tribe, the Spatial One was shocked when he saw the unusual phenomena. 
“What’s going on? I’m almost reaching the Monarch Realm, but it shouldn’t cause this many 
unusual phenomena. Wait, this isn’t me…”

His expression turned grim.

He was half a step shy from breaking through to the Monarch Realm and could manifest a complete 
Monarch’s Heart in a few years. Then, he would become the first Monarch of this era, but someone 
had beat him to it.



How could he accept it?

“Who beat me to it? Damn it!” The Spatial One did not look happy.

Not only him but the other Monarch Seeds of Hongmeng tribes felt the same way when they 
learned that someone was breaking through to the Monarch Realm.

Some of them had a hunch, and they looked in the direction of the Pan Gu Sect.

The Pan Gu Sect was where the unusual phenomena were the densest. All the cultivators looked at 
the Immortals and deities bowing in the sky in awe. There was a hint of zeal in their eyes. 
“Someone is breaking through to the Monarch Realm!”

“It must be the Sect Leader! It must be!”

In the space between Daos, three thousand Great Daos buzzed together.

All the ancient Monarchs were surprised.

“Three thousand Great Daos buzzing together? He did it!” Some Monarchs reacted with a bitter 
look.



Fusing three thousand Great Daos had never been done before.

Chu Kuangren would be the first in history.

On the Destiny Great Dao, Chu Kuangren slowly opened his eyes to Destiny Great Daoist law 
energy surrounding him. That would be the last Daoist law he comprehended.

When the three thousand Daoist laws gathered, they were attracted to each other like magnets.

In the meantime, a colorful Monarch’s Heart took shape.

With that, Chu Kuangren’s consciousness left the space between Daos and returned to his own 
body.

His physical body was surrounded by countless Daoist law energy, like a planet with countless 
planetary rings.

It looked mystical and beautiful.

He savored the Monarch’s Heart in his body, formed by three thousand Daoist laws. He smiled 
brightly. “I’m finally a Monarch!”

He stepped forward and teleported above the Pan Gu Sect.



As his Monarch aura expanded outwards, the three thousand Daoist Laws shone brightly as if 
announcing the birth of the Monarch who would overpower the entire era.

“Kakroom!”

The entire Great Hongmeng Universe trembled, and countless unusual phenomena continued to 
appear.

All the Monarchs were in awe.

“His Monarch aura is powerful!”

“This is… Holy cow! Three thousand Daoist laws? Chu Kuangren has the aura of three thousand 
Daoist laws. He’s a monster!”

“What kind of Monarch is he!” A lot of people gasped in shock. Chu Kuangren was relatively calm. 
He was happy but not thrilled because he knew he would ascend to Monarch soon. It was just a 
matter of time, so there was no need to be carried away by the ascension.

He savored his newly gained Monarch energy.

It was powerful, extremely powerful.



He did not look like a Monarch who had just ascended.

On top of that, he could feel a massive amount of fortune energy gathering on him. The fortune 
energy was more mystical than anything he had ever received.

Even though it could not directly boost his power, it allowed him to quickly cement himself in the 
Monarch Realm.

Coupled with the blessing of fortune energy, his cultivation speed and the development of the Pan 
Gu Sect would only be faster.

He gained the fortune energy that could lead an entire era.

It was a huge opportunity!

With the blessing of fortune, many impossible things could be achieved with ease, such as 
overcoming problems.

The fortune energy promised a smooth sail in life, and it was the reason why it was mystical.

It was not just for Chu Kuangren himself but also for the people around him.

It was the main reason why all the Hongmeng tribes fought for fortune energy. With fortune 
energy’s blessing, future expansion and development would be guaranteed.



“Hm? This aura…”

While Chu Kuangren was savoring his new power, he sensed something in the distant sky. He 
looked into the sky with a frosty gaze.

Common cultivators could not sense anything beyond the space but not him.

He was extremely familiar with the Darkness aura.

“Doomsday Darkness. Something has happened at the Holy Radiant Church,” he murmured.

Instead of reuniting with his friends, he dashed to the Holy Radiant Church immediately. His figure 
disappeared in a flash.

Back at the church, the Radiant Left Sky King saw the unusual phenomena as well. His eyes 
narrowed in surprise. “It seems like someone has broken through to the Monarch Realm. Judging 
from the direction, it must be Chu Kuangren.”

His eyes turned cold. He hated Chu Kuangren. In fact, Chu Kuangren was one of the reasons why 
he betrayed the Radiant Church.

The Radiant Goddess’s bias toward Chu Kuangren made him jealous, and his jealousy grew as Chu 
Kuangren got stronger. In order to take revenge and become stronger, he decided to work with the 
Doomsday Sect.



“I’ll come for you after I deal with the Radiant Goddess and Ming Fei, Chu Kuangren!” the Radiant 
Left Sky King said coldly.

He was confident that he could beat Chu Kuangren.

Chu Kuangren may have broken through to the Monarch Realm, but he was still no match for the 
Doomsday Darkness.

The Radiant Left Sky King looked at Ming Fei and the Radiant Goddess, releasing the Doomsday 
Darkness energy to drown them.

Just then, sword qi rumbled across the realm and formed a barrier in front of Ming Fei and the 
Radiant Goddess that blocked off the Darkness energy.

Bathed in endless Immortal Sparks, a figure in white arrived from the sky. Accompanied by endless 
unusual phenomena, he looked like an Immortal King.

The rumbling energy shook even the void and crushed planets as he arrived.

The darkness around the area dispersed following his arrival.

“Chu Kuangren!”



The Radiant Left Sky King looked at him grimly.

On the other hand, the Radiant Goddess and Ming Fei were delighted to see him. His arrival gave 
them a sense of reassurance. It was as if he was the solution to all problems.

“Chu Kuangren, I see you’ve come knocking on my door yourself. If so, let me show you what 
doomsday is!” The Radiant Left Sky King cackled.

The Darkness Daoist law energy around him rumbled, shattering and distorting the void around 
him.

However, Chu Kuangren remained expressionless against the power that far surpassed a common 
Monarch. He looked on coldly as he swung his sleeve, releasing Daoist law energy to break the 
incoming Darkness Daoist law energy.

“You call yourself doomsday before me?”

Chapter 2328

Overpower the Left Sky King, I’m the One Who Cancels Doomsday, The Real Master Appears

“You dare call yourself doomsday before me?” Chu Kuangren said coldly with a contemptuous 
gaze. He did not know how the Radiant Left Sky King got the Doomsday Darkness’s power, but he 
looked down on the man, the ungrateful traitor who turned his back on the Radiant Church and was 
so eager to show off his newly gained power to the world.



No matter what kind of power he got, his actions were of a weakling.

“Chu Kuangren, I’m not who I used to be. You shall know the consequences of looking down on 
me!” The Radiant Left Sky King’s expression turned grim when he saw Chu Kuangren’s 
contemptuous gaze. He channeled the Darkness Daoist law energy around him and attacked with a 
palm strike.

The Darkness Daoist law energy transformed into a massive palm seal that could shroud the sky.

Chu Kuangren scoffed. “That’s it?”

He stepped forward, and as he raised his hand, his Daoist law energy grew restless. Compared to the 
Radiant Left Sky King’s pure Darkness Daoist law energy, his Daoist law energy contained various 
energy presences. It was mystical and dazzling to the eyes, but it was extremely powerful.

He raised his hand and slammed it down lightly.

“Kabaam!”

The Darkness palm seal that shrouded the sky was crushed.

However, the indomitable Daoist law energy did not stop there as it continued blasting toward the 
Radiant Left Sky King.

The blast sent the Radiant Left Sky King flying away.



“Bang! Bang! Bang!”

He crashed through a dozen planets before he was thrown into space.

The Doomsday Sect Master and his men gasped at the scene.

“How is this possible?”

“How is our Lord’s power so weak? What is Chu Kuangren? How is he so powerful?”

“Our Lord was blasted away?” Before the group could recover from shock, Chu Kuangren’s figure 
flashed and disappeared from the spot.

He reappeared above the Radiant Left Sky King, who was bleeding from the corner of his mouth. 
The Darkness Daoist law energy on the man was messed up.

“Chu Kuangren!” he bellowed when he saw Chu Kuangren above him.

He channeled his energy to the limit and unleashed boundless Darkness Daoist law energy that 
could consume everything.

Chu Kuangren scoffed. Then, he lifted his right foot and stomped downward.



Three thousand Daoist laws manifested into a colorful foot seal that stomped the boundless dark 
tide. With a splat, the stomp crushed the Radiant Left Sky King’s body, sending him flying once 
more. Some of the Monarchs were stunned by the scene.

The Radiant Left Sky King possessed the power of the Doomsday Darkness and could easily defeat 
common Monarchs, yet he was easily overpowered by Chu Kuangren.

With just a lift of his hand and foot, Chu Kuangren could beat up the Radiant Left Sky King.

Such monstrous power was not of a Monarch who had just ascended.

“Impossible!”

The Radiant Left Sky King refused to believe it. He looked at his hand and savored the Darkness 
energy in his body. He felt energetic and unusually strong, yet he had lost to Chu Kuangren.

Why?

How could such a powerful energy not rival Chu Kuangren? How did he lose so easily?

What went wrong? “No! I won’t accept this! It must be because I haven’t fully utilized the 
Doomsday Darkness’s energy! Yes! That must be it!”



The Radiant Left Sky King raised his hand. “Great Judgment of Darkness!”

He used his strongest technique.

The Great Judgment of Light of the Radiant Church was altered into the Great Judgment of 
Darkness as he channeled the Darkness energy in him.

A massive Darkness energy ball was hurled at Chu Kuangren, distorting the void in its trajectory.

Still, Chu Kuangren did not move from the attack.

“Great Judgment of Light!”

He raised his hand. The three thousand Daoist law energies were converted into Radiant Daoist law, 
and a massive ball of light was summoned.

Those who saw it were astonished.

“His Daoist law energy can be converted freely!”

“This is sick!”



“He’s no doubt a Monarch who has fused three thousand Daoist laws!”

A common Monarch would focus on cultivating one or a few Daoist laws, but Chu Kuangren had 
three thousand!

He could freely switch and convert all three thousand of them!

In other words, Chu Kuangren could be a Spatial Monarch, a Flame Monarch, a Radiant Monarch, 
and even a Destiny Monarch!

It was outrageous!

When the black and white energy balls clashed, Light and Darkness intertwined until the Light 
shone through the Darkness with indomitable power.

The black energy ball was dispersed immediately, and the Radiant energy struck the Radiant Left 
Sky King. The power that he was once familiar with burned him like the sun, causing him to scream 
in pain. “Damn it! Damn it! I refuse to believe it! Darkness Destruction Arrow!” The Radiant Left 
Sky King used another of his powerful attacks.

A black bow appeared in his hand. As he drew the string, an energy arrow formed by Darkness 
Daoist law was loaded and shot.

Chu Kuangren retaliated with the same attack but with the Radiant energy.



The Radiant Arrow soared across the sky like a meteor.

The moment the two arrows clashed in the air, an explosion erupted in the void.

The shockwave from the clash destroyed tens of thousands of planets. The Darkness Arrow broke 
upon clashing with the Radiant Arrow, and the blinding arrow perforated the Radiant Left Sky 
King’s chest. The momentum sent him flying backward, crashing through countless planets.

In the end, he was pinned onto a massive planet.

“How? How is this even possible?” The Radiant Left Sky King looked at the Radiant Arrow that 
pinned him on the planet in disbelief.

The scorching Radiant energy was burning his body.

Despite having mastered the Doomsday Darkness, he was no match for Chu Kuangren, who had 
just ascended to Monarch but his powers were terrifying.

As Chu Kuangren, bathed in Immortal Sparks, approached him, the Radiant Left Sky King felt 
aggrieved.

“Why? I turned away everything to attain this power, and I still can’t beat you! Who the hell are 
you?”



“Powers from betrayal? What use is that?” Chu Kuangren looked at the Radiant Left Sky King as if 
he were a clown. “As for who am I, I am the one who cancels doomsday!”

He swung his sleeve and attacked with Radiant energy.

The blast almost tore the Radiant Left Sky King’s body apart.

However, it was at that moment that the Radiant Left Sky King’s brain suddenly hurt terribly.

A strange voice echoed in his mind, saying, “Hmph! You useless thing! I allowed you to use my 
powers, and this is how you use them. Trash!”

“W-Who are you?”

Another consciousness existed in him, and the Radiant Left Sky King freaked out.

“You’ve been using my powers, but you don’t know who I am? How ridiculous.”

The Radiant Left Sky King gradually lost consciousness.

On the outside, the dying Radiant Left Sky King suddenly released a purer and more wicked 
Darkness energy. The power of it shook the void and instilled fear across the Infiniverse. Some 
Monarchs even felt chills running down their spines.



“What’s going on?”

“The Radiant Left Sky King suddenly got stronger?” No one understood why. Chu Kuangren, 
however, was not surprised. He looked at the body coldly and said, “Finally. The real master has 
appeared.”

Chapter 2329 Fight Doomsday Darkness, Monarch Avatar, Monarch Domain

“Great. The real master has appeared.”

Chu Kuangren grinned at the ‘Radiant Left Sky King’.

The ‘Radiant Left Sky King’ looked at him with a grin as well. “This era is indeed the Final Era. 
Even an Outlier that has fused three thousand Daoist laws has appeared. However, the Final Era is 
doomed!”

Final Era? What did it mean?

Chu Kuangren took note of that term.

“Radiant Left Sky King, or should I call you Doomsday Darkness? I can assure you doomsday is 
nothing but nonsense before me. You will crawl before me.”

Chu Kuangren swung his sleeve, releasing an ocean of Daoist law energies. He was countless times 
stronger than before.



Those who saw it were astonished.

They realized Chu Kuangren was just toying with the Radiant Sky King earlier. He did not even 
take the man seriously, and it showed how terrifying his powers were.

“No wonder he’s ranked first on the Divine Bachelor Leaderboard. His Monarch powers are 
terrifying,” the Doomsday Sect Master said with a grave look.

“But our Lord has appeared. No matter how strong Chu Kuangren is, he is no match for our Lord,” 
said one of the men. The Doomsday Sect Master nodded with a grin.

“You’re right. I was wondering why the Radiant Left Sky King was fine after absorbing our master. 
Now, it seems like our Lord just needed some time.”

The Radiant Goddess and Ming Fei looked at Chu Kuangren with concern.

The Radiant Left Sky King was no more and had transformed into the Doomsday Darkness. The 
powerful Darkness energy made it hard for them to breathe.

Could Chu Kuangren rival the Doomsday Darkness?

“Goddess, believe in him. He’s the Child of Light.”



Ming Fei tried to console the Goddess.

“Yeah, he’s the Child of Light, the bane of the Doomsday Darkness.”

Chu Kuangren and the Doomsday Darkness stood in the void, confronting each other. They had not 
fought, but their auras were clashing already.

The power released from the clash between auras alone shattered the planets around them in an 
instant.

“Doomsday Darkness, you are a worthy opponent for me to test my current strength,” Chu 
Kuangren said.

He had just ascended to Monarch and needed an opponent to test his strength.

The Doomsday Darkness would be a great one.

“Using me as a grindstone? Outrageous!”

The Doomsday Darkness’s eyes turned cold. He channeled Darkness Daoist law energy and shot it 
at Chu Kuangren.

The power was countless times stronger than that of the Radiant Left Sky King.



“Sword Twenty-three!”

Chu Kuangren pointed his sword hand sign forward, and sword qi immediately gathered at the tip 
of his fingers.

As he swung his finger down, the Sword Daoist law energy gushed out. The boundless sword qi 
swept across the void, crushing the stream of Darkness Daoist law energy.

It sliced through the stream of energy and went straight for the Doomsday Darkness.

“Doomsday Darkness Slash!” The Doomsday Darkness bellowed and manifested a pitch-black 
halberd in his hands using the Darkness Daoist law energy.

He swung the halberd forward, releasing a huge black halberd ray.

It could devour realms and even crush a Great Dao with ease.

The clash between the sword qi and halberd ray caused a massive crack in the void.

Chu Kuangren stepped into the void, and the Doomsday Darkness followed him inside to continue 
the fight.

Many other Monarchs sent their Immortal Consciousness inside immediately to observe the fight.



It was rare to see Monarchs fight, let alone a monstrous Monarch like Chu Kuangren and the feared 
Doomsday Darkness.

In fact, the power of the Doomsday Darkness at his prime might even surpass a Monarch’s since the 
part of him sealed in the Radiant Tribe was just one-tenth of his original power.

Deep inside the void, the Doomsday Darkness unleashed his Darkness Daoist law energy, 
summoning black abyssal and ominous Immortal Sparks that felt like they could devour everything.

As Chu Kuangren channeled his Daoist law energies, the three thousand different Daoist laws shone 
beautifully.

With their noticeable presence, the Monarchs easily spotted them after they entered the void.

All of them concentrated on the battle, refusing to miss a single detail.

“Doomsday Darkness Art, Fury Torrential Devour!”

The Doomsday Darkness gathered Darkness Daoist law in his hand and shot a torrential stream of 
energy forward.

The rumbling explosion shattered the void in its trajectory.



However, Chu Kuangren remained still with Immortal Sparks circling him.

He pointed his sword hand sign forward, unleashing a sword intent that filled with void.

“Sword Twenty-four!”

The slash blasted a vast sword qi forward. The sword intent shone brightly and lit up the void. 
“Kabaam!”

Upon collision, the Doomsday Darkness was pushed back.

He quickly swung his halberd forward, releasing an even more domineering halberd ray. The 
destructive Darkness energy it contained was terrifying and faster than his previous attacks.

It was aimed directly at Chu Kuangren, cutting off all his escape routes.

“Bang!”

The explosion pushed Chu Kuangren back a few steps as well.

After the first exchange, the two of them seemed fine. It was a draw.



Then, the Doomsday Darkness chuckled and started to channel the Darkness Daoist law energy in 
him. His aura rose sharply, leaving everyone in awe.

His energy rose multiple times, and there seemed to be no limits to it.

Nevertheless, Chu Kuangren was not surprised at all.

He had told Lil Ai to analyze the Doomsday Darkness before, so he had a general idea of how he 
worked.

“You think you are the only one?”

Chu Kuangren scoffed.

A powerful suction force erupted from his body, sucking in all the energy from the void. It was the 
Ultimate-level cultivation technique, the Heaven-devouring Technique!

With that, Chu Kuangren’s energy rose as well.

“That’s a good cultivation technique you have there.” The Doomsday Darkness praised with a grin. 
Then, endless Darkness energy gathered behind him and formed the avatar of an ancient god. The 
appearance of the avatar instilled fear in those who saw it.



It was the Doomsday Darkness’s Monarch Avatar.

“Interesting.” Chu Kuangren smiled.

Even though he had just ascended to Monarch and still could not manifest his own Monarch Avatar, 
he had a way around it.

The Daoist laws and the spiritual energy of the void gathered behind him and manifested into an 
avatar — the Pan Gu Avatar!

The Pan Gu Avatar wielded the Genesis Axe and swung it down at the Doomsday Darkness.

“Bang!”

The two avatars clashed.

With three thousand Daoist laws and the spiritual qi boost from the Heaven-devouring Technique, 
the Pan Gu Avatar rivaled the Monarch Avatar in terms of strength.

It was even stronger than the common Monarch Avatar. Only the Monarch Avatar of the Doomsday 
Darkness could rival it.

The battle was astounding!



All the Monarchs were captivated by the battle as it continued to escalate.

At that moment, the Doomsday Darkness growled and unleashed even more Darkness Daoist law 
energy. The energy flooded the void and started to expel all the other Daoist laws in the realm.

He seemed to have created a world of darkness around him.

“It’s a domain!”

“The Monarch Domain!”

Some of the Monarchs were shocked when they realized what technique it was.

The Monarch Domain was an exclusive technique to the First Step Monarchs. It was a technique 
stronger than the Monarch Avatar!

Chapter 2330 Thrash the Doomsday Darkness, Unlimited Great Dao Realm

“Even if your powers are astounding, a Monarch who has yet to master the domain is like an ant in 
my Monarch Domain, and you’re no different,” the Doomsday Darkness said coldly.

The difference between Monarchs who had mastered the Monarch Domain and those who had not 
was huge. They were not at the same level. Out of all the Monarchs that Chu Kuangren had met, 
only a handful of them had mastered the Monarch Domain, such as the Tempest King and the Devil 
King.



Even the Radiant Goddess, the Divine Sword Palace Ruler, and Monarchs that others deemed 
extremely powerful could only manifest Monarch Avatars.

“Domain? Interesting.”

Chu Kuangren could sense the endless Darkness Daoist law around him. Although his Daoist laws 
were suppressed in the domain, he did not panic.

With just a thought, he cast the Ultimate-level cultivation technique, Infinity Domain.

A domain expanded around him immediately, shocking everyone else.

“Chu Kuangren has mastered the domain as well?”

“Impossible! He just ascended to the Monarch Realm!”

“Wait, this isn’t the Monarch Domain. It’s a cultivation technique!”

Some Monarchs recognized the Infinity Domain, but they were still astonished.

With the Infinity Domain’s help, he was able to resist the oppression of the Darkness Domain and 
raised his hand to summon a crimson saber — the Dragonslayer!



The moment the Dragonslayer was summoned, intense rage qi filled the void. Due to that, the 
Darkness Domain started to tremble violently.

The Doomsday Darkness was forced to take the situation seriously. “An Ultimate Divine Weapon!”

He had seen an Ultimate Divine Weapon before. In fact, he had one himself, but it was not with him 
at the moment.

“Die!” Chu Kuangren bellowed with the Dragonslayer in hand, and the Infinity Domain expanded.

In addition to his Monarch cultivation, the explosive power he released was terrifying. One slash 
from the saber could destroy an entire galaxy.

The Doomsday Darkness dared not be careless either.

He bellowed and channeled more Darkness Daoist law energy in him. He also used the power of the 
domain to form a pitch-black palm seal that could shroud the heavens. As the palm seal slammed 
forward, it swept up a galactic storm in its wake.

The clash between the saber ray and palm seal shattered the void in the area.

Their powers affected even the void between universes.



“Bang!”

The powerful blast pushed the Doomsday Darkness several meters away. His expression looked 
bitter. It was outrageous to think he had fallen into a disadvantage with his Darkness Domain.

What kind of monstrous Monarch was he facing?

How could someone possess such power upon ascending to the Monarch Realm?

“Damn it!” The Doomsday Darkness was furious.

Even though he had one-tenth of his original strength, he should be able to defeat someone who had 
just ascended to the Monarch Realm.

Yet, to his surprise, he was slowly falling behind.

It was a humiliation to the once great Doomsday Darkness.

Doomsday would become a joke if he lost.

“Doomsday Darkness Dart, Darkness All Sky!”



The Doomsday Darkness channeled his energy to the limit.

Darkness Daoist law energies circled him like planets, and each strand released energy that far 
surpassed a common Monarch.

They were mystical, domineering, and abyssal. Such intense darkness dimmed the stars in the 
Infiniverse, and it scared even the Monarchs.

The domineering Darkness Daoist law energy transformed into a torrential tide that locked onto 
Chu Kuangren.

A sliver of the energy destroyed the walls of the void, terrorizing some of the unfortunate universes. 
“A good one!” Chu Kuangren narrowed his eyes and swung his sleeves.

Immortal Sparks shone brightly around him.

He gripped the Dragonslayer tightly and released a shocking sword intent. The three thousand 
Daoist laws were converted into Sword Daoist law.

He raised the Dragonslayer high and wielded the saber like a sword.

“Sword Twenty-five!”

The ultimate Sword Dao technique erupted, blasting dazzling sword rays at the boundless darkness.



The sharp and domineering slash was so powerful that it instilled fear in people’s hearts.

It was like the first light that tore the darkness in half.

When the ultimate attacks clashed, a galactic explosion erupted.

As if tens of thousands of planets had crashed together, the explosion released a dazzling energy 
ripple in the void.

The Great Dao was disrupted, the void shattered, and all in the Infiniverse were shaken.

Chu Kuangren and the Doomsday Darkness took the brunt of the explosion and sustained the most 
severe blast at the epicenter.

Even the Doomsday Darkness’s body started to break.

The rest of the Monarchs watching the battle winced in pain just from watching the galactic 
explosion.

It was difficult for them to continue watching.

They had to wait for the explosion to subside before they could lay eyes on it again.



“Such terrifying power!”

“This could be considered a battle between two top Monarchs.”

“Chu Kuangren is really a monster. He has just ascended to the Monarch Realm, yet he possesses 
such outrageous power. If he had more time, he would be invincible in the Great Hongmeng 
Universe.”

“He’s more than a monster.”

The Monarchs were in awe of the Doomsday Darkness’s strength, but they were shocked by Chu 
Kuangren’s outrageous powers.

No one throughout history possessed such monstrous power immediately after ascending to the 
Monarch Realm.

Chu Kuangren was making history!

After the explosion between the two ultimate attacks, the Doomsday Darkness remained standing 
with Daoist laws surrounding him.

However, his aura was messed up. Even he sustained quite the damage from the blast.



“I have underestimated you,” the Doomsday Darkness said grimly.

His body was starting to break apart after the clash.

Chu Kuangren, on the other hand, remained transcendent.

“The Doomsday Darkness is nothing at all,” Chu Kuangren said with a frosty glare. Then, he swung 
the saber for another slash.

As the slash sent the Doomsday Darkness flying away, Chu Kuangren teleported in front of him and 
stepped on his face!

Having never been humiliated so badly, the Doomsday Darkness’s face was red with indignation. 
He disregarded the body’s limit and channeled as much Darkness Daoist law energy as he could to 
force Chu Kuangren away.

“Even if I have to use up one-tenth of my power, I will make you fear the power of doomsday!”

The Doomsday Darkness roared, releasing an even more intense Darkness energy that tore a crack 
in the void.

Inside the crack were many mystical Great Daos, and one of them was the Darkness Great Dao with 
overflowing Darkness energy.



“This is…”

Chu Kuangren was alarmed yet slightly surprised.

The Doomsday Darkness was using the power from the space between Daos!

“Chu Kuangren, I shall show you the power that surpasses a Monarch!” the Doomsday Darkness 
roared.

Monarchs were categorized into a few categories — three Steps and one Ultimate.

Above Ultimate was an extremely rare realm that only less than a handful of Monarchs could reach 
— the Unlimited Great Dao Realm.

As its name suggested, it allowed the Monarch to channel his power directly from the Great Dao.

The space between Daos was where the Great Daos were, and it contained endless Great Dao 
energy.

Siphoning energy from there would allow one to use explosive and terrifying energy. With that, 
destroying universes with a finger was not impossible.

It was why the Doomsday Darkness was known as the one who brought doomsday upon the 
Infiniverse.
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