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Chapter 1261 

Feeling the breath of Yue Feng, Ren Yingying’s delicate body trembled, her whole body 
softened, and her face was extremely red. Want to struggle, but can’t bear it. 

After more than ten seconds, the two finally separated, Ren Yingying glared at Yue 
Feng angrily: “You…what are you doing?” 

When she said this, Ren Yingying was very angry, but her heart was full of sweetness . 

The moment she was kissed by Yue Feng, Ren Yingying also suddenly realized that 
she had started liking this man very early on. 

Before Yue Feng could speak, Ren Yingying whispered again: “Yue Feng, what you say 
should be counted. If you have time, go to Tianqi Continent to find me, I, I will wait for 
you…” The 

voice fell, Ren Yingying was infinitely shy and heartbroken. Crash, turn around and walk 
away. 

… 

the other side! 

On the Earth’s Circle Continent, on a barren mountain a hundred kilometers away from 
Donghai City! 

Inside the cave, Zhou Qin simply couldn’t survive or die! Yue Wuya took off her shoes 
and scratched the soles of her feet. Now her whole body is about to collapse. She kept 
giggling and begging for mercy! 

“I beg you, stop now…” 

Seeing Zhou Qin laughing with tears streaming down her face, Yue Wuya stopped and 
said with a smile, “Now I’m willing to say it. I ask you, where is the ice?” 

“Say, I said…” The 

itchiness disappeared, Zhou Qin secretly relieved, and nodded quickly: “Hanbing, the 
ice is in the forbidden secret room of my Emei sect. Shut it down!” 

When he said this, Zhou Qin lowered his head and didn’t look at Yue Wuya. Yes, Zhou 
Qin is lying, but she can’t help it. She really doesn’t know where the ice is! 



This chapter is provided by . Visit  for daily update. 

Forbidden secret room? 

Hearing this, Yue Wuya froze for a moment, frowned and asked: “What did Han Bing 
do? You want to be locked in a forbidden room? You have to tell me the truth and don’t 
hide it!” 

Finally, there is Han Bing’s whereabouts , Yue Wuya was very excited. 

Zhou Qin said: “Mother Han Bing is shameless! I have said it many times before, don’t 
you still understand it? Han Bing’s mother, who is our former head of Emei Han Ao Ran, 
secretly talked to Yue Feng seven years ago. You Ran, gave birth to cold ice, but 
concealed this matter!” 

After speaking, Zhou Qin continued bitterly: “A dignified head, to do such a shameless 
thing, as a cold and arrogant person. Daughter, we are already kind enough to lock up 
Han Bing!” 

Zhou Qin felt angry at the thought of Han Ao Ran’s relationship with Yue Feng. Seeing 
that Zhou Qin mentioned Han Bing, his tone was still mean, Yue Wuya’s face sank, and 
he reprimanded: “No matter what their mother and daughter did, you are the same as 
Emei, if you speak so meanly 

, you are not much better!” 

, Yue Wuya stopped talking nonsense, first clicked Zhou Qin’s acupuncture point, 
sealed her inner strength, then untied the rope on her body, and couldn’t wait to urge: 
“Quick, take me to the Emei secret room to find Hanbing! “ 

Thinking of Frost Bing, being trapped in the forbidden secret room, Yue Wuya couldn’t 
wait to grow a pair of wings and rushed to Emei immediately. 

“Okay, I’ll take you there…” 

Zhou Qin rubbed her sore wrist and quickly responded! 

To be honest, at this time, Zhou Qin could not wait to kill Yue Wuya. 

But there was no way, his inner strength was blocked by Yue Wuya, and apart from 
being able to walk, he had no chance to resist. 

More importantly, in this little doll’s hand, there is a hammer full of spiritual power. Even 
if his strength is restored, he is not his opponent. 
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About two hours later, Yue Wuya and Zhou Qin finally arrived at the secret room of 
Mount Emei. 

The secret room of Mount Emei is located behind Mount Emei. The entire secret room 
is made of boulders. The head of Emei in the past dynasties often practiced in this 
secret room. 

“Is Han Bing in this secret room?” Yue Wuya asked happily when he reached the door 
of the stone room. 

“Yes, she is in the secret room.” Zhou Qin started talking nonsense. 

But Yue Wuya believed it to be true and walked quickly into the secret room. This secret 
room is very deep, about a few hundred meters away, but the more Yue Wuya walks, 
the more wrong he feels. In this secret room, the decoration is very simple, except for 
the stone table and stone bench, how can there be a shadow of ice? 

Going all the way to the end of the secret room, Yue Wuya’s face showed anger and 
said to Zhou Qin, “Where is the ice?” 

Zhou Qin pointed at the stone wall, only to see a red raised switch on the stone wall. 
Zhou Qin said with a smile: “Have you seen this red switch? As long as you press it, a 
door will appear on the wall in front of you. Han Bing will be locked behind the door.” 

Hearing this, Yue Wuya was overjoyed . , walked over quickly! Pressed the red organ 
button! 

Swish! 

However, just pressing the red button, at this moment, a giant net fell from the sky, 
covering Yue Wuya with lightning speed! 

The next second, Yue Wuya only felt that his body was light, and the whole person was 
hung up by the big net! 

Nima! 

When Yue Wuya came back to his senses, the whole person was stunned. I just feel 
that the big net that covers my own, I don’t know what material it is made of, and it is full 
of toughness. 

Yue Wuya was shocked, the whole person was hung up, and in a hurry, he took out his 
dagger and tried to draw the big net, but the big net was very tough and could not be cut 
at all. 



What makes him even more angry is that the more he struggles, the tighter the big net 
is! 

“You…” 

Yue Wuya was trembling with anger, staring at Zhou Qin through the big net: “You… 
you dare to lie to me!” 

At this time, Yue Wuya could be considered to understand. Frost is not here at all. 

“Little baby.” Zhou Qin looked at him with a smile: “Although you are strong, you are 
inexperienced in the arena. If you fight with me, you are more tender.” 

Zhou Qin gritted his teeth when he said this. He was the dignified head of Emei, but was 
repeatedly humiliated by a ten-year-old child. 

Now that I have finally caught this child, I must let out a good breath later. 

Yue Wuya was so angry that he couldn’t say anything to refute it. Zhou Qin is right, he 
owns the Overlord Hammer, and the world is free to go up and down, but he is very 
inexperienced in rivers and lakes. I was deceived by this woman! 

Thinking to himself, Yue Wuya was very annoyed. 

Stab it! 

In the next second, Yue Wuya was not reconciled, holding the dagger tightly, and 
rowing towards the big net again. However, it was found that the sharp edges of the 
dagger were all thrown out, but there was no trace of the big net. 

Yue Wuya was shocked and angry, so he wanted to use the Overlord’s Hammer. 

However, his whole body was tightly entangled in the big net, and he couldn’t exert any 
strength. 

Seeing this situation, Zhou Qin smiled tenderly: “Little baby, you don’t have to waste 
your energy, let me tell you, this big net is made of ice silk and ten thousand years of 
fine iron, and it is extremely tough, and no one in the world can pull it off. Break it!” 

Said, Zhou Qin’s face became more and more smug, and his eyes showed abusive 
expressions: “Don’t worry, little baby, I won’t kill you for the time being, I will keep you 
here and let you taste it. It ‘s like being a prisoner.” 

“Let me go!” 
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Yue Wuya was furious and shouted: “I can’t be locked here, I still have important things 
to do!” 

“Important things? Looking for your sister Hanbing?” Zhou Qin seemed to be asked with 
a smile. 

Yue Wuya said anxiously: “It’s not about Hanbing! I have more important things. I want 
to attend the alchemy conference in three days, and I must not miss it! I warn you, if I 
really miss this alchemy conference, I can’t spare you!” 

Alchemy Conference? 

Zhou Qin’s smile froze on her face, and she looked at Yue Wuya in astonishment: “You 
also want to attend the alchemy conference? What are you doing at the alchemy 
conference?” 

Huh! 

Yue Wuya took a deep breath and said, “I am participating in the alchemy conference 
because I want to get the ‘Nine Ranking Linglong Pill’ to save my master! So you must 
let me go. If I miss this alchemy conference, I will work hard with you. “ 

Who is your master?” Zhou Qin asked with a smile. She has a strong interest in Yue 
Wuya’s identity. 

You must know that a ten-year-old child has a magical weapon in his hand, and his 
martial arts are superb! Then the master behind him is definitely not an ordinary person. 

“Who is my master, you don’t need to know!” Yue Wuya said coldly: “I warn you, let me 
go quickly, if you miss my business, you won’t be able to bear the consequences, I can 
tell you in person in charge, I The forces behind you can easily destroy your Emei 
faction!” 

Yue Wuya was right. 

It has been seven years since Mingjiao’s comeback. During these seven years, Mingjiao 
has developed rapidly. Although it is not comparable to the previous peak state, it is 
also one of the top sects in the Tianqi Continent. 

And Emei! 

Without Han Ao Ran and Miao Yuan Shi Tai, the overall strength would be weakened 
by half. If the Ming Sect really invaded, the Emei Sect would be wiped out if they 
couldn’t stop it for a day! 

Swish! 



Hearing Yue Wuya’s words, Zhou Qin’s expression changed! This child, who has been 
caught by himself, dares to speak madly! 

But…. this little baby dares to say such words, it proves that his background really has 
the strength to destroy Emei! 

I have just taken over the Emei faction, and the position of the head has not yet been 
firmly established. If Emei is destroyed, then the head of my own is too incompetent. 

Zhou Qin stood there, a little tangled in his heart. This is how to do? Did you let this kid 
go? But Zhou Qin was unwilling to let him go! Just now, this child, tormenting himself so 
much, can’t let him go easily! 

After more than ten seconds, Zhou Qin breathed a sigh of relief and looked at Yue 
Wuya: “Okay, I can let you go, but you have to promise me three conditions!” 

Three conditions? 

Yue Wuya frowned: “Which three conditions, tell me!” 

Zhou Qin smiled charmingly, with a sly look in his eyes: “I haven’t thought about these 
three conditions yet, don’t worry, these three conditions must be you. What I can do.” 

Yue Wuya frowned and didn’t respond. He didn’t know what the hell Zhou Qin was up 
to, but he just fell for her, so he was very alert! 

Seeing that he refused to agree, Zhou Qin said with a smile: “As long as you agree, I 
will not only help you find the ice, but at that time, at the alchemy conference, if 
someone really practices the ‘Qiqiao Linglong Dan’, I will I’ll help you get it too. How 
about it?” 

Zhou Qin had already thought about it. If you are happy for a while, provoke the little evil 
star in front of you, and bring disaster to the Emei faction, it will not be worth it. 

There is a saying that is good, if you can’t bear it, you will make a big plan! Now that I 
am the head of Emei, I have as many panaceas as I need. When I become stronger in 
the future, I will find this child to avenge the humiliation! 

call! 

Seeing the sincerity on Zhou Qin’s face, Yue Wuya took a deep breath and nodded: 
“Okay, I promise you three conditions, you quickly let me go!” 

Chapter 1264 On the 

other side, Donghai City. 



In a cafe, Liu Xuan and Shen Man were sitting there, sipping coffee. 

The weather is good today, and Liu Xuan is in a particularly good mood. In the morning, 
Liu Xuan sold the villa and returned a sum of cash, ready to buy the medicine to restore 
her appearance from Chen Qi’s hands. At this time, Liu Xuan was here, waiting for 
Chen Qi to come and trade. 

“Mom!” 

At this moment, Liu Xuan smiled at Shen Man: “I sold our villa, so don’t you get angry.” 

“My silly daughter! How could Mom be angry?” Shen Man responded with a smile: “As 
long as you can go back to the way you were before, no matter how much money we 
spend, Mom won’t feel bad!” My 

daughter is smart and capable. I made a lot of money by doing live broadcasts in the 
past! 

As long as my daughter’s face is better, I will go to the live broadcast again. Shen Man 
believes that it won’t take long for her daughter to earn back the money from selling the 
villa! 

Hearing this, Liu Xuan was very moved, hugged Shen Man’s arm and said, “Mom, don’t 
worry, when my face is healed, let’s buy a bigger house!” 

“Okay, Mom trusts you!” Shen Man was full of With a loving face, he nodded with a 
smile. 

As he was talking, a man came in the cafe, in a suit and leather shoes, it was Chen Qi. 

As soon as he came in, Chen Qi saw Liu Xuan and walked over with a smile. 

When he got to the front, Chen Qi put the medicine in his hand on the table, and smiled 
at Liu Xuan, “Miss Liu Xuan, is the money ready?” 

Liu Xuan nodded. 

Chen Qi was very excited, and quickly asked Liu Xuan to transfer money, and then 
handed over the medicine. 

Immediately afterwards, Chen Qi took out an agreement and said with a smile, “Miss Liu 
Xuan, I would like to trouble you to sign it. You also know that our drug has just applied 
for a patent and has not been mass-produced yet. What about this agreement? I just 
hope you don’t leak this drug, you know what I mean!” 

“Okay…” 



Hearing this, Liu Xuan didn’t have the slightest doubt, so she glanced at the agreement 
and signed it. 

“Haha…” 

However, just after Liu Xuan signed, there was a loud laugh at the door, and then a man 
walked in slowly. 

It was Liu Zhiyuan! 

“Liu Zhiyuan?” Seeing him, Liu Xuan was confused. 

At this time, Chen Qi greeted him and smiled at Liu Zhiyuan: “Brother Yuan, it’s done! 
Fifty million has been paid!” 

“Okay, okay!” Liu Zhiyuan nodded excitedly and took the agreement from Chen Qi with 
a smile on his face . 

“Liu Zhiyuan…you…” 

“What’s going on?” 

Seeing this scene, Liu Xuan and Shen Man both realized that it was not good, and 
looked at Liu Zhiyuan closely. 

Liu Zhiyuan was complacent and said with a big laugh, “Liu Xuan, don’t you 
understand? Chen Qi and I are partners, and the drugs we sell you are all fake! 
Understand, bitch!” 

What? 

fake? 

Hearing this, Liu Xuan’s delicate body trembled, and her complexion suddenly changed. 

“Liu Zhiyuan, you are an inhuman thing!” 

At this moment, Shen Man came back to his senses, pointed at Liu Zhiyuan’s nose and 
cursed: “You partnered with others to defraud us of money, you are still not human? 
Has your conscience been eaten by a dog? !” 

When he said this, Shen Man trembled in anger! 

“Conscience?” 



Liu Zhiyuan smiled coldly, with resentment flashing in his eyes, looked at Shen Man and 
sneered: “How dare you tell me about your conscience? Just because of your ugly 
daughter, Yue Feng used his relationship to make the entire Liu family go bankrupt, you 
Do you know, how did our Liu family survive this period of time? And what about you?” 

After speaking, Liu Zhiyuan couldn’t hide his resentment, and said fiercely: “And you 
mother and daughter still live in the villa and drive A luxury car, why?” 

“You…” 

Hearing this, Shen Man was furious: “Liu Zhiyuan, my family’s villa was earned by 
Xuan’er, and it has nothing to do with your Liu family, and , Liu family ended up like this 
today, it’s all your own fault, you can’t blame others!” 

“Haha…” 
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Liu Zhiyuan’s eyes flickered, and he couldn’t help laughing: “I’m not talking nonsense 
with you, in short, Liu Xuan is the reason why the Liu family is in ruins! Therefore, it is 
your retribution that I get your money to buy a house. , this is God’s will!” 

“Liu Zhiyuan!” 

At this moment, Liu Xuan finally couldn’t bear it anymore, her delicate body trembled, 
and said coldly to Liu Zhiyuan: “You lied to me for money, aren’t you afraid of going to 
jail? 

” At this point, Liu Zhiyuan showed a bit of pride on his face, and said leisurely: “I lied to 
you for money? You gave it to me voluntarily. The last few paragraphs of this 
agreement are clearly written, and you just signed it. !” 

Said, Liu Zhiyuan raised the agreement in Yang’s hand with a sinister expression. 

What? 

Liu Xuan’s body trembled, her body was weak and weak, and she slumped on the chair, 
unable to speak. 

At this time, Liu Xuan felt very regretful. 

I was only concerned about getting the medicine as soon as possible, why didn’t I think 
about taking a good look at the agreement? 

It really answered that sentence, and went to the doctor in a hurry! 



At the same time, Shen Man was also dumbfounded. The situation in front of him is very 
obvious. Liu Xuan signed the agreement just now. The 50 million yuan belongs to Liu 
Zhiyuan. Even if he is sued, it will be irreversible! 

How could this be? 

At this moment, Liu Zhiyuan’s face was gloomy and he looked at Liu Xuan with a smile: 
“Liu Xuan, from now on, the kindness between you and the Liu family is truly written off, 
if you are not convinced, you can sue me, but I advise You should give up, if I guess 
right, you don’t even have the money to hire a lawyer now, haha…” 

After saying this, Liu Zhiyuan left with a big smile. 

“you….” 

Liu Xuan was so angry that she almost fainted and sat down on the chair. 

“Liu Zhiyuan, you bastard, you won’t end well!” Shen Man trembled angrily, tears 
streaming down his face. 

The house is gone, the money is gone. 

How about the days to come. 

“Mom! Don’t be angry, it’s all my fault. It’s too easy to trust people.” Liu Xuan bit her lip 
tightly and said very guilty. 

Shen Man sighed, shook his head with a wry smile, and said, “How could Mom blame 
you? I was just thinking, what should we do in the future for our mother and daughter.” 

Phew! 

Liu Xuan took a deep breath, looked at the familiar street outside, and said softly, 
“Leave the East China Sea, find a new place, and start over.” 

When she said this, Liu Xuan’s expression did not fluctuate at all. 

Since Yue Feng’s ‘seven-year appointment’ didn’t come, Liu Xuan has been 
disheartened! 

Now the money to buy a villa has not been cheated, and it is almost nothing. For 
Donghai City, Liu Xuan no longer has any nostalgia for it. 

At this time, Liu Xuan just wanted to leave this place that made her heartbroken. 

….. 



On the other side, Zhongzhou City! Tianzhong Square! 

Tianzhong Square, the largest square in Zhongzhou, is located in the center of 
Zhongzhou. 

Tianzhong Square is nearly 100,000 square meters, which is more than ten times larger 
than the Haiwang Square in Donghai City. 

The weather is very good today, the sun is shining, and there are huge crowds around 
Tianzhong Square. 

good! 

The Alchemy Conference organized by the Alchemy Association was held in Tianzhong 
Square. This time the alchemy conference, the alchemy masters of the entire Earth 
Continent, will come to participate, the scale is unprecedented! 

Not only did all the sects in the rivers and lakes come to watch the game, even families 
from all over the world, as well as ordinary people, came to watch the fun! Really 
crowded! It can be said that this alchemy conference has caused a sensation in the 
entire Earth Continent! 

At this time, in the center of Tianzhong Square, a huge alchemy arena was built early! 
Around the ring, the flags of various sects fluttered. 

I saw that Shaolin, Wudang, and Xiaoyao all came here. 

At this moment, I only saw a dozen women walking slowly outside the square. These 
women, all in white long dresses, give people the feeling that they are indescribably 
beautiful and refined! 

It is the disciple of the Emei School! 

The leader is the new head of Emei, Zhou Qin! 

Avoid other websites because I am the only one who worked hard. I'm providing the 
translated version of the novel: When His Eyes Open. If You guys interested to read this 
novel then follow this website '' . Also Please bookmark this page to get next update or 
join Telegram to touch with me. Thank you 

 
. 

 


