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While speaking, Empress Hua Zhao frowned and looked at Xuan Kun in midair, unable 
to hide her shock. 

Isn’t Xuan Kun a very docile personality? How did it suddenly become so violent? 

“Return to Empress!” 

Hearing the question, the divine general in charge of the Spirit Beast Garden hurried 
over and responded with a sweaty face, “This Xuan Kun has encountered a bottleneck 
in his cultivation, so he will suddenly become violent.” 

Phew! 

After hearing the answer, Madam Hua Zhao locked her up tightly, and then turned back 
to look at the priests: “Dear family, what do you think about the situation in front of you?” 
The 

voice fell, the priests, look at me, I look at you, a Time does not know how to answer. 

Xuan Kun is violent. This situation has not happened once in thousands of years. Who 
knows what to do? 

“Trash!” 

Seeing this situation, Prince Aotian, who was standing by the side, couldn’t help but 
scolded coldly: “What a bunch of trash, can’t they think of a way? I really don’t know 
what to do with you idiots. Use it.” 

When he said this, Aotian’s face was full of arrogance. 

In his heart, even if he can compete for the position of the emperor in a hundred days, 
but he has the backing behind the scenes, the position of the emperor is none other 
than himself. 

Huh… 

Hearing these words, all the priests bowed their heads in shame, daring to be angry and 
not dare to speak. 

Yue Feng looked at Prince Aotian, frowning secretly, Prince Aotian’s virtue, how could 
he be qualified to be the emperor of heaven, no wonder the Pipa Fairy who pursues no 
desire and no desire can’t help but take care of God’s Domain. 
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At this time, Empress Hua Zhao lost her patience and frowned, “Is there nothing I can 
do?” 

“Niangniang!” The voice 

fell, and a middle-aged man who had been standing beside Ao Tian walked out slowly 
and respectfully said: “Wei Chen has a solution.” 

The master Zhao Niangniang found for Prince Aotian, Immortal Venerable Taiyi. 

“Xianzun, tell me quickly!” Empress Hua Zhao looked overjoyed. 

Immortal Venerable Taiyi pointed to Xuankun in midair: “As far as I know, this Xuankun 
followed the ancestors to defeat the demons, and then was tamed by the emperor. In 
other words, only those who have the fate of the emperor can help it. Get over the 
difficulties.” 

“The minister observed just now that Xuan Kun’s violent aura is mostly concentrated on 
the top of his head. As long as someone with the fate of the Emperor of Heaven can 
cast the ‘Holy Emperor’s Awakening Technique’ and inject it into the top of Xuan Kun’s 
head, Drain that violent aura, Xuan Kun will return to calm.” After 

speaking, Immortal Tai Yi talked eloquently, and looked at Prince Aotian from time to 
time. 

Whoa! 

Hearing this, there was an uproar around, and many priests couldn’t help but whisper. 

“Xianzun’s words make sense.” 

“Yes, but who has the destiny of the Emperor of Heaven?” 

“Yes…” The 

surrounding discussions came, and Yue Feng, who was standing not far away , but 
secretly sneered. 

This Taiyi Immortal Venerable really knows nonsense, and he wants to recognize the 
proud emperor as the emperor of heaven. 

But I have to say, this scheming is really admirable. 

“This…” 



At this time, Empress Hua Zhao frowned and seemed a little puzzled, and asked 
Immortal Venerable Taiyi: “According to Immortal Venerable’s meaning, who is the right 
candidate?” 

Immortal Venerable Taiyi smiled slightly, looked at Prince Aotian and said: “His Royal 
Highness has a full heaven, eyes like stars, and the appearance of a heavenly emperor. 
Naturally, he is the most suitable candidate.” After 

speaking, Immortal Taiyi looked around: “Could it be? Apart from Prince Aotian, is there 
any other candidate?” 

When he said this, Immortal Taiyi’s face was serious, but he couldn’t hide the flattery 
and flattery in his eyes. 

To be honest, only those who have the fate of the Emperor of Heaven can help 
Xuankun out of the siege. It is completely made up by him. You must know that he is 
the master of Prince Aotian. Under such circumstances, he would naturally try his best 
to create public opinion favorable to Prince Aotian. 

The voice fell, and many priests around him quickly nodded in agreement. 

“Xianzun said it well.” 

“Only Prince Aotian has this qualification.” 

Haha…. 

Seeing this situation, Aotian felt extremely comfortable, but he was still a little nervous. 
After all, he was very powerful. The Xuan Kun. 

Under tension, Prince Aotian whispered to Immortal Venerable Taiyi and asked, 
“Master, is the method you said really feasible?” 
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Haha…. Xianzun 

Taiyi smiled, with a confident look, and comforted Prince Aotian: “Your Highness, rest 
assured, you are the fate of the Emperor of Heaven, this Xuan Kun will definitely be 
obedient when he sees you. Tame it.” 

“Furthermore, I have observed it three times for the teacher just now, and it is definitely 
not wrong. Most of the violent energy in this Xuankun gathers on the top of his head. 
Get rid of the madness, and you’ll be done!” The 

voice fell, and many priests around began to compliment. 



“Xianzun is really smart, he found Xuan Kun’s weakness so quickly…” “As 

expected of a future emperor, I admire it.” 

“Xianzun is amazing, haha…” The 

surrounding people When the compliment came, Immortal Tai Yi greened his beard and 
looked proud. 

call! 

At this moment, Prince Aotian also exhaled, completely relieved, and a smile appeared 
on his face. 

Haha…. 

Today Xuan Kun suddenly became furious, which is a difficult matter for others, but for 
himself, it is a great thing to ‘rectify his name’. As long as Xuan Kun is tamed today, he 
is the destined future emperor. Then, what qualifications does Aolin have to fight with 
me? 

Thinking to himself, Prince Aotian glanced at Prince Aolin not far away, his eyes full of 
provocation. 

Feeling Prince Aotian’s eyes, Prince Aolin was very calm. 

Yue Feng also smiled without saying a word. 

However, Princess Xiya couldn’t be more angry, she took Prince Aolin’s arm and said, 
“It’s just to tame Xuan Kun, what’s so great, big brother has this ability, big brother you 
are not bad. Apocalypse?” 

“Sister, don’t talk!” 

Prince Aolin smiled bitterly and shook his head: “Xuankun is very powerful, even if the 
emperor is here, he is not sure, let alone me. 

” Prince Lin couldn’t help being curious, and asked Yue Feng: “Master, is the method 
that Immortal Taiyi said is really feasible?” When asked, Prince Aolin seemed calm, but 
he was also a little anxious. 

If it is as Taiyi Immortal Venerable said, whoever has the fate of the Emperor of Heaven 
can subdue Xuankun. If Aotian succeeds, how can he compete with him in a hundred 
days? 

“Not necessarily!” 



Yue Feng smiled lightly, looked at Xuan Kun who was furious in midair, and said 
disapprovingly: “This Xuan Kun is not a fool, how could he let you fight without moving? 
Besides, his weakness is not above his head. “ 

Yue Feng’s voice was not loud, but everyone present heard it. 

What? 

In an instant, there was an uproar in the audience, all eyes locked on Yue Feng. 

The master of this Prince Aolin is really shameless. It is said that the method Taiyi 
Immortal Venerable said is useless? 

Empress Hua Zhao also had a displeased expression on her face, this crazy immortal 
Weng Qingxu really had no rules at all. 

“Interesting!” 

At this moment, Immortal Venerable Taiyi also reacted, looking up and down at Yue 
Feng and said, “Presumably Your Excellency is the master that Fairy Pipa found for 
Prince Aolin, Fairy Qingxu. 

” The immortals from outside the sky have vast magical powers, and they are 
knowledgeable and knowledgeable. Listen to what Your Excellency said just now, my 
method will not work, do you have a method?” 

When saying this, Immortal Taiyi looked polite, but there was a bit of contempt in his 
eyes. 

What about the immortals from outside the sky, when it comes to their status in the 
realm of the gods, they are not worthy to carry their own shoes, and they dare to talk 
nonsense here. 

Swish! 

At this moment, all the eyes of the audience focused on Yue Feng. 

Prince Aolin is also full of anticipation. 

If Master really had a way, Aotian would not dare to be so arrogant today. 

Facing everyone’s gaze, Yue Feng shook his head and answered simply: “No!” 

In fact, Yue Feng had already seen the clue and found a way to deal with Xuan Kun, but 
he didn’t want to say it now. 



Ugh! 

Hearing this, Prince Aolin’s eyes were full of disappointment. 

Princess Xi Ya next to her was even more anxious, and stomped her feet: “You have no 
choice, what nonsense are you talking about?” 

Haha… 

At this time, Immortal Venerable Taiyi couldn’t help laughing, mocking Yue Feng. Said: 
“I thought Xian Weng was really powerful, but now it seems that it is nothing more than 
that.” 

Boom! 

The voice fell, and there was a burst of laughter around. 
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At this time, Prince Aotian also mocked: “If you don’t have real skills, don’t talk 
nonsense there.” After speaking 

, Prince Aotian looked around and said confidently: “Everyone, let’s see how this prince 
is. Tame Xuan Kun.” At this time, Aotian was extremely confident, in his heart, Master 
Taiyi Immortal Venerable would definitely not be wrong. 

hum! 

The last sentence fell, and Prince Aotian’s divine power exploded, heading straight for 
Xuan Kun in mid-air. 

In a blink of an eye, Prince Aotian was on top of Xuan Kun’s head, his divine power was 
running, and he condensed his right hand to shoot at the top of Xuan Kun’s head, 
intending to help Xuan Kun channel the turbulent power. 

Bang! 

In the next second, he heard a dull sound, and Prince Haotian was taken aback. He 
clearly felt that the power gathered above Xuan Kun’s head was extremely powerful and 
could not be channeled at all. 

How could this be? 

“Ow!” 



Just when Prince Aotian was secretly frightened, Xuan Kun at this time was also 
completely provoked, and let out a roar. 

This roar was earth-shattering and soul-stirring. 

In the next second, Xuan Kun’s eyes were blood-red, and he locked onto Prince Aotian 
tightly. His huge body slammed into the air, sending dozens of surrounding soldiers 
flying out. Then, the blood basin opened its mouth and spewed out a blast. A very 
strong sound wave came towards Prince Aotian. 

Huh…. 

Seeing this scene, whether it was Empress Hua Zhao, Immortal Venerable Taiyi and 
those priests, they were all taken aback, and they all sweated for Prince Aotian. 

At the same time, there are some doubts in my heart. 

Don’t you mean this is possible? It’s of no use whatsoever. 

Oops! 

Feeling the sound wave coming towards his face, and sensing the terrifying power 
contained in it, Prince Aotian’s face changed greatly, and he couldn’t help gasping for 
air. 

The next second, Prince Aotian screamed in panic: “Xuan Kun, I am Prince Aotian, the 
future Emperor of Heaven, please calm down for me!” 

However, Xuan Kun was extremely violent at this time, and he could no longer hear it 
his words. 

While exclaiming, Prince Aotian did not forget to move his figure and dodge to the side. 
You must know that this Xuan Kun, who once followed the master to deal with the 
existence of the demon race, dared to fight head-on. 

Seeing this scene, Yue Feng smiled and said nothing. 

Aotian, a fool, said a few words from Immortal Venerable Taiyi, and he believed it to be 
true. 

This… 

At this moment, Prince Aolin was also stunned, and his heart was indescribably 
complicated. 



The master guessed it right, the method of Taiyi Immortal Venerable is really not 
reliable at all. 

Princess Xiya next to her even covered her eyes. Although she was not very close to 
Prince Aotian, she was also a brother and sister after all, so she couldn’t bear to see 
Aotian die in Xuankun’s hands. 

Bang! 

In the end, Prince Aotian tried his best to dodge, but in the end he didn’t dodge. He was 
hit by a sound wave and was knocked several hundred meters away before he fell 
heavily. 

“Pfft…” At the moment of landing, Prince Aotian spat out a mouthful of blood, his face 
was pale, and he was extremely weak. He looked indescribably embarrassed, and 
completely lost the arrogance that he used to be full of confidence. 

“His Royal Highness!” 

“His Royal Highness…” 

“Quick, strengthen your manpower, and you must control Xuan Kun.” 

Seeing this scene, the priests exclaimed in surprise, ran over quickly, and helped Prince 
Aotian up with all his hands and feet. At the same time, more divine soldiers rushed up 
and formed a formation to surround Xuan Kun. 

Empress Hua Zhao’s delicate face was also worried: “Aotian, how are you?” 

Aotian shook his head, indicating that he was fine. 

call! 

Empress Hua Zhao breathed a sigh of relief, with a bit of anger in her eyes, and scolded 
the Taiyi Immortal Venerable: “Taiyi Immortal Venerable, what the hell is going on? 
Didn’t you say that this method is possible? How did Xuankun become more and more 
Furious?” 

Puff! 

Feeling Madam Hua Zhao’s anger, Immortal Venerable Taiyi was full of panic, knelt 
down and said in a panic, “The maiden calms down, it’s because the minister was 
careless, I really didn’t expect that Xuankun’s situation would be more serious than I 
imagined. , I beg your goddess to be kind.” 



At this time, Immortal Venerable Taiyi had a heart hanging in his throat, and he was too 
afraid. 

At the same time, I also have some doubts in my heart. The method I just did is 
obviously fine, why can’t it work? 
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“Forget it!” 

Empress Hua Zhao waved her hand: “In the future, don’t be so arbitrary.” Anyway, 
Aotian was fine, so he didn’t care anymore. 

“Thank you madam, thank you madam.” Immortal Taiyi wiped the cold sweat off his 
forehead and quickly thanked him. 

“Ow!” 

At this moment, Xuan Kun in mid-air roared again, and murderous aura filled his body. 
Then, a terrifying sound wave burst out again, heading straight for the surrounding 
divine soldiers. 

“Ah…” 

At that time, many divine soldiers were too late to react, and were instantly hit by the 
sound waves, screamed and fell from the air. This time, thousands of divine soldiers lost 
their combat effectiveness. 

The rest of the divine soldiers were completely panicked at this time. 

Oops! 

Seeing this, Empress Hua Zhao’s delicate face was full of anxiety and worry. 

Xuan Kun has become more violent, and the situation is getting more and more serious. 
What should I do? 

“Taiyi Immortal Venerable!” 

Anxious, Empress Hua Zhao looked at Immortal Venerable Taiyi: “What do you think 
about this situation now?” Although Immortal Venerable Taiyi made a mistake just now, 
causing Prince Aotian to be injured, But in any case, among the Qing families present, 
he is the most capable, and at critical moments, he still needs to ask for his opinion. 

call! 



Immortal Venerable Tai Yi took a deep breath, thought about it seriously, and said 
slowly: “Miss, this Xuan Kun has been completely violent, it is impossible to let it calm 
down, the only way is to gather all the forces present to form the Xuantian Great Array, 
It is completely destroyed.” 

When he said this, Immortal Taiyi looked serious, but his eyes flashed with complexity. 

The failure of Prince Aotian’s attempt just now caused the Taiyi Immortal Venerable to 
have a shadow, and he really had no other way but to do this. 

Whoa! 

The voice fell, and the surrounding priests suddenly burst into an uproar. 

Destroy Xuan Kun? Isn’t it a pity? 

If not, is there any other way? 

Madam Hua Zhao also breathed a sigh of relief, frowned for a moment, and finally 
nodded: “Okay, according to your method, please ask the Qing family to join forces to 
form the Xuantian Great Array to get rid of this hidden danger.” 

Seriously, Madam Hua Zhao was also a little reluctant to give up. After all, this Xuankun 
followed the master to fight against the demons. Later, after being tamed by the Nine 
Heavens God, she has been staying in the Spirit Beast Garden and guarding one side. 
She is loyal to the realm of the gods. It is really unbearable that it is eliminated. 

But if you don’t do this, there is no other way. You must know that once Xuan Kun is 
completely violent and rushes out of the Spirit Beast Garden, the consequences will be 
disastrous. 

Under the agreement, the priests were ready to join forces to deploy the Xuantian Great 
Array. 

“Alas!” 

However, at this moment, a voice came from the crowd: “Xuankun, Xuankun, you are 
really pitiful. You have been loyal to the God Realm for so many years, and you have 
paid so much. Now you have encountered a bottleneck, but no one can do it. I will help 
you, and I will kill you.” 

“It’s pathetic…” 

Shaw! 

Hearing this, both Empress Hua Zhao and the priests frowned. 



Who is so daring to speak sarcastically here? 

In shock and anger, Empress Hua Zhao looked at her with an angry face, her brows 
furrowed immediately. 

The person who said it was Yue Feng. 

The next second, Empress Hua Zhao held back her anger and said coldly to Yue Feng, 
“What do you mean?” 

Yue Feng didn’t panic at all, and smiled slightly: “It’s nothing, I’m just not worth it for this 
Xuan Kun.” 

talk! 

Hearing this answer, Empress Hua Zhao’s expression changed, her body trembled with 
anger, this immortal Qingxu said so, secretly because she was no longer capable? 

“Bold!” 

At this moment, Immortal Venerable Tai Yi strode out, pointed at Yue Feng and 
scolded: “You are not too timid, what do you mean is that our God Realm has 
mishandled things and treated this Xuan Kun badly? 

” The emperor was injured, and Immortal Taiyi was very frightened in his heart. At this 
time, he took this opportunity to express himself quickly. 

Yue Feng chuckled lightly, but did not respond. 

“Xianweng Qingxu!” Yue Feng didn’t speak, Taiyi Xianzun thought he was afraid, and 
continued with a sneer: “If you have no way to solve the trouble in front of you, please 
shut up, so as not to make a mistake and laugh at you!” 

Hehe! 

Yue Feng chuckled and said slowly, “I can’t solve the troubles in front of me, but that 
doesn’t mean others can’t.” The 

voice was not loud, but he was full of confidence. 
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What? 

Hearing this, there was an uproar in the audience, and there was a lot of discussion. 



“What did he say?” 

“In the current situation, even if the late emperor was alive, he would be helpless. He 
actually said that someone could do it ? 

“ 

Instead, he looked at Immortal Venerable Taiyi and Empress Hua Zhao seriously and 
said, “I’m not joking this time. There is only one person present today who can tame this 
Xuankun.” 

“And this person is Prince Aolin.” The 

last word Falling down, the audience was silent, and countless pairs of eyes converged 
on Prince Aolin at once. 

“Haha…” 

Finally, Immortal Venerable Taiyi was the first to react, and couldn’t help but mocked: 
“It’s a joke, this Xuankun has been completely violent, and even Prince Aotian is 
helpless, his Aolin’s strength is stronger than Aotian Emperor. How can He De be able 
to subdue Xuan Kun?” The 

voice fell, and many priests around nodded in agreement. 

At the same time, Empress Hua Zhao was also very frightened and glared at Yue Feng 
coldly. This immortal Qingxu is really hateful. She even said in public that only Prince 
Aolin can solve the trouble in front of him. This is saying that he is better than his own 
son. Is Aotian strong? 

“Master!” 

Seeing that the situation was not good, Prince Aolin was also a little anxious. He 
couldn’t help but gently pulled Yue Feng and whispered: “Don’t talk nonsense, just now 
Aotian was brave, but he was so embarrassed. How could I have the ability to tame the 
Xuan Kun?” 

I don’t know how much I weigh? 

“Hey!” 

At the same time, Princess Xiya couldn’t help but said, “Old man with a white beard, are 
you trying to embarrass your brother in public?” 

Yue Feng ignored Princess Xiya’s rudeness, but smiled, arrogantly Prince Lin said: “No 
need to worry, Your Highness, as long as you do as I say, you will be successful!” As he 



spoke, Yue Feng took off the pendant on his neck, quietly stuffed it into Prince Aolin’s 
hands, and then put the way Whispered out. 

call! 

Hearing the solution, Prince Aolin was shocked, surprised and delighted, and at the 
same time he asked worriedly: “Is it really feasible?” 

Yue Feng nodded, his face was calm and calm: “You can do whatever Master said. 
Don’t believe me?” 

Yue Feng’s face was full of confidence when he said this. 

Speaking of which, Yue Feng’s solution is very simple. It is to use the fierce pendant to 
help Xuankun eliminate the violent power in his body. This pendant is the place where 
the fierce Biao rests and rests. It not only has a large space, but also has the 
characteristics of devouring. , Fierce Biao had been resting in it before, after a long 
time, a lot of evil spirits and evil spirits gathered in it, and this evil spirits and evil spirits 
just happened to restrain each other with Xuan Kun’s violent aura. 

Just now, Yue Feng carefully observed Xuan Kun’s situation, and it was just after 
realizing this that he thought of this method. 

However, as a master, Yue Feng could not go out in person, only Prince Aolin did it 
himself. In this way, Aolin tamed Xuankun, and he could also establish prestige among 
the priests and compete for the next hundred days. Lay the foundation. 

The roar of laughter continued. 

At this time, Empress Hua Zhao raised her jade hand to signal everyone to be quiet, 
then quietly looked at Ao Lin and said, “Can you really tame Xuan Kun?” 

Huh! 

Faced with the question, Ao Lin did not answer immediately, but looked at Yue Feng, 
and with the encouragement of Yue Feng’s eyes, he responded, “That’s right.” 

“Okay!” 

After hearing the answer, Madam Hua Zhao bit her lip tightly, and her delicate and 
beautiful face showed a bit of contempt and contempt: “If you really tame Xuan Kun, 
today’s business will be fine, If you can’t, you are exaggerating your words, and your 
behavior is not good, and then this palace will let you in the heavenly prison to reflect on 
it for a month!” 



At this time, Madam Hua Zhao was very unhappy, her sons have failed, this proud Tian 
said that he can do it by himself. He really doesn’t know how high the sky is. Later, he 
must give him some color to see and let him know who will be the emperor of heaven in 
the future. 

As soon as the words fell, Immortal Venerable Taiyi said: “Xuankun’s rage is no small 
matter, if Your Highness is successful, it will be deceiving the empress, and the sin is 
unforgivable. already.” 
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Call… 

Seeing this situation, Prince Aolin’s face was complicated, and he hesitated for a while 
how to respond. 

“Wait!” 

At this moment, Yue Feng took a step forward, looked at Empress Hua Zhao, and then 
at Immortal Venerable Taiyi: “It seems that Empress and Immortal Venerable don’t 
believe that Prince Aolin has this ability. ?” 

Empress Hua Zhao didn’t respond, her delicate face did not fluctuate in the slightest. 

Immortal Venerable Taiyi also sneered. 

“Haha…” 

Seeing this situation, Yue Feng chuckled and stared closely at Immortal Venerable 
Taiyi: “In this case, does Your Excellency Immortal Venerable dare to make a bet with 
me?” 

Empress Hua Zhao has a prominent identity. Noble, naturally can’t bet with him, so Yue 
Feng’s goal can only be locked on Taiyi Immortal Venerable. After all, he is the master 
of Prince Aotian. If he loses the bet, there is no light on Aotian’s face, so he will not dare 
to be so arrogant in the future. . 

bet? 

Immortal Venerable Tai Yi was stunned for a moment, and seemed surprised, and then 
said disdainfully: “How do you want to bet?” 

Yue Feng looked at him with a smile, and said word by word: “It’s very simple, if Prince 
Aolin succeeds, your Excellency Immortal Venerable will succeed in the future. When 



you see me, you must bow respectfully and call me Master, if we lose, then according to 
what the Empress said just now, Prince Aolin and I will enter the Heavenly Prison and 
be punished. How?” 

When he said this, Yue Feng There was cunning in his eyes. 

This Taiyi Immortal Venerable is too arrogant and rude, and he must be taught a lesson. 

“You…you are bold!” 
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As soon as he finished speaking, he saw Immortal Tai Yi’s face changed, his whole 
body trembled with anger, and he wanted to call him master if he lost? In this way, His 
Royal Highness Prince Aotian, didn’t he want to call him Patriarch. 

This immortal Qingxu will really take advantage. 

At the same time, Prince Aotian, who was lying not far away, was also very angry, and 
shouted weakly: “It’s too presumptuous, how can you be, let my master call you 
master?” Don’t you want to be called Shizu? 

Yue Feng didn’t even look at Prince Aotian, and said with a smile: “If you don’t dare to 
gamble, it’s fine. I thought that Immortal Venerable Taiyi was a great person. Now, it 
seems that this courage is nothing more than that. 

” , Yue Feng quietly observed the reaction of Taiyi Immortal Venerable. 

That’s right, Yue Feng was deliberately provoking Taiyi Immortal Venerable. 

“Okay!” 

Immortal Venerable Taiyi is also a well-known figure in the realm of the gods. When 
was someone mocked like this, he immediately gritted his teeth and nodded: “I bet. 

” This is what Prince Aolin can do. 

“Okay!” 

Seeing his agreement, Yue Feng nodded with a smile, and then said to Prince Aolin: 
“Your Highness, you can start, be careful!” 

After speaking, Yue Feng said in a low voice: “Don’t worry, follow the instructions. Just 
do what I say.” 

Hmm! 



Prince Aolin nodded, and then, under the attention of the surrounding, urged the figure 
to rush towards Xuan Kun. 

The moment he arrived in front of Xuan Kun, Prince Aolin took out the pendant that Yue 
Feng gave him, silently activated his divine power, opened the inner space of the 
pendant, and released the evil power inside. 

At the same time, Prince Aolin slowly approached Xuan Kun and said, “Don’t be afraid, I 
won’t hurt you, I’m here to help you.” 

Phew! 

Seeing this scene, both Immortal Venerable Taiyi and the priests were stunned. 
Because the distance was a little far, they couldn’t hear what Prince Aolin said, only that 
he was trying to talk to Xuan Kun. 

Haha…. 

Soon, Immortal Venerable Taiyi was the first to react, and couldn’t help but look at Yue 
Feng and laughed: “It’s really interesting, the way you taught Prince Aolin just now, 
wouldn’t you just ask him to persuade Xuan Kun to calm down? Well, hahaha…” 

“If Xuan Kun could understand the words, why would he be so troublesome? It’s 
ridiculous.” 

Haha… The 

voice fell, and many priests also laughed. 

In their eyes, what Prince Aolin did at this time was really naive. 

Buzzing… 

Just as they were laughing, the evil power emanating from the pendant collided with the 
violent force that erupted around Xuan Kun, causing a violent roar. 

Immediately afterwards, the sky and the earth became dark, and the aura storms 
quickly condensed, completely shrouding the figures of Prince Aolin and Xuan Kun. 

call! 

Across the storms, everyone couldn’t see the situation inside clearly, and all of them 
suddenly became complicated. 
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“Oops, it seems that Prince Aolin is going to have an accident…” 

“Hehe… Who told her to be brave, this Xuan Kun has been completely violent, how can 
it be tamed?” 

“Speaking of which, it’s all him The unreliable master did the harm, you have to bet with 
Immortal Taiyi, who is to blame?” The 

surrounding discussions kept coming, Prince Aotian and Immortal Taiyi were both 
happy and proud, and their eyes were even more contemptuous. and gloomy. 

With this little skill, how dare you show ugliness? 

Especially Prince Aotian, his heart was almost happy. 

Truth be told, Aolin died at Xuan Kun’s hands today, and he has no competitors. Isn’t 
the position of Heavenly Emperor within easy reach? 

Haha…the more I think about it, the happier I am. 

At the same time, Empress Hua Zhao also showed a smile. Looking at Yue Feng, there 
was some praise in her eyes. This immortal Qingxu, who seemed to be insane, did not 
expect that she was quite aware of the current affairs, and even took the initiative to 
take her apprentice. Advance the fire pit. 

Not bad, really good. 

However, Princess Xia, who was not far away, was biting her lip, unable to express her 
worry and anxiety! 

Brother… Has something really happened to my brother? 

no, I can not! 

The elder brother is so good, how can something happen so easily, it’s all because this 
white-bearded old man is too hateful. 

Thinking to herself, Princess Xi Ya glared at Yue Feng fiercely, and said tenderly: “It’s 
all you, you have to be brave and let my brother die. If something happens to my 
brother, I will never forgive you.” 

This silly girl . 

Yue Feng’s head was big for a while, and he whispered comfortingly: “Princess don’t 
worry, nothing will happen to Your Highness.” 



“I don’t believe in your nonsense.” Princess Xi Ya said with a face full of disbelief, “You 
will deceive people.” 

After saying that, Princess Xi Ya walked quickly to Empress Hua Zhao, her delicate and 
lovely face full of expressions. It is anxious: “Mother, send someone to save brother, it 
will be too late.” 

Xuan Kun is so powerful, how could brother Aolin be an opponent? 

At this point, only his mother can save him. 

“Xiya!” 

Empress Hua Zhao frowned, very displeased, and whispered: “This is none of your 
business, hurry up and step back.” This girl really doesn’t understand anything. 

“Queen Mother…” Princess Xiya was anxious and even pleading, but she was 
interrupted as soon as she said a word. 

“Little sister!” 

Prince Aotian took a step forward and scolded coldly: “What are you making a mess? 
I’m your own brother, you don’t help me but you go to Ao Lin? What’s the situation, you 
were there just now? Look at this, don’t you understand? It’s Ao Lin who is courting 
death himself, who can blame it?” 

When he said this, Prince Ao Tian was full of anger, it’s better not to have such a sister. 

But at this time he was too lazy to care, because when Ao Lin died, he was the 
righteous emperor of heaven. 

“No…” 

Upon hearing this, Princess Xiya was so anxious that she stomped her feet: “Even if it’s 
a bet, you can’t force Brother Aolin to die.” 

After speaking, Princess Xiya begged Empress Hua Zhao again: “Mother, my daughter 
is begging you, quickly order them to save Brother Aolin. My daughter is begging you, 
begging you…” 

Seriously, Princess Xiya’s strength is mediocre, otherwise, she would have rushed in 
long ago. 

Ugh! 



Empress Hua Zhao sighed softly, made a very embarrassed look, and said 
hypocritically: “Xiya, the queen mother doesn’t want to see anything happen to Aolin, 
but you have seen the situation just now, it was Aolin’s master who insisted Betting with 
Immortal Venerable Taiyi, he even swore that Ao Lin has the ability to tame Xuan Kun, 
since it is a bet, he has to keep his promises, the mother is also powerless about this 
matter, darling, don’t make trouble.” 

Said this . At that time, Empress Hua Zhao’s delicate face was full of helplessness, but 
her heart was incomparably happy. 

As soon as Ao Lin died, his son would have no competitors. After a hundred days, he 
would successfully succeed to the throne and become the new Emperor of Heaven. 
This is a good thing. 

Wow! 

Hearing this, Princess Xi Ya was in despair. She couldn’t help it, and burst into tears: 
“Brother Aolin, don’t die, don’t die…” 

Seeing this situation, the surrounding priests, a All of them looked complicated, and no 
one dared to come up to comfort them. 

Empress Hua Zhao and Prince Aotian have both expressed their attitude, who dares to 
ask for trouble? 

Chapter 4638 

Moreover, in this case, it is indeed the Qingxu Xianweng and the Prince Aolin who were 
successful. Now that something has happened, who can be blamed? 

Right now, within the storm. 

Buzzing…… 

The evil power that erupted from the pendant, and the violent energy around Xuan Kun, 
constantly collided and offset, bursting out with bursts of roar. 

Faced with this situation, Prince Aolin felt uneasy in his heart, and his palms were 
sweating. 

But he didn’t forget Yue Feng’s teaching, and kept saying to Xuan Kun, “Xuan Kun, I am 
Prince Aolin, I am here to help you through this disaster, you must calm down, calm 
down quickly. ……” 

“Ow…” 



Under the constant cancellation of the evil power, the violent power that erupted around 
Xuan Kun gradually weakened, and at this time, he understood Ao Lin’s words and let 
out a low roar. respond. 

The next second, Xuan Kun’s huge body slowly descended, and the blood-red eyes 
gradually returned to normal. 

Haha…. 

Seeing this situation, Prince Aolin was indescribably excited and excited. 

It was successful, it was successful. 

Master didn’t lie to himself, this method is really feasible. 

At this point, the storm is outside. 

“Alas!” 

In the silence around, Immortal Venerable Tai Yi walked out with a smile but not a 
smile, and sighed at the storm: “It seems that Prince Aolin didn’t succeed either, it’s a 
pity!” 

Saying that, Immortal Venerable Taiyi looked around and continued: “Everyone, this 
deity wants to say something fair, and this matter proves that only those who are 
destined by the Emperor of Heaven can tame Xuan Kun, although Prince Aotian didn’t It 
was a success, but because of the destiny of the Emperor of Heaven, Xuan Kun just 
hurt him. As for the fate of Prince Aolin, I don’t need to say it, everyone has seen it.” 

“So, Prince Aotian’s succession to the throne is destiny. “ 

Pfft! 

The last word fell, Taiyi Xianzun bent his legs, knelt in front of Prince Aotian in public, 
and respectfully said: “Weichen Taiyi Xianzun, I have seen Your Majesty, long live Your 
Majesty, long live.” 

When shouting these, Immortal Venerable Taiyi was full of compliments, and his heart 
was even more excited and excited. 

As soon as Ao Lin died, the 100-day competition set before was voided. Prince Ao Tian 
was the Heavenly Emperor who did his duty, and he was also a righteous teacher. 

Huh…. 



Seeing this scene, the surrounding priests, you look at me, I look at you, are all 
stunned. 

They are not stupid, they know that Immortal Taiyi is going to take advantage of the 
situation to support Aotian to ascend the throne, but when Prince Aolin had an accident, 
he was in a hurry to ascend the throne, which seemed a little inappropriate. 

Haha…. 

At this time, the Aotian prince was also a little complacent, and laughed and helped 
Taiyi Immortal Venerable: “Master, please get up, haha, I have a great contribution to 
the emperor, and you will be the emperor in the future. “ 

Thank you, Your Majesty!” Immortal Venerable Taiyi was overjoyed and quickly thanked 
him. 

Ha ha… 

Seeing this scene, Yue Feng sneered secretly. 

This Taiyi Immortal Venerable and Prince Aotian really know how to take advantage of 
the loopholes, especially this Prince Aotian, he wants to be crazy if he wants to be the 
emperor of heaven. 

It’s just a pity that I will disappoint you later. 

At this time, Immortal Venerable Taiyi looked around and said coldly to those priests: 
“What are you doing? Why don’t you hurry up and pay your respects to His Majesty?” 

Hu! 

Seeing this situation, the priests realized that the situation could not be reversed, so 
they knelt down to pay their respects. 

“This prince is not dead yet, who can recognize himself as the emperor of heaven?” 

At this moment, the voice of Prince Aolin was heard, faintly coming from not far away. 

This…. 

hearing the voice, the eyes of the audience immediately turned to the past, and in an 
instant, the entire Spirit Beast Garden was silent and deadly silent! Many priests stared 
wide-eyed, their faces full of incredulity. 

Prince Aolin…he didn’t even die! ! ! 



I saw that the storm dissipated at some point, and Prince Aolin stood there quietly, his 
face was as usual, and there was no trace of scars on his body. 

Beside him, Xuan Kun’s huge body was quietly lying there, extremely docile, completely 
lost its violent look before. 

Huh…. 

Seeing this scene, everyone was dumbfounded, and their faces were inconceivable, 
only Yue Feng smiled and looked cynical and leisurely. 

Chapter 4639 

This is impossible! 

At this time, Prince Aotian lost his smile for a moment, and was shocked and angry in 
his heart. 

How could this Ao Lin tame Xuan Kun? 

Immortal Venerable Taiyi, who was standing aside, was also stunned, only to feel his 
brain buzzing. 

How did this Prince Aolin do it? What did Xianweng Qingxu teach him? 

At the same time, Empress Hua Zhao was also frowning, her mood was relaxed and 
happy, but at this moment it disappeared without a trace, and her eyes were looking at 
Yue Feng from a distance, which was extremely complicated. 

I thought that this immortal man of Qingxu was aware of the current affairs and 
deliberately sent Prince Aolin into danger, so as to fulfill his son Aotian, but he never 
expected that Prince Aolin not only did not die, but also successfully tamed Xuanyuan. 
Kun. 

“Brother!” 

At this moment, Princess Xi Ya took the lead in reacting, ran over with joy, and hugged 
Prince Aolin’s arm all of a sudden: “That’s great, brother, I knew you would be fine, 
That’s great…” 

“Silly girl! How could my brother die so easily?” Prince Aolin showed a smile and 
touched the top of Princess Xiya’s head, his eyes full of love. 

In the next second, Prince Aolin strode up to Yue Feng, bowed deeply, and said loudly, 
“Thank you Master for your teaching, so that the disciple can successfully tame Xuan 
Kun.” 



Shuh! 

The voice fell, and the eyes of the audience instantly converged on Yue Feng. 

Under the gaze, Yue Feng looked indifferent. 

“Taiyi Immortal Venerable” 

At this time, Prince Aolin slowly moved forward, and said coldly to Taiyi Immortal 
Venerable: “Just now, before this prince came out, you took the lead to meet the so-
called New Heaven Emperor, isn’t it a bit unruly?” 

It’s not loud, but it’s majestic. 

“I…” Immortal Venerable Taiyi’s face flushed, and he was embarrassed and didn’t know 
how to respond for a while. 

At this time, Immortal Venerable Taiyi never expected that Prince Aolin would tame 
Xuan Kun so easily. 

Seeing this situation, Yue Feng said with a smile: “Xianzun Taiyi, but you said just now 
that only people with the fate of the emperor can tame Xuankun, and everyone has 
seen the result now. 

” You want to support the new emperor today, so come and meet.” 

When he said this, Yue Feng was smiling, but his eyes were slyly, Mad, isn’t this Taiyi 
Immortal Venerable very good at exploiting loopholes? Today I see how you step down. 

Huh…. 

The last word fell, and the surrounding priests couldn’t help but nodded. 

“That makes sense.” 

“Yeah, this kind of remark just now was put forward by Immortal Venerable Taiyi. Only 
the real Emperor of Heaven can tame Xuankun. According to this statement, Prince 
Aolin successfully tame Xuankun. , you are qualified to be the Emperor of Heaven.” 

“Not bad…” The 

surrounding discussions kept coming, and Immortal Venerable Taiyi almost wanted to 
cry without tears, so he could not wait to find a crack to burrow in. 



He never thought that he deliberately made up some remarks in order to take the 
opportunity to push Aotian to the top, how could he know that people are not as good as 
heaven, and finally hit him in the foot with a stone. 

At the same time, the faces of Empress Hua Zhao and Prince Aotian were also 
extremely ugly. 

Originally, the situation was favorable to his side, but who knew that it would suddenly 
reverse. 

“Xianzun!” 

Seeing the embarrassment on the face of Immortal Taiyi, Yue Feng smiled slightly and 
continued to urge: “I was in high spirits just now, why don’t you talk now? Come and see 
Your Majesty, what are you doing?” 

“I…” 

Taiyixian Zun opened his mouth and wanted to respond, but after saying a word, he 
went dumb. 

At this moment, Prince Aotian strode out, looked at Yue Feng and scolded: “Xianwen 
Qingxu, don’t be aggressive, the competition between this prince and Aolin will not start 
until a hundred days later, how can it be possible now Recommend Heavenly Emperor 
to come out?” 

“It’s really interesting!” 

Yue Feng chuckled and retorted without hesitation: “You guys have done this just now, 
but you are not allowed to do it. Is this the so-called fairness?” 

Hearing the rebuttal, proud Tian’s face changed, and he wanted to refute, but he didn’t 
know how to speak. 

“Alright, alright!” 

At this time, Empress Hua Zhao couldn’t stand it any longer, and said softly, “It is my 
great fortune that Aolin can successfully tame Xuankun. Tonight, there is a banquet in 
this palace, let’s celebrate. All right, let’s all go now.” 

Chapter 4640 

When saying this, Empress Hua Zhao didn’t even look at Yue Feng. 

Although it was surprising that Prince Aolin succeeded in taming Xuankun, it was 
absolutely impossible for everyone present to admit that he was the Emperor of 



Heaven. However, Empress Hua Zhao is very smart, and she can’t think of a few 
understatements at this time. 

Ha ha! 

How smart is Yue Feng, seeing that Empress Hua Zhao didn’t talk about the gambling 
contract, she sneered immediately. Although she was a little unhappy, she didn’t 
respond. 

Phew… 

At the same time, the surrounding priests also looked at each other in dismay, and did 
not dare to speak indiscriminately. 

“Wait!” 

But at this moment, Prince Aolin took a step forward and said to Empress Hua Zhao: 
“Niang Niang, there is one more thing, you seem to have forgotten!” 

“What is it?” Empress Hua Zhaoxiu He frowned and asked knowingly. 

Prince Aolin breathed a sigh of relief and stared at Immortal Venerable Taiyi: “Immortal 
Immortal, shouldn’t you forget about the bet you made with my master so soon? 

” You have successfully tamed Xuankun. When you meet my master in the future, you 
must respectfully salute and call you master, why? The dignified Taiyi Immortal 
Venerable is famous in the realm of the gods, so it doesn’t count for words?” 

When he said this, Prince Aolin glanced at Aotian lightly, his seemingly calm face also 
revealed a bit of determination. 

“I…” 

At this moment, Tai Yi Xianzun’s old face flushed, and he stood there speechless, 
feeling extremely tangled in his heart. 

How to do? 

I did make a bet with his master just now that as long as he successfully tamed 
Xuankun, he would call this Master Qingxu Xianweng, and when we met in the future, 
he would also respectfully salute. 

I thought that the other party was just talking big, but I never thought that this Prince 
Aolin really did it. 



However, if you call the master of the other party, if you call the other party’s master, 
where will you put your son? At the same time, Aotian 

was also angry, pointed at Ao Lin and shouted: “Ao Lin, don’t take the initiative to pick 
things up, how can my master call him master?” 

A glance at Yue Feng. 

“Haha!” 

Ao Lin didn’t get angry at all, and smiled slightly: “Aotian, it’s not me who took the 
initiative to pick things up, the bet just now is obvious to everyone, and everyone knows 
the result. If you don’t count, I will There’s no other way.” 

“You…” 

Hearing this, Aotian was furious, but he had nothing to say. 

call! 

At this time, the priests who were going to disperse were also standing there, watching 
the excitement one by one with interest. At the same time, they also secretly praised Ao 
Lin’s courage. 

You must know that Prince Aotian is backed by Empress Hua Zhao, but Prince Aolin is 
weak, and now he dares to confront Aotian head-on, this courage is really rare. 

Empress Hua Zhao stood there quietly, her beautiful expression did not fluctuate in the 
slightest, but her heart was also filled with indescribable anger. 

This Ao Lin is really bold. He even said that today’s events are over, but he still holds on 
to it, and he simply doesn’t take his mother-in-law into his eyes. 

But what the other party said was reasonable, and there was really no problem. 

“Okay!” 

At this time, Immortal Taiyi finally chose to compromise, walked to Yue Feng step by 
step, gritted his teeth and said in a low voice: “Master…” 

When he shouted these two words, Immortal Taiyi lowered his head and said in a low 
voice. Very small, very unwilling and ashamed in my heart. 

Seriously, calling Master Yue Feng, Immortal Venerable Taiyi was very resistant, but 
there was no way. Everyone present heard the bet just now. If you go back on your 
word, how can you stay in the God Realm in the future? 



Seeing his unwillingness, Yue Feng chuckled and frowned: “Aiya, what did Immortal 
Taiyi shout just now, is it because of my ear, or your voice is too low, I can’t hear a word 
clearly Ah.” 

This Taiyi Immortal Venerable is too arrogant and must be rectified. 

Mad! 

Immortal Taiyi’s face changed, and he was angry, but he still gritted his teeth and 
shouted again: “Master!” 

At the same time, Immortal Taiyi swears in his heart that when he finds an opportunity 
in the future, he must let this immortal Qingxu survive. No, you can’t beg for death. 

 


