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Tianying Sword Art is one of Lihuomen’s stunts. If Liu Ruxue’s strength was before, it 
would be impossible to hurt these elite soldiers. Amazing. 

“Ah…” 

In an instant, under the terrifying power of the sword shadow, many divine soldiers let 
out a scream, and fell to the ground one after another, passing out. 

Seeing this scene, the other elite soldiers around looked at Liu Ruxue’s eyes, unable to 
hide their shock. 

Is this woman so strong? 

Previously received the force of the Blood Sacrifice Great Array and the Zhou Tian Xing 
Dou Great Array, these elite soldiers were all severely injured. At this time, they felt Liu 
Ruxue’s strength and did not dare to rush forward for a while. 

Mad… 

At the same time, the God King Haotian was also furious. 

This woman actually knows how to use the divine power in her body. If she hadn’t been 
beaten by Gone just now, how could she be allowed to be presumptuous here? 

And Lei Xingyu, the reckless man who insisted on chasing Gone, if he was present, the 
situation would not have turned out like this. 

Bang bang bang… 

Just when the God King Haotian was extremely annoyed, Liu Ruxue broke out with a 
sword shadow again, forcing the dozen or so elite soldiers back in front of him, then 
grabbed Sun Dasheng, used his supernatural power, and sent him to Wen Chou Chou 
here. 

At the same time, Liu Ruxue did not forget to shout at Wen Chou Chou and the others: 
“Let’s go.” 

The moment the words fell, Sun Dasheng had already gently landed next to Wen Chou 
Chou. 

Huh… 
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At this moment, Sun Dasheng’s heart was extremely complicated, and he shouted at 
Liu Ruxue: “Thank you, girl. Your great kindness and great virtue, I, Sun Dasheng, will 
never forget.” 

“I still don’t know the girl’s name, where is the teacher…” To 

be honest, at the time of the crisis just now, Dasheng Sun was very desperate, and he 
was ready to die. He was able to save his life under such circumstances. Ruxue is 
naturally very grateful. 

It’s just… This woman looks very unfamiliar, and I really can’t think of any sect with such 
a powerful woman. 

“My name is Liu Ruxue.” 

Liu Ruxue bit her lip lightly and responded, “You don’t have to thank me, I just don’t 
understand what they are doing.” The voice fell, and several elite soldiers rushed up , 
Liu Ruxue did not hesitate, and went directly to meet him. 

Liu Ruxue… 

Hearing this, Wen Chou Chou and Sun Da Sheng looked at each other, and became 
even more puzzled in each other’s hearts. 

I’ve never heard of this name before. When did such a powerful existence appear in the 
world? 

However, Wen Chou Chou quickly realized that the situation at hand was so urgent that 
he had no time to worry about Liu Ruxue’s origin, and immediately shouted, “Thank you 
Miss Liu for your help.” 

After saying that, Wen Chou Chou grabbed Sun Dasheng and quickly moved towards 
Su Qingyan. Edges meet. 

Originally, there were many elite soldiers around Su Qingyan, but after Liu Ruxue 
appeared, all these elite soldiers were attracted, so Su Qingyan and the surrounding 
disciples of Xia Yinzong also had a chance to breathe. And Wen Chou Chou brought 
Sun Dasheng over to meet, and he did not encounter any obstacles. 

“Brother and sister…” 

Wen Chouchou looked serious and said to Su Qingyan, “Quickly bring the Great Sage, 
and Wuya and the others to take refuge in the secret passage.” As 



he spoke, Wen Chouchou turned to look at Liu In Ruxue’s situation, she was 
surrounded by many elite soldiers. Although she possessed divine power, the situation 
was very bad. 

Wen Chou Chou thought about it, and after covering Su Qingyan and the others to enter 
the underground secret passage, he came back to help Liu Ruxue. 

Wen Chou Chou Yi Bo Yun Tian, although she met Liu Ru Xue Ping water, but she 
saved her brother just now, and she can’t leave her alone at this time. 

“Brother Wen…” 

Su Qingyan Bingxue was smart, she guessed Wen Chou Chou’s thoughts at once, and 
immediately frowned, “You want to go back and help Liu Ru Xue?” 

Wen Chou Chou nodded with a serious look: ” This girl Liu is helping her righteously, I 
can’t leave her here alone.” 

“That’s right!” As soon as he finished speaking, Sun Dasheng nodded, with a proud 
face: “It was me who was saved by girl Liu, I can’t just leave like this. , Brother Wen, I’ll 
stay with you.” 

Hearing this, Wen Chou Chou was a little dumbfounded. 

The fiery impatience of this great holy man has never changed. He was injured so badly 
that he still wanted to fight. 
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Thinking, Wen Chou Chou said to Sun Dasheng: “Dasheng, you are so seriously 
injured, don’t follow me, or go to the secret passage with your younger brother and 
sister to take refuge…” 

Sun Dasheng was in a hurry and was about to speak, But it was planned by Su Qingyan 
on the side. 

“No…” 

Su Qingyan stomped her feet in a hurry at this time, and said resolutely, “None of you 
can stay, this Liu Ruxue, I will help her.” 

Brother Wen and the Great Sage, one by one If you are seriously injured, you will die if 
you stay. 

For a moment, Wen Chou Chou and Sun Da Sheng were stunned, and then shook their 
heads in unison. 



“No, you are the Sect Master of Xia Yin Sect, and you have to protect everyone’s lives.” 

“Yes, for this kind of thing, let me and Brother Wen go…” 

Seeing that the brothers objected, Su Qingyan was too lazy to say anything, and 
immediately raised her eyebrows. With a jade hand, he quickly sealed the acupoints of 
Wen Chou Chou and Sun Da Sheng. 

In an instant, the two of them trembled, unable to move. 

Wen Chou Chou looked at Su Qingyan with a look of astonishment, “Brother and 
sister…what are you doing?” 

“Yeah.” Sun Dasheng was also a little confused: “Why are you tapping our acupuncture 
points?” 

Feeling the surprise of the two, Su Qing Yan smiled lightly, pretending to be very calm 
and said: “Brother Wen, Dasheng, don’t be angry, I have no choice but to do this. Both 
of you were injured. Going back to help now will not turn the situation around. I can’t 
help that. Liu Ruxue.” 

“I’m the Sect Master of Xia Yin Sect, I am familiar with the environment here, don’t 
worry…” After the 

last sentence fell, Su Qingyan beckoned and ordered several Xia Yin Sect disciples to 
quickly remove Wen Chou Chou and Sun Dasheng into the forbidden area of the back 
mountain. 

Mad! 

At this time on the battlefield, seeing most of the disciples of the Xia Yin Sect fleeing 
into the forbidden area of the back mountain, the God King Haotian looked extremely 
ugly and shouted: “Trash, what a bunch of trash.” 

“Stop them for me…” 

At this time, the God King Haotian almost fainted from anger. 

Gone escaped just now, which has made him very embarrassed. If everyone in the Xia 
Yinzong successfully escaped at this time, how could he have the face to return to the 
realm of the gods? 

“Kill!” 



Hearing the order of the God King Haotian, more than a hundred elite soldiers 
continued to deal with Liu Ruxue, while the rest let out a howl and rushed towards Su 
Qingyan. 

Seeing the elite soldiers rushing up, Su Qingyan couldn’t tell how nervous she was. Her 
strength was outstanding in the entire Jiuzhou arena, but she was not the opponent of 
so many soldiers, but she still bit her lip and waved her long sword to meet her. And on. 

There was Su Qingyan blocking the elite soldiers who were chasing after him, and the 
members of the Xia Yin Sect took this opportunity to take Sun Dasheng, Yue Wuya and 
others to quickly enter the underground secret passage in the forbidden area of the 
back mountain. 

“By the way, child…” 

Just as everyone entered the secret passage, Hai Linger suddenly thought of 
something. She let out a coquettish cry and ran directly to the mountain to the north. 

When Moyan died tragically, she had entrusted her to take care of the child, and said 
that the child was on the top of the mountain, and Hai Linger remembered it in her heart 
and dared not forget it for a moment. 

Seeing this scene, Yue Wuya’s complexion changed, and he immediately shouted: 
“Linger, what are you doing?” When the voice fell, he moved his figure and quickly 
chased after him. 

When they got to the front, Yue Wuya grabbed Hai Linger with a solemn expression: 
“Linger, don’t run around, fast forward to the secret passage.” When he spoke, Yue 
Wuya’s face was pale and very weak. 

Speaking of which, Yue Wuya also wanted to help Liu Ruxue just now, but he was hit 
hard by Gone before and has yet to recover. At this moment, I just want to enter the 
secret path and quickly recover from practice, but Hai Linger would suddenly run away. 

“Brother Wuya.” 

Hai Linger’s delicate face was full of anxiety: “I’m going to find the child. Just before the 
child’s mother died, the child’s mother told me that the child is on the top of the 
mountain in the north, and I can’t ignore it.” 

Said At these times, Hai Linger almost cried. 

The child is still so young, and at this time, he is alone on the top of the mountain, and 
he doesn’t know what to do. 

Huh… 



Hearing this, Yue Wuya took a deep breath, without any hesitation at the time, nodded 
and said, “Okay, I’ll go with you.” After speaking, he and Hai Linger quickly rushed 
towards the north mountain peak. . 

“There are two over there.” 

“Kill them…” 

At this moment, several divine soldiers spotted the two Yue Wuya, shouted one after 
another, and chased after them. 
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Hearing the movement behind, Yue Wuya and Hai Linger immediately looked back, and 
they were all taken aback. 

“Oops, we’ve been discovered.” 

“Let’s hurry up, it’s important to find the child first.” As he 

spoke, Yue Wuya held Hai Ling’er’s hand tightly, urging her inner strength to speed up. 

Soon, when they reached the top of the mountain, they saw the child lying there, 
surrounded by some stones to prevent them from falling down. 

Phew… 

Seeing that the child is all right, Yue Wuya and Hai Ling’er looked at each other and 
both breathed a sigh of relief. 

Immediately, Hai Linger walked over quickly, hugged the child in her arms, and 
comforted her in a low voice: “Good, we’re here…” As she spoke, thinking of Mo Yan’s 
tragic death, Hai Linger couldn’t stop herself. shed tears. 

Whoops… 

At this time, the soldiers who were chasing behind also flew to the top of the mountain. 
At this time, seeing the child in Hai Ling’er’s arms, several divine soldiers were stunned. 

But soon, several divine soldiers reacted and pulled out their long knives, quickly 
approaching Yue Wuya and Hai Linger. 

“Child?” 

“It must be the remnant of the Xia Yin Sect. We will kill them together.” 



After deliberation, several divine soldiers shot together and slashed at Yue Wuya and 
Hai Ling’er with long knives. 

Cao Nima’s… 

Seeing that they didn’t even let the child go, Yue Wuya’s eyes were instantly red, he 
raised his hand and waved, holding the Overlord’s Hammer tightly, and then protecting 
Hai Ling’er behind him. 

“Ling’er, you go first, I will hold them back.” 

After explaining a sentence, Yue Wuya directly greeted him and fought fiercely with 
several divine soldiers. 

Where would Hai Linger take her child alone? At that time, I was so anxious: “Brother 
Wuya…you be careful…” While shouting, he hugged the child tightly. 

Dang dang dang… 

In the blink of an eye, Yue Wuya and several divine soldiers fought fiercely for several 
rounds. At the beginning, Yue Wuya relied on the power of the Overlord Hammer to 
make those divine soldiers very jealous, but gradually Some can’t stand it anymore. 

After all, he had been hit hard by Gone before and had not fully recovered at this time. 

“Hey…” 

Soon, one of the divine soldiers slashed Yue Wuya’s back with a long knife, and he 
heard Yue Wuya roar, blood sprayed out, his body staggered and took a few steps 
back, his face was even darker. Incomparably white. 

“Brother Wuya…” Hai Linger cried out in grief, tears streaming down her cheeks. At this 
time, she really wanted to rush over to fight alongside Yue Wuya, but she was a little 
hesitant when she thought about the safety of her child. 

Yue Wuya saw her intentions, clenched the overlord hammer, and said hoarsely: 
“Linger, don’t come here, go, go quickly…” 

At this time, Yue Wuya was almost in a hurry. With his current strength, he could It 
won’t take long to resist, the only thing that can be done is to hold back these magic 
soldiers and let Linger take the child away quickly. 

“No…” 

Hai Ling’er shook her head desperately and cried, “I’m not going, I want to go together, 
I’m going to die together.” 



After speaking, she was about to put the child in the circle of stones, Then come and 
help. 

Yue Wuya was anxious all of a sudden, but when he saw those stones, he suddenly 
thought of something: “Linger, do you remember the formation I taught you before? 
Hurry up, use these stones to form a formation, hurry up…” 

Although Yue Wuya did not grow up with Yue Feng, he also inherited Yue Feng’s talent 
in the formation technique. After he became the Sect Master of Tianmen, he was even 
more familiar with the military book, and also had unique accomplishments in the 
formation technique. 

In recent months, in the spare time of Xia Yinzong, Yue Wuya made some simple 
trappings with Hai Linger. Therefore, when I saw the stone at this time, I immediately 
thought of using the formation method to fight the enemy. 

After all, there are just a few magic soldiers, and it is more than enough to deal with 
them with some simple trapped formations. 

Um! 

Hearing this, Hai Linger quickly wiped away the tears from the corners of her eyes, and 
after responding, she quickly moved the stones to form a trapped formation. 

“Want to use the trapped formation to deal with us? It’s too naive.” 

At this time, when they heard the conversation between the two, several divine soldiers 
all looked contemptuous, and immediately attacked Yue Wuya again. 

Yue Wuya didn’t say a word of nonsense. 

Bang Bang Bang… 

In an instant, the sound of the collision of weapons continued to sound on the top of the 
mountain. 

….. 

On the other side, the general altar of Xia Yinzong. 

Su Qingyan returned to the battlefield, intending to help Liu Ruxue, but she was 
surrounded by many divine soldiers before she could rush to the front. 
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dang dang …. 



In less than two rounds, Su Qingyan was a little powerless. Like Wen Chou Chou and 
Sun Dasheng, her strength has not fully recovered. Facing the attacks of so many elite 
soldiers, she simply Can’t stand it. 

Seeing this scene, Liu Ruxue was so anxious that she couldn’t help but said to Su 
Qingyan, “Didn’t I let you go? Why did you come back?” As 

she spoke, she responded to the magic weapon in front of her. Su Qingyan responded, 
“Our Xia Yin Sect has always put chivalry first. You saved the Great Sage just now. As 
the Sect Master of Xia Yin Sect , 

I cannot leave you alone.” 

The famous soldier, taking advantage of Su Qingyan’s inattentiveness, quickly charged 
from behind, and the long knife was as fast as lightning, stabbing Su Qingyan’s back. 

Chi… 

This knife is very powerful, and the air is torn apart wherever it passes. 

Su Qingyan was entangled by the magic weapon in front of her, and she couldn’t dodge 
at all. She felt the danger coming from behind, and her beautiful face could not hide the 
despair. 

The strength of these divine soldiers is really too strong. Could it be that he just died like 
this? 

“Be careful.” 

Seeing the situation here, Liu Ruxue exclaimed. She didn’t have time to think about it at 
the time. She used her divine power to explode the speed to the extreme, and rushed 
directly in front of Su Qingyan. She raised her jade hand and shook the long knife away. 

After recovering his life, Su Qingyan was still in shock. It took a few seconds before she 
recovered and said gratefully to Liu Ruxue, “Thank you.” 

Alas! 

Liu Ruxue sighed and said helplessly, “You can’t help me at all by rushing over like this. 
Instead, you’ll put yourself in danger. 

“ 

While speaking, I saw all the magic soldiers in the audience quickly surrounded them. 



In the face of a powerful enemy, Liu Ruxue felt a hint of despair in her heart at this time. 
What if she had divine power? With so many magic soldiers, it is impossible to win. 

Su Qingyan was also nervous, but she didn’t regret it at all. 

Now Brother Wen and the others are safely hiding in the secret passage, there is no 
danger, even if they die, it is worth it. 

“Go away…” 

At this moment, Liu Ruxue let out a coquettish cry, clenched her long sword tightly, and 
fought the gods again. 

Su Qingyan also bit her lip tightly, with a hint of determination on her face, and stood 
shoulder to shoulder with Liu Ruxue to fight against the powerful enemy. However, the 
divine power in Liu Ruxue’s body was not her own after all. It didn’t take long for her 
speed to slow down, making her a little powerless. 

Chi la… 

It was at this time that a divine soldier slashed with a long knife and cut a wound on Liu 
Ruxue’s shoulder. In an instant, blood sprayed, Liu Ruxue’s body trembled, and she 
staggered back. 

“How are you?” 

Su Qingyan exclaimed, and quickly hugged Liu Ruxue, very worried: “Are you alright…” 

Liu Ruxue shook her head, indicating that she was fine, but delicate But there was 
bitterness on his face: “It seems that today is doomed, is this my life?” 

“In my own world, I just got out of danger, and I thought of coming to another world to 
breathe a little. How could I have imagined that when I just came out of the wolf’s den 
and entered the tiger’s mouth…” 

When Liu Ruxue sighed with emotion, Yue Feng could not help but come out of her 
mind. 

Speaking of which, all this was caused by Yue Feng. If Yue Feng had not brought her 
into the Chaos Teleportation Array, she would not have faced such a situation at this 
time. 

But for some unknown reason, at this time, Liu Ruxue couldn’t hate Yue Feng in her 
heart, instead she was a little worried about him. 

Since entering the teleportation formation, he has never seen Yue Feng again. 



I don’t know how he is. 

“Another world?” 

At this time, Su Qingyan was shocked when she heard Liu Ruxue’s muttering, and 
realized something at that time: “You…you are from another world? “ 

Liu Ruxue nodded. 

Su Qingyan was suddenly stunned, no wonder, she had never heard of it when she 
signed up. 

Wow… 

At this moment, the surrounding magic soldiers rushed up again. 

Liu Ruxue was already at the end of her strength, but she still bit her lip tightly, and 
burst out the last divine power in her body through the long sword. In an instant, a 
golden sword shadow burst out. 

This sword instantly exhausted all Liu Ruxue’s strength, but it was also very terrifying. 
Feeling the power of the golden sword shadow, the surrounding magic soldiers were all 
shocked and retreated. 
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“Let’s go!” 

Taking this opportunity, Su Qingyan grabbed Liu Ruxue’s hand tightly and quickly 
walked towards the back mountain of Xia Yinzong. 

“Want to run?” 

“Chase…” 

The gods and soldiers reacted and shouted, urging their figures to quickly chase after 
them. 

Seeing the chasing soldiers getting closer and closer, Su Qingyan was very anxious 
and at the same time extremely worried, because she could clearly sense that Liu 
Ruxue’s breath was sluggish and would faint at any time. 

How to do? 

When passing through the forbidden area, Su Qingyan really wanted to take Liu Ruxue 
into the underground secret passage, but the divine soldiers at the back were chasing 



too closely. If they did this, not only would they not escape the danger, but they would 
lead the enemy to the secret passage. At that time, Wen Chou Chou and the others are 
in danger. 

Thinking of this, Su Qingyan could only grit her teeth and continue to flee with Liu 
Ruxue. 

Phew… 

A few minutes later, Su Qingyan was exhausted and landed with Liu Ruxue, seeing the 
scene in front of her, she suddenly became desperate. 

I saw that there was a cliff in front of me, and below the cliff was an abyss. 

Speaking of which, this abyss is not far from the Xia Yin Sect. Su Qingyan knows a little 
bit about it. It is said that this abyss is unfathomable and even more dangerous inside. 
Zong sent experts to investigate several times, but no one came up alive. 

Therefore, this abyss has become a restricted area. 

Seeing the abyss in front of her at this time, Su Qingyan’s mouth evoked a hint of 
bitterness, and her eyes were full of despair. 

How did you get here? Is it really God’s will? Today is really doomed. 

wow…. 

At this moment, the gods behind them also chased after them. Seeing that Su Qingyan 
and the two were blocked by the abyss, they couldn’t help but laugh. 

“Run, why don’t you run?” 

“Haha, can’t run away now.” 

While mocking, the gods clenched their long swords and slowly approached. 

call! 

Seeing that the distance between the two sides was getting closer, Su Qingyan took a 
deep breath and planned to discuss countermeasures with Liu Ruxue, but when she 
tilted her head, she saw that Liu Ruxue’s eyes were closed and she had passed out. 

Obviously, in the process of escaping just now, Liu Ruxue did not hold on. 



Seeing that Liu Ruxue passed out, Su Qingyan calmed down instead. At that time, her 
eyes flashed with determination, and she jumped with Liu Ruxue, jumping directly into 
the abyss. 

Su Qingyan looks gentle, but her personality is extremely tough. 

Since there is no way to escape, it is better to give it a shot. Even if you die under the 
abyss, you cannot fall into the hands of these divine soldiers. 

Damn…. 

Seeing Su Qingyan jumping into the abyss, the expressions of all the gods changed, 
they rushed to the edge of the cliff and looked down, and they saw that the clouds and 
mist were so small, how could there be Su Qingyan’s two daughters? figure. 

For a time, the gods were extremely annoyed. 

“Ma De, you actually jumped off a cliff…” 

“The two of them are almost exhausted. Jumping down will definitely kill you.” 

Just as the gods were discussing, they saw Haotian God King leading other gods. , 
came over quickly. 

“Where are the people?” 

Seeing them lingering on the cliff, the God King Haotian looked gloomy and couldn’t 
help but question. 

Hearing the question, the gods and soldiers looked at each other, their faces were full of 
unease, and then one of them walked out cautiously, bowing his head and said, 
“Reporting to His Royal Highness, then… those two women jumped off the cliff just now, 
and we didn’t stop them. 

” cliff? 

At this moment, the God King Haotian was stunned for a moment, and then roared 
angrily: “Then what are you doing standing here one by one? Leave it all to me, and if 
you don’t catch anyone, don’t come back.” 

At this time, the God King Haotian, I was about to explode with anger, but two weak 
women could even let them run away. 

It simply lost the face of God’s Domain. 

“Yes…” 



Feeling the anger of the God King Haotian, the divine soldier trembled, and quickly 
nodded in response, then mobilized his divine power and jumped into the abyss. 

The other divine soldiers also jumped down one after another. 

Watching the gods jumping down into the abyss, the God King Haotian looked gloomy 
and his anger remained, and said coldly to the other gods: “For the rest, immediately 
enter the forbidden area of Xia Yinzong to search, and be sure to find the entrance to 
the secret passage. “ 

When he said this, God King Haotian clenched his fists tightly, his eyes flashing with 
terrifying murderous intent. 

“As ordered…” 
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A few minutes later, hundreds of elite soldiers returned to the forbidden area behind the 
Xia Yinzong and started a carpet search. 

… 

On the other side, the Huashan General Altar. 

Outside the main hall, Yue Feng heard the chatter and laughter inside, and was stunned 
for a long time without recovering. 

Nima, what a coincidence. As soon as I came to Huashan, I encountered someone 
pretending to be myself. 

“Hey!” 

Just as Yue Feng was muttering about this, Su Hong frowned and couldn’t hide his 
disgust: “What are you stunned for? Let me tell you, this is the Huashan Conference 
Hall, and you can’t walk around at will.” 

“You just wait here. After I tell the master, I will tell you to come in again, do you hear 
me?” The 

words were full of impatience. 

As soon as the words fell, Chen Rou also said to Yue Feng, “Don’t walk around.” The 
tone was gentle, and Su Hong’s attitude was completely the same in the sky and the 
other in the ground. 



Yue Feng didn’t take Su Hong’s contempt at all, and smiled at that time: “Thank you 
both.” 

Su Hong was too lazy to talk nonsense, and dragged Chen Rou into the hall quickly. 

Yue Feng kept his promise and did not follow up, but he couldn’t help but quietly poked 
his head and looked into the hall. I saw that musk was lit in the hall, and blue smoke 
was lingering. 

In the center of the hall, sits the current head of Huashan, Su Yanlin. 

Is it him…he is now the head of Huashan? 
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Seeing Su Yanlin, Yue Feng was stunned for a moment. You must know that when the 
ancient tomb of Lu Bu came to the world a few years ago, the head of Huashan was still 
Yang Baimei. 

However, this Su Yanlin was no stranger to Yue Feng. He had met at the ancient tomb 
of Lu Bu at that time. He was Yang Baimei’s junior brother and the law enforcement 
elder of Huashan. 

Judging from this situation, it was Yang Baimei who passed the position of head to him. 

On the VIP chair opposite Su Yanlin, sat a well-proportioned and tall figure with a 
delicate golden mask on his face and a light blue silk blouse, which was extravagant. 

This golden mask is exactly the same as the mask Yue Feng wore when he first 
founded Tianmen. It is carved with a vivid dragon… 

Nima… 

Seeing this mask, Yue Feng frowned and couldn’t help but feel dark. scolded. 

Today’s liars are really reluctant to make a copy. They even forged the golden masks of 
the year. Moreover, the craftsmanship turned out to be fake. 

In shock, Yue Feng became interested in this guy wearing a mask, and secretly sensed 
his strength, and was startled again. 

Yue Feng clearly felt that this person was not weak, but he was actually capable of 
crossing the Tribulation Realm. It’s just that this person is very smart and deliberately 
hides his breath. 



At this time, Yue Feng didn’t know that during the time he left the Kyushu Continent, 
there were many people who imitated him in various places, and this one was one of 
them. 

This person is called Liu Xudong. He was originally a disciple of Tianmen three years 
ago, but his mind was not right, and he often did some deceiving and deceiving things. 
Later, Yue Wuya found out about it, and after punishing him, he was expelled from 
Tianmen. 

After being kicked out of Tianmen, Liu Xudong felt resentment and wanted to take 
revenge on Yue Wuya and Tianmen, but Tianmen was so powerful that Liu Xudong 
never had a chance. Until recently, the Sea Dragon Palace had repeatedly fought 
against Tianmen, and finally destroyed the main altar of Tianmen, causing Tianmen’s 
morale to plummet. In addition, there are many people pretending to be Yue Feng on 
the rivers and lakes, which makes Liu Xudong know that the opportunity has come. 

Liu Xudong used to be responsible for guarding the Sect Master’s closed room, so he 
knew a lot of the internal secrets of Tianmen, and he was very familiar with Yue Feng’s 
original mask. So I found a clever craftsman and copied it on purpose. 

After imitating the golden mask, Li Xudong sneaked into a branch of Tianmen and stole 
a lot of elixir and secret manuals. After practicing for half a year, his strength greatly 
increased, and then it took more than a month to imitate Yue Feng’s voice. 

After that, Liu Xudong swindled and deceived everywhere in the rivers and lakes. At 
first, he deceived some small sects and factions. However, he could not get any benefit 
from these small sects and small factions. Liu Xudong wanted to do a big one, and 
finally targeted Huashan. 

The reason for choosing Huashan is because Huashan is remote, and even if he is 
exposed, the news will not spread to the rivers and lakes in a short time. 
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Speaking of which, when he first went to Mount Huashan, Liu Xudong was very 
nervous, but after seeing Su Yanlin, the other party didn’t see it through, which made 
Liu Xudong very excited, and his doubts disappeared without a trace, 

“Haha…” 

At this time Liu Xudong Sitting on the VIP seat, with a calm and mature attitude, he 
smiled at Su Yanlin and said, “When I went up the mountain just now, I saw the 
disciples of the noble school, all of them full of energy and talent. I believe that in the 
near future, Huashan will definitely be able to Under the leadership of Sect Leader Su, 
he has become one of the top sects in the world.” I 



have to say that Liu Xudong was very careful, his words seemed polite, but there was a 
bit of pride in his tone. 

People who don’t know it really think it’s Yue Feng’s deity. 

Uh…. 

Hearing Liu Xudong’s compliment, Su Yanlin smiled awkwardly and said very humbly: 
“Sect Master Yue Liao Zan, we Huashan are just a couple, and it is already very good to 
have a seat in the arena. Now , to be one of the best sects, I don’t even dare to think 
about it.” 

Saying that, Su Yanlin couldn’t hide the admiration and admiration on his face: “It’s Sect 
Master Yue, who founded Tianmen back then, and he was the real hero. “ 

Haha…” 

Hearing this compliment, Liu Xudong was very impressed and couldn’t help laughing, as 
if he really thought he was Yue Feng. 

At this moment, Su Yanlin thought of something and said with a smile: “Sect Master 
Yue, I, Huashan, have always been on good terms with Tianmen. Speaking of which, 
when the ancient tomb of Lv Bu appeared in the world, it was thanks to you that you 
restrained the audience and prevented Gu Gu. The treasures in the tomb were 
snatched away by other sects.” 

“So, when you come to Huashan, it’s like returning to your own home. Why don’t you 
take off the mask and feel more at ease. 

” Full of anticipation. 

Ever since I met Yue Feng at the ancient tomb of Lü Bu, I never had the chance to see 
him again. A few years later, when Yue Feng suddenly arrived, Su Yanlin was very 
excited. At this moment, he wanted to see Yue Feng’s true face again. 

Huh…. 

Seeing this, Yue Feng, who was standing outside the gate of the main hall, suddenly 
held his breath and stared at Liu Xudong. 

This guy has the guts to pretend to be me, dare to show his true colors? 

He didn’t dare, if he really had the guts, he wouldn’t imitate the golden mask. 



Yue Feng’s guess was good. Liu Xudong didn’t dare to take off the mask at all. After all, 
his appearance and Yue Feng were not even close to each other. If he took off the 
mask, wouldn’t it be exposed? 

Therefore, hearing Su Yanlin’s suggestion at this time, Liu Xudong’s heart was shocked, 
and he was a little nervous at that time. 

“Hehe…” 

But in the next second, Liu Xudong calmed down and said to Su Yanlin with a smile: “I 
still don’t take off the mask, to be honest, I just came back from the God’s Domain 
recently, in order to cultivate one of the God’s Domain. As a result, there was an 
accident and my face was injured, so I should still wear a mask.” 

So… 

Hearing this, Su Yanlin nodded and stopped insisting. 

Interesting… 

Yue Feng, who was eavesdropping on the outside at this time, smiled secretly. This kid 
is quite good at making up lies. Well, I’d like to see, how long can you pretend. 

“Master!” 

“Master, here we are.” 

At this moment, Su Hong and Chen Rou, who had already entered the hall, finally found 
a chance to speak and bowed to Su Yanlin. 

Afterwards, the two women greeted Liu Xudong again, very politely and respectfully: “I 
have seen Sect Master Yue.” Chen Rou was quiet and introverted. When greeting, she 
did not dare to look into Liu Xudong’s eyes. 

After all, this is the famous Kyushu hero. 

However, she didn’t know that the Yue Feng in front of her was fake, and the real Yue 
Feng was just outside the hall. 

Su Hong, who was next to him, had an extroverted personality. At this moment, he was 
indescribably excited. Looking at Liu Xudong wearing a golden mask in front of him, he 
was extremely excited and excited. 

You know, Yue Feng has always been her idol and hero. How can you be unhappy 
when you see a real person now? 



Um! 

At this moment, Su Yanlin was the first to react and explained to Liu Xudong with a 
smile: “Sect Master Yue, don’t mind, these are my two disciples, one is Su Hong and 
the other is Chen Rou.” 

Liu Xudong nodded and made a very The appearance of a gentleman: “The two girls 
are not only young and beautiful, but also have excellent qualifications, not bad…” 
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At this time, Liu Xudong looked at Su Hong and Chen Rou up and down through the 
golden mask while giving a false approval, and his eyes were straight. 

Beautiful, so beautiful.. I 

didn’t expect that there are such top-notch beauties in the Huashan faction. It seems 
that this trip was not in vain. 

“Sect Master Yue!” 

Just when Liu Xudong was fascinated by it, Su Yanlin said very embarrassedly, “I’m 
really sorry, my two female apprentices are fine in everything, but there are no rules, I 
will let them retire now.” 

As he said that, he looked at Su Hong and the two unhappy. 

It’s really outrageous to interrupt yourself and VIP conversations. 

“No, no…” 

As soon as he finished speaking, Liu Xudong quickly waved his hand and said with a 
smile: “Sect Leader Su also said just now that Tianmen and you Huashan have always 
been friends, they are all from their own family, and there are not so many rules. , and, I 
believe that the two of them must have something to do, so they rushed in and 
interrupted our conversation.” 

While speaking, Liu Xudong’s eyes swept over Su Hong and Chen Rou, intentionally or 
unintentionally. 

This time I came to Huashan, and it was a deception. There were two beauties on the 
side, and they looked pleasing to the eye. Naturally, Su Yanlin couldn’t let them drive 
them out. 

Huh … 



Seeing him say that, Su Yanlin nodded, and then said to Su Hong indifferently, “Tell me, 
what’s the matter with the two of you?” Seriously, Su Hong and Chen Rou belonged to 
him. My disciple, I just talked in front of Liu Xudong just now. 

“Master!” 

Hearing the question, Chen Rou bit her lip lightly and said softly, “Just now before my 
senior sister and I went up the mountain, I met a man who seemed to be injured. He 
said that he had something to talk to Master for.” 

man? 

Hearing this, Su Yanlin and Liu Xudong looked at each other, both stunned. 

At this moment, Su Hong curled her lips, and said very boringly: “That person, he is dirty 
and looks like a nobody, I didn’t want to pay attention to it at the time, but my younger 
brother and sister were very kind at that time, and he insisted on bringing them with him. 
So we had to bring people up. We are waiting outside the main hall at this time.” 

When she said this, Su Hong’s delicate face could not hide her disgust. 

That’s it… 

After learning about the situation, Su Yanlin pondered and waved his hand: “Okay, let 
him come in.” 

After speaking, Su Yanlin smiled apologetically at Liu Xudong: “Sect Master Yue, it 
happened suddenly, you don’t Mind.” 

Liu Xudong smiled and said nothing. 

After receiving the order, Su Hong walked out of the hall quickly, and said angrily to Yue 
Feng: “My master let you in, but I can warn you that there are big people today, you 
better be honest, otherwise, I will kick you. Kick down 

the mountain.” When she spoke, Su Hong couldn’t hide the contempt and disgust on 
her face. 

“Understood.” Yue Feng smiled harmlessly. 

Su Hong snorted coldly, stopped talking nonsense, turned and walked into the hall, Yue 
Feng slowly followed. 

Swish! 



The moment they entered the hall, the eyes of Su Yanlin and Liu Xudong converged on 
Yue Feng, and they frowned secretly. 

This man was in a state of embarrassment, but he looked familiar. 

Speaking of which, Su Yanlin had met Yue Feng at the ancient tomb of Lü Bu a few 
years ago, and Liu Xudong was a disciple of Tianmen before, so he was no stranger to 
Yue Feng, but Yue Feng had experienced so many things in the past few days, and his 
clothes were dirty. With a disheveled face and unshaven beard, such an image, not to 
mention Su Yanlin and Liu Xudong, even Wen Chou Chou and Sun Dasheng were 
present, and could not recognize him for a while. 

Huh … 

After a few seconds, Su Yanlin was the first to react. He looked at Yue Feng up and 
down and asked, “Who is your Excellency? I just heard from my two disciples, do you 
have something to ask me? 

” Su Yanlin’s face was very unhappy. 

The heroes of Kyushu are here today. Su Yanlin was thinking about how to treat him 
well, but was interrupted by a stranger. Naturally, his mood was not much better. 

Yue Feng showed a smile, first glanced at Liu Xudong in the VIP seat, and slowly 
replied: “Xiafengtao, a disciple of Danzong in Dongao Mainland, was injured in pursuit 
of a Jiangyang robber a few days ago, passing by the noble faction, I just want Sect 
Leader Su to give some help.” 
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Seriously, at this time Yue Feng really wanted to show his identity, but he looked like a 
beggar, and he didn’t have the slightest strength. After saying it, Su Yanlin in front of 
him would not believe it at all. 

More importantly, there was a fake ‘Yue Feng’ sitting on the VIP seat. 

Therefore, Yue Feng had an idea just now and said that he was a member of Danzong. 
After all, Zheng Chunqiu, the suzerain of Danzong, and Yue Feng were brothers. More 
importantly, Danzong was far away from Mount Hua, so it was impossible for Su Yanlin 
to send someone to Danzong for verification. 

A disciple of Danzong? 

At this moment, when he heard Yue Feng’s self-introduction, Su Yanlin’s expression 
was taken aback. He looked at Yue Feng with less disgust than before. You must know 



that Danzong and Tianmen have fought side by side over the years and have made a 
lot of contributions to Kyushu. 

At the same time, Su Hong and Chen Rou, who were standing aside, were also 
stunned. 

The next second, Su Hong said with a mean face: “It turned out to be a person from 
Danzong. If you don’t say it, I thought it was a beggar wandering around in the rivers 
and lakes.” 

Phew… 

Hearing this, Yue Feng frowned . , I was a little unhappy. 

This Su Hong is a beautiful person, but it’s a pity that she acts too cool and thin, and 
she has never experienced strong winds and waves at first glance. 

Thinking like this, Yue Feng didn’t bother to care about it. 

“Senior sister!” However, at this time, Chen Rou couldn’t help but said to Su Hong: 
“Don’t say that, Danzong has done a lot for Kyushu over the years, and the entire 
Danzong is worthy of admiration. 

” I said, it became like this because the thief was injured in chasing a Jiang Yang 
robber, so don’t judge people by their appearance.” 

She was kind-hearted, and when she saw her sister’s attitude towards Yue Feng, she 
couldn’t help it. 

Su Hong snorted coldly, and curled her lips: “Of course I know, it’s still up to you to say 
that?” She said so, but looking at Yue Feng’s expression, she was still aloof. 

“Brother Feng!” 

At this moment, Su Yanlin smiled and said to Yue Feng, “Your Danzong Sect Master 
Zheng Chunqiu is also a great hero, and I have always admired it.” 

After speaking, what Su Yanlin thought of, Pointing at Liu Xudong next to him, he said 
with a smile: “By the way, this is the famous Sect Master Yue Fengyue. I remember 
your Sect Master Zheng, and Sect Master Yue is also a tacit acquaintance. You can 
meet me. 

” . 

Hearing this, Yue Feng was stunned for a moment, and he felt like crying without tears 
in his heart. 



What kind of thing is this Nima, making me salute a fake ‘self’? 

However, Yue Feng couldn’t help the situation in front of him. At that time, he could only 
bow his hands to Liu Xudong, and said politely, “Dan Zong disciple, I have seen Yue 
Zongzhu.” 

However, Liu Xudong didn’t take him seriously at all. A hum. A mere disciple of 
Danzong, he didn’t care about it at all, and at this time, he only thought about how to 
obtain greater benefits in Huashan. 

However, he didn’t know that the person in front of him was the Yue Feng he pretended 
to be. 

Seeing that Yue Feng finished the ceremony, Su Yanlin asked with a smile: “Brother 
Feng, if you need anything, just say it.” 

Hu… 

Yue Feng took a deep breath, thought about it, and said, “Thank you for your 
generosity, Sect Leader Su, I have nothing to ask for, but Sect Leader Su can give me 
some spirit beast inner pills, so that I can regain some strength, so that I can return to 
the pill sect as soon as possible.” 

When he said this, Yue Feng’s face was full of sincerity. 

Yue Feng knew very well in his heart that he said that he was a disciple of the alchemy 
sect, and it was obviously inappropriate to ask Su Yanlin for a panacea. 

As long as he can absorb the power of some spirit beasts’ inner alchemy and restore 
some strength, he can return to Xia Yinzong as soon as possible. Of course, at that 
time, he can also find an opportunity to uncover the mask of the person sitting in the VIP 
seat. 

Um! 

Hearing this request, Su Yanlin did not hesitate at all, and said to Su Hong, “Su Hong, 
take this Brother Feng to the medicine store to get some spirit beast inner pills.” 

However, as soon as the words fell, Su Hong pouted, her face full of expression. 
Reluctantly, he said, “Master, I don’t want to go, I want to stay in this hall.” As he spoke, 
he looked at Liu Xudong with admiration. 

In Su Hong’s heart, the person she admires most is Yue Feng. She has dreamed 
countless times that she will be able to meet Yue Feng up close one day. 
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And today, Yue Feng really came to Huashan. In this case, she just wanted to stay in 
the hall and cherish the opportunity to see Yue Feng. 

Seeing her disobeying her teacher’s orders, Su Yanlin’s face sank, about to have a 
seizure. 

This Su Hong is really getting more and more outrageous. 

“Master, let me go…” 

But at this moment, Chen Rou walked over quickly and shouted, and then said softly to 
Yue Feng: “Senior sister may have other things, I’ll take you to the medicine store. .” 

She knew that Senior Sister admires Yue Feng the most, and at this moment ‘Yue 
Feng’ is here, so naturally she will not leave easily. 

Um! 

In the face of this situation, Yue Feng didn’t appreciate it, nodded immediately, and 
prepared to leave the hall with Chen Rou. 

Just after walking a few steps, Yue Feng turned his head and changed his mind again. 
This guy who pretended to be himself came to Huashan, and he must have a plan. It is 
better to stay and see the situation. 

“Oops…” 

After making up his mind, Yue Feng pretended to be in pain, yelled, and sat on the chair 
next to him while covering his stomach. 

“What’s wrong with you?” Chen Rou was startled and asked quickly. 

At the same time, Su Yanlin also stood up quickly, with concern in his eyes: “What 
happened to Brother Feng?” 

However, Liu Xudong and Su Hong were both indifferent. 

“It’s okay!” 

Yue Feng squeezed out a smile and waved his hand: “It may be that the injury has been 
affected just now. It’s okay, Sect Leader Su, can I rest in this hall for a while before 
going to get the spirit beast inner pill?” 

Yes, Yue Feng deliberately pretended to be like this, and found a reason to stay in the 
hall temporarily, so that he could also investigate this fake guy and the purpose of 
coming to Huashan. 



Hearing that he was fine, Su Yanlin breathed a sigh of relief and nodded, “Of course 
you can.” 

But Su Hong, who was standing beside him, was full of contempt: “There are so many 
things…” 

Feeling Su Hong’s attitude, Yue Feng He smiled secretly, ignoring it. 

At this time, Chen Rou kindly brought a cup of hot tea, Yue Feng thanked him, took a 
sip of tea, and pretended to rest. 

After confirming that Yue Feng was fine, Su Yanlin smiled at Liu Xudong and continued 
the previous topic. 

After chatting for a while, Su Yanlin couldn’t help but said, “Sect Master Yue, take the 
liberty to ask, this time you are here, but what are the 

important things to discuss?” Su Yanlin knew that Yue Feng was very busy, and it was 
impossible to come if there was no important matter. Huashan. 

Ugh! 

Hearing the question, Liu Xudong sighed and said in a very painful tone: “Sect Leader 
Su, you must have already known about the recent battle between my Heavenly Sect 
and the Sea Dragon Palace 

.” For half a year, the Hailong Palace has been fighting with Tianmen, and even the 
main altar of Tianmen has been destroyed. Who doesn’t know about this? 

Moreover, as early as half a month ago, Huashan also sent elite disciples to support 
Tianmen. 

Um? 

Hearing the conversation between the two, Yue Feng, who was sitting on the chair 
below and pretending to rest, was shocked. 

Tianmen and Hailong Palace are fighting? 

What kind of sect is the Sea Dragon Palace? A recently rising power? 

Just when Yue Feng was puzzled, Liu Xudong continued: “The Sea Dragon Palace is 
very strong, and I have fought several times, and my Tianmen has been killed and 
injured countless times, especially the leader of the Sea Dragon Palace, whose strength 
is even more unfathomable, so this time I went before me. I’m here because I want to 
ask Sect Leader Su for help.” 



“Sect Master Yue invites me to go up and down Mount Hua. Naturally, it’s my 
responsibility.” Su Yanlin nodded and replied seriously, “I’ll be anxious for all the 
disciples later… “ 

Su Yanlin was very excited at this time, to have ‘Yue Feng’ personally come to invite 
help, which simply gave Huashan enough face, and he naturally wanted to help. 

At this time, Su Yanlin didn’t know that the Sea Dragon Palace had been destroyed in 
the Qin Tianjian a few days ago. 

“Not busy, not busy…” 

Seeing Su Yanlin’s resolute statement, Liu Xudong quickly stood up, waved his hand 
and said, “Sect Leader Su, I don’t want you to come out of Huashan, I just want to 
borrow your blood wing armor. I’m not afraid of your jokes. , I have fought against the 
leader of the Sea Dragon Palace before, and I have never been able to defeat him. 
That’s why I want to use the blood wing armor.” 

When he said this, Liu Xudong’s tone was sincere, but his eyes flashed with cunning. 

Yes, the ultimate purpose of his visit to Huashan this time is to get the treasure of the 
Huashan faction, the blood wing armor. 

 


