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Yue Feng didn’t care about these ridicules either. 

He shrugged and picked up a clay pot. There are many bottles and jars in this cave, I 
don’t know who left them. 

After a brief cleaning, Yue Feng looked around: “Qin Shousheng, Liu Zhiyuan, Hao Jian, 
take off your clothes.” 

“What are you doing? Are you sick?” Hao Jian said angrily. 

“Alchemy. We need a fire. It’s raining outside, and the branches are wet. You can only 
use your clothes.” Yue Feng said lightly. 

“Why use ours? You can’t take off your own clothes?” Qin Shousheng jumped out: “How 
cold is it today, we won’t catch a cold?” 

“I don’t want to take it off.” Yue Feng waved his hand: “You guys Your clothes are more 
important than your sister-in-law Li Nan’s life.” 

You! 

Hao Jian was very angry. What is this kid looking for? Okay, aren’t you pretending to be 
alchemy? I take off, I take off! Li Nan hasn’t woken up for a while, let’s see how you 
end! 

Several people looked at each other and could only take off their clothes. 

Their appearance made everyone laugh. 

Soon, a fire was lit. The clay pot was placed on the fire and began to refine the 
medicine pill. 

Every step, Yue Feng is methodical and serious. 

However, Liu Zhiyuan and Hao Jian looked very funny. 

Is this the beginning of alchemy? 
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This kid is pretending to be mysterious, can it be more fake? 

“Yue Feng, you can make pills like this?” Hao Jian clutched his stomach, and his tears 
were about to burst into laughter: “Don’t bluff people here, ancient people made pills, 
but there were special pill-making furnaces. You are just a broken pot, not to mention 
whether you can make it out, it’s too shabby.” 

Yes, this Yue Feng is too funny, a broken pot can make a medicinal pill? 

Fooled them for three-year-olds? 

“Who told you that this pot can’t be used for alchemy?” 

Yue Feng said lightly. 

In real alchemy, the important thing is not what utensils are used, but the precise 
proportion of each material and the control of the heat. 

The proportion of materials, as long as everyone is careful. 

But controlling the heat is the hardest thing to master. 

If the temperature is too high, the medicine pill will be destroyed; if the temperature is 
too low, the medicine pill will not be formed. Therefore, this problem has always been 
the most troublesome for ancient alchemists. 

But for Yue Feng, it was not a big problem. 

After becoming a cultivator, Yue Feng can use the infuriating energy in his body to 
control the heat, completely grasping every detail accurately. 

Therefore, for Yue Feng, as long as it is a container that can withstand burning, it can 
be used for alchemy. 

Of course, none of the people present knew about these circumstances. 

At this time, they all thought that Yue Feng was pretending. 

“I’m quite confident.” At this time, Hao Jian smiled coldly and turned his eyes to Xiao 
Yuruo: “The Xiao family is an antique family, Miss Xiao should know something about 
this, let’s listen to what the professionals say, Xiao Miss, tell me, according to the 
records of ancient literature, can something like this be refined into a medicinal pill?” 

While asking these questions, Hao Jian glanced at Yue Feng proudly. 

Do you still want to keep pretending? Immediately you will be revealed. 



Sure enough, everyone’s eyes were focused on Xiao Yuruo. 

That’s right, why didn’t you think of Miss Xiao’s family? She was the one with the most 
say among all the people present. 

Xiao Yuruo bit her lip. 

In fact, when Yue Feng started to concoct pills just now, Xiao Yuruo was carefully 
observing and pondering in secret. Xiao Yuruo had learned about ancient alchemy from 
ancient books. 

The ancients were very superstitious and always wanted to refine the elixir of 
immortality. So there is an alchemist. 

However, the vast majority of alchemists are all crooks. Even if someone really knows 
how to make alchemy, they are not as casual as Yue Feng. 

Xiao Yuruo still said softly, “As far as I know, the utensils used by ancient alchemists 
include elixir furnace, elixir cauldron, water sea, pomegranate jar, This is the first time 
I’ve heard of Gan Wazi, Huachi, etc., using clay pots to make alchemy.” 

Wow! 

The voice fell, and everyone present broke out into a heated discussion. 

Listen, the eldest lady of the Xiao family said so. 

This kid is not fooling around, what is he doing? 

Under the discussion, many people looked at Sun Dasheng subconsciously. 
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However, Dasheng Sun, as if he didn’t hear what everyone said, quietly stayed by his 
wife’s side, without the slightest emotion on his face. 

Seeing that everyone was laughing at Yue Feng, Xiao Yuruo became anxious: “I’m a 
loner, and I can’t say enough. It’s not ruled out that someone can use a clay pot to 
make alchemy. 

” Having said these words, it will attract ridicule to Yue Feng! 

“Haha, Miss Xiao, you don’t have to cover up for Yue Feng.” 

“Yeah, during the day, this son-in-law saved you from the shark’s mouth, you don’t have 
to be grateful to him. He just pretended to be!” 



Liu Zhiyuan laughed : “I’m afraid I won’t be able to practice the medicinal herbs when 
this jar is burned. Yue Feng, stop acting, are you tired?” 

Bang! 

At this moment, there was a sudden vibration in the pot. 

Everyone was taken aback, and they all stepped back. They saw that the pot was not 
broken. The sound just now was the reaction of the homogeneous flow in the pot under 
the high temperature. 

At this time, Yue Feng also slowly opened the pot. 

At this moment, everyone couldn’t help but surrounded, and for a while, the entire cave 
was silent! 

Several girls couldn’t help exclaiming, feeling their legs softened. 

I saw a black medicinal pill lying quietly at the bottom of the clay pot. Not only that, but 
the fragrance of medicinal medicinal herbs also filled the air. 

What? ! 

Actually…really refined by him? ! 

At this moment, everyone’s mind was blank. Looking at the medicinal herbs in the clay 
pot, they felt incredible! 

Liu Xuan, who was on the side, bit her lip even more tightly. At this time, besides being 
shocked, she was also even more curious! My husband, who can surprise people every 
time, really can’t see through him more and more. 

“Great Sage, the medicine pill is ready, I’ll give it to her.” Yue Feng took out the 
medicine pill, gently opened Li Nan’s red lips, and stuffed the medicine pill into it. 

Just now, everyone ridiculed Yue Feng, but Sun Dasheng did not scold him, because 
he was afraid of affecting his alchemy. At this time, seeing that the medicinal pill was 
really refined, Sun Dasheng was amazed. 

“Fengzi, thank you.” Sun Dasheng nodded slightly, then quietly waited for Li Nan to 
wake up. 

At the same time, other people present also came over carefully and watched the 
results with their breath. 



Ten minutes passed, and Li Nan’s face seemed to be better than before, but he did not 
wake up. 

Fifteen minutes passed, and there was still no sign of waking up. 

Half an hour.. 

an hour! 

“Fengzi, what’s going on?” 

Sun Dasheng looked at Yue Feng and couldn’t sit still anymore. 

Yue Feng smiled lightly and said with relief: “It’s okay, it takes a process to remove the 
toxicity. She is no longer in danger. She should wake up before tomorrow morning. 

” How long it will take effect, there is no detailed record. 

For example, when Zhou Qin ate the Immortal Pill before, there was no response, but in 
the end he succeeded in breaking through. 

Sun Dasheng nodded suddenly. 

However, the others around him were all sneering. 

Although Yue Feng succeeded in practicing the medicine pill, they were surprised. 

But thinking about it carefully, Yue Feng’s ability to refine the medicinal herbs must have 
taken up a lot of accidental ingredients. To put it bluntly, it is Mongolian. 

As for whether it works. 

Everyone has seen that, it is completely deliberately fooling Sun Dasheng. 

“Mr. Sun, I think Yue Feng deliberately lied to you. If he can wake up at dawn tomorrow, 
if his medicine is effective, why would he have no reaction at all?” Qin Shousheng said 
to Sun Dasheng with a shirtless face. 

It’s cold, it’s really cold. 

Originally, the seaside was cold at night, but now it is raining outside, with lightning and 
thunder. Thinking of his clothes and being set on fire by this kid, Qin Shousheng is 
angry! 

At this moment, Yue Feng’s mobile phone ding ding ding ding. 



More than ten WeChat messages. 

It’s so late, who is it? Yue Feng took out his mobile phone, and when he opened it, he 
was stunned. 

What is Li Qin doing? Send yourself so many pictures? 

Driven by curiosity, download these photos. As a result, Yue Feng swallowed his saliva! 

These photos are from the head teacher Tang Lan! 

Speaking of Tang Lan, Yue Feng couldn’t help but miss the school days. In high school, 
the teacher I feared most was Tang Lan. 
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Teacher Tang Lan is really beautiful, but also very strict. 

These dozens of photos, from all angles, fully demonstrate that charming figure. 

What the hell! 

I don’t know what Li Qin is going to do, suddenly posting so many photos of Tang Lan! 

Nima, suddenly clicked on these photos and was seen by several people around. Hao 
Jian suddenly shouted: “Look, Yue Feng is looking at pictures of beautiful women, 
hahaha, this person is really disgusting. When he sees these things, he doesn’t carry 
anyone 

behind his back.” Disgusted look. Wretched men are hated by women everywhere. 

Yue Feng was extremely embarrassed, so he quickly turned off his phone and looked 
around to ease the embarrassment. 

As a result, after looking around, Yue Feng suddenly stood up! Brows furrowed! 

“You’re surprised, what’s wrong?” Hao Jian shouted. 

Yue Feng didn’t speak, but looked at the wall for a while, and the entrance of the cave 
for a while, then took a deep breath, shook his head and said, “This cave is a little bad.” 

Liu Xuan and Sun Dasheng were a little confused. 

What is he saying? What happened to this cave? 



Yue Feng pointed to the water inlet a few hundred meters away from the opposite side 
of the cave, and said slowly: “Stand here and look at the water inlet where we competed 
for swimming before. Does it look like a water dragon meandering there?” 

Sun Dasheng and Liu Xuan, He looked at it, and sure enough, the water bay in the 
distance, under the darkness of the night, really looked like a dragon lying there. 

Yue Feng continued: “In Feng Shui, this is called Longyou Shallow Water, which is a 
very bad omen. Therefore, we encountered sharks before, not only because of pig 
blood.” 

Sun Dasheng’s face was full of surprise . : “Fengzi, do you still know Feng Shui?” 

“He knows shit!” Liu Zhiyuan rolled his eyes: “If this kid understands Feng Shui, he will 
be a son-in-law?” 

Hahaha! 

A group of people laughed. 

Sun Dasheng was a little puzzled. He didn’t think Yue Feng was joking. He couldn’t help 
but ask: “Fengzi, this bay is ‘Longyou Shallow Water’, does that have anything to do 
with the cave we are in?” 

Yue Feng didn’t care about other people’s eyes, looked at Sun Dasheng with a firm 
tone: “Of course It does matter, there is a cliff above this cave, and the whole cliff 
moves like a hungry tiger going down the mountain, and the cave we are in is the 
location of the tiger’s mouth.” 

After speaking, Yue Feng pointed to the bay again: “Shallow water. Dragon, when you 
meet a tiger that goes up and down the mountain, it’s a typical dragon-tiger fight, you 
tell me, we are in the mouth of a hungry tiger, can we have it? This kind of pattern, once 
someone lives in, it is easy to have an accident.” 

Wow! 

Hearing this, everyone was in an uproar. 

Liu Zhiyuan couldn’t help it anymore: “Yue Feng, what tricks do you want to do? What 
kind of dragon swims in shallow water, dragon and tiger fight, everyone is ready to rest, 
don’t talk nonsense.” 

This kid is really wrong, this kid is really special Superstition, alchemy for a while and 
Feng Shui for a while, is it a magic stick? 



Hao Jian sneered and continued, “Liu Zhiyuan, how come you Liu family’s son-in-law, 
how can you be so sane?” 

“Who knows? It is estimated that when you become a son-in-law, you will be depressed 
and become crazy.” Liu Zhiyuan said angrily. . 

The two of you said nothing to me, and Yue Feng didn’t say anything. 

After looking around, he still shook his head and said: “I’m not sure if there is any 
danger. In short, sleeping here is not good for everyone. To make sure, I won’t sleep 
here tonight. Great Sage, do you want to? Go out with me to find a place?” 

“I…” 

Sun Dasheng hesitated, looked down at Li Nan, who was still unconscious, and smiled 
bitterly: “I’m not going, it’s raining outside. I’m afraid my wife won’t be able to hold it…” 

He wanted to go out with Yue Feng to find a place, But with a comatose wife, it is really 
inconvenient. 

Yue Feng nodded, then looked around at the others: “Any of you want to go out with 
me?” 

Although he didn’t like these wealthy children, he still had a clear conscience to ask 
them. 

But obviously, everyone looked at him like a fool. 

It’s thundering and raining outside, is there something wrong with this kid, and he wants 
to go out to live? Hahaha! 

“Yue Feng, stop making trouble.” Liu Xuan took Yue Feng’s arm, bit her lip and said 
softly, her face flushed. 

I almost believed in Yue Feng’s feng shui theory just now, but now I wake up. 

So many things happened today, and my relationship with him quickly warmed up. What 
kind of dragon and tiger fights are all made up by him. 

I just wanted to find an excuse to sleep with myself alone, and then… 

thinking in my heart, Liu Xuan’s face became even hotter, and she felt shy inside. At the 
same time, I was a little angry. In such a heavy rain, if I went out by myself as a girl, 
would I catch a cold? 

“I’m not making trouble, I’m serious.” Yue Feng said. 
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What happened to my wife? face so red? 

“I… I’ll go with you.” At this moment, a graceful figure emerged from the crowd, it was 
Xiao Yuruo. 

When Yue Feng was refining alchemy just now, his own words caused him to be 
ridiculed by everyone. If he didn’t support him this time, he would feel even more sorry 
for him. 

What? 

Xiao Yuruo wants to go with Yue Feng? 

Why? Why did the goddess go with him? 

This time, the Xiao family couldn’t sit still! 

Yue Feng is a door-to-door son-in-law, but Xiao Yuruo has never been with her 
boyfriend, so what’s the matter with him? 

“Miss Xiao, do you believe in this nonsense?” 

“That is, who knows what his heart is. This kid is so arrogant, you can see that he is 
bragging and can concoct alchemy, but Li Nan’s sister-in-law is still Don’t be deceived 
by him!” 

Hearing this, Hao Jian walked out at once: “Mr. Sun, I know, this kid knows that the 
medicinal pill he made is not effective, so he is trying to find an excuse to escape. You 
can’t be fooled by him.” 

Hao Jian said with a smug look on his face. 

This kid Yue Feng, still want to play tricks? Thank you for being inspired. 

“Yes, Hao Jian is right.” 

“He just wanted to run, knowing that no one of us would go with him, and he deliberately 
made up a reason.” 

However, Sun Dasheng ignored them at all. 

When Yue Feng listened to their words, his anger spread. 

Nima, don’t want to pay attention to them, they are not finished yet? ! 



However, Yue Feng was too lazy to explain: “You believe it or not, but when something 
really happens, don’t cry and beg me to save you.” 

Haha… 

This kid really knows how to pretend. 

Hearing this, everyone burst into laughter, all with disdain on their faces. 

Hao Jian sneered: “We beg you to save me? What are you daydreaming about? I tell 
you, if there is a moment, I will kneel down and recognize you as a father.” Does 

this kid really think of himself as a savior? Ridiculous. 

Yue Feng showed a smile and said lightly: “Okay, then I’m going to be a father today, 
remember what you said, don’t be rude when it comes.” 

“Damn pen, will you beep again?!” Hao Jian suddenly became angry. He was about to 
rush over, but was stopped by Zhou Qin. 

“Qin’er, do you also believe his nonsense?” 

Zhou Qin responded angrily: “I didn’t believe him, I stopped you to calm you down, this 
outing was organized by your family, can you please? Don’t be impulsive.” 

In fact, at that moment, Zhou Qin also wanted to go out with Yue Feng, but after 
thinking about it, he finally chose to trust everyone. 

After all, what Yue Feng just said was indeed a bit exaggerated. He just lived in a cave, 
how could there be disasters? 

“Brother, I’ll go first.” Yue Feng, too lazy to talk nonsense with those people, greeted 
Sun Dasheng. 

He knew that Sun Dasheng wanted to go with him, but his wife was still in a coma, 
which was really inconvenient. 

Sun Dasheng nodded: “Okay.” 

A few dozen meters away from the cave, Yue Feng simply built a simple thatched hut 
with branches and coconut leaves. 

Liu Xuan and Xiao Yuruo, who were standing aside, were a little embarrassed to each 
other. 

However, Liu Xuan was a little calmer by comparison. 



Yue Feng deliberately separated from everyone, and he must live a two-person world 
with himself. Now that Xiao Yuruo has also followed, Yue Feng will not mess around. 

“Although it’s simple, it’s okay, eh? What’s wrong with the two of you?” 

Yue Feng excitedly fixed the thatched hut, looked at the two goddesses who were 
stunned, and asked with a smile. 

“You only got one place to live?” Liu Xuan asked angrily. 

And the space inside is not large, and sure enough, he is not at ease. 

Xiao Yuruo, who was next to him, was also too shy. At this time, he really wanted to 
return to the cave, but when he saw the darkness behind him, he couldn’t summon up 
the courage. 
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Yes, Yue Feng only built a thatched hut, how can he live here? 

Xiao Yuruo and Liu Xuan looked helpless. 

And Yue Feng laughed and said of course: “It’s not easy to make one, and it’s so cold at 
night, the three of us can be warmer together, right?” 

Haha, two big beauties are with you tonight How could you possibly build an extra 
thatched hut by yourself? 

Liu Xuan blushed and said angrily, “Do you still want to sleep in the middle? It’s 
beautiful.” 

As she spoke, she smiled and took Xiao Yuruo’s hand: “Go, let’s go to sleep. 

” After the thatched hut, Liu Xuan’s voice came from inside: “Yue Feng, just help us 
suffer outside, you’d better be Yue Feng.” 

This sentence made the bones brittle. 

In her impression, she has never been so gentle with herself. 

“That… Really bear me outside?” Yue Feng wailed with a bitter face. 

Liu Xuan replied with a smile: “Do you really want to sleep in there, Yu Ruoke doesn’t 
have a boyfriend yet.” 

Alas, depressed. depressed! 



Sitting by the thatched hut, Yue Feng lit a cigarette and closed his eyes. 

I don’t know how long it took, Yue Feng woke up from the cold. 

Hearing the even breathing of the two women inside, he couldn’t help swallowing. 

Fell asleep? Such a good opportunity, do you want to go in and take a look? 

It’s not impossible to look at it. 

Yue Feng smiled and quietly was about to get in. As a result, at this moment, a loud 
bang came into the sky! 

“Boom!” 

How loud is that? It’s like a thunderclap on the ground! 

Listening to this voice, it seems to be coming from the other side of the cave! 

Liu Xuan and Xiao Yuruo were also awakened at the same time, and crawled out of it 
with a blank expression, not knowing what happened. 

“Something happened over there in the cave, you two stay here and don’t go 
anywhere.” After saying a word, Yue Feng quickly rushed towards the cave. 

Looking at his back, the two women looked at each other in shock! 

Actually.. was actually hit by him? ! 

It’s really not safe in the cave! 

He, is he a prophet? ! 

They wanted to go there and have a look, but they held back when they thought of Yue 
Feng’s advice. 

hiss! 

Yue Feng rushed to the cave, and the scene in front of him made him take a deep 
breath! 

The cave has collapsed! 

The entrance of the cave was blocked by a boulder that was more than ten meters high, 
leaving only a small gap above it. 



There was a lot of screaming inside, and many people were frightened and kept calling 
for help. But how can there be anyone in this wild country? 

“Help.” 

“I want to go out, I want to go out…” 

Hearing the cry for help, Yue Feng quickly climbed up the boulder and looked inside 
through the gap. 

I only saw this cave, almost all of which was buried by gravel, and now there is only less 
than 100 square meters of space left. 

The people of more than a dozen families huddled together, their bodies covered with 
dust, and they were in a state of indescribable embarrassment. Some timid girls 
immediately started to cry. 

But fortunately, no one seems to have been killed. However, a few people were injured, 
and it seems that they were not lightly smashed. If the wound is not treated in time, it 
can also be life-threatening. 

The most important thing is that now this cave, I don’t know why, keeps falling gravel. 
Small stones, the size of a fist. A big rock, bigger than a basketball. If it is smashed, it is 
estimated that it will not die or be scrapped. 

Call for help? 

It will take at least three hours for someone to come to the rescue. Now the gravel 
keeps falling, it is estimated that it will not last for ten minutes, and it will collapse again 
soon! Someone had already been hit by the gravel, and their head was bleeding. 

“Shut up, where’s the Great Sage?” Yue Feng yelled. 

In an instant, the cave was quiet, and everyone’s eyes followed the voice to Yue Feng. 

Everyone was very panicked, but at this moment, everyone remembered Yue Feng’s 
words at the same time. 

Fulfilled. 

He is not alarmist or grandstanding. 

This place is really not safe. 

“Fengzi, I’m here.” At this moment, the voice of Sun Dasheng came from the cave. 



“I’ll pull you up!” Yue Feng broke many branches and weaved a rope. 

Weaving rope from branches is a ‘stunt’. When he was in the country, an old fisherman 
taught him. The rope weaved was long and strong, just enough to get people up. 

Sun Dasheng and his wife grabbed the rope and left the cave with the help of Yue 
Feng. 
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