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Chapter 2326 

So the pressure was inevitably a bit high. 

“You’d better save my sister; otherwise, I’ll have you buried with her!” Kassidy roared 
angrily. 

At this moment, she was on the verge of rage. 

If she had known that Zizi was such a waste, she shouldn’t have listened to him and 
pulled out the silver needle from her sister’s body. 

If her sister really died, she would never let it go. 

“San’er! Quick! Take out the soul-reviving pill!” 

Zizi didn’t dare to hide his secrets and quickly ordered his apprentice to take out his 
treasure. 

The soul-reviving elixir was a top-quality elixir that he spent a lot of money on, as well 
as a great favor to get back from Stoneray Valley. 

It is known as the soul-reviving pill because it is believed to have the ability to bring the 
dead back to life. 

No matter who it is, no matter how injured they are, even if they have no breath or 
pulse, as long as they take the soul-reviving pill, they can temporarily save their lives. 

Originally, he kept this soul-reviving pill to himself, a treasure that would save his life in 
dire circumstances. 

Many wealthy and powerful people are willing to pay exorbitant prices to buy it, but he 
has been reluctant to sell it. 

But today, in order to save Noemi and save his own life, he had to give up the soul-
reviving pill. 

“Master! Soul-Reviving Pill!” 

The apprentice named San’er opened the hidden compartment of the medicine box, 
quickly took out an exquisite wooden box, and handed it to Zizi with both hands. 

Zizi opened the wooden box and took a look. Inside, there was a golden elixir. 



The elixir exuded a golden halo under the sunlight, resembling gold, and it looked 
incredibly beautiful. 

You can also detect a distinctive scent through your nostrils that is refreshing. 

“Is this the legendary soul-reviving pill that can bring people back to life?”It’s really 
extraordinary!” Conor’s eyes shone with wonder. 

He had naturally heard of the soul-reviving pill from Stoneray Valley. It was a priceless 
treasure that no amount of money could buy. 

Because of the scarcity of medicinal materials, Stoneray Valley can only produce one 
soul-reviving pill every ten years. 

Its value can be imagined. 

Zizi clearly gave away all of his treasures at the bottom of the box. 

“With the Soul-Reviving Pill, the patient will definitely be safe!” 

Zizi took a deep breath and then fed the soul-reviving pill into Noemi’s mouth with great 
pain. 

He couldn’t exchange this priceless treasure for anything. He was really reluctant to use 
it on others unless he had no choice. 

Now, he can only pray that the soul-reviving pill can bring Noemi back to life, like the 
legend says, and bring Noemi back from h-e-l-l. 

Otherwise, he would probably have to explain it here today. 

The daughter of the leader of the Celestial Alliance was put to death, and even ten lives 
were not enough to compensate! 
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The soul-reviving pill melts in the mouth, and wisps of golden liquid slide down Noemi’s 
throat into the body. 

The vigorous vitality instantly penetrated all the limbs and bones and penetrated every 
cell. 

The heart that had stopped beating slowly began to beat again under the stimulation of 
the soul-reviving pill. 



“Dong, dong, dong…” 

With the beating of her heart, Noemi’s chest began to rise and fall slightly, and her 
breathing gradually returned to normal. 

“Noemi is full of energy!” Seeing this scene, Conor looked overjoyed. 

“Great! My sister is finally alive!” 

Kassidy was overjoyed and so excited that tears fell down. 

As for Zizi, he breathed a long sigh of relief. 

Fortunately, the legendary soul-reviving pill had a miraculous effect and rescued Noemi; 
otherwise, his golden sign would have been ruined. 

It was really painful to receive a soul-reviving pill for no reason. 

“It is indeed a soul-reviving pill, and it certainly deserves its reputation.” Conor clicked 
his tongue in surprise. 

Being able to forcefully pull a dead person back from the gate of h-e-l-l shows how 
extraordinary the Soul Resurrection Pill was. 

“Although the process was a bit tortuous, fortunately there was no danger.” 

Zizi forced a smile, but there was a cold sweat on his back. 

He couldn’t understand why his fairy water and Huqu Crossing Acupuncture Technique 
had no effect on Noemi. 

It even worsened the condition. 

It was just a little bit poisoned. Why was it so difficult to cure? 

What went wrong? 

“Doctor Wang, something doesn’t seem right!” 

At this time, Kassidy seemed to see something and frowned again. “My sister’s 
breathing seems to be weakening again.” 

“What? How could this happen?” 

Zizi frowned and quickly stepped forward to check Noemi’s pulse. His expression 
instantly turned ugly. 



As Kassidy said, the pulse of Noemi, who had just regained his vitality, began to slowly 
weaken again. 

It seemed as if the soul-reviving pill just gave the other party a brief moment of 
rejuvenation. 

If this situation continued, Noemi would run out of oil and die in less than one stick of 
incense. 
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“Doctor Wang, what should we do now? Think of a solution quickly!” Kassidy urged with 
an anxious look. 

“This…I…” Zizi opened his mouth, not knowing how to respond. 

He used the detoxifying fairy water. 

He also used the Huqu acupuncture method to expel poison. 

In the end, he even sacrificed the treasure at the bottom of the box, the soul-reviving 
pill. 

It can be said that they have exhausted all means to save Noemi’s life. 

But the final result was of no use at all. 

What he thought was a minor illness turned out to be more and more serious after going 
back and forth for a long time. 

By now, he was at his wits’ end. 

“Doctor Wang! Why are you still standing there? Save people!” Kassidy raised her 
voice. 

“Alas~! The patient’s disease is really strange. I have been practicing medicine for many 
years and have never encountered it before. I’m afraid there is nothing I can do now.” 

Zizi sighed, with a bit of shame and helplessness on his face. 

Kassidy immediately became anxious. “What are you talking about? There’s nothing 
you can do?! Before the treatment, you were full of confidence and patted your chest to 
promise that you could cure my sister. Now you actually tell me that you can’t do 
anything? You are not a miracle doctor!” 



“I…” Zizi was speechless. 

“Doctor Wang, do you have any other miraculous medicines? Bring them all out. As 
long as it can save Noemi, we are willing to spend no matter how much it costs.” Conor 
reminded. 

“It’s useless.” Zizi shook his head and said with a grimace, “I have tried my best and 
used everything that should be used. I even took out the soul-reviving pill. The patient 
has never improved. Looking at it now, the time has come, and I’m helpless. I’m sorry 
for your sister!” 

Kassidy was angry and grabbed Zizi’s collar. “You are a quack! Treat my sister! Now 
you just want to clear up the responsibility with a few perfunctory words, right? I still say 
the same thing: if my sister dies today, all of you will be buried with her.” 

“Miss Marshall, you… aren’t you making things difficult?” Zizi looked bitter and 
panicked. 

“I can’t control that much. You must cure my sister today!” Kassidy roared. 

“Kassidy, calm down first, and let’s think of a way to save your sister.” Conor comforted 
her from the side. 

“Save? This quack doctor pulled out my sister’s silver needle, causing her condition to 
suddenly worsen. How should I save her now?!” 

Kassidy seemed to have thought of something as she roared and was suddenly 
startled. “Wait! That Dr. Rhys from before The doctor seems to have stabilized my 
sister’s condition. If he is invited back, there might be something he can do.” 

“Even Divine Doctor Wang can’t do it; can that kid do it?” Conor responded somewhat. 

“You have to give it a try, no matter what.” Kassidy said solemnly, “Mikayla! Hurry! 
Contact Miss Grace immediately and ask her to invite Dr. Rhys back to save people.” 

Now she has no choice but to die. Become a live doctor and invite Dustin back to try. 

Although the hope is slim, at least there is some hope. 

What if a miracle really happens? 
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At dusk, in the back kitchen of the restaurant. 



Dustin stood in front of the alchemy furnace, using mystical pure energy to carefully 
control the temperature of the furnace fire. 

Grace worked very efficiently. In just one hour, he collected all the precious medicinal 
materials and ordered someone to deliver a high-quality alchemy furnace. 

Dustin followed the ancient method and began to refine the elixir for Noemi to break the 
witchcraft. 

Witchcraft was similar to poison, only more mysterious and unpredictable. 

Fortunately, Dustin was quite accomplished in witchcraft and had read a lot of books, so 
he knew many unknown secrets. 

It was not difficult to refine the antidote. 

While Dustin was concentrating on refining elixirs, Grace suddenly walked in. 

“Dustin, it’s not good. I just received the news that Noemi’s condition has suddenly 
worsened. Now she is about to die. We have to go there immediately!” Grace said it 
with a solemn face. 

Dustin frowned. “The condition has worsened? How could this happen?” 

“My nine-turn resurrecting needle contains the voodoo in Noemi’s body.” As long as the 
needle is not pulled out, it should be fine for two or three days. “Was something wrong 
after only two or three hours?” 

“Someone made an independent decision and invited the famous doctor Zizi to come to 
the clinic for treatment. Unaware of the situation, Zizi immediately used your silver 
needle, causing Noemi’s condition to rapidly worsen and leaving Zizi exhausted. “All 
methods are ineffective in saving her, so Kassidy called me just now and asked me to 
take you there to rescue her immediately.” Grace quickly told what happened. 

“I told them not to pull out the needle; why didn’t they listen? They’re really asking for 
trouble!” Dustin had a headache. 

Originally, as long as the elixir was refined and the mystical pure energy was used to 
slowly eliminate the voodoo, everything would be fine. 

Now that all this has happened, it will undoubtedly make it more difficult for him. 

“Now is not the time. Come with me quickly and rescue Noemi as much as possible.” 
Grace frowned deeply. 



“Wait a few more minutes; I have to finish refining this furnace of elixirs.” Dustin did not 
get up. 

Voodoo was very difficult to solve. Even if he went there, he would not be able to save 
people if there was no corresponding elixir. 

Although Grace was anxious, she could only wait nearby. 

She only hoped that Zizi would be useful and prolong Noemi’s life as much as possible. 

“Hoo~!” 

In order to hurry up, Dustin directly used all his strength to activate the mystical pure 
energy’s true energy. 

The flames under the alchemy furnace instantly became fierce, and the surrounding 
temperature rose rapidly. 

Even Grace, who was standing next to him, was so toasted that her mouth was dry and 
her cheeks were red. 

“Buzz~!” 

At this time, because the flames were too strong, the alchemy furnace began to vibrate 
slightly and make bursts of roaring sounds. 

Generally speaking, when encountering this kind of situation, the alchemist would 
immediately turn to a small fire and lower the temperature; otherwise, there would be a 
risk of the furnace exploding. 

But at this time, Dustin couldn’t care about it anymore. 

Saving people was like putting out a fire. Even if he risked exploding the furnace, he 
had to increase the temperature to speed up the elixir formation. 
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“Click, click, click…” 

Five minutes later, fine cracks began to appear on the surface of the alchemy furnace, 
which had obviously reached its endurance limit. 

The flames driven by mystical pure energy’s true energy were extremely hot, and even 
a high-grade alchemy furnace couldn’t withstand it. 



“Dustin! The alchemy furnace is about to explode!” Grace’s expression changed slightly, 
and she quickly warned. 

Dustin said nothing and continued to stimulate pure mystical energy, his expression 
extremely serious. 

The flames under the furnace were still fierce and showed no signs of weakening. 

Ten more breaths finally overwhelmed the trembling pill furnace, causing it to explode 
with a “bang”. 

For a while, debris and smoke flew everywhere. 

Dustin, who was at the center of the explosion, shook his body, and his protective 
energy burst out, isolating all the debris. 

Immediately afterwards, a scene that shocked Grace occurred. 

Although the alchemy furnace exploded, Dustin had no intention of stopping. Instead, 
he used his mystical, pure energy to construct an alchemy furnace out of thin air. 

True energy, both empty and real, completely transformed this translucent alchemy 
furnace. 

There would also be a slight color change when roasted by flames. 

Grace took a closer look and found an irregular purple pill floating in the pill furnace. 

The remaining liquid medicine in the furnace quickly gathered together, constantly filling 
with purple elixirs. 

After three more breaths, the purple elixir finally took shape. 

“It’s done!” 

Dustin’s eyes lit up, and he suddenly shot out, directly piercing the pill furnace and then 
grabbing the purple pill. 

While holding the elixir, the elixir furnace dissipated into a breeze, and the flames under 
the furnace disappeared instantly. 

“Huh——!” 

Dustin let out a long breath, and before he knew it, he was sweating profusely. 



Using elixir to fuel the flames already consumes a lot of energy. Finally, to avert the 
furnace’s explosion from destroying the elixir, 

He directly used all his true energy to create an alchemy furnace out of thin air. 

In this way, the consumption was even greater. 

If it weren’t for his deep foundation, he wouldn’t be able to support it. 

Fortunately, in the end, the elixir was successfully refined, and his hard work was not in 
vain. 

“Quick! Go rescue people immediately!” 

Without any time to rest, Dustin collected the elixirs and went straight to the Celestial 
Alliance’s lakeside villa with Grace. 

 

 


