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Chapter 711 

Alexander said, “The meanings of the two sets of jewelry are different, and I 
am giving them to different people, so there’s no conflict. It was true that the 
green jade was more dignified and elegant, suitable for elders, and Kennedy’s 
jewelry was more suitable for young people, as a trendy luxury item.” 

Magnolia suddenly asked Elizabeth, “Elizabeth, do you know Kennedy?” 

Elizabeth asked, somewhat confused, “Is Kennedy a man or a woman?” 

“Kennedy is a young woman,” Magnolia said. “I have a friend who met her 
before and couldn’t stop praising her.” 

“Do you also think Kennedy is excellent?” Elizabeth immediately asked. 

Magnolia nodded right away. “Of course, isn’t she excellent?” 

Elizabeth smiled. Alright, if Magnolia also thought Kennedy was excellent, 
that’s enough for her. 

But after thinking for a moment, Elizabeth asked again, “So, Magnolia, do you 
really like Kennedy’s work?” 

Magnolia replied, “Of course, I don’t think anyone would dislike her work.” 

“Then if she makes a comeback, what will happen to Opulent Crest Jewelry?” 
Elizabeth tilted her head. 

Alexander saw a hint of assertiveness in her eyes, which the old Elizabeth 
rarely had. Elizabeth was really different after their divorce. 

“Opulent Crest Jewelry won’t make way for anyone. Kennedy is excellent, but 
Opulent Crest Jewelry is not bad either,” Magnolia answered gracefully. 

But Elizabeth stirred things up. “Mr. Tudor, I have a question for you.” She 
smiled, looking very obedient and gentle, but actually hiding a scheme. 
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Alexander raised an eyebrow, with a calm expression of “Go ahead.” 

“If both Kennedy and Opulent Crest Jewelry wanted your investment, who 
would you choose?” Elizabeth curled her lips, the assertiveness in her eyes 
becoming even more arrogant. 

Alexander stared at her, his eyes slightly narrowed. Magnolia was even more 
surprised, not expecting Elizabeth to ask such a question. But she was also 
quite curious about who Alexander would choose. Although Kennedy was 
excellent, Magnolia had known Alexander for many years. 

Alexander pursed his lips, turned his head to look at Magnolia, and said, “Still 
Opulent Crest Jewelry. A celebrity like Kennedy probably doesn’t need my 
investment.” 

Chapter 711 

Elizabeth was silent. A look of surprise appeared on Magnolia’s face. It seemed 
that Alexander’s answer really surprised her. Elizabeth sighed and could only 
nod in acceptance. 

Before leaving, Elizabeth didn’t forget to say, “Mr. Tudor, you and Magnolia 
are quite suitable for each other. Maybe you should try dating her. After all, 
she has been pursuing you for a long time.” 

After saying that, she walked away without looking back. Alexander stared at 
her back, his previously puzzled face slowly revealing a smile. 

Elizabeth’s seemingly calm three sentences… that means she’s jealous? 

Chapter 712 

Elizabeth went to the restroom to touch up her makeup. She looked at herself 
in the mirror and sighed deeply. Thinking about Alexander mentioning 
investing in Magnolia, she found it amusing. The reason he didn’t invest in 
Kennedy was that Kennedy already had many investors, so he didn’t need 
another one—a typical self-congratulatory way of avoiding investment. Just 
because she had everything, he wouldn’t give her anything? How did he know 
what she wanted most wasn’t from him? 

Elizabeth lowered her eyes, and just as she was lost in thought, someone 
appeared at the door. She saw the person in the mirror and clicked her tongue. 
“Mr. Tudor, this is the ladies’ room.” 



“So what?” He crossed his arms and leaned casually against the wall. He knew 
there was only Elizabeth in the ladies’ room. Otherwise, he wouldn’t have 
shown up here. 

Elizabeth didn’t say anything and instead applied some lipstick. Alexander 
watched her small movements, looking at her slightly parted red lips, and 
licked his own. 

“Elizabeth,” he called her. 

Elizabeth looked up and saw him in the mirror. “You jealous?” His tone was 
low, with a hint of seriousness. 

Elizabeth was stunned for two seconds, then laughed. “Mr. Tudor, have you 
been drinking?” How much had he drunk? How had he not passed out yet and 
started having delusions? What was he saying? He actually asked if she was 
jealous? Where did Alexander get the idea that she was jealous? She didn’t 
know if she was crazy or if he was. 

“Mr. Tudor, if you’re drunk, call Nolan to take you home,” Elizabeth kindly 
reminded him. 

“Do I look drunk? I’m very sober, and I can even judge your mood.” His tone 
was indifferent, but his face was undeniably handsome—although he was very 
tired, it didn’t hide his sharpness. 

Then tell me, what mood am I in? Elizabeth laughed. 

If he judged correctly, she hoped his answer would be: It’s the mood to corse 
someone out. 

Alexander raised an eyebrow. “You’re in the jealous mood.” 

“Alexander, I think you’re crazy,” Elizabeth said angrily. Alexander wasn’t 
upset at all when she cursed at him; instead, he was in a great mood. 

“Pursuing you requires a bit of craziness, doesn’t it?” He crossed his arms and 
stared intently at her, asking, “Am I right?” 

Elizabeth was speechless; she felt he was utterly shameless. “I think you’re 
quite unreasonable.” She smiled and walked past him to leave. 

Alexander reached out and grabbed her arm. “Elizabeth.” 



“What now?” Elizabeth was getting more and more annoyed. Every time 
Alexander called her, she felt angry. But Alexander didn’t think he was 
annoying. He called Elizabeth a few more times, wishing he could call her 
every day. 

Alexander felt a bit aggrieved. “I don’t mean anything else. I just want to ask 
you a question; don’t be so impatient.” Elizabeth felt like punching him. Who 
was he pretending to be aggrieved with? Was he changing tactics? 

Elizabeth irritably pushed his hand away and heard him ask, “Do you like 
Kennedy’s comeback work?” 

“Why?” Elizabeth was impatient. 

“I bought it to give to you, is that okay?” Alexander’s eyes softened. 

Elizabeth almost choked and got confused. “Mr. Tudor, I’m not very fond of it, 
don’t waste your money,” she said politely, declining. 

Alexander didn’t understand. “Don’t all girls like it? Why don’t you?” 

“Because I’m not an ordinary girl.” Elizabeth smiled, wanting to mock him. 

Chapter 713 

Elizabeth still managed to restrain her impulsive words. 

“How about I give you another gift?” Alexander asked. 

Elizabeth was puzzled. “Aren’t you busy? Why do you do that?” 

It used to be incredibly difficult to get him to give her a gift. It seemed so 
cheap. 

“You’ll definitely like this gift,” he said. “I didn’t bring it with me; let’s meet 
tonight.” 

“I’m not free.” Elizabeth rejected him outright. First, she didn’t like the gifts he 
gave; second, she didn’t want to see him either. 

“I’ll be waiting for you at the top floor of the Emerald Skyscraper, Elizabeth. If 
you don’t come, I won’t leave,” he said. 



Elizabeth frowned. But Alexander looked very serious. Elizabeth should know 
that he always kept his word. If he said he wouldn’t leave, he definitely 
wouldn’t leave. 

She pushed him away. 

“So, were you jealous just now?” Alexander followed her. He didn’t care if she 
came or not. Anyway, if she didn’t come, he wouldn’t leave. If Elizabeth felt 
sorry for him, she would come; if she didn’t come, he would understand her. 

“Stop being narcissistic and stop following me. Or I’ll call the police!” 
Elizabeth pointed at him, very annoyed. 

Alexander was indifferent and continued to follow her. Elizabeth was really 
speechless that he didn’t seem tired at all. It seemed that he had been through 
the tough times so easily. 

“The Tudor Group has gotten through the tough times, hasn’t it?” Elizabeth 
asked him. 

“Don’t worry, it will be fine. And the shares I promised you, I’ll still give them 
to you later,” he said with a smile. 

Elizabeth quickly shook him off. Rather than saying she shook him off, he was 
intercepted by Magnolia as soon as he came out of the restroom. Elizabeth had 
never been so grateful to Magnolia. But at this moment, she was very thankful 
to her. Elizabeth gave Alexander a provocative look and then quickly escaped. 

Chapter 713 

Alexander saw her expression and smiled. This side of Elizabeth made him 
feel she was a bit closer, hinting at something more. 

Magnolia followed Alexander’s gaze and saw it was the direction they had both 
left. He hadn’t smiled all night, but just seeing Elizabeth’s back made him 
smile. 

Who would believe that Alexander didn’t love Elizabeth? And when had 
someone as proud as Alexander ever apologized to anyone? But he apologized 
to Elizabeth. 

Magnolia knew she could never catch up to Alexander in this lifetime. But 
being able to have some interaction with him, she was already very content. 



“If you get in touch with Kennedy, I hope you can introduce me,” Alexander 
said to Magnolia. 

Magnolia asked, “Do you want to buy Kennedy’s comeback piece?” 

“Yes,” Alexander replied. 

Magnolia was silent for a moment. She knew that the green jade Alexander 
bought was to be given to an elder. So who was Alexander buying Kennedy’s 
comeback piece for? That kind of jewelry only young people would like. 

Could it be for Elizabeth? 

“Is it for Elizabeth?” Magnolia asked. 

Alexander looked at her. “Otherwise, Ms. Belle, who do you think I would give 
it to?” 

Magnolia laughed. With that one address, Alexander had completely cut off 
any personal relationship between them. In the end, they were just business 
partners. 

Chapter 714 

“Kennedy’s comeback piece is hard to buy. Even if I introduce you, I’d give 
up,” Magentia implied, suggesting the son would not sell it to them. But 
Mexander didn’t buy it. If she’s releasing it as a comeback piece, she’s waiting 
for someone. That’s hitting the nail on the head. In my opinion, if my price is 
right, why wouldn’t they sell? His Magnolia then felt annoyed. 

Because they were both in the jewelry design business. Yet, at her edition, 
Alexander was talking to her about Kennedy. How could she feel comfortable 
with that? Magnolia looked at Elizabeth’s distant figure, then at Alexander, 
whose eyes were fixed on Elizabeth. Then she smiled bitterly, feeling her life 
was truly miserable. Loving someone she shouldn’t love—maybe that’s what it 
was. She was either chasing or always a step too late. 

In college, she fell for Alexander. But Elizabeth had known him since high 
school. When Alexander got married, Magnolia thought he would belong to 
Elizabeth for life, but then she heard he liked Esme. When he got married 
again, Magnolia was still a step too late. He had fallen for Elizabeth again. 
Looking back, Magnolia’s pursuit seemed like she was always struggling alone. 



Being a step too late was actually Magnolia never appearing in Alexander’s life 
trajectory. That so-called step… 

All these years, her affection and emotions were only self-serving. She had 
never been in Alexander’s world. He might not even know how long Magnolia 
had liked him. Magnolia was about to get married, but her heart was still set 
on an unattainable Alexander. She lowered her head, feeling ridiculous. 

“I saw it first. Do you have any sense of fairness?” Elizabeth looked up because 
the voice was Natalia’s. A voice nearby caught everyone’s attention. 

Natalia stood in front of the jewelry display case, looking serious. “Shouldn’t 
there be a first-come, first-served basis? You can’t just take what someone else 
loves because you like it.” Elizabeth walked over. In the center of the crowd 
stood someone who always gave her a headache: Blair. Why was Natalia 
clashing with Blair again? They were already at odds, and now with a reason, 
wouldn’t they start arguing again? 

“Natalia, I want this set of jewelry,” Blair said assertively. Natalia smiled. “I 
want it too, and I won’t give in. My people are already putting down a deposit,” 
she said, arms crossed. Blair remained calm. “My uncle is also putting down a 
deposit for…” 

Elizabeth watched them, raising her hand to her temples. How childish they 
are. Soon, jewelry consultants approached them. Seeing so many people 
gathered, they were a bit flustered but still whispered to both, “This jewelry is 
currently in high demand. Someone else wants to bid on it too. Would you like 
to increase your offer?” 

In the silence, two voices almost simultaneously said, “Yes!” Elizabeth looked 
up to see Blair and Natalia glaring at each other, gritting their teeth, and 
saying together, “Increase to the max!” She then glanced at the jewelry in the 
display case, which was a beautiful diamond necklace with a matching 
bracelet. Under the white light, the diamonds sparkled brilliantly. But it didn’t 
change the fact that the set was quite ordinary. But the price tag in the lower 
right corner exceeded six million dollars, which was not worth it. 

Elizabeth approached Natalia and gently said, “Let it go, Natalia. Let her have 
it if she likes it so much.” The implication was that the jewelry wasn’t worth 
the high price; increasing the bid was unnecessary. With six million dollars, 
Elizabeth could help Natalia pick out a very beautiful and classic set of jewelry, 



the kind that would be the most eye-catching presence at any event without a 
sponsor. 

Chapter 715 

Elizabeth’s outfit today was truly elegant and beautiful. Natalia, on the other 
hand, had a sweet demeanor. The common ground was that both were very 
beautiful, especially their rich, vibrant presence when they stood together. But 
the noticeable attractiveness and confident look… 

“I buy it for you, but how about we choose another one?” Elizabeth told 
Natalia. 

Natalia blinked at her. Suddenly, they started acting like close friends. It was a 
bit sudden for both of them, but since they had started, they had to see it 
through. 

“Afraid you can’t compete with me,” Blair sneered from the side. 

Elizabeth laughed. “It’s just a set of jewelry. What’s there to compete for? 
Since you like it so much, we’ll let you have it.” 

“Elizabeth, stop joking. I saw this jewelry first. How can you say you’re letting 
me have it?” Blair stepped forward, revealing a hint of immaturity. After all, 
she had just graduated not long ago. She was also beautiful, but her beauty 
had a touch of… 

“Do you want it or not?” Elizabeth couldn’t be bothered to argue with her. 

“Elizabeth…” Natalia was still a bit hesitant. 

Currently, the hottest jewelry pieces were only two sets. One was Kennedy’s 
comeback piece: Tears of Snow. The other was Opulent Crest Jewelry’s 
exhibition piece, Magnolia’s masterpiece: Emerald Love. The emerald set had 
already been taken by Alexander, and Kennedy’s Tears of Snow was 
unavailable. So, the Opulent Crest Jewelry’s set was undoubtedly the most 
suitable for showing off at the moment. 

Natalia was hesitating whether to let Blair have it. Blair was also considering. 

“This set isn’t good,” Elizabeth said bluntly. She wasn’t afraid of being laughed 
at, nor was she afraid of offending Magnolia. “It’s not suitable for you, 
Natalia.” 



Blair scoffed, “It really isn’t suitable for her. Kennedy’s Tears of Snow would 
suit her, but you have to be able to buy it first!” She continued to provoke, “I 
think you’re just jealous! Elizabeth, you’re so hypocritical. And you’ve been 
like this since the research institute. Why do you like acting so much? What’s 
the point of acting in the end?” 

Elizabeth’s expression gradually turned cold. 

Natalia, annoyed, retorted, “I’ll tear your mouth apart.” 

Elizabeth quickly pulled back the advancing Natalia. She stopped her not for 
any other reason, but because Natalia really would dare to fight. Then where 
did people think her reputation for being arrogant and domineering came 
from? It was because Natalia really did get physical. 

“Is Kennedy’s Tears of Snow very popular?” Elizabeth frowned, looking 
puzzled. 

“You’re so outdated, Elizabeth. You should know what Kennedy’s jewelry 
represents, right?” Blair mocked, each word like a knife, every glance filled 
with disdain, as Elizabeth didn’t look like a socialite at all. 

“What does it represent?” Elizabeth asked again. 

“Since you don’t know it, let me tell you. Kennedy’s Tears of Snow represents a 
symbol of status! Because Kennedy is very mysterious, and this is her 
comeback piece. If someone can get it, it means they’re the most impressive!” 
Blair explained. 

People around nodded in agreement. Indeed, if someone could show off a set 
of “Tears of Snow” now, it would instantly make others jealous. 

Under everyone’s admiring gazes and Blair’s mocking eyes, plus Natalia’s 
furious desire to punch Blair, Elizabeth lazily asked, “What if I have Kennedy’s 
“Tears of Snow?” 

Chapter 716 

Alarmed and embarrassed, they asked her, "What happened?" Magnolia was 
naked in his presence, causing even more astonishment. How could a Thark of 
her knowledge be currently lost in a daze? Blah suddenly laughed, wired. 



The atmosphere became a bit tense, and everyone kept their mouths shut, 
adopting a watchful silence. Only Blair’s laughter grew increasingly arrogant. 
Natalia even tugged at Elizabeth’s arm, warning her not to speak carelessly, 
especially about Kennedy’s new work. 

“Who are you trying to fool? If Kennedy’s Tears of Snow was sold, the design 
forum would have announced it!” Blair pointed at Elizabeth. “So, you’re 
lying!” 

“Because we’re still finalizing the contract, but Kennedy has already confirmed 
the sale to me.” Elizabeth tilted her head, exuding an air of wealth. 

“It’s impossible!” Blair declared confidently. 

The onlookers also chimed in, “Indeed, we haven’t heard anything. Elizabeth, 
if you don’t have it, just admit it. No need to elevate your status over this.” 

“Exactly, if you don’t have it, it’s no big deal!” 

“We’re destined not to reach Kennedy’s level. I think Opulent Crest Jewelry is 
pretty good too.” Someone laughed, mocking themselves while praising 
Opulent Crest Jewelry. 

Led by Natalia, everyone doubted that Elizabeth had Tears of Snow. The more 
they spoke, the harsher their words became, even telling Elizabeth, “Your 
parents aren’t pretentious people. How did you become so vain?” 

Elizabeth’s face turned cold. Natalia suddenly seemed to remember 
something. She looked up at her and quietly asked, “Could it be a billion 
dollars, the last time I accidentally saw it? Did you buy it?” She recalled 
Elizabeth’s chat record from that day at the hospital. Alexander heard 
Natalia’s words, and a complex look flashed in his eyes. As Kennedy had also 
quoted him a billion dollars. But when he agreed, Kennedy stopped 
responding to his messages. So it turned out that it was sold. 

No wonder when he said he would give Elizabeth Kennedy’s comeback piece, 
she was so calm; she had actually bought it. Alexander chuckled bitterly, 
shaking his head with a complicated expression. He seemed to have forgotten 
that Elizabeth was no longer the girl who used to follow him around, hoping 
he would buy her this and that. Back then, even when she asked him for 
things, she could still support herself. She just wanted to feel what it was like 
for him to buy her things. Now, she truly didn’t need it. She was the socialite of 
the Percy Family, and Declan had only one daughter, naturally giving her all 



the money to spend as she pleased. As long as she was happy, it was worth it. 
A billion dollars to make Elizabeth happy, Declan was more than willing. After 
all, his love for Elizabeth was well-known. 

Blair listened to Elizabeth and Natalia’s conversation, her expression 
trembling. “Who can prove it’s a billion dollars just because you say so?” Blair 
scoffed. Everyone nodded in agreement, starting to point fingers at Elizabeth 
again. 

“It’s just a set of jewelry. Even if it’s Kennedy’s, it’s not worth a billion dollars, 
right?” 

“You really know how to sell yourself as a rich person. A billion dollars. How 
can you even say that?” 

“If someone can prove that Kennedy’s comeback piece is really a billion 
dollars, I’ll do anything Elizabeth asks!” Then he looked up. It was a young 
man in his twenties, probably a rich kid from some family. What a shame to 
make a promise like that. 

Alexander pursed his lips and stepped forward to the center of the crowd. 
Everyone was somewhat apprehensive when they saw Alexander. They all 
thought he was going to help Elizabeth out of this situation, and it would be 
brushed off. But they realized he was there to confirm the truth. 

“Kennedy’s comeback piece is indeed priced at a billion dollars. Elizabeth did 
not exaggerate.” Alexander’s gaze swept over the man who had just made a 
promise. The man’s face changed instantly. “It’s impossible!” 

Chapter 717 

“I never lie,” Alexander raised an eyebrow, crossing his arms and leaning 
provocatively toward the man. “You don’t believe me?” 

The man didn’t know how to respond; he couldn’t dare say that. But Alexander 
and Elizabeth had once been married. What if he was just trying to help her 
out of a tight spot? 

Elizabeth was also surprised that Alexander got involved, as he could have 
easily ignored it. Alexander casually took out his phone. His presence was so 
commanding that even standing there casually, he drew everyone’s attention. 
He opened a chat record and showed the screen to everyone. 



It was a chat between Nolan and him. The content was as follows: 

Alexander: [Kennedy’s comeback piece, price?] 

Nolan replied after a long time: [One billion dollars.] 

When he heard this price, he also thought it was too high. Elizabeth then 
turned her head and smiled; it seemed that one billion dollars was still too 
low. Knowing it was Alexander, they should have asked for two billion dollars 
to scare him. 

Blair was stunned. So, one billion dollars was real. Elizabeth really bought it? 
The man who made a promise was also stunned. The atmosphere suddenly 
became tense. Everyone was frozen in place. 

Elizabeth sighed and said calmly, “I told you, I really have Kennedy’s ‘Tears of 
Snow.’ Not only that, I also have firsthand information.” 

Everyone looked at her, their eyes filled with anticipation. Elizabeth, who had 
just seemed like a fraud, now appeared so composed that no one could look 
away. 

“At the end of this month, Kennedy will reveal the actual piece,” Elizabeth 
smiled. 

“Really?” Natalia’s eyes lit up, full of disbelief. Blair didn’t know how to 
respond either. She just looked at Elizabeth, unable to say a word. 

Chapter 717 

Elizabeth looked at her, her eyes curling up provocatively. “Really. I’ve 
already…fleeced her.” 

Blair was utterly defeated by this statement. And now, she was the real clown. 
So what if she bought that six-million-dollar jewelry set? Elizabeth could give 
Natalia a piece from Kennedy’s comeback collection! Blair really loved Tears 
of Snow! From the moment Kennedy announced it, she had her eyes on it. But 
she never expected that the jewelry would end up in Elizabeth’s hands. 

“How did you buy it?” Alexander suddenly asked Elizabeth. 

Elizabeth smiled. “It’s just Kennedy. I’m familiar with her.” 



Everyone was stunned by Elizabeth’s showing off. Kennedy was a complete 
mystery online, only known to be female. But Elizabeth actually said she was 
familiar with her! Wasn’t that a blow to everyone? 

Chapter 718 

Blair still found it unbelievable. “You know Kennedy?” 

Elizabeth smirked. “I told you, I’m familiar with her.” Of course, that meant 
she knew him. 

“We grew up together,” Elizabeth said, lowering her head and tugging at her 
ear. Blair was indeed impressed by her boast, and her tone was no longer as 
arrogant as before. They actually grew up together. 

A look of confusion flashed across the faces of both Alexander and Natalia. 
Because they didn’t know that Elizabeth grew up with Kennedy, especially 
Alexander, who had been entangled with Elizabeth for years, yet never knew 
she was acquainted with Kennedy. 

Natalia’s mouth twitched, feeling as if she had been punched. Someone like 
Elizabeth was familiar with Kennedy, yet she had been praising Kennedy 
incessantly in front of Elizabeth. And Elizabeth had remained silent, so low-
key that it made people think she didn’t even know who Kennedy was. 

“Elizabeth, you’re really low-key,” Natalia remarked. 

Elizabeth looked at Blair and said calmly, “In life, it’s better to be low-key. If 
you’re too flashy or arrogant, life will always teach you a lesson.” 

Wasn’t Elizabeth a prime example of that? When she first married Alexander, 
she naively thought she could win his heart, but in the end, she was left 
heartbroken, which was a lesson from life. 

“So Natalia, can we not take this?” Elizabeth pointed to the six-million-dollar 
jewelry and asked Natalia seriously. 

Natalia swallowed and stared at her in a daze. Elizabeth was going to give her 
the Tears of Snow, so what did she need with six million dollars? Although this 
set of jewelry was nice, it was nothing compared to the Tears of Snow! 

“Got it.” She would listen to Elizabeth. Natalia then smiled and looked at her. 



Elizabeth then turned to Blair, her expression indifferent. “I’ll let you buy it.” 

Blair couldn’t say a word. In just a few minutes, it felt like a lifetime. And she 
was at a loss. 

Chapter 718 

At this moment, Sheldon walked over. He had just gone to order jewelry for 
Hair and took a phone call. What had happened here? He saw Elizabeth and 
greeted her politely, “Elizabeth.” 

Elizabeth nodded and said nothing. Blair naturally felt embarrassed to speak. 
After all, she was in the wrong. The atmosphere was a bit awkward. 

Magnolia looked at Elizabeth and spoke, “Elizabeth, can we talk?” Elizabeth 
looked at her. She seemed to guess what Magnolia wanted to talk about. 

Elizabeth said directly, “Magnolia, if you want to ask me about Kennedy, I’m 
afraid I can’t answer.” 

“Why?” Magnolia was puzzled. “I just want to communicate with her…” 

“Kennedy doesn’t need to talk to anyone, you understand.” Elizabeth spread 
her hands, looking helpless. She was a mysterious designer herself; who did 
she need to talk to? She just wanted to immerse herself in her world and 
create. 

Magnolia wanted to say something more, but Elizabeth had already stopped 
her. So she found it inconvenient to speak further. Then she sighed; this was 
the closest she had ever been to Kennedy, yet she couldn’t get Kennedy. 

Seeing that it was about time, Elizabeth decided to leave. Elizabeth passed on 
a few words to Magnolia: “Magnolia, pick a suitable set of jewelry for Lila and 
send it to her studio. Send the bill to her assistant later, thanks.” Elizabeth 
smiled slightly and then went to the side to get her clothes from the staff. 

Alexander kept watching her back; he still found it strange. How did she know 
Kennedy? 

Natalia was seeing Elizabeth off when she suddenly heard Elliot ask, 
“Elizabeth, she’s quite capable, isn’t she?” 

Chapter 719 



Natalia looked up and said, “I’m quite surprised too. I always thought she…” 

She had always thought that Elizabeth was just a useless pretty woman who 
only thought about love. But unexpectedly, Elizabeth had hidden depths. 

“Do you get along well?” Elliot asked again. 

“What makes you think that?” Natalia asked with a helpless smile. 

Elliot thought for a moment and said very seriously, “She was very protective 
of you just now.” 

Speaking of which, Elizabeth had said she would give Natalia the five-billion-
dollar jewelry. Didn’t that mean she loves Natalia very much? 

Natalia didn’t dare to speak, for she didn’t know if Elizabeth loved her. She 
only knew that she didn’t have the Percy family’s blood in her. But the Percy 
family treated her very well. 

Meanwhile, Blair, after learning that Elizabeth knew Kennedy, was like a 
deflated balloon, completely enveloped in gloom. She didn’t know what to say, 
and the onlookers around her all lowered their heads. 

Someone said, “Weren’t you going to do the thing you just promised? Are you 
still going to do it?” 

Everyone exchanged glances and laughed. The atmosphere seemed to improve 
a bit, but most people had their own thoughts. 

When Elizabeth came out, she saw a black Pagani parked at the entrance. She 
raised an eyebrow at the license plate; she didn’t need to look inside to know it 
was Alexander. 

“Mr. Tudor,” Elizabeth said, standing by the car as the door automatically 
opened. “What’s up?” 

Alexander appearing here must mean he was waiting for her, and she didn’t 
bother to beat around the bush with him. 

“Get in the car,” Alexander said. 

“I have things to do at the research institute,” Elizabeth said. 



Alexander was silent for a moment, then said, “Just get in first.” 

“No,” Elizabeth shook her head and took two steps back. 

Alexander looked at her, his eyes complicated. She didn’t even want to get in 
his car. 

Alexander sighed and didn’t force her, instead saying, “Don’t forget our 
agreement.” 

Chapter 719 

Elizabeth smiled. “That’s just Mr. Tudor’s one-sided agreement. I haven’t 
decided whether to go or not.” Until she decided to go, it was all his one-sided 
agreement. 

Alexander then chuckled lightly, tapping the steering wheel casually. “Winter, 
it’s really cold.” 

Elizabeth was silent. She could hear the sarcasm in his words. 

“If you’re afraid of the cold, don’t wait for me. You might catch a cold, Mr. 
Tudor.” Then she walked away. 

Alexander watched her departing figure, feeling both amused and helpless. 
Elizabeth had come in her purple Pagani today, which looked really cool. And 
she was a very skilled driver. 

As Alexander watched her car leave, his phone rang. Nolan called. “Mr. Tudor, 
there’s an issue at the company. Please return quickly.” 

Alexander replied, “Alright. Cancel all the meetings tonight; I have plans.” 

Nolan continued, “Mr. Tudor, the company resumed normal operations this 
afternoon. There’s a lot of work to handle. Are your plans tonight very 
important? We have a video conference with our international partners to 
reassure them. Should we cancel it?” 

Alexander looked up, his tone calm. “I’m going to see Elizabeth.” 

Nolan froze. Although it wasn’t the best time for Alexander to see Elizabeth, he 
believed Alexander’s considerations. 



“Got it.” Nolan didn’t say anything more and hung up. 

Alexander’s eyes were deep. Work was important, but right now, Elizabeth 
was more important. 

Chapter 720 

Elizabeth quickly immersed herself in the extraction of Serenity Leaf upon 
returning to the research institute. The extraction was very time-consuming 
and required constant supervision. Elizabeth’s eyes grew increasingly strained 
as she watched the various data appearing on the instruments. Serenity Leaf 
was sure to provide some important essence, but she hoped it could also yield 
some unexpected surprises. If it could help with SH2N, that would be even 
better. 

Elizabeth sighed and rubbed her temples. Just then, her phone suddenly rang. 
She looked up and grabbed her charging phone. The phone showed messages 
from the institute’s group chat. There were hundreds of messages, and 
someone had just mentioned her, which is why she received the notification. 

Elizabeth discovered that not only was she mentioned in the group chat, but 
she had also made it to the trending topics on Instagram. The trending topic 
was none other than her mentioning Kennedy at the exhibition that day. 
Elizabeth fell silent. Sure enough, Kennedy’s reputation was so great that 
simply mentioning knowing her could make it to the trending list. The 
trending content was quite exaggerated. 

Elizabeth smirked. Have you ever seen such an emotional AI designer? Just as 
she was considering this, someone in the comments asked the same question: 
“[Have you ever seen an AI that can design like this?]” Other users quickly 
replied. User B replied to User A: “Don’t forget, if it’s an AI, it’s still being 
controlled by a human. If a human is controlling it, isn’t it normal for the 
designs to have emotions?” This reply received a lot of approval, with the 
number of likes continuously increasing. 

Elizabeth thought there was some truth to it, but Kennedy was not an AI. She 
directly replied with her main account: “[Kennedy is not an AI.]” Soon, people 
noticed her comment. Immediately, news of Elizabeth personally debunking 
rumors about Kennedy started to appear. 

Felix then promptly sent Elizabeth: “[It’s fine. Let them say whatever they 
want. Why did you get involved?]” Felix: “[Don’t give them more to discuss. If 



someone really digs into you, you’ll be in trouble.]” Elizabeth: “[I’m not afraid 
of that.]” Felix: “[You’re not afraid? Boss, get real. If you’re discovered, it will 
trigger a chain reaction!]” 

If the identities of Dr. Emily, racer M, and designer Kennedy were all exposed, 
would Elizabeth still be able to extricate herself? Elizabeth thought about it 
carefully and realized he had a point. But then again… Elizabeth: “[Then what 
am I paying you all for? What’s Base M for? If she could be easily exposed, 
what were they for?]” Felix: “[I’m just worried, okay?]” 

Elizabeth, dissatisfied, decisively closed Felix’s chat window. She opened the 
institute’s messages and scrolled to the top. Someone had seen the Instagram 
news and wanted to ask her but was too shy, so they asked in the group chat: 
“[Elizabeth knows Kennedy, is that true?]” Elizabeth pouted, and soon 
someone replied that it was true. And the one who replied was none other 
than Blair. Blair: “[Yes, Elizabeth is very capable. She even knows Kennedy. 
She never mentioned it, and look at how excited we all were about Kennedy’s 
comeback work. She must be very happy.]” 

Elizabeth pouted; Blair’s words were really sarcastic. She then scrolled to the 
bottom, where a group of people were still demanding confirmation. They 
were very curious about whether… Elizabeth: “[Yes, I know her.]” The group 
chat quickly became excited, for Elizabeth really did know Kennedy! 

 


